
Notes
1

This is a compilation of the W.A. Marine (Hire and Drive Vessels)
Regulations 1983 and includes the amendments referred to in the following

Table 
1a

.

Compilation table

Citation Gazettal Commencement Miscellaneous

W.A. Marine (Hire and
Drive Vessels)
Regulations 1983

1 July 1983
pp. 2185-8

1 July 1983
(see regulation 2)

W.A. Marine (Hire and
Drive Vessels) Amendment
Regulations 1988

12 August 1988
p. 2714

12 August 1988

W.A. Marine (Hire and
Drive Vessels) Amendment
Regulations 1990

1 August 1990
p. 3644

1 August 1990
(see regulation 2)

WA Marine (Hire and
Drive Vessels) Amendment
Regulations 1991

26 July 1991
p. 3928

1 August 1991
(see regulation 2)

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations 1992,
Part 6

11 August 1992
pp. 3976-80

11 August 1992

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 1992,
Part 4

30 June 1992
pp. 2905-9

1 July 1992
(see regulation 2)

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations 1993,
Part 4

29 June 1993
pp. 3184-6

1 July 1993
(see regulation 2)

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations 1994,
Part 4

14 June 1994
pp. 2486-93

1 July 1994
(see regulation 2)

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations 1995,
Part 4

11 July 1995
pp. 2946-53
(Correction 18 July
1995 p. 3040)

11 July 1995

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations 1996,
Part 4

25 June 1996
pp. 2998-3005

25 June 1996

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations 1997,
Division 3

27 June 1997
pp. 3141-6

1 July 1997
(see regulation 2)

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations 1998,
Division 3

12 May 1998
pp. 2790-5

1 July 1998
(see regulation 2)

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations 2000,
regulation 4

20 June 2000
pp. 3062-71

1 July 2000
(see regulation 2)



Citation Gazettal Commencement Miscellaneous

W.A. Marine Amendment
Regulations 2001,
regulation 4

27 July 2001
p. 3803-13

1 August 2001
(see regulation 2)

1a
On the date as at which this compilation was prepared, provisions referred to in
the following table had not come into operation and were therefore not included in
this compilation.  For the text of the provisions see the endnotes referred to in the
table.

Provisions that have not come into operation

Citation Gazettal Commencement

W.A. Marine Amendment

Regulations 2002 r. 4 
2

14 Jun 2002
p. 2825-35

1 Jul 2002 (see r. 2)

2
The W.A. Marine Amendment Regulations 2002 r. 4 reads as follows:

“

4. W.A. Marine (Hire and Drive Vessels) Regulations 1983
amended

(1) The amendments in this section are to the W.A. Marine (Hire and
Drive Vessels) Regulations 1983.

(2) Regulation 4(2)(e) is amended as follows:
(a) in substituted clause 3.1.2(1)(b) by deleting “$269.50”

and inserting instead —
“    $276.10    ”;

(b) in substituted clause 3.1.2(3)(b) by deleting “$134.20”
and inserting instead —
“    $137.50    ”;

(c) in substituted clause 3.1.3(m) by deleting “$51.70” and
inserting instead —
“    $52.80    ”.

”.


