
16 Nove mb c'r 2012 CTOVERNITENT CTAZETTE. W '1 5057

4. Regulation 4 amended

(1) In regulation 4(1):

(a) in paragraph (a) delete "$140; and" and insert:

$143; and

(b) in para^g r-aph (b) delete "$340." and insert:

$349.

(2) In regulation 4(2):

(a) in paraw-aph (a)(i) delete `'$140; and"" and insert:

$143: and

(b) in paragraph (a)(ii) delete "$340;" and insert:

$349;

(c) delete "$70." and insert:

$71.

By Command cif - the Governor,

R. KENNEDY. Clerk of the Executive Council.

RA308*

Liquor Control Act 1988

Liquor Control Amendment Regulations
(No. 6) 2012

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations are the Liquor Control Amendment
Regulations (No. 6) 2012.



558 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE. WA 1( Novrrmbc'r 2012

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation as follows -

(a) regulations I and 2 — on the day on which these
regulations are published in the Gazette;

(b) the rest of the regulations on the day after that day.

3. Regulations amended

These regulations amend the Liquor Control Rcgn'koions 1989.

4. Regulation 9A amended

After regulation 9A(6) before the heading "Tourism" insert:

(7A) A special facility licence grunted for the purpose of
allowing the sale of liquor on a train. bus, ship or
vehicle may also he granted fbr the purpose of allo^^ ing
the sale of liquor at another place of business of the
licensee if -

(a) the sale is in connection with a hooking for
travel on a train. bus, ship or vehicle; and

(h) the liquor is to he supplied on the €rain, bus..
ship or vehicle.

5. Regulation 9E inserted

After regulation 9D insert:

9E. Prescribed period (Act s. 33(6D)(b))

For the purposes of section 33(6D)(b) the period of
3 months is prescribed.

By Command of the Governor,

R. KENNEDY. Clerk of the Executive Council.


