
RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG301* 

 
 

Liquor Control Act 1988 

Liquor Control Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Liquor Control Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 January 2009. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Liquor Control 
Regulations 1989. 

4. Regulation 26 amended 

  Regulation 26(1aa) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$100.00;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $105.00;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$200.00.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $205.00.    ”. 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4729 

 



5. Schedule 3 replaced 

  Schedule 3 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 3 — Fees 

[r. 26(1) and (2A)] 

Item Description Fee 
$ 

Electronic 
lodgment 

fee 
$ 

1. Application for the grant or removal of a hotel 
licence, nightclub licence, casino liquor licence, 
special facility licence or liquor store licence .......... 

 
 
 2 200.00 

 
 

2 000.00 

2. Application for the grant or removal of a club 
licence, restaurant licence, producer’s licence or 
wholesaler’s licence ................................................. 

 
 
 500.00 

 
 

460.00 

3. Application for the transfer of a licence ...................  500.00  

4. Licence fee for all licences other than a 
wholesaler’s licence ................................................. 

 
 155.00 

 

5. Licence fee for a wholesaler’s licence .....................  330.00  

6. Application for an occasional licence where the 
anticipated number of persons attending* is —  

 (a) up to 250 ........................................…............ 

 (b) between 251 and 500 ..................……........... 

 (c) between 501 and 1 000 ....................….......... 

 (d) between 1 001 and 5 000 .............….…......... 

 (e) between 5 001 and 10 000 .............…............ 

 (f) over 10 000 ...................................…............. 

 [*See regulation 26(4) as to the anticipated number 
of persons attending] 

 
 

 35.00 

 80.00 

 145.00 

 610.00 

 1 250.00 

 2 500.00 

 

7. Application for extended trading permit for a period 
of over 21 days — 

 (a) issued for a purpose referred to in 
 section 60(4)(ca) ...........................…............. 

 (b) issued for a purpose referred to in 
 section 60(4)(h) ...................................…...... 

 (c) issued for any other purpose ...............…....... 

 
 

 
 370.00 

 
 245.00 

 670.00 

 
 

 
340.00 

 
230.00 

620.00 

8. Application for extended trading permit for a period 
of 21 days or less (for each day, up to a maximum 
of $500) .................................................................... 

 
 
 65.00 

 

9. Application for approval of manager (other than 
under club restricted licence), after licence is 
granted ......................................................................

 
 
 80.00 

 

10. Application for approval of manager under club 
restricted licence, after licence is granted ................ 

 
 25.00 

 

11. Application for approval of person in position of 
authority, after licence is granted ............................. 

 
 90.00 

 

12. Application for approval for alteration or 
redefinition of licensed premises ............................. 

 
 310.00 

 
285.00 

13. Application for a protection order under 
section 87(1) ............................................................ 

 
 80.00 

 

14. Application for duplicate licence .............................  30.00  

4730 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 October 2008 

 



Item Description Fee 
$ 

Electronic 
lodgment 

fee 
$ 

15. Application for approval of change of name 
of licensed premises ................................................. 

 
 65.00 

 

16. Application to add, vary or cancel condition 
of licence or permit (other than club 
restricted licence) ..................................................... 

 
 
 80.00 

 
 

70.00 

17. Application to add, vary or cancel condition of club 
restricted licence ....................................……….......

 
 30.00 

 

18. On the issue of a list of licensed premises or a list 
of owners of licensed premises ................................ 

 
 80.00 

 

19. On the issue of a list of licensed premises on 
computer disk ........................................................... 

 
 50.00 

 

20. Address labels for licensed premises .......................  115.00  

21. Application for Proof of Age Card (r. 18B) .............  25.00  

22. Supply of approved heading for advertising an 
application ................................................................ 

 
 25.00 

 

23. Copy of plan — per sheet .........................................  25.00  

24. Certified copy of plan defining licensed premises ...  35.00  

25. Issue of a summons to a witness ..............................  20.00  

26. Copy of a licence or a permit, or a decision of the 
Commission (or the former Liquor Licensing 
Court) or the Director ...............................................

 
 
 25.00 

 

27. For the certification of a copy of a licence or 
permit or a decision of the Commission (or the 
former Liquor Licensing Court) or the Director —
 an additional fee of ..................................................

 
 
 
 25.00 

 

28. For a search of records of licences — per licence ...  35.00  

29. For a notice of application for approval of 
arrangement or agreement (s. 68(1)(b)(i)) ............... 

 
 70.00 

 

30. For a copy of documentation, other than that 
already prescribed, per page .................................... 

 
 4.50 

 

31. For a search of postcodes —    

 (a) 1 to 10 postcodes .........................…..............  35.00  

 (b) more than 10 postcodes ...............…..............  70.00  

32. For a full search of the licence record ......................  45.00  

33. Application under section 62(6) to vary any plans 
or specifications the subject of a condition .............. 

 
 230.00 

 
220.00 

34. Application under section 126A for approval of 
entertainment for juveniles on licensed premises .... 

 
 55.00 

 

    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

28 October 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4731 

 


