
16 September 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4187 

 

— PART 1 — 

AGRICULTURE 
AG301* 

Seeds Act 1981 

Seeds Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Seeds Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 
 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 

regulations are published in the Gazette; 
 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Seeds 
Regulations 1982. 

4. Regulation 15 amended 

 (1) Regulation 15(2) is amended by deleting “$420.30” and 
inserting instead — 

  “    $460.00    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 15(6) is amended by deleting “$320” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    $360,    ”. 



4188 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 September 2008 

 

5. Seventh Schedule replaced 

  The Seventh Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is 
inserted instead — 

“     
Seventh Schedule 

Seed analysis and report fees 
[r. 13] 

 $ 
Fees for the analysis of a seed sample provided 
under section 25 of the Act and for a report of the 
result of the analysis are —  

 

Pure seed content analysis, group 1 ..................... 52.00 
Pure seed content analysis, group 2 ..................... 67.00 
Pure seed content analysis, group 3 ..................... 82.00 
Pure seed content analysis, group 4 ..................... 98.00 
The pure seed content analysis group is displayed in column 6  
of the First Schedule. 
Germination analysis, group 1 ............................. 50.00 
Germination analysis, group 2 ............................. 57.00 
Germination analysis, group 3 ............................. 62.00 
The germination analysis group is displayed in column 7 
of the First Schedule. 
Pure seed content analysis of chaffy seed ........... 110.00 
Cultivar determination by grow-on test ............... 195.00 
Moisture content determination ........................... 70.00 
Pest or disease test ............................................... 75.00 
Weed seed presence test (general) ....................... 72.00 
Weed seed presence test (vegetable seed) ........... 68.00 
Weed seed presence test (harvester/hay)  
(per hour) .............................................................

 
140.00 

Caryopsis presence test ........................................ 64.00 
Pigmented seed content ....................................... 45.00 
Number of seeds (per unit volume) ..................... 55.00 
Seed identification ............................................... 33.00 

    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 


