
2898 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 24 June 2008  

.11X308* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates of 
Survey) Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. 	Citation 

These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates 
of Survey) Amendment Regulations 2008. 



24 June 2008 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2899 

	

2. 	Commencement 

These regulations come into operation as follows: 

(a) regulations 1 and 2—on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

(b) the rest of the regulations - on 1 July 2008. 

	

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Surveys and Certificates of Survey) Regulations 1983. 

	

4. 	Schedule I amended 

(1) Schedule 1 item 1(a) is amended by deleting the 'table to the 
paragraph and inserting instead - 

Table 
Length of vessel Examination  Initial Subsequent 
(metres) of plans (S) survey (5) surveys ($) 

Not over 5 573 808 236 

Over 5 but not over 6 666 1113 282 

Over 6 but not over 7 724 1 568 344 

Over 7 but not over 8 935 2082 372 

Over 8 but not over 9 1155 2714 401 

Over 9 but not over lO 1352 3336 423 

Over 10 but not over 11 1667 4011 466 

Over 11 but not over 12 1979 4695 512 

Over 12 but not over 13 2287 5374 560 

Over 13 but not over 14 2611 6049 603 

Over 14 but not over 15 2927 6726 649 

Over 15 but not over 16 3226 7408 691 

Over 16 but not over 17 3540 8086 739 

Over 17 but not over 18 3864 8763 784 

Over l8 but not over 19 4163 9441 828 

Over l9 but not over 20 4480 10122 877 

Over 20 but not over 2l 4842 10849 944 

Over 21 but not over 22 5207 11577 1019 

Over 22 but not over 23 5571 12304 1088 

Over 23 but not over 24 5945 13044 1155 

Over 24 but not over 2s 6303 13765 1219 

Over 2s but not over 26 6678 14492 1287 

Over 26 but not over 27 7032 15221 1352 

Over 27 but not over 28 7408 15963 1428 

Over 28 but not over 29 7765 16689 1493 

Over 29 but not over 30 8130 17412 1562 

Over 30 but not over 3l 8545 18196 1654 

Over 31 but not over 32 8 968 18 990 1 748 

Over 32 but not over 33 9374 19 766 1 836 

Over 33 but not over 34 9800 20551 1929 

Over 34 but not over 3s 10213 21330 2021 



2900 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 24 June 2008 

Length of vessel Examination Initial Subsequent 
(metres) of plans ($) survey (5) surveys (5) 
Over 3 5 but not over 36 10638 22109 2112 

Over 36 but not over 37 11062 22890 2207 

Over 37 but not over 38 11466 23685 2289 

Over 38 but not over 39 11888 24459 2381 

Over 39 but not over 4O 12304 25241 2474 

Over 4O but not over 4l 12780 26070 2596 

Over 41 but not over 42 13243 26909 2709 

Over 42 but not over 43 13712 27753 2819 

Over 43 but not over 44 14184 28572 2938 

Over 44 but not over 45 14651 29423 3050 

Over 4s but not over 46 15121 30244 3159 

Over 46 but not over 47 15 590 31 077 3275 

Over 47 but not over 48 16056 31919 3388 

Over 48 but not over 49 16536 32747 3500 

Over 49 but not over s0 16998 33579 3620 

Over 50 17463 34416 3730 

(2) 	Schedule 1 item 1 is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (b)(i)(A) by deleting "$144.80" and 
inserting instead - 
46 $178.60 "; 

(b) in paragraph (b)(i)(B) by deleting "$144.80' and 
inserting instead - 
46 $178.60 "; 

(c) in paragraph (b)(ii)(A) by deleting "$144.80" and 
inserting instead - 
44 $178.60 "; 

(d) in paragraph (b)(ii)(C)(I) by deleting "$144.80" and 
inserting instead - 
46 $178.60 "; 

(e) in paragraph (b)(ii)(C)(II) by deleting "$144.80" and 
inserting instead - 
46 $178.60 ". 

(3) Schedule 1 item 2 is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$105.80" and inserting 
instead - 

" $130.50 "; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$105.80" and inserting 
instead - 

" $130.50 "; 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$105.80" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $130.50 "; 



24 June 2008 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2901 

(d) in paragraph (d)(i) by deleting "$144.80" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $178.60 

(e) in paragraph (d)(ii) by deleting "$144.80" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $178.60 

(f) in paragraph (e)(i) by deleting "$144.80' and inserting 
instead - 
44 $178.60 

(g) in paragraph (e)(ii) by deleting "S 144.80" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $178.60 

(h) in paragraph (f)(ii) by deleting "$105.80" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $130.50 

(i) in paragraph (g)(ii) by deleting "$105.80" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $130.50 

(j) in paragraph (h)(ii) by deleting "$105.80" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $130.50 

(k) in paragraph (i)(i)(I) by deleting$723.2O" and inserting 
instead - 

" $892.40 
(I) in paragraph (i)(i)(II) by deleting "$362.20" and 

inserting instead - 

" $446.90 "; 
(m) in paragraph (i)(ii)(I) by deleting "$2 171.10" and 

inserting instead - 
44 $2679.10 "; 

(n) in paragraph (i)(ii)(ll) by deleting "$723.20" and 
inserting instead - 
" $892.40 "; 

(o) in paragraph (i)(ii)(III) by deleting "$362.20" and 
inserting instead - 
" $446.90 "; 

(p) in paragraph (i)(iii) by deleting "$723.20" and inserting 
instead - 
" $892.40 

(q) in paragraph (j) by deleting "$723.20" and inserting 
instead - 
44  $892.40 "; 



2902 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 24 June 2008 

(r) in paragraph (k) by deleting "$72.10" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $89.40 

(s) in paragraph (1) by deleting "$144.10" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $178.60 

(t) in paragraph (m) by deleting "$172.70" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $213.10 

(u) in paragraph (n)(i) by deleting "$144.10" in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead - 
46 $161.64 "; 

(v) in paragraph (n)(ii) by deleting "$159.20" in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead - 
44 $178.55 "; 

(w) in paragraph (p) by deleting "$1.00" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $1.20 ". 

(4) The notes at the end of Schedule 1 item 1 are amended by 
deleting "$144.80" and inserting instead - 

" $178.60 " 

(5) Schedule I item 3 is amended as follows: 
(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$94.50" and inserting 

instead - 
46 $116.60 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$94.50" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $116.60 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$58.40" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $72.00 ". 

(6) Schedule 1 item 4(1) is amended as follows: 
(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$78.10" and inserting 

instead - 

" $96.30 
(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$156.10" and inserting 

instead - 

" $192.60 
(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$288.40" and inserting 

instead - 
44 $355.80 "; 



21 June 2008 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2903  

(d) in paragraph (d) by deleting "$392.90" and inserting 
instead — 

" $484.80 ". 

(7) Schedule 1 item 4(2) is amended by deleting "$38.90" and 
inserting instead — 

" $48.00 ". 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


