
1 July 2005 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3003  

P0302* 

Police Act 1892 

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations are the Police (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2005. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2005. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Police (Fees) 
Regulations 1981*. 

[* Reprinted as at 20 August 1999. 
For amendments to 14 June 2005 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 304.] 



3004 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 1 July 2005 

4.  

5.  

Regulation 3 amended 

Regulation 3 is amended by deleting the full stop at the end of 
the definition of "accident" and inserting instead - 
44 

"department" means the department of the Public 
Service principally assisting the Minister in the 
administration of the Act; 

"road traffic conviction record", in respect of a 
person, means the record held in the department of 
the person's convictions against the Road Traffic 
Act 1974; 

"traffic infringement notice record", in respect of a 
person, means the record held in the department of 
infringement notices served on the person under 
the Road Traffic Act 1974 section 102. 

Schedule amended 

The Schedule is amended as follows: 
(a) by deleting items 1 to 4 and inserting instead - 

1. 	Copies of a person's traffic records 
(a) road traffic conviction record fee ......... $16.00 
(b) infringement notice record fee ............. $16.00 

Ia. 	Copy of a notice of disqualification previously 
given to a person under section 103 of the Road 
Traffic Act 1974 .................................... $16.00 

2. 	Escorts and Guards - 
(a) 	each person provided per hour and part 

thereof for - 
(i) high risk escorts carried out by 

TRG 	.................................... $74.30 
(ii) emergency escorts ................... $89.30 
(iii) other escorts ........................... $67.50 

(b) 	per km rate for - 
(i) motor vehicle ................................. 78.3 cents 
(ii) motor cycle .................................... 26.3 cents 

(c) 	booking fee (non-refundable, unless 
booking cancelled with at least 24 hours 
notice) 	......................................... $115.00 

3. 	Photographs, authorised reproductions - 
(a) 5 or more from the same film, per 

photograph 	.................................... $9.50 
(b) otherwise, per photograph .................. $16.00 

4. 	National police certificates, each - 
(a) for a volunteer ................................ $10.00 
(b) for an officer or employee in the Public 

Service 	........................................ $34.00 
(c) otherwise ...................................... $46.00 

33 

(b) in item 5 by deleting "$64.50" and inserting instead - 
66  $69.30 "; 



1 July 2005 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3005  

(c) in item 6 by deleting "$15.60" and inserting instead — 

" $16.00 "; 

(d) in item 7(a) by deleting "$27.50" and inserting 
instead — 

" $29.50 ''; 

(e) in item 7(b) by deleting "$22.00-  and inserting 
instead — 

" $29.50 "; 

(0 in item 8 by deleting "$27.00" and inserting instead — 

" $29.50 ''; 

(g) after item 8 by inserting the following item — 
44 

9. Replacement of prosecution documents — 
(a) a statement of the material facts of a 

charge, which has already been served 
(per hour or part of an hour) ............... 	$69.30 

(b) additional copy of documents already 
disclosed (per hour or part of an hour) ... $69.30 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


