
2214 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 23 June 2006  

MX309* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates of 
Survey) Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates 
of Survey) Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. 	The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Surveys and Certificates of Survey) Regulations 1983*. 

[* Reprinted as at 23 August 2002. 
For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Western Australian 
Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 466.] 



23 June 2006 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2215 

4. 	Schedule 1 amended 

(1) Schedule 1 item 1(a) is amended by deleting the Table to the 
paragraph and inserting instead - 

Table 

Length of vessel Examination Initial Subsequent 
(metres) of plans ($) survey (S) surveys (S) 

Not over 5 373 525 154 

Over 5 but not over 6 433 723 184 

Over 6 but not over 7 471 1019 224 

Over 7 but not over 8 608 1 353 242 

Over 8 but not over 9 750 1 763 261 

Over 9 but not over lO 879 2167 275 

Over lO but not over 11 1083 2605 303 

Over 11 but not over 12 1286 3049 333 

Over 12 but not over 13 1486 3490 364 

Over 13 but not over 14 1 696 3 928 392 

Over l4 but not over 15 1901 4368 422 

Over 15 but not over 16 2096 4811 449 

Over 16 but not over 17 2299 5251 480 

Over 17 but not over 18 2510 5691 510 

Over l8 but not over l9 2704 6131 538 

Over 19 but not over 20 2910 6573 570 

Over 20 but not over 21 3145 7045 613 

Over 2l but not over 22 3382 7518 662 

Over 22 but not over 23 3618 7990 707 

Over 23 but not over 24 3861 8471 750 

Over 24 but not over 25 4093 8939 792 

Over 2s but not over 26 4337 9411 836 

Over 26 but not over 27 4567 9884 879 

Over 27 but not over 28 4811 10366 928 

Over 28 but not over 29 5043 10838 970 

Over 29 but not over 30 5280 11307 1015 

Over 30 but not over 3l 5549 11816 1075 

Over 31 but not over 32 5 824 12 331 1136 

Over 32 but not over 33 6088 12835 1193 

Over 33 but not over 34 6364 13345 1254 

Over 34 but not over 35 6633 13 851 1 313 

Over 3s but not over 36 6908 14357 1372 

Over 36 but not over 37 7184 14864 1434 

Over 37 but not over 38 7446 15380 1487 

Over 38 but not over 39 7720 15883 1547 

Over 39 but not over 40 7990 16 391 1 607 

Over 40 but not over 41 8 299 16 929 1 686 

Over 41 but not over 42 8 600 17474 1 760 

Over 42 but not over 43 8 904 18 022 1 831 

Over 43 but not over 44 9211 18553 1908 

Over 44 but not over 4s 9514 19106 1981 

Over 45 but not over 46 9 819 19 639 2052 



2216 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 23 June 2006 

Length of vessel Examination Initial Subsequent 
(metres) of plans (S) survey (S) surveys (S) 
Over 46 but not over 47 10124 20180 2127 

Over 47 but not over 48 10427 20727 2201 

Over 48 but not over 49 10738 21265 2274 

Over 49 but not over 50 11038 21805 2351 

Over 50 11340 22348 2423 

(2) 	Schedule 1 item 1 is amended as follows: 

(a)  in paragraph (b)(i)(A) by deleting "$112.10" and 
inserting instead - 
46 	$116.10 	"; 

(b)  in paragraph (b)(i)(B) by deleting "$112.10" and 
inserting instead - 
44 	$116.10 	"; 

(c)  in paragraph (b)(ii)(A) by deleting "$112.10" and 
inserting instead - 
46 	$116.10 	"; 

(d)  in paragraph (b)(ii)(C)(I) by deleting "$112. 10" and 
inserting instead - 
44 	$116.10 	"; 

(e)  in paragraph (b)(ii)(C)(II) by deleting "$112.10" and 
inserting instead - 
44 	$116.10 	". 

(3) Schedule 1 item 2 is amended as follows: 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$81.90" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $84.80 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$81.90" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $84.80 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$81.90" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $84.80 

(d) in paragraph (d)(i) by deleting "$112.10" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $116.10 

(e) in paragraph (d)(ii) by deleting "$112.10" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $116.10 

(f) in paragraph (e)(i) by deleting "$112. 10" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $116.10 "; 



23 June 2006 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2217 

(g) in paragraph (e)(ii) by deleting "$112. 10" and inserting 
instead - 
" $116.10 

(h) in paragraph (0(i) by deleting "$112.10" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $116.10 

(i) in paragraph (f)(ii) by deleting "$81.90" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $84.80 

(j) in paragraph (g)(i) by deleting "$112. 10 and inserting 
instead - 
44 $116.10 

(k) in paragraph (g)(ii) by deleting "$81.90" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $84.80 

(I) in paragraph (h)(i) by deleting "$112.10" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $116.10 

(m) in paragraph (h)(ii) by deleting "$81.90" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $84.80 

(n) in paragraph (i)(i)(I) by deleting "$559.40" and inserting 
instead - 
44 $579.50 

(o) in paragraph (i)(i)(II) by deleting "$280.20" and 
inserting instead - 
44 $290.30 "; 

(p) in paragraph (i)(ii)(I) by deleting "$1679.30" and 
inserting instead - 

" $1739.70 "; 
(q) in paragraph (i)(ii)(ll) by deleting "$559.40" and 

inserting instead - 
" $579.50 "; 

(r) in paragraph (i)(ii)(1II) by deleting "$280.20" and 
inserting instead - 
44 $290.30 "; 

(s) in paragraph (i)(iii) by deleting '$559.40" and inserting 
instead - 
" $579.50 

(t) in paragraph (j) by deleting "$559.40" and inserting 
instead - 
44  $579.50 "; 



2218 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 23 June 2006 

(u) in paragraph (k) by deleting "$56.10" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $58.10 

(v) in paragraph (1) by deleting "$112.10" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $116.10 

(w) in paragraph (m) by deleting "133.60" and inserting 
instead - 
46 $138.40 

(x) in paragraph (n)(i) by deleting "$111.50" in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead - 

" $115.50 "; 

(y) in paragraph (n)(ii) by deleting "$123.20" in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead - 
46 $127.60 ". 

(4) The note 1 after item 2 is amended by deleting "$112.10" and 
inserting instead - 

" $116.10 ". 

(5) 	Schedule 1 item 3 is amended as follows: 

(a)  in paragraph (a) by deleting "$73.20" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$75.80 

(b)  in paragraph (b) by deleting "$73.20" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$75.80 

(c)  in paragraph (c) by deleting "$45.20" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$46.80 	". 

(6) 	Schedule 1 item 4(1) is amended as follows: 

(a)  in paragraph (a) by deleting "$60.40" and inserting 
instead - 
44 	$62.60 

(b)  in paragraph (b) by deleting "$120.80" and inserting 
instead - 
" 	$125.10 

(c)  in paragraph (c) by deleting "$223.10" and inserting 
instead - 
46 	$231.10 

(d)  in paragraph (d) by deleting "$304.00" and inserting 
instead - 
46 	$314.90 	". 



23 June 2006 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 2219  

(7) Schedule 1 item 4(2) is amended by deleting "$30.10" and 
inserting instead — 

" $31.20 ". 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


