
II September 19981 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4941 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RA301* 

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Act 1990 

Racing Penalties (Appeals) Amendment 
Regulations 1998 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

These regulations may be cited as the Racing Penalties (Appeals) 
Amendment Regulations 1998. 

2. The regulations amended 

The amendments in these regulations are to the Racing Penalties 
(Appeals) Regulations 1991*. 

[* Published in Gazette 12 April 1991, pp. 1662-3. 
For amendments to 26 August 1998 see 1997 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 222.] 

3. Regulation 4 replaced 

Regulation 4 is repealed and the following regulation is inserted 
instead — 

64 

4. Fees in relation to appeals 

(1) 	The fee payable on the lodgement of an application for 
leave to appeal is — 

(a) for an appeal relating to greyhound racing, 
$100; and 

(b) for all other appeals, $250. 

(2) 	The fee payable on the lodgement of a notice of appeal 
is — 

(a) 	if the appeal is an appeal as of right under the 
Act — 

(i) for an appeal relating to greyhound 
racing, $100; and 

(ii) for all other appeals, $250; 

or 

(b) 
	

if the appeal is an appeal that can be made only 
with the leave of the Tribunal, nil, 

plus, if a stay of proceedings is sought, an additional 
fee of $50. 



4942 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[11 September 1998 

4. Regulation 7 amended 

Regulation 7 is amended by deleting "$2" and inserting 
instead 
46 $3  51.  

5. Schedule 1 amended 

(1) 	Clause 1 in Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting ", whether of a runner or"; 

(b) by deleting "one month." and inserting instead — 

" 	three months. ". 

(2) 	Clause 2 of Schedule 1 is amended by deleting "$500." and 
inserting instead — 

" 	$2 000. ". 

(3) 	Clause 3 in Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

(a) by deleting ", whether of a runner or"; 

(b) by deleting "one month" and inserting instead — 

" 	three months "; 

(c) by deleting "$500." and inserting instead — 

" 	$2 000. ". 

(4) 	The following clause is inserted at the end of Schedule 1 — 
46 

4. 	An appeal to the Tribunal against a determination, or a 
finding comprised in or related to a determination, of an 
appropriate controlling authority, of a racing club, or of any 
committee or stewards, imposing any disqualification of a 
runner. 

By Command of the Governor, 

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


