2486 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 June 1994

W. A. MARINE ACT 1982
W. A. MARINE AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1994
Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council.

PART 1 — PRELIMINARY

Citation

1. These reg:latic’ms may be cited as the W. A Marine Amendment
ions 1994.

Commencement

2. These regulations shall come into operation on 1 July 1994.

PART 2 — W.A. MARINE (ADJUSTMENT OF COMPASSES)
REGULATIONS 1983

Regulation 4 amended

8. The Scale of Fees to regulation 4 of the W.A. Marine (Adjustment of
Compasses) Regulations 1983* is amended by deleting —

[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at Spp. 2191-2.
For amendments to 23 May 1994 see 1993 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p.318.]



14 June 1994] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2487

PART 3 — W.A. MARINE (CERTIFICATES OF COMPETENCY AND
SAFETY MANNING) REGULATIONS 1983

Schedule 3 amended

4. Schedule 3 to the W.A. Marine (Certificates of Ci tency and Safety
Manning) Regulations 1983* is repealed and the following schedule

substituted —

: SCHEDULE 3

[Regs. 14, 17 and 27A]
FEES

Fees applicable $

Registration fee, to be paid for certificate
of competency, or partthereof ........................ 52
Examination fee, for each examination ................. 26
EYaERETasE o: o panvas i et v weEer SEEEs W & 15
Issue of certificate ............. ... ... ... ... ... 20
Copyofcertificate .............. ... iiiiieuirennnn. 20

[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at pp. 2209-40.
For amendments to 23 May 1994 see 1993 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 318-9.]

PART 4 — W.A. MARINE (HIRE AND DRIVE) REGULATIONS 1983

Regulation 4 amended

5. Regulation 4 of the W.A. Marine (Hire and Drive) Regulations 1983* is
amended in subregulation (2) (e) —

(a) in clause 3.1.2 (1) (b) by deleting “$206” and substituting the
following —

“ $2 13 n;

(b) in clause 3.1.2 (3) (b) by deleting “$103” and substituting the
following —

“ $106 . and

(¢) in_clause 3.1.3 (m) by deleting “$40” and substituting the
following —

“ $ 4 1 ”-
[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at gop. 2185.8.

For amendments to 23 May 1994 see 1993 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 320.]



2488 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 June 1994

PART 5 — W.A. MARINE (LOAD LINES) REGULATIONS 1983

Regulation 6 amended

6. Regulation 6 (1) of the W.A. Marine (Load Lines) Regulations 1983* is
amended by deleting “$25” and substituting the following —

“ $26 o
{* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 515 3p.I2193.

For amendments to 23 May 1994 see 1 ndex to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 320.]

PART 6 — W.A. MARINE MER?‘;% TILE MARINE) REGULATIONS

Regulation 7 amended

7. Re%ulation 7 of the W.A. Marine (Mercantile Marine) Regulations 1983*
is amended —

(a) in subregulation (1) by deleting “$22” and substituting the
following —

(13 $23 )l; an d
(a) in subregulation (2) by deleting “$22” and substituting the
following —
“ $23 "
[* Published in the Gazette of 1 July 1983 at p. 2193.

For amendments to 23 May 1994 see 1993 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 320.]

PART 7 — WA. MARINE (RADIOTELEPHONY) REGULATIONS 1981

Regulation 16 amended

.3. ation 16 of the W.A. Marine (Radiotelephony) Regulations 1981* is
amended —

(a) in subregulation (2a) by deleting “$153” and substituting the
following —

£ $158 ”- and

(b) in subregulation (2b) by deleting “$78” and substituting the
following —

s $80 N

[* Published in the Gazette of 27 November 1981 at pp. 4839-46.
For amendments to 23 May 1994 see 1993 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 320-21.]



14 June 1994] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

PART 8 — W.A. MARINE (SURVEYS AND CERTIFICATES
OF SURVEY) REGULATIONS 1983

Schedule 1 amended

9. Schedule 1 to the W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates of Survey)
Qegulatwns 1983* is repealed and the following Schedule is substituted —

Schedule 1

Fees

1 SURVEY FEES

(a) The fees for examination of plans of a vessel, surveys
carried out during construction, and annual or subsequent
surveys are as follows —

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
Length of Vessel Examination Surveys Annual or
(Metres) of plans during Subsequent
Construction Surveys
(%) (%) (£)
Over 0 but not 95 192 104
exceeding 5
Over 5 but not 95 204 104
exceeding 7
Over 7 but not 122 271 112
exceeding 8
Over 8 but not 150 353 119
exceeding 9
Over 9 but not 176 434 126
exceeding 10
Over 10 but not 217 522 139
exceeding 11
Over 11 but not 258 611 152
exceeding 12
Over 12 but not 298 699 167
exceeding 13
Over 13 but not 340 787 180
exceeding 14
Over 14 but not 381 875 193
exceeding 15
Over 15 but not 420 964 206
exceeding 16
Over 16 but not 461 1052 220
exceeding 17
Over 17 but not 503 1140 234
exceeding 18
Over 18 but not 542 1228 248
exceeding 19
Over 19 but not 583 1317 261

exceeding 20



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA {14 June 1994

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
Length of Vessel Examination Surveys Annual or
(Metres) of plans - during Subsequent
Construction Surveys
(%) ($) ($)
Over 20 but not 630 1412 281
exceeding 21
Over 21 but not 678 1506 302
exceeding 22
Over 22 but not 725 1601 323
exceeding 23
Over 23 but not 773 1697 343
exceeding 24
Over 24 but not 820 1791 362
exceeding 25 .
Over 25 but not 869 1885 383
exceeding 26
Over 26 but not 915 1980 402
exceeding 27
Over 27 but not 964 2076 424
exceeding 28
. Over 28 but not 1010 2171 445
exceeding 29
Over 29 but not 1058 2265 464
exceeding 30 ‘
Over 30 but not 1112 2367 491
exceeding 31
Over 31 but not 1167 2470 519
exceeding 32
Over 32 but not 1220 2571 546
exceeding 33
Over 33 but not 1275 2673 574
exceeding 34
Over 34 but not 1329 2775 601
exceeding 35
Over 35 but not 1384 2876 628
exceeding 36
Over 36 but not 1439 2978 _ 655
exceeding 37
Over 37 but not 1492 3081 681
exceeding 38
Over 38 but not 1547 3182 708
exceeding 39
Over 39 but not 1601 3284 735
exceeding 40
Over 40 but not 1662 3391 771
exceeding 41
Over 41 but not 1723 3501 805

exceeding 42



14 June 1994] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2491
Column1l =  Column 2 Column 3
Length of Vessel Examination Surveys Annual or
(Metres) of plans during Subsequent
Construction Surveys
(3) (%) €3]

Over 42 but not 1784 3610 838
exceeding 43 -

Over 43 but not 1845 3717 872
exceeding 44

Over 44 but not 1906 : 3827 906
exceeding 45

Over 45 but not 1967 3934 939
exceeding 46

Over 46 but not 2028 4042 973
exceeding 47 '

Over 47 but not 2089 4152 1006
exceeding 48

Over 48 but not 2151 4260 1040
exceeding 49

Over 49 but not 2211 4368 1075
exceeding 50

Over 50 metres 2272 4477 1108

The fee shown in column 3 for annual and subsequent survey shall be
reduced by $62.00 if the vessel does not have a radio instaliation.

The fee shown in column 3 for annual and subsequent survey provides
for the survey and one further inspection to clear a deficiency notice.
When further inspections are necessary to complete the survey, an
additional fee of $72.00 per visit will be charged.

When the vessel is to be issued with a Classification Certificate in
respect of its hull and machinery by a recognized Classification Society
the fee fayable shall be 50% of the fee prescribed in column 1 an

column 2 and 100% of the fee prescribed in column 3.

) Where a vessel is to be surveyed for more than one class of
vessel, the fee p?'able under &lumn 1 (examination of plans)
shall be increased by the amount of one-half of the fee for each

additional class;

(c) Where a vessel is to be surveyed for more than one class of

: vessel, the fee payable under C‘:)lumn 3 (annual or subsequent
survey) shall be increased by the amount of cne-half the fee for
each additional class;

(d) Issue of a certificate of survey
where the Department accepts
a certificate of survey by another

marineauthority . . ... ............ ... ... ..... $40.00;
(e) For the extension of a certificate

Of SUIVeY . . ..ot e e $40.00;
43 Issue of a replacement certificate

of survey, or a copy of a .
certificate of survey, or a Permit
to Operate, or a Towage Permit . .. ............... $40.00;

@ For a survey specially required subsequent to repairs followintg
damage or accident, the fee is $40.00 per hour or part thereof,
plus associated travel costs; -



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 June 1994

(h)

@)

@

(k)

The fee for consideration of an application to change the class
of the vessel is one-half of the appropriate fee for examination
of plans for each class;

The fee for a survey carried out to chanfge the class of the
vessel is one-half of the appropriate fee, for annual or
subsequent survey, for each class;

Where examination of plans is required due to significant
alterations to a vessel, the fee is one-half of the appropriate fee
payable under Column 1 (Examination of Plans);

Where an additional survey is carried out due to significant
alterations to a vessel, the fee is one-half of the appropriate fee
for a survey carried out during construction.

Fee for —

(a) Examination of the plans of a pressure vessel . ... ... $40.00
per hour
or part
thereof

(b) Initial survey and test of a pressure vessel . ......... $40.00
per hour
or part

_ thereof

(¢) Examination of the plans of a crane installation on a

vessel . .. ... e $40.00
per hour
or part
thereof

(d) Survey of a crane installation on a vessel . . ... ...... $40.00
per hour
or part
thereof

(e) Inspection of towage arrangement before the issue of a

towage permits: .. Lo st spae sl s B SRR ia $40.00
per hour
or part
thereof

(f  Check of stability data of vessel, where detailed check

ofloadingrequired . .....................0..... $492.00
(@ Check of stability data of vessel, where detailed check
of loading not required . . ....................... $122.00

(h) Attendance at inc]iningbexperiment, roll period test or
authorized practical stability test . ... ............. $122.00
The survey fee payable for vessels licensed under the WA
Mari (szm a rive Vessels) Regulations 1983 shall be in
accordance with the following scale —

Type of Vessel Fee ($)

(a) Power boats not exceeding 5 metresin length . ... ... .. 35

(b) Sailing boats other than sailboards . .. .............. 36

(¢) Boats propelled exclusively by oars or paddles and

sailboards . . ... ... e e 21

(d) All other boats exceeding 5 metres in length (including

houseboats) —

fees in accordance with the scale set out in item 1
(a) of this Schedule.






