26 June 1992] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2795

PE301 ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

ROAD TRAFFIC (LICENSING) AMENDMENT
REGULATIONS (NO. 2) 1992

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Licensing)
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 1992.

Commencement

2. These regulations shall come into operation on 1 July 1992.

Principal regulations

8. In these regulations, the Road Traffic (Licensing) Regulations 1975% are
referred to as the principal regulations.

[* Reprinted in the Gazette of 28 August 1984 at pp.2263-82.

For amendments to 25 May 1992 see 1991 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, pp.471-3 and Gazette of 13 March 1992.]

Regulation 3B amended
4. Regulation 3B (1) of the principal regulations is amended —

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$56.00” and substituting the
following —

& $61.00 1
(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$24.00” and substituting the

following —
“ $26.00 " and

(e) %Elloﬁlﬁgriph (c) by deleting “$36.00” and substituting the
% $40.00 i

Regulation 11 amended

5. Regulation 11 (6) of the principal regulations is amended in paragraph
(a) (i) by deleting “$5.00” and substituting the following —

« $6.00 "

Regulation 14 amended

6. Regulation 14 of the principal regulations is amended by deleting “$5.00”
and substituting the following —

“ $6.00 %

Regulation 22 amended

7. Regulation 22 (2) of the Erincipal regulations is amended in paragraph
(a) by deleting “$10.00” and substituting the following —

“ $11.00 "y



2796 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [26 June 1992

Regulation 26 amended

8. Regulation 26 (3) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting
“$16.00§uand substituting the fo?lowing —

“ $17.00 g :

By His Excellency’s Command,
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Council.




