PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

= WESTERN
7 AUSTRALIAN
g GOVERNMENTtt

PERTH, FRIDAY, 27 JUNE 2003 No. 107  spEcIAL

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 4.15 PM
© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

Associations Incorporation Act 1987

Associations Incorporation Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2003

Bills of Sale Act 1899
Bills of Sale (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2003

Chattel Securities Act 1987
Chattel Securities Amendment Regulations 2003

Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943
Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) Regulations 2003

Employment Agents Act 1976
Employment Agents Amendment Regulations 2003

Finance Brokers Control Act 1975

Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment Regulations 2003

Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978

Land Valuers Licensing Amendment Regulations 2003

Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973
Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment Regulations 2003

Travel Agents Act 1985
Travel Agents Amendment Regulations 2003

Weights and Measures Act 1915
Weights and Measures Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2003






27 June 2003

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2541

Associations Incorporation Act 1987

Regulations (No. 2) 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Associations
Incorporation Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2003.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.

The regulations amended

Associations Incorporation Amendment

The amendments in these regulations are to the Associations

Incorporation Regulations 1988*.

[* Reprinted as at 11 October 2002.]

Schedule 2 replaced

Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted

instead —
Schedule 2
[r. 16]
Item Matter Fee
1. Application for approval of purpose of an
association under section 4(1)(f) ....cccccoeveverrererrnnnnne. $31.00
2. Application for incorporation of an association
under Section 5(1) c.oceveeeieiriiiieieieeeeee e $103.00
3. Lodgment of request to Minister to review
decision of COMMISSIONET .........coereereeerieniereenienene $31.00
4, (a) Lodgment of notice of special resolution
setting out particulars of alteration of
rules of an association under section 17 ... $16.80
(b)  Where alteration of rules has effect to
change name of an association, on
approval of change of name and issue of
certificate of incorporation on change of
name under section 18(6) ..........c.coceveeee. $16.80

(c)  Where alteration of rules has effect to
change objects or purposes of an
association, on approval of the alteration
under section 19 .......cocceeveiniinincniee



2542

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

27 June 2003

Item

Matter

Fee

10.

11.

12.

Lodgment of application for extension of period
for holding an annual general meeting under
SECLION 23(1) wovevveieeiiecie et

Lodgment of application for approval of variation
of provisions of rules of an association relating to
distribution of surplus property upon winding up

under SeCtion 33(4) ..cccveeeiieiiie et
Lodgment of distribution plan under section 33(6) ...

Inspection of document lodged with
Commissioner under section 37(2)(a) ........cccuveeenee.

Issue of uncertified copy of, or extract from
document, other than current rules of an
incorporated association, lodged with
Commissioner —

(a)  where fee payable under item 8 for
inspection of the document has been paid,
for each page .......ccccvevveevveeiiciecie e

(b)  where fee payable under item 8 for
inspection of the document has not been
paid —

(i) for the first page .....ccceccvevvververnnnn.
(i) for each additional page .................

Issue of uncertified copy of current rules of an
incorporated association lodged with
COMMISSIONET ..venvienieieriienienieereeieerteeieeeee e eeenees

Issue of certified copy of, or extract from
document lodged with Commissioner —

(a)  forthe first page ......ccccceevvercrerverieeireiens
(b)  for each additional page ..........cccccvverveennnne

Application for certificate of Commissioner under
SECHION 38 i

$31.00

$31.00
$31.00

$6.45

$1.30

$6.45
$1.30

$24.50

$9.05
$1.30

$9.05

By Command of the Governor,

2

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




27 June 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2543

Bills of Sale Act 1899

Bills of Sale (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Bills of Sale (Fees)
Amendment Regulations 2003.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Bills of Sale
(Fees) Regulations 1983*.

[* Published in Gazette 20 January 1984, p. 137.
For amendments to 19 May 2003 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 30.]

4. Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3 is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “12.00” and inserting instead —

“ 1270 7

(b) by deleting “5.00” and inserting instead —
“ 530 7

(¢) Dby deleting “6.00” and inserting instead —
“ 635 7

(d) by deleting “10.00” in both places where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“ 10.60 7
(e) Dby deleting “2.00” and inserting instead —
“ 210 7.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




2544 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 June 2003

Chattel Securities Act 1987

Chattel Securities Amendment Regulations 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Chattel Securities
Amendment Regulations 2003.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Chattel
Securities Regulations 1988%*.

[* Reprinted as at 3 October 2000.
For amendments to 29 May 2003 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 42, and Gazette
14 February 2003.]

4. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended as follows:

(a) Dby deleting item 1(a) and (b) and inserting the following
paragraphs instead —

13

(a) if made by online entry (Internet) ........ 10.00
(b) ifmade by email ..........ccoevvrriiriennnnnn, 11.00
(c) if made by other means ....................... 12.00

(b) Dby deleting item 3(a) and inserting the following
paragraph instead —

13

(a) if made by online entry (Internet) or
eMAl .o 4.00

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




27 June 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2545

Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943

Companies (Co-operative) (Fees)
Regulations 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 409(3) of
the Act.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Companies
(Co-operative) (Fees) Regulations 2003.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.

3. The Act amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Companies
(Co-operative) Act 1943%*.

[* Reprinted as at 14 January 2000.
For subsequent amendments see 2001 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 1, p. 60, and Gazette 28 June 2002.]

4. Tenth Schedule replaced

The Tenth Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

Tenth Schedule

Table of fees to be paid to the Commissioner

1. On submission of the memorandum of a company ......... 223.00
2. For the registration of a company .............ccceevereennnnns 223.00

3. For every authorisation by the Governor under the
provisos to SeCtion 28(7) ...cccveveveeerieeriieeiee e 64.50

4, For every approval of the Commissioner to the
change of name of a company ............cccceeeeeeveerreennnne. 64.50

5. On lodgment of request to the Commissioner to
exercise the powers conferred by section 297, 299
or 300 (Application fee) .......c.cceevveerinienieeieere e 34.00

6. For every act done by the Commissioner as
representing a defunct company under section 297,
299 or 300 (Application fee) .........cceevervrercrvereerreeniens 64.50



2546

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

27 June 2003

$

10.
11.
12.
13.

14.

15.

16.
17.
18.

19.

20.

On late lodgment, registration or filing of any

document under this Act, in addition to any other

fee —

(a)  iflodged, registered or filed within one month
after the period prescribed by law ....................

(b) iflodged, registered or filed more than one
month after the period prescribed by law, in
addition to the fee payable in paragraph (a) ....

The Commissioner, if satisfied that just cause existed
for the late lodgment, may waive in whole or in part
the additional fee under paragraph (b).

For every application for the reservation of a name ...

For every application for extending the time of such
TESETVATION ..eoveeeieeiieieie ettt ettt

On filing any statement in lieu of prospectus ..............
On filing any ProSPectus ........ccvevreeveevreeveeerveerreesveenns
On filing an annual return of a company ....................

For every application for the consent of the Minister
under section 46(3a)(Q) .veeeereercrieeriieiie e eree e

For every application for the consent of the Minister
under section 173(2) coovveviereciieeieece et

For every application for exemption from the
provisions of section 369(1) ......ccccveevvrieniienrieeieene.

On lodging any other application .............cccceevvevurenneens
For every certificate issued by the Commissioner ......

For every inquiry as to the availability of any name
sought to be adopted by a company —

For every name the subject of the inquiry ...................

For production at the Stamp Duties Office of
documents lodged by or in relation to a company ......

(a)  For every inspection of a document or
documents filed or lodged with the
Commissioner by or in relation to a company
or of any transparency or reproduction of such
document or dOCUMENLS .......cccervereeenierueeneenanne

(b)  For the supply of an uncertified copy or print
of any document where the fee prescribed by
paragraph (a) has been paid —

For each page of the copy or print ....................

(c)  For the supply on an uncertified copy or print
of a document without inspection having been
made —

For the first 2 pages of the copy or print ..........
For each additional page ..........ccceevevvercvennnns

(d)  For every inspection of any document filed or
lodged with the Commissioner not being an
inspection in respect of which paragraph (a)
APPLIES eveerreiiieie ettt

11.70

34.00

22.20

22.20
31.50
540.00
64.50

64.50

64.50

64.50
22.20
7.25

7.25

11.90

6.20

1.05

4.15
1.05

2.10



27 June 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2547

(e)  For every written inquiry involving a search
for any document filed or lodged by or in
relation to & COMPANY ......eevveervrerveerierienieeiens 8.50

()  For the supply of an uncertified copy or print
of' a document where the fee prescribed by
paragraph (e) has been paid —
For each page of the copy or print .................... 1.05
21. (a) For certifying a copy of or extract from any
document filed or lodged with the
Commissioner of which a typewritten or
printed copy is supplied by an applicant —
For one page ......cccccevvevveeeeiesieeee e 5.30
For each additional page .........cccceovrvevnnenncns 2.10
(b)  For the supply of a certified copy or print of
any document filed or lodged with the
Commissioner —
For one page ........coeevieeiiiiiniiieec e 7.40
For each additional page ..........cccceevvevvieeiennnnns 4.15
22.  For the deposit of any book or document under
section 288 (provided that the total fees to be paid by
a liquidator under section 288 in respect of any one
company shall not exceed $10.00) .........ccccvvvrerennnen. 3.10

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




2548

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 June 2003

Employment Agents Act 1976

Employment Agents Amendment
Regulations 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Employment Agents
Amendment Regulations 2003.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Employment
Agents Regulations 1976*.

[* Reprinted as at 30 September 1997.
For amendments to 21 May 2003 see Gazette 28 June 2002.]

Regulation 10 amended

The Table to regulation 10(1) is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting “572.00” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“761.00

(b) Dby deleting “166.25” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“ 221.00 :

(c) Dbydeleting “17.30” and inserting instead —
“ 0 23.00 7

(d) by deleting “28.00” and inserting instead —
“ 3725 7

(e) by deleting “30.50” and inserting instead —
“ 4050

(f) by deleting “6.65 and inserting instead —
“ 885

(g) Dby deleting “13.30” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“ 1770



27 June 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2549

(h) by deleting “2.70 and inserting instead —

“ 3.60 7
(1) by deleting “162.00” and inserting instead —
“ 215.00 .

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




2550

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 June 2003

Finance Brokers Control Act 1975

Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment

Regulations 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

4.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Finance Brokers Control
(General) Amendment Regulations 2003.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Finance Brokers
Control (General) Regulations 1977*.

[* Reprinted as at 30 September 1997.]

Regulation 4A replaced

Regulation 4A is repealed and the following regulation is
inserted instead —

4A.

Prescribed periods — sections 31(1) and (2)
and 32(1)
The period prescribed under —

(a) section 31(1) and (2); and

(b) section 32(1),

of the Act is 3 years.

2

Regulation 4B amended

Regulation 4B(2) is repealed and the following subregulation is
inserted instead —

13

)

The holding fee is to be paid within 60 days of the
licensee ceasing to hold a current business certificate in
respect of the licence, and triennially after that
payment.

2



27 June 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2551

5. Schedule amended

The Schedule is amended by deleting item 4 and inserting
instead the following item —

4. For renewal of business certificate —
(for a period of 3 years) ........cccoceervververnnenne 324

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




2552 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 June 2003

Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978

Land Valuers Licensing Amendment
Regulations 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.
1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Land Valuers Licensing
Amendment Regulations 2003.

2. Commencement
These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.
3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Land Valuers
Licensing Regulations 1979*.

[* Reprinted as at 31 March 2000.
For amendments to 15 May 2003 see Gazette 28 June 2002.]

4. Schedule replaced

The Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —

Schedule
[r. 4]
$
1. Fee for a licence
(period 0f 3 Years) c..ueeeveieeieeciieeee et 352.00
2. Fee for renewal of licence ...........ccceeoevveveneneenenne. 352.00
3. Examination fee .........cccevvvevvienieniincienie e, 40.25
4. Fee to inSPect TEZISIET ...vvvvvvveeieereeieerirereeneeeseveeees 10.90
5. Fee for certificate as to an individual registration
in the register —
FIFSE PAZE c.vvevveeireieeeiee e 10.90
each subsequent page ..........cceeevveeeeeieeneenenns 2.05
6. Fee for certificate as to all registrations in the
TEZISTET c.eeuientieiieteteet ettt sttt eae 128.00

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




27 June 2003

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2553

Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment

Regulations 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

L.

1A.

1B.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicle Dealers
(Licensing) Amendment Regulations 2003.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Motor Vehicle
Dealers (Licensing) Regulations 1974*.

[* Reprinted as at 28 May 1996.
For amendments to 28 May 2003 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 229, and
Gazette 28 June and 13 August 2002.]

Third Schedule replaced

The Third Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

(13

Third Schedule
[r. 7]
$
Application for a dealer’s licence or renewal of a dealer’s
licence for the period prescribed by regulation 6A —
(a) ifthe dealer only specifies single premises to be
authorised under section 20E(5) in relation to the
JICENCE .ottt 1 088.00
(b)  if'the dealer specifies 2 or more premises to be
authorised under section 20E(5) .......cccevvveevvernnenen. 544.00
plus
in respect of each premises to be authorised under
section 20E(5) in relation to the licence a further 544.00
Application under section 20F in respect of change of
OS] 101 RSP 91.00

Application under section 20F in respect of each added
PIEIMISES .vvevvrenvrereeieereresressrensreesesssesseessessseenseessessseensesns 544.00



2554

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

27 June 2003

1C.

4A.

4B.

10.
11.
12.
13.

14.

15.

Application for a temporary permit under section 20H ......

Application for yard manager’s licence or renewal of
yard manager’s licence for the period prescribed by
TEGUIALION A ....c.eiiiiiiieiiecte e

Application for salesperson’s licence or renewal of
salesperson’s licence for the period prescribed by
re@UIAtioN OA ......ocviiiiiiiee e

Application for car market operator’s registration or
renewal of car market operator’s registration —

(a) if'the operator only specifies single premises to be
authorised under section 21 A(5) in relation to the
TEEISTTAtION .eveevieeieeeieeieerie e sre e se et e

(b)  if the operator specifies 2 or more premises to be
authorised under section 21A(5) in relation to the
TEEISIIALION ...vviiviieiiieiee e e et e e reeeseree s

plus

in respect of each further premises to be

authorised under section 21A(5) in relation to the

registration, a further ............ccccoeevevceeeeieeeiee e,
Application under section 21B in respect of alteration of
PIEIMESES ..vveeeuvreeeieeireeetreereeeseeesseeesereessseessseeasseeessesessseensns
Application under section 21B in respect of each added
PIEIMISES ..vveeeurreeeieeireeerreereeeseeesseeesereessseessseeasseeesesessseensns
Application for certificate of exemption from the Act
under section 31(1) ..eevvieecriieeieeiie e

Application for temporary authorisation under
SECtioN 16(2) OF 17(2) cvveeeeiieieeiieeeeieiee e

Individual dealer — change to firm ...........c.ccceeeieevennnnnn.
Individual dealer — change to body corporate ...................
Firm — change to sole proprietor ...........cccoceeveveereecveeneenne.
Firm — change to body corporate ............cceceevververvenennne
Body corporate change to individual or firm ......................
Duplicate lICENCE ......ocvievieiieiieciieiieeecteee e

Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of an
individual registration in the register kept under section 24
of the Act —
FIFSE PAZE weveeerieeie et
each subsequent Page ......coccevveeerieniereesiere e

Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of all
registrations in the register kept under section 24 of the
ALCE e

Inspection of register kept under section 24 of the Act ......

By Command of the Governor,

$
36.00

278.00

188.00

1 088.00

544.00

544.00

91.00

544.00

91.00

36.00
91.00
91.00
91.00
91.00
91.00
28.75

13.20
2.40

169.00
13.20

2

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




27 June 2003

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2555

Travel Agents Act 1985

Travel Agents Amendment Regulations 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

(1

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Travel Agents Amendment
Regulations 2003 .

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Travel Agents
Regulations 1986%*.

[* Reprinted as at 20 May 1997.
For amendments to 28 May 2003 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 346, and
Gazette 28 June 2002.]

Regulation 6 amended

Regulation 6(1) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$683” and inserting
instead —
(13 $705 9’;

(b) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$148” and inserting
instead —
(13 $ 1 53 9’;

(c) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$683” and inserting
instead —
(13 $705 9’;

(d) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$148” and inserting
instead —
(13 $ 1 53 ’,;

(e) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$1 026 and inserting
instead —
(13 $1 060 ”;

(f) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$148” and inserting
instead —
113 $ 1 53 9’.



2556

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 June 2003

)

(1

)

Regulation 6(2) is amended by deleting “$1 477" and inserting
instead —

“ $1526 .

Regulation 9 amended

Regulation 9 is amended by deleting “$21.55.” and inserting
instead —

“ $22.30. 7.

Regulation 10 amended

Regulation 10(2) is amended by deleting “$10.30” and inserting
instead —

“ $10.60 .

Regulation 10(3) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$10.30” and inserting
instead —
“ $10.60 7

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$10.30” and inserting
instead —
“ $10.60 7

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$125.20” and inserting
instead —
“ $130.00 .

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




27 June 2003

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2557

Weights and Measures Act 1915

Weights and Measures Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Weights and Measures
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2003.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2003.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Weights and
Measures Regulations 1927%*.

[* Reprinted as at 4 October 2002.
For amendments to 16 May 2003 see Gazette
1 November 2002 and 1 April 2003.]

Tables XIII and XIIIB replaced

Tables XIII and XIIIB are deleted and the following Tables are
inserted instead —

Table XIII

Fees to be paid for testing, verifying or stamping weights

and measures, and weighing or measuring instruments

Weights (Mass)
Fee
(a) masses (each not exceeding 20 kg) $18.60 for each group, or part
of a group, of 5 masses
(b) masses over 20 kg Based on time taken at $37.25
per half hour or part thereof

Measures of Capacity (Volume)

Fee

(a) lubricating oil measures, alcoholic $18.60 for each group, or part
liquor measures or beverage of a group, of 10 measures
measures

(b) dispensing measures or graduated $18.60 for each group, or part
measuring cylinders of a group, of 5 measures or

cylinders

(c) each measure of capacity not Based on time taken at $37.25

specified in paragraph (a) or (b) per half hour or part thereof




2558

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

Measures of Length or Extension

Fee
3. (a) oninitial verification of measures, $18.60 for each group, or part
each not exceeding 1 m of a group, of 5 measures
(b) each measure over 1 m but not
exceeding 20 m $18.60
(¢) each measure over 20 m Based on time taken at $37.25
per half hour or part thereof
Additional sets of graduation on the same measure at prescribed rates above.
Weighing Instruments
Fee
4. (a) each instrument with weighing
capacity not exceeding 10 t $74.50
(b) each instrument with weighing $74.50
capacity over 10 t (plus $37.25 for every 10 t or
part thereof in excess of 10 t)
5. Automatic Weighers, Belt Conveyer Fee based on time taken at
Weighers and Totalisers $37.25 per half hour or part
thereof for each officer
6.  Electronic price computing digital
indicating scales with weighing capacity
not exceeding 75 kg (including
instruments connected to price computing
or ticket printing devices) $28.00
7. Weighing instruments not otherwise
designated —
(a) each instrument with weighing
capacity not exceeding 200 kg $18.60
(b) each instrument with weighing
capacity over 200 kg but not
exceeding 1 000 kg $37.25
(c) each instrument with weighing
capacity over 1 000 kg $74.50
Measuring Instruments
Fee
8.  Fixed measuring instruments (capacity)
petroleum systems —
(a) each retail flow meter $56.00
(b) each wholesale flow meter of rate
not in excess of 1 000 L per minute $74.50
(c) each wholesale flow meter of rate in
excess of 1 000 L per minute $149.00
9.  Calibrated tanks other than farm
milk tanks —
For each 5 000 L or part thereof
contained in an individual
compartment of each calibrated tank $74.50
10. Calibrating measures and measuring
instruments —
(a) for each measure or measuring
instrument up to and including 50 L $37.25

(b) for each measure or measuring
instrument over 50 L

Based on time taken at $37.25
per half hour or part thereof

27 June 2003




27 June 2003

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2559

Fee

11. Calibrated farm milk tanks —
For each 250 L of capacity or part
thereof each calibrated tank $18.60
12.  Each LPG retail flow meter $56.00
13.  Measuring instruments not otherwise Based on time taken at $37.25
designated per half hour or part thereof
General
14.  Subject to a minimum amount of $18.60 being payable in respect of any
matter referred to in this Table, if, after testing, a weight, measure or
instrument is rejected as incorrect, unjust, or otherwise unsuitable, one-half
only of the fee so prescribed with respect to that weight, measure or
instrument may be charged in lieu of the fee in this Table.
Table XIIIB
Miscellaneous Fees
Fee
1. Registration of public weighbridge $67.50
2. Public weighman’s licence $48.00
3. Scale adjuster’s licence $48.00
4. Scale repairer’s licence $48.00
5. Petroleum products measuring instrument —
repairer’s registration $48.00
SA. Charge for examination of applicant for weighman’s
licence or scale repairer’s licence $67.50
6.  Fees chargeable for —

(a) inspector’s time for any service rendered in carrying
out repairs or adjustment, etc. to instruments or any

$37.25 per half

waiting time other than time referred to in hour or part
paragraph (b) thereof
(b) any waiting time allowed by an inspector to permit | $37.25 per half
another person to carry out necessary repairs, etc. hour or part
thereof
(c) any adjustment to —
(i)  each 20 kg or lesser weight $18.60
(i) weights above 20 kg Based on time
taken at $37.25
per half hour or
part thereof
(iii) each measure of capacity not exceeding SO L | $18.60
(d) any distance necessarily travelled by an inspector —
(i) for each kilometre not exceeding 100 km $0.70 (subject to
a minimum

charge of $10.00)

(ii) for each kilometre over 100 km

$0.35

(e) time involved in the calibration of any instrument to
a degree of accuracy greater than the degree of
accuracy applied to instruments in use for trade or
the calibration and certification of instruments used
for purposes other than trade —

$37.25 per half
hour or part
thereof




2560 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 27 June 2003

Fee
7. Charges for use of masses provided by Ministry —
(a) booking of masses of 1 t or more $18.60
(b) hire of masses for each day or part of a day $18.60 pert

(c) testing by inspector of equipment where masses are

used $18.60 pert
Based on time
taken at $18.60
per 15 minutes or
part thereof

8. Charge for response to request to provide report,
documentation or any other information which is
additional to verification, reverification and testing
services

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.







2 00 300 1 0 7 6 G



