
!200800076GG! 
 

  1931 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 20 MAY 2008 No. 76 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Aerial Spraying Control Act 1966—Aerial Spraying Control Amendment Regulations 2008 1933 
Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976—Agriculture and Related 

Resources Protection (Declared Animals) Amendment Regulations 2008 ..........................  1934 
Artificial Breeding of Stock Act 1965—Artificial Breeding (Cattle) Amendment 

Regulations 2008 ....................................................................................................................  1935 
Beekeepers Act 1963—Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 2008 ........................................  1936 
Exotic Diseases of Animals Act 1993—Exotic Diseases (General) Amendment 

Regulations 2008 ....................................................................................................................  1938 
Health Act 1911—Shire of Plantagenet—Health Amendment Local Laws 2008...................  1942 
Local Government Act 1995—Shire of Plantagenet—Health Amendment Local Laws 2008  1942 
Plant Diseases Act 1914—Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations 2008 .............................  1939 
Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968—Enzootic Diseases Amendment Regulations 

(No. 4) 2008.............................................................................................................................  1937 
Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970—Stock (Identification and Movement) 

Amendment Regulations 2008 ...............................................................................................  1941 
 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Consumer and Employment Protection ....................................................................................  1952 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  1958 
Electoral Commission ................................................................................................................  1952 
Heritage......................................................................................................................................  1952 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................  1953 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  1953 
Marine/Maritime........................................................................................................................  1954 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  1955 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  1956 
Water/Sewerage .........................................................................................................................  1957 
 
 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2007 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$24.75 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$57.75 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$57.75 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.55 

  Bulk Notices—$211.00 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1933 

 

— PART 1 — 

AGRICULTURE 

AG301* 

Aerial Spraying Control Act 1966 

Aerial Spraying Control Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Aerial Spraying Control Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Aerial Spraying 
Control Regulations 1971. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  Regulation 4(3)(b) is amended by deleting “$11.50.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $11.90.    ”. 

5. Regulation 9 amended 

  Regulation 9(2)(b) is amended by deleting “$21.50” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $22.20    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



1934 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

AG302* 

Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976 

Agriculture and Related Resources Protection 
(Declared Animals) Amendment 

Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Agriculture and Related Resources 
Protection (Declared Animals) Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Agriculture and 
Related Resources Protection (Declared Animals) 
Regulations 1985. 

4. Regulation 15 amended 

  Regulation 15(2) is amended by deleting “$136.50” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $141.00    ”. 

5. Regulation 16 amended 

  Regulation 16(2)(d) is amended by deleting “$80.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $83.    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1935 

 

AG303* 

Artificial Breeding of Stock Act 1965 

Artificial Breeding (Cattle) Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Artificial Breeding (Cattle) 
Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Artificial 
Breeding (Cattle) Regulations 1978. 

4. Regulation 5 amended 

  Regulation 5(2) is repealed and the following subregulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (2) The following fees are payable in respect of the matters 

listed below —  

(a) for the issue or renewal of a licence for the 
collection and processing of semen for 
general sale or use ...................................... 

 
 

$652.00 
(b) for the issue or renewal of a licence for 

storage and sale of semen ........................... 
 

$435.00 
(c) for the issue or renewal of a licence for the 

transplanting of ova and processes of 
production, handling, fertilisation, 
implantation and storage of ova for general 
sale or use ................................................... 

 
 
 
 

$652.00 

(d) for the transfer or variation of a licence ..... $109.00 



1936 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

(e) for an application for a certificate of 
competency — 

 

 (i) in respect of the class of 
herdsman-inseminator .......................

 
$66.00 

 (ii) in respect of any other class .............. $435.00 
    ”. 

 
By Command of the Governor, 
 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

AG304* 

Beekeepers Act 1963 

Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Beekeepers Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Beekeepers 
Regulations 1963. 

4. Third Schedule amended 

  The Third Schedule is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 by deleting “$30.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $31.50    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “$18.30” and inserting instead —  

  “    $18.90    ”. 
 
By Command of the Governor, 
 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1937 

 

AG305* 

Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968 

Enzootic Diseases Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Enzootic Diseases Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Enzootic 
Diseases Regulations 1970. 

4. Schedule 4 replaced 

  Schedule 4 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 4 — Charges 

[r. 28, 31, 42 and 60] 
Charges $ 

1. Charges for inspection of stock being imported or 
exported (regulations 28 and 31) — 

 

A. Inspection on week day inside normal hours  
(6 a.m. to 6 p.m.) —  
 per 15 minute unit or part of 15 minute unit 

 
 

27.25 
 Travel on week day inside normal hours  

(6 a.m. to 6 p.m.) —  
 

 (i) For the first 25 km from headquarters 
plus 

27.25 

 (ii) For each 25 km or part of 25 km in excess of 
25 km from headquarters 

 
27.25 

B. Inspection on week day outside normal hours — 
 per 15 minute unit or part of 15 minute unit 

 
33.25 

 Travel on week day outside normal hours —   
 (i) For the first 25 km from headquarters 

plus 
33.25 

 (ii) For each 25 km or part of 25 km in excess of 
25 km from headquarters 

 
33.25 



1938 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

Charges $ 
C. Inspection on Saturday, Sunday or public holiday —  
  minimum fee 451.00 
  per 15 minute unit or part of 15 minute unit 37.50 
 Travel on Saturday, Sunday or public holiday —   
 (i) For the first 25 km from headquarters 

plus 
37.50 

 (ii) For each 25 km or part of 25 km in excess of 
25 km from headquarters 

 
37.50 

2. Charges for supply of Triclabendazole —  
 Minimum charge per session (regardless of number 

of animals) 
 

23.50 
 or per kg body weight of each animal (where the sum 

is greater than minimum fee) —  
 

 up to 35 kg 0.70 
 36 — 100 kg 1.95 
 101 — 300 kg 4.35 
 301 — 600 kg 8.75 
 more than 600 kg 11.30 

    ”. 
 
By Command of the Governor, 

 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
 

——————————— 
 

AG306* 

Exotic Diseases of Animals Act 1993 

Exotic Diseases (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Exotic Diseases (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1939 

 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Exotic Diseases 
(General) Regulations 1970. 

4. Regulation 13E amended 

  Regulation 13E(4) is amended by deleting “$248.00.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $257.00.    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

AG307* 

Plant Diseases Act 1914 

Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Plant Diseases Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Plant Diseases 
Regulations 1989. 



1940 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

4. Regulation 19P amended 

 (1) Regulation 19P(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$200.00;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $207.00;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$200.00.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $207.00.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 19P(2) is amended by deleting “$43.00.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $44.50.    ”. 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2 and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1(a) 34.25 35.50 

1(b) 35.25 36.45 

1(c) 43.25 44.75 

1(c) 44.25 45.75 

1(c) 34.25 35.50 

1(c) 106.00 110.00 

2(a) 45.25 46.75 

2(b) 60.00 62.00 

2(b) 45.25 46.75 

2(b) 134.00 139.00 

3(a) 335.00 346.00 

3(a) 52.00 54.00 

3(b) 451.00 466.00 

3(b) 67.00 69.50 

3 134.00 139.00 

4 20.00 20.70 

5 59.50 61.50 
 
 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1941 

 

AG308* 

Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970 

Stock (Identification and Movement) 
Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Stock (Identification and Movement) 
Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Stock 
(Identification and Movement) Regulations 1972. 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 items 2, 4 and 5 are amended by deleting “55” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    57    ”. 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 

 



1942 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 
HEALTH ACT 1911 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
Shire of Plantagenet 

HEALTH AMENDMENT LOCAL LAWS 2008  
Made by the Local Government of the Shire of Plantagenet under Section 342 of the 
Health Act 1911 in accordance with Subdivision 2 of Division 2 of Part 3 of the Local 
Government Act 1995. 
In these local laws, the Shire of Plantagenet Health Local Laws 1997 made under 
the Health Act 1911 and passed by the Local Government of the Shire of Plantagenet 
on 25 November 1997, by notice published in the Government Gazette No. 69 Special, 
on 30 March 1998, are referred to as the principal local laws.  
The principal local law is amended as follows— 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

1 1.1 Insert the section title “Citation” above section 1.1. 

2 1.3(1) In subsection 1.3(1) in the definition of “Act”, delete 
the words “and includes subsidiary legislation made 
under the Health Act 1911”. 

3 1.3(1) In subsection 1.3(1) delete the definition of 
“approved” and substitute the definition 
““approved” means approved by the local 
government”. 

4 1.3(1) In subsection 1.3(1) in the appropriate alphabetical 
order add the following definitions— 

““AS 1530.2: 1993” means the standard 
published by the Standards Association of 
Australia as AS 1530.2: 1993 and called 
“Methods for fire testing on buildings 
materials, components and structures—
Tests for flammability of materials.”“ 

““AS/NZS 1530.3: 1999” means the standard 
published by the Standards Association of 
Australia as AS/NZS 1530.3: 1999 and called 
“Methods for fire tests on building materials, 
components and structures—Simultaneous 
determination of ignitability, flame 
propagation, heat release and smoke 
release.”“ 

““AS 1668.2—2002” means the standard 
published by the Standards Association of 
Australia as AS 1668.2—2002 and called 
“The use of ventilation and air-conditioning 
in buildings—Ventilation design for indoor 
air contaminant control.”“ 

““AS 2001.5.4—2005” means the standard 
published by the Standards Association of 
Australia as AS 2001.5.4—2005 and called 
“Methods of tests for textiles—Dimensional 
change—Domestic washing and drying 
procedures for textile testing (ISO 
6330:2000,MOD).”“ 

 ““AS/NZS 3666.2: 2002” means the standard 
published by the Standards Association of 
Australia as AS/NZS 3666.2: 2002 and called 
“Air-handling and water systems of 
buildings—Microbial Control—Operation 
and maintenance.”“ 

““AS/NZS ISO 7171.1:2004” means the standard 
published by the Standards Association of 
Australia as AS/NZS ISO 7171.1:2004 and 
called “Acoustics—Rating of sound 
insulation in buildings and of building 
elements—Airbourne sound insulation.”“ 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1943 

 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

5 1.3(1) In subsection 1.3(1) delete the definition of 
“Building Code” and substitute the definition 
““Building Code” means the latest edition of the 
Building Code of Australia published from time to 
time by, or on behalf of, the Australian Building 
Codes Board, as amended from time to time, but not 
including explanatory information published with 
that Code”. 

6 1.3(1) and 
the complete 
local laws 

In subsection 1.3(1) delete the definition of 
“Council” and then, except in the definition of 
“water” in subsection 1.3(1), delete the word 
“Council” wherever it appears in the Local Laws and 
substitute “local government” or “the local 
government” as appropriate. 

7 1.3(1) In subsection 1.3(1) insert in the appropriate 
alphabetical order, the definition ““local 
government” means the Shire of Plantagenet”. 

8 1.3(1) In subsection 1.3(1) in the definition of “water” 
delete the symbol and numbers “-1987” and after the 
last word “Council” insert “in 2004 and as amended 
from time to time”. 

9 2.1.1 In subparagraph (ii) of section 2.1.1 in the definition 
“urinal”, delete the word “through” and substitute 
“trough”. 

10 2.1.3(2)(c)(ii)  In subparagraph (ii) of paragraph 2.1.3(2)(c), delete 
the words “hand basin” and substitute the words 
“hand wash basin”. 

11 2.1.4(1)(c)(ii); 
2.1.4(1)(d)(ii); 
8.3.9(c); 9.2.4 
and twice in 
Schedule 1 

In Schedule 1 both times it appears, subparagraphs 
(ii) of paragraphs 2.1.4(1)(c) and 2.2.1(1)(d), 
subsection (c) of section 8.3.9 and section 9.2.4 delete 
the words “wash hand basin” and substitute the 
words “hand wash basin”. 

12 2.1.5 Delete Section 2.1.5 and substitute— 
“Toilets on premises other than a dwelling house 
shall, where more than one toilet is provided on 
the premises, bear, on the entrance to each toilet, 
a suitable sign indicating for which sex its use is 
intended.” 

13 2.1.9 In subsection (2) of section 2.1.9, in the first line, 
delete the word “a” before the words “the premises”. 

14 2.1.11 In section 2.1.11 delete the word “Country” from the 
title of the Act and substitute the word 
“Metropolitan”. 

15 2.1.11 In section 2.1.11 after the year “1909” insert the 
words “and the Health (Treatment of Sewage and 
Disposal of Effluent and Liquid Waste) Regulations 
1974”. 

16 2.2.1 Delete Section 2.2.1 and substitute the following— 
“2.2.1 (1) A person shall not use or occupy, or 
permit to be used or occupied, a dwelling house 
without a bathroom that— 

 (a)  is adequately lined with an impervious 
material and has an adequate ceiling; 

 (b) complies with the Health Act (Laundries 
and Bathrooms) Regulations; and 

 (c)  is equipped with— 
 (i) a hand wash basin; and 
 (ii) either a shower in a shower recess or a 

bath. 
(2) All baths, showers, hand wash basins and 
similar fittings shall be provided with an 
adequate supply of hot and cold water.” 

17 2.2.2 Delete Section 2.2.2 and substitute the following— 
“2.2.2 (1) A laundry must conform to the 
provisions of the Building Code 



1944 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

(2) Where, in any building, a laundry is situated 
adjacent to a kitchen or a room where food is 
stored or consumed, the laundry shall be 
separated from the kitchen by a wall extending 
from the floor to the roof or ceiling. 
(3) Where there is an opening between a laundry 
and a kitchen or other room where food is stored 
or consumed, the opening shall— 

 (a) not be more than 1220 millimetres wide; 
and 

 (b) have a door which when closed shall 
completely fill the opening.” 

18 2.2.4(2) In subparagraph (i) of paragraph 2.2.4(2)(c) delete 
the word “millilitres” before the word “deep” and 
substitute the word “millimetres”. 

19 2.2.4(4) In paragraph (a) of subsection 2.2.4(4), after the 
words “requirements of” insert the words “Energy 
Safety and”. 

20 3.1.1 For section 3.1.1 insert the missing section title 
“Dwelling House Maintenance”. 

21 3.1.1(m) In subsection (m) of section 3.1.1, delete the term 
“the Office of Energy” and substitute “Energy 
Safety”. 

22 3.2.4(1) In the first line of subsection 3.2.4(1), delete the word 
“of” before the word “occupy” and substitute the word 
“or”. 

23 3.2.4(2) In paragraph (b) of subsection 3.2.4(2) delete 
“AS1668.2” and substitute “AS1668.2: 2002” 

24 3.2.4(3) In paragraph (a) of subsection 3.2.4(3) delete 
“AS3666.2—1989” and substitute “AS/NZS 3666.2: 
2002” 

25 3.2.4(3) In paragraph (b) of subsection 3.2.4(3), after the 
word “occupied”, insert the comma and words”, if it is 
a building without approved natural ventilation”. 

26 3.3.2 In the first line of section 3.3.2, delete the word “for” 
before the words “a rainwater tank” and substitute 
the word “from”. 

27  3.5.1(2)(c) In paragraph (c) of subsection 3.5.1(2) delete the 
words “prescribed in Schedule (12)” where they 
appear and substitute the words “as fixed by the 
local government from time to time under Section 
344C of the Act”. 

28 3.5.1(3) In subsection (3) of section 3.5.1 delete the words 
“prescribed in Schedule (12)” where they appear and 
substitute the words “as fixed by the local 
government from time to time under Section 344C of 
the Act”. 

29 4.1.3(2)(b) In the second line of paragraph (b) of subsection 
4.1.3(2), delete the word “and” after “Health” and 
substitute “or”. 

30 4.2.1 In section 4.2.1 delete the definition of “approved 
enclosure”. 

31 4.2.1 In section 4.2.1 delete the definition of “building 
line”. 

32 4.2.1 In section 4.2.1 insert in the appropriate alphabetical 
order the definition ““refuse disposal site” means a 
waste treatment facility or depot licensed under Part 
V of the Environmental Protection Act 1986 to store, 
treat, reuse or dispose of rubbish or refuse.” 

33 4.2.4(a) In paragraph (viii) of section 4.2.4(a), after the word 
“objects” add the words “unless placed in a durable, 
impervious and leak proof container”. 

34 4.2.10(2) In subparagraph (i) of paragraph 4.2.10(2)(a), delete 
the last word “or” and substitute the word “and”. 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1945 

 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

35 4.2.10(2) In subparagraph (ii) of paragraph 4.2.10(2)(a), delete 
the word “suitable” and substitute the word 
“unsuitable”. 

36 4.2.10(2) In paragraph (d) of subsection 4.2.10(2) delete “in AS 
1875—1976” and substitute “by the local 
government”. 

37 4.2.10(3) In subsection (3) of section 4.2.10, delete the words 
“Fire Rules of the Local Fire Brigade issues by the 
Western Australian Fire Brigades Board” and 
substitute “local fire rules”. 

38 4.3.1 In section 4.3.1, delete the definition of “butchers 
waste” and substitute the definition ““butchers 
waste” includes animal skeletons and rib cages from 
a boning room and the inedible products of an 
abattoir.” 

39 5.1.2 Delete section 5.1.2 and substitute— 
“5.1.2 An owner or occupier of premises shall 
maintain any footpath, pavement, area or right 
of way immediately adjacent to the premises 
clear of rubbish, matter or other things coming 
from or belonging to the premises.” 

40 5.1.3 In section 5.1.3 insert the word and comma “smoke,” 
before the word “dust”. 

41 5.1.6(2) In subsection (2) of section 5.1.6, delete the last word 
“therefrom” and substitute the words “there from”. 

42 5.2.4(1) In subsection (1) of section 5.2.4, delete the words 
“District of the local government” and substitute the 
word “district”. 

43 5.2.4(5) In paragraph (b) of subsection 5.2.4(5), delete the 
words “provide a shelter or an enclosure to be” and 
substitute the words “ensure every shelter and 
enclosure is”. 

44 5.2.4(6) In subsection (6) of section 5.2.4, delete the word 
“the” and substitute the word “than”. 

45 5.2.6(3) In subsection (3), of section 5.2.6, delete the word 
“immediately” in the second line and substitute the 
words “as soon as possible”. 

46 5.3.3(1)(b) In subparagraph (ii) of paragraph 5.3.3(1)(b), insert 
the word “a” before the word “minimum”. 

47 5.3.3(1)(e) In subsection (1) of section 5.3.3, delete paragraph (e) 
and substitute— 
 “(e) subject to subsection (3), have a floor, the 

upper surface of which shall— 
 (i) be at least 75 millimetres above the 

surface of the ground; 
 (ii) be constructed of cement, concrete or 

other similar impervious materials; 
 (iii) have a fall of 1 in 100 to a drain, which 

shall empty, into a trapped gully 
situated outside the stable and shall 
discharge in a manner approved by the 
local government.” 

48 5.3.3(2)(a) In paragraph (a) of subsection 5.3.3(2), delete the 
word “to” after the word “Officer” and substitute a 
comma. 

49 5.3.3 In section 5.3.3 insert a new subsection (3) as 
follows— 

(3) A stable constructed with a sand floor may be 
permitted by the local government, subject to the 
following— 

 (a) the site must be well drained with the 
highest known water table at least 1.5 
metres below the sand floor level, which 
may be achieved artificially; 



1946 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

 (b) a 300mm thick bed of crushed limestone 
shall be laid under the sand of the stable 

 (c) sand, whether natural or imported, must 
be clean, coarse and free from dust; 

 (d) footings to each stable shall be a 
minimum of 450mm below ground level; 

 (e) the stable design must allow for the 
access of small earth moving machinery, 
such as a skid steer loader, into each 
individual stall, to maintain the correct 
floor height; 

 (f) the minimum floor area of each stall 
shall be not less than 28 square metres 
and walls shall not be less than 3 metres 
vertically or 4 metres horizontally; 

 (g) the roofed area of each stall shall not be 
less than 50 percent of the floor area of 
the stall.” 

50 5.4.3(a) In the first line of subsection (a) of section 5.4.3, 
delete the word “with” after the word “approach” and 
substitute the word “within”. 

51 5.4.3 In section 5.4.3 change the existing subsection 
designation “(e)” to “(f)” and then immediately after 
subsection (d), insert a new subsection (e) as 
follows— 
 “(e) no poultry is able to approach within 1.2 

metres of any side or rear boundary of the 
premises; and”. Then delete the word “and” 
after the semi-colon at the end of subsection 
(d).  

52 5.4.4(2) In subsection (2) of section 5.4.4, delete the last three 
words “of this section”. 

53 5.4.6(1) In subsection (1) of section 5.4.6, delete the words 
“provision of Section” and substitute the words 
“provisions of Sections”. 

54 5.4.7(2) In subsection (2) of section 5.4.7, delete the word 
“the” before the word “local government” and 
substitute the word “a” and insert the word “made” 
before the word “under”. 

55 5.4.8 After section 5.4.7 insert a new section as follows— 
“Restrictions on Feeding Wild Birds 
5.4.8 A person shall not feed a pigeon, dove, 
seagull, ibis, raven or other wild bird, so as to 
cause a nuisance or be injurious or dangerous to 
health.” 

56 5.5.2(1) In subsection 5.5.2(1), delete the fifth word 
“approved” and substitute the word “used”. 

57 5.5.2(2) In subsection 5.5.2(2), insert the missing brackets 
around the number “3” after the word “subsection”. 

58 5.5.3(1)(a) In paragraph (a) of subsection 5.5.3(1), delete the 
word “slopping” and substitute the word “sloping”. 

59 5.5.3(1)(b) In paragraph (b) of subsection 5.5.3(1), delete the 
word “composing” and substitute the word 
“composed”. 

60 5.6.2(2) In subsection 5.6.2(2), insert the missing brackets 
around the number “3” after the word “subsection”. 

61 5.6.4 In section 5.6.4, in Table 3, delete the row heading 
“50 to 500 pigs” and substitute the heading “50 to 
499 pigs”. 

62 5.7.2(1) In paragraph (b) of subsection 5.7.2(1), delete 
“AS1668.2 Part 2 1991” and substitute “AS 1668.2:-
2002”. 

63 5.7.3(a) In paragraph (i) of subsection 5.7.3(a), change the 
existing sub- subparagraph designations “(a) and (b)” 
to “(A) and (B)” respectively. 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1947 

 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

64 5.7.3(a) In paragraph (i) of subsection 5.7.3(a), in both sub-
subparagraphs (A) and (B) delete “AS 1668.2 Part 2 
1991” and in both places, substitute “AS 1668.2:-
2002”. 

65 6.1.2 In section 6.1.2, in the second line, delete the comma 
between the words “left” and “in”. 

66 6.1.3(g) In the first line of paragraph (g), delete the word 
“any” before the word “may” and substitute the word 
“and”. 

67 6.1.4 In subsection (c) of section 6.1.4, delete the words “of 
flies” and insert them on the next line, aligned with 
the first word of the section. 

68 6.1.5(3) In subsection (3) of section 6.1.5, insert a comma and 
the words “, except to the extent the person has 
suffered unreasonable loss or damage because the 
action taken by the local government was negligent 
or in breach of its duty” after the last word “Section.” 

69 6.2.2 (1)(b) In the second line of paragraph (b) of subsection 
6.2.2(1), delete the comma between the words “in” 
and “or”. 

70 6.2.2(4) In subsection (4) of section 6.2.2, insert the word “to” 
before the word “be”. 

71 6.2.3 In both subsections (2) and (3) of section 6.2.3, delete 
the references to “Section (1)” and substitute the 
word “subsection (1)”. 

72 6.2.3(3) In subsection 6.2.3(3), insert the comma and words “, 
except to the extent the person has suffered 
unreasonable loss or damage because the action 
taken by the local government was negligent or in 
breach of its duty” after the last word “Council” in 
subsection (3). 

73 6.3.3(a) In the first line of subsection (a) of section 6.3.3, 
delete the comma between the words “refuse” and 
“or”. 

74 6.3.3 In both subsections (a) and (b) of section 6.3.3, insert 
the word “stored” before the word “food”.  

75 6.8.1 In section 6.8.1, in the definition of “Arthropod 
vectors of disease” delete paragraph (f). Then 
delete the semi colon and the word “and” after 
paragraph (e) and substitute a full stop. After 
paragraph (d), insert the word “and”. 

76 6.8.2 In the title of section 6.8.2, delete the word “to” and 
substitute the word “or”. 

77 7.1.2(4) 

 

In subsection (4) of section 7.1.2, insert a comma and 
the words “, except to the extent the person has 
suffered unreasonable loss or damage because the 
action taken by the local government was negligent 
or in breach of its duty” after the last word “Section” 

78 7.1.4 Delete section 7.1.4, then renumber sections 7.1.5 
through to 7.1.10 as sections 7.1.4 through to 7.1.9 
respectively. 

79 7.1.8(1) In subsection (1) of section 7.1.8, delete the first word 
“The” and substitute “An”. 

80 7.1.10(3) In subsection (3) of section 7.1.10, insert a comma 
and the words “, except to the extent the person has 
suffered unreasonable loss or damage because the 
action taken by the local government was negligent 
or in breach of its duty” after the last word “Section”. 

81 7.3.1 and 
7.3.2 

In PART 7, delete Division 3—Skin Penetration. 

82 8.1.1(1) In subsection 8.1.1(1), insert, in the appropriate 
alphabetical order, the definition— 

““Food Standards Code” means the Australian 
New Zealand Food Standards Code as 



1948 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

defined in the Commonwealth Food 
Standards Australia New Zealand Act 1991.” 

83 8.1.1 (1) In subsection 8.1.1(1), in the definition of “keeper”, 
delete the second last word “lodger” and substitute 
“lodging”. 

84 8.1.3 In section 8.1.3, delete the section title “Application 
for Registration” and substitute the title 
“Application for Registration” in bold print. 

85 8.1.3(c)(i) In paragraph (i) of subsection 8.1.3(c), delete the 
words “prescribed in Schedule (12)” and substitute 
the words “as fixed from time to time by the local 
government under Section 344C of the Act”. 

86 8.1.5(b) In subsection (b) of section 8.1.5, delete the words 
“prescribed in Schedule (12)” and substitute the 
words “as fixed from time to time by the local 
government under Section 344C of the Act”. 

87 8.2.2(a)(i) In the second line of paragraph (i) of subsection 
8.2.2(a), delete the words “flies, or vectors of disease” 
and substitute the words “flies or other vectors of 
disease”. 

88 8.2.2(b) In subsection (b) of section 8.2.2, delete the words 
“the requirements of the Health (Food Hygiene) 
Regulation 1993” and substitute the words “any of 
the requirements of Standard 3.2.3 of the Food 
Standards Code”. 

89 8.2.5(1)(b) Delete paragraph (b) of subsection 8.2.5(1) and 
substitute— 
 “(b) bathrooms, each fitted with a hand wash 

basin and either a shower or a bath.” 

90 8.2.5(5)(e) In subsection (5) of section 8.2.5, delete paragraph 
(e). Then insert the word “and” after the semi-colon 
at the end of paragraph (c), then delete the word 
“and” and the semicolon at the end of paragraph (d) 
and substitute a full stop.  

91 8.2.5 In section 8.2.5 insert a new subsection (6) as 
follows— 

“(6) Paragraphs (b) and (c) of subsection (5) do 
not apply to a serviced apartment.” 

92 8.2.7(2) In subsection (2) of section 8.2.7, delete the words 
“advised by the Western Australian Fire Brigades 
Board and approved by the Council” and substitute 
the words “required by the Building Code”. 

93 8.2.10(2) In subsection (2) of section 8.2.10, add an “s” to the 
end of the word “year” to change it to the word 
“years”. 

94 8.2.11 Delete section 8.2.11 and substitute the following— 
“Sleeping Accommodation, Short Term 
Hostels and Recreational Campsites 
8.2.11. (1) A keeper of a short term hostel or 
recreational campsite shall provide clear floor 
space of not less than— 

 (a) 4 square metres per person in each 
dormitory utilising beds; 

 (b) 2.5 square metres per person in 
dormitories utilising bunks. 

(2) The calculation of floor space in subsection (1) 
shall exclude the area occupied by any large 
items of furniture, such as wardrobes, but may 
include the area occupied by beds. 
(3) The minimum height of any ceiling in a short 
term hostel or recreational campsite shall be 2.4 
metres in any dormitory utilising beds, and 2.7 
metres in any dormitory utilising bunks. 
(4) The minimum floor area requirements in 
subsection (1) will only apply if there is 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1949 

 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

ventilation, separation distances, fire egress and 
other safety requirements in accordance with the 
Building Code. 
(5) The keeper of any short term hostel or 
recreational campsite shall provide— 

 (a) fixed outlet ventilation at a ratio of 0.15 
square metres to each 10 square metres 
of floor area of the dormitories, and shall 
ensure that dormitories are provided 
with direct ventilation to the open air 
from a point within 230 millimetres of 
the ceiling level through a fixed open 
window or vents, carried as direct to the 
open air as is practicable; 

 (b) mechanical ventilation in lieu of fixed 
ventilation, subject to the local 
government’s approval. 

(6) The keeper of any short term hostel or 
recreational campsite shall provide— 

 (a) beds with a minimum size of— 
 (i) in short term hostels—800 millimetres 

x 1.9 metres; and  
 (ii) in recreational campsites—750 

millimetres x 1.85 metres. 
 (b) storage space for personal effects, 

including backpacks, so that cleaning 
operations are not hindered and access 
spaces are not obstructed. 

(7) The keeper of any short term hostel or 
recreational campsite shall— 

 (a) maintain at all times a minimum 
distance of 750 millimetres between 
beds, and a minimum distance of 900 
millimetres between bunks; 

 (b) ensure that, where bed or bunk heads 
are placed against the wall on either side 
of a dormitory, there is a passageway of 
at least 1.35 metres between each row of 
beds and a passageway of at least 2 
metres between each row of bunks, and 
shall ensure that the passageway is kept 
clear of obstruction at all times; and 

 (c) ensure all doors, windows and 
ventilators are kept free of obstruction. 

(8) The keeper of a short term hostel or 
recreational campsite shall ensure that— 

 (a) materials used in dormitory areas 
comply with AS 1530.2-1993 and 
AS/NZS 1530.3:1999 as follows— 
Drapes, curtains, blinds and bed covers 

 – a maximum Flammability Index  
of 6; 

Upholstery & bedding 
 – a maximum Spread of Flame Index 

of 6; 
 – a maximum Smoke Developed Index 

of 5; 
Floor coverings 

 – a maximum Spread of Flame Index 
of 7; 

 – a maximum Smoke Developed Index 
of 5; 

Fire retardant coatings used to make a 
material comply with these indices must 
be— 

 (i) certified by the manufacturer a 
approved for use with the fabric to 
achieve the required indices; and 



1950 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

 (ii) certified by the manufacturer to 
retain its fire retardatjve effect after 
a minimum of 5 commercial dry 
cleaning or laundering operations 
carried out in accordance with AS 
200 1.5.4-2005, Procedure 7A, using 
ECE reference detergent; and 

 (iii) certified by the applicator as having 
been carried out in accordance with 
the manufacturer’s specification, 

 (b) emergency lighting is provided in 
accordance with the Building Code; 

 (c) a lodger or other person does not smoke 
in any dormitory, kitchen, dining room 
or other enclosed public place, within a 
short term hostel or recreational 
campsite; 

 (d) all mattresses in a short term hostel or 
recreational campsite are fitted with a 
mattress protector.” 

95 8.2.12 After subsection (2) of section 8.2.12, insert new 
subsections (3) and (4) as follows— 

“(3) The sheets and blankets required to be 
provided by subsection (1)(b)(ii), shall be deemed 
to have been provided by the keeper, where the 
keeper offers them for hire to the lodgers. In 
such circumstances, each lodger must either 
provide his own clean sheets or hire them from 
the keeper. 
(4) In a short term hostel or recreational 
campsite, the storage facilities required by 
subsection (1) (c) may be located in a separate 
secure storage room or locker room.” 

96 9.1.1 In section 9.1.1, in the definition of “offensive 
trade”, delete paragraph (d). Then insert the word 
“and” after the semi-colon at the end of paragraph 
(b), then delete the word “and” and the semi-colon at 
the end of paragraph (c) and substitute a fill stop. 

97 9.1.4(b) In subsection (b) of section 9.1.4, delete the title of 
the regulations and substitute the current title 
“Health (Offensive Trades Fees) Regulations 1976 “. 

98 9.1.8 Delete section 9.1.8. 

99 9.2.4 In the title of section 9.2.4, delete the words “Wash 
Basin” and substitute the words “Hand Wash 
Basin”. 

100 9.2.7 In subsection (d) of section 9.2.7, delete the words 
“and at such more frequent intervals as may be 
directed” and substitute the words “or at such other 
intervals as may be approved or directed”. 

101 9.4.1 In section 9.4.1, delete the definition of “exempt 
laundry”. 

102 9.4.1 In section 9.4.1, in the definition of “laundry”, delete 
the words “an exempt laundry or”. 

103 9.4.1 In section 9.4.1, in paragraph (c) of the definition of 
“exempt laundromat”, delete the word “therefrom” 
and substitute the words “there from”. 

104 9.4.2 In section 9.4.2, delete the word “withdrawn” and 
substitute “withdraw”. 

105 9.4.3(1)(a) In paragraph (a) of subsection 9.4.3(1), delete the 
word “except” from the first line.  

106 10.1.1(2) In subsection (2) of section 10.1.1, delete the words 
“of this section”. 

107 Schedule 1 In Schedule 1, in the table entitled “Laundry 
Facilities”, delete the entry: “Coppers”. 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1951 

 

Item Sections 
Affected 

Description 

108 Schedule 2 In Schedule 2, in the title; insert the words 
“REGISTRATION OF” before the words “A 
LODGING HOUSE”. 

109 Schedules 
5,7,8 & 11 

In each of Schedules 5, 7, 8 and 11, delete the 
prefix “19” in the line provided for entering the date 
of signature.  

110 Schedule 12 Delete Schedule 12. 

———— 
Passed at an ordinary meeting of the Council of the Shire of PIantagenet held on 25 
day of March 2008. 
The Common Seal of the Shire of Plantagenet was placed here in the presence of— 

K. M. FORBES Shire President. 
R.J. STEWART Chief Executive Officer. 

On this 25 day of March 2008. 

———— 
Consented to— 

A. ROBERTSON, Executive Director. 
Public Health. 

Dated this 6th day of May 2008. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



1952 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

— PART 2 — 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401* 
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 

REINSTATEMENT OF ASSOCIATION 
Integrity Christian Church Inc. 

Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named association has been re-instated 
pursuant to Section 35(4) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987. 
Dated: 14 May 2008. 

ROBERT ALLEN, A/Director, Business Services 
for Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 

ELECTORAL COMMISSION 

EC401* 
ELECTORAL ACT 1907 

REGISTRATION OF POLITICAL PARTIES 
CANCELLATION OF REGISTRATION 

Community 1st (Inc) 
Under section 62L(2)(a) of the Electoral Act 1907 the Electoral Commissioner may cancel the 
registration of a political party if the Electoral Commissioner is satisfied on reasonable grounds that 
the party no longer exists. 
The Commissioner is satisfied on reasonable grounds that Community 1st (Inc) no longer exists. 
Under section 62L(5) of the Electoral Act 1907 the Electoral Commissioner is required to— 
 (a) give notice of the cancellation and the reasons for it to the secretary of the party; 
 (b) give notice of the cancellation in the Gazette;  
Notice in accordance with (a) has been given and this gazettal is in accordance with (b) above. 

WARWICK GATELY AM, Electoral Commissioner. 

HERITAGE 

HR401* 
HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990 

AMENDMENT OF AN ENTRY IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES 
The entry in the Register of Heritage Places (“the Register”) relating to P2424, The Royal WA 
Institute for the Blind located at 134 Whatley Crescent, Maylands (“the Place”) has been amended 
pursuant to section 54 of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990. 
The reason for the amendment is to provide a more accurate reflection of the land description as a 
consequence of subdivision resulting in the creation of Lot 890 on Deposited Plan 55030 and to 
exclude certain land that is no longer considered to be of heritage significance. 
The amended land description of the Place is— 

That portion of Lots 2, 3, 4 and 5 on Plan 1885 being part of the land contained in Certificate of 
Title Volume 2230 Folio 571 shown as Lot 890 on Deposited Plan 55030. 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1953 

 

NOTICE OF PLACE NOT TO BE ENTERED INTO THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES 

Notice is hereby given in accordance with Section 52(1) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 
that, pursuant to direction from the Minister for Heritage, the place described in Schedule 1 shall not 
be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis. 

Schedule 1 

Description of Place 

Bona Vista at 35 Glenroyd Street, Mount Lawley; Lot 14 on Deposited Plan 24591 being the whole of 
the land contained in C/T V 2204 F 416. 

Submissions in relation to the proposal are invited from persons generally. Submissions must be in 
writing and should be forwarded to the address set out below not later than 5pm on 11 June 2008. 

IAN BAXTER, Director, 
Office of the Heritage Council of W.A., 

108 Adelaide Terrace, East Perth WA 6004. 
20 May 2008. 

JUSTICE 

JU401* 

JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

RESIGNATIONS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Minister has accepted the resignation of— 

Keith Wilfred Ellett of 9 Hannan Place, Huntingdale 

from the Office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia. 

RAY WARNES, Executive Director, 
Court and Tribunal Services. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 

SHIRE OF TAMMIN 

APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed— 

Registration Officers under the Dog Act 1976— 

 • Julie Susanne Oliver 

 • Myra Tisha Hand 

Authorised Officers under the Dog Act 1976 & Regulations, Control of Off-Road Vehicles Act 1978 
& Regulations, Litter Act 1979 & Regulations, Shire of Tammin Local Laws, Local Government 
Act 1995 (Section 3.39, 9.10, 9.11, 9.15); Section 449 of the Local Government (Miscellaneous 
Provisions) Act 1960; Section 59 (2) (a) of the Bush Fires Act 1954 and Section 64 (1) of the 
Cemeteries Act 1986; Section 3,28 &3.29 of the Local Government Act 1995; Sections 9.13, 9.16, 
9.17 of the Local Government Act 1995 and Section 3.39 of the Local Government Act 1995— 

 • Thomas Francis Findlay 

Dated: 15 May 2008. 
M. G. OLIVER, Chief Executive Officer. 



1954 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MX401* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

BOATING PROHIBITED AREA 
City of Mandurah 

Halls Head 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 20 May 2008. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, the 
department hereby revokes item (3) of Notice TR401 as published in the Government Gazette on 
18 August 1995 and hereby closes the following area of water to all craft until further notice— 

Halls Head Beach: All the waters of the Indian Ocean bounded by lines starting from a point 
32°31.173’S, 115°42.120’E (on the foreshore at Halls Head) and extending to 32°31.109’S, 
115°42.140’E (approximately 120m north), then to 32°31.227’S, 115°42.411’E (approximately 
475m west-south-west), then to 32°31.254’S, 115°42.407’E (approximately 50m south on the Janis 
Street groyne). All coordinates based on GDA 94. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 

MX402* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

BOATING PROHIBITED AREA 
City of Mandurah 

Mandurah Ocean Marina 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 20 May 2008. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, the 
department hereby revokes Notice MX403 as published in the Government Gazette on 10 November 
2006 and hereby closes the following area of water to all craft until further notice— 

Mandurah Ocean Marina: All the waters of the marina which lie to the south-east of a line 
drawn between points 32° 31.523’ S, 115° 43.013’ E and 32° 31.508’ S, 115° 43.030’ E. All 
coordinates based on GDA 94. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 

MX403* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 
NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 1958 

WATER SKI AREA 
City of Mandurah 

Comet Bay 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 20 May 2008. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 48A of the Navigable Waters Regulations 
1958, the department hereby revokes Notice TR401 as published in the Government Gazette on 
2 October 1998 and defines and sets aside the following area of Navigable Water for the purpose of 
Water Skiing— 

Comet Bay: The waters of Comet Bay between Robert Point and Becher Point including the 
designated water ski take-off area but excluding— 

 – all other waters within 200 metres of the shore, 
 – all the waters within a radius of 800 metres of the seaward ends of the Mandurah Estuary 

entrance groynes, 
 – all the waters within 100 metres of Bight Reef. 
The area designated as a water ski take-off area lies between the seaward prolongation of the 
boundary between Lot 10 and Lot 11 Ormsby Terrace, Silver Sands, and the seaward prolongation of 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1955 

 

the boundary between Lot 3 and Lot 42 Ormsby Terrace, a distance along the shore of approximately 
165 metres. Bathing shall be prohibited within the water ski take-off area.  

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 

MX404* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

BOATING PROHIBITED AREA 
Shire of Esperance 

Bandy Creek Boat Harbour 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 20 May 2008. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, the 
department hereby revokes Notice MX402 as published in the Government Gazette on 27 November 
2007 and hereby closes the following area of water to all craft until further notice— 

Bandy Creek Boat Harbour: All those waters of Bandy Creek Boat Harbour bounded by lines 
commencing at a point 33°49.911’S, 121°56.067’E (on the southern foreshore of the harbour 
basin); thence northerly to a point 33°49.895’S, 121°56.078’E; thence westerly to 33°49.898’S, 
121°56.014’E (on the eastern side of the navigation channel); thence south-westerly to 
33°49.988’S, 121°55.973’E; thence easterly to 33°49.994’S, 121°56.004’E (on the foreshore on the 
eastern side of the harbour entrance); thence north-easterly to 33°49.922’S, 121°56.037’E; thence 
north-easterly back to the point of commencement. All coordinates based on GDA 94. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
NOTICE OF EXPIRY  

Exploration Permit Nos. WA-301-P, WA-304-P and WA-305-P expired on 22 April 2008. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 
 

——————————— 
 

MP402* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
NOTICE OF EXPIRY  

Exploration Permit No. WA-303-P expired on 24 April 2008. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 
 

——————————— 
 

MP403* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
GRANT OF EXPLORATION PERMIT 

Exploration Permit number WA-410-P has been granted to Santos Offshore Pty Ltd, Chevron 
Australia (W07-5) Pty Ltd and Inpex Browse Ltd to have effect for a period of six (6) years from 5 May 
2008. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 



1956 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

MP404* 

Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 

GRANT OF EXPLORATION PERMIT 

Exploration Permit number WA-411-P has been granted to Santos Offshore Pty Ltd, Beach Petroleum 
Limited and Inpex Browse Ltd to have effect for a period of six (6) years from 5 May 2008. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

MP405* 

Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 

PROHIBITION OF ENTRY INTO A SAFETY ZONE 

I, William Lee Tinapple, the Director Petroleum and Royalties Division of the Department of Industry 
and Resources of the said State by instrument of delegation dated 25 July 2007, and pursuant to 
section 119 of the above Act, hereby prohibit all vessels other than vessels under control of the 
registered holders of Production Licence WA-28-L, vessels operated by authorised persons who are 
exercising powers under Division 6A of Part III section 140 (A) (1) of the above Act and Australian 
Customs Vessels defined as Commonwealth ships under the Australian Customs Act 1901 from 
entering or remaining in the area of the safety zone without the consent in writing of the Director, 
Petroleum and Royalties Division.  

This safety zone, comprising the FPSO 280m plus 500m Safety Zone, extends to a distance of seven 
hundred and eighty metres (780m) radiused from the Internal Turret of the Vincent FPSO.  

GDA94 Coordinates 21°26’02.399”S 114°04’01.382’’E radius 780m 

The Safety Zone remains in force for the duration of the above operational activities. 

Where an unauthorised vessel enters or remains in the safety zone specified in contravention of this 
instrument, the owner and the person in command or in charge of the vessel are each guilty of an 
offence against section 119 of the Act and are punishable, upon conviction, by a fine not exceeding 
$100,000 or imprisonment for a term not exceeding 10 years, or both, pursuant to section 119(3) of the 
Act. 

Dated this 15th  day of May 2008. 

Made under the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1967 of the Commonwealth of Australia. 

WILLIAM LEE TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and 
Royalties Division. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME 

NOTICE OF REVOCATION 

Kelmscott Town Centre 

File: 810-2-22-2 

The Western Australian Planning Commission acting pursuant to clause 32 of the Metropolitan 
Region Scheme has resolved to revoke its resolution 61 for Kelmscott Town Centre in the City of 
Armadale, as published on Page 1357 of the Government Gazette dated 22 April 2005. 

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 



20 May 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1957 

 

PI402* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Brookton 

Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 6 
Ref: 853/4/6/3 Pt 6 

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Brookton local planning scheme amendment on 8 April 2008 for the purpose of— 

 1. Rezoning Lot 265 Cumming Road, Brookton from Rural Townsite to Residential (R10). 
 2. Amending the Scheme Map accordingly. 

L. R. EYRE, Shire President. 
G. A. CLARK, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PI403* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

Shire of Brookton 

Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 7 

Ref: 853/4/6/3 Pt 7 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Brookton local planning scheme amendment on 8 April 2008 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lot 1 Lennard Street, Brookton and Lot 40 Monger Street, Brookton from ‘Public 

Purpose Reserve’ to ‘Rural Townsite’. 

 2. Amending the Scheme Map accordingly. 

L. R. EYRE, Shire President. 
G. A. CLARK, Chief Executive Officer. 

WATER/SEWERAGE 

WA401* 

WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984 

TRIAL BIOSOLIDS STORAGE FACILITY 

Shire of Moora  

Authorisation to construct Trial Biosolids Storage Facility  

In accordance with the provisions of the Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984, the Minister for Water 
Resources has authorised the Water Corporation to construct the Trial Biosolids Storage Facility, 
comprising of— 

 • An access and earthworks pad with concrete loading apron and two biosolids storage sheds; 
and  

 • A drainage system with monitoring pits and a sump to collect, monitor and store leachate. 

The location of the proposed Works will be within the Shire of Moora, with the Works located within 
Lot M1239. 

The Notice of Proposal to construct the Works was advertised on 7 December 2007. 

When completed, the Works will improve the management of biosolids within the shires Moora and 
Victoria Plains. 



1958 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 May 2008 

 

This Authorisation shall take effect from 28 April 2008 and construction will commence after this 
date.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
In the matter of the will of Thomas McGiverin Tennent formerly of 4 Kincaid Road, Greenfields,, 
Western Australia, late of Peel Health Campus, Lakes Road, Greenfields in the State of Western 
Australia, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 27 February 2008 are required by the personal 
representative to send particulars of their claims to her care of Clement & Co, Lawyers, Unit 2, 
12 Sutton Street, Mandurah by 2 July 2008 after which date the personal representative may convey 
or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which she then has notice. 

CLEMENT & CO, as solicitors for the personal representative. 

 

 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

SENTENCE ADMINISTRATION ACT 2003 
Price: $25.05 counter sales 
Plus postage on 385 grams 

 
 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 


