
!200800098GG! 
 

  2703 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 20 JUNE 2008 No. 98 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Animal Welfare Act 2002—Animal Welfare (General) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2008.............................................................................................................................  2719 

Defamation Act 2005—Defamation (Damages for Non-economic Loss) Order 2008 ..............  2707 
Local Government Act 1995—Local Government (Financial Management) Amendment 

Regulations 2008 ....................................................................................................................  2720 
Mining Act 1978—Mining Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008 ..........................................  2728 
Proclamations— 

Police Amendment Act 2008—No. 8 of 2008.....................................................................  2706 
Waste Avoidance and Resource Recovery Act 2007—No. 36 of 2007 ..............................  2705 
Waste Avoidance and Resource Recovery Levy Act 2007—No. 37 of 2007 .....................  2705 

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992—Rates and Charges (Rebates and 
Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2008 .........................................................................  2732 

Registration of Deeds Act 1856—Registration of Deeds Amendment Regulations 2008 .......  2708 
Strata Titles Act 1985—Strata Titles General Amendment Regulations 2008 ......................  2709 
Transfer of Land Act 1893—Transfer of Land Amendment Regulations 2008 ......................  2710 
Valuation of Land Act 1978—Valuation of Land Amendment Regulations 2008 ..................  2718 
Working with Children (Criminal Record Checking) Act 2004—Working with Children 

(Criminal Record Checking) Amendment (Road Traffic) Regulations 2008 ........................  2706 
 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Agriculture .................................................................................................................................  2733 
Cemeteries..................................................................................................................................  2734 
Consumer and Employment Protection ....................................................................................  2737 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  2749 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  2737 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................  2738 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  2738 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  2739 
Parliament..................................................................................................................................  2740 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  2741 
Police ..........................................................................................................................................  2745 
Public Notices.............................................................................................................................  2750 
Public Sector Management........................................................................................................  2748 
Racing, Gaming and Liquor.......................................................................................................  2748 
 
 



 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

WARNING — PRICE INCREASE 
ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 

EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2008 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$25.60 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$59.70 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$59.70 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.95 

  Bulk Notices—$218.20 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2705 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 

AA101* 

WASTE AVOIDANCE AND RESOURCE RECOVERY  
LEVY ACT 2007 

No. 37 of 2007 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 

By the Honourable 
David Kingsley Malcolm, 

Companion of the Order of Australia, 
Queen’s Counsel, Lieutenant-Governor and 

deputy of the Governor of the State of 
Western Australia 

DAVID KINGSLEY MALCOLM 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, acting under the Waste 
Avoidance and Resource Recovery Levy Act 2007 section 2(b) and with the advice and 
consent of the Executive Council, fix 1 July 2008 as the day on which the provisions 
of that Act other than sections 1 and 2 come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 17 June 2008. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

DAVID TEMPLEMAN, Minister for the Environment. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
AA102* 

WASTE AVOIDANCE AND RESOURCE RECOVERY ACT 2007 
No. 36 of 2007 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 

By the Honourable 
David Kingsley Malcolm, 

Companion of the Order of Australia, 
Queen’s Counsel, Lieutenant-Governor and 

deputy of the Governor of the State of 
Western Australia 

DAVID KINGSLEY MALCOLM 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, acting under the Waste 
Avoidance and Resource Recovery Act 2007 section 2(b) and with the advice and 
consent of the Executive Council, fix 1 July 2008 as the day on which Part 1, other 
than sections 1, 2 and 3, Parts 2 to 8, Part 9, other than sections 100 and 101, 
Schedules 1, 2 and 3, Schedule 4, other than clauses 2(1), (2), (3) and (4), 3 and 5, 
and Schedule 5, other than clauses 1, 7 and 8, of that Act come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 17 June 2008. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

DAVID TEMPLEMAN, Minister for the Environment. 

Note: Schedule 4 clauses 2(3) and 3 have not come into operation. 



2706 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

AA103* 
POLICE AMENDMENT ACT 2008 

No. 8 of 2008 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 

By the Honourable 
David Kingsley Malcolm, 

Companion of the Order of Australia, 
Queen’s Counsel, Lieutenant-Governor and 

deputy of the Governor of the State of 
Western Australia 

DAVID KINGSLEY MALCOLM 
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, acting under the Police 
Amendment Act 2008 section 2(2) and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, fix the day after the day on which this proclamation is published in the 
Government Gazette as the day on which section 23 of that Act comes into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 17 June 2008. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 

JOHN KOBELKE, Minister for Police and Emergency Services. 

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 

CX301* 

Working with Children (Criminal Record Checking) Act 2004 

Working with Children (Criminal Record 
Checking) Amendment (Road Traffic) 

Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Working with Children (Criminal 
Record Checking) Amendment (Road Traffic) Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day on which the 
Road Traffic Amendment Act 2006 section 6 comes into 
operation. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2707 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Working with 
Children (Criminal Record Checking) Regulations 2005. 

4. Regulation 18 amended 

 (1) Regulation 18(1) and (2) are each amended by deleting “driver’s 
licence as of class F or class T” and inserting instead —  

  “    driver’s licence endorsed with extension F or T    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 18(3) is amended by deleting the definition of 
“driver’s licence as of class F or class T” and inserting 
instead —  

“     
 “driver’s licence endorsed with extension F or T” 

means a driver’s licence under the Road Traffic 
Act 1974 endorsed with extension F or T, or an 
equivalent authorisation to drive. 

    ”. 
 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and  
deputy of the Governor, 
 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

JUSTICE 

JU301* 

Defamation Act 2005 

Defamation (Damages for Non-economic Loss) 
Order 2008 

Made by the Minister under section 35(3) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Defamation (Damages for Non-economic Loss) 
Order 2008. 

2. Adjustment to maximum damages amount 

  It is declared that from 1 July 2008 the amount that applies for 
the purposes of section 35(1) is $280 500. 

 
J. McGINTY, Attorney General. 



2708 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

LAND 

LA301* 

Registration of Deeds Act 1856 

Registration of Deeds Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Registration of Deeds Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Registration of 
Deeds Regulations 2004. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in Division 1 item 1 by deleting “$85” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $88    ”; 

 (b) in Division 1 item 2 by deleting “$85” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $88    ”; 

 (c) in Division 2 item 1 by deleting “$13.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $15.00    ”; 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2709 

 (d) in Division 3 item 2 by deleting “$85” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $88    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LA302* 

Strata Titles Act 1985 

Strata Titles General Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Strata Titles General Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Strata Titles 
General Regulations 1996. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 item 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a)(i) by deleting “191.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    197.00    ”; 



2710 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

 (b) in paragraph (a)(ii) by deleting “133.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    137.00    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (a) by deleting “52.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    54.00    ”; 

 (d) in paragraph (b) by deleting “133.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    137.00    ”; 

 (e) in paragraph (c) by deleting “86.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    89.00    ”; 

 (f) in paragraph (d) by deleting “85.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    88.00    ”; 

 (g) in paragraph (e) by deleting “85.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    88.00    ”; 

 (h) in paragraph (f) by deleting “85.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    88.00    ”; 

 (i) in paragraph (g) by deleting “85.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    88.00    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

LA303* 

Transfer of Land Act 1893 

Transfer of Land Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Transfer of Land Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2711 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Transfer of Land 
Regulations 2004. 

4. Regulation 6 amended 

  Regulation 6(4) is amended by inserting after paragraph (a) —  

“     
 (ba) Schedule 1 Division 4 item 6 if the matter 

relates to an application to bring land under 
the Act; or 

 (bb) Schedule 1 Division 7 item 1 if the matter 
relates to an application to bring land under 
the Act; or 

    ”. 

5. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 1 — Fees 

[r. 6(1), (1a), (1b), (1c), (2), (2a), (2b)] 

Division 1 — Registrations and recordings 

1. Of a transfer of a mortgage or charge —  

  first mortgage or charge ............................................ $88 

  subsequent mortgage or charge ................................. $13 

2. Of a transfer if stamp duty is assessed under the Stamp 
Act 1921 Second Schedule item 6 or is exempted under 
section 75AB or 119 of that Act before lodgment for 
registration, or is exempt under the Third Schedule to 
that Act ........................................................................... 

 
 
 
 
$88 

3. Of a transfer of a lease, surrender, easement or 
restrictive covenant ......................................................... 

 
$88 

4. Of any other transfer where the value of the 
consideration in respect of the land or the value of the 
land as assessed under the Stamp Act 1921, whichever 
is the greater —  

 

  does not exceed $85 000 ................................................ $88 

  exceeds $85 000 but does not exceed $120 000 ....... $98 

  exceeds $120 000 but does not exceed $200 000 ......... $118 

 plus, for each whole or part $100 000 above  
$200 000 ......................................................................... 

 
$20 



2712 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

 Note: Where —  

 (a) stamp duty is assessed on a parcel of land; and 

 (b) transfers are lodged for parts of that parcel; and 

 (c) a separate value for each part is not allocated in the 
contract, 

 

  the fee for registering and recording the first of the transfers 
lodged for registration is to be assessed under item 4 on the 
value as assessed under the Stamp Act 1921 of the parcel 
and, subject to proof of the payment of that fee, the fee for 
registering and recording each of the second and 
subsequent of the transfers is ................................................ 

 
 
 
 
 
$88 

Note: The fees specified in items 1 to 4 include the creation and 
registration of a new certificate of title where such certificate is 
required by the Registrar. 

 

5. Of a mortgage or charge or of a whole or partial 
discharge of a mortgage or charge — for each 
interest ............................................................................ 

 
 
$88 

6. Of an extension of a mortgage or charge — for each 
interest .............................................................................

 
$88 

7. Of a Crown lease or of a freehold lease or sub-lease or 
extension of a freehold lease ...........................................

 
$88 

8. Of a memorial or notification under any State or 
Commonwealth Act (unless exempted from payment 
under that Act) ................................................................ 

 
 
$88 

9. Of an order of the Supreme Court, the District Court or 
the Magistrates Court ......................................................

 
$88 

10. Of revocation of a power of attorney .............................. $88 

11. Of an instrument not specifically provided for in this 
Division ...........................................................................

 
$88 

Division 2 — Lodgments 

1. Of a caveat, a power of attorney or a declaration of 
trust ................................................................................ 

 
$88 

2. Of a deposited plan —   

  (a) general fee —  

   (i) if approval of Western Australian 
Planning Commission is required ..............

 
$197 

   (ii) if approval of Western Australian 
Planning Commission is not required ........

 
$137 

  (b) for each lot (including any lot shown on an 
inset on the plan) other than a lot vesting in the 
Crown under the Planning and Development 
Act 2005 section 152 ..........................................

 
 
 
$54 

3. Of a replacement deposited plan for a certified correct 
deposited plan — 

 

  (a) if approval of Western Australian 
Planning Commission is required ....................

 
$197 

  (b) if approval of Western Australian 
Planning Commission is not required .............

 
$137 

4. Of a replacement deposited plan for a deposited plan in 
respect of which a requisition has been raised prior to 
preparation of Western Australian Planning 
Commission’s prints .......................................................

 
 
 
$137 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2713 

5. Of a duplicate certificate of title or lease for the 
registration or recording of a dealing lodged by a third 
party —  

 

  (a) for the first certificate of title or lease ........... $44 

  (b) for each subsequent certificate of title or 
lease ............................................................... 

 
$6 

6. Of a memorandum within the meaning of section 54(1) 
of the Act — section 54(2) of the Act ........................... 

 
$88 

7. Of a form for the notification of a factor affecting the 
use or enjoyment of land — section 70A(1) of the Act  

 
$88 

8. Of an instrument for a restrictive covenant created 
under section 129BA of the Act — 
section 129BA(2)(b) of the Act ..................................... 

 
 
$88 

9. Of an instrument for an easement created under 
Part IVA of the Act — section 136C(4) of the Act ....... 

 
$88 

10. Of an instrument for a restrictive covenant created 
under Part IVA of the Act — section 136D(3) of 
the Act ............................................................................ 

 
 
$88 

Division 3 — Withdrawals 

1. Of a caveat, order of the Supreme Court, the District 
Court or the Magistrates Court, a memorial under the 
Taxation Administration Act 2003 Part 6 Division 2 or 
a memorial under the Land Tax Assessment Act 1976 
section 46 that was registered before that Act was 
repealed, or any other Act or Commonwealth Act 
(unless exempted from payment under that Act) ......... 

 
 
 
 
 
 
$88 

2. Of a document from registration or recording ............. $44 

Division 4 — Applications 

1. For a new certificate of title in respect of undivided 
shares in land —  

 

  (a) for one certificate ............................................. $88 

  (b) for each additional certificate ........................... $6 

2. For a new certificate of title the subject of a deposited 
plan ................................................................................ 

 
$88 

 plus, for each lot shown on the deposited plan, other 
than a lot that is proposed to be vested in the Crown 
under the Planning and Development Act 2005 
section 152 ..................................................................... 

 
 
 
$6 

3. For a new certificate of title in any other case ............... $88 

4. To amend certificates of title of other owners affected 
by section 170 of the Act — for each certificate of title 
affected .......................................................................... 

 
 
$88 

5. To serve a section 138A caveator with notice under 
section 138B of the Act ................................................. 

 
$176 

6. For each replacement edition of a duplicate certificate 
of title where a duplicate certificate of title was issued 
on the registration of the certificate of title ................... 

 
 
$88 

7. An application in respect of any matter not specifically 
provided for in this Division .......................................... 

 
$88 



2714 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

Division 5 — Certificates 

1. For the issue of a certificate of title, either on request 
or where necessary in connection with an application 
or process (except where this service is included in 
another fee) .................................................................... 

 
 
 
$88 

2. For a certificate of ownership issued under the Local 
Government Act 1995 section 9.41................................. 

 
$60 

3. For certification by the Registrar of a certificate of 
title, Crown lease, deposited plan, plan, diagram or 
other document .............................................................. 

 
 
$60 

4. For the issue of a certified and sealed document for the 
purposes of section 239B(1)(b) of the Act .................... 

 
fee as 
assessed 
by the 
Registrar, 
not 
exceeding 
actual 
cost 

Division 6 — Inspection and/or copies of documents 

1. Inspection of a Crown lease, Crown title, permit or 
licence ............................................................................ 

 
$15 

2. Copy of a Crown lease, Crown title, permit or licence  $15 

3. Inspection of a Crown land lease ................................... $15 

4. Copy of a Crown land lease ........................................... $15 

5. Inspection of a certificate of title —   

  (a) where required as a result of a check search .... $8 

  (b) in other cases .................................................... $15 

6. Copy of a certificate of title —  

  (a) where required as a result of a check search .... $8 

  (b) in other cases .................................................... $15 

7. Inspection of a plan, diagram or deposited plan ............ $15 

8. Copy of a plan, diagram or deposited plan .................... $15 

9. Inspection of a licensed surveyor’s field book .............. $15 

10. Copy of a licensed surveyor’s field book ...................... $15 

11. Copy of a plan, diagram, deposited plan, survey index 
plan or licensed surveyor’s field book obtained by use 
of departmental self-service equipment ......................... 

 
 
fee as 
assessed 
by the 
Registrar, 
not 
exceeding 
actual 
cost  

12. Inspection of the record of dealings and matters 
referred to in section 48A(2) or 81P of the Act, as is 
relevant to the case, that were endorsed on previous 
digital versions of a digital title, but are not endorsed 
on the current version of that digital title .......................

 
 
 
 
$7 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2715 

13. Inspection of other documents and related information 
not specifically provided for in this Division, including 
documents listed as subject to dealing and status 
reports ............................................................................ 

 
 
 
$15 per 
document 

14. Copy of other documents and related information not 
specifically provided for in this Division, including 
documents listed as subject to dealing and status 
reports ............................................................................ 

 
 
 
$15 per 
document 

15. Inspection of a survey index plan .................................. $15 

16. Copy of a survey index plan .......................................... $15 

17. Check search .................................................................. $7 

18. In response to a request via a privately owned data 
terminal for the results of any of the following searches 
to be sent to that data terminal —  

 

  (a) check search ..................................................... $7 

  (b) search of the power of attorney file for the 
number of a power of attorney document if the 
number is given with confirmation of the 
document’s existence ....................................... 

 
 
 
$1 

Note: The fees specified in item 18 include the taking a hard copy of 
screen print. 

 

19. In response to a request via a privately owned 
facsimile machine for the results of any search referred 
to in items 1 to 17 — for each request (in addition to 
the fees payable under items 1 to 17) ............................ 

 
 
 
$2.40 

20. For arranging the postal delivery of any material for 
which a fee is payable under this Schedule — 

 

  (a) if the material is sent within Australia and is 
not greater than 50 grams ................................. 

 
$9 

  (b) if the material is sent outside Australia or is 
greater than 50 grams ....................................... 

 
$9 plus 
any 
additional 
costs 
incurred, 
as assessed 
by the 
Registrar 

21. Search of the power of attorney file for the number of a 
power of attorney document (unless item 18(b) 
applies) ........................................................................... 

 
 
$7 

22. Inspection of a power of attorney document where the 
number is known ............................................................ 

 
$15 

23. Copy of a power of attorney document where the 
number is known ............................................................ 

 
$15 



2716 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

Division 7 — Miscellaneous 

1. For advertising (minimum fee payable on lodgment 
of application, additional actual cost payable when 
actual cost is known) ................................................... 

 
 
$88 plus 
actual cost 
above $88 

2. For —   

  (a) a map or a colouring of a map on a copy of a 
certificate of title, Crown lease, deposited 
plan or other document; or 

 

  (b) drafting of a deposited plan or other 
document; or 

 (c) the provision of consultancy services relating 
to project planning and project conveyancing 

 
 

 
fee as 
assessed by 
the 
Registrar, 
not 
exceeding 
actual cost 

3. For dispensing with the production of a duplicate of a 
certificate of title or other instrument ..........................

 
$88 

4. Supply of statement of grounds ................................... $88 

5. Order for stay of registration under section 148 of 
the Act ................................................................................

 
$88 

6. For requisitions raised on —  

  (a) a deposited plan or other survey document ... $89 

  (b) any other document —   

   (i) if the requisition is complied with and 
this fee is paid before 5.00 p.m. on the 
business day following the day on which 
the requisition is issued .......................... 

 
 
 
$44 

   (ii) otherwise ................................................ $66 

7. For amendments made to a deposited plan or other 
survey document in respect of which requisitions 
have been raised .......................................................... 

 
 
fee as 
assessed by 
the 
Registrar, 
not 
exceeding 
actual cost 

8. For serving a caveator with notice under section 138 
or 141A of the Act — each caveat .............................. 

 
$88 

9. Cancellation of a plan or diagram ............................... $65 

10. Search of an historic tenure ......................................... fee as 
assessed by 
the 
Registrar, 
not 
exceeding 
actual cost 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2717 

11. Providing a replica of a certificate of title, plan or 
document registered in the State ................................. 

 
actual cost 

12. Amendment to a deposited plan resulting in a 
new version including excisions, addition or 
amendment of lots, easements, and interests and 
notifications table and lodged layer updates ............... 

 
 
 
$43.50 

 if a deposited plan, plan or diagram has been certified 
correct and is to be forwarded to Western Australian 
Planning Commission, an additional fee of …............ 

 
 
$60 

13. For rejection of a document under section 192(1) of 
the Act ......................................................................... 

 
75% of the 
registration, 
recording, 
lodgment 
or 
application 
fee paid or 

  payable on 
the 
document 
(rounded 
down to the 
nearest 
multiple 
of $1) 

14. For registrations and recordings under Division 1, 
lodgments under Division 2 and applications under 
Division 4 — involving more than 10 certificates or 
leases — each certificate or lease in excess of 10 ....... 

 
 
 
$6 

15. For the priority processing of a transfer, mortgage, 
discharge of mortgage, withdrawal of caveat, or 
survivorship application, or not more than 4 of such 
documents if lodged together, or of an enduring 
power of attorney, subject to regulation 5A ................ 

 
 
 
 
$32 

    ”. 

6. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended by inserting after item 8 the following 
item —  

“     
9. An application for the issue of a duplicate certificate of 

title where a duplicate certificate of title was not issued 
on the registration of the certificate of title. 

    ”. 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 



2718 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

LA304* 

Valuation of Land Act 1978 

Valuation of Land Amendment 
Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Valuation of Land Amendment 
Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Valuation of 
Land Regulations 1979. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 by deleting “100.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    125.00    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “40.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    50.00    ”; 

 (c) in item 3 by deleting “4.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    7.00    ”; 

 (d) in item 4 by deleting “12.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    15.00    ”. 
 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and 
deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2719 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 

Animal Welfare Act 2002 

Animal Welfare (General) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Animal Welfare (General) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Animal Welfare 
(General) Regulations 2003. 

4. Schedule 1 amended  

  Schedule 1 is amended by deleting item 13 and inserting the 
following item instead —  

“     
13. Model Code of Practice for the Welfare of Animals: Pigs 

(3rd Edition) 

 First published by the Primary Industries 
Ministerial Council in 2008  

    ”. 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 Form 1 is amended by deleting “complaint” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    prosecution notice    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



2720 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

LG302* 

Local Government Act 1995 

Local Government (Financial Management) 
Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Local Government (Financial 
Management) Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on the day after that day or 
on 1 July 2008, whichever is the later. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Local 
Government (Financial Management) Regulations 1996. 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

 (1) Regulation 3(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting the following definitions —  

“AAS 5” 

“AAS 27” 
“Australian Accounting Standard” 

“material” 

“non-current asset” 

“operating revenue” 
“operating statement” 

“statement of cash flows” 

“statement of financial position”; 

 (b) by inserting in the appropriate alphabetical positions — 

“     
 “AAS” means the Australian Accounting Standards 

made and amended from time to time by the 
Australian Accounting Standards Board; 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2721 

 “Australian Accounting Standards Board” means 
the body corporate of that name continued by the 
Australian Securities and Investments Commission 
Act 2001 (Commonwealth); 

 “balance sheet” means a balance sheet (or equivalent) 
that meets the requirements of the AAS for 
balance sheets; 

 “cash flow statement” means a cash flow statement 
(or equivalent) that meets the requirements of the 
AAS for cash flow statements; 

 “Form”, if followed by a number, means the form of 
that number in Schedule 2; 

 “income statement” means an income statement (or 
equivalent) that meets the requirements of the 
AAS for income statements; 

 “material variance” means a variance that is material 
for the purposes of the AAS; 

 “non-current asset” means an asset that is not a 
current asset for the purposes of the AAS; 

 “operating revenue” means revenue that is operating 
revenue for the purposes of the AAS; 

 “restricted asset”, of a local government, means an 
asset the use of which is restricted, wholly or 
partly, by a law made or a requirement imposed 
outside of the control of the local government, 
where the restriction is relevant to assessing the 
performance, financial position or financing and 
investment of the local government; 

    ”; 

 (c) by deleting the semicolon after the definition of 
“section” and inserting instead a full stop. 

 (2) Regulation 3(2) is repealed and the following subregulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (2) If a term is given a meaning in the AAS, it has the 

same meaning in these regulations unless the contrary 
intention appears. 

    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 3(3) is repealed. 

5. Regulation 4 replaced 

  Regulation 4 is repealed and the following regulation is inserted 
instead —  

“     
4. Effect of AAS 

 (1) These regulations are in addition to and not in 
derogation of the requirements of the AAS. 



2722 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

 (2) If a provision of the AAS is inconsistent with a 
provision of these regulations, the provision of these 
regulations prevails to the extent of the inconsistency. 

 (3) All words in the Act or these regulations that import 
revenue or expenditure are to be interpreted to permit 
compliance with the requirements of the AAS. 

    ”. 

6. Regulation 5A inserted 

  After the heading to Part 2 the following regulation is 
inserted — 

“     
5A. Local governments to comply with AAS 

  Subject to regulation 4, the annual budget, annual 
financial report and other financial reports of a local 
government must comply with the AAS. 

    ”. 

7. Regulation 14 replaced 

  Regulation 14 is repealed and the following regulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
14. Disclosure requirements for operating revenue and 

expenses 

  If the AAS require operating revenue or expenses to be 
disclosed by nature or type classification, disclosure in 
accordance with those standards must be by means of 
notes to, or a separate statement accompanying, the 
annual budget and the annual financial report. 

    ”. 

8. Regulation 22 amended 

 (1) Regulation 22(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by inserting after “includes” —  

  “    the following    ”; 

 (b) by deleting paragraphs (a) and (b) and inserting 
instead — 

“     
 (a) an income statement; 

 (b) a cash flow statement; 
    ”; 

 (c) by deleting paragraph (d)(i) and inserting instead —  

“     
 (i) the revenue and expenditure that have 

been taken into account to determine the 
budget deficiency; and 

    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “and” after paragraph (h). 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2723 

 (2) Regulation 22(2) by deleting “statement of cash flows,” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    cash flow statement,    ”. 

9. Regulation 27 amended 

  Regulation 27 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (i)(i) by deleting “operating” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    income    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (j) by deleting “operating” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    income    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (n) by deleting “operating statement.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    income statement.    ”. 

10. Regulation 30 amended 

  Regulation 30(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “operating” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    income    ”; 

 (b) by inserting after paragraph (a) —  

  “    and    ”. 

11. Regulation 33 amended 

  Regulation 33 is amended by deleting “Executive Director” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    Departmental CEO    ”.   

12. Regulation 33A amended 

 (1) Regulation 33A(1) is amended by inserting after “each” —  

  “    financial    ”. 

 (2) After regulation 33A(1) the following subregulation is 
inserted — 

“     
 (2A) The review of an annual budget for a financial year 

must — 

 (a) consider the local government’s financial 
performance in the period beginning on 1 July 
and ending no earlier than 31 December in that 
financial year; and 

 (b) consider the local government’s financial 
position as at the date of the review; and 



2724 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

 (c) review the outcomes for the end of that 
financial year that are forecast in the budget. 

    ”. 

13. Regulation 34 amended 

 (1) Regulation 34 is amended by inserting before 
subregulation (1) — 

“     
 (1A) In this regulation — 

 “committed assets” means revenue unspent but set 
aside under the annual budget for a specific 
purpose. 

    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 34(1) is amended by deleting “sources and 
applications of funds,” and inserting instead —  

  “    revenue and expenditure,    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 34(3) is amended by inserting after paragraph (a) — 

  “    or    ”. 

 (4) Regulation 34(4)(a) and “and” after it are deleted and the 
following is inserted instead — 

“     
 (a) presented at an ordinary meeting of the council 

within 2 months after the end of the month to 
which the statement relates; and 

    ”. 

 (5) Regulation 34(5) is amended by deleting “AAS 5,” and 
inserting instead — 

  “    the AAS,    ”. 

 (6) Regulation 34(6) is repealed. 

14. Regulation 36 amended 

 (1) Regulation 36(1)(a) is amended by deleting “operating” and 
inserting instead — 

  “    income    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 36(2) and the Table to it are repealed and the 
following is inserted instead —  

“     
 (2) The annual financial report is to include the 

following — 

 (a) the rate setting statement included under 
regulation 22(1)(d) in the annual budget for the 
year to which the report relates; 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2725 

 (b) adjacent to each item in that rate setting 
statement that states an amount, the end-of-year 
amount for the item; 

 (c) adjacent to each item in the income statement 
that states an end-of-year amount, the original 
or amended budget estimate for the item; 

 (d) adjacent to each item that states an end-of-year 
amount required by a provision of these 
regulations listed in the Table to this 
subregulation, the original or amended budget 
estimate for the item. 

Table 

Provision  Provision Provision 
r. 36(1)(a) r. 36(1)(e) r. 38(1)(b) 

r. 38(1)(c) r. 38(1)(e) r. 39(a) 

r. 39(b)(v) r. 39(d)(iv) r. 39(e)(vi) 

r. 39(e)(vii) r. 40(d) r. 40(e) 

r. 42(2) r. 43(a)(ii) r. 43(b)(ii) 

r. 43(c)(iv) r. 44(b) r. 45(a)(i) 

r. 45(b) r. 46(a) r. 48(d)(i) 

r. 48(d)(vii) r. 48(f)(ii)-(v) r. 49 
    ”. 

15. Regulation 38 amended 

 (1) Regulation 38(1)(f) is amended by deleting “statement of 
financial position —” and inserting instead —  

  “    balance sheet    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 38(2) is amended by deleting “AAS 27” and 
inserting instead — 

  “    the AAS,    ”. 

16. Regulation 45 amended 

  Regulation 45 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by inserting after “include” —  

  “    the following    ”; 

 (b) by deleting paragraph (a)(i) and (ii) and “and” after 
subparagraph (ii) and inserting instead —  

“     
 (i) an income statement; 

 (ii) a balance sheet; 
    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “and” after paragraph (a); 

 (d) in paragraph (b) by deleting “operating” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    income    ”. 



2726 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

17. Regulation 46 amended 

  Regulation 46 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (d) by deleting “principal activities,” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    the future,    ”; 

 (b) by inserting after each of paragraphs (a) and (b) — 

  “    and    ”. 

18. Regulation 50 amended 

  Regulation 50(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting the following definitions —  

“current assets” 

“current liabilities” 

“restricted assets” 

“total assets” 

“total liabilities” 

“total revenue”; 

 (b) by inserting in the appropriate alphabetical positions — 

“     
 “current assets” means the total current assets as 

shown in the balance sheet; 

 “current liabilities” means the total current liabilities 
as shown in the balance sheet; 

 “total assets” means all current and non-current assets 
as shown in the balance sheet; 

 “total liabilities” means all current and non-current 
liabilities as shown in the balance sheet; 

 “total revenue” means the total operating revenue 
excluding all specific purpose grants, contributions 
and donations that are used for asset development 
and acquisition; 

    ”. 

19. Regulation 51 amended 

  Regulation 51(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “Executive Director” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    Departmental CEO    ”; 

 (b) by inserting before “CEO” — 

  “    local government’s    ”. 

20. Regulation 54 amended 

  Regulation 54(b) is deleted. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2727 

21. Part 6 replaced 

  Part 6 is repealed and the following Part is inserted instead — 

“     
Part 6 — Transitional matters 

79. Local Government (Financial Management) 
Amendment Regulations 2008, provisions for 

 (1) In this regulation — 

 “amending regulations” means the Local Government 
(Financial Management) Amendment 
Regulations 2008, other than regulations 1 and 2 
of those regulations; 

 “new law” means these regulations as in force after the 
amending regulations come into operation; 

 “old law” means these regulations as in force 
immediately before the amending regulations 
come into operation. 

 (2) This regulation does not affect the operation of the 
Interpretation Act 1984 Part V unless the contrary 
intention appears. 

 (3) Despite the amending regulations, the old law applies 
to and in respect of the financial reports required for, 
and other matters relating to, the financial year ending 
on 30 June 2008. 

 (4) If a budget for the financial year beginning on 1 July 
2008 is adopted under section 6.2 before that date, it 
need not be revised to be in accordance with the new 
law. 

    ”. 

22. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 Part 2 is repealed and the following Part is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Part 2 — Nature or type classifications 

Revenue 

  Rates 
  Operating grants, subsidies and contributions 
  Non-operating grants, subsidies and contributions 
  Profit on asset disposals 
  Fees and charges 
  Service charges 
  Interest earnings 
  Other revenue 



2728 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

Expenditure 

  Employee costs  
  Material and contracts 
  Utility charges (electricity, gas, water etc.) 
  Depreciation on non-current assets 
  Loss on asset disposal 
  Interest expenses 
  Insurance expenses 
  Other expenditure 

    ”. 

23. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended in Form 1 by deleting “(except to the 
extent that these have been varied in the Statement of 
Accounting Policies required by Australian Accounting 
Standard AAS 6 “Accounting Policies” and the accompanying 
notes to the annual financial report)”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP301* 

Mining Act 1978 

Mining Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Mining Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2729 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Mining 
Regulations 1981. 

4. Second Schedule amended 

 (1) The Second Schedule item 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “42.13” and inserting instead —  

  “    43.56    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “142.34” and inserting instead —  

  “    147.18    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “265.10” and inserting instead —  

  “    274.12    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “110.11” and inserting instead —  

  “    113.85    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “171.27” and inserting instead —  

  “    177.10    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “232.43” and inserting instead —  

  “    240.35    ”; 

 (g) by deleting “440.22” and inserting instead —  

  “    455.18    ”; 

 (h) by deleting “12.87” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    13.31    ”; 

 (i) by deleting “14.52” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    14.96    ”; 

 (j) by deleting “$20.79” and inserting instead —  

  “    $22.00    ”; 

 (k) by deleting “2.09” and inserting instead —  

  “    2.20    ”; 

 (l) by deleting “6.38” and inserting instead —  

  “    6.60    ”. 

 (2) The Second Schedule item 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “241.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    250.00    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “1 032.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 070.00    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “346.00” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    360.00    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “234.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    240.00    ”; 



2730 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

 (e) by deleting “587.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    605.00    ”. 

 (3) The Second Schedule item 2A is amended by deleting “222.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    230.00    ”. 

 (4) The Second Schedule item 2B is amended by deleting “7.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    7.25    ”. 

 (5) The Second Schedule item 3 is amended by deleting “7.00” in 
each place where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    7.25    ”. 

 (6) The Second Schedule item 3A is amended by deleting “5.80” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    6.00    ”. 

 (7) The Second Schedule item 4 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “295.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    305.00    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “335.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    350.00    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “405.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    420.00    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “2 025.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    2 100.00    ”. 

 (8) The Second Schedule item 5  is amended by deleting “29.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    30.00    ”. 

 (9) The Second Schedule item 7 is amended by deleting “89.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    92.00    ”. 

 (10) The Second Schedule item 8 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$23.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $24.00    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “5.80” and inserting instead —  

  “    6.00    ”. 

 (11) The Second Schedule item 9 is amended by deleting “18.50” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    19.00    ”. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2731 

 (12) The Second Schedule item 10 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “89.00” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    92.00    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “5.80” and inserting instead —  

  “    6.00    ”. 

 (13) The Second Schedule item 11 is amended by deleting “179.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    185.00    ”. 

 (14) The Second Schedule item 11A is amended by deleting “7.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    7.25    ”. 

 (15) The Second Schedule item 13 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “50.00” in the first place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    52.00    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “35.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    36.00    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “5.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    5.20    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “15.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    15.50    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “7.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    7.25    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 



2732 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

TREASURY AND FINANCE 

TF301* 

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992 

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) 
Amendment Regulations 2008 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in 
Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Rates and Charges (Rebates and 
Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2008. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows: 

 (a) regulations 1 and 2 — on the day on which these 
regulations are published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2008. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Rates and 
Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Regulations 1992. 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

  The Table to regulation 3 is amended by inserting the following 
row at the end of the Table —  

“     
1/7/08 — 30/6/09 $78.95 $156.00 $16.50 $234.90 

    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 

 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2733 

— PART 2 — 

AGRICULTURE 

AG401* 
AGRICULTURE AND RELATED RESOURCES PROTECTION ACT 1976 

AGRICULTURE PROTECTION BOARD 
Rates 

South Perth, 
27 June 2008. 

The Agriculture Protection Board of Western Australia, acting pursuant to Sections 60 and 61 of the 
Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976, and with the approval of the Minister for 
Agriculture and Food, hereby imposes— 
 • in accordance with Section 60 of the Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976, a 

(matched) rate of— 
 (a) 2.41 cents in the dollar on the unimproved value of the land held in the Kimberley 

Zone, comprising the municipal districts of Broome, Derby-West Kimberley, Wyndham-
East Kimberley and Halls Creek;  

 (b) 2.98 cents in the dollar on the unimproved value of the land in the Pilbara Zone, 
comprising the municipal districts of Ashburton, Roebourne, Port Hedland, East 
Pilbara; 

 (c) 4.07 cents in the dollar on the unimproved value of the land held in the Carnarvon 
Zone, comprising the municipal districts of Shark Bay, Carnarvon, Exmouth, Upper 
Gascoyne, Murchison; 

 (d) 3.64 cents in the dollar on the unimproved value of the land held in the Meekatharra 
Zone, comprising the municipal districts of Yalgoo, Mount Magnet, Cue, Meekatharra; 

 (e) 4.08 cents in the dollar on the unimproved value of the land held in the Kalgoorlie 
Zone, comprising the municipal districts of Ngaanyatjarraku, Wiluna, Sandstone, 
Leonora, Laverton, Menzies, Coolgardie, Kalgoorlie/Boulder, Dundas; and 

 (f) 3.01 cents in the dollar on the unimproved value of the other land within the State of 
Western Australia not forming part of the Kimberley, Pilbara, Carnarvon, 
Meekatharra, or Kalgoorlie Zones; 

for the financial year commencing on the first day of July 2008. 

———— 

The Common Seal of the Agriculture Protection Board of Western Australia was hereunto affixed in 
the presence of— 

CHRIS RICHARDSON, Chairman, 
Agriculture Protection Board. 

Approved— 
KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture and Food. 

 

——————————— 

 

AG402* 
AGRICULTURE AND RELATED RESOURCES PROTECTION ACT 1976 

DECLARATION 
Made by the Agriculture Protection Board 
Under section 13 of the Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976, the Agriculture 
Protection Board hereby declares that the Zones constituted by the Board and published in the 
Gazette on 8 February 2002 are abolished, namely the zones of Albany, Bunbury, Esperance, 
Geraldton, Jerramungup, Katanning, Lake Grace, Manjimup, Merredin, Midland, Moora, Narrogin, 
Northam, Three Springs and Waroona. 
Dated: 20 June 2008. 

CHRIS RICHARDSON, Chairman. 



2734 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

CEMETERIES 

CC401* 
CEMETERIES ACT 1986 

 GERALDTON CEMETERY BOARD  
In pursuance of the powers conferred by Section 53 of the Cemeteries Act 1986, the Geraldton 
Cemetery Board hereby records having resolved on the 11 June 2008 that the following fees and 
charges shall apply from 1 October 2008. Schedule Includes 10% Goods and Services Tax except 
where shown exempt.  
 General Lawn 
 Cemetery Cemetery 
BURIALS 
A:  BURIAL FEES—including registration and tablet fee    
 Adult Interment, 13 years and over  $850.00  $900.00 
 Child interment, under 13 years of age—including stillborn in 

ground not set aside for such purpose  $650.00  $650.00 
 Interment of any stillborn child in Infant Burial Area  $250.00  n/a 

B:  LOT FEES    
 A ‘Grant or Right of Burial’ (25 year tenure) being issued for each 

Lot and shall be additional to those fees prescribed in paragraph (A) 
above Ordinary Land for grave 2.1m long x 0.75m wide x 1.8m deep 
where directed by cemetery.  $900.00  $1,250.00 

 Ordinary Land for grave 1.5m long x 0.6m wide x 1.8m deep in 
Infant Burial Area  $350.00  n/a 

 Pre-need purchase—land selected by applicant or land reserved in 
advance  $1,020.00  $1,390.00 

C:  OTHER    
 For exhumation..  $1,000.00  $1,350.00 
 For re-burial after exhumation.  $830.00  $900.00 

 MISCELLANEOUS CHARGES    
 PERMITS:    
 For permit to erect a headstone, monument or rail in General 

cemetery $275.00  exempt 
 For permit to place a plaque in Lawn Cemetery One $160.00  exempt 
 For permit to place a monument in Lawn Cemetery Two  $240.00  exempt 
 For permit to renovate or add to a monument all areas  $85.00  exempt 
 For permit to add inscription to a monument all areas $75.00  exempt 
 Monuments commissioned by Office of Australian War Graves—

permit fee waived —  
 Single Funeral Permit (Funeral Directors’s only)  $245.00  exempt 
 Single Funeral Permit (Other than Funeral Directors).  $490.00  exempt 

 LICENCES:    
 Funeral Director’s Annual Licence Fee $495.00  exempt 
 Monumental Mason’s Annual Licence Fee $350.00  exempt 
 Single Monumental Mason’s Work Licence (permit fee also payable)  $150.00  exempt 

 OTHER:    
 Hire of crematorium facility for a burial service $160.00   
 Hire crematorium for additional hour  $160.00   
 Purchase of small raised headstone $150.00   
 Purchase of large raised headstone $250.00   
 Copy of Grant or Right of Burial $121.00   
 Transfer of Grant or Right of Burial $121.00   
 Copy of By-laws and regulations  $50.00   
 Refund of an unexpired grant of right of burial or prepaid cremation   
 not to exceed the amount originally paid less an administration fee 

of   $121.00   
EXTRA CHARGES  
Interment or cremation without due notice  $450.00  $450.00 
For each interment or cremation on a Saturday  $500.00  $500.00 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2735 

 General Lawn 
 Cemetery Cemetery 

For each interment or cremation not in usual hours  $450.00  $450.00 
For late arrival of a funeral at cemetery gates  $121.00  $121.00 
For late departure of funeral from cemetery gates  $121.00  $121.00 

CREMATORIUM   
A:  Adult cremation, 13 years and over  $1,030.00  
 Non Attend Cremation, 13 years and over.  $870.00  
 Child cremation, under 13 years of age  $600.00  
 Cremation of stillborn without memorial service  $250.00  
 Cremation of stillborn with memorial service..  $550.00  
 Pre-need cremation  $1,250.00  

B:  DISPOSAL OF ASHES -tenure on all cremation memorials shall 
be 25 years from date of receipt of scheduled fee 

 

 Kerbing placement including 152 x 152mm bronze plaque  $500.00  
 Garden placement including 229 x 229mm bronze plaque.  $840.00  
 Garden placement including 380 x 280mm single bronze plaque  $945.00  
 Garden placement including 380 x 280mm double bronze plaque 

with one plate  $1,210.00 
 —second interment including second plate.  $210.00  
 Rose garden placement including 185 x 150mm sculptured rose 

border plaque  $735.00  

 Interment in Single Niche:   
 Brick including 150 x 140mm bronze plaque..  $450.00  
 Tile including 150 x 140mm bronze plaque  $470.00  
 Marble including 150 x 140mm bronze plaque  $505.00  

 Interment in Double Niche:   
 Brick including 320 x 130mm bronze plaque and first plate  $900.00  
 Tile including 320 x 130mm bronze plaque and first plate  $1,000.00  
 Marble including 320 x 130mm bronze plaque and first plate  $1,120.00  
 Second interment and second plate  $210.00  

 Garden of Dreams:   
 Butterfly 180 x 150mm bronze plaque..  $600.00  
 Oval 190 x 120mm bronze plaque  $630.00  
 Square 152 x 152 bronze plaque..  $490.00  

 Other memorials.  poa  
 Reserve pre need memorial position or niche..  $210.00  
 Scatter ashes to winds, with issue of certificate..  $121.00  
 Scatter ashes in memorial gardens, with issue of certificate  $121.00  
 Interment of ashes in a family grave..  $150.00  
 Post ashes overseas  $120.00  
 Post ashes within Australia..  $80.00  
 Hold ashes in safe custody after six months (per month)  $10.00  
 Collection of ashes for cremations performed prior 1.10.02  $97.00  
 Attendance fee for memorial garden placement, each installation  $75.00  
 For permit to place a memorial in the Memorial Gardens  $150.00 exempt 
 Registration of ashes from other crematoria  $85.00  

C:  MEMORIAL POSITION (plaque not included)  
 tenure on all memorial positions shall be 25 years from date of receipt of scheduled fee  
 Kerbing position Memorial Garden No 1 or 2  $280.00 
 Kerbing position Memorial Garden No 3  $550.00 
 Kerbing position Memorial Garden No 4  $600.00 
 Rose garden position Memorial Garden No 2  $470.00 
 Garden position in Memorial Garden 1 to 4  $860.00 
 Single brick niche position  $260.00 
 Double brick niche position  $530.00 



2736 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

 Single tile niche position  $280.00 
 Double tile niche position  $610.00 
 Single marble niche position  $315.00 
 Double marble niche position  $720.00 

 Garden of Dreams   
 rose garden position  $375.00 
 Inner kerb position  $285.00 
 Garden bank  $315.00 

The fees and charges in the above schedule were set by resolution at a duly convened meeting of the 
Geraldton Cemetery Board held on 11 July 2007.  

MAXWELL ALLAN CORREY, Chairman. 
JANICE HATCH, Secretary. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

CC402* 
CEMETERIES ACT 1986 

Shire of Collie 

CEMETERY FEES AND CHARGES 

Under the powers conferred by Section 53 of the Cemeteries Act 1986, the Council of the Shire of 
Collie resolved on the 10 June 2008 to adopt the schedule of Fees and Charges, effective from 1 July 
2008.  

List of Cemetery Fees 
In Open Ground— $ 

For Sinking grave for an adult (including Government contract) 480.00 
For Sinking grave for child if under 14 years of age 480.00 
For Sinking grave for stillborn child 250.00 
For re-opening grave for an adult 480.00 
For re-opening grave for child under 14 years 480.00 
For sinking adult’s grave per 0.3 metres 90.00 
For placement of cremated ashes in grave 55.00 
Fees for exhumation 890.00 
For Sinking grave Weekends and Public Holidays 650.00 
Ordinary Land for Grave, including issue of Grant of Right of Burial 2.4 metres x 

1.8 metres and use of iron number plate 250.00 
Reserve special land for grave 2.4 metres x 1.8 metres selected by Applicant in section 

where burials take place 75.00 
Single Niche, including tablet and standard inscription 265.00 
Double Niche, including tablets and first standard inscription only 360.00 
Second standard inscription 160.00 
Affixing Niche plaque to wall 75.00 
To reserve Niche only (single or double) 75.00 
For internment without due notice 190.00 
For permission to construct a vault 60.00 
For permission to erect any iron railings, stone, brick or concrete kerb gravestone or 

any combination of the same subject to terms  
Of paragraph 2 of the Cemetery By-laws 60.00 
For permission to construct a brick grave 60.00 
Monumental Mason Licence payable annually in July 190.00 
Undertaker’s Licence fee payable annually in July 190.00 

Dated this 16th day of June 2008. 

The Common Seal of the Shire of Collie was hereunto affixed by authority of a decision of the Council 
in the presence of— 

WAYNE SANFORD, Shire President. 
JASON WHITEAKER, Chief Executive Officer. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2737 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401* 
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 

REINSTATEMENT OF ASSOCIATION 
Whitfords & District Aero Modelling Club (Inc) 

Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named association has been re-instated 
pursuant to Section 35(4) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987. 
Dated 13th June 2008. 

ROBERT ALLEN, A/Director, Business Services for 
Commissioner for Consumer Protection. 

 

——————————— 
 

CE402* 
COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943 

Section 403 
REGISTRATION OF AUDITORS 

Notice is hereby given that the following person is registered as qualified to act as an auditor 
pursuant to s402 of the Act with effect from 16 June 2008— 

Billy-Joe Thomas 

ANNE DRISCOLL, Registrar for Consumer Protection. 

 

——————————— 
 

CE403* 
COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943 

Section 403 
REGISTRATION OF AUDITORS 

Notice is hereby given that the following person is registered as qualified to act as an auditor 
pursuant to s402 of the Act with effect from 16 June 2008— 

Christopher James McLaughlin 

ANNE DRISCOLL, Registrar for Consumer Protection. 

ENERGY 

EN401* 
ENERGY COORDINATION ACT 1994 

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23(1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS 
Notice is given that the following Distribution and Trading Licences have been granted— 

Licensee: Origin Energy Retail Ltd 
Issue Date: 9 June 2008 

Address of Licensee: Level 45, Australia Square 
264-278 George Street 
Sydney NSW 2000 

Classification: Distribution Licence (GDL7) 
Term of Licence: Up to and including 8 June 2029 

Area Covered: Licence granted to supply gas to Super Lot in George Grey Road, 
Kalbarri, Western Australia 6536, the Kalbarri Vision Development 
(Plan No. ERA-GAS-004). 



2738 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

Classification: Trading Licence (GTL7) 
Term of Licence: Up to and including 8 June 2018 
Area Covered: Licence granted to supply gas to Super Lot in George Grey Road, 

Kalbarri, Western Australia 6536, the Kalbarri Vision Development 
(Plan No. ERA-GAS-003). 

Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
6th Floor 
197 St Georges Terrace 
Perth WA 6000 
http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

JUSTICE 

JU401* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 

Waitere Ema Miria AP 0558 16/06/08 

Cox Michael James AP 0537 16/06/08 

Crowd Carolyn Ann AP 0551 16/06/08 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager, Acacia Prison Contract. 
16 June 2008. 
 

——————————— 
 

JU402* 
JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

APPOINTMENT 
It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has 
approved of the following to the Office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia— 

Geoffrey Maurice Quinn of 386 Mortimer Road, Wellard 

RAY WARNES, Executive Director, 
Court and Tribunal Services. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Shark Bay 
FEES AND CHARGES 

In accordance with Section 6.16 of the Local Government Act 1995 the Shire of Shark Bay has adopted 
its Fees and Charges for the 2008/09 financial year to form part of its Budget. A Schedule of the Fees 
and Charges is available at the Shire Office for inspection. 
It is proposed that these fees and charges will apply on and from 1 July 2008. 

K. J. MATTHEWS, Chief Executive Officer. 
18 June 2008. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2739 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
GRANT OF EXPLORATION PERMIT 

Exploration Permit number WA-412-P has been granted to Japan Energy Corporation to have effect 
for a period of six (6) years from 13 June 2008. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 
 

——————————— 
 

MP402* 
MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURES 
Department of Industry and Resources, 

Perth WA 6000. 
I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of section 97(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned mining lease is forfeited for breach of covenant viz; non payment of rent. 

FRANCIS LOGAN MLA, Minister for Energy; Resources; Industry and Enterprise. 

———— 
NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD 

MINING LEASE 
70/749 Pearl McKinnon Green South West 
 

——————————— 
 

MP403* 
MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURES 
Department of Industry and Resources, 

Perth WA 6000. 
I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of section 96A(1)of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned exploration licence is forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply with the 
prescribed expenditure conditions. 

FRANCIS LOGAN MLA, Minister for Energy; Resources; Industry and Enterprise. 

———— 
NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD 
28/1041 Kairiki Energy Ltd North East Coolgardie 
 

——————————— 
 

MP404* 
MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURES 
Department of Industry and Resources, 

Perth WA 6000. 
I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of section 97(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned mining tenement is forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply with the 
prescribed expenditure condition. 

FRANCIS LOGAN MLA, Minister for Energy; Resources; Industry and Enterprise. 

———— 
NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD 

MINING LEASE 
77/1013 Ball; Robert Frederick 

Zadow; Gordon 
Yilgarn 



2740 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

MP405* 
MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURES 
Department of Industry and Resources, 

Perth WA 6000. 
I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of section 96A(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned exploration licences are forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply with 
the prescribed expenditure conditions. 

FRANCIS LOGAN MLA, Minister for Energy; Resources; Industry and Enterprise. 

———— 
NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD 
69/2040 St Barbara Ltd Warburton 
69/2041 St Barbara Ltd Warburton 
69/2042 St Barbara Ltd Warburton 
69/2043 St Barbara Ltd Warburton 
69/2044 St Barbara Ltd Warburton 
69/2057 St Barbara Ltd Warburton 
 
 

——————————— 
 

MP406* 
MINING ACT 1978 

INSTRUMENT OF VARIATION TO EXEMPTION OF LAND 
The Minister for Energy; Resources; Industry and Enterprise pursuant to the powers conferred on 
him by Section 19 of the Mining Act 1978, hereby VARIES the exemption of land designated S19/158 
in TENGRAPH (which was initially declared on 1 June 2001 and published on page 3033 of the 
Government Gazette dated 22 June 2001) by including that portion of land described hereunder (not 
being private land or land that is the subject of a mining tenement or an application for a mining 
tenement). 

Description of Land to be included in S19/158, as shown in the attached map 
Land designated FNA 8189 in Tengraph. A geospatial description is filed at pages 85 and 86 of the 
Department of Industry and Resources File No A1498/200303.  

Area of Additional Land 
305.9139 hectares 

Locality 
Mt Murchison 

Dated at Perth this 11th day of June 2008. 

FRANCIS LOGAN MLA, Minister for Energy; Resources; Industry and Enterprise. 

PARLIAMENT 

PA401* 
PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

Royal Assent to Bills 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor has Assented in the name and on behalf 
of Her Majesty the Queen, on the dates shown, to the undermentioned Acts passed by the Legislative 
Council and the Legislative Assembly during the First Session of the Thirty-Seventh Parliament. 

Title of Act Date of Assent Act No. 
Minerals and Energy Research Amendment Act 2008 13 June 2008 23 of 2008 
Road Traffic Amendment Act 2008 13 June 2008 24 of 2008 

MALCOLM PEACOCK, Clerk of the Parliaments. 
17 June 2008. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2741 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

GREATER BUNBURY REGION SCHEME 
East Dalyellup—Shire of Capel 
Notice of Resolution—Clause 13 

Amendment 0001/13 File No.: 812-6-7-2 
Notice is hereby given that in accordance with Clause 13 of the Greater Bunbury Region Scheme, the 
Western Australian Planning Commission resolved on 16 May 2008 to transfer land from the urban 
deferred zone to the urban zone, as shown on plan number 4.1543. 
This amendment is effective from the date of publication of this notice in the Government Gazette. 
The plan may be viewed at the offices of— 
 • Western Australian Planning Commission, Wellington Street, Perth 
 • Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 61 Victoria Street, Bunbury 
 • J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 
 • Municipal office of the Shire of Capel 

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

 
——————————— 

 
PI402 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

City of Cockburn 
Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 50 

Ref: 853/2/23/20 Pt 50 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of 
Cockburn local planning scheme amendment on 10 June 2008 for the purpose of— 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
City of Cockburn 

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 3 
Amendment No. 50 

The City of Cockburn under and by virtue of the powers conferred upon it in that behalf by the 
Planning and Development Act 2005, hereby amend the above Town Planning Scheme by— 
 1 Removing Pt Lots 2 - 5, 14, 21 and 101, Russell Road; Lots 22 - 26, 102, 103, 301, 4291, 4895, 

4896 and 4898, Jessie Lee Street; Lots 2, P15, 125, 126, 901, 4618 and 4899, Anderson Road; 
Lot 2905 Cockburn Road, Henderson and part of the Anderson Road reserve; 

  from the Industry zone and incorporating the land in the Special Use zone No. 22 and 
Development Area No. 29. 

 2. Removing Lots 303, 400, 500, 501, 502 and 4620, Cockburn Road; and Pt Lots 21, 2 - 5 and 
101, Russell Road, Henderson from the unzoned area and incorporating it in Special Use zone 
No. 22 and Development Area No. 29. 

 3. Removing part of Lot P15 and 126, Anderson Road and part of the Anderson Road reserve 
from the Industry zone and including it in the Local Reserve—Parks and Recreation. 

 4. Amending the Scheme Map to include Special Use zone No. 22 and Development Area No. 29 
accordingly. 

 5. Amending Schedule 4—Special Use zones, by adding— 

No. Description of Land Special Use Conditions 
SU 22 Henderson Industrial 

Area Support 
Industry Precinct, 
corner of Russell and 
Cockburn Roads, 
Henderson 

Support industry for marine 
engineering, ship building and the 
manufacture, fabrication and 
assembly of components for use by the 
offshore petroleum industry and 
marine engineering industries 
together with other industrial uses in 
the energy, transport, chemical and 
mining industries, which need to be 
located on the coast to enable 
transport of any of its primary 
products by sea. 

Structure Plan to be 
adopted to guide 
subdivision, land 
use and 
development—
Henderson Marine 
Support Precinct 
Park. (DA 29) 



2742 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

No. Description of Land Special Use Conditions 
  Includes land and buildings used for 

the purpose of the research and 
development, technological 
development, training and education 
of persons involved in ship design, 
building, repair and engineering. 

 

  In the western section of the Support 
Industry Precinct as delineated on the 
structure plan, the land may be used 
for showroom/warehouse and light 
industries related to or in support of 
the above objectives. 

 

  Development of the estate is to be in 
accordance with a purpose built 
industrial park, planned and 
developed in accordance with an 
adopted Structure Plan and in 
accordance with design and 
development guidelines which provide 
for the construction of high quality 
buildings located within an attractive 
landscaped setting and where all 
emissions and hazards are contained 
on site. 

 

  The following land uses apply to the 
precincts identified on the Structure 
Plan— 

 

  Precinct 1 

 (a) The following uses are ‘P’ 
permitted uses, subject to the 
uses being related to the 
objectives of the Support 
Industry Precinct— 

 

   • industry—general  
   • industry—light  

   (b) The following uses are ‘D’ 
uses which are not permitted 
unless the local government 
has in its discretion granted 
planning approval, subject to 
the uses being directly related 
to the purposes of a Support 
Industry Precinct— 

 

   • educational 
establishment (but 
excludes Primary and 
Secondary Schools) 

 

   • fuel depot  
   • warehouse  
   • motor vehicle repair 

(including boats) 
 

   • transport depot  
   • industry—service  
   • caretakers dwelling  
   • telecommunications 

infrastructure 
 

   • other activities/uses 
which the Council is 
satisfied are directly 
related and associated to 
marine related industries 

 

   (c) All other uses are ‘X’ uses, not 
permitted. 

 

  Precinct 2 
 (a) The following uses are ‘P’ 

permitted uses, subject to the 
uses being related to the 

 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2743 

No. Description of Land Special Use Conditions 
objectives of a Support 
Industry Precinct— 

   • boat sales  
   • industry—service  
   (b) The following uses are ‘D’ 

uses which are not permitted 
unless the local government 
has in its discretion granted 
planning approval, subject to 
the uses being directly related 
to the purposes of a Support 
Industry Precinct and 
sufficient evidence to 
demonstrate that the 
proposed uses will not be 
adversely impacted by the 
Woodman Point Wastewater 
Treatment Plant odour 
buffer— 

 

   • childcare facility  
   • bank  
   • office  
   • lunch bar  
   • consulting rooms  
   • recreation—private  
   • showroom  
   • petrol filling station  
   (c) All other uses are ‘X’ uses, not 

permitted. 
 

 6. Amend Schedule 11 by adding— 

Ref No. Area Provisions 
DA29 Henderson Industrial 

Area Support Industry 
Precinct, corner of 
Russell and Cockburn 
Roads, Henderson 

1. Subdivision, land use and development to accord with the 
adopted Structure Plan. 

2. The objectives of the Development Area are to— 
 (a) promote the purposes and functions of the Technology 

Development Act 1983 (as amended); 
   (b) ensure that uses within the Development Area are 

directly related to or incidental to ship design, ship 
building, the offshore petroleum, chemical and 
mining industries, ship repair and marine 
engineering in accordance with the provisions of 
Special Use zone No. 22; 

   (c) encourage research and development relative to 
marine related industry, the offshore petroleum, 
chemical and mining industries; 

   (d) encourage attractive and efficient facilities; 
   (e) provide for the safe movement of vehicular and 

pedestrian traffic; and 
   (f) protect the amenity of areas adjacent to the zone.  
  3. Development Standards 

The following provisions apply to all land included in the 
SU22 zone and DA29 area in addition to any provisions 
which are more specifically applicable to that land under 
the Scheme— 

   (a) Building Setbacks 
  A person shall not erect or cause or permit to be 

erected any building or any portion of a building 
nearer to a street alignment than as follows— 

  Front boundary 
Buildings shall be setback a minimum of 
15 metres from the front boundary. This area 
shall be used for landscaping and car parking. 

  The setback shall apply to any structure greater 
than 1 metre in height other than approved 
signage, retaining walls or displays. 



2744 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

Ref No. Area Provisions 
  Secondary street boundaries 

For corner lots, buildings shall be setback a 
minimum of 7.5 metres from the secondary street. 

  Side and rear boundaries 
Setbacks shall comply with Building Code of 
Australia. 

   (b) Landscaping— 
   (i) A minimum of 5% of the total area of each lot 

must be landscaped between the lot boundary 
and the boundary line (excluding verge areas) 
or as varied under the provisions of Clause 
5.9.2 of the Scheme; 

   (ii) Notwithstanding sub-clause (i) above, lots with 
a boundary to Cockburn Road shall set aside a 
3 metre wide landscape strip along the road 
frontage and this area shall be landscaped and 
maintained to the satisfaction of the local 
government; 

   (iii) A landscape plan detailing the mix of hard and 
soft surfaces shall accompany any application 
for planning consent. Landscaping shall be 
provided in accordance with the approved plan 
and maintained to the satisfaction of the local 
government; 

   (c) Vehicle Parking and Servicing Facilities— 
   (i) Vehicle parking shall be provided in accordance 

with Tables 2, 3 and 4—Vehicle Parking 
Provisions; 

   (iii) Vehicle parking and servicing areas shall be 
screened from the street and either located 
behind the building or a landscape strip; 

   (iii) Where vehicle parking and servicing facilities 
are proposed between the building and street 
alignment, they shall be designed in such a 
way as to complement the building and be 
screened from the street. 

   (d) Building Design 
Buildings shall be designed to accord with the 
principles of the Support Industry Precinct Design 
Guidelines; 

   (e) Signage— 
 (i) A plan or description of all signs for the 

proposed development, including signs painted 
on a building, shall be submitted to and 
approved by the local government as a separate 
application; 

   (ii) Signage is to complement the architectural 
proportion and scale of the building. 

   (iii) Roof signs will not be permitted. 
   (f) Prohibited Uses 

No storage, transport, handling, use and disposal of 
chemicals or toxic and hazardous substances shall 
occur within 100 metres of the wetland boundary. 

   (g) Sustainability 
Development is to incorporate energy and water use 
efficient design, material and products wherever 
practical. 

   (h) Fencing 
Security fencing will be permitted along side and rear 
boundaries; front fencing to any street frontage 
should be limited to a minimum. Where security 
fencing is required to a street frontage, the fence line 
is preferably to be set back to the building line. 

  The minimum standard for fencing is black PVC 
coated galvanised link mesh with black support 
members. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2745 

Ref No. Area Provisions 
   (i) Stormwater Management 

All stormwater is to be managed on site to ensure no 
significant runoff from the lots onto roads will occur 
with the exception of lots located within the 
“Groundwater Protection Zone” (see Structure Plan). 
These lots will drain into a designated drainage swale 
to avoid direct discharge to the adjacent wetlands. 

S. LEE, Mayor. 
S. G. CAIN, Chief Executive Officer. 

POLICE 

PO401* 
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974 

TEMPORARY SUSPENSION OF REGULATIONS 
I, Martin Paul Bond, Commissioner of Police being the delegated officer of the Minister for Transport 
under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 83(1) of 
that Act, and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated for the 
purposes of: 
A Foot Race-Run For Gold by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 27 July 
2008 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of 
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the paths or the right hand side of the carriageways on— 
From Burswood Water Sports Centre across railway bridge to Brown Street and along Victoria 
Terrace, down to Claisebrook Cove along path adjacent to Causeway, right turn to Ellam Street and 
along dual use path past McCallum Park, under Causeway returning to start/finish point at BWSC, 
through various suburbs adjacent to the Swan River foreshore. 

A School Triathlon by members/entrants of the Australind Senior High School on 14 May 2008 
between the hours of 08:30 Hrs and 11:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the 
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Clifton Close and Kingston Drive, in Australind. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event. 

A Teams Cycling Event by members/entrants of the Cyclo Sportif Club of Australia Inc on 18 May 
2008 between the hours of 07:00 Hrs and 14:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of 
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Gingin Road, Walker Avenue, Lancelin Road, Indian Ocean Drive, KW Road, Sappers Road, Cowalla 
Road and Orange Springs Road then return to start in Lancelin. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycling Road Race by members/entrants of the West Coast Masters Cycling Council Inc on 15 June 
2008 between the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 13:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of 
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Pederick Road, Mather Drive, Flynn Drive and Old Yanchep Road in Neerabup. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Pilbara Black Rock Stakes Training by members/entrants of the Pilbara Black Rock Stakes Inc on 
14 June 2008 between the hours of 10:00 Hrs and 17:30 Hrs, 15 June 2008 between the hours of 10:00 
Hrs and 17:30 Hrs, 21 June 2008 between the hours of 10:00 Hrs and 17:30 Hrs, 22 June 2008 
between the hours of 10:00 Hrs and 17:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the 
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Butt Weld Road in the Town of Port Hedland. 

A Pilbara Black Rock Stakes by members/entrants of the Pilbara Black Rock Stakes Inc on 28 June 
2008 between the hours of 03:00 Hrs and 20:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of 
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Goldsworthy Access Road, Great Northern Highway, Port Hedland Road/Wilson Street and Wedge 
Street in the Town of Port Hedland. 



2746 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Midland Cycle Club on 31 May 2008 between the hours of 
13:00 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under 
such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Pickering Brook Road, Bracken Road, Forrest Road and Repatriation Road, in Pickering Brook. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Fun Run by members/entrants of the St Mary’s Primary School on 1 June 2008 between the hours 
of 07:00 Hrs and 12:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made 
under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Bateman Street, West Street, Stephen Street and Horrocks Road (from Northampton to Horrocks 
Beach), in the Shire of Northampton. 

A Be Active TreadnWater Fun Run by members/entrants of the Wickham Events Incorporated on 20 
July 2008 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 11:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension 
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on:-  
Carse Street, Mulga Way, Wickham Drive, Point Samson/Roebourne Road, Fisher Street, Cliff Street, 
Meares Drive and Barker Terrace, from Wickham to Point Samson. 

A Cycle Road Race by members/entrants of the Peel District Cycling Club (Inc) on 1 June 2008 
between the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 12:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the 
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on:-  
Pinjarra-Williams Road, Pinjarra to Dwellingup. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycle Road Race by members/entrants of the Peel District Cycling Club (Inc) on 3 August 2008 
between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 15:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the 
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on:-  
South West Highway, Del Park Road and Pinjarra-Williams Road, in the Shire of Murray. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycle Road Race by members/entrants of the Peel District Cycling Club (Inc) on 21 September 2008 
between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 12:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the 
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Pinjarra-Williams Road, Pinjarra to Coolup and return. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Midland Cycle Club on 28 June 2008 between the hours of 
13:00 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under 
such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Lefroy Avenue, Oakover Road, Campersic Road and William Street, in Herne Hill. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycle Time Trial Race by members/entrants of the Australian Time Trials Association on 1 June 
2008 between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 10:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of 
the Regulations made under such act on the  
carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Lovekin Drive, Kings Park . 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Eastern Goldfields Cycle Club on 1 June 2008 between the 
hours of 09:30 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations 
made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Shenton Street, Goldfields Highway and Hannan Street, from Menzies to Kalgoorlie. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycle Time Trial Race by members/entrants of the Australian Time Trials Association on 13 July 
2008 between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 10:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of 
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Lovekin Drive, Kings Park. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2747 

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Midland Cycle Club on 2 August 2008 between the hours of 
13:00 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under 
such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Pickering Brook Road, Bracken Road, Forrest Road and Repatriation Road in Pickering Brook. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Car Rally (State Championship) by members/entrants of the West Australian Car Club (Inc) on 7 
June 2008 between the hours of 05:30 Hrs and 23:59 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the carriageway on— 
Wright Road, Bussell Road, Yabberup Brook Road, Cameron Gully Road, Blackbutt Road, Davis 
Road, Graphite Road, Fifty Six Road, Connell Road, Kelly Road, McClusky Road, Ardoretum Road, 
Humpery Brook Road and various unnamed roads within the Bussell and Wellington Plantations. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Road Cycling Event by members/entrants of the Melville Fremantle Cycling Club Inc on 8 June 
2008 between the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 13:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of 
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
De Haer Road, Wandi Drive and Lyon Road in Wandi. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A King Of The Mountain Foot Race by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 
20 July 2008 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the extreme right of the carriageway on— 
Helena Valley Road Track and Mundaring Weir Road in the Shire of Mundaring. 

A Foot Race-Perth Marathon by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 6 July 
2008 between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 12:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of 
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway and along footpaths/dual use paths— 
from Perth Water Sports Centre, across Goongoonup Bridge, along Victory Terrace, Brown Street, 
over bridge to Claisebrook Cove, along path under and across Causeway through McCallum Park 
under Narrows Bridge beside Kwinana Freeway, over Canning Bridge, along Haig Road and Burke 
Drive to Hislop Road and return to start/finish area. 

A Foot Race—Lake Gwelup Run by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 14 
September 2008 between the hours of 07:00 Hrs and 09:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the paths, verges and the side of the carriageways— 
from car-park off Huntriss Road, south around Lake Gwelup in an anti-clockwise direction, north 
along limestone path, south onto Wanstead Street at the intersection of March Street, north to Porter 
Street and turn west along limestone track, then travel south returning to start/finish area in the car-
park, in Gwelup. 

A Dampier Triathlon by members/entrants of the Nickol Bay Triathlon Club on 15 June 2008 between 
the hours of 07:00 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations 
made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
The Esplanade, Church Road, Central Avenue, Dampier Road and Parker Point Road, Dampier. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event. 

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Midland Cycle Club on 7 June 2008 between the hours of 
13:00 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under 
such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 
Boulonnais Drive, Campersic Road, Connemara Drive and Sandhurst Close, Brigadoon . 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Midland Cycle Club on 15 June 2008 between the hours of 
13:00 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under 
such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  
Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on— 

Blue Wren Place, Cameron Road, Stoneville Road, Anketell Road and Alice Road, in the Shire of 
Mundaring. 
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

M. P. BOND, Inspector. 



2748 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

PO402 
MISUSE OF DRUGS ACT 1981 

MISUSE OF DRUGS REGULATIONS 1982 
APPROVED BOTANIST 

I, Karl Joseph O’Callaghan, Commissioner of Police in the State of Western Australia, under section 
3A of the Misuse of Drugs Act 1981 approve the following person, employed by the Department of 
Environment and Conservation, as an Approved Botanist for the purpose of the Act. 

Title Given Names Family Name DOB Qualifications 
Dr Kelly Anne Shepherd 09/12/1970 B.Sc. (Botany and Zoology) 

(Hons), PhD. 
Dated: 16 June 2008. 

KARL J. O’CALLAGHAN APM, Commissioner of Police. 

PUBLIC SECTOR MANAGEMENT 

PS401 
PUBLIC SECTOR MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 

EXEMPTION ORDER 
A partial exemption is hereby made under section 25(1)(a) of the Public Sector Management Act 1994 
from the Recruitment, Selection and Appointment Standard, for the Department of Health, for the 
circumstances relating to the initial transmission of palliative care services from the Silver Chain to 
the WA Country Health Services—Midwest. 
The partial exemption applies to the “open and competitive” component of the Recruitment, Selection 
and Appointment Standard. 
This exemption is provided to facilitate the initial employment only of private sector staff engaged to 
continue performance in the public sector of their private sector functions. 
This order has effect on and from the date of the publication in the Gazette. 

Dr RUTH SHEAN, Commissioner for Public Sector Standards. 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG401* 
LIQUOR CONTROL ACT 1988 

LIQUOR APPLICATIONS 
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Control Act 1988 (the Act) and 
required to be advertised.  
Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection process, 
should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming & Liquor, 1st Floor, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, 
Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation. 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE 
12366 City of Fremantle Application for the grant of a Special 

Facility—Reception Centre in respect of 
premises situated in Fremantle and known 
as Fremantle Arts Centre 

17/07/2008 

12367 Allwester Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Restaurant 
Licence in respect of premises situated in 
Fremantle and known as Fremantle Arts 
Centre Café  

17/07/2008 

12373 Precision Catering 
& Equipment Pty 
Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Special 
Facility—Canteen situated in Cue and known 
as Jack Hills Iron Ore Project Camp 

02/07/2008 



20 June 2008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2749 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS 
31970 Woolworths Ltd Application for the grant of an extended 

trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Esperance and 
known as Woolworths Esperance Liquor 
Store 

28/07/2008 

32103 Breakers Tavern & 
Bottleshop Pty Ltd 

Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Geraldton and 
known as Breakers Bar & Cafe 

30/06/2008 

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—LIQUOR WITHOUT A MEAL 
32225 Mattscan Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an extended 

trading permit—liquor without a meal, in 
respect of premises situated in Albany and 
known as Dog Rock Motel 

06/07/08 

APPLICATIONS TO ADD, VARY OR CANCEL A CONDITION OF LICENCE 
281677 Nine Mary’s Pty Ltd Application to add, vary or cancel a condition 

of the Tavern licence in respect of premises 
situated in Perth and known as Nine Mary’s 
Restaurant & Bar 

22/07/2008 

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Act. 

Dated: 18 June 2008. 
B. A. SARGEANT, Director of Liquor Licensing. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Henryk Migas, late of 20 Eudanda Place, Cannington, Western Australia, Retired Plant Operator, 
deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 14 April 2008 are required by the Trustee ANZ 
Trustees Limited ACN 006 132 332 of Level 4, 100 Queen Street, Melbourne, VIC 3000 to send 
particulars of their claim to them by 1 August 2008 after which date the Trustee may convey or 
distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which he then has notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Norman Charles Mogridge, late of Amaroo Village, 2 Wreford Court, Gosnells in the State of Western 
Australia, Retired, died 1 April 2008. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased person are required by the deceased’s representative, Keith 
Gordon Sorensen to send particulars of their claims to him at K. G. Sorensen, Barrister & Solicitor, 
Level 1, 16 Irwin Street, Perth WA 6000 within one (1) month of the date of publication hereof after 
which date the deceased’s representative may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to 
the claims of which he has then received notice. 

K. G. SORENSEN. 



2750 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 20 June 2008 

ZX403 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
In the matter of the Estate of Doris Ellaline Robinson, late of Freeman Lodge, 31 Webb Street,  
Rossmoyne, Western Australia, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the abovenamed deceased who died on the 10th day of September 2007 are 
required by the Executor Margaret Ann Van Gennip to send particulars of their claims by the 25th 
day of July 2008 to them care of Hammond King Touyz, Barristers and Solicitors, 3rd floor, 8 St 
George’s Terrace, Perth, WA, 6000 after which date the Executor may convey or distribute the assets, 
having regard only to the claims of which the Executor then has notice. 

HAMMOND KING TOUYZ, 3rd Floor, 8 St George’s Terrace,  
Perth,Western Australia, 

Solicitors for the Executor. 
 

——————————— 
 
ZX404* 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act, relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before the 20/07/08 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, having 
regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 
Beckwith, Alan Peter, late of 23 Shorebird Parade, Woodvale, died 12.04.2008 (DE20000585EM22) 
Bloom, James Joseph, late of York District Hospital, Trews Road, York, died 31.05.08 

(DE30224797EM17) 
Brennan, John Austin, late of Frank Prendergast House, 27 Pearson Drive, Success, died 26.03.2008 

(DE33034021EM22) 
Cometti, Arthur, late of Hollywood Hospital, Monash Avenue, Nedlands, formerly of 39 Rosebery 

Street Jolimont, died 15.05.2008 (DE20011509EM35) 
Cross, Mary Elizabeth, late of Narrogin Nursing Home, 52 Williams Road, Narrogin, died 9.04.2008 

(DE19970379EM36) 
Gibbs, Dorothy, late of 138 Queens Road,South Guildford, died 16.05.2008 (DE19621698EM13) 
Keay, Wilhemina Jessie, late of Unit 41 104 King William Street, Bayswater, formerly of 54 Burnside 

Street Bayswater, died 3.06.2008 (DE19551037EM38) 
Marney, Steven, late of 4a Charles Ball Drive, Port Hedland, died 26.04.2007 (DE33030014EM36) 
Prestianni, Lina, late of 44 John Street, Midland, died 19.05.2008 (DE19992511EM36) 
Silich, Faye Laraine, late of 102 Virgil Avenue, Yokine, died 9.04.2008 (DE19802203EM213) 
Silich, Robert George, late of 102 Virgil Avenue, Yokine, died 9.04.2008 (DE19640800EM213) 
Studdy, Robert Andrew, also known as Robert Andrew Brander, late of John Bryant House, 

95 Rawlinson Drive, Marangaroo, formerly of Mertone Village, Winifred Road, Bayswater, died 
24.04.2008 (DE19911852EM26) 

Turner, Molly, late of Sarah Hardey House, 222 Cammillo Road, Kelmscott, formerly of 442 Belgravia 
Street, Cloverdale, died 22.03.2008 (DE19980678EM26) 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
Public Trust Office, 565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000. 

Telephone 9222 6777. 

PUBLIC NOTICES 
ZZ401 

DISPOSAL OF UNCOLLECTED GOODS ACT 1970 
DISPOSAL OF UNCOLLECTED GOODS 

We, Karass Pty Ltd t/a Welshpool Self Storage, of 122 Welshpool Road, Welshpool, hereby inform 
Benjamin Falconer-Brown that under Part VI of the Disposal of Uncollected Goods Act, will be 
making application to the court to sell or otherwise dispose of your vehicle, a beige Ford Falcon 
Station Wagon registration number 1BAX 827. 
You may collect your vehicle from our site at 122 Welshpool Road, Welshpool before the 12th July 
2008 otherwise an application under s.19 of the Disposal of Uncollected Goods Act 1970 to dispose of 
the vehicle will be made to the court. 

YASSY GRAVES, Manager. 


