
 2103 

 ISSN 2204-4264 (online) 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 7 NOVEMBER 2025 No. 132 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY GEOFF O. LAWN, GOVERNMENT PRINTER 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 
 

 

 

CONTENTS 

 

 

Page 

Fire and Emergency Services ............................................................................................................  2105 
Justice ................................................................................................................................................  2106 
Local Government ..............................................................................................................................  2106 
Minerals and Petroleum ....................................................................................................................  2108 
Planning .............................................................................................................................................  2110 
Police ..................................................................................................................................................  2111 
Public Notices.....................................................................................................................................  2112 

 

 

  



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 

may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 

Western Australia. Enquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 

Parliamentary Counsel’s Office, publications@pco.wa.gov.au. 

Note: A Creative Commons Attribution 4.0 International Licence (CC BY 4.0) applies with 

respect to material on the WA Legislation Website (with certain exceptions), and to copies of Acts, 

and reprints of Acts and subsidiary legislation, printed by the Government Printer. To view 

relevant information and for a link to a copy of the licence, visit www.legislation.wa.gov.au. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by the Government Printer for the State of 

Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 

unforeseen circumstances. 

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 

periodically. 

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette— 

 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper. 

 • Copy must be lodged with the Publications Officer, Department of the Premier and Cabinet no 

later than 12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition)— 

Email address: 

   gazette@dpc.wa.gov.au 

 • Enquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Publications Officer on 

(08) 6552 6012. 

 • Enquiries regarding payment of notices can be directed to (08) 6552 6000 or 

sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 

 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. 

Failure to observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 

After lodging any notices, confirmation is not required by post. If original copy is forwarded later and 
published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2025 (Prices include GST) 

Public Notices Section—$80.16 minimum charge (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these 

instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices— 

  Per Column Centimetre—$15.99 

  Bulk Notices—$292.74 per page 

Clients who have an account will only be invoiced for charges over $100. 

For charges under $100, clients will need to supply credit card details at time of lodging notice  

(i.e. a notice under 7cm would not be invoiced). 

Clients without an account will need to supply credit card details at the time of lodging the notice. 

 

 

mailto:publications@pco.wa.gov.au


7 November 2025 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2105 

FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES 

FE401 

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

TOTAL FIRE BAN DECLARATION 

Correspondence No. D18023 

Pursuant to powers delegated under the Bush Fires Act 1954, the Assistant Commissioner of the 
Department of Fire and Emergency Services, declared under Section 22A of the Bush Fires Act 1954, a 
total fire ban for Saturday, 1 November 2025 for the local government districts of— 

Laverton 

Dated 31 October 2025. 

PAUL CARR, Assistant Commissioner of the Department of Fire and 
Emergency Services, as a sub-delegate of the Minister under 

section 16 of the Fire and Emergency Services Act 1998. 

 

——————————— 
 

 

FE402 

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

TOTAL FIRE BAN DECLARATION 

Correspondence No. D18023 

Pursuant to powers delegated under the Bush Fires Act 1954, the Assistant Commissioner of the 
Department of Fire and Emergency Services, declared under Section 22A of the Bush Fires Act 1954, a 
total fire ban for Monday, 03 November for the local government districts of— 

Northampton 

Dated Sunday 02 November 2025. 

DANNY MOSCONI, Assistant Commissioner of the Department of 
Fire and Emergency Services, as a sub-delegate of the Minister 
under section 16 of the Fire and Emergency Services Act 1998. 

 

——————————— 
 

 

FE403 

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

TOTAL FIRE BAN DECLARATION 

Correspondence No. D18023 

Pursuant to powers delegated under the Bush Fires Act 1954, the Assistant Commissioner of the 
Department of Fire and Emergency Services, declared under Section 22A of the Bush Fires Act 1954, a 
total fire ban for Wednesday, 5th November 2025 for the local government districts of— 

Wiluna 

Dated 4 November 2025. 

PAUL CARR, Assistant Commissioner of the Department of Fire and 
Emergency Services, as a sub-delegate of the Minister under 

section 16 of the Fire and Emergency Services Act 1998. 



2106 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 November 2025 

JUSTICE 

JU401 

JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in Executive Council has approved of the 
following to the Office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia— 

Brian Leland Cailes of Boyup Brook 

Zachary Vincent Donovan of Kensington 

Wayne Justin James Heldt of Salter Point 

Nathan David Hicks of Mount Hawthorn 

Celia Faye Loot of Leeming 

Ashley Heath Norton of Onslow 

Mortigou Richmond Oliver Labunda of Nedlands 

JOANNE STAMPALIA, Deputy Director General, Court and Tribunal Services. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401 

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Murray 

APPOINTMENT OF CHIEF BUSH FIRE CONTROL OFFICER 

Notice is hereby given that at the Ordinary Council Meeting held on the 23 October 2025, the Shire of 
Murray Council resolved that in accordance with s.38 of the Bush Fires Act 1954, Michael Keeran 
Webster has been appointed as the Chief Bush Fire Control Officer for the district of the Shire of 
Murray. 

The previous appointment of Nicole May Stevens-Barrett as the Chief Bush Fire Control Officer for the 
district of the Shire of Murray is hereby cancelled. 

DEAN UNSWORTH, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

LG402 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

City of Gosnells 

CITY OF GOSNELLS AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2025 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995, and under all other powers enabling 
it, the Council of the City of Gosnells resolved on 28 October 2025 to make the following local law. 

CONTENT 

PART 1—PRELIMINARY 

PART 2—CITY OF GOSNELLS PUBLIC HEALTH LOCAL LAW 2017 

PART 3—CITY OF GOSNELLS FENCING LOCAL LAW 2017 

PART 4—CITY OF GOSNELLS DOGS LOCAL LAW 2020 

PART 5—CITY OF GOSNELLS PARKING LOCAL LAW 2012 

PART 1—PRELIMINARY 

1.1 Title 

This local law is the City of Gosnells Amendment Local Law 2025. 

1.2 Commencement 

This local law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the Government Gazette. 

1.3 Application 

This local law applies throughout the district. 



7 November 2025 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2107 

1.4 Local Laws amended 

This local law amends the City of Gosnells Public Health Local Law 2017, the City of Gosnells Fencing 
Local Law 2017, the City of Gosnells Dogs Local Law 2020, and the City of Gosnells Parking Local Law 
2012. 

PART 2—CITY OF GOSNELLS PUBLIC HEALTH LOCAL LAW 2017 

2.1 City of Gosnells Public Health Local Law 2017 amended 

This part of the local law amends the City of Gosnells Public Health Local Law 2017. 

2.2 Clause 8.3(3) amended 

Clause 8.3(3) is amended by deleting “$5,000” and replacing it with “$10,000”. 

2.3 SCHEDULE 1—PRESCRIBED OFFENCES amended 

SCHEDULE 1—PRESCRIBED OFFENCES is amended as follows— 

(1)  In Item 34 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “500” and replace it with “1,000”. 

(2)  In Item 35 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “500” and replace it with “1,000”. 

(3)  In Item 36 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “250” and replace it with “1,000”. 

(4)  In Item 39 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “250” and replace it with “1,000”. 

PART 3—CITY OF GOSNELLS FENCING LOCAL LAW 2017 

3.1 City of Gosnells Fencing Local Law 2017 amended 

This part of the local law amends the City of Gosnells Fencing Local Law 2017. 

3.2 Clause 5.1 amended 

Clause 5.1 is amended as follows— 

(1)  Delete “$250” and replace it with “$500”. 

(2)  Delete “$5,000” and replace it with “$10,000”. 

PART 4—CITY OF GOSNELLS DOGS LOCAL LAW 2020 

4.1 City of Gosnells Dogs Local Law 2020 amended 

This part of the local law amends the City of Gosnells Dogs Local Law 2020. 

4.2 SCHEDULE 3—OFFENCES IN RESPECT OF WHICH MODIFIED PENALTY APPLIES 
amended 

SCHEDULE 3—OFFENCES IN RESPECT OF WHICH MODIFIED PENALTY APPLIES is amended 
as follows— 

(1)  In Item 1 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “150” and replace it with “200”. 

(2)  In Item 2 of the table, delete the modified penalty value of “100” and replace it with “200”. 

PART 5—CITY OF GOSNELLS PARKING LOCAL LAW 2012 

5.1 City of Gosnells Parking Local Law 2012 amended 

This part of the local law amends the City of Gosnells Parking Local Law 2012. 

5.2 Clause 1.4 amended 

Clause 1.4 is amended by inserting the following definitions in alphabetical order— 

“electric personal transporter has the meaning given to it in the Code; 

electric rideable device has the meaning given to it in the Code; 

electric vehicle means a vehicle that— 

 (a) is powered by an electric motor or motors; and 

 (b) can be recharged from an external source of electricity, 

but does not include an electric personal transporter or electric ridable device; 

electric vehicle charging bay means a parking bay designated by a sign for the use of electric 
vehicles, with an external source of electricity available for charging an electric vehicle stopped 
or parked at that bay;” 

5.3 New clause 7.7 added 

After clause 7.6, add a new clause 7.7 as follows— 

“7.7 Parking in electric vehicle charging bays 

(1)  A driver must not stop or park a vehicle in an electric vehicle charging bay unless the vehicle 
is— 

 (a) an electric vehicle; and 

 (b) connected to the external source of electricity available for that electric vehicle charging 
bay for the purpose of charging the vehicle. 

(2)  Unless otherwise signed, a person may not park in a designated electric vehicle charging bay 
for longer than 2 continuous hours.” 

5.4 Clause 9.1(2) amended 

Clause 9.1(2) is amended by deleting “$5,000” and replacing it with “$10,000”. 



2108 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 November 2025 

5.5 Schedule 1—Prescribed offences amended 

In Schedule 1—Prescribed offences, insert the following rows in the table after CLAUSE 7.6— 

7.7(1)(a) 
Stopping or parking a vehicle other than an electric vehicle in an electric 
vehicle charging bay 

100 

7.7(1)(b) 
Stopping or parking an electric vehicle in an electric vehicle charging 
bay when the vehicle is not connected to the external source of electricity 
for that bay 

100 

7.7(2) 
Stopping or parking for longer than 2 hours in an electric vehicle 
charging bay  

100 

 

Dated 4 November 2025. 

The Common Seal of the City of Gosnells was affixed by authority of a resolution of the Council in the 
presence of— 

TERRESA LYNES, Mayor. 
IAN COWIE PSM, Chief Executive Officer. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401 

DANGEROUS GOODS SAFETY ACT 2004 

1. Approval of Codes of Practice 

In accordance with section 42 of the Interpretation Act 1984 and section 20(7) of the Dangerous Goods 
Safety Act 2004, notice is given for the following codes of practice previously approved by the Minister 
of Mines and Petroleum— 

 • Code of practice: Minimising the risk of tyre fires when transporting ammonium nitrate 
explosion risk goods 

 • Code of practice: Safe storage of solid ammonium nitrate 

 • Code of practice: Safe use of close proximity fireworks in Western Australia 

 • Code of practice: Safe use of outdoor fireworks in Western Australia. 

2. Commencement 

The codes of practice are published on www.worksafe.wa.gov.au and available for public inspection at 
the Department of Local Government, Industry Regulation and Safety Library, located at Level 1, 
Mineral House, 100 Plain Street, East Perth, Western Australia. 

Date approved: 16 October 2025. 

Hon. SIMONE MCGURK, MLA, Minister for Industrial Relations. 

 

——————————— 
 

MP402 

MINING ACT 1978 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines, Petroleum and Exploration, 

Marble Bar WA 6760. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable for forfeiture under the provision of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act 1978 
for non payment of rent. 

WARDEN TW MCPHEE. 

———— 
 

To be heard by the Warden in Perth on 2 December 2025. 

 

PILBARA MINERAL FIELD 

Prospecting Licences 

P 45/3166 Dalrymple Mining & Construction Pty Ltd 

P 46/2041 Valroc Ventures Pty Ltd 

P 46/2042 Valroc Ventures Pty Ltd 

 



7 November 2025 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2109 

MP403 

MINING ACT 1978 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines, Petroleum and Exploration, 

Marble Bar WA 6760. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provision of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act 1978 
for breach of covenant, being failure to comply with the reporting provisions. 

WARDEN TW MCPHEE. 

———— 
 

To be heard by the Warden in Perth on 2 December 2025. 

 

PILBARA MINERAL FIELD 

Prospecting Licences 

P 45/3107 Zabiela, Joseph Victor 

 

——————————— 

MP404 

MINING ACT 1978 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines, Petroleum and Exploration, 

Coolgardie WA 6429. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provision of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act 1978 
for breach of covenant, being failure to comply with the prescribed reporting provisions. 

WARDEN DAVIES. 

———— 
 

To be heard by the Warden in Kalgoorlie on 10 December 2025. 

 

COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 

Prospecting Licences 

P 15/6328 White, Brett Jonathan 

P 15/6329 White, Brett Jonathan 

P 16/3312 Jordan, Guy Alan 

P 16/3366 Rudd, Steven John 

P 16/3367 Rudd, Steven John 

 

——————————— 

MP405 

MINING ACT 1978 

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Mines, Petroleum and Exploration, 

Coolgardie WA 6429. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable for forfeiture under the provision of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act 1978 
for non payment of rent. 

WARDEN DAVIES. 

———— 
 

To be heard by the Warden in Kalgoorlie on 10 December 2025. 

 

COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 

Prospecting Licences 

P 16/3283 Owen, Tristan David 



2110 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 November 2025 

PLANNING 

PL401 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

DECLARATION OF PLANNING CONTROL AREA 192 

Hutton Street (Hector Street West to Howe Street) 

City of Stirling 

File: RLS/1198 

General Description 

The Minister for Planning and Lands has granted approval to the declaration of Planning Control Area 
192, over land for Hutton Street (Hector Street West to Howe Street), Osborne Park as shown on 
Western Australian Planning Commission (WAPC) plan numbers 1.8275 and 1.8276. 

Purpose of the Planning Control Area 

Planning Control Area 192 is intended to protect land for the future widening of Hutton Street in 
Osborne Park. 

The WAPC considers that the Planning Control Area is required over the properties to ensure that no 
development occurs on the land which might prejudice this purpose until it may be reserved for Other 
Regional Roads (ORR) purposes in the Metropolitan Region Scheme. 

Duration and Effects 

The declaration remains in effect for a period of five years from the date of publication of this notice in 
the Government Gazette, being 07 November 2025, or until revoked by the WAPC with approval by the 
Minister, whichever is sooner. 

A person shall not commence and carry out development in a planning control area without the prior 
approval of the WAPC. The penalty for failure to comply with this requirement is $200,000 and, in the 
case of a continuing offence, a further fine of $25,000 for each day during which the offence continues. 

Compensation is payable in respect of land injuriously affected by this declaration, and land so affected 
may be acquired by the WAPC in the same circumstances and in the same manner as if the land had 
been reserved in the Metropolitan Region Scheme for a public purpose. 

Display Locations 

Documents can be viewed online at the Department of Planning, Lands and Heritage website 
https://www.wa.gov.au/government/document-collections/planning-control-areas. 

Ms SAM BOUCHER, Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission. 

 

——————————— 
 

PL402 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

DECLARATION OF PLANNING CONTROL AREA 193 

Mortimer Road (Casuarina/Wellard) 

City of Kwinana 

File: RLS/1162 

General Description 

The Minister for Planning and Lands has granted approval to the declaration of a planning control area 
over portions of Mortimer Road between the Primary Regional Road reservation for Kwinana Freeway 
and the boundary between Lot 123 and Lot 301 Mortimer Road to the north, and Woolcoot Road to the 
south, as shown on Western Australian Planning Commission (WAPC) plan number 1.8141/1. 

Purpose of the Planning Control Area 

Planning Control Area 193 is intended to protect land identified for the future upgrade and widening 
of Mortimer Road. 

The WAPC considers that the planning control area is required over the properties to ensure that no 
development occurs on the land which might prejudice this purpose until it may be reserved for Other 
Regional Road purposes in the Metropolitan Region Scheme. 



7 November 2025 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2111 

Duration and Effects 

The declaration remains in effect for a period of five years from the date of publication of this notice in 
the Government Gazette, being 07 November 2025, or until revoked by the WAPC with approval by the 
Minister, whichever is sooner. 

A person shall not commence and carry out development in a planning control area without the prior 
approval of the WAPC. The penalty for failure to comply with this requirement is $200,000 and, in the 
case of a continuing offence, a further fine of $25,000 for each day during which the offence continues. 

Compensation is payable in respect of land injuriously affected by this declaration, and land so affected 
may be acquired by the WAPC in the same circumstances and in the same manner as if the land had 
been reserved in the Metropolitan Region Scheme for a public purpose. 

Display Locations 

Documents can be viewed online at the Department of Planning, Lands and Heritage website 
https://www.wa.gov.au/government/document-collections/planning-control-areas. 

Ms SAM BOUCHER, Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission. 

POLICE 

PO401 

MISUSE OF DRUGS ACT 1981 

MISUSE OF DRUGS REGULATIONS 1982 

APPROVED ANALYST 

I, Colin John Blanch, Commissioner of Police in the State of Western Australia, under section 3A(1) of 
the Misuse of Drugs Act 1981 by this notice declare the following person, employed by ChemCentre, to 
be an approved analyst for the purposes of the Act. 

Title Given Names Surname DOB Qualifications 

Ms Nadine Rehulina Lingga 06/12/2000 BSc (Hons) (Chemistry) 

Dated 3 November 2025. 

COLIN JOHN BLANCH APM, Commissioner of Police. 

 

——————————— 
 

 

PO402 

MISUSE OF DRUGS ACT 1981 

MISUSE OF DRUGS REGULATIONS 1982 

APPROVED ANALYST 

I, Colin John Blanch, Commissioner of Police in the State of Western Australia, under section 3A(2) of 
the Misuse of Drugs Act 1981 by this further notice approve the following person, employed by 
ChemCentre, to continue as an approved analyst for the purposes of the Act. 

Title Given Names Surname DOB Qualifications 

Mrs Jessica Marie Tommasi (nee 
Murdock)  

28/08/1986 BTech (Forensic and Analytical 
Chemistry) 

B.Sc.(Hons) 

Dated 3 November 2025. 

COLIN JOHN BLANCH APM, Commissioner of Police. 



2112 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 November 2025 

PUBLIC NOTICES 

ZZ401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Margaret Valda Dolphin, late of Carine Parkside Community Care, 29 Silica Road Carine in the State 
of Western Australia, Business Proprietor, Retired, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died 6 September 2025 are required by the applicant for grant 
of representation, c/- CS Legal, Level 20, 77 St Georges Terrace, Perth WA 6000 to send particulars of 
their claims to the applicant within 30 days from the date of publication of this notice, after which date 
the applicant for grant of representation may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the 
claims of which she/he then has notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ402 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Jacoba Johanna Maria Kocken, late of Molenberg 5, DE 522 S-Hertogenbosch, The Netherlands, 
Retired, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 1 October 2024, are required by the Executor, Elinor 
Mary Theodora Kocken, (Executor) care of Mid West Lawyers, 45 Ventnor Avenue, West Perth, Western 
Australia, to send particulars of their claims to her within ONE (1) month from the date of publication 
of this notice, after which date the Executor may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to 
the claims of which they then have notice. 

MID WEST LAWYERS. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ403 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Hilary June Wilson late of 31 Moorhouse Street, Willagee, in the State of Western Australia, deceased 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on the 14th day of April 2025 at Willagee in the said State 
are required by the executor Matthew Edward Wilson of 38 Marconi Road, Yakamia, Western Australia 
to send particulars of their claims to David Moss & Co of PO Box 5744, Albany W.A. 6332 by the date 
one month following the publication of this notice after which date the executors may convey or 
distribute the assets having regard only to the claim for which they have then had notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ404 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Ian Ritchie late of 2/63 Anstey Street, South Perth, in the State of Western Australia, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 26 July 2025 are required by the trustee to send 
particulars of their claims to care of Cornerstone Legal of Suite 205, 5 Harper Terrace, South Perth, in 
the State of Western Australia 6151, on or before 30 days from the date of publication of this notice, 
after which date the trustee may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which 
they then have notice. 

CORNERSTONE LEGAL as solicitors for the personal representative. 

 



7 November 2025 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2113 

ZZ405 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Marlene Rae Carter, late of 26 Megalong Street, Nedlands, Western Australia, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died 27 July 2025, are required by the executors, Richard 
John Sherwood, Byan Martin Gardiner and Jaqueline Peta Thompson of and care of 26 Megalong 
Street, Nedlands, Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to them by the 15th day of 
December 2025, after which date the executors may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only 
to the claims of which they then have notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ406 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Elizabeth Ann Murdoch late of 50 Dumfries Road, Floreat, Western Australia, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 19 July 2025, are required by the Executor, Patrick 
Mark Hamlyn, care of PO Box 564, West Perth, WA 6872 to send particulars of their claim by Tuesday 
9 December 2025, after which date the Executor may convey or distribute the assets, having regard 
only to the claims of which he then has notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ407 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Elizabeth Crosbie-Mahon late of 16 Fiona Wood Road, Murdoch, Western Australia, formerly of 
29 Mitchell Street, Ardross, Western Australia, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 21 April 2025 are required by the personal 
representative, Craig Harry James and Michael Filan Ashforth of care of IRDI Legal, 248 Oxford Street, 
Leederville, Western Australia 6007, to send particulars of their claims to them within 31 days from 
date of publication of this Notice after which date the personal representative may convey or distribute 
the assets having regard to the claims of which they then have notice. 

IRDI LEGAL as solicitors for the personal representative. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ408 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Pamela Heather Morgan late of 15 Hutt Court, Two Rocks, in the State of Western Australia, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 3 August 2025 are required by the trustee to send 
particulars of their claims to care of Cornerstone Legal of Suite 205, 5 Harper Terrace, South Perth, in 
the State of Western Australia 6151, on or before 30 days from the date of publication of this notice, 
after which date the trustee may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which 
they then have notice. 

CORNERSTONE LEGAL as solicitors for the personal representative. 

 

——————————— 
 



2114 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 November 2025 

ZZ409 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 and 
amendments thereto relate) in respect of the estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are 
required by the personal representatives care of Messrs Jackson McDonald, Level 17, 225 St Georges 
Terrace, Perth, Western Australia 6000 (GPO Box M971 Perth Western Australia 6843) to send 
particulars of their claims to them within one month from the date of publication of this notice at the 
expiration of which time the personal representatives may convey or distribute the assets having regard 
only to the claims of which they have then had notice— 

Luke Anthony Banham deceased late of 17 Holmes Street, Boulder, Western Australia, who died 
on 3 February 2025; and 

Merylyn Lucas deceased late of Bethanie Como, 30 McNabb Loop, Como, Western Australia, who 
died on 18 August 2025. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ410 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Kaye Louise Foley, late of 47 Pace Road, Medina, Western Australia, Nursing Assistant, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 3 June 2024 are required by the Administrator William 
Michael Robinson care of Curae Law, Level 4, 1008 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000 to send particulars of 
their claims to him by the date being one month from the date of publication of this notice after which 
date the administrator may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which 
he then has notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ411 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Estate of the late Dallas Winsome Wood late of 57 Palmerston Street, Mosman Park, Western Australia, 
deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates), in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 6 June 2025 are requested by the Executor, Murray 
Noel Thornhill, care of HHG Legal Group, GPO Box 2716, Cloisters Square PO WA 6850 to send 
particulars of their claims to the address stated herein within 30 days of this notice, after which date 
the personal representatives may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of 
which they then have notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ412 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants of Colin John Pickering late of 311 Chloride Street, Broken Hill, 
New South Wales, Industrial Chemist, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 12 June 2025 are required by the Trustee Australian 
Executor Trustees Limited ACN 007 869 794 of GPO Box 546, Adelaide SA 5001 to send particulars of 
their claim to them by 19 December 2025 after which date the Trustee may convey or distribute the 
assets having regard only to the claims of which it then has notice. 

 

——————————— 
 



7 November 2025 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2115 

ZZ413 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Elizabeth Ann Sandon, late of 3/35 King George Street, Victoria Park, Western Australia, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on or before 14 August 2025 are required by the trustee 
to send particulars of their claims to the trustee at their office at Crystal Lawyers, PO Box 8485, Angelo 
St, South Perth, WA 6151 by 6 December 2025, after that date the trustee will convey or distribute the 
assets, having regard only to the claims of which it then has notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ414 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Estate of the late Otto Hofmann, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 13 June 2025, are required by the Executor of the 
Estate to send particulars of their claims to PO Box 1907, Busselton WA 6280 within one (1) month 
from the date of publication of this notice, after which the Executor of the Estate may convey or 
distribute the assets, having regard only to the claims of which they then have notice. 

Dated 4 November 2025. 

CHRISTINE HOFMANN. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ415 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Jennifer Eleanor Caporn late of 55 Eucalyptus Boulevard, Canning Vale in the State of Western 
Australia, deceased. 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 30 May 2025 are required by the trustee to send 
particulars of their claims to care of Cornerstone Legal of Suite 205, 5 Harper Terrace, South Perth, in 
the State of Western Australia 6151, on or before 30 days from the date of publication of this notice, 
after which date the trustee may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which 
they then have notice. 

CORNERSTONE LEGAL as solicitors for the personal representative. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZZ416 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before 8 November 2025. after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, 
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 

Brown, Nancy Joyce, late of 15 Stampel Gardens, Kardinya, who died on 3 September 2025 
(DE19660038 EM15). 

Browne, Valma, late of Dale Cottages, 4 Hobbs Drive, Armadale, who died on 13 September 2025 
(DE33053031 EM53). 

Coleman, Joyce Shirley, late of Emerald Life Aged Care Home by Hall & Prior, 78 Kimberley Street, 
West Leederville, who died on 21 August 2025 (DE19723405 EM22). 

Marriner, Jack Thompson, late of Aegis Carrington, 27 Ivermey Road, Hamilton Hill, who died on 
21 July 2025 (DE19710408 EM23). 



2116 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 November 2025 

Richardson, Norma (also known as Shell Richardson), late of Aegis Shawford, 8 Twyford Place, Innaloo, 
who died on 3 October 2025 (DE19772170 EM14). 

Rowland, Dennis, formerly of Regis Nedlands, 116 Monash Avenue, Nedlands, late of Regis 
Greenmount, 22 Coongan Avenue, Greenmount, who died on 22 July 2025 (PM33103820 EM12). 

Sherwood, Allan George Terence, late of Unit 9, 58 King Road, Beechboro, who died on 11 September 
2025 (DE33113118 EM26). 

Skane, Ramon Keith, late of Aegis Parkview, 6 Drummond Street, Redcliffe, who died on 18 September 
2025 (DE19710251 EM36). 

Tapley, Colleen, formerly of 42 Hume Road, Thornlie, late of BaptistCare Gracewood, 20 Roebuck Drive, 
Salter Point, who died on 21 August 2025 (DE33021556 EM57). 

Thomas, Betty Ida, late of Dale Cottages, 4 Hobbs Drive, Armadale, who died on 16 August 2025 
(DE19830312 EM36). 

BRIAN ROCHE, Public Trustee, 
553 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000. 

Telephone: 1300 746 212. 

 

——————————— 
 

 


