
OF

WE fER14 AUSTRALIA
(Published by Authority at 3 p.m.)

No. 28]
	

PERTH : THURSDAY, 13th
	

[1972

HEALTH ACT, 1911-1970.

Department of Public Health,
Perth, 27th March, 1972.

P.H.D. 828/70. Ex. Co. 880.
HIS Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting pursuant to the
provisions of the Health Act, 1911-1970, has been pleased to make the
regulations set forth in the schedule hereunder.

W. S. DAVIDSON,
Commissioner of Public Health.

Schedule.
Regulations.

1. In these regulations the Meat Inspection and Branding
Regulations made under the provisions of the Health Act, 1911, as
published in the Government Gazette on the 1st December, 1950
and reprinted pursuant to the Reprinting of Regulations Act, 1954
in the Government Gazette on the 28th April, 1965, as amended
from time to time thereafter by notices so published, are referred
to as the principal regulations.

2. Regulation 5 of the principal regulations is amended
(a) by inserting immediately below the passage "Albany-

Thomas Borthwick and Sons (A/ asia) Ltd., Deepwater
Jetty" the passage "Augusta-Margaret River-Sussex Loc.
3947 (Karridale)."; and

(b) by inserting immediately below the passage "Sussex-
Busselton-Sussex Location 5, Lot 162 and part of Sussex
Location 1, Lot 12." the passage "Tammin-Abattoir on
Tammin Agricultural Area Lot 1.".

Principal
regulations.

Reg. 5
amended.

3. Schedule A to the principal regulations is amended by adding Schedule A
to paragraph 3, brands and words as follows- amended.

Augusta-Margaret
	 Tammin.

River.



796
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A.	 [13 April, 1972.

Schedule B
amended.

Schedule C
amended.

4. Schedule B to the principal regulations is amended
(a) by inserting immediately below the passage "Armadale-

Kelmscott Health District." the passage "Augusta-Margaret
River Health District."; and

(b) by inserting immediately below the passage "Swan-Guild-
ford Health District." the passage "Tammin Health
District.".

5. Schedule C to the principal regulations is amended
(a) as to paragraph (2) Scale "B"—

(i) by inserting immediately below the passage "Shire
of Albany." the passage "Shire of Augusta-Margaret
River.";

(ii) by inserting immediately below the passage "Shire
of Busselton." the passage "Shire of Capel.";

(iii) by inserting immediately below the passage "Shire
of Greenough." the passage "Shire of Harvey."; and

(iv) by inserting immediately below the passage "Shire
of Plantagenet." the passage "Shire of Tammin.";
and

(b) by deleting the passages "Shire of Capel." and "Shire of
Harvey." from paragraph (3) Scale "C".

HEALTH ACT, 1911-1970.
Shire of Gosnells.

P.H.D. 674/61; Ex. Co. 882.
WHEREAS under the provisions of the Health Act. 1911-1970, a Local Authority
may make or adopt by-laws, and may alter, amend or repeal any by-laws so
made or adopted: Now, therefore, the Shire of Gosnells, being a local authority
within the meaning of the Act and having adopted the Model By-laws described
as Series "A" as reprinted pursuant to the Reprinting of Regulations Act,. 1954,
in the Government Gazette on the 17th July, 1963, doth hereby resolve and
determine that the said adopted by-laws shall be amended as follows:—

PART I.—GENERAL SANITARY PROVISIONS.
Substitute for the existing by-law 28A a new by-law 28A to read as follows:—

Breeding and Boarding of Dogs.
28A. (1) No person shall keep more than 2 dogs over the age of 3 months

on any land within the district of the Shire of Gosnells except within that area
of the district where kennels are permitted under the Shire of Gosnells Town
Planning Scheme No. 1 as amended.

(2) The occupier of any premises whereon dogs are kept for breeding pur-
poses or for boarding on behalf of any other person or whereon more than 2
dogs over the age of 3 months are kept for any other purpose, shall comply with
the following conditions:

(a) The occupier shall register with the Local Authority as a keeper of
dogs and the premises shall also be registered.

(b) The occupier shall have paid to the Local Authority a registration fee of
fifty cents.

(c) The occupier shall provide for every dog a properly constructed kennel
within an enclosure, which shall comply with the following condi-
tions:—

(i) Every kennel shall have a floor area of not less than six square
feet for every dog over three months old that may be kept
therein.

(ii) The area of the enclosure appurtenant to any kennel or group
of kennels shall not be less than three times the area of the
kennel or group of kennels to which it is appurtenant.



13 April, 1972.]
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A.	 797

(d) No kennel or enclosure shall be at a less distance than 30 feet from
the boundary of any land not in the same ownership or possession
or at any less distance than 30 feet from any dwelling, church, school-
room, hall, factory, dairy, or premises whatsoever wherein food is
manufactured, packed, or prepared for human consumption.

(e) All enclosures, yards, runs and kennels within which dogs are kept,
shall be maintained at all times in a clean condition and free from
vermin and shall at any time be cleaned, disinfected, or otherwise
dealt with as an inspector may direct.

Passed at a meeting of the Gosnells Shire Council held on the 17th day of
January, 1972.

A. A. MILLS,
President.

M. BRYDEN,
Acting Shire Clerk.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, this 22nd
day of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.

HEALTH ACT, 1911-1970.

Shire of Murray.

P.H.D. 254/67; Ex. Co. 881.
WHEREAS under the provisions of the Health Act, 1911, as amended, a local
authority may make or adopt by-laws and may alter, amend or repeal any
by-laws so made or adopted: Now, therefore, the Shire of Murray, being a
local authority within the meaning of the Act and having adopted the Model
By-laws described as Series "A" as reprinted in the Government Gazette on
the 17th July, 1963, doth hereby resolve and determine that the said adopted
by-laws shall be amended as follows:—

PART VII.—FOOD.
By-law 51 is amended by substituting for the amount of ten dollars where

it appears in sub-by-law (2), the amount of twenty-five dollars.

Passed at a meeting of the Murray Shire Council held on the 16th day of
December, 1971.

H. W. NANCARROW,
President.

J. W. SIBBALD,
Shire Clerk.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council this 22nd
day of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.



798
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A.	 [13 April, 1972.

HEALTH ACT, 1911-1970.
Shire of Murray,

P.H.D. 254/67; Ex. Co. 881.
WHEREAS under the provisions of the Health Act, 1911, as amended, a local
authority may make or adopt by-laws and may alter, amend or repeal any
by-laws so made or adopted: Now, therefore, the Shire of Murray, being a
local authority within the meaning of the Act and, having adopted the Model
By-Laws described as Series "A" as reprinted in the Government Gazette on
the 17th July, 1963, doth hereby resolve and determine that the said adopted
by-laws shall be amended as follows:—

PART I.—GENERAL SANITARY PROVISIONS.
Substitute for by-law 28 a new by-law to read as follows:-

28. (1) In respect of a residential block of land having an area of half
an acre or less, a person shall not keep, or permit to be kept thereon, more
than either one horse, or one cow, or one sheep, or one goat, or one donkey,
at any one time, without having first received the written approval of
Council specifying the number of such animals that may be kept thereon,
but such approval may be cancelled by the Council in any case where,
having regard to the circumstances, it is of the opinion that such cancella-
tion is warranted.

(2) In respect of a residential block of land exceeding half an acre in
area, a person shall not keep any horse, cow, sheep, goat or donkey in
excess of the number enumerated above without having first received the
written approval of the Council specifying the number of such animals that
may be kept thereon, but such approval may be cancelled by the Council
in any case where, having regard to the circumstances, it is of the opinion
that such cancellation is warranted.

(3) A person shall not allow any horse, cow, sheep, goat or donkey to
approach to within 100 feet )1' any dwelling whatsoever, or other building
where food is stored or prepared, or to within 100 feet of any street
adjoining such property without having first received the written approval
of Council specifying a lesser distance, but such approval may be cancelled
by the Council in any case where, having regard to the circumstances, it
is of the opinion that such cancellation is warranted.

Passed at a meeting of the Murray Shire Council on the 17th day of Feb-
ruary, 1972.

H. W. NANCARROW,
President.

J. W. SIBBALD,
Shire Clerk.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, this 22nd
day of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.

FIRE BRIGADES ACT, 1942-1971.
Chief Secretary's Department,

Perth, 27th March, 1972.
HIS Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting pursuant to the
provisions of the Fire Brigades Act, 1942-1971, has been pleased to make the
regulations set forth in the Schedule hereunder.

C. W. CAMPBELL,
Secretary.

Schedule.
Regulations.

Principal	 1. In these regulations the Fire Brigades Act Regulations re-
regulations. printed pursuant to the Reprinting of Regulations Act, 1954, and

published in the Government Gazette on the 28th April, 1965, as
amended from time to time thereafter by notices so published, are
referred to as the principal regulations.



13 April, 1972.]	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 799

Reg. 147
amended.2. Regulation 147 of the principal regulations is amended by

substituting for the word "right" in line four, the word "left".

3. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for Reg. 158
regulation 158 the following regulation:—	 substituted.

158. (1) Subject to the provisions of this regulation the
complement of any volunteer brigade shall be forty registered
members, consisting of the following number of members in
each of the following grades

(a) ten Probationary Volunteer Firemen;
(b) twenty-five Active Volunteer Firemen including a Cap-

tain, Foreman, Apparatus Officer and Secretary; and
(c) five Reserve Volunteer Firemen.

(2) The Board may, in addition to the forty registered mem-
bers referred to in subregulation (1) of this regulation, register
Junior Members of any volunteer brigade.

(3) The Board may approve of a temporary increase in the
number of Reserve Firemen in any case where the Board, having
regard to the existence of the special circumstances, is of opinion
that such increase is for the time being necessary.

(4) Where an Active or Reserve Volunteer Fireman is absent
from duty with a brigade, by reason of the operation, of the
National Service Act, 1951 (as amended) of the Commonwealth,
he conitnues as an active or reserve registered member of the
brigade, but, notwithstanding that continued membership and
any provision of this regulation to the contrary, his place may
be filled, during his absence, as provided by regulation 167 of
these regulations.

(5) Where the Board has filled the place of an Active or
Reserve Volunteer Fireman pursuant to subregulation (4) of
this regulation, and that member returns to active duty with
the brigade, the Board shall not fill the vacancy occurring first
after his return to active or reserve duty, with the intent that
the brigade shall be restored to, and be maintained at the correct
complement, as soon as practicable.

4. Regulation 163 of the principal regulations is amended by delet- Reg. 163
ing from paragraphs (c) and (d) the word "reserve".	 amended.

5. The principal regulations are amended by deleting from the
heading to regulation 166 the word "Active".

Reg. 166
amended.

6. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for regu- Reg. 167
lation 167 the following regulation:— 	 substituted.

Brigade Membership.
167. (1) New members shall be enrolled as Probationary

Volunteer Firemen, and after serving three months' satisfactory
service, may be recommended by the brigade Captain to the
Board for transfer to the active volunteer grade, and where
approval by the Board is granted shall be so transferred when
a vacancy occurs.

(2) Where a vacancy exists in either the active or the reserve
grade, any member in either of those grades may, upon the
resolution of a general meeting of the brigade and the approval
of the Board, transfer to the other.

(3) Notwithstanding the provisions of subregulation (1) of this
regulation, the Board may, when new brigades are inaugurated,
enrol members as Active Volunteer Firemen when the Board is
satisfied that those members have had sufficient training to
equip them as active members.

(4) Subject to the approval of the Board, the brigade Captain
may enrol Junior Members, and when vacancies in the grade of
Probationary Volunteer Firemen occur, those vacancies shall,
whenever possible, be filled by Junior Members who have reached
the age of 17 years.



800	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 [13 April, 1972.

Reg. 168
substituted.

Reg. 171
substituted.

Reg. 180
amended.

Reg. 183
amended.

Reg. 184
amended.

Reg. 184A
added.

7. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for
regulation 168 the following regulation:-

168. (1) Probationary, Active and Reserve Volunteer Firemen
shall apply in writing to the brigade Captain for any leave of
absence.

(2) The brigade Captain may approve or reject any applica-
tion for leave of absence for a period less than one month.

(3) When an application for leave of absence is for a period
greater than one month the Captain shall forward the application
to the Board for approval or rejection, with his recommendation.

(4) Junior Members shall apply in writing to the brigade Cap-
tain for any period of leave of absence and the brigade Captain
shall grant or reject that application.

8. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for
regulation 171 the following regulation:-

171. Where, without leave or sufficient excuse
(a) a probationary or active member fails to comply with any

of the provisions of regulation 184 of these regulations;
(b) a reserve member fails to comply with any of the pro-

visions of regulation 185 of these regulations; or
(c) a junior member fails to comply with the provisions of

regulation 185A of these regulations,
he may be struck off the register by the Board. .

9. Regulation 180 of the principal regulations is amended by
deleting from line two of paragraph (1) the word "reserve".

10. Regulation 183 of the principal regulations is amended
(a) by inserting in line four of paragraph (1), after the word

"new", the passage "junior, probationary,"; and
(b) by substituting for subparagraphs (i) and (ii) of paragraph

(m) the following subparagraphs:-
(i) Register of Members—in which shall be entered in ink

the full name of every registered member, together
with his age, birthplace, occupation, residence, brigade
rank, dates of admission to and leaving the brigade,
dates of election to and ceasing to be an officer, dates
of transfer from one grade to another, dates granted
long service awards, and any other relevant informa-
tion.

(ii) Register of Fires—in which shall be entered in ink
full particulars of all fires and alarms of fire, together
with the names and respective ranks of members in
attendance.

11. Regulation 184 of the principal regulations is amended by
substituting for the passage

"Active Members.
184. Active members shall—"

the following passage :—
"Probationary and Active Members.

184. Probationary and active members shall—".

12. The principal regulations are amended by adding after regu-
lation 184 the following regulation:-

184A. Probationary members shall attend volunteer brigade
meetings and may take part in the discussions, but they shall not
have the right to vote on motions submitted to the' meeting. .



13 April, 1972.]	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 801

13. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for
regulation 185 the following regulation:-

185. Reserve members
(a) shall be available for fire calls;
(b) shall keep themselves proficient in the use of fire ex-

tinguishing apparatus and plant by attending periodic
drills and lectures, to the satisfatcion of the brigade
Captain or Chief Officer;

(c) may attend volunteer brigade meetings and speak and
vote on the proceedings at those meetings;

(d) shall not hold office as an officer of the brigade. .

Reg. 185
substituted.

14. The principal regulations are amended by adding after Reg. 185A
regulation 185 a new regulation as follows— added.

Junior Members.
185A. Junior members

(a) may operate pumps under the strict supervision of a
brigade officer;

(b) shall hold separate meetings, under the supervision of
the Captain or officer in charge of the brigade or
other officer appointed for the purpose;

(c) shall not attend fires or participate in brigade practices
and drills held for probationary, active or reserve mem-
bers; and

(d) shall not travel on a fire fighting appliance.

15. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for Reg. 191
regulation 191 the following regulation—	 substituted.

191. (1) Probationary and active members of each brigade
shall be practised in the duties concerning fire extinguishing
apparatus and plant, or other drills at least once each calendar
month, under the supervision of their officers, and at such
other times as the Board, Chief Officer or Captain may direct.

(2) Reserve members shall attend periodic drills and prac-
tices at such times as directed by the brigade Captain or Chief
Officer.

(3) A recognised practice shall mean practical work in fire
extinction or other drill, for at least three-quarters of an hour.

(4) Each brigade may appoint its own dates for practices.

16. Regulation 192 of the principal regulations is amended— 	 Reg. 192
(a) by substituting for the passage "fifty pounds (£50)" in amended.

line three of paragraph 3 (b), the passage "one hundred
dollars ($100.)"; and

(b) by substituting for the passage "twenty-five pounds (£25)"
in line five of paragraph (c), the passage "fifty dollars
($50.)" .

17. Regulation 192A of the principal regulations is amended by
deleting from line one the word "reserve".

Reg. 192A
amended.

18. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for Reg. 193
regulation 193 the following regulation— 	 substituted.

193. (1) The Board shall determine which volunteer brigades
shall be eligible for uniform issue.

(2) The uniform supplied by the Board for Officers and
active and reserve members of eligible volunteer fire brigades,
shall consist of a coat with an arm flash with the brigade name
inscribed thereon, and a cap and belt.

(3) Officers and active and reserve members may provide
their own summer uniform shirt of a style and pattern approved
by the Board, but when on duty may wear that shirt in lieu
of the coat only if and when directed by the Board.



802
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 [13 April, 1972.

(4) Rank insignia and badges for officers shall be as follows:-
Captain—Double Scale Chrome Shoulder Epaulettes worn

on coat and Captain's Badge attached to the coat
above the right top pocket.

Foreman—Single Scale Chrome Shoulder Epaulettes worn
on coat, and Foreman's Badge attached to the coat
above the right top pocket.

Apparatus Officer—Apparatus Officer's Badge attached to
the coat above the right top pocket.

Secretary—Secretary's badge attached to the coat above
the right top pocket.

(5) All officers and active and reserve members of volunteer
fire brigades eligible to wear uniform, shall wear an official
W.A. Fire Brigades badge on the cap.

(6) Probationary volunteer firemen shall not be issued with
uniform.

Reg. 194
substituted.

Reg. 195
substituted.

Reg. 196
amended.

Reg. 202
substituted.

Reg. 204
substituted.

Reg. 205
substituted.

19. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for
regulation 194 the following regulation:-

194. (1) Junior members shall not be supplied with uniforms
by the Board.

(2) The brigade may supply unforms to junior members the
type and design of which, shall from time to time, be determined
by the Board.

20. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for
regulation 195 the following regulation-

195. (1) The uniform and equipment supplied to active and
reserve members in accordance with these regulations shall
remain the property of the Board.

(2) Any uniform supplied to junior members by a brigade
shall remain the property of the brigade.

21. Regulation 196 of the principal regulations is amended by
substituting for the passage "not be more than 20 inches wide over
the instep", in line four, the passage "be a minimum of 19 inches
and a maximum of 22 inches wide over the instep".

22. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for
regulation 202 the following regulation:-

202. Her Majesty the Queen's Fire Brigade Long Service
and Good Conduct Medal shall be worn on the left breast of
the coat but all other long service awards shall be worn in
such manner as is determined from time to time by the Board.

23. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for
regulation 204 the following regulation:-

204. Captains shall during the months of January and July
in each year, inspect all uniforms and equipment on issue, and
forthwith report to the Chief Officer on the condition thereof,
and requisitions for new issues or replacements shall reach the
Chief Officer not later than the 28th day of February and
31st day of August in each year.

24. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for
regulation 205 the following regulation:-

205. Brigade secretaries shall after checking all unifrom
issues to members, with store requisition or purchase order,
return the appropriate copy, duly signed, to the Chief Executive
Officer of the Board.



13 April, 1972.]
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 803

Reg. 206
substituted.25. The principal regulations are amended by substituting for

regulation 206 the following regulation-
206. (1) A member with not less than five years' service as a

Captain under the Board, and not less than fifteen years'
service in all shall be entitled to retain his Double Scale Chrome
Shoulder Epaulettes to be worn on coat and to wear an ex-
Captain's Badge above the right top pocket of his coat.

(2) Service as a junior member shall not be counted as
service for the purpose of sub-regulation (1) of this regulation.

26. Regulation 207 of the principal regulations is amended by
substituting for the symbol and figure "£5" in line five, the symbol
and figures "$10".

27. Regulation 208 of the principal regulations is amended
(a) by substituting for paragraphs (a), (b) and (c) of sub-

regulation (1) the following paragraphs:
(a) for 5, 15, 30, 40 and 50 years' service, a service star;

(b) for 20 years' service, Her Majesty the Queen's Fire
Brigade Long Service and Good Conduct Medal. ;
and

(b) by substituting for paragraph (c) of sub-regulation (2) the
following paragraphs:

(c) where a Probationary Volunteer Fireman is subse-
quently elevated to Active Volunteer Fireman, his
period of service as a Probationary Volunteer Fire-
man shall count towards long service award en-
titlements;

(d) satisfactory service as a reserve volunteer fireman
shall count as an entitlement for long service awards;

(e) periods of service as a junior member shall not
count as service to qualify for awards.

28. Paragraph (b) of regulation 209 of the principal regulations
is amended by substituting for the symbol and figure "El" occurring
in lines five and six, the symbol and figure "$2".

Reg. 207
amended.

Reg. 208
amended.

Reg. 208
amended.

29. Paragraph (a) of regulation 210 of the principal regulations Reg.210
is amended by substituting for the symbol and figure "El" in line amended.
two, the symbol and figure "$2".

30. Regulation 211 of the principal regulations is amended
(a) by substituting for the words "fifty pounds", in line two

of paragraph (a), the words, "one hundred dollars";
(b) by substituting for the words "fifty pounds", in line four

of paragraph (b), the words "one hundred dollars";
(c) by substituting for the passage "El for £1", in line three

of paragraph (d), the passage "$1 for $1"; and
(d) by substituting for the words "one hundred and fifty

Pounds", in line six of paragraph (d), the words "three
hundred dollars".

31. Regulation 212 of the principal regulations is amended by
deleting subregulations (2), (3), (4) and (5) and substituting the
following subregulations:-

(2) Stores requisitions shall be submitted (in triplicate) to
the Chief Officer for approval.

(3) Purchase orders shall be submitted (in duplicate) to the
Chief Officer, and if approved, the original shall be forwarded
to the supplying firm, or brigade secretary as the case requires.

Reg. 211
amended.

Reg. 212
amended.



804	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 [13 April, 1972.

Reg. 213
amended.

Reg. 220
amended.

(4) The original of the approved stores requisition shall be,
wherever possible, returned to the brigade with the stores as a
delivery docket and should be signed by the brigade secretary
and returned to the Chief Executive Officer as a stores receipt.

(5) When services authorised by a purchase order have been
supplied to the satisfaction of the secretary of the brigade, he
will certify the purchase order triplicate promptly and forward
it to the Chief Executive Officer.

(6) All invoices shall be forwarded promptly to the Chief
Executive Officer with completed supporting documents.

32. Regulation 213 of the principal regulations is amended by
substituting for the words "two pounds", in line three, the words
"ten dollars".

33. Regulation 220 of the principal regulations is amended
(a) by adding after the word "owner", in line three, the words

"or occupier"; and
(b) by substituting for the scale of fees and charges at the end

thereof, the following scale:—
For first hour or
part thereof and

thereafter per hour
or part thereof.

Appliances:	 $
Turntable ladder or snorkel 	 30.00
Pumps, 750 g.p.m. and upwards	 27.50
Pumps, 500-749 g.p.m. 	 25.00
Pumps, up to 499 g.p.m. 	 21.00
Other vehicles	 10.20

Equipment:
Each 100 feet of hose	 2.00
Fire extinguishers (2 gallons or 20

pounds)	 2.00	 each
plus cost of recharge

Knapsack spray	 2.00
Breathing apparatus:

Oxygen (per 2 hour set) 	 8.00
C.A.B.A.	 6.00

Manpower:
Officer-in-Charge	 5.00
Other officer	 2.75
Firemen	 2.75

METROPOLITAN REGION TOWN PLANNING SCHEME ACT, 1959-1970.

The Metropolitan Region Planning Authority,
Perth, 28th March, 1972.

HIS Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting pursuant to the
powers conferred by the Metropolitan Region Town Planning Scheme Act,
1959-1970, has been pleased to make the regulations set out in the schedule
hereunder.

E. G. FOREMAN,
Secretary.

Schedule.
Regulations.

Principal	 1. In these regulations the Metropolitan Region (Valuation
regulations. Board) Regulations, 1967, published in the Government Gazette on

the 23rd March, 1967, and subsequently amended by notice so pub-
lished on the 4th February, 1972 are referred to as the principal
regulations.



13 April, 1972.]	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 805

2. The Schedule to the principal regulations is amended by sub-
stituting for the passage beginning with the passage "Reg. 8." and
ending with the figures "18.50", the following passage:-

Reg. 8.
Fees for Board Members (other than Chairman or

or Member appointed to carry out duties under
regulation 5):

Full day	 . 28.00
Half day or portion thereof	 • 18.00

Fees for Chairman (other than a member of the
Public Service):

Full day ...	 35.00
Half day or portion the reof	 25.00

Schedule
amended.

CEMETERIES, ACT, 1897-1957.
The Municipality of the Shire of Collie.

Collie Public Cemetery By-laws.
L.G. 976/53.

IN pursance of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act and
of all other powers enabling it the Council of the abovementioned Municipality
hereby records having resolved on the 4th day of November, 1969, to make
and submit for confirmation by the Governor the following by-laws:-

1. Schedule "A" to the existing by-laws is hereby repealed.

2. The following Scale of Fees and Charges payable to the Trustees of
the Collie Cemetery Board is hereby substituted for the existing Scale of
Fees and Charges.

Collie General Cemetery.
Schedule "A".

SCALE OF FEES AND CHARGES PAYABLE TO TRUSTEES.
On application for an Order for Burial, the following fees shall be payable

in advance:-
In Open Ground- $

For sinking grave for an adult 	 11.00
For sinking grave for an adult if buried by Government contract 11.00
For sinking grave for child if under 14 years of age	 ....	 ..	 6.00
For sinking grave for child under 14 years of age if buried by

Government contract	 7.50
For re-opening grave for an adult ..	 14.00
For re-opening grave for child under 14 years 	 7.00
For sinking grave for stillborn child ....	 4.00
For iron number plate	 1.10

In Private Ground, including the issue of a grant of Right of Burial-
Ordinary land for grave, 8 ft. x 6 ft., where directed	 11.00
For sinking grave for an adult	 11.00
Ordinary land for grave, for each additional lot . 	 12.00
Special land for grave, 8 ft. x 6 ft., selected by applicant in

section where burials take place	 20.00
Special land for grave, for each additional lot 	 12.00
For interment without due notice .... 	 .... 8.40
For sinking adult's grave beyond six feet, for each additional

foot	 •..•	 4.00
For permission to construct vault	 •••• 12.60
Minister's fee (each interment) 	 4.20
For burials outside the usual hours .	 8.40
Fees for exhumation	 8.40



806
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 [13 April, 1972.

Permission to erect any iron railing, stone, brick or concrete
kerb, gravestone, or any combination of the same and subject
to the terms of paragraph 2 of the cemetery by-laws 	 .... 8.40

Permission to construct a brick grave	 ..	 .... 8.40
Undertaker's license fee payable annually in July ... 	 .... 8.40

Charges for items not included in the above shall be as specified by the
Trustees after ministerial approval and publication in the Govern-
ment Gazette.

Dated this 10th day of March, 1972.
The Common Seal of the Shire of Collie was

hereto affixed this 10th day of March,
1972, pursuant to a resolution passed this
4th day of November, 1969, in the pre-
sence of-

L. P. PIAVANINI, J.P.,
President.

P. McNAB,
[L.S.l
	

Shire Clerk.

Recommended-
C. STUBBS,

Minister for Local Government.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council this 22nd
day of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.

BUSH FIRES ACT, 1954-1970.
Shire of Trayning.

WHEREAS under the provisions of the Bush Fires Act, 1954 (as amended), a
local authority may, with the approval of the Governor, make by-laws not
inconsistent with that Act: Now, therefore, the Trayning Shire Council, being
a local authority within the meaning of the said Act, doth hereby resolve and
determine that the by-laws made by the Council and published in the Govern-
ment Gazette on the 7th March, 1952, shall be amended

(a) by substituting for the passage "men over 18", in line two of sub-
by-law (3) of by-law 7, the passage "members of either sex over 15";
and

(b) by substituting for the numerals "18", in the sixth paragraph of the
First Schedule, the numerals "15".

Passed at a meeting of the Council of the Shire of Trayning this 15th day
of November, 1971.

D. R. M. MASON,
[L.S.]
	

President.
E. C. MOLYNEUX,

Shire Clerk.

Recommended
H. D. EVANS,
Minister for Lands.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council this 22nd
day of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.



13 April, 1972.]	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 807

MOTOR VEHICLE (THIRD PARTY INSURANCE) ACT, 1943-1970.

Local Government Department,
Perth, 22nd March, 1972.

L.G. 35/72A.
HIS Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting pursuant to the
powers conferred by the Motor Vehicle (Third Party Insurance) Act, 1943-1970,
has been pleased to make the regulations set forth in the schedule hereunder.

R. C. PAUST,
Secretary for Local Government.

Schedule.
Regulations.

1. In these regulations the Motor Vehicle (Third Party Insur-
ance) Act Regulations, 1962, published in the Government Gazette
on the 1st May, 1962, reprinted pursuant to the Reprinting of
Regulations Act, 1954, in the Government Gazette on the 15th
February, 1965, and amended from time to time by notices so
published, are referred to as the principal regulations.

2. Regulation 22 of the principal regulations is amended
(a) by substituting for the expression "$18.50", in line three,

the expression "$25.00"; and
(b) by substituting for the expression "$13.50", in line five,

the expression "$18.00".

Principal
regulations.

Reg. 22
amended.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT, 1960-1971.
The Municipality of the City of Stirling.

By-laws relating to Storage of Inflammable Liquids.
L.G. 1012/63.

IN pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act and
of all other powers enabling it, the Council of the abovementioned Municipality
hereby records having resolved on the 15th day of February, 1972, to make
and submit for confirmation by the Governor the following By-laws:

The By-laws of the City of Stirling published in the Government Gazette
of the 12th May, 1971, are amended in the following manner:

By-laws 615 to 621 inclusive and By-laws 623 to 628 inclusive are repealed.

Dated the 15th day of February, 1972.
The Common Seal of City of Stirling was here-

unto affixed by authority of the Council
in the presence of-

N. C. HAWKINS,
[L.S.]

	

	
Mayor.

L. A. EASTON,
Acting Town Clerk.

Recommended
C. STUBBS,

Minister for Local Government.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council the 22nd day
of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.



808	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 [13 April, 1972.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT, 1960-1971.

The Municipality of the Shire of Cunderdin.

By-laws Relating to the Clearing of Land and Removal of Refuse,
Rubbish and Disused Material.

L.G. 213/72.
IN pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act
and of all other powers enabling it, the Council of the abovementioned Muni-
cipality hereby records having resolved on the 17th day of September, 1971
to make and submit for confirmation by the Governor the following By-laws:—

1. In these By-laws
"Council" means the Cunderdin Shire Council.
"District" means the townsites of Cunderdin and Meckering.

2. If there is
(a) on any vacant land within the district any trees, scrub, undergrowth

or rubbish; or
(b) on any land within the district any refuse, rubbish or disused material

whether of the same kind as, or a different kind from those here
specified, which in the opinion of the Council is likely to affect
adversely the value of adjoining property or the health, comfort or
convenience of the inhabitants thereof;

the Council may cause a notice under the hand of the Shire Clerk to be
served on the owner or occupier of such land requiring him, within the time
specified in such notice, to clear the land of such trees, scrub, undergrowth
or rubbish or remove such refuse, rubbish or disused material from such land.

3. Every owner or occupier of land upon whom a notice is served under
By-law 2 of these By-laws shall comply with such notice within the time
therein specified.

4. Where the owner or occupier does not clear the land or remove the
refuse, rubbish or disused material as required by the notice given by the
Council, the Council may, without payment of any compensation in respect
thereof, clear or remove it, and dispose of it at the expense of and recover in a
court of competent jurisdiction the amount of the expense, from the owner or
occupier to whom the notice was given.

5. Any person who fails to comply with any notice served under By-law 2
of these By-laws commits an offence against these By-laws and on conviction
shall be liable to a penalty not exceeding forty (40) dollars.

Dated this 20th day of September, 1971.
The Common Seal of the Municipality was

hereto affixed in the presence of-
A. J. JASPER,

[L.S.]
	

President.
N. J. ALCOCK,

Shire Clerk.

Recommended
C. STTJBBS,

Minister for Local Government.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council this 22nd
day of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.



13 April, 1972.]
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 809

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT, 1960-1971.
The Municipality of the Shire of Belmont.

By-Law—Dog Act.
L.G. 319/58A.

IN pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act
and all other powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Belmont hereby
records having resolved on the 1st February, 1972 to submit for confirmation
by the Governor the following amendment to the by-law on the Dog Act
which was published in the Government Gazette on the 13th November, 1953.

1. Delete the existing schedule of fees.

2. Insert the following Schedule of fees:
For the seizure or impounding of a dog—$2.00.
For the sustenance and maintenance of a dog in a pound—$1.00 per day.
For the destruction of a dog—$1.00.

Dated this 15th day of February, 1972.
The Common Seal of the Shire of Belmont was

hereunto affixed in the presence of-
B. A. M. CLAYDEN,

LL.S.l	 President.
R. H. FARDON,

Shire Clerk.

Recommended
C. STUBBS,

Minister for Local Government.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council the 22nd day
of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT, 1960-1971.
The Municipality of the Shire of Narembeen.

Adoption of Draft Model By-law No. 2, Relating to Caravan Parks and
Camping Grounds.

L.G. 114/65.
IN pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act
the Council of the abovementioned Municipality hereby records having re-
solved on the 28th day of July, 1971, to revoke the by-law, Caravan Parks
No. 2, published in the Government Gazette of the 14th day of April, 1965,
and to adopt such of the Draft Model By-laws published in the Government
Gazette No. 82 of the 31st August, 1970, as are here set out: Draft Model
By-law (Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds) No. 2—The whole of the
by-law.

Dated the 18th day of January, 1972.
The Common Seal of the Shire of Narembeen

was hereunto affixed in the presence of-
A. W. LATHAM, J.P.,

EL.S.l
	

President.
A. J. MIDDLETON,

Shire Clerk.

Recommended
C. STUBBS,

Minister for Local Government.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council this 22nd
day of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.



810	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 [13 April, 1972.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT, 1960-1971.
The Municipality of the Shire of Woodanilling.

By-laws Relating to Control and Management of the Woodanilling Sports-
ground Pavilion, Equipment and Property on Reserve No. 5967.

L.G. 1040/69.
IN pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act
and of all powers enabling it, the Council of the abovementioned Municipality
hereby records having resolved on the 14th day of December, 1971, to make
and submit for confirmation by the Governor the following by-laws:-

1. By inserting after the words "Other Organisations" appearing in the
line seven of the Schedule of Charges the words "or Ratepayers of the Shire
of Woodanilling".

Dated this 8th day of February, 1972.
The Common Seal of the Shire of Woodanilling was hereunto affixed by

authority of a resolution of the Council in the presence of
F. M. SHACKLEY,

President.
K. L. HILL,

[L.S.]	 Shire Clerk.

Recommended
C. STUBBS,

Minister for Local Government.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council this 22nd
day of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT, 1960-1971.
The Municipality of the Shire of Tambellup.

By-law Relating to Noxious Weeds.
L.G. 140/72.

IN pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act, and
by section 67 of the Noxious Weeds Act, 1950, and of all other powers enabling
it, the Council of the abovementioned Municipality hereby records having re-
solved on the 12th day of January, 1972, to make and submit for confirmation
by the Governor the following by-law.

NOXIOUS WEEDS ACT, 1950.
A person shall not transport or cause to be transported or permit to be

transported in any vehicle on any road within the district of the Municipality
any grain in bulk or in open sacks, unless that vehicle is to the satisfaction of
an inspector, so fitted and equipped and the grain so covered as to prevent
the escape or spillage from that vehicle of any of that grain while being so
transported.

Penalty for the first offence, a fine not exceeding $20 and for a subsequent
offence a fine not exceeding $50.

The Common Seal of the Municipality was hereto affixed this 8th day of
March, 1972, in the presence of

C. W. CROSBY,
President.

J. W. FLATOW,
[LS.]
	

Shire Clerk.

Recommended
C. STUBBS,

Minister for Local Government.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council this 22nd
day of March, 1972.

F. P. KNIGHT,
Acting Clerk of the Council.



13 April, 1972.]	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 811

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT, 1960.
The Municipality of the City of Stirling.

By-laws Relating to Zoning.
L.G. 565/71E.

IN PURSUANCE of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act
and of all other powers enabling it, the Council of the abovementioned Muni-
cipality hereby records having resolved on the 1st day of February, 1972, to
make and submit for confirmation by the Governor the following by-laws.

The by-laws of the City of Stirling published in the Government Gazette
of the 29th June, 1960, are hereby amended in the following manner:-

1. Section 10 of the Fifth Schedule is altered by the addition, under
the heading "Osborne Ward", of the words, "but excluding Lot 45, Corner
Drake and Ruse Streets (Plan 3407), Perthshire Loc. Au)."

2. Section 6 of the Fifth Schedule is altered by the addition, under the
heading "Osborne Ward" of the following: "Drake/Ruse Streets—Portion
of Perthshire Loc. Au and being Lot 45 on Plan 3407".

Dated the 1st day of February, 1972.
The Common Seal of City of Stirling was here-

unto affixed by authority of a resolution of
the Council in the presence of-

N. C. HAWKINS,
Mayor.

LL.S.1
L. A. EASTON,

Acting Town Clerk.

Recommended
C. STUBBS,

Minister for Local Government.

Approved by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council the 7th
day of April, 1972.

W. S. LONNIE,
Clerk of the Cou

EDUCATION ACT, 1928-1970.
Education Department,

Perth, 12th April, 1972.
THE Minister for Education, acting pursuant to the provisions of the Education
Act, 1928-1970, has been pleased to make the regulations set out in the schedule
hereto.

H. W. DETTMAN,
Director-General of Education.

Schedule.
Regulations.

1. In these regulations the Education Act Regulations, 1960, as
reprinted pursuant to the Reprinting of Regulations Act, 1954, and
published in the Government Gazette on the 18th March, 1971,
and thereafter amended from time to time by notices so published
are referred to as the principal regulations.

2. Paragraph (c) of subregulation (2) of regulation 102A of the
principal regulations is amended, by substituting for the passage
"Union." in line three, the passage "Union, and for the purpose of
this regulation a headmaster of a Class 1 junior high school shall
be deemed to be a secondary school member of the Secondary
Education Division.".

Principal
regulations.

Reg. 102A
amended.

12)-95848



812	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE,W.A.	 [13 April, 1972.

MILK ACT, 1946-1970.
The Milk Board of Western Australia,

Claremont, 22nd March, 1972.
Agric, 786/66.

HIS Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting pursuant to the
powers conferred by section 76 of the Milk Act, 1946-1970, has been pleased to
approve the regulations made by the Minister for Agriculture as set out in the
schedule hereunder.

L. FRANKLIN,
Chairman.

Principal
regulations.

Reg. 63
amended.

Schedule.
Regulations.

1. In these regulations the regulations made under the Milk
Act, 1946 (as amended) and reprinted pursuant to the Reprinting
of Regulations Act, 1954, as published in the Government Gazette
on the 27th April, 1965, and thereafter amended from time to time
by notices so published, are referred to as the principal regulations.

2. Regulation 63 of the principal regulations is amended by
substituting for the expression "$625" the expression "$750".

SEEDS ACT, 1950.
Department of Agriculture,

South Perth, 22nd March, 1972.
File 949/71.

HIS Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting pursuant to the
powers conferred by the Seeds Act, 1950, has been pleased to make the
regulations set out in the schedule hereunder.

E. N. FITZPATRICK,
Director of Agriculture.

Principal
regulations.

First
Schedule
amended.

Schedule.
Regulations.

1 In these regulations the Seeds Act Regulations, 1969 pub-
lished in the Government Gazette on the 1st April, 1969 are referred
to as the principal regulations.

2. The First Schedule to the principal regulations is amended
(a) by deleting from GROUP I the item

"Cow Peas ... Vigna sinensis (L.) Hassk .... 98.8	 0.2
.. 1.2	 70";

(b) by adding in GROUP II above the item beginning with the
word "Crotalaria", the item
"Cow Peas .... Vigna sinensis (L.) Hassk .... 98.6 .... 0.2
.	 0.2 .... 1.2	 70";

(c) by substituting in GROUP II for the item "Dolichos
Dolichos lablab (L.)	 97.5	 0.5 .... 0.5	 2.0	 75

- " the item "Dolichos	 Dolichos lablab (L.) .... 98,6 ...
0 .2 .... 0.2	 1.2	 75 .... - ";

(d) by adding to GROUP II after the item beginnng with the
words "Medics-Strand", the item—"Mung bean 	 Vigna
radiata (L.) Wilczek. 98.6 .... 0.2	 0.2 .... 1.2 .... 70

(e) by substituting for the figures "60" in column 7 of the item
beginning with the word "Cocksfoot" in GROUP III, the
figures "65";



13 April, 1972.]	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, W.A. 	 813

(f) by substituting for the figures "50" in column 7 of the
item beginning with the words "Fescue-Tall" in GROUP
III, the figures "65";

(g) by substituting for the figures "20" in column 7 of the
item beginning with the words "Guinea grass" in GROUP
III, the figures "70"; and

(h) by substituting in GROUP III for the item—"Millet-Pearl
Pennisetum glaucum (L.) R.Br. 97.3	 0.2 . 0.5 .. 2.2

.	 75" the item—"Millet-Pearl, bulrush .... Pennisetum
typhoides (Burin.) Stapf et C.E. Hubb	 97.3	 0.2	 0.5

2.2	 70".

AGRICULTURE PROTECTION BOARD ACT, 1950-1970.
Department of Agriculture,

South Perth, 22nd March, 1972.
A.P.B. 21.

HIS Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting pursuant to the
provisions of the Agriculture Protection Board Act, 1950-1970, has been pleased
to make the regulations set forth in the schedule hereunder.

E. N. FITZPATRICK,
Director of Agriculture.

Schedule.
Regulations.

1. In these regulations the Agriculture Protection Board Act
Regulations, 1951, published in the Government Gazette on the
19th October, 1951, and amended from time to time thereafter by
notices so published, are referred to as the principal regulations.

2. Subparagraph (i) of paragraph (a) of regulation 2 of the
principal regulations is amended

(a) by substituting for the expression "$21.00", in line one,
the expression "$28.00"; and

(b) by substituting for the expression "$13.50", in line three,
the expression "$18.00".

Principal
regulations.

Reg. 2
amended.

By Authority: WILLIAM C. BROWN, Government Printer95848/4/72




