
WESTERN
AUSTRALIIAN
GOVERNMENT

3161

PERTH, TUESDAY, 29 JUNE 1993 No.89

11957-1

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY G. L. DUFFIELD, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

The WesternAustralianGovernmentGazetteis publishedby State
Print for the Stateof WesternAustralia on TuesdayandFriday of each
weekunlessdisruptedby Public Holidaysor unforeseencircumstances
changesto this arrangementwill be advertisedbeforehandon the
insidecover.
SpecialGovernmentGazettesandExtraordinaryGovernmentGazettes
arepublishedperiodically,only the specialgazettesareincludedin the
subscriptionprice.
The following guidelinesshouldbe followed to ensurepublicationin the
GovernmentGazette.
P Material submittedto the ExecutiveCouncilandwhich requires

gazettalwill requireacopyof the signedExecutiveCouncilMinute
Paperandin somecasesthe ParliamentaryCounsel’sCertificate.

P Copyshouldbe receivedby theManager,Law Publisherno later
than3.00p.m. on WednesdayFriday edition or 3.00p.m. on Friday
Tuesdayedition.

P Lengthyor complicatednoticesshouldbe forwardedseveraldays
beforeadvertisedclosingdatefor copy. This is to ensureinclusion in
currentedition. Failure to observethis requestcouldresult in
the noticebeingheldoveruntil the following edition.

P Proofswill be suppliedonly whenrequested.
P No additionsor amendmentsto material for publicationwill be

acceptedby telephone.

Sendcopy to:
The Manager,
Law Publisher
StatePrint
StationStreet,Wembley,6014
Telephone:3838851 Fax:383 8888

P All Noticesshouldbe written in ‘plain English’.

P Signaturesin particular andpropernamesmustbe legible.

P All copy shouldbe typedanddoublespaced.

P If it is necessarythrough isolationor urgencyto communicateby
facsimile,confirmationis not requiredby post. If original copy is
forwardedlater andpublished,the costwill be borne by the advertiser.

P Documentsnot clearlypreparedandin the requiredformat for gazettal,
will be returnedto thesenderunpublished.

P Latecopy receivedat Law Publisherwill be placedin the following issue
irrespectiveof any date/smentionedin the copy.

PRINT POST APPROVED PP565002/00041



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE

© State of WesternAustralia

This work is copyright.Apart from any useas permittedunder the CopyrightAct 1968, no
part may be reproducedby any processwithout written permissionfrom the Government
Printer, State Print. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager, Law Publisher, P.O.
Box 38, Wembley, W.A. 6014.

Advertisrng Rates and Payments

As from 1 July 1992.
DeceasedEstatenotices,per estate-$14.70
Real Estateand BusinessAgentsand FinanceBrokersLicences,per

notice-$33.90
Other Public Notices Section articles $33.90 except items of an

exceptionallylarge nature,then arrangementswill be made for
invoicing.

All otherNotices
Per Column Centimetre-$6.70
Bulk Notices-$124.00per page

Clients will be invoiced for advertisingcharges

COUNTER SALES 1992-93
As from 1 July 1992

$
GovernmentGazette-General 1.80
GovernmentGazette-Special

Up to 2 pages 1.80
Over 2 pages 3.60

Hansard 11.00
Industrial Gazette 9.80
Bound Volumes of Statutes 187.00

IMPORTANT NOTICE
H H

Periodically notices are published indicating a variation in

H
normal publishing arrangements:

H
Easteror Christmas editions etc-----thesenotices appear

H approximately 4 weeksprior to any change. H

* Extraordinarygazettesnot circulatedto all subscribers-

H thesenotices appearin the following general edition of H
H the gazette. H

In all casesnoticesare publishedon page2 and readersare H
H urged to check accordingly prior to contacting State Print. H
H

G. L. DUFFIELD, Director.

= = = = = = = = = = = = = = = = = = - - - - - - - C



29 June1993] GOVERNMENT GAZEYFE, WA 3163

AA1O1

POLLUTION OF WXI’ERS BY On4 AND NOXIOUS SUBSTANCESACT 1987
No. 14 of 1987
PROCLAM/InON

WESTERN AUSTRALIA t By His Excellency the Honourabla Sir Francis
FRANCIS BURT J Theodore Page Burt, Companion of the Order of

Governor. Australia, Knight Commander of the Most Distin
ILSJ guished Order of Saint Michael and Saint

George, Queen’s Counsel, Governor of the State
of Westem Australia.

I, the Governor,acting undersection 2 of the Pollution of Watersby Oil andNoxious Substances
Act 1987 andwith the adviceandconsentof the ExecutiveCouncil, fix 1 July 1993 as the day on
which the provisionsof that Act shall come into operation.
Given undermy hand andthe Public Seal of the State on 22 June 1993.
By His Excellency’sCommand,

ERIC CHARLTON, Minister for Transport.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN

AA1O2

LAND ACT 1933
CLASSIFICATION OF RESERVEDLANDS

PROCLAMATION
WESTERN AUSTRALIA By His Excellency the Honourable Sir Francis

FRANCIS BURT, .J Theodore Page Burt. Companion of the Order of
Governor. Australia, Knight Commander of the Most Distin

IL.SJ guished Order of Saint Michael and Saint
George, Queen’s Counsel, Governor of the State
of Western Australia.

DOLA File 913/963.
Undersection31 1 a of the Land Act 1933, I, the Governoracting with the adviceand consent
of the ExecutiveCouncil, herebyclassi1ras of Class"A" ReserveNo. 27202 comprisingKarlgarin
Lots 67, 72 and73 with an areaof 6.4418hectaresfor the designatedpurposeof "Conservationof
Flora and Fauna".
Local Authority-Shire of Kondinin.
Given undermy hand andthe Seal of the State on 25 May 1993.
By His Excellency’sCommand,

GEORGECASH, Minister for Lands.
GOD SAVE THE QUEEN

AA1O3

MAIN ROADSACT 1930
DECLARA1’ION OF A MAIN ROAD

PROCLAMATION
WESTERN AUSTRALIA 1 By His Excellency the Honourabie Sir Francis

FRANCIS BURT, .J Theodore Page Burt, Companion of the Order of
Governor. Australia, Knight Commander of the Most Distin

LSJ guished Order of Saint Michael and Saint
George, Queen’s Counsel, Governor of the State
of Western Australia.

MRWA 85-9-74.
Whereasby section 13 of the Main RoadsAct 1930, it is providedthat the Governormay on the
recommendationof the Commissioner,by proclamationdeclarethat any sectionor part of a road
shall be a Main Read; and whereasthe Commissionerhas recommendedthat the road section
delineatedon the plans specified in Schedule1 heretoshall be a Main Road. Therefore,I the
Governor,acting with the advice andconsentof the ExecutiveCouncil, in exerciseof the powers
conferredby section 13 of the Main RoadsAct 1930,andpursuantto the said recommendationsdo
herebydeclare¶I"demanRoadat North Fremantleas is delineatedon MRWA Plans7622-760-14
and 7622-761-2and as generally describedin Schedule1 heretoshall be a Main Road,but the
footpaths,if any of such roadare excludedfrom this proclamation,with effect on andfrom July 1,
1993.



3164 GOVERNMENT GAZETFE, WA [29 June1993

Schedule1
Road that shall be a Main Road

Road RouteNo. Local
Government

Location
of Route

As
Delineated

on PlanNo.

‘lydeman Road M52 City of Fremantle The section of road being
TydemanRoad in the City of
Fremantlebetweenits junc
tion with Stirling Highway
H14 and the easternalign
ment of Port BeachRoad.

7622-760-14
7622-761-2

Given undermy hand andthe Public Seal of WesternAustralia, at Perth, on 22nd June1993.
By His Excellency’sCommand, ERIC CHARLTON, Minister for Transport.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN

REAL ESTVFE AND BUSINESSAGENTS ACT 1978
SECTION 101

Notice
The RealEstateandBusinessAgentsSupervisoryBoardactingundersection 101 of the
RealEstate and BusinessAgentsAct 1978 as amendedand Regulation13 thereunder
hereby prescribesthe following Code of Conduct for Real EstateAgents and Sales
Representativesto apply with effect from the 1st July 1993 and the current Codesof
Conductto be repealedwith effect from 1st July 1993.

The Common Seal of the Real Estate and BusinessAgents SupervisoryBoard was
affixed on the 7th May 1993 by authority of a resolutionof the Board in the presence
of- D. MILLER, Chairman.

D. NEWMAN, Member.

CODE OF CONDUCT FOR AGENTS AND SALES REPRESENTATIVES
Made Pursuantto section 101 of the Real Estate and BusinessAgentsAct 1978

1. In this Code-
"agent" meansan agentor a salesrepresentative.
"commission"includesfeeschargesrewardor otherremunerationwhethermonetary

or otherwise.
"principal" in relationto a salesrepresentativemeansthe principal of the agentby

whom the salesrepresentativeis employed.
"the Act" meansthe Real Estate and BusinessAgentsAct 1978 as amended.

2. An agentmustact in the bestinterestsof his or herprincipal exceptwhereit would
be unreasonableor improper to do so.
3. 1 An agentmust not knowingly induce or attempt to inducea personto breacha
contractof sale, letting or agency.

2 An agentmustnot knowingly induceor attempt to inducea personto enterinto
anagencycontractwhich would makethatpersonliable to paycommissionto morethan
oneagentin relation to a sale or a leaseof any real estateor business.
4. 1 An agentmustnot actasagentor representhimself or herselfasacting as agent
on behalfof a personwithout written authority.

2 An agentmustact in accordancewith the instructionsof a principal, exceptwhere
it would be unreasonableor improperto do so.

3 An agentmustnot advertisethat any real estateor businessis for sale or lease
or erect or display a notice of sale or leasingwithout written authority.

4 An agentmustnot-
a advertiseor offer for sale or leaseany real estateor businessat a priceor on

terms different from that, authorisedby the principal; or
b advertiseor offer to purchaseor leaseany real estateor businessat a priceor

on terms different from that authorisedby the principal.
5. 1 An agentmustact fairly and honestly.
2 An agentmustnot knowingly mislead or deceiveany partiesin negotiationsor a

transaction.

CN3O1



29 June1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3165

3 An agentmustnot engagein harshor unconscionableconduct.
6. 1 An agentmustproperlysupervisethe agencybusinesscarriedon by theagentand
take reasonablesteps to ensurethat salesrepresentativesand other employeesof the
agencybusinesscomply with the provisionsof the Act, this Codeof Conductandother
relevantstatutes,rules andregulationswhereapplicableto them.

2 The personin bona fide control of the agencybusinesscarriedon by a corporation
must properly supervisethe agencybusinesscarriedon by the corporationand take
reasonablestepsto ensurethat salesrepresentativesandother employeesof theagency
businesscomplywith theprovisionsof theAct, this Codeof Conductandotherrelevant
statutes,rules andregulationswhereapplicableto them.

3 The personin bona fide control of the agencybusinesscarriedon by a firm must
properlysupervisethe agencybusinesscarriedon by the firm andtakereasonablesteps
to ensurethat salesrepresentativesandotheremployeesof the agencybusinesscomply
with the provisionsof the Act, this Code of Conductother relevantstatutes,rules and
regulationswhereapplicable to them.

4 If a salesrepresentativefails to comply with the provisionsof the Act, this Code
of Conductor any other relevant statutes,rules or regulationswhere applicablethen
for the purposesof sections61, 62 and 63 of this Code the agentor the personin
bona fide control of the agencybusinessshall havethe onusof proving that he or she
complied with the requirementsof those sections.

5 An agentwho personallycarrieson an agencybusiness,the personin bonafide
control of the agencybusinesscarriedon by a corporationand the personin bonafide
control of the agencybusinesscarriedon by a firm must-

a personallymanagethe agencybusinessfull time,

b carry out the principal managerialdutiesof the agencybusiness,and

c frequentlyattendat the offices at which the agencybusinessis conducted.
7. An agentmustexerciseskill, careanddiligence.
8. 1 Prior to the executionby the agent’sprincipal of any contractrelating to the sale
or leaseof any real estateor businessthe agentmust makeall reasonableefforts to
ascertainor verify the facts which are material to that transactionwhich a prudent
agentwould haveascertained.

2 If an agentascertainsa factwhich is materialto a transactionin which theagent’s
principal is involved the agentmustpromptly communicatethat fact to anypersonwho
may be affected by it unlessit is clear that personwas alreadyawareof that fact.

3 When an agentreceivesinstructionsto offer realestatefor sale he or she shall
promptly obtain a copy of the certificateof title for the real estate.
9. An agentengagedto sell or purchaseany real estateor businessmustadvisehis or
herprincipal as to what the agentconsidersto be the currentmarketpriceof that real
estateor businessand,if requested,give reasonsfor that opinion.
10. 1 An agentmustnot acceptan engagementto act, or continueto act, where to do
so would placehis or her interestin conflict with that of the principal.

2 An agentshall not without the prior written consentof the principal, directly or
indirectly, purchaseor takeon leaseor be in any way concernedor interested,legally
or beneficially, in the purchaseor taking on leaseof any realestateor businesswhich
the agentis engagedto sell or lease.

3 An agentwho directly or indirectly purchasesor takeson leaseor is in any way
concernedor interested,legally or beneficially, in the purchaseor taking on leaseof any
real estateor businesswhich the agentis engagedto sell or leaseshall not demand
retain or receivea commissionunlessthe principal has agreedin writing to pay the
commissionat the same time as or following the signing of the consentreferredto in
section 102.
11. An agentmustnot at any time useor discloseanyconfidential informationobtained
while acting on behalfof his or her principal, except for information that an agent is
requiredby law to disclose.
12. An agentmustcommunicateall written offers to his or her principal as soon as
practicable.
13. 1 An agentmustnot acceptor demandanycommissionfrom anypersonotherthan
his or her principalin respectof any serviceperformedor to be performedby the agent,
beinga servicein respectof whichthe agentreceivedcommissionor is entitled to receive
commissionfrom his or her principal.

2 An agentmustnot demandretain or receivea discount or rebatewhich relatesto
a service by a stocktakeror tradesperson,or to advertising, in connectionwith a
transactionor a serviceprovidedby the agentunlessthe agenthas-

a disclosedto his or her principal the full nature, extent and amount of the
discountor rebatesoughtor to be retained;and

b obtainedthe written consentof the principal to the seekingor retainingof the
discountor rebateby the agent.



3166 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

14. An agentmustnot demandretainor receiveacommissionfor a serviceor transaction
which is-

a greaterthananyprescribedmaximum commission;or
b greaterthanthe amount agreedwith the principal; or
c notthe subjectof anyprescribedmaximumcommissionandexcessivein all the

circumstances.
15. 1 If an agentis entitled to seekreimbursementfrom his or her principal of any
expensewhich the agenthasincurred the agentshall promptly supplyto the principal
all relevant information and material which the principal may reasonablyrequire in
orderto be satisfiedas to the amountof the expenseandthat the expensewasproperly
incurred by the agent.

2 An agentshall not seekor retainreimbursementof an expensewhich the agent
has incurred in respectof advertising,sign boards, printed materialand promotions
unless-

a the principal hasagreedin writing to pay the expense,
b theagreementspecifiesa maximumamountwhich the agentmayseekor retain

by way of reimbursement,and
c the maximum amount is handwrittenon the agreementand that amounthas

beeninitialled by the principal.

CW3O1 SUPREME COURT ACT 1935

SUPREME COURT AMENIMENT RULES NO.3 1993

Madeby the Judgesof the SupremeCourt.

Citation

1. Theserules maybe cited asthe SupremeCourt AmendmentRulesNo. 3
1993.

Principal rules

2. In theserules theRulesof the SupremeCourt 1971* are referredto as
the principalrules.

[* Reprintedin the Gazetteof 18 March 1986 at pp. 779-1100.
For amendmentsto 16 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislationof
WesternAustralia, Table 4, pp.26l-3and Gazettesof 26 January,
26 March and20 April 1993.]

Order29 amended

3. Order 29 of the principal rules is amendedby insertingafter Rule 4 the
following rule -

a

Failure to comply with standardtimes deemedin certain
circumstances

‘IA. Whereacause,matteror issueis enteredfor trial and-

a the entry for trial is countermanded;or

b the action is struck out of the list,

that cause,matter or issue is deemedto be a cause,matteror
issue-

c which hasnot beenenteredfor trial; and

d with which therehasbeen a failure to comply with
standardtimes.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3167

Order33 amended

4. Order 33 of the principal rules is amended-

a after Rule 8 by inserting the following rules -

Affidavit of serviceof notice of entry for trial

8A. Within 7 days of filing a notice of entry for
trial, thepartyenteringthe cause,matter or issuefor
trial shall file an affidavit of service of the notice of
entry on all the otherpartieson the record,unlessall
the other parties have filed a certificate
acknowledgingreceiptof the notice of entry.

Application for adjournment to Judge in charge
ot ivil List

8B. 1 Subject to paragraph2 after a cause,
matter or issue has been entered for trial an
applicationfor -

a adjournment of the trial;

b amendmentof pleadings;or

c an interlocutoryapplication,

must only be madeto theJudgein chargeof the Civil
List orhis orher nominee.

2 Notwithstanding paragraph 1 whero a
Judgehasbeenappointedto managea cause,matter
or issue pursuantto an order madeunder Orde 29
Rule 2, an application referred to in paragraph1
mustbe madeto that Judge.

b inRule9-
i in paragraph1 by deleting "7" and substituting the

following -

" 14 ",

ii by deleting paragraph2 and substitu"ig the following
paragraph -

2 Unless otherwise ordered the
summonsfiled should be supportedby aMdavit
or affidavits.

and

iii in paragraph 3 by inserting after "apply" in the second
place where it occurs the following -

" successfully ";

and

c in Rule 11 by deleting"by consentofthe partiesor".

Dated the 22nd day of June 1993.
DAVID K MALCOLM,

B. ROWLAND,
TERENCEA. WALSH,

D. A. IPP,
PAUL SEAMAN,
H. WALLWORK,
M. J. MURRAY,

R. D. NICHOLSON,
K WHITE,

GRAEME SCOrI
Judgessignatures.



3168 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

CW4O1
DISTRICT COURT OF WESTERNAUSTRALIA ACT 1989

SITTINGS AND WINTER VACATION FOR 1994
Pursuantto the powersconferredby the District Court of WesternAustralia Act 1969 I hereby
appoint the following sittings of the District Court for the year 1994.

Civil Sittings at Perth
1. Civil sittings of the District Court at Perth for the trial of causesand issuesof fact shall
commenceon Tuesday11 Januaryandshall continue,exceptfor the EasterandWinter Vacations
andfor Public Serviceholidays,until Friday 23 December.The Court will be held from 10.30 am
on eachday of sitting unlessotherwisestated.

Criminal Sittings at Perth
2. Criminal sittingsof the District Court at Perth shall commenceon the following days-

Tuesday 11 January
Tuesday 1 February
Tuesday 1 March
Wednesday 6 April
Monday 2 May
Wednesday 1 June
Monday 11 July
Monday 1 August
Monday 5 September
Tuesday 4 October
Tuesday 1 November
Monday 5 December

The Court will be held from 10 am on each day of sitting unlessotherwisestated.
Civil and Criminal Sittings at OtherPlaces

3. The places,days and times for other Civil and Criminal sittings of the District Court shall be
as follows-

Place Jurisdiction CommencingDay
Albany Criminal On the following Mondays-

31 January
11 April
30 May
1 August
5 December

and on Tuesday4 October
Albany Civil On the following Mondays-

21 February
2 May
22 August
24 October

Bunbury Criminal On the following Mondays-
17 January
14 March
23 May
19 September
28 November

and on Tuesday12 July
Bunbury Civil On Mondays

28 March and 12 December
and on Tuesdays

7 Juneand4 October
Carnarvon Criminal and Civil On the following Mondays-

2 May
18 July
7 November

and on Tuesday8 March
Esperance Criminal and Civil On the following Mondays-

14 March
30 May
5 September
7 November

Geraldton Criminal On the following Tuesdays-
15 February
19 April
14 June
16 August
18 October
13 December



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3169

Place Jurisdiction
Geraldton Civil

Kalgoorlie Criminal

Kalgoorlie Civil

Broome
Derby
Karratha
Kununurra
Port Hedland

Criminal andCivil

CommencingDay

FISHERIES AMENDMENT REGULATIONS NO.51993

Madeby His Excellencythe Governorin ExecutiveCouncil.

1. Theseregulationsmay be cited as the FisheriesAmendmentRegulations
No. 5 1993.

Commencement

2. Theseregulationscome into operationon 1 July 1993.

The Scheduleamended

3. The Scheduleto the FisheriesRegulations1938* is amended-

a in item 1 a by deleting"25.00" and substitutingthe following -

" 26.00 ,,.

b in item 1 b by deleting"31.00" andsubstituting the following -

" 33.00

c in item 1 c by deleting"46.00" andsubstitutingthe following -

" 48.00

On the following Mondays-
14 February
18 April
13 June
15 August
17 October
12 December

On the following Mondays-
7 February
18 April
22 August
10 October
5 December

andon Tuesday7 June
On the following Mondays-

28 February
18 July
24 October

On the following Mondays-
7 February
11 April
1 August
10 October
5 December

andon Tuesday7 June

Dated the 21st day of June 1993.

The Court will be held from 10 am on each day of sitting unlessotherwisestated.

Winter Vacation
4. The WinterVacationfor 1994 shall commenceon Monday27 Juneandshall terminateon Sunday
10 July.

DESMOND HEENAN, Chief Judge.

F1301 FISHERIESACT 1905

Citation

I 1957-2



3170 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

d in item 1 d by deleting"81.00" andsubstitutingthe following -

" 85.00

e in item 2 by deleting "17.00" andsubstituting the following -

" 18.00

f in item 3 by deleting "25.00" and substitutingthe following -

" 26.00

g in item 19 by deleting "104.00" andsubstituting the following -

" 110.00

h in item 21 a by deleting "21" andsubstituting the following -

" 22.00

i in item 21 b by deleting "260" and substituting the
following -

" 275.00

j in item 21 c by deleting "1040" andsubstitutingthe following -

" 1090.00

k in item 21 d by deleting "182" andsubstitutingthe following -

" 190.00

1 in item 21 e by deleting "26" andsubstituting the following -

" 27.00

m in item 21 1 i by deleting "26" and substituting the following -

" 27.00

n in item 21f ii by deleting "208" andsubstituting thefollowing -

" 220.00 "; and

o in item 21 g by deleting "21" and substituting the
following -

" 22.00

[* Reprintedasat 15 September1988.
For amendmentsto 4 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislation of
WesternAustralia, Table 4, pp. 80-1, and Gazetteof 9 March, 2
April and 28 May 1993.]

By His Excellency’sCommand,
D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council.

F1302
PEARLING ACT 1990

PEARLING GENERAL AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1993

Made by His Excellencythe Governor in ExecutiveCouncil.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Pearling General Amendment
Regulations1993.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3171

Commencement

2. Theseregulationscomeinto operation on 1 July 1993.

Principal regulations

3. In theseregulations thePearlingGeneralRegulations1991* are referred
to as the principal regulations.

{* Publishedin the Gazetteof27 December1990.
For amendmentsto 4 June1993 see 1992 Index to Legislation of
WesternAustralia, Table 4, p.196.]

Regulation6 amended

4. Regulation6 of the principal regulationsis amended-

a in paragraph a by deleting "$208.00" and substituting the
following -

" $220.00 ";

b in paragraphb by deleting "$260.00" and substituting the
following -

" $275.00 "; and

c in paragraphc by deleting "$260.00" and substituting the
following -

$275.00

Regulation8 amended

5. Regulation8 of the principal regulationsis amended-

a in paragraph a by deleting "$21.00" and substituting the
following -

" $22.00

b in paragraph b by deleting "$84.00" and substituting the
following -

$90.00 "; and

c in paragraph c by deleting "$21.00" and substituting the
following -

" $22.00

Regulation9 amended

6. Regulation9 of the principal regulationsis amended-

a in paragrapha by deleting "$260.00" and substituting the
following -

" $275.00

b in paragraph b by deleting "$260.00" and substituting the
following -

" $275.00



3172 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

c in paragraphc by deleting "$260.00" and substituting the
following -

" $275.00 "; and

d in paragraphd by deleting"26c"andsubstitutingthe following -

32c ".

By His Excellency’sCommand,
D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council.

TOBACCO CONTROLACT 1990

TOBACCO CONTROL PACKAGE LABELS AMENDMENT
REGULATIONS 1993

Madeby His Excellencythe Governor in ExecutiveCouncil.

Citation

1. Theseregulationsmay be cited as the TobaccoControl PackageLabels
AmendmentRegulations1993.

Principal regulations

2. In these regulationsthe Tobacco Control PackageLabels Regulations
1993* are referredto as the principal regulations.

[* Publishedin Gazetteof23 December1992 at p. 6259-71.]

Regulation3 amended

3. Regulation 3 1 of the principal regulationsis amendedby deleting the
definition of "prescribedinformation".

Regulation4 amended

4. Regulation4 of the principal regulationsis amended-

a in subregulation1 by deleting "A package"and substitutingthe
following -

On andafter 1 April 1994, a package ";

b by deleting"; and" after paragraphb of subregulation1 and
substitutinga full stop;

c by deletingparagraphc of subregulation1; and

d in paragrapha of subregulation 3 by deleting "and the
prescribedinformation".

Regulation5 amended

5. Regulation5 of the principal regulationsis amended-

a in subregulation 2 by deletingparagraphc; and

b in subregulation 3 by deleting "or in the prescribed
information".

HE3O1



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3173

Regulation6 amended

6. Regulation6 of the principal regulationsis amendedby deleting"1 July
1993."andsubstitutingthe following -

1 April 1994. ".

Regulation10 amended

7. Regulation10 of the principal regulationsis amended-

a in subregulation1 by insertingafter "repealed"the following -

on 1 April 1994 ";

b in subregulation2 by deleting "1 June 1993 andbefore 1 July
1993" andsubstitutingthe following -

1 July 1993 and before 1 April 1994 ";

c in subregulation2 by deleting "if they were then in operation";
and

d by repealingsubregulation3.

Schedule1 amended

8. Schedule 1 to the principal regulations is amended by deleting
ColumnD.

Schedule3 repealed

9. Schedule3 to the principal regulationsis repealed.

By His Excellency’sCommand,
D. G. BLIGH Clerk of the Council.

11E401

HEALTH ACT 1911
HealthDepartmentof WA,

Perth, 16 June 1993.
7884/90.
The appointment of Mr Steven Friend as an Environmental Health Officer to the Shire of
Boddingtoneffective from 2 June1993 is approved.

BRIAN DEYINE, delegateof
ExecutiveDirector, Public Health.

HE402

HEALTH ACT 1911
Health Departmentof WA,

Perth,21 June 1993.
9270/89.
The cancellationof the appointmentof Mr Victor Hayshamas an EnvironmentalHealthOfficer to
the City of Stirling effective from 4 June1993 is approved.

BRIAN DEVJNE, delegateof
ExecutiveDirector, Public Health.



3174 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

11M401

RURAL HOUSING ASSISTANCEACT 1976

Under the provisionsof section5 2 b of the Rural HousingAssistanceAct 1976 His Excellency
the GovernorappointsErnestJohnFairbairnMoore as a Memberof the Rural HousingAuthority
for a period of 3 years to commencefrom 22 June1993 or until suchtime as the Rural Housing
Authority is absorbedwithin Homeswestif earlier.
and
Under the provisionsof section5 2 c of the Rural Housing AssistanceAct 1976 His Excellency
the Governorappoints Shirley Grace Thorn as a Member of the Rural Housing Authority for a
period of 3 years from 1 September1993 or until such time as the Rural HousingAuthority is
absorbedwithin Homeswestif earlier.

NOTICE OF INTENTION NOT TO ENTER PLACES IN THE REGISTEROF HERITAGE PLACES

The Minister for Heritage,Richard Lewis MLA, hasdirectedthat the placedescribedin Schedule
1 not be enteredpermanentlyin the Registerof HeritagePlacespursuantto the Heritageof Western
Australia Act 1990.
In accordancewith the requirementsof section 52 1 of that Act, the HeritageCouncil of Western
Australiaherebygives noticethat it is proposedthattheplaceberemovedfrom theInterim Register
of HeritagePlaces.
Submissionson the proposedremoval from the Register are invited from interestedpersons.
Submissionsmustbe in writing and shouldbe directedto the following address-

The Director
Office of the HeritageCouncil
P0 Box 6201
East Perth6892

Submissionsconcerningthe removalof the placelisted in Schedule1 mustbe lodgedby 10 August
1993.

Schedule1

Place Location Land Description

Railway Hotel ForrestStreet,Kalgoorlie Kalgoorlie
483

Town Lot 190, C/T 1776/

Datedthis 29th day of June 1993.

IAN BAXTER, Director,
Office of the HeritageCouncil.

It is herebynotified that it is intendedto grant a SpecialLeaseover ParduLocation 10 to K. M.
andK L. Nortonundersection116 of theLandAct for aterm of 21 yearsfor thepurposeof Caravan
Parkand Camp Site.

HR4O1

HERITAGE OF WESTERNAUSTRALIA ACT 1990

LA4O1
LAND ACT 1933

SpecialLease

A. A. SKINNER, Executive Director.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3175

LAND ACT 1933
RESERVATIONNOTICE

Made by His Excellencythe Governor under section 29.
The Crown Land describedbelow hasbeenset apartas a public reserve.
DOLA File 1292/993.
ReserveNo. 42796 comprising KununurraLot 37 with an areaof 911 squaremetres on Land
A±ninistrationPlan8699 for the designatedpurposeof "UseandRequirementsof the Government
EmployeesHousingAuthority".
Public Plan: DH79 2 23.17 CajaputStreet.
Local Authority-Shireof Wyndham-EastKimberley.

LAND ACT 1933
AMENDMENT OF RESERVE

Made by His Excellencythe Governorundersection37.

A. A. SKINNER, Chief Executive.

The following reservehas beenamended.
DOLA File 1893/990.
ReserveNo. 26847 KununurraLots 18, 19, 20, 37, 38, 39, 51, 53, 54, 59,60, 83, 86, 119, 136, 140,
142, 145, 265 and 1201 "DepartmentalHousingPublic Works Department"to excludeLot 37 and
of its areabeing reducedto 1.5724 hectaresaccordingly.
Public Plan: DH79 2 23.17.
Local Authority-Shireof Wyndham-EastKimberley.

LAND ACT 1933
CANCELLATION OF RESERVE

Made by His Excellency the Governorundersection37.
The following reservehas beencancelled.
DOLA File 1984/990.
ReserveNo. 27806 FremantleLots 1875 and 1906 "Recreation".
Public Plan: BG 2 06.13 MarineTerrace.
Local Authority-City of Fremantle.

A. A. SKINNER, ChiefExecutive.

A. A. SKINNER, Chief Executive.

250.00
200.00
200.00

The Shireof Northam herebyrecordshavingresolvedon 18 June1993,in accordancewith section
53 of the CemeteriesAct 1986,to set the following fees for the Northam Public Cemetery.

Northam Public Cemetery
Scaleof Fees andChargesPayable

a Burial Fees $
Over 7 years
Under 7 years
Stillborn

c Placementof ashesin Niche Wall
Double 220.00

Datedthe 18th day of June1993.
The CommonSealof the Shireof Northamwas hereuntoaffixed by authorityof a resolutionof the
council in the presenceof-

D. R. ANTONIO, President.
A. J. MIDDLETON, Shire Clerk.

LA7O1

LA8O1

LB2O1

LG4O1
CEMETERIESACT 1986

Shireof Northam



3176 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

LG402

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1960
SECTION 19lÀ
City of Wanneroo

FEES AND CHARGES
It is herebynotified for public information that the Council of the City of Wannerooresolvedon
23 June 1993 to adoptthe following fees and charges.The fees and chargeswill take effect as
follows-

a RegularBookings Indoor Facility Charges1 January1994;
b RegularBookings OutdoorFacility Charges1 October 1993; and
c All other feesand charges15 July 1993.

Day ratesapplybetween8.30am and6.00 pm andnightratesapply between6.00pm andmidnight.

OUT OF SCHOOL CARE FEES

AFTER GrossFamily 1 Child 2 Children 3 Children EachAdditional
SCHOOL Income Child
CARE Per Week Daily Weekly Daily Weekly Daily Weekly Daily Weekly

CENTRE Full Fee Relief $1.90 $9.50 $3.20 $16.00 $4.55 $22.75 $0.85 $4.25

Whitford A. Up to $349 $2.80 $14.00 $4.80 $24.00 $6.75 $33.75 $1.15 $5.75
Warrandyte PartialFeeRelief
Wanneroo
Girrawheen/ B. $350-$449 $3.80 $19.00 $6.70 $33.50 $9.55 $47.75 $1.85 $9.25

Koondoola
Heathridge C. $450-$649 $4.80 $24.00 $8.30 $41.50 $11.80 $59.00 $2.85 $14.25
Kingsley
Qujnns Rocks 11 $650 Plus $5.85 $29.25 $10.20 $51.00 $14.60 $73.00 $4.10 $20.50

SCHOOL Gro8s Family 1 Child 2 Children 3 Children EachAdditional
VACATION Income Child
CARE PerWeek Daily Weekly Daily Weekly Daily Weekly Daily Weekly

CENTRE A. Up to $349 $8.50 $42.50 $13.60 $68.00 $17.00 $85.00 $3.80 $19.00

Sorrento/ B. $350-$449 $10.60 $53.00 $17.00 $85.00 $21.20 $106.00 $4.00 $20.00
Duncraig

Girrawheen/ C. $4504649 $12.70 $63.50 $20.40 $102.00 $25.40 $127.00 $4.55 $22.75
Koondoola

Wanneroo D. $650 Plus $14.00 $70.00 $22.60 $113.00 $28.00 $140.00 $5.30 $26.50
Heathridge
Greenwood
Whitford
SCHOOL VACATION CARE-ExcursionFee-PerExcursion = $2.00 Per Child

COMMUNITY RECREATION CENTRE
Facility Hire Charge1pe

RecreationCentres

FACILITY TYPE Aqua- Girra- SorrentoWarwick Ocean Whit- Wann- Yanchep Craigie
motion wheen Duncraig Leisure Ridge fords eroo Two Leisure

Rocks Centre

SportaHall B B B B B B AA&A
CoffeeLounge G G H G
MeetingRoom 1 G F F G F H
MeetingRoom2 G H G
ActivityRoomi F F H H H H B
ActivityRoom2 I H F I I I
CommitteeRoom I J J
JoyceDonley H
Workshop H F H
Garage J I
Kitchen I I I I I I
Creche F F H H H D
Playgroup Room H H H
FunctionRoom C E E A
Clubroom H
Room3and4 F
BadmintonCourts 33% of Full Rateroundeddown to nearestlOc if using lessthan all availablecourts.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3177

AlexanderHeights/Marangaroo
Community Hall

Activity Room Quinns
DorchesterHall
EllersdaleReserveClubrooms
DuncraigCommunity Hall
DuncraigCommunity Hall MeetingRoom
Effiot RoadAnnexe
Elliot Road Clubrooms
EmeraldParkAnnexe
GirrawheenScout/GuideHall
GreenwoodScout/GuideHall
GumblossomHall, Quinns Rocks
Guy DanielsClubrooms
HudsonClubrooms
JackKikeros Hall
JoondalupPavilion
Kingsley Annexe
Kingsley Clubrooms
Kingsley SportsHall

CalectasiaCommunity Hall
Kingsway SportsPavilion
KoondoolaCommunity Hall
MacDonald Clubrooms
MacDonald SportsHall
MargaretCockmanPavilion Main Hall
MargaretCockmanPavilion Small Hall
PadburyHall
PenistoneClubrooms
PercyDoyle Clubrooms
ReserveKiosks
Rob BaddockHall
SorrentoCommunity Hall
WannerooCivic Centre
WannerooFunctionCentre
WannerooShowgroundClubroom
WarrandyteClubrooms
Warwick CommunityHall
WoodvaleClubrooms

Facifity Hire
Charge1rpe

E
G
C
F
D
F
H
D
E
E
I
D
E
B
D
E
E
C
E

Facility

SeniorCitizensCentre CommunityCare
Centre

Facility Hire Charge¶Irpe
Mildenhall Wanneroo Girrawheen Whitfords Greenwood!

Warwick

Welfare Centre

Kingsley

Function Area H H H H H H
MainHall D D D D

FACILITY HIRE CHARGE TYPE AND RATE PER HOUR

USAGE TYPE ‘1rpe ‘1rpe ‘I,’pe rpe 1ype 1s’pe ‘Irpe lsrpe ‘Iype
lj ¶U

‘1rpe rpe£J lJ

Commercial $46.20 $42.00 $37.80 $33.60 $29.40 $25.20 $21.00 $16.80 $12.60 $8.40 $4.20

Functions $34.70 $31.50 $28.40 $25.20 $22.10 $18.90 $15.80 $12.60 $ 9.50 $6.30 $3.20

Community Groups!
Clubs-

Regular
Casual

$23.10 $21.00 $18.90 $16.80 $14.70 $12.60 $10.50 $ 8.40 $ 6.30
$27.80 $25.20 $22.70 $20.20 $17.70 $15.20 $12.60 $10.10 $ 7.60

$4.20 $2.10
$5.10 $2.60

BOOKINGS GENERAL-No refundswill be grantedunless specialcircumstancesprevail or on production of
a medicalcertificate. A 20% cancellationfee shall be retainedto coveradministrationcosts.

RESERVESAND OTHER OUTDOOR FACiLITIES
OUTDOOR TEAM SPORTS-GRASSEDAREAS-Effective 1 October 1993
REGULAR BOOKINGS
High Maintenance
RugbyLeague,Union, Football, Socceretc
Low Maintenance
Cricket, Hockey,Lacrosseetc
OTHER OUTDOOR SPORTSREQUIRING GRASSEDAREAS

TURF WICKETS
One Wicket
Two Wickets
CasualBookings

CASUAL BOOKINGS
ONE DAY SPORTING FIXTURES OR FAIRS

Community Organisations

CommercialOrganisations
11957-3

Per Season
Per Season
Per Day

Full Day
Half Day
Full Day
Half Day

1 395.00
2 788.00

140.00

68.00
34.00

185.00
93.00

HALLS, MULTI-PURPOSECENTRES,CLUBROOMS AND PAVILIONS
Facifity Facility Hire Facility

Charge1jpe
D

H
E
E
D
I
F
E
F
D
G
C
F
E
J
G
F
E
E

Archery
Dog Obedience
Model Aircraft

PerSeason

PerSeason

$
PerTeam 240.00

PerTeam

PerAnnum
PerAnnum
PerAnnumPerMember

188.00

240.00
240.00

6.00



3178 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

WANNEROO SHOWGROTJNDS $
CommunityOrganisations Full Day 202.00

Half Day 101.00
CommercialOrganisations Full Day 338.00

Half Day 169.00
HARDCOURT SURFACES
Basketballand Netball Day PerHour 4.50

Evening PerHour 6.50
Basketball and Netball Clubs affiliated with the
WannerooDistricts Basketball and Netball Associa
tion and resident in the City of Wannerooshall be
charged50% of casualhourly rate when using courts
on seasonalbasis.
Tennis Per Court Day Per Hour 4.50

Evening Per Hour 6.50
Tennis CoachesPer Court Day Per Hour 6.50

Evening Per Hour 8.50
Tennis Clubs Per Court Day PerAnnum 65.00

Eveing PerAnnum 75.00
TennisClubs shall berequired to pay casualratesfor
any courts used outside those time slots originally
allocated. Casual usersshall be granted accessto
courts during club periods if membersare not using
them. Normal hire chargesshall be paidto Councilfor
any such use.
Kingsway Netball Centre Per Team Per Season 19.00
Note: Plus $30 perhour after midnight.

RECREATION AN] CULTURE
GloucesterLodge Museum
-Admission Charges Adults 1.00

Children 0.50
School Groups 0.50
Pensioners/Senior 0.50
Card

BuckinghamHouse
-Admission Charge Adults 1.00

Children/Pensioners 0.50
-Per Wedding Maximum 2 Hours House andGrounds 50.00

GroundsOnly 25.00
-Activity Session Per Child 2.00
OceanReefBoat Harbour
-Launching Fees Per Launch 3.00
-Annual Pass PerAnnum 60.00
Life Be In It Trailer Weekend 35.00

Week Day 23.00
Bond-Refundable 30.00

Public AddressSystem Weekend 23.00
Week Day 17.00

Mobile Play EquipmentPlatform and Trailer
-Major Hire Weekend 200.00
-Minor Hire Per Day 160.00
-Minimal PerDay 100.00

R. F. COFFEY,Town Clerk.

LG403

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1960
ShireofNungarin
RatingExemption

It is herebynotified for public informationthatpursuantto section532 12 of theLocal Government
Act the Council exempts from paymentof ratesthe Nungarin Bowling Club, lots 148 and 149
Danberrin Road,Nungarin.

L. J. TILBROOK, ShireClerk.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3179

LG404
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1960

ShireofKent
It is herebynotified for public informationthat theKentShire Council actingpursuantto subsection
12 of section532 of the Local GovernmentAct 1960 hasdeclaredthatLocation7531, NyabingGolf
Club Incorporated,is exempt from municipal rates.
It is herebynotified for public informationthat Darryl Carpenterhas beenappointedas-

An authorisedofficer, for the purposeof administeringand enforcing the Shire’s By-laws
relating to parking and parking facilities.

LG405

o An authorisedandregistrationofficer, pursuantto the provisionsof the Dog Act 1976, for
the purposeof administeringand enforcingall the provisionsof the said Act.

B. E. JONES,Shire Clerk.

DOG ACT 1976
City of Bunbury

It is herebynotified for public information that Tracie Patricia Emery has been appointedas a
RegistrationOfficer for the City of Bunbury pursuantto the provisionsof the Dog Act 1976.

V. S. SPALDING, City Manager/TownClerk.

MH301 POLLUTION OF WATERS BY OIL
AND NOXIOUS SUBSTANCESACT 1987

POLLUTION OF WATERS BY OIL AND NOXIOUS SUBSTANCES
REGULATIONS 1993

Made by His Excellencythe Governorin ExecutiveCouncil.

Citation

1. Theseregulations may be cited as the Pollution of Waters by Oil and
NoxiousSubstancesRegulations1993.

Commencement

2. These regulations shall come into operation on the day on which the
Pollution of Waters by Oil and Noxious SubstancesAct 1987 comes into
operation.

Interpretation

3. In theseregulations-

"Commonwealth Act" meansthe Protection of the SeaPreventionof
Pollution from Ships Act 1983 Cwlth as in force at the
commencementof theseregulations;

"Commonwealth regulations" means the Protection of the Sea
Prevention of Pollution from Ships Regulations Cwlth as in
force at the commencementof theseregulations.

Prescribedoffices

4. 1 For the purposesof sections8 and 20 of the Act -

a each of the offices prescribedby the Commonwealthregulations
for the purposes of the corresponding sections of the
CommonwealthAct is prescribed;and



3180 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

b each of the offices of Chief ExecutiveOfficer, ExecutiveMarine
Officer, and Senior Marine Officer - Pollution, in the
Departmentof Marine andHarboursis prescribed.

2 For the purposesof sections11 and22 of the Act -

a each of the offices prescribedby the Commonwealthregulations
for the purposes of the corresponding sections of the
CommonwealthAct is prescribed;and

b the office of Chief Executive Officer, Department of Marine
Harbours,is prescribed;and

c if a prescribedincident as defined in each of those sections
occurs within the boundariesof a port as definedin the Western
Australian Marine Act 1982 - the office of Harbour Master of
thatport if any is prescribed.

3 For the purposesof section 12 of the Act -

a the office of Chief Executive Officer, Department of Marine
Harbours,is prescribed;and

b if a dischargeoccurs within the boundariesof a port as defined
in the Western Australian Marine Act 1982 - the office of
Harbour Master of that port if any is prescribed.

4 For the purposesof sections15 and 25 of the Act eachof the offices
prescribed by the Commonwealth regulations for the purposes of the
correspondingsectionsof the CommonwealthAct is prescribed

5 For the purposesof section 30 2 of the Act each of the offices of
Chief Executive Officer, Executive Marine Officer and Senior Marine
Officer - Pollution, in the Departmentof Marine and larbours is prescribed.

Prescribedmannerof notifying incidentsetc.

5. 1 For the purposesof sections11 1 and 3 and 22 1 and 3 of the
Acts a prescribed incident is notified in the prescribedmanner if it is
notified -

a in the mannerprescribedby the Commonwealthregulationsmade
for the purposes of the corresponding sections of the
CommonwealthAct; or

b in the mannerprescribedby the Commonwealthregulationsmade
for the purposes of the corresponding sections of the
CommonwealthAct but conveyedthrough -

i the Marine EmergencyOperationsCentre, Department of
Marine andHarbours;or

ii a port signal station.

2 For the purposesof section12 1 a dischargefrom aplace on land is
notified in the prescribedmannerif it is notifed in the mannerprescribedby
subregulation1.

Prescribedtime for report

6. For the purposesof sections11 6 and 7, 12 2 and 22 6 and 7 of
the Act, 24 hours immediatelyfollowing the receiptof a requestfor a report is
the prescribedtime.

Prescribedform for report

7. 1 For the purposesof sections11 6 and 7 and 22 6 and 7 of the
Act the form prescribedby the Commonwealthregulationsfor the purposes
of tbe correspondingsectionsof the CommonwealthAct is prescribed.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3181

2 For the purposesof section 12 2 of the Act, the form prescribedby
subregulation1 with such modificationsas arenecessaryandincluding -

a the name, addressand telex, facsimile and telephonenumbersof
the occupier of the place on land from which the discharge
occurred;and

b the geographicallocation wherethe dischargeoccurred,

is prescribed.

Oil record book

8. For the purposesof section 13 3 of the Act a ship shall carry an oil
record book of the kind prescribed for the ship by the Commonwealth
regulations for the purposes of the corresponding section of the
CommonwealthAct.

Prescribedoperationsor occurrencesoil recordbook

9. For the purposesof section 13 5 of the Act, each of the operationsand
occurrencesprescribedby the Commonwealthregulationsfor the purposesof
the correspondingsection of the CommonwealthAct is aprescribedoperation
or occurrence,as the casemaybe.

Cargo recordbook

10. For the purposesof section 23 3 of the Act, the prescribedform for a
cargorecordbook is that prescribedby the Commonwealthregulationsfor the
purposesof the correspondingsectionof the CommonwealthAct.

Prescribedoperationsandoccurrencescargo recordbook

11. For the purposesof section23 5 of the Act, eachof the operationsand
occurrencesprescribedby the Commonwealthregulationsfor the purposesof
the correspondingsection of the CommonwealthAct is a prescribedoperation
or occurrence,as the casemaybe.

Annex II, Regulation8 to havethe force of law

12. Regulation 8 of Annex II to the Convention applies to ships in the
mannerand to the extentprescribedby the Commonwealthregulations.

Exemptions

13. The ships exemptedby the Commonwealth regulations from the
provisionsof the CommonwealthAct andthe Commonwealthregulationsare
exemptedfrom the Act and theseregulations.

By His Excellency’sCommand,
D. G. BLIGHT Clerk of the Council.

MH302
SHIPPING AND PILOTAGE ACT 1967

PORTS AND HARBOURS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1993

Madeby His Excellencythe Governor in ExecutiveCouncil.

Citation

1. Theseregulationsmay be cited as the Ports and HarboursAmendment
Regulations1993.



3182 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

Commencement

2. Theseregulationsshall comeinto operationon 1 July 1993.

Principal regulations

3. In theseregulationsthe Portsand HarboursRegulations*are referredto
as the principal regulations.

[* PublLhedin the Gazetteof 3 February 1966 atpp.277-92.
For amendmentsto 9 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislation of
WesternAustralia, Table 4, pp.240-2.]

Regulations14 amended

4. Regulation 14 3 of the principal regulations is amendedby deleting
"$2 852 and substitutingthe following -

" $2 938

Regulation15 amended

5. Regulation 15 3 of the principal regulationsis amendedby deleting
"$470" andsubstitutingthe following -

" $484 ".

Regulation15A amended

6. Regulation15A of the principal regulationsis amended-

a in subregulation1 by deleting "$457" and substituting the
following -

$471 "; and

b in subregulation2 -

i by deleting"$457" andsubstitutingthe following -

" $471 "; and

ii by deleting"$554" andsubstitutingthe following -

" $571 ".

Regulation15B amended

7. Regulation15B of the principal regulationsis amended-

a by deleting"$222" andsubstitutingthe following -

$229 "; and

b by deleting "$318" andsubstitutingthe following -

" $328

Regulation15C amended

8. Regulation15C of the principal regulationsis amended-

a by deleting"$70" andsubstitutingthe following -

" $72

b by deleting"$470" and substitutingthe following -

" $484 "; and



29 June1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3183

c by deleting "$1 219" andsubstitutingthe following -

$1 256

Regulation16 amended

9. Regulation 16 of the,principal regulationsis amendedin paragraphd
by deleting"$515" andsubstitutingthe following -

" $530

Third Scheduleamended

10. The Third Schedule to the principal regulations is amended in
Part I -

a by deletingitem 1 and substitutingthe following item -

[Reg. 15]

1. The chargesfor pilotage of vesselsinto and
out of ports in the State at which pilotage is
providedare -

PORTS GROSS CHARGES
REGISTERED FOR BOTH
TONNAGE OF INWARD
VESSEL AND

OUTWARD
PILOTAGE

. $

ALBANY Upto1499 1329
BUNBURY 1500-3000 1910
ESPERANCE 3 001- 5 000 2 160

5001-10000 2381
10 001 - 20 000 2 630
20 001 - 30 000 2 852
30 001 - 40 000 3 100
40 001 - 50 000 3 350

Exceeding50 000 3 558

BROOME Up to 1499 1469
1500-3000 1967
3001-5000 2367

5001-10000 2851
10 001-20 000 3523
20 001 -30 000 4 121

Exceeding30 000 4 521

CARNARVON
a CapeCuvier Up to 9 999 2 923

10 000 - 20 000 3 527
20001-30000 4221
30 001-40 000 4890

Exceeding40 000 5 602

b UselessLoop Up to 5 000 3 080
5001-10000 4448

10 001 - 15 000 5 175
15 001 - 20 000 5 789

Exceeding20 000 6 659

PORT WALCOTI’ Up to 1499 1469
1500-3000 1967
3001-5000 2667

5001-10000 3451
10 001 - 20 000 3 936
20001-30000 4663
30001-40000 5460
40001-50000 5889
50 001-60 000 6374
60 001-70 000 6858
70 001-80 000 7257
80001-90000 7613

90 001 - 100 000 8 113
100 001-115000 8484
115001-130000 8854
Exceeding130 000 9 340



3184 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

PORTS GROSS CHARGES
REGISTERED FORBOTH
TONNAGE OF INWARD
VESSEL AND

OUTWARD
PILOTAGE

$

WYNDHAM Upto1499 1669
In respectof 1 500 - 3 000 2 167
pilotagebetween 3 001 - 5 000 2 737
NichollsPointand 5001-10 000 3451
berth 10 001 - 20 000 4 334

20 001-30 000 4890
Exceeding30 000 5 404 ";

and

b initem2-

i by deleting "$388" and substituting the following -

" $400

ii by deleting"$222" and substitutingthe following -

" $229 "; and

iii by deleting"$318"andsubstitutingthe following -

" $328 ".

By His Excellency’sCommand,
D. G. BLIGH Clerk of the Council.

MH3
WESTERNAUSTRALIA MARINE ACT 1982

WA. MARINE AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1993

Made by His Excellencythe Governor in ExecutiveCouncil.

PART 1- PRELIMINARY

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the WA. Marine Amendment
Regulations1993.

Commencement

2. Theseregulations shall come into operation on 1 July 1993.

PART 2- W.A. MARINE ADJUSTMENTOF COMPASSES
REGULATIONS1983

Regulation 4 amended

3. The Scale of Fees to regulation 4 of the W.A. Marine Adjustmentof
CompassesRegulations1983* is amendedby deleting -

$84
$135
$164
$224
$372
$447
$606"



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3185

and substituting the following -

95
152
185 -

252
419
503
682

[* Publishedin the Gazetteof 1 July 1983 at pp. 2191-2.
For amendmentsto 2 June 199.3 see 1992 Index to Legislation of
WesternAustralia, Table 4, p.312.]

PART 3- WA. MARINECERTIFICATESOF COMPETENCYAND
SAFETYMANNING REGULATIONS1983

Schedule3 amended

4. Schedule3 to the WA. Marine Certificates of Competencyand Safety
Manning Regulations 1983* is repealed and the following schedule
substituted -

a

SCHEDULE 3

[Regs. 14, 17 and 27A]

FEES

Feesapplicable $
Registrationfee, to be paid for certificate
of competency,or part thereof 50

Examination fee, for eachexamination 25

Eyesighttest 14

Issueof certificate 19

Copyof certificate 19

[* Publishedin the Gazetteof 1 July 1983 at pp. 2209-40.
For amendmentsto 2 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislationof
WesternAustralia, Table 4, pp. 312-3.]

PART 4- WA. MARINEHIRE ANDDRiVE REGULATIONS1983

Regulation4 amended

5. Regulation4 of the WA. Marine Hire and Drive Regulations1983* is
amendedin subregulation2 e -

a in clause 3.1.2 1 b by deleting "$200" and substituting the
following -

$206

b in clause 3.1.2 3 b by deleting "$100" and substituting the
following -

" $103 "; and



3186 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

c in clause 3.1.3 m by deleting "$38" and substituting the
following -

" $40 -

[* Publishedin the Gazetteof 1 July 1983 at pp. 2185-8.
For amendmentsto 2 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislationof
WesternAustralia, Table 4, p. 314.]

PART 5- WA. MARINE LOADLINES REGULATIONS1983

Regulation6 amended

6. Regulation 6 1 of the WA. Marine Load Lines Regulations1983* is
amendedby deleting "$22" and substituting the following -

" $25 ".

[* Publishedin the Gazetteof 1 July 1983 at p. 2193.
For amendmentsto 2 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislationof
WesternAustralia, Table 4, p. 314.1

PART 6- WA.MARINE RADIOTELEPHONYREGULATIONS1981

Regulation 16 amended

7. Regulation16 of the WA. Marine RadiotelephonyRegulations1981* is
amended-

a in subregulation2a by deleting "$149" and substituting the
following -

" $153 "; and

b in subregulation2b by deleting "$76" and substituting the
following -

" $78 ".

[* Publishedin the Gazetteof27 November1981 at pp. 4839-46.
For amendmentsto 2 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislation of
WesternAustralia, Table 4, pp. 314-5.]

By His Excellency’sCommand,
D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council.

04
TRANSPORT CO-ORDINATION ACT 1966

TRANSPORT COUNTRY TAXI-CAR AMENDMENT
REGULATIONS 1993

Made by His Excellency the Governor in ExecutiveCouncil.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Transport Counta’y Taxi-car
AmendmentRegulations1993.

Commencement

2. Theseregulations come into operation on 1 July 1993.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3187

Scheduleamended

3. The Scheduleto the Transport Country Taxi-car Regulations1982* j
amended- -

a in item 1 by deleting"100" andsubstituting the following -

" 150

b in item 2 by deleting"40" andsubstitutingthe following -

" 48 ";

c in item 3 by deleting"100" and substitutingthe following -

" 150 "; and

d in item 4 by deleting"20" in the secondplace whereit occursand
substitutingthe following -

" 25

[* Publishedin the Gazetteof23 July 1982 at pp.2853-61.
For amendmentsto 3 February 1993 see 1991 Index to Legislation
of WesternAustralia, pp.516-7and Gazetteof 23 June 1992.]

By His Excellency’sCommand,
D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council.

M11305
SHIPPINGAND PILOTAGE ACT 1967

JETTIES ACT 1926
WESTERNAUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982

NAVIGABLE WATERS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1993

Made by His Excellencythe Governor in ExecutiveCouncil.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Navigable Waters Amendment
Regulations1993.

Commencement

2. Theseregulationsshall come into operationon 1 July 1993.

Variousfeesamended

3. The Navigable Waters Regulations* are amendedby deleting in the
provisions referred to in column 1 of the Table to this regulation the fees
respectivelyset out in column 2 of the Table andsubstitutingin eachcasethe
correspondingfee set out in column 3 of the Table.

TABLE

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3

Provisions Deleted Substituted
Fee Fee

Regulation45B 3
TABLE

- item i 27 28
- item ii 54 56
- item iii 101 104
- item iv 138 142

Regulation45B 4 12.00 14.00



3188 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

Column 1 Column2 Column3

Provisions Deleted Substituted
Fee Fee

Regulation45BAA 4
paragraphg 12.00 14.00

Regulation45BA 2
paragrapha 190.00 195.00
paragraphb 190.00 195.00

Regulation45BA 3 139.00 145.00

Regulation45BA 6 51.00 53.00

[* Reprintedasat 17 October 1989.
For amendmentsto 9 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislationof
WesternAustralia, Table 4, pp. 243-4.]

By His Excellency’sCommand
D. G. BLIGH Clerk of the Council.

MH306
WESTERNAUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982

W. A. MARINE SURVEYS AND CERTIFICATES OF SURVEY
AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1993

Made by His Excellency the Governorin ExecutiveCouncil.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the W. A. Marine Surveysand
Certificatesof SurveyAmendmentRegulations1993.

Commencement

2. Theseregulationsshall comeinto operationon 1 July 1993.

Principal regulations

3. In theseregulationsthe WA Marine Surveysand Certificatesof Survey
Regulations1983* are referredto asthe principal regulations.

[* Publishedin the Gazetteof 1 July 1983 at pp. 2195-208.
For amendmentsto 14 June 1993 see 1992 Index to Legislationof
WesternAustralia, TabLe 4, p. 315.]

Schedule1 amended

4. 1 Schedule1 to the principal regulationsis amendedby deletingitem
1 andsubstitutingthe following item -

1. SURVEY FEES
a The feesfor examinationof plansof avessel,surveyscarried

out during construction,andannualor subsequentsurveys
are as follows -

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3

LengthofVess4Met Examinationof
pZans

$

Surveytdurvig
Constnsction

$

Annual or
Subsequent
Surveys

$

Over0 but not exceeding5 92 186 101
Over5 butnot exceeding7 92 198 101
Over7 but notexceeding8 118 263 109



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3189

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3

LengthofVessdMetrv& ExaminaLia
p2an

$

a of Surveysduring
Con,lruction

$

Annual or
Subsequent
Surveys

$

Over8 but not exceeding9 145 342 115
Over9 but not exceeding10 171 421 122
Over 10 but not exceeding11 210 506 135
Over 11 but not exceeding12 250 592 147
Over 12 but not exceeding13 289 677 162
Over 13 but not exceeding14 329 763 174
Over 14 but not exceeding15 369 848 187
Over 15 but not exceeding16 407 934 200
Over 16 but not exceeding17 447 1019 213
Over 17 but not exceeding18 487 1105 227
Over 18 but not exceeding19 525 1190 240
Over 19 but not exceeding20 565 1276 253
Over20 but not exceeding21 611 1368 272
Over21 but not exceeding22 657 1459 293
Over22 but not exceeding23 703 1551 313
Over23 but not exceeding24 749 1644 332
Over24 but not exceeding25 795 1735 351
Over25 but not exceeding26 842 1827 371
Over26 but not exceeding27 887 1919 390
Over27 but not exceeding28 934 2012 411
Over28 but not exceeding29 979 2104 431
Over29 but not exceeding30 1025 2195 450
Over30 but not exceeding31 1078 2294 476
Over31 but not exceeding32 1131 2393 503
Over32 but not exceeding33 1182 2491 529
Over33 but not exceeding34 1235 2590 556
Over34 but not exceeding35 1288 2689 582
Over35 but not exceeding36 1341 2787 609
Over36 but not exceeding37 1394 2886 635
Over37 but not exceeding38 1446 2985 660
Over38 but not exceeding39 1499 3083 686
Over39 but not exceeding40 1551 3182 712
Over 40 but not exceeding41 1610 3286 747
Over41 but not exceeding42 1670 3392 780
Over42 but not exceeding43 1729 3498 812
Over43 but not exceeding44 1788 3602 845
Over44 but not exceeding45 1847 3708 878
Over45 but not exceeding46 1906 3812 910
Over46 but not exceeding47 1965 3917 943
Over47 but not exceeding48 2024 4023 975
Over48 but not exceeding49 2084 4128 1008
Over49 but not exceeding50 2142 4233 1042
Over50 metres 2202 4338 1074

The fee shown in column 3 for annualandsubsequentsurvey shall
be reducedby $60.00if the vesseldoesnot havearadio installation.

The fee shown in column 3 for annual and subsequentsurvey
provides for the survey and one further inspection to clear a
deficiency notice. When further inspections are necessaryto
complete the survey, an additional fee of $70.00per visit will be
charged.

When the vesselis to be issuedwith a Classification Certificate in
respectof its hull and machinery by a recognizedClassification
Society,thefee payableshallbe 50% of the feeprescribedin column
1 andcolumn 2 and 100%of the fee prescribedin column 3.

b Where a vesselis to be survyed for more than one classof
vessel the feepayableunderColumn 1 examinationofplans
shall e increasedby the amount of one-half of the fee for
eachadditional class;

c Where a vessel is to be surveyedfor more than one classof
vessel,thefeepayableunderColumn 3 annualor subsequent
survey shall be increasedby the amountof one-halfthe fee
for eachadditionalclass;



3190 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

d Issueof a certificate of survey
wherethe Departmentaccepts
acertificate of surveyby another
marineauthority $39.00;

e For the extensionof acertificate
of survey $39.00;

f Issueof a replacementcertificate
of survey, or a copy of a
certificate of survey, or a Permit
to Operate,or aTowagePermit $39.00;

g For a survey specially required subsequentto repairs
following damageor accident,the fee is $39.00 per hour or
part thereof,plus associatedtravel costs;

h The fee for considerationof an applicationto changetheclass
of thevesselis one-halfof the appropriatefeefor examination
of plans for eachclass;

i The fee for a survey carried out to changethe classof the
vessel is one-half of the appropriate lee, for annual or
subsequentsurvey, for eachclass;

j Where examinationof plans is requireddue to significant
alterationsto avessel,the fee is one-halfthe appropriatefee
payableunderColumn 1 Examinationof Plans;

k Where an additional surveyis carriedout dueto significant
alterationsto a vessel,the fee is one-halfof the appropriate
fee for a survey carriedout duringconstruction.

2 Schedule1 to the principal regulations is amended-

a initem2-

i in subitems a, b, c, d and e by deleting "$35.00" and
substituting in eachcasethe following -

$39.00

ii in subitem I by deleting "$424.00" and substituting the
following -

" $477.00 "; and

iii in subitemsg andh by deleting"$105.00"andsubstituting
in eachcasethe following -

$118.00 ";

d initem3-

i in subitemsa andb by deleting"31" andsubstituting in
eachcasethe following -

" 35 ";and

ii in subitem c by deleting "18" and substituting the
following -

" 20 ";

e by deletingitem 4 and substitutingthe following item -

4. Annual exemptionfee regs. 10 and 1OA -

a For recordingor transfer
of vessel 14;

b For registrationor renewalwhere
the length of the vessel-

i doesnot exceed5 metres 28;



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3191

ii exceeds5 metresbut does
not exceed10 metres 56;

iii exceeds10 metresbut does
not exceed20 metres 104;

iv exceeds20 metres 142. ";

f in item 5 by deleting"$88" andsubstitutingthe following -

" $99

and

g in item 6 by deleting"$55" andsubstitutingthe following -

$62

By His Excellency’sCommand,
D. G. BLIGHT; Clerk of the Council.

MH307
JETTIESACT 1926

JETI’IES AMENDMENT REGULATIONSNO, 2 1993

Made by His Excellencythe Governorin ExecutiveCouncil.

Citation

1. These regulationsmay be cited as the Jetties AmendmentRegulations
No. 2 1993.

Commencement

2. Theseregulationsshall comeinto operationon 1 July 1993.

Principal regulations

3. In theseregulationsthe JettiesAct Regulations1940* are referredto as
the principal regulations.

[* Reprintedin the Gazetteof 13 December1990 atpp. 6069-116.
For amendmentsto 14 June1993 see 1992 Indexto Legislationof
WesternAustralia, Table 4, p. 144, and Gazetteof 7 May 1993.]

Regulation lOB amended

4. Regulation lOB 1 c of the principal regulationsis amendedby deleting
"13 cents" andsubstitutingthe following -

" 20 cents

Regulation11 amended

5. Regulation11 1 of the principal regulationsis amendedby deleting"10
cents"andsubstitutingthe following -

" 11 cents



3192 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

Regulation 11B amended

6. Regulation 11B 2 b of the principal regulations is amended by
deleting "$5.50" andsubstitutingthe following -

$5.65

Regulation 25 amended

7. Regulation 25 1 of the principal regulations is amended -

a in paragraph a by deleting "29 cehts" in the 2 places it occurs
and substituting in both casesthe following -

" 30 cents "; and

b in paragraph b by deleting "29 cents" in the 2 places it occurs
and substituting in both casesthe following -

" 30 cents

Regulation 70B amended

8. Regulation 70B of the principal regulations is amended by deleting
"$46.00 and substituting the following -

$48.00

Regulation 1051 amended

9. Regulation 1051 1 of the principal regulations is amended -

a by deleting "9.00" and substituting the following -

8.00 "; and

b by deleting "11.00" andsubstituting the following -

10.00 ".

Appendix I repealedand an appendix substituted

10. Appendix I to the principal regulations is repealed and the following
Appendix substituted -

APPENDIX I
Rags.6 and1OA]

1. WHARFAGE HANDLING AND
HAULAGE dHARGES

WHARFAGE
ALL PORTS

$
Empty returns pertonne

or in’
1.05

Explcedves pertonne
or in’

2.00

Fertiliser per tonne
or in’

1.60

Bullocks,cows, etc. each 1.05

Pig8,sheep,goats
anddogs

each 0.25

Meat chilled or
frozen

per tonne
or m’

1.90

Oil, etc.by
pipeline- Bulk

per
kilolitre

5.65



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3193

WHABFAGE
ALL PORTS

$
ORE -

Bulk per tonne 1.55
In containers per tonne 1.55

Productsof thesoil per tonne 0.95
of theStateexcept or in’
otherwisestated
exported

TTh!BER -

Direct from per tonne 2.00
overseas- or m’
in bundles
Direct from per tonne 2.00
overseas- or m’
loose
Ex WA Ports - per tonne 0.85
in bundles or m3

Ex WA Ports - per tonne 0.95
loose or m’

VEHICLES
Commercialvehicles per tonne 1.90
on own wheels or in’

Motor carsand per tonne 1.80
utilities or m’
on own wheels

OTHERGOODS
Generalcargo per tonne 3.35

or m’

Recreationalvessels per metre 8.00

H A U L A G E A N D Chargesfor haulageandhandlingshall bein
HANDLING accordancewith the IPLF charge-outrates.

BERTHAGE DUES Forvesselsover 300 grossregisteredtonnesshall
be45 centsper tonneor percubicmetreor per
kilolitre at the option of the officer in charge,on all
cargolandedor shippedwith a minimum $75.00per
day or part thereof.

Vesselsunder300 grossregisteredtonnesshall be
45 centsper tonneor percubic metreor per
kilolitre, atthe option of the officer in chargeon all
cargolandedor shippedwith aminimum$50.00per
day or part thereof.

Pearlingstoreships,missionvesselsandluggers
shall pay 45 centsper tonneon all cargolandedor
shippedwith a minimum $20.00 perday.

FRESHWATER Suppliedto ships at $1.40perkilolitre.

LIGHTING OF JETTY BROOME - $5.50 perhour or part thereof.
WYNDHAM - for full lighting of jetty shedand
yard $16.50perhour, for useof jetty lighting $5.20
perhour. For reducedlighting $1.80perhour.

MOPSHELL Shall betreatedas cargo for trans-shipmentand
- BROOME paywharfageone way. Departmentis not

responsiblefor safecustodyor loss of or damageto
suchshell.

STORAGE a $0.35per tonneor partthereoffor transit
cargonot removedfrom the goodsshedor yard
within 3 daysof the cargo being received.

b $0.35per tonneor part thereofor percubic
metreor part thereoffor trans-shipmentcargoper
weekfor a maximumperiod of 2 weeks,thereafter
ratesset out in paragrapha apply.

HIRE OF MOBILE $50.00per hour or part thereofcost of operator’s
CRANE wage not included.



3194 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

2. SLIPWAY CRARGES-FEES PER DAY OR PART
THEREOF

[Reg.96]

NOTE: Outside of normal hours, the slipway chargessetout below are
subjectto additional chargesas prescribedby regulations37 and
38 of theseregulations.

WATER & ELECTRIC POWER CHARGES- ALL PORTS
$

Useof water- 2.30
Use of power - 4.00

ALBANY SLIPWAY

SlippageFees-

Vesselsnot exceeding25 GrossRegisteredTons 26.00
Vesselsover 25 but not exceeding50 GrossRegisteredTons 46.00
Vesselsover 50 but not exceeding100 GrossRegisteredTons 105.00
Vesselsover 100 but not exceeding200 GrossRegisteredTons 415.00
Vesselsover 200 GrossRegisteredTons 825.00
Operator’sTime -

At costwith aminimum for eachservice 125.00

CARNARVON SLIPWAY

SlippageFees-

Vesselsnot exceeding10 metres 73.00

Vesselsover 10 metresbut not exceeding15 metres 107.00
Vesselsover 15 metresbut not exceeding20 metres 170.00
Vesselsover 20 metres 278.00
Haulagecharge- All vessels 136.00

SHARK BAY SL1PWAY

SlippageFees-

Vesselsnot exceeding5 metres 33.00
Vesselsexceeding5 metresbut not exceeding12 metres 51.00
Vesselsexceeding12 metresper day or part thereof 58.00
Haulagecharge- All vessels 38.00

JOHNSCREEK POINT SAMSONSLIPWAY / WYNDHAM
SLIF WAY
SlippageFee - Vesselsnot exceeding15 metres 73.00

- Vesselsover 15 metres 107.00
Haulagecharge- All vessels 89.00

3

Appendix IA amended

11. Appendix IA to the principal regulationsis amendedby deletingitems
4, 5 and6 andsubstitutingthe following items-

a

4. PENFEES- PORTOF PERTH

LOCATION - HILLARYS BOATHARBOUR [Reg. 731

AnnualFee: Lengthof Vesselx $240
per metre.

Six MonthlyFee: 60% of the annualfee.

ThreeMonthly fee: 40% of the annualfee.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3195

Monthly Fee: 15% of the annualfee.

Daily Fee: $20 per day flat rate for all
vessels.

Note: 1. For existing "pen holders" the chargeof $240 per metre
will havea ceilingincreaseof no greaterthan4%.

2. A 2½% discountwill apply to annual pen fees paid in
advance.

3. Fishing vessels that have paid the annual fees at
FremantleFishing Boat Harbourwill be charged66% of
theannualfee.

4. Paymentof pen feesentitles thehirer to free useof the
servicejetty locatedwithin the harbourfor the purposeof
loading andunloadingthevessel.

5. PENFEES- PORTOF PERTH

LOCATION - CHALLENGER BOAT HARBOUR
FREMANTLE [Reg. 73]
including Mediterraneanmoorings

Annual Fee: Lengthof Vesselx $185
permetre.

AnnualFeepaid
monthly: 10% of the annualfee per month.

Six Monthly Fee: 60% of the annualfee.

ThreeMonthly Fee: 40% of the annualfee.

Monthly Fee: 15% of the annualfee.

Daily Fee: $20 per day flat ratefor
all vessels.

6. PENFEES- PORTOF PERTH

LOCATION - FRESHWATERBAY BOAT PENS [Reg. 73]

AnnualFee: Length of Vesselx $88
per metre.

Six Monthly Fee: 60% of the annualfee.

ThreeMonthly Fee: 40% of the annualfee.

Monthly Fee: 15% of the annualfee.

Daily Fee: $20 per day flat ratefor
all vessels.

Appendix III repealedandan
Appendixsubstituted

12. Appendix III to the principal regulationsis repealedandthe following
Appendix substituted-

" APPENDIX UI

Part 1 [Beg. 94A}

PEN& BERTHAGEFEES
Otherthan the Port of Perth

LOCATIONS: Emu Point & PrincessRoyal
BoatHarbour, Albany.

CarnarvonBoat Harbour.
Denham.
BandyCreekBoat Harbour.
FremantleFishing Boat Harbour.
JurienBoatHarbour.
MandurahServiceJetty.
JohnsCreekBoat Harbour.
BataviaCoastBoat Harbour.
CasuarinaBoat Harbour.



3196 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

EMU POINT AND PRINCESS ROYAL
BOAT kAW3OUH, ALBANY/
MANLUltAfl SBRVICB JErrY

AnnualFee: Lengthof Vesselx $67 per metre.

Annual Fee 10% of the annual fee per month.
paid monthly

Monthly Fee: 12% of the annualfee.

Daily CasualFee: Length of Vesselx $2 per metre.

2. JURIEN/ BATAVIA COAST /
CASUALUNA BOAT HA1WO1Jl

AnnualFee: Lengthof Vesselx $124
permetre.

AnnualFee
paid monthly: 10% of the annual fee per month.

Monthly Fee: 12% of the annualfee.

Daily CasualFee Length of Vesselx $2 per metre.

3. BANDY CREEK /
JOHNS CkEEWBOAT HARBOUR

AnnualFee: Length of Vesselx $88 permetre.

AnnualFee
paid monthly 10% of the annualfee per month.

Monthly Fee: 12% of the annualfee.

Daily CasualFee: Lengthof Vesselx $2 per metre.

4. CARNARVON BOAT HARBOUR

AnnualFee: Length of Vesselx $120 permetre.

AnnualFee
paid monthly: 10% of the annual fee per month.

Monthly Fee: 20% of the annual fee.

Daily CasualFee: Length of Vesselx $2.50per metre.

5. FREMANTLE FISHING BOAT HARBOUR

Annual Fee: Length of Vessel x $88 per metre for
vessels up to, but not including 20
metres.

Length of Vessel x $115 per metre for
vessels20 metresandover.

Annual Fee
paid monthly: 10% of the annual fee per month.

Monthly Fee: 13% of the annualfee.

Daily Casual Fee: Length of Vesselx $2 per metre.

6. DENHAM

Annual Fee: Length of Vesselx $150 per metre.

AnnualFee
paid monthly 10% of the annualfee per month.

Monthly Fee: 12% of the annual fee.

Daily CasualFee: Length of Vesselx $2 per metre.

NOTE: Paymentof pen feesentitles the hirer to free useof any service
jetty located within the harbour in which that pen is located
subject to the availability of berth spaceand the direction of
authorizedofficers.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3197

Part 2 [Reg.94B]

PILE MOORING FEES - STATEWIDE

Annual Fee: Length of Vesselx $78 permetre.

Annual Fee 10% of annualfee
paid monthly: per month

Monthly Fee: 12% of the annualfee.

Daily CasualFee: 1% of the annualfee.

NOTE: Paymentof pile mooring fee8 entitles the hirer to free useof any
servicejetty located within the harbourin which that mooring is
located subjectto theavailability of berth spaceand thedirection
of authorizedofficers.

Part 3 [Reg. 94C]

CASUAL BERTHING FEES -

OTHER THAN PORT OF PERTH

This fee applies to DepartmentalJetty other than one located
within the Port of Peth for which no other fe has beenprescribedin
regulation.

Daily CasualFee: Lengthof Vesselx $2 per metre.

Part4

SERVICEJETTIES - FUEL WHARFAGE RATES

LOCATIONS: Exmouth

A rateof $0.0025per litre of fuel oil.

Lancelin
Greenhead
Leeman

A rate of $0.005 per litre of fuel oil.

Carnarvon

A rateof $0.00565perlitre of fuel oil.

Denham
Kalbarri
Mandurah
Onslow
Port Gregory

A rateof $0.01per litre of fuel oil.

By His Excellency’s Command,

[Reg. 11B]

,,

D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council.

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
SCHEMEAMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION

ShireofAugusta-MargaretRiver
Town PlanningSchemeNo. 11-AmendmentNo. 64

Ref: 853/6/3/8,Pt. 64.

Notice is herebygiven that the Shire of Augusta-MargaretRiver haspreparedthe abovementioned
schemeamendmentfor the purpose of rezoningPortion SussexLocation 995 Boodjidup Road,
MargaretRiver from "Rural Zone" to "Special Rural Zone".

PD4O1



3198 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

Plansand documentssettingout and explaining the schemeamendmenthavebeendepositedat
Council Offices,Town View Torrace,MargaretRiver, andat the Departmentof PlanningandUrban
Development,Albert Facey House, 469-489 Wellington Street,Perth, and will be available for
inspectionduring office hours up to and includingAugust 10, 1993.
Submissionson the schemeamendmentshouldbe madein writing on Form No. 4 andlodgedwith
the undersignedon or beforeAugust 10, 1993.
This amendmentis availablefor inspectionin orderto providean opportunity for public comment
andit should not be construedthat final approvalwill be granted.

L. CALNEGGIA, Shire Clerk.

PD402
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

SCHEMEAMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
Shire of Busselton

Town PlanningSchemeNo. 5-AmendmentNo. 259
Ref: 853/6/6/6, Pt. 259.
Notice is hereby given that the Shire of Busselton has prepared the abovementioned scheme
amendment for the purpose of rezoning Pt Lot 2 Bussell Highway from a "Restricted Use" zone to
a "Other Commercial" zone.
Plansand documentssetting out and explaining the schemeamendmenthave been deposited at
Council Offices, Southern Drive, Busselton, and at the Departmentof Planning and Urban
Development,Albert Facey House, 469-489 Wellington Street,Perth, and will be available for
inspectionduring office hours up to andincluding August10, 1993.
Submissionson the schemeamendmentshouldbe madein writing on Form No. 4 andlodgedwith
the undersignedon or beforeAugust 10, 1993.
This amendmentis available for inspectionin order to providean opportunity for public comment
and it should not be construedthat final approvalwill be granted.

I. STUBBS, Shire Clerk.

PD403

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
SCHEMEAMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION

Shireof Cunderdin
Town Planning SchemeNo. 2

District Zoning Scheme
Ref: 853/4/10/2.
Noticeis herebygiven that the Shire of Cunderdinhaspreparedthe abovementionedtown planning
schemefor the following purposes-

1. To encourageandcontrol orderly developmentin the SchemeAreain such a way that will
promoteandsafeguardthe health,safety, convenience,andeconomicand generalwelfare
of its inhabitantsandthe amenitiesof the area.

2. To provide for possiblefuture residential,industrialandrural hobby farm development.
3. To identify an appropriateareain Cunderdinwithin which new residenceswill be required

to be constructedof masonrymaterial.
4. To control quality of developmentthroughoutthe Shire.
5. To adopta set of policies which will achievethe statedobjectives.

Plansanddocumentssetting out andexplaining the town planningschemehavebeendepositedat
Council Offices, Lundy Avenue, Cunderdin and at the Department of Planning and Urban
Development,Albert Facey House, 469-489 Wellington Street,Perth, and will be available for
inspectionduring office hours up to andincluding September29, 1993.
Submissionson the town planning schemeshould be madein writing on Form No. 4 and lodged
with the undersignedon or before September29, 1993.

N. J. ALCOCK, Shire Clerk.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3199

PD404

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
SCHEMEAMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION

Shireof Murray
TownPlanning SchemeNo. 4-AmendmentNo. 44

Ref: 853/6/16/7,Pt. 44.
Notice is hereby given that the Shire of Murray has preparedthe abovementionedscheme
amendmentfor the purposeof including section 10 in Schedule3 pertainingto "Murray Lakes"as
follows-

1 Under the heading"PermittedUses"add-

"10. Boat Hire Depot."

2 Under the heading"DevelopmentControl Provisions"add-
"Restricted to Lot 632 Wharf Way andadjoining canal waterways.
Additional usesinclude-

a Boat mooringsfor 4 houseboatsor the like.
b Office for boat hiring.
c Repair and maintenanceof boats may be carried out only in the workshop

betweenthe hoursof 8.00 am and4.30 pm sevendaysper week providedthe
amenity of the neighbourhoodis not prejudiciallyaffected.

d Refuelling facilities in accordancewith the Explosivesand DangerousGoods
Act 1961 and the Flammable Liquids Regulations1967.

e Sewagepump-outfacility, subjectto the approvalof the Water Authority of
WesternAustralia."

Plansand documentssettingout and explaining the schemeamendmenthavebeen depositedat
Council Offices, Pinjarra Road, Pinjarra, and at the Department of Planning and Urban
Development,Albert Facey House, 469-489 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for
inspection during office hours up to and including 10 August 1993.
Submissionson the schemeamendmentshouldbe madein writing on Form No. 4 and lodgedwith
the undersignedon or before 10 August 1993.
This amendmentis availablefor inspectionin order to providean opportunity for public comment
andit shouldnot be construedthat final approvalwill be granted.

D. CLEMENTS, Shire Clerk.

PD405

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENTACT 1928
SCHEMEAMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION

City of Armadale
Town PlanningSchemeNo. 2-AmendmentNo. 92

Ref: 853/2/22/4,Pt. 92.
Notice is hereby given that the City of Armadale has preparedthe abovementionedscheme
amendmentfor the purposeof rezoningPt Lot 50, Lot 51 and Lot 7 Churchman’sBrook Road,
Bedfordalefrom Rural ‘X" Zone to "SpecialUse-Rural/Residential"Zone andamendthe Scheme
text with specific details pertaining to the land use responsibilitiesand controls under such new
zone, accordingly.
Plansand documentssetting out and explaining the schemeamendmenthavebeendepositedat
Council Offices, 7 OrchardAvenue, Armadale,and at the Departmentof Planningand Urban
Development,Albert Facey House,469-489 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for
inspectionduring office hours for an additional period of 48 days up to and including 16 August
1993.
Submissionson the schemeamendmentshouldbemadein writing on FormNo. 4 andlodgedwith
the undersignedon or before 16 August 1993.

This amendmentis available for inspectionin order to provide an opportunityfor public comment
andit should not be construedthat final approvalwill be granted.

A. F. MAXWELL, Acting Town Clerk.



3200 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

PD5O1
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEMEAMENDMENT
Shire of Bridgetown-Greenbushes

Town Planning SchemeNo. 4-AmendmentNo. 21
Ref: 853/6/5/4,Pt. 21.
It is herebynotified for public information, in accordancewith section 7 of the Town Planningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Bridgetown
GreenbushesTown PlanningSchemeAmendmenton 21 June1993, for the purposeof inserting a
new Sub-Clause3.4.3 to read-

"NotwithstandingClause3.4.2 b the PlanningConsentof Council is requiredfor the erection
of a ResitedResidence."

J. TAYLOR, President.
K. HILL, Shire Clerk.

PD502

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEMEAMENDMENT

Shireof Busselton
Town PlanningSchemeNo. 5-AmendmentNo. 247

Ref: 853/6/6/6,Pt. 247.
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordancewith section 7 of the Town Planningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planningapprovedthe Shire of BusseltonTown
PlanningSchemeAmendmenton 21 June 1993 for the purposeof-

1. RezoningPt Lot 2 BussellHighway from "Single Residential"to "OtherCommercial"with
"Additional Uses".

2. Adding the following to Appendix IV-Additional Use Zones-ofthe SchemeThxt.

Street Particulars Additional Use

Bussell Highway Pt Lot 2 Eating House
LicensedRestaurant

R. TOGNELA, President.
I. STUBBS, Shire Clerk.

PD503

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
APPROVEDTOWN PLANNING SCHEMEAMENDMENT

Shireof Chittering
Town Planning SchemeNo. 5-AmendmentNo. 18

Ref: 853/3/4/5,Pt. 18.
It is herebynotified for public information, in accordancewith section 7 of the Town Planningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planning approvedthe Shireof Chittering Town
PlanningSchemeAmendmenton June21, 1993, for the purposeof-

1. Adding to Schedule2-SpecialUses-thefollowing-
Descriptionof Site UsesPermittedand Conditionsof Use

Lot 101 Kay Road, Bindoon Tha Rooms
Saleof Paintings
Farm Stay Accommodation

M. TAYLOR, President.
P. FITZGERALD, Shire Clerk.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3201

PD504

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
APPROVEDTOWN PLANNING SCHEMEAMENDMENT

Shireof Coorow
Town Planning SchemeNo. 1-AmendmentNo. 9

Ref: 853/3/20/1,Pt. 9.
It is herebynotified for public information,in accordancewith section 7 of the Town Planningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planning approvedthe Shire of Coorow Town
PlanningSchemeAmendmenton June21, 1993, for the purposeof-

i Rezoningland comprising Lot 100; including Lot 62, 63 and 64; Lot 59 andportionof the
ShelterReserve;vacant Crown land; and portion of Station Street from the Residential
Zone; Railway ReserveandParksand RecreationReserveto SpecialSite Grain Receival
andAssociatedPurposes.

ii Including in Appendix5-Scheduleof SpecialSites the following-

Street Particularsof Land Use

Station Street Lot 100 GrainReceivalandAssociatedPurposes

A. C. KAU, President.
S. N. HAZELDINE, Shire Clerk.

PD505

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEMEAMENDMENT

Shire of Kalamunda
District PlanningSchemeNo. 2-AmendmentNo. 121

Ref: 853/2/24/16,Pt. 121.
It is herebynotified for public information, in accordancewith section 7 of the TownPlanningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planningapprovedthe Shire of KalamundaTown
PlanningSchemeAmendmenton June 21, 1993, for the purposeof amendingthe Residential
PlanningCode from HiS to R30 for part of Lot 3 Wittenoom Road,High Wycombe,as depictedin
the SchemeAmendmentMap.

B. R. WILLMOfl President.
D. E. VAUGHAN, Shire Clerk.

PD506

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEMEAMENDMENT

Shireof Mundaring
Town PlanningSchemeNo. 1-AmendmentNo. 347

Ref: 853/2/27/1, Pt. 347.
It is herebynotified for public information, in accordancewith section 7 of the Town Planningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the HonMinister for Planningapprovedthe Shireof MundaringTown
PlanningSchemeAmendmenton June21, 1993, for the purposeof-

1 Amending the subdivision guide plan that forms part of Town PlanningSchemeNo. 1 as
it relatesto Part Lot 289 HedgesRoad,Hovea,to allow for the creationof two lots.

2 Amending the SchemeThxt to insert in the First Schedulein columnsa and b the
following-

a b
Part Parkerville Lot 289 on Certificate of Subdivision of the subject land to be in
Title Volume 1713 Folio 058 HedgesRoad, accordancewith the plan of subdivision
Hovea. which forms part of this amendment.

R. P. DULLARD, President.
M. N. WILLIAMS, Shire Clerk.



3202 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

PD507

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENTS

Shireof Roebourne
Town PlanningSchemeNo. 6-AmendmentNos. 25 and 27

Ref: 853/8/5/4,Pta. 25 and 27.
It is herebynotified for public information, in accordancewith section 7 of the Town Planningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planningapprovedthe Shire of RoebourneTown
PlanningSchemeAmendmentson June21, 1993, for the purposeof-

AmendmentNo. 25
1 Modifying the current zoning of Lot 4551 formerly Reserve34747 Lot 3922 to "Service

Commercial".
2 Amending Schedule2 to the SchemeThxt "designatedusesof SpecialUse Zone Sites"by

deleting Lot 3922 from that Schedule.
3 Amending the SchemeMap accordingly.

AmendmentNo. 27
1. RezoningLot 1061 OrkneyRoadfrom "Public Utilities" Reserveto "Industrial Accommoda

tion" Zone.
2. Amending the SchemeMap accordingly.

R. MUNDY, President.
F. GOW, Shire Clerk.

PD508

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
APPROVEDTOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENTS

Shireof Swan
Town PlanningSchemeNo. 9-AmendmentNos. 173, 179 and 186

Ref: 853/2/21/10,Pta. 173, 179 and 186.
It is herebynotified for public information,in accordancewith section7 of the Town Planningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planning approvedthe Shire of Swan Town
PlanningSchemeAmendmentson June21, 1993, for the purposeof-

AmendmentNo. 173
Amending the SchemeMaps to rezoneLot 17 Cur Morrison Road andKeaneStreet,Midland
from "City Centre-CommercialDeferred" to "City Centre-Business"as depicted on the
SchemeAmendmentMap.

AmendmentNo. 179
1. Amending the SchemeLegend to insert the symbol used to delineatethe Conservation

Precinct boundariesandthe words "ConservationPrecinct".
2. Depicting the boundariesof the conservationprecinctsaroundthe Midland Town Centre

boundedby Helena Street, Great Northern Highway, and GreatEasternHighway, and
aroundthe Guildford townaite boundedby the Swan River in the north and west, the
Helena River in the south, and the most easterly arm of the Helena River and the
alignment of the powertransmissionline in the eastas depictedon the SchemeMap.

AmendmentNo. 186
1. Amending the SchemeThxt by adding to Appendix 6B in the various columns, the

following-
Locality StreetandLand Particulars Additional or RestrictedUse

and Conditions
Midland Lot 250 Victoria Street 1. The following use is an additional use

"F’ use-Office:Professional.
2. The additional use referred to in 1

above is restrictedto lots 2, 3 and 4
on StrataPlan22405.

2. Amending the SchemeMaps to insert the Additional or Restricteduse Symbol on Lot 250
Victoria Street,Midland.

M. KIDSON, President.
E. W. LUMSDEN, Shire Clerk.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3203

PD509
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

APPROVEDTOWN PLANNING SCHEMEAMENDMENT
Shire ofYork

Town PlanningSchemeNo. 1-AmendmentNo. 14
Ref: 853/4/34/1,Pt. 14.
It is herebynotified for public information, in accordancewith section7 of the Town Planningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planning approvedthe Shire of York Town
PlanningSchemeAmendmenton 21 June 1993, for the purposeof-

1. In the SchemeThxt including the "Zoning andDevelopmentTable" for the Rural Thwnsite
Zone as containedin this amendment.

2. In the SchemeMap amendingthe Legendto include in the list of zones"Rural Townaite"
to be depictedwith red brown 1.3 border.

"Rural Townsite

3. Rezoning land in the Greenhillslocality from "General Farming" to "Rural Townsite" as
depictedin the SchemeAmendmentMap.

Zone: Rural Townsite
Policy Statement:It is the intention of Council to provide for residentialdevelopmentin established
rural townsites and localities in the District. The R2.5 residentialdensity will apply, and a
minimum areaof lot of 4 000 sq. metresrequiredper dwelling.
Amalgamationof existinglots in the Greenhillslocality will be requiredto satisfythe minimum
areof lot per dwelling requiredfor the R2.5 densityCode.
In the Greenhillslocality Council will support closureof unmaderoads and amalgamationwith
adjoining lots, and will require all on-siteeffluent disposalsystemsto be at least30 metresfrom
Bailey Bailey Brook.

Minimum Minimum Mail- Minimum Boundary Minimum Mini- Other
1/t Area Effective

Frontage
mum
P1t
Ratio

Setbacks

Front Rear Side

Car
Parking

mum
Land-

Requirements

PermittedUses Note:Unlessotherwise specifiedbelow thestandardsabove will apply to this zone

1

2
3
4

5
6
7
8
9

Art and Craft Studio

BoardingHouse
Caretakers’House
ConvenienceStore

CottageIndustry
Home Occupation
Outbuilding
Plant Nursery
Single House

AP

AP
AP
AP

P
AP
P

AP
P

4000 in2 40 in

0.35

1/20 m2
GFA

1.5/ BED
2

1/20 in2
GFA

6

50%

50%

SeeClause2.4
d ande

Note: GFA = GrossFloor Area
M. W. JOYCE, President.

R. J. STEWART, Shire Clerk.

PD51O
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEMEAMENDMENT
City of Wanneroo

Town PlanningSchemeNo. 1-AmendmentNo. 638
Ref: 853/2/30/1,Pt. 638. -

It is herebynotified for public information, in accordancewith section7 of the Town Planningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planningapprovedthe City of WannerooThwn
Planning Scheme Amendment on June 21, 1993, for the purpose of amendingthe Residential
Density Code Maps to recodeportionof Pt Lot 1004 AnchorageDrive, Mindarie from R20 to R30.

G. A. MAJOR, Mayor.
R. F. COFFE Town Clerk.

Explanationof Symbolssee
Clause 2.2.2
P Use permittedsubjectto

compliancewith Develop
ment standards

PS= Usenot permittedunless
approvalgivenby Council
andconditionscomplied
with

AP = Not permittedunlessap
proval given by Council
after advertising

IF = Use not permittedunless
it is incidental to a pre
dominantuseas deter
minedby Council

Provision of a
potable water

As per R2.5 of the ResidentialPlanningCodes supply to each
lot to the sat
isfactionof the

Council



3204 GOVERNMENT GAZETPE, WA [29 June 1993

PD511

Ref: 853/8/4/5,Pt. 10.

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEMEAMENDMENT

Town of Port Hedland
Town PlanningSchemeNo. 4-AmendmentNo. 10

It is herebynotified for public information, in accordancewith section7 of the TownPlanningand
DevelopmentAct 1928 thatthe HonMinister for Planningapprovedthe Townof Port HedlandTown
Planning SchemeAmendmenton June21, 1993, for the purposeof-

1. Altering theheadingof Clause4.2 ResidentialDevelopment-byaddingthe following words
"ResidentialPlanning Codes".

2. Deleting Clause4.2.1 and replacingit with clause-
For the purpose of this Scheme, "Residential Planning Codes" means the residential
planningcodesset out in Appendix 2 to the statementof PlanningPolicy No. 1, together
with any amendmentsthereto.

3. Delete referenceto "Attached House"from the useslisted in Table 1-Zoning Table.
G. EGGLESTON,Mayor.

G. P. BRENNAN, Town Clerk.

It is herebynotified for general informationthat, pursuantto section28 3 of the State Supply
CommissionAct 1991,the StateSupply Commissionhasissuedthe following supplypolicies,which
areapplicableto all public authorities.
Supply Policies-Management

GovernmentInformationTochnology ContractGITC
Supply Policies-InformationandInformation Systems

Annual Supply Reports
Electronic TradingAgreement
Standardsfor CommonElectronicDataInterchangeEDI andElectronicFundsTransferEFT
Documents

L. W. GRAHAM, Chairman,
State Supply Commissionof WesternAustralia.

STATE ENERGYCOMMISSION ELECThICITY AN] GAS CHARGES
AMENDMENT BY-LAWS 1993

Made ly The StateEnergyCommissionof WesternAustraliawith the approval
of His Excellencythe Governor in ExecutiveCouncil.

Citation

1. Theseby-lawsmaybecited astheStateEnergyCornnthsionElectricityand
Gas ChargesAmendmentBy-laws1993.

Commencement

SA4O1

STATE SUPPLY COMMISSIONACT 1991

SJ3O1

STATE ENERGY COMMISSIONACT 1979

2. Theseby-laws shall come into operation on 1 July 1993.



29 June 1993] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3205

First and SecondSchedulesamended

3. The First andSecondSchedulesto theStateEnergyCommissionElectricity
and GasChargesBy-laws 1978* are amended-

a in Tariffs Li andL2 by deleting-

17.88 centsperunit for the first 165 units perday.
15.98 centsperunit for the next 1485 units per day.
14.42centsperunit for thenext 14 850 units per day.
13.56 centsper unit for all over 16 500 units per day.

and

17.88centsperunit for the first 165 units per day.
15.98 centsper unit for the next 1485 units per day.
14.42centsper unit for all over 1650 units per day.

respectivelyand substitutingin eachcasethe following -

15.98 centsper unit for the first 1650 units per day.
14.42 cents per unit per day for all units exceeding
1650 units. ";

b in Tariffs Ml andM2 by deleting -

16.55 centsper unit for the first 165 units per day.
15.44 centsper unit for thenext 1485 units per day.
13.87 centsper unit for thenext 14 850 units per day.
12.63 centsper unit for thenext 16 500 units per day.
11.82 centsper unit for all over 33 000 units per day.

and

16.55 centsper unit for the first 165 units per day.
15.44 centsper unit for thenext 1485 units per day.
13.87 centsper unit for all over 1650 units per day.

respectivelyandsubstitutingin eachcasethe following -

15.44 centsper unit for the first 1650 units per day.
13.87 cents per unit per day for all units exceeding
1650 units.

c in Tariffs Ki and K2 by deleting -

17.88 centsperunit for the next 145 units per day.
15.98 centsper unit for the next 1485 units per day.
14.42 centsper unit for thenext 14 850 units per day.
13.56 centsper unit for all over 16 500 units per day.

and

17.88 centsperunit for the next 145 units per day.
15.98 centsper unit for the next 1485 units per day.
14.42 centsper unit for all over 1650 units per day.

respectivelyandsubstitutingin eachcasethe following -

15.98 centsper unit for the next1630 units per day.
14.42 cents per unit per day for all units exceeding
1650 units.

and



3206 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1993

d by deleting in theTariff chargesreferred to in column 1 of theTable
to thisparagraphthe chargesrespectivelysetout in column2 of the
Tableandsubstitutingin eachcasethe correspondingchargesetout
in column 3 of the Table.

TABLE

Column 1

Tariffs

Tariffs Li and L2

Column 2

Deleted
charge

27.21

Column 3

Substituted
charge

24.31

Tariffs Ml andM2 27.21 24.31

Tariffs Ri and R2 7.50 6.00

{* Publishedin the Gazetteof23 June1978 at pp. 2055-2064.
For amendmentsto 14 May 1993 see 1991 Index to Legislation of
WesternAustralia,pp 495-498andGazettesof25 February,26June,
14 August,and30 October1992.1

MARK HANDS, Secretary,
The State EnergyCommissionof WesternAustralia.

D. G. BLIGHT, Clerk of the Council.

Approvedby His Excellencythe Governor in ExecutiveCouncil.

Annual Returns

STATE TAXETION DEPARTMENT
Notice to all Owners of Land or Property in WesternAustralia

Land Tax

Annual returnsarenot requiredfor 1993/94.
TheDepartmentwill issueassessmentnoticesto propertyownersbasedon registeredlandholdings
as at 30 June 1993.

Applicationsfor Exemptionor Concessions
The owner of anyclassof landin respectof which an exemptionor concessionmay be grantedis
requiredto makeapplication for the exemption or concessiononly wherethe land concernedhas
beenassessedfor land tax for 1993/94.

P. FELLOWES, Commissionerof State Taxation.

METROPOLITAN PERTH PASSENGERTRANSPORT TRUST ACT 1957
MEMBERSHIP OF TRUST

I, Eric Charlton, beingthe Minister administeringthe MetropolitanPerthPassengerTransport
Trust Act 1957 appoint in accordancewith the provisionsof section 7 4 b of that Act, Barbara
Holland as a Memberof the MetropolitanPerth PassengerTransportTrust to 19 May 1994.

SX4O1

TP4O1

ERIC CHARLTON, Minister for Transport.



29 June 19931 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3207

ZZ2O1

TRUSTEESACT 1962
DECEASED ESTATES

Creditorsand other personshaving claims in respect of the estatesmentioned below to which
section63 of the TrusteesAct 1962 as amendedappliesare requiredto sendparticularsof claims
to the Executorsc/- HaynesRobinson,Solicitors of P.O. Box 485, Albany, by 24th July 1993 after
which datethe Executorsmay convey or distribute the assetshaving regard only to the daimsof
which they havenoticeandthe Executorsshall notbe liable to anypersonof whoseclaim they have
had no notice at the time of distribution.

1. Estateof the late Margery GertrudeBourke formerly of Mount Barker late of 3 Arthur
Street,Subiaco,Medical Practitioner,deceased.

2. Estateof the late FrederickWilliam Alfred Warn lateof 15 NarpundRoad,Mount Barker,
Retired Banker, deceased.

Dated this 26th day of June 1993.
HaynesRobinsonfor the Executors.

HAYNES ROBINSON.

STATE PRINT
LAW PUBLISHER
SPECIAL NOTICE

SUBSCRIPTIONCHARGES 1993
All subscriptionsand standingorders run from 1 Januaryto 31 December
1993.
The policy of the State Print is that no refunds or credits will be given if a
subscriptionis cancelledduring the year.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
The GovernmentGazetteis publishedon
TuesdayandFridayof eachweek,unless
disruptedby public holidays or unfore
seencircumstances.
SpecialGovernmentGazettesand Extraor
dinaryGovernmentGazettesare published
periodically.Only thespecialgazettesare
included in the subscriptionprice.

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazetteis publishedmonthly.

Subscriptionrates:
All Mail within WA
All Mail within Australia
All OverseasAirmail

$
189.00
213.00
375.00

Subscription rates:
All Mail within WA
All Mail within Australia
All OverseasAirmail
Bound Volumes of

GovernmentGazette

$
394.00
431.00
649.00

STANDING ORDER
SUBSCRIPTIONSERVICE

Postageis included in quoted price of all
W.A. statutes.

HANSARD

$
187.00
204.00
215.00

Hansard is printed and posted weekly
duringa parliamentarysession.

Bound Statutes:
Within W.A.
Interstate surface mail

760.00 Overseassurface mail
Half Calf Bound Statutes

all areas
Loose Statutes:

Within WA.
Interstate& Overseas

surface mail
$ SessionalBills

Within WA.
Interstate& Overseas

surface mail

Subscription rates:
All Mail within WA
All Mail within Australia
All OverseasAirmail

500.00

86.00

262.00
307.00
605.00

90.00

105.00

115.00



3208 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA {29 June 1993

CONTENTS
REGULATIONS, BY-LAWS, RULES, DETERMINATIONS, ORDERS

Page
FisheriesAmendmentRegulationsNo. 5 1993 3169-70
JettiesAct-JettiesAmendmentRegulationsNo. 2 1993 3191-7
PearlingGeneralAmendmentRegulations1993 3 170-2
Pollution of WatersBy Oil and Noxious SubstancesRegulations1993 3179-81
Portsand HarboursAmendmentRegulations1993 3181-4
Shipping and Pilotage Act--Jetties Act-Western Australian Marine Act-Navigable

WatersAmendmentRegulations1993 3187-8
StateEnergyCommissionAct-StateEnergyCommissionElectricity andGas Charges

AmendmentBy-laws 1993 3204-6
SupremeCourt AmendmentRulesNo. 3 1993 3 166-7
TobaccoControl PackageLabels AmendmentRegulations1993 3172
TransportCo-ordination Act-TransportCountry Taxi-car AmendmentRegulations

1993 3186-7
W.A. Marine Amendment Regulations1993 3184-6
Western Australian Marine Act-WA. Marine Surveys and Certificates of Survey

AmendmentRegulations1993 3188-91

GENERAL CONTENTS
Page

ConsumerAffairs 3164-6
Crown Law 3166-9
Fisheries 3169-72
Health 3172-3
Heritage Council 3174
Homeswest 3174
Land Mministration 3174-5
Local Government 3175-9
Marine and Harbours 3179-97
Planning and Urban Development 3197-3204
Proclamations 3163-4
Public Notices-DeceasedPersonsEstates 3207
Services 3204
State Energy Commission 3204-6
State Taxation 3206
Transperth 3206

11957/6193-1350 199300089GG
GENERAL 29 JUNE




