PRINT POST APPRQVED PP665002/00041

WESTERN

AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

PERTH, TUESDAY, 17 JUNE 1997 No. 89

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

PusLisHING DETAILS

The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law

Publisher for the State of Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of

each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen

circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised

beforehand on the inside cover).

Special Government Gazettes and Extraordinary Government Gazettes

are published periodically, all gazettes are included in the subscription

price.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the

Government Gazette.

B Material submitted to the Executive Council and which requires

gazettal will require a copy of the signed Executive Council Minute

Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

B Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State

Law Publisher no later than 12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition)

or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).

M Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded several days

before advertised closing date for copy. This is to ensure inclusion in

current edition. Failure to observe this request could result in

the notice being held over until the following edition.

B Proofs will be supplied only when requested.

B No additions or amendments to material for publication will be

accepted by telephone.

Send copy to:

The Manager (Sales and Editorial),

State Law Publisher

Ground Floor, 10 William Street, Perth, 6000

Telephone: 9321 7688 Fax: 9321 7536

ADVERTISERS SHOULD NOTE:

B All Notices should be written in ‘plain English’.

B Signatures (in particular) and proper names must be legible.

B All copy should be typed and double spaced.

B If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to communicate by

facsimile, confirmation is not required by post. If original copy is

forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

B Documents not clearly prepared and in the required format for gazettal,

will be returned to the sender unpublished.

B Late copy received at State Law Publisher will be placed in the following

issue irrespective of any date/s mentioned in the copy.




IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no
part may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government
Printer, State Law Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial,
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS

INCREASE EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 1997.

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$17.20

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per
notice)—3$40.10

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$40.10 (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for
pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
Per Column Centimetre—$7.90
Bulk Notices—$148.00 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

COUNTER SALES 1997-98
(As from 1 July 1997) "

Government Gazette—(General) ..........c.cceevvrrevrennenn. 2.50
Government Gazette—(Special)

UP 10 2 PAGES .ooveeeiieieciciicncnettctcre s 2.50

OVeEr 2 PABES ....oovvieiieienrciittere e 4.90
Hansard ........ooooovrieeveriieirreeeneeerenrirreeres e e sesieresesesenes 14.10
Industrial Gazette ......coooovvrvereeiiiiii e, 12.50
Bound Volumes of Statutes ...........cccccceevvvineriieiinerennnns 218.00

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Periodically notices are published indicating a variation in
normal publishing arrangements:

® Easter or Christmas editions etc—these notices appear
approximately 4 weeks prior to any change.

e Extraordinary gazettes not circulated to all subscribers—
these notices appear in the following general edition of
the gazette.

In all cases notices are published on page 2 and readers are
urged to check accordingly prior to contacting State Law
Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK,
Government Printer.



17 June 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2765

FAIR TRADING

FT401
COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943
NILGIN SERVICES CO-OPERATIVE LTD

Notice is hereby given that, pursuant to Section 26 (1) of the abovenamed Act, a Certificate of Incorpo-
ration, as a Limited Company, has this day been issued to Nilgin Services Co-operative Ltd.
Dated this 11th day of June 1997,
(Sgd) A Person Authorised by the Commissioner
for Corporate Affairs in Western Australia.

HeaALTH

HE301
HOSPITALS AND HEALTH SERVICES ACT 1927
HOSPITALS (SERVICES CHARGES) REGULATIONS 1984
HOSPITALS (SERVICES CHARGES FOR MAGNETIC RESONANCE
IMAGING) DETERMINATION AMENDMENT NOTICE 1997

Given by the Minister for Health under section 37 (3) (af) of the Act and
regulation 5 (2) and (3) of the regulations.

Citation

1. This notice may be cited as the Hospitals (Services Charges for Magnetic
Resonance Imaging) Determination Amendment Notice 1997.

Commencement

2. The amendment made by this notice comes into operation on the day on
which this notice is published in the Gazette.

Schedule amended

8. The Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges for Magnetic Resonance
Imaging) Determination 1996* is amended —

(a) in item 1, by deleting “$845” and substituting the following —
“ $880 ”;

(b) in item 2, by deleting “$945” and substituting the following —
“ $984

(¢) in item 3, by deleting “$1690” and substituting the following —
“ $1755 ”; and

(d) in item 4, by deleting “$1790” and substituting the following —
“ $1859 .

[* Published in Gazette 5§ March 1996, pp. 829-30.

For amendments to 12 May 1997 see Gazette 16 April 1996,
p. 1700.]

Dated 11th June 1997.
KEVIN PRINCE, Minister for Health.



2766 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [17 June 1997

LAND ADMINISTRATION

LA401
LOCAL GOVERNMENT (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT 1960
DECLARATION OF PUBLIC STREETS
Orders of the Minister for Lands
Made under Section 288

At the request of the local government nominated, the portions of land specified in the Schedule are
now declared to be absolutely dedicated as public streets.

SCHEDULE
City of Perth (DOLA File No. 2180/996)
1. Road No. 18987 Eastbrook Terrace (Extension).

Portion of Perth Lot 1063 coloured brown and marked Pedestrian Accessway on Diagram 91457 and
being part of the land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 2079 Folio 398, as delineated and
coloured mid brown on Crown Survey Diagram 93081.

2. Road No. 18988 Eastbrook Terrace (Extension).

Portion of Perth Lot 1063 and being part of Lot 208 on Plan 21019 and being part of the land comprised
in Certificate of Title Volume 2077 Folio 731, as delineated and coloured mid brown on Crown Survey
Diagram 93081.

Public Plan: BG34(2) 14.25.

A. A. SKINNER, Chief Executive,
Department of Land Administration.

LB301
LAND ACQUISITION AND PUBLIC WORKS ACT 1902
SALE OF LAND
Notice is hereby given that the Governor has authorised under section 29(7)(a)(ii) of the Land Acquisi-
tion and Public Works Act 1902 of the sale by public auction or private contract of the land hereinafter
described, such land being no longer required for the work for which it was acquired.
LAND
File No. 1301/1996

Portion of Swan Location 1370 being Lot 200 on LTO Diagram 75866 and being the whole of the land
contained in Certificate of Title Volume 1869 Folio 735.

File No. 1770/1968

Reserve No. 29741 comprising Swan Location 8363 formerly portion of Swan Location 70 being Lots
665-668 and Lot 697 on LTO Plan 3394.

File No. 946/1981

Reserve No. 37186 comprising Swan Location 10184 on LTO Diagram 59523.

File No. 2720/1988

Reserve No. 40753 comprising Plantagenet Location 7646 on Crown Diagram 88761.
File No. 2989/1965

The land shown coloured pink on LAWA, Plan 1240 being portion of Canning Location 2289 on Crown
Diagram 90791, held as part of Reserve No. 30234 formerly a portion on closed road.

Notice is hereby given that His Excellency the Governor has approved under Section 29B(1)(a)(i) of the
Land Acquisition and Public Works Act 1902 of the sale by public auction or private contract of the
land hereinafter described, which was compulsorily taken or resumed under that Act for a public work,
namely “Police Station” and has been used for that public work for a period of ten years or more and
being no longer required for that work.

File No. 2989/965

The land shown coloured green on LAWA Plan 1240 being portion of Canning Location 2289 on Crown
Diagram 90791 held as part of Reserve No. 30234 formerly part of LTO Lots 68-70 on LTO Plan 2188.
Lots 68 and 69 were formerly held in Certificate of Title Volume 361 Folioc 163 while Lot 70 was held in
Certificate of Title Volume 198 Folio 164.

Dated this 3rd day of June 1997,
A. A. SKINNER, Chief Executive.



17 June 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2767

LB601*
LAND ACT 1933
ADDITIONAL SPECIAL LEASE PURPOSE
His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, under Section 116(14) of the Land Act 1933.

DOLA File: 07062-1904-06RO.

""Retail, Office and Dining Precinct
Lease may be granted.

Public Plan/s: BG33(2) 05.01
Local Authority: City of Mandurah.

has been approved an additional purpose for which a Special

A. A. SKINNER, Chief Executive.

LocaL GOVERNMENT

LG301*
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
Shire of Carnarvon
LOCAL LAW—CAT CONTROL
In pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act and all other
powers enabling it the Council of the abovementioned Local Government hereby records
having resolved on the 28th day of May 1997, to adopt the following Local Law.
Citation:
1. This Local Law may be cited as the Shire of Carnarvon Local Law Cat Control.

Objects:

2. The object of this Local Law is—
(a) to encourage responsible cat ownership.
(b) to reduce public and environmental nuisance caused by cats.
(c) to promote the effective management of cats.

Interpretation:
3. In this Local Law—
(a) “Act” means the Local Government Act 1995.

(b) “Authorised Person” means a person authorised by the Council to administer the
provisions of this Local Law.

(¢) “Council” means the Council of the Shire of Carnarvon.
(d) “District” means the Local Government district of the Shire of Carnarvon.

(e) “Identified Cat” means a cat identified in the manner of having a collar around its
neck and the collar, or a tag securely attached to the collar, is marked with the
current address or telephone number of the owner or other person entitled to pos-
session of the cat.

(£ “Premises” shall, for the purpose of determining who is the occupier, be taken to
refer to any land or building, or part of any land or building, that is intended to be
occupied as a separate residence from any adjacent tenement.

(g) “Unidentified Cat” means a cat that is not identified in the manner as defined in
sub-clause (e).
Cats Not To Be A Nuisance:

4. No person shall keep or allow to remain on any Premises of which he or she is the owner
or occupier, any cat or cats so as to be a nuisance to another person or injurious to the
health of another person by reason of—

(a) the number of cats;

(b) the noise or odour generated by the presence of the cats or cats;
(c) the aggressive nature of the cat or cats;

(d) the wandering of the cat or cats.

Limit of Cat Numbers:

5. (a) Subject to sub-clause (b) the limit on the number of cats kept on any premises shall
be three.

(b) No person shall keep any cat on the premises where the number of cats being kept
upon the Premises exceeds the limit without the permission of the Council.



2768 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [17 June 1997

Identified Cats:

6. No person shall without permission of the Council keep a cat over the age of three
months on any Premises unless the cat is an identified cat.

Authorised Persons:

7. (a) The Council may appoint suitable persons to be Authorised Persons for the purpose
of administering this Local Law.

(b) An Authorised Person may exercise powers conferred by this Local Law on an Au-
thorised Person within the district.

Penalties:

8. (a) A person who contravenes or fails to comply with any provision of this Local Law is,
upon conviction, liable to a penalty of $200 for each offence.

Modified Penalties:

9. (a) The offences described in the table set out in the First Schedule to this Local Law are
prescribed pursuant to Section 3.10 and 9.17 of the Act as an offence to which a modified
penalty applies and the amount appearing in that table directly opposite an offence is the
prescribed modified penalty payable in respect of that offence if dealt with pursuant to
this sub-clause.

(b) Where an authorised person has reason to believe that a person has committed an
offence of the kind described in the First Schedule a notice may be served on that person in
the form contained in the Second Schedule (in this clause referred to as “an Infringement
Notice”) informing the person that if the person does not wish to have a complaint of the
alleged offence heard and determined by a Court the person may pay to Council, within
the time therein specified, the amount prescribed as the modified penalty.

(¢) An Infringement Notice may be served on an alleged offender personally or by post-
ing it to that person’s address as ascertained from that person at the time of or immedi-
ately following the occurrence giving rise to the allegation of the offence.

(d) Where a person who received an Infringement Notice fails to pay the prescribed
penalty within the time specified in the Notice, or within any further time as in any par-
ticular case is allowed by the Council, the person is deemed to have declined to have the
allegation dealt with by way of a modified penalty.

(e) An alleged offender on whom an Infringement Notice has been served may, within
the time specified in the Notice or further time as in any particular case is allowed by the
Council, send or deliver to the Council the amount of the prescribed penalty, with or with-
out a reply as to the circumstances giving rise to the allegation, and the Council may
thereupon—

(i) appropriate that amount in satisfaction of the penalty and issue an acknowledg-
ment;

or
(i1) withdraw the Infringement Notice and refund the amount so paid.

() An Infringement Notice may, whether or not the prescribed penalty has been paid, be
withdrawn by the Council by sending of a Notice in the form contained in the Third Sched-
ule to the alleged offender at the address specified in the Notice or to the person’s last
known place of residence or business and in that event any amount received by way of
modified penalty shall be refunded and any acknowledgment of the receipt of that amount
shall for the purpose of any proceedings in respect of the alleged offence be deemed not to
have been issued.

(g) Where a person does not contest an allegation that the person committed an offence
of the kind to which this clause applies, the production of an acknowledgment from the
Council that the modified penalty has been paid to the Council is a defence to a charge of
the offence in respect of which the modified penalty was paid.

First Schedule
LOCAL LAW—CAT CONTROL
Shire of Carnarvon

Item Clause Nature of Offence Modified Penalty
1. 4 Keeping a cat so to be a nuisance or injurious to
health ..o $50
2. 5(b) Keeping more than the approved limit on the
NUMDET OF CALS .ovvvreiriirirerrertireesreroreeseesroreoraesniseonens $50
3. 6 Keeping an unidentified cat over the age of three

TNOTIERS 1eveereieeeee it sttt e renereseresestenesesseneseneserenesns $50




17 June 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2769

Second Schedule
LOCAL LAW—CAT CONTROL
Shire of Carnarvon

INFRINGEMENT NOTICE

NO. o

Date oo
1 Lo TP TP PP R PP PP PROPRPRRPPI
Itis alleged that at .......ccccceeeeieieicieiciniereniece e nieeens ONthe (v e
day of coovicieieeeree e 19........ you committed an offence that you .......ccccevceveernnennenn.

(Authorised Person)
You may dispose of this matter:

(a) By payment of a penalty of $.......coovvvvenrnns within twenty-eight days of this Notice
to the Council at Francis Street, Carnarvon, or;

(b) By having it dealt with by a Court.

If this modified penalty is not paid within the time specified, Court proceedings may be
taken against you.

Third Schedule
LOCAL LAW—CAT CONTROL
Shire of Carnarvon
WITHDRAWAL OF INFRINGEMENT NOTICE

Date ....oovvvivviiiiiennenn
TT0 ettt ettt et r bt e aEe ek Ee R oo se et e e s ae e Sheea e ea bt e e e e aE e R e e Re ek ReeReesReere et aeseueesat e st aaneeaneereens
Infringement Notice NO. ..iviiiiccieereeienniieneeeiccinneeeesiineneeecens dated ........... Joviiiinennnn foviirnenns for
Penalty $ .vooveveeeeeeiei e, is hereby withdrawn.
No further action will be taken / It is proposed to institute Court proceedings for the al-
leged offence.

(to be signed by an Authorised Person)

Dated this 28th day of May 1997.
The Common Seal of the Shire of Carnarvon was hereunto affixed in the presence of—

D. MILLS, President.
B. G. WALKER, Chief Executive Officer.

LG401
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1960

Shire of Harvey
Authorisation—Rangers
It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Euan Allott has been appointed as a Ranger with
the Municipality of the Shire of Harvey, effective from Monday, 7th April 1997.
Ranger Allott is duly authorised under the following Acts and By-laws to act on behalf of the Munici-
pality of the Shire of Harvey—

Local Government Act 1995

Dog Act 1976

Litter Act 1979

Bush Fires Act 1954

Control of Vehicles Act (Off-road Areas) 1978

Harvey Shire Council (By-laws)

Fire Control Officer Pursuant to section 38(1) Bush Fires Act 1954

The appointment of Ranger Shaun Nancarrow is hereby cancelled.
KEITH LEECE, Chief Executive Officer.



2770 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [17 June 1997

MaiNn RoAbps

MA401
MRWA 42-12-A

MAIN ROADS ACT 1930
LAND ACQUISITION AND PUBLIC WORKS ACT 1902
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TAKE OR RESUME LAND

The Minister for Works hereby gives notice, in accordance with the provisions of section 17 (2) of the
Land Acquisition and Public Works Act 1902, that it is intended to take or resume under section 17 (1)
of that Act the pieces or parcels of land described in the Schedule hereto and being all in the Kalgoorlie-
Boulder District, for the purpose of the following public works namely, widening of the Great Eastern
Highway (SLK Section 587.80-589.20) and that the said pieces or parcels of land are marked off on
Land Titles Office Plan 21035 which may be inspected at the office of the Commissioner of Main
Roads, Waterloo Crescent, East Perth.

Schedule
No. Owner or Reputed Occupier or Reputed Description Area
Owner Occupier
1. City of Kalgoorlie- Commissioner of Main Portion of Somerville Lot 95 1 056 m?
Boulder Roads vide Caveat now contained in Plan 21035
G198444 and being part of the land
comprised in Certificate of
Title Volume 1876 Folio 893
2.  City of Kalgoorlie- Commissioner of Main Portion of Somerville Lot 96 956 m?
Boulder Roads vide Caveat now contained in Plan 21035
G198444 and being part of the land
comprised in Certificate of
Title Volume 1876 Folio 894
3. City of Kalgoorlie- Commissioner of Main Portion of Somerville Lot 97 956 m?
Boulder Roads vide Caveat now contained in Plan 21035
G198444 and being part of the land

comprised in Certificate of
Title Volume 1876 Folio 895

Dated this 10th day of June 1997.
D. R. WARNER, Director Corporate Services.

PLANNING

PD101*
CORRECTION

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF NORTHAMPTON
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 4—AMENDMENT NO 30
Ref: 853/3/14/6 Pt 30

It is hereby notified for public information that the notice under the above Amendment No published
at page 2580 of the Government Gazette No 81 dated June 3, 1997, contained an error which is now
corrected as follows:

For the words: Scheme No 3
Read: Scheme No 4

G. L. KEEFFE, Chief Executive Officer.



17 June 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2771

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF CANNING
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 40—AMENDMENT NO 61
Ref: 853/2/16/44 Pt 61

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of Canning
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on June 7, 1997 for the purpose of rezoning 1240-1250 Albany
Highway (Lots Pt 6, Pt 5, Pt 4, Pt 3, Pt 2 and Pt 1) and 30 Hamilton Street (Lot 9), Cannington, from
“Residential R17.5/R40" to “Highway Commercial”.

M. S. LEKIAS, Mayor.
I. F. KINNER, Chief Executive Officer.

PD402*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF CANNING
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 40—AMENDMENT NO 63
Ref: 853/2/16/44 Pt 63

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of Canning
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on June 7, 1997 for the purpose of rezoning 391 Welshpool Road
(Lot 4) (corner Station Street), Welshpool, from “Service Station” to “Mixed Business”.

G. DELLE DONNE, D/Mayor.
I. F. KINNER, Chief Executive Officer.

PD403*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
CITY OF ROCKINGHAM
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 1—AMENDMENT NO 294
Ref: 853/2/28/1 Pt 294

Notice is hereby given that the local government of the City of Rockingham has prepared the
abovementioned scheme amendment for the purpose of:

(1) rezoning various land parcels along future Nairn Road, Baldivis from ‘Rural’ to ‘Development
Zone’;

(2) excluding land contained in Reserve No. 1323 (Baldivis Primary School) from the ‘Public Open
Space’ reservation and including it in the ‘Public Purposes’ reservation; and

(3) excluding land contained in portion of Reserve No. 1376 from the ‘Public Purpose’ reservation
and including it in the ‘Public Open Space’ reservation.

Plans and documents setting out and explaining the scheme amendment have been deposited at Coun-
cil Offices, Civic Boulevard, Rockingham and at the Western Australian Planning Commission, Albert
Facey House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for inspection during office hours up
to and including July 29, 1997.

Submissions on the scheme amendment may be made in writing on Form No 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before July 29, 1997.

This Amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

G. G. HOLLAND, Chief Executive Officer.



2772 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [17 June 1997

PD404*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF AUGUSTA-MARGARET RIVER
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 17—AMENDMENT NO 8
Ref: 853/6/3/17 Pt 8

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Augusta-
Margaret River Town Planning Scheme Amendment on June 7, 1997 for the purpose of rezoning Lots
22 and 23 Le Souef Street, Margaret River from “Residential R15” to “Residential R40”.

R. KNAPP, President.
M. EASTCOTT, Chief Executive Officer.

PD405*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
SHIRE OF EXMOUTH
INTERIM DEVELOPMENT ORDER NO 4
Ref: 26/10/7/1

Notice is hereby given that in accordance with the provisions of sub-section (2) of section 7B of the
Town Planning and Development Act, 1928 (as amended), and by direction of the Hon Minister for
Planning a summary as set out hereunder of the Shire of Exmouth Interim Development Order No 4
made pursuant to the provisions of Section 7B of that Act is published for general information.

The Minister for Planning has made copies of this Order available for inspection by any person free of
charge at the offices of the Western Australian Planning Commission, Albert Facey House, 469-489
Wellington Street, Perth, and at the office of the Shire of Exmouth during normal office hours.
SUMMARY
1. The Shire of Exmouth Interim Development Order No 4 contains provisions inter alia:
(a) That the Order applies to the Municipal district of the Shire of Exmouth.

(b) That, unless otherwise stated, the Exmouth Shire Council is the authority responsible for its
administration.

(¢) That the Exmouth Structure Plan is a planning document, the function of which is to provide
a basis for land use and development over the area covered by the Plan.

(d) That the carrying out of certain development on land within the scope of the Order without
approval as stated therein is prohibited.

(e) Relating to the application for, and grant of approval for, development other than development
permitted by the Order.

(f) Relating to development permitted by a public authority.
(g) Relating to certain development permitted by this Order.
(h) Relating to the continuance of the lawful use of land and buildings.

(i) Relating to appeals against refusal of approval for development or against conditions subject
to which approval to carry out development is granted.

2. The Order has effect from and after the publication of this Summary in the Government Gazette.

16 May, 1997.
K. J. GRAHAM, Chief Executive Officer.

PD406*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF DENMARK
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 3—AMENDMENT NO 26
Ref: 853/5/7/3 Pt 26

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Den-
mark Town Planning Scheme Amendment on June 7, 1997 for the purpose of excluding Reserves 30315
and 18045 and Lot 687 Henwood Street, Denmark from the “Residential R2” zone and including Re-
serve 30315 Henwood Street, Reserve 18045 Henwood Street, Lot 687 Henwood Street, and Henwood
Street, Denmark within the “Parks and Recreation” Reserve.

J. K. NEKEL, President.
P. DURTANOVICH, Chief Executive Officer.



17 June 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2773

PusLic SEcTOR MANAGEMENT

PS401
PUBLIC SECTOR MANAGEMENT ACT 1994

CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER APPOINTMENTS

The Government of Western Australia is keen to ensure that chief executive officers of all public
service departments and agencies, are the most suitable for the position. I have therefore decided that
itis generally preferable to advertise chief executive officer positions at the expiry of existing appoint-
ments, to ensure that competitive and merit-based appointments are made. This approach should not,
however, be seen as a reflection upon the capacity of current chief executive officers whose terms of
appointment have expired. I expect that present occupants will, in most cases, wish to apply for
appointment to advertised positions.

Having received and considered relevant advice in respect of the chief executive officer listed below, I,
Richard Fairfax Court, Minister for Public Sector Management, notify that I have not recommended
the reappointment of—
Agency Title Name of Current Occupant
Fremantle Port Authority Chief Executive Officer Kerry Sanderson
I shall soon be requesting the Commissioner for Public Sector Standards to act to enable the filling
of this vacancy.
RICHARD COURT, Premier and
Minister for Public Sector Management.

TRANSPORT

TR401
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982

RESTRICTED SPEED AREAS—ALL VESSELS
VESSEL DEMONSTRATION AND JET SKI AREA
Mandurah Water Sports and Boat Show

Department of Transport,
Fremantle WA, 17 June 1997.

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by section 67 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, the
Department of Transport, by this notice revokes paragraph (d) (19) of the notice published in the
Government Gazette of 25 October 1991 relating to speed limits in the Mandurah Estuary, provided
that this revocation will only apply to authorised bona fide vessels approved by the Mandurah Off-
shore Fishing Club Boat Show Committee between the hours of 1000 and 1600 on Saturday 11 October
and Sunday 12 October 1997 within the following area—

Mandurah Estuary

Adjacent to the rock wall from 50 metres downstream of the Government Fisherman’s service jetty
to the upstream entrance to Dolphin Pool and extending from the wall out to 100 metres.

CHRISTOPHER ROBERT WHITAKER, Acting Director General of Transport.

WATER

WA401*

WATER AGENCIES RESTRUCTURE (TRANSITIONAL AND
CONSEQUENTIAL PROVISIONS) ACT 1995

EXTENSION OF WATER CORPORATION (TEMPORARY STATUS AS AN
SES ORGANISATION) AMENDMENT ORDER NO. 3 1997

Made by the Minister for Public Sector Management under subsection 206(6).

Citation

1. This Order may be cited as the Water Corporation (Temporary Status as an SES Organisation)
Amendment Order No. 3 1997.

Amendment of Clause 2

2. Clause 2 of the Water Corporation (Temporary Status as an SES Organisation) Order 1995 is
re-amended by deleting “30 June 1997” and substituting “31 December 1997”.

RICHARD COURT, Minister for Public Sector Management.



2774 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [17 June 1997

PusLic NoTicEs

77201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962
NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 and amend-
ments thereto relate) in respect of the estate of the late Rita Amy McDonell, late of Braemar Nursing
Home, Canning Highway, East Fremantle, formerly of 39 Riseley Street, Ardross, Widow who died on
the 2nd September 1996 are required by the Executor Ian Peter McDonell of care of Messrs Corser &
Corser, 1st Floor, 256 Adelaide Terrace, Perth to send particulars of their claims to them within one
month from the date of publication of this notice at the expiration of which time the personal repre-
sentatives may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which they have
then had notice.

Dated this 12th day of June 1997.
CORSER & CORSER.

Reprinted Statutes

Individual Acts and Regulations are from time to time reprinted under the
Reprints Act 1984 incorporating all amendments up to a particular date.
This program is managed by Parliamentary Counsel's Office, Ministry of

Justice.
A standing order for either Acts or Regulations may be placed
with State Law Publisher for all Reprints that become available.

Invoices are despatched with the goods to enable clients to check the
contents prior to returning with payment.

If a customer wishes to be placed Manager, Sales & Editorial
on either or both mailing lists, State Law Publisher
send written notification to: 10 William Street,

Perth 6000

These Statutes were reprinted in 1997.

Strata Titles Act 1985

Parliamentary Commissioner Act 1971
Firearms Act 1973

Bush Fires Act 1954

Financial Administration and Audit Act 1985
Constitution Acts Amendment Act 1899
Police Act 1892

Dairy Industry Act 1973

Spear-Guns Control Act 1955

Conservation and Land Management Act 1984
Criminal Injuries Compensation Act 1985
Betting Control Act 1954

Electricity Act 1945

Bail Act 1982

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994
Health Act 1911

Road Traffic Act 1974

Travel Agents Act 1985

Builders Registration Act 1939

Criminal Code Act Compilation Act 1913
Electoral Act 1907

Guardianship and Administration Act 1990
Gaming Commission Act 1987

N\ J




17 June 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2775

NOW
AVAILABLE !'!

Order your Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

1997

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

For Government Departments and private firms who
presently arrange binding for their copies of
Government Gazettes, the State Law Publsiher is
now offering a subscription covering 4 Quarterly
Volumes at a cost of $837.00.

The Gazettes will be bound in black cloth with gold foil
lettering on the spine and personalised by the addition

of the client's name in gold lettering on the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE

On the rare occasion where extra gazettes are published
in one quarter, a fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost involved will be borne by the
State Law Publisher and not passed on to clients.

For further information please contact:

State Law Publisher
Telephone: 9321 7688



2776 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [17 June 1997

STILL AVAILABLE

LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

OFFICIAL
CORRUPTION
RECOMMENDATIONS
REPORT
1992

“Improve anti-corruption mechanisms in this state”
“Give Western Australians greater confidence”

“Minimise official corruption in our community”

In March 1992 the Select Committee on the Official Corruption
Commission Act reported.

This report contains the recommended amendments that the
Committee believes should be made to the Official Corruption
Commission Act.

Cost: $5.00
To purchase your copy please contact:
State Law Publisher
Telephone: 9321 7688
Facsimile: 9321 7536




17 June 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2777

%gy SafetyLine

Workplace Safety on the Internet

|nformation on solutions to work safety and

health challenges has been delivered to

your workplace.

Go to the World Wide Web on the Internet
on your computer and contact

http://www.wt.com.au/safetyline

Help yourself to the information
WorkSafe Western Australia has put there

to help you.

For further information call (08) 9327 8777.

Go on-line to SafetyLine

CUSTOMER

@FOCUS

WESTERN AUSTRALIA




2778 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [17 June 1997

CONTENTS
REGULATIONS, BY-LAWS, RULES, DETERMINATIONS, ORDERS
Page
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—Hospitals (Services Charges) Regulations 1984—
Hospitals (Services Charges for Magnetic Resonance Imaging) Determination
Amendment NOLICE 1997 ...t cecitiir e rerert e s rerererse s er et e s s rareetesesannereesesessmneneesasenten 2765
Local Government Act 1995—Shire of Carnarvon—Local Law—Cat Control ........cc.ccccrenenne 2767-9
GENERAL CONTENTS
Page
T -V v oV PP PPP PP 2765
Land AdmINIStration ... e cereiiiiiereresiiareeseserereressesereresessessrreressesasertesssessenersesesansereesosentas 2766-7
Main ROAAS covvereiiiieieieieieirereiiereeeiiereeeseseiienessnsssssissessssssssniesssissssssssessssssssssasssssssssssssssesasessonasess 2770
0 o T80T O PP PPPPPO 2770-2
Public Sector Management .......cccoveeveiceenerniien et 2773
=R a1C) 1o v PP TP 2773
R RS PP PPN 2773
Public NOLICES 1oivvveierereiinrereniereenrerenianeeiseressnssssiasssioessssanesssmasssisessssanssssrsssssssessessassisssasssansonas 2773

19 9 7 0 0 0 8 9 6 G



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

