PRINT POST APPROVED PP865002/00041

=4 WESTERN
' AUSTRALIAN
g GOVERNMENT t t

PERTH, TUESDAY, 19 AUGUST 1997 No. 140

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

PuBLISHING DETAILS

The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law
Publisher for the State of Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of
each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised

beforehand on the inside cover).

Special Government Gazettes and Extraordinary Government Gazeties
are published periodically, all gazettes are included in the subscription

price.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the
Government Gazette.

B Material submitted to the Executive Council and which requires
gazettal will require a copy of the signed Executive Council Minute

Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

B Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State
Law Publisher no later than 12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition)
or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).

B Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded several days
before advertised closing date for copy. This is to ensure inclusion in
current edition. Failure to observe this request could result in
the notice being held over until the following edition.

B Proofs will be supplied only when requested.

B No additions or amendments to material for publication will be
accepted by telephone.

Send copy to:
The Manager (Sales and Editorial),
State Law Publisher
Ground Floor, 10 William Street, Perth, 6000
Telephone: 9321 7688 Fax: 9321 7536

ADVERTISERS SHOULD NOTE:

B All Notices should be written in ‘plain English’.
B Signatures (in particular) and proper names must be legible.
H All copy should be typed and double spaced.

B If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to communicate by
facsimile, confirmation is not required by post. If original copy is
forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

B Documents not clearly prepared and in the required format for gazettal,
will be returned to the sender unpublished.

B Late copy received at State Law Publisher will be placed in the following
issue irrespective of any date/s mentioned in the copy.




IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no
part may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government
Printer, State Law Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial,
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS

INCREASE EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 1997.

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$17.20

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per
notice)—$40.10

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$40.10 (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for
pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
Per Column Centimetre—$7.90
Bulk Notices—$148.00 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

COUNTER SALES 1997-98
(As from 1 July 1997) $

Government Gazette—(General) ..........ooccceevviiniinnnnes 2.50
Government Gazette—(Special)

UP t0 2 PAGES ..oovveeiieiieeieeierreie et see e saens 2.50

OVeEr 2 PAGES .....ocoeoviiiciiieiieiieieiesee e 4.90
HanSard ... e 14.10
Industrial Gazette ........cocovvvviviviiiviiiiiiree e eerccrereea e, 12.50
Bound Volumes of Statutes ..............ccccevvvvieniininineenne 218.00

r-------------------------------1

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Periodically notices are published indicating a variation in
normal publishing arrangements:

e Easter or Christmas editions etc—these notices appear
approximately 4 weeks prior to any change.

I
I
I
I
I
I
I
I
| e Extraordinary gazettes not circulated to all subscribers—
| these notices appear in the following general edition of
1 the gazette.

I

I

I

I

I

I

[ 5

In all cases notices are published on page 2 and readers are
urged to check accordingly prior to contacting State Law
Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK,
Government Printer.



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4711

AGRICULTURE

AG301
SEEDS ACT 1981

SEEDS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1997

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Seeds Amendment Regulations
1997.

Principal regulations

2. In these regulations the Seeds Regulations 1982* are referred to as the
principal regulations.

[* Published in Gazette 12 March 1982, pp. 828-43.
For amendments to 28 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 243-4.]
Regulation 15 amended
3. Regulation 15 of the principal regulations is amended —

(a) in subregulation (2) by deleting “$201” and substituting the
following —

[11 $207 ”;

(b) in subregulation (4) by deleting “$50” and substituting the
following —

“ $52 ”;

(c) in subregulation (6) by deleting “$50” and substituting the
following —

“ $52 7 and

(d) in subregulation (7) by deleting “$50” and substituting the
following —

“ $52 7.

Seventh Schedule amended

4. r{he Seventh Schedule to the principal regulations is amended in
item 1 —

(a) by deleting “39.00” and substituting the following —
“ 41.00 7

(b) by deleting “56.00” and substituting the following —
“ B7.00 7;

(¢) by deleting “31.00” and substituting the following —
“ 32.00 7

(d) by deleting “24.00” and substituting the following —
“ 2500 7



4712 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA {19 August 1997

(e) by deleting “26.00” and substituting the following —

“ 27.00 7; and
(f) by deleting “23.00” and substituting the following —
“ 2400 "

By Command of the Governor,
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Couneil.

AG302
PLANT DISEASES ACT 1914

PLANT DISEASES AMENDMENT REGULATIONS (No. 4) 1997

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Plant Diseases Amendment
Regulations (No. 4) 1997.

Schedule 2 amended

2. Schedule 2 to the Plant Diseases Regulations 1989* is amended in each
rovision listed in column 1 of the Table to this regulation by deleting the
gure set out opfposite that provision in the column 2 of the Table and

substituting the figure set out opposite that provision in column 3 of the

Table.
Table
“liem | Delete. | subsiitute
1 31 32
2 (a) 17 18
2 (b) 25 26
2 (b) 17 18
2 31 32
3 (a) 138 142
3 (a) 17 18
3 (b) 204 210
3 (b) 17 18

[* Published in Gazette 30 June 1989, pp.1980-93.
For amendments to 29 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 210-12, and Gazette 21 February
and 4 March 1997.]

By Command of the Governor,
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4713

AG303
FERTILIZERS ACT 1977

FERTILIZERS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1997

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. 'These regulations may be cited as the Fertilizers Amendment Regulations
1997.

First Schedule amended

2. The First Schedule to the Fertilizers Regulations 1978% is amended by
gellletix_lg “$103.00”, “$103.00”, and “$23.00” and substituting respectively the
ollowing —

« 106.00 >
“ 106.00 ”; and
24.00 7,

[* Published in Gazette 15 September 1978, pp.3436-42.
For amendments to 28 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, pp.80-81.]

“«

By Command of the Governor,
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.

AG304
EXOTIC DISEASES OF ANIMALS ACT 1993

EXOTIC DISEASES (GENERAL) AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1997

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Exotic Diseases (General)
Amendment Regulations 1997.

Regulation 13E amended

2. Regulation 13E (4) of the Exotic Diseases (General) Regulations® is
amended by deleting “$88.” and substituting the following —

“ $90 »

[* Published in Gazette 24 June 1970, pp. 1824-9.
For amendments to 28 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legisiation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 78.]
By Command of the Governor,

J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.



4714 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

AG305
BULK HANDLING ACT 1967

BULK HANDLING ACT AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1997

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Bulk Handling Act Amendment
Regulations 1997.

Regulation 28 amended

2. Regulation 28 of the Bulk Handling Act Regulations 1967* is amended in
paragraph (c) by deleting “$94” and substituting the following —

(13 $96 ”‘
[* Published in Gazette 4 January 1968, pp. 2-24.

For amendments to 28 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 26-7.]

By Command of the Governor,
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.

AG306
BEEKEEPERS ACT 1963

BEEKEEPERS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1997
Made by the Governor in Executive Council.
Citation
1. These regulations may be cited as the Beekeepers Amendment

Regulations 1997.

Third Schedule amended
2. 'The Third Schedule to the Beekeepers Regulations 1963% is amended in

item 1 —
(a) by deleting “$32.00” and substituting the following —
“ $33.00 7 and
(b) by deleting “$64.00” and substituting the following —
“ $66.00 ”.

[* Published in Gazette 16 December 1963, pp. 3897-906.
For amendments to 28 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 22.]
By Command of the Governor,
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4715

AG307
ARTIFICIAL BREEDING OF STOCK ACT 1965

ARTIFICIAL BREEDING OF ST%(;I; AMENDMENT REGULATIONS

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

PART 1 — PRELIMINARY
Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Artificial Breeding of Stock
Amendment Regulations 1997.

PART 2 — ARTIFICIAL BREEDING (CATTLE) REGULATIONS 1978

Regulation 5 amended

2. Regulation 5 (2) of the Artificial Breeding (Cattle) Regulations 1978% is
repealed and the following subregulation is substituted —

<«

(2) The following fees are payable in respect of the matters listed
below —

(a) for the issue or renewal of a licence for the
collection and processing of semen for
general saleoruse .................. $240.00

(b) for the issue or renewal of a licence for
storage and saleof semen ............. $136.00

(c) for the issue or renewal of a licence for the
transplanting of ova and processes of
production, handling, fertilization,
implantation and storage of ova for general

saleoruse .. ... e $240.00
(d) for the transfer or variation of a licence . . . $45.00
(¢) for an application for a certificate of
competency —
1) in respect of the class of herdsman-
inseminator . .............o.o.... $28.00
(ii) in respect of any other class . ...... $135.00

[* Published in the Gazette of 26 January 1979 at pp. 240-58.
For amendments to 29 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 18.]

PART 3 — ARTIFICIAL BREEDING (GOATS) REGULATIONS 1986

Schedule 2 repealed and a Schedule substituted

3. Schedule 2 to the Artificial Breeding (Goats) Regulations 1986* is
repealed and the following Schedule is substituted —

SCHEDULE 2 — FEES
[Regulation 4]
Fee
Grant or renewal of a licence .. .................. $240.00

Transfer of licence .. ... ...t ininean. $45.00



4716 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

Certificate of competency —

(a) in respect of the class of herdsman-
inseminator . .......... .. $28.00

(b) in respect of any otherclass ........... $135.00

”
.

[* Published in the Gazette of 14 March 1986 at Ig) 755-56.
For amendments to 29 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 18.]

PART 4 — ARTIFICIAL BREEDING (HORSES) REGULATIONS 1982

Schedule 1 repealed and a Schedule substituted

4, Schedule 1 to the Arti{:icial Breeding (Horses) Regulations 1982* is
repealed and the following Schedule is substituted —

£«

SCHEDULE 1 — FEES
[Sections 6 (5) and 10 (3)]

Fee
Grant or renewal of a licence ................... $240.00
Transfer of licence , .. ......................... $45.00
Certificate of competency ...................... $135.00

[* Published in the Gazette of 10 September 1982 at pp. 3669-73.
For amendments to 29 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 19.]

PART 5 — ARTIFICIAL BREEDING (PIG) REGULATIONS 1984

Regulation 4 amended

5. Regulation 4 of the Artificial Breeding (Pig) Regulations 1984* is
amended by deleting paragraphs (a), (b) and (¢) and substituting the following

paragraphs —
(a) grant or renewal ofalicence ............... $240.00
(b) transferoflicence ........................ $45.00

(¢) certificate of competency —

(i) in respect of the class of herdsman-
inseminator . ....................... $28.00

(i) in respect of any otherclass ........... $135.00

»”

[* Published in the Gazette of 9 November 1984 at pp. 3616-18.
For amendments to 29 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 19.]



19 August 1997]

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

4717

PART 6 — ARTIFICIAL BREEDING (SHEEP) REGULATIONS 1983

Regulation 5 amended

6. Regulation 5 of the Artificial Breeding (Sheep) Regulations 1983%* is
amended by deleting paragraphs (a), (b) and (c¢) and substituting the following

paragraphs —
(a) grantorrenewalofalicence ............... $240.00
(b) transferoflicence ........................ $45.00
(¢c) certificate of competency —

1) in respect of the class of herdsman-
inseminator .. ...... .. $28.00

(ii) in respect of any other class ........... $135.00

[* Published in the Gazette of 29 April 1983 at fp. 1347-48.

For amendments to 29 June 1997 see 1996

ndex to Legislation of

Western Australia, Table 4, p. 19.]
By Command of the Governor,

AG308

J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.

STOCK (IDENTIFICATION AND MOVEMENT) ACT 1970
STOCK (IDENTIFICATION AND MOVEMENT) AMENDMENT

REGULATIONS 1997

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Stock (Identification and
Movement) Amendment Regulations 1997.

Schedule 2 amended

2. Schedule 2 to the Stock (Identification and Moverment) Regulations 1972%
is amended —

(a)

()

(c)

(d)

by deleting “23.00” in the 2 places where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“ 2400 7;

by deleting “117.00” in the 2 places where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“ 120.00 ™

by deleting “86.00” in the 3 places where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“ 37.00 7; and
by deleting “12.00” and substituting the following —
“ 13.00 ”.

[* Reprinted as at 7 June 1995.
For amendments to 28 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 258.]

By Command of the Governor,

J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.



4718 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

AG309
STOCK DISEASES (REGULATIONS) ACT 1968

ENZOOTIC DISEASES AMENDMENT REGULATIONS (No. 2) 1997

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Enzootic Diseases Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 1997.

Fourth Schedule amended
2. The Fourth Schedule to the Enzootic Diseases Regulations 1970% is

amended —
(a) in item 1, subitem A by deleting “31” and substituting the
following —
& 32 77;

(b) 1initem 1, subitem B —

(i) by deleting “17” in the 2 places where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“« 18 7

(ii) by deleting “25” and substituting the following —
“ 26 7;and

(iii) by deleting “31” and substituting the following —-
“« 32 7

(¢) initem 1, subitem C —

(i) by deleting “138” and substituting the following —

“ 142 7

(i) by deleting “17” in the 2 places where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“ 18 7;and
(iii) by deleting “204” and substituting the following —
“« 210 ™
(d) initem 2 —

(i) by deleting “15.00” in the 2 Iilaces where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“ 16.00 7

(i) by deleting “2.00” in the 2 places where it occurs and
substituting in each place the following —

“ 250 ”; and
(iii) by deleting “29.00” and substituting the following —
“ 30.00 7; and



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4719

(e) initem 3 —
(i) by deleting “1.50” and substituting the following —
“ 1.60 7; and
(i) by deleting “8.00” and substituting the following —
“ 850 ”.
[* Reprinted as at 21 March 1989.

For amendments to 28 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legisiation of
Western Australia, Table 4, p. 257.]

By Command of the Governor,
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.

AG310
VETERINARY PREPARATIONS AII\EI) ]7)6AN IMAL FEEDING STUFFS ACT

VETERINARY PREPARATIONS AND ANIMAL FEEDING STUFFS
AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1997

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. 'These regulations may be cited as the Veterinary Preparations and
Animal Feeding Stuffs Amendment Regulations 1997.

Regulation 5 amended

2. Regulation 5 of the Veterinary Preparations and Animal Feeding Stuffs
Regulations 1977* is amended —

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$89.00” and substituting the
following —

“ $92‘00 ”;

{b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$57.00” and substituting the
following —

“ $59.00 ”; and

(¢) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$27.00” and substituting the
following —

“ $28.00 ”.
[* Published in Gazette 15 July 1977, pp. 2270-7.
For amendments to 28 June 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 279-280.]

By Command of the Governor,
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.



4720 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

HEeALTH

HE301
POISONS ACT 1964

POISONS (SPECIFIED DRUGS) VARIATION ORDER (No. 2) 1997

}X[adleggz the Governor in Executive Council under section 22A of the Poisons
ct .

Citation

1. This order may be cited as the Poisons (Specified Drugs) Variation Order
{No. 2) 1997.

Schedule varied
2. Part 2 of the Schedule to the Poisons (Specified Druﬁrs) Order (No. 2)

1989* is varied by inserting in the appropriate alphabetical order the
following anabolic steroids —

(13

ATAMESTANE.

BOLAZINE.

BOLENOL.

4-CHLOROMETHANDIENONE.

ENESTEBOL.

EPITIOSTANOL.

MEBOLAZINE.

MEPITIOSTANE.

METRIBOLONE.

NORCLOSTEBOL.

OVANDROTONE.

PROPETANDROL.

ROXIBOLONE.

METHYLTESTOSTERONE.

[* Published in Gazette 19 May 1989, pp. 1490-91.
For amendments to 27 July 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of

W;egsge]rn Australia, Table 4, p. 213, and Gazette 21 February
1997.

By Command of the Governor, C
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Exccutive Council.

HE302
RADIATION SAFETY ACT 1975

RADIATION SAFETY (GENERAL) AMENDMENT
REGULATIONS (No. 2) 1997

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1.  These regulations may be cited as the Radiation Safety (General)
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 1997.



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4721

Principal regulations

2. In these regulations the Radiation Sofety (General) Regulations 1983*
are referred to as the principal regulations.

(* Reprinted as at 4 April 1995.

For amendments to 8 July 1997 see 1996 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 225-6.]

Regulation 3 amended
3. Regulation 3 of the principal regulations is amended —

(a) Dby deleting the definitions of “radiation emission limit” and
“recognized test procedure”; and

(b) by inserting in the appropriate alphabetical position the following
definition —

[13

“microwave oven standard” means the publication
entitled “Approval and Test Specification - Particular
Requirements for Microwave Ovens”, being AS 3301 -

1992, published by the Standards Association of
Australia;

Regulation 7 amended

4, Regulation 7 (2) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting
;rﬁgulgations 39 (1), 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 49 and 50” and substituting the
ollowing —

[{4

regulations 39 and 40 7.

Regulations 39 to 51 repealed and regulations substituted

5. Regulations 39 to 51 of the principal regulations are repealed and the
following regulations are substituted —

{4

New microwave ovens to comply with microwave oven standard

39. A person shall not sell a microwave oven as a new microwave

oven unless it complies with the requirements of the microwave oven
standard.

Commercial microwave ovens to be tested

40. (1) The owner of a microwave oven which is used for purposes
other than domestic or scientific purposes shall not operate or use it, or
permit it to be operated or used, unless the oven has within the
previous 3 years passed a compliance test.

(2) In subregulation (1) —

“compliance test” means a test, conducted in accordance with
the test procedure, set out in item 32.1 of the microwave
oven standard, to ensure that the oven complies with the
radiation emission limit set out in that item.

Schedule I amended

6. Item 2 (2) of Schedule I to the principal regulations is amended by
deleting “limit.” and substituting the following —

[13

limit set out in item 32.1 of the microwave oven standard. ”.



4722 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

Schedule III repealed
7. Schedule III to the principal regulations is repealed.

Schedule VII amended
8. Schedule VII to the principal regulations is amended —
(a) by deleting “[Regulations 7, 43 and 50]” and substituting the
following —

13 »

[Regulation 7] ”; and
(b) by deleting item 1 and substituting the following item —

»

“ 1. Microwave ovens.

By Command of the Governor,
J. PRITCHARD, Clerk of the Executive Council.

LAND ADMINISTRATION

LA401

LAND SURVEYORS LICENSING BOARD
It is hereby notified for general information that the suspension from practise as a Licensed Surveyor
of Mateusz Richard Piowezyk-Kruk of 36 Ashton Avenue, Claremont expired on 31 July, 1997.

H.J. HOUGHTON, Chairman,
G. E. MARION, Secretary.

LB901*
LAND ACQUISITION AND PUBLIC WORKS ACT 1902
NATIVE TITLE ACT 1993 (COMMONWEALTH)
NOTICE OF INTENTION
To Take Land for a Public Work

The Minister for Works gives notice in accordance with section 17(2) of the Land Acquisition and
Public Works Act that it is intended compulsorily to take under section 17(1) of that Act, the land
described in the Schedule (“land”) for the respective public work.

SCHEDULE
Locality/Local Description of land affected Interest holder or Registered Plan Job
Government/Region native title claimant Number/
Reference

Wyndham/East 1. Portion King Location 710 being 1. Crown—Crosswalk Pty Ltd Diagram 350952
Kimberley (Shire) part of Pastoral Lease 3114/640 as lessee., 92729 1707/1982

(Crown Lease 222/1974)—Ivanhoe 2, Crown. Diagram

Station (400 square metres). 3. B WARD, J TOBY, J WARD, 92730

2. Wyndham Lot 1769 being vacant R GERRARD (WC94/6).
Crown land (4034 square metres).

The plan(s) listed may be inspected at the office of the Department of Land Administration, Midland
Square, Midland 6056, telephone (08) 9273 7089.

NATURE OF ACT: The compulsory taking of the land described in the schedule and shown more
particularly on the plans listed for the purpose of Electricity Substation Sites—Reservation with vesting
in Western Power Corporation.

COMMENCEMENT OF ACT: Entry under Sections 28 and 49 of the Energy Corporations (Powers) Act
1979 occurred on 1 November 1995, The taking of the land is subject to the procedural requirements
of section 17(2) of the Land Acquisition and Public Works Act and section 23(6) of the Nutive Title Act.
The taking of the land will proceed if upon the completion of the procedures provided by section 17(2)
of the Land Acquisition and Public Works Act the Minister for Works decides to proceed.



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4723

Persons having or claiming an interesl in any of the land may under section 17(2) of the Land
Acquisition and Public Works Act lodge an objection in writing to the proposed taking with the Depart-
ment of Land Administration, PO Box 2222, Midland, no later than 29 October 1997. Objections must
be in the Form of Objection, copies of which are available from the Department of Land Administration
telephone (08) 9273 7089 or (08) 9273 7293.

TIME DURING WHICH THE ACT WILL CONTINUE TO BE DONE: Construction of the electricily
substations commenced following entry on 1 November 1995 under sections 28 and 49 of the Energy
Corporations (Powers) Act 1979. The taking of the land will permit Western Power or its authorised
representatives to continue construction, operation and maintenance of the clectricity substations.
KIND OF DISTURBANCE TO LAND: Disturbance of the land may be caused by works necessary to
enable construction of electricity substations and ongoing operation and maintenance.

Enquiries relating to the proposed taking of the land may be directed to the Native Title Unit,
Department of Land Administration, PO Box 2222, Midland 6056 (telephone {(08) 9273 7089 or
(08) 9279 7217).

Dated this 13th day of August 1997.
DOUG SHAVE, Minister for Lands.

LB902*
LAND ACQUISITION AND PUBLIC WORKS ACT 1902
NATIVE TITLE ACT 1993 (COMMONWEALTH)
NOTICE OF INTENTION
To Take Land for Purpose of an Easement

The Minister for Works gives notice in accordance with section 17(2) of the Land Acquisition and
Public Works Act that it is intended compulsorily to take under section 17(1) of that Act, rights and
interests in land necessary for the easement as defined in the Schedule to be vested in the Minister for
Works for the purpose of a power transmission line.

SCHEDULE
Locality/Local Description of land affected Interest holder or Registered Plan Job
Government/Region native title claimant Number/
Reference

Wyndham/East 1. Portion King Loc’s 373, 675, 785, 1. Crown. Plans 940468
Kimberley (Shire) 801, 803, 805, 807 being vacant 2. Crown—Water Authority of 191386 to 1420/1994

Crown land (total area 117.2880 Western Australia as vestee. 19140 inc.

hectares). 3. Crown—=Shire of Wyndham/

2, Portion King Loc 563—Reserve East Kimberley as vestee.

36551 “Irrigation”, (9.9145 hectares). 4. Crown—Crosswalk Pty Ltd

3. Portion King Loc 664—Reserve as lessee,

41617 “Recreation”, (2.6189 hectares). 5. B WARD, J TOBY, J WARD,

4., Portion King Loc’s 710, 711 R GERRARD (WC94/6).

subject of Pastoral Lease 3114/640
(Crown Lease 222/1974) Ivanhoe
Pastoral Station (19.1189 hectares).

EASEMENT: “The easement rights to be taken will enable the Minister for Works or his representa-
tives, agents and contractors to enter and construct a power transmigsion line (and associated facili-
ties) within the corridor shown on Department of Land Administration Plans 19136 to 19140 (inclu-
give). Thereafter the Minister or his representatives, agents and contractors will be permitted to enter
for purposes associated with the operation and maintenance of the power transmission line. These
rights include entry for additional construction works as required”.

The plans listed may be inspected at the office of the Department of Land Administration, Midland
Square, Midland 6936, telephone (08) 9273 7089.

NATURE OF ACT: Taking of rights and interests in land necessary for the easement over the land
described in the schedule and shown more particularly on the plans listed for the purpese of a power
transmission line for the provision of electrical power to Kununurra and its surrounds.

COMMENCEMENT OF ACT: The compulsory taking of the easement is subject to the procedural
requirements of section 17(2) of the Land Acquisition and Public Works Act and section 23(6} of the
Native Title Act.

The taking of the land will proceed if upon the completion of the procedures provided by section 17(2)
of the Land Acquisition and Public Works Act the Minister for Works decides to proceed.

Persong having or claiming an interest in any of the land may under section 17(2) of the Land
Acquisition and Public Works Act lodge an objection in writing to the proposed taking with the Depart-
ment of Land Administration, PO Box 2222, Midland, no later than 29 October 1997. Objections must
be in the Form of Objection, copies of which are available from the Department of Land Administration
telephone (08) 9273 7089 or (08) 9273 7293.

TIME DURING WHICH THE ACT WILL CONTINUE TO BE DONE: Construction of the power trans-
mission line commenced pursuant to the issue of notices of entry dated 18 September 1995 under
section 112A of the Land Acquisition and Public Works Act. Following the taking, the easement will be
vested in the Minister for Works and will permit the Minister for Works or his authorised representa-
tives to continue construction, operation and maintenance of the power transmission line.



4724 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

KIND OF DISTURBANCE TO LAND: Disturbance of the land may be caused by the construction, use
and maintenance of the transmisgion line.

Enquiries relating to the proposed taking of the land may be directed to the Native Title Unit,
Department of Land Administration, PO Box 2222, Midland 6936 (telephone (08) 9273 7089 or
(08) 9279 7217).

Dated this 13th day of August 1997.
DOUG SHAVE, Minister for Lands.

LocaL GOVERNMENT

LG401
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954
Shire of Roebourne

Notice is hereby given for public information, that Mr Ron Frame has been appointed in accordance
with the provisions of the Bush Fires Act, 1954, as a Bush Fire Control Officer for the Shire of Roebourne.

The appointment of Gary Bruce Hill is hereby cancelled.
T. S. RULAND, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402
CONTROL OF VEHICLES (OFF ROAD AREAS) ACT 1978
Shire of Roebourne

Notice is hereby given for public information, that on the 11th day of August 1997 the Council of the
Shire of Roebourne did by resolution appoint Mr Ron Frame as an Authorised Officer in accordance
with the Contrel of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978 to enforce and administer the provisions of that
Act within the district.

The appointment of Gary Bruce Hill is hereby cancelled.

N. H. TURNER, President.
T. S. RULAND, Chief Executive Officer.

LG403

SHIRE OF ROEBOURNE
It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Ron Frame has been appointed to the position of
Ranger effective from the 11th day of August 1997, and is authorised on behalf of the Shire of Roebourne
to enforce and administer the provisions of the following Acts and Local Laws as an Authorised Officer
within the district of the Shire of Roebourne.

Local Government Act 1995

Local Government Miscellaneous Provigions Act 1995

Dog Act 1976 and Amendments

Litter Act 1979 and Amendments

Local Law relating to Dogs

Local Laws relating to the Removal and Disposal of Obstructing Vehicles

Local Laws relating to Hawkers and Stallholders

Local Laws relating to Refuse, Rubbish, Litter, Derelict Vehicles, Vehicle Bodies and other Mate-
rial or Things

Local Laws relating to Parking Facilities

Local Laws relating to Parks, Public Reserves, Sports Grounds or Open Spaced Areas,

and any other Local Law or Regulation administered or enforced by the Shire of Rocbourne.
It is hereby notified that the appointment of Gary Bruce Hill as an Authorised Officer for the Shire of
Roebourne is cancelled.

T. S. RULAND, Chief Executive Officer.



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4725

LG404
JUSTICES ACT 1902
LOCAL COURTS ACT 1904
COMPLAINTS
Shire of Roebourne

Notice is hereby given for public information, that the Council of the Shire of Roebourne, has author-
1sed Mr Ron Frame to take proceedings on Council’s behalf under the Justices Act and the Local Courts
Act in relation to any matters pertaining to Council.

The authorisation of Gary Bruce Hill is hereby cancelled.
T. S. RULAND, Chief Executive Officer.

LG405
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
HEALTH ACT 1911
COUNTRY TOWNS SEWERAGE ACT 1948
Shire of Koorda
Memorandum of Imposing Rates

At a meeting of the Koorda Shire Council held on 30th July 1997, it was resolved that the rates and
charges specified hereunder, be imposed on all rateable property within the Shire of Koorda in accord-
ance with the provisions of the Local Government Act 1995, the Health Act 1911 and the Country
Towns Sewerage Act 1948.

Dated this 30th day of July 1997.

V. F. ORCHARD, President.
G. J. McDONALD, Chief Executive Officer.

Schedule of Rates Levied and Charges Imposed
General Rates—

Rural Land—5.05¢ in the dollar on the unimproved value of properties.

Kulja, Dukin and Mollerin Town Sites—9.92¢ in the dollar on the unimproved value of properties.

Koorda Town Site—9.92c¢ in the dollar on the gross rental valuation.

Mining Area’s—5.05¢ in the dollar on the unimproved value, property, tenements and leases.

Minimum Rate—One hundred and thirty dollars ($130.00) per assessment throughout the Shire.
Discount—

A discount of 10% will be allowed on current general rates for which full payment is received at the
offices of the Shire of Koorda by 5.00pm, 17th September 1997. Provided that all arrears and
current rates and charges are paid in full.

Instalment Plan—Administration fee $20.00.

Late Payment Interest Rate—A charge of 10% per annum, calculated daily by simple interest from
17th September 1997.

Due dates for payments of Rates and Service Charges—
Four instalment plan—
17th September 1997
19th November 1997
21st January 1998
25th March 1998.

Refuse Removal Charge—$85.00 per annum per 240 litre bin for domestic and commercial premises.
Eligible pensioners $13.00 per annum.

TV Retransmission Levy—
$30.00 per annum for Residential lots
$15.00 per annum for Commercial lots
$15.00 per annum for eligible pensioners within the designated area.

Sewerage Rate—11.13c in the dollar on gross rental values for residential and commercial properties
with the sewerage defined area.

Non Rated Properties Connected to Sewer
Class 1—First Major Fixture—$115.80 per annum
Each Additional Major Fixture—$50.90 per annum



4726 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

Class 2—$643.75 per connection
Class 3—$643.75 per connection

Minimum Rate—Sewerage—
Vacant Land—Propertics—$100.00 per annum
Residential Properties—$135.50 per annum
Commercial Properties—$364.00 per annum

LG406
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954

FIRE CONTROL OFFICERS
Shire of Harvey

Notice is hereby given pursuant to Section 38 of the Bush Fires Act 1954, that the following is a list of
Fire Control Officers appointed for the respective Brigades, all other appointments are hereby can-
celled.

Fire Control Officers

Area Telephone
Chief Bush Fire Control Officer 08 9725 4100 Bus.
B. Kettle 08 9797 1522 Priv.
Deputy Chief Fire Control Officer 08 9733 5110 Bus.
S. Marston 08 9733 4099 Priv.
1. W.Adams Leschenault 08 9725 8291
Parkfield
C. Smith Binningup 08 9720 1047
2. B.Aplin Myalup 08 9720 1161

Lake Preston

3. A.Jovanovich Yarloop Town 08 9733 5138
G. Moore Yarloop West 08 9733 5047
Yarloop
4. B. Taylor Uduc 08 9729 1946
Korijekup
5. G.Arthur Benger 08 9726 9237
Wokalup East and West
Brunswick North
6. F. Talbot Brunswick Town and South 08 9726 1236
R. George Olive Hill 08 9726 1132
Roelands
7. 1. Byrd Harvey Hills 08 9729 3173
8. S. Marston Cookernup 08 9733 4099
A. Tiltman Australind Town 08 9725 1379
G. Rodgers Harvey Town 08 9729 1348
F. J. Mair Harvey and Dardanup 08 9726 3249

T. Hunter Dual Officer
G. Moore Dual Officer
Fire Permit Officer
J. Twaddle Willowdale Mincesite
Alcoa of Australia

Harvey and Collie
Harvey and Waroona

08 9734 1875
08 9733 5047

08 9733 1593

LG407
LOCAL GOVERNMENT (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT, 1960
Town of Albany
CLOSURE OF PRIVATE STREET
Department of Local Government
Perth, 19 August 1997.
LG: A 4-13

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor has approved under
section 297A of the Local Government (Miscellaneous Prouvisions) Act 1960, the resolution passed by
the Town of Albany that the private street which is described as being portion of Albany Lots 414 and
677 and Albany Suburban Lot A22, being the land coloured brown on Diagram 8239 and being the land
comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 1033 Folio 701 be closed, and the land contained therein be
amalgamated with the adjoining Lot 1150 Burt Street and Part Lot 2 Thomas Street, Albany as shown
in the Schedule hereunder.

JOIIN LYNCII, Executive Director, Department of Local Government.



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4727

Schedule
Diagram No. 93829

/T voL 1854
FOL 530
C.S. DlA 87239

ALBANY LOT 1150 w \ s

ALBANY LOT 1130
UT VoL 185k
FOL 530
€S Dia 87239

Pt 2
C/T VoL 2092
FOL 961

Dia 8239

L.G408
LOCAL GOVERNMENT (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT, 1960
Town of Victoria Park
CLOSURE OF PRIVATE STREET
Department of Local Government
Perth, 19 August 1997,
LG: Vi4-12d

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor has approved under
section 297A of the Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960, the resolution passed by
the Town of Victoria Park that the private street which is described as being portion of Swan Location
35, being portion of the land coloured brown on Plan 1740 and being part of the land comprised in
Certificate of Title Volume 331 Folio 33 be closed, and the land contained therein be amalgamated
with the adjoining Lots 249-268 Mars Street and Lot 10 and Lots 229-247 Star Street, Carlisle as
shown in the Schedules hereunder.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director, Department of Local Government.



4728

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

“
29
239
A
)
4 R
w8 % ¥
D
N NG
W ;\\ ”
“u » N
(448 117754 e
259 ™
L1, 565/%4
260

Schedules
Plan No. 22131

247
38 7%

%2
o wnan

247
Q. w0

Plan No. 22132

238
SPaT
‘}\
237
"* [SERT %
Y
X2
AN 2%
. (TR
AR .
G,
U AP
LN \(
2D 0
N o«\; . 25
o oman e RITAT er s
261 i
&G
B Kya 2
PN 23
CI. s 2T e
267 ¥

4 23
P fees N W% O nowsm
3 LlEAYN
2, Nk
N 2
e 1:? ¥ nn
264




19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4729

LG409
LOCAL GOVENRMENT ACT 1995
HEALTH ACT 1911
Shire of Dundas
Memorandum of Imposing Rates
To whom it may concern,

At a Special Meeting of the Dundas Shire Council held on the 21st July 1997, it was resolved that the
rates and charges specified hereunder should be imposed on all rateable property within the district of
the Shire of Dundas in accordance with the Local Government Act and the Health Act 1911.

Dated this 28th day of July 1997.

F. W. BROWN, President.
E. A. GILBERT, Chief Executive Officer.

Schedule of Rates and Charges
General Rates—

12.3 cents in the dollar on Groess Rental Value;

4.9 cents in the dollar on Unimproved Values.
Minimum Rates—$200.00 per assessment.
Rubbish Rates—

$95.00 per annum per 240 litre MGB per weekly service.

$60.00 per annum per 240 litre MGB per weekly service for eligible pensioners.
Penalty—

A penalty of 13% will be applied to all rates, other than eligible pensioners deferred, still outstand-
ing and where payment has not been received at the office of the Council by close of business as at
the 31st January 1998.

Instalments—

The instalments for rates payments under Section 6.45 of the Act will be either, 1 payment, 2 equal
or nearly equal instalments, or, 4 equal or nearly equal instalments.
Due dates of each instalment are—

If paying in 1 payment—35 days after the date noted on the rate notice as the date the rate notice
was issued.

If paying in 2 instalments—first payment—due 35 days after the date noted on the rate notice as
the date the rate notice was issued, second payment—due 4th November 1997.

If paying in 4 instalments—first payment due 35 days after the date noted on the rate notice as
the date notice was issued, second payment—due 4th November 1997, third payment—due 5th
January 1998, fourth payment due 5th March 1998.

Rate of Interest—where an option other than that of 1 payment is made, interest at 6.5% calculated in
accordance with Financial Management Regulations will be imposed.

Additional Charges—for options other than that of 1 payment, and additional charge of $2.00 per
assessment will be made.

LG410
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
HEALTH ACT 1911
Shire of Pingelly
Memorandum of Imposing Rates and Charges 1997/98

At a meeting of the Pingelly Shire Council held on 4th August, 1997 it was resolved that the rates and
charges specified hereunder should be imposed on all rateable property within the district of the mu-
nicipality in accordance with provisions of the Local Government Act 1995 and Ilealth Act 1911.

E. J. HODGES, President.
M. J. HOOK, Chief Executive Officer.

Schedule of Rates and Charges Levied
General Rates—

14.7534 cents in the dollar on Gross Rental Valuations.
2.2450 cents in the dollar on Unimproved Valuations.



4730 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

Minimum Rates—$200.00 in any location, lot or other piece of land.
Rubbish Rates—

$95.00 per annum for existing services, or

$10.00 per month or part thereof for new services.

Discount—A discount to ten per cent (10%) will be allowed on all rates paid in full within 35 days of the
date of issue of the rates notice.

Instalments—
Instalment Plan Interest Rate—A charge of 6.5% per annum, calculated daily by simple interest.
Late Payment Interest Rate—A charge of 10% per annum, calculated daily by simple interest.
Administration Fee—A charge of $5.00 per reminder notice for rates and services levy.

Due Dates for Payment of Rates and Services Levies 1996/27—30th September 1997, 31st Decem-
ber 1997, 31st March 1998, 30th June 1998.

Fees and Charges—A copy of fees and charges is available for inspection at the Shire Office.

MaiNn Roabps

MA401
MRWA 42-85-G
MAIN ROADS ACT 1930
LAND ACQUISITION AND PUBLIC WORKS ACT 1902
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO TAKE OR RESUME LAND

The Minister for Works hereby gives notice, in accordance with the provisions of section 17 (2) of the
Land Acquisition and Public Works Act 1902, that it is intended to take or resume under section 17 (1)
ofthat Act the pieces or parcels of land described in the Schedule hereto and being all in the Esperance
District, for the purpose of the following public works namely, widening of the Coolgardie-Esperance
Highway (SLK Section 312.2-316.34) and that the said pieces or parcels of land are marked off on Land
Titles Office Diagrams 91994, 91995 and 91996 which may be inspected at the office of the Commis-
sioner of Main Roads, Waterloo Crescent, East Perth.

Schedule
No. Owmer or Reputed Occupier or Reputed Description Area
Owner Occupier
1. Daren Kym D K and KM Curnow Portion of Esperance Location 4 257 m?
Curnow and 568 now contained in Diagram
Kelly Marie 91995 and being part of the
Curnow land comprised in Certificate
of Title Volume 383 Folio 41A
2. Daren Kym D K and KM Curnow Portion of Esperance Location  5.7200 ha
Curnow and 442 now contained in Diagram
Kelly Maric 91995 and being part of the
Curnow land comprised in Certificate
of Title Volume 1924 Folio 126
3. Kym Brett K B and R G Curnow Portion of Esperance Location 46 m?
Curnow and 436 now contained in Thagram
Rosanne Gail 91996 and being part of the
Curnow land comprised in Certificate
of Title Volume 1498 Folio 525
4, Styles Pastoral Styles Pastoral Co Portion of Esperance Location 46 m?
Co Pty Litd Piy Ltd 418 and 144 now contained in

Diagram 91994 and being part
of the land comprised in Certifi-
cate of Title Volume 1468 Folio
389

Dated this 13th day of August 1997.
D. R. WARNER, Director Corporate Services.



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4731

MA402
LAND ACQUISITION AND PUBLIC WORKS ACT 1902
SALE OF LAND
MRWA 41-39-17.
Notice is hereby given that his Excellency the Governor has authorised under Section 29(7)a)(ii) of the
Land Acquisition and Public Works Act 1902 the sale by public auclion or private contract of the land
hereunder described, such land being no longer required for the work for which it was acquired.
LAND

Portion of Swan Location 71 and being Lot 473 on Plan 2005 and being part of the land contained in
Certificate of Title 1551 Folio 783 more particularly delineated and coloured green on plan MR97-145.

Portion of Swan Location 71 and being Lot 474 on Plan 2005 and being part of the land contained in
Certificate of Title 1402 Folio 010 more particularly delineated and coloured green on plan MR97-141.

Portion of Swan Location 71 and being Lot 475 on Plan 2005 and being part of the land contained in
Certificate of Title 1619 Folio 637 more particularly delineated and coloured green on plan MR97-142.

D. R. WARNER, Director Corporate Services.

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
SHIRE OF AUGUSTA-MARGARET RIVER
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 11 —AMENDMENT No, 94
Ref: 853/6/3/8, Pt. 94.

Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Shire of Augusta-Margaret River has prepared
the abovementioned scheme amendment for the purpose of rezoning portions of Sussex Location 1309
Cowaramup Bay Road and Caves Road, Cowaramup from “Rural” to “Special Rural”, “Special Use—
Tourist Development” and “Special Use—Restaurant”.

Plans and documents setting out and explaining the scheme amendment have been deposited at Coun-
cil Offices, Town View Terrace, Margaret River and at the Western Australian Planning Commission,
Albert Facey House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for inspection during office
hours up to and including September 30, 1997,

Submissions on the scheme amendment may be made in writing on Form No. 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before September 30, 1997.

This amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

M. EASTCOTT, Chief Executive Officer.

PD402*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
SHIRE OF DENMARK
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 3—AMENDMENT No. 25

Ref: 853/6/7/3, Pt. 25.
Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Shire of Denmark has prepared the
abovementioned scheme amendment for the purpose of—

1. Amending Appendix 6—Special Rural Zone Provisions relating to specified areas by amending

“11. Denmark Airport Estate Special Rural Zone” as follows—

{c) (i) The minimum lol size should be no less than 2.0 hectares. Subdivision shall gener-
ally be in accordance with the Subdivision Guide Map (91/20/6) as signed by the Chief
Executive Officer.
2. Substituting Subdivision Guide Map 91/20/6 for the existing Subdivigion Guide Map 91/20/3.

Plans and documents setting out and explaining the scheme amendment have been deposited at Coun-
cil Offices, Strickland Street, Denmark and at the Western Australian Planning Commission, Albert
Facey House, 169 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for inspection during office hours up
to and including September 16, 1997.



4732 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

Submissions on the scheme amendment may be made in writing on Form No. 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before September 16, 1997.

This amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

D. TAYLOR, A/Chief Executive Officer.

PD403*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF WYNDHAM-EAST KIMBERLEY
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 4 -AMENDMENT No. 39
Ref: 853/7/5/6, Pt, 39.
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Wyndham-East Kimberley Town Planning Scheme Amendment on August 3, 1997 for the purpose of—
(1) Rezoning Lot 1968, Banyan Street and Flametree Street from Commercial Zone to Residential
Zones 1 and 2;
(2) Rezoning part of Lot 1970 Syris Street from Commercial Zone to Special Site Zone (Commu-
nity Purposes);
(3) Rezoning part of Lot 1972 Syris Street from Residential 1 to Special Site Zone (Community
Purposes).

C. WOOTTON, President.
A. HAMMOND, Chief Executive Officer.

PoLice

PE401
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of a Car Rally by members/entrants of the Ascot Motor Club on 20
September, 1997 between the hours of 1200 (20/9/97) and 0200 (21/9/97) do hereby approve the tempo-
rary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.

Racing to be confined to—Barney Rd, unnamed Rd (from Grimwade to Barney Rds), Two Mile Rd,
Hawk, Plover, Quail, Curlew, Wagtail, Rosella Rds (unnamed Rds between Two Mile & Robin River
Rd), Ewart, ‘A’ Rd, Snake, Dorant, Kinky, Ferndale, Pinea, Larix, Radiata, Kauri, Sabinianna,
Juniper, Strobus, Balsam, Torreya, Wetherley, Insularis, Lewana, Ellis Creek Rd, Patula, Contorta,
Enchinata, Pinaster, Palustris, Crest, Cliff, Crevasse, Stallard, Spur Byron & (unnamed Rd between
Vasse Hwy & Cundinup Rd in Shelly Plantation.

Dated at Perth this 8th day of August 1997.
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support,).

PE402

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by scction 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authoritics having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of a Bicycle Race by members/entrants of the Eastern Goldfields Cycle
Club on 14 September, 1997 between the hours of 0900 and 1100 do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on—Commence Bayley St (near Tourist
Burcau) Coolgardic, left ITunt St, left Sylvester St, across Lefroy St, right Morgan St, continue 14 kms
to Bonnie Vale Railway Station then return.

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 6th day of August 1997.

E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4733

PE403
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purposc of a Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Bunbury Cycle Club Ine on
7 September, 1997 between the hours of 0930 and 1200 do hereby approve the temporary suspension of
the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.

Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on—Dardanup I1all, Ferguson Rd, left
Wellington St, Lowden Rd, U/turn to Donnybrook/Boyup Brook Rd, Wellington, Lowden, left Upper
Ferguson Rd, left Ferguson Rd and return.

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 11th day of August 1997.

E. G. LIENERT, Commandecr (Traffic and Operation Support).

PE404
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of the
Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers con-
ferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and
nominated for the purpose of a Foot Race—Perth Half Marathon by members/entrants of the WA Mara-
thon Club Inc on 14 September, 1997 between the hours of 0730 and 1000 do hereby approve the tempo-
rary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.

Racing to be confined to the extreme right hand side of the carriageway on—Start: Witcomb P1, onto
dual use path adjacent to Mill Point Rd, The Esplanade, across Narrows, Mounts Bay Rd, left Hackett
Dve, The Avenue, Bessel St, Esplanade, Mounts Bay Rd, Riverside Dve, across Causeway to finish
Witcomb Place grass area.

Dated at Perth this 8th day of August 1997.
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).

PE405
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of a Foot Race—Club Bridges by members/entrants of the WA
Marathon Club Inc on 26 October, 1997 between the hours of 0700 and 0830 do hereby approve the
temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s mentioned
hereunder.

Racing to be confined to the extreme right hand side of the carriageway on—Start/finish: Witcomb PI,
South Perth, Coode St, dual usc path adjacent to Mill Point Rd, Esplanade, across Narrows, dual use
path to cross the Causeway, follow path to finish.

Dated at Perth this 8th day of August 1997.

PE406

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I, Edwin Graeme Licnert, Commander (Traffic and Opceration Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under scction 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of a Fun Run from Kanowna to Kalgoorlic by members/entrants of the
GWN Balzano Barrow Race on 7 September, 1997 between the hours of 0900 and 1300 do hereby
approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s men-
tioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to—Kanowna Rd from Kanowna Cemetery to Kalgoorlie/Boulder by pass road,
Iannan St to finish at Centennial Park.

Dated at Perth this 7th day of August 1997.
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).



4734 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

PE407
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under scction 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of a Fun Run from Kanowna to Kalgoorlie by members/entrants of the
GWN Balzano Barrow Racc on 7 September, 1997 between the hours of 1300 and 1530 do hereby
approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s men-
tioned hereunder.

Racing to be confined to—Hannan St from Throssel to Hutton Streets, Kalgoorlie,
Dated at Perth this 7th day of August 1997.

E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).

PE408
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of a Fun Run by members/entrants of the Rotary Club of Bentley Inc on
21 September, 1997 between the hours of 0800 and 1000 do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.

Racing to be confined to—Start/finish: Deep Water Point Car Park, Mt Pleasant along Esplanade, over
Mt Henry Bridge, along Kwinana Fwy foreshore, Salters Point, & Manning over Canning Bridge,
along Esplanade and return.

Dated at Perth this 8th day of August 1997.
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).

PE409

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of the
Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers con-
ferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and
nominated for the purpose of a Left Bank Triathlon by members/entrants of the Sports Performance &
Management on 30 November, 1997 between the hours of 0645 and 0930 do hereby approve the tempo-
rary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to—Start/finish: John Tonkin Park, East Fremantle, then east on Riverside Rd,
turn at Wauhop Park, west Riverside Rd, Beach St, and turn at car park between Parry & Goldsborough
Sts, Beach St, Riverside Rd and enter car park drive from Riverside Rd. (Run) from John Tonkin Park
west Riverside Rd foreshore path to Stirling Traffic Bridge and return {on footpaths at all times).

Dated at Perth this 13th day of August 1997.
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).

PE410
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Acl 1974, pursuant o the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of a East Perth Triathlon (Swim-Cycle-Run) by members/entrants of
the Sports Performance & Management on 26 October, 1997 between the hours of 0630 and 0930 do
hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/
s mentioned hereunder.

Racing to be confined to—Trafalgar Rd, Nile St, (cyclists turn on Nelson Ave between Horatio & Plain
and continue on Nelson Cres) Nelson Ave, Waterloo Cres, Horatio St, Bronte St, Waterloo, Trafalgar
and Royal St, Kast Perth. (Iun) Start: Trafalgar Bridge Park and along foreshore path to Causeway
and return,

Dated at Perth this 13th day of August 1997.
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).



19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4735

PE411

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of a Canning Bridge Triathlon by members/entrants of the Sports
Performance & Management on 8 February, 1997 between the hours of 0645 and 0930 do hercby
approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s men-
tioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to—Commence/finish: Raffles Hotel, Applecross. Canning Beach Rd, Duncraig
Rd, Nesbit Rd, The Strand, Ardross Rd, Fraser Rd, Dee Rd, Melville Beach Rd, turn between Collier &
Cunningham Rds and return.

Dated at Perth this 13th day of August 1997.
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).

PE412
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of the
Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers con-
ferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and
nominated for the purpose of a Rockingham Triathlon by members/entrants of the Sports Promotions
Australia on 15 February, 1997 between the hours of 0630 and 0930 do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.

Racing to be confined to—Start/finish: Churchill Park, Rockingham Rd, Val St, The Esplanade, Hymus
St, Point Peron Rd, Garden Island Causeway, Garden Island Rd then return via Point Peron Rd,
Hymus, The Esplanade, Val, Rockingham Rd.

Dated at Perth this 13th day of August 1997.
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).

PE413

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of a Triathlon (Swim-Bike-Run) by members/entrants of The Triathlon
Association of Western Australia Inc on 18 January, 1998 between the hours of 0630 and 1000
do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriage-
way/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to—Cycle: Up hill on Honour Ave, left at roundabout into Carroll Ave te enter
Burke Dve, right Hurst St, right Warragoon Cres, right Haig Rd, left Burke Dve, left Carroll Ave, right
Honour Ave and return.

Dated at Perth this 13th day of August 1997.
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).

PE414

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I, Edwin Graeme Lienert, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support) being the delegated officer of
the Minister for Transport under section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorilies having been oblained
and nominated for the purpose of a Bicton Triathlon by members/entrants of the Sports Performance
& Management on 22 March, 1997 between the hours of 0645 and 0930 do hereby approve the tempo-
rary suspension of the Regulations made under such Act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to—(Cycle): start/finish at Rob Campbell Park, along Blackwall Reach Pde, Kent
St, Point Walter Rd, Carroll Ave, Burke Dve (cycle turn at Troy Park & return via Burke Dve, Carroll
Ave, Point Walter Rd, Braunton St, Malsbury St, Brindal Cl, along path to finish. (Run): start at Rob
Campbell Park, along foreshore path on Blackwall Reach Pde to Point Walter cycle path past Kent St
turn to finish at Bicton Jetty foreshore.

Dated at Perth this 13th day of August 1997,
E. G. LIENERT, Commander (Traffic and Operation Support).



4736 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

PrRemIER AND CABINET

PR401
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS

It ig hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52 (1) (b) of
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment in the place of the
Ilon. C. L. Edwardes, MLA in the period 5 to 10 August 1997 inclusive—

Minister for the Environment; Employment and Training Hon. N, F, Moore, MLC.
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Chief Executive.

WATER AND RIVERS

WA401
RIGHTS IN WATER AND IRRIGATION ACT 1914
Notice under Section 13 of the Act
Regulation 14 (1)

The applications in the following schedule have been received for a licence to divert, take and use
water from the Warren-Donnelly River Systems.

Any owner or occupier of land within 4.8 kilometres of the applicants land and contiguous te the
watercourse may object to that application.

Objections should be sent to reach me at the Water & Rivers Commission, PO Box 261, Bunbury WA
6230 prior to 5th September 1997 by certified mail.

W. F. TINGEY, Regional Manager, South West Region.

Schedule
Occupier Postal Address Description of Land

Summatus Pty Ltd 12 Burke Dr, Attadale WA 6156 Nelson Loc 2071 & 450 Graphite
Rd, Manjimup.

PusLic NoTiCES

ZZ401
NOTICE OF CHANGE TO PARTNERSHIP

Notice is hereby given that Kristy Margaret Anderson retired from the partnership “Labels Designs
Australia” as from 30 June 1996. Shona Reid and Sandra Elizabeth Wilson have carried on the part-
nership business since 1 July 1996.

IRDI and ASSOCIATES.




19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

4737

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
RETIREMENT VILLAGES ACT 1992

Price: $28.30 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 695 grams

RETIREMENT VILLAGES REGULATIONS 1992

*Price: $2.50 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 25 grams
* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

*Price: $10.90 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 365 grams

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 1992

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
YOUNG OFFENDERS ACT 1994

*Price: $13.90 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 300 grams

YOUNG OFFENDERS REGULATIONS 1995

*Price $3.90 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 65 grams
*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

THE CRIMINAL CODE
(Reprinted as at 17 December 1993)

*Price: $37.40 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 900 grams

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.




4738

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

NURSES ACT 1992

*Price: $6.70 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 150 grams

NURSES RULES 1993

*Price: $5.30 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 80 grams

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the

missing item.

Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

1998.

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 1998

All subscriptions and standing orders run from 1 January to 31 December

The policy of the State Law Publisher is that no refunds or credits will be given
if a subscription is cancelled during the year.
Quoted price includes postage by surface mail unless stated otherwise.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE HANSARD
The Government Gazette is published on Hansard is printed and posted weekly during
Tuesday and Friday of each week, unless a parliamentary session.
disrupted by public holidays or unfore- Subscription rates: $
seen circumstances. Within WA 310.00
Special Government Gazettes are published Interstate 363.00
periodically and are included in the Overseas (airmail) 716.00
subscription price. Bound Volumes of Hansard:
Subscription rates: $ Within W.A. 490.00
Within WA 565.00 Interstate 522.00
Interstate 597.00
Overseas (airmail) 796.00 STATUTES
Bound Volumes of Bound Statutes: $
Government Gazelte 873.00 Within W.A. 218.00
Interstate 241.00
Overseas 246.00
Half Calf Bound Statutes 600.00
Loose Statutes:
INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE Within W.A. 214.00
. . . Interstate 222.00
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. Overseas 324.00
Subscription rates: $ Sessional Bills
Within WA 254,00 Within W.A. 210.00
Interstate 299.00 Interstate 219.00

Overseas (airmail) 424.00 Overseas 329.00




19 August 1997] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4739

NOW
AVAILABLE !'!

Order your Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

1997

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

For Government Departments and private firms who
presently arrange binding for their copies of
Government Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is
now offering a subscription covering 4 Quarterly
Volumes at a cost of $837.00.

The Gazettes will be bound in black cloth with gold foil
lettering on the spine and personalised by the addition
of the client's name in gold lettering on the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE

On the rare occasion where extra gazettes are published
in one quarter, a fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost mvolved will be borne by the
State Law Publisher and not passed on to clients.

For further information please contact:

State Law Publisher
Telephone: 9321 7688

L B N B I N N O R BN BN BN B BN B BN B B BN K BN B B B NN BN OB NN N BN NN BN BN BN B B NN NN NN NN B N A N NN BN BN BN N N NN NN BN NN B B N N N N N N N N N N N N N N R N NN N N NN NN N NN NN NN
LA B ENERRERESEEEEEREREREREEEEERERSEEEEEEREEREEEEREREEEENREEREEREEREREERERENEEREREEEREREREERENENERENERNERREZERNERESENENMNSEN:.EHSSN]



4740 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [19 August 1997

CONTENTS
REGULATIONS, BY-LAWS, RULES, DETERMINATIONS, ORDERS

Page
Artificial Breeding of Stock Act—Artificial Breeding of Stock Amendment Regulations 1997 .. 4715-17
Beekeepers Act—Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 1997 ... 4714
Bulk ITandling Act—Bulk Handling Act Amendment Regulations 1997 .....c.coovcvecccnicennenes 4714
Exotic Diseases of Animals Act—Exotic Diseases (General) Amendment Regulations 1997 .. 4713
Fertilizers Act—Fertilizers Amendment Regulations 1997 ... ioviiirccininnccnccseeeen e 4713
Plant Discases Act—Plant Discases Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 1997 .....cecvvvvncneinns 4712
Poisons Act—Poisons (Specified Drugs) Variation Order (No. 2) 1997 .....cccccovvvvninnvnivnnronines 4720
Seeds Act—Seeds Amendment Regulations 1997 ... e seees 4711-12

Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act—Enzootic Diseases Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 1997 .. 4718-19
Stock (Identification and Movement) Act—Stock (Identification and Movement)

Amendment Regulations 1997 ........cciiiiiiiiiiiiiiniieieimieroneriiiesemniooomssssoiesensssosssssosssasens 4717
Radiation Safety Act—Radiation Safety (General) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 1997 .. 4720-22
Veterinary Preparations and Animal Feeding Stuffs Act—Veterinary Preparations

and Animal Feeding Stuffs Amendment Regulations 1997 ........cccccoeveerurinuenrnereneesveneronees 4719
GENERAL CONTENTS

Page

AGFICUITUTE it ce et eeeee et et e ee e e e e eeee e eeeeneee s eeateet e ee e eneeseneteat eeennneessanees 4711-19
HEAltH .. ittt e e s e st tnb e s e sesrtntatese s ntateessenbRnte e sebbns (eesseerstbeaetensantaneensrrrtes 4720-22
Land AQMINISEIATION ....vvviviiiiiiiireinieiiiereeeieirinreseserrnresssensensesessssssnnsessssssnntesssesssssensesensssnsssesrssnes 4722-24
Li0CAl GOVETTIIIIENTE .. cvieieeerereerereeeeiereererese i aranannenenterereesesesresesarnesessnsnssnanatnsesntenssensesesessensranssnnse 4724-30
Main BOBAS voiiiiiinrireiiiiiiiri et seiitteeseesitreesesesnnntasesesesntnsesssessnnsesssessnssnsssenssnssnsessessasasesransen 4730-31
g B D oV PR 4731-32
POLICE .iivivvnriieiiiiinteeeicertnte et seeentrereeseanresesasansnresesasnantasesasantneseasaratnes e sabanbesaastattsrassaeansnsenesasrtrans 4732-35
Premier and Cabinet .......covvviviiiiiiiiiiiiciiiinirinrerereer s e re s e s eesese s e s asatnesaneeneseneeseressessees rannen 4736
PUDIIC NOBICES ..reireirininrererierirereriereirerersieisinarassenenterereesesesseseseesesessinissssssatnsesnsensssnsesesesseesrontanaen 4736
WELEE AIA RIVETS «oovicccieieiieieiieir et e e renteseseertnteeesesesntsessessnanneses sasanstesssssssssassssnssasenssasrsrees 4736

17 9 9 7 04 ¢ 1 4 0D 6 G



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


