
GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 211121 April 1998]

The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law
Publisher for the State of Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each
week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen circumstances
(changes to this arrangement will be advertised beforehand on the inside
cover).
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular
nature are published periodically.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the
Government Gazette.

Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will
require a copy of the signed Executive Council Minute Paper and in
some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.
Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State
Law Publisher no later than 12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or
12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:

State Law Publisher State Law Publisher
P.O. Box 8448, Ground Floor,
Perth Business Centre 6849 10 William St. Perth, 6000

Telephone: 9321 7688 Fax: 9321 7536
Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for
preparation. Failure to observe this request could result in the notice
being held over.
Proofs will be supplied only on request.
No additions or amendments to material will be accepted by telephone.

All Notices should be written in ‘plain English’.
Signatures (in particular) and proper names must be legible.
All copy should be typed and double spaced.
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is
not required by post. If original copy is forwarded later and published,
the cost will be borne by the advertiser.
Documents not prepared clearly or in the required format for gazettal,
will be returned to the sender unpublished.
Copy received after the deadline will be placed in the following edition
irrespective of any date/s mentioned in the copy.

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

PUBLISHING DETAILS

PERTH, TUESDAY, 21 APRIL 1998 No. 81

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

ADVERTISERS SHOULD NOTE:

2111



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [21 April 19982112

EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 1997.
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$17.20
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per

notice)—$40.10
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$40.10 (except items of an

exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for
pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
Per Column Centimetre—$7.90
Bulk Notices—$148.00 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE

© State of Western Australia

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no
part may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government
Printer, State Law Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial,
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS

COUNTER SALES 1997-98
(As from 1 July 1997)

$
Government Gazette—(General)................................. 2.50
Government Gazette—(Special)

Up to 2 pages............................................................ 2.50
Over 2 pages.............................................................. 4.90

Hansard ............................................................................. 14.10
Industrial Gazette ........................................................... 12.50
Bound Volumes of Statutes.......................................... 218.00

Periodically notices are published indicating a variation in
normal publishing arrangements:

• Easter or Christmas editions etc—these notices appear
approximately 4 weeks prior to any change.

• Extraordinary gazettes not circulated to all subscribers—
these notices appear in the following general edition of
the gazette.

In all cases notices are published on page 2 and readers are
urged to check accordingly prior to contacting State Law
Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK,
Government Printer.

IMPORTANT NOTICE



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 211321 April 1998]

CONSERVATION AND LAND MANAGEMENT

CM301*
CONSERVATION AND LAND MANAGEMENT ACT 1984

FOREST MANAGEMENT AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1998

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation
1. These regulations may be cited as the Forest Management Amendment
Regulations 1998.

Principal regulations
2. In these regulations the Forest Management Regulations 1993* are referred to as the
principal regulations.

[* Published in Gazette 9 February 1993, pp. 1119-201.
For amendments to 9 March 1998 see 1996 Index to Legislation of Western Australia,
Table 4, p. 44.]

Regulation 2 amended
3. Regulation 2 of the principal regulations is amended by inserting before the definition
of “bush landing” the following definition — 
“

“apiary site permit” means a permit referred to in regulation 73 (1);
 ”.

Regulation 73 amended
4. (1) Regulation 73 (1) of the principal regulations is amended by deleting “grant to
any person” and substituting the following — 
“ , upon an application in writing by a person, grant to the person ”.

(2) Regulation 73 (3) of the principal regulations is amended — 
(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “4” and substituting the following — 

“ 5 ”; and
(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “2” and substituting the following — 

“ 4 ”.

Regulation 76 repealed and regulations substituted
5. Regulation 76 of the principal regulations is repealed and the following regulations
are substituted — 
“

Exercise of rights conferred by a permit
76. A permit-holder shall not exercise the rights conferred by the permit otherwise
than in good faith for his or her own benefit.

Transfer of a permit
76A. The Executive Director may, upon an application in writing by a
permit-holder, transfer a permit to another person.

Variation of a permit to change an apiary site
76B. The Executive Director may, upon an application in writing by a
permit-holder, vary a permit so as to change the location of the area to which the
permit applies.

”.

Regulation 82 amended
6. Regulation 82 of the principal regulations is amended — 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$34” and substituting the following — 
“ $60.00 ”; and

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$6.80” and substituting the following — 
“ $12.00 ”.

Schedule 5 amended
7. (1) Schedule 5 to the principal regulations is amended in item 6 by inserting after
“permit” the following — 
“ other than an apiary site permit ”.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [21 April 19982114

(2) Schedule 5 to the principal regulations is amended by inserting after item 6 the
following items — 
“

7. Grant of an apiary site permit
in the south-west zone — 
per 5 permits or less
granted on one application $100.00

8. Grant of an apiary site permit
outside the south-west zone — 
per 5 permits or less
granted on one application $50.00

9. Transfer of an apiary site permit $8.50
10. Variation of an apiary site permit

so as to change the location of the
area to which the permit applies to
a location in the south-west zone $75.00

11. Variation of an apiary site permit
so as to change the location of the
area to which the permit applies to
a location outside the south-west zone $37.50

 ”.
By Command of the Governor,

 M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

FAIR TRADING

FT401
COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943

AVON ARC CO-OPERATIVE LTD

Minister of Fair Trading,
Business Names Branch, Perth WA 6000.

Notice is hereby given that, pursuant to Section 26 (1) of the abovenamed Act, a Certificate of
Incorporation, as a Limited Company, has this day been issued to Avon Arc Co-operative Ltd.
Dated this 15th day of April 1998.

(Sgd) A person Authorised by the Commissioner for
Corporate Affairs in Western Australia.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG301
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Harvey
STANDING ORDERS AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 1998

Made by the Council of the Shire of Harvey under the Local Government Act 1995.

Citation
1. This local law may be cited as the Standing Orders Amendment Local Law 1998.

Principal Local Laws
2. In this law, the Shire of Harvey Standing Orders Local Law, 1997*, are referred to as
the Principal Local Law.

(*Published in the Government Gazette on 7th February 1997, in No. 19 on pages
754-765).

Amendment
3. The Principal Local Law is amended by deleting Clause 13.4 and substituting the
following—

“13.4 Resumption of Adjourned Meeting
On a motion for the adjournment of the Council being carried, the debate on the
question (if any) under debate when that motion was moved shall be continued
immediately upon the Council resuming after the adjournment.”



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 211521 April 1998]

Passed at a meeting of the Council of the Shire of Harvey, held on 14th April 1998.
Dated this 15th day of April 1998.
The Common Seal of the Shire of Harvey was hereunto affixed in the presence of—

J. W. OFFER, President.
K. J. LEECE, Chief Executive Officer.

LG401
TOWN OF BASSENDEAN

Appointment of Ranger
It is hereby notified for public information that Murray Matthews and Adam Wright (6/4/98-30/6/98)
have been appointed as authorised officers for the implementation and enforcement of the following
Acts and Local Laws—

Dog Act 1979
Bushfires Act 1954
Litter Act 1979
Local Government 1995
Local Laws relating to Parking
Council Local Laws
Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978
Justices Act 1902

The appointment of Aaron Bowers is hereby cancelled.
G. MACKENZIE, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402
HEALTH ACT 1911

Section 57(2)
NOTICE OF INTENTION

Shire of Moora
Sewerage Scheme Alteration Moora Townsite

Drummond Street
The Shire of Moora proposes to construct a waste water stabilisation pond for the existing townsite
sewerage scheme for the purpose of draining waste water and sewerage from all buildings served by
the Shire of Moora reticulated sewerage scheme and to treat the waste water and sewerage in the
treatment works already constructed. It is estimated that the capital cost of the extension will cost
$50,000, it is proposed to finance the work from Municipal Funds provided on Council’s Budget.
Water supply for the Sewerage Scheme comes from the existing country areas water supply for Moora
Townsite.
A general plan and description of the proposed extension will be deposited with the Executive Director,
Public Health and copies may be inspected at the Council Office, objections will be received until 10
June 1998.

J. N. WARNE, Chief Executive Officer.

LG403
SHIRE OF MOORA

Sale of Land
Notice is hereby given that Council proposes to sell Lot 205 Tootra Street, Moora being the land subject
of title Vol. 2040 Fol. 932.
Details of the proposed sale are as under—

Vendor: Shire of Moora
Proposed Purchaser: C. M. & J. T. Lewis, PO Box 84, Moora
Consideration: $11,500
Recent Market Valuation (VG): $9,500

Submissions relating to this proposed sale as required by Section 3.58(3) of the Local Government Act
1995 are invited, the closing date/time of which is 4.00 p.m. 2nd May, 1998.

I. V. CRAVEN, Acting Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [21 April 19982116

LG404
DOG ACT 1976
Shire of Moora

It is hereby notified for public information that the following person has been appointed as an
Authorised Person pursuant to Section 29(1) of the Dog Act 1976.

Joseph Austin
I. V. CRAVEN, Acting Chief Executive Officer.

MINERALS AND ENERGY

MN401*
PETROLEUM PIPELINES ACT 1969

Notice of Grant of Pipeline Licence
Pipeline Licence No. PL 40 has been granted to Epic Energy (WA) Nominees Pty Ltd of Level 14,
Forrest Centre, 221 St George’s Terrace, Perth WA 6000 to have effect for a period of twenty one years
from 25 March 1998.

IAN FRASER, Director Petroleum Operations Division.

PUBLIC ADVOCATE

PB401*
GUARDIANSHIP AND ADMINISTRATION ACT 1990

ARRANGEMENT
This arrangement is made under section 44A of the Guardianship and Administration Act 1990 (WA)
on the 27th day of February 1998 between the Hon Attorney General for the State of Western Australia
and the Hon Minister for Human Services for the State of South Australia.
The Hon Attorney General for the State of Western Australia being satisfied that the Guardianship
and Administration Act 1993 (SA) relating to the guardianship of adults corresponds sufficiently with
the Guardianship and Administration Act 1990 (WA), it is agreed that guardianship orders made
under the Guardianship and Administration Act 1993 (SA) in respect of adult persons who enter West-
ern Australia be recognised in Western Australia.

Hon PETER FOSS, Attorney General
for the State of Western Australia.

Hon DEAN BROWN, Minister for Human Services
for the State of South Australia.

PB402*
GUARDIANSHIP AND ADMINISTRATION ACT 1990

ARRANGEMENT
This arrangement is made under section 83D of the Guardianship and Administration Act 1990 (WA)
on the 27th day of February 1998 between the Hon Attorney General for the State of Western Australia
and the Hon Minister for Human Services for the State of South Australia.
The Hon Attorney General for the State of Western Australia being satisfied that the Guardianship
and Administration Act 1993 (SA) relating to the guardianship of adults corresponds sufficiently with
the Guardianship and Administration Act 1990 (WA), it is agreed that administration orders made
under the Guardianship and Administration Act 1993 (SA) in respect of adult persons who enter West-
ern Australia be recognised in Western Australia.

Hon PETER FOSS, Attorney General
for the State of Western Australia.

Hon DEAN BROWN, Minister for Human Services
for the State of South Australia.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 211721 April 1998]

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF CANNING

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 40—AMENDMENT NO. 49
Ref: 853/2/16/44, Pt. 49, Vol 2.
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of Canning
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on April 8, 1998 for the purpose of the designation of R17.5/20
code in precinct St James East area and R17.5/R30 in precinct St James West area previously desig-
nated R17.5/R40.

M. S. LEKIAS, Mayor.
I. F. KINNER, Chief Executive Officer.

PD402*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF CANNING

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 40—AMENDMENT NO. 71
Ref: 853/2/16/44, Pt. 71.
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of Canning
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on April 8, 1998 for the purpose of—

1 Relocating the scheme boundary to include the whole of 1465-1469 Albany Highway (Reserve
30234 Location 2289), Cannington, in the City of Canning.

2 Rezoning the above property from “Local Authority Reservation—Public Purposes” to “High-
way Commercial”.

M. S. LEKIAS, Mayor.
I. F. KINNER, Chief Executive Officer.

PD403*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
CITY OF ROCKINGHAM

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 1—AMENDMENT NO. 298
Ref: 853/2/28/1, Pt. 298.
Notice is hereby given that the local government of the City of Rockingham has prepared the
abovementioned scheme amendment for the purpose of—

1 Rezoning Lots 15 and 33 Churcher Road, Baldivis from ‘Rural’ to ‘Special Rural’.
2 Incorporating Lots 15 and 33 Churcher Road, Baldivis into “Column (a) Locality” of Table IV—

Amendment No 269 area.
Plans and documents setting out and explaining the scheme amendment have been deposited at Coun-
cil Offices, Civic Boulevard, Rockingham and at the Western Australian Planning Commission, Albert
Facey House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for inspection during office hours up
to and including June 2, 1998.
Submissions on the scheme amendment may be made in writing on Form No. 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before June 2, 1998.
This amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

J GREEN, A/Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [21 April 19982118

PD404*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
SHIRE OF BODDINGTON

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 2—AMENDMENT NO. 1
Ref: 853/6/15/2, Pt. 1.
Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Shire of Boddington has prepared the
abovementioned scheme amendment for the purpose of—

1 Rezoning Ptn of Williams Location 1170 Shepherds Turn, Boddington, from ‘Rural’ to ‘Special
Residential’.

2 Rezoning Lot 37, Bannister Road, Boddington from ‘Residential’ to ‘Commercial’.
Plans and documents setting out and explaining the scheme amendment have been deposited at Coun-
cil Offices, 39 Bannister Road, Boddington and at the Western Australian Planning Commission, Albert
Facey House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for inspection during office hours up
to and including June 2, 1998.
Submissions on the scheme amendment may be made in writing on Form No. 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before June 2, 1998.
This amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

B. E. JONES, Chief Executive Officer.

PD405
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF DARDANUP

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 3—AMENDMENT NO. 86
Ref: 853/6/9/6, Pt. 86.
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Dardanup
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on April 8, 1998 for the purpose of—

(1) Rezoning portion of Reserve No. 39158 from “Recreation” to “Other Community Uses”;
(2) Rezoning portion of Reserve No. 39158 from “Recreation” to “Other Community Uses and Ad-

ditional Uses: Office, Medical Clinic and Professional Office”;
(3) Rezoning portion of Lot 7 corner Eaton and Recreation Drives from “General Farming” to

“Other Community Uses and Additional Uses: Office, Medical Clinic and Professional Office”;
(4) Rezoning portion Lot 7 from “General Farming” to “Car Parking”,
(5) Amend Appendix 4—Additional Use Zones of the Scheme Text by the insertion of the following

new Additional Use Zones as follows—

No Street Particulars Additional Conditions
of Land Use Permitted

11 Cnr Eaton Reserve Medical Clinic Office Development shall comply with
Drive & No. 39158 Professional Office the provisions of Town Planning
Recreation Scheme No. 3 and conditions
Drive imposed by Council at the time of

development approval.
12 Cnr Eaton Lot 7 Medical Clinic Office Development shall comply with

Drive & Professional Office the provisions of Town Planning
Recreation Scheme No. 3 and conditions
Drive imposed by Council at the time of

development approval.

(6) Insertion of text; “Development shall comply with the provisions of Town Planning Scheme
No. 3 and conditions imposed by Council at the time of development approval” in the column
titled ‘Conditions’ of Appendix IV Additional Use Zones against A11 & A12.

(7) Amending a portion of the zoning of Lot 9, corner of Eaton Drive and Cudliss Avenue by remov-
ing the “General Farming” zoning; and

(8) Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

M. T. BENNETT, President.
M. L. CHESTER, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 211921 April 1998]

PD406*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT

SHIRE OF DARDANUP

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 3—AMENDMENT NO. 90

Ref: 853/6/9/6, Pt. 90.

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Dardanup
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on April 8, 1998 for the purpose of including Lot 12 Waterloo on
Diagram 7695 within Appendix V as a restricted use site as follows:

PERMITTED USE Integrated Wool Processing Plant and such other ancillary industrial uses as
approved by Council subject to the following conditions applying—

(A) As a condition of development Council shall include a provision requiring Lot 12 to be
connected to a gazetted public road prior to any formal development commencing.

(B) In considering applications for development Council shall assess and where appropriate
apply conditions of approval in respect of the following matters—

1 site access
2 earthworks/cut and fill/compaction
3 building design including materials/exterior finish
4 car parking
5 storm water drainage
6 portable water supply
7 effluent disposal
8 fire protection
9 landscaping

10 clearing of vegetation

M. T. BENNETT, President.
M. L. CHESTER, Chief Executive Officer.

PD407*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION

SHIRE OF MURRAY

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 4—AMENDMENT NO. 128

Ref: 853/6/16/7, Pt. 128.

Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Shire of Murray has prepared the abovementioned
scheme amendment for the purpose of—

1 Amending Clause 6.2.10 to read:

“All buildings shall be set back not less than 9.0 metres from a canal frontage, with the excep-
tion of—

(i) Class 10b structures, as defined in the Building Code of Australia, and shade sails, which
shall be in accordance with Council’s Policy Relating to Shade Sail Structures within the
Canal Development Zone; and

(ii) open deck structures, which shall be in accordance with Council’s Policy Relating to Open
Deck Construction within the Canal Development Zone.”

2 Including the interpretation for ‘Open Deck Structure’ in Appendix 1 of the Scheme Text.

Plans and documents setting out and explaining the scheme amendment have been deposited at Coun-
cil Offices, Pinjarra Road, Pinjarra and at the Western Australian Planning Commission, Albert Facey
House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for inspection during office hours up to and
including June 2, 1998.

Submissions on the scheme amendment may be made in writing on Form No. 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before June 2, 1998.

This amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

N. G. LEACH, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [21 April 19982120

PD408*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
SHIRE OF PLANTAGENET

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 3—AMENDMENT NO. 22
Ref: 853/5/14/4, Pt. 22.
Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Shire of Plantagenet has prepared the
abovementioned scheme amendment for the purpose of—

1 rezoning Lot 27 of Plantagenet Locations 3201 and 3305 Millinup Road from the Rural zone to
the Landscape Protection zone; and

2 incorporating a Landscape Protection zone into the Town Planning Scheme No. 2 text.
Plans and documents setting out and explaining the scheme amendment have been deposited at Coun-
cil Offices, Lowood Road, Mount Barker and at the Western Australian Planning Commission, Albert
Facey House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for inspection during office hours up
to and including June 2, 1998.
Submissions on the scheme amendment may be made in writing on Form No. 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before June 2, 1998.
This amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

C. G. JACKSON, Chief Executive Officer.

PD409*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
SHIRE OF SWAN

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 9—AMENDMENT NO. 322
Ref: 853/2/21/10, Pt. 322.
Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Shire of Swan has prepared the abovementioned
scheme amendment for the purpose of removing the “Local Reserve—Recreation” classification from
Swan Location 10243 (formerly Reserve 37444) Hyne Road, South Guildford and zoning the land “Gen-
eral Industrial”.
Plans and documents setting out and explaining the scheme amendment have been deposited at Coun-
cil Offices, corner Morrison Road and Old Great Northern Highway, Midland and at the Western Aus-
tralian Planning Commission, Albert Facey House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available
for inspection during office hours up to and including June 2, 1998.
Submissions on the scheme amendment may be made in writing on Form No. 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before June 2, 1998.
This amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

E. W. LUMSDEN, Chief Executive Officer.

PD410*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
TOWN OF ALBANY

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 1A—AMENDMENT NO. 85
Ref: 853/5/2/15, Pt. 85.
Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Town of Albany has prepared the abovementioned
scheme amendment for the purpose of designating Lot 67 Middleton Road, Mira Mar as a Special Site
with the additional permitted uses, “Motel” and “Holiday Accommodation” and changing the Residen-
tial Density Code from R20 to R30.
Plans and documents setting out and explaining the scheme amendment have been deposited at Coun-
cil Offices, 221 York Street, Albany and at the Western Australian Planning Commission, Albert Facey
House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for inspection during office hours up to and
including June 2, 1998.
Submissions on the scheme amendment may be made in writing on Form No. 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before June 2, 1998.
This amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

M. A. JORGENSEN, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 212121 April 1998]

PD411*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
TOWN OF PORT HEDLAND

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 4—AMENDMENT NO. 49
Ref: 853/8/4/5, Pt. 49.
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Town of Port
Hedland Town Planning Scheme Amendment on April 8, 1998 for the purpose of—

(a) Rezoning Lot 2115 Stanley Street, South Hedland from Community zone to Special Sites—
‘Caravan Park and Holiday Accommodation’.

(b) Adding Schedule 3 of the Town Planning Scheme Text to include the following—

Description of Special Site Permitted Uses and Conditions of Use

Lot 2115 Stanley Street, South Hedland Caravan Park and Holiday Accommodation
(a) Tree protection and landscaping to be

established in accordance with plans
approved by Council.

(c) Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

G. BLACKMAN, Mayor.
J. ROBERTS, Chief Executive Officer.

POLICE

PE401
POLICE ACT 1892
PUBLIC AUCTION

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892, unclaimed and stolen property will be sold by public
auction at the premises of Port Hedland Auction Centre, Lot 1432 McKay Street, Port Hedland on
Saturday 2nd May 1998.

R. FALCONER, Commissioner of Police.

WATER

WA301*
WATER SERVICES COORDINATION ACT 1995

ROTTNEST ISLAND CONTROLLED AREA (WATER SUPPLY, SEWERAGE AND
DRAINAGE SERVICES) ORDER 1998

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 11.

Citation
1. This order may be cited as the Rottnest Island Controlled Area (Water Supply, Sewerage
and Drainage Services) Order 1998.

Area constituted
2. The area described in Schedule 1—

(a) is constituted as a controlled area (water supply, sewerage and drainage services);
and

(b) is to be called the Rottnest Island Controlled Area (Water Supply, Sewerage and
Drainage Services).

Schedule 1
The area that is Reserve No. 16713 in the records of the Department of Land Administration
being —

(a) the land containing 1 859 hectares comprising Swan Location 10976 as shown
and bordered pink on Department of Land Administration Plan No. 16860; and

(c) the waters comprising Swan Location 11022 as shown on Department of Land
Administration Plan No. 16932, including the sea-bed and subsoil beneath such
waters.

By Command of the Governor,
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [21 April 19982122

CONTENTS

SUBSIDIARY LEGISLATION
Page

Conservation and Land Management Act 1984—Forest Management Amendment
Regulations 1998.................................................................................................................... 2113-14

Local Government Act 1995—Shire of Harvey—Standing Orders Amendment Local
Law 1998 ................................................................................................................................ 2114-15

Water Services Coordination Act 1995—Rottnest Island Controlled Area (Water Supply,
Sewerage and Drainage Services) Order 1998 ..................................................................... 2121

GENERAL CONTENTS
Page

Conservation and Land Management ...................................................................................... 2113-14
Fair Trading ............................................................................................................................... 2114
Local Government ...................................................................................................................... 2114-16
Minerals and Energy ................................................................................................................. 2116
Public Advocate .......................................................................................................................... 2116
Planning ..................................................................................................................................... 2117-21
Police .......................................................................................................................................... 2121
Water .......................................................................................................................................... 2121

!199800081GG!


