
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

1413

PERTH, THURSDAY, 1 APRIL 1999  No. 53
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—Hospitals (Services Charges for Magnetic
Resonance Imaging) Determination Amendment Notice 1999..................................... 1417

Local Government Act 1995—City of South Perth—Local Law Relating to Public
Reserve 10250 (Royal Perth Golf Course)...................................................................... 1418-20

Proclamations..................................................................................................................... 1415-6

———

PART 2

Electoral Commission ........................................................................................................ 1421
Heritage Council................................................................................................................. 1421-2
Justice ................................................................................................................................. 1423
Local Government .............................................................................................................. 1423
Minerals and Energy.......................................................................................................... 1424
Parliament.......................................................................................................................... 1424
Premier and Cabinet .......................................................................................................... 1424-5
Public Notices ..................................................................................................................... 1425-6

NEW FORMAT FOR GENERAL GOVERNMENT GAZETTES
For ease of access to particular notices the general Gazette will be divided into two parts as
detailed below. In each part, the notices will appear in alphabetical order of the authorising
Department.

Part 1 will contain Proclamations, Regulations, Rules, Local Laws and various other
Instruments etc. but not Town Planning Schemes.

Part 2 will contain general notices and information and Town Planning Schemes.



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial, State Law Publisher, 10
William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised beforehand on the inside cover).

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 1998.

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$17.70

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$41.30

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$41.30 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these instances
arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
  Per Column Centimetre—$8.15

  Bulk Notices—$153.00 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

SPECIAL PUBLICATION NOTICE
GOVERNMENT GAZETTE—EASTER 1999

Advertisers are advised to note the following changes to publication dates for
Government Gazette over the Easter period 1999.
There will be no edition for  TUESDAY 6 APRIL.
EASTER ISSUES:
      THURSDAY 1 APRIL (Copy closes Tuesday 30 March at 12.00 noon)
      FRIDAY 9 APRIL  (Copy closes Wednesday 7 April at 12.00 noon)
Any enquiries should be directed to John Thompson, Phone (08) 9426 0010



1 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1415

—  PART  1  —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA101

PUBLIC AND BANK HOLIDAYS ACT 1972
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
P. M. Jeffery,

Governor.
[L.S.]

} By His Excellency Major General Philip Michael
Jeffery, Companion of the Order of Australia, Officer
of the Order of Australia (Military Division), Military
Cross, Governor of the State of Western Australia.

I, the Governor, acting under section 8 of the Public and Bank Holidays Act 1972
and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, declare that instead of
Monday 27 September 1999, Monday 5 July 1999 shall be the Celebration Day for
the Anniversary of the Birthday of the Reigning Sovereign in 1999, in the area of the
townsite of Marble Bar and a radius of 150km from the townsite.
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 23 March 1999.
By His Excellency’s Command

CHERYL EDWARDES, Minister for Labour Relations.
GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !

AA102

PUBLIC AND BANK HOLIDAYS ACT 1972
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
P. M. Jeffery,

Governor.
[L.S.]

} By His Excellency Major General Philip Michael
Jeffery, Companion of the Order of Australia, Officer
of the Order of Australia (Military Division), Military
Cross, Governor of the State of Western Australia.

I, the Governor, acting under section 8 of the Public and Bank Holidays Act 1972
and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, declare that instead of
Monday 27 September 1999, Monday 2 August 1999 shall be the Celebration Day for
the Anniversary of the Birthday of the Reigning Sovereign in 1999, in the area of the
Town of Port Hedland.
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 23 March 1999.
By His Excellency’s Command

CHERYL EDWARDES, Minister for Labour Relations.
GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !

AA103

PUBLIC AND BANK HOLIDAYS ACT 1972
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
P. M. Jeffery,

Governor.
[L.S.]

} By His Excellency Major General Philip Michael
Jeffery, Companion of the Order of Australia, Officer
of the Order of Australia (Military Division), Military
Cross, Governor of the State of Western Australia.

I, the Governor, acting under section 8 of the Public and Bank Holidays Act 1972
and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, declare that instead of
Monday 27 September 1999, Monday 2 August 1999 shall be the Celebration Day for



1416 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [1 April 1999

the Anniversary of the Birthday of the Reigning Sovereign in 1999, in the area of the
Shire of Roebourne.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 23 March 1999.

By His Excellency’s Command

CHERYL EDWARDES, Minister for Labour Relations.
GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !

AA104

PUBLIC AND BANK HOLIDAYS ACT 1972
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
P. M. Jeffery,

Governor.
[L.S.]

} By His Excellency Major General Philip Michael
Jeffery, Companion of the Order of Australia, Officer
of the Order of Australia (Military Division), Military
Cross, Governor of the State of Western Australia.

I, the Governor, acting under section 8 of the Public and Bank Holidays Act 1972
and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, declare that instead of
Monday 27 September 1999, Monday 16 August 1999 shall be the Celebration Day
for the Anniversary of the Birthday of the Reigning Sovereign in 1999, in the area of
the townsite of Newman and a 150km radius northwards, east and west, from the
townsite and to the southern boundary of the Shire.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 23 March 1999.

By His Excellency’s Command

CHERYL EDWARDES, Minister for Labour Relations.
GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !

AA105

PUBLIC AND BANK HOLIDAYS ACT 1972
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
P. M. Jeffery,

Governor.
[L.S.]

} By His Excellency Major General Philip Michael
Jeffery, Companion of the Order of Australia, Officer
of the Order of Australia (Military Division), Military
Cross, Governor of the State of Western Australia.

I, the Governor, acting under section 8 of the Public and Bank Holidays Act 1972
and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, declare that instead of
Monday 27 September 1999, Monday 4 October 1999 shall be the Celebration Day for
the Anniversary of the Birthday of the Reigning Sovereign in 1999, in the area of the
Shire of Murchison.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 23 March 1999.

By His Excellency’s Command

CHERYL EDWARDES, Minister for Labour Relations.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !



1 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1417

HEALTH

HE301*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Services Charges for Magnetic
Resonance Imaging) Determination Amendment

Notice 1999

Made by the Minister for Health under section 37(3)(af) of the Act
and regulation 5(2) and (3) of the Hospital (Services Charges)
Regulations 1984.

1. Citation

This notice may be cited as the Hospitals (Services Charges for
Magnetic Resonance Imaging) Determination Amendment
Notice 1999.

2. Schedule amended

The Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges for Magnetic
Resonance Imaging) Determination 1996* is amended as
follows:

(a) in item 1, by deleting “$880” and inserting instead —

“    $925    ”;

(b) in item 2, by deleting “$984” and inserting instead —

“    $1 035    ”;

(c) in item 3, by deleting “$1 755” and inserting instead —

“    $1 850    ”;

(d) in item 4, by deleting “$1 859” and inserting instead —

“    $1 950    ”.

[* Published in Gazette 5 March 1996, pp. 829-30.
For amendments to 5 February 1999 see 1997 Index
to Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 145.]

JOHN DAY, Minister for Health.



1418 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [1 April 1999

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG301*

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
CITY OF SOUTH PERTH

LOCAL LAW RELATING TO PUBLIC RESERVE 10250
(Royal Perth Golf Course)

In pursuance of the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and all
other powers enabling it the Council of the abovementioned local government hereby
records having resolved on 24 February 1999, to make the following Local Law.

Short Title.
1. This Local Law may be cited as the Royal Perth Golf Course Local Law 1998.

Commencement.
2. This Local Law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the
Government Gazette.

Content and Intent.
3. This Local Law provides for the safety, convenience and comfort of persons in their
use of Public Reserve 10250 and for good order, management and conduct thereon as
a public reserve and as a private golf course.

Repeal of Previous Local Laws.
4. The By-laws published in the Government Gazette on 3 December 1922, are hereby
repealed.

Interpretation.
5. In this Local Law, unless the context requires otherwise:

“Act” means the Local Government Act of 1995;
“authorised person” means a person authorised by the City under section 9.10 of

the Act for the purposes of these local laws;
“CEO” means the Chief Executive of the City and in the absence of the Chief

Executive, the Acting Chief Executive of the City;
“City” means the City of South Perth;
“Council” means the Council of the City;
“District” means the local government district of the City;
“Gender and number” in these Local Laws shall when denoting a gender or

genders include each other and words in the singular include the plural and
vice versa;

“Golf Course” means the Royal Perth Golf Course established on Public Reserve
10250 pursuant to the Lease, as may be varied from time to time;

“Lease” means the lease entered into between RPGC as lessee and the City as
lessor for that portion of Public Reserve 10250 as described in the Lease and
dated 28 February 1957 and includes all other deeds made between RPGC
and the City in respect of the golf course; as may be varied from time to time

“Reserve” means the land known as Public Reserve No. 10250 vested in the City;
“RPGC” means the Royal Perth Golf Club Inc of Labouchere Road, South Perth;
“Person” and words applying to any person or individual include a body

corporate and the plural a group of persons and a club association or other
body of persons.

Access to the Reserve.
6. The Reserve shall be open to the public at all hours free of charge, but subject to

(a) the restrictions contained in these Local Laws; and
(b) the terms and conditions of the Lease.

Prohibited Activities.
7.1 Subject to, but without being limited to, Clauses 8, 9 and 10, a person must not in
or on the Reserve behave in a manner which is:

(a) likely to interfere with the enjoyment of any person who might use the
Reserve; or

(b) interferes with the enjoyment of any person using the Reserve.
7.2 A person must not behave in or on the Reserve in a way which would be
detrimental to the Reserve or any part of it.
7.3 A person is not to enter or remain on the Reserve while under the influence of
alcohol or a prohibited drug.



1 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1419

7.4 A person is not to sell or attempt to sell alcohol unless permitted under a licence
issued under the Liquor Licensing Act 1998 and by permission of the City.
7.5 A person is not to take any prohibited drug onto or consume or use any
prohibited drug on the Reserve.
7.6 A person must not in or on the Reserve; unless authorised by the City where
appropriate:

(a) use language or behave in a manner which is indecent, offensive or abusive
or which disturbs or interrupts any person’s enjoyment or use of the Reserve;

(b) act in a way which endangers any person;
(c) use any volatile, explosive or flammable matter;
(d) damage, destroy, apply graffiti to, interfere with, remove anything from or

affix anything to the Reserve or any fixture or fitting thereon, walk on flower
beds, borders or putting greens;

(e) unless otherwise authorised in writing by the City or RPGC, damage, cut
prune, lop or remove any tree or portion of any tree, shrub, turf or any other
type of vegetation;

(f) carry firearms unless specifically authorised to do so under the Firearms Act
1973;

(g) shoot, snare, molest, injure or in any way harm or interfere with any animal
without lawful authority or just cause;

(h) drop or deposit any litter of any kind unless into receptacles set aside for
such purposes;

(i) use or operate any siren, starting gun or other device which causes a loud
noise in such a manner so as to cause a nuisance or annoyance to any person
on or in the vicinity of the Reserve;

(j) ride a motor cycle or bicycle;
(k) use or operate any musical instrument, radio or loud speaker in such a

manner as to create excessive noise or so as to cause a nuisance or
annoyance to any person on or in the vicinity of the Reserve;

(l) not bring, ride or drive an animal upon the Reserve or any part of it that is
not set aside by the City as an animal exercise area;

(m) act contrary to any conditions of use for the Reserve set forth in the Lease.

Lease of the Reserve to Royal Perth Golf Club Inc.
8. The Council has granted the Lease of the Reserve to RPGC for the purpose of
establishing, maintaining and operating the golf course and golf club thereon and so
long as the Lease remains in force no activity or game other than golf shall be
undertaken or played on the Reserve.
9. No person shall prevent hamper or interfere with RPGC in the use of the Reserve
as a golf course or prevent RPGC from using the Reserve for any other purpose set
forth in the Lease.
10. No person shall interfere with or compete with any person playing golf on the
Reserve in any manner in commencing playing or carrying on any game other than
golf.
11. While the lease is in force, the only persons permitted to play golf on the reserve
are authorised members of the RPGC and other persons authorised by RPGC.
12. The RPGC shall erect and maintain signs at each nominated entry point to the
reserve and such signs are to be in the form of Schedule 1.

Enforcement.
13. Nothing in these Local Laws shall be construed so as to inhibit or preclude an
employee contractor or agent of the City from carrying out his lawful duties.
14. (a) Any person who fails to do anything required or directed to be done under

these Local Laws , or who does anything which under these Local Laws that
person is prohibited from doing commits an offence;

(b) Any person who commits an offence under these Local Laws is liable, upon
conviction, to the penalty specified in these Local Laws or, if no penalty is
specified, to a penalty not exceeding $5,000 and if the offence is of a
continuing nature, to an additional penalty not exceeding $500 for each day
or part of a day during which the offence has continued.

15. (a) An offence against any provision of these Local Laws is a prescribed offence
for the purposes of Section 9.16 (1) of the Act.

(b) The modified penalty for an offence against any provision of these Local
Laws is $100.

16. For the purposes of these Local Laws:—
(a) the form of the infringement notice referred to in Section 9.17 of the Act is

that of Form 1 in the Third Schedule; and



1420 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [1 April 1999

(b) the form of the notice referred to in Section 9.20 of the Act is that of Form 2
of the Third Schedule.

17. The Council may in writing under the hand of the CEO appoint an officer or
officers to carry out the powers and duties conferred by these Local Laws including
authorisation to serve notices under Part 9 Division 2 Subdivision 2 of the Act and
Part 5 of the Local Government (Functions and General) Regulations.
18. A person shall not hinder or interfere with an officer of the City appointed under
clause 17 of these Local Law in the course of that officer’s duties.
19. It shall be a breach of these Local Law for any person to hinder or interfere with
an officer appointed under Clause 17 of these Local Law acting in the course of a
power or function or duty under these Local Law.
20. An officer appointed under Clause 17 of these Local Laws may remove or cause to
be removed from the Reserve any person who contravenes any provisions of these
Local Law.

Schedule 1

RULES OF ACCESS TO RESERVE
• In accordance with Royal Perth Golf Course Local Law 1998, all persons entering

onto this Reserve do so at their own risk and assume full responsibility for their
own safety and property.

• Be aware of the danger of entering onto this Reserve whilst golf is being played.
• A person entering onto this Reserve must not behave in a manner which would be

detrimental to the Reserve, other users and all improvements hereon, or cause
nuisance which in accordance with the Local Law constitutes an offence for which
offenders may be prosecuted.

• The playing of golf without permission of the Royal Perth Golf Club is prohibited.
• Copies of the Royal Perth Golf Course Local Law 1998 are available on request

from the City of South Perth by telephoning 9474 0777.

Dated 23rd March, 1999.
The Common Seal of the City of South Perth was hereunto affixed in the presence
of:—

J. E. HARDWICK, JP, Mayor.
L. L. METCALF, Chief Executive.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 14211 April 1999]

— PART 2 —

ELECTORAL COMMISSION

EL401
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

ORDINARY ELECTIONS
Shire of Exmouth and Shire of Moora

Notice is hereby given in accordance with section 4.7(2) of the Local Government Act 1995 that the
date fixed for the ordinary Local Government Election in the Shire of Exmouth and the Shire of Moora
will be Saturday 29 May 1999.
Pursuant to section 4.7(4) of the Local Government Act 1995, Nomination Day in conjunction with the
ordinary election to be held in the Shire of Exmouth and the Shire of Moora will now end at 4.00 pm on
Thursday 29 April 1999.

Dr K. W. EVANS, Electoral Commissioner.

HERITAGE COUNCIL

HR401*
GOVERNMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990
NOTICE OF ENTRY OF PLACES IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES

Notice is hereby given in accordance with Section 51(2) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, the places described in Schedule 1 have
been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect from today.

Schedule 1

Name Location Description of Place

Merredin Post Office Cnr Barrack & Bates Lot 101 on Diagram 74773, being the whole of
Group Streets, Merredin the land comprised in Certificate of Title

Volume 1843 Folio 928.  Lot 102 on Diagram
74773, being the whole of the land comprised in
Certificate of Title Volume 1822 Folio 128.

The Rocks 182-188 Grey Street, Albany Lots 1475, 1476 and 1477, being the
Albany whole of the land comprised in Certificates of

Title Volume 2147 Folios 368 to 370 respectively.
Uniting Church, Broome 26 Anne Street, Cnr Broome Town Lot 199, being the whole of the

Robinson Street, land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 883
Broome Folio 14.

Wanerenooka Mine Site North-West Coastal Those parts of:  Northampton Lot 346, being the
Highway at the whole of the land comprised in Certificate of
northern boundary of Title Volume 1229 Folio 303; Victoria Location
Northampton Townsite 321, being part of the land comprised in

Country Enrolment EC 1152 in the Registry Of
Deeds; Northampton Lot 468, being part of
Crown Reserve 40683 and being part of the land
comprised in Crown Land Record Volume 3054
Folio 517; Northampton Lot 470, being a part
of Crown Reserve 23472 and being part of
the land comprised in Crown Land Record
Volume 3054 Folio 523; Northampton lot 467,
being Crown Reserve 40684 and being the whole
of the land comprised in Crown Land Record
Volume 3054 Folio 513; Lot 20 the subject of
Diagram 94695, being the whole of the land
comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 2142
Folio 848, as together are defined in HCWA
survey drawing No 4658 prepared by Steffanoni
Ewing & Cruickshank Pt. Ltd.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [1 April 19991422

Pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, notice is hereby given in accordance with Sec-
tion 49(1) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 that it is proposed that the places described in
Schedule 2 be entered in the Register of Heritage Places.  The Heritage Council invites submissions on
the proposal; submissions must be in writing and should be forwarded to the following address not
later than 14th May 1999.

The Director, Office of the Heritage Council
108 Adelaide Terrace, East Perth WA  6004

The places will be entered in the Register on an interim basis with effect from today.

Schedule 2

Name Location Description of Place

18 & 20 Howard Street 18 & 20 Howard Street, That part of Lot 11 on Diagram 67595, being
Perth part of the land comprised in Certificate of Title

Volume 2025 Folio 787 as is defined in HCWA
survey drawing No 2023 prepared by Steffanoni
Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd

Cottage, Old Balcatta 23 Old Balcatta Road, That part of Lot 95 on Plan 4595 (sheet 1),
Road Carine being part of the land comprised in Certificate

of Title Volume 1897 Folio 510 as is defined in
HCWA survey drawing No. 3442 prepared by
Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd.

Lindsay Street Flour 10-12 Lindsay Street, Lot 152 on Plan 594, being the whole of the land
Mill & Bakery Northbridge comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 1552

Folio 15.  Lot 153 on Plan 594, being the whole
of the land comprised in Certificate of Title
Volume 1552 Folio 14.

Lynwood 18 Great Northern Lot 3 on Diagram 12721, being the whole of the
Highway, Middle Swan land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume

1885 Folio 407.

Moora Post Office & Cnr Padbury & Lot 25 on Diagram 73999, being the whole of
Quarters Dandaragan Streets, the land comprised in Certificate of Title

Moora Volume 1814 Folio 783.

No. 3 Pumping Station Forrest Street, Cunderdin Lots 388 and 409, being Crown
Cunderdin Reserve 31433 and being the whole of the land

comprised in Crown Land Record Volume 3027
Folio 530.

Old Council Offices 111 Millpoint Road, Perth Suburban Lot 444, being Crown Reserve
South Perth 28021 and being the whole of the land comprised

in Crown Land Record Volume 3060 Folio 644.

NOTICE OF ADVICE REGARDING REGISTRATION OF CROWN PROPERTY
In accordance with the requirements of Section 47 (5) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act, the
Heritage Council hereby gives notice that it has advised the Minister for Heritage that the places
listed in Schedule 3 should be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on an interim basis.  The
Heritage Council hereby gives notice of the interim registration and invites submissions on the mat-
ter; submissions must be in writing and should be forwarded to the following address not later than
14th May 1999.

The Director, Office of the Heritage Council
108 Adelaide Terrace East Perth  WA  6004

The places listed in Schedule 3 are vested in the Crown, or in a person on behalf of the Crown, in right
of the State.

Schedule 3

Name Location Description of Place

151-165 Beaufort Street 151-165 Beaufort Street, Portion of Perth Town Lot Y66, being the whole
Perth of the land comprised in Certificate of Title

Volume 1356 Folio 354.

Houses, 1 Museum 1 Museum Street, That portion of Perth Lot 1009, being a part of
Street Northbridge Crown Reserve 37585 and being part of the land

comprised in Crown Land Record Volume 3024
Folio 423 as is defined in HCWA survey draw-
ing No 2081 prepared by Steffanoni Ewing &
Cruickshank Pty Ltd.

Dated this 1st day of April 1999.

IAN BAXTER, Director, Office of the Heritage Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 14231 April 1999]

JUSTICE

JM401
JUSTICES ACT 1902

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of—

Mr Ian Douglas Astill of Lot 35 Blain Street, Moorumbine via Pingelly
Mr Walter Laurence King of Kings Road, Perenjori
Mrs Barbara Elizabeth Mander of Lot 33 Woodlands Way, Quindalup
Mr John Lonsdale Newton of 6 Scott Street, Gascoyne Junction

to the office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia.

RICHARD FOSTER, Executive Director, Court Services.

JM402
CHILDREN’S COURT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1988

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of the following person as a Member of the Children’s Court of Western
Australia—

Mr Martyn Lawrence Clarke-Smith of 7 Ridley Street, Cuballing
Mrs Patricia Catherine Gunning of 38 Ballagin Road, Wagin
Mr Paul Arthur Summerfield of House 28 West Island, Cocos (Keeling) Islands

RICHARD FOSTER, Executive Director, Court Services.

JM403
DECLARATIONS AND ATTESTATIONS ACT 1913

It is hereby notified for public information that the Hon Attorney General has approved the appoint-
ment of the following persons as Commissioners for Declarations under the Declarations and Attestations
Act 1913—

Mr Frederick George Bloffwitch of 7 Tamblyn Close, Woodvale
Mrs Beverley Joy Penny of “Korrawilla” Quairading Road, Greenhills via York

RICHARD FOSTER, Executive Director, Court Services.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG402
SHIRE OF PERENJORI

Fire Control Officers
Notice is hereby given pursuant to section 38 of the Bush Fires Act that the following is a list of Fire
Control Officers appointment for their respective brigades, all other appointments are hereby can-
celled.

Chief Fire Control Officer W. L. King
Perenjori B. R. Thompson

T. G. Bonora
G. L. Pridham

Maya/Latham Town R. Anderson
Maya/Latham M. P. Harrington
Bowgada West L. S. Sutherland
Bowgada East B. T. Baxter
Perenjori West I. F. West
Perenjori East N. G. Hamilton
Caron West H. G. James
Caron East W. L. King

B. R. THOMPSON, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [1 April 19991424

MINERALS AND ENERGY

MN401
MINING ACT 1978

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE

Department of Minerals and Energy,
Mt Magnet, 16th March 1999.

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Act 1978, notice is hereby given that the licences
are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) for breach of covenant, viz.
non-payment of rent.

J. PACKINGTON, Warden.

To be heard in the Warden’s Court, Mt Magnet on the 18th May 1999.

MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD

Mt Magnet District
P58/834—Leyland, Michael Terrence; Southern, Donald Charles
P58/955—Hudson, Harry John; Loughnan, James Thomas
P58/956—Hudson, Harry John; Loughnan, James Thomas

PARLIAMENT

PA401*
PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

Bills Assented To

It is hereby notified for public information that the Deputy of the Governor has Assented in the name
and on behalf of Her Majesty the Queen, on the dates shown, to the undermentioned Bills passed by
the Legislative Council and the Legislative Assembly during the Second Session of the Thirty-Fifth
Parliament.

Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No
Friendly Societies (Taxing) Bill 1999 25 March 1999 1 of 1999
Friendly Societies (Western Australia) Bill 1999 25 March 1999 2 of 1999
Transfer of Land Amendment Bill 1999 25 March 1999 3 of 1999
Soil and Land Conservation Amendment Bill 1999 25 March 1999 4 of 1999

L. B. MARQUET, Clerk of the Parliaments.
March 30, 1999.

PREMIER AND CABINET

PR401
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with section 52(1)(b) of the
Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment in the place of the Hon
P. G. Foss MLC in the period 26 March to 1 April 1999 inclusive—

Minister for Justice; the Arts—Hon A. K. R. Prince MLA
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General,
Ministry of the Premier and Cabinet.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 14251 April 1999]

PR402
SUPREME COURT ACT 1935

DESIGNATION OF ACTING ATTORNEY GENERAL ORDER (No. 2) 1999

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council under section 154(3) and (4).

The Honourable Antony Kevin Royston Prince is designated for the purposes of section 154 of the
Supreme Court Act 1935 as the Minister of the Crown—

(a) who may exercise the powers referred to in subsection (3) of that section; and

(b) by, to or with reference to whom acts may be done under subsection (4) of that section,

during the period from 25 March to 1 April 1999 (both dates inclusive).

By His Excellency’s Command,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Council.

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ101
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

Notice to Creditors and Claimants
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their claims
to me on or before 2 May 1999, after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, having regard
only to the claims of which I then have notice.

Ablett, Thomas Howard, late of 253b Berwick Street, Victoria Park, died 15/3/99. (DEC 317978 DC3)

Botica, Kathleen, late of 366 Carrington Street, Hamilton Hill, died 27/2/99. (DEC 317896 DL3)

Churchill, Moira Katherine, late of Murray River Nursing Home, Boundary Road, Mandurah, died
11/3/99. (DEC 317920 DC4)

Eichner, Josephine Maria, late of 14 Woodmore Road, Langford, died 3/3/99. (DEC 317952 DS2)

Finlay, Benjamin, late of 6/62 King George Street, Victoria Park, died 11/3/99. (DEC 317897 DP3)

Harris, Martha, late of Amaroo Nursing Home, 74 Lissiman Street, Gosnells, died 8/3/99. (DEC 318077
DL4)

Johnson, Edna, late of St David’s Retirement Village, Lawley Crescent, Mount Lawley, died 14/3/99.
(DEC 318004 DL3)

Jolley, Patricia Joy, late of 69A Redcliffe Avenue, Balga, died 21/3/99. (DEC 317986 DS3)

Kerr, William Langford, late of Unit 19 Ocean Gardens Village, 60 Kalinda Drive, City Beach, died
20/3/99. (DEC 318018 DA2)

Latham, Maurice Arthur, late of Lot 9A Djargween Road, Broome, died 4/2/99 (DEC 318042 DC2)

McArthur, Bruce Love Lord Jesus, late of Tanderra Hostel, 64 Guildford Road, Mount Lawley, died
5/12/98. (DEC 315741 DL4)

Mitchell, Henry Walter, also known as Mitchell, Harold Walter, late of 14 Dawson Way, Parmelia, died
8/2/99. (DEC 317603 DG2)

Paulett, Peter William, late of 1, Palm Beach Caravan Park, 37 Fisher Street, Rockingham, died
23/12/98. (DEC 316908 DS3)

Saunders, Bernard Raymond, late of 8 Arrochar Court, Hamersley, died 4/3/99. (DEC 318024 DC4)

Sheradski, Irene, late of 91 Crawford Road, Maylands, died 12/3/99. (DEC 317857 DA2)

Silver, Ernest, late of 30 Swan Street, Guildford, died 24/2/99. (DEC 317499 DC4)

Taylor, Doris Alma, late of 8 Indle Street, Willagee, died 3/2/99. (DEC 317744 DG3)

Wasilewski, Jan, late of 41 Laurie Street, Belmont, died 13/3/99. (DEC 318040 DG2)

Webber, Eva, late of Midland Nursing Home, 44 John Street, Midland, died 16/3/99. (DEC 317934
DS3)

Williams, Ronald Ernest, late of U18/12 Lavina Crescent, Coolbellup, died 13/3/99. (DEC 318093 DL4)

K. E. BRADLEY, Public Trustee,
Public Trust Office,

565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000.
Telephone 9222 6777



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [1 April 19991426

ZZ401
NOTICE OF DISSOLUTION OF PARTNERSHIP

Notice is hereby given that the partnership previously subsisting between us the undersigned carry-
ing on business as food processing, manufacturing, importing and exporting at Unit 1, 6 Zeta Crescent,
O’Connor, Western Australia, under the style or firm of “Flying Swan Manufacturing” has been dis-
solved by mutual consent as from the 30th day of June 1998 so far as concerns the said Sy Suan Pty
Ltd (ACN 074 873 751) who retires from the said firm. All debts due to and owing by the said firm will
be received and paid respectively by Allcrest Nominees Pty Ltd (ACN 074 827 142) and Swanmist
Enterprises Pty Ltd (ACN 073 999 836) who will continue to carry on the said business in partnership
under the style or firm of “Flying Swan Manufacturing”.

Common Seal ROBINSON SY SUAN, Signed for and on behalf of
Sy Suan Pty Ltd (ACN 074 873 751).

Common Seal LAURENCE RIEMER, Signed for and on behalf of
Allcrest Nominees Pty Ltd (ACN 074 827 142).

Common Seal NORBERT RIEMER, Signed for and on behalf of
Swanmist Enterprises Pty Ltd (ACN 073 999 836).

ZZ402
TRAVEL COMPENSATION FUND

SERVICE OF NOTICES
Trust Deed Cl. 26

A notice to the Board of the Travel Compensation Fund is duly given if it is—
(a) delivered or sent by prepaid post to the Fund’s postal address at 4th Floor, 303 Pitt Street,

Sydney, New South Wales 2000; or
(b) sent by facsimile to the Fund’s facsimile at (02) 9267 2100.

A notice that is proved to have been properly addressed and posted is taken to have been delivered to
the Fund on the third day after the day on which it was posted.
A notice sent to the Fund’s facsimile address is taken to have been delivered on the next business day
after it was sent.

19 March 1999. CARLO C. BRATTONI, Chief Executive Officer,
Travel Compensation Fund.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 14271 April 1999]

PERTH OBSERVATORY

THE W.A. SPECIALISTS IN
ASTRONOMICAL

Research & Educational Astronomy
PUBLIC TOURS (DAY & NIGHT)

FIELD NIGHTS, LECTURES
Astronomical Information

Astronomical Handbook
Sun rise & set; Moon rise & set

Legal advice
Chronometer calibration
Astronomical souvenirs

SERVING WESTERN AUSTRALIA SINCE 1896

WALNUT ROAD, BICKLEY 6076
TELEPHONE 9293 8255 FAX 9293 8138

ASTRONOMY IS LOOKING UP



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [1 April 19991428

!199900053GG!

NURSES RULES 1993
*Price: $6.70 Counter Sales

Plus Postage on 80 grams

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

NURSES ACT 1992
*Price: $6.70 Counter Sales

Plus Postage on 150 grams

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

Subscription rates: $
Within WA 260.00
Interstate 305.00
Overseas (airmail) 433.00

1999 Gazettes on CD ROM 260.00
1998 also available on CD ROM 260.00

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly during
parliamentary sessions.

Subscription rates: $
Within WA 317.00
Interstate 371.00
Overseas (airmail) 731.00

Bound Volumes of Hansard:
Within WA 500.00
Interstate 533.00

All 1999 Hansards on CD ROM 500.00

STATUTES
Bound Statutes: $

Within WA 223.00
Interstate 246.00
Overseas 251.00

Half Calf Bound Statutes 612.00

1999 Bound Volumes on CD ROM 223.00

Loose Statutes:
Within WA 231.00
Interstate 239.00
Overseas (airmail) 346.00

Sessional Bills
Within WA 215.00
Interstate 224.00
Overseas (airmail) 336.00

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is searchable.
Other CD ROM products with legislation or other
statutory information can be packaged to individual
requirements. Prices are available on request.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
Government Gazettes are published on Tuesday
and Friday of each week, unless disrupted by public
holidays or unforeseen circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.
Subscriptions have been changed this year to enable
clients to subscribe to either General or Special
Gazettes, or to all Gazettes published.

Subscription rates: $
General Gazettes only

Within WA 395.00
Interstate 420.00
Overseas (airmail) 550.00

Special Gazettes only
Within WA 415.00
Interstate 440.00
Overseas (airmail) 570.00

All Gazettes
Within WA 595.00
Interstate 616.00
Overseas (airmail) 914.00
Bound Volumes of full year 891.00

1999 Gazettes on CD ROM 600.00
1998 also available on CD ROM 600.00

STATE LAW PUBLISHER
SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 1999

All subscriptions run from 1 January to 31 December 1999. Our policy is that no refunds or credits will
be given if a subscription is cancelled during the year. The prices quoted include postage by surface mail
unless stated otherwise.


