
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

1709

PERTH, FRIDAY, 23 APRIL 1999  No. 70
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Fish Resources Management Act 1994—Fish Resources Management Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 1999................................................................................................ 1716

Local Government Act 1995—
  Local Government (Administration) Amendment Regulations 1999 .......................... 1717-21
  Local Government (Audit) Amendment Regulations 1999 .......................................... 1722-5
Proclamation—Control of Vehicles (Off-Road Areas) Act 1978....................................... 1711-2
Veterinary Preparations and Animal Feeding Stuffs Act 1976—Stock (Control of

Hormonal Growth Promotants) Amendment Regulations 1999 .................................. 1712-5

———

PART 2

Agriculture ......................................................................................................................... 1726
Health................................................................................................................................. 1726-7
Heritage Council ................................................................................................................ 1727-8
Justice ................................................................................................................................ 1728-9
Local Government.............................................................................................................. 1729-31
Minerals and Energy ......................................................................................................... 1731-3
Planning............................................................................................................................. 1733-40
Premier and Cabinet ......................................................................................................... 1740
Public Notices .................................................................................................................... 1742-3
Racing, Gaming and Liquor .............................................................................................. 1741
Tourism .............................................................................................................................. 1741
Water.................................................................................................................................. 1741-2

NEW FORMAT FOR GENERAL GOVERNMENT GAZETTES
For ease of access to particular notices the general Gazette will be divided into two parts as
detailed below. In each part, the notices will appear in alphabetical order of the authorising
Department.

Part 1 will contain Proclamations, Regulations, Rules, Local Laws and various other
Instruments etc. but not Town Planning Schemes.

Part 2 will contain general notices and information and Town Planning Schemes.



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial, State Law Publisher, 10
William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised beforehand on the inside cover).

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 1998.

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$17.70

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$41.30

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$41.30 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these instances
arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
  Per Column Centimetre—$8.15

  Bulk Notices—$153.00 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.
• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they

fall on a Tuesday or Friday.
In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



23 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1711

—   PART  1  —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA101*

CONTROL OF VEHICLES (OFF-ROAD AREAS) ACT 1978
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
David K. Malcolm,

Lieutenant-Governor and
Administrator

[L.S.]

} By His Excellency the Honourable David Kingsley
Malcolm, Companion of the Order of Australia,
Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator of the State
of Western Australia.

I, the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, acting under section 4(3) of the
Control of Vehicles (Off-road areas) Act 1978 and with the advice and consent of the
Executive Council, do hereby vary the proclamation published in the Government
Gazette on 5 October 1979 at pages 3079-80 and varied from time to time thereafter
by inserting, in the Schedule after Part 27, the following Parts—
“

PART 28
All that portion of land comprising the Kalgoorlie Townsite as promulgated
in the Government Gazette of—

25 October 1957, p. 2977;
11 January 1963, p. 242;
10 April 1964, p. 1904;
24 May 1968, p. 1552;
16 July 1971, p. 2571;
17 March 1972, p. 636;
27 September 1974, p. 3574;
10 March 1978, p. 695;
6 June 1980, p. 1679;
24 September 1982, p. 3798;
4 November 1983, p. 4443;
20 January 1984, p. 152;
14 December 1984, p. 4136;
15 February 1985, p. 595;
31 May 1985, p. 1889;
20 September 1985, p. 3757;
11 April 1986, p. 1391;
1 June 1990, p. 2522;
25 January 1994, p. 258; and
17 May 1994, p. 2076.
Department of Land Administration Public Plans:
CF37 (10) 6.8;
CF37 (2) 27.35, 27.36, 28.35, 28.36, 28.37, 28.38, 28.39, 28.40, 29.35,
29.36, 29.37, 29.38, 29.39, 29.40, 30.36, 30.37, 30.38 & 30.39.

PART 29
All that portion of land comprising the Boulder Townsite as promulgated in
the Government Gazette of—

15 June 1990, p. 2749;
1 November 1991, p. 5619; and
21 December 1993, p. 6739.
Department of Land Administration Public Plans:
CF37 (10) 7.7;
CF37 (2) 29.33, 29.34, 29.35, 29.36, 30.33, 30.34, 30.35 & 30.36.

PART 30
All that portion of land comprising the Port Hedland Townsite as
promulgated in the Government Gazette of—

28 August 1970, p. 2747;
27 August 1971, p. 3150;
30 March 1972, p. 737;
18 April 1975, p. 1171;
23 July 1976, p. 2540;
27 April 1979, p. 1092;



1712 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 1999

25 February 1983, p. 662;
18 March 1983, p. 878;
13 July 1984, p. 2103;
16 May 1986, p. 1665;
4 May 1990, p. 2163;
26 April 1991, p. 1869;
27 June 1995, p. 2571; and
31 October 1995, p. 5132.
Department of Land Administration Public Plans:
BL66 (10) 5.5, 5.6, 5.7 & Pt 4.7, 6.5, 6.6 & 6.7;
BL66 (2) 23.33, 23.34, 24.26, 24.27, 24.28, 24.33, 24.34, 25.21, 25.22,
25.23, 25.24, 25.25, 25.26, 25.27, 25.33, 25.34, 26.21, 26.22, 26.23 &
26.24.

”.
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 20 April 1999.
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator,

PAUL D. OMODEI, Minister for Local Government.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN!

AGRICULTURE

AG301*

Veterinary Preparations and Animal Feeding Stuffs Act 1976

Stock (Control of Hormonal Growth
Promotants) Amendment Regulations 1999

Made by the Lieutenant Governor and Administrator in Executive
Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Stock (Control of
Hormonal Growth Promotants) Amendment Regulations 1999.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Stock (Control
of Hormonal Growth Promotants) Regulations 1994*.

[* Published in Gazette 24 June 1994, pp. 2820-9.
For amendments to 29 March 1999 see 1997 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 277 and Gazette
30 October 1998.]

3. Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3(1) is amended as follows:

(a) in the definition of “Form” by deleting “the Schedule”
and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 2    ”;



23 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1713

(b) by inserting after the definition of “Form” the following
definition —

“
“property identification number”  means a unique

number, or combination of numerals and letters,
allocated by the Department, that identifies a farm,
station, or other property, on which stock are kept
from time to time;

    ”;

(c) by inserting after the definition of “approved” the
following definition —

“
“Department”  means the department in the Public

Service principally assisting the Minister in the
administration of the Act;

    ”;

(d) by deleting the definition of “the Director”.

4. Regulation 6 inserted

After regulation 5 the following regulation is inserted —

“
6. Retail purchasers of HGPs

(1) A person who purchases a Hormonal Growth
Promotant from a retail seller shall give the seller a
declaration in accordance with regulation 48 of the
Agvet Regulations of Western Australia (as defined in
the Agricultural and Veterinary Chemical (Western
Australia) Act 1995) unless the person is a person to
whom regulation 48(2) of those regulations applies.

(2) A purchaser who gives a retail seller a declaration
under subregulation (1) shall retain, in a place of safe
custody, a copy of the declaration for 3 years after the
date of the purchase.

    ”.

5. Regulation 19 amended

(1) Regulation 19(1) is repealed and the following subregulations
are inserted instead —

“
(1) An owner of stock who proposes to sell, or to consign

for sale, any stock that are to be declared untreated with
a prescribed substance at any time in the life of the
stock shall —

(a) in accordance with subregulation (1a) obtain
pink tags on each of which is printed —

(i) “HGP Free”;



1714 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 1999

(ii) the property identification number of the
property of origin of the stock; and

(iii) a serial number that is unique among the
pink tags for that property;

(b) apply the tags to the stock before they are
transported for sale; and

(c) give the purchaser a declaration in the form of
Form 5 except where the stock is purchased by
a person at a saleyard or for immediate
slaughter.

(1a) An owner of stock shall not obtain such tags other than
from —

(a) the Department; or

(b) if authorized by the Department, another
supplier.

(1b) The Department shall not supply an owner of stock
with such tags, or authorize an owner to obtain such
tags from another supplier, unless the owner has
supplied the Department with a signed declaration in
the form of Form 4.

    ”.

(2) Regulation 19(2) is amended by deleting “subregulation
(1)(a)(i)” and inserting instead —

“    subregulation (1b)    ”.

(3) Regulation 19(3) is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting “stating”;

(b) by deleting paragraphs (a) to (c) and inserting instead —

 “

(a) stating the number and description of the stock;

(b) the property identification number of the
property of origin of the stock; and

(c) stating that the stock are identified with pink
tags to indicate that they are untreated stock.

    ”.

6. Regulation 20 amended

Regulation 20 is amended by deleting paragraphs (a) and (b)
and inserting instead —

“

(a) place a tag on any stock that indicates the stock
is free of Hormonal Growth Promotants unless



23 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1715

the person knows that the stock has never been
treated with Hormonal Growth Promotants;

(ab) place a tag on any stock that indicates that the
stock is free of Hormonal Growth Promotants
unless the tag has been obtained under
regulation 19;

(b) use a tag obtained under regulation 19 contrary
to the declaration given under that regulation;

    ”.

7. Schedule 2 amended

(1) Schedule 2, Form 4, is amended as follows:

(a) in the heading by deleting “TAIL”;

(b) by deleting “the pink (Hormonal Growth Promotants
Free) tail tags” and inserting instead —

“
pink tags indicating that the stock are free of Hormonal
Growth Promotants (HGPs)

    ”;

(c) in paragraph (1) by deleting “(Hormonal Growth
Promotants Free) tail tags supplied under” and inserting
instead —

“
tags with “HGP Free” written on them obtained by me as a
result of

    ”;

(d) in paragraph (1) by deleting “(HGP’s)” and inserting
instead —

“    (HGPs)    ”;

(e) in paragraph (2) by deleting “(Hormonal Growth
Promotants Free) tail”.

(2) Schedule 2, Form 5, is amended by deleting “REGISTERED
TAIL TAG NUMBER” and inserting instead —

“
PROPERTY IDENTIFICATION NUMBER OF THE
PROPERTY OF ORIGIN OF THE STOCK (AS ON PINK
TAGS)

    ”.

By Command of the Lieutenant Governor and Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



1716 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 1999

FISHERIES

FI301*

Fish Resources Management Act 1994

Fish Resources Management Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 1999

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive
Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Fish Resources
Management Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 1999.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Fish Resources
Management Regulations 1995*.
[* Published in Gazette 29 September 1995, pp. 4503-646.

For amendments to 12 April 1999 see 1998 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 98-9, and 
Gazette 26 March 1999.]

3. Schedule 5 amended

Schedule 5 is amended by inserting before the item “Grass
Carp” the following item —

“    Black Striped Mussel    ”.

4. Schedule 7 amended

Schedule 7 is amended under the heading “MOLLUSCS” and
the sub-heading “BIVALVES” by inserting after the item that
has the common name “Mussel” the following item —

“

Mussel, Black Striped . . . . . . . . . Mytilopsis and
Congeria spp.

    ”.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



23 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1717

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG301*

Local Government Act 1995

Local Government (Administration)
Amendment Regulations 1999

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive
Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Local Government
(Administration) Amendment Regulations 1999.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Local
Government (Administration) Regulations 1996*.
[* Published in Gazette 24 June 1996, pp. 2799-826.

For amendments to 1 April 1999 see 1997 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 169.]

3. Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3(1) is amended by inserting in alphabetical order
the following definition —

“
“code of conduct” means a code of conduct prepared

or adopted under section 5.103(1);
    ”.

4. Regulation 11 amended

After regulation 11(d) the following paragraph is inserted —

“
(da) written reasons for each decision made at the

meeting that is significantly different from the
relevant written recommendation of a
committee or an employee as defined in
section 5.70 (but not a decision to only note the
matter or to return the recommendation for
further consideration);

    ”.

5. Regulation 20 amended

Regulation 20(1) is amended by deleting “$2 000” and inserting
instead —

“    $10 000    ”.



1718 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 1999

6. Regulation 21 amended

After regulation 21(2) the following subregulations are
inserted —

“
(3) An interest of a relevant person that arises during the

time allocated for the public’s questions (s. 5.24) is an
interest for the purposes of section 5.63(1)(h).

(4) If, during the time allocated for the public’s questions,
a question relating to a matter in which a relevant
person has an interest is directed to that person then
that person is to —

(a) declare that he or she has an interest in the
matter; and

(b) allow another council member or employee to
respond to the question on behalf of the local
government.

    ”.

7. Regulation 25 amended

Regulation 25 is amended by inserting after “$500” —

“
for an annual return (s. 5.76) lodged before
1 January 2000 and $200 for an annual return lodged
on or after that time

    ”.

8. Regulation 26 amended

Regulation 26 is amended by inserting after “$500” —

“
for an annual return (s. 5.76) lodged before
1 January 2000 and $200 for an annual return lodged
on or after that time

    ”.

9. Regulation 29 amended

After regulation 29(1)(b) the following paragraphs are
inserted —

“
(ba) the information contained in an electoral gift

register established and maintained under
regulation 30G(1) of the Local Government
(Elections) Regulations 1997;

(bb) the information contained in a register of token
gifts referred to in regulation 34B(3);

    ”.



23 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1719

10. Regulation 30 amended

(1) Regulation 30(1)(b) is amended by deleting “$100” and
inserting instead —

“    $120    ”.

(2) Regulation 30(2)(b) is amended by deleting “$50” and inserting
instead —

“    $60    ”.

(3) Regulation 30(3) is amended by deleting “$5 000” and inserting
instead —

“    $6 000    ”.

(4) Regulation 30(4)(b) is amended by deleting “$200” and
inserting instead —

“    $240    ”.

(5) Regulation 30(5) is amended by deleting “$10 000” and
inserting instead —

“    $12 000    ”.

11. Regulation 33 amended

Regulation 33(1) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “entertainment” and
inserting instead —

“    local government    ”;

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “entertainment” and
inserting instead —

“    local government    ”;

(c) in paragraph (b) by inserting after “amount” —

“    , but in any case no more than $60 000    ”.

12. Regulation 33A inserted

After regulation 33 the following regulation is inserted —

“
33A. Annual local government allowance for deputies —

s. 5.98A

For the purposes of section 5.98A(1) the prescribed
percentage is 25%.

    ”.

13. Regulation 34 amended

(1) Regulation 34(1)(b) is amended by deleting “$5 000” and
inserting instead —

“    $6 000    ”.



1720 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 1999

(2) Regulation 34(2)(b) is amended by deleting “$10 000” and
inserting instead —

“    $12 000    ”.

14. Regulations 34A, 34B and 34C inserted

After regulation 34 the following regulations are inserted —

“
34A. Allowances in lieu of reimbursement of

telecommunications expenses — s. 5.99A

For the purposes of section 5.99A(b), the maximum
total annual allowance for telephone and facsimile
machine rental charges referred to in
regulation 31(1)(a) and any other telecommunications
expenses that might otherwise have been approved for
reimbursement under regulation 32 is $2 000.

34B. Codes of conduct (token gifts) — s. 5.103(3)

(1) In this regulation —

“gift”  does not include —

(a) a gift from a relative as defined in
section 5.74(1);

(b) a gift as defined in regulation 30A of the
Local Government (Elections) Regulations 1997;

“token gift”  means a gift of, or below, a value
specified by the particular local government.

(2) A code of conduct is to contain a requirement that a
council member or an employee cannot accept a gift,
other than a token gift, from a person who is
undertaking, or is likely to undertake, business —

(a) that requires the person to obtain any
authorization from the local government;

(b) by way of contract between the person and the
local government; or

(c) by way of providing any service to the local
government.

(3) A code of conduct is to contain a requirement that the
CEO is to keep a register of token gifts that are
recorded under subregulation (4).

(4) A code of conduct is to contain a requirement that a
council member or an employee who accepts a token
gift from a person referred to in subregulation (2) is,
subject to subregulation (5), to record —

(a) the names of the persons who gave, and
received, the token gift;



23 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1721

(b) the date of receipt of the token gift; and

(c) a description, and the estimated value, of the
token gift.

(5) If the particular local government decides that —

(a) a specified thing given by way of hospitality; or

(b) a thing given by way of hospitality that belongs
to a specified class of things,

does not need to be recorded under subregulation (4),
the specified thing, and things belonging to the
specified class, do not need to be so recorded.

34C. Codes of conduct (disclosure of interests affecting
impartiality) — s. 5.103(3)

(1) In this regulation —

“employee” has the meaning given by section 5.70;

“interest”  means an interest that would give rise to a
reasonable belief that the impartiality of the person
having the interest would be adversely affected but
does not include an interest as referred to in
section 5.60.

(2) A code of conduct is to contain a requirement that a
council member or an employee is to disclose any
interest that he or she has in any matter to be discussed
at a council or committee meeting that will be attended
by the member or employee.

(3) A code of conduct is to contain a requirement that a
council member or an employee is to disclose any
interest that he or she has in any matter to be discussed
at a council or committee meeting in respect of which
the member or employee has given, or will give,
advice.

(4) A code of conduct is to contain a requirement that
disclosure of an interest under subregulation (2) or (3)
is to be made at the meeting immediately before the
matter is discussed or at the time the advice is given,
and is to be recorded in the minutes of the relevant
meeting.

    ”.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



1722 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 1999

LG302*

Local Government Act 1995

Local Government (Audit) Amendment
Regulations 1999

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive
Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Local Government (Audit)
Amendment Regulations 1999.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Local
Government (Audit) Regulations 1996*.
[* Published in Gazette 24 June 1996, pp. 2827-32.]

3. Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3 is amended by inserting after the definition of
“Australian Accounting Standards” the following definition —

“
“compliance audit”  means an audit of compliance

with the statutory requirements prescribed by
regulation 13;

    ”.

4. Regulation 13 replaced

Regulation 13 is repealed and the following regulations are
inserted instead —

“

13. Statutory requirements to be the subject of
compliance audit — s. 7.13(i)

For the purposes of section 7.13(i) the statutory
requirements set forth in the Table to this regulation are
prescribed.

Table

Local Government Act 1995

s. 2.25
s. 2.29
s. 3.12
s. 3.16
s. 3.18
s. 3.32
s. 3.50
s. 3.51

s. 3.52(4)
s. 3.57
s. 3.58(3) and (4)
s. 3.59(2), (4) and (5)
s. 4.20(2), (4) and (5)
s. 4.32(6)
s. 4.39(2)
s. 4.41

s. 4.43(1)
s. 4.47
s. 4.61(2) and (3)
s. 4.64
s. 5.4
s. 5.5
s. 5.7
s. 5.8



23 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1723

Table—continued

Local Government Act 1995—continued

s. 5.10
s. 5.12
s. 5.15
s. 5.16
s. 5.17
s. 5.18
s. 5.21
s. 5.22
s. 5.23
s. 5.24
s. 5.27
s. 5.29(1)
s. 5.32
s. 5.33
s. 5.36(4)
s. 5.37(2) and (3)
s. 5.38
s. 5.39
s. 5.42
s. 5.43
s. 5.44(2)
s. 5.45(1)(b)
s. 5.46
s. 5.50

s. 5.53
s. 5.54
s. 5.55
s. 5.56
s. 5.57
s. 5.58
s. 5.67
s. 5.68(2)
s. 5.73
s. 5.75
s. 5.76
s. 5.77
s. 5.88
s. 5.94
s. 5.95
s. 5.96
s. 5.98
s. 5.99
s. 5.100
s. 5.103
s. 6.2
s. 6.4
s. 6.8
s. 6.9

s. 6.11
s. 6.12
s. 6.13
s. 6.17(3)
s. 6.19
s. 6.20
s. 6.21
s. 6.33(3)
s. 6.34
s. 6.35(4)
s. 6.36
s. 6.38
s. 6.46
s. 6.47
s. 6.51
s. 6.76(6)
s. 7.3
s. 7.9(1)
s. 9.4
s. 9.6(5)
s. 9.29(2)
Schedule 2.2 cl. 6,
  7 and 9
Schedule 2.3

Local Government (Administration) Regulations 1996

r. 5
r. 6
r. 8
r. 9
r. 10
r. 11
r. 12
r. 13
r. 14(1)
r. 19

r. 22
r. 23
r. 28
r. 30
r. 31
r. 33
r. 34
r. 34A
r. 34B
r. 34C

Local Government (Audit) Regulations 1996

r. 7 r. 10

Local Government (Elections) Regulations 1997

r. 7
r. 8
r. 13
r. 17
r. 26(4)

r. 30G
r. 30H
r. 40
r. 81



1724 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 1999

Local Government (Financial Management)
Regulations 1996

r. 5
r. 6
r. 8
r. 9
r. 11
r. 12
r. 13(2)
r. 19
r. 33

r. 34(1)(a)
r. 35
r. 51
r. 53
r. 54
r. 55
r. 56
r. 57

Local Government (Functions and General)
Regulations 1996

r. 7
r. 9
r. 10
r. 11
r 12
r. 14(1) and (3)
r. 15
r. 16

r. 17
r. 18(1)
r. 19
r. 21
r. 22
r. 23
r. 24

Local Government (Uniform Local Provisions)
Regulations 1996

r. 9(8)

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960

s. 245A(5)(aa)

Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995

s. 21(1)

Cemeteries Act 1986

s. 40

Local Government Grants Act 1978

s. 12(4)

14. Compliance audit return to be prepared

(1) A local government is to carry out a compliance audit
for the period 1 January to 31 December in each year.

(2) After carrying out a compliance audit the local
government is to prepare a compliance audit return in a
form approved by the Minister.



23 April 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1725

(3) A compliance audit return is to be —

(a) presented to the council at a meeting of the
council;

(b) adopted by the council; and

(c) recorded in the minutes of the meeting at which
it is adopted.

15. Completion of compliance audit

(1) After the compliance audit return has been presented to
the council in accordance with regulation 14(3) a
certified copy of the return together with —

(a) a copy of the relevant section of the minutes
referred to in regulation 14(3)(c); and

(b) any additional information explaining or
qualifying the compliance audit,

is to be submitted to the Executive Director by
31 March next following the period to which the return
relates.

(2) In this regulation —

“certified”  in relation to a compliance audit return
means signed by —

(a) the mayor or president; and

(b) the CEO.
    ”.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991726

— PART 2 —

AGRICULTURE

AG401
VETERINARY SURGEONS’ ACT 1960

Agriculture Western Australia,
South Perth, WA 6151.

Agric. 89/89 V1
The Governor has been pleased to appoint, pursuant to Section 6 of the Veterinary Surgeons’ Act 1960,
Dr Katherine Terese Gibson as Deputy Member of the Veterinary Surgeons’ Board for a term of office
expiring on 31 December 2000.

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries.

AG402
PLANT DISEASES ACT 1914

Agriculture Western Australia,
South Perth, WA 6151.

I, the undersigned Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries, being the Minister responsible for the
administration of the Plant Diseases Act 1914, hereby appoint the following as Inspectors pursuant to
Section 7 of the said Act—

Dean, David Charles
De Jong, Dirk
Wright, Natalie
McCallion, Helene
Booth, Gregory Ronald
Postle, Anthony
Gorrie, Brian Roger

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries.

AG403
HERD IMPROVEMENT SERVICE ACT 1984

Agriculture Western Australia,
South Perth, WA 6151.

Agric. 291/88
His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has been pleased to appoint pursuant to section
5(1)(c) of the Herd Improvement Service Act 1984, Mr Ray Blackburn as Member of the Board of
Management of the Herd Improvement Service of Western Australia for a term of office expiring on
1 November 2002.

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries.

HEALTH

HE401*
HEALTH ACT 1911

LOCAL HEALTH AUTHORITIES ANALYTICAL COMMITTEE
 (APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS) INSTRUMENT 1999

Made by the Minister for Health under section 247A(3) of the Act.

1. Citation
This instrument may be cited as the Local Health Authorities Analytical Committee (Appointment of
Members) Instrument 1999.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 172723 April 1999]

2. Interpretation
In this instrument—

“table” means the table in the Schedule to this instrument;
“the Act” means the Health Act 1911 (WA);
“the Committee” means the Local Health Authorities Analytical Committee constituted under

section 247A(1) of the Act;

3. Appointment of Members
Each of the persons named in column 1 of the table in the schedule are appointed as members of the
Committee, pursuant to the provision of the Act specified in column 2 of the table adjacent to the name
of that person, for a period of three years commencing on the date of appointment.

SCHEDULE

TABLE
Column 1 Column 2
NAME SECTION
Mr Dominic Meyrick (3)(b)
Mr Robert Boardman (3)(b)
Councillor Kim Hicks (3)(c)

Date: 22 March 1999.
JOHN DAY, Minister for Health.

HERITAGE COUNCIL

HR401*
Government of Western Australia

HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990
NOTICE OF ENTRY OF PLACES IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES

Notice is hereby given in accordance with Section 51(2) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, the places described in Schedule 1 have
been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect from today.

Schedule 1

Name Location Description of Place

Bruce Rock Shire Offices Cnr Johnson & Bath Bruce Rock Lot 48, being part of Crown
Streets, Bruce Rock Reserve 15098 and being part of the land

comprised in Crown Land Record Volume
3010 Folio 923.

Customs House (fmr) Cnr of Phillimore & Cliff Fremantle Lot 2045, being Crown Reserve
Streets, Fremantle 40256 and being the whole of the land

comprised in Crown Land Record Volume
3037 Folio 637.

Geraldton Customs 7-9 Francis Street, Lots 20 and 21 on Diagram 95780, being
Complex Geraldton the whole of the land comprised in

Certificates of Title Volume 2140 Folios
670 and 671 respectively.

Millbrook Farm Millbrook Road Yallingup Those parts of Sussex Locations 461 and
474, being part of the land comprised in
Certificates of Title Volume 1037 Folio 996
and Volume 1502 Folio 518 as together are
defined in HCWA survey drawing No 0429
prepared by Steffanoni Ewing &
Cruickshank Pty Ltd

Narrows Bridge Perth and South Perth Main Roads Western Australia Bridge No.
953 and those portions of: Main Roads West-
ern Australia Road Reserve to the North
and South of the said Bridge and The bed
of the Swan River, being a part of the Port
of Perth and Perth Lot 921, being part of
Crown Reserve 37594 and being part of the
land comprised in Crown Land Record Vol-
ume 3043 Folio 251 and Perth Lot 920,
being part of Crown Reserve 33804 and
being part of the land comprised in Crown
Land Record Volume 3040 Folio 55, as to-
gether are defined in HCWA survey drawing
No 4795 prepared by Steffanoni Ewing &
Cruickshank Pty Ltd



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991728

Schedule 1—continued

Name Location Description of Place

Pindar Hotel (fmr) Cnr Sharpe & Murchison Pindar Lot 25, being part of the land
Streets, Pindar comprised in Certificate of Title Volume

1066 Folio 819.

Pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, notice is hereby given in accordance with Sec-
tion 49(1) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 that it is proposed that the places described in
Schedule 2 be entered in the Register of Heritage Places. The Heritage Council invites submissions on
the proposal; submissions must be in writing and should be forwarded to the following address not
later than 4th June 1999.

The Director, Office of the Heritage Council
108 Adelaide Terrace, East Perth WA 6004

The places will be entered in the Register on an interim basis with effect from today.

Schedule 2

Place Location Description of Place

Memorial Hall 12 Lochee Street, Mosman Mosman Park Lot 456, being Crown
Park Reserve 25213 and being the whole of the

land comprised in Crown Land Record
Volume 3038 Folio 994.

North Perth Town 24-26 View Street, North Swan Location 2146, being the whole of the
Hall Complex Perth land comprised in Certificate of Title

Volume 2030 Folio 208.
Railway Hotel 44 Tydeman Street, North Lots 1, 2 and part of each of Lots 3 and

Fremantle 26 on Plan 793, being the whole of the
land comprised in Certificate of Title
Volume 1851 Folio 765.

St Luke’s Anglican 16 & 18 Monument Street Lots 9, 13 and 14 on Plan 1663, being
Church Group & 1 Willis Street, part of the land comprised in Certificate

Mosman Park of Title Volume 1193 Folio 558.  Lot 10
on Plan 1663, being the whole of the land
comprised in Certificate of Title Volume
102 Folio 142.

Westbrook Homestead End of Florence Road (off That part of Sussex Location 12, being
Bussell Hwy), Vasse part of the land comprised in Certificate

of Title Volume 1786 Folio 428 as is
defined in HCWA survey drawing No
5372 prepared by Steffanoni Ewing &
Cruickshank Pty Ltd

Dated this 23rd day of April 1999.
IAN BAXTER, Director,

Office of the Heritage Council.

JUSTICE

JM401
JUSTICES ACT 1902

It is hereby notified for public information that the Hon Attorney General has approved the closure of
the following Courts of Petty Sessions effective from the close of business on 30 April 1999.

Argyle Broomehill Carnamah
Mundijong Wickepin Wickham

RICHARD FOSTER, Executive Director, Court Services.

JM402
CHILDREN’S COURT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1988

It is hereby notified for public information that the President of the Children’s Court of Western Aus-
tralia has approved the closure of the following Children’s Courts effective from the close of business
on 30 April 1999.

Argyle Broomehill Carnamah
Mundijong Wickepin Wickham

RICHARD FOSTER, Executive Director, Court Services.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 172923 April 1999]

JM403
DECLARATIONS AND ATTESTATIONS ACT 1913

It is hereby notified for public information that the Hon Attorney General has approved the appoint-
ment of the following persons as Commissioners for Declarations under the Declarations and Attestations
Act 1913—

Mr Fergus Euan Lewis Beer of 56 Elizabeth Street, North Perth
Mr Rooplal Bhojduth Maharaj of 57 Sattelberg Ramble, Dianella

RICHARD FOSTER, Executive Director, Court Services.

JM404
JUSTICES ACT 1902

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of—

Mr Richard James Garnett of 5 Park Road, Gowangerup
to the office of the Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia.

RICHARD FOSTER, Executive Director, Court Services.

JM405
JUSTICES ACT 1902

ORDER UNDER SECTION 7
His Excellency the Governor acting by and with the advice of the Executive Council and under
Section 7 of the Justices Act 1902 has approved of the removal of—

Mr David Alan Huxley of 12 Brookford Court, Jandakot
Mr Bernard Francis Prindiville of 11/219 Mill Point Road, South Perth

from the office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia.

RICHARD FOSTER, Executive Director, Court Services.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG401*
DOG ACT 1976

Shire of Dalwallinu
It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed under the
provisions of the Dog Act 1976 for the municipality of the Shire of Dalwallinu—

Registration Officers Authorised Officers
Mr P. J. Crispin Mr W. T. Atkinson
Miss T. A. Morgan Mr J. C. Mitchell
Miss C. M. Wallis Mr L. H. Holberton
Mrs S. Appleton Mr B. W. Seale
Mrs T. K. Trinder Mr P. J. Crispin
Miss J. L. Waterhouse Mr J. R. Jacobs

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.

W. T. ATKINSON, Chief Executive Officer.

LG501*
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954

Shire of Derby/West Kimberley
FIRE BREAK NOTICE

Pursuant to the powers contained in Section 33 of the Bush Fires Act 1954, all owners or occupiers of
land within the Shire of Derby/West Kimberley are hereby required, on or before 30th June 1999 and



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991730

thereafter up to and including 31st December 1999 to have fire breaks or fire control measures in-
stalled in accordance with the following:

1. Rural lands being all land outside townsites and not being land held under pastoral lease, fire
breaks are required to be:
a. A bare mineral earth fire break not less than four metres wide of a trafficable condition

inside, along and within three metres of the external boundaries of the land, free of all
overhanging vegetation to a height of four metres.

OR;
b. A low fuel break of not less than four metres wide of a trafficable condition with vegetation

not exceeding seventy five millimetres in height inside, along and within three metres of
the external boundaries of the land, free of all overhanging vegetation to a height of four
metres.
AND:

c. A bare mineral earth fire break of not less than four metres wide of a trafficable condition
and within three metres of the perimeter of all buildings and/or haystacks or groups of
buildings, free of all overhanging vegetation to a height of four metres.

OR;
d. A low fuel break of not less than ten metres wide with vegetation not exceeding seventy

five millimetres in height completely surrounding and within three meters of the perim-
eter of all buildings and/or haystacks or groups of buildings.
For the purposes of this requirement live standing trees and non-flammable, maintained
lawns and gardens are deemed to comply.

2. Pastoral lands being all land outside townsites held under pastoral lease, low fuel breaks are
required to be not less than twenty five metres wide, totally surrounding and within three
metres of the perimeter of all buildings and/or haystacks or groups of buildings.

3. Townsite Lands:
1(a). Where the area of the land is 2023 square metres or less, all inflammable material

from the whole of the land is required to be removed, with any stubble left not exceed-
ing seventy five millimetres in height.

1(b). Where the area of the land is greater than 2023 square metres a bare mineral earth
fire break of not less than three metres in width of a trafficable condition, inside,
along and within two metres of the external boundaries of the land, free of all over-
hanging vegetation to a height of four metres,

OR:
1(c). A low fuel break of not less than three metres wide of a trafficable condition with

vegetation not exceeding seventy five millimetres in height inside, along and within
three metres of the external boundaries of the land, free of all overhanging vegetation
to a height of four metres.
AND:

2(a). A bare mineral earth fire break of not less than three metres wide of a trafficable
condition and within three metres of the perimeter of all buildings and/or haystacks
or groups of buildings, free of all overhanging vegetation to a height of four metres.

OR;
2(b). A low fuel break of not less than ten metres wide with vegetation not exceeding sev-

enty five millimetres in height completely surrounding and within three metres of the
perimeter of all buildings and/or haystacks or groups of buildings.
For the purposes of this requirement live standing trees and non-flammable, main-
tained lawns and gardens are deemed to comply.

OR:
2(c). All inflammable material from the whole of the land is required to be removed, with

any stubble left not exceeding seventy five millimetres in height.
4. Rubbish Sites being all rubbish sites for pastoral stations, townsite and community use.  Fire

breaks are required to be of bare mineral earth in a trafficable condition not less than four
metres wide and within five metres of the perimeter of the rubbish sites.

5. Fuel dumps and depots—remove all inflammable material where fuel drum ramps or dumps
are located, and where fuel drums, whether containing fuel or not are stored to a distance of at
least ten metres outside the perimeter of any drum, ramp or stack of drums.

6. The acts referred to in sections 1to 5 hereof must be performed to the satisfaction of the duly
authorised officer of the Shire of Derby/West Kimberley.

7. If it is considered impracticable for any reason to clear firebreaks or to remove inflammable
material from the land as required by this notice, you may apply to this Council or it’s duly
authorised officer no later than 30th May 1999 for permission to provide fire breaks in alter-
native positions or to take alternative action to abate fire hazards on the land. If permission is
not given in writing you must comply with this notice.

8. The penalty for failing to comply with this notice is a fine of up to $1000.00 or a prescribed
modified penalty of $80.00 on service of an infringement notice, and an owner or occupier is
also liable, whether prosecuted or not, to pay the cost to Council of its employees or contractors
performing the work.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 173123 April 1999]

Councils authorised officer has legal right of entry to any property with any machinery or
personnel deemed necessary in order to complete the work, under section 33(4)(b) of the Bush
Fires Act 1954.

Dated this 25th day of November 1998.
By Order of the Council

P. D. ANDREW, Chief Executive Officer.

MINERALS AND ENERGY

MN401
MINING ACT 1978

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO FORFEIT
Department of Minerals & Energy,

Perth WA 6000.
In accordance with Regulation 50(b) of the Mining Act 1978, notice is hereby given that unless the rent
due on the undermentioned licences and leases is paid on or before 24 May 1999 it is the intention of
the Hon Minister for Mines under the provisions of Sections 96A(1) and 97(1) of the Mining Act 1978,
to forfeit such for breach covenant, viz, non-payment of rent.

L. C. RANFORD, Director General.

NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD
EXPLORATION LICENCES

08/893A Epithermal Pacific NL Ashburton
08/937 Ashburton Gold Mines NL Ashburton
09/531 Equatorial Mining Ltd; Merritt Mining NL; Gascoyne

Sovereign Resources (Australia) NL
09/734 Equatorial Mining Ltd; Merritt Mining NL; Gascoyne

Sovereign Resources (Australia) NL
09/895 New Millennium Resources NL Gascoyne
09/896 New Millennium Resources NL Gascoyne
20/346 IFD Ltd Murchison
20/347 IFD Ltd Murchison
20/415 Mount Isa Mines Ltd Murchison
26/76 Kanowna Consolidated Gold Mines NL East Coolgardie
27/174 Gindalbie Gold NL North East Coolgardie
28/715 Mount Kersey Mining NL North East Coolgardie
28/754 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd; North East Coolgardie

Topsfield Pty Ltd
28/755 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/756 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/757 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/758 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/759 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/760 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/761 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/762 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/763 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/764 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/765 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/766 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/767 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/768 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/769 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/770 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/771 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/772 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/773 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/774 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/788 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/789 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/790 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/791 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/792 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
28/793 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991732

NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD
EXPLORATION LICENCES—continued

28/794 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd North East Coolgardie
31/187 Crest Magnesium NL North Coolgardie
37/289 Triton Resources Ltd Mt Margaret
37/468 Kundana Cold Pty Ltd; Mount Isa Mines Ltd Mt Margaret
38/348 Aurora Gold (WA) Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
38/386 Ramsgate Resources NL Mt Margaret
38/1021 Legendre, Bruce Robert; Mt Margaret

Wasse, Bernfried Gunter Fra
38/1045 Creasy, Mark Gareth; Mt Margaret

Johnson’s Well Mining NL
39/604 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/605 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/606 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/607 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/608 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/609 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/610 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/611 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/612 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/613 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/614 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/615 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/616 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/617 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/618 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/619 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/620 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/622 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/623 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/624 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/625 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/626 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/627 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/628 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
39/629 Kitchener Resources Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
45/1802 Darkdale Pty Ltd Pilbara
46/416 Jonellen Pty Ltd Pilbara
46/436 Jonellen Pty Ltd Pilbara
51/473 Murchison Resources Pty Ltd Murchison
52/951 Flint, Warwick John; Peak Hill

Sorna Pty Ltd
52/966 Jimblebar Resources NL; Peak Hill

Sorna Pty Ltd
52/1160 Richmond, William Robert; Peak Hill

Ynema, Martin Hendrick
52/1306 Zohar, David Allan Peak Hill
53/597 Yardarino Mining NL East Murchison
53/666 Silver Gecko Pty Ltd (In Liquidation) East Murchison
58/203 Windimurra Resources Pty Ltd Murchison
58/204 Windimirra Resources Pty Ltd Murchison
59/824 Westland Gold NL Yalgoo
69/652 Sir Samuel Mines NL Warburton
69/1065 Rosanne Holdings Pty Ltd Warburton
69/1066 Rosanne Holdings Pty Ltd Warburton
69/1067 Rosanne Holdings Pty Ltd Warburton
70/774 BHP Minerals Pty Ltd South West
70/785 Baxter, John Lesley; Maloney, Bruce Scott; South West

Prior, Graeme Bruce; Simpson: John Andrew;
Thomas, Stephen Leslie

70/1712 Ashcourt Corporation Pty Ltd South West
70/1829 Astro Mining NL South West
70/1830 Astro Mining NL South West
70/1966 Ammon, Derek Noel; Wigger, Adrian Pierre; South West

Wigger, Joy Catherine
74/213 Chaytor, Maxwell Stanley; Dowling, John Francis; Phillips River

Locsei, Janos; Walker, Robert Denis;
Wanless, Robert James

77/513 Burmine Operations Pty Ltd Yilgarn
77/605 Astro Mining NL Yilgarn
77/606 Astro Mining NL Yilgarn
77/607 Astro Mining NL Yilgarn
77/613 Astro Mining NL Yilgarn
77/614 Astro Mining NL Yilgarn



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 173323 April 1999]

NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD
GENERAL PURPOSE LEASES

47/10 Specified Services Pty Ltd West Pilbara
63/3 Sifam Pty Ltd Dundas

MINING LEASES
15/128 Killoran NL Coolgardie
15/754 Killoran NL Coolgardie
20/64 RTS Pty Ltd Murchison
20/83 RTS Pty Ltd Murchison
20/84 RTS Pty Ltd Murchison
20/93 Boyd, James Curwen Murchison
20/265 RTS Pty Ltd Murchison
20/268 RTS Pty Ltd Murchison
20/269 RTS Pty Ltd Murchison
20/270 RTS Pty Ltd Murchison
20/271 RTS Pty Ltd Murchison
21/84 RTS Pty Ltd Murchison
24/189 Jasper Mining Pty Ltd Broad Arrow
24/484 Mount Kersey Mining NL Broad Arrow
26/553 Astro Mining NL East Coolgardie
26/580 Astro Mining NL East Coolgardie
28/111 Elixer Holdings Pty Ltd; North East Coolgardie

Mount Kersey Mining NL
29/90 Lincoln Areas NL North Coolgardie
37/387 Triton Resources Ltd Mt Margaret
37/412 Triton Resources Ltd Mt Margaret
37/422 Bronzewing Gold NL Mt Margaret
39/334 Bronzewing Gold NL Mt Margaret
46/144 CCR Contractors Pty Ltd Pilbara
51/450 St Barbara Mines Ltd Murchison
51/459 St Barbara Mines Ltd Murchison
53/311 Dalrymple Resources NL; East Murchison

Gold Mines of Australia (WA) NL
59/276 Richearth Mines NL Yalgoo
59/299 Fremantle Park Homes Pty Ltd Yalgoo
59/303 Auriferous Mining Pty Ltd Yalgoo
80/361 Adelsten, Shawn; Arteon, Ghislame; Kimberley

Plant, Anthony Robin

RETENTION LICENCES
70/5 BHP Minerals Pty Ltd South West
70/6 BHP Titanium Minerals Pty Ltd South West

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF ALBANY

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 2—AMENDMENT NO 1
Ref: 853/5/4/4 Pt 1
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of
Albany Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of modifying the Scheme
Text by inserting the following clause in Part IV—Finance and Administration;

4.6 Delegation of Powers
4.6.1 The Council may, either generally or in a particular case or particular class of case or

cases, by resolution passed by an absolute majority of Council, delegate to:
(a) a Committee of the Council; or
(b) an officer(s) of the Council
any power conferred or duly imposed on the Council under this Scheme.

4.6.2 Any delegation made under sub-clause 4.6.1 shall have effect for the period of twelve
(12) months following the resolution unless the Council stipulates a lesser or greater
period in the resolution.

4.6.3 A delegation of authority pursuant to the provisions of this clause has effect and may
be exercised according to its tenor, but is revocable at the will of the Council and does
not prevent the Council from exercising the power.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991734

4.6.4 A resolution to revoke or amend a delegation under this clause may be passed by
simple majority.

4.6.5 A Committee or officer exercising the power of delegation pursuant to the provisions of
this clause shall comply with the provisions of the Scheme governing the exercise of
the power by the Council, insofar as such provisions are reasonably applicable.

4.6.6 A person who is or has been a delegate of the Council is not personally liable for any-
thing done or omitted in good faith in, or in connection with, the exercise or purported
exercise of any powers conferred, or the carrying out of any duty imposed on the Coun-
cil by this Scheme.

K. MICHAEL, Chairman of Commissioners.
E. H. KELLY, Chief Executive Officer.

PD402*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF ALBANY

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 3.2B—AMENDMENT NO 5
Ref: 853/5/4/12 Pt 5
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of
Albany Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of modifying the Scheme
Text by inserting the following clause in Part VI—Finance and Administration;

6.7 Delegation of Powers
6.7.1 The Council may, either generally or in a particular case or particular class of case or

cases, by resolution passed by an absolute majority of Council, delegate to:
(a) a Committee of the Council; or
(b) an officer(s) of the Council
any power conferred or duly imposed on the Council under this Scheme.

6.7.2 Any delegation made under sub-clause 6.7.1 shall have effect for the period of twelve
(12) months following the resolution unless the Council stipulates a lesser or greater
period in the resolution.

6.7.3 A delegation of authority pursuant to the provisions of this clause has effect and may
be exercised according to its tenor, but is revocable at the will of the Council and does
not prevent the Council from exercising the power.

6.7.4 A resolution to revoke or amend a delegation under this clause may be passed by
simple majority.

6.7.5 A Committee or officer exercising the power of delegation pursuant to the provisions of
this clause shall comply with the provisions of the Scheme governing the exercise of
the power by the Council, insofar as such provisions are reasonably applicable.

6.7.6 A person who is or has been a delegate of the Council is not personally liable for any-
thing done or omitted in good faith in, or in connection with, the exercise or purported
exercise of any powers conferred, or the carrying out of any duty imposed on the Coun-
cil by this Scheme.

K. MICHAEL, Chairman of Commissioners.
E. H. KELLY, Chief Executive Officer.

PD403*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF ALBANY

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 7—AMENDMENT NO 12
Ref: 853/5/4/7 Pt 12
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of
Albany Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of modifying the Scheme
Text by inserting the following clause in Part V—Finance and Administration;

5.3 Delegation of Powers
5.3.1 The Council may, either generally or in a particular case or particular class of case or

cases, by resolution passed by an absolute majority of Council, delegate to:
(a) a Committee of the Council; or
(b) an officer(s) of the Council
any power conferred or duly imposed on the Council under this Scheme.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 173523 April 1999]

5.3.2 Any delegation made under sub-clause 5.3.1 shall have effect for the period of twelve
(12) months following the resolution unless the Council stipulates a lesser or greater
period in the resolution.

5.3.3 A delegation of authority pursuant to the provisions of this clause has effect and may
be exercised according to its tenor, but is revocable at the will of the Council and does
not prevent the Council from exercising the power.

5.3.4 A resolution to revoke or amend a delegation under this clause may be passed by
simple majority.

5.3.5 A Committee or officer exercising the power of delegation pursuant to the provisions of
this clause shall comply with the provisions of the Scheme governing the exercise of
the power by the Council, insofar as such provisions are reasonably applicable.

5.3.6 A person who is or has been a delegate of the Council is not personally liable for any-
thing done or omitted in good faith in, or in connection with, the exercise or purported
exercise of any powers conferred, or the carrying out of any duty imposed on the Coun-
cil by this Scheme.

K. MICHAEL, Chairman of Commissioners.
E. H. KELLY, Chief Executive Officer.

PD404*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF ALBANY

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 3—AMENDMENT NO 193
Ref: 853/5/4/5 Pt 193
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of
Albany Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of modifying the Scheme
Text by inserting the following clause in Part 6—Finance and Administration;

6.10 Delegation of Powers
6.10.1 The Council may, either generally or in a particular case or particular class of case or

cases, by resolution passed by an absolute majority of Council, delegate to:
(a) a Committee of the Council; or
(b) an officer(s) of the Council
any power conferred or duly imposed on the Council under this Scheme.

6.10.2 Any delegation made under sub-clause 6.10.1 shall have effect for the period of twelve
(12) months following the resolution unless the Council stipulates a lesser or greater
period in the resolution.

6.10.3 A delegation of authority pursuant to the provisions of this clause has effect and may
be exercised according to its tenor, but is revocable at the will of the Council and does
not prevent the Council from exercising the power.

6.10.4 A resolution to revoke or amend a delegation under this clause may be passed by
simple majority.

6.10.5 A Committee or officer exercising the power of delegation pursuant to the provisions of
this clause shall comply with the provisions of the Scheme governing the exercise of
the power by the Council, insofar as such provisions are reasonably applicable.

6.10.6 A person who is or has been a delegate of the Council is not personally liable for any-
thing done or omitted in good faith in, or in connection with, the exercise or purported
exercise of any powers conferred, or the carrying out of any duty imposed on the Coun-
cil by this Scheme.

K. MICHAEL, Chairman of Commissioners.
E. H. KELLY, Chief Executive Officer.

PD406*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF COCKBURN

DISTRICT ZONING SCHEME NO 2—AMENDMENT NO 111
Ref: 853/2/23/19 Pt 111
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of
Cockburn Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of rezoning a portion
of Pt Lot 152, Lot 10 and portion Lot 1 Beenyup Road, Success from ‘Rural’ to ‘Residential R80B’.

J. P. GRLJUSICH, Mayor.
R. W. BROWN, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991736

PD405*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF CANNING

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 40—AMENDMENT NO 83
Ref: 853/2/16/44 Pt 83
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of
Canning Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of:

1. SCHEME MAP MODIFICATION:
Designating 53-61 Kewdale Road (Lot 56) (cnr Dowd Street), Welshpool, to indicate the addi-
tional use in Serial No 77 of Appendix 5 to the Scheme Text.

2. SCHEME TEXT MODIFICATION:
By adding the following to Appendix 5, Schedule of Additional or Prohibited Uses:

No Lot Address Uses which may be Additional
No prohibited or permitted in Development

addition to those permitted Requirements
by the Zoning Table

Additional Prohibited
Uses: Uses:

77 56 53-61 Kewdale Road Offices Gross Floor
(cnr Dowd Street), Area 1,450m2.
Welshpool

M. S. LEKIAS, Mayor.
I. F. KINNER, Chief Executive Officer.

PD407*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF FREMANTLE

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 3—AMENDMENT NO 46
Ref: 853/2/5/6 Pt 46
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of
Fremantle Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of:

1. Recoding Lots 1, 2, 74 and 75 Chester Street, South Fremantle from Residence ‘R25’ to Resi-
dence ‘R35’, as depicted on the Amending Map and the Scheme Map is hereby amended
accordingly.

2. Including Development Plan No 13 as Appendix A.13.

R. UTTING, Mayor.
R. GLICKMAN, Chief Executive Officer.

PD408*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF ROCKINGHAM

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 1—AMENDMENT NO 321
Ref: 853/2/28/1 Pt 321
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of
Rockingham Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of:

1. Rezoning Lots 364, 398 and 399 Jacquard Way and portion of Lot 995 Saltaire Way, Port
Kennedy from “Light Industry” to “Service Commercial”.

2. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

C. S. ELLIOTT, Mayor.
G. G. HOLLAND, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 173723 April 1999]

PD410*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF CHITTERING

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 5—AMENDMENT NO 71
Ref: 853/3/4/5 Pt 71
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Chittering Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of modifying Sched-
ule 2—Special Uses by:—

(a) deleting the words “Industry—Masonry Preparation” against Lot 6;
(b) adding the words “Carbon Products Processing and Associated Uses” against Lot 6 Brand

Highway, Muchea;
SCHEDULE 2—SPECIAL USES

(a) (b)
Specified Areas Uses Permitted and Conditions of Use

Localities
Lot 6, Brand Highway, Muchea The following uses may be permitted with the

Planning Consent of Council.
Carbon Products Processing and Associated Uses.

S. M. METCALF, President.
R. P. HOOPER, Chief Executive Officer.

PD409
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF CHITTERING

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 5—AMENDMENT NO 43
Ref: 853/3/4/5 Pt 43
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Chittering Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of:

(1) Rezoning Part of the Muchea Townsite from Rural 2 Zone—and Parks and Recreation Reserve
to Special Residential Zone (R 2.5):
1) Parts of Lots 3 and 6 Payne Street;
2) Part Lot 139 Wells Street,
3) Parts of lots 211, 212, and 213 Payne Street,
4) Part of Lots 1, 2, 11, 12, and 14 Faull Street;
5) Lot 142 (reserve 31127) Faull Street.

(2) The following heading being inserted between the existing heading of subclause 3.9.3 and the
text of subclause 3.9.3:

“3.9.3.1 Special Residential Zone—General”
(3) including a new sub-clause titled “3.9.3.2, Special Residential Zone (Muchea West)—Special

Provisions” to read as follows:
Requirements for the Special Residential Zone in the western part of Muchea townsite defined
as the area above 65m AHD are as follows:

“(a) Effluent disposal systems servicing development on lots within the zone shall high
performance systems with bacterial and nutrient stripping capabilities to the specifi-
cations and satisfaction of the Council and the Health Department of Western Australia
and each system shall be located in a position to be determined by the Council’s Envi-
ronmental, Building and Health Officer.

(b) Bores for groundwater extraction shall be located not less than 30 metres from any
irrigation area for waste water disposal systems;

(c) Development of buildings on lots occurring within the zone shall restricted to building
envelopes to be determined by Council;

(d) All buildings within the zone shall have roofing of a non-reflective material;
(e) no clearing of indigenous vegetation and trees shall be undertaken or permitted un-

less such vegetation is dead or diseased, or where the clearing is required for the
purpose of a fire break, fence or driveway or for a dwelling, outbuilding or on-site
effluent disposal system within the designated building envelope.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991738

(f) With the intention of preventing overstocking or other practices detrimental to the
amenity of the zone and to prevent land degradation and nutrient export, the breeding
or keeping of animals shall not be permitted without the approval in writing from
Council.
In considering any applications for breeding or keeping of livestock, Council will be
guided by advice from Agriculture Western Australia.
Notwithstanding the above, in cases where livestock approval has been given but where
environmental or land degradation problems develop, Council after consultation with
Agriculture Western Australia, may take appropriate action to prohibit, restrict or
reduce the number of animals.

(g) Council shall adopt a Bush Fires Management Plan for the subject land which shall
be prepared in consultation with the Bush Fire Service of Western Australia WA. Council
may amend the plan where it considers this to be necessary.
All owners of affected lots shall manage their properties in accordance with the plan.
Development which would conflict with or impede bush fire management in accord-
ance with the plan shall not be permitted or undertaken.

S. M. METCALF, President.
R. P. HOOPER, Chief Executive Officer.

PD411*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF CHITTERING

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 5—AMENDMENT NO 76
Ref: 853/3/4/5 Pt 76
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Chittering Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of rezoning Lot 2,
Great Northern Highway, Bindoon from Residential Zone to Commercial Zone.

S. M. METCALF, President.
R. P. HOOPER, Chief Executive Officer.

PD412*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF LAKE GRACE

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 3—AMENDMENT NO 4
Ref: 853/5/12/5 Pt 4
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Lake Grace Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of amending the
Scheme Map by including part of Roe Location 604 Newdegate Road North, Newdegate in the Scheme
Area and classifying this land as “Residential Zone” with a residential density coding of “R2” as de-
picted on the Scheme Amendment Map.

C. J. CONNOLLY, President.
J. K. McENCROE, Chief Executive Officer.

PD413*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF ROEBOURNE

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 6—AMENDMENT NO 56
Ref: 853/8/5/4 Pt 56
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Roebourne Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of:

1. Rezoning Lot 1925 Ridley Street, Karratha from “Residential R30” to “Residential R40”; and
2. Amending the Scheme Map accordingly.

N. TURNER, President.
T. S. RULAND, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 173923 April 1999]

PD414*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF WANNEROO

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 1—AMENDMENT NO 713
Ref: 853/2/30/1 Pt 713
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Wanneroo Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of:

1. rezoning and recoding Portion of Lot 1001 Tapping Way, Quinns Rocks from Commercial, Service
Station, Residential Development R20 and R35 to Centre Zone and Uncoded;

2. recoding remainder Portion of Lot 1001 Tapping Way, Quinns Rocks from R20, R25 and R30 to
R20, R25 and R40;

3. recoding Portion Lot 1000 from R20 and R25 to R20 and R40; and
4. rezoning and recoding Portion Lot 1002 from Commercial, Service Station, Civic, R30 and R35

to Residential Development R20, and R40.
C. ANSELL, Chairman of Commissioners.

K. WHITE, Chief Executive Officer.

PD415
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF WANNEROO

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 1—AMENDMENT NO 782
Ref: 853/2/30/1 Pt 782
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Wanneroo Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of:

(a) rezoning Lots 24, 25, 26, 27 and 28 Badgerup Road, Gnangara from Rural to Special Rural;
(b) including the following Special Provisions applicable to this proposed Special Rural Zone in

Part 2 of Schedule 4 of the Scheme Text.
Special Rural Zone No 28
Description of Locality:
Lots 24, 25, 26, 27 and 28 Badgerup Road, Gnangara
Special Provisions:
(i) The minimum lot size should be not less than one hectare and subdivision should gener-

ally be in accordance with the “Development Guide Plan”.
(ii) The land the subject of this zone may be used for residential and equestrian purposes only.

Ancillary land uses may be permitted on the condition that they do not generate further
significant nutrient application, or involve the clearing of land (other than for building
envelopes, fences, fire breaks, access and servicing).

(iii) The keeping of livestock for commercial purposes is prohibited.
(iv) No more than one horse shall be permitted on any lot.
(v) A cleared building envelope measuring no greater than 1,200 m will be permitted on each

lot as shown on the Development Guide Plan. The clearing of trees and native vegetation
outside of the building envelope is prohibited other than for fences, fire breaks, access and
servicing. The position of the building envelope shown on each lot may be varied subject to
Council approval.

(vi) Should a horse be kept on any lot the landholder shall confine the horse to the building
envelope area shown on the Development Guide Plan by fencing, and should damage be
caused to tree and shrub vegetation by the horse, the Council may require that the horse
be removed from the lot until such time as improvements to the satisfaction of the Council
have been made to fencing which is intended to protect the trees and shrubs.

(vii) The land is to be managed in such a manner as to avoid the land being laid bare of vegeta-
tion resulting in loose, wind erodible conditions. In particular, lots shall not be cleared of
trees except as provided for by Special Provision (v) or where trees are dead or pose a
hazard to safety.

(viii) On-site effluent disposal system requirements:
(a) the underside of effluent disposal chambers of conventional effluent disposal systems

servicing dwellings shall be a minimum of two (2) metres above the estimated maxi-
mum water table level as determined from time to time by the Water and Rivers
Commission or equivalent State Government agency;

(b) the underside of effluent disposal chambers or effluent disposal pads of modified nu-
trient attenuating on-site sewage disposal systems servicing dwellings shall be a
minimum of five hundred (500) millimetres above the estimated maximum water
table level as determined from time to time by the Water and Rivers Commission or
equivalent State Government agency;



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991740

(c) the effluent disposal chambers of conventional on-site sewage disposal systems serv-
icing dwellings shall be a minimum horizontal distance of one hundred (100) metres
from areas determined from time to time by the City of Wanneroo to be subject to
periodic inundation;

(d) the effluent disposal chambers or effluent disposal pads of modified, nutrient attenu-
ating on-site sewage disposal systems servicing dwellings shall be a minimum
horizontal distance of fifty (50) metres from areas determined from time to time by the
City of Wanneroo to be subject to periodic inundation.

(ix) Where re-vegetation is indicated on the Development Guide Plan, the subdivider of the
estate shall re-vegetate the area in accordance with the recommendations contained in
Appendix D1 of the ‘Special Rural Rezoning Proposal Report for Lots 24, 25, 26, 27 and 28
Badgerup Road, Gnangara’ prepared by Greg Rowe and Associates and dated November
1996 and such re-vegetation shall be undertaken by the subdivider prior to any lots being
created.

(x) The subdivider shall provide a reticulated water supply to all proposed lots within this
zone.

(xi) The 2.5 metre widening of Badgerup Road shown on the Development Guide Plan shall be
ceded free of cost to the Crown at the time of subdivision of the land within this zone.

(xii) Prior to the final approval of a plan or diagram of survey, the subdivider shall undertake
to the satisfaction of the Department of Environmental Protection a site investigation of
building envelopes shown on the Development Guide Plan which have previously been
used for market gardening purposes to determine the presence or otherwise of contamina-
tion through past use of fertiliser, pesticides, or herbicides. Should such contamination be
determined as present, the subdivider shall undertake such actions as deemed necessary
by the Department of Environmental Protection to achieve an acceptable building enve-
lope.

(xiii) Proposed Lot Nos 19 and 20 shown on the Development Guide Plan are to be the subject of
Service Agreements between the owners of those lots and the Water Corporation, ensuring
that the owners of those lots are aware that these lots will not receive a normal standard
of water supply from the Water Corporation’s reticulated supply due to the height of these
lots, and the difficulty this presents for normal gravity supply.”

C. ANSELL, Chairman of Commissioners.
K. WHITE, Chief Executive Officer.

PD416*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF WYNDHAM-EAST KIMBERLEY

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 6—AMENDMENT NO 12
Ref: 853/7/5/8 Pt 12
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Acting Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Wyndham-East Kimberley Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 14 April, 1999 for the purpose of
amending the Scheme Map by rezoning a portion of Reserve No 20359 Gulley Road, Wyndham, and a
small portion of adjoining Vacant Crown Land from Public Purpose Reserve and Parks and Recreation
Reserve to Residential 1.

M. S. MIDDAP, President.
A. C. HAMMOND, Chief Executive Officer.

PREMIER AND CABINET

PR401
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of the
Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment in the place of the Hon
H. J. Cowan MLA in the period 1 to 19 May 1999 inclusive—

Minister for Commerce and Trade; Regional Development; Hon M. G. House MLA
Small Business

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General,
Ministry of the Premier and Cabinet.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 174123 April 1999]

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA401
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988

SUMMARY OF LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and required
to be advertised.  Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection
process, should contact the Liquor Licensing Division, 1st Floor, Hyatt Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace,
Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation.

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE
1537/98 Eugene Louis Harma & Application for the grant of a Producer-Wine 20/5/99

Mary Elizabeth Harma Licence in respect of premises situated
in Porongurup and known as Ironwood
Estate Wines.

1584/98 Cobblestone Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Restaurant 24/5/99
Licence in respect of premises situated
in Pemberton and known as Forest
Lodge Resort.

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS
1100/98 Jillian Campbell & Application for the grant of an extended 12/5/99

Bruce Stuart trading permit—ongoing extended hours,
in respect of premises situated in Bremer
Bay and known as Bremer Bay General Store.

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988.

G. B. AVES, Director of Liquor Licensing.

TOURISM

TB401
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN TOURISM COMMISSION

It is hereby notified that His Excellency the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, in Executive
Council, has in accordance with Section 5 (1) of the Western Australian Tourism Commission Amend-
ment Act 1994 approved of the following—

1. The reappointment for three years expiring on 22 April 2002 of—
Mr Ron Buckey as Commissioner
Mr Kevin Carton as Chairman
Mr Ross Hughes as Commissioner
Mr Rod Warren as Commissioner

NORMAN MOORE, Minister for Mines; Tourism; Sport and Recreation.

WATER

WA401*
RIGHTS IN WATER AND IRRIGATION ACT 1914

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 13 OF THE ACT
[Regulation 14(1)]

The Water & Rivers Commission has received the application listed below to take and use surface
water for mine rehabilitation purposes.
Any owner or occupier of land within 4.8 kilometres of the applicants land and contiguous to the
watercourse may object to that application.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991742

Objections should be sent to reach me at the Water & Rivers Commission, PO Box 261, Bunbury WA
6230 prior to 6th May 1999 by certified mail.
Any queries regarding this application should be referred to Ms Rachael Nickoll on telephone
(08) 9721 0666, Water Resources Officer, South West Region, Water and Rivers Commission.

W. F. TINGEY, Regional Manager, South West Region.

Schedule
1) Applicant: Wesfarmers Coal Limited

Property: Mining Lease ML262SA—Collie Coal Basin
Water Course: South Branch of the Collie River

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ101
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their claims
to me on or before the 24 May 1999, after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, having
regard only to the claims of which I then have notice.
Boddington, Eric Oscar, late of 39 Carson Street, Mullewa, died 15.11.98. (DEC 317942 DG2)
Caudle, William Leonard, late of 25 Mayfair Street, Mount Claremont, died 2.1.99. (DEC 316871 DL4)
Chitty, William John, late of Midland Nursing Home, 44 John Street, Midland, died 12.9.98. (DEC

317341 DP4)
Echene, Lucien, late of 15 Menli Place, Orelia, died 12.1.99. (DEC 317389 DS4)
Esposito, Vera, late of Italian Community Nursing Home, Kent Road, Marrangaroo, died 28.2.99. (DEC

318299 DC4)
Farquharson, Ronald, late of 19 Alvah Street, St James, died 18.3.99. (DEC 318346 DG2)
Fitzgerald, John Joseph, late of 16 Harwood Street, Hilton, died 26.11.98. (DEC 318345 DG3)
Hart, Dorothy Josephine, late of Craigwood Nursing Home, 29 Gardner Street, Como, died 19.3.99.

(DEC 317990 DG3)
Lawler, William Charles, late of Marist Lodge, 12 Lapage Street, Belmont, formerly of 50 Sydney

Street, North Perth, died 22.3.99. (DEC 318102 DP4)
Lethborg, Julia Frances, late of 9 Madura Close, Ballajura, died 11.3.99. (DEC 318320 DA2)
MacDonald, Roy, late of 11 McLeod Street, Lockridge, died 14.3.99. (DEC 318287 DG4)
McCormack, Jack, late of Braemar Lodge Hostel, 51 Point Walter Road, Bicton, died 1.12.98. (DEC

317805 DS4)
Mitchell, John Charles Starr, late of Rockingham Nursing Home, 14 Langley Street, Rockingham,

formerly of Unit 12/5 Merope Place, Rockingham, died 11.3.99. (DEC 318343 DC2)
Pope, Hilda Veronica, late of 22 Hubert Street, East Victoria Park, died 29.3.99. (DEC 318257 DG2)
Rodgers, Snorter, late of Numbala Nunga Nursing Home, Derby, died 1.6.98. (DEC 311722 DP4)
Saban, Radovan, late of St Bartholomew’s House, 78 Brown Street, East Perth, died 27.1.99. (DEC

317450 DS4)
Simpson, Ian Paul, late of BMX Track, Marshall Street, Kalgoorlie, died 3.3.99. (DEC 317720 DC3)
Southall, Grace Janet, late of Howard Solomon Nursing Home, 91 Hybanthus Road, Ferndale, died

12.3.99. (DEC 318296 DL3)
Stanton, James Victor, late of Glover House, Farrelly Street, Margaret River, died 25.2.99. (DEC 317670

DP4)
Stewart, Ronald Thomas, late of Dean Lodge, RAAF Estate, Bull Creek Drive, Bull Creek, formerly of

29 Stead Street, Maddington, died 8.2.99. (DEC 317660 DS4)
Tobin, Ellen Mary, late of Concorde Nursing Home, South Perth, died 27.3.99. (DEC 318303 DC3)
Whittaker, Patricia Frances Catherine, late of 33/158 Bibra Lake Drive, Bibra Lake, died 9.3.99. (DEC

318480 DS3)
Williams, Ruby Doreen, late of Howard Solomon Nursing Home, Ferndale, died 27.3.99. (DEC 318410

DC3)
K. E. BRADLEY,

Public Trustee,
Public Trust Office,

565 Hay Street,
Perth WA 6000.

Telephone: 9222 6777



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 174323 April 1999]

ZZ201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

Creditors and other persons having claim (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of Dorothy Graeme Watts, Widow, who was late of 116 Ulster Road, Albany, and who died on
1 September 1998, are required to send particulars of their claims to the executor of the estate of care
of Kott Gunning, 15 William Street, Perth, within 1 month of the date of this advertisement after
which date the Trustee may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which
notice has been given.

ZZ202
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

Stanley Herbert Foss Duffield, late of 38 Cricklewood Way, Carine, Western Australia, Company Di-
rector, deceased.
Creditors and other persons having claim (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the abovenamed deceased who died on 30th of October 1998, are required by the executor,
Cyril Desmond Tolson, to send particulars of their claims to the executor C/- Tolson & Co., 12 St.
George’s Terrace, Perth, WA 6000 within 1 month of the date of publication of this notice, after which
date the executor may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which he then
has notice.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

BOTANIC GARDENS AND PARKS
AUTHORITY ACT 1998

 Price: $6.70 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 100 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT
ACT 1994

 Price: $21.90 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 360 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 April 19991744

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

INDUSTRY AND TECHNOLOGY
DEVELOPMENT ACT 1998

 Price: $5.30 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 70 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

RAIL SAFETY ACT 1998

 Price: $8.10 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 123 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

BIRTHS, DEATHS AND MARRIAGES
REGISTRATION ACT 1998

 Price: $6.70 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 102 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES
AUTHORITY OF W.A. ACT 1998

 Price: $5.30 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 72 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

!199900070GG!


