
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

2145

PERTH, FRIDAY, 28 MAY 1999  No. 92
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN E. THOMPSON, ACTING GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Electricity Act 1945—Electricity (Licensing) Amendment Regulations 1999 ............... 2147
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment

Regulations 1999....................................................................................................... 2148
Local Government Act 1995—City of Rockingham—Parking Local Law 1995

Amendment............................................................................................................... 2149

———

PART 2

Fair Trading ................................................................................................................. 2154
Fisheries....................................................................................................................... 2150-4
Health .......................................................................................................................... 2155-6
Land Administration .................................................................................................... 2156
Local Government ........................................................................................................ 2156-7
Minerals and Energy .................................................................................................... 2157-9
Planning....................................................................................................................... 2159-60
Police ............................................................................................................................ 2161
Public Notices—Deceased Estates ................................................................................ 2161-3
Racing, Gaming and Liquor.......................................................................................... 2161

NEW FORMAT FOR GENERAL GOVERNMENT GAZETTES
For ease of access to particular notices the general Gazette will be divided into two parts as
detailed below. In each part, the notices will appear in alphabetical order of the authorising
Department.

Part 1 will contain Proclamations, Regulations, Rules, Local Laws and various other
Instruments etc. but not Town Planning Schemes.

Part 2 will contain general notices and information and Town Planning Schemes.



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial, State Law Publisher, 10
William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised beforehand on the inside cover).
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 1998.

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$17.70

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$41.30

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$41.30 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these instances
arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
  Per Column Centimetre—$8.15

  Bulk Notices—$153.00 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.
• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they

fall on a Tuesday or Friday.
In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



28 May 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2147

—  PART  1  —

ENERGY

EC301*

Electricity Act 1945

Electricity (Licensing) Amendment
Regulations 1999

Made by the Lieutenant Governor and Administrator in Executive
Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Electricity (Licensing)
Amendment Regulations 1999.

2. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 to the Electricity (Licensing) Regulations 1991* is
amended as follows:

(a) in item 1(b) by deleting “16 P.A.” and inserting
instead —

“    22 P.A.    ”;

(b) in item 2(b) by deleting “230” and inserting instead —

“    256    ”;

(c) in item 2(c) by deleting “115” and inserting instead —

“    128    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 26 February 1997.
For amendments to 25 February 1999 see 1997 Index 
to Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 63.]

By Command of the Lieutenant Governor and Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



2148 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [28 May 1999

HEALTH

HE301*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment
Regulations 1999

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Services
Charges) Amendment Regulations 1999.

2. Schedule amended

Part 1 of the Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges)
Regulations 1984* is amended as follows:

(a) in item 1(c) by deleting “$27.05 per day” and inserting
instead —

“    $27.35 per day    ”;

(b) in item 1(d)(i) by deleting “$90.85 per day” and
inserting instead —

“    $91.15 per day    ”;

(c) in item 1(d)(ii) by deleting “$84.85 per day” and
inserting instead —

“    $85.15 per day    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 14 February 1995.
For amendments to 7 April 1999 see 1997 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 144 and
Gazette 27 February and 30 June 1998 and
22 January 1999.]

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



28 May 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2149

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG301

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
City of Rockingham

PARKING LOCAL LAW 1995 AMENDMENT
Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and by all other
powers, the Council of the City of Rockingham resolved to amend the Parking Local
Law 1995 on the 25th day of May 1999, as follows—

deletion of the following words in clause 4(2)
“other than a parking facility or parking station which—

(a) is neither owned, controlled nor occupied by the municipality; or
(b) although owned by the municipality, is leased to another person.”

and the following words substituted
“If—

(a) the parking station(s) and/or parking facility(ies) are either owned,
controlled or occupied by the municipality; or

(b) the parking station(s) and/or parking facility(ies) are owned by the
municipality, are leased to another person and that person consents
in writing to their use as such; or

(c) the parking station(s) and/or parking facility(ies) are privately
owned and the owner or occupier consents in writing to their use as
such.”

Dated this 26th day of May 1999.
The Common Seal of the City of Rockingham as affixed in the presence of—

C. S. ELLIOTT, Mayor.
G. G. HOLLAND, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [28 May 19992150

— PART 2 —

FISHERIES

FI401
FISHERIES ADJUSTMENT SCHEMES ACT 1987

HARDY INLET ESTUARINE FISHERY VOLUNTARY FISHERIES ADJUSTMENT
SCHEME NOTICE 1999

FD 1504/97

Made by the Minister for Fisheries under section 10B of the Act.

Citation
1. This notice may be cited as the Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment
Scheme Notice 1999.

Interpretation
2. In this notice—

“authorization” means a fishing boat licence or a commercial fishing licence as described in this
notice;

“commercial fishing licence” means a licence granted under the regulations authorizing a person
to engage in commercial fishing in the Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fishery;

“committee” means the “Voluntary Resource Reallocation and Buyout Committee” established on
25 June 1997 under s. 11 of the Act;

“fishing boat licence” means a licence granted under the regulations authorizing a person to use a
boat for commercial fishing in the Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fishery;

“Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fishery” means the fishing for any species of fish in the Hardy Inlet;
“regulations” means the Fish Resources Management Regulations 1995;
“scheme” means the Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment Scheme

established in clause 3;

Establishment of fisheries adjustment scheme
3. There is established a fisheries adjustment scheme in respect of the Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fish-
ery to be known as the Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment Scheme.

Objective
4. The objective of the scheme is to reduce—

(a) the number of persons fishing in the Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fishery by reducing the number of
commercial fishing licences that authorize the holder to commercially fish in that fishery; and

(b) the number of boats that may be used to commercially fish in the Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fish-
ery by reducing the number of fishing boat licences that permit the holder to use a boat to
commercially fish in that fishery.

The fishery to which this scheme applies
5. The fishery to which this scheme applies is the Hardy Inlet Estuarine Fishery.

Who may offer to surrender an authorization or part of an entitlement
6. Any person who is the holder of an authorization is entitled to offer the surrender of the authoriza-
tion.

Manner of operation
7. The manner of operation of the scheme shall be—

(a) invitations for offers to surrender authorizations shall be made in accordance with section
10C(4) of the Act;

(b) any offer shall be submitted to the committee assisting the Minister in the administration of
the scheme in the form approved by that committee;

(c) the committee shall forward any offers to the Minister and advise the Minister whether to
accept or decline any offer or to make a counter offer;

(d) the Minister shall respond to any offer in accordance with section 10(5) of the Act after consid-
ering any advice of the committee.

Duration of scheme
8. This scheme shall operate from 4 May 1999 to 30 June 2000.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 215128 May 1999]

Terms of the scheme
9. The terms of the scheme are that—

(a) provided that the objective specified in clause 4 will be attained, compensation in an amount
agreed between the Minister and the holder of an authorization shall be paid for the surrender
of an authorization; and

(b) a person who surrenders an authorization as described in (a) shall retain any proprietary
rights in the fishing boat and fishing gear to which the authorization relates.

Dated this 20th day of May 1999.
MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Fisheries.

FI402
FISHERIES ADJUSTMENT SCHEMES ACT 1987

LESCHENAULT ESTUARINE FISHERY VOLUNTARY FISHERIES ADJUSTMENT
SCHEME NOTICE 1999

FD 1163/97
Made by the Minister for Fisheries under section 10B of the Act.

Citation
1. This notice may be cited as the Leschenault Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment
Scheme Notice 1999.

Interpretation
2. In this notice—

“authorization” means a fishing boat licence or a commercial fishing licence as described in this
notice;

“commercial fishing licence” means a licence granted under the regulations authorizing a person
to engage in commercial fishing in the Leschenault Estuarine Fishery;

“committee” means the “Voluntary Resource Reallocation and Buyout Committee” established on
25 June 1997 under s. 11 of the Act;

“fishing boat licence” means a licence granted under the regulations authorizing a person to use a
boat for commercial fishing in the Leschenault Estuarine Fishery;

“regulations” means the Fish Resources Management Regulations 1995;
“Leschenault Estuarine Fishery” means the fishing for any species of fish in the Leschenault Es-

tuary;
“scheme” means the Leschenault Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment Scheme es-

tablished in clause 3;

Establishment of fisheries adjustment scheme
3. There is established a fisheries adjustment scheme in respect of the Leschenault Estuarine Fish-
ery to be known as the Leschenault Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment Scheme.

Objective
4. The objective of the scheme is to reduce—

(a) the number of persons fishing in the Leschenault Estuarine Fishery by reducing the number
of commercial fishing licences that authorize the holder to commercially fish in that fishery;
and

(b) the number of boats that may be used to commercially fish in the Leschenault Estuarine
Fishery by reducing the number of fishing boat licences that permit the holder of that licence
to use a boat to commercially fish in that fishery.

The fishery to which this scheme applies
5. The fishery to which this scheme applies is the Leschenault Estuarine Fishery.

Who may offer to surrender an authorization or part of an entitlement
6. Any person who is the holder of an authorization is entitled to offer the surrender of the authoriza-
tion.

Manner of operation
7. The manner of operation of the scheme shall be—

(a) invitations for offers to surrender authorizations shall be made in accordance with section
10C(4) of the Act;

(b) any offer shall be submitted to the committee assisting the Minister in the administration of
the scheme in the form approved by that committee;

(c) the committee shall forward any offers to the Minister and advise the Minister whether to
accept or decline any offer or to make a counter offer;

(d) the Minister shall respond to any offer in accordance with section 10(5) of the Act after consid-
ering any advice of the committee.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [28 May 19992152

Duration of scheme
8. This scheme shall operate from 4 May 1999 to 30 June 2000.

Terms of the scheme
9. The terms of the scheme are that—

(a) provided that the objective specified in clause 4 will be attained, compensation in an amount
agreed between the Minister and the holder of an authorization shall be paid for the surrender
of an authorization; and

(b) a person who surrenders an authorization as described in (a) shall retain any proprietary
rights in the fishing boat and fishing gear to which the authorization relates.

Dated this 20th day of May 1999.

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Fisheries.

FI403
FISHERIES ADJUSTMENT SCHEMES ACT 1987

MANDURAH ESTUARINE FISHERY VOLUNTARY FISHERIES ADJUSTMENT
SCHEME NOTICE 1999

FD 1164/97
Made by the Minister for Fisheries under section 10B of the Act.

Citation
1. This notice may be cited as the Mandurah Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment Scheme
Notice 1999.

Interpretation
2. In this notice—

“authorization” means a fishing boat licence or a commercial fishing licence as described in this
notice;

“commercial fishing licence” means a licence granted under the regulations authorizing a person
to engage in commercial fishing in the Mandurah Estuarine Fishery;

“committee” means the “Voluntary Resource Reallocation and Buyout Committee” established on
25 June 1997 under s. 11 of the Act.,

“fishing boat licence” means a licence granted under the regulations authorizing a person to use a
boat for commercial fishing in the Mandurah Estuarine Fishery;

“Mandurah Estuarine Fishery” means the fishing for any species of fish in the Mandurah Estuary;
“regulations” means the Fish Resources Management Regulations 1995;
“scheme” means the Mandurah Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment Scheme estab-

lished in clause 3;

Establishment of fisheries adjustment scheme
3. There is established a fisheries adjustment scheme in respect of the Mandurah Estuarine Fishery
to be known as the Mandurah Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment Scheme.

Objective
4. The objective of the scheme is to reduce—

(a) the number of persons fishing in the Mandurah Estuarine Fishery by reducing the number of
commercial fishing licences that authorize the holder to commercially fish in that fishery; and

(b) the number of boats that may be used to commercially fish in the Mandurah Estuarine Fish-
ery by reducing the number of fishing boat licences that permit the holder of that licence to use
a boat to commercially fish in that fishery.

The fishery to which this scheme applies
5. The fishery to which this scheme applies is the Mandurah Estuarine Fishery.

Who may offer to surrender an authorization or part of an entitlement
6. Any person who is the holder of an authorization is entitled to offer the surrender of the authoriza-
tion.

Manner of operation
7. The manner of operation of the scheme shall be—

(a) invitations for offers to surrender authorizations shall be made in accordance with section
10C(4) of the Act;

(b) any offer shall be submitted to the committee assisting the Minister in the administration of
the scheme in the form approved by that committee;

(c) the committee shall forward any offers to the Minister and advise the Minister whether to
accept or decline any offer or to make a counter offer;



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 215328 May 1999]

Duration of scheme
8. This scheme shall operate from 4 May 1999 to 30 June 2000.

Terms of the scheme
9. The terms of the scheme are that—

(a) provided that the objective specified in clause 4 will be attained, compensation in an amount
agreed between the Minister and the holder of an authorization shall be paid for the surrender
of an authorization; and

(b) a person who surrenders an authorization as described in (a) shall retain any proprietary
rights in the fishing boat and fishing gear to which the authorization relates.

Dated this 20th day of May 1999.

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Fisheries.

FI404
FISHERIES ADJUSTMENT SCHEMES ACT 1987

SOUTH COAST ESTUARINE FISHERY VOLUNTARY FISHERIES ADJUSTMENT
SCHEME NOTICE 1999

FD 1161/97
Made by the Minister for Fisheries under section 10B of the Act.

Citation
1. This notice may be cited as the South Coast Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment
Scheme Notice 1999.

Interpretation
2. In this notice—

“authorization” means a fishing boat licence or a commercial fishing licence as described in this
notice;

“commercial fishing licence” means a licence granted under the regulations authorizing a person
to engage in commercial fishing in an estuary on the south coast of Western Australia between
Cape Beaufort and 129° east longitude;

“committee” means the “Voluntary Resource Reallocation and Buyout Committee” established on
25 June 1997 under s. 11 of the Act;

“fishing boat licence” means a licence granted under the regulations authorizing a person to use a
boat for commercial fishing in an estuary on the south coast of Western Australia between
Cape Beaufort and 129° east longitude;

“regulations” means the Fish Resources Management Regulations 1995;
“South Coast Estuarine Fishery” means the fishing for any species of fish in an estuary on the

south coast of Western Australia between Cape Beaufort and 129°;
“scheme” means the South Coast Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment Scheme es-

tablished in clause 3;

Establishment of fisheries adjustment scheme
3. There is established a fisheries adjustment scheme in respect of the South Coast Estuarine Fish-
ery to be known as the South Coast Estuarine Fishery Voluntary Fisheries Adjustment Scheme.

Objective
4. The objective of the scheme is to reduce—

(a) the number of persons fishing in the South Coast Estuarine Fishery by reducing the number
of commercial fishing licences that authorize the holder to commercially fish in that fishery;
and

(b) the number of boats that may be used to commercially fish in the South Coast Estuarine
Fishery by reducing the number of fishing boat licences that permit the holder of that licence
to use a boat to commercially fish in that fishery.

The fishery to which this scheme applies
5. The fishery to which this scheme applies is the South Coast Estuarine Fishery.

Who may offer to surrender an authorization or part of an entitlement
6. Any person who is the holder of an authorization is entitled to offer the surrender of the authoriza-
tion.

Manner of operation
7. The manner of operation of the scheme shall be—

(a) invitations for offers to surrender authorizations shall be made in accordance with section
10C(4) of the Act;



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [28 May 19992154

(b) any offer shall be submitted to the committee assisting the Minister in the administration of
the scheme in the form approved by that committee;

(c) the committee shall forward any offers to the Minister and advise the Minister whether to
accept or decline any offer or to make a counter offer;

(d)  the Minister shall respond to any offer in accordance with section 10(5) of the Act after consid-
ering any advice of the committee.

Duration of scheme
8. This scheme shall operate from 4 May 1999 to 30 June 2000.

Terms of the scheme
9. The terms of the scheme are that—

(a) provided that the objective specified in clause 4 will be attained, compensation in an amount
agreed between the Minister and the holder of an authorization shall be paid for the surrender
of an authorization; and

(b) a person who surrenders an authorization as described in (a) shall retain any proprietary
rights in the fishing boat and fishing gear to which the authorization relates.

Dated this 20th day of May 1999.

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Fisheries.

FAIR TRADING

FT401
RETAIL TRADING HOURS ACT 1987

RETAIL TRADING HOURS (TOWNSITE OF MANJIMUP) REVOCATION ORDER 1999

Made by the Minister under Section 13(3) of the Act.

Citation
1. This Order may be cited as the Retail Trading Hours (Townsite of Manjimup) Revocation Order
1999.

Commencement
2. This Order shall come into operation on the day on which the Order is published in the Govern-
ment Gazette.

Revocation
3. The Retail Trading Hours (Townsite of Manjimup) Order 1988 [published in the Government
Gazette of 2 September 1988 at p.3463] is hereby revoked.

DOUG SHAVE, Minister for Lands;
Fair Trading; Parliamentary and Electoral Affairs.

FT402
COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943

NATURES PATHWAYS CO-OPERATIVE LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that, pursuant to Section 26(1) of the abovenamed Act, a Certificate of Incorp-
oration, as a Limited Company, has this day been issued to—

NATURES PATHWAYS CO-OPERATIVE LIMITED

Dated this 19th day of May 1999.
Sgd. A person authorised by the Commissioner for

Corporate Affairs in Western Australia.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 215528 May 1999]

HEALTH

HE401*
MENTAL HEALTH ACT 1996

MENTAL HEALTH REVIEW BOARD
(APPOINTMENT OF PRESIDENT) INSTRUMENT (No. 2) 1999

Made by the Governor under section 126(1)(a) of the Act.

Citation
1. This notice may be cited as the Mental Health Review Board (Appointment of President)
Instrument (No. 2) 1999.

Appointment
2. Mr Neville Robert Barber is appointed as President of the Mental Health Review Board pursuant
to section 126(1)(a) of the Mental Health Act 1996 for the period ending 30 June 1999.
By His Excellency’s Command,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE402*
NURSES ACT 1992

NURSES BOARD OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA
(APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS) INSTRUMENT 1999

Made by the Minister for Health under section 6(1) of the Act.

Citation
1. This instrument may be cited as the Nurses Board of Western Australia (Appointment of Members)
Instrument 1999.

Appointment of Member
2. Mr Phillip Roy Della is appointed to the Nurses Board of Western Australia pursuant to section
6(1) of the Nurses Act 1992 for the period ending 28 October 1999.
Date: 18 May 1999.

JOHN DAY, Minister for Health.

HE403*
PSYCHOLOGISTS REGISTRATION ACT 1976

PSYCHOLOGISTS REGISTRATION BOARD OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA
(APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS) INSTRUMENT 1999

Made by the Governor under section 9(1) of the Act.

Citation
1. This instrument may be cited as the Psychologists Registration Board of Western Australia
(Appointment of Members) Instrument 1999.

Interpretation
2. In this instrument—

“table” means a table in the schedule to this instrument;
“the Act” means the Psychologists Registration Act 1976;
“the Board” means the Psychologists Registration Board of Western Australia established under

section 7(1) of the Act.

Appointment of Members
3. Each of the persons named in column 1 of the table in the schedule are appointed as members of
the Board pursuant to the provisions of the Act specified in column 2, for a period of 1 year commencing
on the date of appointment.

Appointment of Deputies
4. Pursuant to section 12(1) of the Act, each of the persons named in column 3 of the table is
appointed as deputy to act in the place of the Board member specified in column 1 of the table adjacent
to the name of that person.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [28 May 19992156

SCHEDULE
TABLE

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
MEMBER SECTION DEPUTY
Dr John Hewlett Hogben 9(1)(a) Dr Marjorie Anne Collins
Dr Oleh Vojevod Kay 9(1)(b) Dr Peter David McCarthy
Mr Leslie John Harrison 9(1)(c) Mr John Herbert Manners
Ms Bethany Joy Pennington 9(1)(c) Ms Larraine McLean
Mr Stephen Dexter Crooks 9(1)(d) Ms Janette Maria Tavelli

By His Excellency’s Command,
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

LAND ADMINISTRATION

LA401
TRANSFER OF LAND ACT 1893

APPLICATION G977488
Take notice that Geoffrey Hugh Daw and Helen Mary Daw, both of Post Office Box 839, Toodyay, have
made application to be registered under the Act as proprietors of an estate in fee simple in possession
in the land situated at Toodyay being Portion of West Toodyay Sub Lot 39 contained in Memorial Book
XXIX Number 60.
All persons other than the applicant claiming any estate right title or interest in the above land and
desiring to object to the application are required to lodge in this office on or before 22nd June 1999, a
caveat forbidding the land being brought under the operation of the Act.

IAN HYDE, Registrar of Titles.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG401
SHIRE OF DARDANUP

Temporary Rangers
It is hereby noted for public information that John Brian Kowal, Russell Anthony Finlay, Lewis Ronald
Winter, Timothy Christopher Wall and Phillippe Stephen Rowe have been appointed as Authorised
Persons of the Shire of Dardanup pursuant to the following—

To exercise powers under Part XX of the Local Government Act (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act
1960; Section 44 9 of the Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 as Pound Keeper
and Ranger; Part 9 Division 2 of the Local Government Act 1995; Section 9.13, 9.15 of the Local
Government Act 1995 as an Authorised Person; Section 3.39 of the Local Government Act 1995 as
an Authorised Person;

and as an Authorised Person pursuant to the following—
Dog Act 1976 for the purposes of registering, seizing, impounding, detaining and destroying of
dogs; Section 33E (1) Dog Act as an Authorised Person;
Control of Vehicles (Off Road Area) Act 1978;
Litter Act 1979;
Bush Fires Act 1954

and effecting general rangers duties within the district.
M. L. CHESTER, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402
DOG ACT 1976

Shire of Victoria Plains
DOG CONTROL RANGER/AUTHORISED PERSON

Mr Derek John Lloyd has been appointed by Council as an authorised person to exercise the powers
conferred on authorised persons by Section 29 of the Dog Act 1976.
The appointment of Mr David John Ashford is cancelled.

P. L. HAYES, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 215728 May 1999]

LG403
CITY OF ROCKINGHAM

Appointment of Ranger
It is hereby notified for public information that Colin Richard Curry has been appointed as Ranger for
the City of Rockingham and is authorised on behalf of the Council of the City of Rockingham to admin-
ister the following legislation within the district of the City of Rockingham—

(1) The Litter Act 1979.
(2) The Dog Act 1976—as authorised Officer and Registration Officer.
(3) The Bush Fires Act 1954-1977 and to issue Infringement Notices under section 59(a) of the

Bush Fires Act 1954-1977.
(4) The Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978.
(5) To exercise power under—

(i) Part XX of the Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960.
(ii) Section 449 of the Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 as Pound Keeper

and Ranger.
(iii) Part 9, Division 2 of the Local Government Act 1995.
(iv) Section 9.13, 9.16 of the Local Government Act 1995 as Authorised Person.
(v) Part 3, Sub-division 4 of the Local Government Act 1995.

(vi) Section 3.39 of the Local Government Act 1995 as Authorised Removal and Impounding
Employee.

(6) The City of Rockingham Parking Local Laws 1995 as Authorised Person.
(7) All City of Rockingham Local-Laws.

G. G. HOLLAND, Chief Executive Officer.

LG501
HEALTH ACT 1911
Shire of Lake Grace

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO EXTEND SEWER
Under Section 57 of the Health Act 1911 the Lake Grace Shire Council hereby gives notice of it’s
intention to extend the Lake Grace Sewerage Scheme to service Lots 101-108 inclusive Blackbutt
Drive, Lake Grace.
Any person objecting to the proposal should petition the Minister for Health in accordance with
Section 58 of the Health Act 1911 before the first (1st) day of July 1999.
A copy of the proposed extension is available for inspection at the Shire Office Stubbs Street, Lake
Grace between the hours of 9.00 a.m. and 4.00 p.m. Monday to Friday.

J. K. McENCROE, Chief Executive Officer.

MINERALS AND ENERGY

MN402
MINING ACT 1978

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE
Department of Minerals and Energy,

Mt Magnet, 18th May 1999.
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Act 1978, notice is hereby given that the licences
are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) for breach of covenant, viz. non-
payment of rent.

J. PACKINGTON, Warden.

To be heard in the Warden’s Court, Mt Magnet on the 20th July 1999.

MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD
Cue District

P 20/1740—ABC Resources Pty Ltd

Mt Magnet District
P 58/976—Leyland, Michael Terrence; Little, Terrence Harold; Pemberton, Garry Rex



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [28 May 19992158

MN401*
Commonwealth of Australia

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967
NOTICE OF GRANT OF PRODUCTION LICENCE

Production Licence No. WA-18-L was granted to BHP Petroleum (North West Shelf) Pty Ltd to have
effect from the 13 May 1999.

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum Operations Division.

MN403
MINING ACT 1978

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE
Department of Minerals and Energy,

Leonora.
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act
1978, for breach of covenant, viz, non-payment of rent.

P. M. HEANEY, Warden.

To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 15th June 1999.

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD
Mount Malcolm District

Prospecting Licences
37/4182—McKnight, Russell Geoffrey
37/5298—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart; Pascoe, David Rodney; Stockley, John Louis
37/5299—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart; Pascoe, David Rodney; Stockley, John Louis
37/5307—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart; Randell, Matthew Owen
37/5308—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart; Randell, Matthew Owen
37/5312—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart
37/5313—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart
37/5314—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart
37/5329—Normandy Gold Pty Ltd
37/5338—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart
37/5339—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart
37/5340—Singh, Barbara Lila
37/5352—McKeaig, Lindsay Stuart
37/5513—Heron Resources NL
37/5514—Heron Resources NL
37/5515—Heron Resources NL
37/5516—Heron Resources NL
37/5517—Heron Resources NL
37/5518—Heron Resources NL
37/5519—Heron Resources NL
37/5520—Heron Resources NL
37/5521—Heron Resources NL
37/5522—Heron Resources NL
37/5523—Heron Resources NL
37/5524—Heron Resources NL
37/5525—Heron Resources NL
37/5526—Heron Resources NL
37/5527—Heron Resources NL
37/5528—Heron Resources NL
37/5529—Heron Resources NL

Mount Margaret District
Prospecting Licences

38/2286—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2287—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2289—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2290—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2291—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2292—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2293—Duketon Goldfields NL



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 215928 May 1999]

Mount Margaret District—continued
Prospecting Licences—continued

38/2299—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2300—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2301—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2302—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2303—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2304—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2305—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2306—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2307—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2308—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2309—Maiden Gold NL
38/2310—Maiden Gold NL
38/2324—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2325—Duketon Goldfields NL
38/2612—Richmond, William Robert
38/2625—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2649—Williams, Geoffrey Thomas
38/2655—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2656—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2667—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2694—Crew, Christopher; Crew, Ross Frederick; Dixon, Trevor John; McKnight, Russell Geoffrey
38/2698—Crew, Christopher; Crew, Ross Frederick; Dixon, Trevor John; McKnight, Russell Geoffrey
38/2718—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2719—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2720—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2721—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2722—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2725—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2726—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2727—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2728—Maynard, Allen John
38/2729—Maynard, Allen John
38/2737—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2742—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2747—Spinifex Gold NL
38/2790—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2791—Johnson’s Well Mining NL
38/2853—Foley, Michael John; Rennie, Michael Terence Simon

Mount Morgans District
Prospecting Licences

39/3253—Bronzewing Gold NL
39/3254—Bronzewing Gold NL
39/3400—Ross, Ian James

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF DALWALLINU

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 1—AMENDMENT NO 8
Ref: 853/3/5/1 Pt 8
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Dalwallinu Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 20 May, 1999 for the purpose of:

1. amending Table I—Zoning Table (RURAL Use Class) by inserting a new Use Class ‘Stables’
with the following symbols against each column:—

TABLE I—ZONING TABLE

Zone 1 2 3 4 5 6

Stables SA SA SA P



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [28 May 19992160

2. amending Schedule I—Interpretations by inserting after the definition of ‘Showroom’ the fol-
lowing definition:—

“Stable” means a premises used for the keeping, breeding, agistment and rearing of horses
and ponies and may include the use of associated buildings, corrals, and compounds.

W. R. CARTER, Mayor.
W. T. ATKINSON, Chief Executive Officer.

PD402*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT

SHIRE OF DANDARAGAN

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 6—AMENDMENT NO 18

Ref: 853/3/6/7 Pt 18

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of
Dandaragan Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 20 May, 1999 for the purpose of amending Appen-
dix 1 (Additional Requirements Special Rural Zone) by modifying provision “a” relating to Part of
Victoria Location 10602 Jurien East Road, Jurien by deleting the following:—

“Part of Victoria Location 10602 (a) Subdivision shall be generally in accordance with
Jurien East Road, Jurien the Plan of Subdivision Plan No 1, which forms part

of the Scheme. Building envelopes as depicted on Plan
of Subdivision No 1 may be varied by Council to avoid
areas of limestone outcropping for effluent disposal.”

and substituting the following words:

“Lot 1, portion of Victoria Location (a) Subdivision shall be generally in accordance with a
10602 Jurien Road, Jurien. Subdivision Guide Plan approved by Council and en-

dorsed by the Commission. Council may, upon appli-
cation from the developer/lot owner, agree to vary the
position and/or configuration of a building envelope
provided it can be demonstrated from on-site investi-
gation that the existing building envelope does not
suit the individual characteristics of the lot and the
new building envelope is environmentally acceptable.”

G. SNOOK, President.
B. J. HOLDING, Chief Executive Officer.

PD403*
METROPOLITAN REGION TOWN PLANNING SCHEME ACT 1959

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME

NOTICE OF RESOLUTION

CLAUSE 32 (No 57)

NORTH COOGEE
File: 810-2-1-1; 810-2-1-8

The Western Australian Planning Commission (the Commission) has resolved in accordance with the
provisions of clause 32 of the Metropolitan Region Scheme (MRS) to define an area of the Scheme
which is to be reviewed. The defined area is generally in North Coogee and is depicted on Commission
plan number 4.1472.

In respect of this defined area, the Cities of Cockburn and Fremantle are required to forward every
application made under clause 28 of the MRS for all classes of development to the Commission for
determination.

PETER MELBIN, Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 216128 May 1999]

POLICE

PE501
POLICE ACT 1892
POLICE AUCTION

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892-1992, unclaimed found and stolen property and bicycles
will be sold by public auction at Smith Broughton & Sons, 1 Clayton Street, Midland on Saturday,
5 June 1999 at 9.00am.
The auction is to be conducted by Mr Gary J. Silcock.

R. FALCONER, Commissioner of Police,
West Australian Police Service.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA401
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988

SUMMARY OF LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and required
to be advertised.  Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection
process, should contact the Liquor Licensing Division, 1st Floor, Hyatt Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace,
Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation.

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE
1604/98 Peckham Mining Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Tavern 4/7/99

licence in respect of premises situated in
Meekatharra and known as Mt Augustus
Outback Tourist Resort.

1605/98 Cedardale Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Hotel licence 23/6/99
in respect of premises situated in Perth
and known as Moon & Sixpence.

1606/98 Fini Properties Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Special 24/6/99
Facility licence in respect of premises
situated in Karratha and known as
Karratha Central Apartment Hotel.

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS
1113/98 Newman Club Inc Application for the grant of an extended 11/6/99

trading permit—ongoing extended hours,
in respect of premises situated in Newman
and known as Newman Club Inc.

1114/98 Curtin Hotels Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an extended 4/4/99
trading permit—ongoing extended hours,
in respect of premises situated in
Karawara and known as Kitty O’Shea’s
Hotel.

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988.

G. B. AVES, Director of Liquor Licensing.

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ101
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their claims
to me on before 28 June 1999 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, having regard
only to the claims of which I then have notice.
Arbery, Ethel May, late of 441 Rokeby Road, Subiaco, died 26/1/99. (DEC 317094 DC4)



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [28 May 19992162

Avery, Roberta Helen, late of Shoalwater Nursing Home, 74 Fourth Avenue, Shoalwater, died 8/5/99.
(DEC 319323 DS4)

Bloomfield, Robert Leslie, late of Midland Nursing Home, 44 John Street, Midland, formerly of 5/20
Deakin Street, Bassendean, died 3/5/99. (DEC 319159 DP4)

Diggins, Isabella, late of Braemar Court, 11/234 Canning Highway, East Fremantle, died 15/3/99.
(DEC 318176 DS4)

Graham, Norma Olwyn, late of 28 Hefron Way, Parmelia, died 19/4/99. (DEC 319329 DG3)
Foster, Emily Louisa, late of Brookton Nursing Home, 9 Lennard Street, Brookton, died 2/5/99. (DEC

319026 DG4)
Gennoe, Hector Howard, late of Leighton Nursing Home, 40 Florence Street, West Perth, formerly of

213A Grand Promenade, Doubleview, died 19/5/99. (DEC 319391 DA2)
Green, Christina Simpson, late of Association for the Blind, 8/163 Royal Street, Yokine, died 28/4/99.

(DEC 319272 DG2)
Hall, Mary, late of Tindara Nursing Home, 73 Jarrah Road, Bentley, died 1/5/99. (DEC 319160 DS4)
Handley, William James, late of Timberside Villas, 63/10 Timbercrest Rise, Woodvale, died 28/4/99.

(DEC 319335 DL3)
Johnson, Cyril Peter, late of 24 Klem Avenue, Salter Point, formerly of 91 Amethyst Crescent, Armadale,

died 4/5/99. (DEC 319288 DC2)
Luff, Justin Ashley, late of Unit 206/447 Stirling Highway, Cottesloe, died 3/12/97. (DEC 317946 DA3)
Martin, James Ernest, late of 8 Watsonia Road, Kalamunda, died 25/4/99. (DEC 318964 DS4)
Matthew, Violet Joan, late of 21 Duncan Road, Coodanup, died 27/3/99. (DEC 318175 DP1)
McCorry, Dulcie Janet, late of 18L Metrome Village, 30 Winifred Road, Bayswater, died 15/5/99. (DEC

319336 DL4)
McCulloch, Joseph, late of 104/49 Smith Street, Highgate, died 25/12/98. (DEC 317075 DS4)
Moore, Charles Alfred, late of 18 Sampson Close, Midland, died 25/2/99. (DEC 318412 DL4)
Myssonski, Enid Dorothy, late of Osborne Lodge, Osborne Place, Stirling, formerly of 108 Gildercliffe

Street, Scarborough, died 26/4/99. (DEC 319297 DS2)
Parry, Jean Patricia, late of 57/37 Brittania Road, Mount Hawthorn, died 8/5/99. (DEC 319326 DG4)
Pendlebury, Arthur, late of 20 Parker Street, Bassendean, died 25/3/99. (DEC 318313 DP3)
Shannon, Robert William Floyd, late of 11 Hesse Street, Waroona, died 13/4/99. (DEC 318920 DG1)
Turner, Grace June, late of 32 Carnarvon Street, East Victoria Park, died 12/5/99. (DEC 319303 DC3)
Williams, Linda May, late of 6 Avenue, Maylands, died 10/5/99. (DEC 319275 DC4)

K. E. BRADLEY, Public Trustee,
Public Trust Office, 565 Hay Street,

Perth WA 6000.
Telephone: 9222 6777

ZZ201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and all persons having claims in respect of the estates of the undermentioned persons are
required by the executor to send particulars of their claims to Messrs. Robertson Hayles, 4th Floor,
33 Barrack Street, Perth 6000 by 29 June 1999 after which date the executor may distribute assets
having regard only to claims of which he has had notice.
Belski, Anatol, late of 25 Hornsey Road, Floreat, (died 27 May 1998).
Drakesmith, Thomas Henry, late of Rockingham Nursing Home, Rockingham, (died 18 January 1999).
Fellowes, Ursula Violet, late of 6 Belgrade Road, Wanneroo, (died 17 April 1999).

G. E. HAYLES, Executor.

ZZ203
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

In the estate of the late Richard Alexander Burwood of 12 Shoalwater Road, Shoalwater formerly of
8 Cavan Street, Bicton in the State of Western Australia, Ship Master deceased 3 May 1999. Creditors
and other persons having claim (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) are required by
the Executors Richard Paul Burwood and Julie Anne French of 75a Birdwood Circus, Bicton WA 6157
to send particulars of their claims to them by 30 June 1999 after which date the Executors may convey
or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which they then have notice.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 216328 May 1999]

ZZ202
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the undermentioned deceased person are required to send particulars of their claims to the
Executor care of Mayberry, Hammond & Co., 85 Fitzgerald Street, Northam within one (1) calendar
month from the date of publication of this Notice at the expiration of which time the Trustees may
convey or distribute the assets having regard only to claims of which notice has been given.
Details—

Killick, Frederick Albert Roland, late of Avon Valley Residency, Burgoyne Street, Northam. Date of
Death: 28 February 1999.

Dated this 21st day of May 1999.

(Sgd.) Messrs. Mayberry, Hammond & Co.,
85 Fitzgerald Street, Northam,

Solicitors for the Executor.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

YOUNG OFFENDERS ACT 1994

 *Price: $15.50 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 300 grams

YOUNG OFFENDERS REGULATIONS 1995
*Price $3.90 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 65 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

RETIREMENT VILLAGES ACT 1992
Price: $6.70 Counter Sales

Plus Postage on 132 grams

RETIREMENT VILLAGES REGULATIONS 1992
*Price: $3.90 Counter Sales

Plus Postage on 25 grams
* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 1992

*Price: $13.90 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 365 grams



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [28 May 19992164

Order your Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

1999
An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes

of Government Gazette

For further information please contact:
State Law Publisher
Telephone: 9321 7688

NOW
AVAILABLE ! !

For Government Departments and private firms who
presently arrange binding for their copies of
Government Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is
now offering a subscription covering 4 Quarterly
Volumes at a cost of $891.00.

The Gazettes will be bound in black cloth with gold foil
lettering on the spine and personalised by  the addition
of the client's name in gold lettering on the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE

On the rare occasion where extra gazettes are published
in one quarter, a fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost involved will be borne by the
State Law Publisher and not passed on to clients.

�������������


