
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

2859

PERTH, WEDNESDAY, 30 JUNE 1999  No. 117 SPECIAL
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 2.45 PM

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

FIREARMS ACT 1973
_________

FIREARMS AMENDMENT
REGULATIONS 1999

PAWNBROKERS AND SECOND-HAND DEALERS
ACT 1994
_________

PAWNBROKERS AND SECOND-
HAND DEALERS AMENDMENT

REGULATIONS 1999

SECURITY AND RELATED ACTIVITIES
(CONTROL) ACT 1996

_________

SECURITY AND RELATED
ACTIVITIES (CONTROL)

AMENDMENT REGULATIONS
1999

POLICE ACT 1892
_________

POLICE (FEES) AMENDMENT
REGULATIONS 1999



2860 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 1999



30 June 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2861

Firearms Act 1973

Firearms Amendment Regulations 1999

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Firearms Amendment
Regulations 1999.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1999.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Firearms
Regulations 1974*.
[* Reprinted as at 28 January 1997.

For amendments to 1 June 1999 see 1998 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p 92.]

4. Regulation 4 amended

(1) The Table to subregulation 4(1a) is deleted and the following
Table is inserted instead —

“
Table of Application Forms and Fees

Form
No.

Kind of Licence Fee
$

1 Firearm Licence – original issue (1 year) . . . . . . 74
1 Firearm Licence - renewal (1 year) . . . . . . . . . . . 22
1 Firearm Collector's Licence – original issue

(5 years) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 84
1 Firearm Collector's Licence – renewal (5 years) . 44
2 Corporate Licence - original issue (1 year) . . . . . 134
2 Corporate Licence - renewal (1 year) . . . . . . . . . 72

Fee for noting an additional firearm on the licence
(each) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14

    ”.

(2) Regulation 4(1b)(a) is amended by deleting “$12” and
inserting —

“    $14    ”.



2862 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 1999

(3) The Table to subregulation 4(1c) is deleted and the following
Table is inserted instead —

“
Table of Application Forms and Fees

Form
No.

Kind of Licence Fee
$

3 Dealer’s Licence – original issue (1 year) . . . . . . 135
3 Dealer’s Licence - renewal (1 year) . . . . . . . . . . 73
3 Repairer’s Licence - original issue (1 year) . . . . 96
3 Repairer’s Licence - renewal (1 year) . . . . . . . . . 40
3 Manufacturer’s Licence - original issue (1 year) 96
3 Manufacturer’s Licence - renewal (1 year) . . . . . 40
3 Shooting Gallery Licence - original issue

(1 year) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 96
3 Shooting Gallery Licence - renewal (1 year) . . . 40
4 Ammunition Collector's Licence – original issue

(5 years) ) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 84
4 Ammunition Collector's Licence – renewal

(5 years) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 44
    ”.

5. Regulation 5 amended

Regulation 5(1)(b) is amended by deleting “$6” and inserting —

“    $7    ”.

6. Regulation 7 amended

After regulation 7(5) the following subregulation is added —

“
(6) The applicant for an Extract of Licence is to pay a fee

of $10 for the issue of that Extract of Licence.
    ”.

7. Regulation 8 amended

Regulation 8(2) is amended by deleting “$12” and inserting —

“    $14    ”.

8. Regulation 11 amended

Regulation 11(1) is amended by deleting “$14” and inserting —

“    $37    ”.

9. Regulation 27 amended

Regulation 27(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$100” and
inserting —

“    $150    ”.
By Command of the deputy of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



30 June 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2863

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers
Amendment Regulations 1999

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Pawnbrokers and Second-
hand Dealers Amendment Regulations 1999.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1999.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Pawnbrokers
and Second-hand Dealers Regulations 1996*.
[* Published in Gazette 29 March 1996, pp. 1557-76.

For amendments to 24 May 1999 see 1998 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 227-8.]

4. Regulation 28 amended

The Table to regulation 28(4) is deleted and the following Table
is inserted instead —

“

TABLE —FEES FOR ISSUE OF LICENCES

Item
No.

Licence 1 year
or part
thereof

($)

2 years
or part
thereof

($)

3 years
or part
thereof

($)
1. Pawnbroker’s

licence only 286 481 675

2. Second-hand
dealers licence only
(computer option) 286 481 675

3. Second-hand
dealers licence only
(facsimile option) 366 678 988

4. Pawnbroker’s
licence and second-
hand dealers
licence 325 520 715

    ”.



2864 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 1999

5. Regulation 28 amended

The Table to regulation 28(4) is deleted and the following Table
is inserted instead —

“

TABLE —RENEWAL FEES FOR LICENCES

Item
No.

Licence 1 year
or part
thereof

($)

2 years
or part
thereof

($)

3 years
or part
thereof

($)
1. Pawnbroker’s

licence only 211 409 607
2. Second-hand

dealers licence only
(computer option) 211 409 607

3. Second-hand
dealers licence only
(facsimile option) 338 648 958

4. Pawnbroker’s
licence and second-
hand dealers
licence 225 438 637

    ”.

6. Regulation 31 amended

Regulation 31 is amended by deleting “$8.00.” and inserting
instead —

“    $9.00.    ”.

By Command of the deputy of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



30 June 1999] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2865

Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996

Security and Related Activities (Control)
Amendment Regulations 1999

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Security and Related
Activities (Control) Amendment Regulations 1999.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1999.

3. Schedule 4 amended

Schedule 4 to the Security and Related Activities (Control)
Regulations 1997* is amended as follows:

(a) under the heading “Agents licences” in column 3 —

(i) in the first item commencing “s. 46 (1)”, by
deleting “180” and “200” and inserting
respectively —

“    190    ” and “    210    ”; and

(ii) in the item commencing “s. 49 (1) (c)”, by
deleting “120” and inserting instead —

“    130    ”;

(b) under the heading “Other licences” in column 3 in the
item commencing “s. 49 (1) (c)”, by deleting “40” and
inserting instead —

“    45    ”;

(c) under the heading “Miscellaneous” in column 3 in the
item commencing “s. 10 (3)”, by deleting “15” and
inserting instead —

“    18    ”.
[* Published in Gazette 27 March 1997, pp. 1651-90

For amendments to 24 May 1999 see 1998 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 276.]

By Command of the deputy of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



2866 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 1999

Police Act 1892

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 1999

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Police (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 1999.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 1999.

3. The Schedule amended

The Schedule to the Police (Fees) Regulations 1981* is
amended as follows:

(a) in item 2(a) by deleting “$38.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $39.00    ”;

(b) in item 5 by deleting “$38.00” and inserting instead —

“    $39.00    ”.
[* Published in Gazette 13 February  1981, pp. 612-3.

For amendments to 24 May 1999 see 1998 Index to 
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 239-40.]

By Command of the deputy of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

�
�����

����


