
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

3189

PERTH, FRIDAY, 23 JUNE 2000  No. 118
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Dangerous Goods (Transport) Act 1998—Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Road and
Rail) Amendment Regulations 2000 .............................................................................. 3204-5

Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961—
Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Dangerous Goods Handling and Storage)

Amendment Regulations 2000 ................................................................................ 3205-6
Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Explosives) Amendment Regulations 2000 ....... 3203-4

Finance Brokers Control Act 1975—Code of Conduct Finance Brokers Board............... 3193-7
Gaming Commission Act 1987—Gaming Commission Amendment Regulations

(No. 2) 2000 ..................................................................................................................... 3206-9
Gaming Commission (Continuing Lotteries Levy) Act 2000—

Gaming Commission (Continuing Lotteries Levy) Regulations 2000....................... 3210
Gas Pipelines Access (Western Australia) Act 1998—Gas Pipelines Access (Privatized

DBNGP System) (Transitional) Amendment Regulations 2000................................... 3191-2
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—

Hospitals and Health Services (Central Great Southern Health Service Board
Appointments) Instrument 2000 ............................................................................. 3199-200

Hospitals and Health Services (Reorganisation of Hospital Boards) Notice 2000 ... 3197-8
Interpretation Act 1984—

Gaming Commission (Continuing Lotteries Levy) Regulations 2000....................... 3210
Local Government Act 1995—

City of Geraldton—Parking and Parking Facilities Local Law................................. 3201-2
Shire of Morawa—Parking and Parking Facilities Local Law.................................. 3200-1

Mines Safety and Inspection Act 1994—Mines Safety and Inspection Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2000................................................................................................. 3202-3

Proclamation—Acts Amendment (Continuing Lotteries) Act 2000—Act No. 6 of 2000 . 3191
Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987—Rottnest Island Amendment Regulations 2000 .. 3211-2
Stamp Act 1921—Stamp Amendment Regulations 2000................................................. 3210-1

———

PART 2

Agriculture.......................................................................................................................... 3213
Conservation & Land Management .................................................................................. 3213
Heritage Council ................................................................................................................ 3214
Local Government .............................................................................................................. 3215
Minerals and Energy.......................................................................................................... 3215-27
Premier and Cabinet.......................................................................................................... 3228
Public Notices—

Deceased Estates ......................................................................................................... 3230-2
Application for Winding-up......................................................................................... 3232-3

Public Sector Management ................................................................................................ 3228
Racing, Gaming and Liquor............................................................................................... 3228-9
Water .................................................................................................................................. 3229-30



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial, State Law Publisher, 10
William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised beforehand on the inside cover).

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2000 (Prices include GST).

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$19.91

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$46.53

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$46.53 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
  Per Column Centimetre—$9.24
  Bulk Notices—$172.70 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.

• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they
fall on a Tuesday or Friday.

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3191

—  PART  1  —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA101*

ACTS AMENDMENT (CONTINUING LOTTERIES) ACT 2000
Act No. 6 of 2000
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
G. A. Kennedy,
Administrator.

[L.S.]

} By the Honourable Geoffrey Alexander
Kennedy, Officer of the Order of
Australia, Administrator of
the State of Western Australia.

I, the Administrator, acting under section 2 of the Acts Amendment (Continuing
Lotteries) Act 2000 and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix
1 July 2000 as the day on which that Act comes into operation.
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 13 June 2000.
By Command of the Administrator,

NORMAN MOORE, Minister for Racing and Gaming.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !

Note for Information—
The commencement of the Acts Amendment (Continuing Lotteries) Act 2000, as fixed
by the above proclamation, also brings into operation the Gaming Commission
(Continuing Lotteries Levy) Act 2000.

ELECTRICITY

EG301*

Gas Pipelines Access (Western Australia) Act 1998

Gas Pipelines Access (Privatized DBNGP
System) (Transitional) Amendment

Regulations 2000

Made under clause 9(2) of Schedule 3 to the Act by the Administrator in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Gas Pipelines Access
(Privatized DBNGP System) (Transitional) Amendment
Regulations 2000.



3192 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Gas Pipelines
Access (Privatized DBNGP System) (Transitional)
Regulations 1999*.

[*Published in Gazette 31 December 1999, pp. 7093-4.]

4. Regulation 3 amended

(1) Section 3(1) is amended by deleting “regulation 35 of ”.

(2) Section 3(1) is amended by deleting “(which relates to prices in
a post-transfer access contract) is” and inserting instead —

“    are    ”.

5. Schedule 1 amended

(1) Schedule 1 is amended by inserting before clause 1 the
following clauses —

“
1A. Modified regulations 35(1)(a) and (b)

Regulations 35(1)(a) and (b) are amended by adding at the
end of each of them —

“
, unless the excess is justifiable under
subregulation (1a)

    ”

1B. Additional subregulation (1a)

After regulation 35(1) the following subregulation is
inserted —

“
(1a) If the price, or a component of the price, exceeds the amount

to which it would be limited because of subregulation (1),
the excess is justifiable if it is no more than is necessary to
offset the consequences of the New Tax System changes
(and no other changes) in relation to that contract.

    ”.
(2) Clause 2(1)(b) of Schedule 1 is amended by inserting after the

definition of “clause 95” the following definition —

“
“New Tax System changes” has the same meaning as it has

in the New Tax System Price Exploitation Code text
applying as a law of this State under the New Tax
System Price Exploitation Code (Western Australia)
Act 1999.

    ”.

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3193

FAIR TRADING

FT301*

FINANCE BROKERS CONTROL ACT 1975
CODE OF CONDUCT FINANCE BROKERS BOARD

The following code of conduct has been approved by the Finance Brokers Supervisory
Board pursuant to the provisions of section 81 of the Finance Brokers Control Act
1975 (“the Act”).
Finance Brokers failing to comply with the terms of the Code of Conduct will be
liable for disciplinary action pursuant to section 83 (2) (c) (iii) of the Act.

1. Definitions
In this Code of Conduct (“this Code”) the following words have the meanings
indicated—

“The Act” means The Finance Brokers Control Act 1975.
“Finance Broker” has the same meaning as under section 4 of the Act.
“Principal” means the person corporation or other entity for, or on behalf of

whom, a Finance Broker negotiates or arranges a loan of money.
“Party” means any party to a loan transaction in which the Finance Broker acts

as a finance broker.

2. Duties to Parties
2.1 The Finance Broker must not, without the consent of his or her Principal,
directly or indirectly disclose the Principal’s confidence or reveal the contents of any
instructions, information, documents or papers given to the Finance Broker by the
Principal to any person except to the extent required by law.
2.2 The Finance Broker’s duty of confidentiality towards his or her Principal
continues after the relationship of principal and agent has ceased.
2.3 The Finance Broker must treat—

(a) all Parties fairly and honestly and
(b) not engage in any harsh or unconscionable conduct towards any party.

2.4 The Finance Broker must exercise reasonable skill, care and diligence in the
conducting and carrying on business of a finance broker.
2.5 The Finance Broker must carry out competently all relevant instructions issued
by the Finance Broker’s Principal as soon as is reasonably possible.
2.6 The Finance Broker must not knowingly or negligently—

(a) mislead or deceive any Party or
(b) make any false representations to any Party.

2.7 The Finance Broker’s  Principal must be given undivided fidelity unaffected by
any interest of the Finance Broker or of any other person.
2.8 The Finance Broker must at all times disclose to his or her Principal any interest
the Finance Broker may have or intends to have in any loan transaction involving
the Principal and the Finance Broker shall only act for that Principal if the Principal
is fully informed and agrees to the Finance Broker acting or continuing to act in that
transaction.
2.9 The Finance Broker must provide in a timely manner and without undue delay
all information requested by a lender or borrower relating to a loan to which they are
parties, including any request for a statement of account for a loan managed by the
Finance Broker (subject to Article 5.3) provided the request is reasonable.
2.10 Before the execution of a mortgage to secure a loan negotiated and arranged by
the Finance Broker the lender and borrower must be given a notice in writing
substantially in the form of Form 1 in the Schedule to this Code containing the
following information—

(a) Full name and address of lender
(b) Full name and address of borrower
(c) Amount of the loan
(d) Description of the property to be mortgaged
(e) Priority of Mortgage
(f) Interest rate
(g) Commencement date for interest
(h) Date of advance
(i) Purpose for which loan is required
(j) Penalty rate

(k) Repayment dates



3194 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

(l) Term of loan
(m) Rights of discharge
(n) The name or names of the party or parties for whom the Finance Broker

acts.
2.11 Before negotiating and arranging a loan the Finance Broker must make full
disclosure to the prospective lender and borrower of all interests the Finance Broker
may have, or intends to have, directly or indirectly in any property being offered as
security for a loan. The disclosure must also be made in the case where employees
agents or members of the Finance Broker’s family may have or intend to have a
corresponding interest.
2.12 Where such an interest exists and full disclosure is made the Finance Broker
must not act in the loan transaction unless the lender and the borrower both receive
independent advice from a legal practitioner or finance broker.

3. Duties to Borrowers
3.1 Where the Finance Broker is also a licensed real estate agent and a loan
transaction is negotiated and arranged on behalf of a borrower the loan shall not be
made conditional upon the Finance Broker obtaining an authority to sell or be given
a management agreement in relation to any property being offered as security for
the loan.
3.2 A Finance Broker must enquire whether a prospective borrower is eligible for a
low interest government or other beneficial loan and if the prospective borrower is
eligible he or she must be informed of this fact by the Finance Broker before any
further steps are taken in negotiating and arranging the loan.

4. Duties to Lenders
4.1 The Finance Broker must—

(a) ascertain and communicate to the lender all material facts relating to any
property being offered as security for a loan and

(b) ensure all information which is provided to the lender relating to any
property being offered as security for a loan is accurate.

4.2 Where the lender requires a valuation of land to be offered as security for a loan,
the broker shall—

(a) inform the lender by notice in writing that the lender is entitled to choose
and appoint an independent valuer;

(b) immediately provide the lender with a complete copy of any valuation
obtained;

4.3 In the event that the lender instructs a finance broker to engage a valuer to value
land to be offered as security for a loan, the Finance Broker shall select an
independent licensed valuer and take reasonable steps to ensure that the valuer has
no interest whatsoever, financial or otherwise, in the property to be valued or the
loan for which the land is required as security.
4.4 If the valuer is not appointed by the lender then the Finance Broker must ensure
that the valuer’s liability for the valuation is extended to the lender.
4.5 The Finance Broker shall obtain from each intending lender, being a Finance
Broker’s Principal, a Statement substantially in the form of Form 2 in the Schedule
to this Code containing particulars of—

(a) the interest rate and when the interest is payable
(b) the terms of repayment
(c) the security required
(d) the ratio of loan to valuation
(e) the lender’s requirements for valuation of any property being offered as

security.
(f) the lender’s requirements for—

(i) The credit history of the borrower, if required
(ii) insurance

(iii) the preparation and custody of necessary documents and
(iv) a management agreement, if required.

4.6 The Finance Broker must retain the statement referred to in Article 4.5 and give
a copy to the lender.
4.7 If the Finance Broker retains the Certificate or Certificates of Title for the lender
then the Finance Broker must acknowledge in writing that fact to the Lender.
4.8 The requirement in Article 4.5 is not necessary where the intending lender is a
body corporate licensed under or exempt from licensing under the Credit
(Administration) Act 1984.



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3195

5. General
5.1 Where two Finance Brokers act in conjunction in negotiating and arranging a
loan and reach agreement in relation to sharing remuneration that remuneration
must not exceed the maximum remuneration for the transaction determined by the
Board pursuant to Section 44 of the Act.
5.2 The Finance Broker who operates a business under a licence must—

(a) Personally manage full time and carry out the principal managerial duties of
the business and where a branch office of the business is conducted ensure
that the manager of the branch office personally manages and carries out
the principal managerial duties of the branch office,

(b) Except for reasons of genuine emergency sickness or for the taking of
holidays, properly supervise the business and ensure all employees comply
with the provisions of the Act this Code and all other relevant Acts Rules
and Regulations.

5.3 The Finance Broker must provide free of charge on the request of a borrower or
lender a statement of account for a loan which is managed by the Finance Broker for
either party.
This requirement is limited to once every six months by each Party otherwise the
Finance Broker is entitled to charge for the service rendered.
5.4 The Finance Broker must be fully acquainted with all duties imposed by the Act
and this Code and in particular the Finance Broker must be aware that the
obligation to the Principal is one which requires that the duty owed to the Principal
must not be in conflict, or in any likelihood of conflict, with the Finance Broker’s own
interests or those of the Finance Broker’s employees, agents or members of the
Finance Broker’s family.
5.5 The Finance Broker may sometimes arrange and negotiate a loan for both
parties.  The test to apply is to consider whether in the interests of one party the
Finance Broker should withhold some information or advice from the other party.  If
this should occur then the Finance Broker must inform both Parties to instruct other
finance brokers to act on their behalf.
5.6 The Finance Broker must not act for a party in the same matter if that party has
provided confidential information which the Finance Broker is obliged to disclose to
the Finance Broker’s Principal to the detriment of the Party supplying the
confidential information.
Where a borrower proposes to appoint the Finance Broker to act to negotiate and
arrange a loan and the Finance Broker is also acting on behalf of the lender and is to
receive a fee commission or other remuneration from the lender for arranging and
negotiating the loan then before the appointment required by Section 43 of the Act is
effected and before the Finance Broker submits any loan application on behalf of the
borrower the Finance Broker must give to the borrower a notice in writing in the
form of Form 3 in the Schedule to this Code which must disclose the name of the
lender and the fact that a fee commission or other remuneration may be received by
the Finance Broker from the lender for negotiating and arranging the loan.

Schedule
FINANCE BROKERS CONTROL ACT 1975

CODE OF CONDUCT
Clause 2.10

Form 1
NOTICE

Finance Broker
Name And Address

Lender’s
Name and Address

Borrower’s
Name and Address

Guarantors (if any)
Name and Address

Amount of Loan

Description of Mortgaged Property

Priority of Mortgage (ie first, second mortgage or other)



3196 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

Interest Rate

Commencement Date of Interest

Date of Advance

Purpose for which loan is required

Penalty Rate

Repayment Dates

Term of the Loan

Rights of Discharge

The party/parties for whom the Finance Broker acts

Name(s) ........................................................................................................................

Address (s) ....................................................................................................................

..................................................................................................................

..................................................................................................................

ALL PARTIES TO THE LOAN TRANSACTION ARE PUT ON NOTICE
1. Where the Finance Broker acts for one Party, the other Party should seek
indepenent legal advice.
2. Where the Finance Broker acts for both Parties, each Party should seek
independent financial, legal and valuation advice.

ALL LENDERS TO THE LOAN TRANSACTION ARE PUT ON NOTICE
In the event of default by the Borrower, the Lender should seek independent legal
advice.

Clause 4.5
Form 2

STATEMENT

Interest Rate

When Interest is payable

Commencement Date of Interest

Terms of Repayment

Ratio of Loan to Valuation of Mortgaged Property

Valuation of Mortgaged Property Requirements

Description of Mortgaged Property

Credit history of Borrower required/not required

Insurance Requirements

Responsibility for Preparation and Custody of Security Documents

Management Agreement Required/Not Required



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3197

Clause 5.7
FORM 3

NOTICE OF DISCLOSURE

To .......................................................................................................................................
(name of proposed borrower)

 you have indicated your intention to appoint .................................................................
(name of Finance Broker)

to arrange a loan for you—
You should take notice that ..............................................................................................

(name of Finance Broker)

has been appointed to act for............................................................................................

............................................................................................................................................
(name of lender)

and the Finance Broker is to receive a fee, commission, or financial reward
from....................................................................................................................................

(name of lender)
in connection with the loan.
This appointment could possibly give rise in the future to a conflict of interest.  The
Finance Broker has not yet submitted your loan application, you are entitled to
appoint another finance broker to negotiate the loan for you.
Borrower’s signature(s)
.................................................. .................................................. ....../ ....../ ......

Date

Dated this 16th day of June 2000.

The common Seal of the Finance Brokers Supervisory Board was hereunder affixed
by the authority of a resolution of the Board in the presence of—

J. URQUHART, Chairman.
E.BROADLEY, Member.

HEALTH

HE301*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals and Health Services (Reorganisation
of Hospital Boards) Notice 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council under section 16(1) of
the Act.

1. Citation

This notice may be cited as the Hospitals and Health Services
(Reorganisation of Hospital Boards) Notice 2000.



3198 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

2. Commencement

This notice comes into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Amalgamation of boards to form new board

The boards mentioned in Division 1 of Schedule 1 are
reorganised by amalgamating them to form a new board.

4. Assignment of corporate name to new board

The new board formed under clause 3 is assigned the corporate
name “Central Great Southern Health Service Board”.

5. Constitution of Central Great Southern Health Service
Board

The Central Great Southern Health Service Board is constituted
in relation to the public hospitals mentioned in Division 2 of
Schedule 1.

Schedule 1 — Formation and constitution of the Central
Great Southern Health Service Board

[cl. 3 and 5]

Division 1 — Amalgamated boards

Gnowangerup District Hospital Board

Katanning Health Service

Kojonup District Hospital Board

Tambellup Hospital Board

Division 2 — Public hospitals in relation to which the Central Great
Southern Health Service Board is constituted

Gnowangerup District Hospital

Katanning District Hospital

Kojonup District Hospital

Tambellup Nursing Post

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3199

HE302*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals and Health Services (Central Great
Southern Health Service Board Appointments)

Instrument 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council under section 15 of the
Act.

1. Citation

This instrument may be cited as the Hospitals and Health
Services (Central Great Southern Health Service Board
Appointments) Instrument 2000.

2. Commencement

This instrument comes into operation immediately after the
reorganisation notice comes into operation.

3. Definitions

In this instrument —

“Central Great Southern Health Service Board” means the
board assigned that corporate name under clause 4 of the
reorganisation notice;

“former board” means a board mentioned in Division 1 of
Schedule 1 to the reorganisation notice;

“reorganisation notice” means the Hospitals and Health
Services (Reorganisation of Hospital Boards) Notice 2000.

4. Termination of term of tenure

The term of tenure of every member of a former board who
holds office on the coming into operation of this instrument is
terminated.

5. Appointment to the Central Great Southern Health Service
Board

(1) The persons mentioned in Schedule 1 to this instrument are
appointed to constitute the Central Great Southern Health
Service Board —

(a) in the case of the persons mentioned in Division 1 of
that Schedule — from 1 July 2000 to 30 September
2001;

(b) in the case of the persons mentioned in Division 2 of
that Schedule — from 1 July 2000 to 30 September
2002; and



3200 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

(c) in the case of the persons mentioned in Division 3 of
that Schedule — from 1 July 2000 to 30 September
2003.

(2) A person whose name (“the deputy member’s name”) is
mentioned in brackets in Schedule 1 to this instrument is
appointed —

(a) as the deputy for the person (“the member”) whose
name appears opposite the deputy member’s name in
that Schedule; and

(b) for the same period that the member is appointed under
subclause (1).

Schedule 1 — Appointments to Central Great Southern
Health Service Board

[cl. 5]

Division 1 — Appointments to 30 September 2001

Margaret Anne Kelly (Patricia Bunny)

Gillian Mae Lamont (Joan Anne Olden)

Division 2 — Appointments to 30 September 2002

Timothy John Eyres (Lewis Adrian Smit)

Lillian Ruth Mann (Barry John Rose)

Sandra Lorraine Shackley (Douglas John Hepworth)

Division 3 — Appointments to 30 September 2003

Christopher David Griffin (Ian David Mann)

Lorraine Frances Jury (Harold Theodore Altus)

Pauline Faye Roosendaal (Solveiga Sprigg)

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG301

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
Shire of Morawa

PARKING AND PARKING FACILITIES LOCAL LAW
Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and under all other
powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Morawa resolved on 15 June 2000 to
make the following local law.
The Shire of Leonora Parking and Parking Facilities Local Law published in the
Government Gazette of 31 May 2000, is adopted as a local law of the Shire of Morawa
with the modifications which follow—

1. Preliminary
Wherever the “Shire of Leonora” is mentioned in the local law substitute “Shire
of Morawa”.



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3201

2. Clause 1.2—Repeal
Delete clause 1.2 and substitute—

“1.2 Repeal
The Shire of Morawa did not previously have a Local Law relating to
Parking Facilities, therefore no repeal is necessary.”

Dated 19 June 2000.
The Common Seal of the Shire of Morawa was affixed by resolution of the Council in
the presence of—

JAMES, F. COOK, Shire President.
SHANE A. COLLIE, Chief Executive Officer.

LG302*

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
City of Geraldton

PARKING AND PARKING FACILITIES LOCAL LAW
The Council of the City of Geraldton records having made the following amendments
by special majority at a meeting on the 23rd May 2000.
The Local Laws relating to Parking and Parking Facilities published in the
Government Gazette on 2 July 1998 are amended as follows—

(i) Insert new Clause 33 (4) which reads: “A person shall not stand or park or
allow to stand or be parked a vehicle or bus, trailer or caravan unattached to
a motor vehicle on the street verge longer than six hours in any 24 hour
period;”

(ii) Insert new Clause 23 (a) which reads: “No person shall permit a vehicle to
remain parked in a parking station after the expiration of the period for
which the prescribed fee has been paid and during a period for which a fee is
prescribed;”

(iii) Insert new Clause 27 (4) (a) which reads: “No motor cycle or cycle shall stand
in any parking stall marked with the symbol M/C for longer than the time
permitted for parking in any stall or metered space adjacent thereto;”

(iv) Within Clause 18 (3) after the word station delete the word “of” and insert
the word “or”;”

(v) Delete the Second Schedule and insert—
Second Schedule

CITY OF GERALDTON
Cathedral Avenue

GERALDTON  WA 6530
PARKING AND PARKING FACILITIES LOCAL LAW

Clause
Number

Nature of Offence Penalty

8 Fail to Insert Coin in Parking Meter 30.00
10 Stand Against an Expired Meter 25.00
12 Park Not Wholly Within a Metered Space 30.00
13 Used Other Than Prescribed Coin in Meter 30.00
15 Stand in Metered space Marked No Parking

(Hooded)
30.00

23 Fail to Display Valid Parking Ticket 25.00
23 (a) Display Expired Parking Ticket 25.00

24 Park Not Wholly Within a Parking Stall 30.00
25 (1) (a) Cause Obstruction Within a Parking Station 50.00
25 (2) (b) Stand Longer than 30 Mins in Loading Bay 30.00
25 (2) (a) Stand Non Commercial Vehicle - Loading Bay 30.00
27 (1) (a) Stand a Vehicle of a Different Class 40.00
27 (1) (b) Park in a Disabled Stall 60.00
27 (2) (a) Stand in a No Standing Area 50.00
27 (2) (b) Park on Verge Contrary to Sign 50.00
27.2 (c) Park Other Than Motorcycle in M/C Stall 30.00

27 (2) (c) Park a Vehicle in a Motor Cycle Bay 30.00



3202 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

Clause
Number

Nature of Offence Penalty

27 (3) Park in a No Parking Area 25.00
27 (4) (a) Stand a M/C Other Than Time Allowed 30.00

27.5 Park in an Authorized Vehicles Only Area 30.00
28 (1) Park Facing Wrong Way 30.00
28 (5) Cause Obstruction on Roadway 30.00

29 Park Not Entirely Within a Parking Area 30.00
31 (2) Fail to Angle Park 30.00

32 (2) (5) (6) Stand in a Bus Stall 50.00
32 (2) (a) Double Parked 30.00
32 (2) (c) Stand So As to Cause an Obstruction 50.00
32 (2) (f) Stand on Footpath on Pedestrian Crossing 50.00
33 (4) A Park on Verge—6 hours 30.00

34 Fail to Move Vehicle When Directed 30.00
36 (1) Stand Longer than Time Permitted 30.00
36 (2) Re-Park Within Same Parking Area 30.00
37 (a) Park Vehicle For Sale on Road 30.00
38 (2) Park on Private Property Without Consent 30.00
38 (3) Park on Private Property Longer Than Allowed 30.00
39 (1) Park or Drive on a Reserve 50.00

(vi) Delete Clause 36 (1) wording and substitute—

36 (1) “Where the standing or parking of vehicles in a parking facility is
permitted for a limited time, a person shall not—

(a) move a vehicle within the parking facility so that the total time
of standing or parking exceeds the maximum time allowed for
standing or parking in the parking facility;

(b) stand a vehicle within the parking facility and by any such sign
the standing of vehicles is permitted for a specified time, for
longer than such time.

Dated at Geraldton this 9th June 2000.

The Common Seal of the City of Geraldton was affixed in the presence of—

P. G. COOPER, Mayor.
N. WILSON, Chief Executive Officer.

MINERALS AND ENERGY

MN301*

Mines Safety and Inspection Act 1994

Mines Safety and Inspection Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Mines Safety and
Inspection Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000.



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3203

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule 2 amended

Items 1 and 2 of Schedule 2 to the Mines Safety and Inspection
Regulations 1995* are amended by deleting “100” and inserting
instead —

“    110    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 17 October 1997.
For amendments to 22 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 190.]

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

MN302*

Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961

Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Explosives)
Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Explosives and Dangerous
Goods (Explosives) Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Second Schedule amended

The Second Schedule to the Explosives and Dangerous Goods
(Explosives) Regulations 1963* is amended as follows:

(a) in the item “Authorisation of explosive”, by deleting
“110.00” and inserting instead —

“    121.00    ”;

(b) in the item “Inspection of packages damaged, per day or
part thereof ”, by deleting “210.00” and inserting
instead —

“    231.00    ”;



3204 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

(c) in the item “Inspection of ships conveying explosives,
per day or part thereof ”, by deleting “210.00” and
inserting instead —

“    231.00    ”;

(d) in the item “Inspection for certificate of release”, by
deleting “130.00” and inserting instead —

“    143.00    ”;

(e) in the item “Tonnage fees for magazines erected on
explosives reserves (for every 1 000 kilograms of
licensed capacity)”, by deleting “175.00” and inserting
instead —

“    192.50    ”;

(f) in the item “Examination for a Shotfirer’s Permit”, by
deleting “130.00” and inserting instead —

“    143.00    ”;

(g) in the item “Issue of an Entry Permit”, by deleting
“130.00” and inserting instead —

“    143.00    ”;

(h) in the item “Permit for purchase and use of fireworks”,
by deleting “130.00” and inserting instead —

“    143.00    ”;

(i) in the item “Initial approval of equipment used for or in
connection with detonation of explosives”, by deleting
“250.00” and inserting instead —

“    275.00    ”;

(j) in the item “Testing of equipment for or in connection
with detonation of explosives — per unit”, by deleting
“15.00” and inserting instead —

“    16.50    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 17 March 2000.]

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

MN303*
Dangerous Goods (Transport ) Act 1998

Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Road and Rail)
Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Dangerous Goods
(Transport) (Road and Rail) Amendment Regulations 2000.



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3205

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Regulation 23.1 amended

Item 1 of the Table to regulation 23.1 of the Dangerous Goods
(Transport) (Road and Rail) Regulations 1999* is amended by
deleting “210” and inserting instead —

“    231    ”.

[* Published in Gazette 8 June 1999, pp. 2311-423.]

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

MN304*

Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961

Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Dangerous
Goods Handling and Storage) Amendment

Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Explosives and Dangerous
Goods (Dangerous Goods Handling and Storage) Amendment
Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 to the Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Dangerous
Goods Handling and Storage) Regulations 1992* is amended as
follows:

(a) in item 1, by deleting “210” and inserting instead —

“    231    ”;

(b) in Table 2 —

(i) by deleting “180” and inserting instead —

“    198    ”;



3206 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

(ii) by deleting “360” and inserting instead —

“    396    ”; and

(iii) by deleting “600” and inserting instead —

“    660    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 10 March 2000.]

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA301*
Gaming Commission Act 1987

Gaming Commission Amendment Regulations
(No. 2) 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Gaming Commission
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Gaming
Commission Regulations 1988*.

 [*Reprinted as at 6 June 1997
For amendments to 12 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 106 and Gazette 
12 May 2000.]

4. Part 4, Division 2 inserted

After Part 4, Division 1 the following Division is inserted —
“

Division 2 — Continuing Lotteries

14. Maximum number of tickets prescribed

For the purposes of section 104L(1) of the Act the
maximum number of tickets that may be in one batch
shall be 5 000.



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3207

15. Records maintained under Part V, Division 7

(1) A person who is a licensed supplier under Part V,
Division 7 of the Act shall maintain —

(a) a record in which there shall be recorded in
respect of all tickets obtained by the licensed
supplier —

(i) the name of the person from whom the
tickets were obtained;

(ii) the day on which the tickets were
obtained;

(iii) the number of batches obtained;

(iv) the number of tickets in each batch;

(v) the face value of the tickets in each
batch; and

(vi) the series number of the tickets in each
batch;

and

(b) a record in which there shall be recorded in
respect of all tickets supplied by the licensed
supplier —

(i) the name of the person to whom the
tickets were supplied;

(ii) the day on which the tickets were
supplied;

(iii) the number of batches supplied;

(iv) the number of tickets in each batch;

(v) the face value of the tickets in each
batch; and

(vi) the series number of the tickets in each
batch.

(2) A person who is a licensed supplier under Part V,
Division 7 of the Act shall maintain a stock card in
respect of each kind of ticket that has been obtained by,
or supplied by, the licensed supplier showing —

(a) the face value of tickets of that kind; and

(b) the number of tickets of that kind that
comprises a batch,

and setting out in respect of all tickets of that kind
obtained by, or supplied by him, all of the other
particulars referred to in subregulation (1)(a) and (b)
and a running total of the number of batches of tickets
of that kind currently in the possession of the licensed
supplier.



3208 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

(3) For the purposes of subregulation (2), tickets are of the
same kind where —

(a) the tickets have the same face value and are
identical if regard is not had to —

(i) the series number; or

(ii) the concealed portion that is to be
exposed in the course of conducting a
continuing lottery;

and

(b) the batch of which each ticket is a part
comprises the same number of tickets.

(4) A person who is a licensed supplier under Part V,
Division 7 of the Act and receives from a person from
whom he has obtained tickets any invoice in respect of
such tickets shall keep every such invoice for 5 years
after the tickets were so obtained.

    ”.

5. Regulation 18AA amended

Regulation 18AA(9) is amended by deleting “6% shall be paid
to the Commission.” and inserting instead —

“
3.25% shall be paid to the Commission, to be
distributed in the manner set out in section 104G(2) of
the Gaming Commission Act 1987.

    ”.

6. Regulation 40 amended

Regulation 40 is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting “For” and inserting instead —

“    Subject to regulation 40A, for    ”;

(b) by deleting “$100” and inserting instead —

“    $200    ”.

7. Regulation 40A inserted

After regulation 40 the following regulation is inserted —

“
40A. Football tipping (section 108)

(1) Despite regulation 40, a person conducting a football
tipping competition under section 108 may offer prizes
of —

(a) approximately $200 (per weekly prize); and

(b) approximately $3 000 (as a grand final prize),

but shall not exceed an aggregate prize value of $7 500
for the football season to which the competition relates.

    ”.



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3209

8. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended as follows:

(a) in the item commencing “ 47, 53   Fee on application for
a function permit for —” by deleting

“104 (e) a continuing lottery —

(i) where the total retail value of
prizes or prize money does not
exceed $5 000 .............................. 10

(ii) otherwise ...................................... 25”

and inserting instead —

“

104 (e) a continuing lottery .................................. 10
    ”;

(b) in the item commencing “ 47, 53   Fee on application for
a permit of a continuing nature for —” by deleting

“104 (e) a continuing lottery where the annual
total prize value —

(i) is $3 000 or under ......................... 25

(ii) is $3 001 to $5 000 ....................... 50

(iii) is $5 001 to $10 000 ..................... 75

(iv) is $10 001 to $20 000 ................... 100

(v) is $20 001 to $40 000 ................... 125

(vi) is $40 001 to $60 000 ................... 150

(vii) is $60 001 to $80 000 ................... 175

(viii) is $80 001 to $100 000 ................. 200

(ix) is $100 000 or over ....................... 250”

and inserting instead —

“

104 (e) a continuing lottery .................................. 20
    ”;

(c) after the item commencing “ 88 (5)   Fee on the issue of
a certificate relating to —” by inserting the following
item —

“

104B Fee on application to be a licensed supplier
under section 104B .............................................. 200

    ”.

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3210 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

RA302*

Gaming Commission (Continuing Lotteries Levy) Act 2000

Interpretation Act 1984

Gaming Commission (Continuing Lotteries
Levy) Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Gaming Commission
(Continuing Lotteries Levy) Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Levy amount prescribed (section 3)

The amount by way of levy to be paid under Part V Division 7
of the Gaming Commission Act 1987 for the period commencing
1 July 2000 is 3.25% of the face value of the tickets supplied for
that period.

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

RA303*

Stamp Act 1921

Stamp Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Stamp Amendment
Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.



23 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3211

3. Regulations 12B and 12C repealed

Regulations 12B and 12C of the Stamp Regulations 1979* are
repealed.
[* Reprinted as at 10 March 1997

For amendments to 26 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 280.]

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

ROTTNEST ISLAND

RI301*

Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987

Rottnest Island Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Rottnest Island
Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Rottnest Island
Regulations 1988*.

[* Reprinted as at 1 August 1997
For amendments to 23 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 265-6.]

4. Schedule 5 amended

Schedule 5 is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting “$8.00” and inserting instead —

“    $8.80    ”;

(b) by deleting “$16.00” and inserting instead —

“    $17.60    ”;

(c) by deleting “$24.00” and inserting instead —

“    $26.40    ”;



3212 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 2000

(d) by deleting “$32.00” and inserting instead —

“    $35.20    ”.

5. Schedule 6 amended

(1) Schedule 6 Part 1 is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting “$20.00” and inserting instead —

“    $22.00    ”;

(b) by deleting “$30.00” in both places where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“    $33.00    ”.

(2) Schedule 6 Part 2 is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting “$17.00” and inserting instead —

“    $18.70    ”;

(b) by deleting “$25.00” in both places where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“    $27.50    ”.

6. Schedule 7 amended

(1) Schedule 7 Part 1 is amended as follows:

(a) in item 1(c) —

(i)  by deleting “50 cents” and inserting instead —

“    55 cents    ”;

(ii)  by deleting “$9.50” and inserting instead —

“    $10.45    ”;

(b) in item 2(c) by deleting “$100” and inserting instead —

“    $110    ”.

(2) Schedule 7 Part 2 is amended as follows:

(a) in item 3 by deleting “$30” and inserting instead —

“    $33    ”;

(b) in item 4 by deleting “$50” and inserting instead —

“    $55    ”.

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 321323 June 2000]

— PART 2 —

AGRICULTURE

AG401
STOCK DISEASES (REGULATIONS) ACT 1968

STOCK (IDENTIFICATION AND MOVEMENT) ACT 1970
BEEKEEPERS ACT 1963

Agriculture Western Australia,
South Perth WA 6151.

The Governor is pleased to appoint the following as Inspectors pursuant to the following—
Section 37 of the Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970—

Trembath, Wayne Ronald
Bulloch, Ian Robert

Section 5 of the Beekeepers Act 1963—
Trembath, Wayne Ronald
Bulloch, Ian Robert

Section 8 of the Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968—
Trembath, Wayne Ronald
Bulloch, Ian Robert

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries.

AG402
AERIAL SPRAYING CONTROL ACT 1966

Agriculture Western Australia,
South Perth.

I, the undersigned Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries, being the Minister responsible for the
administration of the Aerial Spraying Control Act 1966 hereby appoint the following as an Inspector
pursuant to the said Act.

Parry, Colin

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries.

CONSERVATION & LAND MANAGEMENT

CM401
CONSERVATION AND LAND MANAGEMENT ACT 1984

ORDER TO CANCEL TIMBER RESERVE No. 175/25
CALM File 016087F3102
DOLA File 1668/992
This order is made by His Excellency the Administrator in Executive Council under section 10(1)(b) of
the Conservation and Land Management Act 1984.
On the recommendation of the Minister for the Environment, the land described in the Schedule is
declared to be no longer reserved as Timber Reserve No. 175/25.

Schedule
Hay Location 2283.
Public Plan: Owingup SW 1:25000

By Command of the Administrator.
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003214

HERITAGE COUNCIL

HR401*
Government of Western Australia

HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990
NOTICE OF ENTRY OF PLACES IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES

Notice is hereby given in accordance with Section 51(2) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, the places described in Schedule 1 have
been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect from today.

Schedule 1

Name Location Description of Place

Halliday House 114 King William Part of Lot 5 on Plan 5233, being the whole of the
Street, Bayswater land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 1049

Folio 955.
Harper’s Buildings 810-820 Hay Street, Portion of Perth Town Lot G15, being the whole

Perth of the land comprised in Certificate of Title
Volume 22 Folio 373A. Portion of Perth Town
Lot G14, being the whole of the land comprised in
Certificate of Title Volume 22 Folio 372A.

Public Buildings, 133, 135 and 101 Portion of Swan Location 4274, being the whole of
East Fremantle Canning Highway, the land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume

East Fremantle 1594 Folio 799.  Swan Location 1714, being the
whole of the land comprised in Certificate of Title
Volume 196 Folio 52. Swan Location 3219, being
Crown Reserve 19771 and being the whole of the
land comprised in Crown Land Record Volume
3044 Folio 542.  Swan Location 2351, being Crown
Reserve 10799 and being the whole of the land
comprised in Crown Land Record Volume 3044
Folio 288

Semaphore Chambers 77-79 Hannan Street, Portion of each of Kalgoorlie Town Lots 16 and 17,
Kalgoorlie being the whole of the land comprised in  Certificate

of Title Volume 1735 Folio 45.
Wilhelmsen House 11 Cliff Street, Cnr Lot 10 on Diagram 42319, being the whole of the

Phillimore Street, land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 575
Fremantle Folio 192A.

Pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, notice is hereby given in accordance with
Section 49(1) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 that it is proposed that the places described
in Schedule 2 be entered in the Register of Heritage Places.  The Heritage Council invites submissions
on the proposal; submissions must be in writing and should be forwarded to the following address not
later than 4 August 2000.

The Director, Office of the Heritage Council
108 Adelaide Terrace, East Perth WA 6004

The places will be entered in the Register on an interim basis with effect from today.

Schedule 2

Place Location Description of Place

Anzac Cottage 38 Kalgoorlie Street, Lot 15 on Plan 1659, being the whole of the land
Mount Hawthorn comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 1918

Folio 578
Maddington Burslem Drive, That part of Lot 177 on Plan 3047, being part of
Homestead Maddington the land comprised in Certificate of Title

Volume 2015 Folio 831 as is defined in HCWA
survey drawing No 1132 prepared by Steffanoni
Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd

Wesfarmers Building 569 Wellington Street, Portion of Perth Town Lot V26, being part of the
(fmr) Perth land on Diagrams 911 and 4056 and being the whole

of the land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume
2068 Folio 809.

Windmill and Wishing Cnr Albany Highway, Portion of Swan Location 36 on Diagram 10163
Well Shepperton Road & being the balance of the land remaining in

Asquith Street, Certificate of Title Volume 1051 Folio 496.
Victoria Park

Dated this  23rd day of June 2000 IAN BAXTER, Director,
Office of the Heritage Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 321523 June 2000]

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG401
CITY OF COCKBURN

Appointment
It is hereby notified for public information that effective from 3 July 2000, Mr Brett Douglas Plant has
been appointed as City Ranger and is a duly authorised officer in accordance with the various acts,
regulations and local laws as detailed hereunder—

1. Dog Act 1976
2. Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978
3. Litter Act 1979
4. Local Government Act 1995
5. Council Local Laws & Regulations
6. Fire Control Officer pursuant to s.38 and s.59 of the Bush Fires Act 1954.
7. S. 9.10 Local Government Act 1979.

R. W. BROWN, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402
CITY OF ROCKINGHAM

Authorised Persons
It is hereby notified for public information that Andrew John Page, Andrew Peter Conway, Peter Michael
Scott, Joshua James Linton, Christopher Anthony Hoekzema, Blake Thomas Pugh, Daryl Toni Rewita,
Colin Damien Thomson have been appointed as Parking Officers for the City of Rockingham and are
authorised on behalf of the Council of the City of Rockingham to administer the following legislation
within the boundaries of the Rockingham City Shopping Centre, Council Avenue, Rockingham.

1. The City of Rockingham Parking Local Law 1995.
2. Local Government (Parking for Disabled Persons) Regulations 1988.

G. G. HOLLAND, Chief Executive Officer.

MINERALS AND ENERGY

MN401
MINING ACT 1978

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE

Department of Minerals and Energy,
Coolgardie WA 6430.

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Act 1978, notice is hereby given that the following
licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) for breach of covenant, viz. non
payment of rent.

R. H. BURTON (SM), Warden.

To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Coolgardie on 14th August, 2000.

COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD

Prospecting Licences
15/3339—Molas Pty Ltd
15/3340—Molas Pty Ltd
15/3341—Molas Pty Ltd
15/3968—Farren, Michael Roy; Farren, Fiona Jay
16/1582—Centaur Mining and Exploration Ltd
16/1583—Centaur Mining and Exploration Ltd
16/1584—Centaur Mining and Exploration Ltd
16/1585—Centaur Mining and Exploration Ltd
16/1586—Centaur Mining and Exploration Ltd



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003216

MN402
MINING ACT 1978

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE

Department of Minerals and Energy,
Leonora.

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act,
1978, for breach of covenant, viz. non payment of rent.

R. H. BURTON (SM), Warden.

To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 18th July, 2000.

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD

Mount Malcolm District
Prospecting Licences

37/5443—Dixon, Trevor John
37/5703—Werjutina, Aldo
37/5765—Mindex Australia Pty Ltd
37/5766—Mindex Australia Pty Ltd
37/5767—Mindex Australia Pty Ltd
37/5768—Mindex Australia Pty Ltd
37/5769—Mindex Australia Pty Ltd
37/5770—Mindex Australia Pty Ltd

Miscellaneous Licence
37/21—Higherealm Pty Ltd

Mount Margaret District
Prospecting Licence

38/2908—Johnson’s Well Mining NL

Mount Morgans District
Prospecting Licences

39/3441—McKnight, Russell Geoffrey
39/3539—Potter, Rodney Morris

MN403*
NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR A PIPELINE LICENCE UNDER THE PETROLEUM

(SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967
I, WILLIAM LEE TINAPPLE, Director of the Petroleum Division in the Department of Minerals and
Energy for the State of Western Australia being the officer for the time being, which holds certain
powers and functions of the Designated Authority under the above Act, by virtue of an instrument of
delegation dated 4 June 1998 and published in the Government Gazette of Western Australia on 16
June 1998, GIVE NOTICE pursuant to Section 94(e) of the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1967
that an application has been received from the registered holders of Production Licence WA-20-L—

APACHE NORTHWEST PTY LTD
WOODSIDE ENERGY LTD
SANTOS LIMITED
of c/- Woodside Energy Limited, 1 Adelaide Terrace, PERTH  WA

for a licence to construct and operate the Legendre field export pipeline on the North West Shelf,
including the riser up to the first flange on the platform topsides pipe work to the tie-in flange for the
CALM buoy hose on the pipeline end manifold.
Dated this 16th day of June 2000.

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum Division.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 321723 June 2000]

MN404*
Commonwealth of Australia

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967
AMENDMENT TO 2000 OFFSHORE ACREAGE RELEASE—WEST AUSTRALIAN ADJACENT

AREA
The notice at pages 2301 to 2321 of the Government Gazette  dated 12 May 2000 listing the Schedule
of Blocks available for application is amended as follows—

Applications for areas W00-33 to W00-50, W00-54 to W00-57 and W00-62 to W00-68 will be received
up until 4:00 pm on Thursday, 2 November 2000.
Applications for areas W00-1 to W00-12, W00-14 to W00-32, W00-51 to W00-53 and W00-58 to
W00-61 will be received up until 4:00 pm on Thursday 3 May 2001.

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum Division.

MN405*
Commonwealth of Australia

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967
NOTICE OF INVITATION FOR APPLICATIONS FOR EXPLORATION PERMITS

I, William Lee Tinapple, Delegate of the Designated Authority in respect of the adjacent area of Western
Australia, for and on behalf of the Commonwealth-Western Australia Offshore Petroleum Joint
Authority, acting pursuant to Section 20(1) of the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1967 re-release
those areas which closed on 6 April 2000 and  hereby invite applications for the grant of exploration
permits in respect of the following Blocks within the areas as described in the following schedule and
as shown on the plans immediately following this notice.
Applications for areas W99-3, W99-6, W99-8 to W99-10, W99-12 and W99-13, W99-16 to W99-20, W99-
22 to W99-28, W99-30 to W99-32 and W99-35 to W99-37 will be received up until 4:00 pm on Thursday,
2 November 2000.

Schedule
(The references hereunder are to the names of map sheets of the 1:1 000 000 series and to the number
of the graticular sections shown thereon).

Area W99-3
Map Sheet SD51 (Brunswick Bay)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No
1468 1469 1539 1540 1541
1611 1612 1613 1682 1683
1684 1685 1754 1755 1756
1757 1825 part 1826 1827 1828
1829 1896 part 1897 part 1898 1899
1900 1901 1967 part 1968 1969
1972 1973 2039 2040 2041
2044 2045 2112 2116 2117
2184 2187 2188 2189 2256
2257 2258 2259 2260 2261

Assessed to contain 50 blocks

Area W99-6
Map Sheet SD50

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
2226 2227 2228 2229 2230
2231 2232 2298 2299 2300
2301 2302 2303 2304 2364
2365 2366 2367 2368 2369
2370 2371 23721 2373 2374
2375 2376 2436 2437 2438
2439 2440 2441 2442 2443
2444 2445 2446 2447 2448
2508 2509 2510 2511 2512
2513 2514 2515 2516 2517
2518 2519 2520 2580 2581
2582 2583 2584 2585 2586
2587 2588 2589 2590 2591
2592 2652 2653 2654 2655



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003218

Area W99-6—continued
Map Sheet SD50—continued

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
2656 2657 2658 2659 2660
2661 2662 2663 2664 2724
2725 2726 2727 2728 2729
2730 2731 2732 2733 2734
2735 2736 2796 2797 2798
2799 2800 2801 2802 2803
2804 2805 2806 2807 2808
2868 2869 2870 2871 2872
2873 2874 2875 2876 2877
2878 2879 2880 2940 2941
2942 2943 2944 2945 2946
2947 2948 2949 2950 2951
2952

Assessed to contain 131 blocks

Area W99-8
Map Sheet SD51 (Brunswick Bay)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
2458 2459 2460 2461 2462
2463 2530 2531 2532 2533
2534 2535 2602 2603 2604
2605 2606 2607 2674 2675
2676 2677 2678 2679 2746
2747 2748 2749 2750 2751
2818 2819 2820 2821 2822
2823 2824 2825 2890 2891
2892 2893 2894 2895 2896
2897

Assessed to contain 46 blocks

Area W99-9
Map Sheet SD50

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
3012 3013 3014 3015 3016
3017 3018 3084 3085 3086
3087 3088 3089 3090 3156
3157 3158 3159 3160 3161
3162 3228 3229 3230 3231
3232 3233 3234 3300 3301
3302 3303 3304 3305 3306
3374 3375 3376 3377 3378
3446 3447 3448 3449 3450

Map Sheet SE50 (Rowley Shoals)
Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
62 63 64 65 66
134 135 136 137 138
206 207 208 209 210
278 279 280 281 282
350 351 352 353 354
422 423 424 425 426

Assessed to contain 75 blocks

Area W99-10
Map Sheet SD50

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
3019 3020 3021 3022 3023
3024 3091 3092 3093 3094
3095 3096 3163 3164 3165
3166 3167 3168 3235 3236
3237 3238 3239 3240 3307
3308 3309 3310 3311 3312
3379 3380 3381 3382 3383
3384 3451 3452 3453 3454
3455 3456



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 321923 June 2000]

Map Sheet SD51 (Brunswick Bay)
Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
2953 2954 3025 3026 3097
3098 3169 3170 3241 3242
3313 3314 3385 3386

Assessed to contain 56 blocks

Area W99-12
Map Sheet SD51 (Brunswick Bay)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
2963 2964 2965 2966 2967
2968 2969 3035 3036 3037
3038 3039 3040 3041 3107
3108 3109 3110 3111 3112
3179 3180 3181 3182 3183
3184 3251 3252 3253 3254
3255 3256 3323 3324 3325
3326 3327 3328 3395 3396
3397 3398 3399 3400

Assessed to contain 44 blocks

Area W99-13
Map Sheet SD50

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
3367 3368 3369 3370 3371
3372 3373 3439 3440 3441
3442 3443 3444 3445

Map Sheet SE50 (Rowley Shoals)
Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
55 56 57 58 59
60 61 127 128 129
130 131 132 133 199
200 201 202 203 204
205 268 269 270 271
272 273 274 275 276
277 340 341 342 343
344 345 346 347 348
349 412 413 414 415
416 417 418 419 420
421 484 485 486 487
488 489 490 491 492
493 556 557 558 559
560 561 562 563 564
565 636 637 708 709

Assessed to contain 89 blocks

Area W99-16
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No.  Block No. Block No. Block No.
13 14 15 16 17
18 85 86 87 88
89 90 157 158 159
160 161 162 229 230
231 232 233 234 301
302 303 304 305 306
373 374 375 376 377
378

Assessed to contain 36 blocks

Area W99-17
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
19 20 21 22 23
91 92 93 94 95
163 164 165 166 167
235 236 237 238 239
307 308 309 310 311
379 380 381 382 383

Assessed to contain 30 blocks



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003220

Area W99-18
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
24 25 26 27 96
97 98 99 168 169
170 171 240 241 242
243 312 313 314 315
384 385 386 387

Assessed to contain 24 blocks

Area W99-19
Map Sheet SD51 (Brunswick Bay)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
3340 3341 3342 3343 3344
3345 3412 3413 3414 3415
3416 3417

Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)
Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
28 29 30 31 32
33 100 101 102 103
104 105

Assessed to contain 24 blocks

Area W99-20
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
172 173 174 175 176
177 244 245 246 247
248 249 316 317 318
319 320 321 388 389
390 391 392 393

Assessed to contain 24 blocks

Area W99-22
Map Sheet SE50 (Rowley Shoals)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
503 504 575 576 647
648 719 720 791 792
863 864

Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)
Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
433 434 435 436 437
505 506 507 508 509
577 578 579 580 581
649 650 651 652 653
721 722 723 724 725
793 794 795 796 797

Assessed to contain 42 blocks

Area W99-23
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
438 439 440 441 442
443 444 510 511 512
513 514 515 516 582
583 584 585 586 587
588 654 655 656 657
658 659 660 726 727
728 729 730 731 732
798 799 800 801 802
803 804

Assessed to contain 42 blocks



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 322123 June 2000]

Area W99-24
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
445 446 447 448 449
450 517 518 519 520
521 522 589 590 591
592 593 594 661 662
663 664 665 666 733
734 735 736 737 738
805 806 807 8081 809
810

Assessed to contain 36 blocks

Area W99-25
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
885 886 887 888 889
890 891 part 892 part 957 958
959 960 961 962 part 963 part
1029 1030 1031 1032 1033
1034 part 1035 part 1101 1102 1103
1104 1105 1106 part

Assessed to contain 28 blocks

Area W99-26
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
1173 1174 1175 1176 1177
1178 part 1245 1246 1247 1248
1249 1250 part 1317 1318 1319
1320 1321 1322 part 1389 1390
1391 1392 1393 1394 part 1461
1462 1463 1464 1465 1466 part

Assessed to contain 30 blocks

Area W99-27
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
1533 1534 1535 1536 1605
1606 1607 1608 1677 1678
1679 1680 1750 1751 1752
1822 1823 1824 1825 1895
1896 1897 1967 1968 1969 part
2039 part 2040 part

Assessed to contain 27 blocks

Area W99-28
Map Sheet SE51 (Broome)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
1747 1748 1749 1819 1820
1821 1891 1892 1893 1894
1963 1964 1965 1966 2035
2036 2037 2038 part 2107 2108
2109 part 2110 part 2179 2180 part 2181 part
2251 part 2252 part 2253 part 2323 part 2395 part
2467 part 2539 part

Assessed to contain 32 blocks

Area W99-30
Map Sheet SF50 (Hamersley Range)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
248 249 part 250 part 320 part 321 part

Assessed to contain 5 blocks



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003222

Area W99-31
Map Sheet SF50 (Hamersley Range)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
659 661 662 733 734

Assessed to contain 5 blocks

Area W99-32
Map Sheet SF50 (Hamersley Range)

Block No. Block No Block No. Block No. Block No.
805 806 877 879 part 1021 part

Assessed to contain 5 blocks

Area W99-35
Map Sheet SI (Eyre)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
727 728 729 730 731
732 733 734 735 736
799 800 801 802 803
804 805 806 807 808
871 872 873 874 875
876 877 878 879 880
943 944 945 946 947
948 949 950 951 952
1015 1016 1017 1018 1019
1020 1021 1022 1023 1024
1087 1088 1089 1090 1091
1092 1093 1094 1095 1096
1159 1160 1161 1162 1163
1164 1165 1166 1167 1168
1231 1232 1233 1234 1235
1236 1237 1238 1239 1240
1303 1304 1305 1306 1307
1308 1309 1310 1311 1312
1375 1376 1377 1378 1379
1380 1381 1382 1383 1384
1447 1448 1449 1450 1451
1452 1453 1454 1455 1456
1519 1520 1521 1522 1523
1524 1525 1526 1527 1528
1591 1592 1593 1594 1595
1596 1597 1598 1599 1600
1663 1664 1665 1666 1667
1668 1669 1670 1671 1672
1735 1736 1737 1738 1739
1740 1741 1742 1743 1744
1807 1808 1809 1810 1811
1812 1813 1814 1815 1816

Assessed to contain 160 blocks

Area W99-36
Map Sheet SI (Eyre)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
737 738 739 740 741
742 743 744 745 746
809 810 811 812 813
814 815 816 817 818
881 882 883 884 885
886 887 888 889 890
953 954 955 956 957
958 959 960 961 962
1025 1026 1027 1028 1029
1030 1031 1032 1033 1034
1097 1098 1099 1100 1101
1102 1103 1104 1105 1106
1169 1170 1171 1172 1173
1174 1175 1176 1177 1178
1241 1242 1243 1244 1245
1246 1247 1248 1249 1250



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 322323 June 2000]

Area W99-36—continued
Map Sheet SI (Eyre)—continued

1313 1314 1315 1316 1317
1318 1319 1320 1321 1322
1385 1386 1387 1388 1389
1390 1391 1392 1393 1394
1457 1458 1459 1460 1461
1462 1463 1464 1465 1466
1529 1530 1531 1532 1533
1534 1535 1536 1537 1538
1601 1602 1603 1604 1605
1606 1607 1608 1609 1610
1673 1674 1675 1676 1677
1678 1679 1680 1681 1682
1745 1746 1747 1748 1749
1750 1751 1752 1753 1754
1817 1818 1819 1820 1821
1822 1823 1824 1825 1826

Assessed to contain 160 blocks

Area W99-37
Map Sheet SI (Eyre)

Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
747 748 749 750 751
752 753 754 755 756
819 820 821 822 823
824 825 826 827 828
891 892 893 894 895
896 897 898 899 900
963 964 965 966 967
968 969 970 971 972
1035 1036 1037 1038 1039
1040 1041 1042 1043 1044
1107 1108 1109 1110 1111
1112 1113 1114 1115 1116
1179 1180 1181 1182 1183
1184 1185 1186 1187 1188
1251 1252 1253 1254 1255
1256 1257 1258 1259 1260
1323 1324 1325 1326 1327
1328 1329 1330 1331 1332
1395 1396 1397 1398 1399
1400 1401 1402 1403 1404
1467 1468 1469 1470 1471
1472 1473 1474 1475 1476
1539 1540 1541 1542 1543
1544 1545 1546 1547 1548
1611 1612 1613 1614 1615
1616 1617 1618 1619 1620
1683 1684 1685 1686 1687
1688 1689 1690 1691 1692
1755 1756 1757 1758 1759
1760 1761 1762 1763 1764
1827 1828 1829 1830 1831
1832 1833 1834 1835 1836

Assessed to contain 160 blocks

APPLICATIONS FOR AREAS W99-3, W99-6, W99-8 to W99-10, W99-12 and W99-13, W99-16 to W99-
20, W99-22 to W99-28, W99-30 to W99-32 and W99-35 to W99-37.
Applications for the award of a permit over areas W99-3, W99-6, W99-8 to W99-10, W99-12 and W99-
13, W99-16 to W99-20, W99-22 to W99-28, W99-30 to W99-32 and W99-35 to W99-37 are required to be
made in the approved manner, submitted in duplicate and should be accompanied by—

1.1 Details of—
1.1.1 Technical Assessment

The applicant’s technical assessment of the petroleum potential of the area, including
the concepts underlying its proposed exploration work program, with sufficient detail
to support that program



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003224

1.1.2 Minimum Guaranteed Work Program

The applicant’s minimum guaranteed proposal (including indicative minimum
expenditure) for exploration wells to be drilled, 3D and 2D seismic and other surveying
activities, data evaluation and other work, for each year of the first three years of the
permit term.  This proposal, to be known as the minimum guaranteed work program,
should comprise work expected to involve a substantial exploration component -
normally, appraisal work should not be included

1.1.3 Secondary Work program

The applicant’s proposal (including indicative minimum expenditure) for exploration
wells to be drilled, 3D and 2D seismic and other surveying activities, data evaluation
and other work, for each of the three remaining years of the permit term.  This proposal,
to be known as the secondary work program, should comprise work expected to involve
a substantial exploration component - normally, appraisal work should not be included.

1.2 Particulars of the applicant—

1.2.1 the technical qualifications of the applicant and of its key employees

1.2.2 the technical advice available to the applicant

1.2.3 the financial resources available to the applicant, including evidence of the applicant’s
ability to fund the work program proposed, a statement of other exploration
commitments over the next 6 years, and a copy of the latest annual and quarterly
reports for each applicant company

1.2.4 where relevant, the viability of the consortium lodging the application, including
evidence that a satisfactory settlement has been, or can be, reached on the Joint
Operating Agreement (a copy of a signed Heads of Agreement dealing will generally
suffice), and

1.2.5 the percentage participating interest of each party to the application.

1.3 Other Information

Such other information as the applicant wishes to be taken into account in consideration of
the application.

1.4 Fee

Each application must be accompanied by a fee of $A3,000, payable to the Commonwealth of
Australia through an Australian bank or bank cheque.

Further details of the work program bidding system outlined above, including the criteria for
assessment of applications and the conditions to apply following the award of a permit, are
available from the Director, Petroleum Operations Division, Department of Minerals and Energy
in Perth and from the Petroleum and Fisheries Division, Department of Primary Industries
and Energy in Canberra.

It should be noted that any income derived in the future from the recovery of petroleum from
these areas will be subject to the Commonwealth Government’s Resources Rent Tax.

Lodgement of Applications

Applications for areas W99-3, W99-6, W99-8 to W99-10, W99-12 and W99-13, W99-16 to W99-20, W99-
22 to W99-28, W99-30 to W99-32 and W99-35 to W99-37 must be lodged before 4:00 pm on Thursday, 2
November 2000

Applications, together with supporting data should be submitted in the following manner to—

Director Petroleum Division
Department of Minerals and Energy
Level 11, Mineral House
100 Plain Street
EAST Perth Western Australia 6004

Attention:  Petroleum Applications Receiving Officer

The following special instructions should be observed—

• two copies of the application and supporting data together with the application fee should be
sealed in an envelope or package, clearly marked “Application for Exploration Permit Area ...
Commercial-in-Confidence”; and

• further enclosed in a plain covering envelope or package and delivered by hand or posted to
the above address.

Receipts for applications (received and delivered by hand) will be issued by the Petroleum Applications
Receiving Officer.

Enquiries concerning this gazettal should be referred to—

Margaret Beall
Petroleum Operations Division
Telephone: (09) 222 3278
Facsimile: (09) 222 3515



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 322523 June 2000]



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003226



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 322723 June 2000]



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003228

PREMIER AND CABINET

PR401
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the Administrator in accordance with Section 52(1)(b)
of the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment in the place of
Hon. J. D. van de Klashorst MLA—

Minister for Family and Children’s Services; Seniors; Women’s Interests—
18 to 28 July 2000 Hon. M. J. Criddle, MLC
31 July to 5 August 2000 Hon. P. D. Omodei, MLA

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General,Ministry of the
Premier and Cabinet.

PUBLIC SECTOR MANAGEMENT

PS401
EXEMPTION IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 25 OF THE PUBLIC SECTOR

MANAGEMENT ACT 1994
In accordance with s.25(1)(a) of the Public Sector Management Act 1994, I exempt the Health
Department of Western Australia from the Recruitment, Selection and Appointment Standard, for the
filling of specified positions in specified Multi-Purpose Services sites to enable the absorption of
employment of current employees at these locations into the public sector.
The Multi-Purposes Services sites to which this exemption applies are—

Dongara/Eneabba/Mingenew
Pemberton
Wongan Hills
North Midlands
Morawa/Perenjori
Moora
Beverley

The exemption applies for the period July 1, 2000 to June 30, 2001, and does not apply to any other
positions within the Health Department of Western Australia or any other Multi-Purposes Services
sites not specified in this schedule.
Dated 19 June 2000.

DON SAUNDERS, Commissioner for Public Sector Standards.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA401
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988

SUMMARY OF LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and required
to be advertised.  Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection
process, should contact the Liquor Licensing Division, 1st Floor, Hyatt Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace,
Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation.

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE
7823 Patminderjit Singh Ruba Application for the grant of a Restaurant 17/7/00

licence in respect of premises situated in
Victoria Park East and known as
BritishIndia Sake.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 322923 June 2000]

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE—continued

7819 Riocove Holdings Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Producer— 16/7/00
Beer licence in respect of premises
situated in Caversham and known as The
Ironbark Brewery.

7827 John David Griffiths and Application for the grant of a Producer— 23/7/00
Jane Catherine Micallef Wine licence in respect of premises

situated in Baskerville and known as
Griffiths & Micallef.

7828 JPE Jewellers Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Special 18/7/00
Facility—Tourism licence in respect of
premises situated in Pemberton and
known as Gold ‘n’ Grape Gallery & Cafe.

7766 Neil William Wilson Application for the grant of a Special 19/7/00
Facility—Theatre licence in respect of
premises situated in Geraldton and
known as Queens Park Theatre.

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS
4802 Windward Holdings Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an 12/7/00

extended trading permit—ongoing
extended hours, in respect of premises
situated in Williams and known as
Williams Hotel.

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988.

HUGH HIGHMAN, Acting Director of Liquor Licensing.

WATER

WA401*
RIGHTS IN WATER AND IRRIGATION ACT 1914

Notice under Section 13 of the Act

[Regulation 14(1)]

The Water & Rivers Commission has received the application listed below to take and use surface
water for irrigation purposes.

Any owner or occupier of land within 4.8 kilometres of the applicants land and contiguous to the
watercourse may object to that application.

Objections should be sent to reach me at the—Water & Rivers Commission, PO BOX 261, BUNBURY
WA 6230 prior to 6th July 2000 by certified mail.

Any queries regarding this application should be referred to Ms Rachael Nickoll on telephone
08 9721 0666, Water Resources Officer, South West Region, Water and Rivers Commission.

W. F. TINGEY, Regional Manager, South West Region.

Schedule
(1) Applicant: K Hillier

Property: Portion Wellington Location 1293, Harris River Road, Collie
Water Course: Collie River



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003230

WA402
WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984

Margaret River Wastewater: Shire of Augusta/Margaret River-Margaret River
PROPOSAL TO CONSTRUCT A WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT AND

LAND DISPOSAL SYSTEM
This project is planned to commence in September 2000 and will take approximately 18 months to
complete. It involves the construction of a wastewater treatment plant and irrigated tree lot with
associated storage dam, pumping station, irrigation and drainage equipment.
For further information on this essential wastewater project please telephone Craig Boyce during
normal office hours on 9420 2271.
If you have an objection to the proposed works, please write to—

Craig Boyce
Project Manager
Water Corporation
PO Box 100
Leederville WA 6902

Any objections must be lodged by the close of business on 12 July 2000.
This project is subject to environmental and other approvals.

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ101
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their claims
to me on or before the 24th July 2000, after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, having
regard only to the claims of which I then have notice.
Callan, Cora, late of 120 Wood Street, Inglewood, died 19/5/00 (DEC 327515 DL3).
Epis, Joseph, late of 61 Richardson Street, Boulder, died 7/5/00 (DEC 327565 DS3).
Layard, Catherine Barbara Alice, late of St Andrews Care Facility, 37 Burwood Road, Balcatta, formerly

of 4/6 Shipley Place, Balga, died 14/4/00 (DEC 327624 DG4).
Legzdins, Melanija Antonija, late of Rowethorpe, Hillview Terrace, Bentley, died 24/5/00 (DEC 327524

DC3).
McArthur, Alma Louisa, late of 38 Garratt Road, Bayswater, died 28/3/00 (DEC 327625 DC2).
Michael, Kathleen, late of Midland Nursing Home, 44 John Street, Midland, died 4/6/00 (DEC 327562

DS4).
Scully, Enid Mathilda, late of 1 Dawson Place, Parkwood, died 28/10/99 (DEC 326068 DP4).
Smith, Ida Grace Ellen, late of Mosman Park Nursing Home, 57 Palmerston Street, Mosman Park,

died 9/6/00 (DEC 327580 DL3).
Taylor, Ellen May, late of Ida Mann Hostel, Sixth Avenue, Maylands, died 31/5/00 (DEC 327618 DP2).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 323123 June 2000]

Tutty, Ernest Albert, late of Unit 1/84 McLeod Road, Applecross, died 20/4/00 (DEC 327591 DL4).
Vickers, Richard William Lorne, late of 12 Chemsford Road, Mount Lawley, died 15/5/00 (DEC 327640

DG1).
Vinten, Gertrud Alice, late of 24 Lofoten Way, Ferndale, formerly of 48 Crocus Way, Ferndale, died

8/4/00 (DEC 327240 DL2).
Walsh, Michael George, late of 44 Axford Street, Como, died 7/5/00 (DEC 327125 DG4).

ANTONINA ROSE McLAREN, Public Trustee,
Public Trust Office, 565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000.

Telephone 9222 6777.

ZZ201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act, 1962 relates) in
respect of the undermentioned deceased person, are required to send particulars of their claims to the
Executor care of Mayberry, Hammond & Co., 85 Fitzgerald Street, Northam within one (1) calendar
month from the date of publication of this Notice at the expiration of which time the Trustees may
convey or distribute the assets having regard only to claims of which notice has been given.
Details—

Ian Sumpton, deceased, late of 5 Martin Street, Wongan Hills, Retired Motor Mechanic.
Date of Death: 8th day of January 2000.

Dated this 12th day of June 2000.
MESSRS, MAYBERRY, HAMMOND & CO.,

85 Fitzgerald Street, Northam.
Solicitors for the Executor.

ZZ202
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act, 1962 relates) in
respect of the undermentioned deceased person, are required to send particulars of their claims to the
Administrator care of Mayberry, Hammond & Co., 85 Fitzgerald Street, Northam within one (1) calendar
month from the date of publication of this Notice at the expiration of which time the Administrator
may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to claims of which notice has been given.
Details—

Rebecca Marie Candeloro, deceased, late of Lot 788, Nunile Road, Toodyay, Haul Pack Driver.
Date of Death: 10th day of November 1999.

Dated this 15th day of June 2000.
MESSRS, MAYBERRY, HAMMOND & CO.,

85 Fitzgerald Street, Northam.
Solicitors for the Administrator.

ZZ203
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act, 1962 relates) in
respect of the Estate of the undermentioned deceased person, are required by Perpetual Trustees WA
Limited of c/- 5th Floor, 39 Hunter Street, Sydney, NSW, to send particulars of their claims to the
Company by the undermentioned date, after which date the said Company may convey or distribute
the assets, having regard only to the claims of which the Company then has notice.
Claims for the following expire one month after the date of publication hereof.

Melville Dudley Wray, late of Brightwater, Walter Road, Inglewood WA 6052, Retired Builder, died
29/12/1999.

STEPHEN MAXWELL, Senior Estate Manager,
Perpetual Trustees WA Limited.

Direct Phone: (02) 9229 3419.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003232

ZZ204
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act, 1962 relates) in
respect of the Estate of the undermentioned deceased person, are required by Perpetual Trustees WA
Limited of c/- 5th Floor, 39 Hunter Street, Sydney, NSW, to send particulars of their claims to the
Company by the undermentioned date, after which date the said Company may convey or distribute
the assets, having regard only to the claims of which the Company then has notice.
Claims for the following expire one month after the date of publication hereof.

Alice Emily Dickhart, late of Two Pines Nursing Home, 77 Clarkson Road, Maylands WA 6051,
Widow, died 17/5/2000.

ANNALISA GRAY, Estate Manager,
Perpetual Trustees WA Limited.

Direct Phone: (02) 9229 3349.

ZZ401
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPLICATION FOR WINDING-UP

FORM 18
IN THE SUPREME COURT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA AT PERTH

No. COR 132 of 2000
In the matter of The Foothills School Inc

Notice is hereby given that an application for the winding up in insolvency of the abovenamed association
by the Supreme Court of Western Australia was on 26 May 2000 filed by The Foothills School Inc. The
application is to be heard before a master in chambers at the Supreme Court at Perth at 10.00 am on
12 July 2000.
The liquidator whose appointment is sought is Mr Glen Featherby of the firm of Featherby Reilly,
Level 2, 9 Havelock Street, West Perth.
Any creditor or contributory of the association desiring to support or oppose  the making of an order on
the application may appear at the time of hearing by himself or his counsel for that purpose.
The applicant’s solicitor is Mr Leigh Warnick of Mallesons Stephen Jaques, Level 10, 152-158 St George’s
Terrace, Perth.
Note—

(1) Any person who intends to appear on the hearing of the application must serve on or send by
post to the abovenamed solicitor notice in writing of that intention. The notice must state the
name and address of the person or, if a firm, the name and address of the firm, and must be
signed by the person or firm, or their solicitor (if any), and must be served, or, if posted, must
be sent by post in sufficient time to be recieved no later than 4 pm on 11 July 2000.

(2) A person may not, without leave of the Court, oppose the application unless, at least 7 days
before the hearing date, the person has filed and served on the applicant—
(a) notice of the grounds of opposition; and
(b) an affidavit verifying the matters stated in the notice.

ZZ402
IN THE SUPREME COURT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA AT PERTH

COR No. 132 of 2000
In the matter of section 31(1)(e) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987 (WA) and section 583 of

the Corporations Law of Western Australia
In the matter of The Foothills School Inc

Ex parte: The Foothills School Inc Applicant.
NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT OF PROVISIONAL LIQUIDATOR PURSUANT TO ORDER 81G

RULE 86 OF THE RULES OF THE SUPREME COURT
Date of Document: June 2000
Filed on behalf of: The Applicant
Date of Filing: June 2000



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 323323 June 2000]

Prepared by: Mallesons Stephen Jaques
Central Park
152-158 St George’s Terrace
Perth WA 6000
Telephone No. 9269 7000
Facsimile No. 9269 7999
Reference: DLW:LAW:09-5036-1169

On 26 May 2000 the Supreme Court of Western Australia in proceedings COR 132 of 2000 appointed
Mr Glen Featherby of Level 2, 9 Havelock Street, West Perth in the State of Western Australia as
provisional liquidator of Foothills School Inc.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

SURVEILLANCE DEVICES ACT 1998

 Price: $6.75 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 110 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

MINES SAFETY AND INSPECTION
ACT 1994

 Price: $12.35 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 350 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

PAWNBROKERS AND SECONDHAND
DEALERS ACT 1994

 Price: $9.55 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 160 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003234

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

BOTANIC GARDENS AND PARKS
AUTHORITY ACT 1998

 Price: $6.75 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 100 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT
ACT 1994

 Price: $17.10 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 360 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

ADOPTION ACT 1994

 Price: $18.70 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 215 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

FINES, PENALTIES AND INFRINGEMENT
NOTICES ENFORCEMENT ACT 1994

 *Price: $13.90 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 175 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 323523 June 2000]

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

THE CRIMINAL CODE
(Reprinted as at 20 October 1999)

*Price: $34.70 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 900 grams

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

YOUNG OFFENDERS ACT 1994

 *Price: $18.70 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 300 grams

YOUNG OFFENDERS REGULATIONS 1995
*Price $3.95 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 65 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

RETIREMENT VILLAGES ACT 1992
Price: $6.75 Counter Sales

Plus Postage on 132 grams

RETIREMENT VILLAGES REGULATIONS 1992
*Price: $3.95 Counter Sales

Plus Postage on 25 grams
* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 1992

*Price: $10.95 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 365 grams



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [23 June 20003236

�������������

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER
SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2000

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2000. Subject to certain
limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. The prices
quoted include postage by surface mail unless stated otherwise.
PLEASE NOTE: A Goods and Services charge (GST) will be applicable to all goods and services
supplied after 30 June 2000.  Clients will be sent an additional invoice for these charges when
details are finalised.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, unless
disrupted by public holidays or unforseen
circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.

All Gazettes  $
Within WA ............................................ 649
Interstate .............................................. 673
Overseas (airmail) ............................. 1012

Bound Volumes of full year 894

Electronic Gazette Online
(includes all Gazettes from Jan 1998)
Existing hard copy subscriber ................ 150
Electronic Subscription only ................... 500

1999 Gazettes on CD ROM ...................... 600
1998 Gazettes on CD ROM ...................... 600

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

$
Within WA ............................................ 261
Interstate .............................................. 311
Overseas (airmail) ............................... 435

1999 Gazettes on CD ROM ...................... 260
1998 Gazettes on CD ROM ...................... 260

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly
during parliamentary sessions.

$
Within WA ............................................ 416
Interstate .............................................. 514
Overseas (airmail) ............................... 557

Bound Volumes of Hansard
Within WA ........................................... 502
Interstate ............................................. 535

1999 Hansards on CD ROM................... 500

STATUTES
Bound Statutes
Bound volumes are posted during March of
the following year.

$
Within WA ........................................... 224
Interstate ............................................. 247
Overseas .............................................. 252
Half Calf Bound Statutes ................... 615

1999 Bound Volumes on CD ROM.........223
1998 Bound Volumes on CD ROM.........223

Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become
available

$
Within WA .......................................... 239
Interstate ............................................ 247
Overseas (airmail) ............................. 354

Sessional Bills
Bills are posted weekly as they become
available

$
Within WA .......................................... 330
Interstate ........................................... 344
Overseas (airmail) ............................. 515

Electronic Statutes Online
Includes all Acts, Regulations, Bills, Acts by
year, Index to Statutes, Hansard, etc

$
1st user ................................................ 600
2nd and each additional user ............. 300

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is
searchable. Other CD ROM products with
legislation or other statutory information
can be packaged to individual requirements.
Prices are available on request.


