
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

3395

PERTH, FRIDAY, 30 JUNE 2000  No. 125
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS
PART 1

Page
Beekeepers Act 1963—Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 2000................................................. 3399
Conservation and Land Management Act 1984—
    Conservation and Land Management Amendment Regulations 2000 ..................................... 3400-1
    Forest Management Amendment Regulations 2000................................................................. 3401-2
Cremation Act 1929—Cremation Amendment Regulations 2000 ................................................... 3406
Financial Institutions Duty Act 1983—Financial Institutions Duty Amendment Regulations

2000 ............................................................................................................................................... 3432-3
Firearms Act 1973—Firearms Amendment Regulations 2000........................................................ 3427-9
First Home Owner Grant Act 2000—First Home Owner Grant Regulations 2000......................... 3433-7
Health Act 1911—
    Health (Game Meat) Amendment Regulations 2000 ................................................................ 3407
    Health (Meat Inspection, Branding and Processing) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000 .. 3407-12
    Health (Treatment of Sewage and Disposal of Effluent and Liquid Waste) Amendment

    Regulations 2000.................................................................................................................... 3413
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—
    Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment Regulations 2000................................................... 3415-6
    Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000 ....................................... 3414-5
    Hospitals (Services Charges for Compensable Patients) Amendment Determination Notice

    2000 ........................................................................................................................................ 3416-7
Local Courts Act 1904—Local Court Amendment Rules (No. 2) 2000............................................. 3419-20
Local Government Act 1995—City of Cockburn (Dismissal of Council) Order 2000....................... 3422-3
Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994—Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers

Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000 .......................................................................................... 3423-4
Pharmacy Act 1964—Pharmacy Amendment Regulations 2000..................................................... 3405-6
Plant Diseases Act 1914—Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2000 .......................... 3399-400
Police Act 1892—Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2000........................................................ 3426
Proclamations—
    Justices Act 1902 ....................................................................................................................... 3397
    Rail Freight System Act 2000—No. 13 of 2000 ......................................................................... 3397
Public Trustee Act 1941—Public Trustee Amendment Regulations 2000 ...................................... 3429-31
Radiation Safety Act 1975—Radiation Safety (Qualifications) Amendment Regulations 2000 ..... 3413-4
Rules of Harness Racing 1999—Notice of Amendment ................................................................... 3431-2
Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996—Security and Related Activities (Control)

Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000 .......................................................................................... 3425
Strata Titles Act 1985—Strata Titles General (Amendment) Regulations (No. 2) 2000 ................ 3420-1
Supreme Court Act 1935—Supreme Court Amendment Rules (No. 3) 2000................................... 3417-9
Weights and Measures Act 1915—Weights and Measures Amendment Regulations 2000............ 3403-5
Western Australian Meat Industry Authority Act 1976—Western Australian Meat Industry

Authority Amendment Regulations 2000 ..................................................................................... 3398
Zoological Gardens Act 1972—Zoological Gardens Amendment By-laws 2000............................... 3438

———

PART 2
Agriculture ........................................................................................................................................ 3439
Coal Industry .................................................................................................................................... 3439
Education .......................................................................................................................................... 3440
Environmental Protection ................................................................................................................ 3440
Fair Trading...................................................................................................................................... 3440-1
Justice ............................................................................................................................................... 3441-2
Land Administration ........................................................................................................................ 3442
Local Government............................................................................................................................. 3443-7
Minerals and Energy ........................................................................................................................ 3448-9
Parliament ........................................................................................................................................ 3449
Planning............................................................................................................................................ 3449-53
Police ................................................................................................................................................. 3453-65
Public Notices—
    Deceased Estates ....................................................................................................................... 3469-70
    Voluntary Liquidation ............................................................................................................... 3470
Racing, Gaming and Liquor.............................................................................................................. 3465-6
State Revenue ................................................................................................................................... 3466
Transport .......................................................................................................................................... 3467
Water................................................................................................................................................. 3467-8
Worksafe ........................................................................................................................................... 3468-9



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial, State Law Publisher, 10
William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised beforehand on the inside cover).

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2000 (Prices include GST).

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$19.91

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$46.53

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$46.53 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
  Per Column Centimetre—$9.24
  Bulk Notices—$172.70 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.

• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they
fall on a Tuesday or Friday.

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3397

—  PART  1  —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA101

JUSTICES ACT 1902
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
G. A. Kennedy,
Administrator.

[L.S.]

} By the Honourable Geoffrey Alexander
Kennedy, Officer of the Order of
Australia, Administrator of  the
State of Western Australia.

I, the Administrator, acting under section 24 of the Justices Act 1902 and with the
advice and consent of the Executive Council—

(a) order that a court of petty sessions constituted by a stipendiary magistrate
only shall be held at the places specified in the Table below; and

(b) direct that the court of petty sessions constituted by a stipendiary
magistrate only at such a place shall be held at least once in each period
specified opposite the place in the Table below,

as from and including 1 July 2000.

Table
Balgo 4 months One Arm Point 6 weeks
Beagle Bay 6 weeks Oombulgurri 3 months
Bidyadanga 3 months Warburton 2 months
Kalumburu 2 months Warmun 4 months

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 27 June 2000.

By Command of the Administrator,

PETER FOSS, Attorney General.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !

AA201*

RAIL FREIGHT SYSTEM ACT 2000
No. 13 of 2000

PROCLAMATION
WESTERN AUSTRALIA

G. A. Kennedy,
Administrator.

[L.S.]

} By the Honourable Geoffrey Alexander
Kennedy, Officer of the Order of
Australia, Administrator of  the
State of Western Australia.

I, the Administrator, acting under section 2 of the Rail Freight System Act 2000 and
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council —

(a) fix the day on which this proclamation is published in the Government
Gazette as the day on which that Act, other than Part 5 Divisions 1 and 6
and sections 91(1)(a) and (b) and 93, comes into operation; and

(b) fix the day after the day on which this proclamation is published in the
Government Gazette as the day on which Part 5 Divisions 1 and 6 of that Act
come into operation.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 27 June 2000.
By Command of the Administrator,

MURRAY CRIDDLE, Minister for Transport.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !



3398 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

AGRICULTURE

AG301*

Western Australian Meat Industry Authority Act 1976

Western Australian Meat Industry Authority
Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Western Australian Meat
Industry Authority Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on the later of 1 July 2000
and the day on which they are published in the Gazette.

3. Schedule 6 amended

Schedule 6 of the Western Australian Meat Industry Authority
Regulations 1985* is amended as follows —

(a) by repealing Part 2 and inserting the following Part
instead —

“
Part 2 — Midland Saleyard : sale fees

Animal Fee per head

Calves................................................... $2.00

Cattle .................................................... $3.10

Goats .................................................... $0.37

Horses................................................... $3.10

Lambs ................................................... $0.37

Pigs....................................................... $1.10

Sheep .................................................... $0.37
    ”;

(b) in Part 4, in the definition of “throughput fee”, by
deleting “0.65” and inserting instead —

“    0.7    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 22 October 1999.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3399

AG302*
Beekeepers Act 1963

Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Beekeepers Amendment
Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Third Schedule amended

The Third Schedule to the Beekeepers Regulations 1963* is
amended as follows:

(a) in item 1 by deleting “$14.00” and inserting instead —

“    $36.00    ”;

(b) in item 1 by deleting “$34.00” and inserting instead —

“    $68.00    ”;

(c) in item 1 by deleting “$69.00” and inserting instead —

“    $111.00    ”;

(d) in item 2 by deleting “$12.00” and inserting instead —

“    $14.00    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 23 April 1999.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

AG303*
Plant Diseases Act 1914

Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations (No. 3)
2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Plant Diseases
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2000.



3400 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

2. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 Part B item 12(b) of the Plant Diseases Regulations
1989* is amended by deleting ““Proposed Property Freedom for
Mango Seed Weevil (MSW)” dated 16 March 1994 as approved
by the Minister” and inserting instead —

“
“Property Freedom Protocol for Mango Seed Weevil
(MSW)” dated 1 May 2000 as approved by the Minister

    ”.
[* Reprinted as at 17 March 2000.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

CONSERVATION AND LAND MANAGEMENT

CM301*
Conservation and Land Management Act 1984

Conservation and Land Management
Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Conservation and Land
Management Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule 1 replaced

Schedule 1 to the Conservation and Land Management
Regulations 1992* is repealed and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

“
Schedule 1 — Camping site fees

[r. 3]

Description Fee per night
$

1. Camping fee for sites with only toilet facilities —

one or two persons.......................................... 10.00

each additional person aged 16 or over .......... 5.50

each additional child under 16........................ 2.00



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3401

Description Fee per night
$

2. Camping fee for sites where facilities include
toilets and showers — 

one or two persons.......................................... 12.50

each additional person aged 16 or over .......... 5.50

each additional child under 16........................ 2.00
    ”.

[* Published in Gazette 20 March 1992, pp. 1246-50.
For amendments to 1 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 37.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

CM302*

Conservation and Land Management Act 1984

Forest Management Amendment
Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Forest Management
Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Forest
Management Regulations 1993*.

[* Reprinted as at 15 September 1999.]

4. Regulation 100 amended

Regulation 100 is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$7” and inserting
instead —

“    $7.70    ”;



3402 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$14” and inserting
instead —

“    $15.40    ”.

5. Schedule 2A amended

Parts 2 and 3 of Schedule 2A are deleted and the following Parts
are inserted instead —

“

Part 2 — Fees for entrance to Tree Top Walk
Description Fee

$
1. Per person 16 years and over 6.00
2. Per person under 16 2.50
3. Per family 14.00

Part 3 — Fees for use of camping sites in State forests and
timber reserves

Description Fee

$
1. Daily camping fee for site with no ablutions,

showers and caravan sites — 
site for not more than 2 persons 10.00
each additional person 16 years and
over

5.50

each additional person under 16 years 2.00
2. Daily camping fee for site with facilities

including ablutions, showers and caravan
sites — 

site for not more than 2 persons 12.50
each additional person 16 years and
over

5.50

each additional person under 16 years 2.00
    ”.

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3403

FAIR TRADING

FT301*

Weights and Measures Act 1915

Weights and Measures Amendment
Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Weights and Measures
Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Weights and
Measures Regulations 1927*.

[* Published in Gazette 3 June 1927, pp. 1416-48.
For amendments to 7 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 325-31.]

4. Table XIII amended

Table XIII is amended as follows:

(a) in item 1(a) by deleting “16.00” and inserting instead —

“    17.60    ”;

(b) in item 1(b) by deleting “$32.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $35.20    ”;

(c) in item 2(a) and (b) by deleting “16.00” and inserting
instead —

“    17.60    ”;

(d) in item 2(c) by deleting “$32.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $35.20    ”;

(e) in item 3(a) and (b) by deleting “16.00” and inserting
instead —

“    17.60    ”;

(f) in item 3(c) by deleting “$32.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $35.20    ”;



3404 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

(g) in item 4(a) by deleting “64.00” and inserting instead —

“    70.40    ”;

(h) in item 4(b) —

(i) by deleting “64.00” and inserting instead —

“    70.40    ”; and

(ii) by deleting “$28.00” and inserting instead —

“    $30.80    ”;

(i) in item 5 by deleting “$32.00” and inserting instead —

“    $35.20    ”;

(j) in item 6 by deleting “24.00” and inserting instead —

“    26.40    ”;

(k) in item 7(a) by deleting “16.00” and inserting instead —

“    17.60    ”;

(l) in item 7(b) by deleting “32.00” and inserting instead —

“    35.20    ”;

(m) in item 7(c) by deleting “64.00” and inserting instead —

“    70.40    ”;

(n) in item 8(a) by deleting “48.00” and inserting instead —

“    52.80    ”;

(o) in item 8(b) by deleting “64.00” and inserting instead —

“    70.40    ”;

(p) in item 8(c) by deleting “128.00” and inserting
instead —

“    140.80    ”;

(q) in item 9 by deleting “64.00” and inserting instead —

“    70.40    ”;

(r) in item 10(a) by deleting “32.00” and inserting
instead —

“    35.20    ”;

(s) in item 10(b) by deleting “$32.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $35.20    ”;

(t) in item 11 by deleting “16.00” and inserting instead —

“    17.60    ”;

(u) in item 12 by deleting “48.00” and inserting instead —

“    52.80    ”;

(v) in item 13 by deleting “$32.00” and inserting instead —

“    $35.20    ”;

(w) in item 14 by deleting “$16.00” and inserting instead —

“    $17.60    ”.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3405

5. Table XIIIB amended

Table XIIIB is amended as follows:

(a) in item 6(a) and (b) by deleting “32.00” and inserting
instead —

“    35.20    ”;

(b) in item 6(c)(i) by deleting “16.00” and inserting
instead —

“    17.60    ”;

(c) in item 6(c)(ii) by deleting “$32.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $35.20    ”;

(d) in item 6(c)(iii) by deleting “16.00” and inserting
instead —

“    17.60    ”;

(e) in item 6(d)(i) by deleting “0.60” and inserting
instead —

“    0.66    ”;

(f) in item 6(d)(ii) by deleting “0.30” and inserting
instead —

“    0.33    ”;

(g) in item 6(e) by deleting “32.00” and inserting instead —

“    35.20    ”;

(h) in item 7(a), (b) and (c) by deleting “16.00” and
inserting instead —

“    17.60    ”;

(i) in item 8 by deleting “$16.00” and inserting instead —

“    $17.60    ”.

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HEALTH

HE301*
Pharmacy Act 1964

Pharmacy Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Pharmacy Amendment
Regulations 2000.



3406 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Appendix B amended

Appendix B to the Pharmacy Act Regulations 1976* is amended
in the item commencing “For examinations conducted pursuant
to section 21 (1) (c) of the Act” by deleting “200” and inserting
instead —

“    220    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 1 August 1997.
For amendments to 20 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 208.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE302*
Cremation Act 1929

Cremation Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Cremation Amendment
Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Appendix B amended

Appendix B to the Cremation Regulations 1954* is amended in
the item commencing “For a permit to cremate” as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “31.00” and inserting
instead —

“    34.10    ”;

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “52.00” and inserting
instead —

“    57.20    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 15 October 1959.
For amendments to 20 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 50.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3407

HE303*

Health Act 1911

Health (Game Meat) Amendment Regulations
2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Health (Game Meat)
Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule 4 amended

Schedule 4 to the Health (Game Meat) Regulations 1992* is
amended in item 3 by deleting “30” and inserting instead —

“    33    ”.

[* Published in Gazette 23 December 1992, pp. 1414-15.
For amendments to 20 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 132.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE304*

Health Act 1911

Health (Meat Inspection, Branding and
Processing) Amendment Regulations (No. 2)

2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Health (Meat Inspection,
Branding and Processing) Amendment Regulations (No. 2)
2000.



3408 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule C amended

(1) Schedule C to the Health (Meat Inspection, Branding and
Processing) Regulations 1950* is amended by deleting Table 1
and inserting the following Table instead —

“
Table 1

Fees Payable to Executive Director, Public Health

Carcass Side Piece or Quarter

For each swine $0.16 $0.082 $0.040

    ”.

(2) Schedule C to the Health (Meat Inspection, Branding and
Processing) Regulations 1950* is amended by deleting Table 2
Part 1 and inserting the following Part instead —

“
Part 1 — Fees payable to local governments

Scale A

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, goat, calf or deer
(under 70 kg)............................. 3.3c 1.65c .82c

For each swine....................................... 16.5c 8.25c 4.12c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... 26.4c 13.2c 6.6c

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

6.6c — —

Scale B

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, goat, calf or deer
(under 70 kg)............................. 5.5c 2.75c 1.37c

For each swine....................................... 27.5c 13.75c 6.87c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... 44c 22c 11c

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

11c — —

Scale C

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, goat, calf or deer
(under 70 kg)............................. 22c 11c 5.5c

For each swine....................................... $1.10 55c 27.5c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $1.76 88c 44c

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

44c — —



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3409

Scale D

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, goat, rabbit, calf or
deer (under 70 kg)................ 27.5c 13.75c 6.87c

For each swine....................................... $1.37 68.7c 34.37c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $2.20 $1.10 55c

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

55c — —

Scale E

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, goat, calf, deer or
rabbit (under 70 kg).................. 33c 16.5c 8.25c

For each swine....................................... $1.65 82.5c 41.25c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $2.64 $1.32 66c

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

66c — —

Scale F

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, goat, rabbit, calf or
deer (under 70 kg)................ 38.5c 19.25c 9.62c

For each swine....................................... $1.92 96.25c 48.125

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $3.08 $1.54 77c

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

77c — —

Scale G

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. 44c 22c 11c

For each swine....................................... $2.20 $1.10 55c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $3.52 $1.76 88c

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

88c — —

Scale H

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat, rabbit or
calf (under 70 kg)................ 49.5c 24.75c 12.37c

For each swine....................................... $2.47 $1.237 61.87c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $3.96 $1.98 99c

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

99c — —



3410 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

Scale I

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, goat, calf or deer
(under 70 kg)............................. 55c 27.5c 13.75c

For each swine....................................... $2.75 $1.37 68.75c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $4.40 $2.20 $1.10

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$1.10 — —

Scale J

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. 60.5c 30.25c 15.12c

For each swine....................................... $3.02 $1.512 75.62c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $4.84 $2.42 $1.21

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$1.21 — —

Scale K

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. 66c 33c 16.5c

For each swine....................................... $3.30 $1.65 82.5c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $5.28 $2.64 $1.32

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$1.32 — —

Scale M

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. 77c 38.5c 19.25c

For each swine....................................... $3.85 $1.92 96.25c

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $6.16 $3.08 $1.54

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$1.54 — —

Scale N

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. 82.5c 41.25c 20.62c

For each swine....................................... $4.12 $2.062 $1.03

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $6.60 $3.30 $1.65

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27
kg approx.)

$1.65 — —



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3411

Scale P

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, goat, calf or deer
(under 70 kg)............................. $1.54 77c 38.5c

For each swine....................................... $7.70 $3.85 $1.92

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $12.32 $6.16 $3.08

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$2.75 — —

Scale Q

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. 99c 49.5c 24.75c

For each swine....................................... $4.95 $2.47 $1.237

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $7.92 $3.96 $1.98

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$1.98 — —

Scale R

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. $1.21 60.5c .302c

For each swine....................................... $5.22 $2.612 $1.305

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $8.36 $4.18 $2.09

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule.................... $2.09 — —

Scale S

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. $1.10 55c 27.5c

For each swine....................................... $5.50 $2.75 $1.37

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $8.80 $4.40 $2.20

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$2.20 — —

Scale T

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. $1.26 63.25c 31.62c

For each swine....................................... $6.32 $3.162 $1.58

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $10.12 $4.60 $2.30

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$2.53 — —



3412 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

Scale U

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. $2.42 $1.21 60.5c

For each swine....................................... $12.10 $6.05 $3.02

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $19.36 $9.68 $4.84

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$4.84 — —

Scale V

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)............................. $2.09 $1.04 52.25c

For each swine....................................... $10.45 $5.22 $2.612

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer......... $16.72 $8.36 $4.18

For each carton of meat on which no
previous charge has been made
under this Schedule....................

Carton (27 kg
approx.)

$4.18 — —

Scale W

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)………………... 44c — —

For each swine……………………….. $2.03 — —

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer.…… $3.24 — —

Scale X

Unit of Livestock Carcass Side Piece

For each sheep, lamb, deer, goat or calf
(under 70 kg)………………... 11c — —

For each cow, bull, heifer or steer.…… 55c — —
    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 21 May 1999.
For amendments to 19 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 133, and Gazette
29 February 2000.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3413

HE305*
Health Act 1911

Health (Treatment of Sewage and Disposal of
Effluent and Liquid Waste) Amendment

Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Health (Treatment of
Sewage and Disposal of Effluent and Liquid Waste) Amendment
Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 to the Health (Treatment of Sewage and Disposal of
Effluent and Liquid Waste) Regulations 1974* is amended as
follows:

(a) in item 3(a) by deleting “50.00” and inserting instead —
“    55.00    ”;

(b) in item 3(b) by deleting “12.00” and inserting instead —
“    13.20    ”;

(c) in item 4 by deleting “25.00” and inserting instead —
“    27.50    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 2 May 1998.
For amendments to 19 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 136.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE306*
Radiation Safety Act 1975

Radiation Safety (Qualifications) Amendment
Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Radiation Safety
(Qualifications) Amendment Regulations 2000.



3414 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule 2 amended

Schedule 2 to the Radiation Safety (Qualifications)
Regulations 1980* is amended as follows:

(a) in item 1(a) by deleting “553” and inserting instead —

“    608.30    ”;

(b) in item 1(b) by deleting “277” and inserting instead —

“    304.70    ”;

(c) in item 1(c) by deleting “553” and inserting instead —

“    608.30    ”;

(d) in item 1(d) by deleting “277” and inserting instead —

“    304.70    ”;

(e) in item 2 by deleting “28” and inserting instead —

“    30.80    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 26 March 1999.
For amendments to 19 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 248.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE307*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Services Charges)  Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Services
Charges)  Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3415

3. Schedule amended

The Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges)
Regulations 1984* is amended in Part V by deleting “$17.00 per
day” and inserting instead —

“    $18.70 per day    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 26 November 1999.
For amendments to 20 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 143.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE308*
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment
Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Services
Charges) Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule amended

The items of the Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges)
Regulations 1984* listed in column 1 of the Table to this
regulation are amended by deleting the amounts set out in
column 2 of the Table and inserting instead the amounts set out
in column 3.

Table of amended items

Column 1
Item

Column 2
Delete

Column 3
Insert

Part I

item 1(b)(i) $376.00 $395.00

item 1(b)(ii) $216.00 $222.00

item 1(c) $27.65 $28.10

item 1(d)(i) $92.75 $93.45

item 1(d)(ii) $86.75 $87.45

item 1(e) $669.00 $765.00



3416 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

Column 1
Item

Column 2
Delete

Column 3
Insert

Part II

item (b) $90.00 $92.00

Part III

item 1(b) $90.00 $92.00

item 2(a)(ii) $3.20 $3.30

item 2(b)(ii) $3.20 $3.30

item 2(c)(i) $3.20 $3.30

Part IV

item (b) $160.00 $162.00

item (d) $560.00 $513.00

[* Reprinted as at 26 November 1999.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE309*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Services Charges) Regulations 1984

Hospitals (Services Charges for
Compensable Patients) Amendment

Determination Notice 2000

Made by the Minister for Health under section 37(3)(af) of the Act and
regulation 5(2).

1. Citation

This determination may be cited as the Hospitals (Services
Charges for Compensable Patients) Amendment Determination
Notice 2000.

2. Commencement

This determination comes into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The determination amended

The items of the Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges
for Compensable Patients) Determination 1994* listed in



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3417

column 1 of the Table to this regulation are amended by deleting
the amounts set out in column 2 of the Table and inserting
instead the amounts set out in column 3.

Table of amended items

Column 1
Item

Column 2
Delete

Column 3
Insert

Part 1

item 1 $629 $679

item 2 $541 $652

item 3 $160 $162

Part 2 $90 $92

Part 3

item 1 $90 $92

item 2 $90 $92

item 4 $90 $92

Part 4

item (a) $405 $435

item (b) $429 $488

[* Reprinted as at 24 June 1994, pp. 2878-9.
For amendments to 25 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p.143.]

J. H. D. DAY, Minister for Health.

JUSTICE

JM301*
Supreme Court Act 1935

Supreme Court Amendment Rules (No. 3) 2000

Made by the Judges of the Supreme Court.

1. Citation

These rules may be cited as the Supreme Court Amendment
Rules (No. 3) 2000.

2. The rules amended

The amendments in these  rules are to the Rules of the Supreme
Court 1971*.

[* Reprinted as at 21 November 1994.
For amendments to 22 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 287-8, and
Gazette 10 March and 8 May 2000.]



3418 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

3. Order 37 amended

Order 37 rule 4A is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (b) by deleting “interpreter” and inserting
instead —

“    translator    ”;

(b) in paragraph (c) by deleting “interpreter” and inserting
instead —

“    translator    ”;

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “interpreter’s” and inserting
instead —

“    translator’s    ”;

(d) in paragraph (d) by deleting “interpreter” and inserting
instead —

“    translator    ”.

4. Order 66 amended

Order 66 rule 19 is repealed and the following rule is inserted
instead —

“
19. Allowances on taxation

Any of the following items, disbursements, expenses,
payments, or charges are allowable on taxation —

(a) items of costs allowable under any relevant
scale and such counsel fees as may be allowed;

(b) disbursements for fees of court;

(c) disbursements for fees of officers of the Court;

(d) witness expenses paid or to be paid under any
relevant scale of allowances fixed in that
regard;

(e) agency charges, if specially allowed by the
Court or by the Taxing Officer;

(f) the reasonable expenses as fixed by the Taxing
Officer of the typing, printing, and binding of
appeal books;

(g) other necessary disbursements or payments
made in the conduct of the litigation;

(h) any other necessary expense incurred in the
conduct of the litigation, whether or not it has
been paid before the taxation of that expense
takes place.

”.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3419

5. The Fourth Schedule amended

Item 30(4) of the Fourth Schedule is amended by deleting
“paid” and inserting instead —

“    has been paid or is to be paid    ”.

Dated: 20 June 2000.

G. A. KENNEDY, Acting Chief Justice.

W. P. PIDGEON K. H. PARKER

H. A. WALLWORK D. C. HEENAN

M. J. MURRAY A. J. TEMPLEMAN

R. J. ANDERSON C. A. WHEELER 

N. J. OWEN G. P. MILLER 

G. F. SCOTT J. R. McKECHNIE 

C. D. STEYTLER N. P. HASLUCK 

Judges’ signatures.

JM302*

Local Courts Act 1904

Local Court Amendment Rules (No. 2) 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These rules may be cited as the Local Court Amendment Rules
(No. 2) 2000.

2. Commencement

These rules take effect one month after their publication in the
Gazette.

3. Part II of Appendix amended

Part II of the Appendix to the Local Court Rules 1961* is
amended by inserting after item 15 of the Bailiff Fees the
following item —

“
16. If GST (within the meaning of section 195-1 of the A

New Tax System (Goods and Services Tax) Act 1999 of



3420 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

the Commonwealth) is payable on a service listed in this
table of Bailiff Fees, the fee for the service is the
applicable fee in this table, increased by 10%.

”.

[* Reprinted as at 26 February 1996.
For amendments to 14 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 165, and Gazette
24 March 2000.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

LAND ADMINISTRATION

LA301*

Strata Titles Act 1985

Strata Titles General (Amendment)
Regulations (No. 2) 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Strata Titles General
(Amendment) Regulations (No. 2) 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 to the Strata Titles General Regulations 1996* is
amended by deleting item 3 and inserting the following item
instead —

“
3. The fees payable to the Commission for a certificate of

approval to a strata plan are to be in accordance with the
following scale —

Number of
allotments

Application
fee ($)

1 120

2 145



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3421

Number of
allotments

Application
fee ($)

3 160

4 190

5 220

6-10 260

11-15 295

16-20 340

21-25 390

26-30 450

31-35 505

36-40 565

41-45 620

46-50 680

51-55 730

56-60 795

61-65 850

66-70 910

71-75 960

76-80 1 025

81-85 1 075

86-90 1 140

91-95 1 190

96-100 1 260

101-125 1 315

126-150 1 400

151-175 1 460

176-200 1 530

201-225 1 650

226-250 1 855

251-300 2 210

over 300 2 595
    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 11 February 1997.
For amendments to 23 May 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 285, and Gazette
14 April 2000.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3422 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG301*

Local Government Act 1995

City of Cockburn (Dismissal of Council)
Order 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

This order may be cited as the City of Cockburn (Dismissal of
Council) Order 2000.

2. Commencement

This order comes into operation on the day on which it is
published in the Government Gazette.

3. Council of City of Cockburn dismissed

Under section 8.25 of the Act and on the recommendation of the
Minister made under section 8.24(3) of the Act, the council of
the City of Cockburn is dismissed as from the day on which this
order comes into operation.

4. Commissioners appointed

Under sections 8.33, 2.39 and 2.40 of the Act —

(a) the following people are appointed as commissioners of
the City of Cockburn until a new council is elected and
holds its first meeting —

(i) Julian Francis Donaldson;

(ii) Jennifer Lee Smithson;

(iii) Murray Alan Jorgensen;

(b) Julian Francis Donaldson is appointed to be the
chairperson of the commissioners; and

(c) Jennifer Lee Smithson is appointed to be the deputy
chairperson of the commissioners.

5. Poll date for election of new council fixed

Under section 8.34 of the Act 6 December 2000 is fixed as the
day for any poll needed for the election of a new council for the
City of Cockburn.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3423

6. Terms of office of new councillors, direction as to

(1) The direction in this clause is made under section 9.62 of the
Act.

(2) For the purposes of sections 2.28 and 4.78 of the Act and
Schedule 4.2 to the Act the returning officer is directed to fix
terms of office for the councillors that are elected on
6 December 2000 that result in —

(a) as near as practicable to ½ of them retiring in 2003; and

(b) the remainder of them retiring in 2005,

despite clauses 1, 2 and 5 of Schedule 4.2 to the Act.

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

POLICE

PE301*

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Pawnbrokers and
Second-hand Dealers Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Pawnbrokers
and Second-hand Dealers Regulations 1996*.

[* Published in Gazette 29 March 1996, pp. 1557-75.
For amendments to 7 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 201.]



3424 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

4. Regulation 28 amended

The Table to regulation 28 is deleted and the following Table is
inserted instead —

“

Table — Fees for issue of licences

Licence 1 year or
part

thereof ($)

2 years or
part

thereof ($)

3 years or
part

thereof ($)

1. Pawnbroker’s licence only 300 505 709

2. Second-hand dealer’s licence
only (computer option) 300 505 709

3. Second-hand dealer’s licence
only (facsimile option) 384 712     1 037

4. Pawnbroker’s licence and
second-hand dealer’s licence 341 546 751

    ”.

5. Regulation 29 amended

The Table to regulation 29 is deleted and the following Table is
inserted instead —

“

Table — Fees for Renewal of licences

Licence 1 year or
part

thereof ($)

2 years or
part

thereof ($)

3 years or
part

thereof ($)

1. Pawnbroker’s licence only 222 429 637

2. Second-hand dealer’s licence
only (computer option) 222 429 637

3. Second-hand dealer’s licence
only (facsimile option) 355 680     1 006

4. Pawnbroker’s licence and
second-hand dealer’s licence 236 460 669

    ”.

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3425

PE302*
Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996

Security and Related Activities (Control)
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Security and Related
Activities (Control) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule 4 amended

Schedule 4 to the Security and Related Activities (Control)
Regulations 1997* is amended in the items listed in column 1 of
the Table to this regulation by deleting the amounts set out in
column 2 of the Table and inserting instead the amounts set out
in column 3.

Table of amended items

Column 1 — Item Column 2 — Delete Column 3 — Insert

Agent’s licenses

items relating to s. 46(1) 190
210
60

207
227
65

item relating to s. 49(1)(c) 130 136

Other licenses

items relating to s. 46(1) 40
60

45
65

Miscellaneous

item relating to s. 10(2) 10 12

item relating to s. 10(3) 18 20

item relating to s. 46(1) 25 32

item relating to s. 66 10 11

[* Published in Gazette 27 March 1997, pp. 1651-90.
For amendments to 1 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 268, and
Gazette 10 March 2000.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3426 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

PE303*

Police Act 1892

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Police (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Schedule amended

The Schedule to the Police (Fees) Regulations 1981* is
amended as follows:

(a) in item 1 by deleting “Conviction” and inserting
instead —

“    Traffic conviction    ”;

(b) in the items listed in column 1 of the Table to this
subregulation by deleting the amounts set out in
column 2 of the Table and inserting instead the
amounts set out in column 3.

Table of amended items

Column 1 — Item Column 2 — Delete Column 3 — Insert

item 1 $7.00 $12.68

item 2(a) $39.00 $49.97

item 2(b)(i) 65.1 cents 71.6 cents

item 2(b)(ii) 21.9 cents 24.1 cents

item 3(a) $11.00 $14.86

item 3(b) $11.00 $14.86

item 4 $16.00 $17.60

item 5 $39.00 $47.48

item 6 $11.00 $14.86

item 7(a) $22.00 $26.15

item 7(b) $17.00 $21.68

[* Reprinted as at 20 August 1999.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3427

PE304*
Firearms Act 1973

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Firearms Amendment
Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Firearms
Regulations 1974*.

[* Reprinted as at 28 January 1997.
For amendments to 7 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 83.]

4. Regulation 4 amended

(1) Regulation 4(1a) is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting “, or for the notation of an additional firearm
upon an existing licence,”;

(b) by deleting paragraph (b) and inserting the following
paragraph instead —

“

(b) the fee to be paid shall be that specified in
relation thereto in the third column.

    ”;
(c) in the Table to the subregulation —

(i) by deleting “74” and inserting instead —

“    93    ”;

(ii) by deleting “134” and inserting instead —

“    148    ”;

(iii) by deleting the item for noting an additional
firearm on a licence.

(2) After regulation 4(1a) the following subregulation is inserted —

“
(1aa) For the purpose of making an application for the

notation of an additional firearm upon an existing
licence the fee to be paid shall be —

(a) for a Firearms Licence or a Corporate Licence,
$19 for each additional firearm; and



3428 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

(b) for a Firearms Collector’s Licence, $14 for each
additional firearm.

    ”.

(3) Regulation 4(1b)(a) is amended by deleting “$14” and inserting
instead —

“    $19    ”.

(4) The Table to regulation 4(1c) is deleted and the following Table
is inserted instead —

“
Table of application forms and fees

Form
No.

Kind of Licence Fee
($)

3 Dealer’s Licence – original issue (1
year)…………...

148

3 Dealer’s Licence – renewal (1 year)………………... 73

3 Repairer’s Licence – original issue (1 year)………... 148

3 Repairer’s Licence – renewal (1 year)……………… 40

3 Manufacturer’s Licence – original issue (1 year)…... 148

3 Manufacturer’s Licence – renewal (1 year)………… 40

3 Shooting Gallery Licence - original issue (1 year)…. 111

3 Shooting Gallery Licence – renewal (1 year)………. 40

4 Ammunition Collector’s Licence - original issue
(5 years)……………………………………………... 84

4 Ammunition Collector’s Licence – renewal (5 years) 44
    ”.

5. Regulation 5 amended

Regulation 5(1)(b) is amended by deleting “$7” and inserting
instead —

“    $9    ”.

6. Regulation 7 amended

Regulation 7 is amended by renumbering the first
subregulation (6) (which begins “The applicant for an Extract”)
as subregulation (5a).

7. Regulation 8 amended

Regulation 8(2) is amended by deleting “$14” and inserting
instead —

“    $19    ”.

8. Regulation 11 amended

Regulation 11(1) is amended by deleting “$37” and inserting
instead —

“    $74    ”.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3429

9. Regulation 27 amended

Regulation 27(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$150” and
inserting instead —

“    $200    ”.

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

PUBLIC TRUSTEE

PT301*

Public Trustee Act 1941

Public Trustee Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Public Trustee
Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Second Schedule amended

The Second Schedule to the Public Trustee Regulations 1942*
is amended in the manner set out in the Table to this regulation.

Table

Delete “3%” and insert instead —
“    3.3%    ”.

Delete “2%” and insert instead —
“    2.2%    ”.

Item 1(1)(a)(iii)

Delete “1%” and insert instead —
“    1.1%    ”.

Item 1(1)(b)(i)(II) Delete “2½ per centum” and insert
instead —
“    2.75%    ”.

Item 1(1)(b)(ii)(II) Delete “2½ per centum” and insert
instead —
“    2.75%    ”.



3430 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

Item 1(1a)(a) Delete “1%” and insert instead —
“    1.1%    ”.

Item 1(1a)(b) Delete “1½ per centum” and insert
instead —
“    1.65%    ”.

Item 1(1a)(c) Delete “1½ per centum” and insert
instead —
“    1.65%    ”.

Item 1(1a)(d) Delete “1½%” and insert instead —
“    1.65%    ”.

Item 2(1a) Delete “2%” and insert instead —
“    2.2%    ”.

Item 3 Delete “1.25%” and insert instead —
“    1.375%    ”.

Item 3B Delete “$100” and insert instead —
“    $110    ”.

Item 4(2) Delete “3%” and insert instead —
“    3.3%    ”.

Item 5 Delete “3½ per centum” and insert
instead —
“    3.85%    ”.

Item 6 Delete “1%” and insert instead —
“    1.1%    ”.

Delete “$25” and insert instead —
“    $27.50    ”.

Item 7

Delete “$50” and insert instead —
“    $55    ”.

Item 9A(4) Delete “2.5%” and insert instead —
“    2.75%    ”.

Delete “20” and insert instead —
“    22    ”.
Delete “50” and insert instead —
“    55    ”.

Item 9B(2) (Table)

Delete “60” and insert instead —
“    66    ”.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3431

Delete “50” and insert instead —
“    55    ”.

Delete “100” and insert instead —
“    110    ”.

Delete “150” and insert instead —
“    165    ”.

Delete “200” and insert instead —
“    220    ”.

Delete “300” and insert instead —
“    330    ”.

Delete “500” and insert instead —
“    550    ”.

Delete “1 000” and insert instead —
“    1 100    ”.

Item 9C(2) (Table)

Delete “2 500” and insert instead —
“    2 750    ”.

Delete “$70” and insert instead —
“    $77    ”.

Item 9D (Table)

Delete “$100” and insert instead —
“    $110    ”.

Item 9F Delete “$25” and insert instead —
“    $27.50    ”.

Item 9G(a) Delete “$100” and insert instead —
“    $110    ”.

Item 9G(b) Delete “$100” and insert instead —
“    $110    ”.

[* Reprinted as authorised 17 January 1979.
For amendments to 15 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 243-4.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA301
RULES OF HARNESS RACING 1999

Notice of Amendment
Notice is hereby given that the Committee of the Western Australian Trotting
Association at Gloucester Park, East Perth, on the 22nd June 2000 resolved by
majority of members of the Committee that the Rules of Harness Racing 1999 be
amended as follows—

Insert Local Rule 189;
LR189 Withdrawal of horse from race

(1) For the purposes of Rule 189(8)—
(a) the stewards are taken to have reasonable grounds for suspecting

that—
(i) a prohibited substance was or is in or on a horse; or



3432 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

(ii) blood, urine, saliva or other matter or sample or specimen taken
from a horse may contain a prohibited substance,

as the case may be: and
(b) the stewards may withdraw a horse from a race, bar it from racing

for a period, or give such direction about the horse as they consider
appropriate,

where the stewards are in receipt of a certificate referred to in Rule
191(1) with respect to that horse.

(2) Nothing in this Rule is to be taken to limit—
(a) the matters to which the stewards may have regard in forming a

suspicion under Rule 189(8); or
(b) the stewards powers under Rule 189(8).

G. PAPADOPOULOS, President.

STATE REVENUE

SX301*

Financial Institutions Duty Act 1983

Financial Institutions Duty Amendment
Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Financial Institutions
Duty Amendment Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Regulation 5C inserted

After regulation 5B of the Financial Institutions Duty
Regulations 1984* the following regulation is inserted —

“

5C. Prescription under section 10(4)(r) — first home
owner grants

(1) A receipt that arises from the payment of a first home
owner grant and that is —

(a) a direct deposit to the credit of an account kept
by a registered financial institution in the name
of an applicant for the grant;

(b) a credit to an account of a delegate of the
Commissioner that is used by the delegate
solely for the purpose of receiving the payment
of first home owner grants; or



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3433

(c) the transfer of a credit referred to in
paragraph (b) to an account referred to in
paragraph (a),

is prescribed under section 10(4)(r) of the Act as a
receipt to which the Act does not apply.

(2) In subregulation (1) —

“delegate of the Commissioner” means a financial
institution or other person to which functions of
the Commissioner are delegated under an
administration agreement entered into under
section 37 of the First Home Owner Grant
Act 2000;

“first home owner grant” means a grant authorised to
be paid under the First Home Owner Grant
Act 2000 or under a corresponding law within the
meaning of that Act.

    ”.

[*Reprinted as at 25 June 1997.
For amendments to 19 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 82.]

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

SX302*
First Home Owner Grant Act 2000

First Home Owner Grant Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the First Home Owner Grant
Regulations 2000.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. Definition

In these regulations —

“interested person” has the same meaning as it has in
section 16 of the Act.



3434 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

4. Interest of disabled person in home prescribed to be
relevant interest (s 6(1)(h))

(1) If —

(a) a person —

(i) enters into a comprehensive home building
contract to have a home built; or

(ii) as an owner builder, begins the building of a
home,

on land in the State that is not owned by the person; and

(b) the Commissioner is satisfied that —

(i) the person is eligible for financial assistance
under a scheme that provides financial assistance
to persons with disabilities that is administered
by the department of the Public Service
principally assisting the Minister in the
administration of the Housing Act 1980; and

(ii) the person has been given written permission by
the owner of the land to occupy the home when it
is completed,

then, for the purposes of section 6(1)(h) of the Act, the interest
that the person has in the home is a relevant interest in the land
on which the home is built.

(2) A person who is not eligible for financial assistance under a
scheme referred to in subregulation (1)(b)(i) is taken to be
eligible for that assistance for the purposes of this regulation if
the Commissioner is satisfied that it is only because of the
person’s financial circumstances that the person is not eligible
for that assistance.

5. Interest of occupier of home on primary production land
prescribed to be relevant interest (s 6(1)(h))

(1) If —

(a) a person —

(i) enters into a comprehensive home building
contract to have a home built; or

(ii) as an owner builder, begins the building of a
home,

on land in the State that is not owned by the person; and

(b) the Commissioner is satisfied that —

(i) the land is used solely or principally for a
primary production business; and

(ii) the person has been given written permission by
the owner of the land to occupy the home when it
is completed,

then, for the purposes of section 6(1)(h) of the Act, the interest
that the person has in the home is a relevant interest in the land
on which the home is built.



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3435

(2) In subregulation (1) —

“primary production business” means —

(a) an agricultural, silvicultural or reafforestation
business; or

(b) a grazing, horse-breeding, horticultural, viticultural,
apicultural, pig-raising or poultry-farming business.

6. Prescribed qualification to completion of eligible transaction
(s 14(6))

An eligible transaction is not completed for the purposes of
section 14(6) of the Act unless, in the case of a contract for the
purchase of a home in circumstances to which
section 14(6)(a)(ii) of the Act applies, each interested person has
obtained registration of the person’s title to the land on which
the home is situated.

7. Certain owners of land excluded from the operation of
section 16(1)

(1) A person who gives permission for a home to be occupied as
mentioned in regulation 4(1)(b)(ii) or 5(1)(b)(ii) is excluded
from the operation of section 16(1) of the Act in relation to an
application for a first home owner grant in relation to the home.

(2) A person who is an interested person because the person is a
relevant owner of land is excluded from the operation of
section 16(1) of the Act if —

(a) the home in relation to which the relevant application for
a first home owner grant is made is on that land; and

(b) the person does not have, and will not acquire on the
completion of the eligible transaction to which the
application relates, the right to occupy that home.

(3) If the State Housing Commission is an interested person, that
Commission is excluded from the operation of section 16(1) of
the Act.

(4) In this regulation —

“relevant owner of land” means a person who owns land as a
tenant in common as described in paragraph (b)(i) of the
definition of “home unit” in section 19(1) of the Land Tax
Assessment Act 1976;

“State Housing Commission” means the body corporate
preserved and continued under section 6 of the Housing
Act 1980.

8. Prescribed rates of interest (ss 30(3), 32(4) and 52(3) and (7))

(1) The rate of interest for the purposes of section 30(3) of the Act
is 6% per annum.

(2) The rate of interest for the purposes of section 32(4) of the Act
is 6% per annum.



3436 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

(3) The rate of interest for the purposes of section 52(3) and (7) of
the Act is 9% per annum.

9. Conditions to be included in administration agreements
(s 37(2))

(1) The conditions that, under subsection (2) of section 37 of the
Act, are to be included in the conditions specified in an
administration agreement entered into by a financial institution
or other person (a “delegate”) under that section are the
conditions to which subregulations (2) and (3) apply.

(2) This subregulation applies to the conditions that a delegate is
to —

(a) maintain the records in relation to an application for a
first home owner grant administered by the delegate;

(b) provide the records or copies of the records to the
Commissioner when required by the Commissioner to
do so and, subject to reasonable notice, allow the
Commissioner to have access to and inspect the records
at any reasonable time; and

(c) retain the records for a period of 5 years after the
payment of the first home owner grant to which the
application relates.

(3) This subregulation applies to the condition that a delegate is
entitled to retain any interest that accrues on amounts —

(a) received by the delegate from the Commissioner for the
payment of first home owner grants by the delegate on
behalf of the Commissioner; and

(b) held in an account used by the delegate solely for the
purpose of receiving those amounts and any other
amounts approved by the Commissioner.

(4) In subregulation (2) —

“the records”, in relation to an application for a first home
owner grant administered by a delegate, means —
(a) the original application form;
(b) any document that the Commissioner notifies the

delegate in writing is a record for the purposes of this
paragraph; and

(c) any other document given to or created by the
delegate that relates to the application.

10. Witness fees and expenses (s 41(7))

(1) Subject to subregulation (2), a person who is required to attend
for examination under section 41 of the Act (a “witness”) is
entitled to be paid —

(a) a fee determined by the Commissioner according to the
time taken by the examination and the amount that the
Commissioner considers, by reference to an appropriate
publication, to be the average weekly earnings in the
State; and



30 June 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3437

(b) if the witness resides more than 7 kilometres from the
place where the examination is held — an amount for
travelling expenses that the Commissioner considers
reasonable and that is not more than the amount paid by
the witness.

(2) If an examination under section 41 of the Act is held in relation
to an application for a first home owner grant, subregulation (1)
does not apply to a witness who is the applicant or the
applicant’s spouse.

(3) In subregulation (1) —

“appropriate publication” includes material published by the
Australian Bureau of Statistics.

11. Authorised receipt and permitted disclosure of confidential
information (s 65(3))

(1) The National Crime Authority established under the National
Crime Authority Act 1984 of the Commonwealth is authorised
to receive confidential information under section 65(3)(a) of the
Act.

(2) The disclosure of confidential information is permitted under
section 65(3)(c) of the Act to —

(a) the Minister, if the disclosure is made for the purposes
of the administration of the first home owner grant
scheme;

(b) the Treasurer or an officer of the Treasury, if the
disclosure is made for the purposes of the formulation of
policy in relation to the first home owner grant scheme
or for purposes relating to the costs of that scheme;

(c) an officer of a department of the Public Service that
administers a scheme that provides financial assistance
in relation to home ownership, if the disclosure is made
for the purposes of the administration of the scheme;

(d) the Minister responsible for the administration of a
scheme referred to in paragraph (c), if the disclosure is
made for the purposes of that administration or the
formulation of policy in relation to the scheme;

(e) a person performing functions delegated to the person by
the Commissioner under an administration agreement
entered into under section 37 of the Act, if the disclosure
is made for the purposes of an application for a first
home owner grant administered by that person.

(3) In this regulation —

“confidential information” has the meaning given in
section 65(7) of the Act.

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3438 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 2000

ZOOLOGICAL GARDENS

ZG301*

Zoological Gardens Act 1972

Zoological Gardens Amendment By-laws 2000
Made by the Zoological Gardens Board and approved by the
Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These by-laws may be cited as the Zoological Gardens
Amendment By-laws 2000.

2. Commencement

These by-laws come into operation on 1 July 2000.

3. By-law 24 amended

By-law 24(1) of the Zoological Gardens By-laws 1975* is
repealed and the following sub-bylaw is inserted instead —

“
(1) Subject to sub-bylaw (2) the charges for admission to

the gardens shall be as follows —

Children 4 to 15 years of age $6.00

Students (16 years of age and over and
holding approved Australian identification
cards) $9.00

Concession (person (other than Seniors)
holding an Australian social security or
health care card) $9.00

Seniors (on presentation of Australian aged
pension or Australian seniors card) $8.00

Individual adults (other than the above) $12.00

Mini groups (2 adults and 2 children) $32.50
”.

[* Reprinted as at 22 October 1999.]

The Common Seal of the )
Zoological Gardens )
Board was affixed to these )
by-laws in the presence of )

JOHN HOWELL, President.
SUZANNE PIERCE, Member.

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 343930 June 2000]

— PART 2 —

AGRICULTURE

AG401
AGRICULTURAL PRODUCE (CHEMICAL RESIDUES) ACT 1983

Agriculture, Western Australia,
South Perth.

I, the undersigned Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries, being the Minister responsible for the
administration of Agricultural Produce (Chemical Residues) Act 1983, hereby appoint the following as
an Inspector pursuant to Section 6 of the said Act.

Ben MADIN

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries.

AG402
VETERINARY PREPARATIONS AND ANIMAL FEEDING STUFFS ACT 1976

Agriculture, Western Australia,
South Perth.

I, the undersigned Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries, being the Minister responsible for the
administration of the Veterinary Preparations and Animal Feeding Stuffs Act 1976, hereby appoint
the following as an Inspector pursuant to Section 37 of the said Act.

Ben MADIN

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries.

COAL INDUSTRY

CO401
COAL INDUSTRY SUPERANNUATION ACT 1989

Perth, June 2000.
Under the provisions of Section 8 of the Coal Industry Superannuation Act 1989, the following employee
elected members are appointed as constituted under the said Act, from the 1st day of July 2000.

Gary Norman Wood (2) two years
Michael Pokrywka Alternate Member (1) one year

G. R. GILLIES, Chairman.

CO402
COAL INDUSTRY SUPERANNUATION ACT 1989

Perth, June 2000.
Under the provisions of Section 8 of the Coal Industry Superannuation Act 1989, the following employer
nominated members are appointed as constituted under the said Act, from the 1st day of July 2000.

Barry John Kelly (2) two years
Tim Morgan Alternate Member (1) one year

G. R. GILLIES, Chairman.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003440

EDUCATION

ED401
MURDOCH UNIVERSITY ACT 1973

Office of the Minister for Education,
Perth 2000.

It is hereby notified for general information that the Governor in Executive Council has, in accordance
with Section 12(1)(g) of the Murdoch University Act 1973, approved the reappointment of Emeritus
Professor Geoffrey Bolton and Mr Malcolm Macpherson as members of the Murdoch University Senate
for terms of office expiring on 10 September 2003 and the appointment of Justice Kate O’Brien and Sir
William Heseltine as members of the Murdoch University Senate for terms expiring 15 May 2003 and
24 July 2003 respectively.

COLIN J. BARNETT, MLA, Minister for Education,
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

EP401*
ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION ACT 1986

REVIEW OF THE ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION (OZONE PROTECTION) POLICY 1993
As part of its review of the Environmental Protection (Ozone Protection) Policy 1993, the Environmental
Protection Authority has released a new draft Environmental Protection (Ozone Protection) Policy
2000 for public comment. The policy provides for the ongoing management of ozone-depleting substances
in those activities where such substances have not been phased out. This draft policy also provides
provisions for alternative refrigerants, which are being introduced to replace existing ozone-depleting
refrigerants. These provisions for alternative refrigerants have been incorporated to provide protection
for existing ozone-depleting refrigerant inventories during the phasing in of the new alternative
refrigerants. It is anticipated they will only be required for the seven year life of this policy.
In accordance with section 26 (d) of the Environmental Protection Act 1986, the Environmental
Protection Authority invites submissions from the public on the new draft policy. Copies of the draft
Policy are available free of charge from the Department of Environmental Protection offices at the
following locations—

• the public reading room, 8th Floor, 141 St Georges Terrace, Perth;
• Viscovich House, 377 Hannan Street, Kalgoorlie, Western Australia 6430;
• SGIO Building, Welcome Road, Karratha, Western Australia 6714;
• 165 Gilmore Avenue, Kwinana, Western Australia 6167;
• 10th Floor, Bunbury Tower, 61 Victoria Street, Bunbury, Western Australia, 6231; and
• 5 Burges Street, Geraldton, Western Australia, 6530.

Interested people and organisations are invited to submit written comments by 5 pm, Friday 28 July
2000. Submissions should be addressed to:

The Chairman
Environmental Protection Authority
Westralia Square, 141 St Georges Terrace, Perth WA 6000

Queries to Geoff Fulford, 9222 7131 during office hours.

FAIR TRADING

FT401
CHARITABLE COLLECTIONS ACT 1946

I, Doug Shave, being the Minister administering the Charitable Collections Act 1946, acting in the
exercise of the powers conferred by subsection (3) of section 12 of that Act, hereby give notice that I
have revoked the licence of the organisations listed below—

• Toc H WA Inc
• Paul Terry Foundation Limited

Dated this 23rd day of June 2000.
DOUG SHAVE MLA, Minister for Fair Trading.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 344130 June 2000]

FT402*
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987

ORDER PURSUANT TO SECTION 34(2)
WEST AUSTRALIAN JUNIOR BASEBALL LEAGUE (INCORPORATED)

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 34(2) of the Associations Incorporation Act 1987, I order that the
undertaking of West Australian Junior Baseball League (Incorporated) be transferred to Baseball WA
Limited ACN 087 442 822 with effect from the date of the publication of this order.
Dated this 27th day of June 2000.

M. EATON, Manager, Registration Services Branch
for Commissioner for Fair Trading.

JUSTICE

JM401
CHILDREN’S COURT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1988

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of the following persons as Members of the Children’s Court of Western
Australia—

Mr Frank James Rankin of 33 South Crescent, Byford
Mrs Jan-Maree Young of 8 Birch Street, Waroona

PAULINE PHILLIPS, A/Executive Director, Court Services.

JM402
DECLARATIONS AND ATTESTATIONS ACT 1913

It is hereby notified for public information that the Attorney General has approved of the appointment
of the following persons as Commissioners for Declarations under the Declarations and Attestations
Act 1913—

Mrs Margaret Barnesby-Johnson of 4/3 Birkwood Road, Melville
Mr John Frederick Flood of 17 Statford Street, Kingsley
Mr Michael George Meerwald of 22/42 Gillett Drive, Kardinya
Mrs Roslyn Anne Moore of 29 South Street, North Dandalup
Mrs Julie Ann Newton of Lot 2426 Chapman Valley Road, Chapman Valley
Mrs Margaret Anne Paterson of “Kelrama”, 13 Chapman Crescent, Busselton
Mr Richard Wah Chooi Tan of 62 Luderman Road, Noranda
Mr Graham Milton Weir of 11 Hawkins Road, Roleystone.

PAULINE PHILLIPS, A/Executive Director, Court Services.

JM403
JUSTICES ACT 1902

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of—

Mrs Linley Grace Bell of 13 Berkshire Valley Road, Moora
Mrs Jan-Maree Young of 8 Birch Street, Waroona

to the office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia.

PAULINE PHILLIPS, A/Executive Director, Court Services.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003442

JM404
EX OFFICIO JUSTICE OF THE PEACE

It is hereby notified for public information that Lester John Charlesworth has been appointed under
Section 9 of the Justices Act 1902 to be a Justice of the Peace for the Magisterial District of Stirling
during his term of office as the President of the Shire of Kojonup.

PAULINE PHILLIPS, A/Executive Director, Courts Division.

LAND ADMINISTRATION

LA401*
LAND ADMINISTRATION ACT 1997

INSTRUMENT OF DELEGATION
I, Douglas James Shave, MLA, Minister for Lands, acting in accordance with section 9 of the Land
Administration Act 1997 and regulation 3B of the Land Administration Regulations 1998, hereby
delegate to the Executive Director, Finance and Services, of Main Roads Western Australia my powers
and duties under sections 57, 79 and 91 of the Land Administration Act 1997 subject to the following
conditions—

A. Limited Extent of Delegation
• This delegation is limited to the power to grant leases and licences over Crown land—

(i) comprising a main road, highway or secondary road under the Main Roads Act 1930;
(ii) in accordance with the prevailing policy or policies of the Department of Land

Administration relating to leases and licences, to the extent those policies relate to
roads the subject of this Instrument of Delegation.

• This delegation does not extend to transfers in fee simple; or to leases or licences
inconsistent with the Land Administration Act 1997.

DOUG SHAVE, MLA, Minister for Lands; Fair Trading;
Parliamentary and Electoral Affairs.

LA402*
LAND ADMINISTRATION ACT 1997

INSTRUMENT OF DELEGATION
I, Douglas James Shave, MLA, Minister for Lands, acting in accordance with section 9 of the Land
Administration Act 1997 and regulation 3A of the Land Administration Regulations 1998, hereby
delegate to the Executive Director, Finance and Services, of Main Roads Western Australia my powers
and duties under section 18 of the Land Administration Act 1997 subject to the following conditions—

A. Limited Extent of Delegation
• This delegation is limited to approving dealings over Crown land—

(i) comprising a main road, highway or secondary road under the Main Roads Act 1930;
(ii) the subject of a management order issued to the Commissioner of Main Roads pursuant

to section 46 of the Land Administration Act 1997, or a vesting order issued to the
Commissioner of Main Roads under section 33 (2) of the Land Act 1933;

(iii) to the extent of the Commissioner of Main Roads statutory power to grant or deal in
interests in the subject land;

(iv) in accordance with any terms and conditions of a management order issued under
section 46 of the Land Administration Act 1997 or a vesting order issued under section
33 (2) of the Land Act 1933.

• This delegation does not extend to transfers in fee simple; assignments of vesting or
management to other parties; or leases inconsistent with the Land Administration Act
1997 or the Main Roads Act 1930.

B. Limited Term of Delegation
This delegation will only endure until—

• Legislation is proclaimed to exclude the application of section 18 of the Land Administration
Act 1997 in relation to Crown land to which this Instrument of Delegation otherwise applies,
or

• Existing management orders or vesting orders already issued in relation to  any land to
which this Instrument of Delegation otherwise applies; are revoked and replaced by
management orders issued under section 46 of the Land Administration Act 1997, a
condition of which is that the approval of the Minister for Lands to dealings in the subject
land is not required.

DOUG SHAVE, MLA, Minister for Lands; Fair Trading;
Parliamentary and Electoral Affairs.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 344330 June 2000]

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG401
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954

SHIRE OF GINGIN
Notice is hereby given, pursuant to section 38 of the Bush Fires Act 1954, that the following person has
been appointed as Fire Control Officer—

Guilderton Fire Area—Tom Griffin
The appointment of Leon Myers as a Fire Control Officer for the Guilderton Area is hereby cancelled.
Dated 28 June 2000.

S. D. FRASER, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402
CITY OF STIRLING

Appointment
It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons—

John Ellis
Gail Patricia Rebeiro

have been appointed Honorary Parking Inspectors in accordance with section 9.10 of the Local
Government Act 1995, to administer the provision of the Local Government Uniform General (Parking
for Disabled) By-laws 1988 and the City of Stirling Local Laws dealing with parking within the No. 11
Parking Station, Mirrabooka Shopping Centre, Mirrabooka.
All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.

M. J. WADSWORTH, Chief Executive Officer.

LG403
SHIRE OF WYNDHAM-EAST KIMBERLEY

Authorised Officer
It is hereby notified for public information that Garry King has been appointed pursuant to the following
Acts and has been authorised to enforce the following Acts, Regulations and Local Laws—

• Officer under the provisions of the Local Government Act 1995
• Registered Officer under provisions of the Dog Act 1976
• Authorised Person under provisions of the Dog Act 1976
• Authorised Person under the provisions of the Control of Vehicles Act (ORV)
• Fire Control Officer under provisions of the Bush Fires Act 1954
• Authorised Officer under provisions of the Litter Act 1979
• Authorised Officer under provisions of the Caravan Park and Camping Grounds Act 1995.

TONY BROWN, Chief Executive Officer.

LG404
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF RESOLUTION DECIDING TO PREPARE A
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME

Shire of Irwin Town Planning Scheme No. 5—District Zoning Scheme
Notice is hereby given that the Shire of Irwin Council of the Local Government of the Shire of Irwin on
23 November 1999, passed the following resolution—

Resolved that the Council, in pursuance of Section 7 of the Town Planning and Development
Act 1928, prepare the above Town Planning Scheme with reference to an area situated wholly
within the Shire of Irwin and enclosed within the inner edge of the black border on a plan now
produced to the Council and marked and certified by the Chief Executive Officer under his hand
dated 16 November 1999 as ‘Scheme Area Map’.

J. MERRICK, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003444

LG405
CITY OF STIRLING
Authorised Officers

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons—
Craig Andrews Collins
Trevor Joseph Slater
Colin Heaysman
Gregory Flahey
Mario Psaila

have been appointed by the City of Stirling as Authorised Officers to exercise powers pursuant to the
following—

Local Government Act 1995
Bush Fires Act 1954
Dog Act 1976
Litter Act 1979
The Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978
Spear Guns 1955

The following persons have had their appointment by the City of Stirling as Authorised Officers for
the abovementioned Acts cancelled, effective immediately—

David Sullivan
Neil Craig
Luisa Rodwell
Dean Reynolds
Kim Briggs

ROD CONSTANTINE, A/Chief Executive Officer.

LG406*
SHIRE OF MUNDARING

Rangers
It is hereby noted for public information that Mr Phillip Kenneth Avery and Mr Adam Christopher
Smith have been appointed—

(1) as Authorised Persons/Officers for the Shire of Mundaring in accordance with the provisions
of the following legislation—

• Part XX of the Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960;
• Part 9 Division 2 Local Government Act 1995;
• Section 29(1) Dog Act 1976;
• Section 38(1) Control of Vehicles (Off-Road Areas) Act 1978;
• Section 26 Litter Act 1979;
• All Local Laws adopted by the Shire of Mundaring.

(2) As Bush Fire Control Officers in accordance with Section 38 Bush Fires Act 1954.

M. N. WILLIAMS, Chief Executive Officer.

LG407
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

City of Gosnells
BASIS OF RATES

Department of Local Government,
Perth, 30 June 2000.

LG: GS 5-4
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Minister for Government has determined that the method of valuing
land in the district of the City of Gosnells as a basis for a rate is to be the gross rental value of the
land except that the land depicted in the Schedule is to be valued on unimproved values with effect
from 1 July 2000.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

Schedule
All those portions of land as shown delineated in black and coloured green on Department of Land
Administration Statutory Services Plan 21103.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 344530 June 2000]

LG408
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

City of Swan
BASIS OF RATES

Department of Local Government,
Perth, 30 June 2000.

LG: SW 5-4
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Minister for Local Government has determined that the method of
valuing the land described in the schedules hereunder shall be gross rental values for the purposes of
rating with effect from 1 July 2000.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

Schedule A
Lot 4 on Diagram 55932 as shown on Certificate of Title Volume 1978 Folio 979.

Schedule B
Lot 1 on Diagram 55932 as shown on Certificate of Title Volume 1978 Folio 978.

Schedule C
Lot 1 on Diagram 98336 as shown on Certificate of Title Volume 2176 Folio 221.

LG409
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Ashburton
BASIS OF RATES

Department of Local Government,
Perth, 30 June 2000.

LG: AB 5-4
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Minister for Local Government has determined that the method of
valuing the land described in the schedules hereunder shall be gross rental values for the purposes of
rating with effect from 1 July 2000.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

Schedule A
All that portion of land the subject of Office of Titles Diagram 36234.

Schedule B
All that portion of land comprising Lot 2 on Office of Titles Diagram 40273 and Lot 4 on Office of Titles
Diagram 98585.

Schedule C
All that portion of land comprising Windell Location 84 on Certificate of Title Volume 2077 Folio 889.

LG410
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Derby-West Kimberley
BASIS OF RATES

Department of Local Government,
Perth, 30 June 2000.

LG: DW 5-4
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Minister for Local Government has determined that the method of
valuing the land described in the schedule hereunder shall be gross rental values for the purposes of
rating with effect from 1 July 2000.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

Schedule
All those portions of land the subject of Office of Titles Plan 23035.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003446

LG411
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Nannup
BASIS OF RATES

Department of Local Government,
Perth, 30 June 2000.

LG: NP 5-4
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Minister for Local Government has determined that the method of
valuing the land described in the schedules hereunder shall be gross rental values for the purposes of
rating with effect from 1 July 2000.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

All those portions of land comprised in the schedules below:

Schedule “A”
All that portion of land the subject of Office of Titles Diagram 98630.

Schedule “B”
Portion of each of Nelson Locations 4394 and 11169 and being Lot 5 on Office of Titles Plan 21432.

LG412
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Northampton
BASIS OF RATES

Department of Local Government,
Perth, 30 June 2000.

LG: NR 5-4
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Minister for Local Government has determined that the method of
valuing the land described in the schedule hereunder shall be gross rental values for the purposes of
rating with effect from 1 July 2000.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

Schedule
All those portions of land the subject of Office of Titles Plan 24160.

LG413
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Waroona
BASIS OF RATES

Department of Local Government,
Perth, 30 June 2000.

LG: WR 5-4
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Minister for Local Government has determined that the method of
valuing the land described in the schedules hereunder shall be gross rental values for the purposes of
rating with effect from 1 July 2000.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

Schedule A
All those portions of land the subject of Office of Titles Diagrams 22060, 89369, 89370, 89975 and
93954.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 344730 June 2000]

Schedule B
All that portion of land comprising Lots 21 to 28 inclusive, 30 to 37 inclusive and lot 40 on Office of
Titles Plan 18601.

LG414
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of West Arthur
BASIS OF RATES

Department of Local Government,
Perth, 30 June 2000.

LG: WA 5-4
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Minister for Local Government has determined that the method of
valuing the land described in the schedule hereunder shall be gross rental values for the purposes of
rating with effect from 1 July 2000.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

Schedule
All that portion of land comprising Lot 7 on Office of Titles Diagram 66474.

LG415
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

City of Armadale
BASIS OF RATES

Department of Local Government,
Perth, 30 June 2000.

LG: AK 5-4
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Minister for Local Government has determined that the method of
valuing the land described in the schedules hereunder shall be gross rental values for the purposes of
rating with effect from 1 July 2000.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

All those portions of land comprised in the schedules below:

Schedule “A”
All those portions of land the subject of Office of Titles Diagrams 98718 and 99740.

Schedule “B”
Portion of Canning Location 32 and being Lot 11 on Office of Titles Diagram 38786; Portion of Canning
Location 32 and being Lot 2 on Office of Titles Diagram 41024; Portion of Canning Location 32 and
being Lots 54 and 55 on Office of Titles Diagram 67943; Portion of Canning Location 32 and being Lot
40 on Office of Titles Diagram 72764; Portion of Canning Location 32 and being Lot 205 on Office of
Titles Diagram 98650.

Schedule “C”
Portion of Canning Location 32 and being part of Lot 1 on Office of Titles Diagram 41024, as shown on
Certificate of Title Volume 1330 Folio 599; Portion of Canning Location 32 and being part of Lot 53 on
Office of Titles Diagram 67943, as shown on Certificate of Title Volume 2163 Folio 535; Portion of
Canning Location 32 and being part of Lot 56 on Office of Titles Diagram 67943, as shown on Certificate
of Title Volume 2193 Folio 470.

Schedule “D”
Portion of Bedfordale Lot 46, as shown on Certificate of Title Volume 2150 Folio 653.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003448

MINERALS AND ENERGY

MN401
MINING ACT 1978

Department of Minerals & Energy,
Perth WA 6000.

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of Sections 96A(1) and 97(1) of the Mining Act 1978
that the undermentioned mining tenements are forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply
with the prescribed expenditure conditions.

NORMAN MOORE MLC, Minister for Mines.

Number Holder Mineral Field
Exploration Licence

29/155 Reclaimed Resources Pty Ltd North Coolgardie

MN402
MINING ACT 1978

Department of Minerals & Energy,
Perth WA 6000.

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of Sections 96A(1) and 97(1) of the Mining Act 1978
that the undermentioned mining tenements are forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply
with the prescribed expenditure conditions/non payment of rent.

NORMAN MOORE MLC, Minister for Mines.

Number Holder Mineral Field
Exploration Licences

28/514 Arotinco Resources NL North East Coolgardie
77/659 Fargo Investments Pty Ltd Yilgarn

General Purpose Lease
63/3 Sifam Pty Ltd Dundas

MN403
MINING ACT 1978

Department of Minerals & Energy,
Perth WA 6000.

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of Sections 96A(1) and 97(1) of the Mining Act 1978
that the undermentioned mining tenements are forfeited for breach of covenant viz; non payment of
rent.

NORMAN MOORE MLC, Minister for Mines.

Number Holder Mineral Field
Exploration Licences

52/1303 Foote, Heather Rosemary Peak Hill
Foote, Herbert Nicholas

52/1304 Viper Resources Pty Ltd Peak Hill
Foote, Heather Rosemary
Foote, Herbert Nicholas



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 344930 June 2000]

Mining Leases
04/302 Dodsley Pty Ltd West Kimberley
59/273 Fairside Pty Ltd Yalgoo
59/389 Seivwright, Kevin Charles Yalgoo

PARLIAMENT

PA401*
PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

Bill Assented To
It is hereby notified for public information that the Administrator has Assented in the name and on
behalf of Her Majesty the Queen, on the date shown, to the undermentioned Bill passed by the
Legislative Council and the Legislative Assembly during the Third Session of the Thirty-Fifth
Parliament.

Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No
Prostitution Bill 1999 22 June 2000 17 of 2000

Dated 26 June 2000.
L. B. MARQUET, Clerk of the Parliaments.

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928

 ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF STIRLING

DISTRICT PLANNING SCHEME No. 2—AMENDMENT No. 368
Ref: 853/2/20/34 Pt 368
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of Stirling
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 23 June 2000 for the purpose of rezoning Lots 7 and 8, HN 953
Beaufort Street, Inglewood, from Service Station to Residential R40.

D. C. VALLELONGA, Mayor.
M. J. WADSWORTH, Chief Executive Officer.

PD402*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928

 ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
TOWN OF CLAREMONT

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 3—AMENDMENT No. 74
Ref: 853/2/2/3 Pt 74
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Town of
Claremont Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 23 June 2000 for the purpose of—

(1) Deleting subclause 98(2) of the Scheme and substituting the following—
“any delegation made pursuant to this Clause that involves discretion conferred by the
Residential Planning Codes shall comply with the guidelines as resolved by Council from
time to time.”

(2) Adding the following new subclause (3) to Clause 53 as follows—
“(3) Where—

The Council has granted approval under Clause 53 (1)(b)(i); and the building, object or
place referred to in that Clause is demolished or damaged so as to be unfit for occupation



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003450

or its original architectural form is materially altered, then no other person shall use
or develop the land otherwise than in conformity with the requirements of the lower R
Code Density accorded to that land.”

(3) Amending Clause 79 by deleting subclauses (3), (4) and (5).
(4) Modifying Table 2—Development Table by deleting the words ‘In the Town Centre zone, one

for each 20sqm of gross leasable area’ from the column headed ‘Car Parking Space Requirements
opposite the use ‘Office’.

P. OLSON, Mayor.
A. KYRON, Chief Executive Officer.

PD403*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928

 ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
 TOWN OF KWINANA

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 2—AMENDMENT No. 68
Ref: 853/2/26/3 Pt 68
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Town of Kwinana
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 23 June 2000 for the purpose of rezoning Lot M873 Beacham
Place from Residential R20 to Residential R40, and amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

J. H. D. SLINGER, Mayor.
F. R. EDWARDS, Chief Executive Officer.

PD404*
METROPOLITAN REGION TOWN PLANNING SCHEME ACT 1959

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT NO. 1014/33A
TO CLARIFY APPROVAL REQUIREMENTS FOR SINGLE DWELLINGS

INVOLVING THE SWAN RIVER TRUST AREA AND LAND SUBJECT
TO PLANNING CONTROL AREA DECLARATIONS

NOTICE OF APPROVED AMENDMENT
File: 833-2-1-35
The Hon Minister for Planning has approved, without modification, the abovementioned amendment
to the Metropolitan Region Scheme text.  The Amendment shall have effect from the date of publication
of this notice in the Government Gazette.
The Metropolitan Region Scheme text is to be amended by inserting the following—

(a) after ‘building on that lot’ where it appears in clause 24(2)(b)(i)—
‘unless any part of that lot is within or abuts the Swan River Trust Management Area within the
meaning of the Swan River Trust Act 1988 or abuts or is likely to affect waters which are in that
Management Area’

(b) after ‘under Clause 32 of this Scheme’ where it appears in clause 24(2)(a)—
‘or declaration under section 35C of the Scheme Act’

PETER MELBIN, Secretary,
Western Australian Planning Commission.

PD405*
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN PLANNING COMMISSION ACT 1985

NOTICE OF DELEGATION
DEVELOPMENT CONTROL POWERS

UNDER THE METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME
TO LOCAL GOVERNMENT

File: 970-1-1-3
Notice is hereby given that the Western Australian Planning Commission (the Commission) acting
pursuant to the provisions of section 20 of the Western Australian Planning Commission Act 1985 has
resolved to cancel a delegation and to delegate its powers and functions with respect to the Metropolitan
Region Scheme (the MRS) as set out in this notice.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 345130 June 2000]

1. Cancellation of Delegation
The delegation enacted by notice published in the Government Gazette on 28 November 1997,  relating
to the determination of applications for approval to commence development by local governments, is
hereby cancelled.
2. Notice of Delegation
The Commission has resolved, subject to the exceptions set out herein and to conditions set out in
Schedule 1 of this notice, to delegate to local governments and to members or officers thereof, its
function as responsible authority in respect of the determination, in accordance with Part IV of the
MRS, of applications for approval to commence and carry out development within their respective
local government districts—

(a) on land zoned under Part III of the MRS—
(i) except where the land is subject to a resolution under Clause 32 of the MRS; or

(ii) except where the land is subject to the declaration of a planning control area under section
35C of the Metropolitan Region Town Planning Scheme Act 1959; or

(iii) except where that land is partly within the management area within the meaning of the
Swan River Trust Act 1988  or is outside the management area but abuts waters within
the management area; or

(iv) except where the local government is of the opinion that the application should be
determined by the Commission on the grounds that the proposal is of State or regional
importance or is in the public interest, or

(v) except in respect of development by public authorities; or
(vi) except to the extent necessary to give effect to the provisions of clauses 3, 4, and 5 of this

notice.
(b) on land reserved or partly reserved under Part II of the MRS for the purposes of a highway or

road to the extent necessary to give effect to the provisions of clause 3 of this notice.
3. Development On or Abutting Regional Road Reservations
[This clause relates to all regional road reservations in the MRS as amended from time to time.  Western
Australian Planning Commission plans SP 693/1 and SP 694/1 (as revised from time to time) show
the current regional roads under the responsibility of Main Roads WA (Plan SP 693/1) and the
Commission (Plan SP 694/1). Plan SP 693/1 also shows additional roads under control of MRWA that
are not currently reserved in the MRS.   Plans SP 693/1 and SP 694/1 categorise the regional roads
as—

Category 1—frontage access is not allowed (control of access).
Category 2—frontage access may be allowed subject to approval.
Category 3—road reservation not accurately defined or under review.

(See the section below headed AInterpretations@ for further explanation of these categories).
The regional road network changes from time to time with amendments to the MRS and the Ministry for
Planning should be contacted with regard to new additions to the regional road network to ascertain the
category and whether Main Roads WA or the Commission has responsibility. Similarly, the Ministry for
Planning should be contacted to ascertain the latest revision of plans SP 693/1 and SP 694/1.
The Ministry for Planning will provide local governments with comments and recommendations on
applications for development on or abutting regional road reservations for which the Commission is
responsible.  Main Roads WA will provide local governments with comments and recommendations on
applications for development on or abutting regional road reservations for which it is the responsible
authority.
Copies of plans SP 693/1 and SP 694/1 are available from the office of the Commission, Albert Facey
House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth.]

(a) Category 1 and 2 roads
The following applications for development on land on or abutting regional road reservations
classified as Category 1 or 2 shall be referred to Main Roads WA or the Ministry for Planning,
as applicable, for comment and recommendation before being determined by the local
government—
In respect of Category 1 roads
— applications for development, including earthworks and drainage, which encroaches upon

the road reservation;
— applications which involve direct access between the subject land and the road reservation;
— applications with potential for a significant increase in traffic using any access, either

directly or indirectly, onto the road reservation.
In respect of Category 2 roads
— applications for development, including earthworks and drainage, which encroaches upon

the road reservation;
— applications which involve additional, relocated or new access between the subject land

and the road reservation;
— applications with potential for a significant increase in traffic using any access, either

directly or indirectly, onto the road reservation;
— applications which propose retention of an existing access between the subject land and

the road reservation, where there is an alternative access to a local road;



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003452

Exceptions in respect of Category 1 and 2 roads:
Referral is not required where—

(i) the local government first decides to refuse an application under the MRS; or
(ii) the application is for a residential development of less than five dwellings without

any development encroachment upon the road reservation; or
(iii) the application is for an ancillary and incidental addition or modification to an

existing authorised development which does not encroach upon the road
reservation.

(b) Category 3 roads
All applications for development on land on or abutting regional road reservations classified
as Category 3 shall be referred to Main Roads WA or the Ministry for Planning, as applicable,
for comment and recommendation before being determined by the local government.
Exception—

Referral is not required where the local government first decides to refuse an application
under the MRS.

The Ministry for Planning or Main Roads WA, as applicable, shall provide comment and
recommendations, if any, within 30 days of receipt of the application.  If no comment or recommendation
is received within that 30 day period the local government may determine the application on the
available information.   Where a  recommendation provided by the Ministry for Planning or Main
Roads WA is not acceptable to the local government, the application shall be forwarded immediately to
the Commission for its determination.
In determining applications under this delegation, local governments shall have regard for the
Commission’s Policy D.C 5.1 “Regional Roads (Vehicular Access)”.

4. Development Abutting Swan River Trust Management Area
Any application for development on land  that is outside the management area but abutting land that
is in the management area, or in the opinion of the local government is likely to affect waters in the
management area, shall be referred to the Swan River Trust for comment and recommendation.
The Swan River Trust shall provide its comment and recommendation, if any, within 30 days of receipt
of the application.  If no comment or recommendation is received within that 30 day period the local
government may determine the application on the available information.  Where a recommendation
provided by the Swan River Trust is not acceptable to the local government, the application shall be
forwarded immediately to the Commission for its determination.

5. Development Abutting Other Reservations
Applications for development on land abutting land reserved in the MRS for purposes other than
regional roads or Parks and Recreation (where the reservation corresponds with the Swan River Trust
management area and is covered by clause 4 of this notice) shall be referred to the public authority
responsible for that reserved land for comment and recommendation.  In the case of land reserved for
the purpose of Parks and Recreation which is not vested or owned by another public authority, the
application shall be referred to the Ministry for Planning.
The Ministry for Planning or the public authority, as the case may be, shall provide comment and
recommendation, if any, within 30 days of receipt of the application.   If no comment or recommendation
is received within that 30 day period the local government may determine the application on the
available information.  Where a recommendation provided by the relevant public authority is not
acceptable to the local government, the application shall be forwarded immediately to the Commission
for its determination.

Schedule 1
For the purpose of this notice, the powers delegated to a member or officer of a local government may
only be exercised by a member or officer who has delegated power from Council to consider and determine
applications for approval to commence and carry out development within the local government district
under the local government town planning scheme.
Interpretations
For the purposes of this notice the following terms have the meanings assigned to them—

“access” means both entry and exit from either a road or abutting development by a vehicle.
“development” means a development as it is interpreted  in the Town Planning and Development

Act 1928.
“local government” means a local government within the area covered by Scheme.
“local road” means a road other than a private road or a road subject of reservation under Part II

of the MRS.
“regional road” means any road designated under the Scheme as follows—

(a) land coloured red in the Scheme Map—Primary Regional Roads; and
(c) land coloured dark blue in the Scheme Map—Other Regional Roads.

“reserved land” means land reserved under Part II of the MRS.
“road reservation” means a reservation under Part II of the MRS, for the purposes of a highway or

road.
“category 1 road” applies where regional roads—

(i) are constructed or planned to a fully controlled and grade separated freeway standard; or



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 345330 June 2000]

(ii) are constructed or planned to an access controlled arterial standard, (ie. a primary or
district distributor road with widely—spaced signalised intersections or roundabouts, and
few, if any, direct access points to individual sites or local streets).

“category 2 road” applies where regional roads—
(i) are constructed or planned to a partially access controlled arterial standard, ( ie. a primary

or district distributor road with direct connections to local streets and driveways to larger
sites, but with some  restriction of direct frontage access to individual properties); or

(ii) have direct frontage access to abutting properties due to the historic development of the
road and properties.

PETER MELBIN, Secretary,
Western Australian Planning Commission.

PD406*
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN PLANNING COMMISSION ACT 1985

CANCELLATION OF DELEGATION TO
NORTHBRIDGE URBAN RENEWAL COMMITTEE

Files: 970-1-1-3
Notice is hereby given that the Western Australian Planning Commission hereby cancels its delegation
of powers and functions to the Northbridge Urban Renewal Committee notice of which delegation was
published in pages 7064-7065 the Government Gazette of 20 December 1996.

PETER MELBIN, Secretary,
Western Australian Planning Commission.

POLICE

PE401
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a bicycle time trial by members/entrants of the Australian Time Trials Assn on July
2nd, 2000 between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 09:30 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Perry Lakes Dve, Oceanic Dve, West
Coast Hwy, Rochdale Rd, Stephenson Ave, Perry Lakes.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 26th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE402
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a Cottesloe Cup Race by members/entrants of the WA Marathon Club Inc. on July
2nd, 2000 between the hours of 10:00 hrs and 11:30 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: John St, Curtin Ave, Warton St,
Marine Parade, Cottesloe.
Dated at Perth this 2nd day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003454

PE403
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle criterium by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club on July 16th,
2000 between the hours of 10:00 hrs and 13:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Mears Dve, McCourt St, Murray St,
Fisher St, Samson Rd, Point Samson.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE404
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the West  Australian Cycling Federation on
June 24th, 2000 between the hours of 11:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Pickering Brook Rd, Bracken St,
Forrest, Repatriation, Pickering Brook.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 2nd day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Peel District Cycle Club on June 24th, July
29th and September 2nd, 2000 between the hours of 13:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the
temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned
hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Dog Hill Rd, St Albions Rd, Foley Rd,
Young Rd, Baldivis.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 26th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of  a cycle racing by members/entrants of the Spokes Cycle Club on June 25th, 2000
between the hours of 09:00 hrs and 10:30 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Geraldton/Walkaway Rd, Moonyoonooka
/Narngulu Rd, Geraldton /Mt. Magnet Rd, Geraldton.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 345530 June 2000]

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of  a cycle race by members/entrants of the Melville Fremantle Cycling Club on June
25th, 2000 between the hours of 09:30 hrs and 13:30 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Mandogalup Rd, Wattleup Rd, Postans
Rd, Hope Valley Rd, Abercrombie Rd, Anketell Rd, Mandogalup.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 26th day of May 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle races by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club on June 25th, 2000
between the hours of 10:00 hrs and 12:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Tambrey Dve, Bathgate Rd, Balmoral
Rd, Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 2nd day of May 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle racing by members/entrants of the Spokes Cycle Club on July 2nd, 2000
between the hours of 09:00 hrs and 11:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Old Coastal Hwy, Chapman Valley
Rd, North West Coastal Hwy, Old Coastal Hwy,, Geraldton.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club on July 2nd, 2000
between the hours of 10:00 hrs and 12:00 hrs and August 13th, 2000 between the hours of 1100 and
1300 do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the
carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Karratha Rd, North West Coastal
Highway, Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 6th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003456

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the West Australian Cycling Federation on July
8th, 2000 between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 12:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Mundijong Rd to Baldivas Rd then
return to Mundijong.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 9th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael. Landford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the West Australian Cycling Federation on July
8th, 2000 between the hours of 12:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Patterson St, Mundijong, Whitby St,
Anstey St, Cockram, Patterson St, Mundijong.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 8th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Western Australian Cycling Federation on
July 9th, 2000 between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Pickering Brook Rd, Bracken Rd,
Forrest Rd, Repatriation, Pickering Brook Rd.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 8th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the West Australian Cycling Federation on July
9th, 2000 between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Pickering Brook Rd, Bracken Rd,
Patterson Rd, Walnut Rd, Glenisla Rd, Canning Rd, Pickering Brook Rd.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 22nd day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 345730 June 2000]

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Spokes Cycle Club on July 9th, 2000 between
the hours of 09:00 hrs and 10:30 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations
made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Geraldton Walkaway Rd,
Moonyoonooka/Narngulu Rd, Geraldton/ Mt. Magnet Rd, Geraldton.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle races by members/entrants of the Bunbury Cycle Club on July 9th and
August 13th, 2000 between the hours of 09:00 hrs and 12:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Cathedral Ave, Elinor Bell Rd,
Roberts Rd, Australind Rd, Cathedral Ave, Bunbury.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 8th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club on July 9th, 2000
between the hours of 15:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: The Esplanade, Church Rd, Central
Aye, Parker Point Rd, Dampier.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 7th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the West Coast Veterans Bicycle Club on July
16th, 2000 between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 12:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to he confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Argyle Rd, Lefroy, Oakover, Campersic,
Padbury Rd, Herne Hill.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 7th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003458

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Peel District Cycle Club on July 16th, 12th
August 2000 between the hours of 13:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: South West Hwy to Pinjarra, Williams
Rd to Dwellingup, Del Park Rd to North Dandalup
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Bunbury Cycle Club on July 22nd, September
2nd, 2000 between the hours of 14:30 hrs and 17:30 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Marriott Rd, Wellesley Rd, Old Coast
Rd, Treasure Rd, Wellesley Rd, Marriott Rd, Rosamel Rd, Bunbury.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 20th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club on July 23rd, 2000
between the hours of 15:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Searipple Rd, Millstream Rd, Maitland
Rd, Mystery Rd, Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race (Denmark—Albany Classic) by members/entrants of the Albany Cycle
Club on July 29th, 2000 between the hours of 14:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: South Coast Hwy, Denmark/Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 16th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 345930 June 2000]

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Karratra Cycle Club on August 5th, 2000
between the hours of 13:00 hrs and 16:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Central Ave, Parker Point Rd, The
Esplanade, Church Rd, Dampier Rd, Burrup Rd, Dampier.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Peel District Cycle Club on August 5th and
September 10th, 2000 between the hours of 13:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Patterson Rd, Corio, Rd, Sth West
Hwy to North Dandalup, Lakes Rd to Patterson Rd, Pinjarra.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Albany Cycle Club on August 5th, 2000
between the hours of 14:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Troode St Albany, Ulster Rd, Lower
King Rd to Two Peoples Bay, return to start.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Northern Districts Cycling Club on August
6th, 20th, 2000 between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 12:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Shenton Ave, Grand Boulevarde,
Joondalup Dve, Joondalup.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003460

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the West Coast Veterans Bicycle Club on August
6th, 20th, 2000 between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 12:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Argyle Rd, Lefroy Rd, Oakover,
Campersic, Padbury, Lefroy Rd, Herne Hill.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycle race by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club on August 20th, 2000
between the hours of 10:00 hrs and 12:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Balmoral Rd, Dampier Rd, Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 22nd day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE405
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a Dampier half/marathon by members/entrants of the Karratha Dampier Running
Club on July 8th, 2000 between the hours of 15:30 hrs and 18:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Central Ave, Dampir Rd, Burrup Rd
then return to start.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 8th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE406
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a Duathlon Series by members/entrants of the North Coast Triathlon Club on July
2nd, 23rd, August 13th, 2000 between the hours of 08:30 hrs and 10:00 hrs do hereby approve the
temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned
hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Avery St, Turnbull Rd, Warman St,
Mather Dve, Neerabup.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 346130 June 2000]

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a Duathlon by members/entrants of the Bunbury Triathlon Club on July 23rd, 2000
between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 11:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Craigie St, Bunbury from R.C.R.
carpark and return to start.
Dated at Perth this 21st day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a Duathlon Series by members/entrants of the North Coast Triathlon Club on
September 3rd, 24th, October 15th, 2000 between the hours of 08:30 hrs and 10:00 hrs do hereby
approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s
mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Avery St, Turnbull Rd, Warman Rd,
Mather Dve, Neerabup.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE407
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a Foot Race by members/entrants of the WA Marathon Club Inc. on June 25th, 2000
between the hours of 07:00 hrs and 09:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Cliff St, Phillmore St, Elder Pl, Beach
St, Cycle path along Riverside Rd, Waubop Rd, Preston Point Rd, Jerrat Dve, Riverside Rd, Cycle path
along Mews Rd to South Beach, Wilson Park, Marine Tce, Fremantle.
Dated at Perth this 26th day of May 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE408
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a Community Fun Run by members/entrants of the Fremantle City Council on June
23rd, 2000 between the hours of 09:00 hrs and 11:30 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Shared path from Esplanade Reserve
to South Beach, Fremantle.
Dated at Perth this 26th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003462

PE409
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a Hillclimb by members/entrants of the Albany Cycle Club on August 12th, 2000
between the hours of 13:00 hrs and 15:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Marine Dve, Forts Rd, Apex Dve,
Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE410
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a W.A. Rally Championships by members/entrants of the West Australian Car Club
on July 1st, 2000 between the hours of 12:00 hrs and 24:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Lyalls Log Rd, Palmer Rd, Connell
Rd, Kelly Rd, Wight Rd, Bussell Rd, Humprey Brook Rd, McLusky Rd, Yabberup Brook Rd, Blackbutt
Rd, Fig Rd, Pears Rd, North Rd, Davis Rd, Unnamed roads within the Mungalup, and Bussell Plantations
and other unnamed roads.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 2nd day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE411
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and, the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a road cycle race by members/entrants of the Albany Cycle Club on June 24th, 2000
between the hours, of 14:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Chester Pass Rd, Hassell Hwy to
manypeaks and return to start Mercer St, Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 20th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a road cycle race by members/entrants of the Albany Cycle Club on July 1st, 2000
between the hours of 14:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Quaranup Rd, Frenchman Bay Rd,
Gap Rd, Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 7th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 346330 June 2000]

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a road cycle race by members/entrants of the Albany Cycle Club on July 8th, 2000
between the hours of 14:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Ocean Beach Rd, Campbell Rd, Inlet
Dve, Holling Rd, Denmark.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 7th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a road cycle club by members/entrants of the Albany Cycle Club on July 15th, 2000
between the hours of 14:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Albany Hwy, Chester Pass Rd, Millbrook
Rd, Albany Hwy, Chester Pass Rd, Willyting Rd, Rocky Crossing Rd, Albany Hwy, Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 7th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a road cycle race by members/entrants of the Albany Cycle Club on July 22nd, 2000
between the hours of 14:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Albany Hwy, Redmond Rd, Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 16th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a road cycle race by members/entrants of the Albany Cycle Club on August 12th,
2000 between the hours of 15:00 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Stead Rd, Sanford Rd, Graham St,
Barker Rd, Stead Rd, Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003464

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a cycling road race by members/entrants of the Masters Cycling Council of W.A. Inc
on August 13th, October 29th, 2000 between the hours of 09:00 hrs and 12:30 hrs do hereby approve
the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned
hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Anketell Rd, Mandogalup Rd, Postans
Rd, Hope Valley Rd, Abercrombie Rd, Anketell Rd.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 21st day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE412
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a state championship by members/entrants of the West Australian Cycling Federation
on July 30th, 2000 between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 16:30 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Raeburn Rd, Heath St, Chevin Rd,
Coventry Rd, Urch Rd, Peet Rd, Raeburn Rd, Roleystone.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE413
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a supercharge triathlon by members/entrants of the Nickol Bay Triathlon Club on
July 16th, 2000 between the hours of 11:00 hrs and 13:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Samson Rd, Meares Dve, McCourt St,
Murray St, Fisher St, Point Samson.
Dated at Perth this 12th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a triathlon by members/entrants of the Nickol Bay Triathlon Club on August 6th,
2000 between the hours of 08:00 hrs and 10:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Millstream Rd, Maitland Rd, Mystery
Rd, Searipple Rd, Warambie Rd, Balmoral Rd,
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 346530 June 2000]

PE414
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974

I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of  a two/day cycle tour by members/entrants of the Narrogin District Cycle Club on
July 22nd 2000 between the hours of 08:30 hrs and 17:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Northam/Cranbrook Rd, Campbell
St, Alton St, Austral St, Darcy St, Cuballing West Rd, Wandering/Narrogin Rd, Narrakine Rd, Clayton
Rd, Kipling St, Garfield St, Narrogin to Cuballing on Northam/Cranbrook Rd.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
I Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the Minister
for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by
section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated
for the purpose of a two/ day cycle tour by members/entrants of the Narrogin District Cycle Club on
July 23rd, 2000 between the hours of 08:30 hrs and 16:00 hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on: Northam Cranbrook Rd (Narrogin to
Wagin) Williams/Kulin Rd from Narrogin to Williams, Federal St, Egerton St, Williams/Kulin Rd,
Dumberning Rd, Highbury West Rd, Northam/Cranbrook Rd from Highbury to Narrogin.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.
Dated at Perth this 19th day of June 2000.

R. M. LANGFORD, Superintendent (Traffic Support).

PE501
POLICE ACT 1892
POLICE AUCTION

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892, unclaimed found and stolen property and bicycles will be
sold by public auction at Smith Broughton & Sons, 1 Clayton Street, Midland on Saturday, 8 July 2000
at 9.00 am.
The auction is to be conducted by Mr Gary Silcock.

B. MATTHEWS, Commissioner of Police,
West Australian Police Service.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA401
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988

SUMMARY OF LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and required
to be advertised.  Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection
process, should contact the Liquor Licensing Division, 1st Floor, Hyatt Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace,
Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation.

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE
7830 Patricia Ellen Davidson Application for the grant of a Restaurant 26/7/2000

Licence in respect of premises situated
in Cottesloe and known as Barista Cafe



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003466

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE—continued
7831 Alan George Williams and Application for the grant of a Producer— 3/8/2000

Diane Jean Ida Williams Wine Licence in respect of premises
situated in Mount Barker and known as
Towerhill Estate

7832 Phillip Mario Franzone Application for the grant of a Producer— 23/7/2000
Wine Licence in respect of premises
situated in Baldivis and known as Tuart
Ridge

7835 Kiandra Investments Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Special 27/7/2000
Facility—Other Licence in respect of
premises situated in Subiaco and known
as Subiaco Seafood Emporium

7837 Coltline Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Hotel 1/8/2000
Licence in respect of premises situated in
Dunsborough and known as Mercure Inn
Dunsborough

7826 Margaret Ann Matthews Application for the grant of a Producer— 25/7/2000
Wine Licence in respect of premises
situated in Henley Brook and known as
Marlindah Vineyard

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS
4804 Ambergold Holdings Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an Extended 12/7/2000

Trading Permit—Ongoing Extended
Hours, in respect of premises situated in
Leederville and known as Fibber McGees

4805 RC Dearlove Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an Extended 14/7/2000
Trading Permit—Ongoing Exteded
Hours, in respect of premises situated in
Denham and known as Heritage Resort
Shark Bay

APPLICATION TO ADD, VARY OR CANCEL A CONDITION OF LICENCE
113291 Hayjack Pty Ltd Application to Add, Vary or Cancel a 21/7/2000

Condition of the Hotel Licence or Permit
in respect of premises situated in
Carnarvon and known as Carnarvon
Hotel

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988.

HUGH HIGHMAN, Acting Director of Liquor Licensing.

STATE REVENUE

SX401*
NOTICE TO ALL OWNERS OF LAND OR PROPERTY IN WESTERN AUSTRALIA

Land Tax
State Revenue Department.

Annual Returns
Annual Returns are not required for 2000/2001.
The Department will issue assessment notices to property owners, based on registered land holdings
as at 30 June 2000.

Applications for Exemption or Concession
The owner of any class of land in respect of which an exemption or concession may be granted, is
required to make application for the exemption or concession only where the land concerned has been
assessed for land tax for 2000/2001.

W. SULLIVAN, Acting Commissioner of State Revenue.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 346730 June 2000]

TRANSPORT

TR401
PORT AUTHORITIES ACT 1999

Office of the Minister for Transport
Perth.

It is hereby notified for general information that the Hon. Minister for Transport has approved—
• the reappointment of Mr Terry Enright as Chairman of the Albany Port Authority for a term

to expire on 30 June 2003.
This appointment is in accordance with Sections 7-10 of the Port Authorities Act 1999.

MURRAY CRIDDLE, Minister for Transport.

TR402
PORT AUTHORITIES ACT 1999

Office of the Minister for Transport,
Perth.

It is hereby notified for general information that the Hon Minister for Transport has approved the—
• reappointment of Mr Jack Haunold as Director of the Albany Port Authority for a three year

term to expire on 30 June 2003;
• appointment of Mr Brent Rudler as a Director of the Port Hedland Port Authority for a one

year term to expire on 30 June 2001; and
• appointment of Mr Barry Ralston as a Director of the Port Hedland Port Authority for a one

year term to expire on 30 June 2001.
These appointments are in accordance with Sections 7-10 of the Port Authorities Act 1999.

MURRAY CRIDDLE, Minister for Transport.

WATER

WA401
METROPOLITAN WATER AUTHORITY ACT 1982

NOTICE OF ALTERATION OF DECLARED DRAINAGE AREA
Forrestfield—Wattle Grove 2000 Addition

FILE: CV1 2000 00422 VO1
Made by the Hon Minister for Water Resources pursuant to Section 104(3).
1. The area formerly known as Metropolitan Main Drainage District No. 1, deemed, pursuant to Section
104(7) of the Metropolitan Water Authority Act 1982, to have been declared a drainage area, is referred
to in this notice as “the declared drainage area”.
2. Notice is hereby given that the boundaries of the declared drainage area, as altered, are, as from
30 August 2000 to be further altered by the addition of the land shown shaded in the Schedule hereto
and more particularly delineated on plan FN50-0, Sheets 3, 4, 5, 6, 7 and 8.
3. A person who is aggrieved by this proposal or who alleges that any land is not land which will—

(a) benefit from; or
(b) contribute to the need for,

the main drains as delineated on plan FN50-0, Sheet 2 may, pursuant to Section 104(4) of the
Metropolitan Water Authority Act 1982, by notice in writing to the Minister within one month of the
publication of this notice, object to the proposal contained herein.

Dr KIM HAMES, Minister for Water Resources.

Note: Plan FN50-0 may be inspected at the Water Corporation’s Business Office at 13 South St, Canning
Vale between the hours of 8.15am and 4.30pm on any working day.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003468

Schedule

In accordance with the provisions of the M.W.A. Act 1982, it is hereby notified that all rateable land
situated within such portions of the declared area as altered by this Notice shall be rated for main
drainage from 1 October 2000.

J. I. GILL, Managing Director, Water Corporation.

WORKSAFE

WS401
OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH ACT 1984

OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH REGULATIONS 1996
EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE PURSUANT TO REGULATION 2.13

(No. 7 of 2000)
I, BRIAN THOMAS BRADLEY, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner, hereby grant an exemption
to Collex Pty Limited from the requirements of Regulation 3.67(1) of the Occupational Safety and
Health Regulations 1996 in relation to continuous handrailing at the points of access between the
different levels on the scaffold, subject to the following conditions—

(i) this exemption applies only to scaffolding used for the refurbishment of Woodsides’ wharf at
the King Bay Supply Base in Dampier where high pressure water blasting is under way;

(ii) the scaffold otherwise complies with the requirements of AS/NZS 1576:1995 and as applicable
AS/NZS 4576:1995, and the relevant sections of Division 7 of the Occupational Safety and
Health Regulations 1996;

(iii) a solid rail that runs the full length of the ladder is placed parallel to the side of the ladder
acting as a guard rail;

(iv) a risk assessment is carried out, documented and displayed on site for all those affected by
this exemption to view; and



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 346930 June 2000]

(v) operators of this scaffold are instructed and advised on the conditions of this exemption.
This exemption is valid until 30 October 2000.
Dated this twentieth day of June 2000.

BRIAN THOMAS BRADLEY, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner.

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ101
PUBLIC TRUSTEE ACT 1941

Notice is hereby given that pursuant to Section 14 of the Public Trustee Act, 1941 and amendments
the Public Trustee has elected to administer the estates of the undermentioned deceased persons.
Dated at Perth the 23rd day of June 2000.

A. R. McLAREN, Public Trustee,
565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000.

Name of Deceased; Address; Date of Death; Date Election Filed.
Crocos, Robert Henry (DEC 326908 DS4); Merredin; 14/3/00; 8/6/00.
Best, Margaret Philomena (DEC 326788 DP4); Carlisle; 30/4/00; 8/6/00.
Wallin, Edward William (DEC 327237 DC4); Nollamara; 2/5/00; 8/6/00.
Polman, Theodorus (DEC 326848 DP4); Bayswater; 25/3/00; 16/6/00.
Hynes, John Percival (DEC 327255 DL4); Subiaco; 14/5/00; 22/6/00.

ZZ102
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their claims
to me on or before the 31st July 2000 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, having
regard only to the claims of which I then have notice.
Boyle, Gwendoline Gena, late of Unit 4, 19/21 Mackie Street, Victoria Park, died 27/5/2000.

(DEC 327339 DL3)
Davies, Phyllis, late of Concorde Nursing Home, 25 Anstey Street, South Perth, died 9/6/2000.

(DEC 327666 DA3)
Ettridge, Marion Annie Jean, late of Mandurah Nursing Home, 1 Hungerford Avenue, Halls Head,

died 21/4/2000. (DEC 327740 DL4)
Hancock, Ronald Jack, late of Brightwater Nursing Home, Renegade Way, Kingsley, died 3/6/2000.

(DEC 327764 DS3)
Kerr, John Law, late of 105 Forrest Road, Armadale, died 28/4/2000. (DEC 326981 DG4)
Kluck, Apolonia Cornelia, late of 2 Metrome Village, Winifred Road, Bayswater, died 11/6/2000.

(DEC 327720 DG4)
Lowrie, Christina Mary, late of Craigmont Nursing Home, Third Avenue, Maylands, died 11/6/2000.

(DEC 327691 DC3)
Muston, Lavinia, late of St Vincent’s Aged Care, 224 Swan Street, Guildford, formerly of Trinity Village,

Number 37 Room 1, 7 Bedde Road, Duncraig, died 1/6/2000. (DEC 327781 DL4)
Pratt, Linda Georgina, late of Rockingham Nursing Home, 14 Langley Street, Rockingham, formerly of

131 Robert Street, Norseman, died 7/6/2000. (DEC 327669 DS4)
Ross, James, late of Mount St Camillus Nursing Home, 138 Lewis Road, Forrestfield, formerly of

111 The Cotso, Gorakan, New South Wales, died 3/4/2000. (DEC 326481 DL4)
Stace, Allan Stanley, late of Hamersley Nursing Home, 441 Rokeby Road, Subiaco, formerly of Unit

8/299 Harborne Street, Glendalough, died 25/5/2000. (DEC 327627 DG2)
Stannard, Eileen Elizabeth, late of 14/20 Plantation Street, Menora, died 8/6/2000. (DEC 327690 DC4)
Stanwell, Elsye Mary, late of Leighton Nursing Home, Florence Street, West Perth, formerly of

29 Munderee Place, Wanneroo, died 15/2/2000. (DEC 327750 DP3)
Tait, Kathleen, late of 123A Raleigh Street, Carlisle, formerly of 12 Mayfair Street, Nollamara, died

9/6/2000. (DEC 327721 DS4)
ANTONINA ROSE McLAREN, Public Trustee, Public Trust Office

565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000. Telephone: 9222 6777.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [30 June 20003470

ZZ201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Joseph Burton, late of 90 Browne Avenue, Dalkeith, Western Australia. Retired Real Estate Agent and
Valuer.
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 31 May 2000, are required by the Trustee ANZ
Executors & Trustee Company Limited (ACN 006 132 332) of Level 9, Allendale Square, 77 St George’s
Terrace, Perth WA 6000 to send particulars of their claim to him by 5 August 2000, after which the
Trustee may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims he then has notice.

ZZ202
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the estate of the deceased person Raymond John Smith of 18 Bolderwood Drive, South Lake,
Western Australia who died on 14 June 2000 are required by the personal representative, Alan Robert
Tillotson of care of Peter J. Griffin & Co., Solicitors of Suite 4, 1st Floor, 48 Kishorn Road, Applecross,
Western Australia, to send particulars of their claims to him not less than one month from the date of
advertisement hereof, after which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets,
having regard only to the claims of which he then has notice.

Signed: PETER GRIFFIN.

ZZ203
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the estate of the deceased person Edmund Mervyn Tanner late of Lathlain Care Facility, 63
Archer Street, Carlisle but formerly of 66 Alness Street, Applecross, Western Australia who died on 19
May 2000 are required by the personal representative, Susan Mary Jones of care of Peter J. Griffin &
Co., Solicitors of Suite 4, 1st Floor, 48 Kishorn Road, Applecross, Western Australia, to send particulars
of their claims to her not less than one month from the date of advertisement hereof, after which date
the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the claims of
which she then has notice.

Signed: PETER GRIFFIN.

ZZ401
SMITHDOWN INVESTMENTS PTY LTD

(In Voluntary Liquidation)
ACN 008 710 754

NOTICE OF FINAL MEETING OF MEMBERS
PURSUANT TO SECTION 509

Notice is hereby given pursuant to Section 509 of the Australian Corporations and Securities Legislation
that the final General Meeting will be held at the offices of Metcalf Spahn, Level 2, 16 Altona Street,
West Perth on 28 July 2000 at 10.00 am to receive the Liquidator’s account showing how the winding-up
has been conducted and the property of the company has been disposed of and to hear any explanations
that may be given to the Liquidator.
Dated this 27th day of June 2000.

R. W. METCALF, Liquidator.

�������������


