
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

3839

PERTH, FRIDAY, 14 JULY 2000  No. 139
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY KEVIN J. McRAE, ACTING GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—
Hospitals and Health Services (Metropolitan Health Service Board Appointment)

Instrument 2000 .................................................................................................... 3842
Hospitals and Health Services (Pathcentre Board Appointment of Members)

Instrument 2000 .................................................................................................... 3842
Local Government Act 1995—Local Government (Appeals to Building Referees)

Amendment Regulations 2000 ....................................................................................... 3844-5
Local Government Act 1995—Town of Claremont—

Foreshore Building Line—Freshwater Bay Local Law............................................... 3843
Height of Buildings—Freshwater Bay Escarpment Local Law.................................. 3843

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960— Local Government
(Appeals to Building Referees) Amendment Regulations 2000 .................................... 3844-5

Mental Health Act 1996—Mental Health (Authorized Mental Health Practitioners)
Order (No. 8) 2000 .......................................................................................................... 3841

Proclamation—Dairy Industry and Herd Improvement Legislation Repeal Act 2000—
No. 25 of 2000.................................................................................................................. 3841

Rail Freight System Act 2000—Rail Freight System Regulations 2000 ......................... 3846-7
Totalisator Agency Board Betting Act 1960—Totalisator Agency Board (Betting)

Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000 ........................................................................... 3845-6

———

PART 2

Agriculture.......................................................................................................................... 3848
Electoral Commission ........................................................................................................ 3848-9
Fair Trading ....................................................................................................................... 3849
Heritage Council................................................................................................................. 3849-51
Homeswest.......................................................................................................................... 3851
Local Government .............................................................................................................. 3851-2
Minerals and Energy.......................................................................................................... 3852-3
Parliament.......................................................................................................................... 3853
Planning.............................................................................................................................. 3853
Premier and Cabinet .......................................................................................................... 3854
Public Notices ..................................................................................................................... 3855-6
Racing, Gaming and Liquor............................................................................................... 3854



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial, State Law Publisher, 10
William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised beforehand on the inside cover).

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2000 (Prices include GST).

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$19.91

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$46.53

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$46.53 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
  Per Column Centimetre—$9.24
  Bulk Notices—$172.70 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.

• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they
fall on a Tuesday or Friday.

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



14 July 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3841

—  PART  1  —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA101*

DAIRY INDUSTRY AND HERD IMPROVEMENT LEGISLATION
REPEAL ACT 2000

No. 25 of 2000
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
G. A. Kennedy,
Administrator.

[L.S.]

} By the Honourable Geoffrey Alexander
Kennedy, Officer of the Order of
Australia, Administrator of the
State of Western Australia.

I, the Administrator, acting under section 2(2) and (3) of the Dairy Industry and
Herd Improvement Legislation Repeal Act 2000 and with the advice and consent of
the Executive Council—

(a) fix the day on which this proclamation is published in the Government
Gazette as the day on which Part 2 of that Act comes into operation; and

(b) fix 1 August 2000 as the day on which Part 3 of that Act comes into
operation.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 11 July 2000.
By Command of the Administrator,

MONTY HOUSE, Minister for Primary Industry.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !

HEALTH

HE301*

MENTAL HEALTH ACT 1996
MENTAL HEALTH (AUTHORIZED MENTAL HEALTH PRACTITIONERS)

ORDER (No. 8) 2000
Made by the Chief Psychiatrist under section 20.

Citation
1. This order may be cited as the Mental Health (Authorized Mental Health
Practitioners) Order (No. 8) 2000.

Commencement
2. This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Gazette.

Authorized mental health practitioner
3. The mental health practitioners specified in the schedule to this order are
designated as authorized mental health practitioners.

Limitation
4. The authorized mental health practitioners specified in the schedule are to
perform the functions vested in such practitioners by sections 29 and 63 of the Act
only in connection with their employment at the workplace specified opposite their
name in the schedule.

Schedule

NAME PROFESSION WORKPLACE ADDRESS
Jean Hoolahan Mental Health Nurse Psychiatric Wellington Street

Emergency Team PERTH
Michael Holmes Mental Health Nurse Derbaryl Yerrigan Wittenoom Street

Health Service EAST PERTH



3842 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 July 2000

NAME PROFESSION WORKPLACE ADDRESS
Sandy Bennett Mental Health Nurse South West Alma St Centre

Metropolitan Mental FREMANTLE
Health Region

Andrew Wollan Mental Health Nurse South West Alma St Centre
Metropolitan Mental FREMANTLE
Health Region

Louise Jenkins Mental Health Nurse South West Alma St Centre
Metropolitan Mental FREMANTLE
Health Region

Sudha Countinho Occupational North West BROOME
Therapist Mental Health Region

Dated 10 July 2000.

ROWAN DAVIDSON, Acting Chief Psychiatrist.

HE302*

HOSPITALS & HEALTH SERVICES ACT 1927
HOSPITALS AND HEALTH SERVICES (METROPOLITAN HEALTH SERVICE

BOARD APPOINTMENT) INSTRUMENT 2000
Made by the Governor under section 15 of the Hospitals and Health Services Act
1927.

1. Citation
This instrument may be cited as the Hospitals and Health Services (Metropolitan
Health Service Board Appointment) Instrument 2000

2. Appointment of Member
The Hon. Ian William Payne McCall is appointed as member and Chairman of the
Metropolitan Health Service Board, for the period ending 30 June 2001.
By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE303

HOSPITALS & HEALTH SERVICES ACT 1927
HOSPITALS AND HEALTH SERVICES (PATHCENTRE BOARD APPOINTMENT

OF MEMBERS) INSTRUMENT 2000
Made by the Governor under section 7C of the Hospitals and Health Services Act
1927.

1. Citation
This instrument may be cited as the Hospitals and Health Services (PathCentre
Board Appointment of Members) Instrument 2000

2. Appointment of Members
The following persons listed are appointed to the PathCentre Board for the period
ending 30 June 2003—

Members
Dr Anne Donnelly
Ms Jennifer Jane Pickworth
Dr Robert Arthur Dunstan
Dr David Gordon Masters
Dr Keven James Turner
Mr Peter Douglas Eastwood

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



14 July 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3843

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG301*

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
TOWN OF CLAREMONT

FORESHORE BUILDING LINE—FRESHWATER BAY LOCAL LAW
In pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the Local Government Act 1995 and
all other powers enabling it, the Council of the above mentioned Local Government
hereby records having resolved on the 4th day of July 2000 to make and adopt the
following Local Law.

1 The Municipality of the Town of Claremont By-law 132—Relating to
Foreshore Building Line—Freshwater Bay published in the Government
Gazette on 25 of January 1962 is hereby repealed.

2 A building line is made extending from Location 241 Victoria Avenue to
Reserve A885 at a distance of 9 metres inland from high water mark.

3 For the purpose of this Local Law, high water mark corresponds to surveyed
line of Reserve 24523.

4 No building or part of a building shall hereafter be erected between the said
building line and the said high water mark.

5 The Town of Claremont shall be the authority responsible for carrying this
Local Law into effect and enforcing observance thereof.

6 The time for making claims for compensation  for injurious affection by the
making of this Local Law is six months from the publication thereof in the
Government Gazette.

Dated this 11th day of July 2000.
The Common Seal of the Town of Claremont was affixed by authority of a resolution
of the Council in the presence of—

PETER OLSON, JP, Mayor.
ARTHUR KYRON, Chief Executive Officer.

LG302*

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
TOWN OF CLAREMONT

HEIGHT OF BUILDINGS—FRESHWATER BAY ESCARPMENT LOCAL LAW
In pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the Local Government Act 1995 and
all other powers enabling it, the Council of the above mentioned Local Government
hereby records having resolved on the 4th day of July 2000 to make and adopt the
following Local Law.

1. The Municipality of the Town of Claremont By-law 123—Height of
Buildings—Freshwater Bay Escarpment published in the Government
Gazette on 1st day of June 1967 is hereby repealed.

2. In that part of the district included in the hatched area on the plan in the
schedule hereto the distance from the underside of the footings of any
building or structure to the top of that building or structure immediately
above such part shall not exceed 2.4 metres and no part of any building or
structure shall be more than 1 metre above the natural surface of the land
beneath such part.

Dated this 11th day of July 2000.
The Common Seal of the Town of Claremont was affixed by authority of a resolution
of the Council in the presence of—

PETER OLSON, JP, Mayor.
ARTHUR KYRON, Chief Executive Officer.



3844 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 July 2000

Schedule

LG303*

Local Government Act 1995

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960

Local Government (Appeals to Building
Referees) Amendment Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Local Government
(Appeals to Building Referees) Amendment Regulations 2000.



14 July 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3845

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Local
Government (Appeals to Building Referees) Regulations 1961*.

[* Published in Gazette 29 June 1961, p. 2064.
For amendments to 21 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 172-3.]

3. Regulation 2 amended

Regulation 2 is amended by deleting “$180” and inserting
instead —

“    $200    ”.

4. Regulation 5 amended

Regulation 5 is amended by deleting “$90” and inserting
instead —

“    $100    ”.

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA301*

Totalisator Agency Board Betting Act 1960

Totalisator Agency Board (Betting) Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Totalisator Agency Board
(Betting) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2000.



3846 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 July 2000

2. Regulation 34C replaced

Regulation 34C of the Totalisator Agency Board (Betting)
Regulations 1988* is repealed and the following regulation is
inserted instead —

“
34C. Prescribed body corporate

Tabcorp Manager Pty. Ltd. (ACN 064 304 016) is
prescribed for the purposes of section 27 of the Act.

    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 20 August 1999.
For amendments to 20 June 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 294, and Gazette
12 May 2000.]

By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

TRANSPORT

TR301*

Rail Freight System Act 2000

Rail Freight System Regulations 2000

Made by the Administrator in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Rail Freight System
Regulations 2000.

2. Warrant to enter

The form set out in Schedule 1 is prescribed for the purposes of
section 55(3)(a) of the Act.



14 July 2000] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3847

Schedule 1 — Form
[r. 2]

Rail Fright System Regulations 2000

Warrant to Enter

Warrant The persons named below are authorised to enter the land,
premises or thing described below for the purpose set out
below, using as much force as is necessary.

Persons
authorised
to enter

• The Rail Corridor Minister by its authorised persons

• Police officers

• ______________________________________________

• ______________________________________________

Land,
premises or
thing to be
entered

Purpose for
which entry
is permitted

Grounds for
warrant

I am satisfied that the entry is reasonably required and that — 

❏ entry has been refused or is opposed or prevented;

❏ entry cannot be obtained; or

❏ notice cannot be given under section 54 of the Act without
unreasonable difficulty or without unreasonably delaying
entry.

Signature

Name

Justice of
the Peace

Date

By Command of the Administrator,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 July 20003848

— PART 2 —

AGRICULTURE

AG401
AGRICULTURAL PRACTICES (DISPUTES) ACT 1995

Agriculture Western Australia
South Perth WA 6151.

Agric 969/87
I, Monty House, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries, acting under Schedule 1 of the Agricultural
Practices (Disputes) Act 1995 hereby appoint the following to the Agricultural Practices Board of
Western Australia for terms of office and positions as specified—

Name Position Term of Office Expiring
Elaine Marchetti Member 8 July 2003
Bevan Henderson Member 8 July 2003
Maurice Pell House Deputy Member 8 July 2003

MONTY HOUSE, MLA, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries.

AG402
STOCK DISEASES (REGULATIONS) ACT 1968

STOCK (IDENTIFICATION AND MOVEMENT) ACT 1970
BEEKEEPERS ACT 1963

Agriculture Western Australia
South Perth WA 6151.

The Governor is pleased to appoint the following as Inspectors pursuant to the following—
Section 37 of the Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970—

Andrew Reeves
Ben Madin

Section 5 of the Beekeepers Act 1963—
Ted Harris

Section 8 of the Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968—
Ted Harris
Andrew Reeves
Ben Madin

MONTY HOUSE, MLA, Minister for Primary Industry; Fisheries.

ELECTORAL COMMISSION

EL401
POTATO MARKETING CORPORATION OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

ELECTION NOTICE
Election of Officers Pursuant to the Section 5 of the Marketing of Potatoes Regulations 1987

In accordance with Section 6(c)(e) of the Marketing of Potatoes Regulations 1987 notice is hereby
given that it is intended to hold an election to elect one (1) elective member of the Potato Marketing
Corporation of Western Australia.
Close of Nominations—Monday, 21 August 2000 at 12 noon
Close of Poll (in the Event of an Election)—Thursday, 14 September 2000 at 4.00pm.
Every nomination of a candidate shall be made in writing in the prescirbed form, and shall be signed
by the candidate and also by a proposer and seconder, both of whom shall be persons enrolled on the
electoral roll to be used at the election.
Please Note—Candidates must be a current licensed commercial producer to nominate.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 384914 July 2000]

How to Lodge Nominations—
By Hand—

Returning Officer
Potato Marketing Corporation of Western Australia
Western Australian Electoral Commission
Level 2, AXA Centre
111 St George’s Terrace
Perth WA 6000 or

By Post—
GPO Box F316
Perth WA 6841.

Nomination forms are available from the Potato Marketing Corporation of WA or the Returning Officer
at the Western Australian Electoral Commission.
All members! Have you changed your address?
If so, please advise the Potato Marketing Corporation of WA on 9368 3237 of your new address.
Dated 12 July 2000.

JULIE CARTER, Returning Officer.

FAIR TRADING

FT401
RETAIL TRADING HOURS ACT 1987

RETAIL TRADING HOURS (BUSSELTON) EXEMPTION ORDER 2000
Made by the Minister for Fair Trading under Section 5 of the Act.

Citation
1. This Order may be cited as the Retail Trading Hours (Busselton) Exemption Order 2000.

Commencement
2. This Order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government Gazette.

Exemption
3. (1) General retail shops within the town boundaries of the townsite of Busselton are exempted from
Section 12(1)(d) of the Retail Trading Hours Act 1987 provided that the shop is closed on Sunday in
each week until 11am and from and after 4pm.
(2) Subject to subclause (3), each general retail shop in the townsite of Busselton is exempted from
section 12(1)(e) of the Retail Trading Hours Act 1987.
(3) Subclause (2) does not apply in respect of Christmas Day, Good Friday and Anzac Day.

Repeal
4. The Retail Trading Hours (Busselton) Exemption Order 1994 is repealed.

DOUG SHAVE, MLA, Minister for Lands; Fair Trading;
Parliamentary and Electoral Affairs.

HERITAGE COUNCIL

HR401*
HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990

NOTICE OF ENTRY OF PLACES IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES
Notice is hereby given in accordance with Section 51(2) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, the places described in Schedule 1 have
been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect from today.

Schedule 1

Name Location Description of Place

1915 Block, Albany 70-88 Albany Highway, That portion of Albany Lot 1274, being part of
Primary School Albany Crown Reserve 34020 and being part of the

land comprised in Crown Land Record Volume
3009 Folio 581 as is defined in HCWA survey
drawing No 3463 prepared by Steffanoni
Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 July 20003850

Schedule 1—continued

Name Location Description of Place

Hillview House Group 124 Massingham Street, Lot 27 on 95393, being the whole of the land
Kellerberrin comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 2147

Folio 919.
House, 66 Stirling 66 Stirling Highway, That part of Lot 600 on Diagram 99211, being
Highway North Fremantle part of the land comprised in Certificate of

Title Volume 2182 Folio 133 as is defined in
HCWA Survey drawing No 10202 prepared by
Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd

Perry’s Paddock, Cottage 1170 Ocean Reef Road, That portion of Lot 1 on Diagram 61697, being
and Stables Woodvale part of the land comprised in Certificate of

Title Volume 2085 Folio 749 as is defined in
HCWA survey drawing No 9484 prepared by
Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd

WA School for Deaf 53 Curtin Avenue, Cottesloe Suburban Lot 88, being Crown
Children Cottesloe Reserve 23147 and being the whole of the land

comprised in Crown Land Record Volume 3090
Folio 879.

Wearne Hostel Marine Parade, Cottesloe Cottesloe Suburban Lot 87, being the whole of
the land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume
1293 Folio 311

Pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, notice is hereby given in accordance with Section
49(1) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 that it is proposed that the places described in
Schedule 2 be entered in the Register of Heritage Places.  The Heritage Council invites submissions on
the proposal; submissions must be in writing and should be forwarded to the following address not
later than 25 August 2000.

The Director, Office of the Heritage Council
108 Adelaide Terrace, East Perth WA  6004

The places will be entered in the Register on an interim basis with effect from today.

Schedule 2

Place Location Description of Place

Church of the Good Clayton Street, Bellevue Lot 5 on Diagram 2221, being the whole of the
Shepherd land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume

1158 Folio 578 and Lots 6 and 7 on Diagram
2221, being the whole of the land comprised in
Certificate of Title Volume 372 Folio 2.

NOTICE OF ADVICE REGARDING REGISTRATION OF CROWN PROPERTY
In accordance with the requirements of Section 47 (5) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act, the
Heritage Council hereby gives notice that it has advised the Minister for Heritage that the places
listed in Schedule 3 should be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on an interim basis.  The
Heritage Council hereby gives notice of the interim registration and invites submissions on the
matter; submissions must be in writing and should be forwarded to the following address not later
than 25 August 2000.

The Director, Office of the Heritage Council
108 Adelaide Terrace East Perth  WA  6004

The places listed in Schedule 3 are vested in the Crown, or in a person on behalf of the Crown, in right
of the State.

Schedule 3

Place Location Description of Place

Albany Fish Ponds Mt Melville, Albany That portion of Albany Lot 1454 being part of
the land comprised in Crown Land Title
Volume 3109 Folio 850 as is defined in HCWA
survey drawing No 0109 prepared by
Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd

Boulder Railway Station, Hamilton Street, Boulder Those portions of Boulder Lot 3405, being part
Subway & Loopline of Crown Reserve 32594 and being part of the

land comprised in Crown Land Record Volume
3049 Folio 841 and Boulder Lot 3603, being
Crown Reserve 6662 and being the whole of
the land comprised in Crown Land Record
Volume 3034 Folio 798 and that portion of
Railway Reserve as together are defined in
HCWA survey drawing No 4639 prepared by
Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 385114 July 2000]

Schedule 3—continued

Place Location Description of Place

Christian Brothers Cnr Wilson & MacDonald That portion of Kalgoorlie Lot 3633, being part
College (fmr), Kalgoorlie Streets, Kalgoorlie  of Crown Reserve 39589 and being part of the

land comprised in Crown Land Record Volume
3042 Folio 765 as is defined in HCWA survey
drawing No 1310 prepared by Steffanoni
Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd

Outram Street Terraces 74-82 Outram Street, Those parts of Lot 56 on Diagram 79450, being
West Perth part of the land comprised in Certificate of

Title Volume 1975 Folio 65 and Lot 19 on Plan
13229, being part of the land comprised in
Certificate of Title Volume 1571 Folio 163 and
that section of dedicated road as together are
defined in HCWA survey drawing No 4506
prepared by Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank
Pty Ltd

Dated this 14th day of July 2000.
IAN BAXTER, Director, Office of the Heritage Council.

HOMESWEST

HM401
BUILDING SOCIETIES ACT 1976

Section 23(3)
CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION ON CHANGE OF NAME OF BUILDING SOCIETY

This is to certify that Trades and Labor Council of WA No. 29 Building Society, which was on the
Eighth day of August 1978, incorporated under the Building Societies Act 1976, did on the First day of
April 2000 change its name to TLC Building Society.
Given under my hand and seal at Perth this Sixth day of July 2000.

JOHN COLES, Deputy Registrar of
Co-Operative and Financial Institutions.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG401
CITY OF COCKBURN

Authorised Person
It is hereby notified for public information that effective from 14 July 2000, Mr Roy Beresford’s
authorisation for the following Local Laws and Acts is hereby revoked.

1. Dog Act 1976
2. Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978
3. Litter Act 1979
4. Local Government Act 1995
5. Council Local Laws and Regulations
6. Fire Control Officer pursuant to s.38 and s.59 of the Bush Fires Act 1954
7. s.9.10 Local Government Act 1979

R. W. BROWN, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

DISTRICT OF THE CITY OF WANNEROO (CHARGE OF WARD BOUNDARIES) ORDER 2000
Made by the Administrator in Executive Council under the provisions of section 2.2 of the Local
Government Act 1995.

Citation
1. This Order may be cited as the District of the City of Wanneroo (Change of Ward Boundaries) Order
2000.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 July 20003852

Commencement
2. This Order shall take effect from the date of publication in the Government Gazette.

Change of Ward Boundaries
3. The boundaries of Alexander and South Wards in the District of the City of Wanneroo are changed so
that the land described in the Schedule ceases to be in the South Ward and is instead in the Alexander
Ward.
By Command of the Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Schedule
All that portion of land bounded by lines starting from the intersection of a western side of Wanneroo
Road with the prolongation westerly of the centreline of Marangaroo Drive, a point on a present western
boundary of the City of Wanneroo and extending easterly to and generally easterly and generally
southeasterly along that centreline to the prolongation easterly of the centreline of Warwick Place;
thence westerly to and along that centreline and westerly along the centreline of Mereworth Way and
onwards to a southwestern side of Wanneroo Road, a point on a present southwestern boundary of the
City of Wanneroo and thence generally northerly along boundaries of that City to the starting point.

MINERALS AND ENERGY

MN101*
CORRECTION

Commonwealth of Australia
PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967

CORRECTION OF NOTICE OF INVITATION FOR APPLICATIONS FOR EXPLORATION
PERMITS

The notice at page 3217 of the Government Gazette dated 23 June 2000 listing the Schedule of Blocks
available for application is corrected as follows—

Block Number 23721 for area W99-6 Map Sheet SD50 is corrected to 2372.

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum Division.

MN401
MINING ACT 1978

INSTRUMENT OF EXEMPTION OF LAND
The Minister for Mines pursuant to the powers conferred on him by Section 19 of the Mining Act 1978,
hereby exempts all areas of land as described in the schedule hereunder, not being private land or land
that is the subject of a mining tenement or of an application therefor, from Divisions 1 to 5 of Part IV
of the Mining Act 1978.

Schedule
Mineral Field—West Pilbara

Starting point is situated at 22° 29´ 04´´, 118° 27´,
thence to 22° 28´ 48.8´´, 118° 27´,
thence to 22° 28´ 44´´, 118° 27´ 39´´,
thence to 22° 28´ 48.8´´, 118° 28´ 10´´,
thence to 22° 29´ 04´´, 118° 28´ 10´´,
back to starting point.
Area—108.3088 hectares
Public Plan—Tengraph

Dated at Perth this 5th day of July 2000.
NORMAN MOORE, MLC, Minister for Mines.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 385314 July 2000]

MN402
MINING ACT 1978

INSTRUMENT OF EXEMPTION OF LAND—EXTENSION OF PERIOD
The Minister for Mines pursuant to the powers conferred on him by Section 19 of the Mining Act 1978,
hereby extends the exemption (designated S19-124 on the Departmental Public Plan) granted on 15
July 1998 and published in Government Gazette dated 24 July 1998 of that area described hereunder
from Divisions 1 to 5 of Part IV of the Mining Act 1978.
Description
Carlton Plain and Mantinea Flat, Ord Irrigation Area; those portions of land, not being the subject of
a mining tenement or application for a mining tenement and described as follows—

Primary Number Graticular Block
Darwin 2981 n, o, p, s, t, u, x, y, z

2982 l, m, n, q, r, s, t, u, v, w, x, y, z
2983 v, w
3053 c, d, e, h, j, k, n, o, p, s, t, u, x, y, z
3054 a, b, c, d, e, f, g, h, j, k, l, m, n, o, p, q, r, s, t, u, v, w, x, y, z
3055 a, b, c, d, e, f, g, h, j, k, l, m, n, o, p
3125 c, d, e, h, j, k
3126 a, b, c, d, e, f, g, h, j, k
3127 a, b, c, d, e, f, g, h, j, k

Dated at Perth this 4th day of July 2000.
NORMAN MOORE, MLC, Minister for Mines.

PARLIAMENT

PA401*
PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

Bills Assented To
It is hereby notified for public information that the Administrator has Assented in the name and on
behalf of Her Majesty the Queen, on the dates shown, to the undermentioned Bills passed by the
Legislative Council and the Legislative Assembly during the Third Session of the Thirty-Fifth Parliament.

Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No
Courts Legislation Amendment Bill 1999 6 July 2000 27 of 2000
Stamp Amendment Bill 1999 6 July 2000 28 of 2000
Revenue Laws Amendment (Assessment) Bill 2000 6 July 2000 29 of 2000
Treasurer’s Advance Authorisation Bill 2000 6 July 2000 30 of 2000
Appropriation (Consolidated Fund) Bill (No. 1) 2000 6 July 2000 31 of 2000
Appropriation (Consolidated Fund) Bill (No. 2) 2000 6 July 2000 32 of 2000
Bulk Handling Repeal Bill 2000 6 July 2000 33 of 2000

L. B. MARQUET, Clerk of the Parliaments.
10 July 2000

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION
 TOWN OF KWINANA

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO 2—AMENDMENT NO 64
 Ref: 853/2/26/3 Pt 64
Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Town of Kwinana has prepared the
abovementioned Scheme Amendment for the purpose of adding Clause 6 to the Fourth Schedule—
Residential Development Areas—No 1 Casuarina, for the prohibition of highly reflective materials.
Plans and documents setting out and explaining the Scheme Amendment have been deposited at
Council Offices, Corner Gilmore Avenue/Sulphur Road, Kwinana  and at the Western Australian
Planning Commission, Albert Facey House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and will be available for
inspection during office hours up to and including 25 August 2000.
Submissions on the Scheme Amendment may be made in writing on Form No 4 and lodged with the
undersigned on or before 25 August 2000.
This Amendment is available for inspection in order to provide an opportunity for public comment and
it should not be construed that final approval will be granted.

F. R. EDWARDS, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 July 20003854

PREMIER AND CABINET

PR401
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the Administrator in accordance with Section 52(1)(b)
of the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointments in the place of the
Hon A. K. R. Prince MLA, in the period 1 to 23 July 2000 inclusive—

Minister for Police; Emergency Services—Hon C. L. Edwardes MLA

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General,
Ministry of the Premier and Cabinet.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA401
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988

SUMMARY OF LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS

The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and required
to be advertised.  Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection
process, should contact the Liquor Licensing Division, 1st Floor, Hyatt Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace,
Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation.

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE
7853 Peter Edward Pawlowitsch Application for the grant of a Special 7/8/2000

and Kimberley John Taylor Facility—Other Licence in respect of
Morrison premises situated in Dunsborough and

known as To Be Advised (Dunsborough)
7854 Ewald Ringer Application for the grant of a Wholesaler’s 3/8/2000

licence in respect of premises situated in
Willagee and known as Taste of Europe

7855 Stanko Consulting Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Special 9/8/2000
Facility—Bed and Breakfast Licence in
respect of premises situated in Wellington
Mills and known as Peppermint Land Bed
and Breakfast

7858 Jetcrest Investments Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Restaurant 6/8/2000
licence in respect of premises situated in
Northbridge and known as Hogs Breath
Cafe—Northbridge

7849 Geraldton Rovers Soccer Application for the grant of a Club 8/8/2000
Club Inc Restricted licence in respect of premises

situated in Geraldton and known as
Geraldton Rovers Soccer Club Inc

7793 Andrew John Nicholson Application for the grant of a Producer’s 15/8/2000
Gaman licence in respect of premises situated in

Margaret River and known as Rockfield
Estate Vineyard

APPLICATIONS TO ADD, VARY OR CANCEL A CONDITION OF LICENCE
111151 Curtin Hotels Pty Ltd Application for the grant of add, vary or 26/7/2000

cancel a condition of a licence in respect
of premises situated in York and known as
Curtin Tavern

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988.

HUGH HIGHMAN, Acting Director of Liquor Licensing.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 385514 July 2000]

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ101
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

Notice to Creditors and Claimants
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their claims
to me on or before the 14th August 2000 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, having
regard only to the claims of which I then have notice.
Beet, Merlyn, late of Unit 21 Fulham Street, Kewdale, formerly of 1 Martin Avenue, Rivervale, died

25.06.2000. (DEC 328000 DC4)
Bowra, Bevan James, also known as Bowra, Beverley James, late of St Lukes Nursing Home, Rokeby

Road, Subiaco, died 22.05.2000. (DEC 327922 DG2)
Curo, James Foster, late of 28 Jamieson Street, Pemberton, formerly of Pine Street, Pemberton, died

20.05.2000. (DEC 327741 DP4)
Duncan, Kathleen, late of Hollywood Senior Citizen’s Village, 31 William Street, Nedlands, formerly of

Unit 258, 31 William Street, Nedlands, died 16.06.2000. (DEC 328009 DS4)
Foster, James Edgar, late of Rockingham Nursing Home, 14 Langley Street, Rockingham, died

06.06.2000. (DEC 327746 DG3)
Fox, Peter John, late of 619 Byron Road, Kalamunda, formerly of 29B Ann Avenue, Kalamunda, died

17.06.2000. (DEC 327949 DS4)
Giulietti, Mario, late of 351 Orrong Road, Kewdale, died 21.04.2000. (DEC 326930 DC3)
Jones, Roy Claxton, late of 8 Ripley Way, Duncraig, died 17.06.2000. (DEC 328003 DG4)
Kermode, Monica Mary Lucy, late of 10 First Avenue, Bassendean, died 20.04.2000. (DEC 327999 DS3)
McCrea, Jean, late of 15 Alconbury Road, Kingsley, died 19.06.2000. (DEC 327985 DS2)
McKenzie, Colin, late of Craigmont Nursing Home, Third Avenue, Maylands, died 11.04.2000. (DEC

326822 DG4)
North, Colin, late of 31 Catherine Street, Byford, died 28.05.2000. (DEC 327190 DS3)
Ong, Joseph, late of 114 French Street, Tuart Hill, died 12.05.2000. (DEC 327190 DS3)
Paynter, Mavis Frances, late of Shoalwater Nursing Home, 72 Fourth Avenue, Shoalwater. formerly of

34B Bates Road, Innaloo, died 25.06.2000. (DEC 327920 DP4)
Scott, John Weller, late of Kensington Park Nursing Home, Gwenyfred Road, Kensington, formerly of

15 Rothbury Road, Embleton, died 31.05.2000. (DEC 327877 DP3)
Steigmajer, Karin, late of 6 Greenway Avenue, Thornlie, died 22.03.1999. (DEC 323566 DG4)
Taylor, Robert Leslie, late of Lakeside Nursing Home, 68 Lyall Street, Redcliffe, formerly of Salvation

Army Citizen’s Centre, Gosnells, died 21.06.2000. (DEC 328104 DS3)
Ward, Mervyn Lennard, late of 42 O’Sullivan Drive, Westfield, died on or about 27.06.2000. (DEC

327932 DC3)
Watson, Annie Kathleen, late of 8/19 Sorrento Street, North Beach, died 27.05.2000. (DEC 327853

DC3)
White, Ronald Joseph Charles, late of Room 22, 238 Beaufort Street, Northbridge, died 07.03.2000.

(DEC 325971 DP4)
Wolski, Janina, late of 32 Beechboro Road, Bayswater, died 29.01.1999. (DEC 318688 DG3)

ANTONINA ROSE McLAREN
Public Trustee

Public Trust Office
565 Hay Street
Perth WA 6000

Telephone: 9222 6777

ZZ201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

Notice to Creditors and Claimants
Julius Cyzas, late of 283 Crawford Road, Inglewood deceased.
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect to the estate of the deceased who died on the 30th day of May 2000 are required by the Trustee
Eugene Stankevicius of 202 Loftus Street, Leederville to send particulars of their claims to him by the
20th day of August 2000, after which date the Trustee may convey or distribute the assets having
regard only to the claims of which he then has notice.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 July 20003856

ZZ202
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

Notice to Creditors and Claimants
Brian Sommer, late of Loc 44 Kitchener Road, Kalgoorlie, Western Australia, Retired Gardener, deceased.
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 28 May 1999 are required by the Executrix of care of
McAuliffe’s Lawyers of PO Box 4903 Kalgoorlie WA 6433 to send particulars of their claims by 15 August
2000, after which date the Executrix may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the
claims for which she has then had notice.

ZZ401*
TRUSTEE COMPANIES ACT 1987

National Australia Trustees Limited ABN 80 007 350 405 hereby gives notice it intends to alter its
scale of charges for deceased estate and trust administration with effect from 21 July 2000.
Maximum commissions (inclusive of GST*) are—

(a) Jointly held assets—
transferred to survivor at nominal fee.

(b) Principal place of residence—
where transferred direct to beneficiary and if not jointly held—1.08% of market value
(currently 1%).

(c) Other assets—
Commission on gross capital value will not exceed—

4.33% on first $250,000 (currently 4%)
3.25% on next $250,000 (currently 3%)
2.16% on next $250,000 (currently 2%)
1.08% in excess of $750,000 (currently 1%)

(d) On gross income collections—6.47%pa (currently 6%)
(e) Management of a business – fees to be negotiated.
(f) National Australia Trustees Limited is entitled to the reimbursement of all disbursements

properly made by the company in the administration and management of an estate.
(g) National Australia Trustees Limited may, in addition to commissions and disbursements, charge

a fee for work involved in the preparation and lodgement of returns for the purpose of or in
connection with assessments of any duties or taxes (other than probate, death, succession or
estate duties).

(h) Copies of the current and proposed scale of charges are available upon request and free of
charge from Level 11, 50 St Georges Terrace Perth, WA.

* ‘GST’—a goods and services tax or any similar tax imposed in Australia.

ZZ402
COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943
AND OF CO-OPERATIVE BULK HANDLING LIMITED

Notice is hereby given that Co-operative Bulk Handling Limited (“the Applicant”) has applied to the
Supreme Court of Western Australia for an order to convene a meeting of members to approve a
proposed scheme of arrangement (“the Scheme”) under section 158 of the Companies (Co-operative)
Act 1943 (“the Act”). The proposed Scheme relates to the conversion of the Applicant from a co-operative
company registered under the Act to a public company registered under the Corporations Law. In
particular, the Scheme provides for the cancellation of all the Applicant’s shares and the issue in
substitution of two new classes of shares and the adoption of a new Constitution in place of the existing
Memorandum and Articles of Association.
The application was made on Friday 7 July 2000 and will be heard on Friday 28 July 2000 at 9.15am
at the Supreme Court of Western Australia, Perth.
Notice is given by:

Clayton Utz, of 108 St George’s Terrace Perth WA 6000, Solicitors for the Applicant
Notice is given on behalf of:

The Applicant—Co-operative Bulk Handling Limited
Gayfer House
22 Delhi Street
West Perth WA 6005



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 385714 July 2000]

Order your Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

2000
An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes

of Government Gazette

For further information please contact:
State Law Publisher
Telephone: 9321 7688

For Government Departments and private firms who
presently arrange binding for their copies of
Government Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is
now offering a subscription covering 4 Quarterly
Volumes at a cost of $983.40.

The Gazettes will be bound in black cloth with gold foil
lettering on the spine and personalised by  the addition
of the client's name in gold lettering on the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE

On the rare occasion where extra gazettes are published
in one quarter, a fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost involved will be borne by the
State Law Publisher and not passed on to clients.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [14 July 20003858

�������������

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER
SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2000

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2000. Subject to certain
limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. The prices
quoted include postage by surface mail unless stated otherwise.
PLEASE NOTE: A Goods and Services charge (GST) will be applicable to all goods and services
supplied after 30 June 2000.  Clients will be sent an additional invoice for these charges when
details are finalised.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, unless
disrupted by public holidays or unforseen
circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.

All Gazettes  $
Within WA ............................................ 649
Interstate .............................................. 673
Overseas (airmail) ............................. 1012

Bound Volumes of full year 983.40

Electronic Gazette Online
(includes all Gazettes from Jan 1998)
Existing hard copy subscriber ................ 165
Electronic Subscription only ................... 550

1999 Gazettes on CD ROM ...................... 660
1998 Gazettes on CD ROM ...................... 660

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

$
Within WA ............................................ 261
Interstate .............................................. 311
Overseas (airmail) ............................... 435

1999 Gazettes on CD ROM ...................... 286
1998 Gazettes on CD ROM ...................... 286

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly
during parliamentary sessions.

$
Within WA ............................................ 416
Interstate .............................................. 514
Overseas (airmail) ............................... 557

Bound Volumes of Hansard
Within WA ...................................... 552.20
Interstate ........................................ 588.50

1999 Hansards on CD ROM................... 550

STATUTES
Bound Statutes
Bound volumes are posted during March of
the following year.

$
Within WA ......................................246.40
Interstate ........................................ 271.70
Overseas ......................................... 277.20
Half Calf Bound Statutes ..............676.50

1999 Bound Volumes on CD ROM....245.30
1998 Bound Volumes on CD ROM....245.30

Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become
available

$
Within WA .......................................... 239
Interstate ............................................ 247
Overseas (airmail) ............................. 354

Sessional Bills
Bills are posted weekly as they become
available

$
Within WA .......................................... 330
Interstate ........................................... 344
Overseas (airmail) ............................. 515

Electronic Statutes Online
Includes all Acts, Regulations, Bills, Acts by
year, Index to Statutes, Hansard, etc

$
1st user ................................................ 660
2nd and each additional user ............. 330

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is
searchable. Other CD ROM products with
legislation or other statutory information
can be packaged to individual requirements.
Prices are available on request.


