
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

331

PERTH, TUESDAY, 16 JANUARY 2001  No. 16
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Building and Construction Industry Training Fund and Levy Collection Act 1990—
Building and Construction Industry Training Fund and Levy Collection
Amendment Regulations 2001 ...................................................................................... 338

Building and Construction Industry Training Levy Act 1990—Building and
Construction Industry Training Levy Regulations 2001 ............................................. 339

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947—
Cane River Water Reserve Order 2000 ...................................................................... 340-1
Harding Dam Catchment Area Order 2000 ............................................................... 342-3
Ledge Point Water Reserve Order 2000 ..................................................................... 344-5

Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961—Explosives and Dangerous Goods
(Authorised Explosives) Amendment Order 2000 ......................................................... 336-7

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment
Regulations (No. 3) 2000................................................................................................. 335

Proclamation—Metropolitan Water Supply, Sewerage, and Drainage Act 1909............ 333-4

———

PART 2

Health ................................................................................................................................. 346
Local Government .............................................................................................................. 346
Planning.............................................................................................................................. 347-8
Public Notices—Deceased Estate ...................................................................................... 349
Water .................................................................................................................................. 348



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial, State Law Publisher, 10
William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised beforehand on the inside cover).

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2000 (Prices include GST).

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$19.91

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$46.53

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$46.53 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
  Per Column Centimetre—$9.24
  Bulk Notices—$172.70 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

ALTERATION TO PUBLISHING TIME
(AUSTRALIA DAY 2001)

Because of the Australia Day public holiday on 26th January the
normal Friday edition of the Government Gazette will be published a
day early on Thursday 25th January 2001.

Copy for the Thursday 25th January edition must be received at
State Law Publisher by 12 noon on Tuesday 23rd January.

Any copy received after this time will be held over for the next gazette
on Tuesday 30th January 2001.

Copy for the Tuesday 30th January edition must be received at
State Law Publisher by 12 noon Thursday 25th January



16 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 333

—  PART  1  —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA101*

METROPOLITAN WATER SUPPLY, SEWERAGE, AND DRAINAGE
ACT 1909

PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
John Sanderson,

Governor.
[L.S.]

} By His Excellency Lieutenant General John Murray
Sanderson, Companion of the Order of Australia,
Governor of the State of Western Australia.

I, the Governor, acting under section 13 of the Metropolitan Water Supply, Sewerage,
and Drainage Act 1909 and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council,
constitute a catchment area to be known as the Stirling Dam Catchment Area and
define the boundaries of that catchment area to be those —

(a) outlined $$  $$  $$  $$  $$ on plan 13350-01 held by the Water and Rivers
Commission at its office at 3 Plain Street, East Perth; and

(b) defined by straight lines connecting the Australian Map Grid coordinates
(Australian Geodetic Datum 1984) for zone 50 specified on the annexure to
the plan and extending along those coordinates in a clockwise direction from
the first coordinate back to that coordinate,

and represented for information purposes in the plan in Schedule 1.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 9 January 2001.

By Command of the Governor,

KIM HAMES, Minister for Water Resources.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !



334 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 January 2001

Schedule 1 — Stirling Dam Catchment Area

394 000 mE394 000 mE

6 
35

9 
60

0 
m

N

447 760 mE

6 
32

6 
00

0 
m

N

S
ca

le

1
0

0
0

1
0

0
0

2
0

0
0

S
ca

le
 =

 1
:7

0,
00

0

6 
32

6 
00

0 
m

N
A

us
tr

al
ia

n 
G

eo
de

tic
 d

at
um

 Z
on

e 
50

6 
35

9 
60

0 
m

N

447 760 mE

0
3

0
0

0
m

B
O

U
N

D
A

R
Y

 O
F

 P
R

O
P

O
S

E
D

 S
T

IR
LI

N
G

 D
A

M
 C

A
T

C
H

M
E

N
T

 A
R

E
A

28
25

13
0

57
63

12
6

13
1

13
5 1

42
R

A
IL

16
6

27
86

5
2

28
25

2
50

082
23

14

25

14

14

28
25

14

10
45 C

LO
S

E
D

10
45

14

28
25

14
13

6 1
41

15
4

C
LO

S
E

D
13

0
12

7
64

67
70

26

13
7 1

40
11

39
12

9
12

8
15

5

23
99

13
81

39
14

5

32
48

15
0

72

4

13
2

13
6

71

1
30

6

11
39

74
73

75
87

76

47
27

78
88

77

13
3

2

79
80

13
5

82
81

27

83
84

13
4

0
1

86
85

30
33

47
28

R
A

IL

64
8

64
8 10

2

16
6

51
7

43
9

C
LO

S
E

D
14

2
66

7
32

08
54

7

2
69

2
10

1

51
7

47
30

14
1

51
54

14
0

32
08

14

36
99

13
99

32
07

47
29

28
6

13
9

13
8

1

31
25

31
25

32
07

57
3

57
3

0

13
2

61
1

14
5

67
0

R
O

A
D

47
31

14
6

R
O

A
D

C
LO

S
E

D

15

41
56

25
03

41
67

0 0

18
1

47
31

13
3

43
18

2

41
56

13
4

61
5

0

19
4

27
29

47
31

42
14

4

1

13
5

13
2013

20

14
7

71
7

73

14
3

13
6

15

32
01

18
0

42

13
7

14
2

68

13
8

19
3

14
8

18
3

14
1

17
9

13
9

67

R
O

A
D

20
8

71
7

15

14
0

19
2

14
9

37
4

40
99

7
18

4
15

0
41

15
1

69

17
8

15
3

R
O

A
D

38
15

2

99
7

17
7

2
66

19
1

26
72

68
15

4
35

18
5

34
15

5
35

17
6

71
6 71

6
71

6
47

53

15

4
15

6
31

24
7

30

17
5

25
30

57
33

24
6

2
15

7

70

1

19
0

12
0

55
3

1
18

6

65

23
17

4
34

15
9

26

C
R

O
W

N

15
8

18
17

3
0

37
40

14
D

R
A

IN
35

16
0

27
16

1
18

7
1

7
41

47
53

12
75

55
4

2

31
20

13
38

8
17

2
9

16
3

18
9

10
19

8
36

40
16

2
39

28
8

22
0

17
8

12
17

1
15

1
15

0

31
62

16
4

26
8

12
1

16
5

21
9

5
12

0
64

91
17

0
15

3
90

1

15
2

16
6

12
3

0

12
2

65
18

8

37
2

93
1

90
16

9
15

5
92

15
4

23
0

12
5

26
5

25
7

23
0

12
4

15
28

22
60

9
25

4
25

21
95

16
8

15
7

94
15

6
67

12
7

0
26

9
2

10
12

6
40

94
97

16
7

0
15

9
96

15
8

8
52

80
69

11

12
9

68
12

8
99

21

4

42
16

1
98

1
16

0

27
527

6
71

20
50

68
25

0
13

1
70

13
0

45
10

1
44

10
0

6
23

16
2

73
0

22
13

3
72

13
2

47
10

3
46

10
2

25
16

4
75

24
13

5
74

8
13

4
0

49

5

10
5

48
10

4
27

16
6

77
26

50
68

25
0

27
5

76
13

7
7

0
51

13
6

8

0

10
7

50

6

7
10

6
29

16
8

28
79

13
9

78
9

13
8

8
53

10
9

52
10

8
11

59

17
0

10 31
81

30
14

1
80

2
1

7

14
0

55
10

11
1

54
11

0
33

1A
3

83
14

3
82

22
7

25
1

14
2

57
28

2
12

11
3

56
11

2
85

14
5

84
0

3
59

11
5

28
3

58
11

4
28

4
87

14
7

86
28

5
C

R
O

W
N

61
11

7
26

6
60

C
R

O
W

N
11

6
1 D
R

A
IN

89
14

9
88

14
8

2
63

14
8 11

9
62

96
22

5
11

8
D

R
A

IN
C

LO
S

E
D

11
2

93
12

3

24

2

2
11

3
10

94
11

6
1

11
4

4

2

8
26

1
24

9
23

1
23

2
1

24
1

23
6

12
0

12
7

12
6

12
5

12
4

12
3

12
2

12
1

37
9

11
3

22
2

26
0

25
6

10
2

91
21

5
6

25
3

23
2

1
92

22
1

75
10

1
74

3
52

5
88

25
9

0
53

27
2

71
71

76
4

27
1

30
D

R
A

IN

78
1

22
6

27
0

21
6

7

25
8

22
1

D
R

A
IN

0
0

83
79

30
82

2
81

4
0

21
7

80
54

6
10

0

32

32

11

1

33

20
7

56
31

20
19

38
21

18
0

1
2

36
22

17

13
14

15
16

12
11

10
35

15

0

83
6

10

41

5

0

72
73

74
75

82

5
6

7
1

2
3

44

42
0

48
47

R
O

A
D

43
1

37
2

4 3

44

51

36

0

0
44

72

C
LO

S
E

D

35

5

1

44
72

8

4

54
70

15

35
40

13

57
80

35
40

4

C
R

O
W

N

8
30

62

6
5

50
14

3 1

R
O

A
D

1

2

3

1
35

41

51
0

43
66

28
25

0

27
59

57

59

1

27
59

1

58

39
34

55

51
08

55
2

39
33

5
27

58
43

60

60

39
33

36
66

0

56
56

8

10
5

6

4

27
60

43
37

35
85

0

4

28
25

1

39
05

10
4

42
47

0
11

9
27

57

R
O

A
D

1
10

4

27
56

13

12
67

66
30

58
1

1

67

27
20

27
20

13

2
2

10

20
4

C
LO

S
E

D

61
9

12
16

92
3

R
A

IL

46
8

D
R

A
IN

26
0

15
36

3
42

3

20
3

93
0

14
80

4

35
4

R
O

A
D

13

80
4

62
1

14

80
4

12
35

3

1

14

20
3

85
5

12
54

35
1

1
5

D
R

A
IN

1
51

4

65
7

19
3

12 1
3

15
96

15
96

C
LO

S
E

D

2
11

70

15
96

15
96

D
R

A
IN

19
4

26
4 C
LO

S
E

D
20

3
14

1
2

20
3

92
1

38
7

41
0

39
0

20
3

13
87

38
7

20
3 19

14
14

5
14

6

13
44

42
0

62
6

10
31

14
27

9
48

9
19

50

20
3

49
2

42
38

12
08

27
9

16

12

13
1

84
6

84
6

33
2

16
33

43

15
14

15
27 14

84
6

15
57

60

42
01

15
42

2
42

2
1

94
5

R
O

A
D

21
43

24
63

19
31

1
2

26
06

1
52

8
17

3
44

89

33
1

85
3

20

26
97

90
7

42
01

1

30
3

44
92

T
R

A
M

11
89

62
61

65
92

42
01

R
O

A
D

19
00

13
73

5
93

66
63

64

12
1

51
56

94
95

67
68

22
81

52
07

2
1

70
96

97

2
29

9
D

R
A

IN
29

81
94

93
1

76
77

99
98

28
1

1
75

80
5

29
10

0
10

1
51

56
C

R
O

W
N

13
51

74

26
82

95
0

11
14

29
41

16
21

30
08

10
3

10
2

18
90

97
98

73
31

2

D
R

A
IN

3
32

78
1

72
4

1

97

7

10
1

5
45

10
5

51
4

10
4

60
99

10
0

26
83

50
11

0

30
12

6

82
6

46
18

30
99

46
19

82
6

28
0 1

30
17

99
12

53
0

53
22

80
5

46
36

97
3

33
42

82
6

1
10

5
10

643
43

10
6

53
23

44
44

R
O

A
D

30
12

51
26

45
45

80
4

46
46

R
O

A
D

74
1

13
89

10
8

10
7

18
7

1
26

46

26
48

51
12

81
6

68
8

32
33

32
32

26
31

52
51

46
45

11
1

31
56

6

7
44

50
47

53

48
54

43
55

49

31
56

1

0

4
32

32

3

16
3

16
15

28
9

13 3

2

4

10

1
18

18
19

28
29

34
11

2

95
4

1

3

5
2

20
27

15
30

33

0

21
26

10
5

4
14

9

29
79

32
18

22
25

6
8

13
31

32
7

33
37

23
24

12

0

6

11
6

10
48

23
03

24
18

1
2

71
3

35

2

49
00

2
37

38

3
3

57
2

42
41

40
39

50
15

53
3

53
2

20
3

32
11

1
10

47
2

42
3

28
4

29
50

53

50
15

12
2

28
25

10

R
A

IL
71

3
7

4
1

28
25

1

32
10

32
30

13
27

8
11

14

12
5

97
21

18
15

52
5

52
5

66
8

35
93

23
13

24
00

24
00

14

24
00

36
34

51
90

51
90

14
30

42
89

22
25

28
90

12
6

50
00

92
91

11
1

11
1

11
2

11
6

11
7

11
8

35
32

29

23
14

11
0

53
0

11
5

11
3

1

50
00

93
96

14

2

12
0

11
9

27
7

11
4

95
94

10
9

36
39

42
8

12
1

12
2

28
8

16
6

14
12

9

C
LO

S
E

D

12
4

12
3

49
46

43
4

28
25

15
3

5
28

7
35

98
50

2
1

56
14

7
9

50
08

49
29

35
97 49

29
25

5
2

6
0

27
8

16
6

3
15

7
14

4
13

3
13

2
12

5
63

60
59

14
13

0
57

2
10

45
13

4 1
43

10
45

13
1

12
6

13
5 1

42
28

25
14

14

74
7

74
8

46
25

19
92

49
93

53
36

46
23

74
9

46
22

46
24

55
02

C
LO

S
E

D

46
22

46
2246

21

46
21

14
46

22

53
36

46
21

46
22

46
22

C
LO

S
E

D
14

15

55
03

53
36

15
C

R
O

W
N

54
43

13
23

3

0

36
88

15

27
61

27
62

41
77

27
64

27
63

25
77

36
83

21
75

21
76

21
75

27
55

27
55

14

70
9

70
2

35
3

1

11
74

58
20

58
20

92
9

1

15
97

14

62
7

C
R

O
W

N
65

71

64
8

63
2

1

78
91

63
2

11
2 11

2

C
R

O
W

N
C

R
O

W
N

23
3

2

13
86

0

13
86

0

23
4

90
4

R
O

A
D

12
69

12

R
O

A
D

2

13
17

13
17

12
61

10
W

A
T

E
R

21
7

35
25

54
59

85
77

87
89

C
LO

S
E

D
87

89

87
89

W
A

T
E

R
11

C
R

O
W

N
14

58
5

37
96

14
12

1

87
90

87
90

18
31

56
9

50
30

18
31

37
99

43
62

63
3

15
13

29
73

85
77 85

30

12
08

85
30

85
30

R
O

A
D

15
70

2

22
34

56
4

56
3

85
30

38
00

85
30

56
8

56
7

R
O

A
D 56

6
56

5

79
2

R
O

A
D

79
2

12
59

15
71

18
31

14
8

11
28

56
2

37
98

13
10

13
10

8

59
1

55
9

55
9

63
9

66
7

39
82

2
15

53
17

17

40
92

37
97

15
18

9

C
R

O
W

N

15
18

9
14

6

14

56
1

26
32

15
53

15
50

14

40
92

14
85

31

12
59

R
O

A
D

2
1

2
2

4

C
R

O
W

N

37
97

1

1

11

31
17

19
72

26
23

15
51

55
8

17
78

R
O

A
D

58
0

18
27

57
9

R
O

A
D

15
51

12

R
O

A
D

79
2

4

35
88

15
52

15
52

55
7

18
27

15
52

57
9

1

58
0

26
23

79
6

17
7

3
36

09

55
05

14

31
17

12
90

19
71

79
6

31
88

10
06

2

15
73

19
72

13
15

48
15

48
55

6

78
7

26
77

1
2

5
54

18

95
8

22
08

5
41

95
15

49
15

49
56

0

53
36

19
52

R
O

A
D

80
7

17
7

22
52

C
R

O
W

N
1

1
74

4

S
T

A
T

E
 F

O
R

E
S

T
15

S
T

A
T

E
 F

O
R

E
S

T
15

S
T

A
T

E
 F

O
R

E
S

T
15

S
T

A
T

E
 F

O
R

E
S

T
15

S
T

A
T

E
 F

O
R

E
S

T
 1

4

S
T

A
T

E
 F

O
R

E
S

T
 1

4

55
25

22
60

63
20

93
10

37

39
22

30
48

39
23

20
96

0
26

2

1

22
73

15
79

3
0

5
C

R
O

W
N

W
A

T
E

R
33

61
94

8

0

26
2

0
4

1
2

0

6

28
1

57

2
49

69
5

0

17
2

C
LO

S
E

D

19
6

4
22

25
14

5

0

C
LO

S
E

D

2

4

0

1

0

33
61

0

0

28

0

0

1

10 11
13

12

22
2

19
6

12

30
29

9

31

3

3
11

28

20
7

C
R

O
W

N
15

22

15
22

84
3

15
22

27
48

27
47

R
O

A
D

54
04

0
19

81
15

21
9 21

9
0

8

9

11
87

57
9

19
81

3

0

11

0

15

36
72

30
31

10
26

47

0
8

30
92

20

31
10

36
74

11
87

20
20

15

20
17

20
18

1

4
20

15
20

16

55
26

3

20
14

28
25

1

2 54
03

3
2

13

4
54

03

13

15

1

14 14
15

5

15

10
9

48
85

R
O

A
D

48
85

50
0

6
17

54
04

50
1

57
9



16 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 335

HEALTH

HE301*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment
Regulations (No. 3) 2000

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Services
Charges) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2000.

2. Schedule amended

Part I of the Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges)
Regulations 1984* is amended as follows:

(a) in item 1(c) by deleting “$28.10” and inserting
instead —

“    $29.10    ”;

(b) in item 1(d)(i) by deleting “$93.45” and inserting
instead —

“    $94.40    ”;

(c) in item 1(d)(ii) by deleting “$87.45” and inserting
instead —

“    $88.40    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 26 November 1999.
For amendments to 13 September 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 143 and Gazette
30 June 2000.]

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



336 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 January 2001

MINING

MN301*

Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961

Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Authorised
Explosives) Amendment Order 2000

Made by the Minister for Mines under section 14 of the Explosives and
Dangerous Goods Act 1961.

1. Citation

This order may be cited as the Explosives and Dangerous Goods
(Authorised Explosives) Amendment Order 2000.

2. Commencement

This order comes into operation on the day after the day on which
it is published in the Gazette.

3. The order varied

The amendments in this  order are to the Explosives and
Dangerous Goods (Authorised Explosives) Order 2000*.

[* Published in Gazette 17 October 2000, pp. 5771-87.]

4. Explosives declared to be authorised explosives

The explosives referred to in clause 5 are declared to be
authorised explosives for the purposes of the Explosives and
Dangerous Goods Act 1961.

5. Schedule 1 amended

(1) Classification 1.1D of Schedule 1 is varied by inserting, in the
appropriate alphabetical positions, the following items —

“

(0241) Energan Gold 2660Xi (ORICA)

(0082) Johnson Stope Charge (JHT Aust)

(0042) Megaprime and BST Cast Booster (Blast-Tech)

(0241) Sabre (DNAP)

(0241) Titan 6100 Emulsion-Gassed (DNAP)
    ”.



16 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 337

(2) Classification 1.3C of Schedule 1 is varied by inserting, in the
appropriate alphabetical positions, the following items —

“

(0161) Alliant Blue Dot (Wesfire)

(0161) Alliant Bulls Eye (Wesfire)

(0161) Alliant Green Dot (Wesfire)

(0161) Alliant Herco (Wesfire)

(0161) Alliant Red Dot (Wesfire)

(0161) Alliant Reloader Series (Rifle) (Wesfire)

(0161) Alliant Unique (Wesfire)

(0161) Alliant 2400 (Wesfire)

(0161) American Select (Wesfire)

(0161) AR2217 (ADI)

(0161) Steel (Wesfire)
    ”.

(3) Classification 1.4C of Schedule 1 is varied by inserting, in the
appropriate alphabetical positions, the following items —

“

(0276) RockStick 45/20 (Brandrill)

(0276) RockStick 45/40 (Brandrill)

(0276) RockStick 45/60 (Brandrill)
    ”.

(4) Classification 1.4S of Schedule 1 is varied by inserting, in the
appropriate alphabetical positions, the following items —

“

(0454) Fusehead Assemblies (RBS)

(0454) PCF Cartridge Igniter (RBS)

(0432) Quickdraw Propelling Charge (Brandrill)

(0323) RocKracker 38/40 Cartridge (RockTek)

(0323) RocKracker 38/60 Cartridge (RockTek)
    ”.

NORMAN MOORE, Minister for Mines.



338 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 January 2001

TRAINING

TB301*

Building and Construction Industry Training Fund and Levy Collection
Act 1990

Building and Construction Industry Training
Fund and Levy Collection Amendment

Regulations 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Building and Construction
Industry Training Fund and Levy Collection Amendment
Regulations 2001.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 February 2001 unless
they are published in the Gazette after that day, in which case
they come into operation on the day on which they are published
in the Gazette.

3. Regulation 6 amended

Regulation 6 of the Building and Construction Industry
Training Fund and Levy Collection Regulations 1991* is
amended as follows: 

(a) by inserting before “For” the subregulation designation
“(1)”;

(b) in paragraph (a) by inserting after “contract price” —

“    (including the GST)    ”;

(c) in paragraph (b) by inserting after “sum of the value” —

“    (including the GST)    ”;

(d) at the end of the regulation by inserting the following
subregulation —

“
(2) In this regulation —

“GST” has the same meaning as it has in the A New
Tax System (Goods and Services Tax) Act 1999 of
the Commonwealth.

    ”.
[* Reprinted 15 September 2000.]

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



16 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 339

TB302*

Building and Construction Industry Training Levy Act 1990

Building and Construction Industry Training
Levy Regulations 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Building and Construction
Industry Training Levy Regulations 2001.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 February 2001 unless
they are published in the Gazette after that day, in which case
they come into operation on the day on which they are published
in the Gazette.

3. Rate of levy

For the purposes of section 5 of the Act 0.182% is prescribed.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



340 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 January 2001

WATER

WA301*

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947

Cane River Water Reserve Order 2000

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

This order may be cited as the Cane River Water Reserve
Order 2000.

2. Former Cane River Water Reserve abolished

The Cane River Water Reserve —

(a) contained within the boundary outlined :Â:Â:Â:Â:Â: on
plan 3184-01 held by the Water and Rivers Commission
at its office at 3 Plain Street, East Perth; and

(b) constituted by Order in Council in Gazette
28 October 1994, p. 5559,

is abolished.

3. New Cane River Water Reserve constituted

The land contained within the boundary —

(a) outlined $$  $$  $$  $$  $$ on plan 3184-01 held by the Water
and Rivers Commission at its office at 3 Plain Street,
East Perth; and

(b) defined by straight lines connecting the Australian Map
Grid coordinates (Australian Geodetic Datum 1984) for
zone 50 specified on the annexure to the plan and
extending along those coordinates in a clockwise
direction from the first coordinate back to that
coordinate,

is constituted the Cane River Water Reserve.

4. Information plan of the Cane River Water Reserve

The former Cane River Water Reserve and the new Cane River
Water Reserve are represented for information purposes in the
plan in Schedule 1.



16 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 341

Schedule 1 — Cane River Water Reserve

[cl. 4]

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



342 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 January 2001

WA302*

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947

Harding Dam Catchment Area Order 2000

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

This order may be cited as the Harding Dam Catchment Area
Order 2000.

2. Former Harding Dam Water Reserve abolished

The Harding Dam Water Reserve —

(a) contained within the boundary outlined :Â:Â:Â:Â:Â: on
plan 3193-01 held by the Water and Rivers Commission
at its office at 3 Plain Street, East Perth; and

(b) constituted by Order in Council in Gazette
2 March 1984, p. 540,

is abolished.

3. New Harding Dam Catchment Area constituted

The land contained within the boundary —

(a) outlined $$  $$  $$  $$  $$ on plan 3193-01 held by the Water
and Rivers Commission at its office at 3 Plain Street,
East Perth; and

(b) defined by straight lines connecting the Australian Map
Grid coordinates (Australian Geodetic Datum 1984) for
zone 50 specified on the annexure to the plan and
extending along those coordinates in a clockwise
direction from the first coordinate back to that
coordinate,

is constituted the Harding Dam Catchment Area.

4. Information plan of the Harding Dam Catchment Area

The former Harding Dam Water Reserve and the new Harding
Dam Catchment Area are represented for information purposes
in the plan in Schedule 1.



16 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 343

Schedule 1 — Harding Dam Catchment Area

[cl. 4]

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



344 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 January 2001

WA303*

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947

Ledge Point Water Reserve Order 2000

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

This order may be cited as the Ledge Point Water Reserve
Order 2000.

2. Ledge Point Water Reserve constituted

The land contained within the boundary —

(a) outlined $$  $$  $$  $$  $$ on Plan 3149-01 held by the Water
and Rivers Commission at its office at 3 Plain Street,
East Perth; and

(b) defined by straight lines connecting the Australian Map
Grid coordinates (Australian Geodetic Datum 1984) for
zone 50 specified on the annexure to the plan and
extending along those coordinates in a clockwise
direction from the first coordinate back to that
coordinate,

is constituted the Ledge Point Water Reserve.

3. Information plan of the Ledge Point Water Reserve

The boundary of the Ledge Point Water Reserve as constituted
by this order is shown for information purposes in the plan in
Schedule 1.



16 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 345

Schedule 1 — Ledge Point Water Reserve

[cl. 3]

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 January 2001346

— PART 2 —

HEALTH

HE401
HEALTH ACT 1911

Health Department of WA,
Perth, 31 December 2000.

In accordance with the provisions of section 28 of the Health Act 1911, the appointment of the following
persons as Environmental Health Officers is approved—

Environmental Health Date Effective Local Government
Officer
Simon Di Rosso 3 January 2001-23 February 2001 City of Gosnells
Michelle Stewart 14 December 2000 City of Cockburn
Anthony Edward Turner 14 December 2000 City of Cockburn
Jennifer Roberts 13 December 2000 City of Mandurah
David Cook 27 December 2000 City of Swan
Peter Haas 12 February 2001 Shire of Moora
George Stark 3 November 2000-31 January 2001 Shire of Moora
Martin Osmond 22 December 2000 Shire of Plantagenet
Bryanna Park 8 January 2001 Shire of Broome

Dr PAUL PSAILA-SAVONA, Executive Director, Public Health.

HE402
MEDICAL ACT 1894

MEDICAL (UNMET AREA OF NEED) DETERMINATION (No. 10) 2000
Made by the Minister for Health pursuant to section 11AF of the Medical Act 1894.

Citation
1. This determination may be cited as the Medical (Unmet Area of Need) Determination (No. 10) 2000.

Commencement
2. This determination comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government
Gazette.

Unmet area of need
3. The area of need specified in the Schedule is determined to be an unmet area of need for the
purposes of section 11AF(1)D of the Act.

Expiry of determination
4. This determination expires one year after its commencement.

SCHEDULE—UNMET AREA OF NEED
• General medical services in the Shire of Plantagenet and the Shire of Cranbrook.

Dated this 5th day of December 2000.
JOHN DAY, Minister for Health.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG401
DOG ACT 1976
Shire of Leonora

AUTHORISED OFFICERS
Notice is hereby given that Michael Hall and Ashley Keith have been appointed as authorised officers
for the Shire of Leonora pursuant to the provisions of—

(i) Dog control in accordance with provisions of the Dog Act 1976, Regulations and Amendments
and the Local Laws Relating to Dogs.

J. G. EPIS, Chief Executive Officer.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 34716 January 2001

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF MURRAY

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 4—AMENDMENT No. 144
Ref: 853/6/16/7 Pt 144
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the Shire of Murray Town Planning
Scheme Amendment on 9 January 2001 for the purpose of—

1. Amending Special Provision 2. of Schedule 4-22 Coral Park Estate, to include Aged or Dependent
Persons Dwelling from an (“X”) Use to (“AA”) Use as follows—

(A) (B)
Specified Land Special Provisions Relating to (A)

Coral Park Estate  2. (a) The following uses are permitted (“P”)—
comprising Lots 34 and 35
Dewar Road, Lots 36 and – Single House
37 Lakes Road, Lots 38 to – Outbuilding
43 and 45 to 48 Jennie Place; – Public Utility
Lots 33 and 44 Beau
Sovereign Court; portion of (b) The following uses may be permitted at the
Cockburn Sound Loc 16 and discretion of Council (“AA”)—
Lot 122 Beau Sovereign
Court, Lakes Road and – Home Occupation
Atkins Road; and Lot 8 – Stables
Lakes Road, North Dandalup – Aged or Dependent Persons Dwelling

(c) All other uses are not permitted (“X”),  including
Ancillary Accommodation, Veterinary Clinic and
Rural Pursuit.

2. Introducing a definition for Aged and Dependent Persons Dwelling within Appendix 1—
Interpretations as follows—
Aged or Dependent Persons Dwelling—means a dwelling used for the accommodation of a
person who is aged 55 years or over or for a person with a recognised form of handicap requiring
special accommodation provisions for independent living or special care.

3. Deleting Clause 6.4.6.

N. H. NANCARROW, President.
N. LEACH, Chief Executive Officer.

PD402*
METROPOLITAN REGION TOWN PLANNING SCHEME ACT

DECLARATION OF PLANNING CONTROL AREA No. 46
LOT 53, DALGETY ROAD, RED HILL (BUSH FOREVER SITE NO. 42)

CITY OF SWAN

General Description
The Hon Minister for Planning has granted approval to the declaration of a Planning Control Area
over land at Lot 53, Dalgety Road, Red Hill (Bush Forever Site No. 42) as shown on Western Australian
Planning Commission Plan No. 3.1390.

Purpose of The Planning Control Area
The purpose of the Planning Control Area is to protect land identified in Bush Forever for its considerable
conservation value. Regionally, the vegetation is classified as the Forrestfield Complex, which is
inadequately represented for conservation on the Swan Coastal Plain. The critically endangered floristic
community type on this site is listed for national protection. The Commission considers that the Planning
Control Area is required to ensure that no further development occurs on this land which might prejudice
this purpose until it may be reserved for the purpose of Parks and Recreation in the Metropolitan
Region Scheme.

Duration And Effects
The declaration remains in effect for a period of five years from the date of publication of this notice in
the Government Gazette or until revoked by the Western Australian Planning Commission with approval
by the Minister, whichever is the sooner.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 January 2001348

A person shall not commence and carry out development in a Planning Control Area without the prior
approval of the Western Australian Planning Commission.  The penalty for failure to comply with this
requirement is $2,000 and, in the case of a continuing offence, a further fine of $200 for each day
during which the offence continues.
Compensation is payable in respect of land injuriously affected by this declaration, and land so affected
may be acquired by the Western Australian Planning Commission in the same circumstances and in
the same manner as if the land had been reserved in the Metropolitan Region Scheme for a public
purpose.

Where the Planning Control Area is Available for Public Inspection
• Ministry for Planning • Municipal office of the City of Swan

1st floor, 469 Wellington Street Midland Square
PERTH  WA Cnr Morrison Road and Great Northern Hwy

MIDLAND  WA
• JS Battye Library

Alexander Library Building
NORTHBRIDGE  WA

TIM HILLYARD, A/Secretary,Western Australian
Planning Commission.

WATER

WA401*
WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984

WATER SUPPLY IMPROVEMENTS:  WEST BOWGADA (SHIRES OF MORAWA,
THREE SPRINGS AND PERENJORI)

Notice of Proposal to Construct a Pump Station and Water Pipelines

To provide water supply to the West Bowgada farming district, the Water Corporation proposes to
construct the following works—

• 60km of underground water pipeline including valves, meters and service connections
• One booster pump station complete with pumps motors and associated pipework, valves and

electrical equipment, located 10km west of Billeranga.
The works also include upgrade of the existing Perenjori Booster Pump Station and redevelopment of
an Arrowsmith production bore.
The proposed works are scheduled to commence in March 2001 and will continue for a duration of
approximately 10 months.
A copy of the Notice of Proposal (referred to as FV24-0-1) is available at the Water Corporation’s
Midwest Regional Office, 45 Cathedral Avenue, Geraldton 6530, during office hours.
Further information may also be obtained by contacting the Project Manager, Mr Mike Greenlees
telephone (08) 9923 4947.
Objections to the proposed works will be considered if lodged in writing, addressed to the Project
Manager, Mr Mike Greenlees, Water Corporation, PO Box 43, Geraldton 6531 before the close of business
on the 31st of January 2001.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 34916 January 2001

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

Notice to Creditors and Claimants of Joan Margaret Ellis, late of 41 Forrest Street, Beverley, Western
Australia, Home Duties deceased.
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 11 October 2000, are required by the Trustees ANZ
Executors & Trustee Company Limited (ACN 006 132 332) of Level 9, Allendale Square, 77 St George’s
Terrace, Perth WA 6000 to send particulars of their claim to him by 1 February 2001 after which the
Trustee may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims he then has notice.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

MINES SAFETY AND INSPECTION
ACT 1994

 Price: $17.65 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 350 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

SURVEILLANCE DEVICES ACT 1998

 Price: $7.65 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 110 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

PAWNBROKERS AND SECONDHAND
DEALERS ACT 1994

 Price: $10.85 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 160 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 January 2001350

�������������

Order your Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

2001
An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes

of Government Gazette

For further information please contact:
State Law Publisher
Telephone: 9321 7688

For Government Departments and private firms who
presently arrange binding for their copies of
Government Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is
now offering a subscription covering 4 Quarterly
Volumes at a cost of $983.40.

The Gazettes will be bound in black cloth with gold foil
lettering on the spine and personalised by  the addition
of the client's name in gold lettering on the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE

On the rare occasion where extra gazettes are published
in one quarter, a fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost involved will be borne by the
State Law Publisher and not passed on to clients.


