
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

613

PERTH, TUESDAY, 30 JANUARY 2001  No. 23
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994—Fines, Penalties
and Infringement Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations 2001...................... 617-8

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—Hospitals (Service Charges) Amendment
Regulations 2001............................................................................................................. 616-7

Motor Vehicle Drivers Instructors Act 1963—Motor Vehicle Drivers Instructors
Amendment Regulations 2001 ....................................................................................... 618-20

Proclamations—
  Acts Amendment (Fines Enforcement and Licence Suspension) Act 2000.................. 615
  Medical Amendment Act 2000 ....................................................................................... 616
  Road Traffic Amendment Act 2000................................................................................ 615
Road Traffic Act 1974—
  Road Traffic (Blood Sampling and Analysis) Amendment Regulations 2001.............. 622-5
  Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2001 ...................... 620-2
  Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2001 .................................. 628
  Road Traffic (Urine Sampling and Analysis) Amendment Regulations 2001 ............. 625-7

———

PART 2

Health ................................................................................................................................. 629
Local Government .............................................................................................................. 629-30
Planning.............................................................................................................................. 630-1
Police................................................................................................................................... 631
Public Notices ..................................................................................................................... 632-3
Racing, Gaming and Liquor............................................................................................... 631-2



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher. Inquiries should be directed to the Manager Sales & Editorial, State Law Publisher, 10
William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances (changes to this arrangement will be advertised beforehand on the inside cover).

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.

The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy should be received by the Manager (Sales and Editorial), State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2000 (Prices include GST).

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$19.91

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$46.53

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$46.53 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices
  Per Column Centimetre—$9.24
  Bulk Notices—$172.70 per page

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.

• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they
fall on a Tuesday or Friday.

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



30 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 615

—  PART  1  —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA101*

ROAD TRAFFIC AMENDMENT ACT 2000
39 of 2000

PROCLAMATION
WESTERN AUSTRALIA

John Sanderson,
Governor.

[L.S.]

} By His Excellency Lieutenant General John Murray
Sanderson, Companion of the Order of Australia,
Governor of the State of Western Australia.

I, the Governor, acting under section 2 of the Road Traffic Amendment Act 2000, and
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council —

(a) fix the day on which this proclamation is published in the Government
Gazette as the day on which sections 3, 17(1), 34 to 37, 47(3) and 67 of that
Act come into operation;

(b) fix 5 February 2001 as the day on which sections 18, 23, 24, 27, 29 and 48 of
that Act and Schedule 1 to that Act, except clauses 3 and 5, come into
operation.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 23 January 2001.
By Command of the Governor,

MURRAY CRIDDLE, Minister for Transport.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !

AA201*

ACTS AMENDMENT (FINES ENFORCEMENT AND
LICENCE SUSPENSION) ACT 2000

51 of 2000
PROCLAMATION

WESTERN AUSTRALIA
John Sanderson,

Governor.
[L.S.]

} By His Excellency Lieutenant General John Murray
Sanderson, Companion of the Order of Australia,
Governor of the State of Western Australia.

I, the Governor, acting under section 2 of the Acts Amendment (Fines Enforcement
and Licence Suspension) Act 2000, and with the advice and consent of the Executive
Council, fix 5 February 2001 as the day on which that Act comes into operation.
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 23 January on 2001.
By Command of the Governor,

PETER FOSS, Attorney General.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN  !

Note for Information:
The commencement of the Acts Amendment (Fines Enforcement and Licence
Suspension) Act 2000, as fixed by the above proclamation, also brings into operation
the following subsidiary legislation as published in the Gazette—

y the Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Amendment
Regulations 2001

y the Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2001



616 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001

AA301*

MEDICAL AMENDMENT ACT 2000
48 of 2000

PROCLAMATION
WESTERN AUSTRALIA

John Sanderson,
Governor.

[L.S.]

} By His Excellency Lieutenant General John Murray
Sanderson, Companion of the Order of Australia,
Governor of the State of Western Australia.

I, the Governor, acting under section 2(2) of the Medical Amendment Act 2000, and
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix the day after the day on
which this proclamation is published in the Government Gazette as the day on which
sections 5 to 10 of that Act come into operation.
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 23 January 2001.
By Command of the Governor,

JOHN DAY, Minister for Health.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN!

HEALTH

HE301*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Service Charges) Amendment
Regulations 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Service
Charges) Amendment Regulations 2001.

2. Schedule amended

Part III of the Schedule to the Hospitals (Services Charges)
Regulations 1984* is amended as follows:

(a) in item 2(a)(ii) by deleting “$3.30” and inserting
instead —

“    $3.50    ”;

(b) in item 2(b)(ii) by deleting “$3.30” and inserting
instead —

“    $3.50    ”;

(c) in item 2(c)(i) by deleting “$3.30” and inserting
instead —

“    $3.50    ”.



30 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 617

[* Reprinted 26 November 1999.
For amendments to 9 January 2001 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 143, and Gazette
30 June 2000.]

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

JUSTICE

JM301*

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices
Enforcement Amendment

Regulations 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Fines, Penalties and
Infringement Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations 2001.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on the day on which the
Acts Amendment (Fines Enforcement and Licence Suspension)
Act 2000 comes into operation.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Fines, Penalties
and Infringement Notices Enforcement Regulations 1994*.

[* Reprinted 6 August 1999.
For amendments to 28 December 2000 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 82, and Gazette
25 August 2000.]

4. Regulation 3A inserted

After regulation 3 the following regulation is inserted —

“
3A. Form of request (s. 27A)

A request under section 27A(1) must be made in a form
approved by the CEO.

    ”.



618 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001

5. Regulation 6BA inserted

After regulation 6B the following regulation is inserted —

“

6BA. Form of request (s. 55A)

A request under section 55A(1) must be made in a form
approved by the CEO.

”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

TRANSPORT

TR301*

Motor Vehicle Drivers Instructors Act 1963

Motor Vehicle Drivers Instructors Amendment
Regulations 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicle Drivers
Instructors Amendment Regulations 2001.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 5 February 2001.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Motor Vehicle
Drivers Instructors Regulations 1964*.

[* Reprinted as at 2 July 1999.
For amendments to 12 January 2001 see Gazette
17 May 2000.]

4. Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3 is amended by deleting “the schedule to these
regulations.” and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 1.    ”.



30 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 619

5. Regulation 4 amended

Regulation 4 is amended by deleting “the schedule to these
regulations.” and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 1.    ”.

6. Regulation 12 amended

Regulation 12(1) is amended by deleting “The Licensing and
Services Division of the Western Australia Police Department”
and inserting instead —

“    A body listed in Schedule 2    ”.

7. Regulation 13 amended

Regulation 13 is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting the item beginning “Examination by The
National Safety Council of Western Australia
Incorporated or other prescribed body” and inserting
instead —

“
Test by the Director General under
section 7(3) of the Act ............………………. 42.15

    ”.
(b) by deleting the item beginning “Entering into a training

course with The National Safety Council of Western
Australia Incorporated or other prescribed body”.

8. Regulation 13A amended

Regulation 13A(1)(a) is amended by deleting “The National
Safety Council of Western Australia Incorporated or any other
body prescribed for the purpose of section 7(4) of the Act” and
inserting instead —

“    a body listed in Schedule 2    ”.

9. Schedule amended

The Schedule is amended by deleting the heading and inserting
instead —

“
Schedule 1 — Forms

[rr. 3 and 4]
    ”.

10. Schedule 2 inserted

After Schedule 1 the following Schedule is inserted —

“
Schedule 2 — Prescribed bodies

[rr. 12(1), 13A(1)(a)]

1. Driver Training and Education Centre Pty Ltd trading as
Driver Training and Education Centre



620 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001

2. Road Transport Industry Training Committee Western
Australia Inc

3. Institute of Driver Development Pty Ltd

4. Industries Services Training Pty Ltd

5. Midland College of TAFE, established under the Vocational
Education and Training Act 1996

6. Arkery Pty Ltd trading as Skill Driving School

7. Marlies Hobbs and Jenny Duke trading as Achieved by
Driving Together

8. Driving Improvement Consultancy (Tas) Pty. Ltd.

9. Crossrange Holdings Pty Ltd trading as Nationwide
Transport Training

10. ETAS (WA) Pty Ltd

11. Shawsett Training Pty Ltd

12. Transport Training Centre (SA) Incorporated

13. Chiholm College of TAFE (NSW), established under the
Technical and Further Education Commission Act 1990 of
New South Wales

14. Wodonga College of TAFE (Vic), established under the
Vocational Education and Training Act 1990 of Victoria

15. Transport Industries Skills Centre Incorporated (ACT)
    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

TR302*

Road Traffic Act 1974

Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) Amendment
Regulations (No. 3) 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Drivers’
Licences) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2001.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 5 February 2001.



30 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 621

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Road Traffic
(Drivers’ Licences) Regulations 1975*.

[* Reprinted as at 18 February 2000.
For amendments to 12 January 2001 see Gazette 17 May,
8 September and 1 December 2000.]

4. Regulation 4E inserted

After regulation 4 the following regulation is inserted —

“
4E. Requirements prescribed under section 42(2)(c)

(1) Except as provided in subregulation (3), an applicant is
required under section 42(2)(c) to —

(a) record at least 25 hours of driving under
subregulation (2); and

(b) after recording that driving, and being at least
17 years of age, satisfy the Director General, by
a test approved by the Director General, that the
applicant has an ability to recognise hazards on
roads.

(2) Driving is to be recorded under this subregulation in a
logbook in a form approved by the Director General
and can only be recorded if —

(a) before the driving was performed the applicant
had satisfied the Director General that the
applicant had an ability to control the class of
motor vehicle and had reached the age of
16 years and 6 months; and

(b) the driving was supervised by the holder of a
licence issued under the Motor Vehicle Drivers
Instructors Act 1963 or a person prescribed in
regulation 12C.

(3) This regulation does not apply to an applicant who had
reached the age of 16 years on 4 February 2001.

”.

5. Regulation 12C inserted

After regulation 12 the following regulation is inserted —

“
12C. Driving instructors prescribed under

section 48C(1)(b)

(1) A person is prescribed under section 48C(1)(b) of the
Act if —

(a) the person is an instructor in a youth driver
education course conducted or supervised by a
body authorised by the Director General for
that purpose; or



622 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001

(b) the person has held a driver’s licence
appropriate to the class of vehicle specified in
the relevant learner’s permit —

(i) in the case of a moped, for at least
2 years; or

(ii) in any other case, for at least 4 years.

(2) If the learner’s permit is issued to someone who has an
incapacity of the kind referred to in section 44(1)(a) of
the Act, subregulation (1)(b) does not apply to a person
unless the person is approved by the Director General.

”.

6. Regulation 13 amended

Regulation 13(2)(a) is amended by deleting “one year” and
inserting instead —

“    2 years    ”.

7. Transitional

Regulation 4E of the Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences)
Regulations 1975 does not apply to a person who holds a
learner’s permit issued before the day on which these
regulations come into operation.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

TR303*

Road Traffic Act 1974

Road Traffic (Blood Sampling and Analysis)
Amendment Regulations 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Blood
Sampling and Analysis) Amendment Regulations 2001.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Road Traffic
(Blood Sampling and Analysis) Regulations 1975*.



30 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 623

[* Reprinted as at 12 December 1985.
For amendments to 5 January 2001 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 257.]

3. Regulation 2 amended

Regulation 2 is amended by deleting the definitions of
“regulation” and “the Act” and inserting after the definition of
“subject” the following definition —

“
“technologist” means —

(a) a person registered as an analyst under
section 203 of the Health Act 1911; or

(b) a person approved, or belonging to a class of
persons approved, by the Minister to prepare
sampling equipment.

    ”.

4. Regulation 4 amended

Regulation 4 is amended by deleting “the Health Department of
Western Australia” and inserting instead —

“    a body approved by the Minister    ”.

5. Regulation 5 replaced

Regulation 5 is repealed and the following regulation is inserted
instead —

“
5. Sampling equipment

The sampling equipment shall comprise —

(a) a sterile syringe of a type approved by the
Minister;

(b) 2 sterile containers of a type approved by the
Minister for storing blood samples, each
numbered with the serial number of the
package mentioned in regulation 6(b) and
containing approximately 25 mg of potassium
oxalate and approximately 10 mg of sodium
fluoride; and

(c) 2 non-alcoholic swabs of cotton wool or
2 hospital approved non-alcoholic medical
wipes.

    ”.

6. Regulation 6 amended

Regulation 6 is amended by deleting “the Health Department”
and inserting instead —

“    a body approved by the Minister    ”.



624 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001

7. Regulation 7 amended

Regulation 7(2) is amended as follows:
(a) in paragraph (c) by deleting “the mercury bichloride

solution and cottonwool” and inserting instead —

“
a non-alcoholic swab of cotton wool or a
hospital approved non-alcoholic medical wipe

    ”;
(b) in paragraph (e) by deleting “bottles” in both places

where it occurs and inserting instead —
“    containers    ”;

(c) in paragraph (f) by deleting “cap on each bottle” and
inserting instead —
“    cover of each container    ”;

(d) in paragraph (g) by deleting “bottle” and inserting
instead —
“    container    ”.

8. Regulation 8 amended

Regulation 8(2) is amended by deleting “bottles” and inserting
instead —
“    containers    ”.

9. Regulation 11 amended

(1) Regulation 11(1) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$64” and inserting
instead —
“    $120    ”;

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$51” and inserting
instead —
“    $100    ”.

(2) Regulation 11(2) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$55” and inserting
instead —
“    $100    ”;

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$240” and inserting
instead —
“    $450    ”.

(3) Regulation 11(2a) is amended by deleting “$240” and inserting
instead —
“    $450    ”.

10. Schedule amended

(1) The Schedule is amended in Form A by deleting “Laboratory
Services, Health Department, Perth, in the State of Western
Australia,” and inserting instead —

“    ........................................................................................ ,    ”.



30 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 625

(2) The Schedule is amended in Form B by deleting “bottle” and
inserting instead —

“    container    ”.

(3) The Schedule is amended in Form C by deleting “bottle” and
inserting instead —

“    container    ”.

(4) The Schedule is amended in Form D by deleting “or Medical
Registrar,” and inserting instead —

“    , Medical Registrar or Registered Nurse,    ”.

11. Various references to “registered nurse” inserted

(1) In each place listed in the Table to this subregulation, after
“medical practitioner” the following is inserted —

“    or registered nurse    ”.

Table

r. 7(1) r. 11(1)
r. 7(2) r. 12
r. 8(1) Form B of the Schedule
r. 8(2) Form D of the Schedule

(2) In Form B of the Schedule, after “Medical Practitioner” in both
places where it occurs, the following is inserted —

“    or Registered Nurse    ”.

(3) In Form B of the Schedule, after “Doctor” the following is
inserted —

“    or registered nurse    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

TR304*

Road Traffic Act 1974

Road Traffic (Urine Sampling and Analysis)
Amendment Regulations 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Urine
Sampling and Analysis) Amendment Regulations 2001.



626 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these  regulations are to the Road Traffic
(Urine Sampling and Analysis) Regulations 1983*.

[* Published in Gazette 25 February 1983, pp. 651-3.
For amendments to 5 January 2001 see 1999 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, pp. 262-3.]

3. Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3 is amended by deleting the definitions of
“regulation” and “the Act” and inserting after the definition of
“subject” the following definition —

“
“technologist” means —

(a) a person registered as an analyst under
section 203 of the Health Act 1911; or

(b) a person approved, or belonging to a class of
persons approved, by the Minister to prepare
sampling equipment.

    ”.

4. Regulation 5 amended

Regulation 5 is amended by deleting “the Health Department of
the Public Service of the State” and inserting instead —

“    a body approved by the Minister    ”.

5. Regulation 6 amended

Regulation 6(b) is amended by deleting “jars” and inserting
instead —

“    containers    ”.

6. Regulation 7 amended

Regulation 7 is amended by deleting “the Health Department of
the Public Service of the State” and inserting instead —

“    a body approved by the Minister    ”.

7. Regulation 8 amended

Regulation 8(2) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (d) by deleting “jars” and inserting
instead —
“    containers    ”;

(b) in paragraph (e) by deleting “jar” and inserting
instead —
“    container    ”.

8. Regulation 9 amended

Regulation 9(2) is amended by deleting “jars” and inserting
instead —

“    containers    ”.



30 January 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 627

9. Regulation 10 amended

(1) Regulation 10(1) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$64” and inserting
instead —

“    $120    ”;

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$51” and inserting
instead —

“    $100    ”.

(2) Regulation 10(3) is amended by deleting “$240” and inserting
instead —

“    $450    ”.

(3) Regulation 10(6) is amended by deleting “$240” and inserting
instead —

“    $450    ”.

10. Schedule amended

(1) The Schedule is amended in Form 1 by deleting “Laboratory
Services Health Department,” and inserting instead —

“     ................................................................................... ,    ”.

(2) The Schedule is amended in Form 2 by deleting “jar” and
inserting instead —

“    container    ”.

11. Various references to “registered nurse” inserted

(1) In each place listed in the Table to this regulation, after
“medical practitioner” the following is inserted —

“    or registered nurse    ”.

Table

r. 8(1) r. 9(2)
r. 8(2) r. 10(1)
r. 9(1)(a) Form 2 of the Schedule

(2) In Form 2 of the Schedule, after “Medical Practitioner” in both
places where it occurs, the following is inserted —

“    or Registered Nurse    ”.

(3) In Form 2 of the Schedule, after “Medical practitioner” the
following is inserted —

“    or registered nurse    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



628 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001

TR305*

Road Traffic Act 1974

Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Licensing)
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2001.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 5 February 2001.

3. Regulations 3D and 3E inserted

After regulation 3C of the Road Traffic (Licensing)
Regulations 1975* the following regulations are inserted
into Part II —

“
3D. Minimum age of applicant for issue of a licence

(1) Except as provided in subregulation (2), the minimum
age at which an individual may apply for the issue of a
vehicle licence is 16 years.

(2) The minimum age at which an individual may apply for
the issue of a vehicle licence for a heavy vehicle is
18 years.

3E. Proof of age and identity of applicant for issue of a
licence

An application for the issue of a vehicle licence is to be
accompanied by such proof of the applicant’s age and
identity as the Director General may require.

    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 11 February 2000.
For amendments to 12 January 2001 see Gazette
18 February, 17 May and 8 September 2000.]

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 62930 January 2001

— PART 2 —

HEALTH

HE401
MEDICAL ACT 1894

MEDICAL (REMOTE AND RURAL WA) DETERMINATION (NO. 1) 2001
Made by the Minister for Health pursuant to section 11AG of the Medical Act 1894.

Citation
1. This determination may be cited as the Medical (Remote and Rural WA) Determination (No. 1) 2001.

Commencement
2. This determination comes into operation on the day on which section 8 of the Medical Amendment
Act 2000 commences.

Remote and rural WA
3. The parts of the State specified in the Schedule are determined to be remote and rural WA for the
purposes of section 11AG of the Act.

SCHEDULE—REMOTE AND RURAL WA
• Shire of Beverley
• Shire of Broome
• Shire of Bruce Rock
• Shire of Carnarvon
• Shire of Collie
• Shire of Coolgardie
• Shire of Corrigin
• Shire of Dalwallinu
• Shire of Dandaragan
• Shire of Denmark
• Shire of Derby-West Kimberley
• Shire of East Pilbara
• City of Geraldton
• Shire of Greenough
• Shire of Halls Creek
• Shire of Harvey
• City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder
• Shire of Katanning
• Shire of Lake Grace
• Shire of Leonora
• Shire of Manjimup
• Shire of Merredin
• Shire of Pingelly
• Town of Port Hedland
• Shire of Quairading
• Shire of Three Springs
• Shire of Wagin
• Shire of Wyndham-East Kimberley
• Shire of York

Dated this 23 day of January 2001.

JOHN DAY, Minister for Health.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG401
SHIRE OF GINGIN

Appointment of Authorised Officer
It is hereby notified for public information that Alan Neil Snow has been appointed as an authorised
officer pursuant to the following Acts and has been authorised to enforce the following Acts, Regulations
and Local Laws—

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960
Local Government Act 1995



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001630

Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995
Control of Vehicles (Off-Road Areas) Act 1978 and Regulations
Dog Act 1976 and Regulations
Bush Fires Act 1954 and Regulations
The Litter Act 1979
All of Council’s By-laws

S. D. FRASER, Chief Executive Officer.

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF BAYSWATER (CITY OF STIRLING)

DISTRICT PLANNING SCHEME No. 2—AMENDMENT No. 2
DISTRICT TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 2, LOCALITIES OF MAYLANDS AND PART

MOUNT LAWLEY AS ADMINISTERED BY THE CITY OF BAYSWATER UNDER GOVERNOR’S
ORDERS DATED 26 JUNE 1998

Ref: 853/2/14/28 Pt 2
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of Bayswater
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 23 January 2001 for the purpose of—

1. Amending the Scheme Map by rezoning Lot 573, No. 87 Guildford Road, Mount Lawley, from
Medium Density Residential R50 to Special Use—Medium Density Residential R50, Office
and Consulting Rooms.

2. Adding the following text to Schedule 2 (Special Use Zones) of the Scheme—
Location Particulars of Land Permitted Use
Guildford Road Portion of Swan Residential R50
Mount Lawley Location Y and being Lot Offices

573 on Plan 2168 Consulting Rooms

J. D’ORAZIO, Mayor.
M. J. CAROSELLA, Chief Executive Officer.

PD402*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF COCKBURN

DISTRICT ZONING SCHEME No. 2—AMENDMENT No. 211
Ref: 853/2/23/19 Pt 211
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning approved the City of Cockburn
Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 4 January 2001 for the purpose of—

1. Rezoning JAA Lots 210, Pt 211, Pt 212 and Pt 214 Lyon Road and JAA Pt 209 Beenyup Road
from Rural to Development zone in accordance with the Scheme Amendment Map.

2. Adding to the Ninth Schedule Development Area No 10—Atwell South (DA10) including the
following provisions—

NINTH SCHEDULE
DEVELOPMENT AREAS

Ref no. Area Provisions

DA10 Atwell 1. An adopted Structure Plan together with all adopted amendments shall
South apply to the land in order to guide subdivision and development.

2. The provisions of the Scheme shall apply to the land use areas created
under the Structure Plan.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 63130 January 2001

Ref no. Area Provisions

3. The local government may adopt Design Guidelines for any development
precincts as defined on the Structure Plan.  All development in such
precincts is to be in accordance with the adopted guidelines in addition
to any other requirements of the Scheme, and where there is any
inconsistency between the design guidelines and the Scheme, the Scheme
shall prevail.

4. No subdivision or development of incompatible use will be supported
within the generic buffer area associated with the piggery on Pt Lot 15
Lyon Road until the use of the land ceases or the buffer area is
scientifically determined and approved by the Department of
Environmental Protection.  Buffer areas are to be shown on the Structure
Plan.

5. Development of Shops (retail uses) within the Development Area shall
be a maximum of 2700m2 NLA for the Village Centre and 200m2 NLA
for the Local Centre.

6. The Structure Plan for Pt 212 is to include a strong pedestrian connection
between the proposed Success Railway Station and the Village Centre,
in addition to Gibbs Road.

7. The Structure Plan shall retain the existing remnant vegetation in the
Reserve of Beenyup Road unless the local government agrees in
particular circumstances that some of the vegetation may be removed.

3. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.
J. DONALDSON, Chairman of Commissioners.

R. W. BROWN, Chief Executive Officer.

POLICE

PE501

POLICE ACT 1892

POLICE AUCTION

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892, Unclaimed found and stolen property and bicycles will be
sold by public auction at Smith Broughton & Sons, 1 Clayton Street, Midland on Saturday 3rd February
2001 at 10.00am.

The Auction is to be conducted by Mr Gary Silcock.

B. MATTHEWS, Commissioner of Police,
West Australian Police Service.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA401
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988

SUMMARY OF LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and required
to be advertised.  Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about the objection
process, should contact the Liquor Licensing Division, 1st Floor, Hyatt Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace,
Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry organisation.

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE
8129 Baden Pty Ltd & Kingsridge Application for the grant of a Special 21/2/2001

Pty Ltd Facility licence in respect of premises
situated in Bunbury and known as
(To be advised)



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001632

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE—continued
8133 Cartin Holdings Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Restaurant 18/2/2001

licence in respect of premises situated in
East Perth and known as Antico Caffe

8138 Linda Jane Males & Rajko Application for the grant of a Producer— 26/2/2001
Boehlke Wine licence in respect of premises

situated in Bindoon and known as Halina
Brook Estate

8139 Legends Of The Lodge Pty Application for the grant of a Producer— 25/2/2001
Ltd Wine licence in respect of premises

situated in Yallingup and known as Cape
Lodge

8141 Broadwater Hospitality Pty Application for the grant of a Special 25/2/2001
Ltd Facility licence in respect of premises

situated in Kalgoorlie and known as
(To be advised)

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988.

HUGH HIGHMAN, Director of Liquor Licensing.

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ101
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their claims
to me on or before the 28th February 2001, after which date I may convey or distribute the assets,
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice.
Armstrong, Hilda Edith Susannah, Late of 114 Watkins Street, White Gum Valley, died 8/1/2001

(DEC331148DS2)
Ball, Ethel Emily Mary Ann, Late of Craigwood Green, 29 Gardiner Street, Como, formerly of Unit

11/5 Merope Close, Rockingham, died 5/1/2001 (DEC331122DS3)
Burge, Ann Isabella, Late of Craigeville Gardens, 1 French Road, Melville, formerly of 197 Stock Road,

Palmyra, died 13/12/2000 (DEC331071DS4)
Cobby, Amy Alice Ellen, Late of Ray Village Nursing Home, Vasse died 17/12/2000 (DEC331126DP2)
Cockman, James Wesley, Late of 4 Wilkie Avenue, Yanchep, died 18/12/2000 (DEC331089DL3)
Curtis, Patrick John, Late of 8 Pelican Place, Dunsborough, died 20/10/2000 (DEC330418DD1)
D’Souza, Stanilaus Emanuel, Late of Marist Lodge, 12 Lapage Street, Belmont, died 6/1/2001

(DEC331127DC4)
Dyer, William Archibald, Late of Kalgoorlie Nursing Home, Dugan Street, Kalgoorlie, formerly of

35 Whitlock Street, Kalgoorlie, died 21/11/2000 (DEC331038DS4)
Jovanovich, Mary Margaret, Late of Illawong Hostel, 1 Rodd Place, Hamilton Hill, died 26/12/2000

(DEC331161DC4)
Kearsley, Hilda, Late of Sarah Hardy Nursing Home, 54 Monmouth Street, Mount Lawley, died

7/12/2000 (DEC331037DL4)
Lanza, Gloria June, Late of 3 Feathertop Rise, Alexander Heights, died 31/12/2000 (DEC331137DG2)
Maplethorpe, George Henry, Late of 4 James Street, Swan View, died 4/8/2000 (DEC328846DG3)
McDougall, Mary Alice, Late of 49 Argus Street, Narrogin, Formerly of 41 Argus Street, Narrogin, died

26/10/2000 (DEC331176DS3)
Morris, Kathleen Patricia, Late of Alfred Carson Lodge, 30 Bay Road, Claremont, died 10/1/2001

(DEC331227DC4)
Parker, Norman Victor, Late of 15 Knowles Street, Harvey, died 4/12/2000 (DEC331130DC2)
Passeri, Biagio, Late of Brightwater, 2 Walter Road, Inglewood, died 16/4/2000 (DEC327908DA2)
Pratley, William John, Late of Craigmont Waters Nursing Home, 3rd Avenue, Maylands, died 3/1/2001

(DEC331076DG2)



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 63330 January 2001

Shea, Francisco Ferrer, Late of 12 Foss Street, Palmyra, died 17/11/2000 (DEC331065DP2)
Thomson, Nessie McDonald, Late of Amaroo Retirement Village, 25 Wreford Court, Gosnells, died

7/1/2001 (DEC331183DC2)
Tomkins, Percy Reeves, Late of 2 Devling Place, Morley, died 15/12/2000 (DEC331150DA3)
Woo, Sylvia Christina Pearl, Late of Kalgoorlie Nursing Home, Dugan Street, Kalgoorlie, died

21/12/2000 (DEC331113DP3)

ANTONINA ROSE McLAREN, Public Trustee,
Public Trust Office,

565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000.
Telephone 9222 6777.

ZZ201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

The estate of ANTHONY JOHN CROCI,
late of 13 Chesson Street, Dianella

Creditors and other persons having claims in respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on
5 October 2000, are required by the executor, Mary Bridget Croci, of 13 Chesson Street, Dianella, to
send particulars of their claims to them by the 1st day of March 2001, after which date the executors
intend to convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the claims of which they then have
notice.

Reprinted Statutes/Regulations
Individual Acts and Regulations are from time to time reprinted under the

Reprints Act 1984 incorporating all amendments up to a particular date.
This program is managed by Parliamentary Counsel's Office, Ministry of

Justice.
A standing order for either Acts or Regulations may be placed

with State Law Publisher for all Reprints that become available.
Invoices are despatched with the goods to enable clients to check the

contents prior to returning with payment.

If a customer wishes to be placed
on either or both mailing lists,
send written notification to:

Manager,  Sales & Editorial
State Law Publisher
10 William Street, Perth 6000

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

GAS PIPELINES ACCESS (W.A.) ACT 1998

 Price: $24.90 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 535 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001634

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

INDUSTRY AND TECHNOLOGY
DEVELOPMENT ACT 1998

 Price: $6.05 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 70 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

BIRTHS, DEATHS AND MARRIAGES
REGISTRATION ACT 1998

 Price: $7.65 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 102 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

RAIL SAFETY ACT 1998

 Price: $9.25 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 123 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES
AUTHORITY OF W.A. ACT 1998

 Price: $6.05 Counter Sales
Plus Postage on 72 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 63530 January 2001

Order your Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

2001
An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes

of Government Gazette

For further information please contact:
State Law Publisher
Telephone: 9321 7688

For Government Departments and private firms who
presently arrange binding for their copies of
Government Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is
now offering a subscription covering 4 Quarterly
Volumes at a cost of $983.40.

The Gazettes will be bound in black cloth with gold foil
lettering on the spine and personalised by  the addition
of the client's name in gold lettering on the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE

On the rare occasion where extra gazettes are published
in one quarter, a fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost involved will be borne by the
State Law Publisher and not passed on to clients.



GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 January 2001636

�������������

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2001
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2001. Subject to certain
limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. The prices
quoted include postage by surface mail unless stated otherwise.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, unless
disrupted by public holidays or unforseen
circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.

All Gazettes  $
Within WA ....................................... 728.20
Interstate ......................................... 754.60
Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,031.00

Bound Volumes of full year 983.40

Electronic Gazette Online
(includes all Gazettes from Jan 1998)
Existing hard copy subscriber ........... 168.30
Electronic Subscription only .............. 561.00

2000 Gazettes on CD ROM ................. 673.20
1999 Gazettes on CD ROM ................. 673.20
1998 Gazettes on CD ROM ................. 673.20

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

$
Within WA ....................................... 292.60
Interstate ......................................... 348.70
Overseas (airmail) .......................... 443.00

1999 Gazettes on CD ROM ................. 291.50
1998 Gazettes on CD ROM ................. 291.50

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly
during parliamentary sessions.

$
Within WA ....................................... 466.40
Interstate ......................................... 576.40
Overseas (airmail) .......................... 568.00

Bound Volumes of Hansard
Within WA ...................................... 563.20
Interstate ........................................ 599.50

1999 Hansards on CD ROM.............. 561.00

STATUTES
Bound Statutes
Bound volumes are posted during March of
the following year.

$
Within WA ...................................... 250.80
Interstate ........................................ 277.20
Overseas ......................................... 257.00
Half Calf Bound Statutes .............. 689.70

1999 Bound Volumes on CD ROM....249.70
1998 Bound Volumes on CD ROM....249.70

Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become
available

$
Within WA ..................................... 268.40
Interstate ....................................... 277.20
Overseas (airmail) ........................ 361.00

Sessional Bills
Bills are posted weekly as they become
available

$
Within WA ..................................... 369.60
Interstate ...................................... 386.10
Overseas (airmail) ........................ 525.00

Electronic Statutes Online
Includes all Acts, Regulations, Bills, Acts by
year, Index to Statutes, Hansard, etc

$
1st user ................................................ 660
Between 2 and 10 users (each) ......... 330
More than 10 users (each) ................ 165

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is
searchable. Other CD ROM products with
legislation or other statutory information
can be packaged to individual requirements.
Prices are available on request.


