
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

3023

PERTH, FRIDAY, 22 JUNE 2001  No. 115
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992—Rates and Charges (Rebates
and Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2001........................................................... 3025-6

———

PART 2

Agriculture.......................................................................................................................... 3027
Education............................................................................................................................ 3027
Fisheries ............................................................................................................................. 3027-8
Heritage Council................................................................................................................. 3028-9
Insurance Commission....................................................................................................... 3029
Justice ................................................................................................................................. 3029-30
Local Government .............................................................................................................. 3030-1
Mining................................................................................................................................. 3031-5
Planning.............................................................................................................................. 3035-7
Premier and Cabinet .......................................................................................................... 3037
Public Notices—Deceased Estates..................................................................................... 3039-40
Public Sector Management ................................................................................................ 3038
Racing, Gaming and Liquor............................................................................................... 3038
Transport ............................................................................................................................ 3039



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010.
• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to

observe this request could result in the notice being held over.
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2000 (Prices include GST).
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$19.91
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$46.53
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$46.53 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).
All other Notices
  Per Column Centimetre—$9.24
  Bulk Notices—$172.70 per page
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

NEW

  
ADVERTISING  RATES

EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2001 (Prices include GST)
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$20.55
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per

notice)—$48.00
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$48.00 (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made
for pricing the notice at time of lodging).
All other Notices
    Per Column Centimetre—$9.55
    Bulk Notices—$178.20 per page
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.



22 June 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3025

—  PART  1  —

STATE REVENUE

SX301*

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments)
Amendment Regulations 2001

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Rates and Charges
(Rebates and Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2001.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2001.

3. Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3 of the Rates and Charges (Rebates and
Deferments) Regulations 1992* is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a), by deleting “30 June 1999 but not after
30 June 2000” and inserting instead —

“    30 June 2000 but not after 30 June 2001    ”;

(b) in paragraph (a)(i), by deleting “$60.90” and inserting
instead —

“    $62.15    ”;

(c) in paragraph (a)(ii), by deleting “$98.55” and inserting
instead —

“    $100.55    ”;

(d) in paragraph (a)(iii), by deleting “$11.65” and inserting
instead —

“    $11.90    ”;

(e) in paragraph (b), by deleting “30 June 2000 but not after
30 June 2001” and inserting instead —

“    30 June 2001 but not after 30 June 2002    ”;

(f) in paragraph (b)(i), by deleting “$62.15” and inserting
instead —

“    $64.35    ”;



3026 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2001

(g) in paragraph (b)(ii), by deleting “$100.55” and inserting
instead —

“    $104.10    ”;

(h) in paragraph (b)(iii), by deleting “$11.90” and inserting
instead —

“    $12.30    ”.

[* Reprinted as at 2 February 2001.]

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



22 June 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3027

—  PART  2  —

AGRICULTURE

AG401
EXOTIC DISEASES OF ANIMALS ACT 1993

Exotic Diseases of Animals Importation Restriction Order 2001
Number 2—Extension number 4

Made by the Minister under Section 25.
The Importation Restriction Order Number 2 published on page 1235 of the Special Government
Gazette on 28 February 2001 and effective until 26 June 2001 is extended for 30 days until 26 July
2001.

KIM CHANCE, MLC, Minister for Agriculture;
Forestry and Fisheries.

EDUCATION

ED401
CURTIN UNIVERSITY OF TECHNOLOGY ACT 1966
MURESK BOARD OF MANAGEMENT APPOINTMENT

It is hereby notified for general information that I have, in accordance with Section 21C of the Curtin
University of Technology Act 1966, approved the appointment of Mr Ray Wilson and Mrs Ellen Cox as
members of the Muresk Board of Management for terms of office expiring on 5 September 2002 and
19 October 2001.

ALAN CARPENTER, Minister for Education.

FISHERIES

FI401*
PEARLING ACT 1990

Section 23(8)
NOTICE OF GRANT OF A PEARL OYSTER
FARM LEASE—CATAMARAN BAY A, B, C

FD 31/00
I, Peter Rogers, the Executive Director of the Fisheries Department of Western Australia, pursuant to
section 23 of the Pearling Act 1990 (“the Pearling Act”) have granted an application by BR & LM
Brown to vary an existing pearl oyster farm lease for the balance of the current lease term, in respect
of an area of water located in the vicinity of Catamaran Bay, King Sound.
Under section 33(1) of the Pearling Act a person aggrieved by my decision may, within 14 days after
publication of this notice in the Gazette appeal against this decision by serving on the Minister for
Fisheries a statement in writing of the grounds of that appeal.
The statement of the grounds of appeal may be served on the Minister care of the following address—

The Executive Director, Fisheries Department
Third Floor, SGIO Atrium
168-170 St Georges Terrace
PERTH WA 6000

Dated this 15th day of June 2001.

P. P. ROGERS, Executive Director, Fisheries Department.



3028 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2001

FI402*
PEARLING ACT 1990

Section 23(8)
NOTICE OF GRANT OF A PEARL OYSTER

FARM LEASE—LOWENDAL ISLANDS
FD 1914/00
I, Peter Rogers, the Executive Director of the Fisheries Department of Western Australia, pursuant to
section 23 of the Pearling Act 1990 (“the Pearling Act”) have granted an application by Cossack Pearls
Pty Ltd (ACN 009 212 015) for a pearl oyster farm lease for a three year term, in respect of an area of
water totalling 0.67 square nautical miles, located in the vicinity of the Lowendal Islands.
Under section 33(1) of the Pearling Act a person aggrieved by my decision may, within 14 days after
publication of this notice in the Gazette appeal against this decision by serving on the Minister for
Fisheries a statement in writing of the grounds of that appeal.
The statement of the grounds of appeal may be served on the Minister care of the following address—

The Executive Director, Fisheries Department
Third Floor, SGIO Atrium
168-170 St Georges Terrace
PERTH WA 6000

Dated this 15th day of June 2001.
P. P. ROGERS, Executive Director, Fisheries Department.

FI403*
PEARLING ACT 1990

Section 23(8)
NOTICE OF GRANT OF A PEARL OYSTER
FARM LEASE—MACKENZIE ANCHORAGE

FD 1462/99
I, Peter Rogers, the Executive Director of the Fisheries Department of Western Australia, pursuant to
section 23 of the Pearling Act 1990 (“the Pearling Act”) have granted a pearl oyster farm lease to
Dampier Pearling Company Pty Ltd (ACN 061 740 145) for a term of four (4) years, in respect of an
area of water 2.92 square nautical miles located in the vicinity of Mackenzie Anchorage, Napier
Broome Bay.
Under section 33(1) of the Pearling Act a person aggrieved by my decision may, within 14 days after
publication of this notice in the Gazette appeal against this decision by serving on the Minister for
Fisheries a statement in writing of the grounds of that appeal.
The statement of the grounds of appeal may be served on the Minister care of the following address—

The Executive Director, Fisheries Department
Third Floor, SGIO Atrium
168-170 St Georges Terrace
PERTH WA 6000

Dated this 20th day of June 2001.
P. P. ROGERS, Executive Director, Fisheries Department.

HERITAGE COUNCIL

HR401*
HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990

NOTICE OF ENTRY OF PLACES IN THE REGISER OF HERITAGE PLACES
Notice is hereby given in accordance with Section 51(2) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, the places described in Schedule 1 have
been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect from today.

Schedule 1
Description of Place

Azelia Ley Homestead at 34 Davilak Road, Hamilton Hill: Portion of Lot 9 on P 3727 sheet 2, being
part of the land comprised in C/T V 1224 F 230  as is defined in HCWA survey dwg No. 533 prepared
by Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd.



22 June 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3029

Schedule 1—continued
Description of Place—continued

Barracks Arch at St George’s Terrace/Malcolm & Elder Street, Perth: Perth Lot 870, being CR
36692 & being the whole of the land comprised in CLR V 3062 F 801.
British Arms Hotel (fmr) at 22 Outridge Terrace, Kalgoorlie: Kalgoorlie Lot 4905, being CR 41628
& being the whole of the land comprised in CLR V 3100 F 811.
Commissariat Buildings (fmr) at Cliff Street & Croke Lane, Fremantle: Fremantle Lot 14, being
CR 29859 & being the whole of the land comprised in CLR V 3037 F 292.
Hale School (fmr) at cnr Parliament Place & Havelock Street, West Perth: Perth Lot 822, being CR
26741 & being the whole of the land comprised in CLR V 3014 F 970.
State Battery, Coolgardie at Battery Road, Coolgardie: Ngalbain Location 67, being CR 9435 &
being the whole of the land comprised in CLR V 3081 F 367.
22 June 2001.

IAN BAXTER, Director, Office of the Heritage Council.

INSURANCE COMMISSION

IA401
MOTOR VEHICLE (THIRD PARTY INSURANCE) ACT 1943

In accordance with the requirements of section 3C and 3D of the Motor Vehicle (Third Party
Insurance) Act 1943, I give notice that the following amounts will apply for the purposes of those
sections with effect on and from 1 July 2001.

Amount A $232,000.00
Amount B $11,500.00
Amount C $35,000.00
Amount D $5,000.00

JUSTICE

JM401
CHILDREN’S COURT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1988

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of the following persons as Members of the Children’s Court of Western
Australia—

Mrs Lynette Jean Whittington of 100 Lennon Street, Wiluna
Mr Raymond John Lambly of Unit C, 1487 Trenton Street, Wiluna
Mr Peter Graham Flavel of 187 Scotia Street, Wiluna
Mr Philip Robert Greves Wall of 2 Salmond Court, Carnarvon
Mr David Gower Hall of 52 Stoke Hughes Street, Exmouth
Mr Peter Robert Webster of Hepburn Street, Mt Magnet.

GARY THOMPSON, Executive Director, Court Services.

JM402
JUSTICES ACT 1902

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of—

Mrs Katrina Joy Montague of 28 Bungaree Road, Wilson
Mr Gavin David Briggs of 82 Hampton Road, Fremantle
Mr Raymond John Lambly of Unit C, 1487 Trenton Street, Wiluna



3030 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2001

Mrs Lynette Jean Whittington of 100 Lennon Street, Wiluna
Mr Milton John Evans of 17 Yokanup Road, Flinders Park, Albany

to the office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia.

GARY THOMPSON, Executive Director, Court Services.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG401
DOG ACT 1976

Shire of Tambellup
DOG REGISTRATION OFFICER

It is hereby notified for public information that the following Officers have been appointed by Council
as Authorised Dog Registration Officers under the Dog Act 1976, effective immediately until further
notice—

Appointments—
Joanne Trezona
Vicki Webster
Erryn Hicks
Leonie Marsden
Jenny Cristinelli

Cancellations—
All previous appointments not listed above.

J. M. TREZONA, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402*
LITTER ACT 1979

APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS AND DEPUTIES
Department of Local Government,

Perth, July 2001.
DLG: 479–98
It is hereby notified for public information that the Minister for Local Government, acting pursuant to
the provisions of sections 9 and 10 and the first schedule of the Litter Act 1979, has been pleased to
appoint the following persons as members and deputies to the Keep Australia Beautiful Council (WA),
each for a period expiring on 31 December 2001.
1. Mr David MEDLEY as member representing the Soft Drink Manufacturers’ Association (WA) for

a period of six months expiring on 31 December 2001.
2. Mr Kevin GLANVILLE as deputy member representing the Soft Drink Manufacturers’

Association (WA) for a period of six months expiring on 31 December 2001.
3. Ms Judith SHIELDS as member representing the Brewing Industry for a period of six months

expiring on 31 December 2001.
4. Mr Garry LONGTON as deputy member representing the Brewing Industry for a period of six

months expiring on 31 December 2001.
5. Mr John McNAUGHT as member representing the Packaging Council of Australia (WA Divn) for

a period of six months expiring on 31 December 2001.
6. Mr Gavin WILLIAMS as deputy member representing the Packaging Council of Australia (WA

Divn) for a period of six months expiring on 31 December 2001.
7. Mr David CHENEY as member representing the Manufacturers of Cans for a period of six

months expiring on 31 December 2001.
8. Mr Mark FOGARTY as deputy member representing the Manufacturers of Cans for a period of

six months expiring on 31 December 2001.
9. Mr Michael RODDY as member representing the Manufacturers of Glass for a period of six

months expiring on 31 December 2001.



22 June 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3031

10. Mr William PRITCHARD as deputy member representing the Manufacturers of Glass for a period
of six months expiring on 31 December 2001.

11. Mr Glen BENNETT as member representing the Education Department for a period of six
months expiring on 31 December 2001.

12. Mr Alan ATKINSON as deputy member representing the Education Department for a period of
six months expiring on 31 December 2001.

13. Mr Ian COWIE as member representing the Department of Local Government for a period of six
months expiring on 31 December 2001.

14. Ms Virginia SCOTT as deputy member representing the Department of Local Government for a
period of six months expiring on 31 December 2001.

15. Ms Margaret BUCKLAND as member representing the Department of Conservation and Land
Management for a period of six months expiring on 31 December 2001.

16. Ms Kate HASSALL as deputy member representing the Department of Conservation and Land
Management for a period of six months expiring on 31 December 2001.

17. Mr Jeff ANDERTON as member representing the Conservation Council of Western Australia for
a period of six months expiring on 31 December 2001.

18. Mrs Valerie MOYLAN as member representing the interests of consumers for a period of six
months expiring on 31 December 2001.

19. Ms Genette KEATING as deputy member representing the interests of consumers for a period of
six months expiring on 31 December 2001.

20. Mr Trevor Charles WRIGHT as Chairman and member with knowledge or experience in litter
prevention and/or environmental matters for a period of six months expiring on 31 December
2001.

JOHN LYNCH, Executive Director,
Department of Local Government.

LG501*
HEALTH ACT 1911

NOTICE PURSUANT TO SECTION 137
To: Mr John Chatterton
Whereas you are the owner of a house as defined by the Health Act 1911 situated at Lot 229 of
107 Dugan Street, Kalgoorlie.
Take notice as follows—

Pursuant to Section 137 Division 1 of Part V of the Health Act 1911, the Council of the City of
Kalgoorlie-Boulder hereby requires you, being the owner of said dwelling house, within 14 days of
the date of service on you of this notice to take down and remove, the house and clear the land of
all materials, debris and other rubbish.
And further take notice that failing compliance with the requirements hereof, may result in
Council carrying out the work and recovering any costs from you.

Any person aggrieved by this Notice has the right of appeal, under section 36 of the Health Act 1911.
Dated this 5th day of June 2001.

B. A. HUNT, Principal Environmental Health Officer.

MINING

MN401*
Commonwealth of Australia

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967
Grant of Exploration Permits

Exploration Permit Nos. WA-308-P and WA-309-P were granted to Cultus Timor Sea Pty Ltd and
OMV Petroleum Pty Ltd on 12 June 2001.

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum Division.



3032 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2001

MN402
MINING ACT 1978

Department of Minerals and Energy,
Perth WA 6000.

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of Sections 96A(1) and 97(1) of the Mining Act 1978
that the undermentioned mining tenements are forfeited for breach of covenant viz; non payment of
rent.

CLIVE BROWN MLA, Minister for State Development.

Number Holder Mineral Field

Exploration Licences
09/963 Bellotti, Barry

Bellotti, Rod
Bellotti, Roy
Cashmore, Frank
Gillibrand, Kay
Schulda, Harry
White, Phil

Gascoyne

36/410 Adenia Investments Pty Ltd East Murchison
47/995 Goldfields Exploration Pty Ltd West Pilbara
47/996 Goldfields Exploration Pty Ltd West Pilbara
69/1451 Apec Power and Energy Pty Ltd Warburton
69/1452 Apec Power and Energy Pty Ltd Warburton
80/2457 Bella, Leone Della

Chilman, Geoffrey Robert
Schultz, Leslic Barric
Vroom Pty Ltd

Kimberley

Mining Lease
29/90 Lincoln Areas NL North Coolgardie

MN403
MINING ACT 1978

Department of Minerals and Energy,
Perth WA 6000.

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of Section 96A(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the
undermentioned Exploration Licence is forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply with the
prescribed expenditure conditions.

CLIVE BROWN MLA, Minister for State Development.

Number Holder Mineral Field
38/518 Mount Grace Resources NL Mt Margaret

MN404
MINING ACT 1978

Department of Minerals and Energy,
Perth WA 6000.

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of Section 97(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the
undermentioned mining lease is forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply with the
prescribed expenditure conditions/non payment of rent.

CLIVE BROWN MLA, Minister for State Development.

Number Holder Mineral Field
15/679 Pollock, George Leo Coolgardie



22 June 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3033

MN405
MINING ACT 1978

INSTRUMENT OF EXEMPTION
The Minister for State Development, pursuant to the powers conferred on him by section 19 of the
Mining Act 1978, hereby exempts the areas of land described in the schedule hereunder (not being
private land or land that is the subject of a mining tenement or an application therefor) from
Divisions 1 to 5 of Part IV of the Mining Act 1978.

SCHEDULE

AREA 1 (ZONE 50) (s19/157)
GDA GRID COORDINATES

AREA 2 (ZONE 50) (s19/158)
GDA GRID COORDINATES

Location: Mt Wittenoom
Yalgoo Mineral Field

Location: Mileura
Murchison Mineral Field

NORTHING (M) EASTING (M) NORTHING (M) EASTING (M)
7014706.986 439174.023 7091717.399 467642.618
7014859.344 508408.749 7091749.953 485635.516
6953187.475 508367.024 7100462.657 495647.642
6953188.178 498494.683 7100343.326 555786.557
6917708.090 498499.244 7078190.736 555690.836
6917378.696 412661.043 7078122.661 568723.205
6976319.798 412238.191 7033211.645 568481.173
6976479.694 439360.323 7033388.593 486895.088

7017347.035 486917.356
7017251.025 450516.983
7053506.510 450374.714
7053560.555 467738.821

Dated at Perth this 1st day of June 2001.

CLIVE BROWN MLA, Minister for State Development.

MN407
MINING ACT 1978

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO FORFEIT
Department of Minerals and Energy,

Perth WA 6000.
In accordance with Regulation 50(b) of the Mining Act 1978, notice is hereby given that unless the
rent due on the undermentioned licences and leases is paid on or before 17 July 2001 it is the
intention of the Hon. Minister for State Development under the provisions of Sections 96A(1) and
97(1) of the Mining Act 1978 to forfeit such for breach covenant, viz, non-payment of rent.

L. C. RANFORD, Director General.

Number Holder Mineral Field
Exploration Licences

04/1057 Banarana Pty Ltd West Kimberley
04/1101 Williams, Paul West Kimberley
04/1102 Williams, Paul West Kimberley
15/262 B2B. Net Technology Ltd Coolgardie
15/581 Opaltrend Nominees Pty Ltd Coolgardie
28/912 Gutnick Resources NL North East Coolgardie
28/1046 Gutnick Resources NL North East Coolgardie
28/1047 Gutnick Resources NL North East Coolgardie
28/1048 Gutnick Resources NL North East Coolgardie
28/1049 Gumick Resources NL North East Coolgardie
29/415 Gutnick Resources NL North East Coolgardie



3034 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2001

Number Holder Mineral Field
Exploration Licences—continued

29/440 Ganeff, Mary North Coolgardie
Royal Resources Pty Ltd

31/315 Heron Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/386 Cove Mining NL North Coolgardie
31/436 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/437 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/438 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/440 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/443 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/447 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/448 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/453 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/457 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/458 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/459 Quester Holdings Pty Ltd North Coolgardie
31/461 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/462 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/463 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/468 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/469 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/472 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
31/481 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
37/237 Dalrymple Resources NL Mt Margaret

Forrestania Gold NL
38/814 Bellzac Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
38/1116 Fargo Resources NL Mt Margaret
38/1117 Fargo Resources NL Mt Margaret
38/1128 Fargo Resources NL Mt Margaret
38/1198 Fargo Resources NL Mt Margaret
39/539 Great Southern Mines NL Mt Margaret
39/785 Desert Exploration Pty Ltd Mt Margaret
40/147 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
40/150 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
40/169 Gutnick Resources NL North Coolgardie
47/743 Phoenix Mining Ltd West Pilbara
52/1215 Flint, Warwick John Peak Hill
59/892 Australian Gold Resources Ltd Yalgoo
63/470 Honeybourne Investments Pty Ltd Dundas

Lionore Australia (Nickel) Ltd
63/546 Lionore Australia (Nickel) Ltd Dundas
69/1142 Sir Samuel Mines NL Warburton
69/1371 Millennium Minerals (Operations) Pty Warburton

Ltd
69/1372 Millennium Minerals (Operations) Pty Warburton

Ltd)
69/1423 Rio Tinto Exploration Pty Ltd Warburton
70/2178 Regaldove Pty Ltd South West
70/2197 Darcey, William Peter South West

Garreg Pty Ltd
70/2198 Darcey, William Peter South West

Garreg Pty Ltd
74/219 Homestake Gold of Australia Ltd Phillips River
74/220 Homestake Gold of Australia Ltd Phillips River
74/221 Homestake Gold of Australia Ltd Phillips River
74/222 Homestake Gold of Australia Ltd Phillips River
74/223 Homestake Gold of Australia Ltd Phillips River
77/566 Barranco Resources NL Yilgarn
77/707 Sons of Gwalia Ltd Yilgarn
80/2489 South Norseman NL Kimberley
80/2490 South Norseman NL Kimberley



22 June 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3035

Number Holder Mineral Field

Mining Leases
04/237 Stella Blast NL West Kimberley
08/27 Ramirez, Arnold James Ashburton
31/88 Gel Oil Pty Ltd North Coolgardie
31/284 Gel Oil Pty Ltd North Coolgardie
38/378 Delta Gold Ltd Mt Margaret
58/229 Nichols, Steven Jeremy Troup Murchison

Pemberton, Garry Rex
70/275 Hudson Resources Ltd South West
70/276 Hudson Resources Ltd South West
70/277 Hudson Resources Ltd South West

MN406
MINING ACT 1978

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE
Department of Minerals and Energy,

Mt Magnet, 13 June 2001.
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Act 1978, notice is hereby given that the licences
are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) for breach of covenant, viz. non-
payment of rent.

S. WILSON, Warden.

To be heard in the Warden’s Court, Mt Magnet on the 21st August 2001.

MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD
Day Dawn District

P21/608—Lowe, Leslie Edward

YALGOO MINERAL FIELD
P59/1499—Australian Gold Resources Ltd
P59/1500—Australian Gold Resources Ltd

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF ARMADALE

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 2—AMENDMENT No. 169
Ref: 853/2/22/4 Pt 169
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the City of Armadale Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 19 June 2001 for the purpose of—

1. Rezoning Lot 6 Carradine Road, Bedfordale from “Special Use No. 84 - Rural Residential and
Educational Establishment” to “Rural X”.

2. Modifying the Scheme Maps accordingly.

R. C. STUBBS, Mayor.
R. S. TAME, Chief Executive Officer.



3036 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2001

PD402*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF AUGUSTA-MARGARET RIVER

DISTRICT ZONING SCHEME No. 11—AMENDMENT No. 111
Ref: 853/6/3/8 Pt 111
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Augusta-Margaret River Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 19 June 2001 for the
purpose of—

1. Rezoning a portion of Lot 54 Waverly Road, Cowaramup from “Rural” to “Residential R15 and
R30” and “Local Reserves For Parks and Recreation”.

2 Amending the Scheme Text by adding to Schedule V the following special provisions—

SPECIFIED AREA OF LOCALITY
(B)

SPECIAL PROVISIONS TO REFER TO
(B)

Portion of Part Lot 54 Waverly Road,
Cowaramup as contained within
Certificate of Title Volume 2126 Folio 963.

1. Residential Zone:  Within this zone
(a) Subdivision shall be generally in

accordance with a Subdivision
Guide Plan endorsed by the Shire of
Augusta-Margaret River;

(b) Residential Development R15 and
R30 with development adhering to
the Residential Planning Codes;
and

(c) Specific building and development
guidelines applying to any singular
R30 lots at the time of subdivision
to the satisfaction of the Shire of
Augusta-Margaret River.

J. KELLY, Chairman of Commissioners.
M. T. EASTCOTT, Chief Executive Officer.

PD404*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF GOSNELLS

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 1—AMENDMENT No. 530
Ref: 853/2/25/1 Pt 530
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the City of Gosnells Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 19 June 2001 for the purpose of—

1. Rezoning Lot 1 Nicholson Road, Canning Vale, from “Rural” to “Commercial - Non Retail” as
depicted on the Scheme Amendment Map.

2. Amending the Scheme Text by inserting into the Eighth Schedule Restricted Use Permitted,
the following—

Street Particulars Restricted Use Permitted

Nicholson Road
corner Ranford
Road, Canning
Vale.

Lot 1 Nicholson Road
(corner Ranford
Road)

Council will permit in accordance with the
symbols set out in Zoning Table No. 3
cross referenced to the “Commercial Non-
Retail” zone all of the uses listed
excluding “Take-Away Food Outlets”.

3. Amending Clause 5 of Town Planning Scheme No. 1 “Definitions” to add a new definition
after that for “street verge” which reads as follows—

“take-away food outlet” means any land or buildings used for the preparation, sale and
serving of food to customers in a form ready to be eaten, without further preparation,
primarily off the premises.

P. M. MORRIS, Mayor.
S. HOLTBY, Chief Executive Officer.



22 June 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3037

PD403*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF AUGUSTA-MARGARET RIVER

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 11—AMENDMENT No. 113
Ref: 853/6/3/8 Pt 113
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Augusta-Margaret River Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 19 June 2001 for the
purpose of—

1. Rezoning Lot 2 and Lot 6 of Sussex Location 3715 Brockman Highway, Karridale, from
“Private Clubs and Institutions” zone to “Other Commercial” zone, as depicted on the Scheme
Amendment Map.

2. Amending Table 1—”Zoning, Site Requirements and Development Standards” in Town
Planning Scheme No. 11 by including the Use and Development class of “Single Dwelling” as
an “AA” (Discretionary) use within the “Other Commercial” zone.

J. KELLY, Chairman of Commissioners.
M. T. EASTCOTT, Chief Executive Officer.

PD405*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
SHIRE OF GINGIN

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 8—AMENDMENT No. 81
Ref: 853/3/8/10 Pt 81
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Gingin Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 19 June 2001 for the purpose of
introducing the following clause, (a component of the Model Scheme Text), into the Scheme—

6.8 Unauthorised Existing Developments
6.8.1 The Council may grant planning approval to a development already commenced or

carried out regardless of when it was commenced or carried out.
6.8.2 Development which was unlawfully commenced shall not be rendered lawful by the

occurrence of any subsequent event except the granting of planning approval and the
continuation of the development unlawfully commenced shall be deemed to always
have been lawful development upon the grant of planning approval.

G. MORTON, President.
S. D. FRASER, Chief Executive Officer.

PREMIER AND CABINET

PR401
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment in the place of the
Hon J. C. Kobelke BSc DipEd JP MLA in the period 7 to 22 July 2001 (both dates inclusive)—

Minister for Labour Relations; Consumer Affairs; Hon J. A. McGinty BA BJuris (Hons) LLB
Employment and Training JP MLA

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General,
Ministry of the Premier and Cabinet.



3038 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2001

PUBLIC SECTOR MANAGEMENT

PS401
PUBLIC SECTOR MANAGEMENT ACT 1994

EXEMPTION IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 25
In accordance with s.25(1)(a) of the Public Sector Management Act 1994, I exempt the Health
Department of Western Australia from the Recruitment, Selection and Appointment Standard, for the
filling of specified positions in the Jurien Bay Health Centre, to enable the absorption of current
employees in this location into the public sector.
The exemption applies to the schedule of persons provided to my Office and does not apply to any
other positions within the Health Department of Western Australia, or any other multi-purpose
service site or centre not specified in the schedule.
Dated 15 June 2001.

DON SAUNDERS, Commissioner for Public Sector Standards.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RA401
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988

SUMMARY OF LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and
required to be advertised.  Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about
the objection process, should contact the Liquor Licensing Division, 1st Floor, Hyatt Centre, 87
Adelaide Terrace, Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry
organisation.

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for

Objections

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE

8313 Kaye Phelps, John
Martello, TH and
Kerry Matek

Application for the grant of a Producer—Wine
licence in respect of premises situated in
Kununurra and known as Ord Valley Vines

11/7/01

8356 Blackwood Valley
Brewery Company
Pty Ltd

Application for the grant of a Special Facility
licence in respect of premises situated in
Bridgetown and known as The Cidery

18/7/01

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS

8442 Quelsen Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an extended
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in
respect of premises situated in Mount Lawley
and known as The Flying Scotsman

5/7/01

APPLICATIONS FOR APPROVAL TO ALTER/REDEFINE THE LICENSED PREMISES

126537 Western Sun
Nominees Pty Ltd

Application for approval to alter/redefine the
Hotel in respect of premises situated in Gingin
and known as Gingin Hotel

23/7/01

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988.

HUGH HIGHMAN, Director of Liquor Licensing.



22 June 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3039

TRANSPORT

TR401*
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982

CLOSURE OF NAVIGABLE WATERS
POPE’S NOSE CREEK

POINT SAMSON
Department of Transport,

Fremantle WA, 22 June 2001.
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 paragraph (d) of the Western Australian
Marine Act, the Department of Transport hereby closes the following waters to navigation by all craft
until further notice—

Shire of Roebourne—
All the waters of Pope’s Nose Creek [Point Samson] between a point commencing 100 metres
downstream of the Pope's Nose Bridge to a point 100 metres upstream.

GARY HODGE, Acting Director General of Transport.

TR402*
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982

SWIMMING PROHIBITED AREA
POPE’S NOSE CREEK

POINT SAMSON
Department of Transport,

Fremantle WA, 22 June 2001.
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 10A of the Navigable Waters Regulations, the
Department of Transport hereby closes the following waters to swimming until further notice—

Shire of Roebourne—
All the waters of Pope’s Nose Creek [Point Samson] between a point commencing 100 metres
downstream of the Pope's Nose Bridge to a point 100 metres upstream.

GARY HODGE, Acting Director General of Transport.

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

Notice to Creditors and Claimants
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their
claims to me on or before the 22nd July 2001, after which date I may convey or distribute the assets,
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice.
Bates, Jessie Margaret, late of Canning Lodge, Caprice Place, Willetton, died 18/5/01,

(DEC33313100DS4).
Campbell, Cecilia Kay, late of Yallambee Hostel, Fenton Street, Mundaring, died 4/4/01,

(DEC33293300DG4).
Coffin, Jack, late of 53 Kingsmill Street, Port Hedland, died 23/4/01, (DEC33281700DS4).
Dodd, Elsie Elvina, late of 294 Marmion Street, Cottesloe, died 4/6/01, (DEC33306300DP3).
Gath, Edna Olive, late of 16 Deerness Way, Armadale, died 16/5/01, (DEC33280000DL2).
Grist, Doreen May, late of 1 Cade Place, Greenwood, died 26/5/01, (DEC33302900DG2).
Hilton, Keith, late of Unit 5, I Block, Newman Drive, Newman, died 9/6/01, (DEC33318200DC3).
Hull, Margaret Elizabeth, late of 6A Matheson Road, Applecross, died 25/5/01, (DEC33314800DL4).
Hulme, Harry Charles James, late of Quadriplegic Centre, 10 Selby Street, Shenton Park, formerly of

58 Homer Street, Dianella, died 2/6/01, (DEC33305400DL3).



3040 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2001

Jackson, Jean Olive, late of 13 Bradley Court, Samson, died 8/3/01, (DEC33301600DP2).
Jakovich, Lymbomir Peter, late of 13 Indle Street, Willagee, died 6/6/01, (DEC33312100DA2).
Juncken, Nancy, late of Unit 11, Ocean Star Villas, Ocean Drive, Bunbury, died 6/5/01,

(DEC33300700DL2).
Martyr, Raymond John, late of St Francis Nursing Home, 163 Nealy Road, Hamilton Hill, died

12/4/01, (DEC33314200DC4).
McNally, Ivy Elizabeth, late of Mt St Camillus Nursing Home, 138 Lewis Road, Kalamunda, died

9/4/01, (DEC33253000DG4).
Mouat, Patricia Blodwen, late of Ningana Nursing Home, Allen Court, Bentley, died 3/6/01,

(DEC33311800DP2).
O’Brien, Terrace James Francis, late of 15 Crawford Street, Mandurah, died 5/5/01,

(DEC33317000DA3).
Payne, John Muggleston, late of Ritcher Lodge, 480 Guildford Road, Bayswater, died 5/5/01,

(DEC33287000DS4).
Preston, Harry Francis, late of Amaroo Nursing Home, 74 Lissiman Street, Gosnells, died 12/5/01,

(DEC33295700DP4).
Rayner, Jean Olive, late of Unit 4/36 Ewen Street, Scarborough, died 29/5/01, (DEC33315300DS2).
Rossiter, Beryl Louise, late of Churches of Christ Homes & Community Services, Unit 3/20 Plantation

Street, Mount Lawley, died 6/6/01, (DEC33311500DL4).
Rowland, Brian James, late of 50 Cobden Street, Bayswater, died 8/4/01, (DEC33303300DS4).
Scott, Jean Margaret, late of St Vincent’s Nursing Home, 224 Swan Street, Guildford, died 18/5/01,

(DEC33291900DC4).
Smith, Alan Michael, late of 2 Swanson Way, Secret Harbour, died 13/4/00, (DEC32841200DS4).
Stewart, Rosaline Isabella, late of Unit 4/54 Whatley Crescent, Mount Lawley, died 28/2/01,

(DEC33181100DS4).
Thomas, Alfred, late of Yulanya Residential Care Facility, Morgan Street, Port Hedland, died 27/4/01,

(DEC33307700DL4).
Tostevin, Marjorie Alice, late of Hollywood Village Nursing Home, 118 Monash Avenue, Nedlands,

formerly of 115 Lissadel Street, Floreat, died 21/5/01, (DEC33309800DS3).
Van Dyke, Hank, late of Kensington Park Nursing Home, 62 Gwenyfred Road, South Perth, died

18/4/01, (DEC33275700DG4).
Wallace, Mary, late of Unit 12/15 Cottrill Street, Myaree, died 13/5/01, (DEC33312900DC2).
Witten, Daisy Clara, late of 22 Swanview Terrace, South Perth, died 6/5/01, (DEC33304400DG3).

ANTONINA ROSE McLAREN, Public Trustee,
Public Trust Office, 565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000.

Telephone 9222 6777.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

YOUNG OFFENDERS ACT 1994
 *Price: $15.85 counter sales
Plus postage on 300 grams

YOUNG OFFENDERS REGULATIONS 1995
*Price $4.45 counter sales
Plus postage on 65 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.



22 June 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3041

PERTH OBSERVATORY

THE W.A. SPECIALISTS IN
ASTRONOMICAL

RESEARCH & EDUCATIONAL
ASTRONOMY

Public Tours (day and night)
Field Nights, Lectures

Astronomical Information

Astronomical Handbook
Sun rise & set; Moon rise & set

Legal advice
Chronometer calibration
Astronomical souvenirs

SERVING WESTERN AUSTRALIA SINCE 1896

WALNUT ROAD, BICKLEY 6076
TELEPHONE 9293 8255  FAX 9293 8138

A STR O N O M Y  IS LO O K IN G  U P



3042 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 June 2001

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2002
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2002. Subject to
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year.
The prices quoted include postage by surface mail unless stated otherwise.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week,
unless disrupted by public holidays or
unforseen circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.
All Gazettes $    
  Within WA ....................................  750.20
  Interstate  .....................................  777.70
  Overseas (airmail) ......................  1,168.20
Bound Volumes of full year .......  1,013.10

Electronic Gazette Online
(includes all Gazettes from Jan 1998)
Existing hard copy subscriber..........  173.80
Electronic Subscription only ...........  578.60
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year) ......................................  694.10

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

$    
  Within WA  ...................................  301.40
  Interstate ......................................  359.70
  Overseas (airmail)  ........................  502.70
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year) ......................................  300.30

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly
during parliamentary sessions.

$    
  Within WA  ...................................  480.70
  Interstate ......................................  594.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ........................  643.50
Bound Volumes of Hansard
  Within WA  ...................................  580.80
  Interstate ......................................  618.20
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999
  (per year)  ......................................  578.60

STATUTES
Bound Statutes
Bound volumes are posted during March of
the following year.

$    
  Within WA......................................  258.50
  Interstate .......................................  286.00
  Overseas .......................................  291.50
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ...............  710.60

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year).......................................  257.40

Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA......................................  276.10
  Interstate........................................  286.00
  Overseas (airmail) ...........................  409.20

Sessional Bills
Bills are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA .....................................  380.60
  Interstate .......................................  398.20
  Overseas (airmail) ..........................  595.10

Electronic Statutes Online
Includes all Acts, Regulations, Bills, Acts by
year, Index to Statutes, Hansard, etc

$    
  1st user  ........................................  679.80
  2nd and each additional user (each) 339.90
  More than 10 users (each) ..............  170.50

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is
searchable. Other CD ROM products with
legislation or other statutory information can
be packaged to individual requirements.
Prices are available on request.

�������������


