
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

3437

PERTH, TUESDAY, 10 JULY 2001  No. 135
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Local Courts Act 1904—Local Court Amendment Rules 2001......................................... 3439-40
Local Government Act 1995—
    Shire of Toodyay—
        Local Government Fencing Local Law................................................................ 3441
        Local Government Pest Plants Local Law.......................................................... 3441

———

PART 2

Censorship .......................................................................................................................... 3442-4
Education............................................................................................................................ 3445-9
Fair Trading ....................................................................................................................... 3449
Health ................................................................................................................................. 3449-50
Justice ................................................................................................................................. 3450
Land Administration.......................................................................................................... 3450-1
Minerals and Energy.......................................................................................................... 3451
Planning.............................................................................................................................. 3452
Premier and Cabinet .......................................................................................................... 3453
Public Notices ..................................................................................................................... 3453-4
WorkCover .......................................................................................................................... 3453



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010.
• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to

observe this request could result in the notice being held over.
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2001 (Prices include GST).
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$20.55
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$48.00
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$48.00 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).
All other Notices
    Per Column Centimetre—$9.55
    Bulk Notices—$178.20 per page
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.

• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they
fall on a Tuesday or Friday.

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



10 July 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3439

—  PART  1  —

JUSTICE

JM301*

Local Courts Act 1904

Local Court Amendment Rules 2001

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These rules may be cited as the Local Court Amendment
Rules 2001.

2. Commencement

These rules come into operation on the day after the last day of
the specified period, which is the period of one month after the
day on which these rules are published in the Gazette.

3. The rules amended

The amendments in these rules are to the Local Court
Rules 1961*.

[* Reprinted as at 13 October 2000.
For amendments to 28 May 2001 see 2000 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 203.]

4. Order 37 amended

Order 37 rule 13 is amended by deleting “12 of ” and inserting
instead —

“    9 of the Table of court fees in    ”.

5. Appendix amended

The Appendix is amended in Part II Bailiff Fees as follows:

(a) in item 1(a) by deleting “$15.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $16.50    ”;
(b) in item 1(b) by deleting “$21.00” and inserting

instead —

“    $23.00    ”;



3440 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 10 July 2001

(c) in item 2(a) by deleting “$40.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $44.00    ”;

(d) in item 2(c) by deleting “$21.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $23.00    ”;

(e) in item 2(d) by deleting “$21.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $23.00    ”;

(f) in item 4 —

(i) by deleting “$5.00” and inserting instead —

“    $5.50    ”;

(ii) by deleting “$10.00” and inserting instead —

“    $11.00    ”;

(iii) by deleting “$45.00” and inserting instead —

“    $49.00    ”; and

(iv) by deleting “$55.00” and inserting instead —

“    $60.00    ”;

(g) in item 5 by deleting “$47.00” and inserting instead —

“    $51.00    ”;

(h) in item 7 by deleting “$90.00” and inserting instead —

“    $100.00    ”;

(i) in item 8(a) by deleting “$150.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $165.00    ”;

(j) in item 9 by deleting “$3.30” and inserting instead —

“    $4.00    ”;

(k) in item 13 by deleting “$29.50” and inserting instead —

“    $32.00    ”;

(l) by deleting item 14(a) and inserting instead —

“
14.(a) Attendance on a Judgment Summons

hearing or related matter $2.00
    ”;

(m) in item 14(b) by deleting “$2.00” and inserting
instead —

“    $2.50    ”.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



10 July 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3441

LOCAL GOVERNMENT

LG301*
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Toodyay
LOCAL GOVERNMENT FENCING LOCAL LAW

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and under all other
powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Toodyay resolved on June 28,2001
to make the following local law—

The Shire of Toodyay Fencing Local Law as published in the Government Gazette
dated November 1,1999 with the following modifications—
1. First Schedule

In Clause A(a) delete the phrase “to be 125mm x 125mm x 75mm x 2400mm”
and replace with “to be 125mm x 125mm x 75mm x 1800mm”
In clause A(f) delete the phrase “1800mm in height” and replace with
“1200mm in height”
In clause B(d) delete the phrase “to be a minimum of 1800mm” and replace
with “to be a minimum of 120mm”
In clause C(d) delete the phrase “to be a minimum of 1800mm” and replace
with “to be a minimum of 1200mm”
In Clause D(1)(b) delete the phrase “galvanised starting rod 1500mm high”
and replace with “galvanised starting rod 900mm high”

Dated this 28th Day of June, 2001
The Common seal of the Shire of Toodyay was affixed in the presence of—

Cr. A. E. HENSHAW, Shire President.
A. D. SMITH, Chief Executive Officer

LG302*
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Toodyay
LOCAL GOVERNMENT PEST PLANTS LOCAL LAW

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and under all other
powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Toodyay resolved on June 28,2001 to
make the following local law—

The Shire of Toodyay Pest Plants Local Law as published in the Government
Gazette dated December 31,1999 with the following modifications—
1. First Schedule

Addition of the following—
“Bridal Creeper Asparagus asparagoides”

Dated this 28th Day of June,2001
The Common seal of the Shire of Toodyay was affixed in the presence of—

Cr. A. E. HENSHAW, Shire President.
A. D. SMITH, Chief Executive Officer



3442 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 10 July 2001

—  PART  2  —

CENSORSHIP

CS401*
CENSORSHIP ACT 1996

I, Jim McGinty, being the Minister administering the Censorship Act 1996, acting in the exercise of
the powers conferred by Section 15 of that Act, do hereby determine that the publications specified in
the schedule below shall be classified as refused publications for the purposes of that Act.
Dated this 2nd day of July 2001.

JIM McGINTY, Attorney General.

Schedule
26 June 2001

Refused Classification
Title or Description Publisher
Australian Flesh Iss 75 Redrock Media Pty Ltd
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Dec 1988 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 9 No 12
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) May 1989 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 10 No 5
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jun 1989 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 10 No 6
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jul 1989 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 10 No 7
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Aug 1989 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 10 No 8
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jan 1990 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 11 No 1
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Feb 1990 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 11 No 2
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jul 1990 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 11 No 7
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jan 1992 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 13 No 1
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Nov 1993 Gemkilt Publishing Pty Ltd
  Vol 14 No 11
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) May 1995 Gemkilt Publishing Pty Ltd
  Vol 16 No 5
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Aug 2000 Gemkilt Publishing Pty Ltd
  Vol 21 No 8
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Sep 2000 Gemkilt Publishing Pty Ltd
  Vol 21 No 9
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Oct 2000 Gemkilt Publishing Pty Ltd
  Vol 21 No 10
Babyface May 2001 No 5 The Score Group
Dirty Teens Vol 22 Bookpress
Hustler (Gold Edition) Vol 6 No 2 JT Publishing Pty Ltd

CS402*
CENSORSHIP ACT 1996

I, Jim McGinty, being the Minister administering the Censorship Act 1996, acting in the exercise of
the powers conferred by Section 15 of that Act, do hereby determine that the publications specified in
the schedule below shall be classified as restricted publications for the purposes of that Act.
Dated this 2nd day of July  2001.

JIM McGINTY, Attorney General.



10 July 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3443

Schedule
26 June 2001

Restricted Classification

Title or Description Publisher
30 Something (Score Special) No 50 The Score Group
Adult Cinema Review Jun 2001 Vol 19 Iss 3 Global Media Group Ltd
Asian Angels Vol 7 No 2 Tribeca Publishing Inc
Asian Babes Vol 9 No 9 Fantasy Publications Ltd
Australasian Sex Paper Jun 2001 Vol 11 No 117 Xpress (Australia) Pty Ltd
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) May 1986 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 7 No 5
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jul 1986 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 7 No 7
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Aug 1986 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 7 No 8
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Sep 1986 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 7 No 9
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jan 1987 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 8 No 1
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Mar 1987 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 8 No 3
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) May 1987 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 8 No 5
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jun 1987 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 8 No 6
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jul 1987 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 8 No 7
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Dec 1987 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 8 No 12
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Apr 1988 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 9 No 4
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jun 1988 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 9 No 6
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Sep 1988 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 9 No 9
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) May 1990 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 11 No 5
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jun 1990 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 11 No 6
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Sep 1990 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 11 No 9
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Apr 1991 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 12 No 4
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Apr 1992 PH Editorial Services Pty Ltd
  Vol 13 No 4
Babyface Oct 2000 No 10 The Score Group
Back Seat Driver XXX.Com Vol 1 No 2 Amazing Media Group Inc
Best of Cheri, The (Special Edition #140) Vol 23 No 9 Cheri Magazine Inc
Best of Club, The No 167 Paragon Publishing Inc
Best of Sarah Young, The No 1 MGM
Best of Sarah Young, The No 3 MGM
Best of Sarah Young, The No 4 MGM
Big Ones (International) Vol 12 No 3 Fantasy Publications Ltd
Blueboy Jul 2001 Vol 12 No 6 Global Media Group Ltd
Busty Beauties Summer 1998 Vol 10 No 10 LFP Inc
Celebrity Skin Apr 2001 Vol 23 No 94 Man’s World Publications
Celebrity Sleuth Vol 14 No 1 Broadcast Communications Inc
Cheri Jun 2001 Vol 25 No 12 Cheri Magazine Inc
Chic 1995 Vol 1 No 4 JT Publishing
Chic Dec 1998 Vol 23 No 2 LFP Inc
Club Feb 2001 Vol 27 No 1 Paragon Publishing Inc
Encounters Iss 57 Pleasures Pty Ltd
Escort Vol 21 No 5 Paul Raymond Publications Ltd
Finally Legal Jun 2001 Vol 3 No 6 Dowager Inc
Fox Jun 2001 Vol 19 No 13 Montcalm Publishing Corporation
Freeway Iss 201 Freeway
Gallery May 2001 Vol 29 No 5 Montcalm Publishing Corporation
Gent (Home of the D-Cups) May 2001 No 46 Gent Publications Inc
Hawk Jun 2001 Vol 10 No 6 Killer Joe Productions Inc
High Society Jun 2001 Vol 26 No 6 The Crescent Publishing Group Inc
Hustler (Gold Edition) Vol 6 No 7 JT Publishing Pty Ltd
Just Come of Age May 2001 World Media Group
Just Legal (Barely 18 Special) Vol 1 No 24 D&T Publ Co Inc
Just Legal (Barely 18 Special) Vol 1 No 26 D&T Publ Co Inc



3444 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 10 July 2001

Restricted Classification—continued

Title or Description Publisher
Leg Sex Jun 2001 Vol 5 No 3 The Score Group
Leg Tease Sep 2000 World Media Group
Leg Tease May 2001 World Media Group
Live Young Girls Jun 2001 Vol 21 No 5 Live Periodicals Inc
Machismo Jun 2001 Vol 7 Iss 3 Global Media Group Ltd
Mating Club (Australia) 2001 Vol 1 Iss 5 Not Known
New Rave Mar 1998 Vol 3 No 2 Hemisphere Publishing
New Talent Vol 8 No 4 Fantasy Publications Ltd
No 1 International Jan 1998 Not Known
Nude Readers’ Wives No 168 Fantasy Publications Ltd
Oriental Women Jan 2001 Vol 32 Iss 1 Global Media Group
Oriental Women May 2001 Vol 32 Iss 3 Global Media Group
Oui Jul 2001 Vol 31 Iss 7 Global Media Group
Panther International Not Known
Penthouse May 2001 Vol 32 No 9 General Media Communications Inc
Penthouse Forum May 2001 Vol 31 No 5 General Media Communications Inc
Picture Premium, The Iss 33 ACP Extra
Playboy’s Girlfriends Jul 2001 Special Editions
Plumpers and Big Women Jan 2001 No 32 Gent Publications Inc
Plumpers and Big Women Feb 2001 No 33 Gent Publications Inc
Private No 165 Private Media
Private Sex No 32 Private Media
Purely 18 Feb 2001 Vol 3 No 4 Canary Inc
Score Jun 2001 Vol 10 No 6 The Score Group
Ultimate of Sarah Young, The No 12 MGM
Very Best of High Society, The #131 Vol 18 No 3 The Crescent Publishing Group
Voluptuous May 2001 Vol 8 No 5 The Score Group
Young & Old Vol 2 No 2 Fantasy Publications Ltd

CS403*
CENSORSHIP ACT 1996

I, Jim McGinty, being the Minister administering the Censorship Act 1996, acting in the exercise of
the powers conferred by Section 15 of that Act, do hereby determine that the publications specified in
the schedule below shall be classified as unrestricted publications for the purposes of that Act.
Dated this 2nd day of July 2001.

JIM McGINTY, Attorney General.

Schedule
26 June 2001

Unrestricted Classification
Title or Description Publisher
Australian Girls 1996 Vol 1 No 4 Not Known
Australian Penthouse (Black Label Edition) Jan 1982 Vol 3 No 4 ADM Franchise Pty Ltd
Australian Penthouse (National) Aug 2001 Vol 22 No 8 Gemkilt Publishing Pty Ltd
Celebrity Sleuth Vol 14 No 4 Broadcast Communications Inc
Heavy Metal Summer 2001 Vol 15 No 2 Heavy Metal Magazine
New Zealand Naturist Jun 2001 Iss 177 New Zealand Naturist Federation Inc
Perfect 10 Summer 2001 Vol 4 No 1 Perfect 10 Inc
Picture, The (Home Girls Annual) 2001 ACP Extra
Playboy Jul 2001 Vol 48 No 7 Playboy
Playboy Aug 2001 Vol 48 No 8 Playboy
Playboy’s Book of Lingerie May-Jun 2001 Vol 79 Playboy Press
Playboy’s Book of Lingerie Jul 2001 Vol 80 Playboy Press
Playboy’s Girls of Summer Jun 2001 Special Editions
Playboy’s Natural Beauties May 2001 Special Editions
Playboy’s Sexy Celebrities Feb 2001 Special Editions
Playboy’s Sexy Girls of The World Jun 2001 Special Editions



10 July 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3445

EDUCATION

ED401*
SCHOOL EDUCATION ACT 1999

REGISTERED NON-GOVERNMENT SCHOOLS - 2001

Department of Education Services,
Office of Non-Government Education.

In accordance with the provisions of Section 160 of the School Education Act 1999, the following
schools are approved for the current year—

K indicates that the school is registered for the Kindergarten level.
PP indicates that the school is registered for the Pre-Primary level.

P indicates that the school is registered for the Primary level.
LS indicates that the school is registered beyond the Primary level but not beyond Year 10.
US indicates that the school is registered beyond Year 10.

    Tuition Level Name Location
K PP P LS Aboriginal Community College Gnangara

US Alexander Institute of Technology Perth
K PP P Al-Hidayah Islamic School Bentley
K PP P LS US All Saints College Bullcreek

P LS US Aquinas College Manning
LS US Aranmore Catholic College Leederville

K PP P Aranmore Catholic Primary School Leederville
K PP P LS US Armadale Christian College Bedfordale
K PP P Armadale John Calvin Primary School Armadale
K PP P Armadale Seventh-day Adventist School Brookdale
K PP P Assumption Catholic Primary School Mandurah
K PP P Australian Islamic College Thornlie

P LS US Australian Islamic College (Kewdale) Kewdale
K PP P Australian Islamic College (North Of The River) Dianella
K PP P Beechboro Christian School Beechboro
K PP P Beehive Montessori School Mosman Park
K PP P LS Bethel Christian School Albany

PP P LS US Bible Baptist Christian Academy Mount Helena
K PP P Birlirr Ngawiyiwu Catholic School Via Halls Creek
K PP P Blue Gum Montessori School Bibra Lake
K PP P Bold Park Community School Shenton Park
K PP P LS US Bunbury Cathedral Grammar School Bunbury

LS US Bunbury Catholic College Bunbury
K PP P Bunbury Community School Picton
K PP P Byford John Calvin School Byford
K PP P Calvary Christian School Hamilton Hill

PP P LS US Carey Baptist College Forrestdale
LS US Carmel Adventist College Carmel

K PP P Carmel Adventist College Primary School Bickley
K PP P LS US Carmel School Dianella
K PP P Carnarvon Christian School Carnarvon
K PP P Casa Mia Montessori Community School Bassendean

LS US Catholic Agricultural College Bindoon
LS US Chisholm Catholic College Bedford

PP P LS US Christ Church Grammar School Claremont
K PP P Christ The King School Beaconsfield
K PP P LS US Christian Aboriginal School Coolgardie
K PP P Christian Aboriginal School Kurrawang

LS Christian Brothers Agricultural School Tardun
LS US Christian Brothers College Fremantle

K PP P Chrysalis Montessori School Osborne Park
LS US Clontarf Aboriginal College Bentley

K PP P Collie Catholic College Collie
PP P LS Cornerstone Christian Community School Busselton

LS US Corpus Christi College Bateman
LS US Corridors College Midland

PP P LS Culunga Aboriginal Community School West Swan
K PP P Currambine Catholic Primary School Currambine
K PP P Dale Christian School Armadale

PP P LS US Divine Mercy College Rivervale
PP P LS Djarindjin Lombadina Catholic School Lombadina
PP P LS US El Shaddai College Wellard

K PP P LS Ellenbrook Christian College Ellenbrook
LS Emmanuel Catholic College Yangebup

K PP P Emmanuel Christian Community School Girrawheen
K PP P Esperance Christian Primary School Esperance



3446 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 10 July 2001

    Tuition Level Name Location
K PP P Forrestfield Christian School Forrestfield
K PP P Foundation Christian School Mandurah

PP P LS US Frederick Irwin Anglican Community School Mandurah
K PP P LS US Geraldton Grammar School Geraldton
K PP P Golden Hill Steiner School Denmark
K PP P LS Goldfields Baptist College Kalgoorlie
K PP P Good Shepherd Catholic School Lockridge
K PP P Good Shepherd School Kelmscott
K PP P LS US Grace Christian School Bunbury

P LS US Great Southern Grammar Albany
K PP P LS US Guildford Grammar School Guildford
K PP P Gumnut Montessori School Claremont

P LS US Hale School Wembley Downs
K PP P Helena College Junior School Darlington

P LS US Helena College Senior School Glen Forrest
K PP P Holy Name School Carlisle
K PP P Holy Rosary School Derby
K PP P Holy Rosary School Doubleview
K PP P Holy Spirit School City Beach

PP P LS US Hope Christian College Roelands
K PP P Infant Jesus School Morley

LS US Iona Presentation College Mosman Park
K PP P Iona Primary School Mosman Park

PP P LS John Calvin School Albany
LS US John Calvin Senior High School Armadale
LS US John Paul College Kalgoorlie

K PP P LS John Pujajangka Piyirn School Lake Gregory
Station

K PP P LS US John Septimus Roe Anglican Community School Mirrabooka
PP P LS US John Wollaston Anglican Community School Kelmscott

K PP P LS US John XXIII College Claremont
K PP P Kalamunda Christian School Walliston

PP P LS Karalundi Aboriginal Education Centre Via Meekatharra
K PP P LS US Kearnan College Manjimup

P Kelmscott John Calvin School Kelmscott
K PP P Kerry Street Community School Hamilton Hill

PP P LS US Kids Open Learning School Maylands
K PP P LS US Kingsway Christian College Landsdale
K PP P Kingsway Christian College - Merriwa Merriwa

LS US Kolbe Catholic College Rockingham
K PP P LS US Kulkarriya Community School Noonkanbah

Station
K PP P LS Kururrungku Catholic Education Centre Via Halls Creek

LS US La Salle College Viveash
PP P LS US Lake Joondalup Baptist College Joondalup

K PP P Lance Holt School Fremantle
K PP P Landsdale Gardens Christian School Landsdale
K PP P Leschenault Catholic Primary School Australind
K PP P LS Living Waters Lutheran College Warnbro
K PP P Liwara Catholic Primary School Greenwood
K PP P Loreto Primary School Nedlands

LS US Lumen Christi College Gosnells
K PP P LS Luurnpa Catholic School Via Halls Creek

LS US Mackillop Catholic College Busselton
K PP P Majella Primary School Balga
K PP P LS US Mandurah Catholic College Mandurah
K PP P LS US Maranatha Christian College Waikiki
K PP P Margaret River Montessori School Margaret River
K PP P Mary Mackillop Catholic Community School Ballajura
K PP P Marys Mount Primary School Gooseberry Hill
K PP P Mater Christi Catholic Primary School Yangebup

LS US Mater Dei College Edgewater
K PP P Matthew Gibney Catholic Primary School High Wycombe

LS US Mazenod College Lesmurdie
K PP P Mel Maria Catholic Primary School Attadale

LS US Mercedes College Perth
LS US Mercy College Mirrabooka

K PP P Mercy Primary School Koondoola
K PP P LS US Methodist Ladies College Claremont
K PP P Midland Christian School Middle Swan
K PP P Moerlina School Mt Claremont
K PP P LS US Montessori School Kingsley

PP P LS Mukinbudin Christian School Mukinbudin
K PP P Mundaring Christian School Mundaring



10 July 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3447

    Tuition Level Name Location
LS US Murdoch College Murdoch
LS US Nagle Catholic College Geraldton
LS US Newman College Churchlands

K PP P Newman Junior College Churchlands
K PP P LS Ngalangangpum School Via Kununurra

P LS US Nollamara Christian Academy Nollamara
K PP P Notre Dame School Cloverdale
K PP P Nyikina Mangala Community School via Derby
K PP P Nyindamurra Family School Of Creativity Forest Grove
K PP P Orana Catholic School Willetton
K PP P Our Lady Of Fatima School Palmyra
K PP P Our Lady Of Good Counsel School Karrinyup
K PP P Our Lady Of Grace School North Beach
K PP P Our Lady Of Lourdes School Dardanup
K PP P Our Lady Of Lourdes School Nollamara
K PP P Our Lady Of Mercy Primary School Girrawheen
K PP P Our Lady Of Mount Carmel School Hilton
K PP P Our Lady Of Mount Carmel School Mullewa
K PP P Our Lady Of The Cape Primary School Dunsborough
K PP P Our Lady Star Of The Sea Catholic Primary School Esperance
K PP P Our Ladys Assumption School Dianella
K PP P Parklands School Albany
K PP P LS Parnngurr Community School Via Newman
K PP P LS US Penrhos College Como

PP P LS US Perth College Mount Lawley
US Perth Institute of Business and Technology Churchlands

K PP P Perth Montessori School Victoria Park
K PP P LS US Perth Waldorf School Bibra Lake
K PP P LS Peter Moyes Anglican Community School Mindarie

LS Phoenix West Secondary Vocational College Geraldton
K PP P Pioneer Village School Armadale

LS US Port Community High School Hamilton Hill
LS US Prendiville Catholic College Ocean Reef

PP P LS US Presbyterian Ladies College Peppermint Grove
K PP P LS Purnululu Aboriginal School Via Kununurra
K PP P Queen Of Apostles School Riverton

PP P LS Quinns Baptist College Mindarie
K PP P Padbury Catholic Primary School Padbury
K PP P Quintilian School Mt Claremont
K PP P LS Rawa Community School Via Newman
K PP P Regent College Victoria Park
K PP P Rehoboth Christian Primary School Wilson
K PP P Rehoboth Christian Primary School Yangebup

LS US Rehoboth Christian School Kenwick
K PP P Riverlands School Whiteman
K PP P Riverside Community School Victoria Park
K PP P Rockingham Family School Rockingham
K PP P Rockingham John Calvin School Baldivis
K PP P Sacred Heart Catholic School Goomalling

LS US Sacred Heart College Sorrento
K PP P Sacred Heart Primary School Highgate
K PP P LS Sacred Heart School Beagle Bay
K PP P Sacred Heart School Mundaring
K PP P Santa Clara School Bentley

LS US Santa Maria College Attadale
K PP P Sacred Heart Primary School Thornlie

P LS US Scotch College Swanbourne
LS US Servite College Tuart Hill
LS US Seton Catholic College Samson
LS US Somerville Baptist College Murdoch

K PP P LS US Southlands Christian College Albany
LS US Sowilo Community High School Wembley

K PP P Speech and Hearing Centre Wembley
K PP P St Andrews Catholic Primary School Clarkson
K PP P LS St Andrews Grammar Dianella
K PP P St Annes School Harvey
K PP P St Anthonys School Greenmount
K PP P St Anthonys School Wanneroo
K PP P St Augustines School Rivervale
K PP P St Benedicts School Applecross
K PP P St Bernadettes Catholic Primary School Port Kennedy
K PP P St Bernards School Kojonup
K PP P LS US St Brigids College Lesmurdie
K PP P St Brigids Primary School Middle Swan



3448 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 10 July 2001

    Tuition Level Name Location
K PP P St Brigids School Bridgetown
K PP P St Cecilias College Port Hedland

LS US St Clares School East Perth
K PP P St Columbas Catholic Primary School South Perth
K PP P St Columbas Primary School Bayswater
K PP P St Denis School Joondanna
K PP P St Dominics School Innaloo
K PP P St Francis Xavier Primary School Geraldton
K PP P St Francis Xavier School Armadale
K PP P St Gerards Primary School Balga
K PP P St Helena’s Catholic Primary School Ellenbrook
K PP P LS US St Hildas Anglican School For Girls Mosman Park
K PP P St Jeromes School Munster
K PP P St Johns School Rangeway
K PP P St Johns School Scarborough
K PP P LS US St Josephs College Albany
K PP P St Josephs Primary School Bunbury
K PP P St Josephs School Boulder
K PP P St Josephs School Busselton
K PP P St Josephs School Kununurra
K PP P St Josephs School Moora
K PP P LS St Josephs School Northam
K PP P St Josephs School Pemberton
K PP P St Josephs School Pinjarra
K PP P St Josephs School Queens Park
K PP P St Josephs School Southern Cross
K PP P St Josephs School Waroona
K PP P St Josephs School Wyndham
K PP P St Judes Catholic School Langford
K PP P St Kieran Primary School Tuart Hill
K PP P St Lawrence Primary School Balcatta
K PP P St Lawrences Primary School Geraldton
K PP P St Lukes Catholic Primary School Woodvale

LS US St Lukes College Karratha
K PP P St Lukes Primary School Beeliar
K PP P St Maria Goretti School Redcliffe

PP P LS US St Marks Anglican Community School Hillarys
LS US St Marks International College Perth

K PP P LS St Mary Star of the Sea Catholic School Carnarvon
K PP P LS US St Marys Anglican Girls School Karrinyup
K PP P St Marys Catholic Primary School Bunbury
K PP P St Marys Catholic School Boyup Brook
K PP P LS US St Marys College Broome
K PP P St Mary’s Primary School Kalgoorlie
K PP P St Marys School Donnybrook
K PP P St Marys School Merredin
K PP P St Marys School Northampton
K PP P St Matthews School Narrogin
K PP P St Michaels School Bassendean
K PP P St Michaels School Brunswick Junction
K PP P St Munchins School Gosnells

LS US St Norbert College Queens Park
K PP P St Patricks Primary School Fremantle
K PP P St Patricks School Katanning
K PP P St Pauls Primary School Karratha
K PP P St Pauls Primary School Mount Lawley
K PP P St Peters Primary School Bedford
K PP P St Pius X School Como
K PP P St Simon Peter Catholic Primary School Ocean Reef

PP P LS US St Stephens School Duncraig
K PP P St Thomas More Catholic Primary School Margaret River
K PP P St Thomas Primary School Claremont
K PP P St Vincents School Kwinana
K PP P Star Of The Sea School Rockingham
K PP P LS US Strathalbyn Christian College Geraldton

PP P LS Strelley Community School Via Port Hedland
LS US Swan Christian College Middle Swan

US Swan College Perth
LS US Taylors College O’Connor

P LS The Japanese School In Perth Scarborough
K PP P The Silver Tree Steiner School Parkerville
K PP P LS US Thornlie Christian College Southern River
K PP P LS US Tranby College Baldivis
K PP P LS Treetops Montessori School Darlington



10 July 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3449

    Tuition Level Name Location
P LS US Trinity College East Perth

K PP P Unity Christian School Australind
K PP P LS US Ursula Frayne Catholic College Victoria Park

LS US WA International College Joondalup
K PP P Wanalirri Catholic School Via Derby
K PP P Wandalgu Catholic Primary School Tardun
K PP P Warlawurru Catholic School Via Halls Creek
K PP P LS US Wesley College South Perth
K PP P West Coast Steiner School Nollamara
K PP P Whitford Catholic Primary School Hillarys
K PP P Wilgie View Learning Centre Denmark

LS US Winthrop Baptist College Murdoch
US Wongutha Christian Aboriginal School Gibson

K PP P Woodbury Boston Primary School Torbay
LS Woodthorpe Drive Secondary School Welshpool

PP P LS Wulungarra Independent Community School Via Fitzroy
Crossing

K PP P LS Yakanarra Community School Via Fitzroy
Crossing

K PP P Yallingup Steiner School Yallingup
K PP P Yidarra Catholic Primary School Bateman
K PP P LS Yiyili Aboriginal Community School Via Fitzroy

Crossing
Pre-Compulsory Only
K PP Banksia Montessori School Dianella
K Borden Kindergarten Borden
K PP College Park Kindergarten Nedlands
K Conon Road Kindergarten Applecross

PP Coolabaroo Neighbourhood Centre Thornlie
K Ewin Pre-School Centre Kununurra
K Fantasia Ballajura
K First Steps Independent Kindergarten Kardinya
K Hensman Street Pre-School South Perth
K PP Kindy-Care Kingsley

PP Mundaring Montessori School Mundaring
K Ongerup Kindergarten Ongerup
K Parkwood Kindergarten Parkwood

PP Riverton-Willetton Kindergarten Riverton
K Romper Place Kindergarten Kenwick
K St Francis Xavier Third Road Kindy Armadale

FAIR TRADING

FT401
CHARITABLE COLLECTIONS ACT 1946

I, John Kobelke being the Minister administering the Charitable Collections Act 1946, acting in the
exercise of the powers conferred by subsection (3) of section 12 of that Act, hereby give notice that I
have revoked the licence of the organisations listed below—

• The Association for the Care and Rehabilitation of Alcoholics and Homeless People
Incorporated

• Narembeen Ladies Hospital Auxiliary
Dated this 13th day of June 2001.

JOHN KOBELKE, MLA, Minister for Consumer Affairs.

HEALTH

HE401
HEALTH ACT 1911

Health Department of WA,
Perth, 30 June 2001.

In accordance with the provisions of section 28 of the Health Act 1911, the appointment of the
following persons as Environmental Health Officers is approved.
Environmental Health Officer Date Effective Local Government
Steven Alex Jorden 5 June 2001 Shire of Augusta-Margaret River
Jaala Downes 28 May 2001 Shire of Dundas



3450 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 10 July 2001

Environmental Health Officer Date Effective Local Government
Constance Jane Liebenberg 11 June 2001 Shire of Busselton
David Allen Shimmin 12 June 2001 City of Wanneroo
Michael Turner 15 June 2001 City of South Perth
Philip Evan Boultwood 6 June 2001-30 June 2001 City of Cockburn
Joanne Abbiss 25 June 2001 Shire of Serpentine-Jarrahdale
Raymond Joseph Green 18 June 2001 Shire of Bridgetown-Greenbushes
Julie Lazos 18 June 2001-30 June 2001 City of Joondalup
David Wilson 18 June 2001-30 June 2001 City of Joondalup
Erina Male 20 June 2001-6 July 2001 Town of Bassendean
Grayson Hindmarsh 2 July 2001 Cunderdin/Dowerin Health

Services Scheme

Professor BRYANT STOKES AM, Executive Director,
Public Health.

JUSTICE

JM401
CHILDREN’S COURT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1988

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of the following persons as Members of the Children’s Court of Western
Australia—

Mrs Judith Rae Carter of 290 Queen Victoria Street, Leonora
Mr Graham Robert Dawes of 501 Gwalia Street, Leonora.

GARY THOMPSON, Executive Director,
Court Services.

JM402
JUSTICES ACT 1902

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of—

Mr Ralph Edward Ashwin of 188 Piesse Street, Boulder
Ms Susan Joy Johnson of 53 Simms Street, Port Augusta
Mr Peter Francis Manuel of 27 Parham Crescent, Port Augusta

to the office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia.

GARY THOMPSON, Executive Director,
Court Services.

LAND ADMINISTRATION

LA401*
LAND ACT 1933

FORFEITURE
Department of Land Administration.

The following lease together with all rights, title and interest therein have this day been forfeited to
the Crown under the Land Act 1933 for the reasons stated.
Dated: 2 July 2001.

GRAHAME SEARLE, Acting Chief Executive Officer.

Name Lease District Reason Corres.
Number

Finch, Ethel Mary 1158/1932 Wiluna Lot 545 Non payment of rent 1907/1999



10 July 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3451

LA402
LAND ACT 1933
FORFEITURES

Department of Land Administration.

The following licences together with all rights, title and interest therein have this day been forfeited
to the Crown under the Land Act 1933 for the reasons stated.
Dated: 5 July 2001.

GRAHAME SEARLE, Acting Chief Executive Officer.

Name Licence District Reason Corres.
Number

Plan

Naumann, Wolfgang
Gerhard and Elaine Violet
Watson, Peter John and
Jillian Amy

345B/3217 Marvel Loch
Lot 222

Non compliance
with conditions

2698-1994 Marvel Loch
Townsite

Naumann, Wolfgang
Gerhard and Elaine Violet
Watson, Peter John and
Jillian Amy

345B/3218 Marvel Loch
Lot 223

Non compliance
with conditions

2699-1994 Marvel Loch
Townsite

MINERALS AND ENERGY

MN401*
PETROLEUM PIPELINES ACT 1969

NOTICE OF APPLICATION FOR A PIPELINE LICENCE
I, William Lee Tinapple, Director of the Petroleum Operations Division in the Department of Mineral
and Petroleum Resources for the State of Western Australia being the Officer for the time being
holding certain powers and functions of the Minister in respect of the area specified in the State of
Western Australia by virtue of an instrument of delegation dated 1 March 2001 and published in the
Government Gazette of Western Australia on 13 March 2001, give notice pursuant to Section 8(4) of
the Petroleum Pipelines Act, 1969 that an application recorded as 2P/01-2 has been received from—

GWALIA TANTALUM PTY LTD
of 16 Parliament Place, West Perth WA 6005

for a pipeline licence to construct and operate a pipeline for the conveyance of natural gas from the
boundary of Mining Lease 45/381 to the Wodgina Mine Site Power Station.
A map showing the position of the proposed pipeline may be examined during public office hours until
27 July 2001 at the Petroleum Operations Division, Department of Mineral and Petroleum Resources,
11th Floor, Mineral House, 100 Plain Street, East Perth WA and at the office of the Mining Registrar,
Karratha, WA.
Dated this 5 July 2001.

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum Operations Division.

MN402*
PETROLEUM ACT 1967

NOTICE OF RENEWAL OF EXPLORATION PERMITS
Exploration Permit Nos. EP390 and EP391 held by Kimberley Oil NL have been renewed to have
effect for a period of five (5) years from 29 June 2001.

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum Division.



3452 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 10 July 2001

PLANNING

PD401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
CITY OF ARMADALE

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 3—AMENDMENT No. 7
Ref: 853/2/22/6 Pt 7
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of
Armadale Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 28 June 2001 for the purpose of—

1. Rezoning Lots 1, 2, 24-27, 86 and 100 South Western Highway, Lots 58 and 200 Church
Avenue, Pt Lot 15, Part Lot 16 and Lot 101 Jull Street and Reserve Nos. 14682 and 21514
from ‘Office’ and ‘Local Road’  to ‘Mixed Business/Residential’ and ‘Local Road’  (adjusted as
per the alignment of the proposed ‘Local Road’  as shown on the plan dated 7 March 2001).

2. Amending Table 1 of Town Planning Scheme No. 3—City Centre Zoning Table to include
‘Showroom’ and ‘Public Assembly—Place of ’  uses as ‘AA’ uses, and ‘Warehouse’ use as an ‘IP’
use.

3. Modifying the Scheme Maps accordingly.

R. C. STUBBS, Mayor.
R. S. TAME, Chief Executive Officer.

PREMIER AND CABINET

PR401
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment in the place of the
Hon. E. Ripper MLA in the period 16 to 20 July 2001 (both dates inclusive)—

Office of Treasurer; Minister for Energy Hon. N. Griffiths, LLB MLC

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, Department of the
Premier and Cabinet.

PR402
APPOINTMENT OF DEPUTY OF THE GOVERNOR

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor, under clause XVI of the Letters Patent
relating to the Office of Governor of the State of Western Australia dated 14 February 1986, has
appointed the Lieutenant-Governor the Honourable David K. Malcolm AC, to be deputy of the
Governor and in that capacity to perform and exercise all the powers and functions of the Governor
during the periods—

7 to 15 July 2001 (all dates inclusive)

6 to 10 August 2001 (all dates inclusive)

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, Department of the
Premier and Cabinet.



10 July 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3453

WORKCOVER

WC401
WORKERS’ COMPENSATION AND REHABILITATION ACT 1981

NOTICE
Given by the Commission for the purposes of section 164 of the Workers’ Compensation and
Rehabilitation Act 1981.

Notice of Exemption
1. Notice is given that on 26 June 2001, the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor acting
under section 164 of the Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981 and with the advice and
consent of Executive Council, exempted St John of God Health Care Inc. from the obligation to insure
pursuant to that Act, except for the obligation to insure against liability to pay compensation under
that Act for any industrial disease of the kinds referred to in section 151 (a) (iii) of the Act.

BRIAN THOMAS BRADLEY, Chairman of the Commission.

PUBLIC NOTICES

ZZ201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the estates of the undermentioned deceased persons, are required to send particulars of
their claims to Geoffrey Donald Church of Level 2, 46 Ord Street, West Perth WA on or before the
expiration of one month from the date of publication of this notice after which date the Trustee may
convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the claims of which it then has notice.
Le Fanu, Margaret Edeline late of Unit 4, St Mary’s Close Retirement Village, 9 Ridge Street, South

Perth, Married Woman died on 5th April, 1997.
Le Fanu, Stephen Henry John late of Concorde Nursing Home, Anstey Street, South Perth, Retired

Solicitor died on 14th September, 1998.
Crawley, Joan Margaret late of 8A View Road, Mt Pleasant, Widow died on 26th September, 2000.
Dated this 5th day of July, 2001.

GEOFFREY DONALD CHURCH, Trustee.

ZZ202
TRUSTEES ACT 1962

NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the estate of the undermentioned deceased person, are required to send particulars of their
claims to Gregory Roy Bryant of Level 2, 46 Ord Street, West Perth WA on or before the expiration of
one month from the date of publication of this notice after which date the Trustee may convey or
distribute the assets, having regard only to the claims of which it then has notice.
Bator, Wolfgang late of Lot 540 Coondle Drive, Toodyay, Postal Delivery Officer died on 6th

September, 1999.
Dated this 5th day of July, 2001.

GREGORY ROY BRYANT, Trustee.

ZZ203
TRUSTEES ACT 1962
Notice under Section 63

Wilmer James Western, late of 144 Gibbs Street, Queens Park in Western Australia, Milk Vendor.
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 7 May 2001 at Fremantle Hospital, Fremantle in
Western Australia, are required by the personal representative, being Steven Raymond Fidock care of
Fidock & Fidock Barristers & Solicitors of Level 23, St Martins Tower 44 St Georges Terrace, Perth



3454 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 10 July 2001

Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to him by the 13th day of August 2001 after
which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the
claims of which he then has notice.

ZZ401
MARKETING OF EGG ACT, 1945

(Regulation 19 (a))
CERTIFICATE BY RETURNING OFFICER OF RESULT OF AN ELECTION

I, Harold Thomas Preston being the Returning Officer duly appointed under and for the purpose of
the regulations made under the Marketing of Eggs Act, 1945 do hereby certify as follows—

1. That in accordance with the said regulations, I have held an election, which closed at 4.00pm
on 22nd day of June, 2001 for the election of a person, as the elective member of the Western
Australian Egg Marketing Board under Section 7 (3) (c) of the Act.

2. That the candidates for election were—
Mr William Johnson of North Beach WA Commercial Producer
Mr Lindsay Bell of Rossmoyne WA Commercial Producer
Mr Robert Da Prato of Banjup WA Commercial Producer

3. That the voting resulted as follows—
On the first count: Number of Votes
Mr William Johnson 4
Mr L Bell 51
Mr Robert Da Prato 13

That the result of the said voting, Mr Lindsay Bell was duly elected as the person to be the elective
member, on the 22nd day of June 2001, as required by the Act for appointment by the Governor as a
member of the Board.
Dated the 22nd day of June 2001.

HAROLD PRESTON, Returning Officer.



10 July 2001 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3455

New Publication – Now Available!

ACTIVE CITIZENSHIP
Celebrating the Centenary of Federation at

Parliament House, National Trust
and Kings Park

“This resource package is an excellent way of giving
young people the chance to visit and learn about
places that will hopefully inspire them to think about
what they want for their present and future lives.”

Dr Geoff Gallop MLA
Premier of Western Australia
Minister for Citizenship and Multicultural Affairs

Cost: $4.40
For further information please contact:

State Law Publisher
Telephone: 9321 7688
Facsimile: 9321 7536



3456 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 10 July 2001

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2002
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2002. Subject to
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year.
The prices quoted include postage by surface mail unless stated otherwise.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week,
unless disrupted by public holidays or
unforseen circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.
All Gazettes $    
  Within WA ....................................  750.20
  Interstate  .....................................  777.70
  Overseas (airmail) ......................  1,168.20
Bound Volumes of full year .......  1,013.10

Electronic Gazette Online
(includes all Gazettes from Jan 1998)
Existing hard copy subscriber..........  173.80
Electronic Subscription only ...........  578.60
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year) ......................................  694.10

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

$    
  Within WA  ...................................  301.40
  Interstate ......................................  359.70
  Overseas (airmail)  ........................  502.70
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year) ......................................  300.30

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly
during parliamentary sessions.

$    
  Within WA  ...................................  480.70
  Interstate ......................................  594.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ........................  643.50
Bound Volumes of Hansard
  Within WA  ...................................  580.80
  Interstate ......................................  618.20
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999
  (per year)  ......................................  578.60

STATUTES
Bound Statutes
Bound volumes are posted during March of
the following year.

$    
  Within WA......................................  258.50
  Interstate .......................................  286.00
  Overseas .......................................  291.50
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ...............  710.60

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year).......................................  257.40

Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA......................................  276.10
  Interstate........................................  286.00
  Overseas (airmail) ...........................  409.20

Sessional Bills
Bills are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA .....................................  380.60
  Interstate .......................................  398.20
  Overseas (airmail) ..........................  595.10

Electronic Statutes Online
Includes all Acts, Regulations, Bills, Acts by
year, Index to Statutes, Hansard, etc

$    
  1st user  ........................................  679.80
  2nd and each additional user (each) 339.90
  More than 10 users (each) ..............  170.50

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is
searchable. Other CD ROM products with
legislation or other statutory information can
be packaged to individual requirements.
Prices are available on request.

�������������


