PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

—7 WESTERN
a AUSTRALIAN
g GOVERNMENT tt

PERTH, TUESDAY, 21 MAY 2002 No. 96

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM
© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

CONTENTS

PART 1

Page

Chiropractors Act 1964—Chiropractors Registration Board Amendment Rules 2002 . 2590-1
Consumer Credit (Western Australia) Act 1996—Consumer Credit (Western

Australia) Amendment Regulations 2002 ..........ccccooiiiiiiiiiieiiiiiiieeee e 2589-90
Health Act 1911—Shire of Trayning Health Local Laws 2002 ...........cccccceeeveviinvinennennn. 2592
Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984—Occupational Safety and Health

Amendment Regulations (N0. 3) 2002 .........ccccveeeiiiiiieeiiiiieeeiieeeesreeeesnreeeereeeesareaeens 2595-6
Proclamation—Consumer Credit (Western Australia) Amendment Act 2001—30 of

D201 RPN 2589
Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981—Workers’ Compensation and

Rehabilitation (Scales of Fees) Amendment Regulations 2002 ............cccceeeeevvereenneen. 2593-4

PART 2
AGTICUITUIE ..eviiiiiiiiiee ettt ettt e ettt ettt e e sttt e e e v eeeesetaeeessaaeeeetbaeeeasssaeesnssaaeanssseeeasssaeesnseeans 2597
D T s U)o 1 <SRRI 2597
|5 =T 111 RPN 2598
JUSTICE oenniiiiieiiieee et e e et e e et e e e et e e e e et e aeera——————— 2598-9
L0CAl GOVEITIIMEIIE ..vvvviiiiiiieiiiii e e e e e e e e eeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeseseeeseseseeeseeeeeeens 2599-600
Minerals and PetroleUIN ...........uuueueeeieieiiii e e e e e e e e e e e eeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeseeeeeeens 2600
Planning and INfrastructure .........cccccooeeeiiiiiiic e e et 2600
POJICE oot ———————————————————————————————————————————————————trrros 2601
Premier and CabINet .........oovvvviiviiiiiiiiiiiieieeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeee e eeveeeeesaeaeaseseaasssasanenanaes 2601
PUDIIC NOTICES wovvvviviiiiiiiiieiieeieteeeee et a e e s aa e saaasaaaaasaeasasasasasasssssnsssssnennrenes 2602

Racing, Gaming and LiQUOT .........ccccveiiiiiiiiiiiiieicc e e irare e e e e e aeaanees 2601-2




IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE

© State of Western Australia

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS

The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances.

Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.
* Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.
* Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).

Postal address: Delivery address:
State Law Publisher State Law Publisher
P.O. Box 8448, Ground Floor,
Perth Business Centre 6849 10 William St. Perth, 6000

Telephone: 9321 7688 Fax: 9321 7536
* Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010.

* Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to
observe this request could result in the notice being held over.

If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS

EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2001 (Prices include GST).
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$20.55
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$48.00

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$48.00 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).

All other Notices

Per Column Centimetre—$9.55

Bulk Notices—$178.20 per page
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS

Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

+ Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.

* Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they
fall on a Tuesday or Friday.

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.




21 May 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2589

— PART 1 —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA101*

CONSUMER CREDIT (WESTERN AUSTRALIA)
AMENDMENT ACT 2001

30 of 2001
PROCLAMATION
WESTERN AUSTRALIA By His Excellency Lieutenant General John Murray
John Sanderson, Sanderson, Companion of the Order of Australia,
Governor. Governor of the State of Western Australia.

LS]

I, the Governor, acting under section 2 of the Consumer Credit (Western Australia)
Amendment Act 2001, and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix
1 June 2002 as the day on which that Act comes into operation.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 14 May 2002.
By Command of the Governor,

JOHN KOBELKE, Minister for Consumer and
Employment Protection.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN !

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION

CE301*

Consumer Credit (Western Australia) Act 1996

Consumer Credit (Western Australia)
Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Consumer Credit
(Western Australia) Amendment Regulations 2002.

N

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on the day on which the
Consumer Credit (Western Australia) Amendment Act 2001
comes into operation.



2590 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 21 May 2002

3. The regulation amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Consumer
Credit (Western Australia) Regulations 1996*.

[* Reprinted as at 28 April 2000.
For amendments to 1 May 2002 see 2000 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 57.]

4. Section 6 amended
Section 6(a) is amended by deleting “$200” and inserting
instead —
c¢$5079'

5. Section 6E inserted

After section 6D the following section is inserted —

6E. Authorised deposit-taking institutions — exemption
from Code

(1) The Code does not apply to the provision of credit by
an authorised deposit-taking institution limited by the
contract to a total period not exceeding 62 days.

(2) In this section —

“authorised deposit-taking institution” has the
meaning given under the Banking Act 1959
(Cwlth), section 5(1).

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HEALTH

HE301*
Chiropractors Act 1964

Chiropractors Registration Board Amendment
Rules 2002

Made by the Board with the approval of the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These rules may be cited as the Chiropractors Registration
Board Amendment Rules 2002.



21 May 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2591

2.

The rules amended

The amendments in these rules are to the Chiropractors
Registration Board Rules 1966*.

[* Reprinted as at 10 November 2000.
For amendments to 12 April 2002 see 2000 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 45-6.]

Rule 10A replaced

Rule 10A is repealed and the following rule is inserted
instead —

10A.  Advertising

A chiropractor who advertises, or causes to be
advertised, any material relating to the chiropractor’s
practice of chiropractic that —

(a) is false, misleading or deceptive;

(b) creates an unjustified expectation of beneficial
treatment; or

(c) promotes the unnecessary or inappropriate use
of the chiropractor’s services,

commits an offence.

2

Rule 10B repealed

Rule 10B is repealed.

Rule 10C amended

Rule 10C(2) and (3) are repealed.

The Common Seal of the
Chiropractors Registration Board
was affixed in the presence of —

VALERIE FRAZER, Chairman.

ROBERT CHARLES SCOTT, Member.

Approved by the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



2592 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 21 May 2002

LocAL GOVERNMENT

LG301*
HEALTH ACT 1911
SHIRE OF TRAYNING HEALTH LOCAL LAWS 2002

Made by the Council of the Shire of Trayning under section 342 of the Health Act
1911 in accordance with subdivision 2 of Division 2 of Part 3 of the Local Government
Act 1995.

Citation

1. These Local Laws may be cited as the “Shire of Trayning Health Local Laws
2002”.

Incorporation by Reference
2. (1) In these Local Laws, “The Shire of Koorda Health Local Laws 2001,
(a) means The Shire of Koorda Health Local Laws 2001 published in the
Government Gazette, special edition number No. 4, on 11 January 2002; and
(b) does not include any amendments that might be made to those Local Laws

(i1) Subject to the modifications set out in the Schedule, The Shire of Koorda Health
Local Laws 2001 are incorporated with and form part of these Local Laws.

Repeal

3. (1) The Health Local Laws adopted by the Shire of Trayning and published in the
Government Gazette on 19 June 1925 and amended from time to time, are repealed;
(2) The Health Local Laws published in the Government Gazette on 7 September
1945 and amended from time to time, are repealed, and

(3) The Health Local Laws adopted by the Shire of Trayning on 19 August 1953 and
published in the Government Gazette on 13 November 1953 and amended from time
to time, are repealed, and

(4) The Health Local Laws adopted by the Shire of Trayning on 17 October 1956 and
published in the Government Gazette on 21 January 1957 and amended from time to
time, are repealed, and

(5) The Health Local Laws adopted by the Shire of Trayning on 17 April 1972 and
published in the Government Gazette on 7 June 1972 and amended from time to
time, are repealed.

SCHEDULE
Modifications to The Shire of Koorda Health Local Laws 2001
Item Sections Affected Description
1. 1.1 Delete Section 1.1 and substitute the following:

“1.1 These Local Laws may be cited as the “Shire of
Trayning Health Local Laws 2002..”

2. 1.2 Delete Section 1.2.

3. 1.3(1) and Delete “Shire of Koorda” whenever it occurs and
Schedules 1 - 15 substitute “Shire of Trayning”.

4. 4.2.16 Delete the words “The townsite of Koorda and

localities of 1, 2, 3, 4 of Avon Location 16386
Ninghan Road Koorda” and substitute the words

“The townsites of Trayning, Kununoppin and
Yelbeni.

Made at a meeting of the Council of the Shire of Trayning held on 20 February 2002.
The Common Seal of the Shire of Trayning was hereunto affixed in the presence of—

T. R. LAMOND, President.
G. M. PEDDIE, Chief Executive Officer.

On this 20t day of March 2002.

Consented to—
Dr RICHARD LUGG, delegate of
Executive Director, Public Health.
Dated this 5th day of April 2002.



21 May 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2593

WORKCOVER

WC301*

Workers” Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981

Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation
(Scales of Fees) Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council, on the recommendation of
the Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Commission.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Workers’
Compensation and Rehabilitation (Scales of Fees)
Amendment Regulations 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendment in these regulations is to the Workers’
Compensation and Rehabilitation (Scales of Fees)
Regulations 1998%*.

[* Published in Gazette 13 October 1998, p. 5709-25.
For amendments to 24 April 2002 see 2000 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 415-6, and
Gazette 28 December 2001.]

Schedule 2 replaced

Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —

Schedule 2
[r. 3]
Scale of fees — physiotherapists
Type of service Fee
$
1. Initial consultation 51.00

(Includes individual initial services provided in

rooms, home or hospital; hydrotherapy treatment;
specialist consultations; extended treatments; and
services provided outside normal business hours)



2594 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 21 May 2002

2. Standard consultation 41.00
(Includes individual subsequent services provided
in rooms, home or hospital; hydrotherapy
treatment; specialist consultations; extended
treatments; and services provided outside normal
business hours)

3. Two distinct areas of treatment per visit 51.85

(Includes individual initial or subsequent services
provided in rooms, home or hospital;
hydrotherapy treatment; specialist consultations;
and services provided outside normal business
hours)

4. Three or more distinct areas of treatment per 69.05
visit

(Includes individual initial or subsequent services
provided in rooms, home or hospital;
hydrotherapy treatment; complex treatment;
specialist consultations; and services provided
outside normal business hours)

5. Group consultation — per person 12.00

(Includes services provided to more than one
individual in rooms, home or hospital;
hydrotherapy treatment; complex treatment;
specialist consultations; extended treatments; and
services provided outside normal business hours)

6. Worksite visit (per hour) 116.00
7. Solicitors reports 51.00
8. Travel (per kilometre) 0.60

2

Recommended by the Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Commission
on the 12" day of March 2002.

The common seal of the

Workers” Compensation and C.S.

N~ N N N

Rehabilitation Commission

H. T. NEESHAM.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



21 May 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

2595

WORKSAFE

WS301*
Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984

Occupational Safety and Health Amendment
Regulations (No. 3) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Occupational Safety and
Health Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Occupational
Safety and Health Regulations 1996*.

[* Reprinted as at 15 October 1999.
For amendments to 27 March 2002 see 2000 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 239, and
Gazette 30 March and 13 July 2001 and 8 March 2002.]

4. Schedule 6.1 amended
Schedule 6.1 is amended by deleting “$23.25” and inserting
instead —
“ $23.75 .

5. Schedule 6.1A amended

Schedule 6.1A is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “$3 017” and inserting instead —
“ $3095
(b) by deleting “$2 000 and inserting instead —
“ %2052 7
(c) by deleting “$1 000” and inserting instead —
“ $1026 .



2596

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 21 May 2002

Schedule 6.2 amended

Schedule 6.2 is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “$59.00” and inserting instead —

“ $61.00
(b) Dby deleting “$59.00” and inserting instead —
“ $61.00 .
Schedule 6.2A amended

Schedule 6.2A is amended by deleting “$3 092 and inserting
instead —

“ 83172

Schedule 6.3 amended

Schedule 6.3 is amended as follows:

(a) Dby deleting “$59.00” and inserting instead —
“ $61.00 7

(b) Dby deleting “$31.00” and inserting instead —
“$32.00 7

(c) Dbydeleting “$713.00” and inserting instead —
“$732.00

(d) by deleting “$119.00” and inserting instead —
“$122.00 7

(e) by deleting “$357.00” and inserting instead —
“ $366.00 .

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




21 May 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2597

— PART 2 —

AGRICULTURE

AG401*

EXOTIC DISEASES OF ANIMALS ACT 1993
DISEASE CONTROL ORDER

Made by the Minister for Agriculture, Forestry and Fisheries under Section 41 of the Exotic Diseases
of Animals Act 1993.

This notice certifies that Virulent Newcastle Disease has been diagnosed in the State of Victoria on
8 May 2002.

KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture,
Forestry and Fisheries.

AG402*
EXOTIC DISEASES OF ANIMALS ACT 1993
IMPORT RESTRICTION ORDER 2002
Number 1
Made by the Minister for Agriculture, Forestry and Fisheries under Section 24 of the Exotic Diseases
of Animals Act 1993.

The national Consultative Committee on Exotic Animal Diseases has, on 8 May 2002 confirmed the

diagnosis of Virulent Newcastle Disease in the State of Victoria.

For the purpose of the Exotic Diseases of Animals Act 1993, the following conditions/prohibitions

apply to importation into Western Australia of—

Species of animals: Avian

Animal Products: All Avian

Conditions/prohibitions: = Except as approved by the Chief Veterinary Officer, a person must not
move any avian animal or any avian animal product into Western
Australia, from an area of the State of Victoria declared under a law of
that State to be a Restricted Area or a Control Area for the purpose of
controlling Virulent Newcastle Disease.

Unless sooner revoked, this order applies for a period of thirty (30) days commencing on the day it is
published in the Gazette.

KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture,
Forestry and Fisheries.

FISHERIES

FI401
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994
BROOME PRAWN MANAGED FISHERY MANAGEMENT PLAN 1999
Clause 12 Closures of Areas Within the Fishery

I, Peter Rogers, Executive Director of the Department of Fisheries, in accordance with subclause 12(1)
of the Broome Prawn Managed Fishery Management Plan 1999*, hereby prohibit all persons from
fishing in the waters described in Schedule 2 of that plan for the following periods—

1. commencing from the date this notice is published in the Gazette and ending at 1800 hours
Western Standard Time on 1 June 2002.

2. the period commencing at 0800 hours Western Standard Time on 15 August 2002 and ending
at 1800 hours Western Standard Time on 1 June 2003.

[*Published in the Gazette of 26 February 1999]
Dated this 14t day of May 2002.

P. P. ROGERS, Executive Director.



2598 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 21 May 2002

HEALTH
HE401*
HEALTH ACT 1911
HEALTH ACT (APPLICATION OF DIVISION 3 OF PART V)
ORDER 2002
Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 161(c).
1. Citation

This notice may be cited as the Health Act (Application of Division 8 of Part V) Order 2002.
2. Commencement
This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government Gazette.

3. Application in the district of the Shire of Derby/West Kimberley

The provisions of Division 3 of Part V of the Health Act 1911 operate and have effect in the health
district of the Shire of Derby/West Kimberley.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE402*
HEALTH ACT 1911

HEALTH ACT (DALWALLINU TOWNSITE SEWERAGE SCHEME
EXTENSION) ORDER 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 60 of the Act.
1. Citation

This order may be cited as the Health Act (Dalwallinu Townsite Sewerage Scheme Extension) Order
2002.

2. Commencement
This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government Gazette.

3. Dalwallinu Townsite Sewerage Scheme Extension

The Shire of Dalwallinu is empowered to undertake the construction of an extension to the existing
sewerage scheme to service 35 residential lots that will form part of a proposed subdivision to be
developed by the Shire on an area of land bordered by Strickland Drive and Leahy, South and Myers
Streets, currently covered by Reserves 27749 and 27750 and part of Reserve 7718, in the townsite of
Dalwallinu.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

JUSTICE

JU401*
COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999
PERMIT DETAILS

Pursuant to the provisions of section 51 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the
Director General of the Ministry of Justice has issued the following persons with Permits to do
High-Level Security Work:

Surname First Name(s) Permit Date Permit  Permit Permit Expiry
Number Issued Commence Date
Date
Fairbrother David Peter CS2-324 14/05/2002 14/05/2002 30/07/2005

Ridgeway Richard  Allen CS2-325 14/05/2002 14/05/2002 30/07/2005




21 May 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2599

Pursuant to the provisions of section 56 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the
Director General of the Ministry of Justice has revoked the following Permits to do High-Level
Security Work:

Surname First Name(s) Permit Date Permit
Number Revoked
Fairbrother David Peter CS2-037 14/05/2002

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999.

PETER MOORE, A/Director,
Custodial Contracts.

LocAL GOVERNMENT

LG401*
SHIRE OF BROOME
AUTHORISED OFFICERS

It is hereby notified for public information that effective from 14 May 2002, the persons listed
hereunder have been appointed as “authorised persons” in accordance with Section 9.10 of the Local
Government Act 1995 and are hereby authorised to exercise powers in accordance with the following
Acts, Regulations and Local Laws—

Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995

Dog Act 1976

Local Government Act 1995

Litter Act 1979

Bush Fires Act 1954

Control of Vehicles (Off Road) Act 1978

Authorised Persons—

Donna Rochelle Middleton
Helga Jane Mowat
The following appointment is hereby cancelled—

Peter James Sandow
GREG POWELL, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402
DOG ACT 1976
Shire of Dardanup
NEW POUND FACILITY

Under the powers conferred by the Dog Act 1976 and under all other powers enabling it, the Council
of the Shire of Dardanup resolved on 15 May 2002, to create a new pound facility.

The pound to be used by the Shire of Dardanup is located at 6 Cassowary Bend, Eaton.

The pound keeper or other employee authorised by the Council shall be in attendance at the pound for

the release of dogs at such times and on such days of the week as shall from time to time be
determined by the pound keeper or other employee Authorised by the Council.

Dated this 16th day of May 2002.

Cr. M. T. BENNETT, Shire President.
M. L. CHESTER, Chief Executive Officer.

LG403
SHIRE OF UPPER GASCOYNE
AUTHORISED PERSONS

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed as
authorised and registration officers pursuant to the following Acts and have been authorised to
enforce the following Acts—

Local Government Act 1995

Caravan Parks and Camping Act 1995



2600 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 21 May 2002

Dog Act 1976 and Regulations

Bush Fires Act 1954 and Regulations

Litter Act 1979

Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978 and Regulations

John Lonsdale Newton

Ross McKenzie

Keith Draper

William Stocks

Valerie Hobbs
The following persons have been appointed Casual Rangers/Authorised persons under provisions of
the Dog Act 1976 and Regulations—

Anthony Robinson

Cody Dhu

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.
Dated: 26 April 2002.

JOHN L. NEWTON, Chief Executive Officer.

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM

MP401*
MINING ACT 1978

Mining (Ellendale Diamond Royalties)
(Sale Date) Notice 2002

Under regulation 4 of the Mining (Ellendale Diamond Royalties) Regulations 2002, it is notified that
the sale date was 23 April 2002.

Regulation 2 of the Mining (Ellendale Diamond Royalties) Regulations 2002 states that those
regulations come into operation on the sale date.

CLIVE BROWN, MLA, Minister for State Development.

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE

PI401

METROPOLITAN REGION TOWN PLANNING SCHEME ACT 1959
DISPOSAL OF LAND

Notice is given that His Excellency the Governor has consented under the provisions of section
37A (4) of the Metropolitan Region Town Planning Scheme Act 1959 to the disposal of the properties
described in the Schedule below to the State of Western Australia for dedication as a public road
(Hepburn Avenue) under section 288 of the Local Government Act 1995.

FIRST SCHEDULE

1. Portion of each of Swan Locations G and 1315 and being the land shown as “Road Widening”
on Deposited Plan 31415 being part of the land contained in Certificate of Title Volume 2045
Folio 463.

2. Portion of Swan Location 1315 and being part of each of Lots 98 and 99 on Plan 4617 (Sheet 3)
and being the whole of the land contained in Certificate of Title Volume 1826 Folio 803.

3. Portion of each of Swan Locations G and 1315 and being the land shown as “Hepburn Avenue”
on Deposited Plan 31415 being part of the land contained in Certificate of Title Volume 346
Folio 101A.

4. Portion of each of Swan Locations G, H and 1315 and being Lot 1000 on Plan 22399 and being the
whole of the land contained in Certificate of Title Volume 2118 Folio 924.

5. Portion of each of Swan Locations G and 1315 and being the land shown as “Road Widening”
on Deposited Plan 31415 being part of the land contained in Certificate of Title Volume 1450
Folio 136.

6. Portion of each of Swan Locations H, I, K and 1315 and being the land shown as “Hepburn
Avenue” on Deposited Plan 31416 being part of the land contained in Certificate of Title Volume
1918 Folio 448.

Dated: 16 May 2002.

R. N. STOKES, Secretary,
Western Australian Planning Commission.



21 May 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2601

POLICE

PO501
POLICE ACT 1892
POLICE AUCTION

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892, unclaimed found and stolen property and bicycles will be
sold by Public Auction at Smith Broughton & Sons, 1 Clayton Street, Midland on Saturday 25th May
2002 at 10.00am.

Auction will be conducted by Mr Gary Silcock.

B. MATTHEWS, Commissioner of Police
Western Australian Police Service.

PREMIER AND CABINET

PC401
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984
MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the deputy of the Governor in accordance with Section
51(1)(b) of the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment in the
place of the Hon. A. MacTiernan, MLA in the period 17 to 21 May 2002 (both dates inclusive)—

Minister for Planning and Infrastructure Hon. T. G. Stephens, ML.C
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, Department of the Premier and Cabinet.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RG401
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988
SUMMARY OF LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS

The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and
required to be advertised. Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about
the objection process, should contact the Liquor Licensing Division, 1st Floor, Hyatt Centre,
87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry
organisation.

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for
Objections
APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE
8937 Drakesbrook Wines Application for the grant of a Producer—Wine 5/6/02
Pty Ltd licence in respect of premises situated in
Waroona and known as Drakesbrook Wines
8938 Fillipa Barreca and Application for the grant of a Producer—Wine 13/6/02
Antonino Barreca licence in respect of premises situated in
Donnybrook and known as Old Brookhampton
Cellars
8944 Deltanet Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Wholesaler’s 11/6/02
licence in respect of premises situated in
Osborne Park and known as Deltanet
8949 Cockburn Lakes Application for the grant of a Club Restricted 13/6/02
Amateur Football licence in respect of premises situated in
Club Inc South Lake and known as Cockburn Lakes
Amateur Football Club Inc.
8918 Sodexho Food & Application for the grant of a Special Facility 11/6/02
Management P/L licence in respect of premises situated in

Osborne Park and known as Sodexho Food
and Management Services




2602 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 21 May 2002

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for
Objections
APPLICATION FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS
12102 Taymmer Pty ltd Application for the grant of an extended 5/6/02
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in
respect of premises situated in Binningup and
known as Binningup General Store
12103 Raymond John Lewis Application for the grant of an extended 7/6/02
and Beverley Kaye trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in
Lewis respect of premises situated in Cambellup and
known Kambellup Roadhouse
11882 Whitecrest Holdings Application for the grant of an extended 22/5/02
Pty Ltd trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in
respect of premises situated in Perth and
known as Court Hotel
11942 George Alexander Application for the grant of an extended 27/5/02

Irving trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in
respect of premises situated in Bruce Rock
and known as Bruce Rock Hotel

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988.
HUGH HIGHMAN, Director of Liquor Licensing.

PuBLIC NOTICES

77201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962
DECEASED ESTATES
Notice to Creditors and Claimants
Beatrice Sarah Tindall late of Craigwood Nursing Home, Gardner Street, Como in the State of
Western Australia, Widow, deceased.

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in
respect of the estate of Beatrice Sarah Tindall deceased who died on the 6t day of February 2002 at
Como aforesaid are required by the personal representative David Malcolm Moss of 27 Golf
Links Road, Albany, Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to David Moss & Co of
PO Box 5744, Albany WA 6332 by the 23' day of June 2002 after which date the personal
representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claim for which he has
then had notice.

2 0 0 2 00 0O 9 6 G G



