PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

—7 WESTERN
a AUSTRALIAN
g GOVERNMENT tt

PERTH, FRIDAY, 28 JUNE 2002 No. 116

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM
© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

CONTENTS
PART 1
Page
Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976—Agriculture and Related
Resources Protection (Declared Animals) Amendment Regulations 2002..............cccc.eeee... 3038-41
Associations Incorporation Act 1987—Associations Incorporation Amendment Regulations
(INO. 2) 2002......cuteieeiiiieeeieee et e eette e e eteeeatreeeetseeeesseaeasssaeasssaeassssesassssasesssseesassseeessssasennnn 3050-2
Beekeepers Act 1963—Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 2002 3041-2
Bulk Handling Act 1967—Bulk Handling Act Amendment Regulations 2002 3042-3
Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943—Companies (Co-operative) (Fees) Regulations 2002 ... 3052-4
Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947—(Great Southern Towns) Country Water Area
Amendment Order 2002...........c.uuviiiiieiiiiciiiiie e et e e e e e e e e e e e a e e e e e e aaraaaeaeaeannaraaes 3118-20
Criminal Investigation (Identifying People) Act 2002—Criminal Investigation (Identifying
People) Regulations 2002............coooeeeiiiiiiiiiiiii 3103-5
Dangerous Goods (Transport) Act 1998—
Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Explosives by Road and Rail) Amendment Regulations
2002 .ttt e e et — e e —ee e e et —te e e —aeeei—aeeaetbaeeeaabaeeeaaaeeeebaeeearreeearens 3085-6
Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Road and Rail) Amendment Regulations 2002 3086-7
Employment Agents Act 1976—Employment Agents Amendment Regulations 2002........... 3054-5
Energy Operators (Powers) Act 1979—Energy Operators (Western Power Corporation)
(Charges) Amendment By-1aws 2002 ..........coccoiiiiiiiiiiieeeieeiiiieeee e eeeeeieeeee e e eeeetaeee e e e e e eeanneees 3064-5
Exotic Diseases of Animals Act 1993—Exotic Diseases (General) Amendment Regulations
B2 0102 SRR SRRSOt 3043-4
Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961—
Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Dangerous Goods Handling and Storage)

Amendment Regulations 2002...........ueiiiiiiiiriiiriniiieeniiee ettt et e e e 3084-5

Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Explosives) Amendment Regulations 2002 .............. 3082-3
Firearms Act 1973—Firearms Amendment Regulations 2002 .............cccceevvveeeeeeeeiiinneeeeeenn. 3097-8
Fish Resources Management Act 1994—Fish Resources Management Amendment

Regulations (INO. 7) 2002 .........cooiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeee ettt eeeeeeeaeeeaaaaaasaaassesssessaassassssasaanrees 3065-7
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—
Hospitals and Health Services (Directions for Reorganisation of Hospital Boards)

InStrument 2002.........oooiiiiiiiiee e e e e e e e e e e e e aeeeeeennnraaes 3074-6
Hospitals and Health Services (Hospital Boards Appointments) Instrument 2002......... 3069-70
Hospitals and Health Services (Reorganisation of Hospital Boards) Notice 2002 ........... 3070-3
Hospitals and Health Services (WA Country Health Service) Abolition Notice 2002...... 3077
Hospitals and Health Services (WA Country Health Service Appointments)

INStrument 2002.........cooiiiiiiiiiiiiee e e e e e e e e baa e e e e e e erarbaaaeaeaeennraaes 3076-7
Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978—Land Valuers Licensing Amendment Regulations 2002 3056-7
Liquor Licensing Act 1988—Liquor Licensing Amendment Regulations 2002...................... 3105-6
Local Government Act 1995—

Local Government (Administration) Amendment Regulations 2002..............cccceuvvveeennn. 3079-81
Local Government (Functions and General) Amendment Regulations 2002 .... 3081-2
Mining Act 1978—Mining Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2002............ccooevvvvvveeeeeeeeccnnnnnnn.. 3087-9
Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973—Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment
Regulations 2002 .......ccuiiiiiiiiiiiie ettt e et e e st e e st e e e abaeeeabeeesnaaaeas 3057-8
Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984—Occupational Safety and Health Amendment
Regulations (INO. 5) 2002 .........uueiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeeiiite e e e e e eeirteeeeeeeesitaaeeeeeeaeesssareeeeeeesssssssseeeens 3121
Optometrists Act 1940—Optometrists Registration Board Amendment Rules 2002 ............ 3078
Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994—Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers
Amendment Regulations 2002...........ccoecivrieeeeiiiiiiiieiee e eeeeeiee e e e eeeeetaeeee e e e e e e e e e e e e eaaaees 3101-2

PTO




3036 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

Page
Pay-roll Tax Assessment Act 1971—Pay-roll Tax Assessment Amendment Regulations
(INO. 2) 2002 ...veieeiriee ettt eete e ettt e e et e e e etbe e e eetaaeeeetaaeeeeaabeeeearaeeetreeeearaeeenareeeenaraeeens 3110-1
Pearling Act 1990—Pearling (General) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002.. 3068-9
Petroleum Act 1967—Petroleum Amendment Regulations 2002 .............cc.ccoovvivvveeneennn. 3090-1
Petroleum Pipelines Act 1969—Petroleum Pipelines Amendment Regulations 2002 3095-6
Petroleum (Registration Fees) Act 1967—Petroleum (Registration Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2002........ccoiiiiiiiiieiiiie ettt e et e et e e st e e et eesenbbeesebbeeeentee 3091-2
Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1982—Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Amendment
Regulations 2002........ccoiiiiiiiiie ittt ettt e e st e e st eeeenbbeessbbeeeennee 3092-4
Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Registration Fees Act 1982—Petroleum (Submerged
Lands) Registration Fees Amendment Regulations 2002 .........ccccceeeeeeieiiiiieeeeeceeeciiieeeeeeane 3094-5
Plant Diseases Act 1914—Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002 3044-5
Police Act 1892—Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2002............ccccovveeeeiiieiiiineeeeeeeeeenns 3099
Proclamations—
Criminal Investigation (Identifying People) Act 2002—6 of 2002 .........ccvvvveeeeeeecnveeeeeenn. 3037
Machinery of Government (Planning and Infrastructure) Amendment Act 2002—7 of
2002 ..ttt ettt e ettt e ettt e e ettt e e e abt e e e e bbee e e bbeeeebbaeeehbaeeenbaeestaeeeas 3037
Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992—Rates and Charges (Rebates and
Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2002 .........ccceiiiiiiiiiiiiiniiieeniieeeieee e 3111-2
Road Traffic Act 1974—
Road Traffic (Events on Roads) Amendment Regulations 2002 .........c.cccceeevviiierieeennnnen. 3112-3
Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2002.... 3113-5
Road Traffic (Vehicle Standards) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002 3116-8
Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987—Rottnest Island (Management Plan) Notice 2002 ....... 3106-8
Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996—Security and Related Activities
(Control) Amendment Regulations 2002.........ccccciiiiriiiiiniiiieiniiieeniiieeeiieeeeireeeeseeeeesiieee e 3100-1
Seeds Act 1981—Seeds Amendment Regulations 2002 ..........cceeeeieeieiiivveeeeeeeeciiieeeeee e 3045-7
State Enterprises (Commonwealth Tax Equivalents) Act 1996—State Enterprises
(Commonwealth Tax Equivalents) (Application) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002.... 3108-10
Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968—Enzootic Diseases Amendment Regulations
(VDL 2) 2002 ...iieiniiiee ettt ettt e ettt e e ettt e e ettt e e sttt e e e hbt e e e eabt e e e abb e e e eabb e e e ebbeeesabaeeeabaeeens 3048-50
Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970—Stock (Identification and Movement)
Amendment Regulations 2002.........ccooiuiiiiiiiiiiiiieiiiiie ettt e eite e et e sibre e e e e 3047-8
Transport Co-ordination Act 1966—Transport Co-ordination Amendment Regulations
(VDL 2) 2002 ...eiieiiiiee ettt ettt ettt e ettt e e ettt e e ettt e e et e e ettt e e e abt e e e abb e e e ettt e e e bt e e e sabaeeeabaeeeas 3115
Travel Agents Act 1985—Travel Agents Amendment Regulations 2002 ...........ccceeevuveeennnnen. 3059-60
Weights and Measures Act 1915—Weights and Measures Amendment Regulations 2002 ... 3060-3
PART 2
AGTICUITUTE ..ottt ettt e e et e e e et e e s sabbeeseabbeeesabbeeesntesnraeennnee 3122
Consumer and Employment Protection 3122
Fisheries.......ccccoevviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii e 3122-6
Health .....coooviviiiiiiiieieeees 3126
Heritage .....ccccevviveeiviiiiiiiiieeieeee, 3126-7
Housing and Works ........cccceevvieeennnen. 3127
JUSEICE .o 3127
Local Government.............ccccvveeeeennnn. 3127-8
Minerals and Petroleum..................... 3128-9
Planning and Infrastructure.............. 3130
Police.....ooovviiiiiiiiie 3130-1
Public Notices—Deceased Estates..... 3133-4
Racing, Gaming and Liquor ............... 3132
Regional Development 3131
Treasury and Finance 3132

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE

© State of Western Australia

This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.




28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3037

— PART 1 —

PROCLAMATIONS

AA101*
CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION (IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) ACT 2002
6 of 2002
PROCLAMATION
WESTERN AUSTRALIA By His Excellency Lieutenant General John Murray
John Sanderson, Sanderson, Companion of the Order of Australia,
Governor. Governor of the State of Western Australia.

LS]

I, the Governor, acting under section 2 of the Criminal Investigation (Identifying
People) Act 2002, and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix the
day after the day on which this proclamation is published in the Government Gazette
as the day on which that Act, except for Parts 4, 5, 6 and 7 and Schedule 2 clauses 1,
3 and 5(2), comes into operation.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 25t June 2002.
By Command of the Governor,

M. H. ROBERTS, Minister for Police and Emergency Services.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN !

AA102*

MACHINERY OF GOVERNMENT (PLANNING AND
INFRASTRUCTURE) AMENDMENT ACT 2002

7 of 2002
PROCLAMATION
WESTERN AUSTRALIA By His Excellency Lieutenant General John Murray
John Sanderson, Sanderson, Companion of the Order of Australia,
Governor. Governor of the State of Western Australia.

LS]

I, the Governor, acting under section 2 of the Machinery of Government (Planning
and Infrastructure) Amendment Act 2002, and with the advice and consent of the
Executive Council, fix 1 July 2002 as the day on which that Act comes into operation.

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 25t June 2002.
By Command of the Governor,

ALANNAH, MacTIERNAN, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure.

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN !




3038

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

AGRICULTURE

AG301*
Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976

Agriculture and Related Resources
Protection (Declared Animals) Amendment
Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Agriculture and Related
Resources Protection (Declared Animals) Amendment
Regulations 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Agriculture and
Related Resources Protection (Declared Animals)
Regulations 1985*.

[* Reprinted as at 4 January 2000.
For amendments to 11 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 11 and Gazette
14 May 2002.]

4. Regulation 13 amended

Regulation 13(3) is deleted and the following subregulation is
inserted instead —

13

(3) A permit relating to the keeping of category A6 birds
must not specify a date of expiry that is more than
2 years after the date of issue of the permit.

S. Regulation 14 amended

(1) Regulation 14 is amended by inserting before “An” the
subregulation designation “(1)”.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3039

(2) At the end of regulation 14 the following subregulation is
inserted —

13

(2) An application for the renewal of a permit issued under
regulation 16 must be made at least 7 days before the
date of expiry specified in the permit.

2

6. Regulation 16 replaced

Regulation 16 is repealed and the following regulations are
inserted instead —

16. Issue or renewal of permit

(1) The Protection Board may, on receipt of an application
under regulation 14 for the issue or renewal of a
permit, and on payment of the fee required by
subregulation (2) to be paid —

(a) 1issue or renew a permit in accordance with the
application;

(b) issue or renew a permit in respect of a lesser
number of animals, or in respect only of
specified animals;

(¢) endorse on any permit issued or renewed such
conditions as to it seem appropriate;

(d) in any permit issued or renewed by it, limit the
number of animals, or of specified animals, that
may be kept pursuant to that permit;

(e) request the applicant to provide further
information relevant to the application.

(2) The fee required to be paid with an application for the
issue or renewal of a permit is —

(a) for a permit to keep rabbits (Oryctolagus
cuniculus) for commercial purposes — $200;

(b) for a permit to keep birds listed in
Schedule 3 — nil;

(c) for a permit to keep any other birds — $30 per
annum for the period for which the permit is to
be issued or renewed; and

(d) in any other case — $15.
16A. Revocation of permits

The Protection Board may revoke a permit if the holder
of the permit —
(a) does not comply with a condition or limitation
endorsed on the permit; or

(b) no longer keeps the animals covered by the
permit.

2



3040

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

Schedule 2 amended

Schedule 2 is amended by deleting item 3.

Schedule 3 inserted

After Schedule 2 the following Schedule is inserted —

Schedule 3 — Category A6 birds that are exempt
from permit fees

Common Name
Canary, Yellow-fronted; Green Singing Finch
Cockatoo, Sulphur-crested
Conure, Jandaya
Conure, Sun

Dove, Collared; Collared Turtle-dove; Indian
Ring Dove; Barbary Dove (fawn or white
variations)

Dove, Namaqua; Cape Dove
Dove, Ruddy Ground; Talpacoti
Fody, Madagascan Red; Madagascar Weaver

Goose, Egyptian

Greenfinch; European Greenfinch

Lovebird, Black-collared

Lovebird, Black-winged; Abyssinian Lovebird
Lovebird, Fischer’s

Lovebird, Grey-headed; Madagascar Lovebird
Lovebird, Masked

Lovebird, Nyasa

Lovebird, Peach-faced

Lovebird, Red-faced

Mannikin, Bronze-winged; Bronze Mannikin;
Hooded Weaver

Mannikin, Chestnut; Tri-coloured Mannikin;
Black-headed Munia; Black-headed Nun

Mannikin, Nutmeg; Spice Finch; Spotted
Munia; Scaly-breasted Munia

Munia, White-headed

Munia, White-rumped; Bengalese Mannikin
Parakeet, Alexandrine

Parakeet, Plum-headed

Parakeet, Red-fronted; Red-fronted Kakariki

Parakeet, Rose-ringed; Indian or African
Ringneck Parrot or Parakeet

Parakeet, Yellow-fronted; Yellow-fronted
Kakariki

[r. 16]

Scientific Name
Serinus mozambicus
Cacatua galerita
Aratinga jandaya
Aratinga solstitialis

Streptopelia decaocto
Oena capensis
Columbina talpacoti

Foudia
madagascariensis

Alopchen aegyptiacus
Carduelis chloris
Agapornis swinderniana
Agapornis taranta
Agapornis fischeri
Agapornis cana
Agapornis personata
Agapornis lilianae
Agapornis roseicollis
Agapornis pullaria

Lonchura cucullata
Lonchura malacca

Lonchura punctulata
Lonchura maja
Lonchura striata
Psittacula eupatria
Psittacula cyanocephala

Cyanoramphus
novaezelandiae

Psittacula krameri

Cyanoramphus auriceps



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3041

By Command of the Governor,

Common Name
Parrot, Meyer’s; Brown Parrot
Partridge, Chukar; Chukor or Chukka

Partridge

Pheasant, Ring-necked
Pheasant, Silver
Quail, Japanese
Scaup, New Zealand
Shelduck, Paradise

Silverbill, Indian; White-throated Munia;

Common Silverbill
Sparrow, Java; Paddy Finch

Sparrow, Paradise; Aberdeen Finch;

Red-headed Amadina

Strawberry Finch, Red; Red Munia; Red or
Indian Avadavat; Tiger Finch; Red Waxbill

Waxbill, Common; St Helena Waxbill
Weaver, Cut-throat; Cut-throat Finch; Ribbon

Finch

Weaver, Grenadier; Red Bishop; Orange
Bishop Weaver; Northern Red Bishop Weaver

Whydah, White-winged

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

AG302*

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Beekeepers Act 1963

Scientific Name
Poicephalus meyeri

Alectoris chukar
Phasianus colchicus
Lophura nycthemera
Coturnix japonica
Aythya novaeseelandiae

Tadorna variegata

Lonchura malabarica
Padda oryzivora

Amadina erythrocephala

Amandava amandava
Estrilda astrild

Amadina fasciata

Euplectes orix

Euplectes albonotatus

2

Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 2002

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Beekeepers Amendment

Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.



3042

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Beekeepers
Regulations 1963%*.

[* Reprinted as at 23 April 1999.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 29.]

Third Schedule amended

The Third Schedule is amended as follows:

(a) initem 1 row 1 by deleting “$37.10” and inserting
instead —

“$38.10 7

(b) initem 1 row 2 by deleting “$70.10” and inserting
instead —

“$72.00

(c) initem I row 3 by deleting “$114.00” and inserting
instead —

“ $117.00 7
(d) initem 2 by deleting “$14.50” and inserting instead —
“ $1490 7.

By Command of the Governor,

AG303*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Bulk Handling Act 1967

Bulk Handling Act Amendment
Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Bulk Handling Act
Amendment Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3043

3.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Bulk Handling
Act Regulations 1967%*.

[* Reprinted as at 25 June 1997.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 35.]

Regulation 28 amended

Regulation 28(¢) is amended by deleting “$220” and inserting
instead —

“$247.50 .

By Command of the Governor,

AG304*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Exotic Diseases of Animals Act 1993

Exotic Diseases (General) Amendment
Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Exotic Diseases (General)
Amendment Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Exotic Diseases
(General) Regulations 1970%*.

[* Published in Gazette 24 June 1970, p. 1824-9.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 92-3.]



3044

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

Regulation 13E amended

Regulation 13E(4) is amended by deleting “$100” and inserting
instead —

“ $184.00 .

By Command of the Governor,

AG305*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Plant Diseases Act 1914

Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations

(No. 2) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Plant Diseases
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Plant Diseases
Regulations 1989%*.

[* Reprinted as at 17 March 2000.
For amendments to 11 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 455-6, and
Gazette 19 April 2002.]

Schedule 2 replaced

Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —

Schedule 2
[r. 9]
Fees $
General inspection inside normal or shift hours —
(a) At an inspection point, per 15 minute unit 18.00



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3045

Fees
(b)  Away from an inspection point —
per 15 minute unit within 2 hours from the
commencement of the inspection
for each additional contiguous 15 minute unit beyond
2 hours for the rest of the working period

PLUS an additional service charge when the
inspection is more than 50 km away from an
inspection point

General inspection contiguous with normal or shift
hours —

(a)  Atan inspection point, per 15 minute unit
(b) Away from an inspection point —

per 15 minute unit within 2 hours from the
commencement of the inspection

for each additional contiguous 15 minute unit beyond
2 hours for the rest of the working period

PLUS an additional service charge when the
inspection is more than 50 km away from an
inspection point
Call out, inspection and travel —
(a) At an inspection point —

for the first 2 hours

for each additional 15 minute unit
(b)  Away from an inspection point —

for the first 2 hours

for each additional 15 minutes

PLUS an additional service charge when the
inspection is more than 50 km away from an
inspection point

Documentation assessment fee

Laboratory analysis of plants

By Command of the Governor,
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

AG306*

Seeds Act 1981

Seeds Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

28.00

18.00

56.00

24.00

32.00

24.00

70.00

232.00
29.00

312.00
30.00

70.00
12.50
22.73

These regulations may be cited as the Seeds Amendment

Regulations 2002.

2



3046

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

28 June 2002

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Seeds
Regulations 1982%*.

[* Reprinted as at 20 August 1999.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 306.]

Regulation 15 amended

Regulation 15 is amended as follows:

(a) in subregulation (2) by deleting “$353” and inserting

instead —
“ $363 7
(b) in subregulation (6) by deleting “$220” and inserting
instead —
“ 8226

Seventh Schedule replaced

The Seventh Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is

inserted instead —

Seventh Schedule

Seed analysis and report fees

$
1. Fees for the analysis of a seed sample

provided under section 25 of the Act and for

a report of the result of the analysis are —

Pure seed content analysis; group 1 .............. 46.00
Pure seed content analysis; group 2 .............. 58.00
Pure seed content analysis; group 3 .............. 70.00
Pure seed content analysis; group 4 .............. 82.00

The pure seed content analysis group is displayed in column 6
of the First Schedule.

Germination analysis, group 1 .........cccccueenee. 46.00
Germination analysis, group 2 .........cccecveenue.. 51.00
Germination analysis, group 3 .........cccccveeneee. 56.00

The germination analysis group is displayed in column 7
of the First Schedule.

Pure seed content analysis of chaffy seed ..... 81.15
Cultivar determination by fluorescence test .. 50.00
Cultivar determination by grow-on test ........ 113.00
Moisture content determination .................... 45.20

Pest or disease test ....oovuvvvvveeiiviieieieeee e 50.00

[r. 13]



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3047

$

Weed seed presence test .........coveeveeveenveennen. 47.00

Caryopsis presence test ........cceeevveerveereveennne. 45.20

Pigmented seed content ............cccceeevveeennen. 32.00

Number of seeds (per unit volume) .............. 42.00

Seed identification ...........ccoeveeveerivereerieennnnns 21.00

AdMIXTULE ..ot 67.80

Cultivar ID by Mass Spectrometry ............... 60.00

Cultivar ID by DNA Microsatellite .............. 120.00

ISTA Certificate Base Fee .......cccovevvenennnen. 30.00

A0 10 G I S 120.00

Weighted Replicates .........cccccvvevvveeiiiennnennne. 58.00
2. Fee payable for an additional copy of an

analysis report (the first copy of which is

covered by the fee set out in item 1) ............. 11.00
3. Fee payable for an additional copy of any

other report under the Act .......cccceeeevvrivennnnnne 11.00
4, Fee payable for a Shed Fax

(DT PAZE) weevvverreeieerieieenieeienieesreseesneenne e 4.00

2

By Command of the Governor,

AG307*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970

Stock (Identification and Movement)
Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Stock (Identification and
Movement) Amendment Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.



3048 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Stock
(Identification and Movement) Regulations 1972%.

[* Reprinted as at 10 March 2000.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 325.]

4. Schedule 2 replaced
Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —
Schedule 2
Item Reg. Service Fee
$
1. Information concerning a registered
brand —
(a) singlebrand.............. no charge
(b) 2 — 200 brands or
l—10pages............. 13.90
(c) 201 — 1 500 brands or
11—200pages........... 28.75

(d) aprinted copy of more

than 1 500 brands or

200pages. ... 144.00
(e) an electronic copy of

information by way of a

computer disc of more

than 1 500 brands . . ........ 143.00

2. 14(2)  Application to register a brand . . . . . . 46.00

3. 16 Provision of a duplicate certificate . . . 15.60
4, 17(2)  Application to transfer a registered

brand.......... ... ... L 46.00

5. 18 Application to re-register a brand . . . . 46.00

By Command of the Governor,
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

AG308*
Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968

Enzootic Diseases Amendment Regulations
(No. 2) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Enzootic Diseases
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3049

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Enzootic
Diseases Regulations 1970%*.

[* Reprinted as at 13 August 1999.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 323-4.]

4. Fourth Schedule replaced

The Fourth Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

Fourth Schedule
1. Charges for inspection of Stock being imported or exported
(regulations 28 and 31) —
Charges
$
A. General inspection inside normal or shift hours —
(1) At an inspection point, per 15 minute unit 18.00
Minimum charge 36.00
(i1) Away from an inspection point —
per 15 minute unit, within 2 hours from the
commencement of the inspection 28.00

for each additional contiguous 15 minute unit
beyond 2 hours for the rest of the working period 18.00

Minimum charge 84.00

PLUS an additional service charge when the
inspection is more than 50 km away from an

inspection point 84.00
B. General inspection contiguous with normal or shift
hours —
(i) At an inspection point, per 15 minute unit 24.20
Minimum charge 48.50

(i1)) Away from an inspection point —
per 15 minute unit, within 2 hours from the
commencement of the inspection 35.00

for each additional contiguous 15 minute unit
beyond 2 hours for the rest of the working period 24.00

PLUS an additional service charge when the
inspection is more than 50 km away from an
inspection point 105.00

C. Call out, inspection and travel —
(i) At an inspection point —

for the first 2 hours 232.00

thereafter for each additional 15 minute unit 29.00
(i1) Away from an inspection point —

for the first 2 hours 312.00

thereafter for each additional 15 minutes 30.00



3050 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002
$

PLUS an additional service charge when the

inspection is more than 50 km away from an
inspection point 110.00

2. Charges for supply of medicine, per animal —

Body weight up to 35 kg 0.50
36 — 100 kg 1.55
101 — 300 kg 3.60
301 — 600 kg 7.20
more than 600 kg 9.25
Minimum charge 20.00

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION

CE301*

Associations Incorporation Act 1987

Associations Incorporation Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Associations
Incorporation Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Associations
Incorporation Regulations 1988*.

[* Reprinted as at 28 November 1997.
For amendments to 29 May 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 25.]



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3051

4.

10.

Schedule 2 replaced

Schedule 2 is deleted and the following Schedule is inserted

instead —

Schedule 2

FEES

Application for approval of purpose of an
association under section 4(1)(f) ......cceevvvreeercrrenenne

Application for incorporation of an association
under SECtion S(1) .ocvvvvveeviecieriierieeee e

Lodgment of request to Minister to review decision
Of COMMIUSSIONET ..c..eeuvevieniiieniieienenieeee e

(a) Lodgment of notice of special resolution
setting out particulars of alteration of rules of
an association under section 17 ..........cccceenee.

(b) Where alteration of rules has effect to change
name of an association, on approval of change
of name and issue of certificate of
incorporation on change of name under
SECtION 18(6) vevvvvieeiieiieeiie e

(¢) Where alteration of rules has effect to change
objects or purposes of an association, on
approval of the alteration under section 19 .....

Lodgment of application for extension of period
for holding an annual general meeting under
SECHION 23(1) wvvieiiieiiieeiieeieee et

Lodgment of application for approval of variation
of provisions of rules of an association relating to
distribution of surplus property upon winding up
under SECtion 33(4) ..vvvveeiererieeieeie e

Lodgment of distribution plan under
SECLION 33 (6) vovvvereeieeiieieeie e e ere e

Inspection of document lodged with Commissioner
under Section 37(2)(2) cveeeveerverreereerieneeere e e

Issue of uncertified copy of, or extract from
document lodged with Commissioner —

(a) where fee payable under item 8 for
inspection of the document has been paid, for
€ACh PAZE .ooviiieecieee e

(b) where fee payable under item 8 for inspection
of the document has not been paid —

(1) for the first page ......ccoceevveevviecieeeiieenen,
(i) for each additional page ..........c..ccveeveeneee.

Issue of certified copy of, or extract from
document lodged with Commissioner —

(a) for the first PAge ....ccevvvevveeireieeieeeereeee e
(b) for each additional page .........c.cccceeeuervrrireennns

30.00

100.00

30.00

16.25

16.25

16.25

30.00

30.00

30.00

6.25

1.25

6.25
1.25

8.75
1.25

[r. 16]



3052 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

11. Application for certificate of Commissioner under
SECHION 38 .ottt 8.75

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

CE302*
Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943

Companies (Co-operative) (Fees)
Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 409(3) of the
Act.
1. Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Companies (Co-operative)
(Fees) Regulations 2002.
2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. Interpretation

In these regulations —

“Tenth Schedule” means the Tenth Schedule to the Companies
(Co-operative) Act 1943*.

[* Reprinted as at 14 January 2000.
For subsequent amendments see 2001 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia, Table 1, p. 60.]
4. Tenth Schedule replaced

The Tenth Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

Tenth Schedule

Table of fees to be paid to Commissioner

1. On submission of the memorandum of a company .......... 215.50
2. For the registration of a company ...........ccccceveverveervernennn. 215.50



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3053

10.
11.
12.
13.

14.

15.

16.
17.
18.

19.

20.

For every authorisation by the Governor under the
Provisos to SeCtion 28(7) ..ccveveereerverierieeierre e

For every approval of the Commissioner to the change
of name of @ COMPANY ......cccveevevviiviieiiieceeeee e,

On lodgment of request to the Commissioner to exercise
the powers conferred by section 297, 299 or 300
(Application fEe) ......ccceceerveerierieiierierreee e

For every act done by the Commissioner as representing
a defunct company under section 297, 299 or 300
(Application fee) ........cccevieririerieireeeeeeeeeeee e

On late lodgment, registration or filing of any document
under this Act, in addition to any other fee —

(a) iflodged, registered or filed within one month
after the period prescribed by law .........cccccvevuvenneene

(b) iflodged, registered or filed more than one month
after the period prescribed by law, in addition to
the fee payable in paragraph (a) .......ccccceveeeeeeneene

The Commissioner, if satisfied that just cause existed for
the late lodgment, may waive in whole or in part the
additional fee under paragraph (b).

For every application for the reservation of a name .........

For every application for extending the time of such
TESETVATION ..veeenientiiieiiteeeiete sttt st et et bt eee e eee i

On filing any statement in lieu of prospectus ...................
On filing any ProSPeCtus ........cccceerveervervrereervenireereesneenns
On filing an annual return of a company .............cceeueeneee..

For every application for the consent of the Minister
under Section 46(3a)(Q) ..eevvveveereerierienienre e

For every application for the consent of the Minister
under section 173(2) coveeeevieeii et

For every application for exemption from the provisions
0f SECtion 369(1) .oooevieiiiiieeee e

On lodging any other application ............cccceeveveeercreennnens
For every certificate issued by the Commissioner ...........

For every inquiry as to the availability of any name
sought to be adopted by a company —

for every name the subject of the inquiry ..........ccceeeuneees

For production at the Stamp Duties Office of documents
lodged by or in relation to a company ............cccceeeeveenneee.

(a)  For every inspection of a document or documents
filed or lodged with the Commissioner by or in
relation to a company or of any transparency or
reproduction of such document or documents .......

(b)  For the supply of an uncertified copy or print of
any document where the fee prescribed by
paragraph (a) has been paid —

For each page of the copy or print ...........cccecveennene

62.50

62.50

33.00

62.50

11.30

33.00

62.50

62.50
21.50
7.00

7.00

11.50

6.00

1.00



3054 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

$
(c)  For the supply on an uncertified copy or print of a
document without inspection having been
made —
For the first 2 pages of the copy or print ................ 4.00
For each additional page ..........cccceevvevvvevieeieenreennen. 1.00

(d)  For every inspection of any document filed or

lodged with the Commissioner not being an

inspection in respect of which

paragraph (a) applies .......cceeververreereercrerieeie e 2.00
(e)  For every written inquiry involving a search for

any document filed or lodged by or in relation to a

COMPANY .eveeerreerrrerereeaereesreereeessseesseessssessssesssseeans 8.20
()  For the supply of an uncertified copy or print of a

document where the fee prescribed by

paragraph (e) has been paid —

For each page of the copy or print ..........cccceeveennene 1.00

21. (a) For certifying a copy of or extract from any
document filed or lodged with the Commissioner
of which a typewritten or printed copy is supplied

by an applicant —
FOr one page ......ccceevveeeeeeeeceeeie et 5.15
For each additional page ...........ccoeevveevverencieenieenen. 2.00

(b)  For the supply of a certified copy or print of any
document filed or lodged with the

Commissioner —
FOr one page .....ccoeeevveeeeiiieeieeciee e 7.20
For each additional page ..........ccceevvvevviencieeennens 4.00

22.  For the deposit of any book or document under
section 288 (provided that the total fees to be paid by a
liquidator under section 288 in respect of any one
company shall not exceed $10) ......ccoevvveririereneieieenen 3.00

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

CE303*
Employment Agents Act 1976

Employment Agents Amendment
Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Employment Agents
Amendment Regulations 2002.



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3055

2.

13

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Employment
Agents Regulations 1976%*.

[* Reprinted as at 30 September 1997.]

Regulation 10 amended

Regulation 10(1) is repealed and the following subregulation is
inserted instead —

(1

The fees set out in the Table to this subregulation shall
be paid with respect to the matters set out opposite
them in that Table.

Table
$

Grant of a general licence for a period not
exceeding the prescribed period .........c.ccvvevvvennene 572.00
Renewal of a general licence for a period not
exceeding the prescribed period .........c.ccvevvveneee 166.25
Grant of a restricted licence for a period not
exceeding the prescribed period .........c.ccvevvvennee. 572.00
Renewal of a restricted licence for a period not
exceeding the prescribed period .........c.cccvevevennenne 166.25
Renewal of a general or a restricted licence for a
period of 3 YEars .......cceeveevieciieieeieeeee e 166.25
Application for an interim licence ..............c..cu..... 17.30
Duplicate liCence ........ceevveeievieniiiiecie e 28.00

Application for transfer of licence under

SECHION 19(6) .veeeereeiiiecieeeiee ettt 30.50
The penalty prescribed under section 13(2) of the

Act for any late application for the renewal of a

licence is 25% of the fee due for the granting of

that renewal.

Inspection of record under section 51 of the
ACT et 6.65

Inspection of the Register ...........ccecvveevieeirrcreennns 13.30

Copy (certified or uncertified) of an individual
registration in the Register —

FIrSE PAZE vvvvvveenreeie et 13.30
each subsequent page ..........cccocevreeerveennnne, 2.70

Copy (certified or uncertified) of all registrations
N the REGISIET ...ovvvveieeeiieieeice e 162.00

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3056 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

CE304*
Land Valuers Licensing Act 1978

Land Valuers Licensing Amendment
Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Land Valuers Licensing
Amendment Regulations 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Land Valuers
Licensing Regulations 1979*.

[* Reprinted as at 31 March 2000.
For amendments to 29 May 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 186-7.]

4. Schedule replaced
The Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —
Schedule
[r. 4]
$
1. Fee for a licence —
(a) for a period of not more than 6 months ......... 57.50
(b) for a period of more than 6 months but not
more than one year ............cccccceeevviiiiiinnne. 115.00
(c) for a period of more than one year but not
more than 18 months ... 170.50
(d) for a period of more than 18 months but not
more than 2 years ...........cccoceevvvviieiciinnnenne, 230.00
(e) for a period of more than 2 years but not
more than 2 years and 6 months .................... 287.50
(f) for a period of more than 2 years and
6 months but not more than 3 years .............. 340.50
2. Fee for renewal of licence ........c.ceceveverveninennnn 340.50
3. Examination fee ........cccooeverenienienineneneeceee 39.00

4. Fee to INSPECt TEZISIET ..ovvvevreeerieereeereeveeeeree e 10.50



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3057

$
5. Fee for certificate as to an individual registration
in the register —
FIESE PAGE cevveevieeieeeee e 10.50
each subsequent page ..........ccceevveeeeeveeieenens 2.00
6. Fee for certificate as to all registrations in the
TEZISTET oo 124.00

2

By Command of the Governor,

CE305%

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment

Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicle Dealers
(Licensing) Amendment Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Motor Vehicle
Dealers (Licensing) Regulations 1974%*.

[* Reprinted as at 28 May 1996.]

Third Schedule replaced

The Third Schedule is deleted and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

Third Schedule
[r. 7]

Application for a dealer’s licence or renewal of a dealer’s
licence for the period prescribed by regulation 6A —
(a) ifthe dealer only specifies single premises to be

registered in the dealer’s name under section 21 in
relation to the licence . . ...................... 907



3058 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

$
(b) ifthe dealer specifies 2 or more premises to be
registered in the dealer’sname . . .............. 453
plus
in respect of each premises to be registered in the
dealer’s name under section 21 in relation to the
licenceafurther............................ 453
2. Application for yard manager’s licence or renewal of
yard manager’s licence for the period prescribed by
regulation 6A .. ... ... .. 232
3. Application for salesman’s licence or renewal of salesman’s
licence for the period prescribed by regulation 6A .. ....... 157
4, Application for car market operator’s licence or renewal of
car market operator’s licence —
(a) if the operator only specifies single premises to be
registered in relation to the licence . . ........... 907
(b) if the operator specifies 2 or more premises to be
registered in the operator’sname .. ............. 453
plus
in respect of each further premises to be registered
in relation to the licence, a further . ............. 453
5. Application for certificate of exemption from the Act under
SECtion 30(2) . . oot 76
6 Application for temporary permit under section 30(7) . . . ... 30
7. Individual dealer — changetofirm..................... 76
8 Individual dealer — change to body corporate . ........... 76
9 Firm — change to sole proprietor . . .................... 76
10.  Firm — change to body corporate . . .................... 76
11.  Body corporate change to individual or firm.............. 76
12. Duplicate licence .. .. ..., 24
13.  Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of an individual
registration in the register kept under section 24 of the Act —
firstpage . .....coiii i 11
cach subsequentpage .......................... 2
14.  Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of all
registrations in the register kept under section 24 of the Act.. 141
15. Inspection of register kept under section 24 of the Act . . .. .. 11

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3059

CE306*

Travel Agents Act 1985

Travel Agents Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Travel Agents Amendment
Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Travel Agents
Regulations 1986*.

[* Reprinted as at 20 May 1997.]

Regulation 6 amended

(1) Regulation 6(1) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$666” and inserting
instead —
(13 $683 9’;

(b) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$144” and inserting
instead —
(13 $ 148 9’;

(¢c) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$666” and inserting
instead —
(13 $683 ’,;

(d) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$144” and inserting
instead —
(13 $ 148 9’;

(e) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$1 000 and inserting
instead —
113 $1 026 79;

(f) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$144” and inserting
instead —
(13 $ 148 ’,.

(2) Regulation 6(2) is amended by deleting “$1 440 and inserting
instead —

“ 81477 .



3060 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002
5. Regulation 9 amended
Regulation 9 is amended by deleting “$21.” and inserting
instead —
“ $21.55. .
6. Regulation 10 amended

(1)

2)

Regulation 10(2) is amended by deleting “$10” and inserting
instead —

“ $1030 .

Regulation 10(3) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$10” and inserting
instead —
“ $1030 7

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$10” and inserting
instead —
“ $1030 7

(¢c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$122” and inserting
instead —
“ §$12520 7.

By Command of the Governor,

CE307*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Weights and Measures Act 1915

Weights and Measures Amendment

Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Weights and Measures
Amendment Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3061

3.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Weights and
Measures Regulations 1927*.

[* Published in Gazette 3 June 1927 at p. 1416-48.
For amendments to 12 June May 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 373-5.]

Tables XIII and XIIIB replaced
Tables XIII and XIIIB are deleted and the following Tables are
inserted instead —

TABLE XIII

Fees to be paid for testing, verifying or stamping weights and
measures, and weighing or measuring instruments —

Weights (Mass)

Fee

(a) masses (each not exceeding 20 kg)

$18.00 for each group,
or part of a group, of
5 masses

(b) masses over 20 kg

Based on time taken at
$36.00 per half hour or
part thereof

Measures of Capacity (Volume)

Fee

capacity over 10 t

2. (a) lubricating oil measures, alcoholic $18.00 for each group,
liquor measures or beverage or part of a group, of
measures 10 measures

(b) dispensing measures or graduated $18.00 for each group,
measuring cylinders or part of a group, of
5 measures or cylinders
(c) each measure of capacity not Based on time taken at
specified in paragraph (a) or (b) of $36.00 per half hour or
this item part thereof
Measures of Length or Extension
Fee
3. (a) on initial verification of measures, $18.00 for each group,
each not exceeding 1 m or part of a group, of
5 measures
(b) each measure over 1 m but not
exceeding 20 m $18.00
(c) each measure over 20 m Based on time taken at
$36.00 per half hour or
part thereof
Additional sets of graduation on the same measure at prescribed rates above.
Weighing Instruments
Fee

4. (a) each instrument with weighing

capacity not exceeding 10 t $72.00
(b) each instrument with weighing $72.00

(plus $36.00 for every
10 t or part thereof in
excess of 10 t)




3062

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

28 June 2002

Fee
5. Automatic Weighers, Belt Conveyer Fee based on time taken
Weighers and Totalisers at $36.00 per half hour or
part thereof for each
officer
6. Electronic price computing digital
indicating scales with weighing capacity
not exceeding 75 kg (including
instruments connected to price computing
or ticket printing devices) $27.00
7. Weighing instruments not otherwise
designated —
(a) each instrument with weighing
capacity not exceeding 200 kg $18.00
(b) each instrument with weighing
capacity over 200 kg but not
exceeding 1 000 kg $36.00
(c) each instrument with weighing
capacity over 1 000 kg $72.00
Measuring Instruments
Fee
8. Fixed measuring instruments (capacity)
petroleum systems —
(a) each retail flowmeter $54.00
(b) each wholesale flowmeter of rate not
in excess of 1 000 L per minute $72.00
(c) each wholesale flowmeter of rate in
excess of 1 000 L per minute $144.00
9. Calibrated tanks other than farm
milk tanks —
For each 5 000 L or part thereof
contained in an individual
compartment of each calibrated tank
$72.00
10. Calibrating measures and measuring
instruments —
(a) for each measure or measuring
instrument up to and including 50 L
$36.00
(b) for each measure or measuring Based on time
instrument over 50 L taken at $36.00
per half hour or
part thereof
11. Calibrated farm milk tanks —
For each 250 L of capacity or part
thereof each calibrated tank $18.00
12. Each LPG retail flowmeter $54.00
13. Measuring instruments not otherwise Based on time taken at
designated $36.00 per half hour or
part thereof
General
14.  Subject to a minimum amount of $18.00 being payable in respect of any

matter referred to in this Table, if, after testing, a weight, measure or
instrument is rejected as incorrect, unjust, or otherwise unsuitable, one-half
only of the fee so prescribed with respect to that weight, measure or
instrument may be charged in lieu of the fee in this Table.




28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3063

TABLE XIIIB
Miscellaneous Fees
Fee
1. Registration of public weighbridge $65.50
2. Public weighman’s licence $16.50
3. Scale adjuster’s licence $16.50
4. Scale repairer’s licence $16.50
5. Petroleum products measuring
instrument —
repairer’s registration $16.50
5A.  Charge for examination of applicant for
weighman’s licence or scale repairer’s
licence $65.50
6. Fees chargeable for —
(a) inspector’s time for any service
rendered in carrying out repairs or
adjustment, etc. to instruments or
any waiting time other than time
referred to in paragraph (b) of this $36.00 per half hour or
item part thereof
(b) any waiting time allowed by an
inspector to permit another person to
carry out necessary repairs, etc. $36.00 per half hour or
part thereof
(c) any adjustment to —
(i)  each 20 kg or lesser weight $18.00
(ii) weights above 20 kg Based on time taken at
$36.00 per half hour or
part thereof
(iii) each measure of capacity
not exceeding 50 L $18.00
(d) any distance necessarily travelled by
an inspector —
(i)  for each kilometre not $0.70 (subject to a
exceeding 100 km minimum charge of
$10.00)
(ii) for each kilometre over
100 km $0.35
(e) time involved in the calibration of
any instrument to a degree of
accuracy greater than the degree of
accuracy applied to instruments in
use for trade or the calibration and
certification of instruments used for $36.00 per half hour or
purposes other than trade — part thereof
7. Charges for use of masses provided by
Ministry —
(a) booking of masses of 1 t or more $18.00
(b) hire of masses for each day or part of
a day $18.00 per tonne
(c) testing by inspector of equipment
where masses are used $18.00 per tonne
8. Charge for response to request to provide
report, documentation or any other
information which is additional to Based on time taken at
verification, reverification and testing $18.00 per 15 minutes or
services part thereof

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

2



3064

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

ENERGY

EN301*
Energy Operators (Powers) Act 1979

Energy Operators (Western Power Corporation)
(Charges) Amendment By-laws 2002

Made by the Western Power Corporation with the approval of the
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council.
1. Citation
These by-laws may be cited as the Energy Operators (Western
Power Corporation) (Charges) Amendment By-laws 2002.
2. Commencement

These by-laws come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The by-laws amended

The amendments in these by-laws are to the Energy Operators
(Western Power Corporation) (Charges) By-laws 1996%*.

[* Reprinted as at 20 April 2001.
For amendments to 17 May 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 85.]

4. By-law 9 amended

By-law 9(4)(b) is deleted and the following paragraph is
inserted instead —

13

(b) entitled to pay the reduced meter testing fee
specified in item 6(b) of Schedule 5.

2

5. Schedule 5 replaced
Schedule 5 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —
Schedule 5 — Fees
[by-laws 7 and 9(4)]
Description of fee Amount
I. Non-refundable account establishment fee payable
on the establishment or transfer of an account. . . . $27.50
2. Three phase residential installation —
(a) new installation or replacement of

single phasemeter . . ............... $240.40
(b) installation of subsidiary three phase
meter (each installation) . ........... $148.50



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3065
Description of fee Amount
3. Non-refundable reconnection fee where supply has
been terminated for non-payment of charges or for
any other lawful reason. . .................... $23.50
4, Connection to standard public telephone facility
where supply not independently metered (per day) 30.68 cents
5. Temporary supply connection —
(a) single phase (overhead)............. $300.00
(b) three phase (overhead).............. $390.90
6. Meter testing —
(a) standard meter testingfee........... $152.00
(b) reduced meter testingfee............ $139.80
7. Disconnection of overhead service leads following
unauthorised reconnection . .. ................. $190.00
8. Meter reading where reading requested by
COMSUIMET .+« v v et e te et e e e e e e e e e $19.20
9. Supply of electricity to standard railway crossing
lights (perday) .. ........... ..., 39.22 cents
10. Overdue accountnotices . . ................... $3.80
11. Tariff R1 “time-of-use meter” installation fee . . . . $709.00
The Common Seal of the
[LS]

affixed to these by-laws

)
Western Power Corporation was )
)
)

in the presence of —

DAVID EISZELE, Director.
MARK A. HANDS, Executive Officer.

Approved by the Lieutenant-Governor
and deputy of the Governor,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

FISHERIES

FI301*

Fish Resources Management Act 1994

Fish Resources Management Amendment

Regulations (No. 7) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Fish Resources
Management Amendment Regulations (No. 7) 2002.



3066 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Fish Resources
Management Regulations 1995%*.

[* Reprinted as at 2 March 2001.
For amendments to 7 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 111, and Gazette
26 February and 3 May 2002.]

4. Schedule 1 amended

(1) Schedule 1 Part 1 is amended by deleting in each provision,
referred to in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation the
amount set out in column 2 of that Table and inserting instead
the amount set out in column 3 of that Table.

Table
Item Delete Insert
2 20.00 25.00
3 20.00 25.00
4 300.00 350.00
5 10.00 15.00

(2) Schedule 1 Part 2 is amended as follows:

(a) Dby deleting in Item 17 “(reg. 138)” and inserting
instead —

“ under section 141 of the Act ”’;

(b) by deleting in each provision referred to in column 1 of
the Table to this subregulation the amount set out in
column 2 of that Table in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead the amount set out in column 3 of that

Table.
Table
Item Delete Insert
1 55.00 65.00
1 310.00 360.00
2 55.00 65.00
2 310.00 360.00
3 55.00 65.00
4(a) 25.00 30.00
4(c) 25.00 35.00
4(d) 15.00 20.00
4(e) 20.00 25.00
4(%) 60.00 70.00
5 55.00 65.00

5 210.00 245.00



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3067

Item Delete Insert
6 310.00 360.00
7 300.00 350.00
8 300.00 350.00
8 60.00 70.00
8 350.00 410.00
9 350.00 410.00
10 1 600.00 1 850.00
11 110.00 130.00
11 500.00 580.00
11 55.00 65.00
11 365.00 425.00
12 210.00 245.00
12 55.00 65.00
12 310.00 360.00
13 210.00 245.00
13 55.00 65.00
14 500.00 580.00
15 55.00 65.00
16 100.00 115.00
17 100.00 115.00
18 100.00 115.00
19 500.00 580.00

(3) Schedule 1 Part 3 is amended by deleting in each provision
referred to in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation the
amount set out in column 2 of that Table and inserting instead
the corresponding amount set out in column 3 of that Table.

Table
Item Delete Insert
1(a) 555.00 645.00
1(b) 1110.00 1290.00
1(c) 1 380.00 1 600.00
1(d) 825.00 960.00
1(e) 270.00 315.00
1(f) 270.00 315.00
1(g) 270.00 315.00
2(a) 230.00 270.00

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




3068

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

F1302*

Pearling Act 1990

Pearling (General) Amendment Regulations

(No. 2) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Pearling (General)
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Pearling
(General) Regulations 1991%*.

[* Reprinted as at 26 April 2000.]

Regulation 6 amended

Regulation 6(1) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$1 600.00” and inserting
instead —

“ $1850.00 7

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$275.00” and inserting
instead —

“§$320.00 7

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$275.00” and inserting
instead —

“$320.00 .
Regulation 8 amended

Regulation 8 is amended by deleting “$55.00” in each place
where it occurs and inserting instead —

“ $65.00 .

Regulation 9 amended
Regulation 9 is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “500” and inserting instead —
(13 580 9’;



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3069

(b) by deleting “55” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —

(13 65 9’;
(c) Dbydeleting “310” and inserting instead —
(13 360 9’.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HEALTH

HE301*
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals and Health Services (Hospital Boards
Appointments) Instrument 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 15 of the Act.

1. Citation

This instrument may be cited as the Hospitals and Health
Services (Hospital Boards Appointments) Instrument 2002.

2. Appointment to the East Pilbara Health Service

Michael Mathew Daube, Andrew Mark Chuk and Dr Brian
Lloyd are appointed to constitute the East Pilbara Health
Service.

3. Appointment to the Coral Bay Nursing Post

Michael Mathew Daube, Andrew Mark Chuk and Dr Brian
Lloyd are appointed to constitute the Coral Bay Nursing Post.

4. Appointment to the Kimberley Health Service

Michael Mathew Daube, Andrew Mark Chuk and Dr Brian
Lloyd are appointed to constitute the Kimberley Health Service.

5. Appointment to the Nickol Bay Hospital Board

Michael Mathew Daube, Andrew Mark Chuk and Dr Brian
Lloyd are appointed to constitute the Nickol Bay Hospital
Board.



3070

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

6. Appointment to the Roebourne District Hospital Board

Michael Mathew Daube, Andrew Mark Chuk and Dr Brian
Lloyd are appointed to constitute the Roebourne District
Hospital Board.

7. Appointment to the Wickham District Hospital Board

Michael Mathew Daube, Andrew Mark Chuk and Dr Brian
Lloyd are appointed to constitute the Wickham District Hospital
Board.

8. Appointment to the Varley Nursing Post

Michael Mathew Daube, Andrew Mark Chuk and Dr Brian
Lloyd are appointed to constitute the Varley Nursing Post.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HE302*
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals and Health Services (Reorganisation
of Hospital Boards) Notice 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 16 of the Act.

1. Citation

This notice may be cited as the Hospitals and Health Services
(Reorganisation of Hospital Boards) Notice 2002.

2. Commencement

This notice comes into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. Amalgamation of boards to form new board
The boards mentioned in Schedule 1 Division 1 are reorganised
by amalgamating them to form a new board.

4. Assignment of a corporate name to new board

The new board formed under clause 3 is assigned the corporate
name “WA Country Health Service”.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3071

5. Constitution of WA Country Health Service

The WA Country Health Service is constituted in relation to the
public hospitals mentioned in Schedule 1 Division 2.

Schedule 1 — Formation and constitution of the WA
Country Health Service
[cl. 3 and 5]

Division 1 — Amalgamated boards
Ashburton Health Service
Avon Health Service
Beverley District Hospital Board
Boddington District Hospital Board
Brookton Health Service
Bruce Rock Memorial Hospital Board
Central Great Southern Health Service Board
Coral Bay Nursing Post
Corrigin District Hospital Board
Cunderdin District Hospital Board
Dongara Eneabba Mingenew Health Service Board
Dundas Health Service
East Pilbara Health Service
Esperance Health Service
Gascoyne Health Service
Geraldton Health Service
Kalgoorlie-Boulder Health Service
Kellerberrin Health Services Board of Management
Kimberley Health Service
Kununoppin and Districts Health Service
Laverton and Leonora Health Service
Lower Great Southern Health Service Board
Merredin Health Service
Morawa and Districts Health Service
Mukinbudin Health Service
Mullewa Health Services
Murchison Health Service
Narambeen Health Services Board
Nickol Bay Hospital Board
Northampton Kalbarri Health Services
North Midlands Health Service
Quairading District Hospital Board
Ravensthorpe Health Service
Roebourne District Hospital Board
Southern Cross District Health Service
Upper Great Southern Health Service
Varley Nursing Post
Western Health Service



3072 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

Wickham District Hospital Board
Wyalkatchem-Koorda and Districts Hospital Board
Yalgoo Health Service

Division 2 — Public hospitals in relation to which the WA Country
Health Service is constituted

Albany Regional Hospital
Beverley District Hospital
Boddington District Hospital
Brookton Nursing Home and Nursing Post
Broome District Hospital

Bruce Rock Memorial Hospital
Carnarvon Regional Hospital
Coolgardie Health Centre

Coral Bay Nursing Post

Corrigin District Hospital

Cue Nursing Post

Cunderdin District Hospital
Dalwallinu District Hospital
Denmark District Hospital

Derby Regional Hospital
Dongara Multi-Purpose Health Centre
Dumbleyung District Memorial Hospital
Esperance District Hospital
Exmouth District Hospital
Fitzroy Crossing District Hospital
Geraldton Regional Hospital
Gnowangerup District Hospital
Goomalling District Hospital
Halls Creek District Hospital
Jerramungup Hospital

Kalgoorlie Regional Hospital
Kambalda Nursing Post
Katanning District Hospital
Kellerberrin Memorial Hospital
Kojonup District Hospital
Kondinin District Hospital
Kukerin Nursing Post
Kunnunoppin District Hospital
Kununurra District Hospital

Lake Grace District Hospital
Laverton District Hospital
Leonora District Hospital

Marble Bar Nursing Post



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3073

Meekatharra District Hospital
Menzies Nursing Post

Merredin District Hospital
Moora District Hospital
Morawa District Hospital
Mount Magnet Nursing Post
Mukinbudin Nursing Post
Mullewa District Hospital
Narambeen District Memorial Hospital
Narrogin Regional Hospital
Newman District Hospital
Nickol Bay Hospital

Norseman District Hospital
Northam Regional Hospital
Northampton District Hospital
North Midlands District Hospital
Numbala Nunga Nursing Home
Onslow District Hospital
Paraburdoo District Hospital
Pingelly District Hospital
Plantagenet District Hospital
Port Hedland Regional Hospital
Quairading District Hospital
Ravensthorpe District Hospital
Roebourne District Hospital
Sandstone Nursing Post
Southern Cross District Hospital
Tambellup Nursing Post

Tom Price District Hospital
Varley Nursing Post

Wagin District Hospital
Wickepin Nursing Post
Wickham District Hospital
Williams Medical Centre
Wongan Hills District Hospital
Wyalkatchem-Koorda and Districts Hospital
Wyndham District Hospital
Yalgoo Nursing Post

York District Hospital

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3074

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

HE303*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals and Health Services (Directions
for Reorganisation of Hospital Boards)

Instrument 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 16(4) of

the Act.

1.

Citation

This instrument may be cited as the Hospitals and Health
Services (Directions for Reorganisation of Hospital Boards)
Instrument 2002.

Commencement

This instrument comes into operation immediately after the
reorganisation notice comes into operation.

Definitions

In this instrument —

“commencement day” means the day on which this instrument
comes into operation;

“former board” means a board mentioned in Schedule 1
Division 1 to the reorganisation notice;

“reorganisation notice” means the Hospitals and Health
Services (Reorganisation of Hospital Boards) Notice 2002,

“WA Country Health Service” means the board assigned that
corporate name under clause 4 of the reorganisation notice.

Transfer of assets and liabilities of former boards

It is directed that, on the commencement day —

(a) any real or personal property or moneys vested in,
acquired by, or under control of a former board, and any
other rights of a former board, are transferred to the
WA Country Health Service;

(b) any moneys payable to, or appropriated for the purposes
of, a former board become payable to, or appropriated
for the purposes of, the WA Country Health Service;

(c) all obligations and liabilities of a former board,
including contingent liabilities, become obligations and
liabilities of the WA Country Health Service;



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

5.

(d) any agreement or instrument to which a former board is
a party has effect as if the WA Country Health Service
were substituted for the former board;

(e) all proceedings commenced by or against a former board
and pending on the commencement day are taken to be
proceedings by or against the WA Country Health
Service;

(f) anything done or omitted to be done in relation to the
property, moneys, rights, obligations and liabilities
referred to in paragraphs (a), (b) and (c) before the
commencement day by, to or in respect of a former
board (to the extent that that thing has any force or
effect) is taken to have been done by, to or in respect of
the WA Country Health Service; and

(g) the WA Country Health Service becomes the owner of
all of a former board’s registers, documents, books and
other records, however compiled, recorded or stored,
and of any tape, disc or other device or medium relating
to such records.

Staff of former boards

It is directed that —

(a) on the commencement day, any person employed or
engaged by a former board immediately before that day
ceases to be so employed or engaged and is employed or
engaged by the WA Country Health Service;

(b) the operation of paragraph (a) in relation to a person
does not —

(1) affect the person’s remuneration or terms and
conditions of employment;

(i) prejudice the person’s existing or accrued rights;

(ii)  affect any rights under a superannuation scheme;
or

(iv)  interrupt continuity of service;
and

(c) aperson is not entitled to receive any payment or other
benefit by reason only of having ceased to be employed
or engaged by a former board as a result of

paragraph (a).
References to former board

It is directed that any reference to a former board in any
instrument, contract or legal proceedings made or commenced
before the commencement day is to be read and construed as a
reference to the WA Country Health Service.

Accountable authority

Despite section 54 of the Financial Administration and Audit
Act 1985 it is directed that the WA Country Health Service is



3076

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

the accountable authority of a former board for the purposes of
the report required by section 66 of the Financial
Administration and Audit Act 1985 with respect to the period
from 1 July 2001 to the day immediately preceding the day on
which the reorganisation notice takes effect.

By Command of the Governor,

HE304*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals and Health Services (WA Country
Health Service Appointments) Instrument 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

This instrument may be cited as the Hospitals and Health
Services (WA Country Health Service Appointments)
Instrument 2002.

Commencement

This instrument comes into operation immediately after the
reorganisation notice comes into operation.

Definitions

In this instrument —

“former board” means a board mentioned in Schedule 1
Division 1 to the reorganisation notice;

“reorganisation notice” means the Hospitals and Health
Services (Reorganisation of Hospital Boards) Notice 2002,

“WA Country Health Service” means the board assigned that
corporate name under clause 4 of the reorganisation notice.

Termination of term of tenure

The term of tenure of every member of a former board who
holds office on the coming into operation of this instrument is
terminated.



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3077

S.

Appointment to the WA Country Health Service

Michael Mathew Daube, Andrew Mark Chuk and Dr Brian
Lloyd are appointed to constitute the WA Country Health
Service.

By Command of the Governor,

HE305*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals and Health Services (WA Country

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 8 of the Act.

1.

Health Service) Abolition Notice 2002

Citation

This notice may be cited as the Hospitals and Health Services
(WA Country Health Service) Abolition Notice 2002.
Commencement

This notice comes into operation on 1 July 2002, immediately
after the Hospitals and Health Services (WA Country Health
Service Appointments) Instrument 2002 comes into operation.

Abolition of the WA Country Health Service

The board assigned the corporate name WA Country Health
Service under clause 5 of the Hospitals and Health Services

(Reorganisation of Hospital Boards) Notice 2002 is abolished.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




3078

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

HE306*
Optometrists Act 1940

Optometrists Registration Board Amendment
Rules 2002

Made by The Optometrists Registration Board with the approval of the
Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These rules may be cited as the Optometrists Registration Board
Amendment Rules 2002.

2. The rules amended

The amendment in these rules is to the Optometrists
Registration Board Rules 1941%.

[* Reprinted in Gazette 15 July 1966.
For amendments to 6 May 2002 see 2001 Index to Legislation
of Western Australia, Table 4, p 239.]

3. Rule 30 replaced

Rule 30 is repealed and the following rule is inserted instead —

30. Evidence of qualification — s. 35(1)(d)(ii)

(1) For the purposes of section 35(1)(d)(ii) of the Act, the
following qualifications are prescribed as sufficient to
qualify a person for registration under the Act —

(a) adegree in optometry from a school of
optometry accredited by the Council;

(b) a certificate of competency in optometry issued
by the Council.

(2) Inthis rule —

“Council” means The Optometry Council
(ACN 074 875 111).

Passed by a resolution of The Optometrists Registration Board at a
meeting of the Board held on 4 December 2001.

The Common Seal of

The Optometrists Registration
Board was at the time of the
above resolution affixed in the
presence of — )

ANNE DURACK, Chairman.
COLIN EMMOTT, Registrar.

N N N N

Approved by the Governor,
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3079

LocAL GOVERNMENT

LG301*

Local Government Act 1995

Local Government (Administration)
Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

(1

)

13

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Local Government
(Administration) Amendment Regulations 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Local
Government (Administration) Regulations 1996%*.

[* Published in Gazette 24 June 1996, p. 2799-2826.
For amendments to 6 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 200-1.]

Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3(1) is amended by inserting in the appropriate
alphabetical position the following definition —

13

“relevant person” has the meaning that it has in
section 5.59;

Regulation 7 amended

Regulation 7(1) is amended by deleting “and (3).” and inserting
instead —

“ ,(@B)and (5). .

After regulation 7(4) the following subregulation is inserted —

(5) If, during the time allocated for questions to be raised
by members of the public and responded to, a question
relating to a matter in which a relevant person has an
interest, as referred to in section 5.60, is directed to the
relevant person, the relevant person is to —

(a) declare that he or she has an interest in the
matter; and

(b) allow another person to respond to the question.

2



3080

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

S. Regulation 21 replaced

Regulation 21 is repealed and the following regulation is
inserted instead —

21. Interests that need not be disclosed — s. 5.63(1)(h)

The interests prescribed for the purposes of
section 5.63(1)(h) are as follows —

(a) an interest relating to an allowance to which
section 5.98A or 5.99A refers;

(b) aninterest (not being an interest referred to in
section 5.63(1)) relating to the payment by the
local government of money that the local
government is legally obliged to pay;

(c) an interest that a relevant person has in a matter
that is the subject of a question directed to him
or her during the time allocated for questions to
be raised by members of the public and
responded to at a meeting to which
section 5.24(1)(a) or (b) applies;

(d) aninterest relating to the provision by a local
government of refreshments, meals or
accommodation to persons —

(i) attending a meeting or function of the
local government;

(i) attending a conference relevant to local
government business; or

(iii))  on other local government business;
(e) an interest relating to —

(1) the provision by the local government of
office equipment to a relevant person for
both local government purposes and
occasional personal use;

(i) arelevant person becoming the owner of
office equipment —

()  that is provided under
subparagraph (i) to the relevant
person; and

(IT)  that has only minor residual
value after use by the relevant
person;

or

(i11))  setting an amount of a minor residual
value for the purposes of
subparagraph (ii);



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3081

(f) an interest relating to —

(1) the specification by a local government
of a value for the purposes of the
definition of “token gift” in
regulation 34B(1);

(i1)) the making of a decision by a local
government under regulation 34B(5); or

(ii1)  a gift that can be accepted by a relevant
person in accordance with a code of
conduct to be observed by the relevant
person.

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

LG302*
Local Government Act 1995

Local Government (Functions and General)
Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Local Government
(Functions and General) Amendment Regulations 2002.

2. The regulations amended

The amendment in these regulations is to the Local Government
(Functions and General) Regulations 1996*.

[* Reprinted as at 8 September 2000.
For amendments to 6 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 201.]



3082 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

3. Regulation 35A inserted

After regulation 35 the following regulation is inserted —

35A. Delegable functions of Minister — s. 9.66

The Minister’s functions under the provisions of the
Act that are listed in the Table to this regulation are
delegable functions.

Table
5. 2.25(2) s. 6.2(1) 5. 6.33(3)
s.5.7(1)and (2)  s. 6.4(3) 5. 6.35(5)
5. 5.69 s. 6.14(1)(b)  s. 6.74
5. 5.69A s. 6.28(1) s.7.5

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM

MP301*
Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961

Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Explosives)
Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Explosives and Dangerous
Goods (Explosives) Amendment Regulations 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Explosives and
Dangerous Goods (Explosives) Regulations 1963%*.

[* Reprinted as at 17 March 2000.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 94.]



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3083

4. Second Schedule amended

The Second Schedule is amended as follows:

(2)

(b)

(©)

(d)

(e)

®

(g)

(h)

(i)

@)

(k)

M

(m)

(n)

(0)

(p)

by deleting “140.00” and inserting instead —
“ 144.00 7

by deleting “45.00” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“ 4650 7
by deleting “300.00” and inserting instead —
“ 308.00 :

by deleting “30.00” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“ 3100

by deleting “70.00” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“72.00 7

by deleting “105.00” and inserting instead —
“ 108.00 7

by deleting “280.00” and inserting instead —
“ 288.00

by deleting “121.00” and inserting instead —
“ 12430

by deleting “15.00” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“ 1550 7

by deleting “1.30” and inserting instead —
“ 135 7

by deleting “5.00” and inserting instead —
“ 515 7

by deleting “231.00” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —
“ 237.60 7

by deleting “143.00” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —

“ 14850 7

by deleting “192.50” and inserting instead —
“ 198.00 7

by deleting “275.00” and inserting instead —
“ 28270 7

by deleting “16.50” and inserting instead —
“ 17.00 .

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3084

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

MP302*

Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961

Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Dangerous
Goods Handling and Storage) Amendment

Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Explosives and Dangerous
Goods (Dangerous Goods Handling and Storage) Amendment
Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Explosives and
Dangerous Goods (Dangerous Goods Handling and Storage)
Regulations 1992*.

[* Reprinted as at 10 March 2000.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 94.]

Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended as follows:
(a) initem 1 by deleting “231” and inserting instead —
“ 237.60 7
(b) initem 2 by deleting “210” and inserting instead —
“ 216 7
(c) inTable 1 —
(1) by deleting “14” and inserting instead —

“ 1450 7

(i1)) by deleting “28” and inserting instead —
“ 29 7

(ii1)) by deleting “70” and inserting instead —
“oT2

(iv) by deleting “175” and inserting instead —
(13 180 9,;



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3085

(v) by deleting “350” and inserting instead —

“ 360 7
(vi) by deleting “1 120 and inserting instead —
“ 1150 7
(vii) by deleting “1 700” and inserting instead —
“ 1745 7
(viii) by deleting “2 100” and inserting instead —
“ 2155 7
(ix) by deleting “2 500” and inserting instead —
“ 2565 7
(x) by deleting “3 000” and inserting instead —
“ 3080 7
(xi) by deleting “3 500 and inserting instead —
“ 3600 7

(d) in Table2 —
(1) by deleting “198” and inserting instead —

“ 203.50 7

(i1)) by deleting “396” and inserting instead —
“ 407 7

(iii)) by deleting “660” and inserting instead —
“ 677.60 7.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

MP303*
Dangerous Goods (Transport) Act 1998

Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Explosives by
Road and Rail) Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Dangerous Goods
(Transport) (Explosives by Road and Rail) Amendment
Regulations 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.



3086

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Dangerous
Goods (Transport) (Explosives by Road and Rail)
Regulations 1999*.

[* Published in Gazette 8 June 1999, p. 2427-51.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 71.]

Regulation 5.33 amended

The Table to regulation 5.33 is amended as follows:

(a) initems 1 and 2 by deleting “10” and inserting
instead —

“ 10.50 7

(b) initems 3 and 4 by deleting “105” and inserting
instead —

13 108 9’.

By Command of the Governor,

MP304*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Dangerous Goods (Transport) Act 1998

Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Road and Rail)

Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Dangerous Goods
(Transport) (Road and Rail) Amendment Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Dangerous
Goods (Transport) (Road and Rail) Regulations 1999%*.

[* Published in Gazette 8 June 1999, p. 2311-423.
For amendments to 4 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 71.]

4. Regulation 23.1 amended

The Table to regulation 23.1 is amended as follows:

(a) initems 2 and 3 by deleting “10” and inserting
instead —

“ 1050 7

(b) initems 4 and 5 by deleting “105” and inserting
instead —

(13 108 9’.
By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

MP305*
Mining Act 1978

Mining Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Mining Amendment
Regulations (No. 4) 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Mining
Regulations 1981%*.

[* Reprinted as at 21 July 2000.
For amendments to 12 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 228.]



3088 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

4. Second Schedule amended

The Second Schedule is amended as follows:
(a) initem 1 —
(1) by deleting “34.65” and inserting instead —
“ 3564 7

5

(i) by deleting “220.00” and inserting instead —
“ 22572 7

(ii1)) by deleting “90.64” and inserting instead —
“ 93.06 7

(iv) by deleting “10.56” in each place where it occurs
and inserting instead —

“ 10.89 7

5

(v) by deleting “12.00” in each place where it occurs
and inserting instead —

“o1232 7

5

(vi) by deleting “$17.00” and inserting instead —
“ $17.60

(vii) by deleting “1.70” and inserting instead —
“ 176 7

(viii)) by deleting “5.28” and inserting instead —
“ 550 7
(b) initem2—
(1) by deleting “100.00” and inserting instead —

“ 105.00 7
(i) by deleting “824.00” and inserting instead —
“ 800.00 7

5

(i11)) by deleting “165.40 in each place where it
occurs and inserting instead —

“ 20000

(iv) by deleting “20.00” and inserting instead —
“ 2500 7

(v) by deleting “82.40” and inserting instead —
“ 100.00 7

(vi) by deleting “400.00” and inserting instead —
“410.00 7

5

(c) initem 3 by deleting “4.60” in each place where it
occurs and inserting instead —

“ 6.00 7



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3089

(d)

(e)

®

(g)

(h)

(1)

@)

(k)

(D

(m)

in item 3A by deleting “3.75” and inserting instead —
“ 500 7

initem 4 —
(1) by deleting “200.00” and inserting instead —
“ 250.00 7
(i1)) by deleting “1 000.00” and inserting instead —
“ 1250.00 7
initem 5 —

(1) by deleting “24.50” and inserting instead —

“ 2500 7
(1) by deleting “20.00” and inserting instead —
“ 2500

in item 7 by deleting “60.00” and inserting instead —
“ 7500 7
in item 8§ —

(i) by deleting “$17.00” and inserting instead —

“$20.00 7
(i) by deleting “3.90” and inserting instead —
“ 500 7

in item 9 by deleting “16.30” and inserting instead —
“ 17.00 7%

initem 10 —

(1) by deleting “60.00” in each place where it occurs
and inserting instead —

“ 7500 7
(i) by deleting “4.60” and inserting instead —
“ 500 7

in item 11 by deleting “142.00” and inserting instead —
“ 150.00 7

in item 11A by deleting “4.60” and inserting instead —
“ 6.00 7

in item 13(i) by deleting “40.00” and inserting

instead —

“44.00 7.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3090

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

MP306*

Petroleum Act 1967

Petroleum Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

(1)

2)

3)

4

©)

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Petroleum Amendment
Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Petroleum
Regulations 1987*.

[* Reprinted as at 4 May 2001.]

Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3(2) is amended by deleting “$2.00” and inserting
instead —

“ $3.00 7.

Regulation 3(4) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$25” and inserting
instead —

(13 $26 9’;
(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$25” and inserting
instead —

(13 $26 9’.
Regulation 3(5) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$25” and inserting
instead —

[13 $26 9’;

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$25” and inserting
instead —
[13 $26 9’.

Regulation 3(6) is amended by deleting “$55.00” and inserting
instead —

“ §57.00 .

Regulation 3(7) is amended by deleting “$6 600.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $6772.00 .



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3091

(6) Regulation 3(8) is amended by deleting “$19 800.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $25740.00 .

5. Schedule 1 replaced
Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —
Schedule 1
[r. 3(D)]
Prescribed fees
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
Item Provision of Act Amount of

prescribed fee
1 s. 31(1)(H) $3 078.00
2 s. 34(1)(a) $3 078.00
2a s. 37A(2)(e) $616.00
3 5. 40(2)(c) $1232.00
3a s. 43B(1)(H) $3 078.00
3b s. 43F(3)(d) $1232.00
4 s. 48A(2)(e) $1232.00
5 s. 48F(2)(d) $1232.00
6 s. 51(1)(e) $1232.00
7 s. 58(1)(a) $3 078.00
8 5. 61(2)(e) $616.00
9 s. 64(2)(d) $1232.00
10 5. 73(2) $62.00
11 s. 73(3)(b) $62.00
12 s. 80(1) $13.00
13 s. 81(3) $31.00
14 s. 105(2)(d) $616.00
15 s. 137(a) $1 129.00

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

MP307*
Petroleum (Registration Fees) Act 1967

Petroleum (Registration Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Petroleum (Registration
Fees) Amendment Regulations 2002.



3092

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

(1)

)

©)

4

©)

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended
The amendments in these regulations are to the Petroleum
(Registration Fees) Regulations 1990%*.

[* Published in Gazette 28 September 1990, p. 5108.]

Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3(1) is amended by deleting “$600.00” and inserting
instead —

“ $616.00 .

Regulation 3(2) is amended by deleting “$600.00” and inserting
instead —

“ $616.00 .

Regulation 3(3) is amended by deleting “$3 000.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $3078.00 .

Regulation 3(4) is amended by deleting “$600.00” and inserting
instead —

“ $616.00 .

Regulation 3(5) is amended by deleting “$3 000.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $3078.00 .

By Command of the Governor,

MP308*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1982

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Amendment

Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Petroleum (Submerged
Lands) Amendment Regulations 2002.



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3093

2.

(1

2)

€)

4

©)

(6)

(7)

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Petroleum
(Submerged Lands) Regulations 1990*.

[* Reprinted as at 9 March 2001.]

Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3(2) is amended by deleting “$2.00” and inserting
instead —

“ $3.00 7.

Regulation 3(4) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$25” and inserting
instead —

(13 $26 9’;
(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$25” and inserting
instead —

113 $26 ”.

Regulation 3(5) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$25” and inserting
instead —

(13 $26 9’;
(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$25” and inserting
instead —

13 $26 9’.

Regulation 3(6) is amended by deleting “$1 100.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $1129.00 .

Regulation 3(7) is amended by deleting “$55.00” and inserting
instead —

“ §57.00 .

Regulation 3(8) is amended by deleting “$6 600.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $6772.00 .

Regulation 3(9) is amended by deleting “$19 800.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $25740.00 .



3094

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

28 June 2002

5. Schedule 1 replaced

Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted

instead —

Column 1
Item

N = N NI NS SR

—_——
w N

14
15
16
17
18

v vn v v v v v M v LN L L L v v v v wn

Schedule 1

Prescribed fees

Column 2
Provision of
Act

L21(1)(H)

. 24(1)(a)
.30(2)(c)
.38A(2)(e)
. 38F(2)(d)
. 41(1)(e)

. 48(1)(a)
.51(2)(e)

. 54(2)(d)

- 64(1)(H)

. 68(2)(c)
.71(2)(e)
.79(2)

. 79(3)(b)

. 86(1)
.87(3)
1112)(d)
141

By Command of the Governor,

MP309*

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Registration Fees Act 1982

Column 3

Amount of

prescribed
fee

$3 078.00
$3 078.00
$1232.00
$1232.00
$1232.00
$1232.00
$3 078.00
$616.00
$1232.00
$3 078.00
$1232.00
$616.00
$62.00
$62.00
$13.00
$31.00
$616.00
$91.00

[r. 3(1)]

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Registration Fees
Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Petroleum (Submerged

Lands) Registration Fees Amendment Regulations 2002.



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3095

2.

(1

)

)

4

©)

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Petroleum
(Submerged Lands) Registration Fees Regulations 1990*.

[* Published in Gazette 28 September 1990, p. 5108-9.]

Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3(1) is amended by deleting “$600.00” and inserting
instead —

“ $616.00 .

Regulation 3(2) is amended by deleting “$600.00” and inserting
instead —
“ $616.00 .

Regulation 3(3) is amended by deleting “$3 000.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $3078.00 .

Regulation 3(4) is amended by deleting “$600.00” and inserting
instead —

“ $616.00 .

Regulation 3(5) is amended by deleting “$3 000.00” and
inserting instead —

“ $3078.00 .

By Command of the Governor,

MP310*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Petroleum Pipelines Act 1969

Petroleum Pipelines Amendment
Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Petroleum Pipelines

Amendment Regulations 2002.



3096 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Petroleum
Pipelines Regulations 1970%*.

[* Reprinted as at 18 May 2001.]

4. Regulation 4B amended
Regulation 4B is amended by deleting “$88.00” and inserting
instead —
“ $91.00 .

5. Third Schedule replaced

The Third Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

Third Schedule
(r. 4)
Petroleum Pipelines Act 1969
Fees

1. Application for licence s. 8(1)() $3 078.00
2. Application for Renewal of Licence s. 11(2)(d) $1232.00
3. Application for Variation of Licence s. 15(2)(d) $616.00
4. Registration of memorandum of

transfer and name of transferee s. 44(9) $62.00
5. Registration as licensee on

devolution by operation of law s. 45(2) $62.00
5A. Application by company licensee for

registration of change of name s. 45(3) $62.00
5B. Entry on memorial of registration of

approval of dealing s. 47(12) $62.00

Inspection of register s. 52(1) $13.00

Copies of or extracts from the

register or of or from an instrument

certified by Minister s. 53(2) $3.00
8. Certificate by Minister as to entry,

matter or things under the Act s. 53(3) $31.00

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3097

POLICE

PO301*

Firearms Act 1973

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

(1)

)

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Firearms Amendment
Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Firearms
Regulations 1974%*.

[* Reprinted as at 8 June 2001.
For amendments to 5 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 104-5.]
Regulation 4 amended

The Table to regulation 4(1a) is deleted and the following Table
is inserted instead —

Table of application forms and fees

Form Kind of Licence Fee
No. ®
1  Firearm Licence — original issue (1 year) ................. 115
1  Firearm Licence — renewal (1 year) ........ccceeevveeeunennns 26
1 Firearm Collector’s Licence — original issue (5 years).. 120
1 Firearm Collector’s Licence — renewal (5 years) ...... 48
2 Corporate Licence — original issue (1 year)............... 185
2 Corporate Licence — renewal (1 year)...........ccoeeueen. 72

Regulation 4(1aa) is amended as follows:

(a) Dby deleting “an additional firearm” and inserting
instead —

13 2

one or more additional firearms

(b) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$22 for each additional
firearm” and inserting instead —
(13 $23 9’;

(c) in paragraph (b) by deleting “for each additional
fircarm”.



3098 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

(3) Regulation 4(1b)(a) is amended by deleting “$22” and inserting
instead —

173 $23 79'

(4) The Table to regulation 4(1c) is deleted and the following Table
is inserted instead —

Table of application forms and fees

Form Kind of Licence Fee
No. (%)
3 Dealer’s Licence — original issue (1 year) ................... 185
3 Dealer’s Licence — renewal (1 year) .........cceeveeennennee. 73
3 Repairer’s Licence — original issue (1 year) ................ 185
3 Repairer’s Licence — renewal (1 year) ..........cceecvennnee. 40
3 Manufacturer’s Licence — original issue (1 year) ........ 185
3 Manufacturer’s Licence — renewal (1 year).................. 40
3 Shooting Gallery Licence — original issue (1 year) ........... 138
3 Shooting Gallery Licence — renewal (1 year)............... 49
4 Ammunition Collector’s Licence — original issue (5 years).. 120
4  Ammunition Collector’s Licence — renewal (5 years).. 48
5. Regulation 27 amended

Regulation 27(1) is amended as follows:
(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$284” and inserting
instead —
(13 $299 9’;

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting one of the commas after
“requires”.

6. Various regulations amended

The regulations listed in column 1 of the Table to this regulation
are amended by deleting the amounts set out in column 2 of that
Table opposite those regulations and inserting instead the
amounts set out in column 3.

Table of amendments

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
Regulation Delete Insert
5(1)(b) $11 $12
8(2) $22 $23
8(2a) $19 $12
11(1) $89 $92

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3099

PO302*
Police Act 1892

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Police (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Police (Fees)
Regulations 1981%*.

[* Reprinted as at 20 August 1999.
For amendments to 5 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 262.]

4. Schedule amended

(1) The Schedule Item 2(a) is amended as follows:

(a) in subparagraph (i), by deleting “$59.11” and inserting
instead —

“ 86273 7

(b) in subparagraph (ii), by deleting “$51.70” and inserting
instead —

“ 8$54.05 .

(2) Item 3 is deleted and the following item is inserted instead —

3. Photographs, authorised reproductions ........ $15.40

2

(3) Item 4 is amended by deleting “$18.70” and inserting instead —

“ $19.80 .

(4) Item 5 is amended by deleting “$53.90” and inserting instead —
“ $5596 .

(5) Item 6 is amended by deleting “$15.20” and inserting instead —
“ $1540 .

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3100

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

PO303*

Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996

Security and Related Activities (Control)

Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Security and Related
Activities (Control) Amendment Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Security and
Related Activities (Control) Regulations 1997%.

[* Reprinted as at 20 April 2001.
For amendments to 5 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 305.]

Schedule 4 amended

Schedule 4 is amended by deleting the Table of fees and
inserting the following Table instead —

Provision of Subject matter Fee ($)
Act or
regulations
column 1 column 2 column 3

Agent’s licences

s. 46(1) Application for issue of agent’s licence —
for one year or less™® ........ccceeeevvieiieinieens 227
fOr 3 Years ....cceeveeveeeeeieecee e 247
s. 46(1) Application by licensee for an additional
agent’s licence (€ach) ........cccecveveviviiciieicennen, 71

s.49(1)(c) Application for renewal of agent’s licence —
3year (€aCh) ...ocvvieiieiieiiece e 136

Other licences

s. 46(1) Application for issue of any other licence —
for one year or 1eSs .......ccceeveeecriienieininens 49
fOr 3 Years ...ocovveeereeeeee e 69



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3101

Provision of Subject matter Fee ($)
Act or
regulations
column 1 column 2 column 3

s. 46(1) Application by licensee for an additional other

licence (€ach) .....cceevvevieeiieiicie e 27
s.49(1)(c) Application for renewal of any other

licence — 3 year (€ach) ........cccecvveerreviieieennnnns 47
r. 10 Application for endorsement under

SECLION 24 .ooiiiiiiiieieecete e 20
r. 12 Application for permit under section 25 .......... 89
r. 13 Application for endorsement under

SECLION 26 .eovviiiieiieiieeieite et 22

Miscellaneous

s. 10(2) Application to inspect register ..........c.ccecuerunne. 13
s. 10(3) Certified copy of register entry ............ceveeuee. 22
s. 46(1) Fee if fingerprints and palm prints are

required under section 48 ..........c.ceveeevierieienns 36
s. 66 Issue of duplicate licence or duplicate

identification card ........c.ccocevernieniniineee. 27

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

PO304*
Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers
Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Pawnbrokers and
Second-hand Dealers Amendment Regulations 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.



3102

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Pawnbrokers
and Second-hand Dealers Regulations 1996%*.

[* Reprinted as at 2 March 2001.]

4. Regulation 28 amended

The Table to regulation 28 is deleted and the following Table is
inserted instead —

13

Table — Fees for issue of licences

Licence lyearor 2yearsor 3 yearsor
part part part
thereof ($) thereof (§) thereof (%)
1. Pawnbroker’s licence only 330 556 780
2. Second-hand dealer’s licence
only (computer option) 330 556 780
3. Second-hand dealer’s licence
only (facsimile option) 423 783 1141
4. Pawnbroker’s licence and
second-hand dealer’s licence 375 601 826
5. Regulation 29 amended

The Table to regulation 29 is deleted and the following Table is
inserted instead —

13

Table — Fees for renewal of licences

Licence lyearor 2yearsor 3 yearsor
part part part
thereof (§) thereof ($) thereof (%)
1. Pawnbroker’s licence only 244 472 701
2. Second-hand dealer’s licence
only (computer option) 244 472 701
3. Second-hand dealer’s licence
only (facsimile option) 390 748 1106
4. Pawnbroker’s licence and
second-hand dealer’s licence 260 506 736
6. Regulation 31 amended
Regulation 31 is amended by deleting “$9.00” and inserting
instead —
13 $ 1 0 79‘

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3103

PO305*

Criminal Investigation (Identifying People) Act 2002

Criminal Investigation (Identifying People)

Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

(1)

)

(1

)

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Criminal Investigation
(Identifying People) Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on the day on which Part 2
of the Criminal Investigation (ldentifying People) Act 2002
comes into operation.

Public officers (s. 5(1))

The office of aboriginal aide to which appointments are made
under Part ITIA of the Police Act 1892 is prescribed under
section 5(1)(a) of the Act.

The powers in the Act that a holder of the office of aboriginal
aide may exercise are specified under section 5(1)(b) of the Act
to be all the powers that the Act provides may be exercised by a
public officer.

Qualified persons (s. 52)

For the definition of “qualified person” in section 52 of the Act,
a person is qualified to do any non-intimate identifying
procedure if the person is —

(a) a forensic scientist approved under subregulation (3);

(b) a forensic technician approved under subregulation (3);
or

(c) apolice officer who has satisfactorily completed a
course of training approved under subregulation (3).

For the definition of “qualified person” in section 52 of the Act,
a person is qualified to do the intimate identifying procedure of
taking a sample of blood if —

(a) the person is a police officer who has satisfactorily
completed a course of training approved under
subregulation (3); and

(b) the sample is to be taken by means of a lancet or a finger
blood sampling device.



3104 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

(3) The Commissioner may by notice published in the Gazette —

(a) approve a person as a forensic scientist for
subregulation (1)(a) or as a forensic technician for
subregulation (1)(b);

(b) approve a course of training for subregulation (1)(c) or
(2)(a); or

(c) amend or revoke a notice under paragraph (a) or (b).

(4) In this regulation —

“police officer” means a person appointed under Part I or IITA
of the Police Act 1892.

5. Law enforcement officers (s. 73(1)(e))

A person is a law enforcement officer for section 73(1)(e) of the
Act if the person is —

(a) amember of the police force of another State or a
Territory or a member of the Australian Federal Police;
or

(b) an officer of Customs within the meaning of the
Customs Act 1901 of the Commonwealth.

6. Corresponding laws (s. 87, 88(a))

Each law listed in the Table to this regulation is prescribed
under section 88(a) of the Act to be a corresponding law for the
definition of that expression in section 87 of the Act.

Table

Part 1D of the Crimes Act 1914 of the Commonwealth

Crimes (Forensic Procedures) Act 2000 of New South Wales
Part 3 Division 1 Subdivision 30A of the Crimes Act 1958 of
Victoria

Chapter 8 of the Police Powers and Responsibilities Act 2000 of
Queensland

Criminal Law (Forensic Procedures) Act 1998 of South Australia
Forensic Procedures Act 2000 of Tasmania

Sections 31, 31A, 31B, 51 and 70B of the Juvenile Justice Act of
the Northern Territory

Part VII Division 7 of the Police Administration Act of the Northern
Territory

Crimes (Forensic Procedures) Act 2000 of the Australian Capital
Territory

7. Authorised officers (s. 87, 88(b))

Each office listed in the Table to this regulation is prescribed
under section 88(b) of the Act for the definition of “authorised
officer” in section 87 of the Act.

Table

DNA Coordinator, Forensic Services, Australian Federal Police
(Commonwealth)
Director of Forensic Services, New South Wales Police Service



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3105

Director, Victoria Forensic Science Centre, Victoria Police
Superintendent, Forensic Services Branch, Queensland Police
Service

Officer in Charge, Forensic Services Branch, South Australia Police
Inspector, Forensic Services, Tasmania Police

Director, Forensic Science Centre, Northern Territory Police
Superintendent, Prosecution and Judicial Support, Australian
Federal Police (Australian Capital Territory)

Registrar (s. 87, 88(c))

The office of Divisional Officer, Forensic Division, Police
Force of Western Australia is prescribed under section 88(c) of
the Act for the definition of “Registrar” in section 87 of the Act.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RG301*

Liquor Licensing Act 1988

Liquor Licensing Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Liquor Licensing
Amendment Regulations 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Liguor
Licensing Regulations 1989*.

[* Reprinted as at 8 March 2002.]

Regulation 3A amended

Regulation 3A(1) is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting the definition of “low alcohol”;

(b) in the definition of “notional wholesale selling price” by
deleting “low alcohol beer or wine” and inserting
instead —

(13 2

wine that is low alcohol liquor ”;



3106 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

(c) in the definition of “notional wholesale selling price” by
deleting “beer or” in the second place where it occurs.

S. Regulation 21 amended

(1) Regulation 21(1) is amended as follows:
(a) Dby deleting “beer and”;
(b) in the formula by deleting “5.20% B +”;
(c) Dby deleting the paragraph beginning with “B =" and
ending with “subregulation (2);”;
(d) in the paragraph beginning with “W = by deleting “low
alcohol wine” and inserting instead —

13 2

wine that is low alcohol liquor

(2) Regulation 21(2) is amended as follows:

(a) Dby deleting “low alcohol beer or wine” and inserting
instead —

13 2

wine that is low alcohol liquor ”;
(b) by deleting subparagraph (b)(i) and “or” after it.
6. Regulation 21AB repealed
Regulation 21AB is repealed.

7. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended in Form 19 as follows:

(a) by deleting “5A. AMOUNT OF SUBSIDY CLAIMED
(BEER)”;

(b) in the Table opposite that text, by deleting the row
containing “(d) Sales of beer” and “$”.
By Command of the Governor,
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

ROTTNEST ISLAND AUTHORITY

RX301*
Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987

Rottnest Island (Management Plan) Notice 2002

Given by the Rottnest Island Authority under section 21 of the Act.
1. Citation

This notice may be cited as the Rottnest Island (Management
Plan) Notice 2002.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3107

2. Management plan notification

The Rottnest Island Authority gives notice that a proposed
management plan (Rottnest Island Management Plan
2002-2007) has been prepared.

3. Inspection of proposed management plan

Copies of the proposed management plan may be inspected
at —
(a) the Administration Office
Rottnest Island Authority
Level 1, E Shed, Victoria Quay
Fremantle WA; and

(b) Salt Store Gallery and Exhibition Centre
Rottnest Island WA.

4. Copies of proposed management plan

Copies of the proposed management plan may be obtained
from —

(a) the Rottnest Island Authority website
www.rottnest.wa.gov.au; and

(b) the Rottnest Island Authority —

(1) by telephoning the Rottnest Island Authority on
(08) 9432 9300; or

(i) at the Administration Office
Rottnest Island Authority
Level 1, E Shed, Victoria Quay
Fremantle WA.

5. Written submissions on proposed management plan
Written submissions on the proposed management plan
may be —

(a) posted to—
The Rottnest Island Management Plan 2002-2007
Rottnest Island Authority
PO Box 693
Fremantle WA 6959;

(b) delivered to —
the Administration Office
Rottnest Island Authority
Level 1, E Shed, Victoria Quay
Fremantle WA or



3108 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

(c) delivered by facsimile transmission to —
The Rottnest Island Management Plan 2002-2007
Rottnest Island Authority
(08) 9432 9301,

so that they are received by 5 p.m. Friday 27 September 2002.

The common seal of the Authority is affixed in the presence of:

JENNIFER ARCHIBALD, Chairman.

JOHN MITCHELL, Chief Executive Officer.

TREASURY AND FINANCE

TF301*
State Enterprises (Commonwealth Tax Equivalents) Act 1996

State Enterprises (Commonwealth Tax
Equivalents) (Application) Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the State Enterprises
(Commonwealth Tax Equivalents) (Application) Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2002.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the State
Enterprises (Commonwealth Tax Equivalents) (Application)
Regulations 1997%*.

[* Published in Gazette 11 June 1997, p. 2645-46.
For amendments to 7 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 320, and Gazette
28 March 2002.]



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3109

3.

Regulation 3 amended

The Table to regulation 3 is deleted and the following Table is
inserted instead —

Table
State enterprises Commencement

of application
AgraCorp Pty Ltd 1 July 1996
East Perth Redevelopment Authority established
by the East Perth Redevelopment Act 1991, 5.6 1 July 1996
Electricity Corporation established by the
Electricity Corporation Act 1994, s. 4
[Western Power] 1 July 1996
Forest Products Commission established under
the Forest Products Act 2000 1 January 2001
Gold Corporation constituted under the Gold
Corporation Act 1987, s. 4 1 July 2002

The Western Australian Government Railways
Commission constituted under the Government
Railways Act 1904, s. 8 [Westrail] 1 July 1996

Insurance Commission of Western Australia
(formerly called the State Government Insurance
Commission) established by s. 4 of the
Insurance Commission of Western Australia

Act 1986 (formerly called the State Government

Insurance Commission Act 1986) 1 July 1997

Albany Port Authority established under the

Port Authorities Act 1999 1 July 1996

Broome Port Authority established under the The day on which

Port Authorities Act 1999 item 2 in
Schedule 1 to the
Port Authorities
Act 1999 comes

into operation
Bunbury Port Authority established under the

Port Authorities Act 1999 1 July 1999
Dampier Port Authority established under the

Port Authorities Act 1999 1 July 1996
Esperance Port Authority established under the

Port Authorities Act 1999 1 July 1996
Fremantle Port Authority established under the

Port Authorities Act 1999 1 July 1996
Geraldton Port Authority established under the

Port Authorities Act 1999 1 July 1996
Port Hedland Port Authority established under

the Port Authorities Act 1999 1 July 1996

State Government Insurance Corporation
established by the State Government Insurance

Commission Act 1986, s. 28 1 July 1996
Subiaco Redevelopment Authority established
by the Subiaco Redevelopment Act 1994, s. 6 1 July 1996

Bunbury Water Board constituted under the
Water Boards Act 1904, s. 6 1 October 1996



3110 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

State enterprises Commencement
of application
Busselton Water Board constituted under the
Water Boards Act 1904, s. 6 1 July 1996
Water Corporation established by the Water
Corporation Act 1995, s. 4 1 July 1996

Western Australian Land Authority established

by the Western Australian Land Authority

Act 1992, s. 5 [LandCorp] 1 July 1996
Western Australian Treasury Corporation

established by the Western Australian Treasury

Corporation Act 1986 1 July 1999

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

TF302*
Pay-roll Tax Assessment Act 1971

Pay-roll Tax Assessment Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Pay-roll Tax Assessment
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Pay-roll Tax
Assessment Regulations 1971%*.

[* Reprinted as at 16 March 1998.
For amendments to 14 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 244.]

4. Schedule 2 amended

Schedule 2 is amended as follows:

(a) Dby inserting after item 1 the following item —

13

1A. Commissioner of Main Roads

2



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3111

(b) by inserting after item 2 the following item —

(13

2A. Curriculum Council

(c) Dby inserting after item 36 the following item —

13

36A. Office of the Public Sector Standards
Commissioner

(d) Dby deleting items 8, 28, 31, 34 and 42.
By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

TF303*
Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments)
Amendment Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Rates and Charges
(Rebates and Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Rates and
Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Regulations 1992*.

[* Reprinted as at 2 February 2001.
For amendments to 13 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 277.]



3112 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

4. Regulation 3 amended

Regulation 3 is amended by deleting paragraph (a) and “and”
following it and inserting instead —

13

(a) where the charge relates to the provision of a
service during a rating year commencing after
30 June 2002 but not after 30 June 2003 —

(1) in the case of a charge for water supply,
$66.25;

(i) in the case of a charge for sewerage,
$107.15;

(ii1)  in the case of a charge for drainage,
$12.65;

(iv)  in the case of a charge by way of rates,
$193.55;

and

2

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

TRANSPORT

TR301*
Road Traffic Act 1974

Road Traffic (Events on Roads) Amendment
Regulations 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Events on
Roads) Amendment Regulations 2002.

2. Commencement
These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.
3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic
(Events on Roads) Regulations 1991%.

[* Reprinted as at 1 February 2002.]



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3113

4.

Schedule 2 replaced

Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —

Schedule 2 — Application fees
[r. 6(2)(c)]

$
Category 1 event 122
Category 2 event 73
Category 3 event 49
Category 4 event 49

2

By Command of the Governor,

TR302*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Road Traffic Act 1974

Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment

Regulations (No. 4) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

(1)

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Licensing)
Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation immediately after the
Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2002
come into operation.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic
(Licensing) Regulations 1975%.

[* Reprinted as at 11 February 2000.
For amendments to 14 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 294, and Gazette
7 and 17 May 2002.]

Regulation 3B amended

Regulation 3B(1) is amended by deleting “item 2 and inserting
instead —

“ jtems 2 and 2A 7.



3114 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

(2) Regulation 3B(2) is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting “subregulations (1) and (2a)” and inserting
instead —

13 2

subregulation (1) ”;

(b) by deleting “necessary” and inserting instead —

13 2

noted

(3) Regulation 3B(2a) is amended by deleting “specified in item 3
of Schedule 2 shall be payable by the owner of the vehicle for
the examination of that vehicle.” and inserting instead —

specified —

(a) initem 2B of Schedule 2 shall be payable by
the owner of the vehicle for an initial
examination of that vehicle; and

(b) initem 3 of Schedule 2 shall be payable by the
owner of the vehicle for a second or subsequent
examination of that vehicle.

5. Schedule 2 amended

Schedule 2 is amended by deleting items 2 and 3 and inserting
the following items instead —

Item  Regulation Service Fee
No. $
2. 3B(1) An examination (and where

necessary one re-examination)

of a caravan or trailer without

brakes, motor cycle, motor

carrier, engine change,

earthmoving or agricultural

equipment 33.00

2A. 3B(1) Subject to items 3, 3A and 3B,
an examination of a vehicle
under regulation 3B(1) that is
not set out in item 2 50.70

2B. 3B(2a) An examination of a vehicle in
the circumstances referred to in
regulation 3B(2a) —

(a) in the case of a vehicle
which is a motor carrier, a
trailer or any other vehicle
with a manufacturer’s
gross vehicle mass not
exceeding 4.5 tonnes, a
motor cycle, or a moped; 63.50

(b) in the case of any other
vehicle; 126.90



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3115

Item  Regulation Service Fee
No. $
3. 3B(1) & A second or subsequent
3B(2a) examination of a vehicle
referred to in item 2A or 2B. 35.20

2

By Command of the Governor,

TR304*

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

Transport Co-ordination Act 1966

Transport Co-ordination Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Transport Co-ordination
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation on the day on which the
Machinery of Government (Planning and Infrastructure)

Act 2002 comes into operation.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Transport Co-
ordination Regulations 1985%*.

[* Published in Gazette 20 December 1985, p. 4835-55.
For amendments to 19 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 342.]
Regulation 3 amended
Regulation 3 is amended by deleting the definition of “common
seal”.
Regulation 4 repealed

Regulation 4 is repealed.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3116 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

TR303*
Road Traffic Act 1974

Road Traffic (Vehicle Standards) Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Vehicle
Standards) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2002.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2002.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic
(Vehicle Standards) Regulations 1977%*.

[* Reprinted as at 7 September 2001.
For amendments to 12 June 2002 see Gazette 17 May 2002.]

4. Regulation 1107 amended

After regulation 1107(1) the following subregulations are
inserted —

13

(la) A person referred to in subregulation (1) may refuse to
issue a permit under that subregulation if the owner or
operator of the vehicle or combination of vehicles does
not have a valid accreditation certificate issued under
regulation 1107A(1) (the “accreditation certificate”).

(1b)  If the owner or operator of a vehicle or combination of
vehicles does not have a valid accreditation certificate,
the person referred to in subregulation (1) may issue a
permit subject to a condition that the owner or operator
obtains an accreditation certificate by a date specified
in the condition.

(1c) A permit issued under subregulation (1) to a person
who has a valid accreditation certificate is valid in
relation to the vehicle or combination of vehicles in
respect of which the permit was issued only during the
period that the accreditation certificate of the owner or
operator of the vehicle or combination of vehicles is
valid.



28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3117

5. Regulation 1107A inserted

After regulation 1107 the following regulation is inserted —

1107A. Accreditation certificate

(1)

)

3)

(4)

)

(6)

(7)

The Commissioner of Main Roads may issue an
accreditation certificate to a person, on payment of the
fee prescribed in subregulation (5), if a person
approved by the Commissioner has certified that the
applicant for the accreditation certificate has systems
that comply with the requirements of the standards
referred to in the Table to this subregulation.

Table

Main Roads Western Australia, Western Australian Heavy
Vehicle Accreditation Process Maintenance Management
Module Standards (28 February 2002)

Main Roads Western Australia, Western Australian Heavy

Vehicle Accreditation Process Fatigue Management
Module Standards (28 February 2002)

An accreditation certificate is valid for a period of
36 months from the date of issue or renewal.

An accreditation certificate may be renewed on
payment of the fee prescribed in subregulation (5).

An accreditation certificate may be revoked by the
Commissioner of Main Roads if the Commissioner is
satisfied that the person to whom it was issued does not
have systems that comply with the requirements of the
standards referred to in the Table to subregulation (1).

The fee payable under subregulations (1) and (3) is
$225.00.

The fee referred to in subregulation (5) may be paid by
3 equal annual instalments, the first being payable
before the issue or renewal of the accreditation
certificate and the second and third instalments being
payable on or before the day (the “due day”) 10 days
after the day one year and 2 years, respectively, after
the day on which the certificate was issued or renewed.

If an instalment of a fee is not paid on or before the due
day —
(a) the full amount outstanding of the fee becomes
immediately payable; and

(b) the accreditation certificate to which the fee
applies is not valid during the period from the
due day until the day on which the full amount
outstanding is paid.

2



3118 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

6. Regulation 1402 amended

After regulation 1402(1) the following subregulations are
inserted —

13

(la) The Commissioner may refuse to issue a permit under
subregulation (1) if the owner or operator of the
vehicle, trailer or combination of vehicles does not
have a valid accreditation certificate issued under
regulation 1107A(1) (the “accreditation certificate”).

(1b)  If the owner or operator of a vehicle, trailer or
combination of vehicles does not have a valid
accreditation certificate, the Commissioner may issue a
permit subject to a condition that the owner or operator
obtains an accreditation certificate by a date specified
in the condition.

(1c) A permit issued under subregulation (1) to a person
who has a valid accreditation certificate is valid in
relation to the vehicle, trailer or combination of
vehicles in respect of which the permit was issued only
during the period that the accreditation certificate of the
owner or operator of the vehicle, trailer or combination
of vehicles is valid.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

WATER

WA301*
COUNTRY AREAS WATER SUPPLY ACT 1947

(GREAT SOUTHERN TOWNS) COUNTRY WATER AREA
AMENDMENT ORDER 2002

Made by the Lieutenant Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council
under section 8 of the Act.

1. Citation

This order may be cited as the (Great Southern Towns) Country Water Area
Amendment Order 2002.

2. (Great Southern Towns) Country Water Area boundary amended

The boundary of the (Great Southern Towns) Country Water Area is amended by the
addition of the area shown bordered _ _ on Water
Corporation plans EP 36-1-45-1 and EP36-1-45-2.

3. Information plan of (Great Southern Towns) Country Water Area

The boundary of the (Great Southern Towns) Country Water Area as amended by
this order is shown for information purposes in the plans in Schedule 1.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.



3119

T

(1

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

El

|__ .

WA 40 15T HIMGS

Ned AL T9D0T

28 June 2002




3120 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

fis

Al

A [=

LOCALITY PLAN
SO0UTH WEST OF W.d.

1
= “FP36.1.45.2




28 June 2002

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3121

WORKSAFE

WS301*

Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984

Occupational Safety and Health Amendment

Regulations (No. 5) 2002

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1.

Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Occupational Safety and
Health Amendment Regulations (No. 5) 2002.

Commencement

These regulations come into operation immediately after the
Occupational Safety and Health Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2002 come into operation.

The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Occupational
Safety and Health Regulations 1996*.

[*Reprinted as at 15 October 1999.
For amendments to 12 June 2002 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 237 and
Gazette 8 March, 21 May and 7 June 2002.]

Regulation 4.54 amended

Regulation 4.54(3) is amended by deleting “unit is inspected,
operated and maintained” and inserting instead —

13 2

unit is operated

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.




3122 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

— PART 2 —

AGRICULTURE

AG401*
AGRICULTURAL PRODUCE COMMISSION ACT 1988
WITHDRAWAL OF NOTICE
NOTICE OF PORK PRODUCTION INDUSTRY FEE FOR SERVICE

This is to advise of the withdrawal of Notice AG401* Published in Gazette No. 100, Page 2672 on
4 June 2002.

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION

CE401*
COPYRIGHT ACT 1968 (Cth)
NOTIFICATION UNDER SECTION 183 (4)
To: Training Media Services
From: the Department of Consumer and Employment Protection

Under Section 183 (4) of the Copyright Act 1968 (Cth) the Government of Western Australian is
required to notify you, the owner of copyright in the video “Fair Trading”, a training guide describing
various aspects of Fair Trading and Consumer Protection legislation that the Government of Western
Australia has authorised Elizabeth McKenzie, librarian, to copy this video eight times for the
purposes of providing training to staff and to the community to support its various education and
training programmes.

FISHERIES

FI401*
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994

PROHIBITION ON RECREATIONAL FISHING ACTIVITIES
(WALPOLE/NORNALUP ESTUARY) ORDER 2002

Order No. 4 of 2002
FD 1620/98 [459]
Made by the Minister under section 43.

Citation

1. This order may be cited as the Prohibition on Recreational Fishing Activities (Walpole/Nornalup
Estuary) Order 2002.

Commencement

2. This order will commence operation on 1 July 2002.

Prohibition on recreational fishing

3. Subject to clause 4, a person must not engage in recreational fishing in the waters of the
Walpole/Nornalup Estuary or its tributaries.

Exemption from this order

4. This order does not apply to a person engaged in any of the following recreational fishing
activities—

(a) fishing for crabs, prawns or marron; or



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3123

(b) (i) fishing by means of a hand line; or
(i1) rod, reel and line,
with not more than 3 hooks attached to the line.

Dated this 18t day of June 2002.
KIM CHANCE, Minister for Agriculture,
Forestry and Fisheries.

F1402*
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994

PROHIBITION ON FISHING ACTIVITY MINIMUM NET MESH SIZE IN
BEAUFORT INLET) ORDER 2002

Order No. 3 of 2002
FD 1620/98 [461]

Made by the Minister under section 43.

Citation

1. This order may be cited as the Prohibition on Fishing Activity (Minimum Net Mesh Size in
Beaufort Inlet) Order 2002.

Commencement

2. This order will commence operation on 1 July 2002.

Restriction on use of certain mesh nets

3. Subject to clause 4, a person must not fish in the waters of the Beaufort Inlet or any tributary of
that inlet by means of a fishing net that has a mesh size of less than 76mm.

Exemption from this order

4. This order does not apply—

(a) to a person using a fishing net under the authority of a managed fishery permit which
authorises fishing in the South Coast Estuarine Fishery*;
(b) to a person fishing for crabs, prawns or marron.
[*Declared in the South Coast Estuarine Fishery (Interim) Management Plan 2001 published in the
Gagzette of 22 January 2002.]

Dated this 18t day of June 2002.
KIM CHANCE, Minister for Agriculture,
Forestry and Fisheries.

FI1403*
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994

SOUTH COAST ESTUARINE FISHING PROHIBITIONS (REPEAL) ORDER 2002

Order No. 2 of 2002
FD 1620/98 [456]

Made by the Minister under section 43.

Citation
1. This order may be cited as the South Coast Estuarine Fishing Prohibitions (Repeal) Order 2002.

Commencement
2. This order will take effect on 1 July 2002.

Repeal
3. The following orders* are repealed—

(a) the proclamation referenced “C.S.D. 262/37” dated 24 October 1940 and published in the
Gazette of 1 November 1940;

(b) the proclamation referenced “F.D. 61/37 Ex. Co. No 599” dated 26 March 1952 and published
in the Gazette of 4 April 1952;

(c) the notice referenced “F & W 1419/76” dated 11 November 1977 and published in the Gazette
of 27 January 1978;

(d) Notice No. 40 published in the Gazette of 29 August 1980;
(e) Notice No. 227 published in the Gazette of 24 April 1986;
() Notice No. 228 published in the Gazette of 24 April 1986;
(g) Notice No. 368 published in the Gazette of 21 October 1988;



3124 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

(h) Notice No. 196 published in the Gazette of 28 June 1985; and

(1) Lawful Nets (Broke Inlet) Notice 1990 (Notice No. 442) published in the Gazette of 6 April
1990.

[*See regulation 186 of the Fish Resources Management Regulations concerning the continuation of
notices made or continued under section 9, 10, 11 or 38 of the Fisheries Act 1905 and that were in force
immediately before the commencement of those regulations.]
Dated this 18t day of June 2002.
KIM CHANCE, Minister for Agriculture,
Forestry and Fisheries.

F1404*
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994

PROHIBITION ON COMMERCIAL FISHING ACTIVITY (NETTING IN
RIVERS, ESTUARIES, INLETS AND LAKES SOUTH OF 23° SOUTH
LATITUDE) AMENDMENT ORDER 2002

Order No. 1 of 2002
FD 1620/98 [455]

Made by the Minister under section 43.

Citation

1. This order may be cited as the Prohibition on Commercial Fishing Activity (Netting in Rivers,
Estuaries, Inlets and Lakes South of 23° South Latitude) Amendment Order 2002.

Commencement

2. This order will take effect on 1 July 2002.

Order amended
3. The amendments in this order are to the Closed Waters Professional Netting (Rivers, Estuaries,
Inlets and Lakes) Notice 1992*.
Schedule 1 amended
4. Schedule 1 is amended by deleting—
(a) Area 3 of item 5; and
(b) items 6 to 17 inclusive.

Schedule 2 Amended
5. Schedule 2 is amended by deleting items 5 to 12 inclusive.

Schedule 3 amended
6. Schedule 3 is amended by inserting after “ and 2 ” the following—
“but not including those rivers, streams, estuaries and their tributaries east of Cape Beaufort”.

[*Published in the Gazette of 26 June 1992. For amendments to 24 May 2002 see the Closed Waters
Professional Netting (Rivers, Estuaries, Inlets and Lakes South of 23° South latitude) Amendment
Notice 1992 published in the Gazette of 14 August 1992 and the Closed Waters Professional Netting
(Rivers, Estuaries, Inlets and Lakes South of 23° South Latitude) Amendment Notice 1994 published
in the Gazette of 29 July 1994.

See regulation 186 of the Fish Resources Management Regulations concerning the continuation of
notices made or continued under section 9, 10, 11 or 38 of the Fisheries Act 1905 and that were in force
immediately before the commencement of those regulations.]
Dated this 18th day of June 2002.
KIM CHANCE, Minister for Agriculture,
Forestry and Fisheries.

FI1405%
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994

SOUTH COAST PURSE SEINE FISHERY MANAGEMENT PLAN
AMENDMENT (No. 2) 2002
FD 28/02 [487]

Made by the Minister under section 54.

Citation

1. This instrument may be cited as the South Coast Purse Seine Fishery Management Plan
Amendment (No. 2) 2002.

Commencement

2. This instrument will commence operation on 1 July 2002.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3125

Management plan amended
3. The amendments in this instrument are to the South Coast Purse Seine Management Plan 1994*.

Clause 3 amended
4. Clause 3 is amended—

(a) in the item commencing “Zone 1 unit of entitlement” by deleting “means 546 kilograms of
small pelagic fish” and inserting instead—

“means, subject to clause 13(3), 1,650 kilograms of small pelagic fish”;

(b) in the item commencing “Zone 2 unit of entitlement” by deleting “means 546 kilograms of
small pelagic fish” and inserting instead—

“means, subject to clause 13(3), 1,650 kilograms of small pelagic fish”;

(¢c) in the item commencing “Zone 3 unit of entitlement” by deleting “2913” and inserting
instead—

“6,000”; and

(d) in the item commencing “Zone 4 unit of entitlement” by deleting “8,496” and inserting
instead—

“11,280”.

Clause 13 amended
5. Clause 13 is amended by inserting after subclause (2) the following—

“(3) Notwithstanding the meanings of “Zone 1 unit of entitlement” and “Zone 2 unit of
entitlement” in clause 3(1), during the period commencing on 1 July 2002 and ending on 31
December 2002 a “Zone 1 unit of entitlement” and a “Zone 2 unit of entitlement” shall each
mean 730 kilograms of small pelagic fish. ”.

Schedule 2 amended

6. Schedule 2 is amended in the descriptions of “Zone 3” and “Zone 4” by deleting “Point Charles” and
inserting instead—

“120° east longitude”.

[*Published in the Gazette of 22 February 1994. For amendments to 18 June 2002 see Notice No. 708
published in the Gazette of 23 May 1995, Notice No. 714 published in the Gazette of 16 June 1995,
Notice No. 727 published in the Gazette of 29 September 1995, the South Coast Purse Seine
Management Plan Amendment 1996 published in the Gazette of 9 February 1996, the South Coast
Purse Seine Management Plan Amendment (No. 2) 1996 published in the Gazette of 29 March 1996,
the South Coast Purse Seine Management Plan Amendment 1997 published in the Gazette of 27 March
1997, the South Coast Purse Seine Management Plan Amendment (No. 5) 1997 published in the
Gazette of 29 August 1997, the South Coast Purse Seine Management Plan Amendment 1999
published in the Gazette of 26 March 1999, the South Coast Purse Seine Management Plan
Amendment (No. 2) 1999 published in the Gazette of 30 November 1999, the South Coast Purse Seine
Fishery Management Plan Amendment (No. 3) 1999 published in the Gazette of 24 December 1999; the
South Coast Purse Seine Fishery Management Plan Amendment 2000 published in the Gazette of 31
March 2000, the South Coast Purse Seine Fishery Management Plan Amendment 2001 published in
the Gazette of 25 May 2001, the South Coast Purse Seine Fishery Management Plan Amendment (No.
2) 2001 published in the Gazette of 29 June 2001 and the South Coast Purse Seine Fishery
Management Plan Amendment 2002 published in the Gazette of 11 January 2002. See regulation 183
of the Fish Resources Management Regulations 1995 concerning the citation of notices under the
Fisheries Act 1905 immediately before the commencement of those regulations.]

Dated this 24th day of June 2002.
KIM CHANCE, Minister for Agriculture,
Forestry and Fisheries.

FI406
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994
SHARK BAY SCALLOP MANAGED FISHERY
Clause 9 closures of areas within the Fishery

I, Peter Rogers, Executive Director of the Department of Fisheries Western Australia, in accordance
with the Shark Bay Scallop Management Plan 1994 hereby give notice that I have cancelled
Determination No. 2 of 2002 which set out the dates and times that fishing is prohibited in the Shark
Bay Scallop Managed Fishery.
I hereby give notice that a new Determination (Determination No. 3 of 2002) has been made in
accordance with clause 9 of the Shark Bay Scallop Management Plan 1994 of the times and dates that
fishing is prohibited in the Shark Bay Scallop Managed Fishery.
A copy of this Determination which is signed by me may be obtained from, or inspected at the Head
Office of the Department of Fisheries located at 168 St George’s Terrace, Perth or the offices of
Department of Fisheries located at 83 Olivia Terrace, Carnarvon and Knight Terrace, Denham.
Dated this 26th day of June 2002.

P. P. ROGERS, Executive Director.



3126 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

FI1407
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994

SHARK BAY PRAWN MANAGEMENT PLAN 1993
Clause 10 closure of areas in the Fishery

I, Peter Rogers, Executive Director of the Department of Fisheries Western Australia, in accordance
with the Shark Bay Prawn Management Plan 1993 hereby give notice that I have cancelled
Determination No. 1 of 2002 which set out the dates and times that fishing is prohibited in the Shark
Bay Prawn Managed Fishery.

I hereby give notice that a new Determination (Determination No. 2 of 2002) has been made in
accordance with clause 10 of the Shark Bay Prawn Management Plan 1993 of the times and dates
that fishing is prohibited in the Shark Bay Prawn Managed Fishery during the period commencing
from the date of gazettal of this notice and ending 1 April 2003.
A copy of this Determination which is signed by me may be obtained from, or inspected at the Head
Office of the Department of Fisheries Western Australia located at 168 St Georges Terrace, Perth or
the offices located at 83 Olivia Terrace, Carnarvon and Knight Terrace, Denham.
Dated this 26th day of June 2002.

P. P. ROGERS, Executive Director.

HEALTH

HE401
HEALTH ACT 1911

APPOINTMENTS
Health Department of WA,
Perth, 21 June 2002.

In accordance with the provisions of section 28 of the Health Act 1911, the appointment of the
following persons as Environmental Health Officers is approved.

Environmental Health Officer Date Effective Local Government
Rodney Alexander Wood 11 June 2002 Shire of Irwin

Erica Louise Scott 14 June 2002 Shire of Mingenew

Erica Louise Scott 14 June 2002 Shire of Yalgoo

Graeme Calnon 6 June 2002 - 19 July 2002 Town of Port Hedland
Graeme Calnon 5 August 2002 - 18 October 2002 Shire of Roebourne

John Randall 15 July 2002 Mortlock Health Group
Andrew Hawthorne 17 June 2002 - 19 July 2002 Shire of Boddington

Alex Wiese 10 June 2002 City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder

Dr VIRGINIA McLAUGHLIN, Acting Executive Director, Public Health.

HERITAGE

HR401*
Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990

NOTICE OF ENTRY OF PLACES IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES

Notice is hereby given in accordance with Section 51(2) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for the Environment & Heritage, the places described
in Schedule 1 have been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect
from today.

Schedule 1

Description of Place

Model Timber Home at 12 The Boulevard, Floreat; Lt 6 on P 5659, being the whole of the land
comprised in C/T V 1040 F 131.

Pursuant to directions from the Minister for the Environment & Heritage, notice is hereby given in
accordance with Section 49(1) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 that it is proposed that
the places described in Schedule 2 be entered in the Register of Heritage Places. The Heritage Council
invites submissions on the proposal which must be in writing & should be forwarded to the address
below not later than 9 August 2002. The places will be entered in the Register on an interim basis
with effect from today.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3127

Schedule 2
Description of Place

Cuballing Post Office & Quarters at 195 Campbell Street, Cnr Alton Street, Cuballing; Ptn of
Cuballing Lt 20 & being Lt 2 on D 33149 & being the whole of the land comprised in C/T V 7 F 219A.

Cue Railway Station (fmr) off Wittenoom Street, Cue; Cue Lt 500 being R 38357 being the whole of
the land contained in CLR V 3007 F 136.

House, 4 Scott Street at 4 Scott Street, Guildford; Lot 133 on Plan 13 being the whole of the land
comprised in C/T V 1402 F 78.

NOTICE OF ADVICE REGARDING REGISTRATION OF HISTORIC PRECINCTS

Notice is hereby given in accordance with Section 48 of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for the Environment & Heritage, the place described in
Schedule 3 has been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect from
today.
Schedule 3
Description of Place

Summer Hill Farm Precinct at Great Northern Highway, New Norcia; Ptn of Lt 101 on D 88368 &
being part of the land comprised in C/T V 2097 F 9 as is defined in HCWA survey No 3943 prepared
by Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd.
Dated 28 June 2002 .

IAN BAXTER, DIRECTOR, Office of the Heritage Council.

108 Adelaide Terrace East Perth WA 6004.

HOUSING AND WORKS

HW401*

COUNTRY HOUSING ACT 1998
STANDARD RATE OF INTEREST
Notice is hereby given, in accordance with Section 40 of the Country Housing Act 1998 that the
standard rate of interest to apply for assistance provided under this act is 6.50% effective from
1st July, 2002.
TOM STEPHENS MLC, Minister for Housing and Works.

JUSTICE
JU401*

PRISONS ACT 1981
GAZETTAL OF PERMIT DETAILS

Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Director General of the
Department of Justice has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security Work—

SURNAME OTHER NAMES PERMIT No. ISSUE DATE
LAGUE MATTHEW JOHN AP 0202 10 April 2002
WRIGHT GEOFF AP 0192 10 December 2001

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981.

Dated 19 June 2002.
BRIAN YEARWOOD, A/Director, Custodial Contracts.

LocAL GOVERNMENT

LG401*

BUSH FIRES ACT 1954
Shire of Northampton
APPOINTMENTS

Notice is hereby given that the following persons have been appointed as Authorised Officer to
exercise powers pursuant to the Bush Fires Act 1954—

Garry Keeffe Bob Fraser Ken Harris
Kristy Williams Murray Carson Marshall Clifton
Brett Bain Colin Reynolds Stan Sutherland
Sam Smith Richard Allen Lindsay Rowe
Owen Simkin Chris Haselby Nigel Simkin

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.
GARRY L. KEEFFE, Chief Executive Officer.



3128 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

LG402
DOG ACT 1976

Shire of Coolgardie
AUTHORISED PERSONS
At the Ordinary Council Meeting of 23 May 2002, the following persons were appointed as Authorised
Persons under the provisions of the Dog Act 1976 for the Municipality of the Shire of Coolgardie.
Mr Troy Linch

Mr Tyronne Tucker
JIM FRASER, Chief Executive Officer.

LG501*
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954

Shire of Northampton
NOTICE TO ALL OWNERS AND OCCUPIERS OF LAND

Pursuant to the powers contained in Section 33 of the above Act, you are hereby required on or before
the 1st day of October of each year to plough, scarify, cultivate or otherwise clear and thereafter
maintain free of all inflammable material until February 15th of the following year, firebreaks of not
less than two metres in width in the following positions on the land owned or occupied by you—

RURAL LAND

(a) Within 20 metres inside all external boundaries of the property, and where such lands
are divided by or abut a trafficable road within 20 metres inside the land abutting that
road.

(b) In such positions as is necessary to divide all land under pasture in excess of 200 hectares
into areas not exceeding 200 hectares each completely surrounded by a firebreak.

(¢) Within 20 metres of buildings, haystacks, and fuel ramps situated on the land.
TOWNSITE LAND

(a) Where the area of land is 2000 square metres or less, all inflammable materials on the
land shall be removed from the whole of the land.

(b) Where the land exceeds 2000 square metres in area, firebreaks at least two metres wide
shall be cleared of all inflammable materials inside all external boundaries of the land
and also immediately surrounding all buildings situated on the land.

(¢) FUEL DEPOTS—In addition to any firebreaks required in paragraphs 1 and 2 herein,
you shall clear of all inflammable material the whole of any land occupied by drums used
for the storage of inflammable liquid, whether the drums contain inflammable liquid or
not, including any land on which ramps for holding the drums are constructed and an
area outside the land so occupied to a distance of not less than three metres.

If it is considered to be impracticable for any reason to clear firebreaks or to remove inflammable
material from land as required by this notice, you may apply to the Council or its duly authorised
Officer, not later than October 1st of each year for permission to provide firebreaks in alternative
position or to take alternative action to abate fire hazards on the land. If permission is not granted by
the Council or its duly authorised Officer, you shall comply with the requirements of this notice.

By order of the Council.

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM

MP101*
CORRECTION
COMMONWEALTH OF AUSTRALIA
PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967
NOTICE OF AMENDMENT OF PROHIBITION OF ENTRY INTO A SAFETY ZONE

Notice MP401* published in the Government Gazette, WA, 21 June 2002, is corrected as follows—

The Floating Production Storage and Offloading facility “Four Lakes” is corrected to “Four

Vanguard”.

RICHARD CRADDOCK, Acting Director Petroleum Division.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3129

MP401
MINING ACT 1978

SECTION 19
INSTRUMENT OF EXEMPTION OF LAND
EXTENSION OF PERIOD
The Minister for State Development pursuant to the powers conferred on him by Section 19 of the
Mining Act 1978, hereby extends the exemption granted on 5 July 2000 and published in Government
Gazette dated 14 July 2000 of that area described hereunder from Divisions 1 to 5 of Part IV of the
Mining Act 1978.
DESCRIPTION
Those portions of land not being private land or land that is the subject of a mining tenement or
application for a mining tenement bordered pink on the plan at page 106 of Department of Mineral
and Petroleum Resources File No. 8471/97 and designated ‘S19/151° on the Departmental Public Plan.
Area: 108.3088 ha
Period of Extension: 5 July 2002 to 4 July 2004

Dated at Perth this 20t day of June 2002.
CLIVE BROWN MLA, Minister for State Development.

MP402*
MINING ACT 1978

CRITERIA FOR ASSESSING ROYALTY RELIEF UNDER THE MINING ACT
DEPARTMENT OF MINERAL AND PETROLEUM RESOURCES
General

1. Relief is to be provided on a project by project and not an industry basis. Each application will
be examined on its merits.

2. The applicant will need to demonstrate long term viability and cash flow problems through
full financial disclosure.

3. Relief will only be recommended if the project is able to demonstrate cash flow problems,
which are beyond the control of management. Cash flows will be negative and of such
importance that they could lead to closure of the project. The cash flow analysis will include
operating cost cash flows and maintenance but capital expenditures for additions, expansion
and new development will be excluded.

4. A project that has a negative cash flow may receive royalty relief but will be required to pay
back to Government the net assistance received when the project moves back into a positive
and sustainable operating cash flow position.

5. Relief will be granted on the basis of a portion only, as specified by the Minister in his
determination, of the royalty base. Royalty exemptions will not be given unless there are
exceptional circumstances.

6. Relief recommended would be short term in nature with regular reviews of the project's
position. Such reviews would generally be performed every six months.

Gold Projects—From 1 July 1998 Until 30 June 2005

7. A gold royalty project will not need to demonstrate long term viability under Criterion 2, in
order to be eligible for temporary royalty relief. Furthermore, the assessment of cash flow
difficulties for gold projects will, in addition to the matters set out in Criterion 3, take into
account replacement capital expenditures essential to the project.

8. Notwithstanding any of the above, if a gold royalty project can demonstrate to the satisfaction
of the Minister that continued payment of a gold royalty alone would force the project to close,
temporary royalty relief shall be granted.

9. Where a gold royalty project that has received temporary royalty relief closes permanently
without fully repaying that royalty relief, the Government will not claim the remaining
royalty liability following the closure.

CLIVE BROWN, Minister for State Development.

MP403*
COMMONWEALTH OF AUSTRALIA

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967
Notice of Grant of Production Licence

PRODUCTION LICENCE NO. WA-25-L has been granted to Agip Australia Limited, Mobil Australia
Resources Company Pty Limited and Tap West Pty Ltd to have effect from and including 21 June
2001.

RICHARD CRADDOCK, Acting Director Petroleum Division.



3130 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE

PI401*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
City of Bunbury
TOWN PLANNING SCHEME No. 6—AMENDMENT No. 239
Ref: 853/6/2/9 Pt 239

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the City of Bunbury Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 18 June 2002 for the purpose of—

1. Rezoning portion of Leschenault Location 26 and being Lot 174 Forrest Avenue, Bunbury
from the 'Residential R15' zone to the 'Special Use—Medical Offices/Consulting
Rooms/Professional Offices' zone as depicted on the scheme amendment maps.

2. Modifying Appendix IV—First Schedule of the Scheme Text by including Lot 174 and the
Permitted Uses and Development Conditions to read as follows—

Description of Land

(Lot, Street etc) Permitted Uses Development Conditions
Lot 174 Forrest The following uses are 1. A person shall not develop or use
Avenue, Bunbury listed as permitted uses— land or erect, use or adapt any
Consulting Rooms building for use as an office unless

. car parking spaces are provided in
Medical Centre, the ratio of 1 car parking space for
Medical Offices, each 30 square metres of gross
Professional Offices floor area or part thereof, or in the
case of consulting rooms, in
accordance with the Scheme
provisions.

2. All future development on the site
shall be in accordance with the
provisions of the City of Bunbury
Town Planning Scheme.

3. A Traffic Management Report to
be provided and approved to the
satisfaction of the Executive
Manager prior to any development
commencing on the site.

4. A Landscaping Plan showing a
landscape buffer to adjoining
properties being provided and
approved to the satisfaction of the
Executive Manager prior to any
development commencing on site.

G. M. CASTRILLI, Mayor.
K. L. WEARY, Acting Chief Executive Officer.

POLICE

PO402*
CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION (IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) ACT 2002

CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION (IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) REGULATIONS 2002
(Notice under regulation 4)
Approved Course of Training

I, Barry Eldon Matthews, Commissioner of Police in the State of Western Australia, under regulation
4(3)(b) of the Criminal Investigation (Identifying People) Regulations 2002 approve the following
courses of training for police officers for the purposes of regulation 4(1)(c) and (2)(a) of those
regulations.
1. Identifying Procedures Course—Non-intimate, provided by the Western Australia Police
Service.

2. Identifying Procedures Course—Intimate, provided by St John of God Health Care Inc.

Dated 215t June 2002.
B. E. MATTHEWS, Commissioner of Police.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3131

PO401*
CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION (IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) ACT 2002

CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION (IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) REGULATIONS 2002
(Notice under regulation 4)
Approved Forensic Scientists

I, Barry Eldon Matthews, Commissioner of Police in the State of Western Australia, under regulation
4(3)(a) of the Criminal Investigation (Identifying People) Regulations 2002 approve the following
persons, employed as Forensic Scientists by The Western Australian Centre for Pathology and
Medical Research (PathCentre), as forensic scientists for the purposes of regulation 4(1)(a) of those
regulations.

Title | Given names Family name DoB Qualifications

Mr Aleksander BAGDONAVICIUS 03/10/52 B.Sc (Med Sc)

Mr Martin BLOOMS 12/09/50 B.Sc Med Sc)

Mr Scott Elliott EGAN 13/08/75 B.Sc (Human Biol)

Mrs | Anna-Marie FURMEDGE 28/11/66 B.Sc Med Sc),
P Grad Dip (Biomed Sc)
B.Sc (Hons),

Dr Gavin Robert TURBETT 09/07/65 PhD,
RFP (Biology)

Mr Laurance Grant WEBB 23/05/57 B.Sc (Med Sc)

Dated 21t June 2002.
B. E. MATTHEWS, Commissioner of Police.

PO501
POLICE ACT 1892

POLICE AUCTION

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892, unclaimed found and stolen property and bicycles will be
sold by public auction at Smith Broughton & Sons, 1 Clayton Street, Midland on Saturday 6t July
2002 at 10.00 am.
The auction is to be conducted by Mr Gary Silcock.
B. MATTHEWS, Commissioner of Police,
West Australian Police Service.

REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT

RD401*

REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT COMMISSIONS ACT 1993

It is hereby notified for general information that the Minister for Peel and the South West has
approved the appointment of the following as board members in accordance with Part 3 of the
Regional Development Commissions Act 1993.

PEEL DEVELOPMENT COMMISSION
Board of Management
e  Mr John Collett appointment as Chairman (Community Member) extended to 31 December 2002;

e Cr Jan Star, AM appointment as Deputy Chairman (Ministerial Member) extended to
31 December 2002;

e  Mr Mark Anderson appointed as a Community Member for a term expiring on 31 December 2002;
e Mr Keith Holmes appointed as a Ministerial Member for a term expiring on 31 December 2002;

e Cr Thomas Cornock appointed as a Local Government Member for a term expiring on
31 December 2002;

e Cr Ian Richards appointment as a Local Government Member extended to 31 December 2002.

SOUTH WEST DEVELOPMENT COMMISSION
Board of Management
e Mrs Ann Miller appointed as a Community Member for a term expiring on 31 December 2002;
e  Mrs Margaret Lane appointed as a Ministerial Member for a term expiring on 30 June 2004;

e Cr Maureen Thurston appointed as a Local Government Member for a term expiring on 30 June
2003.
JIM McGINTY MLA, Attorney General, Minister for Peel and the South West.



3132 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR

RG401

LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988
SUMMARY OF LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS

The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and
required to be advertised. Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about
the objection process, should contact the Liquor Licensing Division, 1st Floor, Hyatt Centre,
87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant industry
organisation.

Last Date
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for
Objections
APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE
8984 Valerie Lawson & Application for the grant of a Producer’s 10/7/2002
Michael Lawson licence in respect of premises situated in
Wandering and known as Concotten Creek.
8992 Midland Railway Application for the grant of a Special Facility 23/5/2002
Company Pty Ltd Package/Transport in respect of premises
situated in Midland.
9000 David John Brocksopp Application for the grant of a Producer’s 21/7/2002
licence in respect of premises situated in
Pemberton and known as Lillian.
9159 Rosemary Dianne Application for the grant of a Producer’s 24/7/2002
Brent-white & Drew licence in respect of premises situated in
Brenton Brent-white Yallingup and known as Windance Estate.
9165 Kimac Estate Pty Ltd ~ Application for the grant of a Producer’s 24/7/2002

licence in respect of premises situated in
Mount Barker and known as Trappers Gully.

APPLICATIONS FOR THE REMOVAL OF A LICENCE

148237 Jacwine Pty Ltd Application for the removal of a Wholesaler’s 18/7/2002
licence from premises situated in Osborne
Park suburb to a new site in Shenton Park
and known as Jacwine Pty Ltd.

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS

12502 Bx Management Pty Application for the grant of an extended 14/7/2002
Ltd trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in
respect of premises situated in Mount Barker
and known as Mount Barker Hotel.

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988.
26 June 2002.

HUGH HIGHMAN, Director of Liquor Licensing.

TREASURY AND FINANCE

TF401*
LAND TAX
Notice to All Owners of Land or Property in Western Australia

Annual Returns

Annual Returns are not required for 2002/2003

The Department will issue assessment notices to property owners, based on registered land holdings
as at 30 June 2002.

Applications for Exemption or Concession

The owner of any class of land in respect of which an exemption or concession may be granted, is
required to make application for the exemption or concession only where the land concerned has been
assessed for land tax for 2002/2003.

BILL SULLIVAN, Commissioner of State Revenue.



28 June 2002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3133

PuBLIC NOTICES

77201
TRUSTEES ACT 1962
DECEASED ESTATE
Notice to Creditors and Claimants

In the matter of the Estate of Friedrich Lothar Flockenhaus, late of 2 Sycamore Drive, Duncraig in
the State of Western Australia, Businessman, deceased.

Creditors and other persons having claims to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relate in
respect of the Estate of the deceased, who died on the 3rd day of November 2001, are required by the
Executrixes, Lilian Flockenhaus and Dorothea Flockenhaus, to send the particulars of their claim to
Messrs Taylor Smart of Level 28, 44 St George’s Terrace, Perth in the State of Western Australia, by
the 29th day of July 2002 after which date the said Executrixes may convey or distribute the assets,
having regard only to the claims of which they then have had notice.

Dated the 20th day of June 2002.
GARRY E. SAME, Taylor Smart.

77202
TRUSTEES ACT 1962
DECEASED ESTATES
NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS
William Frank Smith, late of 40 Stinton Street, Mandurah in Western Australia, Seaman.

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 8 February 2002 at Peel Health Campus, Lakes
Road, Greenfields in Western Australia, are required by the personal representative, being Geoffrey
Ernest Peacock to send particulars of their claims to 7 Ben Hall Rise, Gnangara WA 6065 within 30
days of publication of this notice after which date the personal representative may convey or
distribute the assets, having regard only to the claims of which he then has notice.

FIDOCK & FIDOCK.

77203
TRUSTEES ACT 1962
DECEASED ESTATES
NOTICE TO CREDITORS AND CLAIMANTS

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their
claims to me on or before the 28t July 2002 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets,
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice.

Bicknell, Gerald Maxwell, Late of Midland Nursing Home 44 John Street Midland formerly of 190
Swan Street Guildford, died 3/6/2002, (DE19813190EM45)

Burrows, Beryl Yvonne, Late of 5 Thorpe Street Morley, died 2/6/2002, (DE19820684EM35)

Campin, Wilfred Kenneth, Late of 52 Blackwattle Parade Padbury, died 19/2/2002,
(DE19703554EM33)

Dawson, Eric Ernest, Late of 24 Kalangedy Drive Riverton, died 29/4/2002, (DE19900704EM27)

Doyle, Alfred James, Late of Warwick Village 98 Ellersdale Avenue Warwick, died 13/3/2002,
(DE30335529EM15)

Dzio, Adolf Dzio, Late of Unit 6/2 McKail Street Orana, died 29/7/2001, (DE30333834EM26)

Erceg, Johanna Ardina, Late of 3 National Park Road Swan View, died 31/12/2001,
(DE19980256EM24)

Goodlet, Patricia Grace, Late of 32 Dotterel Way Yangebup, died 23/5/2002, (DE19631846EM43)
Groves, Avis Irene, Late of 3 Morriett Street Attadale, died 11/6/2002, (DE19713572EM44)
Hayes, Lillian Maude, Late of 29 Gardner Street Como, died 12/6/2002, (DE30321059EM24)
Jarvis, Frederick, Late of 8 Tall Karri Close Kelmscott, died 2/6/2002, (DE19913459EM36)
Kinghorn, Walter James, Late of 27 Johnson Street Redcliffe, 20/4/2002, (DE19900006 EM16)



3134 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 June 2002

McKenzie, Charles Thomas, Late of Unit 14 Amherst Street Katanning, died 17/2/2002,
(DE19703620EM27)

Parker, John Douglas, Late of 382 South Terrace South Fremantle, died 10/5/2002,
(DE33009608EM14)

Roberts, Keith Henry Finch, Late of Brightwater Care Group—Birralee 155 Odin Road Innaloo, died
15/5/2002, (DE30333661EM15)

Scott, Neil Edward, Late of 57 Allnut Street Mandurah, died 4/5/2002, (DE19912768EM24)
Shannon, John Mervyn, Late of 97 Wittenoom Street Collie, died 1/4/2002, (DE19710633EM24)

Smith, Olive Elsie, Late of Onslow Gardens Hamersley Road Subiaco, died 28/5/2002,
(DE19710345EM16)

Thomas, Gloria Faith, Late of Unit 2/92 Murray Road Bicton, died 13/6/2002, (DE20002885EM22)
Timms, James Bradley, Late of Bouvard Villas Unit 43/1515 Old Coast Road Bouvard, died 11/5/2002,
(DE19901378EM32)

Townend, Phyllis May, Late of Florence Hummerston Lodge 67 Cleaver Street West Perth formerly of
Unit 10/96 Caledonian Avenue Maylands, died 8/5/2002, (DE19652379EM37)

ANTONINA ROSE McLAREN, Public Trustee,
Public Trust Office, 565 Hay Street,

Perth WA 6000.

Telephone: 9222 6777

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 1992

*Price: $16.70 counter sales
Plus postage on 365 grams

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

RETIREMENT VILLAGES ACT 1992

Price: $14.55 counter sales
Plus postage on 132 grams

RETIREMENT VILLAGES REGULATIONS 1992

*Price: $4.65 counter sales
Plus postage on 25 grams

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

2 002 00 1T 1 6 G G




