
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

741

PERTH, FRIDAY, 7 MARCH 2003  No. 35 SPECIAL

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.45 PM

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981

Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation
(Scales of Fees) Amendment Regulations 2003

Made under section 176(1a) by the Governor in Executive Council,
on the recommendation of the Workers’ Compensation and
Rehabilitation Commission.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Workers'
Compensation and Rehabilitation (Scales of Fees)
Amendment Regulations 2003.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Workers’
Compensation and Rehabilitation (Scales of Fees)
Regulations 1998*.

[* Reprinted as at 24 May 2002.
For amendments to 14 February 2003 see
Gazette 10 September 2002.]

3. Regulation 7A amended

Regulation 7A is amended by deleting “$47” and inserting
instead —

“    $47.20    ”.

4. Schedule 5 amended

Schedule 5 is amended as follows:
(a) in item 1 by deleting “$107” and inserting instead —

“    $107.70    ”;



742 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7 March 2003

(b) in item 2 by deleting “$138” and inserting instead —
“    $139.60    ”;

(c) in item 3 by deleting “$46” and inserting instead —
“    $47.10    ”;

(d) in item 5 by deleting “$82” and inserting instead —
“    $82.40    ”.

Recommended by the Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation
Commission.

Date: 19th February 2003.

B. BRADLEY.

The common seal of the )
)

Workers’ Compensation and ) C.S.
)

Rehabilitation Commission )

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

!200300035gg!


