
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

919

PERTH, TUESDAY, 25 MARCH 2003  No. 46
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Betting Control Act 1954—Betting Control Amendment Regulations 2003................... 921-2
Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981—Workers’ Compensation and

Rehabilitation (Scales of Fees) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2003........................ 922-3

———

PART 2

Agriculture ......................................................................................................................... 924
Consumer and Employment Protection ............................................................................ 924
Fisheries ............................................................................................................................. 924-5
Justice................................................................................................................................. 925
Land Administration ......................................................................................................... 925
Local Government.............................................................................................................. 926
Minerals and Petroleum.................................................................................................... 927-34
Planning and Infrastructure ............................................................................................. 934-9
Transport............................................................................................................................ 939-40
Water and Rivers ............................................................................................................... 940
Worksafe............................................................................................................................. 940



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010.
• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to

observe this request could result in the notice being held over.
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2002 (Prices include GST).
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$21.10
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$49.20
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$49.20 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).
All other Notices
    Per Column Centimetre—$9.80
    Bulk Notices—$183.00 per page
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.

• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they
fall on a Tuesday or Friday.

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 921

— PART 1 —

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR
RG301*

Betting Control Act 1954

Betting Control Amendment Regulations 2003

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Betting Control
Amendment Regulations 2003.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 April 2003.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Betting Control
Regulations 1978*.

[* Reprinted as at 6 April 2001.
For amendments to 7 March 2003 see 2001 Index to
Legislation of Western Australia, Table 4, p. 30, and Gazette
20 September and 17 December 2002.]

4. Regulation 72 amended

Regulation 72(1) is amended as follows:
(a) in paragraph (d)(i) by deleting “$200” and inserting

instead —
“    $100    ”;

(b) in paragraph (d)(i) by deleting  “$2 000” and inserting
instead —
“    $1 000    ”;

(c) in paragraph (d)(ii) by deleting “$100” and inserting
instead —
“    $50    ”;



922 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

(d) in paragraph (d)(ii) by deleting  “$1 000” and inserting
instead —
“    $500    ”.

5. Regulation 75 amended

Regulation 75 is amended as follows:
(a) in paragraph (d)(i) by deleting “$200” and inserting

instead —
“    $100    ”;

(b) in paragraph (d)(i) by deleting  “$2 000” and inserting
instead —
“    $1 000    ”;

(c) in paragraph (d)(ii) by deleting “$100” and inserting
instead —
“    $50    ”;

(d) in paragraph (d)(ii) by deleting  “$1 000” and inserting
instead —
“    $500    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

WORKCOVER
WC301*

Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981

Workers' Compensation and Rehabilitation
(Scales of Fees) Amendment Regulations

(No. 2) 2003

Made under section 176(1a) by the Governor in Executive Council, on
the recommendation of the Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation
Commission.

1. Citation

These rules may be cited as the Workers' Compensation and
Rehabilitation (Scales of Fees) Amendment Regulations
(No. 2) 2003.



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 923

2. The rules amended

The amendments in these rules are to the Workers’
Compensation and Rehabilitation (Scales of Fees)
Regulations 1998*.

[* Reprinted as at 24 May 2002.
For amendments to 5 March 2003 see Gazette
10 September 2002.]

3. Schedule 2 amended

Schedule 2 is amended as follows:
(a) in item 1 by deleting “51.00” and inserting instead —

“    51.70    ”;
(b) in item 2 by deleting “41.00” and inserting instead —

“    41.50    ”;
(c) in item 3 by deleting “51.85” and inserting instead —

“    52.50    ”;
(d) in item 4 by deleting “69.05” and inserting instead —

“    69.90    ”;
(e) in item 5 by deleting “12.00” and inserting instead —

“    12.80    ”;
(f) in item 6 by deleting “116.00” and inserting instead —

“    117.50    ”;
(g) in item 7 by deleting “51.00” and inserting instead —

“    51.70    ”.

Recommended by the Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation
Commission.

B. BRADLEY.

Date: 6th March 2003.

The common seal of the )
)

Workers’ Compensation and ) C.S.
)

Rehabilitation Commission )

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



924 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

— PART 2 —

AGRICULTURE
AG401*

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MEAT INDUSTRY AUTHORITY ACT 1976
APPOINTMENTS

Department of Agriculture,
South Perth WA 6151.

Agric. 491/89
I, Kim Chance, Minister for Agriculture, Forestry and Fisheries, acting in accordance with the
provisions of the Western Australian Meat Industry Authority Act 1976, hereby appoint pursuant to
Sections 8 and 9, the following as members of the Western Australian Meat Industry Authority for a
term of office to expire on 3 March 2006.

Martine Pop Chairperson
Renata Paliskis-Bessell Member
Gary Minton Member
Peter Trefort Member
Warren Robinson Member
John Pugh Member
Malcolm Seymour Member and Deputy Chairperson
David Hopperton Member

KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture, Forestry and Fisheries.

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION
CE401

ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987
Section 35

CANCELLED ASSOCIATION

AMOS (Incorporated)
Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named association has been cancelled as
from the date of this notice.
Dated the 21st day of March 2003.

PATRICK WALKER, Commissioner for Fair Trading.

FISHERIES
FI401*

PEARLING ACT 1990
Section 23(8)

GRANT OF A PEARL OYSTER FARM LEASE—WEST LEWIS ISLAND—DAMPIER ARCHIPELAGO

FD 710/01
I, Peter Millington, the Executive Director of the Department of Fisheries, Western Australia,
pursuant to Section 23 of the Pearling Act 1990 (“the Pearling Act”) have granted an application by
Tennereef Pty Ltd, for a pearl oyster farm lease for quarantine purposes for a period of 8 months, in
respect of an area of water located near West Lewis Island in the Dampier Archipelago.



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 925

Under section 33(1) of the Pearling Act a person aggrieved by my decision may, within 14 days after
publication of this notice in the Gazette appeal against this decision by serving on the Minister for
Agriculture, Forestry and Fisheries a statement in writing of the grounds of that appeal.
The statement of the grounds of appeal may be served on the Minister care of the following address—

The Executive Director, Department of Fisheries
Third Floor, SGIO Atrium
168—170 St Georges Terrace
PERTH WA 6000

Dated this 19th day of March 2003.

P. J. MILLINGTON, Executive Director, Department of Fisheries.

JUSTICE
JU401

CHILDREN’S COURT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1988
APPOINTMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has
approved of the appointment of—
    Mr Wayne Anthony Parker of 8 Harper Street, Port Hedland
as Members of the Children’s Court of Western Australia.

GARY THOMPSON, Executive Director, Court Services.

LAND ADMINISTRATION
LA401

LICENSED SURVEYORS ACT 1909
APPOINTMENTS

Land Surveyors Licensing Board
The Governor in Executive Council, under Section 4 of the Licensed Surveyors Act 1909 has
appointed Cherilyn Miranda Randolph, John Frederic Carter, Barry George Cribb, Anthony John
Snow and Neil Edmund Browne as members of the Land Surveyors Licensing Board for a term of
office expiring 31 December 2003.

G. E. MARION, Secretary, Land Surveyors Licensing Board.

LA402
STATE HOUSING ACT 1946

CANCELLATION OF DEDICATION

Department of Land Administration,
Midland.

Correspondence No: 01894-2001-01RO
It is hereby notified that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has cancelled the State
Housing Act 1946 dedication of the land mentioned in the Schedule.

Schedule
Lot/Location Correspondence No.
Collie Lot 1932 01894-2001-01RO

A/Chief Executive Officer,
Department of Land Administration.



926 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

LOCAL GOVERNMENT
LG401

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
Shire of Mundaring

(Basis of Rates)
Department of Local Government

And Regional Development.
21 March 2003.

DLGRD: NP5-1
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the
Local Government Act 1995, the Director General of the Department of Local Government and
Regional Development under delegation from the Hon Tom Stephens MLC, Minister for Local
Government and Regional Development being charged for the time being, with the administration of
the Local Government Act 1995, has determined that the method of valuing the land described in the
schedule hereunder shall be gross rental value for the purposes of rating with effect from
20 December 2002.

CHERYL GWILLIAM, Director General.

Schedule
CORR: 2488/971 V1

TECHNICAL DESCRIPTION
ADDITION TO GROSS RENTAL VALUE AREAS

SHIRE OF NANNUP
All that portion of land the subject of Deposited Plan 31490.

LG402*
DOG ACT 1976

Shire of Dalwallinu
APPOINTMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed, under the
provisions of the Dog Act 1976 for the municipality of the Shire of Dalwallinu—
Registration Officers Authorised Officers
Mr P.J. Crispin Mr B.W. Seale
Miss T.A. Morgan Mr T.J. Walker
Ms K.Y. Patiniotis Mr M.A. Burgess
Ms D.N. Hansen Mr I.E. Wilson
Mr B.G. Parkinson Mr B.G. Parkinson
Miss C.R. Andrews Mr K.D. Ashby

Mr D.C. Head
Mr P.J. Crispin

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.

W. T. ATKINSON, Chief Executive Officer.

LG403*
DOG ACT 1976
Shire of Corrigin
APPOINTMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed under the
provisions of the Dog Act 1976 (as amended) for the municipality of the Shire of Corrigin—

Registration Officers Authorised Officers
Mrs Karen Wilkinson Mr Bruce Mead
Miss Jody McMiles Mr Scott McKenzie
Miss Heather Blacklock Mr Edwin Long
Mr Scott McKenzie Mr Greg Tomlinson

Mr Rodney Anderson
Mr Leslie Caley

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.

BRUCE MEAD, Chief Executive Officer.



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 927

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM
MP401*

Commonwealth of Australia
PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967

NOTICE OF INVITATION FOR APPLICATIONS FOR EXPLORATION PERMITS

(2003 Offshore Acreage Release—West Australian Adjacent Area)
I, William Lee Tinapple, the delegate of the Designated Authority in respect of the adjacent area of
Western Australia, for and on behalf of the Commonwealth-Western Australia Offshore Petroleum
Joint Authority, acting pursuant to Section 20(1) of the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1967,
hereby invite applications for the grant of exploration permits in respect of the following Blocks
within the areas as described in the following schedule.
The Commonwealth/State/Territory jurisdictional boundary in coastal waters is determined by the
Australian Maritime Boundaries Information System Dataset of 2000, released in January 2001 by
the Australian Surveying and Land Information Group (now Geoscience Australia National Mapping
Division).
Section 5AAA of the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1967 provides that, where a change to the
baseline of Australia’s territorial sea would impact on the boundary of an existing petroleum title (in
Commonwealth or State or Territory waters), there is in fact no such impact. The Commonwealth,
State or Territory Act (as the case may be) under which the title has been granted, continues to apply
to the title and the whole title area for as long as the title remains in force. Therefore, this Instrument
does not apply to any such area that is already under title.
Applications for areas W03-7 to W03-15 will be received up until 4:00 pm on Thursday,
25 September 2003.
Applications for areas W03-1 to W03-6 will be received up until 4:00 pm on Thursday
25 March 2004.

Schedule
(The references hereunder are to the names of map sheets of the 1:1 000 000 series and to the number
of the graticular sections shown thereon).
Area W03-1
Caswell Sub-basin, Browse Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SD51 (Brunswick Bay)
1468 1469 1539 1540 1541
1611 1612 1613 1683 1684
1685 1755 1756 1757 1827
1828 1829
Assessed to contain 17 graticular blocks

Area W03-2
Caswell Sub-basin, Browse Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SD51 (Brunswick Bay)
1682 1754 1825(part) 1826 1896(part)
1897(part) 1898 1967(part) 1968 1969
2039 2040 2041 2112 2184
2256
Assessed to contain 16 graticular blocks

Area W03-3
Caswell Sub-basin, Browse Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SD51 (Brunswick Bay)
1899 1900 1901 1972 1973
2044 2045 2116 2117 2187
2188 2189 2257 2258 2259
2260 2261
Assessed to contain 17 blocks

Area W03-4
Northern Exmouth Plateau, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SE49
1430 1431 1432 1433 1434
1435 1436 1437 1438 1439
1440 1502 1503 1504 1505
1506 1507 1508 1509 1510
1511 1512 1574 1575 1576



928 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

1577 1578 1579 1580 1581
1582 1583 1584 1646 1647
1648 1649 1650 1651 1652
1653 1654 1655 1656 1718
1719 1720 1721 1722 1723
1724 1725 1726 1727 1728
1790 1791 1792 1793 1794
1795 1796 1797 1798 1799
1800 1862 1863 1864 1865
1866 1867 1868 1869 1870
1871 1872 1934 1935 1936
1937 1938 1939 1940 1941
1942 1943 1944 2006 2007
2008 2009 2010 2011 2012
2013 2014 2015 2016 2078
2079 2080 2081 2082 2083
2084 2085 2086 2087 2088
2150 2151 2152 2153 2154
2155 2156 2157 2158 2159
2160

Map Sheet SE50 (Rowley Shoals)
1369 1370 1441 1442 1513
1514 1585 1586 1657 1658
1729 1730 1801 1802 1873
1874 1945 1946 2017 2018
2089 2090
Assessed to contain 143 blocks

Area W03-5
Northern Exmouth Plateau, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SE50 (Rowley Shoals)
1371 1372 1373 1374 1375
1376 1377 1378 1379 1380
1381 1382 1443 1444 1445
1446 1447 1448 1449 1450
1451 1452 1453 1454 1515
1516 1517 1518 1519 1520
1521 1522 1523 1524 1525
1526 1587 1588 1589 1590
1591 1592 1593 1594 1595
1596 1597 1598 1659 1660
1661 1662 1663 1664 1665
1666 1667 1668 1669 1670
1731 1732 1733 1734 1735
1736 1737 1738 1739 1740
1741 1742 1803 1804 1805
1806 1807 1808 1809 1810
1811 1812 1813 1814 1875
1876 1877 1878 1879 1880
1881 1882 1883 1884 1885
1886 1947 1948 1949 1950
1951 1952 1953 1954 1955
1956 1957 1958 2019 2020
2021 2022 2023 2024 2025
2026 2027 2028 2029 2030
2091 2092 2093 2094 2095
2096 2097 2098 2099 2100
2101 2102
Assessed to contain 132 blocks

Area W03-6
Northern Exmouth Plateau, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SE50 (Rowley Shoals)
1383 1384 1385 1386 1387
1388 1389 1390 1391 1392
1393 1394 1395 1396 1455
1456 1457 1458 1459 1460



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 929

1461 1462 1463 1464 1465
1466 1467 1468 1527 1528
1529 1530 1531 1532 1533
1534 1535 1536 1537 1538
1539 1540 1599 1600 1601
1602 1603 1604 1605 1606
1607 1608 1609 1610 1611
1612 1671 1672 1673 1674
1675 1676 1677 1678 1679
1680 1681 1682 1683 1684
1743 1744 1745 1746 1747
1748 1749 1750 1751 1752
1753 1815 1816 1817 1818
1819 1820 1821 1822 1823
1824 1825 1887 1888 1889
1890 1891 1892 1893 1894
1895 1896 1897 1959 1960
1961 1962 1963 1964 1965
1966 1967 1968 1969 2031
2032 2033 2034 2035 2036
2037 2038 2039 2040 2041
2103 2104 2105 2106 2107
2108 2109 2110 2111 2112
2113
Assessed to contain 136 blocks
Area W03-7
Rankin Platform, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SE50 (Rowley Shoals)
3182 3183 3254 3255 3326
3327 3397 3398 3399

Map Sheet SF50 (Hamersley Range)
13
Assessed to contain 10 graticular blocks
Area W03-8
Dampier and Beagle Sub-basins, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SE50 (Rowley Shoals)
2846 2847 2848 2849 2850
2851 2918 2919 2920 2921
2922 2923 2990 2991 2992
2993
Assessed to contain 16 graticular blocks
Area W03-9
Dampier and Beagle Sub-basins, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SE50 (Rowley Shoals)
2994 2995 3061 3062 3063
3064 3065 3066 3067 3133
3134 3135 3136 3137 3138
3139 3203 3204 3205 3206
3207 3275 3276 3277 3347
Assessed to contain 25 graticular blocks
Area W03-10
Southern Exmouth Plateau, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SF49 (Cloates)
494 495 496 497 498
499 500 501 502 566
567 568 569 570 571
572 573 574 638 639
640 641 642 643 644
645 646 710 711 712
713 714 715 716 717
718 782 783 784 785
786 787 788 789 790
854 926
Assessed to contain 47 graticular blocks



930 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

Area W03-11
Southern Exmouth Plateau, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SF49 (Cloates)
503 504 575 576 647
648 719 720 791 792

Map Sheet SF50 (Hamersley Range)
433 434 435 436 437
438 505 506 507 508
509 510 577 578 579
580 581 582 649 650
651 652 721 722 723
724 795
Assessed to contain 37 graticular blocks

Area W03-12
Barrow Sub-Basin, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SF50 (Hamersley Range)
664(part) 736(part)
Assessed to contain 2 graticular blocks

Area W03-13
Exmouth Sub-basin, Carnarvon Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SF49 (Cloates)
1581 1652 1653 1724 1796
1866 1867 1868 1938 1939
2010 2011 2082 2154 2226
Assessed to contain 15 graticular blocks.

Area W03-14
Edel Sub-Basin, Perth Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SH50 (Perth)
365(part) 366(part) 437 438(part) 439(part)
510 511(part) 582(part) 583(part) 654
655(part) 726 727(part) 728(part) 798
Assessed to contain 15 graticular blocks

Area W03-15
Perth Basin, Western Australia
Map Sheet SH50 (Perth)
2019 2020 2021 2091 2092
2093 2163 2164 2165 2166
2167 2168 2169 2170 2171
2172(part) 2235 2236 2237 2238
2239 2240 2241 2242 2243
2244(part) 2245(part) 2307 2308 2309
2310 2311 2312 2313 2314
2315 2316 2317(part) 2379 2380
2381 2382 2383 2384 2385
2386 2387 2388 2389(part) 2390(part)
2451 2452 2453 2454 2455
2456 2457 2458 2459 2460
2461 2462(part) 2463(part) 2523 2524
2525 2526 2527 2528 2529
2530 2531 2532 2533 2534
2535(part) 2536(part)
Assessed to contain 77 graticular blocks

SPECIAL CONDITIONS
Area W03-15
No exploration or development activities will be permitted within the Lancelin Defence Training
Area, which overlaps part of area W03-15 without prior approval from the Department of Defence.
Successful applicants will be required to consult closely with the Royal Australian Navy if proposing
to enter into the Lancelin Defence Training Area.



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 931

APPLICATIONS FOR AREAS –W03-1 TO W03-15
Applications for the award of a permit over areas W03-1 to W03-15 are required to be made in the
approved manner, submitted in duplicate and should be accompanied by—
1.1 Details of—

1.1.1 Technical Assessment
The applicant’s technical assessment of the petroleum potential of the area, including the
concepts underlying its proposed exploration work program, with sufficient detail to
support that program

1.1.2 Minimum Guaranteed Work Program
The applicant’s minimum guaranteed proposal (including indicative minimum
expenditure) for exploration wells to be drilled, 3D and 2D seismic and other surveying
activities, data evaluation and other work, for each year of the first three years of the
permit term. This proposal, to be known as the minimum guaranteed work program,
should comprise work expected to involve a substantial exploration component—
normally, appraisal work should not be included

1.1.3 Secondary Work program
The applicant’s proposal (including indicative minimum expenditure) for exploration
wells to be drilled, 3D and 2D seismic and other surveying activities, data evaluation and
other work, for each of the three remaining years of the permit term. This proposal, to be
known as the secondary work program, should comprise work expected to involve a
substantial exploration component—normally, appraisal work should not be included.

NOTE: Applicants should note it is mandatory that the minimum work program proposed in
each year of the exploration permit is stated precisely to avoid any ambiguity. Proposals
for work programs that cannot be guaranteed to be undertaken within the first 3 years of
the permit must not be included.

1.2 Particulars of the applicant—
1.2.1 the technical qualifications of the applicant and of its key employees
1.2.2 the technical advice available to the applicant
1.2.3 the financial resources available to the applicant, including evidence of the applicant’s

ability to fund the work program proposed, a statement of other exploration commitments
over the next 6 years, and a copy of the latest annual and quarterly reports for each
applicant company

1.2.4 where relevant, the viability of the consortium lodging the application, including evidence
that a satisfactory settlement has been, or can be, reached on the Joint Operating
Agreement (a copy of a signed Heads of Agreement dealing will generally suffice), and

1.2.5 the percentage participating interest of each party to the application.
1.3 Other Information
Such other information as the applicant wishes to be taken into account in consideration of the
application. Where an applicant has previously had an exploration permit cancelled such information
might include why the applicant believes the prior failure is irrelevant to the current application.
1.4 Fee
Each application must be accompanied by a fee of $A3,900, payable to the Commonwealth of
Australia through an Australian bank or bank cheque.
An information package on the release areas detailing the work program bidding system outlined
above and including the criteria for assessment of applications and the conditions to apply following
the award of a permit, is available on the Department of Industry, Tourism and Resources Website at
www.industry.gov.au/petexp, or on CD-ROM. Copies of the CD-ROM can be obtained through the
Department of Industry, Tourism and Resources by e-mailing petroleum.exploration@industry.gov.au.
Obtaining and observing the release package is essential to making an informed
application for any of the areas.
The Government will also publish on-line data about Australia’s petroleum exploration opportunities.
This spatial data gives key hydrocarbon well information (about hydrocarbon shows, biostratigraphic
age, porosity and depositional environment) and will be released on the Geoscience Australia internet
site at www.ga.gov.au free of charge.
It should be noted that any income derived in the future from the recovery of petroleum from these
areas will be subject to the Commonwealth Government's Resources Rent Tax.
Lodgement of Applications
Applications for areas W03-7 to W03-15 must be lodged before 4:00 pm on Thursday, 25 September
2003.
Applications for areas W03-1 to W03-6 must be lodged before 4:00 pm on Thursday 25 March 2004.
Applications, together with supporting data should be submitted in the following manner to—

Director Petroleum Division
Department of Industry and Resources
Level 11, Mineral House
100 Plain Street
EAST Perth  Western Australia  6004
Attention: Petroleum Applications Receiving Officer



932 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

The following special instructions should be observed—
• two copies of the application and supporting data together with the application fee should be

sealed in an envelope or package, clearly marked “Application for Exploration Permit
Area...Commercial-in-Confidence”; and

• further enclosed in a plain covering envelope or package and delivered by hand or posted to
the above address.

Receipts for applications (received and delivered by hand) will be issued by the Petroleum
Applications Receiving Officer.
Enquiries concerning this gazettal should be referred to—

Senior Titles Officer (Titles)
Petroleum Division
Telephone: (08) 9222 3186
Facsimile: (08) 9222 3799

MP402*
PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1982

Section 20(1)
PETROLEUM ACT 1967

Section 30(1)
DISCRETE AREA (COASTAL WATERS) RELEASE

Invitation for Applications for the Grant of Exploration Permits
Release Date: Tuesday 25 March 2003
Closing Date: Thursday 4:00pm 18 September 2003

AREAS AVAILABLE
Applications are invited for the grant of exploration permits over the following discrete areas within
Western Australia’s coastal waters and onshore Perth Basin as identified on the attached
plans.
Applications will be received up until 4.00 PM on Thursday, 18 September 2003.

AREAS L03-1 with T03-2
These areas comprise blocks described below which straddle the baseline dividing the Petroleum Act
1967 from the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1982.
Despite that two statutes are involved, only a single combined application (proposing a unified work
program) is necessary. However the application fee in this instance is $7800.00.
While two permits will be issued to the successful applicant, those permits will, as far as the
legislation allows be dealt with as one.

AREA L03-1
Map Sheet (SF50) Hamersley Range
Block No.
5879
Assessed to contain 1 block.

AREA T03-2
Map Sheet (SG49) Carnarvon
Block No. Block No. Block No.
5807 T 5878 T 5879 T
Assessed to contain 3 blocks.

ONSHORE
AREA L03-2
Map Sheet (SI50) Albany
Block No. Block No. Block No.
6598 6670 6671
6742 6743
Assessed to contain 5 blocks.

AREA L03-3
Map Sheet (SI50) Albany
Block No. Block No. Block No.
6814 6815 6886
6887 6888 6959
6960
Assessed to contain 7 blocks.



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 933

OFFSHORE
AREA T03-1
Map Sheet (SD52) Darwin
Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
7111 T 7112 T 7183 T 7184 T
7185 T 7186 T 7187 T 7257 T
7258 T 7259 T 7260 T 7264 T
7330 T 7331 T 7332 T 7333 T
7334 T 7335 T 7336 T 7337 T
7338 T 7339 T 7340 T 7341 T
7404 T 7405 T 7406 T 7407 T
7408 T 7409 T 7410 T 7411 T
7412 T 7413 T 7482 T 7483 T
7484 T 7485 T
Assessed to contain 38 blocks.

AREA T03-3
Map Sheet (SH50) Perth
Block No. Block No. Block No. Block No.
7608 T 7609 T 7680 T 7681 T
7752 T 7753 T 7754 T 7824 T
7825 T 7826 T 7897 T 7898 T
7899 T 7970 T 7971 T 8043 T
8044 T
Assessed to contain 17 blocks.

NOTE
The Commonwealth/State/Territory jurisdictional boundary in coastal waters is determined by the
Australian Maritime Boundaries Information System Dataset of 2000, released in January 2001 by
the Australian Surveying and Land Information Group (now Geoscience Australia National Mapping
Division).
However this is modified by section 5AAA of the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1967, which
provides that, where a change to the baseline of Australia’s territorial sea would impact on the
boundary of an existing petroleum title (in Commonwealth or State or Territory waters), there is in
fact no such impact. The Commonwealth, State or Territory Act (as the case may be) under which the
title has been granted, continues to apply to the title and the whole title area for as long as the title
remains in force. Therefore, this Instrument does not apply to any such area that is already under
title.

APPLICATION INFORMATION
Work Program
Central to any application made is the program of work proposed for each of the years of the six year
term. Applications are to be made in accordance with Section 31 of the Petroleum Act 1967 and
Section 21 of the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1982 as appropriate. Consideration of an
application for the grant of a Permit shall take into account work programs relative to the whole of
the area applied for, the adequacy of the work program and the applicant’s technical and financial
ability to undertake the work. Permits are awarded on the understanding that the first two years
work commitment will be fulfilled without variation.
Where there is more than one applicant to the application, the percentage participating interests of
each party to the application is to be supplied including evidence that a satisfactory settlement has
been, or can be, reached on a Joint Operating Agreement (a copy of a Heads of Agreement dealing will
generally suffice).
Land Access
Applicants should make themselves aware of the existence of any areas, which have the potential to
restrict exploration activities eg, National Parks, Nature Reserves, Marine Parks, World Heritage
Areas and Ramsar wetlands.
Insofar as Reserved Land is concerned, entry for exploration purposes is subject to approval by the
Minister. In this regard, it should be noted that Government policy, at least, is such that petroleum
extraction from within National Parks and Nature Reserves should not be presumed.
Fishing Activities
In respect to offshore areas, impacts on fishing activities should also be considered.
Native Title
Any applications over the above onshore areas may be subject to the provisions of the Commonwealth
Native Title Act 1993 and applicants should be prepared to negotiate with Native Title parties
pursuant to the right to negotiate provisions of the NTA. It should, however, be noted that the right to
negotiate does not apply offshore.
Applicants should also be aware that all the areas available for application are subject (at least in
part) to Native Title claims. Plans showing these claim boundaries are available from the Department
of Industry and Resources.



934 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

Release Package
An information package on the release areas detailing the criteria for assessment of applications and
the conditions to apply following the award of a permit, and including a plan of the release areas and
an application proforma, is available on CD-ROM. Copies of the CD-ROM can be obtained from the
Petroleum Division, Department of Industry and Resources by contacting the Senior Titles Officer
(Titles) on (08) 9222 3186.

LODGEMENT OF APPLICATIONS
Applications must be lodged by 4:00 PM Thursday 18 September 2003. Applications, together
with supporting data, should be submitted to—

Director Petroleum Division
Department of Industry and Resources
Level 11, Mineral House
1000 Plain Street
EAST PERTH WA 6004
Attention: Petroleum Applications Receiving Officer

The following special instructions should be observed—
• The application and supporting data, together with a fee of $3,900.00 (non-refundable)

payable to the Department of Industry and Resources through an Australian Bank or by bank
cheque, should be enclosed in the envelope or package.

• The application should be sealed and clearly marked “Application for Exploration Permit—
Commercial-in-Confidence”.

• Unless delivered by hand to the Petroleum Applications Receiving Officer the sealed
application (as described above) should be enclosed in plain paper, envelope or package and
forwarded to the above address

Receipts for applications (received and delivered by hand) will be issued by the Petroleum
Applications Receiving Officer.
Enquires concerning this gazettal should be referred to—

Senior Titles Officer (Titles)
Petroleum Division
Telephone: (08) 9222 3186
Facsimile: (09) 9222 3799

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE
PI401

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT, 1928
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT

Shire of Northampton
Town Planning Scheme No. 8—Amendment No. 2

Ref: 853/3/14/10 Pt 2
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Northampton Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 17 March 2003 for the purpose of—

(1) Incorporating the following Clauses within Part VI of the Scheme—
6.6 Operation of Special Control Areas

6.6.1 The following special control areas are shown on the Scheme Map—
1. Development Area

6.6.2 In respect of a special control area shown on the Scheme Map, the provisions
applying to the special control area apply in addition to the provisions applying to
any underlying zone or reserve and any general provisions of the Scheme.

6.7 Development Areas
6.7.1 Interpretation

In clause 6.7, unless the context otherwise requires—
‘owners’ means an owner or owners of land in the Development Area; and
‘structure plan’ means a structure plan that has come into effect in accordance

with clause 6.7.12.1.
6.7.2 Purpose of Development Areas

6.7.2.1 The purposes of Development Areas are to—
(a) identify areas requiring comprehensive planning; and



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 935

(b) coordinate subdivision and development in areas requiring comprehensive
planning.

6.7.2.2 Appendix No. 9 describes the Development Areas in detail and sets out the specific
purposes and requirements that apply to the Development Areas.

6.7.3 Subdivision and Development in Development Areas
6.7.3.1 The development of land within a Development Area is to comply with Appendix

No. 9.
6.7.3.2 The subdivision and development of land within a Development Area is to generally

be in accordance with any structure plan that applies to that land.
6.7.4 Structure Plan required

6.7.4.1 The Council is not to—
(a) consider recommending subdivision; or
(b) approve development
of land within a Development Area unless there is a structure plan for the
Development Area or for the relevant part of the Development Area.

6.7.4.2 Notwithstanding clause 6.7.4.1, the Council may recommend subdivision or approve
the development of land within a Development Area prior to a structure plan coming
into effect in relation to that land, if the Council is satisfied that this will not
prejudice the specific purposes and requirements of the Development Area.

6.7.5 Preparation of proposed structure plans
6.7.5.1 A proposed structure plan may be prepared by—

(a) the local government; or
(b) an owner.

6.7.5.2 A proposed structure plan may be prepared for all, or part of, a Development Area.
6.7.6 Details of proposed structure plan

6.7.6.1 A proposed structure plan is to contain the following details—
(a) a map showing the area to which the proposed structure plan is to apply;
(b) a site analysis map showing the characteristics of the site including—

(i) landform, topography and land capability;
(ii) conservation and environmental values including bushland, wetlands, damp

lands, streams and water courses, foreshore reserves and any
environmental policy areas;

(iii) hydrogeological conditions, including approximate depth to water table;
(iv) sites and features of Aboriginal and European heritage value;

(c) a context analysis map of the immediate surrounds to the site including—
(i) the pattern of neighbourhoods, and existing and planned neighbourhood,

town and regional centres;
(ii) transport routes, including arterial routes and neighbourhood connector

alignments, public transport routes and bus stops (if applicable) and
strategic cycle routes;

(iii) existing and future land use;
(d) for local structure plans a map showing proposals for—

(i) neighbourhoods around proposed neighbourhoods and town centres;
(ii) existing and proposed commercial centres;

(iii) natural features to be retained;
(iv) street block layouts;
(v) the street network including street types;

(vi) transportation corridors, public transport network (if applicable), and cycle
and pedestrian networks;

(vii) land uses including residential densities and estimates of population;
(viii) school(s) and community facilities;

(ix) public parklands; and
(x) urban water management areas;

(e) a written report to explain the mapping and to address the following—
(i) the planning framework for the structure plan including any applicable

regional or district structure plans, and any policies, strategies and scheme
provisions which apply to the land, and any environmental conditions which
apply under the Scheme;

(ii) the site analysis including reference to the matters listed in clause 6.7.6.1
(b) above, and, in particular, the significance of the conservation,
environmental and heritage values of the site;

(iii) the context analysis including reference to the matters listed in clause
6.7.6.1(c) above;



936 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

(iv) how planning for the structure plan area is to be integrated with the
surrounding land;

(v) the design rationale for the proposed pattern of subdivision, land use and
development;

(vi) traffic management and safety;
(vii) parkland provision and management;

(viii) urban water management;
(ix) proposals for public utilities including sewerage, water supply, drainage,

gas, electricity and communication services;
(x) the proposed method of implementation including any cost sharing

arrangements and details of any staging of subdivision and development.
6.7.6.2 The maps referred to in clause 6.7.6.l are to—

(a) be drawn to a scale that clearly illustrates the details referred to in clause
6.7.6.1; and

(b) include a north point, visual bar scale, key street names and a drawing title and
number.

6.7.6.3 A proposed structure plan may, to the extent that it does not conflict with the
Scheme, impose a classification on the land included in it by reference to reserves,
zones or the Residential Design Codes, and where the proposed structure plan
becomes a structure plan, the Council is to have due regard to such reserves, zones or
Residential Design Codes when recommending subdivision or approving development
of land within a Development Area.

6.7.6.4 A proposed structure plan must, in the opinion of the Council, be consistent with
orderly and proper planning.

6.7.7 Submission to the Council and Commission
6.7.7.1 A proposed structure plan prepared by an owner is to be submitted to the Council.
6.7.7.2 Within 7 days of preparing or receiving a proposed structure plan which proposes the

subdivision of land, the Council is to forward a copy of the proposed structure plan to
the Commission.

6.7.7.3 The Commission is to provide comments to the Council as to whether it is prepared to
endorse the proposed structure plan with or without modifications.

6.7.7.4 The Commission must provide its comments to the Council within 30 days of
receiving the proposed structure plan.

6.7.8 Advertising of structure plan
6.7.8.1 Within 60 days of preparing or receiving a proposed structure plan that conforms

with clause 6.7.6 and complies with the Scheme (or such longer time as may be
agreed in writing between the owner who submitted the proposed structure plan and
the Council), the Council is to—
(a) advertise, or require the owner who submitted the proposed structure plan to

advertise, the proposed structure plan for public inspection by one or more of the
following ways—

(i) notice of the proposed structure plan published in a newspaper circulating
in the Scheme area;

(ii) a sign or signs displaying notice of the proposed structure plan to be erected
in a conspicuous place or places in the Development Area, or part of the
Development Area, to which the proposed structure plan applies; and

(b) give notice or require the owner who submitted the proposed structure plan to
give notice, in writing to—

(i) all owners whose land is included in the proposed structure plan;
(ii) all owners and occupiers who, in the opinion of the Council, are likely to be

affected by the adoption of the proposed structure plan;
(iii) such public authorities and other persons as the Council nominates.

6.7.8.2 The advertisement and notice are to—
(a) explain the scope and purpose of the proposed structure plan;
(b) specify when and where the proposed structure plan may be inspected; and
(c) invite submissions to be lodged with the Council by a specified date being not less

than 21 days after the giving or erection of the notice or publication of the
advertisement, as the case requires.

6.7.9 Adoption of proposed structure plan
6.7.9.1 The Council is to consider all submissions received and within 60 days of the latest

date specified in the notice or advertisement for the making of submissions is to—
(a) adopt the proposed structure plan, with or without modifications; or
(b) refuse to adopt the proposed structure plan and, where the proposed structure

plan was submitted by an owner, give reasons for this to the owner.
6.7.9.2  (a) In making a determination under clause 6.7.9.1, the Council is to have due

regard to the comments and advice received from the Commission in relation to
the proposed structure plan.



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 937

(b) If the Commission requires modifications to the proposed structure plan, the
Council is to consult with the Commission prior to making a determination under
clause 6.7.9.1.

6.7.9.3 If the Council, after consultation with the Commission, is of the opinion that a
modification to the proposed structure plan is substantial, the Council may—
(a) readvertise the proposed structure plan; or
(c) require the owner who submitted the proposed structure plan to readvertise the

proposed structure plan;
and thereafter, the procedures set out in clause 6.7.8.1 onwards are to apply.

6.7.9.4 If within the period referred to in clause 6.7.9.1, or such further time as may be
agreed in writing between the owner who submitted the proposed structure plan and
the Council, the Council has not made a determination under clause 6.7.9.1, the
Council is deemed to have refused to adopt the proposed structure plan.

6.7.10 Endorsement by Commission
6.7.10.1 If the proposed structure plan proposes the subdivision of land, then within 7 days of

making its determination under clause 6.7.9.1, the Council is to forward the proposed
structure plan to the Commission for its endorsement.

6.7.10.2 As soon as practicable after receiving the proposed structure plan, the Commission is
to determine whether to endorse the proposed structure plan.

6.7.10.3 The Commission is to notify the Council of its determination under clause 6.7.10.2.
6.7.11 Notification of structure plan

6.7.11.1 As soon as practicable after adopting a proposed structure plan under clause 6.7.9.1
and if clause 6.7.10 applies, as soon as practicable after being notified of the
Commission’s decision under clause 6.7.10.3, the Council is to forward a copy of the
structure plan to—
(a) any public authority or person that the Council thinks fit; and
(b) where the structure plan was submitted by an owner, to the owner.

6.7.12 Operation of structure plan
6.7.12.1 A structure plan comes into effect—

(a) where the structure plan proposes the subdivision of land, on the day on which it
is endorsed by the Commission pursuant to clause 6.7.10.2; or

(b) on the day on which it is adopted by the Council under clause 6.7.9.1 in all other
cases.

6.7.12.2 If a provision of a structure plan is inconsistent with a provision of the Scheme, then
the provision of the Scheme prevails to the extent of the inconsistency.

6.7.13 Inspection of structure plan
6.7.13.1 The structure plan and the Commission’s notification under clause 6.7.10.3 is to be

kept at the Council’s administrative offices, and is to be made available for inspection
by any member of the public during office hours.

6.7.14 Variation to structure plan
6.7.14.1 The Council may vary a structure plan—

(a) by resolution if, in the opinion of the Council, the variation does not materially
alter the intent of the structure plan;

(b) otherwise, in accordance with the procedures set out in clause 6.7.6 onwards.
6.7.14.2 If the Council varies a structure plan by resolution, and the variation does not

propose the subdivision of land, the Council is to forward a copy of the variation to
the Commission within 10 days of making the resolution.

6.7.14.3 If the Council varies a structure plan by resolution, and the variation proposes the
subdivision of land, the Council is to forward a copy of the variation to the
Commission within 10 days of making the resolution for its endorsement.

6.7.14.4 As soon as practicable after receiving the copy of the variation referred to in clause
6.7.14.3, the Commission is to determine whether to endorse the proposed variation.

6.7.14.5 The Commission is to notify the Council of its determination under clause 6.7.14.4.
6.7.14.6 A variation to a structure plan by resolution comes into effect—

(a) where the variation proposes the subdivision of land, on the day on which it is
endorsed by the Commission pursuant to clause 6.7.14.4; or

(b) on the day on which the Council resolves to make the variation under clause
6.7.14.1 (a).

6.7.15 Detailed area plan
6.7.15.1 Where it is considered desirable to enhance, elaborate or expand the details or

provisions contained in a structure plan for a particular lot or lots, a detailed area
plan may be prepared by—
(a) the Council; or
(b) an owner.



938 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

6.7.15.2 A detailed area plan may include details as to—
(a) building envelopes;
(b) distribution of land uses within a lot;
(c) private open space;
(d) services;
(e) vehicular access, parking, loading and unloading areas, storage yards and

rubbish collection closures;
(f) the location, orientation and design of buildings and the space between buildings;
(g) advertising signs, lighting and fencing;
(h) landscaping, finished site levels and drainage;
(i) protection of sites of heritage, conservation or environmental significance;
(j) special development controls and guidelines; and

(k) such other information considered relevant by the Council.
6.7.15.3 When a proposed detailed area plan is prepared under clause 6.7.15.1, the Council is

to—
(a) advertise, or require the owner who submitted the proposed detailed area plan to

advertise, the proposed detailed area plan for public inspection by one or more of
the following ways—

(i) notice of the proposed detailed area plan published in a newspaper
circulating in the Scheme area;

(ii) a sign or signs displaying notice of the proposed detailed area plan to be
erected in a conspicuous place or places in the Development Area, or part of
the Development Area, to which the proposed detailed area plan applies;
and

(b) give notice or require the owner who submitted the proposed detailed area plan
to give notice, in writing to—

(i) all owners whose land is included in the proposed detailed area plan;
(ii) all owners and occupiers who, in the opinion of the Council, are likely to be

affected by the adoption of the proposed detailed area plan;
(iii) such public authorities and other persons as the Council nominates.

6.7.15.4 The advertisement and notice are to—
(a) explain the scope and purpose of the proposed detailed area plan;
(b) specify when and where the proposed detailed plan may be inspected; and
(c) invite submissions to the Council by a specified date being not less than 21 days

after the giving or erection of the notice or publication of the advertisement, as
the case requires.

6.7.15.5 The Council is to consider all submissions received and—
(a) approve the detailed area plan with or without conditions; or
(b) refuse to approve the detailed area plan and, where the proposed detailed area

plan was submitted by an owner, give reasons for this to the owner.
6.7.15.6 If within 60 days of receiving a detailed area plan prepared under clause 6.7.15.1(b),

or such longer period as may be agreed in writing between the owner and the
Council, the Council has not made one of the determinations referred to in clause
6.7.15.5, the Council is deemed to have refused to approve the detailed area plan.

6.7.15.7 Once approved by the Council, the detailed area plan constitutes a variation of the
structure plan.

6.7.15.8 The Council may vary a detailed area plan in accordance with the procedures set out
in clause 6.7.15 onwards provided such variations do not prejudice the intention of
any related structure plan.

6.7.16 Appeal
6.7.16.1 An owner who has submitted a proposed structure plan under clause 6.7.7.1 may

appeal, under Part V of the Town Planning Act—
(a) any failure of the Council to advertise, or require the owner to advertise, a

proposed structure plan within the required time period under clause 6.7.8.1;
(b) any determination of the Council—

(i) to refuse to adopt a proposed structure plan (including a deemed refusal); or
(ii) to require modifications to a proposed structure plan that are unacceptable

to that owner.
6.7.16.2 An owner who has submitted a detailed area plan in accordance with clause 6.7.15

may appeal, in accordance with Part V of the Town Planning Act, any discretionary
decision made by the Council under clause 6.7.15.

(2) Altering the Table of Contents by inserting the following as required—
Part VI Development Requirements

6.6 Operation of Special Control Areas
6.7 Structure Plans and Development Areas



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 939

Part X Administration
10.8 Delegation of Functions

Appendices
9. Development Areas

(3) Amending the Scheme Map by incorporating a new boundary to encompass the proposed
Special Control Area as shown on the Scheme Amendment Map.

(4) Amending the Scheme Map by incorporating a new symbol “DA” and a corresponding number
to designate the Special Control Area as shown on the Scheme Amendment Map.

(5) Inserting a new Appendix within the Scheme as follows—

Appendix No. 9
DEVELOPMENT AREAS

Area No. Provisions
DA1 1. A structure plan, approved in accordance with Clause 6.7 of the Scheme,

together with any approved variations, shall apply to the land in order to
guide subdivision and development. Subdivision of this land, unless it is of a
minor nature and in the opinion of the Council and the Commission will not
prejudice the future structure planning of the area, will not be supported in
the absence of such a structure plan. Development on this land, unless it is
of a minor nature and in the opinion of the Council will not prejudice the
future structure planning of the area, will not be approved in the absence of
such a structure plan.

G. V. PARKER, President.
G. L. KEEFFE, Chief Executive Officer.

TRANSPORT
TR401*

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982
BOATING PROHIBITED AREA

Deepwater Point, Canning River
Department for Planning and Infrastructure

Fremantle WA, 25 March 2003.
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982,
the department by this notice revokes paragraph (a)(2) of Notice TR402 as published in the
Government Gazette on 27 January 1995, relating to the boating prohibited area at Deepwater Point
on the Canning River.
Providing that this revocation will only apply during the hours of 8.00 a.m. and 12.30 p.m. on
Saturday 29 March 2003.

GREG MARTIN, Chief Executive Officer,
Department for Planning and Infrastructure.

TR402*
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982

RESTRICTED SPEED AREAS

Swan River
Department for Planning and Infrastructure

Fremantle WA, 25 March 2003.
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 67 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982 the
department by this notice revokes paragraphs (d)(2)(i) and (d)(2)(ii) of Notice MH401 as published in
the Government Gazette on 25 October 1991 and replaces the paragraphs as follows—

(i) Mosman Bay—All those waters of the Swan River extending from Point A (32° 0.1016' S
115° 46.4720' E) located on the foreshore at Keanes Point thence in an easterly direction to
Point B (32° 0.1869' S 115° 46.8801' E) being the lit starboard beacon thence south to Point C
(32° 0.5940' S 115° 46.8801' E) thence west to the foreshore at Point D (32° 0.5940' S
115° 46.3105' E). This applies to all vessels of 20 metres or more in length. (all coordinates
based on GDA94)



940 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

(ii) Matilda Bay—All those waters of the Swan River extending from Point A (31° 59.1642' S
115° 49.6512' E) located near Pelican Point thence along the boundary of the Swan Estuary
Marine Park to Point B (31° 59.1562' S 115° 49.6626'E) thence in an easterly direction to
Point C (31° 59.1838' S 115° 50.0575'E) being the unlit starboard beacon thence north to the
foreshore near Quarry Point at Point D (31° 58.2312' S 115° 50.0575'E) but excluding the
gazetted boating prohibited area. This applies to all vessels of 20 metres or more in length.
(all coordinates based on GDA94)

GREG MARTIN, Chief Executive Officer,
Department for Planning and Infrastructure.

WATER AND RIVERS
WR401*

RIGHTS IN WATER AND IRRIGATION ACT 1914
DRAFT LOCAL AREA MANAGEMENT PLAN FOR THE LOWER GASCOYNE RIVER

Notification that a Draft Plan has been prepared and call for Public Comment
The Water and Rivers Commission and the Carnarvon Water Allocation Advisory Committee invites
you to comment on a Draft Local Area Management Plan for the Lower Gascoyne River under section
26GZA of the Rights in Water and Irrigation Act 1914.
You are also invited to attend the public release of the Plan on 27th March 2003 at Santa Rosa
Packing Shed at 2pm. Copies of the plan will be available on the day. (Please RSVP to Leah Jones on
9941 4921 if you wish to attend the public release.)
The Water and Rivers Commission has prepared a Draft Local Area Management Plan in conjunction
with the Carnarvon Water Allocation Advisory Committee. This Plan was developed in response to
the direction of the Lower Gascoyne Management Strategy. The Management Strategy identified a
need to develop appropriate water allocation and management policies for the Lower Gascoyne Region
through the production of a management plan that would include tradeable water entitlements.
This document is the first comprehensive Management Plan developed for the alluvial groundwater
resources associated with the Lower Gascoyne River. It is intended to be both an informative and a
technical publication. The aim of the Plan is to ensure that the groundwater resources of the Lower
Gascoyne River are allocated equitably and used sustainably in the long term for the benefit of the
Carnarvon community, taking into consideration the inherent social, economic and environmental
impacts of such usage.
Copies of the Draft Plan can be obtained from the Commission’s Website at
http://www.wrc.wa.gov.au/using/policy.htm, from the Commission’s Information Centre on telephone
9278 0464 fax 9278 0301 or e-mail to library@wrc.wa.gov.au, and from the Commission’s Carnarvon
office.
For more detailed information contact Ms Claire Thorstensen or Mr Darryl Abbott on telephone
(08) 9941 4921 or facsimile (08) 9941 4931.
Submissions on the draft plan must be written, can be made by any body or person, and must be
received at either of the addresses specified below by the closing date for submissions.
Please send your submission to Ms Claire Thorstensen, Water and Rivers Commission Carnarvon
District Office,
Midwest Gascoyne Region, PO Box 81, CARNARVON WA 6701 or e-mail to
correspondence@wrc.wa.gov.au.
The closing date for submissions is 30 May 2003.

WORKSAFE
WS401*

OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH ACT 1984
OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH REGULATIONS 1996

EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE PURSUANT TO REGULATION 2.13
(No. 12 of 2003)

I, Brian Thomas Bradley, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner, hereby grant an exemption to
Otis Elevator Company Pty Ltd from the requirements of section 17 “Suspension Means” of
AS 1735.2—2001 as cited in regulation 4.56(1)(a)(i) of the Occupational Safety and Health
Regulations 1996 to the extent that will allow the use of flat coated steel belts instead of steel ropes
with two GeN2 Machine Roomless Elevators in the Read Building, which is located on the corner of
Hay and Milligan Streets in Perth.
Dated this 13th day of March 2003.

BRIAN THOMAS BRADLEY, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner.



25 March 2003 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 941

Order your Bound Volumes of
Government Gazette 2003

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

For Government Departments and
private firms who presently arrange
binding for their copies of Government
Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is
now offering a subscription covering 4
Quarterly Volumes at a cost of
$1,039.50.

The Gazettes will be bound in black
cloth with gold foil lettering on the
spine and personalised by  the addition
of the client's name in gold lettering on
the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE
On the rare occasion where extra
gazettes are published in one quarter, a
fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost involved will be
borne by the State Law Publisher and
not passed on to clients.

For further information please contact:

State Law Publisher

Telephone: 9321 7688



942 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 25 March 2003

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2003
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2003. Subject to
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year.
The prices quoted include postage by surface mail unless stated otherwise.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week,
unless disrupted by public holidays or
unforseen circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.
All Gazettes $    
  Within WA ..................................... 781.00
  Interstate  ..................................... 797.50
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,089.00
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,039.50
Electronic Gazette Online
(includes all Gazettes from Jan 1998)
Existing hard copy subscriber .......... 178.20
Electronic Subscription only ............ 594.00
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)....................................... 711.70

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

$    
  Within WA  .................................... 339.90
  Interstate ...................................... 404.80
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 515.00
Electronic Gazette Online
(includes all Gazettes from Jan 1996)
  Existing hard copy subscriber ....... 110.00
  Electronic Subscription only...........220.00
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)....................................... 308.00

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly
during parliamentary sessions.

$    
  Within WA  .................................... 741.40
  Interstate ...................................... 906.40
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 854.00
Bound Volumes of Hansard
  Within WA  .................................... 731.50
  Interstate ...................................... 742.50
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999
  (per year)  ........................................  759.00

STATUTES
Bound Statutes
Bound volumes are posted during March of
the following year.

$    
  Within WA....................................... 265.10
  Interstate ....................................... 293.70
  Overseas ........................................ 272.00
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 729.30
Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)........................................ 264.00

Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA....................................... 283.80
  Interstate ........................................ 293.70
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 382.00

Sessional Bills
Bills are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA ...................................... 390.50
  Interstate ....................................... 409.20
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 555.00

Electronic Statutes Online
Includes all Acts, Regulations, Bills, Acts by
year, Index to Statutes, Hansard, etc

$    
  1st user  ........................................ 697.40
  2nd and each additional user (each) 348.70
  More than 4 users—site licenses apply—
  please contact our sales staff for rates

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is
searchable. Other CD ROM products with
legislation or other statutory information can
be packaged to individual requirements.
Prices are available on request.

!200300046GG!


