
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

1171

PERTH, THURSDAY, 8 APRIL 2004  No. 62
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

ISSN 1448-949X

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Health Act 1911—Health (Pesticides) Amendment Regulations 2004 ........................... 1173-4
Local Government Act 1995—Town of Vincent Local Law Relating to Parks and

Public Reserves Amendment ......................................................................................... 1176
Optometrists Act 1940—Optometrists Registration Board Amendment Rules 2004..... 1175
Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981—Workers’ Compensation and

Rehabilitation Amendment Regulations 2004 .............................................................. 1177

———

PART 2

Fisheries ............................................................................................................................. 1178
Health................................................................................................................................. 1178-80
Justice................................................................................................................................. 1180
Local Government.............................................................................................................. 1180
Minerals and Petroleum.................................................................................................... 1181-2
Parliament.......................................................................................................................... 1183
Planning and Infrastructure ............................................................................................. 1183
Police .................................................................................................................................. 1184-9
Public Notices..................................................................................................................... 1190-1
Water .................................................................................................................................. 1189



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010.
• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to

observe this request could result in the notice being held over.
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2003 (Prices include GST).
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$21.80
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$50.85
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$50.85 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).
All other Notices
    Per Column Centimetre—$10.15
    Bulk Notices—$189.20 per page
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

SPECIAL PUBLICATION NOTICE
GOVERNMENT GAZETTE—EASTER 2004

Advertisers are advised to note the following changes to publication
dates for Government Gazette over the Easter period 2004.

EASTER ISSUES:

THURSDAY 8 APRIL (Copy closes Tuesday 6 April at 12.00 noon)

There will be no edition for  TUESDAY 13 APRIL.

Any enquiries should be directed to John Thompson,
Phone (08) 9426 0010



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1173

— PART 1 —

HEALTH
HE301*

Health Act 1911

Health (Pesticides) Amendment
Regulations 2004

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in
Executive Council on the advice of the Pesticides Advisory Committee.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Health (Pesticides)
Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Health
(Pesticides) Regulations 1956*.

[* Reprint 6 as at 10 October 2003.]

3. Regulation 33 amended

(1) Regulation 33(2) is amended by deleting “$270” and inserting
instead —

“    $280    ”.

(2) Regulation 33(4) is amended by deleting “$250” and inserting
instead —

“    $280    ”.

4. Regulation 36 amended

(1) Regulation 36(1) is amended by deleting “$290” and inserting
instead —

“    $140    ”.

(2) Regulation 36(3)(a) is amended by deleting “$135” and
inserting instead —

“    $140    ”.



1174 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

5. Regulation 63 amended

(1) Regulation 63(2) is amended as follows:

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$270” and inserting
instead —

“    $280    ”;

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$135” and inserting
instead —

“    $140    ”.

(2) Regulation 63(4) is amended by deleting “$270” and inserting
instead —

“    $280    ”.

6. Regulation 68 amended

Regulation 68(c) is amended as follows:

(a) in subparagraph (i) by deleting “$135” and inserting
instead —

“    $140    ”;

(b) in subparagraph (ii) by deleting “$67.50” and inserting
instead —

“    $70    ”;

(c) in subparagraph (iii) by deleting “$135” and inserting
instead —

“    $140    ”.

7. Regulation 70 amended

Regulation 70(6)(a) is amended by deleting “$135” and
inserting instead —

“    $140    ”.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1175

HE302*

Optometrists Act 1940

Optometrists Registration Board Amendment
Rules 2004

Made by The Optometrists Registration Board with the approval of the
Lieutenant-Governor and deputy of the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These rules may be cited as the Optometrists Registration Board
Amendment Rules 2004.

2. The rules amended

The amendments in these rules are to the Optometrists
Registration Board Rules 1941*.

[* Reprint 2 as at 7 March 2003.]

3. Second Appendix amended

The Second Appendix is amended, under the heading “Fees
(other than examination fees)”, in the item “For registration of
an optometrist” by deleting “20.00” and inserting instead —

“    100.00    ”.

Passed by a resolution of The Optometrists Registration Board at a
meeting of the Board held on 17th February 2004.

The Common Seal of )
The Optometrists Registration )
Board was at the time of the )
above resolution affixed in the )
presence of — )

ANNE DURACK, Chairman.

COLIN EMMOTT, Registrar.

Approved by the Lieutenant-Governor and
deputy of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



1176 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

LOCAL GOVERNMENT
LG301*

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
TOWN OF VINCENT LOCAL LAW RELATING TO PARKS AND

PUBLIC RESERVES AMENDMENT

In pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the Local Government Act 1995, and
all other powers enabling it, the Council of the Town of Vincent hereby records
having resolved on 23 March 2004 to amend the Town of Vincent Local Law Relating
to Parks and Public Reserves, published in the Government Gazette on 22 December
1998.
(1) That “Schedule A” be amended, in the appropriate place as follows—

(a) by inserting in column 1, in alphabetical order, the words “Leederville Oval
Reserve”;

(b) by inserting under Leederville Oval Reserve in column 2, the words “RES
3839 Vesting Order 3213/895V3”;

(c) by inserting in column 1, in alphabetical order, the words “Perth Oval and
Loton Park”;

(d) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 3, headed
“Volume”, the number “183”;

(e) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed “Folio”,
the number “169”;

(f) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 3, headed
“Volume”, the number “407”;

(g) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed “Folio”,
the number “110”;

(h) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton in column 3, headed “Volume”, the
number “409”;

(i) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed “Folio”,
the number “180”;

(j) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 3, headed
“Volume”, the number “414”;

(k) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed “Folio”,
the number “72”;

(l) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 3, headed
“Volume”, the number “965”;

(m) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed “Folio”,
the number “70”;

(n) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 3, headed
“Volume”, the number “2034”;

(o) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed “Folio”,
the number “696”;

(p) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 3, headed
“Volume”, the number “2064”;

(q) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed “Folio”,
the number “390”;

(r) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 3, headed
“Volume”, the number “2064”;

(s) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed “Folio”,
the number “391”;

(t) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 3, headed
"Volume", the number "3062";

(u) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed "Folio",
the number "999";

(v) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 3, headed
“Volume”, the number “2540”;

(w) by inserting under Perth Oval and Loton Park in column 4, headed “Folio”,
the number “859”.

Dated: 2 April 2004.
The Common Seal of the Town of Vincent was affixed in the presence of—

NICK CATANIA JP, Mayor.
MIKE ROOTSEY, Acting Chief Executive Officer.



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1177

WORKCOVER
WC301*

Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981

Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation
Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive
Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Workers’ Compensation
and Rehabilitation Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Workers’
Compensation and Rehabilitation Regulations 1982*.

[* Reprinted as at 17 April 2003.
For amendments to 16 February 2004 see Gazette 30 June
and 16 September 2003.]

3. Regulation 17AA amended

Regulation 17AA is amended by deleting “29” and inserting
instead —

“    33    ”.

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



1178 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

— PART 2 —

FISHERIES
FI101*

CORRECTION
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994

WARNBRO SOUND (CRAB) FISHERY MANAGEMENT PLAN AMENDMENT (NO. 2) 2003
An error occurred in the Warnbro Sound (Crab) Fishery Management Plan Amendment (No. 2) 2003
published on pages 5235 to 5237 of Government Gazette No. 202 dated 23 December 2003 and is
corrected as follows.
In clause 3 delete items (d), (e), (f) and (g) and insert the following instead—
“ (d) in the item commencing “pull” by deleting “net or” in both places where it occurs;

(e) by deleting the item commencing “net”;
(f) by deleting the item commencing “regulations' and inserting the following item instead—

“ “regulations” means the Fish Resources Management Regulations 1995;”;
(g) in the item commencing “net” by deleting “net or” in both places where it occurs; and”.

HEALTH
HE402

HEALTH ACT 1911
APPOINTMENTS

Department of Health WA,
Perth, 31 March 2004.

In accordance with the provisions of section 28 of the Health Act 1911, the appointment of the
following persons as Environmental Health Officers is approved.

Environmental Health
Officer

Date Effective Local Government

Kenan Bender 27 February 2004 City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder
Jodi Parry 27 February 2004-30 June 2004 City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder
Michael James Worthington 5 March 2004 Shire of Kalamunda
Kenan Bender 4 March 2004 Shire of Menzies
Laura Kim Tucker 8 March 2004 Town of Port Hedland
Anthony Turner 8 March 2004 Shire of Serpentine-Jarrahdale
John Cameron Mitchell 28 January 2004 Shire of Cunderdin
Kenan Bender 10 March 2004 Shire of Laverton
Nicola Gosatti 11 March 2004-30 June 2004 City of Melville
Sharon Ovens 11 March 2004-30 June 2004 City of Melville
Tanya Politis 18 March 2004 City of Joondalup
Nathan Rayner 18 March 2004 City of Joondalup
Kenan Bender 19 March 2004 Shire of Leonora
David Conrad Bond 19 April 2004 City of Armadale
David Williams 19 April 2004 City of South Perth
Steven Sullivan 19 March 2004 City of South Perth
Sharon Ovens 25 March 2004 City of Belmont
David John Sutton 25 March 2004 Shire of Carnarvon
Bill Donald Warnsbrough 25 March 2004 Shire of Carnarvon

Dr M. STEVENS, Executive Director, Public Health.



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1179

HE401
MEDICAL ACT 1894

ORDERS OF THE BOARD

The Medical Board of Western Australia
Inquiry No. 1596-54
Date Heard: 19, 20, 27, 29 May and 6 June 2003
Date Reasons Delivered: 17 March 2004
Date Orders Delivered: 29 March 2004
In the matter of the Medical Act 1894 (WA) as amended and in the matter of Dr Brian David
Roberman and in the matter of an Inquiry conducted by the Medical Board pursuant to Section 13 of
the Medical Act 1894 (WA) as amended.
Before: Dr T. Lord MBBS, FRACGP; Mr N. Mullany LLB (Hons) (West Aust), BCL (Oxon); Associate
Professor G. Riley MRC Psych., FRACGP, FRANZCP; Dr F. Jefferies MBBS; Mrs White.
Upon hearing Ian Viner AO, QC, with Ms F. Vernon, as counsel assisting the Medical Board, and
John Ley for Dr Brian Roberman, on the allegations contained in the Notice of inquiry issued on 16
January 2003, the Medical Board finds Dr Roberman guilty of gross carelessness, contrary to section
13(1)(c) of the Medical Act 1894 (WA) and orders that—

1. Dr Roberman’s registration be suspended for 9 months from Tuesday, 13 April 2004.
2. Dr Roberman is to pay 65% of the reasonable costs of the Inquiry, to be agreed between the

solicitors for the Practitioner and the solicitors assisting the Board, and if not agreed to be
fixed by the Board after receiving further written submissions in that regard, which written
submissions are to be filed within 30 days.

Dated the 1st day of April 2004.
SIMON HOOD, Registrar.

HE403
MEDICAL ACT 1894

MEDICAL (UNMET AREA OF NEED) DETERMINATION (NO. 9) 2004
Made by the Minister for Health pursuant to section 11AF of the Medical Act 1894.

Citation
1. This determination may be cited as the Medical (Unmet Area of Need) Determination (No. 9) 2004.

Commencement
2. This determination comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government
Gazette.

Unmet area of need
3. The area of need specified in the Schedule is determined to be an unmet area of need for the
purposes of section 11AF(1)D of the Act.

Expiry of determination
4. This determination expires 5 years after its commencement.

SCHEDULE
General Medical Services in the Shire of Yilgarn

Dated this 23rd day of March 2004.
JIM McGINTY MLA, Minister for Health.

HE404
MEDICAL ACT 1894

MEDICAL (UNMET AREA OF NEED) DETERMINATION (NO. 8) 2004
Made by the Minister for Health pursuant to section 11AF of the Medical Act 1894.

Citation
1. This determination may be cited as the Medical (Unmet Area of Need) Determination (No. 8) 2004.

Commencement
2. This determination comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government
Gazette.



1180 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

Unmet area of need
3. The area of need specified in the Schedule is determined to be an unmet area of need for the
purposes of section 11AF(1)D of the Act.

Expiry of determination
4. This determination expires 5 years after its commencement.

SCHEDULE
•  General Medical Services in the Shire of Coomalling.

Dated this 23rd day of March 2004.
JIM McGINTY MLA, Minister for Health.

JUSTICE
JU401*

COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999
REVOCATION OF PERMITS

Pursuant to the provisions of section 56 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the
Director General of the Department of Justice has revoked the following Permits to do High-Level
Security Work—

Surname First Name(s) Permit
Number

Date Permit
Revoked

Fabo Zoltan Laszlo CS2-036 30/03/2004

McIntosh Bryce CS2-087 30/03/2004

Edwards Kenneth Herbert CS2-176 30/03/2004

Sorrin Alan CS2-237 30/03/2004

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999.

BRIAN YEARWOOD, Director, Custodial Contracts.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT
LG401*

SHIRE OF NORTHAMPTON
APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED OFFICER/RANGER

It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Zoltan Fabo has been appointed as Ranger for the
Shire of Northampton and has duly been appointed as an authorised officer to exercise powers
pursuant to the following:

1. Dog Act 1976
2. Bush Fires Act 1954
3. Local Laws relating to—

Reserves & Foreshores, Kalbarri Recreation Jetty, Halfway Bay, Removal & Disposal of
Obstructing Vehicles, Aerodromes and Safety & Decency, Convenience and Comfort of
persons in respect of bathing.

GARRY L. KEEFFE, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402*
SHIRE OF NORTHAMPTON

APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED HONORARY RANGER

It is hereby notified for public information that the appointment of Mr Geoffrey Morris as Honorary
Ranger for the Port Gregory area has hereby been cancelled.

GARRY L. KEEFFE, Chief Executive Officer.



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1181

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM
MP401

MINING ACT 1978
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE

Department of Industry and Resources,
Leonora.

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act,
1978, for breach of covenant, viz. failure to comply with the prescribed expenditure conditions and/or
failure to lodge a report within the prescribed period.

S. P. SHARRATT, (SM), Warden.

To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 27th May, 2004.

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD
Mount Margaret District

Prospecting Licences
38/2368—Granny Smith Mines Ltd; Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd
38/2406—Granny Smith Mines Ltd; Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd
38/2407—Granny Smith Mines Ltd; Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd
38/2409—Granny Smith Mines Ltd; Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd
38/2410—Granny Smith Mines Ltd; Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd
38/2412—Granny Smith Mines Ltd; Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd
38/2414—Granny Smith Mines Ltd; Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd
38/2415—Granny Smith Mines Ltd; Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd
38/3023—Le Chem Pty Ltd
38/3024—Le Chem Pty Ltd
38/3025—Le Chem Pty Ltd

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD
Mount Morgans District

Prospecting Licences
39/4104—Crew, Ross Frederick; Dixon, Trevor John; McKnight, Russell Geoffrey
39/4105—Crew, Ross Frederick; Dixon, Trevor John; Faull, Tony Roy
39/4108—Crew, Ross Frederick; Dixon, Trevor John
39/4112—Crew, Ross Frederick; Dixon, Trevor John
39/4158—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd
39/4159—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd
39/4184—Rocky Reef Mining Pty Ltd; Royal Resources Pty Ltd

MP402
MINING ACT 1978

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE

Department of Industry and Resources,
Mt Magnet.

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Act 1978, notice is hereby given that the licences
are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) for breach of covenant, viz.
non-payment of rent.

S. RICHARDSON, Warden.

To be heard in the Warden’s Court, Mt Magnet on the 18th May, 2004.

MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD
P20/1837—Allie, Wayne Lawrence



1182 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

MP403
MINING ACT 1978

INSTRUMENT OF EXEMPTION OF LAND

The Minister for State Development, pursuant to the powers conferred on him by section 19 of the
Mining Act 1978, hereby exempts all areas of land, described in the Schedule hereunder, not being
private land, from Divisions 1-5 of Part IV of the Mining Act 1978 for a period of two years.

Schedule
All Crown and Reserved land within that area of land south East of Kununurra (at “Duracks Folly”)
in the Kimberley Mineral Field shown as s19/181 in the Department of Industry and Resources’
Tengraph digital mapping system, except for any portion that is comprised in any mining tenement or
application for a mining tenement.
Nett Area: 10032.7638 hectares.

Dated at Perth this 1st day of April 2004.

CLIVE BROWN, MLA, Minister for State Development.

MP404
MINING ACT 1978

INSTRUMENT OF EXEMPTION OF LAND—EXTENSION OF PERIOD

The Minister for State Development, pursuant to the powers conferred on him by Section 19 of the
Mining Act 1978, hereby extends the exemptions as detailed hereunder, for further periods expiring
on 9 May 2006 from Divisions 1 to 5 of Part IV of the Mining Act 1978.
Location: North of Mungari Industrial Park, Kalgoorlie

Description of Land
(Tengraph Notation)

Original exemption
Declared Government Gazette Area

S19/91 28 February 1997 14 March 1997 376.0 ha
S19/101 9 November 1997 14 November 1997 65.52 ha
S19/150 10 May 2000 26 May 2000 658.0 ha

Dated at Perth this 25th day of March 2004.

CLIVE BROWN, MLA, Minister for State Development.

MP405
MINING ACT 1978

INSTRUMENT OF EXEMPTION OF LAND

The Minister for State Development pursuant to the powers conferred on him by Section 19 of the
Mining Act 1978, hereby further exempts for a period of two (2) years, the land described hereunder
from Divisions 1-5 of Part IV of the Mining Act 1978.

DESCRIPTION
Coordinates are MGA 94 Zone 50;
Corner 1. 6655960.269N and 311276.175E;
Corner 2. 6655344.907N and 312187.996E;
Corner 3. 6654847.564N and 311852.309E;
Corner 4. 6655462.900N and 310940.539E;
and designated “S19/168” on TENGRAPH.
Dated at Perth this 26th day of March 2004.

CLIVE BROWN, MLA, Minister for State Development.



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1183

PARLIAMENT
PA401*

PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

Bill Assented To
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor has Assented in the name and on behalf
of Her Majesty the Queen, on the date shown, to the undermentioned Bill passed by the Legislative
Council and the Legislative Assembly during the Second Session of the Thirty-Sixth Parliament.

Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No.
Nuclear Waste Storage (Prohibition) Amendment Bill 2004 April 1 2004 2 of 2004

L. B. MARQUET, Clerk of the Parliaments.
April 2 2004.

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE
PI401*

METROPOLITAN REGION TOWN PLANNING SCHEME ACT 1959
DECLARATION OF PLANNING CONTROL AREA NO. 79

Stakehill / Larkhill
(Railways, other Regional Roads and Parks and Recreation)

City of Rockingham
File: 835-2-28-11

General Description
The Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure has granted approval to the declaration of a
Planning Control Area over lots 112, 594,595 and 598 Jarvis Road, Baldivis and lot 596 & portion of
lots 599 & 102 Stakehill Road, Baldivis as shown on Western Australian Planning Commission Plan
No. 3.1725/1.

Purpose of The Planning Control Area
The purpose of the Planning Control Area is to allow for the possible relocation of the future Stakehill
/ Larkhill Railway Station from its current location at the corner of Fletcher Road to a location north
of Stakehill Road west of the rail corridor to better service the Larkhill Racecourse. The Commission
considers that the Planning Control Area is required to ensure that no development occurs on this
land which might prejudice this purpose until it may be reserved for Railways, Other Regional Roads
and Park and Recreation in the Metropolitan Region Scheme.

Duration And Effects
The declaration remains in effect for a period of five years from the date of publication of this notice in
the Government Gazette or until revoked by the Western Australian Planning Commission with
approval by the Minister, whichever is the sooner.
A person shall not commence and carry out development in a Planning Control Area without the prior
approval of the Western Australian Planning Commission.  The penalty for failure to comply with this
requirement is $2,000 and, in the case of a continuing offence, a further fine of $200 for each day
during which the offence continues.
Compensation is payable in respect of land injuriously affected by this declaration, and land so
affected may be acquired by the Western Australian Planning Commission in the same circumstances
and in the same manner as if the land had been reserved in the Metropolitan Region Scheme for a
public purpose.

Where the Planning Control Area is Available for Public Inspection
• Department for Planning and Infrastructure

1st floor, 469 Wellington Street
PERTH WA

• JS Battye Library
Alexander Library Building
NORTHBRIDGE WA

• Municipal office of the City of Rockingham
Civic Boulevard
ROCKINGHAM WA

P. M. MELBIN, Secretary,
Western Australian Planning Commission.



1184 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

POLICE
PO401*

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974
TEMPORARY SUSPENSION OF REGULATIONS

I, Robin Michael Langford, Superintendent (Traffic Support) being the delegated officer of the
Minister for Transport under Section 83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers
conferred by section 83(1) of that Act and the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained
and nominated for the purpose of—

R. C. RANDALL, Inspector (Operations Support).

A Community Cycling Event by members/entrants of the Bunbury Bicycle Users Group on 14th
March 2004 between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 11:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the carriageway on Prince Phillip Drive and bike path around Big Swamp in
Bunbury.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Bike It To Ballidu by members/entrants of the Ballidu Parents and Citizens on 19th March 2004
between the hours of 15:00 Hrs and 23:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Northam-Pithara Road from Wongan
Hills to Ballidu and Alpha Street in Ballidu.
All participants to wear approved head protection at al times.

A Cycle Race—Time Trial by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club Inc on 21st March and
2nd May 2004 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 11:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Madigan Road, Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Joondalup Fun Run by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 21st March
2004 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left side of the carriageway on Collier Pass, Grand Boulevard, Boas
Avenue, Lakeside Drive, Aldgate Street, Piccadilly Circle and footpath adjacent to Joondalup Drive,
Joondalup.

The ANZ Police & Emergency Services Games by members/entrants of the ANZ Police & Emergency
Services Games on 23rd March 2004 between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 09:00 Hrs do hereby approve
the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned
hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Lovekin Drive and Forrest Drive and
on Footpaths/Dual Use Paths adjacent thereto in Kings Park.
All participants to wear approved head protection during the cycle event.

A Respect Yourself Forest Rally 2004 by members/entrants of the West Australian Car Club on 26th
March 2004 between the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 24:00 Hrs and 27th March 2004 between the hours of
00:01 Hrs and 24:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under
such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the carriageway on Geographe Bay Road (between Scout Road and Georgette
Street); Carey Street (between Geographe Bay Road and Marine Terrace); Milne Street (between
Geographe Bay Road and Marine Terrace); and Marine Terrace (between Scout Road and north of
Carey Street) in Busselton.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Women’s Triathlon by members/entrants of the Women’s Triathlon Pty Ltd on 28th March 2004
between the hours of 07:00 Hrs and 09:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Hackett Drive, The Avenue,
Birdwood Parade, Jutland Parade, Victoria Avenue and Beatrice Road in Crawley/Nedlands/Dalkeith.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event.

A Cycle Race, Handicap by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club Inc on 28th March 2004
between the hours of 16:00 Hrs and 18:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Tambrey Drive, Bathgate Road and
Balmoral Road in Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1185

A Cycle Race—Handicap by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club Inc on 30th March 2004
between the hours of 16:00 Hrs and 18:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Tambrey Drive, Bathgate Road and
Balmoral Road, Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A South West Schools Interschool Triathlon by members/entrants of the Margaret River Senior High
School on 1st April 2004 between the hours of 10:30 Hrs and 13:00 Hrs do hereby approve the
temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned
hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway on Scout Road, Marine Terrace and Guerin Street
in Margaret River.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event.

A Classic Car Rally by members/entrants of the Town of Northam between the hours of 15:00 Hrs and
19:00 Hrs on 3rd April 2004 do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made
under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the carriageway on Minson Avenue, Beavis Place and Grey Street in
Northam.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Geraldton Triathlon Assn on 3rd, 17th and 24th April 2004
between the hours of 15:00 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway on Willcock Drive, Brand Highway and Portway
in Geraldton.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event.

A Cycle Race—Handicap by members/entrants of the Bunbury Cycle Club Inc on 3rd April 2004
between the hours of 14:30 Hrs and 16:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Bridge Street, Boyanup Road West,
Bussell Highway, Railway Road, Boyanup Road West in the Boyanup/Capel Area.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Mt Ommanney Hillclimb by members/entrants of the Vintage Car Club of WA on 3rd April 2004
between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 17:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the carriageway on Mt Ommanney Drive in Northam.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Motorkhana—Part of Car Rally by members/entrants of the Mini Car Club of WA Inc on 3rd April
2004 between the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 12:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the carriageway on Marrinup Street, Dwellingup.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Classic Car Rally—Northam Flying 50 by members/entrants of the Town of Northam on 4th April
2004 between the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 18:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the carriageway on Fitzgerald Street, Beavis Place, Gordon Street,
Wellington Street, Minson Avenue, Grey Street, Elizabeth Street and Nind Street in Northam.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Criterium—Cycling Circuit Race by members/entrants of the Peel District Cycling Club on 4th
April 2004 between the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 11:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Wellard Road, Karnup Road and
Lefroy Road, Serpentine.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A ASICS Bridges Run by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 4th April 2004
between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to e confined to the side of the carriageway on Riverside Drive, Causeway, Dual Use Path
around river and Narrows Bridge in Perth.

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Albany Triathlon Club on 4th April 2004 between the hours
of 09:00 Hrs and 12:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made
under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway on Chipana Drive, Chipana Way, Frenchman Bay
Road and Stubs Road in Pagoda Point, Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event.



1186 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Spokes Cycle Club Inc on 4th April 2004 between the hours
of 08:50 Hrs and 12:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made
under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Geraldton Mt Magnet Road (between
Mullewa and Greenough Airport Gates) in the Shire of Greenough.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Cycling Road Race by members/entrants of the West Coast Masters Cycling Council Inc on 4th
April, 30th May, 4th July and 24th October 2004 between the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 12:00 Hrs do
hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the
carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Lefroy Avenue, Oakover Road,
Campersic Road and Padbury Road, Herne Hill.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Sports Mad on 4th April 2004 between the hours of 06:30 Hrs
and 09:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act
on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway on Honour Avenue, Burke Drive, Carroll Avenue,
Pt Walter Road, Preston Point Road, Wauhop Street, Riverside Drive, Beach Street in Bicton/Point
Walter Area.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all ties for the cycle event.

A Graded Mass Start Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club Inc on 4th April
and 1st August 2004 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Central Avenue, Parker Point Road,
The Esplanade, Church Road, Central Avenue, Dampier Road and Burrup Road on the
Dampier/Burrup Peninsula.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Eastern Goldfields Cycle Club on 7th April 2004 between
the hours of 17:30 Hrs and 18:15 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations
made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to e confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Melrose Street, Stockyard Way,
Carnegie Street and Nambi Way in Kalgoorlie.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A GSSSSA Triathlon by members/entrants of the Albany Senior High School on 7th April 2004
between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 13:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Dual Use Path from Ellen Cove Jetty
to Griffiths Street, Marine Parade, Golf Links Road, Emu Point Road, Mermaid Avenue, Hunter
Street and Roe Parade in Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event.

An Australind SHS Triathlon by members/entrants of the Australind Senior High School on 8th April
2004 between the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 12:oo Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Recreation Centre Access Road,
Clifton Close and Kingston Drive and/or Dual Use Paths/Cycle Paths adjacent thereto.
All participants to wear approved head protection during the cycle event.

A Cycle Time Trial Race (16km) by members/entrants of the Australian Time Trials Association on
9th April 2004 between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Bibra Drive, Hope Road and Progress
Drive, Bibra Lake.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Northern Districts Cycling Club on 11th April and 2nd, 9th
and 23rd May 2004 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Achievement Way and Paramount
Drive in Wangara.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Criterium Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Bunbury Cycle Club Inc on 14th April 2004
between the hours of 18:00 Hrs and 19:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Maxted Street, Shanahan Road and
Maxted Street in Halifax/Davenport Area.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1187

A Lancaster Road—Group Start by members/entrants of the Albany Cycling Club Inc on 17th April
2004 between the hours of 13:30 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Lancaster Road, Albany Highway
and Link Road in Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Sports Mad on 18th April 2004 between the hours of 06:30
Hrs and 09:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such
act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway on Brindal Close, Malsbury Road, Bruanton
Avenue, Pt Walter Road, Honour Avenue, Carroll Avenue, Pt Walter Road, Preston Point Road,
Wauhop Street, Riverside Road, Phipps Street in the Bicton Area.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event.

A John Forrest 40 Miler and Relay by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on
18th April 2004 between the hours of 06:30 Hrs and 12:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway on Car Park and Track through John Forrest
National Park in Hovea.

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Nickol Bay Triathlon Club on 18th April 2004 between the
hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:00 Hrs and 9th May 2004 between the hours of 12:00 Hrs and 14:00 Hrs do
hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the
carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Meares Drive, McCourt Street,
Murray Street and Samson Road in Point Samson.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event.

A Road Cycling Race—Elleker by members/entrants of the Albany Cycling Club Inc on 24th April
2004 between the hours of 13:30 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of
the Regulations made under such act on the Carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Lower Denmark Road, Hassell Street
and Elleker-Grassmere Road in Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Peel District Cycling Club )Inc) on 24th April, 22nd May,
17th July, 15th August 2004 between the hours of 13:00 Hrs and 15:00 Hrs do hereby approve the
temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned
hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Stock Road, Merrit Road, Mulga
Drive and Marginata Road in Parklands, Mandurah.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Jim McCann Memorial Mile by members/entrants of the WA State Masters Games on 24th April
2004 between the hours of 16:00 Hrs and 18:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the carriageway on York Street, Albany.

A South of the River Foot Race by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 25th
April 2004 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway on Footpath alongside Canning River, Canning
Bridge, Mt Henry Bridge, Regent Street, Esplanade in the Mt Pleasant/Applecross/Como/Salter Point
Area.

A cycle Road Race by members/entrants of the South West Cycle Club Inc on 25th April 2004 between
the hours of 14:00 Hrs and 16:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations
made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Sues Road (25km South) in
Busselton.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Car Rally by members/entrants of the Ascot Motor Club on 1st May 2004 between the hours of
10:00 Hrs and 23:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under
such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the carriageway on Scrub Bird Road, Raven Road, Jolly Road, Fantail Road,
Turkey Road, Thrush Road, Old Wilga Road, Barney Road, Windmill Gully Road, Palmers Road,
Hamilton Road, Warbler Road, Tow Mile Road, Hawk Road, Robin Road, Rosella Road, Kestrel Road,
Curlew Road, Preston Road, Wagtail Road, Magpie Road, Scramble Road, Jackson Road and various
unnamed tracks within Grimwade Plantation.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.



1188 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Melville Fremantle Cycling Club on 2nd May 2004 between
the hours of 09:00 Hrs and 12:15 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations
made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Wandi Drive, Lyon Road, De Haer
Road in Wandi.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Cycling Road Race by members/entrants of the West Coast Masters Cycling Council Inc on 8th
May, 12th June and 4th September 2004 between the hours of 14:00 Hrs and 16:00 Hrs do hereby
approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s
mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Lefroy Avenue, Oakover Road,
Campersic Road and Padbury Avenue, Herne Hill.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Spokes Cycle Club on 8th May 2004 between the hours of
14:00 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under
such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on  Narra Tarra/Moonyoonooka and
Morrell Road in the Shires of Greenough and Chapman Valley.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Handicap Road Race by members/entrants of the Bunbury Cycle Club Inc on 8th May 2004 between
the hours of 12:00 Hrs and 16:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations
made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Vasse Highway (from Stewart Bovell
Park for 8km), Sues Road (45km) in Busselton.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Graded Mass Start Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club Inc on 8th May
2004 between the hours of 15:30 Hrs and 17:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on North West Coastal Highway in
Roebourne.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Two People Bay—Nanarup Handicap by members/entrants of the Albany Cycling Club Inc on 8th
May 2004 between the hours of 13:30 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension
of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Nanarup Road and Two Peoples Bay
Road in Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Spokes Cycle Club on 8th May 2004 between the hours of
08:00 Hrs and 12:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under
such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Mullewa Road, Walkaway Road and
Narngulu/Moonyoonooka Road in the Shire of Greenough.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Women’s Classic by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 9th May 2004
between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway on Dual Use Path around the River (Narrows
Bridge to Causeway) in East Perth/South Perth.

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Nickol Bay Triathlon Club on 9th May 2004 between the
hours of 12:00 Hrs and 14:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations
made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the side of the carriageway on Samson Road, Murray Street, McCourt Street,
Meares Drive and Barker Terrace in Point Samson.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event.

A Syd Harper Cup—Handicap by members/entrants of the Albany Cycling Club Inc on 15th May 2004
between the hours of 13:30 Hrs and 17:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Frenchman’s Bay Road in Albany.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Graded Mass—Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club Inc on 18th July 2004
between the hours of 10:00 Hrs and 12:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1189

Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Karratha Road, Dampier Road,
Madigan Road, North West Coastal Highway, Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times

A Criterium Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club Inc on 31st July 2004
between the hours of 15:00 Hrs and 18:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the
Regulations made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Orkney Road, Chiratta Road and
King Way, Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

A Cycle Race by members/entrants of the Karratha Cycle Club Inc on 1st August 2004 between the
hours of 09:00 Hrs and 11:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations
made under such act on the carriageway/s mentioned hereunder.
Racing to be confined to the left hand side of the carriageway on Balmoral Road, Karratha.
All participants to wear approved head protection at all times.

WATER
WA401*

WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984
WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT MODIFICATIONS: SHIRE OF KATANNING

Notice of Proposal to Construct Storage Dam.
To improve the disposal of treated wastewater from the Katanning Wastewater Treatment Plant, the
Water Corporation proposes to construct an insitu clay-lined dam (to receive treated wastewater);
miscellaneous civil, mechanical and electrical works at the existing wastewater treatment plant for
pumping facilities; screening vegetation work west of the dam; and a power supply to the dam site.
The proposed works are scheduled to commence in October 2004, and will continue for approximately
six months.
A pipeline and associated mechanical and electrical works for the pumping station were approved in
June 2002.
A copy of this Notice of Proposal (referred to as GF66-0-4) is available for review during office hours
at the Water Corporation’s Katanning District Operations Centre, 130 Beaufort St, Katanning 6317.
Further information may also be obtained by contacting the Project Manager, Jim Ghaswala, on
telephone (08) 9420 2012.
Objections to the proposed works will be considered if lodged in writing, addressed to the Project
Manager, Jim Ghaswala, Water Corporation, PO Box 100, Leederville 6902, before the close of
business on the 7 May 2004.



1190 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

PUBLIC NOTICES
ZZ201

TRUSTEES ACT 1962
DECEASED ESTATES

Notice to Creditors and Claimants
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act, 1962 relates) in
respect of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons, are required by Perpetual Trustees
W.A. Ltd C/- Ground Floor, 39 Hunter Street, Sydney NSW, to send particulars of their claims to the
Company, by the undermentioned date, after which date the said company may convey or distribute
the assets, having regard only to the claims of which the Company then has notice.
Claims for the following estates expire one month after the date of publication hereof.
Estate late Patricia Joy Owen
Late of 4/8 Avonmore Terrace, Cottesloe, Home Duties
Died: 21/2/2004
Estate late Doris Edith Philip
Late of 29/10 Comer Street, Como, Home Duties
Died: 20/2/2004
Estate late Harriet Hailstone Ryan
Late of 146 Williamson Avenue, Cloverdale, Home Duties
Died: 10/2/2004

STEPHEN JOHN MAXWELL, Senior Estate Manager.
Direct Phone: (02) 9229 3419.

ZZ202
TRUSTEES ACT 1962
DECEASED ESTATES

Notice to Creditors and Claimants
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their
claims to me on or before the 8th May 2004, after which date I may convey or distribute the assets,
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice.
Carson, Walter Alfred, late of Unit 5/33 Cayley Street Glendalough, died 3/2/03, (DE20010610EM27)
Cowie, James Lamb, late of Bedingfeld Lodge 4 Bedingfeld Road Pinjarra, died 16/3/04,

(DE19761079EM17)
Crain, Stanley Leonard also known as Stanley Lenard Crain, late of Foley Village Hostel 84 Collick

Street Hilton, died 9/3/04, (DE33030186EM17)
Davey, Cecil Alfred, late of Tranby Units Rowethorpe Village Hayman Road Bentley, died 8/4/04,

(DE19520054EM36)
Daw, William John Frederick, late of Dale Cottages 16 Deerness Way Armadale, died 19/3/04,

(DE19951421EM27)
Ellis, Ralph Llewellyn, late of Romily House 19 Shenton Road Claremont, died 24/2/04,

(DE30228963EM26)
Everett, Amelia Jessie, late of Unit 326 Elloura Lodge Hollywood Village 31 Williams Road Nedlands,

died 25/2/04, (DE19711283EM16)
Fealy, Frederick Vincent, late of 409 Crawford Road Dianella, died 21/3/04, (DE19781177EM43)
Fidler, Miroslav, late of 27 Acacia Way Duncraig, died 1/7/02, (DE33020062EM32)
Grainger, Keith, late of 201 Keymer Street Belmont, died 15/5/03, (DE33026173EM110)
Hall, Bernice May, late of Unit 3/21 Adrian Street Palmyra, died 19/3/04, (DE33029064EM35)
Hardwicke, Gladys Ada, late of Windsor Park Nursing Home 110 Star Street Carlisle, died 13/2/04,

(DE19750870EM17)
Hywood, Bradley Gordon, late of 39B Johnsmith Street Morley formerly of 76A Crimea Street Morley,

died 19/3/04, (DE19913159EM22)
Kelleher, Marie-Louise, late of Cancer Cottage Hospice 15 Bedbrook Place Shenton Park formerly of

Apartment 243 The Lodge Parkland Villas 52 Liege Street Woodlands, died 10/3/04,
(DE19920725EM32)

Kirkaldy, Alice Jean, late of 67 Cleaver Street West Perth, died 21/2/04, (DE19733871EM17)
Maley, John Joseph also known as Jack Maley, late of 21 Jecks Street Rockingham, died 23/2/04,

(DE19940291EM36)



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1191

Moore, Jeffrey Ervin, late of 1 Apara Place Koongamia, died 22/1/97, (DE33019375EM45)
Phillips, James Arthur, late of 16 Duncan Street Victoria Park, died 20/10/03, (DE30230542EM36)
Pilgrim, Ronald Cecil, late of 3 Woodlands Street Mount Lawley, died 2/3/04,  (DE19741982EM12)
Pittard, Jack, late of Lakeside Nursing Home 68 Lyall Street Redcliffe, died 14/11/03,

(DE30259437EM16)
Pomroy, Kathleen May, late of Cabrini Nursing Home 111 Guildford Road Maylands, died 4/7/02,

(PM33014362TM34)
Ramsden, Myra Catherine, late of Brightwater Care Facility 41 Renegade Way Kingsley, died

24/9/03, (DE30277485EM34)
Sanvido, Eduardo, late of Unit 11/22 Raleigh Street Belmont, died 3/3/04, (DE19943971EM36)
Scothern, Raymond Harold. late of 15/15 Corvus Place Rockingham, died 28/8/99, (DE33017429EM13)
Timms, Timmy, late of Warmun Community Mail Service Warmun, died 30/12/2000,

(DE30335574EM32)
Tofte, Andre, late of Balmoral Caravan Park Karratha, died 14/9/03, (DE33030083EM110)
Wilson, Mabel, late of Norseman District Hospital Talbot Street Norseman, died 13/10/03,

(DE33029586EM36)

ANTONINA ROSE McLAREN, Public Trustee,
Public Trust Office, 565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000.

Telephone 9222 6777.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

LABOUR RELATIONS REFORM ACT 2002
Price: $24.95 counter sales
Plus postage on 400 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

CRIMINAL INVESTIGATION
(IDENTIFYING PEOPLE) ACT 2002

Price: $15.55 counter sales
Plus postage on 215 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.



1192 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

PUBLIC TRANSPORT AUTHORITY
ACT 2003

Price: $13.75 counter sales
Plus postage on 200 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

PUBLIC INTEREST DISCLOSURE
ACT 2003

Price: $8.50 counter sales
Plus postage on 107 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

CARBON RIGHTS ACT 2003
Price: $3.20 counter sales
Plus postage on 30 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.

WESTERN AUSTRALIA

CORRUPTION AND CRIME COMMISSION
ACT 2003

Price: $22.60 counter sales
Plus postage on 355 grams

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments.



8 April 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1193

Order your Bound Volumes of
Government Gazette 2004

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

For Government Departments and
private firms who presently arrange
binding for their copies of Government
Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is
now offering a subscription covering 4
Quarterly Volumes at a cost of
$1,072.50.

The Gazettes will be bound in black
cloth with gold foil lettering on the
spine and personalised by  the addition
of the client's name in gold lettering on
the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE
On the rare occasion where extra
gazettes are published in one quarter, a
fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost involved will be
borne by the State Law Publisher and
not passed on to clients.

For further information please contact:

State Law Publisher

Telephone: 9321 7688



1194 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 8 April 2004

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2004
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2004. Subject to
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year.
The prices quoted include postage by surface mail unless stated otherwise.
* Prices cover period from 1 January to 30 June 2004.  From 1 July access to on-line
legislation will be free.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week,
unless disrupted by public holidays or
unforseen circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.
All Gazettes $    
  Within WA ..................................... 806.30
  Interstate  ..................................... 822.80
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,124.00
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,072.50
Electronic Gazette Online
(includes all Gazettes from Jan 1998)
* Existing hard copy subscriber ........ 122.80
* Electronic Subscription only ......... 360.75
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)....................................... 734.80

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

$    
  Within WA  .................................... 350.90
  Interstate ...................................... 418.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 532.00
Electronic Gazette Online
(includes all Gazettes from Jan 1996)
* Existing hard copy subscriber .........  85.15
* Electronic Subscription only .......... 170.30
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)....................................... 317.90

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly
during parliamentary sessions.

$    
  Within WA  .................................... 765.60
  Interstate ...................................... 935.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 881.00
Bound Volumes of Hansard
  Within WA  .................................... 754.60
  Interstate ...................................... 766.70
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999
  (per year)  ........................................  783.20

STATUTES
Bound Statutes
Bound volumes are posted during March of
the following year.

$    
  Within WA....................................... 273.90
  Interstate ....................................... 303.60
  Overseas ........................................ 281.00
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 752.40
Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)........................................ 272.80

Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA....................................... 293.70
  Interstate ........................................ 303.60
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 395.00

Sessional Bills
Bills are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA ...................................... 403.70
  Interstate ....................................... 422.40
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 573.00

Electronic Statutes Online
Includes all Acts, Regulations, Bills, Acts by
year, Index to Statutes, Hansard, etc

$    
* 1st user  .........................................  359.55
* 2nd and each additional user (each) .180.35
More than 4 users—site licenses apply—
please contact our sales staff for rates

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is
searchable. Other CD ROM products with
legislation or other statutory information can
be packaged to individual requirements.
Prices are available on request.

!200400062GG!


