
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

2505

PERTH, TUESDAY, 29 JUNE 2004  No. 112
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

ISSN 1448-949X

CONTENTS
PART 1

Page
Births, Deaths and Marriages Registration Act 1998—Births, Deaths and Marriages

Registration Amendment Regulations 2004 ................................................................................. 2531-2
Dangerous Goods (Transport) Act 1998—
    Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Dangerous Goods in Ports) Amendment Regulations 2004..... 2539
    Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Explosives by Road and Rail) Amendment Regulations 2004. 2537-8
    Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Road and Rail) Amendment Regulations 2004........................ 2536-7
Employment Agents Act 1976—Employment Agents Amendment Regulations 2004 .................... 2512-3
Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961—
    Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Dangerous Goods Handling and Storage) Amendment

  Regulations 2004.................................................................................................................... 2533-4
    Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Explosives) Amendment Regulations 2004........................ 2534-6
Finance Brokers Control Act 1975—Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment

Regulations 2004 ........................................................................................................................... 2507-8
Financial Administration and Audit Act 1985—Financial Administration and Audit

(Designation of Statutory Authorities) Regulations 2004............................................................. 2550-1
Fire and Emergency Services Superannuation Act 1985—Fire and Emergency Services

(Superannuation Fund) Amendment Regulations 2004 ............................................................... 2520-2
Firearms Act 1973—Firearms Amendment Regulations 2004 ........................................................ 2539-41
Fish Resources Management Act 1994—
    Fish Resources Management Amendment Regulations (No. 5) 2004........................................ 2522-3
    Fish Resources Management Amendment Regulations (No. 8) 2004........................................ 2524
Hairdressers Registration Act 1946—Hairdressers Registration Amendment Regulations 2004 .. 2510-1
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927—
    Fremantle Hospital Amendment By-laws 2004......................................................................... 2528-9
    Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2004........................................ 2525-8
    Hospitals (Services Charges for Compensable Patients) Amendment Determination (No. 2)

  2004 ........................................................................................................................................ 2529-30
Industrial Relations Act 1979—Industrial Relations (General) Amendment Regulations 2004..... 2516-20
Medical Act 1894—Medical Amendment Rules 2004 ....................................................................... 2524-5
Mines Safety and Inspection Act 1994—Mines Safety and Inspection Amendment Regulations

(No. 3) 2004.................................................................................................................................... 2538
Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973—Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment Regulations

2004................................................................................................................................................ 2508-10
Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994—Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers

Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2004........................................................................................... 2544-5
Police Act 1892—Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2004 ........................................................ 2541-2
Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992—Rates and Charges (Rebates and

Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2004 ................................................................................. 2548-9
Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987—Rottnest Island Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2004........ 2545-8
Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996—Security and Related Activities (Control)

Amendment Regulations 2004 ...................................................................................................... 2542-3
Stamp Act 1921—Stamp Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2004 ..................................................... 2549-50
Weights and Measures Act 1915—Weights and Measures Amendment Regulations 2004 ............ 2513-6

———

PART 2
Agriculture......................................................................................................................................... 2552
Community Development.................................................................................................................. 2553
Consumer and Employment Protection ............................................................................................ 2552-3
Fisheries ............................................................................................................................................ 2553
Justice................................................................................................................................................ 2554-7
Local Government ............................................................................................................................. 2557-8
Planning and Infrastructure ............................................................................................................. 2558-70
Transport ........................................................................................................................................... 2570
Water ................................................................................................................................................. 2571



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010.
• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to

observe this request could result in the notice being held over.
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2004 (Prices include GST).
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.45
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$52.40
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$52.40 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).
All other Notices
    Per Column Centimetre—$10.45
    Bulk Notices—$194.70 per page
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.

• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they
fall on a Tuesday or Friday.

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2507

— PART 1 —

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION
CE301*

Finance Brokers Control Act 1975

Finance Brokers Control (General) Amendment
Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Finance Brokers Control
(General) Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Finance Brokers
Control (General) Regulations 1977*.

[* Reprinted as at 30 September 1997.
For amendments to 26 May 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 109.]

4. Schedule amended

(1) The amendments in this regulation are to the Schedule.

(2) Item 1 is amended by deleting “324” and inserting instead —

“    350    ”.

(3) Item 2 is amended by deleting “324” and inserting instead —

“    350    ”.

(4) Item 3 is amended by deleting “324” and inserting instead —

“    350    ”.



2508 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

(5) Item 4 is amended by deleting “324” and inserting instead —

“    350    ”.

(6) Item 5 is amended by deleting “150” and inserting instead —

“    162    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

CE302*

Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973

Motor Vehicle Dealers (Licensing) Amendment
Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Motor Vehicle Dealers
(Licensing) Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Motor Vehicle
Dealers (Licensing) Regulations 1974*.

[* Reprint 3 as at 5 March 2004.]



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2509

4. Third Schedule replaced

The Third Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

“
Third Schedule

[r. 7]
$

1. Application for a dealer’s licence or renewal of a dealer’s
licence for the period prescribed by regulation 6A —

(a) if the dealer only specifies single premises to be
authorised under section 20E(5) in relation to the
licence .................................................................... 1 115.00

(b) if the dealer specifies 2 or more premises to be
authorised under section 20E(5) ............................

plus
in respect of each premises to be authorised under
section 20E(5) in relation to the licence a further

557.00

557.00
1A. Application under section 20F in respect of change of

premises .............................................................................. 93.00
1B. Application under section 20F in respect of each added

premises .............................................................................. 557.00
1C. Application for a temporary permit under section 20H ...... 37.00
2. Application for yard manager’s licence or renewal of

yard manager’s licence for the period prescribed by
regulation 6A ...................................................................... 285.00

3. Application for salesperson’s licence or renewal of
salesperson’s licence for the period prescribed by
regulation 6A ...................................................................... 193.00

4. Application for car market operator’s registration or
renewal of car market operator’s registration —

(a) if the operator only specifies single premises to be
authorised under section 21A(5) in relation to the
registration ............................................................. 1 115.00

(b) if the operator specifies 2 or more premises to be
authorised under section 21A(5) in relation to the
registration ............................................................. 557.00

plus
in respect of each further premises to be
authorised under section 21A(5) in relation to the
registration, a further ............................................. 557.00

4A. Application under section 21B in respect of alteration of
premises .............................................................................. 93.00

4B. Application under section 21B in respect of each added
premises .............................................................................. 557.00

5. Application for certificate of exemption from the Act
under section 31(1) ............................................................. 93.00

6. Application for temporary authorisation under
section 16(2) or 17(2) .......................................................... 37.00

7. Individual dealer — change to firm .................................... 93.00



2510 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

$
8. Individual dealer — change to body corporate ................... 93.00
9. Firm — change to sole proprietor ....................................... 93.00
10. Firm — change to body corporate ...................................... 93.00
11. Body corporate change to individual or firm ...................... 93.00
12. Duplicate licence ................................................................. 30.00
13. Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of an

individual registration in the register kept under section 24
of the Act —

first page ................................................................
each subsequent page ............................................

13.50
2.50

14. Copy (certified or uncertified) or an extract of all
registrations in the register kept under section 24 of
the Act ................................................................................. 173.00

15. Inspection of register kept under section 24 of the Act ...... 13.50
”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

CE304*

Hairdressers Registration Act 1946

Hairdressers Registration Amendment
Regulations 2004

Made by the Board under section 21 of the Act.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Hairdressers Registration
Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2511

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Hairdressers
Registration Regulations 1965*.

[* Reprinted as at 16 April 1999.
For amendments to 31 May 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 159.]

4. Regulation 26 replaced

Regulation 26 is repealed and the following regulation is
inserted instead —

“
26. Fees

The fees set out in the Table to this regulation are
payable in respect of the matters set out in the Table.

Table
1 Theoretical examination on a class of hairdressing,

taken for the first time …………………………………..$60
2 Practical examination on a class of hairdressing,

taken for the first time …………………………………..$175
3 Practical examination on a class of hairdressing,

taken for a second or subsequent time,
when the examination is on —
(a) 1 subject …………………………………………...
(b) 2 subjects ………………………………………….
(c) 3 or more subjects …………………………………

$60
$90
$120

4 Application for registration as a hairdresser
(principal or employee) …………………………………$120

5 Registration as a principal hairdresser —
(a) if applicant is an employee hairdresser …………...
(b) otherwise ………………………………………….

$13
$75

6 Registration as an employee hairdresser —
(a) if applicant is a principal hairdresser ……………...
(b) otherwise ………………………………………….

$13
$48

7 Issue of certificate of registration ……………………… $13
8 Voluntary suspension, or re-instatement, of registration …. $13

    ”.
The common seal of the Hairdressers
Registration Board of Western Australia
was affixed hereto in the presence of:

L. J. MARSHALL

V. McGOUGH

Approved by the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



2512 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

CE303*

Employment Agents Act 1976

Employment Agents Amendment
Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Employment Agents
Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Employment
Agents Regulations 1976*.

[* Reprint 2 as at 6 February 2004.]

4. Regulation 10 amended

The Table to regulation 10(1) is amended as follows:
(a) by deleting “761.00” in each place where it occurs and

inserting instead —
“    1 021.00    ”;

(b) by deleting “221.00” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —
“    294.00    ”;

(c) by deleting “23.00” and inserting instead —
“    30.00    ”;

(d) by deleting “37.25” and inserting instead —
“    49.00    ”;

(e) by deleting “40.50” and inserting instead —
“    54.00    ”;

(f) by deleting “8.85” and inserting instead —
“    12.00    ”;

(g) by deleting “17.70” in each place where it occurs and
inserting instead —
“    23.00    ”;



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2513

(h) by deleting “3.60” and inserting instead —
“    4.00    ”;

(i) by deleting “215.00” and inserting instead —
“    286.00    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

CE305*

Weights and Measures Act 1915

Weights and Measures Amendment
Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Weights and Measures
Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Weights and
Measures Regulations 1927*.

[* Reprinted as at 4 October 2002.
For amendments to 26 May 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 425.]



2514 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

4. Tables XIII and XIIIB replaced

Tables XIII and XIIIB are deleted and the following Tables are
inserted instead —

“
Table XIII

Fees to be paid for testing, verifying or stamping weights
 and measures, and weighing or measuring instruments

Weights (Mass)
Fee

1. (a) masses (each not exceeding 20 kg) $19 for each group, or part of a
group, of 5 masses

(b) masses over 20 kg Based on time taken at $38 per
half hour or part thereof

Measures of Capacity (Volume)
Fee

2. (a) lubricating oil measures, alcoholic
liquor measures or beverage
measures

$19 for each group, or part of a
group, of 10 measures

(b) dispensing measures or graduated
measuring cylinders

$19 for each group, or part of a
group, of 5 measures or
cylinders

(c) each measure of capacity not
specified in paragraph (a) or (b)

Based on time taken at $38 per
half hour or part thereof

Measures of Length or Extension
Fee

3. (a) on initial verification of measures,
each not exceeding 1 m

$19 for each group, or part of a
group, of 5 measures

(b) each measure over 1 m but not
exceeding 20 m $19

(c) each measure over 20 m Based on time taken at $38 per
half hour or part thereof

(d) each additional set of graduations on
the same measure

Rate set out in paragraph (a),
(b) or (c) as applicable

Weighing Instruments
Fee

4. Weighbridges —
(a) each instrument with weighing

capacity not exceeding 10 t $76
(b) each instrument with weighing

capacity over 10 t
$76
(plus $38 for every 10 t or part
thereof in excess of 10 t)

5. Automatic Weighers, Belt Conveyer
Weighers and Totalisers

Fee based on time taken at $38
per half hour or part thereof for
each officer

6. Electronic price computing digital
indicating scales with weighing capacity
not exceeding 75 kg (including
instruments connected to price computing
or ticket printing devices) $29

7. Weighing instruments not otherwise
designated —
(a) each instrument with weighing

capacity not exceeding 200 kg $19



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2515

Fee
(b) each instrument with weighing

capacity over 200 kg but not
exceeding 1 000 kg $38

(c) each instrument with weighing
capacity over 1 000 kg $76

Measuring Instruments
Fee

8. Fixed measuring instruments (capacity)
petroleum systems — 
(a) each retail flow meter $57
(b) each wholesale flow meter of rate

not in excess of 1 000 L per minute $76
(c) each wholesale flow meter of rate in

excess of 1 000 L per minute $152
9. Calibrated tanks other than farm

milk tanks — 
For each 5 000 L or part thereof
contained in an individual
compartment of each calibrated tank $76

10. Calibrating measures and measuring
instruments — 
(a) for each measure or measuring

instrument up to and including 50 L $38
(b) for each measure or measuring

instrument over 50 L 
Based on time taken at $38 per
half hour or part thereof

11. Calibrated farm milk tanks — 
For each 250 L of capacity or part
thereof each calibrated tank $19

12. Each LPG retail flow meter $57
13. Measuring instruments not otherwise

designated
Based on time taken at $38 per
half hour or part thereof

General
14. Subject to a minimum amount of $19 being payable in respect of any matter

referred to in this Table, if, after testing, a weight, measure or instrument is
rejected as incorrect, unjust, or otherwise unsuitable, one-half only of the fee
so prescribed with respect to that weight, measure or instrument may be
charged in lieu of the fee in this Table.

Table XIIIB
Miscellaneous Fees

Fee
1. Registration of public weighbridge $69
2. Public weighman’s licence $49
3. Scale adjuster’s licence $49
4. Scale repairer’s licence $49
5. Petroleum products measuring instrument —

repairer’s registration $49
5A. Charge for examination of applicant for weighman’s

licence or scale repairer’s licence $69
6. Fees chargeable for — 

(a) inspector’s time for any service rendered in carrying
out repairs or adjustment, etc. to instruments or any
waiting time other than time referred to in
paragraph (b)

$38 per half hour
or part thereof



2516 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

Fee
(b) any waiting time allowed by an inspector to permit

another person to carry out necessary repairs, etc.
$38 per half hour
or part thereof

(c) any adjustment to — 
(i) each 20 kg or lesser weight $19
(ii) weights above 20 kg Based on time

taken at $38 per
half hour or part
thereof

(iii) each measure of capacity not exceeding 50 L $19
(d) any distance necessarily travelled by an inspector —

(i) for each kilometre not exceeding 100 km $0.72 (subject to
a minimum
charge of $10)

(ii) for each kilometre over 100 km $0.36
(e) time involved in the calibration of any instrument to

a degree of accuracy greater than the degree of
accuracy applied to instruments in use for trade or
the calibration and certification of instruments used
for purposes other than trade

$38 per half hour
or part thereof

7. Charges for use of masses provided by Department — 
(a) booking of masses of 1 t or more $19
(b) hire of masses for each day or part of a day $19 per t
(c) testing by inspector of equipment where masses

are used $19 per t
8. Charge for response to request to provide report,

documentation or any other information which is
additional to verification, reverification and testing
services

Based on time
taken at $19 per
15 minutes or
part thereof

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

CE306*

Industrial Relations Act 1979

Industrial Relations (General) Amendment
Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Industrial Relations
(General) Amendment Regulations 2004.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2517

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Industrial
Relations (General) Regulations 1997*.

[* Published in Gazette 30 September 1997, p. 5440-41.
For amendments to 31 March 2003 see Gazette
26 July 2002.]

3. Part 5 amended

Part 5 is amended by renumbering —
(a) regulation 6 as regulation 8;
(b) regulation 7 as regulation 9;
(c) regulation 8 as regulation 10, and subregulations (3) and

(4) of that regulation as subregulations (2) and (3)
respectively; and

(d) regulation 9 as regulation 11.

4. Part 6 inserted

Before Schedule 1 the following Part is inserted —

“
Part 6 — Bargaining for industrial agreement

12. Notice initiating bargaining

A notice given under section 42(1) of the Act —
(a) may be given in the form of GFB 1 in

Schedule 3; and
(b) must be accompanied by all of the particulars

set out in that form.

13. Response to notice initiating bargaining

A person to whom a notice is given under section 42(1)
of the Act may notify the initiating party of his or her
response in the form of GFB 2 in Schedule 3.

14. Notice and response to be given to Commission

(1) A notice given under section 42(1) of the Act, or a
response under section 42A(1) of the Act, cannot be
admitted in any proceeding or conference before the
Commission unless a copy of that notice or response
has been filed in the office of the Registrar of the
Commission at least 7 days before the proceeding or
conference.

(2) Subregulation (1) does not apply in respect of an
application under section 42A(2).

    ”.



2518 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

5. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended as follows:
(a) by deleting “[r.7]” and inserting instead —

“    [r. 9]    ”;
(b) by deleting item 1 and inserting the following item

instead —

“
1 For filing a claim under section 29(1)(b)

of the Act 50.00
    ”.

6. Schedule 2 amended

Schedule 2 is amended by deleting “[r.7]” and inserting
instead —

“    [r. 9]    ”.

7. Schedule 3 inserted

After Schedule 2 the following Schedule is inserted —

“
Schedule 3 — Forms

GFB 1

[r. 12]

Industrial Relations Act 1979

NOTICE TO INITIATE BARGAINING

To ...........................................................................................................
.................................................................................................................
.................................................................................................................

(name of party being given notice)1

Take notice that ......................................................................................
.................................................................................................................

(name of party giving notice)
has this .........day of ..................given notice initiating bargaining for
an industrial agreement.

1. Types of employment to be covered by agreement2

2. Area in which agreement is to operate3



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2519

3. Intended parties to the agreement4

....................................................
Signature of party giving notice

1 This notice is not to be given to an organisation or association of employers unless
that organisation or association has given written consent to being given such
notice.

2 If all employment is intended to be covered then state that. If is not intended to cover
all the employment, specify by classification or occupation and specify whether
full-time, part-time and casual employment is to be covered.

3 Nominate the area of the State (eg. whole State or metropolitan area or north of the
26th parallel) as well as any particulars relating to the employers’ premises.

4 If the intention is for the initiating party to bargain as a collective group, specify the
other parties who will comprise that group

INFORMATION FOR RECIPIENTS OF NOTICE TO
INITIATE BARGAINING

The party who gave you this notice (the “initiating party”) is seeking to
negotiate an industrial agreement which will bind you in respect of the
employees in the employment identified in the particulars of the notice.

The initiating party is also seeking to negotiate the agreement within the
requirements of the good faith bargain provisions of the Industrial Relations
Act 1979. These provisions place certain procedural requirements on the
negotiating parties to assist them to reach agreement. These procedural
requirements can be enforced by the Western Australian Industrial Relations
Commission.

If you wish to enter into negotiations for an industrial agreement, you should
notify the initiating party within 21 days of receiving this notice.
Note: Documents served by post are deemed received 2 working days after they are

posted. The response may be in the form of the attached GFB 2.

If there are other parties identified in the notice as intended parties to the
agreement and you wish to negotiate separately with the initiating party, you
may make an application to the Western Australian Industrial Relations
Commission for a direction that you may negotiate separately.
Note: You must still respond to the initiating party within 21 days of receiving the

notice if you wish to enter into negotiations for an industrial agreement.

If you do not wish to enter into negotiations for an industrial agreement, you
do not need to take any action. Alternatively, you may notify the initiating
party that you will not enter into negotiations for an industrial agreement.
You may use GFB 2 for the notification.

If you do not enter into negotiations for an industrial agreement, the initiating
party may apply to the Western Australian Industrial Relations Commission
for an enterprise order which will determine the pay and conditions for
employees who were proposed to be covered by the industrial agreement.

GFB 2
[r. 13]

Industrial Relations Act 1979

RESPONSE TO INITIATION OF BARGAINING

To ...........................................................................................................
.................................................................................................................
.................................................................................................................

(name of party who provided notice initiating bargaining)



2520 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

Take notice that ......................................................................................
.................................................................................................................

(name of party responding to notice)
has this .........day of..................responded to the notice and:

wishes to enter into negotiations for an industrial agreement.
does not wish to enter into negotiations for an industrial
agreement.
(tick appropriate box)

....................................................
Signature of party responding to notice

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES
FE301*

Fire and Emergency Services Superannuation Act 1985

Fire and Emergency Services (Superannuation
Fund) Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Fire and Emergency
Services (Superannuation Fund) Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement
These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Fire and
Emergency Services (Superannuation Fund) Regulations 1986*.

[* Reprinted as at 7 September 2001.
For amendments to 15 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 118.]



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2521

4. Regulations 14A, 19, 20, 21 and 32 amended
Regulations 14A(4), 19(1)(a), 20, 21(1)(b)(i) and 32(2) are
amended by deleting “Schedule 1” and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 1A    ”.

5. Regulation 41 amended
Regulation 41(7) is amended by inserting after “Schedule 1” —

“    , Schedule 1A    ”.

6. Schedule 1 amended
Schedule 1 is amended by deleting the heading and shoulder
clause and inserting instead —

“
Schedule 1 — Defined benefit:

death or total and permanent disablement
[r. 17 and 18]

    ”.
7. Schedule 1A inserted

After Schedule 1 the following Schedule is inserted —
“

Schedule 1A — Defined benefit:
partial and permanent disablement or

leaving service
[r. 14A and 19 — 21]

The amount calculated in accordance with this Schedule is B in the
formula —

( ) ( )[ ] M2  0.18  M1  0.215   
365.25

SB ×+××=

where —
S is the member’s final average salary;
M1 is the number of days in the member’s membership period

before 1 July 2004;
M2 is the number of days in the member’s membership period on

and after 1 July 2004.
    ”.

8. Schedule 4 amended
Schedule 4 is amended as follows:

(a) by deleting the equation and inserting the following
equation instead —

“

( ) ( )[ ]
365.25

n

r)(1

1    M2    0.18M1    0.215    
365.25

S  B
+

××+××=

    ”;



2522 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

(b) by deleting the definition of “M” and inserting the
following definitions instead —

“
M1 is the number of days in the member’s membership

period before 1 July 2004;
M2 is the number of days in the member’s membership

period on and after 1 July 2004;
    ”;

(c) in the definition of “n” by deleting “birthday.” and
inserting instead —

“
birthday, but not more than the number of days (if
any) determined by the Superannuation Board on
the advice of the actuary to be necessary to ensure
that the employer will not incur an individual
superannuation guarantee shortfall (within the
meaning of the Superannuation Guarantee
(Administration) Act 1992 of the Commonwealth)
in respect of the member.

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

FISHERIES
FI301*

Fish Resources Management Act 1994

Fish Resources Management Amendment
Regulations (No. 5) 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Fish Resources
Management Amendment Regulations (No. 5) 2004.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2523

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Fish Resources
Management Regulations 1995*.

[* Reprint 4 as at 14 November 2003.
For amendments to 26 May 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 126, and
Gazette 9 January, 17 February and 6 April 2004.]

3. Regulation 40 amended

Regulation 40 is amended as follows:
(a) after paragraph (b) by deleting “or”;
(b) after paragraph (c) by deleting the comma and inserting

instead —

“
; or

(d) a single throw net that has a length not
exceeding 3 metres measured from the centre
retrieval line to the lead line and a mesh of not
more than 25 millimetres,

    ”.

4. Schedule 2 amended

Schedule 2 Part 2 Division 3 Subdivision 2 is amended by
deleting “Barramundi, when taken from the waters of the
Fitzroy River upstream from 17° 27′ south latitude” and
inserting instead —

“
Barramundi, when taken or brought ashore from, or in the
possession of a person within the area bounded by a line
commencing at the intersection of 17° 27′ south latitude and
123° 08. 23′ east longitude; thence extending due south to 19° 00′
south latitude; thence due east to 125° 50′ east longitude; thence
due north to 17° 50′ south latitude; thence due west along 17° 50′
south latitude to the intersection of 17° 50′ south latitude and the
northern side of the Great Northern Highway; thence along the
northern side of the highway to the eastern side of the Derby
Broome Highway; thence along the eastern side of the Derby
Broome Highway to the intersection of the eastern side of the
highway and 17° 27′ south latitude; thence due west along 17° 27′
south latitude to the starting point (Fitzroy River area)

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



2524 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

FI302*

Fish Resources Management Act 1994

Fish Resources Management Amendment
Regulations (No. 8) 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Fish Resources
Management Amendment Regulations (No. 8) 2004.

2. The regulations amended

The amendment in these regulations is to the Fish Resources
Management Amendment Regulations (No. 6) 2004*.

[* Published in Gazette 28 May 2004 p. 1895-902.]

3. Regulation 4 amended

Regulation 4 is amended by deleting “Item 3”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

HEALTH
HE302*

Medical Act 1894

Medical Amendment Rules 2004

Made by the Medical Board and approved by the Governor in
Executive Council.

1. Citation

These rules may be cited as the Medical Amendment
Rules 2004.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2525

2. The rules amended

The amendments in these rules are to the Medical Rules 1987*.

[* Reprinted as at 23 July 1999.
For amendments to 18 May 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 238.]

3. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended as follows:
(a) in item 2 by deleting “275.00” and inserting instead —

“    350.00    ”;
(b) in item 2a by deleting “70.00” and inserting instead —

“    89.00    ”;
(c) in item 2b by deleting “56.00” and inserting instead —

“    71.00    ”.

Date: 31st May 2004.

CON MICHAEL AO, President of the Medical Board.

Approved by the Governor in Executive Council,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

HE301*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Services Charges) Amendment
Regulations (No. 3) 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Hospitals (Services
Charges) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.



2526 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Hospitals
(Services Charges) Regulations 1984*.

[* Reprinted as at 7 December 2001.
For amendments to 31 May 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 184-5,
and Gazette 13 February and 4 May 2004.]

4. Regulation 5 amended

Regulation 5(1) and (2) are amended by deleting “the Schedule”
in each place where it occurs and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 1    ”.

5. Regulation 7 amended

Regulation 7(1) is amended by deleting “Part I of the Schedule”
and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 1 Division 1    ”.

6. Regulation 8 amended

Regulation 8 is amended by deleting “Part II of the Schedule”
and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 1 Division 2    ”.

7. Regulation 9 amended

Regulation 9 is amended by deleting “Part III of the Schedule”
and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 1 Division 3    ”.

8. Regulation 9A amended

Regulation 9A(1) is amended by deleting “Part IV of the
Schedule” and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 1 Division 4    ”.

9. Schedule replaced

The Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —

“
Schedule 1 — Charges for services

[r. 5, 7, 8, 9 and 9A]

Division 1 — In-patients
1. Accommodation, maintenance, nursing care and

other services other than in hospital beds subject to
a determination made under regulation 5(2) — 
(a) for public in-patients ………………………… no charge



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2527

(b) for private in-patients — 
(i) in single bed wards (if taken at patient’s

request) ……………………………………$461 per day
(ii) in other wards …………………………….. $255 per day

(c) for nursing home type patients ………………...$33.90 per day
(d) for private nursing home type patients ………...$114 per day
(e) for ineligible in-patients ………………………. $1 068 per day
(f) for eligible war service veteran in-patients ……..no charge

2. Home modifications service and supply or loan as
appropriate, of such aids and appliances, orthotics
and prostheses, oxygen, gas and equipment, wigs,
surgical implants or devices as are approved by the
Executive Director (including repair and
replacement) ………………………………………...no charge
This item does not apply to — 
(a) surgically implanted prostheses subject to a

determination made under regulation 5(2)(c); or
(b) specialized orthoses or prostheses subject to

a determination made under regulation 5(2)(e).

Division 2 — Day patients
3. Accommodation, maintenance and other services

for eligible day patients ……………………………..no charge

Division 3 — Out-patients
4. Out-patients service, except for drugs and

medication referred to in item 2 and any service
subject to a determination made under
regulation 5(2) — 
(a) for eligible out-patients and war service

veteran out-patients …………………………… no charge
(b) for ineligible out-patients — for each

individual service rendered …………………… $116
5. Drugs and medication — per calendar year — 

(a) for pensioners and concessional
beneficiaries —
(i) for holders of an entitlement card ………… no charge
(ii) for others …………………………………..$3.80 per item

(b) for war service veteran out-patients — 
(i) for holders of an entitlement card .....…..…. no charge
(ii) for holders of a personal treatment

entitlement card or specific treatment
entitlement card …………………………... $3.80 per item

(c) for all other out-patients — 
(i) for holders of a concession card …………...$3.80 per item
(ii) for other persons —

(I) at a participating hospital …………….PBS price up to
a maximum of
$23.70 per item

(II) otherwise ……………………………..$19 per item



2528 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

Division 4 — Same day patients
6. Same day treatment, other than a service subject to

any determination made under regulation 5
associated with the rendering of such treatment — 
(a) for public same day patients …………………...no charge
(b) for private same day patients ………………… $189 per day
(c) for eligible war service veteran same day

patients ………………………………………... no charge
(d) for ineligible same day patients ………………..$850 per day

Division 5 — Other services
7. Accommodation for persons accompanying patients

(except when parent accompanies sick child for
medical wellbeing of sick child or breastfeeding, or
when breastfed child accompanies sick mother) …... $21.20 per day

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

HE304*

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Fremantle Hospital Amendment By-laws 2004

Made by the Minister for Health in his capacity as the board of
Fremantle Hospital.

1. Citation

These by-laws may be cited as the Fremantle Hospital
Amendment By-laws 2004.

2. Commencement

These by-laws come into operation on 1 July 2004 or the day
after the day on which they are published in the Gazette,
whichever is the later.

3. The by-laws amended

The amendments in these by-laws are to the Fremantle Hospital
By-laws 1992*.

[* Reprint 1 as at 25 July 2003.]



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2529

4. By-law 16 amended
By-law 16(5) is repealed and the following sub-bylaw is
inserted instead —

“
(5) For the purposes of sub-bylaw (4), the prescribed

charge is —
(a) for the period up to and including

30 June 2005, 40 cents for every hour or part of
hour; and

(b) for the period commencing on 1 July 2005,
60 cents for every hour or part of hour.

    ”.

JIM McGINTY, Minister for Health,
in his capacity as the board of Fremantle Hospital.

———————————

HE303*
Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927

Hospitals (Services Charges for
Compensable Patients) Amendment

Determination (No. 2) 2004

Made by the Minister for Health under section 37(3)(af) of the Act and
regulation 5(2) of the regulations.

1. Citation
This determination may be cited as the Hospitals (Services
Charges for Compensable Patients) Amendment
Determination (No. 2) 2004.

2. Commencement
This determination comes into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The determination amended
The amendments in this determination are to the Hospitals
(Services Charges for Compensable Patients) Determination
2002*.
[* Published in Gazette 18 June 2002, p. 2859-61.

For amendments to 21 May 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 185,
and Gazette 13 February 2004.]



2530 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

4. Schedule 1 replaced

Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —

“
Schedule 1 — Services charges for

compensable patients
[cl. 3]

Division 1 — Compensable in-patients
1. Accommodation, maintenance, nursing care and

other services in a hospital bed, other than as
provided in items 2 and 4......................................…..$1 063 per day

2. Accommodation, maintenance, nursing care and
other services in a hospital bed for a patient in
respect of whose care and treatment the Motor
Vehicle (Third Party Insurance) Act 1943 applies
or prima facie appears to apply ..................................$925 per day

3. Accommodation, maintenance, nursing care and
other services in a nursing home bed .........................$189 per day

4. Ventilator dependent compensable in-patient with
tracheostomy requiring 24 hours individual care..…..$2 393 per day

Division 2 — Compensable out-patients
5. For pathological service — for each request to a

separate department of a laboratory ...........................$116
6. For radiological service — for each item of service ..$116
7. Subject to item 8, for drugs and medications for

each item —
(a) at a participating hospital ................................... PBS price up to

a maximum of
$23.70

(b) otherwise ....................................................…… $19
8. For each other individual service (with any drugs

and medications supplied at the time of the initial
service being treated as included in that service) ...... $116

Division 3 — Compensable same day patients
9. In hospitals, other than day hospitals, nursing

homes and nursing posts —
(a) for a patient in respect of whose care and

treatment the Motor Vehicle (Third Party
Insurance) Act 1943 applies or prima facie
appears to apply .......................................…….. $828 per day

(b) for any other patient ................................……... $952 per day
    ”.

JIM McGINTY, Minister for Health.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2531

JUSTICE
JU301*

Births, Deaths and Marriages Registration Act 1998

Births, Deaths and Marriages Registration
Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Births, Deaths and
Marriages Registration Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Births, Deaths
and Marriages Registration Regulations 1999*.

[* Published in Gazette 12 March 1999, p. 1163-5.
For amendments to 29 March 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 33.]

4. Regulation 4 amended

Regulation 4 is amended by deleting the Table and inserting the
following Table instead —

“

Table
Item Matter Fee

Certified copies, certificates, extracts and
searches

1. Certified copy of a registration other than one
provided under item 2 or 3 of this Table (includes
one 5 year search). $40.00

2. Commemorative certificate (includes one 5 year
search and the issue of a standard certified copy of
the registration). $50.00

3. Certified copy of a registration at least 60 years
old if the applicant provides the registration
number and identifies the registration district. $30.00



2532 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

Item Matter Fee

4. Extract of an entry in a register of births, deaths or
marriages (includes one 5 year search). $40.00

5. Certified copy of portion of adoptee’s birth
registration that does not refer to the adoption or
the birth parents. $40.00

6. Each 5 year search (other than a 5 year search
referred to in item 1, 2 or 4 of this Table). $25.00

7. Result of search certificate. $25.00

Registrations and changes to the Register

8. Registration of birth if the birth registration
statement is lodged more than 12 months after the
birth. $35.00

9. Registration of change of name. $140.00

10. Addition to, or correction of, information in the
Register. $35.00

11. Change to a child’s name within 12 months of
birth. $35.00

12. Notation of change of name in the entry relating
to a birth if the application is made after the
change of name is registered. $35.00

Miscellaneous

13. Priority service, in addition to any other fee. $30.00

14. Microfiche set containing consolidated birth,
death and marriage index records — 1841-1905. $140.00

15. Compact disk containing birth, death and
marriage index records — 1841-1905. $205.00

16. Microfiche set containing death index records
1906-1953
1954-1965
1966-1970
1971-1980

$100.00
$35.00
$20.00
$40.00

17. Microfiche set containing marriage index records
1906-1930
1931-1953
1954-1965

$35.00
$55.00
$35.00

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2533

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM
MP302*

Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961

Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Dangerous
Goods Handling and Storage) Amendment

Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Explosives and Dangerous
Goods (Dangerous Goods Handling and Storage) Amendment
Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement
These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Explosives and
Dangerous Goods (Dangerous Goods Handling and Storage)
Regulations 1992*.

[* Reprinted as at 6 September 2002.
For amendments to 8 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 104.]

4. Schedule 1 replaced

Schedule 1 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted
instead —

“
Schedule 1 — Fees

[r. 2.4, 2.8, 4.3 and 4.4]

Item Description Fee
1. For approval of packaging $250
2. For approval of a bulk container $228
3. For the issue or renewal of a licence when the

premises are used or proposed to be used to store
dangerous goods — according to the amount (in
tonnes or kilolitres) to be stored or proposed to be
stored —
(a) not over 2.3 $15.50
(b) over 2.3 but not over 23 $31
(c) over 23 but not over 46 $77



2534 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

Item Description Fee
(d) over 46 but not over 230 $190
(e) over 230 but not over 2 300 $380
(f) over 2 300 but not over 4 600 $1 215
(g) over 4 600 but not over 9 200 $1 840
(h) over 9 200 but not over 13 800 $2 275
(i) over 13 800 but not over 18 400 $2 710
(j) over 18 400 but not over 23 000 $3 250
(k) over 23 000 $3 800

3A. For the examination of an application for a licence
referred to in item 3 — according to the amount (in
tonnes or kilolitres) stored or proposed to be
stored —
(a) not over 50 $215
(b) over 50 but not over 250 $430
(c) over 250 $715

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

MP301*

Explosives and Dangerous Goods Act 1961

Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Explosives)
Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Explosives and Dangerous
Goods (Explosives) Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2535

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Explosives and
Dangerous Goods (Explosives) Regulations 1963*.

[* Reprinted as at 4 November 2002.
For amendments to 8 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 106.]

4. Second Schedule replaced

The Second Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is
inserted instead —

“
Second Schedule — Fees

[r. 157]

Item Description Fee ($)
1. Licence to import explosives 152.00
2. Licence to manufacture explosives

(a) fireworks 49.00
(b) any other explosives 325.00

3. Licence to manufacture a blasting agent 33.00
4. Licence to sell explosives 49.00
5. Licence to store explosives —

(a) licensed premises Mode A 33.00
(b) licensed premises Mode B 76.00
(c) magazine not exceeding 1 000 kg 76.00
(d) magazine exceeding 1 000 kg but not

exceeding 5 000 kg 114.00
(e) magazine exceeding 5 000 kg 305.00

6. Authorisation of explosive 131.00
7. Transfer of any licence 16.50
8. Storage in public magazine — for each package

and for each week or part thereof 1.45
9. Inspection and testing fees —

(a) for each sample submitted to the “Heat Test” 5.40
(b) inspection of packages damaged, per day or

part thereof 250.00
(c) inspection of ships conveying explosives, per

day or part thereof 250.00
(d) inspection for certificate of release 156.00

10. Tonnage fees for magazines erected on explosives
reserves (for every 1 000 kg of licensed capacity) 210.00

11. Shotfirer’s permit, issue and renewal 16.50
12. Examination for a shotfirer’s permit 156.00
13. Issue of an entry permit 156.00
14. Permit for purchase and use of fireworks 156.00
15. Initial approval of equipment used for or in

connection with detonation of explosives 298.00



2536 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

Item Description Fee ($)
16. Testing of equipment for or in connection with

detonation of explosives — per unit 18.00
    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE,Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

MP303*

Dangerous Goods (Transport) Act 1998

Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Road and Rail)
Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Dangerous Goods
(Transport) (Road and Rail) Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Dangerous
Goods (Transport) (Road and Rail) Regulations 1999*.

[* Published in Gazette 8 June 1999, p. 2311-2423.
For amendments to 8 June 2004  see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 78.]

4. Regulation 23.1 amended

The Table to regulation 23.1 is amended as follows:
(a) in item 1 by deleting “238” and inserting instead —

“    245    ;”
(b) in items 2 and 3 by deleting “11” and inserting

instead —
“    11.50    ”;



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2537

(c) in items 4 and 5 by deleting “112” and inserting
instead —
“    114    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

MP304*

Dangerous Goods (Transport) Act 1998

Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Explosives by
Road and Rail) Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Dangerous Goods
(Transport) (Explosives by Road and Rail) Amendment
Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Dangerous
Goods (Transport) (Explosives by Road and Rail)
Regulations 1999*.

[* Published in Gazette 8 June 1999, p. 2427-51.
For amendments to 8 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 77.]

4. Regulation 5.33 amended

The Table to regulation 5.33 is amended as follows:
(a) in items 1 and 2 by deleting “$11” and inserting

instead —
“    $11.50    ”;



2538 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

(b) in items 3 and 4 by deleting “$112” and inserting
instead —
“    $114    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

MP306*

Mines Safety and Inspection Act 1994

Mines Safety and Inspection Amendment
Regulations (No. 3) 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Mines Safety and
Inspection Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Mines Safety
and Inspection Regulations 1995*.

[* Reprinted as at 5 April 2002.
For amendments to 8 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 246, and
Gazette 13 February 2004.]

4. Schedule 2 amended

Schedule 2 is amended by deleting “118” in both places where it
occurs and in each place inserting instead —

“    121    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2539

MP305*

Dangerous Goods (Transport) Act 1998

Dangerous Goods (Transport) (Dangerous
Goods in Ports) Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Dangerous Goods
(Transport) (Dangerous Goods in Ports) Amendment
Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement
These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended
The amendments in these regulations are to the Dangerous
Goods (Transport) (Dangerous Goods in Ports)
Regulations 2001*.

[* Published in Gazette 22 January 2002, p. 321-356.
For amendments to 8 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 77.]

4. Regulation 43 amended
Regulation 43(1)(i) is amended by deleting “$258” and
inserting instead —

“    $264    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

POLICE
PO301*

Firearms Act 1973

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Firearms Amendment
Regulations 2004.



2540 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

2. Commencement
These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended
The amendments in these regulations are to the Firearms
Regulations 1974*.

[* Reprinted as at 8 June 2004.
For amendments to 21 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 116.]

4. Regulation 4 amended

(1) The Table to regulation 4(1a) is deleted and the following Table
is inserted instead —

“
Table of application forms and fees

Form
No.

Kind of Licence Fee
($)

1 Firearm Licence — original issue (1 year) .................. 142
1 Firearm Licence — renewal (1 year) ........................... 31
1 Firearm Collector’s Licence — original issue (5 years) .. 285
1 Firearm Collector’s Licence — renewal (5 years) ....... 52
2 Corporate Licence — original issue (1 year) ............... 296
2 Corporate Licence — renewal (1 year) ........................ 79

    ”.

(2) The Table to regulation 4(1c) is deleted and the following Table
is inserted instead —

“
Table of application forms and fees

Form
No.

Kind of Licence Fee
($)

3 Dealer’s Licence — original issue (1 year) .................... 296
3 Dealer’s Licence — renewal (1 year) ............................. 73
3 Repairer’s Licence — original issue (1 year) ................. 296
3 Repairer’s Licence — renewal (1 year) .......................... 53
3 Manufacturer’s Licence — original issue (1 year) ......... 296
3 Manufacturer’s Licence — renewal (1 year) ................... 53
3 Shooting Gallery Licence — original issue (1 year) ............. 195
3 Shooting Gallery Licence — renewal (1 year) ................ 57
4 Ammunition Collector’s Licence — original issue (5 years) .. 187
4 Ammunition Collector’s Licence — renewal (5 years) .. 51

    ”.

5. Regulation 5 amended

Regulation 5(1)(b) is amended by deleting “$36” and inserting
instead —

“    $39    ”.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2541

6. Regulation 11 amended

Regulation 11(1) is amended by deleting “$92” and inserting
instead —

“    $100    ”.

7. Regulation 27 amended

Regulation 27(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$332” and
inserting instead —

“    $361    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

PO302*

Police Act 1892

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation
These regulations may be cited as the Police (Fees) Amendment
Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement
These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended
The amendments in these regulations are to the Police (Fees)
Regulations 1981*.

[* Reprinted as at 20 August 1999.
For amendments to 27 May 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 293.]

4. Schedule amended
The Schedule is amended as follows:

(a) in item 2(a)(i) by deleting “$65.45” and inserting
instead —
“    $72.45    ”;



2542 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

(b) in item 2(a)(ii) by deleting “$58.85” and inserting
instead —
“    $61.95    ”;

(c) in item 2(b)(i) by deleting “71.6 cents” and inserting
instead —
“    78.3 cents    ”;

(d) in item 2(b)(ii) by deleting “24.1 cents” and inserting
instead —
“    26.3 cents    ”;

(e) in item 4 by deleting “$41.00” and inserting instead —
“    $44.00    ”;

(f) in item 5 by deleting “$61.50” and inserting instead —
“    $64.50    ”;

(g) in item 7(a) by deleting “$27.00” and inserting
instead —
“    $27.50    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

PO303*

Security and Related Activities (Control) Act 1996

Security and Related Activities (Control)
Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Security and Related
Activities (Control) Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2543

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Security and
Related Activities (Control) Regulations 1997*.

[* Reprinted as at 20 April 2001.
For amendments to 28 May 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 349.]

4. Schedule 4 amended

Schedule 4 is amended by deleting the Table of fees and
inserting the following Table instead —

“
Provision of Act
or regulations
  Column 1

Subject matter

Column 2

Fee ($)

Column 3

Agent’s licences

s. 46(1) Application for issue of agent’s licence — 
for one year or less* ………………………..340
for 3 years …………………………………..360

s. 46(1) Application by licensee for an additional
agent’s licence (each) ……………………………140

s. 49(1)(c) Application for renewal of agent’s licence —
3 year (each) ……………………………………. 188

Other licences

s. 46(1) Application for issue of any other licence — 
for one year or less …………………………119
for 3 years …………………………………..139

s. 46(1) Application by licensee for an additional other
licence (each) ……………………………………89

s. 49(1)(c) Application for renewal of any other licence —
3 year (each) ……………………………………. 110

r. 10 Application for endorsement under section 24 ….28
r. 12 Application for permit under section 25 ………...110
r. 13 Application for endorsement under section 26 ….28

Miscellaneous

s. 10(2) Application to inspect register …………………..28
s. 10(3) Certified copy of register entry ………………….28
s. 46(1) Fee if fingerprints and palm prints are

required under section 48 ..………………………44
s. 66 Issue of duplicate licence or duplicate

identification card ………………………………. 18
    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



2544 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

PO304*

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Pawnbrokers and
Second-hand Dealers Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Pawnbrokers
and Second-hand Dealers Regulations 1996*.

[* Reprinted as at 2 March 2001.
For amendments to 21 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 268.]

4. Regulation 28 amended
The Table to regulation 28 is deleted and the following Table is
inserted instead —

“
Table — Fees for issue of licences

Licence 1 year or
part
thereof ($)

2 years or
part
thereof ($)

3 years or
part
thereof ($)

1. Pawnbroker’s licence only 370 623 875
2. Second-hand dealer’s licence

only (computer option) 350 589 827
3. Second-hand dealer’s licence

only (facsimile option) 450 833 1 214
4. Pawnbroker’s licence and

second-hand dealer’s licence 420 674 926

    ”.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2545

5. Regulation 29 amended

The Table to regulation 29 is deleted and the following Table is
inserted instead —

“
Table — Fees for renewal of licences

Licence 1 year or
part
thereof ($)

2 years or
part
thereof ($)

3 years or
part
thereof ($)

1. Pawnbroker’s licence only 273 529 786
2. Second-hand dealer’s licence

only (computer option) 259 501 743
3. Second-hand dealer’s licence

only (facsimile option) 415 796 1 176
4. Pawnbroker’s licence and

second-hand dealer’s licence 292 568 825
    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

ROTTNEST ISLAND AUTHORITY
RX301*

Rottnest Island Authority Act 1987

Rottnest Island Amendment Regulations
(No. 2) 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Rottnest Island
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.



2546 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Rottnest Island
Regulations 1988*.

[* Reprinted as at 1 August 1997.
For amendments to 4 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 343.]

4. Part 2 heading replaced

The heading to Part 2 is deleted and the following heading is
inserted instead —

“
Part 2 — Fees

    ”.

5. Regulation 7E inserted

After regulation 7D the following regulation is inserted in
Part 2 —

“
7E. Main Ferry Jetty berthing fee

(1) The owner of a vessel shall before berthing that vessel
at the Main Ferry Jetty at Rottnest Island pay to the
Authority the relevant berthing fee set out in
Schedule 8 for berths at that jetty.

(2) A person referred to in subregulation (1) who fails or
refuses to pay a berthing fee payable by him under that
subregulation commits an offence.
Penalty: $1 000.

    ”.

6. Schedule 5 amended

Schedule 5 is amended as follows:
(a) by deleting “$22.00” and inserting instead —

“    $23.00    ”;
(b) by deleting “$44.00” and inserting instead —

“    $46.00    ”;
(c) by deleting “$66.00” and inserting instead —

“    $69.00    ”;
(d) by deleting “$88.00” and inserting instead —

“    $92.00    ”.

7. Schedule 6 amended

(1) Schedule 6 Part 1 is amended as follows:
(a) by deleting “$22.00” and inserting instead —

“    $23.00    ”;



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2547

(b) by deleting “$33.00” in both places where it occurs and
inserting instead —
“    $35.00    ”.

(2) Schedule 6 Part 2 is amended as follows:
(a) by deleting “$18.70” and inserting instead —

“    $20.00    ”;
(b) by deleting “$27.50” in both places where it occurs and

inserting instead —
“    $30.00    ”.

8. Schedule 7 amended

(1) Schedule 7 Part 1 item 1 is deleted and the following item is
inserted instead —

“
1. Admission Fee to Island  (r. 5(1)) $1.00 for a child

who has reached
4 years, but is
under 13 years of
age.
$11.50 for every
person 13 or more
years of age.

    ”.

(2) Schedule 7 Part 1 item 2a is amended by deleting “$110.00” and
inserting instead —

“    $121.00    ”.

(3) Schedule 7 Part 2 item 3 is amended by deleting “$33” and
inserting instead —

“    $35.00    ”.

9. Schedule 8 inserted

After Schedule 7 the following Schedule is inserted —

“
Schedule 8 — Berthing fee for Main Ferry Jetty

[r. 7E]

Method of calculating
annual rate (based on
surveyed passenger carrying
capacity for the vessel’s
highest class of survey)
plus —

$40.00 per
passenger

Vessels less than 35 m: $285.00/m x
length of vessel

Vessels 35 m and over: $455.00/m x
length of vessel



2548 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

Fees for berthing at the Main Ferry Jetty are as follows —
Annual Rate: Vessel occupying a berth

overnight to be at annual
rate.
Vessel occupying a berth
for a portion of the day to
be at 50% of the annual
rate.

Quarterly Rate: 30% of the annual rate.
Monthly Rate: 12% of the annual rate.
Daily Rate: 1% of the annual rate.

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

TREASURY AND FINANCE
TF301*

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Act 1992

Rates and Charges (Rebates and Deferments)
Amendment Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Rates and Charges
(Rebates and Deferments) Amendment Regulations 2004.

2. Commencement

These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2004.

3. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Rates and
Charges (Rebates and Deferments) Regulations 1992*.

[* Reprinted as at 2 February 2001.
For amendments to 8 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 312-3.]



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2549

4. Regulation 3 replaced

Regulation 3 is repealed and the following regulation is inserted
instead —

“
3. Maximum limit for rebate

The limit on the amount of rebate that an eligible
senior is to be allowed on a prescribed charge referred
to in section 40(9)(a) of the Act is the amount set in the
following Table for that charge for the rating year
during which the service to which the charge relates
was provided.

Service to which charge relates

Rating year
water
supply sewerage drainage rates

1/7/02 — 30/6/03 $66.25 $107.15 $12.65 $193.55

1/7/03 — 30/6/04 $68.45 $110.70 $13.05 $199.95

1/7/04 — 30/6/05 $68.45 $110.70 $13.05 $204.75
    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

TF302*

Stamp Act 1921

Stamp Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Stamp Amendment
Regulations (No. 3) 2004.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Stamp
Regulations 2003*.

[* Published in Gazette 27 June 2003 p. 2315-18.
For amendments to 3 June 2004 see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 364, and
Gazette 27 February and 7 May 2004.]



2550 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

3. Regulation 5 amended

Regulation 5 is amended as follows:
(a) by deleting “recognized” and inserting instead —

“    recognised    ”;
(b) by deleting paragraph (c) and inserting the following

paragraph instead —

“
(c) any stock exchange that is a member of the

World Federation of Exchanges.
    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

TF303*

Financial Administration and Audit Act 1985

Financial Administration and Audit
(Designation of Statutory Authorities)

Regulations 2004

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council under
section 4(2) of the Act.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Financial
Administration and Audit (Designation of Statutory
Authorities) Regulations 2004.

2. The Act amended

The amendment in these regulations is to the Financial
Administration and Audit Act 1985*.

[* Reprinted as at 16 September 2002.
For subsequent amendments see Western Australian
Legislation Information Tables for 2002, Table 1, p. 139, and
Acts Nos. 31, 35, 48, 65, 67 and 74 of 2003.]



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2551

3. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended by deleting “Fremantle Cemetery
Board”.

By Command of the deputy of the Governor,

ROD SPENCER, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————



2552 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

— PART 2 —

AGRICULTURE
AG401*

AGRICULTURE AND RELATED RESOURCES PROTECTION ACT 1976
PASTORAL RATES

Agriculture Protection Board
South Perth.

22nd June 2004.
The Agriculture Protection Board of Western Australia, acting pursuant to Sections 60 and 61 of the
Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976, and with the approval of the Minister for
Agriculture, Forestry and Fisheries, hereby imposes—

(a) a general rate of 3.20 cents in the dollar on the unimproved value of the land held in the
Kimberley;

(b) a general rate of 4.43 cents in the dollar on the unimproved value of the land in the area
south of the Kimberley; and

(c) a zonal rate of 0.73 cents in the dollar on the unimproved value of the land held in all those
municipal districts comprising the Kalgoorlie Zone i.e. the Shires of Ngaanyatjarraku,
Wiluna, Sandstone, Leonora, Laverton, Menzies, Coolgardie, Kalgoorlie/Boulder and Dundas

for the financial year commencing on the first day of July 2004.
The Common Seal of the Agriculture Protection Board of Western Australia was hereunto affixed in
the presence of—

CHRIS RICHARDSON, Chairman, Agriculture Protection Board.
Approved—

KIM CHANCE, MLC, Minister for Agriculture, Forestry and Fisheries.

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION
CE401

ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987
CANCELLED ASSOCIATION (SECTION 35)

The Manjimup BMX Club Incorporated
Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named association has been cancelled as
from the date of this notice.
Dated the 29th day of June 2004.

PATRICK WALKER, Commissioner for Fair Trading.

CE402*
CONSUMER AFFAIRS ACT 1971

SECTION 23R(6)(a)
REVOCATION OF CONSUMER PRODUCT SAFETY ORDER

I, Anne Marie Driscoll, Deputy Commissioner for Fair Trading, acting pursuant to the powers vested
in me by Section 23R(6)(a) of the Consumer Affairs Act 1971 and upon the recommendation of the
Consumer Product Safety Committee, hereby revoke the Consumer Product Safety Order made on
29 March 1988 by Norman Richard Fletcher, Commissioner for Consumer Affairs and published in
the Government Gazette on 31 March 1988 with respect to the goods described in the Schedule.
Dated the 28th day of May 2004.

ANNE DRISCOLL, Deputy Commissioner for Fair Trading.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2553

SCHEDULE
Goods being exercise or fitness equipment consisting of two foot pedals connected to a bar handle by a
spring, including goods known as “Tummy Trimmers”, “Fitness Exerciser”, “Rowing Exerciser”, ‘Flab
Blaster”, “Gut Buster”, “Belly Blaster”, “Power Exerciser”, “Gut Trimmer” and “Stomach Blaster”.

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
CX401

ADOPTION ACT 1994
CONTACT AND MEDIATION AGENCY LICENCE

I, Jane Brazier, Director General for Community Development, issue the following person with a
licence to act as a Contact and Mediation Agency under Sections 105 and 106 of the Adoption Act
1994 and subject to the Adoption Regulations and Code of Practice 1995 for a period of three years—

Jennifer Anne Newbould
38 Queens Crescent
Mount Lawley WA

Dated this 17th day of June 2004.

JANE BRAZIER, Director General,
Department for Community Development.

FISHERIES
FI401*

FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994
PROHIBITION ON FISHING BY NET (NORTH COAST) AMENDMENT ORDER 2004

Order No. 4 of 2004
FD 1620/98 [614]
Made by the Minister under section 43.

Citation
1. This order may be cited as the Prohibition on Fishing by Net (North Coast) Amendment Order 2004.

Order amended
2. Notice No. 197* published in the Gazette of 9 August 1985 is amended—

(a) by inserting immediately before “(a)” where it first occurs the following subclause
designation—

“ (1) “;
(b) by inserting immediately before the Schedule the following subclause—

“ (2) Subclause (1) does not apply to a person who—
(a) is fishing for a non-commercial purpose;
(b) is fishing for—

(i) cherabin; or
(ii) bait fish of any of the Families Clupeidae, Atherinidae, Engraulididae,

Mugilidae and Hermiramphidae; and
(c) is fishing by means of a throw net.”; and

(c) in the part of the Schedule commencing “Area 6.” by deleting those provisions in columns 2, 3
and 4 that relate to cherabin.

[*Published in the Gazette of 9 August 1985. For amendments to 7 April 2004 see the Closed Waters
(North Coast) Amendment Notice 1993 published in the Gazette of 12 November 1993.
See regulation 186 of the Fish Resources Management Regulations concerning the continuation of
notices made under section 9, 10, 11 or 38 of the Fisheries Act 1905 and that were in force immediately
before the commencement of those regulations.]
Dated this 17th day of June 2004.

K. CHANCE, Minister for Agriculture, Forestry and Fisheries.



2554 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

JUSTICE
JU401*

COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999
PERMIT DETAILS

Pursuant to the provisions of section 51 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the
Director General of the Ministry of Justice has issued the following persons with Permits to do High-
Level Security Work—

Surname First Name(s) Permit
Number

Date Permit
Issued

Permit
Commence
Date

Permit Expiry
Date

COOK Catherine Jane CS4-082 03/06/2004 04/06/2004 30/07/2005
PLUSCHKE Marie Dawn CS4-083 03/06/2004 04/06/2004 30/07/2005

Pursuant to the provisions of section 56 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the
Director General of the Ministry of Justice has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level
Security Work—

Surname First Name(s) Permit
Number

Date Permit
Revoked

Percy Stephen William CS2-361 03/06/2004

O’Neill Hugh CS2-299 03/06/2004

Boddington Nola Rose CS3-041 03/06/2004

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999.

BRIAN YEARWOOD, Director, Custodial Contracts.

JU402*
COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999

PERMIT DETAILS

Pursuant to the provisions of section 51 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the
Director General of the Ministry of Justice has issued the following persons with Permits to do High-
Level Security Work—

Surname First Name(s) Permit
Number

Date Permit
Issued

Permit
Commence
Date

Permit Expiry
Date

Blenkinsopp Steve CS4-086 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Bodin Anthony CS4-087 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Cassey Shane CS4-088 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Clarke Neil CS4-089 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Coole Michael CS4-090 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Coppendale Paul CS4-091 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
De Chaufepie Frank CS4-092 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Dickson Mark CS4-093 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Dwyer Paul CS4-094 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Edge Raymond CS4-095 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Eitzen Andrew CS4-096 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Ferguson James CS4-097 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Galibardy Gordon CS4-098 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Gaillorenzo Mario CS4-099 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Gibbs Liam CS4-100 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Hampson Steven CS4-101 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Harrison Colin CS4-102 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Hatch Matthew CS4-103 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Hatwell Robert CS4-104 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Henry Glen CS4-105 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Horne David CS4-106 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2555

Surname First Name(s) Permit
Number

Date Permit
Issued

Permit
Commence
Date

Permit Expiry
Date

Johnson Aaron CS4-107 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Kavanagh Jon CS4-108 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Kaye Martin CS4-109 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Kentish Bruce CS4-110 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
King Clive CS4-111 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Kneale John CS4-112 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Lambie John CS4-113 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Lewis Paul CS4-114 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Lynn Robert CS4-115 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Marshall Eric CS4-116 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Massie Gary CS4-117 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Matheson Philip CS4-118 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Nair Daniel CS4-119 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Pickett David CS4-120 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Robinson Jeffrey CS4-121 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Scott Robert CS4-122 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Screaigh Trevor CS4-123 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Sedgwick Mark CS4-124 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Smith Craig CS4-125 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Spitty Scott CS4-126 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Stoker Gary CS4-127 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Thomas Gareth CS4-128 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Van Leeuwen Roy CS4-129 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Turner Nicholas CS4-130 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Vigne Didier CS4-131 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Wall Bradley CS4-132 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Walton Christopher CS4-133 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Watkins Jason CS4-134 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Watts Derek CS4-135 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
White David CS4-136 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Williams Mark CS4-137 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Williamson Kenneth CS4-138 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Wisse Stephen CS4-139 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Wynne Malcolm CS4-140 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Zappelli Peter CS4-141 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Fisher James CS4-142 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Hands Robert CS4-143 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Harper Christopher CS4-144 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Keelan Janice CS4-145 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Marriott Glen CS4-146 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Sheehan Mark CS4-147 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Bond Kerry CS4-148 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Hunt Brett CS4-149 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Kenworthy Alma CS4-150 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Cosstick Peter CS4-151 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Clegg Jeff CS4-152 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
McKeaig Gregory CS4-153 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Chu Reynoldo CS4-154 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Coyne Douglas CS4-155 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Devereaus Sean CS4-156 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
England Sean CS4-157 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Gilchrist Norman CS4-158 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005



2556 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

Surname First Name(s) Permit
Number

Date Permit
Issued

Permit
Commence
Date

Permit Expiry
Date

Schumacher Mark CS4-159 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Smith Geoffrey CS4-160 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Hughes Peter CS4-161 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Lobb Scott CS4-162 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Luxton Richard CS4-163 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Priestly Gary CS4-164 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Willis Richard CS4-165 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Schilo James CS4-166 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Tyson Patrick CS4-167 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Castle Craig CS4-168 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Matthews Terry CS4-169 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Gaudie David CS4-170 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Carey Anthony CS4-171 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Fordham Anthony CS4-172 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Gerrand Darren CS4-173 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Grover Graham CS4-174 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Hogan Mark CS4-175 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Jones Ian CS4-176 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Slater Anthony CS4-177 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Trindorfer Peter CS4-178 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Williams Anthony CS4-179 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Bogle Geoff CS4-180 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Emery Wayne CS4-181 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Galant Gary CS4-182 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Beaton Laurie CS4-183 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Maher Peter CS4-184 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Moore Ian CS4-185 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Patten Graham CS4-186 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Rowe Neville CS4-187 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Ray Bell CS4-188 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Bolton Pauline CS4-189 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Carberry Leon CS4-190 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Collier Russell CS4-191 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Coulter William CS4-192 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Dillon Bernie CS4-193 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Donatelli Nadia CS4-194 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Hatch Matthew CS4-195 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Leis Karen CS4-196 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Kennedy Dawn CS4-197 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Lewis Mark CS4-198 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Loughlin Derek CS4-199 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Mair Francine CS4-200 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Pulford Mark CS4-201 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Ratten Daniel CS4-202 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Stevens Peta CS4-203 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Tilbrook Max CS4-204 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Treasure Elizabeth CS4-205 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Wilkinson Stuart CS4-206 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Woodland Carol CS4-207 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Hanlon Henry CS4-208 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Irving Bruce CS4-209 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Lehman Barry CS4-210 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2557

Surname First Name(s) Permit
Number

Date Permit
Issued

Permit
Commence
Date

Permit Expiry
Date

Longman Gary CS4-211 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Morton Debbie CS4-212 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Wagener Lindsay CS4-213 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Wardlow Barry CS4-214 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Bailey Cathy CS4-215 14/06/2004 14/06/2004 30/05/2005
Smith Kevin CS4-216 15/06/2004 15/06/2004 30/05/2005
Renolds Siglinde CS4-217 16/06/2004 15/06/2004 30/05/2005
Mitchell Alan CS4-218 16/06/2004 15/06/2004 30/05/2005
Meyerink Theodoor Johan CS4-219 16/06/2004 17/06/2004 30/05/2005
Gorman Michael CS4-220 17/06/2004 18/06/2004 30/05/2005

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999.

BRIAN YEARWOOD, Director, Custodial Contracts.

LOCAL GOVERNMENT
LG401

Shire of Dalwallinu
APPOINTMENTS

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed, under the
provisions of the Dog Act 1996 for the municipality of the Shire of Dalwallinu—

Registration Officers Authorised Officers
Mr P. J. Crispin Mr W. T. Atkinson
Mr B. G. Parkinson Mr P. J. Crispin
Ms K. Y. Patiniotis Mr B. G. Parkinson
Ms D. N. Allan Mr D. C. Head
Ms D. A. Thompson Mr S. G. Morton
Miss C. R. Andrews Mr K. D. Ashby
Miss K. S. Hewson Mr H. F. Bryan
Mr H. F. Bryan

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed as
authorised persons under the provisions of the Litter Act 1979 for the municipality of the Shire of
Dalwallinu—

Mr. W. T. Atkinson Mr B. G. Parkinson
Mr H. F. Bryan Mr G. S. Benson
Mr P. J. Crispin

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled.

W. T. ATKINSON, Chief Executive Officer.

LG402*
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Gingin
APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED OFFICER

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed as
authorised officers for the registration of dogs under the Dog Act, 1976 (as amended)—

Priscilla Siano
Sally Stemp
Lisa Riley

The appointment of Gemma Sparkman is hereby cancelled.

S. D. FRASER, Chief Executive Officer.



2558 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

LG403*
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

Shire of Gingin
APPOINTMENT OF REGISTRATION OFFICER AND AUTHORISED OFFICER

It is hereby notified for public information that Mellanie Bernice Culhane has been appointed as an
authorised officer pursuant to the following Acts and has been authorised to enforce the following
Acts, Regulations, By-laws and Local Laws—

Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1960
Local Government Act, 1995 (as amended)
Control of Vehicles (Off-Road Areas) Act, 1978 and Regulations
Dog Act, 1976 and Regulations
Bush Fires Act, 1954 and Regulations
Spear-guns Control Act, 1955
Justices Act, 1902
The Litter Act, 1979
All of Council’s By-laws and Local Laws

S. D. FRASER, Chief Executive Officer.

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE
PI401

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928
ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT

Shire of Augusta-Margaret River
Town Planning Scheme No. 11—Amendment No. 134

Ref: 853/6/3/8 Pt 134
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Augusta-Margaret River Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 20 June 2004 for the
purpose of—

1. Rezoning Lot 3 Leeuwin Road, Augusta from ‘Rural’ to ‘Special Use’,
2. Amending Schedule III of the Scheme to include reference to Lot 3 Leeuwin Road, Augusta as

follows—
SCHEDULE III—SPECIAL USE SITES
LOT AND LOCATION Permitted Uses (See Clause 4.8)
Lot 3 Leeuwin Road, Augusta 1. The following uses and development classes

are classified ‘P’—
— Caretakers Dwelling
— Holiday Cabins and Chalets
— Hotel
— Licensed Restaurant
— Eating House
— Museum
— Aquaculture
— Manager’s Residence as part of Hotel

The following use and development class is
classified ‘AA’—

— Rural Industry
The following use and development class is
classified ‘IP’

— Shop
2. Development of the land shall be generally in

accordance with the Development Guide Plan
attached to the Scheme Amendment Report
or such alternative Development Guide Plan
endorsed by the Council and the Western
Australian Planning Commission.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2559

The Council may approve development of the
land that includes minor variation to a
Development Guide Plan—provided such
variation does not alter the intent of the
Plan, and may not reasonably be considered
to constitute a modification requiring
separate approval or a new Development
Guide Plan.

In considering a proposal for modification to
the Development Guide Plan or a new
Development Guide Plan the following shall
be addressed to the satisfaction of Council—

— Landscape (visual) assessment to
appraise visual outcome resulting
from the proposed modification.

— Scale of development (number and
bulk of buildings), including as a
consequence of an adopted Fire
Management Plan.

In considering a proposal for modification to
the Development Guide Plan, or a new
Development Guide Plan, Council shall cause
one or more of the following to be carried
out—

(i) Notice of the proposed modification or
new Development Guide Plan to be
served on the owners and occupiers of
land within an area determined by the
Council as likely to be affected by the
adoption of the modification or new
Development Guide Plan stating that
submissions may be made to the
Council within thirty days of the
service of such notice.

(ii) Notice of the proposed modification or
new Development Guide Plan to be
published in a newspaper circulating
in the Scheme Area stating that
submissions may be made to the
Council within thirty days from the
publication thereof.

(iii) A sign or signs displaying notice of the
proposed modification or new
Development Guide Plan to be erected
in a conspicuous position on the land
for a period of thirty days from the
date of publication of the notice.

After expiration of thirty days from the
serving of notice of the proposed modification
or new Development Guide Plan, the
publication of notice or the erection of a sign
or signs, whichever is the later, the Council
shall do one or other of the following—

— adopt the proposed modification or
new Development Guide Plan, with
or without changes, or

— refuse to adopt the proposed
modification or new Development
Guide Plan.

Upon Council’s determination of the
Development Guide Plan, the Council shall
refer the Development Guide Plan to the
Western Australian Planning Commission for
its consideration. In considering the
Development Guide Plan the Western
Australian Planning Commission may
either—

— adopt the proposed modification or
new Development Guide Plan, with
or without changes, or



2560 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

— refuse to adopt the proposed
modification or new Development
Guide Plan.

The proposed modification or new
Development Guide Plan has no effect until it
is endorsed by the Western Australian
Planning Commission.

3. In considering any proposal for development
the following shall be addressed, where
relevant, to the satisfaction of Council—

— Built form (including building height
and materials and colours) and
visual impact on surrounding
environment and key tourist viewing
points

— Parking
— Vehicle movement (traffic

management) within the site
— Stormwater management
— Effluent disposal to the satisfaction

of Council and the Department of
Health

— Clearing
— Landscaping
— Access points
— Development is to be connected to a

reticulated water supply
— Development is to be in accordance

with AS3959-1999 Construction of
Buildings in Bushfire Prone Areas

— Arrangements being made to ensure
public access is available to adjacent
Reserves via Lot 3

— A fire management plan to be
prepared to the satisfaction of FESA
and Council

— A foreshore management plan is to
be prepared and implemented for the
abutting coastal foreshore reserve at
the development stage

— Prior to development, detailed
investigation of the site is to be
undertaken for evidence of sites of
Aboriginal heritage significance

— Development is to be generally in
accordance with the Environmental
Management Strategy dated 22
December 1999

— Existing vegetation is to be
preserved where possible and
revegetation using native local
species is to be encouraged.

4. Notwithstanding the Scheme definition of
‘Chalet’, Chalet development on Lot 3
Leeuwin Road Augusta shall not exceed
150m2 in gross area, or a maximum height of
8m unless otherwise approved by Council.

3. Inserting the following in alphabetic order in Appendix III—Interpretations—
Chalet—means an attached, detached or semi detached, single unit, residential building
not exceeding 100m2 in gross area or a height of 7m and normally constructed as one of a
group of two or more such buildings that is used or provided for holiday purposes within a
tourist facility other than a farm-stay operation and available to the public at large or to
a part of the public defined by a common class, trade, employment, religion or association
and “holiday cabin” has a similar meaning except that it refers only to a detached form of
development.
Licensed Restaurant—means premises where the predominant use is the sale and
consumption of food and drinks on the premises and where seating is provided for
patrons, and which has been licensed under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988;



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2561

Aquaculture—means any fish farming operation for which an Aquaculture Licence issued
pursuant of the provisions of Part 8 of the Fish Resources Management Act 1994 (as
amended) and the Fish Resources Management Regulations 1995 (as amended) is
required;

Manager’s Residence as part of Hotel—means a building used as a residence by the
proprietor or manager of a Hotel upon the same site;

4. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

N. DORNAN, President.
I. BODILL, Chief Executive Officer.

PI402
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT

Shire of Chapman Valley

Town Planning Scheme No. 1—Amendment No. 18

Ref: 853/3/17/1 Pt 18

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Chapman Valley Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 23 June 2004 for the purpose
of—

1. Rezoning Victoria Locations 2, 538, 1039, portion of Victoria Locations 3, 2249, Pt 2511,
portion of Vacant Crown Land (Foreshore Reserve), Reserve 43488 (Public Recreation),
portion of Lot 13 (Buller River) and portion of Lots 11, 12, 13, 14, 15 and 16 North West
Coastal Highway from General Farming Zone and Recreation Zone to Industrial
Investigation Zone.

2. Deleting Clause 1.3.2 (f) and renumbering Clause 1.3.2 (g) to 1.3.2 (f).

3. Adding to Clause 1.7 after “Industiy-Noxious” and before “Industry-Rural” the following—

Industry-Resource Processing: means any industry defined by Council as handling,
treating or processing a raw resource or material (including chemical industries), and
which by reason of the processes involved, materials used or produced, or scale of
operation will normally involve—

– substantial capital investment;

– significant employment; and
– a need for substantial separation or buffer distances to sensitive areas.

4. Adding to Clause 1.7 after “Poultry Farm” and before “Prison” the following—

Power Generation: means land and buildings, structures and plant used for the
generation of electrical power and includes such land, buildings, structures, ore bodies
and water bodies that provide fuel to or are ancillary to the generation of electrical power
but shall not include small scale generators and renewable energy sources.

5. Adding “Industrial Investigation Zone” to Clause 2.1.1 after “Service Station Zone” and before
“Industry Zone”.

6. Adding to Clause 2.2 Zoning and Development Table for ZONE—General Farming under the
‘Other Requirements’ column for the uses Industry-Noxious and Industry—Hazardous the
following—

“This use is not permitted within the Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone Buffer (refer
Clause 2.7.3.2)”.

7. Adding to Clause 2.2 Zoning and Development Table for ZONE—General Farming under the
‘Other Requirements’ colunm for the uses “Abattoirs”, “Industry-Extractive”, “Industry-
Noxious”, “Industry-Hazardous”, “Piggery” and “Poultry Farm” the following—

Development outside the Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone Buffer shall not
compromise the development and expansion of industry within the strategic industrial
core (Area C) within the Industrial Investigation Zone.

8. Adding to Clause 2.2 the following Zoning and Development Tables for the “Industrial
Investigation Zone” after that for “Service Station Zone” and before that for “Industry Zone”.



2562 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

ZONING AND DEVELOPMENT TABLE
ZONE—INDUSTRIAL INVESTIGATION
POLICY STATEMENT—The Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone is an area under review by the

Government with respect to its potential as a location for heavy industry. The zone allows for the
location of industrial development but without any implied Government commitment to provide
the necessary transport infrastructure to the site. The zone includes a potential strategic
industrial core area, ancillary general industrial area and a potential regional port facility. These
have been delineated as separate Areas within the Industrial Investigation Zone for the purpose
of exercising different land use and development controls in each Area. A separate Policy
Statement, list of Permitted Uses and Development Standards is provided for each Area
hereunder.

AREA A GENERAL INDUSTRY POLICY STATEMENT—Should potential development within the
adjacent strategic industrial core (Area C) proceed, this Area will primarily provide for ancillary
industries (such as manufacturing, fabrication and processing industries) which will not affect the
locality through the emission of noise, odours, smoke and other wastes.

IP = Use not permitted unless it is incidental to a predominant use as determined by Council.
P = Use permitted subject to compliance with Development Standards.
PS = Use not permitted unless special approval given by Council and conditions complied with.
AP = Not permitted unless special approval given by Council after advertising.

Development Standards
Minimum boundary

setbacksMinimum
Lot area

Minimum
effective
frontage

Minimum
area of lot
per unit Front Rear Sides

Minimum
car parking

spaces

Minimum
landscap-

ing

Minimum
Advertis-

ing

Other
require-
ments

2000m2 25m 0.5 20m 7.5m 5m one
side

1 per 50m2

of gross
floor area

10% on
front and

side
boundaries
See Clause

3.1.12

See Clause
3.1.19

Refer
Clause 2.7

PERMITTED USES Note: Unless otherwise specified against a particular use below the standards above will apply to this area
1 Radio & TV

Installation
P 1 per 2

employees
on site

2 Warehouse IP
3 Service Station PS 1500m2 0.3 7.5 5 20% of site

on
perimeter

of site—see
Clauses
3.1.12 &

6.6
4 Motor Vehicle

Repair Station
P

5 Builder’s Storage
Yard

P

6 Transport Depot P
7 Premises for the

temporary or
permanent storage
of engineering
equipment and
material and the
parking of
earthmoving
equipment and
machinery

P Nil

8 Public Utility PS 1 per 2
employees

onsite
9 Convenience Store PS

10 Industry—General PS
11 Industry—Light P
12 Fuel Depot P
13 Power Generation IP
14 Office IP
15 A lock up shop

upon the premises
of or adjoining a
factory used
primarily to
provide meals and
refreshments for
the employees of
the factory

IP

16 A factory
showroom or an
office upon the
premises of or
adjoining the
factory

IP

AREA B COASTAL POLICY STATEMENT—The area is identified as a potential site for a port,
transport and service corridors, port related land uses and low key recreation activities. The
objective is to accommodate the requirements of potential industries within the adjacent strategic
industrial core (Area C) integrated with the protection of areas of landscape, heritage and
recreation significance.

IP = Use not permitted unless it is incidental to a predominant use as determined by Council.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2563

P = Use permitted subject to compliance with Development Standards.
PS = Use not permitted unless special approval given by Council and conditions complied with.
AP = Not permitted unless special approval given by Council after advertising.

Development Standards
Minimum boundary

setbacksMinimum
Lot Areas

Minimum
effective
frontage

Minimum
lot area
per unit Front Rear Sides

Minimum
car parking

spaces

Minimum
landscap-

ing
Other Requirements

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A Refer Clause 2.7
PERMITTED USES Note: Unless otherwise specified against a particular use below the standards above will apply to this area

1
2

3
4
5
6

7

Public Recreation
Harbour

Installations
Public Utility
Fuel Depot
Marina
Marine Collectors

Yard
Marine Filling

Station

PS

PS
PS
PS
PS

PS

PS

1. Prior to construction
of the port, a Coastal
Management and
Structure Plan will
be prepared for Area
B of the Industrial
Investigation Zone by
the State
Government to the
satisfaction of
Council and in
consultation with the
Environmental
Protection Authority
and the Western
Australian Planning
Commission. The
Plan shall provide for
the coordination and
integration of
intended land uses,
transport and service
corridors and sites of
heritage and
landscape
significance, and
shall depict public
access to and along
the ocean foreshore.
The plan shall
address port and
associated activities,
transport and
services corridors
and rehabilitation of
remnant vegetation
and management of
recreation.

2. The Coastal
Management and
Structure Plan shall
be consistent with
relevant Western
Australian Planning
Commission policy,
shall conform with
conditions set by the
Minister for the
Environment for the
Oakajee Deep Water
Port Proposal and
have due regard for
Clause 3.2.8 (General
Policy for Coastal
Management).

AREA C STRATEGIC INDUSTRY POLICY STATEMENT—The area is under investigation as a
potential site for development of a strategic industrial estate, adjacent to a port facility. The
objective is to ensure that should development of strategic industry proceed, it is contained within
a strategic industrial core with appropriate surrounding buffers, and that development adheres to
strict environmental standards and operational criteria approved by the Environmental
Protection Authority and Council.

IP = Use not permitted unless it is incidental to a predominant use as determined by Council.
P = Use permitted subject to compliance with Development Standards.
PS = Use not permitted unless special approval given by Council and conditions complied with.
AP = Not permitted unless special approval given by Council after advertising.

Development Standards
Minimum boundary

setbacksMinimum
Lot Areas

Minimum
effective
frontage

Minimum
lot area
per unit Front Rear Sides

Minimum
car parking

spaces

Minimum
landscap-

ing
Other Requirements

5ha 80m N/A 20m 30m 10m
each
side

1 per 2
employees

on-site

Refer
2.7.3(1)

Refer Clause 2.7

PERMITTED USES Note: Unless otherwise specified against a particular use below the standards above will apply to this area
1
2

3
4

5
6
7

Industry—Noxious
Industry—

Hazardous
Fuel Depot
Industry—

Extractive
Power Generation
Public Utility
Industry—

Resource
Processing

PS

PS
PS

PS
PS
PS

PS

All major developments
in this zone shall be
subject to—
1. Approved

environmental
management criteria
governing layout,
manner of
development and
ongoing management
of proposed
operations, including
safety and



2564 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

satisfactory storage
or disposal of noxious
or hazardous
materials or wastes.

2. An environmental
impact statement if
required by Council
or the Environmental
Protection Authority.

9. Adding “Industrial Investigation Zone” to the Scheme Map Legend.
10. Adding to the Scheme Map Legend after “Rural Residential Zone”: “Special Control Areas”.
11. Adding to Part II—Control of Development and Use of Land after Clause 2.6 the following—

2.7 Special Control Areas
2.7.1 The following Special Control Areas are shown on the Scheme Map

(i) Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone and Buffer.
2.7.2 The provisions of the Special Control Area apply in addition to the provisions of

the zone and any general provisions of the Scheme.
2.7.3 Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone and Buffer.

The Special Control Area shown on the Scheme Map (generally bounded by
Buller River to the south, the ocean foreshore to the west, Coronation Beach
Road to the north and an alignment east of the North West Coastal Highway)
comprises the Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone and Buffer.

2.7.3.1 Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone
The Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone, located within the Special
Control Area, is an area under review by the Government with respect
to its potential as a location for heavy industry. The zone allows for the
location of industrial development but without any implied
Government commitment to provide the necessary transport
infrastructure to the site. The zone includes a potential strategic
industrial core area, ancillary general industrial area and a potential
regional port facility.

2.7.3.2 Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone
The potential for industrial development within the strategic industrial
core in the Industrial Investigation Zone generates the need for a
buffer to prevent land use conflicts. The Special Control Area boundary
is defined by the outer boundary of the buffer, which is reserved
exclusively to accommodate impacts from industry located in the
strategic industrial core. Industry-Noxious and Industry-Hazardous
located outside of the Special Control Area shall not compromise
development of the strategic industrial core afforded by the Oakajee
Industrial Buffer.

2.7.3.3 The following provisions apply to this Special Control Area.—
(a) Prior to any development proposal being considered by Council,

the Estate Manager, as nominated by the Government of
Western Australia must first consider the proposal. The State
Government shall establish an advisory group comprising
representatives of relevant agencies, local government, industry
and the community. The role of the advisory group shall be to
make recommendations to the Estate Manager.

(b) All development proposed must be in accordance with an
approved structure plan or plans.

(c) Notwithstanding any other provision contained within this
Scheme no residential use, temporary or permanent, including a
Dwelling House (Single), shall be permitted on land within the
Special Control Area. Specific exception may be made to
accommodate temporary camp accommodation for workers prior
to the establishment of the first industry within the Strategic
Industry zone.

(d) All applications for development of land within the strategic
industrial core (Area C) shall be referred to the Environmental
Protection Authority.

(e) Prior to any clearing of remnant vegetation, searches shall be
undertaken to identify significant flora on the site. Flora
management strategies will be prepared for areas of significant
flora.

(f) The Estate Manager will be required to establish a noise
monitoring program before the establishment of the first
industrial activity to monitor the cumulative impact of noise
generated by industries in the estate, in consultation with the
Department of Environment, to determine whether
Environmental Protection Authority Regulations are being met
within the special control area boundary.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2565

(g) The Estate Manager will be required to establish an air quality
monitoring program before the establishment of the first
industrial activity to monitor cumulative impact of gaseous
emissions, odours and/or greenhouse gases to the satisfaction of
the Department of Environment.

(h) The Estate Manager will be required to establish a program
before the establishment of the first industrial activity for
collection of baseline data and undertake air quality monitoring
for dust and particle emissions to the satisfaction of the
Department of Environment.

(i) The Estate Manager will be required to establish a program
before the establishment of the first hazardous industrial
activity for ongoing assessment of cumulative risk and to
undertake cumulative risk appraisal prior to any new hazardous
industry development, to the satisfaction of the Department of
Environment.

(j) The Estate Manager will be required to establish a monitoring
program before the establishment of the first industrial activity
for groundwater and marine water to collect baseline data and
to ensure water quality is maintained or improved to the
satisfaction of the Department of Environment.

(k) The Estate Manager will be required to establish a monitoring
program before the establishment of the first industrial activity
for rainwater to collect baseline data and to ensure that
rainwater quality is maintained or improved to the satisfaction
of the Department of Environment.

(l) Notwithstanding the provisions contained within Part IV of this
Scheme, should the cumulative environmental impacts of
incremental industrial development exceed the Environmental
Protection Authority criteria, the Estate Manager is required to
make suitable arrangements for occupants of residences within
the Oakajee Industrial Investigation Zone buffer to vacate that
residence.

(m) Individual industries will be required to provide drainage plans
to the satisfaction of Council prior to undertaking any
construction.

(n) The Estate Manager will be required to prepare an overall
Oakajee Landscape Master Plan with performance timetables to
ensure nominated actions are completed within time. This
Master Plan is to be prepared prior to commencement of
construction of the first industry.

(o) Individual industries will comply with Landscape Master Plan
requirements and submit individual landscape plans and
implementation timetables with their development applications.
Landscape plans shall be designed and implemented to the
satisfaction of the Council.

(p) Provisions shall be made for the protection and management of
two European heritage sites illustrated on the Structure Plan.
All development applications shall also be required to address
aboriginal heritage issues in accordance with Aboriginal
Heritage Management Plan/s approved by the state government
agency responsible for the protection of aboriginal heritage.

12. Deleting from Clause 2.2 Zoning and Development Table—Special Zones, entry 1 relating to
Part of Victoria Locations 2, 3, 1039 and 2511 and amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

J. P. COLLINGWOOD, President.
M. BATTILANA, Chief Executive Officer.

PI404
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
Shire of Northampton

Town Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 40
Ref: 853/3/14/6 Pt 40
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Northampton Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 23 June 2004 for the purpose of—

1. (i) Rezoning and reclassifying Lot 900 Browne Boulevard, a portion of Lot 901 George
Grey Drive and various lots on Jacques Boulevard, Castaway Street, Mariner Crescent,



2566 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

Charlton Loop and Kestrel Street from the Residential, Commercial, Special Rural,
Rural and Special Site Zones, Park and Recreation Reserve and No Zone to the
Residential, Commercial, Tourist Accommodation, Rural and Special Site Zones and
the Park and Recreation Reserve, as shown on the Scheme (Amendment) Map.

(ii) Amending the Development Precincts and Residential Codes Map for all Residential
zoned land on the Scheme (Amendment) Map by replacing the current zones with, in
the case of land currently zoned Residential, and adding over the remainder, the R5,
R12.5 and R20 codes, as shown on the Development Precincts and Residential Codes
Amendment Map.

2. Deleting entries relating to Special Sites 6 and 7 from Appendix No 5.
3. Deleting the second entry from Appendix No 6.
4. Amending the Scheme Text by—

Replacing Provision (1) in Appendix No. 10 with the following—
“(1) Subdivision—

Subdivision is to be generally in accordance with the Superlot 2 Structure Plan Port
Kalbarri, as endorsed by the Commission.”

(ii) Deleting Provisions (3) and (4) in Appendix No. 10 and inserting the following as
Provision (3)—

“(3) Uses Not Permitted—
Notwithstanding anything on Table 1—Use Class Table, no horses may be kept
on any lot unless the landowner satisfies Council that they will be stabled and
hand fed and that this provision warrants relaxation.”

(iii) Renumbering Provision (5) in Appendix No. 10 as Provision (4) and inserting the
following at the end of the provision—
“Fibre reinforced fencing is not permitted on any boundary.”

(iv) Renumbering Provision (6) in Appendix No. 10 as Provision (5) and modifying part (a)
of that provision by replacing “100m2” with “140m2”.

(v) Replacing part (b) of Provision (6) in Appendix No. 10 (to be renumbered as Provision
(5)) with the following—
“all roofs shall be constructed in a material to the satisfaction of the Council.”

(vi) Renumbering Provisions (7) to (9) in Appendix No. 10 as Provisions (6) to (8)
respectively.

(vii) Deleting Provision (10) in Appendix No. 10.
(viii) Renumbering Provisions (11) to (13) in Appendix No. 10 as Provisions (9) to (11)

respectively.
(ix) Replace Provision (2) in Appendix No. 10 with the following—

“(2) Minimum Lot Size and Reticulated Water—
The minimum lot size shall be 1.0 hectare and reticulated water shall be
provided to all lots.”

5. Adding the prefix (a) to the existing Provision (12) (to be renumbered as Provision (10)) in
Appendix No. 10, and inserting the following as part (b) of that Provision—
“(b) Notwithstanding (a) above, the Shire may require planting of additional trees as part of

a development approval and may request the West Australian Planning Commission to
impose a condition at the subdivision stage for the provision of landscaping and tree
planting to enhance the landscape quality of the locality. Selected tree species to be
endorsed by the Shire.”

6. Amending the Scheme Text by—
(i) inserting the following definition, in alphabetical order, into Appendix No. 1—

“ “bed and breakfast” means a portion of a dwelling in which provision is made for
short term occupation by no more than four persons exclusive of family members of
the keeper thereof, for hire or reward.”; and

(ii) inserting Bed and Breakfast into Table 1—Use Class Table, as an AA use within the
Residential, Residential Development, Rural and Special Rural Zones, and as a
prohibited (“-”) use within all other zones (with the exception that no notation be
included for the use within the Special Site Zone).

7. Subdivision within the Superlot 2 Revised Structure Plan, Port Kalbarri shall incorporate the
water sensitive urban design principles where practicable.

8. Replace Table 1—Use Class Table with the version of Table 1—Use Class Table that was
contained within the Scheme immediately prior to the gazettal of Amendment No. 30 to the
Scheme, but incorporating the uses introduced by that Amendment, the Tourist Development
Zone, and the permissibility classifications for those new uses and Zone as introduced by that
Amendment, along with those changes to Table 1—Use Class Table proposed in this
Amendment and any other changes to Table 1—Use Class Table introduced by any
Amendment to Town Planning Scheme No. 4 gazetted since Amendment No. 30.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2567

9. Amending the Scheme Text by inserting the following entry into Appendix No. 5—Special
Site Schedule—

Lot No.—Location Use Development Requirements

Portion of Lot 901
George Grey Drive

Tourist accommodation and
associated uses

Refer Appendix 6

(Note: the top row is for information purposes and does not need to be duplicated within
Appendix No 5).

10. Amending the Scheme Text by inserting the following entry into Appendix No. 6—Special
Site Development—
 “Purpose: Tourist accommodation and associated uses
Location: Portion of Lot 901 George Grey Drive
Objective: To permit progressive development of a range of tourist

accommodation facilities and associated uses.
Permitted Uses: The following uses are permitted (P) as specified in Clause 4.3—

Hotel, Motel, Chalet Park, Holiday Accommodation
The following uses are discretionary (AA) as specified in Clause
4.3—

Amusement Parlour, Private Club, Recreation, Recreational
Facilities, Restaurant

The following uses are discretionary, and require advertising (SA)
as specified in Clause 4.3—

Micro-Brewery, Night Club, Tavern
The following uses are not permitted unless incidental (IP) as
specified in Clause 4.3—

Office, Shop, other uses incidental to the predominant use of
the land as determined by Council

Uses Not Permitted: Residential use, Camping Ground, Caravan Park
Development Twenty percent of individual sites shall be landscaped in
Requirements: accordance with a landscaping plan approved by Council.

A two-storey height restriction and plot ratio of 0.5 apply.
Variations to the above standards may apply at Council discretion.
Prior to any planning approval for a micro-brewery being granted
by Council, the proponent shall prepare and submit for Council’s
consideration a site plan and a management plan demonstrating
that the proposed use will be able to operate without unacceptable
impacts on the residential amenity of existing or future adjacent
residential properties. These plans shall address landscaping, car
parking and vehicular access, visual amenity, relationship to
adjacent uses, noise, odours, hours of operation and any other
matter required to be addressed by Council. Council may impose
conditions on any planning approval for a micro-brewery to ensure
that any of the issues addressed by the site plan and management
plan are to Council’s satisfaction. Car parking provision, setbacks
and landscaping shall be as determined by Council.
All development shall be connected to reticulated sewer.
No direct vehicular access from the site to George Grey Drive shall
be allowed.”

G. V. PARKER, President.
G. L. KEEFFE, Chief Executive Officer.

PI403
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
City of Geraldton

Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 23
Ref: 853/3/2/7 Pt 23
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the City of Geraldton Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 23 June 2004 for the purpose of—

1. Adding the following Scheme Objective to clause 2.1
• to prohibit the use or development of land for certain nuclear activities which may result

in—
(i) environmental harm;



2568 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

(ii) detriment to any land used for the public benefit or from which the public derives
aesthetic enjoyment; or

(iii) detriment to the amenity, health or safety of the public.
2. Amending Schedule 1—Interpretations by—

(a) Adding the following definitions in the appropriate alphabetical position—
(i) Environment has the same meaning as given to the Environment Protection Act

1986;
(ii) Environmental Harm means the direct or indirect alteration of the

environment, or any aspect of the environment, to its detriment or degradation;
(iii) Nuclear Activity means—

(A) the handling, production, processing, treatment, use, mining,
transportation, transfer, storage or disposal of a radioactive material or a
radioactive mineral, irrespective of whether the activity constitutes—

(1) the entire use or development of land;
(2) a predominant or significant aspect of some other use or

development of land; or
(3) an incidental or minor aspect of some other use or development of

land;
(B) nuclear power generation—

but does not include;
(C) the handling, production, processing, treatment, use, transportation,

transfer or storage of a radioactive mineral which is incidental to the
mining of nonradioactive minerals for example mineral sands;

(D) the use of a radioactive material for a recognised and accepted procedure
undertaken within a consulting rooms group, hospital, hospital special
purpose or medical centre; or

(E) the use of radioactive mineral or a radioactive material where the Council
is satisfied that it is to be used for a recognised and accepted industrial,
commercial, domestic or other application.

(iv) Nuclear Fuel means the fissionable and fertile elements and isotopes used as
the source of energy in nuclear reactors;

(v) Nuclear Power Generation means the production or generation of electricity
using the process of nuclear fission or nuclear fusion or by any process involving
or requiring nuclear fuel;

(vi) Radioactive Material means radioactive substances, nuclear fuel, waste or by
products of any of these;

(vii) Radioactive Mineral means a mineral from which radioactive material is
derived including, but not limited to, uranium, thorium and radium.

(b) Deleting the definition of Public Utility and substituting for it the following—
Public Utility means any work or undertaking constructed or maintained by a
Public Authority or the Council as may be required to provide water, sewerage,
electricity, gas, drainage, communications or other similar services but does not
include nuclear power generation.

(c) Deleting paragraphs (a), (b) and (c) of the definition of Industry and substituting the
following—

(a) the winning, processing or treatment of minerals but not including radioactive
minerals;

(b) the making, altering, repairing, or ornamentation, painting, finishing, cleaning,
packing or canning or adapting for sale, or the breaking up or demolition of any
article or part of an article but does not include a nuclear activity;

(c) the generation of electricity or the production of gas but not including nuclear
power generation;

(d) Deleting paragraph (a) from the definition of Industry—Extractive and substituting
the following—

(a) the extraction of sand, gravel, clay, turf, soil, rock, stone, minerals (but not
including radioactive minerals unless incidental to the mining of nonradioactive
minerals), or similar substances from the land and also the storage, treatment or
manufacture of products from those materials on the land from which those
materials are extracted or on land adjacent thereto; or

(e) Deleting the definition of Industry—Hazardous and substituting the following—
Industry Hazardous means an industry which by reason of the processes involved
or the method of manufacture or the nature of the materials used or produced
requires isolation from other buildings, but does not include a nuclear activity.

3. Adding the following after clause 4.2.5—
4.2.6 Any use or development, which constitutes or includes a nuclear activity is not

permitted on land within the Scheme Area.

V. G. PETERSEN, Mayor.
R. W. JEFFERIES, Chief Executive Officer.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2569

PI405*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT

City of Swan
Town Planning Scheme No. 9—Amendment No. 423

Ref: 853/2/21/10 Pt 423

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the City of Swan Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 23 June 2004 for the purpose of rezoning
Lots 500, 501 and 502 Arbon Way, Lockridge, from “Residential R60” to “Residential R40”.

C. M. GREGORINI, Mayor.
E. W. LUMSDEN, Chief Executive Officer.

PI406*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT

City of Mandurah
Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 51

Ref: 853/6/13/12 Pt 51
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the City of Mandurah Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 22 June 2004 for the purpose of—

1. Recoding the Residential R20 and Residential R40 portions of Part Lot 1001 Murdoch Drive,
Greenfields to Residential R30.

2. Recoding the Residential R20 portion of Lot 4 Murdoch Drive to Residential R30.
3. Recoding the unzoned portions of Allnut Street located south-east and south-west of Murdoch

Drive (abutting the Belswan and Ladybrand properties) to Residential R30.
4. Revising the shape of the Local Recreation Reserve to generally accord with the adopted

Structure Plan, with an area of not less than 1.12 hectares.
5. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

K. HOLMES, President.
M. NEWMAN, Chief Executive Officer.

PI407*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT

Shire of Murray
Town Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 178

Ref: 853/6/16/7 Pt 178
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Murray Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 22 June 2004 for the purpose of—

1. For lots north of Culeenup Road as identified by Schedule 5-2 of Town Planning Scheme
No. 4, modifying Special Provision No. 3 to read as follows—
3. Buildings and the filling of land shall be setback from the side boundaries so as to allow

the free flow of water during a major flood event, to the satisfaction of the Department of
Environment.

2. For those lots south of Culeenup Road as identified by Schedule 5-3 of Town Planning Scheme
No. 4, modifying Special Provision No. 4 to read as follows—
4. Buildings and the filling of land shall be setback from the side boundaries so as to allow

the free flow of water during a major flood event, to the satisfaction of the Department of
Environment.

N. H. NANCARROW, President.
N. LEACH, Chief Executive Officer.



2570 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

PI408*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
Shire of Murray

Town Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 182
Ref: 853/6/16/7 Pt 182
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Murray Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 22 June 2004 for the purpose of—

1. Rezoning Lot 555 Uldina Place, Carcoola from ‘Commercial’ to ‘Residential’ with an R Coding
of R-25.

2. Amending the Scheme Maps in accordance with the Scheme Amendment Map.

N. H. NANCARROW, President.
N. LEACH, Chief Executive Officer.

PI409*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
Shire of Murray

Town Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 183
Ref: 853/6/16/7 Pt 183
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Murray Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 22 June 2004 for the purpose of—

1. Rezoning Lot 801 Murray Street, Pinjarra, from “Civic/Cultural Reserve” to “Town Centre”.
2. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.

N. H. NANCARROW, President.
N. LEACH, Chief Executive Officer.

PI410*
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928

ADVERTISEMENT OF APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT
Shire of Murray

Town Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 187
Ref: 853/6/16/7 Pt 187
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 7 of the Town Planning and
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Hon Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved
the Shire of Murray Town Planning Scheme Amendment on 22 June 2004 for the purpose of—

1. Rezoning Lot 17 Newton Street, Dwellingup, from “Residential (R10)” and “Community
Purpose Reserve” to “Town Centre” Zone.

2. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.
N. H. NANCARROW, President.

N. LEACH, Chief Executive Officer.

TRANSPORT
TR401*

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982
RESTRICTED SPEED AREAS—ALL VESSELS

Stirling Traffic Bridge
Swan River

Department for Planning and Infrastructure
Fremantle WA, 26 June 2004.

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 67 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982,
the department by this notice revokes Notice TR401 as published in the Government Gazette on 28
May 2004.

GREG MARTIN, Chief Executive Officer,
Department for Planning and Infrastructure.



29 June 2004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2571

WATER
WA401*

WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984

WATER SUPPLY IMPROVEMENTS

Shire of Laverton—Laverton

Notice of Authorisation to Construct New Water Supply Bores and
a Water Treatment Plant

In accordance with the provisions of the Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984, the Minister for the
Environment has authorised the Water Corporation to construct additional water supply bores at the
Wedge Pit site and a water treatment plant at the Beasley Creek bore site comprising a filtration
plant, a chlorination plant, water storage tanks, a water pumping station and associated ancillary
works. Backwash from the filtration plant will be discharged into drying ponds incorporated into the
water treatment plant site.
The location of the proposed works is approximately 11km north of Laverton.

The works will significantly improve quality of the drinking water by reducing arsenic and nitrate.

———————————

PROPOSED
WATER
TREATMENT
PLANT SITE

N

TO LEONORA
DN150 BORE MAIN

D
N

250 W
ATER M

AIN

BERIA

LAVERTON

PROPOSED
NEW BORES

WEDGE PIT
SITE

EXISTING
WEDGE PIT
BORES

EXISTING
TELEGRAPH
BORES

EXISTING BEASLEY
CREEK BORE SITE

D
N

20
0B

ORE M
A

IN



2572 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 29 June 2004

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2005
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2005. Subject to
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year.
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated
otherwise.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week,
unless disrupted by public holidays or
unforseen circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.

All Gazettes $    
  Within WA ..................................... 830.50
  Interstate  ..................................... 848.10
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,158.00

Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,104.40

Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)....................................... 756.80

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

$    
  Within WA  .................................... 361.90
  Interstate ...................................... 431.20
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 548.00

Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)....................................... 327.80

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly
during parliamentary sessions.

$    
  Within WA  .................................... 788.70
  Interstate ...................................... 963.60
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 907.00

Bound Volumes of Hansard
  Within WA  .................................... 777.70
  Interstate ...................................... 789.80

Hansards on CD ROM from 1999
  (per year)  ........................................  807.40

STATUTES
Bound Statutes
Bound volumes are posted during March of
the following year.

$    
  Within WA....................................... 282.70
  Interstate ....................................... 313.50
  Overseas ........................................ 290.00
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 775.50

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)........................................ 281.60

Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA....................................... 302.50
  Interstate ........................................ 313.50
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 407.00

Sessional Bills
Bills are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA ...................................... 415.80
  Interstate ....................................... 435.60
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 590.00

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is
searchable. Other CD ROM products with
legislation or other statutory information can
be packaged to individual requirements.
Prices are available on request.

!200400112GG!


