
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041

1

PERTH, TUESDAY, 4 JANUARY 2005  No. 1
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA

WESTERN
AUSTRALIAN
GOVERNMENT

ISSN 1448-949X

CONTENTS

PART 1
Page

Local Government Act 1995—Shire of Bruce Rock—Repeal of By-laws Local Law 2 of
2004................................................................................................................................. 5

Poisons Act 1964—Poisons Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2004 ................................. 3-4
Public Sector Management Act 1994—Public Sector Management (Entities which are

not Organsisations ) Regulations 2004.......................................................................... 5-6
Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981—Workers’ Compensation and

Rehabilitation (Scale of Fees) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2004 ......................... 6-14

———

PART 2

Health................................................................................................................................. 15
Local Government.............................................................................................................. 16
Minerals and Petroleum.................................................................................................... 16
Planning and Infrastructure ............................................................................................. 17
Water .................................................................................................................................. 17-18



IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE
© State of Western Australia
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000.

PUBLISHING DETAILS
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen
circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically.
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette.

• Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed
Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate.

• Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than
12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition).
Postal address: Delivery address:
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor,
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000
    Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536

• Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010.
• Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to

observe this request could result in the notice being held over.
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser.

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2004 (Prices include GST).
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.45
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$52.40
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$52.40 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging).
All other Notices
    Per Column Centimetre—$10.45
    Bulk Notices—$194.70 per page
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice.

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays.

• Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year.

• Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they
fall on a Tuesday or Friday.

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date.
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to
contacting State Law Publisher.

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.    



4 January 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3

— PART 1 —

HEALTH
HE301*

Poisons Act 1964

Poisons Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council.

1. Citation

These regulations may be cited as the Poisons Amendment
Regulations (No. 2) 2004.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Poisons
Regulations 1965*.

[* Reprint 7 as at 10 January 2003.
For amendments to 23 November 2004 see Western
Australian Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4,
p. 289, and Gazette 5 October 2004.]

3. Part 5 Division 2 heading amended

The heading to Part 5 Division 2 is amended by deleting
“Fourth Schedule” and inserting instead —

“    Schedule 4    ”.

4. Regulation 39C inserted

After regulation 39B the following regulation is inserted —

“
39C. Use of poisons included in Schedule 4 on ships

carrying livestock

(1) The master of a ship that is to carry livestock is
authorised to procure and be in possession of any



4 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4 January 2005

poison included in Schedule 4 that is necessary for
compliance —

(a) by the exporter with the Australian Livestock
Export Standards — March 2001 (as amended
from time to time); or

(b) by the master with order 18 of the Marine
Orders Part 43: Cargo and Cargo Handling —
 Livestock (as amended from time to time)
made under the Navigation Act 1912 of the
Commonwealth.

(2) The holder of an appropriate licence or any other
authorised person may supply a poison included in
Schedule 4 to the master of a ship on receipt of a
written order certifying that the master is authorised
under subregulation (1) to procure and be in possession
of the poison.

(3) The written order must be signed by the master of the
ship himself or herself and by the exporter of the
livestock.

(4) The master of a ship must store a poison supplied
under subregulation (2) in a secure place on board the
ship.

(5) In this regulation —
“livestock” means livestock in relation to which an

exporter has given a notice of intention to export
under order 6 of the Export Control (Animals)
Orders as amended, made under the Export
Control (Orders) Regulations 1982 in force under
the Export Control Act 1982 of the
Commonwealth;

“exporter” means a person who holds a live-stock
export licence under the Australian Meat and
Live-stock Industry Act 1997 of the
Commonwealth, or a person authorised in writing
by the licensee as the licensee’s agent;

“master of a ship” includes, except in
subregulation (3), a person authorised in writing
by the master as the master’s agent.

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



4 January 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5

LOCAL GOVERNMENT
LG301

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
Shire of Bruce Rock

REPEAL OF BY-LAWS LOCAL LAW 2 OF 2004
Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and by all other
powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Bruce Rock resolved on the 9th day of
September 2004 to make the following local law as set out below.

Repeal
The following by-laws and local laws are repealed—

Bruce Rock Public Cemetery, published in the Government Gazette of 10 May
1918 and its following amendments published in the Government Gazette on 5
March 1948, 25 June 1948, 24 August 1951, 15 October 1976 and 3 May 1985;
Establishment, maintenance and equipment of Bush Fire Brigades for the Road
District or any part of the Road District of Bruce Rock, published in the
Government Gazette of 25 August 1950;
Parking, published in the Government Gazette on 23 November 1956; and Bush
Fires Brigades By-laws—Amendment, published in the Government Gazette of
10 August 1973.

Dated this 23rd day of December 2004.
The Common Seal of the Shire of Bruce Rock was affixed in the presence of—

S. STRANGE, President,
S. O’HALLORAN, Chief Executive Officer.

PUBLIC SECTOR MANAGEMENT
PS301*

Public Sector Management Act 1994

Public Sector Management (Entities which are
not Organisations) Regulations 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 108(1)(a).

1. Citation

These regulations are the Public Sector Management (Entities
which are not Organisations) Regulations 2004.

2. Public Sector Management Act 1994 amended

The amendment in these regulations is to the Public Sector
Management Act 1994*.

[* Reprint 6 as at 14 May 2004.]



6 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4 January 2005

3. Schedule 1 amended

Schedule 1 is amended by inserting after item 11 the following
item —

“
12. The Independent Market Operator established

under the Electricity Industry (Independent Market
Operator) Regulations 2004

    ”.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

WORKCOVER
WC301*

Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation Act 1981

Workers’ Compensation and Rehabilitation
(Scales of Fees) Amendment Regulations

(No. 3) 2004

Made by the Governor in Executive Council, on the recommendation of
the Commission, under section 176(1a).

1. Citation

These regulations are the Workers’ Compensation and
Rehabilitation (Scales of Fees) Amendment Regulations (No. 3)
2004.

2. The regulations amended

The amendments in these regulations are to the Workers’
Compensation and Rehabilitation Regulations 1982*.

[* Reprinted as at 24 May 2002.
For amendments to 13 December 2004 see Western
Australian Legislation Information Tables for 2003,
Table 4, p. 451, and Gazette 9 January, 19 March and
29 October 2004.]



4 January 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 7

3. Regulation 3 amended

(1) Regulation 3 is amended by inserting before “Under” the
subregulation designation “(1)”.

(2) At the end of regulation 3 the following subregulation is
inserted —

“
(2) In Schedule 2 Part 2 —

“metropolitan area” means the area within a radius of
50 kilometres from the General Post Office at
Perth.

    ”.

4. Regulation 6 amended

Regulation 6 is amended by deleting “$154.35” and inserting
instead —

“    $159.20    ”.

5. Regulation 7A amended

Regulation 7A is amended by deleting “$48.85” and inserting
instead —

“    $50.40    ”.

6. Regulation 8 amended

Regulation 8 is amended by deleting “$115.25” and inserting
instead —

“    $118.85    ”.

7. Schedule 1 amended

(1) Schedule 1 Part 1 is amended in the item headed “GENERAL
PRACTITIONER” by deleting each of the amounts shown in
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, which amounts are
shown in the order in which they occur in that Part, and
inserting instead the amount shown opposite it in column 2.

Table

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

48.00 49.50
87.70 90.45

134.75 138.95
28.60 29.50
37.40 38.55
72.00 74.25

108.90 112.30
147.70 152.30



8 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4 January 2005

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

36.00 37.15
72.00 74.25

131.10 135.20
203.10 209.45

57.00 58.80
61.85 63.80
96.00 99.00

131.10 135.20
60.00 61.90
82.15 84.70

121.85 125.65
169.85 175.15

72.00 74.25
107.10 110.45
164.30 169.45
240.00 247.50

16.05 16.55
20.05 20.70
41.95 43.25
62.90 64.85

180.55 186.20
3.20 3.30

(2) Schedule 1 Part 1 is amended in the item headed
“PHYSICIANS, OCCUPATIONAL & REHABILITATION
PHYSICIANS” by deleting each of the amounts shown in
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, which amounts are
shown in the order in which they occur in that Part, and
inserting instead the amount shown opposite it in column 2.

Table
Column 1

Delete
Column 2

Insert instead
182.25 187.95

91.20 94.05
218.25 225.10
125.95 129.90
182.25 187.95

91.20 94.05
218.25 225.10
125.95 129.90
182.25 191.05

91.20 94.05
218.25 225.10
125.95 129.90



4 January 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 9

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

23.85 24.60
29.50 30.40
61.65 63.60
93.15 96.05

267.65 276.05
3.20 3.30

(3) Schedule 1 Part 1 is amended in the item headed
“CONSULTANT PSYCHIATRISTS” by deleting each of the
amounts shown in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation,
which amounts are shown in the order in which they occur in
that Part, and inserting instead the amount shown opposite it in
column 2.

Table

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

53.50 55.15
106.65 110.00
159.75 164.75
213.75 220.45
241.90 249.45
269.95 278.40

87.80 90.55
141.75 146.20
193.50 199.55
247.50 255.25
298.15 307.50

70.90 73.10
154.85 159.70
267.65 276.05

3.20 3.30

(4) Schedule 1 Part 1 is amended in the item headed
“SPECIALISTS” by deleting each of the amounts shown in
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, which amounts are
shown in the order in which they occur in that Part, and
inserting instead the amount shown opposite it in column 2.

Table

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

103.60 106.85
54.05 55.75

139.70 144.05
89.00 91.80



10 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4 January 2005

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

103.60 106.85
54.05 55.75

139.50 143.85
88.85 91.65
23.85 24.60
29.50 30.40
61.65 63.60
93.15 96.05

267.65 276.05
3.20 3.30

(5) Schedule 1 Part 1 is amended in the item headed
“ANAESTHETISTS” by deleting “$33.10” and inserting
instead —

“    $34.15    ”.

(6) Schedule 1 Part 2 is amended by deleting each of the amounts
shown in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, which
amounts are shown in the order in which they occur in that Part,
and inserting instead the amount shown opposite it in column 2.

Table

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

40.00 41.25
113.90 117.45

69.00 71.15
241.00 248.55
113.90 117.45

53.15 54.80
214.70 221.40
284.75 293.65

92.00 94.90
122.70 126.55

76.70 79.10
90.95 93.80

184.05 189.80
102.35 105.55
366.95 378.45
181.80 187.50
122.70 126.55
164.30 169.45
138.00 142.30
184.05 189.80
214.70 221.40



4 January 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 11

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

284.75 293.65
76.70 79.10

101.85 105.05
33.40 34.45

148.95 153.60
416.20 429.25
107.35 110.70
107.35 110.70
109.50 112.95
138.00 142.30
159.95 164.95
184.05 189.80
230.00 237.20
208.10 214.60
235.45 242.80
273.80 282.35
344.95 355.75
273.80 282.35
323.05 333.15
366.95 378.45
460.00 474.40
273.80 282.35
323.05 333.15
366.95 378.45
460.00 474.40
613.30 632.50
273.80 282.35
383.30 395.30
153.35 158.15
306.65 316.25
613.30 632.50
460.00 474.40
613.30 632.50

70.15 72.35
553.10 570.40
733.75 756.70
919.95 948.75

1 232.05 1 270.60
109.50 112.95
166.45 171.65
166.45 171.65
284.75 293.65

83.25 85.85
124.85 128.75



12 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4 January 2005

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

124.85 128.75
273.80 282.35
416.20 429.25
481.85 496.95
815.85 841.40

1 620.80 1 671.55
219.00 225.85
328.55 338.85
443.55 457.45
553.10 570.40
662.60 683.35
258.50 266.60
481.85 496.95
416.20 429.25
711.85 734.15

1 002.00 1 033.35
$138.00 $142.30

$83.25 $85.85

8. Schedule 2 amended

(1) Schedule 2 Part 1 is amended by deleting each of the amounts
shown in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, which
amounts are shown in the order in which they occur in that Part,
and inserting instead the amount shown opposite it in column 2.

Table

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

53.50 55.15
42.95 44.30
54.30 56.00
72.30 74.55
13.25 13.65

121.55 125.35
53.50 55.15

0.62 0.64



4 January 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 13

(2) Schedule 2 Part 2 is amended as follows:
(a) by deleting item 14 and inserting instead —

“
14. Travel, within metropolitan

area
31.35 per journey

to a venue (If a
physiotherapist
consults with
more than one
worker before

leaving a venue,
the fee for the
journey to the
venue is to be
apportioned

equally between
the workers.)

    ”.
(b) by deleting the amounts and words shown in column 1

of the Table to this subregulation, which amounts and
words are shown in the order in which they occur in that
Part, and inserting instead the amount, and words if any,
shown opposite in column 2.

Table

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

$117.50
maximum amount

chargeable per
session (for a
session of one
hour or more)

$125.75 per
hour, total fee
not to exceed

 $251.50

51.70 55.35
41.50 44.45
41.50 44.45

(c) after item 14 by deleting the italicised text beginning
with “[Notes:” and ending with “program.]”.

9. Schedule 3 amended

Schedule 3 is amended by deleting each of the amounts shown
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, which amounts
are shown in the order in which they occur and inserting instead
the amount shown opposite it in column 2.

Table

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

42.30 43.60
35.30 36.40
84.00 86.65



14 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4 January 2005

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

126.10 130.05
0.60 0.62

10. Schedule 4 amended

Schedule 4 is amended by deleting each of the amounts shown
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, which amounts
are shown in the order in which they occur and inserting instead
the amount shown opposite it in column 2.

Table

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

18.30 18.85
36.60 37.75
60.30 62.20
90.45 93.30

120.60 124.35
39.60 40.85

11. Schedule 5 amended

Schedule 5 is amended by deleting each of the amounts shown
in column 1 of the Table to this subregulation, which amounts
are shown in the order in which they occur and inserting instead
the amount shown opposite it in column 2.

Table

Column 1
Delete

Column 2
Insert instead

111.40 114.90
144.40 148.90

48.70 50.20
63.10 65.10
85.25 87.90

Recommended by the Workers’ Compensation and
Rehabilitation Commission on the ……….. day of
…………………… 2004.

The common seal of the )
Workers’ Compensation and ) LS
Rehabilitation Commission )

B. BRADLEY.

By Command of the Governor,

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.



4 January 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 15

— PART 2 —

HEALTH
HE401*

ALCOHOL AND DRUG AUTHORITY ACT 1974
WA ALCOHOL AND DRUG AUTHORITY BOARD

(Appointment Of Members)
Instrument 2003

Made by the Governor under section 5 of the Act.

1. Citation
This notice may be cited as the WA Alcohol and Drug Authority Board (Appointment of Members and
Chairman) Instrument 2004.

2. Appointment of Members
(i) The following persons listed are appointed as members of the WA Alcohol and Drug Authority

Board pursuant to section 5(1) of the Act for the period 1 January 2005 and ending
31 December 2007.

Member
Professor Michael Matthew DAUBE
Dr Margaret Frances STEVENS
Associate Professor Steven John ALLSOP
Ms Violet BACON

By Command of the Governor

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council.

———————————

HE402
MEDICAL ACT 1894

MEDICAL (UNMET AREA OF NEED) DETERMINATION (NO. 36) 2004
Made by the Minister for Health pursuant to section 11AF of the Medical Act 1894.

Citation
1. This determination may be cited as the Medical (Unmet Area of Need) Determination (No. 36) 2004.

Commencement
2. This determination comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government
Gazette.

Unmet area of need
3. The area of need specified in the Schedule is determined to be an unmet area of need for the
purposes of section 11AF (1)D of the Act.

Expiry of determination
4. This determination expires 4 years after its commencement.

Schedule
In the Swan Kalamunda Health Service—

• Consultant Psychiatrists
• Psychiatric Registrars

Dated this 29th day of December 2004.

JIM McGINTY, MLA, Minister for Health.



16 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4 January 2005

LOCAL GOVERNMENT
LG401*

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995
City of Melville

AUTHORISED PERSON

It is hereby notified for public information that Nicholas George Curtis, Darryn Terence Thomason,
Leah Maree Goode, Wayne Douglas Robertson and Trystan Philip Edward Gausden have been
appointed an Authorised Persons at Garden City Shopping Centre (as defined in the City of Melville
Parking Facilities Local Laws) and as an Authorised Person for the purposes of Section 9.10, 9.13 and
9.15 of the Local Government Act 1995.

CRAIG McCLURE, A/Chief Executive Officer.

———————————

LG402
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995

City of Melville
AUTHORISED PERSON

It is hereby notified for public information that Doreen Rose La-Rosa has been appointed an
Authorised Person for the purposes of Section 9.10, 9.13 and 9.15 of the Local Government Act 1995.

CRAIG McCLURE, A/Chief Executive Officer.

———————————

LG403*
HEALTH ACT 1911

City of Nedlands
FIXING OF HEALTH ACT FEES & CHARGES

The City of Nedlands resolved on 27 April 2004 to fix the following fees and charges in accordance
with Section 344C of the Health Act 1911 (as amended).

Type of Fee Proposed Fee
Registration of Eating Houses $276
License to conduct an Eating Houses $55
Transfer of Licence to Conduct an Eating House $55

The Fees and Charges will take effect 14 days after gazettal.

DAVID E. PRICE, Chief Executive Officer.

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM
MP401*

Commonwealth of Australia
PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967

GRANT OF EXPLORATION PERMITS

EXPLORATION PERMIT No. WA-354-P has been granted to Apache Northwest Pty Ltd and BHP
Billiton Petroleum Pty Ltd to have effect for a period of six (6) years from   December 2004.

EXPLORATION PERMIT No. WA-355-P has been granted to Apache Northwest Pty Ltd to have
effect for a period of six (6) years from   December 2004.

EXPLORATION PERMIT No. WA-356-P has been granted to Apache Northwest Pty Ltd and Kufpec
Australia Pty Ltd to have effect for a period of six (6) years from   December 2004.

EXPLORATION PERMIT No. WA-357-P has been granted to Apache Northwest Pty Ltd to have
effect for a period of six (6) years from   December 2004.

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director,Petroleum and Royalties Division.



4 January 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 17

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE
PI401*

METROPOLITAN REGION TOWN PLANNING SCHEME ACT 1959
METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME

Notice of Revocation
Clause 32 (Resolution No 17)
Cultural Centre, Northbridge

File: 810-2-10-10
The Western Australian Planning Commission, acting pursuant to clause 32 of the Metropolitan
Region Scheme, resolved on 21 December 2004 to revoke the resolution of 23 January 1974 affecting
development of land in an area of Northbridge and Perth as defined and published on page 341 of the
Government Gazette on 8 February 1974. The revocation is effective on and from this date of gazettal.

IAN PATTERSON, Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission.

WATER
WA401*

WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984
WATER SUPPLY IMPROVEMENTS—MINGENEW FARMLANDS WATER SUPPLY

Notice of Proposal to Construct a New Tank and Two New Pump Stations.
To improve the reliability of water supply and reduce excessive water pressure to the farmlands area
in Mingenew, the Water Corporation proposes to construct a new tank and pump station on Coalseam
Road, and a new booster pump station on Melara Road.
The proposed works are scheduled to commence in March 2005 and will continue for approximately 3
months.
Further information may be obtained by contacting the Project Manager, Jeff Pace, on (08) 9420 2826.
A copy of this Notice of Proposal (referred to as HI65-0-1) is available for viewing during office hours
at the Water Corporation’s Regional Office, 45 Cathedral Avenue, Geraldton.
Objections to the proposed works will be considered if lodged in writing, addressed to the Project
Manager, Jeff Pace, Water Corporation, 629 Newcastle Street Leederville, 6007, before the close of
business on 31 January 2005.



18 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4 January 2005

WA402*
WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984

WATER TREATMENT ENHANCEMENT: CITY OF PERTH—MOUNT ELIZA RESERVOIRS

Notice of Proposal to Construct a Load-in Facility and Standard Disinfection Module.
To enhance the disinfection of drinking water distributed from the Mount Eliza Reservoirs, the Water
Corporation proposes to construct a disinfectant load-in area located on the western side of the
reservoirs (just outside the reservoir boundary fence). The load-in area will consist of a load-in pad,
approximately 16m in length and 4.5m in width, and two small transfer pumps and ancillary
equipment that will be housed in a lockable charcoal grey structure of approximately 12m2 in area.
The Water Corporation also proposes to construct a bitumen road and turning circle that will replace
the limestone track which currently provides access to the area.
Works will also include a disinfectant (sodium hypochlorite) storage and dosing facility housed in a
prefabricated building adjacent to the conference centre but completely contained within the reservoir
complex. The module will be charcoal grey with dimensions of approximately 7.5m long, 3.0m wide
and 3.5m high.
The location of the proposed works is within the reservoir complex, with the access road and load-in
area located within Kings Park to the west of the reservoirs.
The proposed works are scheduled to commence in February 2005 and will continue for approximately
6 months.
Construction of the proposed works within Kings Park will involve road works and the construction of
a lockable structure for protection of equipment from vandalism.
A copy of this Notice of Proposal (referred to as HL48-0-1) is available for viewing during office hours
at the Water Corporation’s Customer Enquiries Counter, John Tonkin Water Centre, 629 Newcastle
Street, Leederville 6007.
Further information may be obtained by contacting the Project Manager, Paul Kilpa, on (08) 9420
3332.
Objections to the proposed works will be considered if lodged in writing, addressed to the Project
Manager, Paul Kilpa, Water Corporation, 629 Newcastle Street, Leederville 6007, before the close of
business on 24 January, 2005.

———————————



4 January 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 19

Order your Bound Volumes of
Government Gazette 2005

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette

For Government Departments and
private firms who presently arrange
binding for their copies of Government
Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is
now offering a subscription covering 4
Quarterly Volumes at a cost of
$1,098.90.

The Gazettes will be bound in black
cloth with gold foil lettering on the
spine and personalised by  the addition
of the client's name in gold lettering on
the front cover.

PLEASE NOTE
On the rare occasion where extra
gazettes are published in one quarter, a
fifth volume may be required. In this
instance the extra cost involved will be
borne by the State Law Publisher and
not passed on to clients.

For further information please contact:

State Law Publisher

Telephone: 9321 7688



20 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4 January 2005

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS)

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the
missing item.
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full.

STATE LAW PUBLISHER

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2005
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2005. Subject to
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year.
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated
otherwise.

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
General Government Gazettes are published
on Tuesday and Friday of each week,
unless disrupted by public holidays or
unforseen circumstances.
Special Government Gazettes are published
periodically.

All Gazettes $    
  Within WA ..................................... 826.10
  Interstate  ..................................... 842.60
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,151.00

Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,098.90

Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)....................................... 753.50

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE
Industrial Gazette is published monthly.

$    
  Within WA  .................................... 359.70
  Interstate ...................................... 429.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 545.00

Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)....................................... 325.60

HANSARD
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly
during parliamentary sessions.

$    
  Within WA  .................................... 784.30
  Interstate ...................................... 958.10
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 903.00

Bound Volumes of Hansard
  Within WA  .................................... 773.30
  Interstate ...................................... 785.40

Hansards on CD ROM from 1999
  (per year)  ........................................  803.00

STATUTES
Bound Statutes
Bound volumes are posted during March of
the following year.

$    
  Within WA....................................... 280.50
  Interstate ....................................... 311.30
  Overseas ........................................ 288.00
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 771.10

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998
  (per year)........................................ 279.40

Loose Statutes
Statutes are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA....................................... 301.40
  Interstate ........................................ 311.30
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 405.00

Sessional Bills
Bills are posted weekly as they become
available.

$    
  Within WA ...................................... 413.60
  Interstate ....................................... 433.40
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 587.00

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is
searchable. Other CD ROM products with
legislation or other statutory information can
be packaged to individual requirements.
Prices are available on request.

!200500001GG!


