
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 
 

  1391 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 26 APRIL 2005 No. 68 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Local Government Act 1995—Shire of Wyndham East Kimberley—Activities in 
Thoroughfares and Public Places and Trading Amendment Local Law 2005...................... 1393 

Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003— 
RWWA Rules of Harness Racing 2004............................................................................... 1394 
RWWA Rules of Thoroughbred Racing 2004 ..................................................................... 1393 

Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984— 
Country Areas Water Supply Amendment By-laws 2005................................................. 1397 
Country Towns Sewerage Amendment By-Laws 2005 ..................................................... 1394 
Metropolitan Water Supply, Sewerage and Drainage Amendment By-laws 2005.......... 1396 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Consumer and Employment Protection........................................................................................1399 
Justice ............................................................................................................................................1399 
Local Government..........................................................................................................................1399 
Planning and Infrastructure .........................................................................................................1400 
 
 



 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be 
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western 
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law 
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western 
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen 
circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Postal address: Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher 
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor, 
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000 
     Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original 
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2004 (Prices include GST). 
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.45 
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$52.40 
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$52.40 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these 
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging). 
All other Notices 
  Per Column Centimetre—$10.45 
  Bulk Notices—$194.70 per page 
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 

 

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS 
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered 
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays. 

 • Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year. 

 • Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they 
fall on a Tuesday or Friday. 

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally 
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date. 
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to 
contacting State Law Publisher. 

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.  



26 April 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1393 

— PART 1 — 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG301* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
Shire of Wyndham East Kimberley 

ACTIVITIES IN THOROUGHFARES AND PUBLIC PLACES AND 
TRADING AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2005 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and under all other 
powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Wyndham East Kimberley, resolved 
on the 19th day of April 2005 to make the following local law. 

Citation 
This local law may be cited as the “Activities in Thoroughfares and Public Places and 
Trading Amendment Local Law 2005.” 

Principal Local Law 
In this local law, the Shire of Wyndham East Kimberley Activities in Thoroughfares 
and Public Places and Trading Local Law 2003 as adopted by the Council of the 
Shire of Wyndham East Kimberley by notice published in the Government Gazette on 
the 3rd of December 2003 is referred to as the principal local law. 

Principal Local Law Amended 
The principal local law is amended by— 
 1. Adding section 2.3[1] No gambling in a public place or on local government 

property stating: A person shall not undertake any gambling related activity 
in a public place or on local government property unless— 

 1. the person is doing so in accordance with a permit from the Shire. 
 2. Adding the following in Schedule 1 Prescribed Offences— 

Clause Description Penalty 

2.3[1] Gambling in public place or on local government 
property 

$100 

Adopted at an ordinary meeting of Council of the Shire of Wyndham East Kimberley 
held on the 19th day of April 2005. 
Dated the 20th day of April 2005. 
The Common Seal of the Shire of Wyndham East Kimberley was hereunto affixed by 
authority of Council. 

C. J. ADAMS, Chief Executive Officer. 
W. M. SCOTT, Authorised Officer. 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 
RG301 

RACING AND WAGERING WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 2003 
RWWA RULES OF THOROUGHBRED RACING 2004 

In accordance with Section 45 (1) (a) of the Racing and Wagering Western Australia 
Act 2003, notice is hereby given that the Board of Racing and Wagering WA on 
13 April 2005 resolved that, the RWWA Rules of Thoroughbred Racing 2004 be 
amended as follows— 

Amendment to Local Rules— 
Insert Local Rule LR175. which reads “If in exercising the power under 
AR.8B:, the stewards identify and/or take possession of any substance(s) or 



1394 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 April 2005 

preparation(s) that have not been registered, prescribed, labeled, dispensed 
or otherwise obtained in accordance with relevant State and Commonwealth 
legislation, any trainer or other relevant person in charge at the time may be 
punished.” 

A copy of the above rules may be obtained during office hours from the Western 
Australian Turf Club, 70 Grandstand Road, Ascot, WA or Racing and Wagering 
Western Australia website, www.rwwa.com.au. 

R. B. BENNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

RG302 
RACING AND WAGERING WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 2003 

RWWA RULES OF HARNESS RACING 2004 
In accordance with Section 45 (1) (b) of the Racing and Wagering Western Australia 
Act 2003, notice is hereby given that the Board of Racing and Wagering WA on 
13 April 2005 resolved that, the RWWA Rules of Harness Racing 2004 be amended 
as follows— 

RWWA RULES OF HARNESS RACING 2004 
Amendments to Dictionary— 

Add Definition of “Suffering” 
Amendment to National Rules— 

Amend 154(1), 211 
Insert 183A, 289(9) 

A copy of the above rules may be obtained during office hours from the Western 
Australian Trotting Association or Racing and Wagering Western Australia Website, 
www.rwwa.com.au. 

R. B. BENNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 

WATER 
WA301* 

Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 

Country Towns Sewerage Amendment 
By-Laws 2005 

Made by the Minister under section 34(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These by-laws are the Country Towns Sewerage Amendment By-
Laws 2005. 



26 April 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1395 

2. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in these by-laws are to the Country Towns 
Sewerage By-laws 1952*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 2 January 2001. 
  For amendments to 22 March 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 70, and 
Gazette 28 and 29 June 2004.] 

3. By-law 18 amended 

  By-law 18(a) is amended by deleting “$40.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $200.    ”. 

4. By-law 49 amended 

  By-law 49(1)(a)(i) and (ii) are amended by deleting “the 
Standards Association of Australia” and inserting instead —  

  “    Standards Australia    ”. 

5. By-law 231 amended 

  By-law 231(3) is repealed. 

6. By-law 232 amended 

  By-law 232 is amended as follows: 
 (a) before “Any” by inserting the sub-bylaw designation 

“(1)”;  
 (b) by deleting “$40 and in addition may be ordered to pay 

any expense incurred by the Corporation in consequence 
of such breach.” and inserting instead —  

  “    $200.    ”; 
 (c) before “In” by inserting the sub-bylaw designation 

“(2)”;  
 (d) by deleting “$10” and inserting instead —  
  “    $50   ”; 
 (e) at the end of the by-law by inserting the following 

sub-bylaw —  

“     
 (3) In addition to any penalty provided by these by-laws, 

any expense, loss or damage incurred by the 
Corporation or the Commission in consequence of the 
breach of any by-law shall be payable by the person 
committing the breach and may be recovered as a debt 
due in a court of competent jurisdiction. 

    ”. 

JUDY EDWARDS, Minister for the Environment. 



1396 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 April 2005 

WA302* 

Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 

Metropolitan Water Supply, Sewerage and 
Drainage Amendment By-laws 2005 

Made by the Minister under section 34(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These by-laws are the Metropolitan Water Supply, Sewerage 
and Drainage Amendment By-laws 2005. 

2. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in these by-laws are to the Metropolitan Water 
Supply, Sewerage and Drainage By-laws 1981*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 17 August 2001.  
  For amendments to 22 March 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 244 and 
Gazette 28 and 29 June 2004.] 

3. By-law 6.2 amended 

 (1) By-law 6.2.1 is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting the full stop after paragraph (j) and inserting 

instead a semicolon; 
 (b) by inserting after paragraph (j) the following 

paragraph —  

“     
 (k) The sale of the water by a person who holds an 

operating licence under Part 3 of the Water 
Services Licensing Act 1995. 

    ”. 

 (2) By-law 6.2.5 is repealed.  

4. By-law 28.6 amended 

  By-law 28.6.2(a)(i) is amended as follows: 
 (a) in item (A) by deleting “the Standards Association of 

Australia” and inserting instead —  
  “    Standards Australia    ”;  



26 April 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1397 

 (b) in item (B) by deleting “the Standards Association of 
Australia” and “that Association” and inserting instead 
in each place —  

  “    Standards Australia    ”. 

5. By-law 31.4 amended 

  By-law 31.4.2 is amended by deleting “$20.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $50.00    ”. 

JUDY EDWARDS, Minister for the Environment. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

WA303* 

Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 

Country Areas Water Supply Amendment 
By-laws 2005 

Made by the Minister under section 34(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These by-laws are the Country Areas Water Supply Amendment 
By-laws 2005. 

2. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in these by-laws are to the Country Areas 
Water Supply By-laws 1957*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 3 August 2001. 
  For amendments to 22 March 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2003, Table 4, p. 406, and 
Gazette 28 and 29 June 2004.] 

3. By-law 52 amended 

  By-law 52(1) is amended by deleting “$40.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $200.    ”. 



1398 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 April 2005 

4. By-law 58A amended 

 (1) By-law 58A(1)(a) is amended by deleting “the Standards 
Association of Australia” in both places where it occurs and 
“that Association” and inserting instead —  

  “    Standards Australia    ”; 

 (2) By-law 58A(3) is amended by deleting “works of the 
Coordinator” and inserting instead —  

  “    works of the Corporation    ”. 

5. By-law 59 amended 

  By-law 59(2) is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting “$20” and inserting instead —  
  “    $200    ”; 
 (b) by deleting “$4” and inserting instead —  
  “    $20    ”. 

6. By-law 67 amended 

  By-law 67(3) is repealed. 

7. By-law 71 repealed 

  By-law 71 is repealed. 

8. By-law 105 amended 

  By-law 105(1) is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting “$40” and inserting instead —  
  “    $200    ”; 
 (b) by deleting “$10” and inserting instead —  
  “    $50    ”. 

JUDY EDWARDS, Minister for the Environment. 

 

 
——————————— 

 



26 April 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1399 

— PART 2 — 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 
CE401 

ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 
CANCELLED ASSOCIATIONS 

Section 35 
Moora Tourism Association Inc 

Moora Tidy Town Association Incorporated 
Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named associations has been cancelled as 
from the date of this notice. 
Dated the 20th day of April 2005. 

BRAD JOLLY, A/Manager, Registration Services 
for Commissioner for Fair Trading. 

JUSTICE 
JU401 

COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999 
PERMIT DETAILS 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 51 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Director General of the Department of Justice has issued the following person to do High-Level 
Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Issued 

Permit 
Commence 

Date 

Permit Expiry 
Date 

Robertson Karen Francis CS5-172 11/4/05 7/4/05 30/7/05 

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999. 

BRIAN YEARWOOD, Director, Contracted Services. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG402* 

DOG ACT 1976 
Shire of Three Springs 

APPOINTMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed under the 
provision of the Dog Act 1976 for the Municipality of the Shire of Three Springs— 

Registered Officers Authorised Officers 
Ms. Jane Calliss Mr. Wayne Jolly  
Ms. Kylie McGree Mr. Charles Strahan 
Miss. Kelly Fletcher  Mr. Darryl Dalgetty 
Miss. Jenna Antonio Mr. Graham Little 
Mr. Wayne Jolly 
Mr. Graham Little 

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled, dated 12 April 2005. 

JANE CALLISS, Acting Chief Executive Officer. 



1400 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 April 2005 

LG401 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

City of Melville 
AUTHORISED PERSON 

It is hereby notified for public information that David Wayne Roberts has been appointed an 
Authorised Person (as defined in the City of Melville Parking Facilities Local Laws) and as an 
Authorised Person for the purposes of Section 9.10, 9.13 and 9.15 of the Local Government Act 1995. 

JOHN McNALLY, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

LG403* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Wyndham-East Kimberley 
APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED OFFICERS AND INSPECTORS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following have been appointed as Registration 
Officers in accordance Officers under the provisions of the Local Government Act 1995; John Gault, 
Matthew Scott, Hayley McKeen, Amanda Trengove, Jeanne Harris, Gillian Old, Vaughan Davies, 
Yale Bolto, Steven Chadwick, Rachel Lines, Brent Christianson, Keith Williams, Roger Feely, Phillip 
Harris, Darryl Williams, Francis Cox and Ken MacDonald  
The following have been appointed under the provisions of the Health Act 1911; Roger Feely, Steven 
Chadwick and Chris Adams  

The following have been appointed as Authorised Officers in accordance with the Dog Act 1976; Ken 
MacDonald, Maria Lines, Jeanne Harris, Grahame Gould, Gillian Old, Rachel Lines, Amanda 
Trengove, Nicole O’Conner, Beverley Ozanne, Amanda Quartermaine, Yale Bolto and Margaret King  

The following have been appointed as Authorised Officers under the provisions of the Dog Act 1976; 
Steven Chadwick, Rachel Lines, Ken MacDonald and Roger Feely . 
The following have been appointed as Authorised Officers under the provisions of the Control of 
Vehicles Act (ORV); Matthew Scott, Steven Chadwick, Phillip Harris, Kevin Lipscombe, Rachel Lines, 
Leslie King, Brian Bateman and Ken MacDonald. 
The following has been appointed as an Authorised Person and Inspector under the provisions of the 
Environmental Protection Act, Sections 87 and 88; Roger Feely 

The following have been appointed as Authorised Officers under the provisions of the Caravan Parks 
and Camping Grounds Act 1995; Steven Chadwick, Phillip Harris, and Ken MacDonald  
The following has been appointed under the provisions of the Local Government (Miscellaneous 
Provisions) Act 1960; Sharon McLachlan 
The following has been appointed under the provisions of the Bush Fires Act 1954; Steven Chadwick  

The following has been appointed under the provisions of the Town Planning Development Act 1928; 
Keith Williams  
The following previously gazetted appointments for the Shire of Wyndham East Kimberley are 
cancelled; Leanne Wattchow, Sarah Parker, Bree Burrows, Fiona Dent, Lee-Anne Jones, Dacre 
Alcock, Jennine Brown, David Burt, Tizi Bonora,Brian Wall, David Goodwin, Craig Dunster, Peter 
Royce, Jon Jones, Wendy Cooke, Marius Olsen, Richard Duke 

20 April 2005. 

CHRIS ADAMS, Chief Executive Officer. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 
PI401* 

METROPOLITAN REGION TOWN PLANNING SCHEME ACT 1959 
METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT NO. 1035/33 

James Point, Kwinana—Port Facility 
Call for Public Submissions 

The Western Australian Planning Commission intends to amend the Metropolitan Region Scheme 
(MRS) for land in the local government of Kwinana and is seeking public comment. 
The amendment seeks to transfer two areas of Waterways reservation in Cockburn Sound, Kwinana 
to the Industrial zone to allow for the development of new port facilities. 



26 April 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1401 

The plans showing the proposed change and the Commission's Amendment Report which explains the 
proposal, will be available for public inspection from Tuesday 29 March 2005 to Friday 1 July 2005 at 
each of the following places— 

� Department for Planning and Infrastructure 
 Wellington Street, PERTH 
� State Reference Library, Northbridge 

� City of Perth 
� City of Cockburn 
� City of Fremantle 
� City of Rockingham 
� Town of Kwinana 

Documents are also available from the Commission's internet site www.wapc.wa.gov.au. 

Submissions 
Any person who desires to make a submission to support, object or provide comment on any part of 
the proposed Amendment should do so on a Form 6A. This submission form is available from the 
display locations, the Amendment Report and the Internet. 
Submissions must be lodged with the: Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission, 
469 Wellington Street, PERTH WA  6000, on or before 5.00pm Friday, 1 JULY 2005.  
Late submissions will not be considered. 

IAN PATTERSON, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

CONTAMINATED SITES ACT 2003 
*Price: $18.50 counter sales 
Plus postage on 240 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

MOTOR VEHICLE REPAIRERS ACT 2003 
*Price: $14.20 counter sales 
Plus postage on 205 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

LEGAL PRACTICE ACT 2003 
*Price: $33.20 counter sales 
Plus postage on 630 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



1402 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 April 2005 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES 
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS) 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State 
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the 
missing item. 
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full. 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2005 
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2005. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically. 

All Gazettes $
  Within WA ....................................  826.10
  Interstate  .....................................  842.60
  Overseas (airmail) ......................  1,151.00

Bound Volumes of full year .......  1,098.90

Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year) ......................................  753.50
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $
  Within WA  ...................................  359.70
  Interstate ......................................  429.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ........................  545.00

Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year) ......................................  325.60
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $
  Within WA  ...................................  784.30
  Interstate ......................................  958.10
  Overseas (airmail)  ........................  903.00

Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  ...................................  773.30
  Interstate ......................................  785.40

Hansards on CD ROM from 1999  
 (per year) ........................................ 803.00

STATUTES 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $ 
  Within WA......................................  280.50 
  Interstate .......................................  311.30 
  Overseas .......................................  288.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ...............  771.10 

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year).......................................  279.40 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA......................................  301.40 
  Interstate........................................  311.30 
  Overseas (airmail) ...........................  405.00 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA .....................................  413.60 
  Interstate .......................................  433.40 
  Overseas (airmail) ..........................  587.00 

 

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is 
searchable. Other CD ROM products with 
legislation or other statutory information can 
be packaged to individual requirements.  
Prices are available on request.

 

!200500068GG! 


