
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 
 

  2021 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 6 MAY 2005 No. 89 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Dog Act 1976—Town of Vincent—Local Law Relating to Dogs................................................ 2025 
Economic Regulation Authority Act 2003—Economic Regulation Authority (Cost of 

Supplying Bulk Potable Water to Kalgoorlie-Boulder Reference) Notice (No. 2) 2005........ 2026 
Evidence Act 1906—Evidence (Prescribed Persons) Regulations 2005 ................................... 2024 
Legal Practice Act 2003—Legal Practice Board Amendment Rules (No. 3) 2005 ................... 2023 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Cemeteries .....................................................................................................................................2028 
Deceased Estates ...........................................................................................................................2039 
Education .......................................................................................................................................2029 
Health.............................................................................................................................................2030 
Heritage .........................................................................................................................................2031 
Justice ............................................................................................................................................2031 
Marine/Maritime ...........................................................................................................................2032 
Minerals and Petroleum................................................................................................................2032 
Planning and Infrastructure .........................................................................................................2036 
Premier and Cabinet .....................................................................................................................2037 
Public Trust ...................................................................................................................................2038 
Racing, Gaming and Liquor ..........................................................................................................2038 
Water..............................................................................................................................................2039 
 
 



 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part may be 
reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for Western 
Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, State Law 
Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of Western 
Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or unforeseen 
circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Postal address: Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher   State Law Publisher 
  P.O. Box 8448,   Ground Floor, 
  Perth Business Centre 6849   10 William St. Perth, 6000 
     Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If original 
copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2004 (Prices include GST). 
Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.45 
Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$52.40 
Other articles in Public Notices Section—$52.40 (except items of an exceptionally large nature. In these 
instances arrangements will be made for pricing the notice at time of lodging). 
All other Notices 
  Per Column Centimetre—$10.45 
  Bulk Notices—$194.70 per page 
Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  
Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 

 

PUBLISHING ALTERATIONS 
Periodically the normal Gazette publishing times need to be altered 
to cater for disruption caused by public holidays. 

 • Easter and Christmas holidays cause disruption each year. 

 • Australia Day and Anzac Day cause disruption when they 
fall on a Tuesday or Friday. 

In these instances, notices warning of the change are generally 
published on page 2 for approximately 4 weeks prior to the date. 
Readers are urged to check Gazettes accordingly, prior to 
contacting State Law Publisher. 

JOHN A. STRIJK, Government Printer.  



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2023 

— PART 1 — 

JUSTICE 
JU301* 

Legal Practice Act 2003 

Legal Practice Board Amendment 
Rules (No. 3) 2005 

Made by the Legal Practice Board under section 252 of the Legal 
Practice Act 2003. 

1. Citation 
  These rules are the Legal Practice Board Amendment 

Rules (No. 3) 2005. 

2. The rules amended 
  The amendments in these rules are to the Legal Practice Board 

Rules 2004*. 
 [* Published in Gazette 14 May 2004, p. 1473-557. 
  For amendments to 18 April 2005 see Gazette 12 April 2005.] 

3. Rule 44 amended 
  Rule 44(3) is amended as follows: 
 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$300” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    $500    ”; 
 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$550” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    $950    ”; 
 (c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$600” and inserting 

instead —  
  “    $1 000    ”. 

Made by the Legal Practice Board under section 252 

Mr I. WELDON, Member. 

Mr R. O’CONNOR QC, Member. 

Mr G. TANNIN SC, Member. 

Ms S. SCHLINK, Member. 



2024 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

JU302* 

Evidence Act 1906 

Evidence (Prescribed Persons) Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Evidence (Prescribed Persons) 
Regulations 2005. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which they 
are published in the Gazette, or the day on which the Evidence 
Amendment Act 2004 section 4 comes into operation, whichever 
is the later. 

3. Interpretation 

  In these regulations —  
 “PathCentre” means the agency established under 

section 7B(1) of the Hospitals and Health Services 
Act 1927 under the name “The Western Australian Centre 
for Pathology and Medical Research”. 

4. Authorised officer (section 50B) 

  The chief executive officer of PathCentre is prescribed as an 
authorised officer for the purposes of the definition of that term 
in section 50B(1). 

5. Forensic scientists (section 50B) 

  The following persons employed as forensic scientists by 
PathCentre are prescribed as forensic scientists for the purposes 
of the definition of that term in section 50B(1) — 

 
Given names Family name DoB Qualifications 
Aleksander BAGDONAVICIUS 03/10/52 B.Sc (Med Sc) 
Janeen Ann BENNETT 30/09/61 B.Sc (Med Sc) 
Martin BLOOMS 12/09/50 B.Sc (Med Sc) 
Christine Yoke 
Bing 

CHIN 16/03/54 B.Sc, M.Sc, 
MAACB         
Grad Dip OSH 

Scott Elliott EGAN 13/08/75 B.Sc (Human Biol) 



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2025 

Given names Family name DoB Qualifications 
Anna-Marie FURMEDGE 28/11/66 B.Sc (Med Sc), 

P Grad Dip 
(Biomed Sc) 

Christine 
Danielle 

GARBIN 27/03/75 B.Sc (Hons), 
P Grad Dip 
(Forensic Science) 

Denise Susan GROVER 21/06/68 B.Sc (Med Sc), 
P Grad Dip 
(Biomed Sc), M.Sc 

Paula Jane HALLAM 04/05/63 B.Sc (Hons), PhD 
Louise Susanne TAYLOR 12/05/75 B.Sc (Hons), PhD 
Gavin Robert TURBETT 09/07/65 B.Sc (Med Sc) 

(Hons) 
Laurance Grant WEBB 23/05/57 B.Sc (Med Sc) 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG301* 

DOG ACT 1976 

Town of Vincent 

LOCAL LAW RELATING TO DOGS 
In pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the abovementioned Act and of all 
other powers enabling it, the Council of the Town of Vincent HEREBY RECORDS 
having resolved on 22 March 2005 to amend the principal Town of Vincent Local 
Law Relating to Dogs, published in the Government Gazette on 23 May 2000 and its 
amendment published in the Government Gazette on 5 December 2000 as follows— 
 1. the Seventh Schedule being amended as follows— 

 (a) by inserting in column 1, the word “7”; and 
 (b) by inserting in column 2, the words “The south portion of Les 

Lilleyman Reserve bounded by Gill Street, to the south and the 
prolongation of the northern kerb-line of Woodstock Street, eastwards 
across Les Lilleyman Reserve”. 

 2. the Eighth Schedule being amended at item 3 by inserting in column 2, after 
the words “North Perth” the words “Except that portion of the reserve 
roughly bounded by Gill Street, to the south and the prolongation of the 
northern kerb-line of Woodstock Street, eastwards across Les Lilleyman 
Reserve”. 

———— 
 
Dated: 2 May 2005. 
The Common Seal of the Town of Vincent was affixed in the presence of— 

NICK CATANIA, JP, Mayor. 
JOHN GIORGI, JP, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

 
 



2026 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

WATER/SEWERAGE 
WA301* 

Economic Regulation Authority Act 2003 

Economic Regulation Authority (Cost of 
Supplying Bulk Potable Water to Kalgoorlie-

Boulder Reference) Notice (No. 2) 2005 

Given by the Economic Regulation authority under section 34(1) of the 
Economic Regulation Authority Act 2003. 

1. Citation 

  This notice is the Economic Regulation Authority (Cost of 
Supplying Bulk Potable Water to Kalgoorlie-Boulder 
Reference) Notice (No. 2) 2005. 

2. Reference amended 

 (1) Under section 33 of the Economic Regulation Authority 
Act 2003, the Treasurer has amended the reference, notice of 
which was given in the Economic Regulation Authority (Cost of 
Supplying Bulk Potable Water to Kalgoorlie-Boulder 
Reference) Notice 2005 published in the Gazette on 8 February 
2005, pp.664-666. 

 (2) The particulars of the amendments are set out in Schedule 1. 

3. Period of the inquiry 

  The period of the inquiry is 13 January 2005 to 16 September 
2005. 

4. Public submissions 

 (1) Members of the public may make written submissions to the 
Economic Regulation Authority on any matter that is dealt with 
in the draft report referred to in the terms of reference. 

 (2) The draft report will be made available by 30 June 2005. 

 (3) Submissions in response to the draft report may be made within 
4 weeks after the draft report is made available or any longer 
period allowed by the Economic Regulation Authority. 

 (4) The address for submissions is the Economic Regulation 
Authority, GPO Box 8469, Perth Business Centre WA 6849. 



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2027 

5. Further information 

  Further information about matters relating to the inquiry is 
available on the Economic Regulation Authority’s website at 
http://www.era.wa.gov.au. 

 
Schedule 1 — Particulars of amendment 

[cl. 2(2)] 
NOTICE OF AMENDMENT TO REFERENCE FOR INQUIRY ON 
THE COST OF SUPPLYING BULK POTABLE WATER TO 
KALGOORLIE-BOULDER 
 
I, Eric Ripper, under section 33 of the Economic Regulation Authority 
Act 2003, amend the reference for the Inquiry on the Cost of Supplying 
Bulk Potable Water to Kalgoorlie-Boulder, notice of which was 
published in the Gazette on 8 February 2005 at pages 664-6, as follows: 
 

1. The draft report is to be made available by 30 June 2005 instead 
of 6 May 2005. 

 
2. The final report is to be completed by no later than 16 September 

2005 instead of 4 July 2005. 

 

ERIC RIPPER MLA 
DEPUTY PREMIER; TREASURER; 
MINISTER FOR ENERGY 

 

Chairman 
Economic Regulation Authority 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 



2028 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

— PART 2 — 

CEMETERIES 
CC401* 

CEMETERIES ACT 1986 
Shire of Wongan-Ballidu 

SCALE OF FEES AND CHARGES 
In pursuance of powers conferred upon it by Section 53 of the Cemeteries Act the Shire of Wongan-
Ballidu hereby records having resolved on the 21st April 2005, that the following fees and charges 
shall apply to all cemeteries within the Shire of Wongan-Ballidu from the 1st July 2005. 
All fees and charges are inclusive of GST where applicable. 

CEMETERY CHARGES   
 (a) In Open Ground:    
    Ten Years of Age + to a Depth of 1.8m   $400.00  
    Any Child under Ten Years of Age 1.4m Deep   $300.00  
    Any Stillborn Child in Grave 1.4m Deep   $280.00  
    Burial on Saturday   $450.00  
    Burial on Sunday or Public Holiday   $600.00  
 or (b) In Reserved Ground (Private Grave):   
    Ten Years of Age + to a Depth of 1.8m   $400.00  
    Any Child under Ten Years of Age 1.4m Deep   $300.00  
 or (c) Re-opening of Grave     
    Second Interment for any Grave   $400.00  
    NOTE: Undertaker to remove existing headstone and reinstate or extra charges 
apply.     
    Re-Interment after exhumation   $440.00  
 (d) Extra Charge if Grave Deeper than 1.8 m:     
    For each additional 0.3m   $60.00  
 and (e) Land Fee (In addition to Interment Charge     
   for Open and Reserved Ground:     
    2.4m x 1.2m   $120.00  
    2.4m x 2.4m   $160.00  
    2.4m x 3.6m   $ — 
 Single Compartment   $80.00  
 Double Compartment   $140.00  
 Cost of Plaque and Fitting Additional   Varies  
 Reservation Fee—Niche Wall per Compartment   $35.00  
 Interment of Ashes in Private Niche Wall—By Applicant   $30.00  
 Interment of Ashes in Private Niche Wall—By Council   $50.00  
 Interment without Due Notice   $60.00  
 Late Arrival at Cemetery gates of Funeral   $44.00  
 Exhumations   $1,000.00  
 Additional Charge for manual digging   $200.00  
 Permission to Erect a Headstone, Monument or Kerbing   $33.00  
 Permission to Erect a Name Plate Only   $33.00  
 Issuing an Extract or Certified Copy from the Register   $11.00  
 Copy of the By-Laws (Local Law)   $11.00  
 Issue or Renewal of a “Grant of Right of Burial”   $55.00  
 Transfer of a “Grant of Right of Burial”   $11.00  



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2029 

CEMETERY CHARGES  
 Copy of a “Grant of Right of Burial”   $11.00 
 Funeral Directors Annual License   $100.00 
 Single Funeral Permit   $35.00 
 Interment of Ashes in Ordinary Grave: by Applicant   $30.00 
 By Council   $110.00 
 Grave Dressers Annual License   $55.00 

 
DALE STEWART, Chief Executive Officer. 

EDUCATION 
ED401 

UNIVERSITY OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1911 
AMENDING BY-LAW 

It is hereby notified that the Governor in Executive Council, acting under the provisions of 
Section 16B of the University of Western Australia Act 1911, has approved an amendment to Part 2 of 
the First Schedule of The University of Western Australia Lands By-Laws as set out in the attached 
schedule. 

LJILJANNA RAVLICH, MLC, Minister for Education and Training. 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

———— 
The University of Western Australia 

THE UNIVERSITY OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA LANDS BY-LAWS 
The University of Western Australia, in pursuance of the University of Western Australia Act 1911, 
hereby makes the following amendments to The University of Western Australia Lands By-Laws, for 
the purpose of regulating the terms and conditions under which those lands may be visited or used 
and the conduct of persons when on those lands— 

FIRST SCHEDULE 
PART 2 is amended— 

 (a) by adding the following— 
  3 CLARK STREET 
  40. Portion of Swan location 268 and being Lot 274 on Plan 2948 comprised in 

Certificate of Title Volume 1054 Folio 293. 
The Common Seal of the University of Western Australia was hereto affixed by authority of the 
Senate attested by— 

ALAN ROBSON, Vice-Chancellor. 
 

——————————— 
 
ED402 

UNIVERSITY OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1911 
AMENDING STATUTE 

It is hereby notified that the Governor in Executive Council, acting under the provisions of Section 33 
of the University of Western Australia Act 1911, has approved Amending Statute No. 1 of 2004 as set 
out in the attached schedule. 

LJILJANNA RAVLICH, MLC, Minister for Education and Training. 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

———— 
UNIVERSITY OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1911 

Office of the Minister for Education 
Perth, 2004. 

His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, acting pursuant to the provisions of Section 33 of 
the University of Western Australia Act 1911, has been pleased to approve the Statute made by the 
Senate of The University of Western Australia which is set out in the schedule hereunder. 

LJILJANNA RAVLICH, MLC, Minister for Education and Training. 



2030 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

SCHEDULE 
AMENDING STATUTE NO. 1 OF 2004 

1. STATUTE 10—VICE CHANCELLOR 
Clauses 1 to 6 are replaced by the following— 
 1. The Vice-Chancellor, who is also the President of the University, is the chief executive officer 

of the University. 
 2. Subject to the Acts, Statutes and regulations and to any resolutions of the Senate, the 

Vice-Chancellor— 
 (a) is specially charged with the duty of promoting the interests and furthering the 

development of the University; 
 (b) is responsible for the academic, administrative, financial and other business of the 

University; 
 (c) exercises a general supervision over the staff and students of the University. 
 3. (1) The Vice-Chancellor has the authority necessary to carry out the duties and 

responsibilities of the office. 
 (2) The Vice-Chancellor may, with the approval of the Senate from time to time, delegate 

any of the powers (except this power of delegation), duties and responsibilities of the 
office to another person, and that person has the authority necessary to carry out all 
the duties and responsibilities so delegated. 

 (3) The Vice-Chancellor may at any time resolve or terminate any such delegation. 
 4. (1) The Vice-Chancellor is ex officio a member of every committee and board of the Senate, 

of the Academic Board and its boards and committees, and of every faculty, faculty 
board and faculty committee. 

 (2) Subject to the approval of the Senate, the Vice-Chancellor may appoint a representative 
from time to time on any of the bodies described in sub-clause (1). 

 5. (1) Whenever the Vice-Chancellor is absent from duty at the University, an Acting 
Vice-Chancellor is appointed by the Vice-Chancellor from the senior staff of the 
University in the following order: the Deputy Vice-Chancellor, another member of the 
Executive, a dean, a professor. 

 (2) If circumstances prevent the Vice-Chancellor from making a necessary appointment to 
the position of Acting Vice-Chancellor in terms of sub-clause (1), the Chancellor makes 
the appointment. 

 6. Nothing in this Statute affects the precedence or authority of the Chancellor or 
Pro-Chancellor. 

The Common Seal of The University of Western Australia was hereto affixed by authority of the 
Senate. 
Attested by— 

ALAN ROBSON, Vice-Chancellor. 
By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

HEALTH 
HE401* 

HEALTH ACT 1911 
APPOINTMENTS 

Department of Health WA, 
Perth, 30 April 2005. 

In accordance with the provisions of section 28 of the Health Act 1911, the appointment of the 
following persons as Environmental Health Officers is approved. 

Environmental Health 
Officer Date Effective Local Government 

Michelle Stewart 13 April 2005 Shire of Brookton 
Michelle Stewart 8 April 2005 Shire of Pingelly 
Leonard Allan Welch 20 June 2005 Shire of Boddington 
Leonard Allan Welch 13 April 2005 Town of Port Hedland 
Linton Keith Thomas 12 April 2005 Shire of Wyalkatchem 
Elena Boull 12 April 2005 Shire of Chapman Valley 
Jason Jenke 8 April 2005 City of  South Perth 
Claire Davison 13 April 2005 City of Cockburn 



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2031 

Environmental Health 
Officer Date Effective Local Government 

Jeffrey Howe 2 May 2005 City of Subiaco 
Linton Keith Thomas 1 April 2005 Shire of Trayning 
Trevor Kohler 26 April 2005 Shire of Greenough 
Peter Horgan 26 April 2005 Shire of Busselton 
Robert Cavazzi 28 April 2005 City of Subiaco 
Chad Robert Harvey 28 April 2005 Shire of East Pilbara 

Dr. M. STEVENS, Executive Director, Public Health. 

HERITAGE 
HR401* 

HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990 
INTENTION TO AMEND AN ENTRY IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES 

In accordance with the requirements of Section 54(1) (a) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 
1990, the Heritage Council hereby gives notice that it is proposed to amend the entry in the Register 
on a permanent basis in respect of the Place being the Nurses Memorial Centre, 34 Kings Park Road, 
West Perth. 
The reason for the proposed amendment is to allow for a proposed Strata subdivision of the original 
land parcel. The Nurses Memorial Centre will be situated on two of the proposed new Strata lots. The 
amended description of the Place will be— 

Lot 1 on Strata Plan 43947 being the whole of the land contained in Certificate of Title Volume 
2589 Folio 701, Lot 72 on Strata Plan 43947 being the whole of the land contained in Certificate 
of Title Volume 2589 Folio 772 and portion of the common property of Strata Plan 43947 together 
as shown on Heritage Council of Western Australia Survey Drawing No. 2665 prepared by Brown 
McAllister (WA) Pty Ltd and dated 15 April 2005. 

The Heritage Council invites submissions on the proposal. Submissions must be in writing and should 
be forwarded to the following address not later than 5pm on 17 June 2005. 
Dated this 6th day of May 2005. 

(sgd) IAN BAXTER, Director, 
Office of The Heritage Council of W.A. 

108 Adelaide Terrace East Perth WA  6004. 

JUSTICE 
JU402* 

COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999 
PERMIT DETAILS 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 51 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Director General of the Ministry of Justice has issued the following persons with Permits to do High-
Level Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Issued 

Permit 
Commence 

Date 

Permit Expiry 
Date 

Brown Aaron David CS5-206 02/05/2005 22/04/2005 30/07/2005 

McFarland Robert John CS5-194 02/05/2005 22/04/2005 30/07/2005 

Leembruggen Jennifer Beth CS5-192 02/05/2005 22/04/2005 30/07/2005 

Jones Steven Kenneth CS5-190 02/05/2005 22/04/2005 30/07/2005 

Byron Ross  Iain CS5-182 02/05/2005 22/04/2005 30/07/2005 

Yotopoulos Tracey Lee CS5-181 02/05/2005 22/04/2005 30/07/2005 

Brash Julie  CS5-178 02/05/2005 22/04/2005 30/07/2005 



2032 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 56 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Director General of the Ministry of Justice has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level 
Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Revoked 

Fawcett Mark Maurice CS3-038 03/05/2005 

Callaghan Geoffrey Edward CS2-017 29/04/2005 

Marsh Peter James CS2-082 29/04/2005 

Thomson Drew CS2-242 29/04/2005 

Stephenson Christopher John CS4-044 29/04/2005 

Raymond Fiona Ann CS4-060 29/04/2005 

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999. 

BRIAN YEARWOOD, Director, Contracted Services. 
 

——————————— 
 
JU401 

CORRUPTION AND CRIME COMMISSION ACT 2003 
DECLARATION 

I declare the Honourable Dennis Leslie Mahoney AO QC, an Inquirer appointed pursuant to 
section 11 of the Public Sector Management Act 1994 to enquire into a matter relating to the Public 
Sector viz in respect of the management of offenders in custody and in the community in accordance 
with the terms of reference set out in an instrument of appointment dated 5 April 2005, to be a person 
to whom paragraph 18(2)(g)(vii) of the Corruption and Crime Commission Act 2003 applies. 

JIM McGINTY MLA, Attorney General. 

MARINE/MARITIME 
MX401* 

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 
BOATING PROHIBITED AREA 

Twilight Cove 
Shire of Esperance 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 
Fremantle WA, 6 May 2005. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, 
the department hereby closes the following waters to navigation by all motorised craft until further 
notice— 

Twilight Cove: All those waters of Twilight Cove contained within an area commencing at a 
point 33º53.741’S, 121º49.357’E (corresponding to where the foreshore meets the start of the 
rocks) thence in a north-easterly direction for 170 metres to a point 33º53.649’S, 121º49.367’E (in 
line with northern wall of surf club building) thence in an easterly direction for 280 metres 
offshore to a point 33º53.655’S, 121º49.548’E thence in a south-easterly direction for 325 metres to 
a point 33º53.769’S, 121º49.709’E thence in a south-westerly direction for 315 metres to a point 
33º53.879’S, 121º49.553’E thence north-westerly to the commencement point. 

GREG MARTIN, Chief Executive Officer, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 
MP401 

COAL MINERS’ WELFARE ACT 1947 
APPOINTMENTS 

His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council, pursuant to Section 9(2) of the Coal Miners’ 
Welfare Act 1947, is pleased to approve the appointment of the following persons to the Coal Miners’ 
Welfare Board of Western Australia for a term ending 31 December 2005. 

John Leslie KEARNEY - as Chairman 
John Joseph BORLINI - as a member 
Pamela Jean ANDERSON - as a member 



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2033 

MP402* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
NOTICE OF INVITATION FOR APPLICATIONS FOR EXPLORATION PERMITS (RE-RELEASE) 

I, William Lee Tinapple, the delegate of the Designated Authority in respect of the adjacent area of 
Western Australia, for and on behalf of the Commonwealth-Western Australia Offshore Petroleum 
Joint Authority, acting pursuant to Section 20(1) of the Petroleum (Submerged Lands) Act 1967, re-
release areas W04-1, W04-15 and W04-16 which closed on 31 March 2005 and hereby invite 
applications for the grant of an exploration permit in respect of these areas. 

Area W04-1 
Londonderry High, Bonaparte Basin, Western Australia 
Map Sheet SC52 (Melville Island) 
3098 3099 3100 3101 3170 
3171 3172 3173 3242 3243 
3244 3245 3314 3315 3316 
3317 3386 3387 3388 3389 
Assessed to contain 20 graticular blocks 

Area W04-15 
Houtman Sub-basin, Perth Basin, Western Australia 
Map Sheet SG49 (Carnarvon) 
1769 1770 1771 1772 1773 
1774 1775 1776 1777 1778 
1779 1841 1842 1843 1844 
1845 1846 1847 1848 1849 
1850 1851 1852 1913 1914 
1915 1916 1917 1918 1919 
1920 1921 1922 1923 1924 
1925 1985 1986 1987 1988 
1989 1990 1991 1992 1993 
1994 1995 1996 1997 2057 
2058 2060 2061 2062 2063 
2064 2065 2066 2067 2068 
2069 2070 2071 2129 2130 
2131 2132 2133 2134 2135 
2136 2137 2138 2139 2140 
2141 2142 2143   
Assessed to contain 78 graticular blocks 

Area W04-16 
Houtman Sub-basin, Perth Basin, Western Australia 
Map Sheet SG49 (Carnarvon) 
2202 2203 2204 2205 2206 
2207 2208 2209 2210 2211 
2212 2213 2214 2215 2274 
2275 2276 2277 2278 2279 
2280 2281 2282 2283 2284 
2285 2286 2287 2288 2346 
2347 2348 2349 2350 2351 
2352 2353 2354 2355 2356 
2357 2358 2359 2360 2418 
2419 2420 2421 2422 2423 
2424 2425 2426 2427 2428 
2429 2430 2431 2432 2433 
2490 2491 2492 2493 2494 
2495 2496 2497 2498 2499 
2500 2501 2502 2503 2504 
2505 2576 2577 2649  
Assessed to contain 79 graticular blocks 
An information package on the release area detailing the work program bidding system outlined 
above and including the criteria for assessment of applications and the conditions to apply following 
the award of a permit, is available on the Department of Industry, Tourism and Resources Website at 
www.industry.gov.au/petexp.   
Obtaining and observing the release package is essential to making an informed application for any of 
the areas. 
The Government will also publish on-line data about Australia’s petroleum exploration opportunities.  
This spatial data gives key hydrocarbon well information (about hydrocarbon shows, biostratigraphic 
age, porosity and depositional environment) and will be released on the Geoscience Australia internet 
site at www.ga.gov.au free of charge. 



2034 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

Lodgement of Applications 
Applications for areas W04-1, W04-15 and W04-16 must be lodged before 4:00 pm on Thursday 
20 October 2005. 
Applications, together with supporting data should be submitted in the following manner to— 

Director Petroleum & Royalties Division 
Department of Industry and Resources 
Level 11, Mineral House 
100 Plain Street 
EAST Perth Western Australia  6004 
Attention:  Petroleum Applications Receiving Officer 

The following special instructions should be observed— 
 � two copies of the application and supporting data together with the application fee should be 

sealed in an envelope or package, clearly marked “Application for Exploration Permit Area ... 
Commercial-in-Confidence”; and 

 � further enclosed in a plain covering envelope or package and delivered by hand or posted to 
the above address. 
Receipts for applications (received and delivered by hand) will be issued by the Petroleum 
Applications Receiving Officer. 

Enquiries concerning this gazettal should be referred to— 
Senior Titles Officer (Releases) 
Petroleum & Royalties Division 
Telephone: (08) 9222 3130 
Facsimile: (08) 9222 3799 

 
——————————— 

 
MP403* 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Industry and 
Resources, Leonora. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act 
1978, for breach of covenant, viz, failure to lodge a report within the prescribed period. 

S. P. SHARRATT (SM), Warden. 
———— 

To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 25th May 2005. 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Margaret District 

Prospecting Licence 
P37/6097—Hawks, Graham Alfred 
 

——————————— 
 
MP404 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Industry and 
Resources, Leonora. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act 
1978, for breach of covenant, viz, failure to comply with the prescribed expenditure conditions. 

S. P. SHARRATT (SM), Warden. 
———— 

To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 25th May 2005. 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mt Malcolm District 
Prospecting Licences 

P37/4375—Tarmoola Australia Pty Ltd 
P37/5148—Gilt-Edged Mining NL 
P37/5149—Gilt-Edged Mining NL 
P37/5150—Gilt-Edged Mining NL 



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2035 

Prospecting Licences—continued 
P37/6029—Tarmoola Australia Pty Ltd 
P37/6288—Great Gold Mines NL 
P37/6289—Great Gold Mines NL 
P37/6290—Great Gold Mines NL 
P37/6291—Great Gold Mines NL 
P37/6292—Great Gold Mines NL 
P37/6293—Great Gold Mines NL 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
MP405 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Industry and 
Resources, Leonora. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act 
1978, for breach of covenant, viz, non-payment of rent. 

S. SHARRATT (SM), Warden. 

———— 
To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 25th May 2005. 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Malcolm District 

Prospecting Licences 
P37/6212—Quantum Resources Ltd 
P37/6213—Quantum Resources Ltd 
P37/6246—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P37/6247—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P37/6294—Great Gold Mines NL 

Mount Margaret District 
Prospecting Licences 

P38/2368—Granny Smith Mines Ltd 
 Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd 
P38/2406—Granny Smith Mines Ltd 
 Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd 
P33/2407—Granny Smith Mines Ltd 
 Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd 
P38/2409—Granny Smith Mines Ltd 
 Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd 
P38/2410—Granny Smith Mines Ltd 
 Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd 
P38/2412—Granny Smith Mines Ltd 
 Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd 
P38/2414—Granny Smith Mines Ltd 
 Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd 
P38/2415—Granny Smith Mines Ltd 
 Placer (Granny Smith) Pty Ltd 

Mount Morgans District 
Prospecting Licences 

P39/2691—Delta Gold Exploration Pty Ltd 
 GME Resources Ltd 
P39/4158—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P39/4159—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P39/4279—Ross, Vernon Christopher 
 Sinclair, Glen Allen 
P39/4284—Wiltshire, Peter Andrew 



2036 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 
PI401* 

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

Shire of Busselton 
Town Planning Scheme No. 20—Amendment No. 61 

Ref: 853/6/6/21 Pt 61 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
Shire of Busselton town planning scheme amendment on 29 April 2005 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lot 1 Cape Naturaliste Road, Dunsborough from ‘Rural Residential’ to ‘Rural 

Residential’, ‘Additional Use (No. 57)’ and ‘Recreation’ reserve as indicated on the Scheme 
Amendment Map.  

 2. Inserting the following particulars into Schedule 4—Additional Uses of the Scheme Text as 
follows— 

Schedule 4—Additional Uses 

No. PARTICULARS OF 
LAND 

LAND USE 
PERMITTED / 

SPECIFIED 

CONDITIONS 

57 Lot 1 Cape Naturaliste 
Road, Dunsborough 

Residential R2.5 1. Subdivision and development 
shall be in accordance with a 
Development Guide Plan adopted 
by Council and endorsed by the 
Western Australian Planning 
Commission for the land. No 
further subdivision shall be 
permitted. 

T. BUSWELL, President. 
A. MacNISH, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI402* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION 
Shire of Irwin 

Town Planning Scheme No. 5 
Local Planning Strategy 

Ref: 853/3/9/5 
Notice is hereby given that the local government of the Shire of Irwin has prepared the 
abovementioned town planning scheme and local planning strategy to replace existing Town Planning 
Scheme No. 4. 
The town planning scheme has been prepared for the purpose of— 
 1. setting out the local government's planning aims and intentions for the scheme area;  
 2. setting aside land as reserves for public purposes;  
 3. zoning land within the scheme area for the purposes defined in the scheme; 
 4. controlling and guiding land use and development; 
 5. setting out procedures for the assessment and determination of planning applications; 
 6. making provision for the administration and enforcement of the scheme; and 
 7. addressing other matters set out in the First Schedule to the Town Planning Act. 
The local planning strategy has been prepared to accompany the town planning scheme for the 
purpose of— 
 (a) setting out the long term planning directions for the local government; 
 (b) applying State and regional planning policies; and 
 (c) providing the rationale for the zones and other provisions of the scheme. 
The documents have been adopted by Council for the purpose of advertising for public comment only. 
Following receipt of public submissions, Council officers will prepare a report to Council in light of 
public submissions received. This may result in changes (deletions, additions or modifications) to the 
town planning scheme and local planning strategy prior to adoption by Council. 



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2037 

Plans and documents setting out and explaining the town planning scheme and local planning 
strategy have been deposited at the Shire of Irwin offices, 13 Waldeck Street, Dongara, the 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, Geraldton office, 65 Chapman Road, Geraldton, and at 
the Western Australian Planning Commission, Albert Facey House, 469 Wellington Street, Perth, and 
will be available for inspection during office hours up to and including 4 August 2005. 
Submissions on the town planning scheme and local planning strategy may be made in writing on 
Form No. 4 during the 90 day advertising period and must be lodged with the undersigned on or 
before 4 August 2005. 

J. L. MERRICK, Chief Executive Officer. 
Ph: (08) 9927 2068 

Fax: (08) 9927 1453 

PREMIER AND CABINET 
PC401* 

APPOINTMENT OF DEPUTY OF THE GOVERNOR 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor, under clause XVI of the Letters Patent 
relating to the Office of Governor of the State of Western Australia dated 14 February 1986, has 
appointed the Honourable Justice Geoffrey Peter Miller, to be the deputy of the Governor and in that 
capacity to perform and exercise all the powers and functions of the Governor during the following 
period (both dates inclusive)— 

4 to 7 May 2005 
and the Honourable Justice Anthony John Templeman, to be deputy of the Governor and in that 
capacity to perform and exercise all the powers and functions of the Governor during the following 
periods (all dates inclusive)— 

14 to 21 May 2005 and 28 to 31 May 2005. 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

 

——————————— 
 

PC402* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointments— 

Hon J. Bowler MLA to act temporarily in the office of Minister for Fisheries; the Kimberley, 
Pilbara and Gascoyne in the absence of the Hon J. R. Ford MLC for the period 17 to 30 July 2005 
(both dates inclusive). 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

 

——————————— 
 

PC403* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointment— 

Hon A. J. Carpenter MLA to act temporarily in the office of Minister for Tourism; Racing and 
Gaming; Youth; Peel and the South West in the absences of the Hon M. McGowan MLA for the 
periods 11 to 13 April 2005 and 3 to 8 May 2005 (all dates inclusive). 

This notice supersedes that published in Government Gazette Number 62 on 19 April 2005. 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 



2038 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

PUBLIC TRUST 
PX401* 

PUBLIC TRUSTEE ACT 1941 

COMMON FUND INTEREST RATES 
Notice is hereby given that the rates of interest payable to the respective estates and trusts, the 
monies of which are held in the Common Fund, as from 1 May 2005, have been fixed as follows. 
Deceased Estates and Uncared for Property matters (in the course of administration or whilst under 
investigation) at the rate of 3.00% where the balance is up to $35,600; 3.25% where the balance is 
$35,601 and over but under $500,000; 3.50% where the balance is $500,001. 
Court Awards at the rate of 4.80% where the balance is up to $35,600, 5.40% where the balance is 
$35,601 and over but under $500,000, 5.80% where the balance is $500,001 and over. 

Dated at Perth the 2nd day of May 2005. 

A. R. McLAREN, Public Trustee, 
565 Hay Street, 
Perth WA 6000. 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 
RG401* 

LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988 

LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS 
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and 
required to be advertised. Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about 
the objection process, should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming and Liquor, 1st Floor, Hyatt 
Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant 
industry organisation. 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE 
10743 Compass Group 

(Australia) Pty Ltd 
Application for the grant of a Special 
Facility—Canteen licence in respect of 
premises situated in Newman and known as 
Newman Accommodation Village 

01/06/2005 

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMIT—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS 
23203 Tocoan Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an Extended 

Trading Permit—Ongoing Extended Hours in 
respect of premises situated in Bunbury and 
known as The Reef Hotel. 

19/05/2005 

APPLICATIONS FOR APPROVAL TO ALTER/REDEFINE THE LICENSED PREMISES 
203762 
210103 

Always Holdings 
Pty Ltd 

Application for approval to alter/redefine the 
Hotel in respect of premises situated in 
Bicton and known as the Leopold Hotel. 

02/06/2005 

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988. 

Dated: 4 May 2005. 
H. R. HIGHMAN, Director of Liquor Licensing. 

 
 
 



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2039 

WATER 
WA401* 

COUNTRY TOWNS SEWERAGE ACT 1948 
COUNTRY SEWERAGE AREA ORDER NUMBER 3 OF 2004 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under Section 4 of the Act. 

1. Citation 
This Order may be cited as the Country Sewerage Area Order Number 3 of 2004. 

2. Kambalda Sewerage Area constituted 
The boundary of the Kambalda Sewerage Area is shown bordered in red                    on Water 
Corporation plan  ET 72-001-025-01. 

3. Information plan of Kambalda Sewerage Area 
The boundary of the Kambalda Sewerage Area as constituted by this Order is shown for information 
purposes in the plans in Schedule 1. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

———— 
 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

DECEASED ESTATES 
ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons, are required by Perpetual Trustees 
WA Ltd, c/- Ground Floor, 39 Hunter Street, Sydney NSW, to send particulars of such claims to the 
Company by the undermentioned date, after which date the said company may convey or distribute 
the assets, having regard only to the claims of which the Company  then has notice. 
Claims for the following estates expire one month after the date of publication hereof. 

Estate late Ernest Rawson Jenkinson 
Late of St Ives Retirement Village, 31/177 Dampier Avenue, Kallaroo, Retired Farmer, died 4/3/05 

Estate late Francis John Longhurst 
Late of Tandara Nursing Home, 26 Plantation Drive, Bentley, Retired Farmer, died 18/4/05 



2040 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

Estate Late Norma Beatrice Marzi 
Late of Second Avenue Nursing Home, 51-53 Second Avenue, Mount Lawley, Widow, died 28/3/05 

Estate Late Lorna Thomson Royce 
Late of Forrest Gardens Nursing Home, 929 Woodrow Street, Carey Park, Home Duties, died 28/3/05 

Estate Late Thelma Doreen Wooding 
Late of Hollywood Senior Citizens Village Nursing Home, 118-120 Monash Avenue, Nedlands, Home 
Duties, died 25/3/05 

STEPHEN JOHN MAXWELL, Senior Estate Manager. 
Direct Phone: (02) 9229 3419 

 

——————————— 
 
ZX402* 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Estate of Richard James House late of 4 Henley Road, Ardross, Western Australia, Operations 
Manager. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on 28 August 2004, are required by me the Trustee 
Patricia Mary House to send particulars of any such claim to the Estate’s solicitor Trainor Legal of 
Suite 2/2 Richardson Street, West Perth, Western Australia 6005 by 6 June 2005. After that date I 
will convey or distribute the assets with regard only to the claims of which I have notice. 
 

——————————— 
 
ZX403 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before the 6th June 2005 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, 
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 
Boyce Ethel Rose, late of Wanneroo Community Nursing Home 9 Amos Road Wanneroo, died 

23.03.2005, (DE19951507EM26) 
Bridger William John, late of 12 Christison Way Rockingham, died 08.04.2005, (DE19922617EM17) 
Coppin Thelma Jean, late of Belmont Community Nursing Home 5 Kemp Place Rivervale, died 

04.11.2004, (DE19822683EM13) 
Cosgrave Valma Maud, late of 15 Homewood Street Cloverdale, died 28.02.2005, (DE19982455EM27) 
Day Marjorie May, late of 95 Lakes Road Mandurah, died 12.03.2005, (DE19883685EM23) 
Freeman-Smith Jack, late of Lathlain Care Facility 63 Archer Street Carlisle, died 23.10.2004, 

(DE19550760EM17) 
Glasson Geoffrey England, late of 150 Oats Street Carlisle, died 27.03.2005, (DE19954299EM35) 
Hill Lorna Annie also known as Lorna Ann Hill, late of St Andrews 37 Burwood Road Balcatta, died 

04.01.2005, (DE19802654EM12) 
Leach Desmond Anthony, late of 22 Devenish Street Geraldton, died 28.03.2005, (DE19932493EM32) 
Malone Hugh Joseph, late of Concorde Nursing Home 25 Anstey Street South Perth formerly of Unit 

9/100, Lawler Street Subiaco, died 18.02.2005, (DE19972795EM26) 
Martinz Merlyn Irene, late of 51A Hudson Street Bayswater, died 03.03.2005, (DE19730599EM16) 
Mildwaters Roma May, late of Wearne House 7 Leslie Street Mandurah formerly of 45 Crowther 

Street Bayswater, died 03.04.2005, (DE19750134EM32) 
Netkowski Alojzy, late of 172 Banksia Street Tuart Hill, died 13.04.2005, (DE33039631EM34) 
Nunn Robert Saunders, late of 1 Deakin Street Collie, died 12.03.2005, (DE33025502EM36) 
Pengilly Eileen Patricia, late of Castledare Village Balmoral House 108 Fern Road Wilson formerly of 

Castledare Village 41/108 Fern Road Wilson, died 07.04.2005, (DE19981675EM27) 
Pond Kathleen Mary, late of Mercy Hostel 9 Harvest Loop Edgewater, died 04.04.2005, 

(DE19872843EM16) 
Scott Lewis Sydney, late of Craiglea Nursing Home 38 Alday Street St James formerly of 2/1 Skytown 

Place Queens Park, died 08.02.2004, (PM30330323TM24) 

ANTONINA ROSE McLAREN 
Public Trustee 

Public Trust Office 
565 Hay Street 
Perth WA 6000 

Telephone: 9222 6777 



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2041 

ZX404 
 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Harry Grainger, Late of Lot 521 Peters Road, Muchea in the State of Western Australia, Business 
Proprietor, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons who have a claim (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 7 September 2004 are required by the 
Administratrix, Vanessa Monck to send particulars of their claims to her C/- Messrs D.O.D. Price & 
Associates, Barristers & Solicitors, PO Box 1172, Wangara, Western Australia by 14 June 2005 after 
which date the Administratrix may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of 
which she then has notice. 

D.O.D. Price & Associates, 
Solicitors for the Administratrix. 

 

——————————— 
 
 

 
 WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 1992 
 

*Price: $14.20 counter sales 
Plus postage on 188 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

YOUNG OFFENDERS ACT 1994 
*Price: $35.65 counter sales 
Plus postage on 690 grams 

YOUNG OFFENDERS REGULATIONS 1995 
*Price $5.15 counter sales 
Plus postage on 70 grams 

*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

THE CRIMINAL CODE 
(Reprinted as at 9 September 2004) 

*Price: $65.05 counter sales 
Plus postage on 1360 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



2042 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

 
 

PERTH OBSERVATORY 

 

THE W.A. SPECIALISTS IN 
ASTRONOMICAL 

RESEARCH & EDUCATIONAL 
ASTRONOMY 

Public Tours (day and night) 
Field Nights, Lectures 

Astronomical Information 

Astronomical Handbook 
Sun rise & set; Moon rise & set 

Legal advice 
Chronometer calibration 
Astronomical souvenirs 

SERVING WESTERN AUSTRALIA SINCE 1896 

WALNUT ROAD, BICKLEY 6076 
TELEPHONE 9293 8255  FAX 9293 8138 

ASTRONOMY IS LOOKING UP 



6 May 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2043 

 
 

SafetyLine
Workplace Safety on the Internet 

 
Information on solutions to work 

safety and health challenges has been 

delivered to your workplace. 

Go to the World Wide Web on the 

Internet on your computer and contact 

http://www.safetyline.wa.gov.au 

Help yourself to the information 

WorkSafe Western Australia has put 

there to help you. 

 
For further information call (08) 9327 8777. 

 

Go on-line to SafetyLine 
 



2044 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 6 May 2005 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES 
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS) 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State 
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the 
missing item. 
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full. 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 

SUBSCRIPTION CHARGES 2005 
All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2005. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically. 

All Gazettes $
  Within WA ....................................  826.10
  Interstate  .....................................  842.60
  Overseas (airmail) ......................  1,151.00

Bound Volumes of full year .......  1,098.90

Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year) ......................................  753.50
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $
  Within WA  ...................................  359.70
  Interstate ......................................  429.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ........................  545.00

Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year) ......................................  325.60
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $
  Within WA  ...................................  784.30
  Interstate ......................................  958.10
  Overseas (airmail)  ........................  903.00

Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  ...................................  773.30
  Interstate ......................................  785.40

Hansards on CD ROM from 1999  
 (per year) ........................................ 803.00

STATUTES 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $ 
  Within WA......................................  280.50 
  Interstate .......................................  311.30 
  Overseas .......................................  288.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ...............  771.10 

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year).......................................  279.40 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA......................................  301.40 
  Interstate........................................  311.30 
  Overseas (airmail) ...........................  405.00 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $ 
  Within WA .....................................  413.60 
  Interstate .......................................  433.40 
  Overseas (airmail) ..........................  587.00 

 

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is 
searchable. Other CD ROM products with 
legislation or other statutory information can 
be packaged to individual requirements.  
Prices are available on request.

!200500089GG! 


