
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  2995 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 1 JULY 2005 No. 125 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Fair Trading Act 1987— 
  Fair Trading (Product Safety Standard) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2005.............  2997 
  Fair Trading (Product Safety Standard) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2005.............  2998 
Financial Administration and Audit Act 1985—Financial Administration and Audit 

(Designation of Statutory Authorities) Regulations 2005 ....................................................  3007 
Firearms Act 1973—Firearms Amendment Regulations 2005................................................  3001 
Gas Pipelines Access (Western Australia) Act 1998—Gas Pipelines Access (Western 

Australia) (Funding) Amendment Regulations 2005............................................................  2999 
Local Government Act 1995—Town of Port Hedland—Standing Orders ...............................  3000 
Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994—Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers 

Amendment Regulations 2005 ...............................................................................................  3005 
Police Act 1892—Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2005................................................  3003 
Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984— 
  Water Agencies Amendment By-laws 2005.......................................................................  3009 
  Water Agencies (Charges) Amendment By-laws (No. 3) 2005..........................................  3008 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Conservation ..............................................................................................................................  3018 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  3028 
Education ...................................................................................................................................  3019 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................  3019 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  3020 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  3020 
Parliament..................................................................................................................................  3022 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  3022 
Police ..........................................................................................................................................  3026 
Premier and Cabinet..................................................................................................................  3026 
Racing, Gaming and Liquor.......................................................................................................  3026 
Regional Development ...............................................................................................................  3027 
Salaries and Allowances Tribunal ............................................................................................  3028 
 
 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2005 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.90 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$53.45 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$53.45 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$10.70 

  Bulk Notices—$199.10 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2997 

 

— PART 1 — 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE301* 

 
Fair Trading Act 1987 

Fair Trading (Product Safety Standard) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Fair Trading (Product Safety 
Standard) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Fair Trading 
(Product Safety Standard) Regulations 2001*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 15 January 2002, p. 183-228. 
  For amendments to 24 May 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 113.] 

3. Regulation 16 amended 

  Regulation 16 is amended by deleting “objects.” and inserting 
instead —  

“     
  objects, 

  but does not include; 

 (c) elasticised cargo nets; or 

 (d) elasticised straps specifically made for the 
purpose of securing a vehicle jack or toolkit 
within a vehicle. 

    ”. 



2998 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

4. Regulation 17 amended 

  Regulation 17(2) is amended by inserting after “have”—  

  “    permanently    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

CE302* 
Fair Trading Act 1987 

Fair Trading (Product Safety Standard) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Fair Trading (Product Safety 
Standard) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2005. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2005. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Fair Trading 
(Product Safety Standard) Regulations 2001*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 15 January 2002, p. 183-228. 
  For amendments to 24 May 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 113.] 

4. Schedule 13 amended 

  Schedule 13 Division 2 Subdivision 2 clause 20 is amended as 
follows: 

 (a) in subclause (1) by deleting “and fourth sentences, 
which commence “Toys …” and “Guidance …” 
respectively.” and inserting instead —  

  “    sentence.    ”; 

 (b) by deleting subclause (2). 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2999 

 

ENERGY 

EN301* 

 
Gas Pipelines Access (Western Australia) Act 1998 

Gas Pipelines Access (Western Australia) 
(Funding) Amendment Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Gas Pipelines Access (Western 
Australia) (Funding) Amendment Regulations 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Gas Pipelines 
Access (Western Australia) (Funding) Regulations 1999*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 4 March 2005.] 

3. Regulation 9 amended 

 (1) Regulation 9(2) is amended by deleting “incurred by the Board 
in connection with” and inserting instead —  

  “    of    ”. 

 (2) After regulation 9(2) the following subregulation is inserted —  

“     
 (2a) Without limiting subregulation (2), the cost and 

expenses of the hearing and determination of particular 
proceedings include any cost and expenses attributable 
to the provision of services, facilities and support under 
section 56(1) of the Act for the purposes of those 
proceedings. 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



3000 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Town of Port Hedland 
STANDING ORDERS 

In pursuance of the powers conferred upon it by the above mentioned Act, the 
Council of the Town of Port Hedland hereby records having resolved on Wednesday 
23 February 2005, to amend its Standing Orders Local Law as follows— 

The text of clause 2.7 be deleted,  

Order of Business 
 2.7 The order of business at Council and Committee meetings shall be as 

determined by Council or committee from time to time and such order may 
be altered for a particular meeting by the chairperson or members by 
resolution. 
Item 1 Opening of Meeting. 
Item 2 Recording of Attendance and Apologies. 
Item 3 Response to Previous Questions—On Notice. 
Item 4 Public Time; 

 4.1 Public Question Time, 
 4.2 Public Statements. 

Item 5 Questions from Members Without Notice. 
Item 6 Declaration of Members to Have Given Due Consideration to all 

Matters Contained in the Business Paper Presented Before the 
Meeting 

Item 7 Confirmation of Minutes of Previous Meeting. 
Item 8 Announcements by Chairman without Discussion. 
Item 9 Petitions/ Deputations/ Presentations/ Submissions. 
Item 10 Reports of officers. 
Item 11 Late Items as Permitted by Chairperson/ Council. 
Item 12 Motions of Which Previous Notice has Been Given. 
Item 13 Confidential Items. 
Item 14 Applications for Leave of Absence. 
Item 15  Closure 

and substituted with— 
 “2.7 The order of business at Council or Committee meetings shall be as 

determined by Council or committee from time to time and such order may 
be altered for a particular meeting by the chairperson or members by 
resolution 
Item 1 Opening of the Meeting 
Item 2 Recording of Attendance and Apologies 
Item 3 Response to Previous Questions—On Notice 
Item 4 Public Time 

 4.1 Public Question time 
 4.2 Public Statements 

Item 5 Questions from Members Without Notice 
Item 6 Declaration by Members to Have Given Due Consideration to all 

Matters Contained in the Business Paper Presented Before the 
Meeting. 

Item 7 Confirmation of Minutes of Previous Meeting  
Item 8 Announcements by Chairman without Discussion 
Item 9 Reports by Elected Members without Discussion 
Item 10 Petitions/Deputations/Presentations/ Submissions. 
Item 11 Reports of Officers. 
Item 12 Late Items as Permitted by Chairperson/Council 
Item 13 Motions of which Previous Notice has Been Given 
Item 14 Confidential Items 
Item 15 Applications for Leave of Absence 
Item 16 Closure” 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3001 

 

The following text be added after 5.3 

Declarations Of Due Consideration 
 5.4 Any member who is not familiar with the substance of any report or minutes 

or other information provided for consideration at a Council or committee 
meeting shall declare that fact at the time declarations of due consideration 
are called for in the Order of Business of the meeting or otherwise before the 
meeting considers the matter.  In the event that any member makes such a 
declaration the relevant matter shall be stood down for later consideration 
at that meeting so as to allow an opportunity for any member making a 
declaration to become familiar with the relevant report or minutes or other 
information.” 

L. P. STRUGNELL, Chief Executive Officer. 

POLICE 

PO301* 

Firearms Act 1973 

Firearms Amendment Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Firearms Amendment 
Regulations 2005. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2005. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Firearms 
Regulations 1974*. 

 [* Reprint 5 as at 15 April 2005.] 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

 (1) The Table to regulation 4(1a) is deleted and the following Table 
is inserted instead —  

“     
Table of application forms and fees 

Form 
No. 

Kind of Licence Fee 
($) 

1 Firearm Licence — original issue (1 year) .................. 148 

1 Firearm Licence — renewal (1 year) ........................... 32 

1 Firearm Collector’s Licence — original issue (3 years) .. 177 



3002 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

Form 
No. 

Kind of Licence Fee 
($) 

1 Firearm Collector’s Licence — renewal (3 years) ....... 32 

2 Corporate Licence — original issue (1 year) ............... 305 

2 Corporate Licence — renewal (1 year) ........................ 80 
    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 4(1aa) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$23” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $24    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$23” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $24    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 4(1b)(a) is amended by deleting “$23” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $24    ”. 

 (4) The Table to regulation 4(1c) is deleted and the following Table 
is inserted instead —  

“     
Table of application forms and fees 

Form 
No. 

Kind of Licence Fee 
($) 

3 Dealer’s Licence — original issue (1 year) .................... 305 

3 Dealer’s Licence — renewal (1 year) ............................. 75 

3 Repairer’s Licence — original issue (1 year) ................. 305 

3 Repairer’s Licence — renewal (1 year) .......................... 57 

3 Manufacturer’s Licence — original issue (1 year) ......... 305 

3 Manufacturer’s Licence — renewal (1 year) ................... 57 

3 Shooting Gallery Licence — original issue (1 year) ............. 197 

3 Shooting Gallery Licence — renewal (1 year) ................ 59 

4 Ammunition Collector’s Licence — original issue (5 years) .. 187 

4 Ammunition Collector’s Licence — renewal (5 years) .. 54 
    ”. 

5. Regulation 5 amended 

  Regulation 5(1)(b) is amended by deleting “$39” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $41    ”. 

6. Regulation 7 amended 

  Regulation 7(5a) is amended by deleting “$15” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $16    ”. 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3003 

 

7. Regulation 8 amended 

  Regulation 8 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in subregulation (2) by deleting “$23.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $24.    ”; 

 (b) in subregulation (2a) by deleting “$15” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $16    ”. 

8. Regulation 11 amended 

  Regulation 11(1) is amended by deleting “$100” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $107    ”. 

9. Regulation 27 amended 

  Regulation 27(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$361” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $376    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 

PO302* 

Police Act 1892 

Police (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Police (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2005. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2005. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Police (Fees) 
Regulations 1981*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 20 August 1999. 
  For amendments to 14 June 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 304.] 



3004 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

  Regulation 3 is amended by deleting the full stop at the end of 
the definition of “accident” and inserting instead —  

“     
  ; 
 “department” means the department of the Public 

Service principally assisting the Minister in the 
administration of the Act; 

 “road traffic conviction record”, in respect of a 
person, means the record held in the department of 
the person’s convictions against the Road Traffic 
Act 1974; 

 “traffic infringement notice record”, in respect of a 
person, means the record held in the department of 
infringement notices served on the person under 
the Road Traffic Act 1974 section 102. 

    ”. 

5. Schedule amended 

  The Schedule is amended as follows: 
 (a) by deleting items 1 to 4 and inserting instead —  

“     
1. Copies of a person’s traffic records —  

(a) road traffic conviction record fee ………
(b) infringement notice record fee ………….

 
$16.00 
$16.00 

1a. Copy of a notice of disqualification previously 
given to a person under section 103 of the Road 
Traffic Act 1974 ………………………………

 
 

$16.00 
2. Escorts and Guards —  
 (a) each person provided per hour and part 

thereof for — 
 

  (i) high risk escorts carried out by 
TRG ……………………………...

 
$74.30 

  (ii) emergency escorts ………………. $89.30 
  (iii) other escorts ……………………... $67.50 
 (b) per km rate for —   
  (i) motor vehicle ................................. 78.3 cents 
  (ii) motor cycle .................................... 26.3 cents 
 (c) booking fee (non-refundable, unless 

booking cancelled with at least 24 hours 
notice) …………………………………..

 
 

$115.00 
3. Photographs, authorised reproductions —  

(a) 5 or more from the same film, per 
photograph ……………………………...

(b) otherwise, per photograph ……………...

 
 

$9.50 
$16.00 

4. National police certificates, each —  
(a) for a volunteer …………………………..
(b) for an officer or employee in the Public 
 Service ………………………………….
(c) otherwise ………………………………..

 
$10.00 

 
$34.00 
$46.00 

    ”; 

 (b) in item 5 by deleting “$64.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $69.30    ”; 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3005 

 

 (c) in item 6 by deleting “$15.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    $16.00    ”; 

 (d) in item 7(a) by deleting “$27.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $29.50    ”; 

 (e) in item 7(b) by deleting “$22.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $29.50    ”; 

 (f) in item 8 by deleting “$27.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $29.50    ”; 

 (g) after item 8 by inserting the following item —  

 “     
9. Replacement of prosecution documents —  

(a) a statement of the material facts of a 
 charge, which has already been served 
 (per hour or part of an hour) …………… 
(b) additional copy of documents already 
 disclosed (per hour or part of an hour) … 

 
 
 

$69.30 
 

$69.30 
    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

 
——————————— 

 
 

PO303* 

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers Act 1994 

Pawnbrokers and Second-hand Dealers 
Amendment Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Pawnbrokers and Second-hand 
Dealers Amendment Regulations 2005. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 September 2005. 



3006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Pawnbrokers 
and Second-hand Dealers Regulations 1996*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 2 March 2001. 
  For amendments to 10 June 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 277-8.] 

4. Regulation 28 amended 

  The Table to regulation 28 is deleted and the following Table is 
inserted instead —  

“     
Table — Fees for issue of licences 

 Licence 1 year or 
part 
thereof ($) 

2 years or 
part 
thereof ($) 

3 years or 
part 
thereof ($) 

1. Pawnbroker’s licence only 403 679 953 

2. Second-hand dealer’s licence 
only (computer option) 

 
368 

 
618 

 
868 

3. Second-hand dealer’s licence 
only (facsimile option) 

 
473 

 
875 

 
1 275 

4. Pawnbroker’s licence and 
second-hand dealer’s licence 

 
457 

 
734 

 
1 009 

    ”. 

5. Regulation 29 amended 

  The Table to regulation 29 is deleted and the following Table is 
inserted instead —  

“     
Table — Fees for renewal of licences 

 Licence 1 year or 
part  
thereof ($) 

2 years or 
part 
thereof ($) 

3 years or 
part 
thereof ($) 

1. Pawnbroker’s licence only 297 576 856 

2. Second-hand dealer’s licence 
only (computer option) 

 
272 

 
526 

 
780 

3. Second-hand dealer’s licence 
only (facsimile option) 

 
436 

 
836 

 
1 235 

4. Pawnbroker’s licence and 
second-hand dealer’s licence 

 
318 

 
618 

 
899 

    ”. 

6. Regulation 31 amended 

  Regulation 31 is amended by deleting “$10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $11    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3007 

 

TREASURY AND FINANCE 

TF301* 

 
Financial Administration and Audit Act 1985 

Financial Administration and Audit 
(Designation of Statutory Authorities) 

Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 4(2) of 
the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Financial Administration and Audit 
(Designation of Statutory Authorities) Regulations 2005. 

2. The Act amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Financial 
Administration and Audit Act 1985*. 

 [* Reprint 8 as at 9 July 2004. 
  For subsequent amendments see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 1, p. 165 and 
Gazette 4 February 2005.] 

3. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “Midland College of TAFE” and “South 
East Metropolitan College of TAFE”; 

 (b) by inserting in the appropriate alphabetical position —   

  “    Swan TAFE    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 

 
 
 



3008 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

WATER/SEWERAGE 

WA301* 

Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 

Water Agencies (Charges) Amendment 
By-laws (No. 3) 2005 

Made by the Minister under section 34(1). 

1. Citation 

  These by-laws are the Water Agencies (Charges) Amendment 
By-laws (No. 3) 2005. 

2. Commencement 

  These by-laws come into operation on 1 July 2005. 

3. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in these by-laws are to the Water Agencies 
(Charges) By-laws 1987*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 9 May 2003. 
  For amendments to 27 June 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 435 and 
Gazette 13 May 2005.] 

4. By-law 8A amended 

 (1) By-law 8A(1) is repealed and the following sub-bylaws are 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (1) This by-law does not apply —  

 (a) to a person who registers an entitlement to a 
rebate under the Rates and Charges (Rebates 
and Deferments) Act 1992 in respect to a unit in 
a retirement village; or 

 (b) to a unit in a retirement village once a person 
has registered an entitlement to a rebate under 
the Rates and Charges (Rebates and 
Deferments) Act 1992. 

 (1a) Where a person was liable, immediately prior to 
1 July 2005, to pay a charge under —  

 (a) Schedule 1 item 1; 

 (b) Schedule 3 item 8; 

 (c) Schedule 3 item 10(a); or 

 (d) Schedule 4 item 3, 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3009 

 

  to these by-laws in respect of a unit in a retirement 
village and that person is liable on or after 1 July 2005 
to pay that charge in respect of that unit, the person is 
to be allowed a concession in respect of the charge in 
accordance with sub-bylaw (2). 

    ”. 

 (2) By-law 8A(2) is amended by deleting “in sub-bylaw (1)” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    in sub-bylaw (1a)    ”. 

J. KOBELKE, Minister Assisting the Minister for Water Resources. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

WA302* 

Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 

Water Agencies Amendment By-laws 2005 

Made by the Minister under section 34(1) of the Act. 

Part 1 — Preliminary 

1. Citation 

  These by-laws are the Water Agencies Amendment 
By-laws 2005. 

2. Commencement 

  These by-laws come into operation on 1 July 2005. 

3. Application 

  Nothing in these by-laws affects the application after 1 July 2005 
of a by-law in force before that day in so far as that by-law relates 
to a fee or charge for a period commencing before that day or to a 
fee or charge for any matter or thing done before that day. 

Part 2 — Carnarvon Irrigation District By-laws 
amended 

4. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in this Part are to the Carnarvon Irrigation 
District By-laws*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 8 August 2003.] 



3010 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

5. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended by deleting “74.50” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    78.00    ”. 

 

Part 3 — Country Areas Water Supply 
By-laws 1957 amended 

6. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in this Part are to the Country Areas Water 
Supply By-laws 1957*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 3 August 2001. 
  For amendments to 22 June 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 429-30, 
and Gazette 26 April 2005.] 

7. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 is amended by deleting items 2 to 10 and inserting 
the following items instead — 

“     

2. Meter testing —  

  Meter size —   

  20 or 25 mm ....................................................... 78.00 

  40 mm and over .................................................. actual cost 

3. Minimum fee in respect of turning or cutting off the 
water supply ............................................................... 

 
105.00 

 Minimum fee in respect of reduction or restoration 
of water supply — 

 

  (a) between 7.00 a.m. and 4.00 p.m. any day 
except Saturdays, Sundays and public 
holidays ......................................................... 

 
 

105.00 

  (b) at any other time ............................................ 166.50 

4.  (a) Reading of meter ........................................... 12.20 

  (b) Urgent reading of meter ................................ 41.10 

  (c) Electronic lodgment of a combined request 
for a single statement, reading of meter and 
orders and requisitions .................................. 

 
 

32.45 

  (d) Electronic lodgment of a combined request 
for a single statement, urgent reading of 
meter and orders and requisitions ................. 

 
 

61.50 

  (e) Lodgment other than under paragraph (c) of 
a combined request for a single statement, 
reading of meter and orders and requisitions  

 
 

55.50 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3011 

 

  (f) Lodgment other than under paragraph (d) of 
a combined request for a single statement, 
urgent reading of meter and orders and 
requisitions .................................................... 

 
 
 

84.50 

  (g) Provision of information other than under 
paragraphs (a) to (f) involving research or 
investigation of 15 minutes or more — per 
hour or part of an hour .................................. 

 
 
 

66.45 

5. Fee under section 43A in respect of land on which it 
is proposed to — 

 

  (a) construct a new single residential building or 
alter an existing single residential building  

106.00 
(per residential 

unit) 

  (b) construct or alter a building other than a 
residential building — an amount based on 
the cost of the construction or alteration as 
assessed by the Corporation, of — 

 

  over $22 500 but not over $200 000 ........……. 85.00 

  over $200 000 but not over $500 000 ......……. 330.00 

  over $500 000 but not over $1 000 000 ......….. 550.00 

  over $1 000 000 but not over $10 000 000 …... 0.90 
(per $1 000 of 
construction) 

  over $10 000 000 ........................................... 0.25 
(per $1 000 of 
construction) 

6. Supply of copy of, or extract from, records or plans 
(other than those stored in digital format) under 
section 102(3) of the Water Agencies (Powers) 
Act 1984 (provided on A4 paper) ............................... 

 
 
 

11.00 

7. Re-sealing of private fire service connection under 
by-law 98(5) ............................................................... 

 
69.30 

8. Fee for relocation of water supply connection (less 
than 500 mm) — 

 

  (a) where the connection size is —  

  20 mm ............................................................ 123.50 

  25 mm ............................................................ 146.00 

  40 mm ............................................................ 191.50 

  50 mm ............................................................ 248.50 

  (b) other sizes, an amount equal to the actual 
cost of relocation 

 

9.  (a) Fee for fixing a meter under by-law 77(3) .... 258.50 

  (b) Fee for assessing a meter under  
by-law 77(5) .................................................. 

 
184.50 

  (c) Fee for assessing a meter and fixing a new 
meter under by-law 77(6) .............................. 

 
241.00 

10. Fee for installation of a temporary building  
standpipe .................................................................... 

 
99.50 

    ”. 



3012 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

 (2) Schedule 2 is amended by deleting items 13 and 14 and 
inserting the following items instead —  

“     

13. Fees for authorisation of materials, fittings and 
fixtures — 

 

  (a) application —  

  (i) first item of product type .......................... 452.10 

  (ii) each additional item of product type ........ 63.25 

  (b) examination, testing, inspection or evaluation 
(per hour or part of an hour) ............................ 

 
104.50 

14. Minimum fee for application for disconnection or 
reconnection of water supply under by-law 96 — on 
redevelopment or subdivision ....................................... 

 
 

149.00 
    ”. 

 

Part 4 — Country Towns Sewerage 
By-laws 1952 amended 

8. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in this Part are to the Country Towns 
Sewerage By-laws 1952*. 

 [* Reprint 4 as at 29 April 2005.] 

9. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 Division 1 item 1 is amended by deleting “15.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    15.35    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 2 is amended by deleting Division 2 and inserting the 
following Division instead —  

“     
Division 2 — Fees under section 41A 

[bl. 29(1)(b)] 
  $ 
4. In respect of land on which it is proposed to —  

  (a) construct a new single residential building or 
alter an existing single residential building  

106.00 
(per residential 

unit) 

  (b) construct an outbuilding to a single residential 
building (including a pool, garage or pergola)  

 
31.00 

  (c) construct or alter a building other than a 
residential building — an amount based on 
the cost of the construction or alteration as 
assessed by the Corporation, of — 

 

  up to $22 500 .............................................. 25.00 

  over $22 500 but not over $200 000 ........……. 85.00 

  over $200 000 but not over $500 000 ......……. 330.00 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3013 

 

  $ 

  over $500 000 but not over $1 000 000 ......….. 550.00 

  over $1 000 000 but not over $10 000 000 …... 0.90  
(per $1 000 of 
construction) 

  over $10 000 000 ........................................... 0.25  
(per $1 000 of 
construction) 

    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 2 is amended by deleting Division 4 and inserting the 
following Division instead —  

“     
Division 4 — Statements and information 

[bl. 224] 

  $ 

7. Electronic lodgment of a combined request for a 
copy of any portion of the records kept under 
s. 69A of the Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984 
and answers to orders and requisitions in relation to 
land ........................................................................... 32.45

8. Lodgment other than under item 7 of a combined 
request for a copy of any portion of the records kept 
under s. 69A of the Water Agencies (Powers) 
Act 1984 and answers to orders and requisitions in 
relation to land .......................................................... 55.50

9. Provision of information other than under items 7 
or 8 that involves research or investigation of 
15 minutes or more — per hour or part of an hour ... 66.45

    ”. 

 (4) Schedule 2 is amended by deleting Divisions 6, 7 and 8 and 
inserting the following Divisions instead —  

“     
Division 6 — Fees for authorisation of materials, fittings 

and fixtures 

[bl. 49(3)(c) and (7)] 

  $ 

12. Application fee —   

  (a) for first item of product type ........................ 452.10

  (b) for each additional item of product type ...... 63.25

13. Examination, testing, inspection or evaluation (per 
hour or part of an hour) ............................................. 104.50

Division 7 — Fees for the provision of plan sheets for 
preparation of diagrams of property sewer installations 

[bl. 18B(1)(a)] 
 $ 
14. A4 size (per pad of 25 sheets) .................................. 4.95 
15. A3 size (per pad of 25 sheets) .................................. 8.80 
16. A1 size (per sheet) .................................................... 1.65 



3014 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

Division 8 — Minimum fees for installation of 
sewer junction 

[bl. 230(1)] 

  $ 

17. 100 mm sewer junction ............................................. 320.50

18. 150 mm sewer junction ............................................. 396.50
    ”. 

 

Part 5 — Metropolitan Water Authority (Miscellaneous) 
By-laws 1982 amended 

10. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in this Part are to the Metropolitan Water 
Authority (Miscellaneous) By-laws 1982*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 17 May 2002. 
  For amendments to 22 June 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 431-2.] 

11. Schedule 2 replaced 

  Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead — 

“     
Schedule 2 — Charges 

[bl. 9(1), (2) and (6) and 11(2)] 

  $ 

1. Meter testing deposit —  

  (a) where the meter size is 20-25 mm ....................... 78.00

  (b) where the meter is any greater size, an amount 
equal to the actual cost of testing the meter 

 

2. Charges for fixing water supply and fire fighting 
connections — 

 

  (a) within a central business district as described in 
Schedule 3 where the connection size is — 

 

   20 mm .........................................................……. 623.00

   25 mm .......................................................……... 911.00

   40 mm .........................................................……. 1 390.00

   50 mm ........................................................…….. 1 694.00

   100 mm ...................…................................……. 3 190.00

   150 mm .......................................................……. 3 789.00

  (b) otherwise, an amount equal to the actual cost of 
fixing the connection 

 

3. Charge for —  

   disconnection ..............................................……. 105.00

   reconnection ...............................................…….. 105.00



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3015 

 

  $ 

4. Charge for relocation of water supply connection (less 
than 500 mm) — 

 

  (a) where the connection size is —   

   20 mm .................................................................. 123.50

   25 mm .................................................................. 146.00

   40 mm .................................................................. 191.50

   50 mm .................................................................. 248.50

  (b) other sizes, an amount equal to the actual cost of 
relocation 

 

    ”. 

12. Schedule 6 amended 

 (1) Schedule 6 is amended by deleting item 1 and inserting the 
following item instead — 

“     
1.  (a) Reading of meter .................................................... 12.20 

  (b) Urgent reading of meter ......................................... 41.10 

  (c) Electronic lodgment of a combined request for a 
single statement, reading of meter and orders and 
requisitions ............................................................. 

 
 

32.45 

  (d) Electronic lodgment of a combined request for a 
single statement, urgent reading of meter and 
orders and requisitions ........................................... 

 
 

61.50 

  (e) Lodgment other than under paragraph (c) of a 
combined request for a single statement, reading 
of meter and orders and requisitions ...................... 

 
 

55.50 

  (f) Lodgment other than under paragraph (d) of a 
combined request for a single statement, urgent 
reading of meter and orders and requisitions ......... 

 
 

84.50 

  (g) Provision of information other than under 
paragraphs (a) to (f) involving research or 
investigation of 15 minutes or more — per hour or 
part of an hour ........................................................ 

 
 
 

66.45 
    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 6 is amended by deleting items 3, 4, 5 and 6 and 
inserting the following items instead — 

“     
3. Hydrant standpipes —  

  (a) application fee ................................................... 82.00 

  (b) hire fee for a month —  

   small metered standpipe .................................... 140.00 

   large metered standpipe ..................................... 255.50 

  (c) hire fee for part of a month is as for a month 
apportioned to reflect the number of days 
hiring 

 

4.  (a) Reconnection ..................................................... 105.00 



3016 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

  (b) Restoration —  

 (i) between 7.00 a.m. and 4.00 p.m. any day 
except Saturdays, Sundays, and public 
holidays ....................................................... 

 
 

105.00 

 (ii) at any other time .......................................... 166.50 

5. Fee under section 148 of Metropolitan Water Supply, 
Sewerage, and Drainage Act 1909 in respect of land 
on which it is proposed to — 

 

  (a) construct a new single residential building or 
alter an existing single residential building  

 
106.00 

(per residential 
unit) 

  (b) construct an outbuilding to a single residential 
building located in a sewered area (including a 
pool, garage or pergola) ………………………. 

 
 

31.00 

  (c) construct or alter a building other than a 
residential building — an amount based on 
the cost of the construction or alteration as 
assessed by the Corporation, of — 

 

  up to $22 500 (in a sewered area) ............…… 31.00 

  over $22 500 but not over $200 000 ........……... 106.00 

  over $200 000 but not over $500 000 ......……... 420.00 

  over $500 000 but not over $1 000 000 ......……. 680.00 

  over $1 000 000 but not over $10 000 000 ……. 1.10 
(per $1 000 of 
construction) 

  over $10 000 000 ...................................…….. 0.30 
(per $1 000 of 
construction) 

6. Fee for application for disconnection or reconnection 
of water supply under by-law 9(5a) — on 
redevelopment or subdivision ...............................……. 

 
 

149.00 
    ”. 

 

Part 6 — Metropolitan Water Supply, Sewerage and 
Drainage By-laws 1981 amended 

13. The by-laws amended 

  The amendments in this Part are to the Metropolitan Water 
Supply, Sewerage and Drainage By-laws 1981*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 17 August 2001. 
  For amendments to 22 June 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 253, and 
Gazette 26 April 2005.] 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3017 

 

14. Schedule C replaced 

  Schedule C is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule C — Fees 

  $ 

1. Fee in respect of a proposal to connect plumbing to 
the sewer ……..………………………………...……. 

 
15.35 

2. Fee for installation of sewer junction — 

   100 mm sewer junction ...............................… 320.50 

   150 mm sewer junction ...............................… 396.50 

3. Fees for authorisation of materials, fittings and 
fixtures — 

  (a) application — 

   (i) first item of product type ......................... 452.10 

   (ii) each additional item of product type ....... 63.25 

  (b) examination, testing, inspection or evaluation 
(per hour or part of an hour) .......................... 

 
104.50 

5.  (a) Fee for installing a meter under 
by-law 6.7.1A.1 ...........................................…. 

 
258.50 

  (b) Fee for assessing a meter under 
by-law 6.7.1A.3 ............................................. 

 
184.50 

  (c) Fee for assessing a meter and installing a new 
meter under by-law 6.7.1A.4 ......................... 

 
241.00 

6. Fee for installation of a temporary building standpipe .... 99.50 

9. Fees for the provision of plan sheets for preparation of 
diagrams of property sewer installations — 

  (a) A4 size (per pad of 25 sheets) ....................... 4.95 

  (b) A3 size (per pad of 25 sheets) ....................... 8.80 

  (c) A1 size (per sheet) ......................................... 1.65 
    ”. 

J. KOBELKE, Minister Assisting the Minister for Water Resources. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 



3018 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

— PART 2 — 

BOTANIC GARDENS AND PARKS AUTHORITY 
BX401* 

BOTANIC GARDENS AND PARKS AUTHORITY ACT 1998 
BOTANIC GARDENS AND PARKS AUTHORITY 
Bold Park Draft Management Plan 2005-2010 

The Authority gives notice, consistent with the Botanic Gardens and Parks Authority Act 1998, of the 
release of the Bold Park Draft Management Plan 2005-2010 for the statutory two month public 
comment period. 
Bold Park is a large coastal remnant bushland reserve near Floreat in Perth. The Park provides a 
haven for biodiversity, an important ecological corridor, and opportunities for environmental 
education and passive recreation. The Draft Plan identifies objectives; achievements and progress for 
the past five years; revisions/improvements to the existing plan; future directions and strategies for 
management; and, priorities for the next five years.  
Copies of the Draft Plan are available from the Authority website www.bgpa.wa.gov.au. Copies for 
viewing and comments books are located at Bold Park Administration (165 Perry Lakes Drive, 
Floreat); Kings Park and Botanic Garden Administration (Fraser Avenue, West Perth); Town of 
Cambridge Administration (1 Bold Park Drive, Floreat); City of Nedlands Administration (71 Stirling 
Hwy, Nedlands); and, Cambridge Library (99 The Boulevard, Floreat). 
Written submissions on the Draft Plan should be addressed to the Planning Officer, Botanic Gardens 
and Parks Authority, Fraser Avenue, West Perth WA 6005; faxed to (08) 9322 5064; or, emailed to 
planning@bgpa.wa.gov.au. Please provide your name and contact details, clearly legible, for 
submission validation. Submissions will not be accepted by telephone.  
The closing date for submissions is 5:00pm Wednesday, 31 August 2005. 

MARK WEBB, Chief Executive Officer, 
Botanic Gardens and Parks Authority. 

CONSERVATION 
CO401* 

CONSERVATION AND LAND MANAGEMENT ACT 1984 
JURIEN BAY MARINE PARK MANAGEMENT PLAN 

Under section 14(9) of the Conservation and Land Management Act 1984 (CALM Act) notice is given 
that the indicative management plan for the Jurien Bay Marine Park has been approved by the 
Minister for the Environment. 
The indicative management plan was prepared in accordance with sections 13 to 14 of the CALM Act 
and was approved, with modifications, by the Minister for the Environment on 8 July 2004. The 
indicative management plan, called the Jurien Bay Marine Park Management Plan, comes into 
operation on the day of publication of this notice in the Gazette. 
The indicative management plan was approved by the Minister for the Environment under section 
14(7) of the CALM Act with the following modifications— 
 • The boundaries of the following zones have been modified (reasons for modification in 

parentheses)— 
  North Head Sanctuary Zone (to permit fishing along southern shoreline); 
  Special Purpose (Scientific Reference) Zones and Special Purpose (Shore-Based 

Activities) Zones (to simplify the zoning scheme in relation to compliance); and 
  Booker Rocks Sanctuary Zone (to simplify the zoning scheme in relation to compliance). 
 • A part of the proposed North Head Sanctuary Zone was changed to become a Special Purpose 

(Shore-Based Activities) Zone to allow for shore-based fishing to continue in this area. 
 • Other minor changes were made to the boundaries of some zones to simplify the zoning 

scheme, increase ease of compliance by users and so increase management cost effectiveness. 
Where these changes were made, the original intent of the plan is maintained. 

 • There were amendments to the permitted activities table for the zoning scheme to reflect the 
changes to the zoning scheme, practical compliance issues and other issues raised through 
the review of public submissions. 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3019 

 

 • New management strategies were inserted for some ecological and social values. 
 • There were some amendments to the management strategies, management objectives and 

long-term management targets for some values.  
 • Direct management intervention (Section 8.7) was inserted. 
 • Provision for a mooring plan for the marine park was added (Section 9). 
 • Some minor changes were made to the text of the indicative management plan e.g. structure 

of document, formatting, minor text amendments, and timeline for implementation of 
management strategies. 

Copies of the Jurien Bay Marine Park Management Plan can be inspected at the offices and libraries 
of the Shires of Dandaragan and Coorow. Copies of the Plan and the Analysis of Submissions can also 
be inspected at the following Department of Conservation and Land Management offices— 
 • State Operational Headquarters, 17 Dick Perry Avenue, Technology Park, Western Precinct, 

Kensington WA 6151 
 • Marine Conservation Branch, 47 Henry St, Fremantle WA 6160 
 • Midwest Regional Office, 1st Floor Foreshore Centre, 201 Foreshore Drive, Geraldton WA 

6530 
 • Jurien District Office, Lot 124 Bashford Street, Jurien Bay WA 6516 
 • Cervantes Office, Bradley Loop, Light Industrial Area, Cervantes WA 6511 
The Jurien Bay Marine Park Management Plan and an analysis of public submissions can also be 
viewed on the Department of Conservation and Land Management’s Naturebase website at 
http://www.naturebase.net 

KEIRAN McNAMARA, Executive Director. 
Department of Conservation and Land Management. 

EDUCATION 
ED401 

VOCATIONAL EDUCATION AND TRAINING ACT 1996 
APPOINTMENTS 

Made by the Minister for Education and Training under section 19(a) of the Vocational Education and 
Training Act 1996. 

Citation 
1. This is the State Training Board (Appointment of Members) Instrument 2005. 
2. The persons whose names are listed below, namely— 
 • Ms Lyn Sherwood, 36 Halesworth Road, Jolimont WA; 
 • Mr Bill McKenzie, c/- The Goldfields-Esperance Development Authority, Kalgoorlie WA; 
 • Mr Denis McInerney, c/- McInerney Ford, Walter Road, Morley WA; 
 • Mr Guiseppe (Joe) Passione, 15 Sycamore Rise, Dianella WA; 
are appointed members of the State Training Board for the period commencing on 1 July 2005 and 
ending on 30 June 2008. 
Dated this 22nd day of June 2005. 

LJILJANNA RAVLICH MLC, Minister for Education and Training. 

JUSTICE 
JU401* 

PRISONS ACT 1981 
PERMIT DETAILS 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Director General of the 
Department of Justice has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 
Hide David John AP0331 01/07/05 
Robinson Tracey Anne AP0216 01/07/05 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager, Acacia Prison Contract. 
29 June 2005. 



3020 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
SHIRE OF DONNYBROOK/BALINGUP 

APPOINTMENT OF RANGER 
It is hereby notified for public information that: 
Mr Graham George Chester is appointed to the position of Ranger for the Shire of 
Donnybrook/Balingup from 24 June 2005 as an authorized officer for the following— 
 (a) Local Government Act 
 (b) Dog Act 
 (c) Litter Act 
 (d) Bush Fires Act 
 (e) Control of Off-Road Vehicle (Off-Road Areas) Act 
 (f) All council local laws 

JOHN ATTWOOD, Chief Executive Officer. 
24 June 2005 
 

——————————— 
 

LG402 
DOG ACT 1976 

Shire of Cuballing 
APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that Jenna Lyne Hewett has been appointed as a Dog 
Registration Officer for the Shire of Cuballing. 
The appointment of Carol Anne McQueen is hereby cancelled. 

PETER NAYLOR, Chief Executive Officer. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
SURRENDER OF EXPLORATION PERMIT WA-307-P 

The surrender of Exploration Permit No. WA-307-P has been registered and will take effect on the 
date this Notice appears in the Government Gazette. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum & Royalties Division. 
 

——————————— 
 

MP402* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
NOTICE OF GRANT OF EXPLORATION PERMITS 

Exploration Permit Nos. WA-362-P and WA-363-P have been granted to Octanex NL of 25th Floor, 
500 Collins Street, Melbourne VIC 3000; Strata Resources NL of 25th Floor, 500 Collins Street, 
Melbourne VIC 3000 and Gascorp Australia Ltd of 25th Floor, 500 Collins Street, Melbourne VIC 
3000 to have effect for a period of six (6) years from 22 June 2005. 
Exploration Permit Nos. WA-364-P to WA-367-P have been granted to ChevronTexaco of Level 24, 
QV1 Building, 250 St. George’s Terrace, Perth WA 6000 and Shell Development (Australia) Pty Ltd of 
Level 28, QV1 Building, 250 St. George’s Terrace, Perth WA 6000 to have effect for a period of six (6) 
years from 28 June 2005. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3021 

 

MP403 
MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURE 

Department of Industry & Resources, 
Perth WA 6000. 

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of Section 96A(1) and of the Mining Act 1978 that 
the undermentioned mining tenements are forfeited for breach of covenant viz; non payment of rent. 

ALAN CARPENTER, MLA, Minister for State Development. 

———— 

NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD 
EXPLORATION LICENCE 

36/505 Gough, Roger East Murchison 
40/191 McKnight, Russell Geoffrey North Coolgardie 
77/1062 Kent, Mark Yilgarn 
80/2711 Kimberley Rose Australia Ltd Kimberley 
80/2714 Kimberley Rose Australia Ltd Kimberley 
80/2715 Kimberley Rose Australia Ltd Kimberley 
 

——————————— 
 
MP405 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Industry and 
Resources, Leonora. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act 
1978, for breach of covenant, viz, failure to lodge a report within the prescribed period. 

K. AUTY (SM), Warden. 

———— 
To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 27th July 2005. 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Morgans District 

Prospecting Licences 
P39/2493—Blackley, Keer Thomas 
P39/2748—Blackley, Keer Thomas 
P39/3997—Heke, Matini Raymond 
P39/4229—Kos, Vaso 
 

——————————— 
 
MP404 

MINING ACT 1978 
APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 

Department of Industry 
and Resources, Leonora. 

In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining Act 
1978, for breach of covenant, viz, failure to comply with the prescribed expenditure conditions. 

K. AUTY (SM), Warden. 

———— 
To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 27th July 2005. 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Malcolm District 

Prospecting Licences 
P37/6248—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P37/6249—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P37/6250—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P37/6251—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P37/6262— Quantum Resources Ltd 



3022 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

MOUNT MARGARET DISTRICT 
Prospecting Licences 

P38/2896—Fargo Resources Pty Ltd 
P38/2897—Fargo Resources Pty Ltd 
P38/2898—Fargo Resources Pty Ltd 
P38/2899—Fargo Resources Pty Ltd 
P38/2900—Fargo Resources Pty Ltd 
P38/2901—Fargo Resources Pty Ltd 

MOUNT MORGANS DISTRICT 
Prospecting Licences 

P39/4211—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P39/4212—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 
P39/4213—Axis Consultants Pty Ltd 

PARLIAMENT 
PA401* 

PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
Royal Assent To Bill 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor has Assented in the name and on behalf 
of Her Majesty the Queen, on the date shown, to the undermentioned Bill passed by the Legislative 
Council and the Legislative Assembly during the First Session of the Thirty-Seventh Parliament. 

Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No. 
Financial Administration Legislation Amendment Bill 2005 June 27 2005 5 of 2005 

PETER J. McHUGH, Acting Clerk of the Parliaments. 
June 27 2005. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI402* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Town of Cottesloe 

Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 36 
Ref: 853/2/3/5 Pt 36  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
Town of Cottesloe town planning scheme amendment on 23 June 2005 for the purpose of amending 
Appendix 1—Town Centre Zone Development Policy Plan by— 
 1. Adding a new category of uses in the legend, which permits “Showrooms, Offices, 

Restaurants, Service Industries and Retail uses”. 
        2. (i) removing the existing stippled highlighting for Nos 10 (Lot 10 Station Street) through 

to and including No 16 (Part Lot 7 and Lot 6) Station Street; and 
 (ii) including those properties identified in Part b)(i) in the newly created category of uses 

in Part a); and 
 (iii) transferring No 19 (Lot 51) Station Street from the Hotel Use classification to the 

Retail Uses classification.  

K. MORGAN, Mayor. 
S. TINDALE, Chief Executive Officer. 

 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3023 

 

PI401* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Canning 

Town Planning Scheme No. 40—Amendment No. 123 
Ref: 853/2/16/44 Pt 123  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
City of Canning town planning scheme amendment on 23 June 2005 for the purpose of zoning the 
north-western half portion of Radium Street (between Channon & Sevenoaks Streets), General 
Industry and the south-eastern half portion of Radium Street (between Channon & Sevenoaks 
Streets), Residential R17.5/R30; and including Canning Location Pt 2, Lots 5-9, 11-15 and Pt 25 
Radium Street, Cannington, in Appendix 5—Schedule of Additional or Prohibited Uses as follows— 

Uses which may be prohibited or 
permitted in addition to those 
permitted by the Zoning Table 

No 

Lot No Address 

Additional Uses Prohibited 
Uses 

Additional 
Development 
Requirements 

94 South-eastern 
on portion of 
Radium 
Street 
(between 
Channon & 
Sevenoaks 
Streets), 
Canning 
Location Pt 2, 
Lots 5-9, 11-
15 and Pt 25 
Radium 
Street 

57-85 
Radium 
Street, 
Cannington 

Office, 
Education 
Establishment, 
Car Parking, and 
Enclosed Storage 

 Development is to be 
in accordance with an 
Outline Development 
Plan approved by 
Council and designed 
to minimise the 
impact on adjoining 
residential properties. 

M. S. LEKIAS, Mayor. 
D. CARBONE, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
——————————— 

 
PI403* 

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

Shire of Kalamunda 
District Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 229 

Ref: 853/2/24/16 Pt 229  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
Shire of Kalamunda town planning scheme amendment on 23 June 2005 for the purpose of inserting 
in Appendix D to the Scheme Text— 

LESCHENAULTIA WAY, MAIDA VALE 
(3) Lot 86 
Place of Worship 
The Additional Use is an “AA” use.  

E. TAYLOR, President. 
G. H. PARSLOW, Acting Chief Executive Officer. 

 
——————————— 

 
PI404* 

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

City of Nedlands 
Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 159 

Ref: 853/2/8/4 Pt 159  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
City of Nedlands town planning scheme amendment on 23 June 2005 for the purpose of— 
 1. Inserting into Schedule 1—Additional Use the following wording— 
  ‘Lot 478’, ‘(42) Alexander Road’, ‘Church Purposes’ 



3024 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

 2. Amending the Scheme Map to denote A102 on Lot 478 (42) Alexander Road, Dalkeith as 
shown on the Scheme Amendment.  

L. G. TAYLOR, Mayor. 
D. E. PRICE, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI405* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Stirling 

District Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 474 
Ref: 853/2/20/34 Pt 474  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
City of Stirling town planning scheme amendment on 23 June 2005 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lots 1 and 2, corner Lynn Street and Charles Riley Road, Trigg, from ‘Service 

Station’ and ‘Business’ to ‘Business’ and ‘Residential R40’.  
 2. Amending the Scheme Map accordingly.  

D. C. VALLELONGA, Mayor. 
L. DELAHAUNTY, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI406* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Town of Bassendean 

Town Planning Scheme No. 3—Amendment No. 67 
Ref: 853/2/13/3 Pt 67  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
Town of Bassendean town planning scheme amendment on 27 June 2005 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lots 9 & 10 Pearson Street from “Tavern” and “Service Station” to “Residential 

R20/30/40” and inclusion of the land within Special Control Area No 1—Development Areas.  
 2. Rezoning Lot 685 Jacqueline Street and Lot 7 Hardy Road from “Tavern” to “Residential 

R20”. 
 3. Amending the Scheme Map accordingly. 
 4. Amending Appendix XII by the inclusion of SCA-2— 

REF NO AREA PROVISIONS 
SCA-2 Lots 9 and 10 Pearson 

Street, Ashfield 
An approved Structure Plan together with 
all approved amendments shall apply to the 
land in order to guide subdivision and 
development. 

W. G. KLEIN, Mayor. 
G. EVERSHED, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI407* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Toodyay 

Town Planning Scheme No. 1—Amendment No. 57 
Ref: 853/4/28/2 Pt 57  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
Shire of Toodyay town planning scheme amendment on 27 June 2005 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lot 525 Nerramine Drive, Julimar, from “Rural 4—General Farming” to “Special 

Site”. 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3025 

 

 2. Adding to Schedule C, Town Planning Scheme No 1— 
Description of Site Permitted Uses and Provisions Applying to Special Sites 
Lot 525 Nerramine 
Drive, Julimar 

(i) The following uses may be approved at discretion of Council, 
following, if deemed necessary by Council, an advertising 
period of not less than 21 days: restaurant, winery, chalets, 
single dwelling and rural use. 

 (ii) Consideration will be given to the following when 
determining a development application for the site, to ensure 
the proposal is in keeping with the rural nature of the area— 
(a) Building design and location 
(b) Construction materials 
(c) Landscaping 
(d) Floor area, opening hours and capacity of the restaurant 
(e) Number of chalets 
(f) Traffic movements 
(g) Offsite impacts. 

A. HENSHAW, President. 
G. MERRICK, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

PI408* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of York 

Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 14 
Ref: 853/4/34/2 Pt 14  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act, 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
Shire of York town planning scheme amendment on 27 June 2005 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning Lot 46 Pool Street from ‘Public Purposes’ to ‘Special Use’—including the uses 

‘Residential’ and ‘Restaurant’. 
 2. Inserting at Schedule 3 specific land use and development requirements for the site— 

No. Particulars of Land Special Use Conditions 
3. Lot 46 Pool Street Residential 

and 
Restaurant 

1. Residential development restricted to 
one dwelling and comply with the 
setback requirements of the R2.5 
zone. 

2. In considering an application for 
planning consent for a proposed 
restaurant (including additions and 
alterations to existing development) 
the local government shall have 
regard to the following— 
(a) the colour and texture of 

external building materials; 
(b) building size, height, bulk, roof 

pitch; 
(c) setback and location of the 

building on its lot; 
(d) architectural style and design 

detail of the building; 
(e) the relationship to surrounding 

development; and 
(f) other characteristics considered 

by the local government to be 
relevant. 

J. D. GREGORY, President. 
R. P. HOOPER, Chief Executive Officer. 



3026 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

POLICE 

PO501* 
POLICE ACT 1892 
POLICE AUCTION 

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892, unclaimed and forfeited property and bicycles will be 
sold by public auction Ross’s Sales & Auctions, 241 Railway Parade, Maylands on Wednesday 
20 July 2005 at 10.00am. 
The auction is to be conducted by Mr Brad Buckle, Mr Craig Edwards and Mr Kevin Grickage. 

 K. O’CALLAGHAN, Commissioner of Police, 
Western Australia Police Service. 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PC401* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary appointments to act in the office of 
Minister for the Environment; Science in the absence of the Hon Dr J. M. Edwards MLA for the 
period 11 to 24 July 2005 (all dates inclusive)— 

Hon E. S. Ripper MLA—11 to 17 July 2005 
Hon M. McGowan MLA—18 to 24 July 2005 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG401* 
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988 

LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS 
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and 
required to be advertised. Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about 
the objection process, should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming and Liquor, 1st Floor, Hyatt 
Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant 
industry organisation. 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE 
10825 Constantinos 

Kontorinis 
Application for the grant of a Liquor Store 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Carey Park and known as Carey Park Liquor 
Store 

21/07/2005 

10827 Silver Ridge Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Restaurant 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Norseman and known as The Railway 

6/07/2005 

10829 AOC Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Wholesaler's 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Australind and known as AOC Pty Ltd 

8/07/2005 

10833 Boyanup Capel 
Dardanup Football 
Club Inc 

Application for the grant of a Club Restricted 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Eaton and known as Boyanup Capel 
Dardanup Football Club Inc 

11/07/2005 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3027 

 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE—continued 
10837 Sealife Charters Pty 

Ltd 
Application for the grant of a Special Facility 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Broome and known as Kharma IV 

4/08/2005

10838 Touraust Hotels Pty 
Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Restaurant 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Belmont and known as Inter City Motel 

11/07/2005

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS 
24123 Drillsense 

Consultants Pty Ltd 
Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Victoria Park 
East and known as Franklins Tavern 

13/07/2005

24163 Higgins Holdings 
Pty Ltd 

Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Perth and 
known as Hyde Park Hotel 

13/07/2005

24164 Warrungup Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Jurien and 
known as Jurien Bay Hotel Motel 

13/07/2005

24183 Bubba Nominees Pty 
Ltd 

Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Victoria Park 
East and known as Joe Black’s Bar and 
Restaurant 

11/07/2005

APPLICATIONS TO ADD, VARY OR CANCEL A CONDITION OF LICENCE 
225564 Nannup Tigers 

Football Club Inc 
Application to add, vary or cancel a condition 
of the Club Restricted licence in respect of 
premises situated in Nannup and known as 
Nannup Tigers Football Club Inc 

13/07/2005

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988. 

Dated: 29 June 2005. 
P. MINCHIN, Acting Director of Liquor Licensing. 

REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT 

RD401 
REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT COMMISSIONS ACT 1993 

APPOINTMENTS 
It is hereby notified for general information that the Minister for Peel and the South West has 
approved the appointment of the following as board members in accordance with Part 3 of the 
Regional Development Commissions Act 1993. 

SOUTH WEST DEVELOPMENT COMMISSION 

Board of Management 
 • Mr David Trench appointed as a community member for a term expiring on 31 October 2007. 

 • Mr John Bird appointed as a community member for a term expiring on 31 October 2007. 
 • Cr Maureen Thurston appointed as a local government member for a term expiring on 

31 October 2007. 



3028 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES TRIBUNAL 

SX401* 
SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES ACT 1975 

SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES TRIBUNAL 
Determination Variation 

The determination of the Salaries and Allowances Tribunal made on 7 April 2005 under sections 
6(1)(c), (d) and (e) of the Salaries and Allowances Act 1975, as amended from time to time, is hereby 
varied by a further determination, to make the amendment set out below— 

Insert in Part 1 of the First Schedule the following— 

AGENCY OFFICE CLASSIFICATION 
Department of Treasury and Finance Under Treasurer Group 4 Maximum 

plus an allowance of 10% of 
determined salary, subject to the 
pending review of positions overall 

Dated at Perth this 16th day of June 2005. 

J. A. S. MEWS, Member. 
M. L. NADEBAUM, Member. 

SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES TRIBUNAL 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their claims to the 
Executors, care of Butcher Paull & Calder, 8th Floor, 231 Adelaide Terrace, Perth WA 6000 (Ref: 
JMC/BWF) within one month of the date of publication hereof after which date the Executor may 
convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which they then have notice. 
Daniel, Ronald William late of Orange Grove Aged Care, 185 Maddington Road, Maddington formerly 

of 1 McWhae Place, Bull Creek WA, Retired RAAF Flight Lieutenant, died 27 February 2005. 
Hamilton, Coral Dorothy late of 57 Fifth Avenue, Roasmoyne WA, Nurse, died 29 April 2005. 
Nutter, Yvonne Lily late of 16 Wynyard Way, Thornlie WA, Typist, died 13 October 2003. 
O’Keefe, Tanya Louise late of 405 Belmont Avenue, Cloverdale WA, Marketing Executive, died 

29 April 2005. 
Short, Lila Irene late of Unit 44, 77 Clere Pass, Canning Vale WA, Bank Clerk, died 24 April 2005. 
Dated 23 June 2005. 

BUTCHER PAULL & CALDER, as solicitors for the Executor. 
 

——————————— 
 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased person Peter Richard Walmsley of 25 Coogee Road, Mount 
Pleasant, Western Australia who died on 4th June 2005 are required by the personal representative, 
Mr. Peter John Griffin of care of Peter J. Griffin & Co., Solicitors of Suite 4, 1st Floor, 48 Kishorn 
Road, Applecross, Western Australia, to send particulars of their claims to him not less than one 
month from the date of advertisement hereof, after which date the personal representative may 
convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the claims of which he then has notice. 

PETER GRIFFIN. 



1 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3029 

 

ZX403 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 

DECEASED ESTATES 
Notice to Creditors and Claimants 

Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before the 1st August 2005 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, 
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 

Ballintyne, Howard William, late of Hillview Terrace Bentley formerly of 31B Weeks Way Bull Creek, 
died 30.03.2005, (DE19610561EM26) 

Clarke, Marjorie Sholl, late of 37 Hastie Street Bunbury, died 03.04.2005, (DE30225300EM110) 

D’Ascenzo, Assunta Lucia, late of Greenmount Gardens Nursing Home 20 Coongan Avenue 
Greenmount, died 10.05.2005, (DE30313898EM26) 

Howells, Leonard John, late of Prinsep Street Collie, died 23.05.2005, (DE19790777EM38) 

Johnson, Albert, late of Cabrini Care Facility 111 Guildford Road Maylands, died 26.11.2004, 
(DE33014367EM16) 

Kearney, Daniel Patrick, late of 7 Heathcroft Road Balga, died 22.02.2005, (DE33031566EM34) 
Littler, Gary Wayne, late of 10 Malone Court Thornlie, died 19.05.2004, (DE33021857EM34) 

Meyers, Joseph Frederick Vincent, late of Hilltop Lodge Hillview Terrace Bentley formerly of Unit 
4/13 Talga Close Wilson, died 28.05.2005, (DE19972091EM17) 

Narkle, Clarkie Albert, late of Narrogin Nursing Home 52 Williams Road Narrogin, died 13.04.2005, 
(DE30307094EM17) 

Picton, William Joseph, late of 70-74 Fourth Avenue Shoalwater, died 11.07.2004, 
(DE33027819EM26) 

Rowland, Allan Robert Walter, late of J E Murray Home 16 Deerness Way Armadale formerly of 
51 Challis Road Armadale, died 16.06.2005, (DE19972592EM16) 

Spackman, Peter John, late of Ocean Gardens Retirement Village 221/60 Kalinda Drive City Beach, 
died 08.06.2005, (DE19831467EM34) 

Sweeny, Beryl Irene, late of Unit 69 10 Timbercrest Rise Woodvale, died 25.05.2005, 
(DE19941372EM15) 

Torrens, Elsie Mary, late of Clarence House 55 Hardie Road Albany, died 18.06.2005, 
(DE19570026EM16) 

White, Ruth Doreen, late of Room 405 Weston 18-20 Monash Avenue Nedlands, died 01.06.2005, 
(DE33030915EM17) 

ANTONINA ROSE McLAREN 
Public Trustee 

Public Trust Office 
565 Hay Street 
Perth WA 6000 

Telephone: 9222 6777 
 
 

——————————— 

 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

RETIREMENT VILLAGES ACT 1992 
Price: $8.75 counter sales 

Plus postage on 105 grams 

————— 

RETIREMENT VILLAGES REGULATIONS 1992 
*Price: $5.15 counter sales 

Plus postage on 40 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



3030 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1 July 2005 

 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES 

(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS) 
For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State 
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the 
missing item. 
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full. 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2006 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2006. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 845.90
  Interstate  ..................................... 862.40
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,178.00
 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,098.90
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 771.10
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 407.00
  Interstate ...................................... 484.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 558.00
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 333.30
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 803.00
  Interstate ...................................... 981.20
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 924.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 792.00
  Interstate ...................................... 804.10
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999  
 (per year) ........................................  821.70

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 287.10 
  Interstate ....................................... 319.00 
  Overseas ........................................ 295.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 789.80 

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)........................................ 286.00 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 309.10 
  Interstate ........................................ 319.00 
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 415.00 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA ...................................... 423.50 
  Interstate ....................................... 444.40 
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 601.00 

 

 

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is 
searchable. Other CD ROM products with 
legislation or other statutory information can 
be packaged to individual requirements.  
Prices are available on request. 

 

!200500125GG! 


