
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  3399 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 26 JULY 2005 No. 141 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984—Occupational Safety and Health Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2005 ........................................................................................................  3403 

Port Authorities Act 1999—Port Authorities Amendment Regulations 2005 ........................  3401 
Road Traffic Act 1974—Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2005 ......  3402 
 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Deceased Estates ...........................................................................................................................3410 
Health.............................................................................................................................................3406 
Justice.............................................................................................................................................3408 
Local Government..........................................................................................................................3408 
Regional Development ...................................................................................................................3409 
WorkSafe ........................................................................................................................................3410 
 
 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2005 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.90 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$53.45 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$53.45 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$10.70 

  Bulk Notices—$199.10 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



26 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3401 

 

— PART 1 — 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MX301* 

 

Port Authorities Act 1999 

Port Authorities Amendment Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Port Authorities Amendment 
Regulations 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Port Authorities 
Regulations 2001*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 20 May 2005.] 

3. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 Division 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 by deleting “$2 807.20” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $2 893.00    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “$1 403.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $1 446.50    ”; 

 (c) in item 3 by deleting “$701.80” and inserting instead —  

  “    $723.25    ”; 

 (d) in item 4 by deleting “$701.80” and inserting instead —  

  “    $723.25    ”. 



3402 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 July 2005 

 

 (2) Schedule 2 Division 2 is amended after item 4 by inserting the 
following item —  

“     
5. Cancellation of pilot boat crew only $723.25 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

TRANSPORT 

TR301* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2005 

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Licensing) Regulations 1975*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 20 September 2002. 
  For amendments to 20 June 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 357.] 

3. Regulation 21PB amended 

  Regulation 21PB(2) is amended by deleting “$28” in the 
2 places where it occurs and inserting instead in both places —  

  “    $53    ”. 

By Command of the deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



26 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3403 

 

WORKSAFE 

WS301* 

Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984 

Occupational Safety and Health Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2005 

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Occupational Safety and Health 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendment in these regulations is to the Occupational 
Safety and Health Regulations 1996*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 9 July 2004. 
  For amendments to 28 June 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 271 and 
Gazette 7 January, 4 March and 1 April 2005.] 

3. Part 3 Division 11 inserted 

  After regulation 3.134 the following Division is inserted —  

“     
Division 11 — Construction industry safety awareness 

training obligations 

3.135. Definitions 

  In this Division —  

 “approved safety awareness training course” 
means —  

 (a) a safety awareness training course accredited 
under section 27 of the Vocational Education 
and Training Act 1996; or 

 (b) a course accredited by the Commission 
under section 14(1)(h) of the Act for the 
purposes of this Division;  

 “current”, in relation to a safety awareness training 
certificate, has the meaning given in 
regulation 3.136(5); 

 “employee” includes a person who, under section 23D, 
23E or 23F of the Act, is treated as an employee 
for purposes set out in the section; 



3404 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 July 2005 

 

 “employer” includes a person who, under section 23D, 
23E or 23F of the Act, is treated as an employer 
for purposes set out in the section; 

 “safety awareness training certificate” means a 
certificate that —  

 (a) was issued by the provider of an approved 
safety awareness training course to a person 
named in the certificate; and 

 (b) certifies that on the date specified in the 
certificate the person satisfactorily 
completed the approved safety awareness 
training course; 

 “safety awareness training course” means a training 
course that includes at least 4 hours of instruction 
in —  

 (a) the rights and responsibilities under the Act 
and these regulations of persons who do 
construction work or employ persons who do 
such work; 

 (b) the hazards to which a person is likely to be 
exposed while doing construction work at a 
workplace; and 

 (c) how to apply risk control principles when 
doing construction work at the workplace; 

 “safety training induction certificate” means a 
certificate showing that, before 
31 December 2005, the holder of the certificate 
completed an induction course in safety awareness 
for construction work.  

3.136. Safety awareness training requirements 

 (1) During the period beginning on 1 January 2007 and 
ending on 31 December 2007, an employee or a 
self-employed person must not do construction work at 
the workplace unless the employee or self-employed 
person holds —  

 (a) a safety training induction certificate; or 

 (b) a current safety awareness training certificate. 

 Penalty: the regulation 1.15 penalty. 

 (2) During the period beginning on 1 January 2007 and 
ending on 31 December 2007, an employer, a main 
contractor or a person having control of the workplace 
must not permit an employee or a self-employed 
person to do construction work at the workplace unless 
the employee or self-employed person holds —  

 (a) a safety training induction certificate; or 

 (b) a current safety awareness training certificate. 



26 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3405 

 

 Penalty: the regulation 1.15 penalty. 

 (3) On or after 1 January 2008, an employee or a 
self-employed person must not do construction work at 
the workplace unless the employee or self-employed 
person holds a current safety awareness training 
certificate. 

 Penalty: the regulation 1.15 penalty. 

 (4) On or after 1 January 2008, an employer, a main 
contractor or a person having control of the workplace 
must not permit an employee or a self-employed 
person to do construction work at the workplace unless 
the employee or self-employed person holds a current 
safety awareness training certificate. 

 Penalty: the regulation 1.16 penalty. 

 (5) For the purposes of this Division —  

 (a) a safety awareness training certificate issued for 
an approved safety awareness training course 
that was completed by the holder of the 
certificate after the commencement of this 
Division but before 1 January 2007 remains 
current until 31 December 2009; and 

 (b) a safety awareness training certificate issued for 
an approved safety awareness training course 
that was completed by the holder of the 
certificate on or after 1 January 2007 remains 
current for 3 years after the day on which the 
course was completed. 

    ”. 

By Command of the deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

 



3406 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 July 2005 

 

— PART 2 — 

HEALTH 

HE401* 
POISONS ACT 1964 

POISONS (AUTHORIZED POSSESSION OF SUBSTANCES) 
AMENDMENT ORDER 2005 

Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council under section 41 of the Act. 

Citation 
1. This order may be cited as the Poisons (Authorized Possession of Substances) Amendment  
Order 2005. 

Commencement 
2. This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Gazette. 

Principal order 
3. In this order the Poisons (Authorized Possession of Substances) Order (No. 11) 2002* is referred to 
as the principal order. 
 [*Published in Gazette 24 September 2002, p. 4781-4782 and amended in Gazettes 10 January 2003, 

p. 35; 20 May 2003, p. 1794, and 4 May 2004, p. 1390] 

Clause 4 amended 
4. Clause 4 of the principal order is amended by deleting the following entry from the table to that 
clause— 

“ James Antony Hill, police officer, Canine Section, Western Australia Police Service,  
2 Swanbank Road, Maylands. ”. 

By Command of the deputy of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

——————————— 
 

HE402* 
HEALTH ACT 1911 

ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH OFFICERS  
(SECTION 31—QUALIFICATIONS FOR APPOINTMENT) NOTICE 2005 

Made by the Executive Director, Public Health under section 31. 

1. Citation 
This notice may be cited as the Environmental Health Officers (Section 31—Qualifications for 
Appointment) Notice 2005. 

2. Revocation 
This notice replaces the section 31 notice that was published in the Government Gazette on 
14 January 1983 at page 209. 

3. Certificates of competency 
The qualifications set out in the table to this clause are recognised as being the certificates of 
competency for the purposes of section 31 of the Health Act 1911. 

TABLE 
QUALIFICATION INSTITUTION 

Royal Society of Health Diploma of Health 
Inspection. 

Royal Society of Health, United Kingdom. 

Royal Society of Health Diploma, Inspector of 
Meat and Other Foods. 

Royal Society of Health, United Kingdom. 

Diploma in Environmental Health. Technical Education Division, Department of 
Education, Western Australia. 



26 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3407 

 

QUALIFICATION INSTITUTION 
Bachelor of Applied Science 
(Environmental Health). 

Western Australian Institute of Technology, 
Western Australia. 

Bachelor of Applied Science  
(Environmental Health). 

Curtin University of Technology, Western 
Australia. 

Bachelor of Science 
(Environmental Health). 

Curtin University of Technology, Western 
Australia. 

Bachelor of Science  
(Environmental Health) / Bachelor of Science 
(Environmental Biology). 

Curtin University of Technology, Western 
Australia. 

Bachelor of Applied Science  
(Environmental Health). 

University of Western Sydney (Hawkesbury), 
New South Wales. 

Bachelor of Science 
(Environmental Health). 

Griffith University, Queensland. 

Bachelor of Health Science  
(Environmental Health). 

Queensland University of Technology, 
Queensland. 

Bachelor of Applied Science  
(Environmental Health). 

Queensland University of Technology, 
Queensland. 

Bachelor of Applied Science  
(Environmental Health). 

Flinders University, 
South Australia. 

Bachelor of Applied Science 
(Environmental Health). 

Swinburne University of Technology, Victoria. 

Bachelor of Health Science 
(Environmental Health Management). 

Swinburne University of Technology, Victoria. 

Bachelor of Health Science  
(Public Health and Environmental Health). 

Swinburne University of Technology, Victoria. 

Bachelor of Public Health  
(Environmental Health). 

Latrobe University, 
Victoria. 

United Kingdom: Any environmental health 
qualification from the United Kingdom, where 
accompanied by a Certificate of Registration 
that has been issued by the Chartered 
Institute of Environmental Health (UK). 

United Kingdom: 

Baccalaureus Technologiae, 
Environmental Health. 

Technikon Natal, 
South Africa. 

 
Dated 21st July 2005. 

Dr MARGARET STEVENS, Executive Director, Public Health. 
 

——————————— 
 

HE403 
HEALTH SERVICES (QUALITY IMPROVEMENT) ACT 1994 

HEALTH SERVICES (QUALITY IMPROVEMENT) (APPROVED COMMITTEE) ORDER (NO. 5) 2005 
Made by the Principal Medical Officer (as delegate of the Minister for Health) pursuant to section 7(1) 
of the Health Services (Quality Improvement) Act 1994. 

Citation 
1. This order may be cited as the Health Services (Quality Improvement) (Approved Committee) Order 
(No. 5) 2005. 

Commencement 
2. This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government Gazette. 

Committee 
3. Royal Australasian College of Surgeons Western Australian Audit of Surgical Mortality 
Management Committee established by the Royal Australasian College of Surgeons is an approved 
quality improvement committee for the purposes of the Act. 

Expiry of order 
4. This order expires three years after its commencement. 
Dated this 21st day of July 2005. 

Dr DOROTHY JONES, Principal Medical Officer. 



3408 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 July 2005 

 

JUSTICE 

JU401* 
JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

APPOINTMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has 
approved of the following to the office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia— 

Amy Averil Amelia Doughty-Carvell of 78 Carter Road, Grass Valley 
Lisa Maree Lawlor of 53 Throssell Street, Northam 
Merrilee Claire MacDonald of 57, Lot 29 Fitzroy Street, Derby 
Stephen Phillip Withnell of 19 Moore Street, Northam 

RAY WARNES, A/Executive Director, Court Services. 
 

——————————— 
 

JU402* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Director General of the 
Department of Justice has issued the following persons with Permits to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname First Names Permit No Issue Date 

Bracken Matthew AP 0396 19/07/2005 

Stenhouse Dennis AP 0331 19/07/2005 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager Acacia Prison Contract. 
 

——————————— 
 

JU403* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Director General of the 
Department of Justice has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 

 Gvozdenovic Tatjana AP 0212 22/07/05 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager, Acacia Prison Contract. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

DISTRICT OF SWAN (CHANGE OF WARDS AND REPRESENTATION) ORDER 2005 
Made by the deputy of the Governor in Executive Council on the recommendation of the Minister for 
Local Government and Regional Development. 

Citation 
1. This order is the District of Swan (Change of Wards and Representation) Order 2005. 

Abolition of existing wards (s. 2.2 (1) (d) of the Act) 
2. The Gidgegannup and Swan Valley Wards in the district of Swan are abolished immediately before 
the first ordinary elections day after the commencement of this order. 



26 July 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3409 

 

New ward created (s. 2.2 (1) (b) of the Act) 
3. (1) On and after the first ordinary elections day after the commencement of this order, a new ward 
is created in the district of Swan, named the Swan Valley/Gidgegannup Ward. 
(2) The Swan Valley/Gidgegannup Ward consists of the land described in Schedule 1. 

Number of councillors changed (s. 2.18 (3) of the Act) 
4. On and after the first ordinary elections day after the commencement of this order— 
 (a) the number of offices of councillor for the new ward of Swan Valley/Gidgegannup created 

under clause 3 is two (2); and 
 (b) the number of offices of councillor for the Ellenbrook Ward is two (2) instead of one (1). 

Continuing councillor allocated to new ward (s. 9.62 of the Act) 
5. (1) In this clause— 

“continuing councillor” means a person — 
 (a) who was a councillor immediately before the commencement of this order; and 
 (b) whose term of office as councillor continues beyond the day of the first ordinary 

elections after the commencement of this order. 
(2) A person who was a continuing councillor for the Gidgegannup Ward immediately before the 
abolition of that ward under clause 2 is, on and after the first ordinary elections day, to be taken to 
have been elected as a councillor for the Swan Valley/Gidgegannup Ward created under clause 3. 
(3) For the avoidance of doubt, it is declared that this clause does not affect the term of the office of 
any continuing councillor. 

Election to fill vacancies (s. 4.11 and 9.62 of the Act) 
6. (1) An election is to be held to fill the offices of councillor specified in clause 4. 
(2) Any poll needed for an election to fill the offices is to be held on the first ordinary elections day 
after the commencement of this order. 
(3) Part 4 of the Act applies to preparing for and conducting the election as if the changes effected by 
clauses 2, 3, 4 and 5 had taken effect on the day on which this order commenced. 
(4) For the purposes of subclause (3)— 
 (a) Part 4 of the Act is modified to the extent necessary to give effect to subclauses (1), (2) and 

(3); and 
 (b) without limiting paragraph (a), a reference in Part 4 of the Act to a ward, in relation to the 

district of Swan, is to be read as a reference to a ward created under clause 3 as it is or will 
be, as a result of the operation of clause 3, on the first ordinary elections day after the 
commencement of this order. 

———— 

SCHEDULE 1—Ward description 
Description of land in Swan Valley/Gidgegannup Ward 

All that land which has previously comprised the Swan Valley Ward and the Gidgegannup Ward. 
I recommend that the orders in clauses 2, 3 and 4 be made as recommended by the Local Government 
Advisory Board. 

JOHN BOWLER, Minister for Local Government 
and Regional Development. 

By Command of the deputy of the Governor, 
G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT 

RD401 
REGIONAL DEVELOPMENT COMMISSIONS ACT 1993 

APPOINTMENT 
It is hereby notified for general information that the Minister for Peel and the South West has 
approved the following appointment in accordance with Part 3 of the Regional Development 
Commissions Act 1993. 

SOUTH WEST DEVELOPMENT COMMISSION 
Board of Management 

Mr Stan Liaros is appointed as Chairperson of the South West Development Commission Board for a 
three year term expiring on 31 October 2008. 



3410 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 July 2005 

 

WORKSAFE 

WS401* 
OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH ACT 1984 

OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH (CODE OF PRACTICE) NOTICE  
Published under section 57(4) of the Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984. 

Citation 
1. This notice may be cited as the Occupational Safety and Health (Code of Practice) Notice (No. 1) 
2005. 

2. Approval of code of practice 
Notice is hereby given that I, the undersigned Minister for Consumer and Employment Protection, 
being the Minister charged with administration of the Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984, 
acting in exercise of the power conferred upon me by section 57(1) of the said Act, on the 24 April 2005 
the Code of Practice Occupational Safety and Health in Call Centres as a code of practice in 
accordance with section 57 of the Occupational Safety and Health Act 1984. 
Note: A copy of the code of practice referred to in this notice is available for inspection (without 
charge) at the WorkSafe Library, 5th floor, 1260 Hay Street, West Perth or on the Internet 
information service [www.worksafe.wa.gov.au]. The code of practice can be purchased from the 
WorkSafe Division of the Department of Consumer and Employment Protection, 1260 Hay Street, 
West Perth [Tel: 1300 307 877]. 

Hon JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Consumer  
and Employment Protection. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 as amended 
relates in respect of the estate of George Duncan Scott Lippe late of Unit 1, 136 Spencer Street 
Bunbury who died on or around 7/8 June 2005 are required by the personal representative to send 
particulars of their claims addressed to the Executors of the Estate of George Duncan Scott Lippe 
deceased care of Young & Young 5 Spencer Street Bunbury by the 23rd day of August 2005 after 
which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the 
claims of which the personal representative then has notice. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

!200500141GG! 


