
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  4051 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 30 AUGUST 2005 No. 164 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Children’s Court of Western Australia Act 1988—Children’s Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2005 ....................................................................................................................  4054 

Port Authorities Act 1999—Port Authorities Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2005 ............  4057 
Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003—Rules of Wagering Amendment 

Rules 2005...............................................................................................................................  4055 
Road Traffic Act 1974—Road Traffic (Events on Roads) Amendment Regulations 2005.......  4056 
Volunteers (Protection from Liability) Act 2002—Volunteers (Protection form Liability) 

Regulations 2005 ....................................................................................................................  4053 
 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Cemeteries..................................................................................................................................  4059 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  4069 
Fire and Emergency Services ....................................................................................................  4060 
Fisheries .....................................................................................................................................  4060 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................  4060 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  4061 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  4063 
Parliament..................................................................................................................................  4064 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  4064 
Premier and Cabinet..................................................................................................................  4066 
Transport....................................................................................................................................  4067 
Water ..........................................................................................................................................  4067 
 
 



 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2005 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.90 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$53.45 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$53.45 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$10.70 

  Bulk Notices—$199.10 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4053 

— PART 1 — 

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 

CX301* 

Volunteers (Protection from Liability) Act 2002 

Volunteers (Protection from Liability) 
Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Volunteers (Protection from Liability) 
Regulations 2005. 

2. Extension of meaning of “community work” in the Act 

  For paragraph (k) of the definition of “community work” in 
section 3(1) of the Act, the following purposes are prescribed —  

 (a) the purpose of promoting the interests of an ethnic 
community; 

 (b) the purpose of promoting the interests of a religious 
community. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 



4054 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

JUSTICE 

JU301* 

Children’s Court of Western Australia Act 1988 

Children’s Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Children’s Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendment in these regulations is to the Children’s Court 
(Fees) Regulations 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 28 April 2005, p. 1415-33.] 

3. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 Division 2 item 1(b) is amended by deleting “30 or”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 



30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4055 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG301* 

Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003 

Rules of Wagering Amendment Rules 2005 

Made by RWWA, with the approval of the Commission, under section 
120 of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Rules of Wagering Amendment Rules 2005. 

2. The rules amended 

  The amendments in these rules are to the Rules of 
Wagering 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 28 January 2005, p.401-479.] 

3. Rule 18 amended 

  Rule 18(5) is repealed and the following rule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
 (5) Where a totalisator pool is conducted for a trifecta 

wager and no wager placed in the totalisator pool is a 
winning wager, RWWA is to —  

 (a) deduct the prescribed commission from the sum 
of the wagers included in the totalisator pool; 
and 

 (b) carry the remaining balance of that pool 
forward and add it to a totalisator pool 
conducted for a trifecta wager either on the 
same day or on a subsequent day. 

    ”. 
 

Approved by the Gaming and Wagering Commission of Western 
Australia on the 25th day of August 2005. 
 

BARRY A. SARGEANT, Chairman. 
 

Made by Racing and Wagering Western Australia on the 25th day of 
August 2005. 
 

RAY BENNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 



4056 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

TRANSPORT 

TR301* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Events on Roads) Amendment 
Regulations 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Events on Roads) 
Amendment Regulations 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Events on Roads) Regulations 1991*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 1 February 2002. 
  For amendments to 12 July 2005 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 352.] 

3. Schedule 2 replaced 

  Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead — 

“     
Schedule 2 — Application fees 

[r. 6(2)(c)] 

 $ 
Category 1 event 132.00 
Category 2 event 79.00 
Category 3 event 53.50 
Category 4 event 53.50 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 



30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4057 

TR302* 

Port Authorities Act 1999 

Port Authorities Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2005 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Port Authorities Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Port Authorities 
Regulations 2001*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 20 May 2005.] 

3. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 Division 6 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 —  

 (i) by deleting “$0.2277” and inserting instead —  

  “    $0.25    ”; and 

 (ii) by deleting “$2 464.00” and inserting instead — 

  “    $2 710.40    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “$4 558.00” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    $5 103.80    ”; 

 (c) in item 3 by deleting “$5 421.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $5 963.10    ”; 

 (d) in item 4 by deleting “$6 037.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $6 640.70    ”; 

 (e) in item 5 by deleting “$6 406.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $7 046.60    ”; 

 (f) in item 6 by deleting “$1 497.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $1 470.70    ”; 



4058 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

 (g) in item 7 — 

 (i) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$616.00” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $677.60    ”; and 

 (ii) by deleting “$862.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $948.20    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 

 
 



30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4059 

— PART 2 — 

CEMETERIES 

CC401* 
CEMETERIES ACT 1986 

Shire of Serpentine-Jarrahdale 
SCHEDULE OF FEES AND CHARGES 2005/2006 

Notice is hereby given that at a Council meeting held 25 July 2005, Council adopted the following— 
CEMETERY FEES AND CHARGES 

Interment Fee: 
Adult Burial .....................................................................................................................  
Child Burial ......................................................................................................................  
Land for Graves: 
Ordinary land for graves 2.4m x 1.2m ............................................................................  
Land reserved in advance ................................................................................................  
Exhumation Fee ...............................................................................................................  
Re-interment after exhumation ......................................................................................  
Monumental Work: 
Single Licence / Permit Fee .............................................................................................  
Annual Licence .................................................................................................................  
Full Monument—headstone with kerbing (plus Licence or Permit Fee) ......................  
New Headstone/Additional Monument (plus Licence or Permit Fee) ...........................  
Additional Inscription (plus Licence or Permit Fee) ......................................................  
Placement of Transferred Headstone: 
Placement by shire (plus acceptance and registration fee) ............................................  
Acceptance and registration fee ......................................................................................  
Funeral Director’s License: 
Annual Fee .......................................................................................................................  
Single funeral permit .......................................................................................................  
Grant of Right of Burial: 
Re-issue of Grant of Burial or Registration of Assigned Grant (after 25 year period) .  
Transfer of Grant of Right ...............................................................................................  
Penalty Fees: 
Late arrival, departure of insufficient notice .................................................................  
Interment after 2:30 pm per hour or part thereof ..........................................................  
Interment of oblong or oversized casket .........................................................................  
Interment on Saturday ....................................................................................................  
Interment on Sunday or public holiday ..........................................................................  
Ashes placed on Saturday, Sunday or public holiday ....................................................  
Disposal of Ashes: 
Niche reserved in advance (non-refundable) ..................................................................  
Niche Wall (single) plus registration and placement fee ...............................................  
Niche Wall (double) plus registration and placement fee ..............................................  
Ground Niche plus registration and placement fee ........................................................  
Kerb Niche plus registration and placement fee ............................................................  
Memorial Niche (plus registration and placement fee) ..................................................  
Placement of ashes by Shire with service .......................................................................  
Placement of ashes by Shire without service ..................................................................  
Scattering of ashes to the wind .......................................................................................  
Collection of ashes from cemetery office .........................................................................  
Transfer of ashes to new position ....................................................................................  
Acceptance and registration of ashes ..............................................................................  
Search Fees (involving staff): 
For up to two interments or memorial locations only ....................................................  
For each additional location inquiry or search requiring information ..........................  
Photocopies of records (per copy) .....................................................................................  
Digital Photograph sent via email ..................................................................................  
Each additional photo in any format ..............................................................................  

$ 
760.00
535.00

995.00
175.00

1,520.00
760.00

110.00
315.00
135.00
115.00
95.00

100.00
45.00

580.00
105.00

770.00
105.00

105.00
120.00
180.00
390.00
710.00
175.00

70.00
165.00
235.00
310.00
200.00
475.00
140.00
80.00
95.00
95.00
95.00
95.00

5.00
5.00
5.00

20.00
10.00



4060 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES 

FE401* 
FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES AUTHORITY OF WESTERN 

AUSTRALIA ACT 1998 
APPROVAL OF STATE EMERGENCY SERVICES UNITS 

Fire and Emergency Services Authority, 
Perth. 

Correspondence No. 05642 
I, Robert Mitchell, FESA Chief Executive Officer, hereby declare under Section 18C(1) of the Fire and 
Emergency Services Authority of Western Australia Act 1998 that the following State Emergency 
Service Unit is approved as a State Emergency Service Unit for the purposes of the Act— 

Communications Support Unit (CSU) 

ROBERT MITCHELL, FESA Chief Executive Officer, 
Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western Australia. 

FISHERIES 

FI401* 
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 

PROHIBITION ON FISHING (“SOUTH TOMI” WRECK SITE) ORDER 2005 
Order No. 22 of 2005 

FD 1620/98 [710] 
Made by the Minister under section 43. 

1. Citation 
This order may be cited as the Prohibition on Fishing (“South Tomi” Wreck Site) Order 2005. 

2. Prohibition on fishing 
A person must not fish by any means in the waters described in the Schedule. 

Schedule 
All the waters bounded by a line commencing at the intersection of 28° 43.968’ south latitude and 
114° 33.392’ east longitude; thence west along the parallel to the intersection of 114° 33.206’ east 
longitude; thence north along the meridian to the intersection of 28° 43.752’ south latitude; thence 
east along the parallel to the intersection of 114° 33.392’ east longitude; thence south along the 
meridian to the commencement point. 
Dated this 23rd day of August 2005. 

J. FORD, Minister for Fisheries. 

JUSTICE 

JU402* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Director General of the 
Department of Justice has issued the following person with a Permit to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Issue Date 
Rankin Walter Charles AP0397 19/07/2005 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

BRETT HUNT, A/Manager, 
Acacia Prison Contract.  



30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4061 

JU401* 
COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 51 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Director General of the Ministry of Justice has issued the following persons with Permits to do High-
Level Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Issued 

Permit 
Commence 

Date 

Permit 
Expiry Date

Manuel Martha Jacqueline CS6-378 22/08/2005 17/08/2005 30/07/2008 
Haning Chicquetta Anne CS6-380 22/08/2005 17/08/2005 30/07/2008 
Harman Nadia  CS6-397 22/08/2005 17/08/2005 30/07/2008 
Paulin Derek Paulin CS6-400 22/08/2005 17/08/2005 30/07/2008 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 56 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Director General of the Ministry of Justice has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level 
Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Revoked 

Withers Ronald George CS6-066 22/08/2005 
Lawrence Ronald Victor CS6-150 22/08/2005 
Hay Maxine Jane CS6-185 22/08/2005 
Morris Philip CS6-195 22/08/2005 
Stack Marlene Matilda CS6-203 22/08/2005 
Thornton Justin Glen CS6-208 22/08/2005 
Lorraine Robert Sydney CS6-217 22/08/2005 
Agafonoff Alexander CS6-340 22/08/2005 
Hort Gregory Ronald CS6-352 22/08/2005 

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999. 

BRIAN YEARWOOD, Director, 
Contracted Services. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

JU403* 
JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

APPOINTMENT 
It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has 
approved of the following to the office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia; 

Antony Lazzara of 17 Baskir Way, Henley Brook 

RAY WARNES, A/Executive Director, Court Services. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG402 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

City of Canning 
SWIMMING POOL INSPECTION FEE 

At the meeting of the City of Canning held on 23 August 2005, it was resolved to impose the following 
Swimming Pool Inspection Fee for the period 1 July 2005 to 30 June 2006— 

Swimming Pool Inspection Fee— $12.80 per year (GST inclusive) 
 $6.40 eligible pensioners/seniors 

M. S. LEKIAS, Mayor. 
D. CARBONE, Chief Executive Officer. 



4062 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

LG401* 
SHIRE OF COOLGARDIE 

APPOINTMENT OF BUSH FIRE CONTROL OFFICERS 
The following have been appointed Bush Fire Control Officers for the Shire of Coolgardie in 
accordance with section 38 of the Bush Fire Act 1954. 
Chief Fire Control Officer Gavin Harris 
Deputy Chief Fire Control Officer Mal Osborne 
Bush Fire Control Officers Stanislav Kocian 
 Brad Isbister 
 Amanda Jones 
 Paul Janssan 
 Edward Czaplinski 
 Nathan Harvey 
 Shane Munro 
 Tim Funston 
 Anthony J Crook 
 Darren Varcoe 
 Dashti Sambo 
 Phil Chamberlain 
 Fletcher Newbury 
All previous appointments have been withdrawn. 

M. J. (Mal) OSBORNE, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

LG403* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Plantagenet  
FIRE CONTROL OFFICERS—2005/2006 

The following persons have been appointed to the designated positions for the Shire of Plantagenet in 
accordance with the Bush Fires Act 1954. All other appointments are hereby cancelled. 
Chief Bush Fire Control Officer David Burcham 
Deputy Chief Bush Fire Control Officer Len Handasyde 
Bush Fire Control Officers 
Simon Grylls Gavin Smith Norm Handasyde 
Michael Jenkins Vern Drage Brian Bailey 
Mike Lanigan Peter Pavlovich Penny Elverd 
Len Handasyde Geoff DePledge Rob Lally 
David Burcham Brian Harwood Keith Hart 
Wayne Davis Stan Hall Stephen Beech 
Ken Frost Phillip Webb Colin Taylor 
Bill Sounness Robert Sounness Brett Bell 
Peter Slade Owen Sounness Norm Hill 
Mark Wallace Warren Forbes Tom Rouse 
Bill Hollingworth Bill Bentley Marshall Stallebrass 
Ross Backhouse Robin Ditchburn Syd Anning 
John Russell Ray Williams Ron Thomas 
Brad Cluett Phillip Rule Kelvin Ridgway 
Richard Stan-Bishop Ian Higgins Lachlan Cameron 
Grant Cooper Trevor Pieper Chester Powell 
Barry Pearce Raymond Drage Cliff Rosman 
Kevin Forbes Ray Parry 
Chief Fire Weather Officer Ron Sounness 
Deputy Fire Weather Officer Grant Cooper 
The following have been appointed as a Dual Bush Fire Control Officer for the Shire of Plantagenet 
and the City of Albany— 

John Russell Warren Forbes Ross Backhouse 
The following have been appointed as a Dual Bush Fire Control Officer for the Shire of Plantagenet 
and the Shire of Denmark— 

Simon Grylls Len Handasyde 
The following have been appointed as a Dual Bush Fire Control Officer for the Shire of Plantagenet 
and the Shire of Cranbrook— 

Geoff DePledge Ian Higgins David Burcham 



30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4063 

The following have been appointed as a Dual Bush Fire Control Officer for the Shire of Plantagenet 
and the Shire of Gnowangerup— 

David Burcham Graeme Pyle 
The following has been appointed as a Dual Bush Fire Control Officer for the Shire of Plantagenet 
and the Shire of Manjimup— 

Ian Higgins 

ROB STEWART, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

LG501* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Coolgardie 
NOTICE TO ALL OWNERS AND/OR OCCUPIERS OF LAND 

Pursuant to the powers contained in Section 33 of the Bush Fires Act 1954, you are hereby required 
on or before the 1st day of November 2005 or within fourteen days of you becoming owner or occupier 
of land should this be after the 1st day of November 2005 to clear firebreaks and remove flammable 
materials from the land owned or occupied by you as specified hereunder and to have the specified 
land and firebreaks clear of all flammable materials from the 1st day of November 2005 up to the 
30th day of April 2006. 
1. Land Outside Town sites 
 1.1 All buildings on land which is outside town sites shall be surrounded by two firebreaks not 

less than two (2) metres wide cleared of all flammable material, the inner firebreak to be not 
more than twenty (20) metres from the perimeter of the building or group of buildings and 
the outer firebreak not less than 200 metres from the inner firebreak. 

 1.2 The removal of flammable material from the whole of the land between the firebreaks 
required in paragraph 1.1 above. 

2. Land in Town sites 
 2.1 Where the area of land is 2000 square metres (approximately ½ acre) or less, all flammable 

material shall be removed from the whole of the land. 
 2.2 Where the area of land exceeds 2000 square metres, firebreaks at least three (3) metres in 

width shall be cleared of all flammable material immediately inside and along the boundaries 
of land. Where there are buildings on the land additional firebreaks three metres in width 
shall be cleared immediately surrounding each building. 

If it is considered for any reason to be impractical to clear firebreaks or remove flammable material as 
required by this notice, you may apply to the Council or its duly authorised Officer not later than the 
1st day of November 2004 for permission to provide firebreaks in alternative positions or take 
alternative action to remove or abate fire hazards. If permission is not granted by Council or its duly 
authorised Officer, you shall comply with the requirements of this notice. 
“Flammable material” does not include green growing trees or green growing plants in gardens. 
If the requirements of this notice are carried out by burning, such burning shall comply with the 
relevant provisions of the Bush Fire Act. 
The penalty for failing to comply with this notice is a fine of $1000 and a person in default is also 
liable, whether prosecuted or not, to pay cost of performing the work directed in this notice, if it is not 
carried out by the owner or occupier by the date required by this notice. 
The prohibited burning period will be from the 1st November 2005 to 30th April 2006 and shall apply 
throughout the whole shire. 

By Order of the Council, 

M. J. OSBORNE, Chief Executive Officer. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
PETROLEUM ACT 1967 

SECTION 47(1) 
Declaration of a Location 

I, William L Tinapple, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division of the Department of Industry and 
Resources for the State of Western Australia, delegate of the Minister for State Development by 
virtue of an instrument of delegation dated 26 March 2004 and published in the Government Gazette 



4064 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

of Western Australia on 2 April 2004, declare the following blocks to be a location for the purpose of 
Part III of the Act. 

Hamersley Range Map Sheet 
Block Field Location No. 
6168 CYRANO 1/05-6 

This block is the subject of Exploration Permit No. EP 364 (R1) held by— 
Tap (Shelfal) Pty Ltd 
Westranch Holdings Pty Ltd 
Wildlook Enterprises Pty Ltd 

Dated at Perth on this 24th day of August 2005. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director, 
Petroleum and Rotyalties Division. 

PARLIAMENT 

PA401* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

DISALLOWANCE OF LOCAL LAW 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Legislative Council has disallowed the following 
Regulations made under the Local Government Act 1995— 

Shire of Nannup Parking and Parking Facilities Local Law published in the Gazette on 
January 11 2005 and tabled in the Legislative Council on April 5 2005, under the Local 
Government Act 1995. 

Disallowance is effective on and from Tuesday, August 23 2005. 
Dated August 25 2005. 

MALCOLM PEACOCK, Acting Clerk of the Legislative Council. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI101 
CORRECTION 

TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 
APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 

City of Nedlands 
Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 144 

Ref: 853/2/8/4 Pt 144  
It is hereby notified for public information that the notice under the above Amendment No 144 
published at page 4790 of the Government Gazette No. 180 dated 15 October 2004, contained an error 
which is now corrected as follows— 

Delete points 2. and 3. and insert the following— 
 2. Inserting clause 5.3.9 under Part V of the Scheme with the following wording— 
 5.3.9 Notwithstanding the provisions of the Residential Design Codes or any other provision 

specified elsewhere in the Scheme, the following development standards shall apply for 
land contained within Amendment No. 144, being the site bounded by Aberdare Road, 
Smyth Road, Verdun Street and the rear of the western lots on Kitchener Street (as 
depicted on the Scheme Maps)— 

 (a) In respect of the area coded R60 the following design and development elements 
shall apply— 

 (i) no less than 30% of dwellings proposed in any Application for Approval to 
Commence Development shall have a maximum plot ratio area of 60sqm; 
and 

 (ii) no less than 30% of dwellings proposed in any Application for Approval to 
Commence Development shall have a maximum plot ratio area of 90 sqm. 



30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4065 

 (b) no development shalt occur unless it is on a green title lot which is greater than 
4,000sqm; and 

 (c) buildings shall not exceed a 3 storey height limit or the equivalent building 
height limit applicable to a Category C area building in Table 3 of the Residential 
Design Codes. 

 3. Inserting Part VIII, into the Scheme with the following wording— 
PART VIII—LOCAL PLANNING POLICY FRAMEWORK 
8.1 LOCAL PLANNING POLICIES 
The Council may prepare a Local Planning Policy in respect of any matter related to the 
planning and development of the Scheme area so as to apply— 

 (a) to an aspect or aspects or development control or any other matter relevant to 
this Scheme; and 

 (b) to all or part of the Scheme area, 
and may amend or add to or rescind the Policy. 
8.2 RELATIONSHIP OF LOCAL PLANNING POLICIES TO SCHEME 

 8.2.1 If the provision of a Local Planning Policy is inconsistent with the Scheme, the 
Scheme prevails. 

 8.2.2 A Local Planning Policy is not part of the Scheme and does not bind the Council 
in respect of any application for planning approval but the Council is to have 
regard to provisions of the Policy and the objectives which the Policy is designed 
to achieve before making its decision. 

8.3 PROCEDURE FOR MAKING OR AMENDING A LOCAL PLANNING POLICY 
 8.3.1 The Council in preparing a draft Local Planning Policy, shall have due regard 

to— 
 (a) the purpose for which the land is set aside under the Scheme; 
 (b) the orderly and proper planning of the area; 
 (c) the conservation of the amenities of the locality; and 
 (d) any strategies, study findings adopted by the Council; and any other 

matter it considers relevant. 
 8.3.2 If the Council resolves to prepare a Local Planning Policy, the Council— 
 (a) is to publish a notice of the proposed draft Policy once a week for 3 

consecutive weeks, in a newspaper circulating in the Scheme Area, giving 
details of— 

 (i) where the draft Policy may be inspected; 
 (ii) the subject and nature of the draft Policy; and 
 (iii) in what form and during what period (being not less than 21 days 

from the date the notice is published) submissions may be made. 
 (b) may publish a notice of the proposed policy in such other manner and carry 

out such other consultation as the Council considers appropriate. 
 8.3.3 All submissions shall be made to the Chief Executive Officer of the Council by 

written notice. 
 8.3.4 After the expiry of the period within which submissions may be made, the 

Council is to— 
 (a) Review the draft Local Planning Policy having regard to any submissions 

made; and 
 (b) Determine, by resolution, to adopt the draft Local Planning Policy, with or 

without amendment or not to proceed with the Policy. 
 8.3.5 If the Council resolves to adopt the Policy, the Council is to— 
 (a) publish notice of the Policy once in a newspaper circulating in the Scheme 

area; 
 (b) where practicable in the opinion of the Council, notice is to be given to 

those persons directly affected by the Local Planning Policy; and 
 (c) if, in the opinion of the Council, the Policy affects the interests of the 

Commission, forward a copy of the Policy to the Commission; 
 8.3.6 A policy has effect on publication of a notice under clause 8.4.5; 
 8.3.7 A copy of each Local Planning Policy, as amended is to be kept and made 

available for public inspection during business hours at the offices of the Council 
and any other premises nominated by the Council; 

 8.3.8 A Local Planning Policy adopted by the Council may be altered only by following 
the procedure set out in this clause making and adopting a Local Planning Policy; 

8.4 REVOCATION OF LOCAL PLANNING POLICY 
A Local Planning Policy may be revoked by— 

 (a) the adoption by Council of a new Policy under clause 8.4 that is expressed to 
supersede the existing Policy; or 



4066 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

 (b) publication of a notice of revocation by the Council once a week for 3 consecutive 
weeks, in a newspaper circulating in the Scheme Area. 

D. E. PRICE, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PI401* 
METROPOLITAN REGION TOWN PLANNING SCHEME ACT 1959 

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT NO. 1097/33A 
Realignment of Other Regional Roads Through Banksia Grove, Butler And Jindalee 

Call For Public Submissions 
The Western Australian Planning Commission (WAPC) intends to amend the Metropolitan Region 
Scheme (MRS) for land in the local government of Wanneroo and is seeking public comment. 

The amendment proposes to realign the Other Regional Roads reservations within the following areas 
of the Metropolitan Region Scheme— 

 • Banksia Grove, between Joondalup Drive and Flynn Drive, to allow for the creation of 
identifiable neighbourhoods and minimise the impact on bushland 

 • Lot 9042 Marmion Avenue, Butler, to be consistent with the Butler-Brighton Charrette 
(workshop) 

The Western Australian Planning Commission has certified that, in its opinion, the amendment does 
not constitute a substantial alteration to the Metropolitan Region Scheme. 

The plans showing the proposed changes and the WAPC Amendment Report which explains the 
proposals, will be available for public inspection from Tuesday 30 August 2005 to Friday 28 October 
2005 at each of the following places— 
 • Department for Planning and Infrastructure, Wellington Street, Perth 

 • J S Battye Library, Level 3 Alexander Library Building, Perth Cultural Centre 
 • Municipal office of the City of Wanneroo 

Documents are also available from the WAPC Internet site www.wapc.wa.gov.au. 

Submissions 

Any person who desires to make a submission to support, object or provide comment on any part of 
the proposed amendment should do so on a Form 33A. This submission form is available from the 
display locations, the Amendment Report and the Internet. 

Submissions must be lodged with the: Secretary, Western Australian Planning Commission, 
469 Wellington Street, PERTH WA 6000; on or before 5.00pm Friday, 28 October 2005. 

Late submissions will not be considered. 

R. N. STOKES, Acting Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PC401* 
RETENTION OF TITLE 

Department of the Premier and Cabinet 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor, on behalf of Her Majesty the Queen, 
has approved the retention of the title “Honourable” by the following persons— 

William (Bill) Noel Stretch 
Derrick Gordon Tomlinson 
James (Jim) Alan Scott 
John Alexander Cowdell 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 



30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4067 

PC402* 
EXTENSION OF TERM OF OFFICE 

Department of the Premier and Cabinet 
It is hereby notified for public information that Her Majesty the Queen has approved an extension of 
the term of office of His Excellency Lieutenant General John Murray Sanderson AC, as Governor of 
Western Australia, for the period 18 August to 31 October 2005. 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

TRANSPORT 

TR401 
SHIPPING AND PILOTAGE ACT 1967 

APPOINTMENT 
Office of the Minister for Planning and 

Infrastructure. 
It is hereby notified for general information that the Governor, in Executive Council, has approved in 
accordance with Section 4 of the Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967— 

The appointment of Ross Anil John Baptist Amaral as a Pilot for the Port of Onslow. 
This appointment is in accordance with the Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967. 

ALANNAH MacTIERNAN MLA, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

WATER 

WA402* 
WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984  

Shire of Brookton  

WATER SUPPLY IMPROVEMENTS: BROOKTON 
Proposal to Construct a 3,000m3  Ground Level Water Storage Tank  

To improve the water quality to the existing water supply for Brookton the Water Corporation 
proposes to construct the following works— 
 • A ground level water storage tank of reinforced concrete construction of approximately 3000 

cubic metres capacity, 26.0 metres diameter and 6.0 metres wall height with a reinforced 
concrete roof. 

 • Associated pipework including valves and meters.  

 • Modification of existing chlorination facilities including installation of chlorination dosing 
and sampling points and associated instrumentation.  

 • Earthworks over approximately 0.23 hectares for the proposed tank. 

The location of the proposed works is at Brookton Dam site, Brookton, as shown on the plan.  
Subject to obtaining all necessary approvals, the proposed works are scheduled to commence in 
January 2006 and will continue for a duration of approximately 6 months.  

A copy of this Notice of Proposal (referred to as HT90-0-1) is available for viewing, during office hours, 
at the Water Corporation’s head office, 629 Newcastle St, Leederville.  

Further Information may also be obtained by contacting the Project Manager, Mr Eric Hughes, 
telephone (08) 9420 2679. 
Objections to the proposed works will be considered if lodged in writing, addressed to the Project 
Manager, Mr Eric Hughes Project Management, Water Corpoation, John Tonkin Water Centre, 629 
Newcastle Street, Leederville WA 6007 before close of business on 30 September 2005. 



4068 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

WA401* 
WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984 

City of Armadale 
WATER SUPPLY IMPROVEMENTS: BEDFORDALE 

Authorisation to Upgrade the Wungong Dam Chemical Dosing Plant  
In accordance with the provisions of Section 91 of the Water Agencies (Powers) Act 1984, the Minister 
Assisting the Minister for Water Resources has authorised the Water Corporation to construct the 
following works— 
 • Modifications to the existing chemical dosing building by enlarging the size of the chlorine 

drum store and internal re-arrangement of the rooms.  
 • Construction of a new fluoridation building in place of the existing generator building. The 

building will be of brick construction approximately 12m x 6m x 4m high.  
 • Replacement and upgrade of existing chemical dosing equipment within the existing chemical 

dosing building and installation of equipment in the new fluoride building.  
 • Replacement and upgrade of existing electrical control equipment including a new outdoor 

emergency generator in a weather and soundproof enclosure.  
 • Associated pipework including valves, meters and concrete valve pits.  
The location of the proposed works is within the existing chemical dosing plant compound at the base 
of the Wungong Dam as shown on the plan opposite.  
The works will allow greater draw from Wungong Dam and improve control of the chemical dosing 
systems.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



30 August 2005 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4069 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Kathleen Joy Mueller, late of 61 Aurelian Street, Palmyra in the State of Western Australia, 
deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 14 May 2005 are required by the Administrator 
Edward John Mueller of care of Hammond Worthington, Lawyers, Level 2, 40 St Georges Terrace, 
Perth to send particulars of their claims to him by 30 September 2005 after which date the 
Administrator may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which he then has 
notice. 

HAMMOND WORTHINGTON, as Solicitors for the personal representative. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
In the estate of Terence Michael Darling, late of Darling Downs, 1728 Great Northern Highway, 
Upper Swan, Western Australia, Company Director, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the abovenamed deceased who died on the 28th day of September 2004 are 
required by the personal representative Ian Eric Swallow of care of Wheatleys Legal, PO Box 1363, 
West Perth WA 6872 to send particulars of their claims to him by the 6th day of October 2005 after 
which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the 
claims of which he then has notice. 
 
 
 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

PUBLIC TRANSPORT AUTHORITY 
ACT 2003 

Price: $19.00 counter sales 
Plus postage on 260 grams 

 
*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

PUBLIC INTEREST DISCLOSURE 
ACT 2003 

Price: $9.05 counter sales 
Plus postage on 107 grams 

 
*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



4070 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 30 August 2005 

 
STATE LAW PUBLISHER 

 
 

CHANGES TO 
BUSINESS HOURS 

 
 

CUSTOMERS PLEASE NOTE: 
 
 

From Monday 5th September 2005, 
our business hours will change. 

 
 

Opening and closing times will be from 
8.30am to 4.30pm Monday to Friday. 

 

 

 

 
JOHN STRIJK, Manager and Government Printer. 

 

 

 

 

!200500164GG! 


