
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  427 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 24 JANUARY 2006 No. 18 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Proclamations—Stamp Amendment (Assessment) Act 2005—No. 36 of 2005 .......................  429 
Sentencing Act 1995—Sentencing Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2005 .............................  429 
Strata Titles Act 1985—Strata Titles General Amendment Regulations 2006 ............................431 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Agriculture .......................................................................................................................................439 
Armadale Redevelopment Authority ..............................................................................................439 
Consumer and Employment Protection ..........................................................................................440 
Deceased Estates .............................................................................................................................444 
Education .........................................................................................................................................441 
Justice...............................................................................................................................................441 
Land Administration .......................................................................................................................441 
Local Government............................................................................................................................441 
Marine/Maritime..............................................................................................................................442 
Premier and Cabinet........................................................................................................................443 
WorkSafe ..........................................................................................................................................444 
 
 



 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2005 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.90 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$53.45 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$53.45 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$10.70 

  Bulk Notices—$199.10 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



24 January 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 429 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 

AA101* 
STAMP AMENDMENT (ASSESSMENT) ACT 2005 

No. 36 of 2005 
PROCLAMATION 

Western Australia 

By the Honourable Justice David Kingsley Malcolm, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator 
of the State of Western Australia 
DAVID KINGSLEY MALCOLM 

Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator 

 

[L.S.] 

I, the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, acting under the Stamp Amendment 
(Assessment) Act 2005 section 2 and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, fix 1 March 2006 as the day on which sections 6 and 8 of that Act come into 
operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 17 January 2006. 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

E. RIPPER, Treasurer. 
 

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN ! 

JUSTICE 

JU301* 

Sentencing Act 1995 

Sentencing Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2005 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Sentencing Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2005. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Sentencing 
Regulations 1996*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 3 September 2002. 
  For amendments to 14 November 2005 see Western 

Australian Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, 
p. 370, and Gazette 28 April 2005.] 



430 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 January 2006 

3. Regulation 13 amended 

  The Table to regulation 13 is amended by inserting the 
following item at the end of the Table —  

“     

79, 129 Notice alleging commission of offence 
while subject to sentence  

 
5 

    ”. 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended by inserting the following form after 
Form 4 —  

“     

5. Notice alleging commission of offence while subject to 
sentence 

No.  WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
Sentencing Act 1995, s. 79, 129 

NOTICE ALLEGING 
COMMISSION OF OFFENCE 
WHILE SUBJECT TO [SENTENCE] 1 

  Supreme Court 
 District Court 
 Magistrates Court 
 Children’s Court 

At: 
 

Name: 

Address: 

Offender 

Date of birth:  Male/Female: 
 

Notice to 
offender 

It is alleged that while you were serving the sentence for 
the first offence described below you committed another 
offence.  
You must attend a hearing at the court which sentenced 
you for the first offence to deal with this allegation. 

 

Offence:  

[Prosecution notice/Indictment] No.: 

Dates: offence committed: ___/____/______ 
 convicted: ___/____/______ 
 sentenced:  ___/____/______ 

First 
offence2 

Sentence: 
 

Offence:  

Court: at:  

[Prosecution notice/Indictment] No.: 

Dates: offence committed: ___/____/______ 
 convicted: ___/____/______ 
 sentenced:  ___/____/______ 

Offence2 
committed 
while 
subject to 
[sentence]1 

Sentence: 
 

Notice of 
application 
for order 
to pay3 

When released on the CRO you agreed to [pay/forfeit] 

$________ if you committed an offence during the term 
of the CRO.   
An application will be made to the court for an order that 
this amount must now be [paid/forfeited]. 



24 January 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 431 

 

Name: 

Official title: 

Address: 

Phone No.:  Date: ___/____/______ 

Signature: 

Notice 
issued by 

Witness: __________________________________________ 
 JP/Prescribed court officer 

Notes to Form 5 
1. Insert type of sentence eg. CRO, CBO, ISO, suspended imprisonment 
2. If more than one offence, modify notice as required and give details of all 

offences.  
3. Delete if not applicable.  

Modify notice as required if a surety gave an undertaking, or deposited an 
amount, and the order is to be sought in respect of the surety as well as, or 
instead of, the offender. 

 

    ”. 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 
 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

LAND 

LA301* 

Strata Titles Act 1985 

Strata Titles General Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive 
Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Strata Titles General Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Strata Titles 
General Regulations 1996*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 15 November 2002. 
  For amendments to 22 December 2005 see Western 

Australian Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, 
p. 393, and Gazette 13 May and 24 June 2005.] 



432 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 January 2006 

3. Heading to Part 2 amended 

  The heading to Part 2 is amended by deleting “plans” and 
inserting instead — 

  “    plans and forms    ”. 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  Regulation 4 is amended as follows: 

 (a) after “A plan” by inserting — 

  “    or form    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (a) by deleting “drawing”; 

 (c) in paragraph (b) by deleting “the drawing medium;” and 
inserting instead — 

  “    any drawing;    ”; 

 (d) in paragraph (c) — 

 (i) by deleting “the” at the start of the paragraph; 

 (ii) after “typewriting” by inserting — 

  “    on any drawing    ”; 

 (iii) by deleting “of the drawing medium;” and 
inserting instead — 

  “    it;    ”. 

5. Regulation 5 amended 

 (1) Regulation 5(1) is amended by deleting “the form of Form 1 or 
2 and must be accompanied by an annexure sheet in the form of 
Form 8.” and inserting instead — 

  “    the form approved by the Registrar of Titles.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 5(1a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “be drawn showing —” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    specify —     ”. 

 (b) in paragraph (a) by inserting before “the north point” — 

  “    in the case of a drawing    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (b) by inserting before “the scale” — 

  “    in the case of a drawing    ”; 

 (d) in paragraphs (c)(ii)(IV) and (e)(v)(V) by deleting 
“54 and”; 

 (e) by deleting paragraph (f); 

 (f) in paragraph (g) by deleting “the correctness of the 
plan.” and inserting instead — 

  “    certifying the plan under subregulation (1b).    ”. 



24 January 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 433 

 (3) After regulation 5(1a) the following subregulation is inserted — 

“     
 (1b) All such plans must be certified by a licensed surveyor 

in the form of the Table to regulation 54 of the Survey 
Regulations. 

    ”. 

 (4) Regulation 5(4) is amended as follows: 

 (a) after “every plan” by inserting — 

  “    in the form of a drawing    ”; 

 (b) in the list of ratios by inserting after “1:100” — 

  “    1:125    ”. 

 (5) Regulation 5(5) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “the form of Form 4” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    a form approved by the Registrar of Titles    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “, and if used must comply with these 
regulations, must be numbered consecutively ‘sheet .... 
of .....sheets’ and all floor plans must be drawn to the 
same scale and in the same relationship to the borders of 
the floor plan sheets except where the Registrar of Titles 
otherwise determines.” and inserting instead a full stop. 

 (6) Regulation 5(6)(b) is amended by inserting after “lot and” — 

  “    those areas    ”. 

 (7) Regulation 5(8) is repealed. 

6. Regulation 8 amended 

  Regulation 8(1)(b) is amended by deleting “Department of Land 
Administration.” and inserting instead — 

“     
  department principally assisting the Minister in 

the administration of the Act. 
    ”. 

7. Regulation 13 amended 

  Regulation 13(3) is amended by deleting “so as, in the opinion 
of the Registrar of Titles, not to be confusing or misleading.” 
and inserting instead — 

  “    in a manner approved by the Registrar of Titles.    ”. 

8. Regulation 14L amended 

  Regulation 14L is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “the form of Form 34” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    a form approved by the Registrar of Titles    ”; 



434 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 January 2006 

 (b) in paragraph (a) by deleting “regulation 5(1)(a), (b), (f) 
and (g);” and inserting instead — 

  “    regulation 5(1a)(a), (b) and (g);    ”; 

 (c) in paragraphs (b) and (c) by deleting “regulation 5(1)” in 
each of the 6 places where it occurs and inserting 
instead — 

  “    regulation 5(1a)    ”. 

9. Regulation 18 amended 

  Regulation 18(b) is amended by deleting “Department of Land 
Administration.” and inserting instead — 

“     
  department principally assisting the Minister in 

the administration of the Act. 
    ”. 

10. Regulation 21 amended 

  Regulation 21(2)(a) is amended by deleting “of that lot on the 
plan as previously registered;” and inserting instead — 

  “    of the land the subject of the application;    ”. 

11. Regulation 25 replaced 

  Regulation 25 is repealed and the following regulation is 
inserted instead — 

“     
25. Period and types of records to be retained under 

section 35  

 (1) The prescribed period under section 35(1)(h) is —  

 (a) in the case of documents kept under 
section 35(1)(h)(ii) to (vii) — a period of 
7 years; 

 (b) in the case of documents kept under 
section 35(1)(h)(i) and (viii) and under 
subregulation (2)(a) and (b) — 

 (i) a period of 20 years; or 

 (ii) a period ending when the document has 
ceased to have effect, 

  whichever is the longer; or 

 (c) in the case of documents kept under 
subregulation (2)(c) — 

 (i) if the documents comprise material 
delivered under section 49(3)(a) — the 
life of the scheme; 

 (ii) if the documents comprise material 
delivered under section 49(3)(b) and are 
of the same type as documents referred 



24 January 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 435 

to in paragraph (a) of this 
subregulation — the period referred to 
in paragraph (a); or 

 (iii) if the documents comprise material 
delivered under section 49(3)(b) and are 
of the same type as documents referred 
to in paragraph (b) of this 
subregulation — the period referred to 
in paragraph (b). 

 (2) The prescribed documents under section 35(1)(h)(ix) 
are — 

 (a) resolutions without dissent; 

 (b) policies of insurance; and 

 (c) material delivered under section 49(3) by an 
original proprietor to a strata company at its 
first annual general meeting. 

    ”. 

12. Regulation 28 amended 

  Regulation 28 is amended by deleting “$400.” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    $500.    ”. 

13. Regulation 29 amended 

  Regulation 29 is amended by deleting “$50.” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    $65.    ”. 

14. Regulation 37AA inserted 

  After regulation 37A the following regulation is inserted — 

“     
37AA. Manner of describing boundaries for purposes of 

section 3(2)(b) 

  For the purposes of section 3(2)(b), the boundaries of 
any cubic space referred to in paragraph (a) of the 
definition of “floor plan” in section 3(1) must be 
described — 

 (a) if the cubic space is within a building that is not 
part of a single tier scheme — 

 (i) in the case of a vertical boundary, where 
the base of any wall corresponds 
substantially with any line referred to in 
paragraph (a) of that definition — by 
reference to the inner surface of that 
wall; and 

 (ii) in the case of a horizontal boundary, 
where any floor or ceiling joins a 



436 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 January 2006 

vertical boundary of that cubic space — 
by reference to the upper surface of that 
floor and the under surface of that 
ceiling; 

  and 

 (b) in any other case — in a manner that 
unambiguously defines the cubic space and its 
location in relation to the relevant building. 

    ”. 

15. Regulation 44 amended 

  Regulation 44 is amended by deleting “$400.” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    $500.    ”. 

16. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 item 4 is deleted and the following item is inserted 
instead — 

“     
4. The fees payable to the strata company are — 

 $ 
(a) for an application made under 

section 43(1)(a) ........................... 
 

10.00 
(b) for the inspection of records 

under section 43(1)(b) —  
 

 (i) by any proprietor or 
mortgagee who has notified 
an interest to the strata 
company ....................…….. 

 
 
 

Nil 
 (ii) by any other person ............. 40.00 
(c) for a certificate under 

section 43(1)(c) and (d) ............... 
 

100.00 
(d) for copies provided under 

section 43(1a) .............................. 
 
$40.00 for the 
first 5 pages and 
$1.00 for each 
subsequent page 

    ”. 

17. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting the first item; 

 (b) in the second item by deleting “5A(1)(d)” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    5A(d)    ”; 

 (c) by deleting the third item; 

 (d) in the fifth item by deleting “Section 5B(1)(a), 8A(d), 
8A(e), 22(2)” and inserting instead — 

  “    Section 8A(e), 22(2)    ”; 



24 January 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 437 

 (e) in the seventh item — 

 (i) in the column headed “Section or regulation” by 
deleting “Regulation 5(1a)” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    Regulation 5(1)    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting everything in the column headed 
“Number and Description of Form” and inserting 
instead — 

“     
  Form 8 — Annexure of Strata/Survey Strata Plan No. 

and Schedule of Encumbrances 
    ”; 

 (f) by deleting the item beginning “Section 21T(1)(b), 
Regulation 14L”. 

18. Schedule 3 amended 

 (1) Schedule 3 is amended by deleting Forms 1, 2, 4 and 34. 

 (2) Schedule 3 is amended by deleting Form 6 and inserting 
instead — 

“     
Form 6 

Strata Titles Act 1985 

Sections 8A(e), 22(2) 

SURVEY-STRATA PLAN No. …… 

DESCRIPTION OF PARCEL 

CERTIFICATE OF LICENSED SURVEYOR 

I . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . being a licensed surveyor registered 
under the Licensed Surveyors Act 1909, certify that the survey-strata 
plan which relates to the parcel described above — 

 (a) is a plan of re-subdivision; and 

 (b) complies with Schedule 1 by-law(s) No(s). . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
on Survey-strata Plan No. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
registered in respect of (name of scheme) or sufficiently 
complies with that/those by-law(s) in a way that is allowed 
by regulation 36 of the Strata Titles General 
Regulations 1996. 

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
       Date          Licensed Surveyor 

    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 3 Form 38 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting paragraphs (a) to (c); 

 (b) by renumbering paragraphs (d) to (h) as paragraphs (a) 
to (e) respectively; 



438 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 January 2006 

 (c) in renumbered paragraph (e), by deleting 
“paragraph (g)(ii)” and inserting instead — 

  “    paragraph (d)(ii)    ”. 

 

By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 



24 January 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 439 

— PART 2 — 

AGRICULTURE 

AG401* 

BEEKEEPERS ACT 1963 

STOCK DISEASES (REGULATIONS) ACT 1968 

STOCK (IDENTIFICATION AND MOVEMENT) ACT 1970 

APPOINTMENT 

Department of Agriculture, 
South Perth  WA  6151. 

The Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator is pleased to appoint the following as an Inspector 
pursuant to the following Acts— 

Section 5 of the Beekeepers Act 1963 
Section 37 of the Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970 and 
Section 8 (1) of the Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968 

Stephen John Bell 

KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture and Forestry. 

ARMADALE REDEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY 

AB401* 

ARMADALE REDEVELOPMENT ACT 2001 

ARMADALE REDEVELOPMENT SCHEME 2004——AMENDMENT NO. 6 
Notice is hereby given that, in accordance with the consent of the Minister for Planning and 
Infrastructure to its public notification, the proposed Armadale Redevelopment Scheme 2004—
Amendment No 6 has been prepared by the Armadale Redevelopment Authority. 

In January 2005, the Kelmscott town centre (west) area was introduced into the Armadale 
Redevelopment Area by the Armadale Redevelopment (Extension of Redevelopment Area) Regulations 
2005. Amendment 6 proposes to extend the Armadale Redevelopment Scheme 2004 area to include the 
Kelmscott town centre (west) precinct within the Scheme Area, Scheme Reserves, Development 
Contribution and Structure Plan Areas. Amendment 6 also introduces precinct objectives and 
relevant statutory provisions.  This will help facilitate the comprehensive redevelopment of the 
precinct.  
A document setting out the Amendment is available for inspection or purchase at the offices of the 
Armadale Redevelopment Authority, Shops 4-5, Armadale Shopping City, Jull Street, Armadale, 
between the hours of 8.30 am and 5.00 pm, Monday to Friday, until Friday 10 March 2006. The 
document can also be viewed at and downloaded from the Authority’s website at www.ara.wa.gov.au 
Written submissions on the Scheme Amendment should be addressed to— 

Executive Director 
Armadale Redevelopment Authority 
PO Box 816 
Armadale WA 6992 

Submissions may also be hand delivered to the Authority’s office. 
The closing date for all submissions is 5.00pm, Friday 10 March 2006. 



440 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 January 2006 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401* 
RETAIL TRADING HOURS ACT 1987 

RETAIL TRADING HOURS (REGIONAL AUSTRALIA DAY) EXEMPTION ORDER 2006 
Made by the Minister for Consumer and Employment Protection under Section 12(1a) of the Act. 

Part 1—Preliminary 

1. Citation 
This order may be cited as the Retail Trading Hours (Regional Australia Day) Exemption Order 2006. 

2. Commencement 
This Order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government Gazette. 

3. Application 
(1) This Order applies to general retail shops within the municipal boundaries of the Local 
Government Authorities specified in the Schedule. 
(2) This Order does not affect the operation of the Retail Trading Hours Exemption Order (No 12) 
1994. 
(3) This Order does not affect the operation of the Retail Trading Hours (Motor Shops) S12 Order 
1996. 

Part 2—Exemption from Act provisions 

4. Wednesday 25 January 2006 
Each general retail shop to which this Order applies is exempted from Section 12(1)(a) of the Act on 
25 January 2006 provided that the shop is closed on that day until 8.00am and from and after 
9.00pm. 

5. Schedule 
City of Albany Shire of Beverley Shire of Boddington 
Shire of Boyup Brook Shire of Bridgetown-

Greenbushes 
Shire of Brookton 

Shire of Broomehill Shire of Bruce Rock City of Bunbury 
Shire of Busselton Shire of Capel Shire of Carnamah 
Shire of Chapman Valley Shire of Chittering Shire of Collie 
Shire of Coolgardie Shire of Coorow Shire of Corrigin 
Shire of Cranbrook Shire of Cuballing Shire of Cue 
Shire of Cunderdin Shire of Dalwallinu Shire of Dowerin 
Shire of Dumbleyung Shire of Esperance Shire of Geraldton 
Shire of Greenough Shire of Gnowangerup Shire of Goomalling 
Shire of Harvey Shire of Jerramungup City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder 
Shire of Katanning Shire of Kellerberrin Shire of Kent 
Shire of Kojonup Shire of Kondinin Shire of Koorda 
Shire of Kulin Shire of Lake Grace Shire of Laverton 
Shire of Leonora Shire of Mandurah City of Manjimup 
Shire of Merredin Shire of Meekatharra Shire of Menzies 
Shire of Mount Magnet Shire of Morawa Shire of Moora 
Shire of Mullewa Shire of Murchison Shire of Mt Marshall 
Shire of Murray Shire of Mukinbudin Shire of Nannup 
Town of Narrogin Shire of Narrogin Town of Northam 
Shire of Nungarin Shire of Perenjori Shire of Plantaganet 
Shire of Pingelly Shire of Quairading Shire of Ravensthorpe 
Shire of Sandstone Shire of Tambellup Shire of Tammin 
Shire of Toodyay Shire of Trayning Shire of Three Springs 
Shire of Victoria Plains Shire of Wagin Shire of Wandering 
Shire of Waroona Shire of Westonia Shire of West Arthur 
Shire of Williams Shire of Wyalkatchem Shire of Wickepin 
Shire of Woodanilling Shire of Wongan-Ballidu Shire of Yalgoo 
Shire of Yilgarn   
 

JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Consumer and Employment Protection. 



24 January 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 441 

EDUCATION 

ED401 
COUNTRY HIGH SCHOOL HOSTELS AUTHORITY ACT 1960 

APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS OF THE COUNTRY HIGH SCHOOL HOSTELS AUTHORITY 
The Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive Council has appointed Norma Jeffery of 
77 Stanley Street, Nedlands WA 6009, to be a member and chairperson of the Country High School 
Hostels Authority for a three-year term from 17th January 2006. 

LJILJANNA RAVLICH MLC, Minister for Education and Training. 
G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

JUSTICE 

JU401 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Director General of the 
Department of Justice has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security Work— 

SURNAME OTHER NAMES PERMIT No. REVOCATION 
DATE 

Opperman Kim William AP 0205 15/01/06 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

BRETT HUNT, A/Manager, Acacia Prison Contract. 
17 January, 2006. 

LAND ADMINISTRATION 

LA401 
LICENSED SURVEYORS ACT 1909 
LAND SURVEYORS LICENSING BOARD 

The Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in Executive Council, under Section 4 of the Licensed 
Surveyors Act 1909 has appointed Neil Edmund Browne as Chairperson and Cherilyn Miranda 
Randolph, John Frederic Carter, Barry George Cribb and Anthony John Snow as members of the 
Land Surveyors Licensing Board for a term of office expiring on 31 December 2006. 

EUGENE BROWNE, Secretary, 
Land Surveyors Licensing Board. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401 
DOG ACT 1976 

Shire of Cuballing 
APPOINTMENT 

It is hereby notified for public information that Belinda Jane Draper has been appointed as a Dog 
Registration Officer for the Shire of Cuballing. 
The appointment of Natasha Marie Hobbs is hereby cancelled. 

PETER NAYLOR, Chief Executive Officer. 



442 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 January 2006 

LG402 
DOG ACT 1976 
Shire of Tammin 
APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed under the 
provisions of the Dog Act 1976— 

Registration Officers Michael Geoffrey Oliver 
 Elizabeth Lindsay-Grace McDonald 
 Alison Mary Fleay 
 Carolyn Ann Crane 
Authorised Persons Michael Geoffrey Oliver 
 John Cameron Mitchell 
 Robert Edward McMeeken 
 Geoff Copley 

All previous appointments are hereby revoked effective 18 January 2006. 
Dated: 18 January 2006. 

M. G. OLIVER, Chief Executive Officer. 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MX401* 
NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
DECLARATION OF EMERGENCY VESSELS 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 
Fremantle WA, 24 January 2006. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 19H(1) of the Navigable Waters Regulations I 
hereby declare as follows— 
 1) The following vessels to be emergency vessels and are exempt from the provisions of the 

Regulations [Reg 19H(2)(b)] whilst the masters of the vessels are acting in the course of their 
duties or when the vessels are being used as an emergency vessel PROVIDING HOWEVER 
that this exemption shall only apply between 0800 on 26 January 2006 and 0800 on 
27 January 2006. 
 Vessel 
 Name 
Department of Fisheries FD3 
Department of Fisheries FD9 
Department of Fisheries FD50 
Department for Planning BM002 
 and Infrastructure 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 

MX402* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
PROHIBITION OF FREESTYLE DRIVING—PERSONAL WATERCRAFT 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 
Fremantle WA, 24 January 2006. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 paragraph (b) of the Western Australian 
Marine Act 1982, and Regulation 50A(1)(b) of the Navigable Waters Regulations, the Department by 
this notice revokes sub paragraph (1) of the notice published in the Government Gazette on 
3 December 1999 relating to the Narrows—Personal Watercraft Freestyle Driving Area. 
Providing that this revocation will apply only on Thursday 26 January 2006 between the hours of 
1500 and 2200 for the purpose of spectator craft mooring during Lotto Skyworks 2006. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 



24 January 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 443 

MX403* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
CLOSURE 

Belmont Water Ski Area 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 24 January 2006. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 48A of the Navigable Waters Regulations, the 
Department by this notice temporarily revokes Notice TR401 as published in the Government Gazette 
on 10 September 2002 and hereby closes the Belmont Water Ski Area for water skiing from 3pm to 
sunset on Thursday 26 January 2006. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 

MX404* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
RESTRICTED SPEED AREAS—ALL VESSELS  

CLOSURE OF WATERS—ALL VESSELS 
Prohibited Swimming Area 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 
Fremantle WA, 24 January 2006. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 and 67 of the Western Australian Marine 
Act 1982, and Regulation 10A(b) of the Navigable Waters Regulations, the Department by this notice 
closes the waters of Perth Waters between the Narrows Bridge and Heirrison Island and limits the 
speed of motor vessels to that of 8 knots, and prohibits bathing or swimming within the following area 
and during the following times— 

PORT OF PERTH—SWAN RIVER 
All the waters of the Swan River commencing at Quarry Point; thence due east to the Quarry 
Starboard Navigation Marker, then north east to Mill Point and extending upstream to the 
Causeway Bridge 
Providing however that this speed restriction and prohibited bathing shall only apply between the 
hours of 1500 and 2200 on Thursday 26 January 2006 and is not applicable to those bona fide 
vessels or persons involved in approved aquatic events or associated with the Lotto Skyworks 
2006.   
Furthermore, that the Closure of Waters will only apply between the hours of 1700 and 2030 on 
Thursday 26 January 2006 and is not applicable to those bona fide vessels or persons involved in 
approved aquatic events or associated with the Lotto Skyworks 2006.  

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PC401* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator in 
accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the following temporary 
appointments to act temporarily in the office of Minister for Agriculture and Forestry; the Midwest 
and Wheatbelt in the absence of the Hon K M Chance MLC for the period 14 January to 3 February 
2006 (both dates inclusive)— 

Hon J Bowler MLA—14 to 16 January 2006 inclusive 
Hon J C Kobelke MLA—17January to 3 February 2006 inclusive. 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 



444 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 January 2006 

WORKSAFE 

WS401* 
OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH ACT 1984 

OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH REGULATIONS 1996 
EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE PURSUANT TO REGULATION 2.13 

(No. 3 of 2006) 
I, Nina Lyhne, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner, hereby grant an exemption to White 
Crane Management Pty Ltd from the requirements of Regulation 3.60(3)(b) of the Occupational 
Safety and Health Regulations 1996 in relation to the requirement to have a non-portable residual 
current device fitted on the vessel, ‘White Crane’ M & H 5823. 
This exemption is granted on the condition that there is a full time engineer on board with 
responsibility for monitoring the earth light system.  
Dated this 18th day of  January 2006. 

NINA LYHNE, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 as amended 
relates in respect of the estate of John Gordon Aughey late of 7 Mitchell Avenue, Boyup Brook who 
died on 21 September 2005 are required by the personal representative to send particulars of their 
claims addressed to the Executors of the Will of .John Gordon Aughey deceased care of Young & 
Young 5 Spencer Street Bunbury by the 21st day of February 2006 after which date the personal 
representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which the 
personal representative then has notice. 
 

——————————— 
 

 
 
 
 
 

A L L   N E W   ! 
WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Consolidated Loose Leaf Version 
(Including Index) 

 
$49.80 (incl. GST) Plus Postage 

Green Binder is an additional $17.20 if required 

Available from: 
State Law Publisher 

10 William Street, Perth 
Telephone: 9321 7688 

Fax: 9321 7536 
sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 



24 January 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 445 

—  N E W ! ! !  — 

Available from: 

State Law Publisher 
10 William Street, Perth 

Telephone: 9321 7688 
Fax: 9321 7536 

sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 



446 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 24 January 2006 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES 

(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS) 
For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State 
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the 
missing item. 
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full. 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2006 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2006. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 845.90
  Interstate  ..................................... 862.40
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,178.00
 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,098.90
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 771.10
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 407.00
  Interstate ...................................... 484.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 558.00
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 333.30
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 803.00
  Interstate ...................................... 981.20
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 924.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 792.00
  Interstate ...................................... 804.10
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999  
 (per year) ........................................  821.70

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 287.10 
  Interstate ....................................... 319.00 
  Overseas ........................................ 295.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 789.80 

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)........................................ 286.00 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 309.10 
  Interstate ........................................ 319.00 
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 415.00 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA ...................................... 423.50 
  Interstate ....................................... 444.40 
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 601.00 

 

 

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is 
searchable. Other CD ROM products with 
legislation or other statutory information can 
be packaged to individual requirements.  
Prices are available on request. 

 

!200600018gg! 


