
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  903 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 28 FEBRUARY 2006 No. 39 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927— 
Hospitals (Services Charges for Compensable Patients) Amendment Determination 

2006 ........................................................................................................................................912 
Hospitals (Services Charges) Regulations 1984— 

Hospitals (Services Charges for Compensable Patients) Amendment Determination 
2006 ........................................................................................................................................912 

Proclamations—Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967...........................................................................905 
Racing and Wagering Western Australia Act 2003— 
  RWWA Rules of Harness Racing 2004.....................................................................................914 
  RWWA Rules of Greyhound Racing 2005................................................................................913 
  RWWA Rules of Thoroughbred Racing 2004...........................................................................913 
Workers’ Compensation and Injury Management Act 1981— 

Approved Medical Specialists Order (No. 1) 2006 ...................................................................914 
Working with Children (Criminal Record Checking) Act 2004— 

Working with Children (Criminal Record Checking) Amendment Regulations 2006 ...........907 
 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Deceased Estates .............................................................................................................................919 
Energy ..............................................................................................................................................915 
Fisheries ...........................................................................................................................................915 
Heritage............................................................................................................................................916 
Justice...............................................................................................................................................917 
Planning and Infrastructure ...........................................................................................................917 
 
 



 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2005 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.90 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$53.45 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$53.45 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$10.70 

  Bulk Notices—$199.10 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



28 February 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 905 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 

AA101 
SHIPPING AND PILOTAGE ACT 1967 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 

By the Honourable Justice David Kingsley Malcolm, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator 
of the State of Western Australia 
DAVID KINGSLEY MALCOLM 

Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, acting under the Shipping and 
Pilotage Act 1967 section 10(2)(ba) and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, specify the Executive Director of the Department of Conservation and Land 
Management as the controlling authority of the Carnac Island Nature Reserve 
mooring control area for the purposes of that Act. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 17 January 2006. 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

JOHN BOWLER, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure. 
 

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN ! 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

 

AA102 
SHIPPING AND PILOTAGE ACT 1967 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 

By His Excellency 
Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 

KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 
Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Governor, acting under the Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 section 10(2)(a) 
and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, declare the place 
described in the Schedule to this Proclamation to be a mooring control area for the 
purposes of that Act. 

SCHEDULE 
Shoalwater Islands Marine Park mooring control area 
All that portion of Indian Ocean referred to as “Rockingham Shoalwater Islands 
Mooring Control Area Lease” as bordered and shown on Department of Planning and 
Infrastructure W A Plan 324-02-01. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on the 14th day of February 
2006. 
By Command of the Governor, 

ALLANAH MacTIERNAN, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure. 
 

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN ! 



906 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 February 2006 

AA103 
SHIPPING AND PILOTAGE ACT 1967 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 

By His Excellency 
Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 

KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 
Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Governor, acting under the Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 section 10(2)(ba) 
and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, specify the Executive 
Director of the Department of Conservation and Land Management as the 
controlling authority of the Shoalwater Islands Marine Park mooring control area for 
the purposes of that Act. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on the 14th day of February 
2006. 
By Command of the Governor, 

ALLANAH MacTIERNAN, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure. 
 

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN ! 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

AA104 
SHIPPING AND PILOTAGE ACT 1967 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 

By the Honourable Justice David Kingsley Malcolm, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator 
of the State of Western Australia 
DAVID KINGSLEY MALCOLM 

Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator 

 

[L.S.] 

 
I, the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, acting under the Shipping and 
Pilotage Act 1967 section 10(2)(a) and with the advice and consent of the Executive 
Council, declare the area described in the Schedule to this Proclamation (known as 
the Carnac Island Nature Reserve) to be a mooring control area for the purposes of 
that Act. 

SCHEDULE 
Carnac Island Nature Reserve mooring control area 
All that portion of Indian Ocean referred to as the “Carnac Island Nature Reserve” 
as bounded by lines joining the following co-ordinates running clockwise from the 
initial North-West corner— 

32° 6.8508´ S, 115° 39.2844´ E. 
32° 6.8508´ S, 115° 40.2324´ E. 
32° 7.7448´ S, 115° 40.2324´ E. 
32° 7.7448´ S, 115° 39.2844´ E. 
32° 6.8508´ S, 115° 39.2844´ E. 

Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 17 January 2006. 
By Command of the Lieutenant-Governor and Administrator, 

JOHN BOWLER, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure. 
 

GOD SAVE THE QUEEN ! 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 



28 February 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 907 

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT 

CX301* 

Working with Children (Criminal Record Checking) Act 2004 

Working with Children (Criminal Record 
Checking) Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Working with Children (Criminal 
Record Checking) Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Children and Community Services Act 2004 section 250 comes 
into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Working with 
Children (Criminal Record Checking) Regulations 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 21 December 2005, p. 6189-214.] 

4. Regulation 10 amended 

 (1) Regulation 10(1) is amended by deleting “and (3),” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    , (3) and (3a),    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 10(3) is amended by deleting “If ” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    Subject to subregulation (3a), if    ”. 

 (3) After regulation 10(3) the following subregulation is inserted —  

“     
 (3a) If a provision of the Act would, but for this regulation, 

apply to, or in relation to a person, from 2 or more 
different days and those days are provided under 
regulations 16 and 22 then the provision is to apply to, 
or in relation to, the person —  

 (a) from the day that applies under regulation 22; 
or 



908 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 February 2006 

 (b) from the day that is earliest in time, if the 
person has more than one child-related job. 

    ”. 

5. Regulation 11 amended 

  Regulation 11(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “or” after paragraph (a); 

 (b) by inserting after paragraph (a) — 

“     
 (aa) if the applicant for the notice is a person 

carrying out child-related business specified in 
regulation 21(2), 4 months; 

 (ab) if the applicant for the notice is a person who is 
employed in child-related employment 
specified in regulation 21(3), 4 months; or 

”. 

6. Regulation 19 amended 

  After regulation 19(3)(b) the following paragraph is inserted —  

“     
 (ba) referred to in section 6(1)(a)(vii) in connection 

with the performance by an officer, as defined 
in the Children and Community Services 
Act 2004 section 3, of a function given to the 
officer under that Act; 

    ”. 

7. Regulations 21 and 22 inserted 

  After regulation 20 the following regulations are inserted —  

“     
21. Work in connection with a child care service 

(s. 57(1), 60(2) and 61) 

 (1) For the purpose of section 57(1), section 24(b) applies 
to a person who starts to carry on a child-related 
business referred to in section 6(1)(a)(i) in connection 
with a child care service on or after 1 January 2007, 
from when the person starts to carry on the business. 

 (2) For the purpose of section 57(1), section 24(b) applies 
to a person who carries on a child-related business 
referred to in section 6(1)(a)(i) in connection with a 
child care service before 1 January 2007 and who —  

 (a) immediately before the commencement of the 
Children and Community Services Act 2004 
section 250 was the holder of a licence or a 
permit issued under the Community Services 
Act 1972 section 17B; or 



28 February 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 909 

 (b) holds a licence, or is a managerial officer in 
relation to a body corporate that holds a licence, 
under the Children and Community Services 
Act 2004 Part 8, 

  from the day on which the term of the licence or permit 
expires. 

 (3) Sections 22(4) and 24(a) do not apply in relation to a 
person who is employed in child-related employment 
referred to in section 6(1)(a)(i) in connection with a 
child care service before 1 January 2007 until —  

 (a) in the case of a person who has produced, or 
given, to a licensee or permit holder —  

 (i) a current criminal record check for the 
person under the Community Services 
(Child Care) Regulations 1988 
regulation 37A(1); or 

 (ii) a copy of a current criminal record 
check for the person under the 
Community Services (Outside School 
Hours Care) Regulations 2002 
regulation 42(1), 

  the day that —  

 (iii) is on or after 1 January 2007; and 

 (iv) is 2 years after the day on which a check 
or copy was produced, or given, to the 
licensee or permit holder; 

 (b) in the case of a person who has before 
1 January 2007 given a licensee a copy of a 
current criminal record check under the 
Children and Community Services (Early 
Childhood Care) Regulations 2006 
regulation 28(1) or the Children and 
Community Services (Outside School Hours 
Care) Regulations 2006 regulation 27(1), 
2 years after the day on which the copy was 
given to the licensee; 

 (c) in the case of a person who is the subject of a 
criminal record check provided by a licensee 
under the Children and Community Services 
(Early Childhood Care) Regulations 2006 
regulation 11(3) or 12(3) or (4), the day on 
which the term of the licence of the licensee 
expires; 

 (d) in the case of a person who —  

 (i) is the subject of a criminal record check 
provided by a licensee under the 
Children and Community Services 



910 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 February 2006 

(Early Childhood Family Day Care) 
Regulations 2006 regulation 11(3)(a); or 

 (ii) is to be taken to have been appointed to 
act in place of the licensee with the 
approval of the CEO under the Children 
and Community Services (Early 
Childhood Family Day Care) 
Regulations 2006 regulation 11(7), 

  the day that —  

 (iii) is on or after 1 January 2007; and 

 (iv) is 2 years after the day on which a check 
or copy was produced, or given, to the 
licensee or permit holder; 

 (e) in the case of a person who is the subject of a 
criminal record check provided by a licensee 
under the Children and Community Services 
(Outside School Hours Care) Regulations 2006 
regulation 12(3) or 13(3) or (4), the day on 
which the term of the licence of the licensee 
expires; or 

 (f) in the case of a person who —  

 (i) is the subject of a criminal record check 
provided by a licensee under the 
Children and Community Services 
(School Age Family Day Care) 
Regulations 2006 regulation 12(3)(a); or 

 (ii) is to be taken to have been appointed to 
act in place of the licensee with the 
approval of the CEO under the Children 
and Community Services (School Age 
Family Day Care) Regulations 2006 
regulation 12(7), 

  the day that is on or after 1 January 2007 on 
which the term of a licence of the licensee 
expires. 

 (4) Sections 22(4) and 24(a) do not apply in relation to a 
person who starts to be employed in child-related 
employment referred to in section 6(1)(a)(i) in 
connection with a child care service on or after 
1 January 2007, until the person starts to be so 
employed. 

22. Work in connection with a placement arrangement 
under the Children and Community Services 
Act 2004 (s. 57(1) and 60(2)) 

 (1) For the purpose of section 57(1), section 24(b) applies 
to a person who carries on a child-related business 
referred to in section 6(1)(a)(vi) in connection with a 



28 February 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 911 

placement arrangement under the Children and 
Community Services Act 2004 —  

 (a) from 1 January 2008, if the person starts to 
carry on the business before 1 January 2007; or 

 (b) from when the person starts to carry on the 
business, if the person starts to carry on the 
business on or after 1 January 2007. 

 (2) For the purpose of section 60(2), sections 22(6) and 
24(b) apply in relation to a person who is being 
employed in child-related employment referred to in 
section 6(1)(a)(vi) in connection with a placement 
arrangement under the Children and Community 
Services Act 2004 — 

 (a) from 1 January 2008, if the person starts to be 
employed in the employment before 
1 January 2007; or 

 (b) from when the person starts to be employed in 
the employment, if the person starts to be so 
employed on or after 1 January 2007. 

    ”. 

8. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 is amended by inserting before clause 1 the 
following clause —  

“     
1a. Child care services (s. 6(1)(a)(i) 

  Work — 

 (a) referred to in section 6(1)(a)(i) in connection with a 
child care service; and 

 (b) carried out on a voluntary basis by a parent of a 
child — 

 (i) to whom the service is being provided; or 

 (ii) who is enrolled for, or otherwise ordinarily 
is provided with, the service. 

    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 1 is amended by deleting item 13 and inserting instead 
the following item —  

“     
13. Community kindergartens, educational institutions, 

coaching or private tuition services and overnight camps 
(s. 6(1)(a)(ii), (iii), (iv) and (xv))  

  Work — 

 (a) referred to in section 6(1)(a)(ii), (iii) or (iv) in 
connection with —  

 (i) a community kindergarten registered under 
the School Education Act 1999 Part 5;  

 (ii) an educational institution for children; or 



912 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 February 2006 

 (iii) a coaching or private tuition service; 

  or 

 (b) referred to in section 6(1)(a)(xv) in connection with 
an overnight camp arranged by a kindergarten, 
educational institution or service referred to in 
paragraph (a), 

  and carried out by a person who is a member of the Western 
Australian College of Teaching established under the 
Western Australian College of Teaching Act 2004. 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

HEALTH 

HE301* 

Hospitals and Health Services Act 1927 

Hospitals (Services Charges) Regulations 1984 

Hospitals (Services Charges for Compensable 
Patients) Amendment Determination 2006 

Made by the Minister for Health under section 37(3)(af) of the Act and 
regulation 5(2) of the regulations. 

1. Citation 

  This determination is the Hospitals (Services Charges for 
Compensable Patients) Amendment Determination 2006. 

2. The determination amended 

  The amendments in this determination are to the Hospitals 
(Services Charges for Compensable Patients) 
Determination 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 28 June 2005, p. 2922-4.] 



28 February 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 913 

3. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 Division 2 item 7 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a)(i) by deleting “$28.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $29.50    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (a)(ii) by deleting “$22.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $23.60    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$22.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $23.60    ”. 

J. A. McGINTY, Minister for Health. 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG301 
RACING AND WAGERING WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 2003 

RWWA RULES OF THOROUGHBRED RACING 2004 
In accordance with Section 45 (1) (a) of the Racing and Wagering Western Australia 
Act 2003, notice is hereby given that the Board of Racing and Wagering WA on 
20 February 2006 resolved that, the RWWA Rules of Thoroughbred Racing 2004 be 
amended as follows, with effect from 1 March 2006— 

Amendment to Local Rules 
Insert LR 93G, LR182A 
A copy of the above rules may be obtained during office hours from the Western 
Australian Turf Club, 70 Grandstand Road, Ascot, WA or Racing and Wagering 
Western Australia website, www.rwwa.com.au. 

R. B. BENNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

RG302 
RACING AND WAGERING WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 2003 

RWWA RULES OF GREYHOUND RACING 2005 
In accordance with Section 45 (1) (c) of the Racing and Wagering Western Australia 
Act 2003, notice is hereby given that the Board of Racing and Wagering WA on 
20 February 2006 resolved that the RWWA Rules of Greyhound Racing 2005 be 
amended as follows, with effect from 1 March 2006— 

Amendment to National Rules 
Amend R131 (7) be deleting “suspended” 
Amend AR 30(1), 30(5), 35(1), 42(1), 50, 52, 53, 57(3), 57(4) and 116 by deleting 
“owner” in these rules. 
Amend Definition of “drugs” 

Amendment to Local Rules 
Delete LR131 (7) 

A copy of the above rules may be obtained during office hours from the Western 
Australian Greyhound Racing Association, Cnr. Albany Highway & Station Street, 
Cannington, WA or Racing and Wagering Western Australia website, 
www.rwwa.com.au. 

R. B. BENNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 



914 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 February 2006 

RG303 
RACING AND WAGERING WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 2003 

RWWA RULES OF HARNESS RACING 2004 
In accordance with Section 45 (1) (b) of the Racing and Wagering Western Australia 
Act 2003, notice is hereby given that the Board of Racing and Wagering WA on 
20 February 2006 resolved that, the RWWA Rules of Harness Racing 2004 be 
amended as follows, with effect from 1 March 2006— 

RWWA RULES OF HARNESS RACING 2004 
Amendments to National Rules— 
Amend 15(1)(t), 51(1), 91(1), 188A(3), 195A(2) 
Insert 15(2), 91(4), 95(4), 95(7), 188A(4), 188A(5) 
Renumber existing 15 and subsequent sub-rules as 15(1) respectively 
Renumber existing 95(4) as 95(5) and 95(5) as 95(6) 
Renumber existing 267 as 267(1) and amend 267(1) and add 267(2) 
Delete 51(2) 

Amendments to Local Rules 
Add LR188AB 
Delete LR252 
Delete LR259 and replace with 259(1) and 259(2) 

A copy of the above rules may be obtained during office hours from the Western 
Australian Trotting Association or Racing and Wagering Western Australia Website, 
www.rwwa.com.au. 

R. B. BENNETT, Chief Executive Officer. 

WORKCOVER 

WC301 

Workers’ Compensation and Injury Management Act 1981 

Approved Medical Specialists Order (No. 1) 
2006 

Made by WorkCover WA under section 146F(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Approved Medical Specialists Order (No. 1) 
2006. 

2. Approved medical specialists 

  The following medical practitioners are designated as approved 
medical specialists under section 146F(1) of the Act: 

  
 Dr Jane Dymond 
 Dr Neil Ozanne 
 Dr Max Bowater 

ADRIAN WARNER, Chief Executive Officer, 
Workcover WA. 



28 February 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 915 

— PART 2 — 

ENERGY 

EN401* 
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23 (1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS 
Notice is given that the following Generation Licence has been granted— 

Licensee: NewGen Power Kwinana Pty Ltd 
Issue Date: 22 February 2006 
Address of Licensee: The Chifley Tower 
 Level 39, 2 Chifley Square 
 Sydney  NSW  2000 
Classification: Generating Works  
Term of Licence: Up to and including 21 February 2036 
Area Covered: Licence area located within the Kwinana Industrial Area, Cockburn 

Sounds, Lot 22 on Diagram 723310, Lot 218 Reserve 30611 on Deposit 
Plan 215932 and Lot 3000 Reserve 30611 on Deposit Plan 46763. (Plan 
No. ERA-EL-068) 

Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
 6th Floor 
 197 St Georges Terrace 
 Perth WA 6000 
 http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

FISHERIES 

FI401 
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 

ABALONE MANAGEMENT PLAN 1992 
Statement of Determination 

I Peter Rogers, Executive Director of the Department of Fisheries Western Australia, pursuant to 
clause 11(3) of the Abalone Management Plan 1992, hereby make a determination in regard to the 
maximum quantity of abalone that may be taken from the relevant areas of the Abalone Managed 
Fishery during the licensing period commencing on 1 April 2006, as set out below— 

Area 1 
9,900 kilograms of Roe’s abalone (whole weight) 
1,200 kilograms of Greenlip abalone (meat weight) 
0 kilograms of Brownlip abalone (meat weight) 

Area 2 
19,800 kilograms of Roe’s abalone (whole weight) 
31,200 kilograms of Greenlip abalone (meat weight) 
7,900 kilograms of Brownlip abalone (meat weight) 

Area 3 
32,000 kilograms of Greenlip abalone (meat weight) 
8,000 kilograms of Brownlip abalone (meat weight) 

Area 4 
0 kilograms of Greenlip abalone (meat weight) 
0 kilograms of Brownlip abalone (meat weight) 



916 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 February 2006 

Area 5 
20,000 kilograms of Roe’s abalone (whole weight) 

Area 6 
12,000 kilograms of Roe’s abalone (whole weight) 

Area 7 
36,000 kilograms of Roe’s abalone (whole weight) 

Area 8 
15,000 kilograms of Roe’s abalone (whole weight) 

Dated this 20th day of February 2006. 
P. P. ROGERS, Executive Director. 

HERITAGE 

HR401* 
HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990 

ENTRY OF PLACES IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES 
Notice is hereby given in accordance with Section 51(2) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, the places described in Schedule 1 have 
been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect from today. 

Schedule 1 
Description of Place 

Freemason’s Hall (fmr), Subiaco at cnr Roberts & Coghlan Roads, Subiaco; Lot 26 on D31657 being 
the whole of the land contained in C/T V: 11 F: 118A. 

RAAF Headquarters Bunker (fmr), Belmont at 81-91 Leake Street, Belmont; That ptn of Lot 8231 on 
D12370 being ptn of Res 28749 & being part of the land contained in CLT V: 3119 F: 56 as is 
defined on HCWA Survey Drawing No. 16785 prepared by Warren King & Company & Midland 
Survey Services. 

St. Louis Catholic Church, Boyanup at Bridge Street cnr Thomas Street, Boyanup; Lot 9 on DP 
222153 being the whole of the land contained in C/T V: 95 F: 89. 

 
Pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, notice is hereby given in accordance with 
Section 49(1) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 that it is proposed that the places 
described in Schedule 2 be entered in the Register of Heritage Places.  The Heritage Council invites 
submissions on the proposal, which must be in writing & should be forwarded to the address below 
not later than 11 April 2006.  The places will be entered in the Register on an interim basis with 
effect from today. 

Schedule 2 
Description of Place 

Council House, Perth at 27-29 St Georges Terrace, Perth; Lot 760 on DP205838 being the whole of the 
land comprised in C/T V: 1179 F: 882. 

St Davitt’s at 27 Georgette Street, Busselton; Lot 24 on D23342 being the whole of the land contained 
in C/T V: 1339 F: 432. 

 
NOTICE OF ADVICE REGARDING REGISTRATION OF CROWN PROPERTY  
In accordance with the requirements of Section 47(5) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act, the 
Heritage Council hereby gives notice that it has advised the Minister for Heritage that the place 
listed in Schedule 3 should be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on an interim basis.  The 
Heritage Council hereby gives notice of the interim registration and invites submissions on the 
matter; which must be in writing and should be forwarded to the address below not later than 11 
April 2006. The place listed in Schedule 3 is vested in the Crown, or in a person on behalf of the 
Crown, in right of the State. 

Schedule 3 
Description of Place 

Lillimilura Ruins and Grotto at approx 147km east of Derby, in the Windjana Gorge National Park, 
Fairfield–Leopold Downs Road, West Kimberley; Ptn of Stock Route Res 17206 & ptn of Windjana 
Gorge National Park Res 31107 as shown on HCWA Survey Drawing No 3691 prepared by 
Midland Survey Services. 

Dated 28 February 2006. 

STEPHEN CARRICK, Acting Director, Office of the Heritage Council of W.A. 
108 Adelaide Terrace East Perth WA  6004. 



28 February 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 917 

JUSTICE 

JU401* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Revocations 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permits to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 

Nuttal Peter Raymond AP0266 13/02/06 

Radhanauth Roger AP0115 14/02/06 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 
24 February, 2006. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, 
Manager, Acacia Prison Contract. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Broome 

Town Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 24 
Ref: 853/7/2/4 Pt 24  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
Shire of Broome town planning scheme amendment on 21 February 2006 for the purpose of— 
 1. Amending the Planning Scheme map so that the Residential Density codes of R10/20 within 

the area bound by Frederick, Herbert, Stewart and Weld streets, Broome, are replaced by the 
Residential Coding of R40 in accordance with the map. 

 2. Amending the Planning Scheme map so that the Residential lots fronting Frederick Street 
between Herbert and Weld Streets, Broome, are designated as A13 (Additional Uses) in 
accordance with the map. 

 3. Amending Schedule 2—Additional Uses to include 'Office' within those Residential zoned lots 
fronting Frederick Street between Herbert and Weld streets, Broome, as follows— 

Amendment 
No. 

Description of 
Land 

Additional 
Use 

Conditions 

24 Lot 1 Robinson 
Street cnr 
Frederick Street 

Office 1. Office Development to be generally in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Residential Design Codes in regard to side 
and rear setbacks, building height and site 
coverage. 
2. All other development standards as 
determined by Council. 

 Lot 834 Frederick 
Street cnr Weld 
Street 

Office 1. Office Development to be generally in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Residential Design Codes in regard to side 
and rear setbacks, building height and site 
coverage. 
2. All other development standards as 
determined by Council. 

 Lots 59 and 60 
Frederick Street 

Office 1. Office Development to be generally in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Residential Design Codes in regard to side 
and rear setbacks, building height and site 
coverage. 
2. All other development standards as 
determined by Council. 



918 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 February 2006 

Amendment 
No. 

Description of 
Land 

Additional 
Use 

Conditions 

 Lot 63 Frederick 
Street cnr 
Robinson Street 

Office 1. Office Development to be generally in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Residential Design Codes in regard to side 
and rear setbacks, building height and site 
coverage. 
2. All other development standards as 
determined by Council. 

 Lots 65 and 66 
Frederick Street 

Office 1. Office Development to be generally in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Residential Design Codes in regard to side 
and rear setbacks, building height and site 
coverage. 
2. All other development standards as 
determined by Council. 

 Lot 67 Frederick 
Street cnr Walcott 
Street 

Office 1. Office Development to be generally in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Residential Design Codes in regard to side 
and rear setbacks, building height and site 
coverage. 
2. All other development standards as 
determined by Council. 

 Part Lot 103 
Frederick Street, 
cnr Weld Street 

Office, but only 
to a depth of 
50.29 metres as 
measured from 
the Frederick 
Street 
boundary. 

1. Office Development to be generally in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Residential Design Codes in regard to side 
and rear setbacks, building height and site 
coverage. 
2. All other development standards as 
determined by Council. 

 Part Lots 71 and  
72 Frederick  
Street 

Office, but only 
to a depth of 
50.29 metres as 
measured from 
the Frederick 
Street 
boundaries 

1. Office Development to be generally in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Residential Design Codes in regard to side 
and rear setbacks, building height and site 
coverage. 
2. All other development standards as 
determined by Council. 

 Lot 73 Frederick 
Street cnr Herbert 
Street 

Office, with 
development 
and operations 
to front 
Frederick 
Street so as not 
to detract from 
the residential 
amenity of 
dwellings 
immediately 
opposite on 
Herbert Street 

1. Office Development to be generally in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Residential Design Codes in regard to side 
and rear setbacks, building height and site 
coverage. 
2. All other development standards as 
determined by Council. 

G. T. CAMPBELL, President. 
I. M. BODILL, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI402* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Wyndham-East Kimberley 

Town Planning Scheme No. 7—Amendment No. 17 
Ref: 853/7/5/9 Pt 17  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 7 of the Town Planning and 
Development Act 1928 (as amended) that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the 
Shire of Wyndham-East Kimberley town planning scheme amendment on 21 February 2006 for the 
purpose of— 
 1. Recoding the residential densities of Lot 134, 137, 138 and 144 Grevillia Avenue and Lot 169 

Gardenia Drive from “Residential R15” to “Residential R20”.  



28 February 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 919 

 2. Recoding the residential densities of Lot 2396 Banyan Street from “Residential R15/50” and 
“Residential R15” to “Residential R30”. 

 3. Rezoning and recoding Lot 2397 Banyan Street from “Special Site Zone” and “Local Centre 
Zone” to “Residential Zone—Residential R30”. 

 4. Rezoning and recoding Portion of Drainage Reserve R42153, corner of Casuarina Way and 
Gardenia Drive, from “Public Purposes Reserve” to “Residential Zone—Residential R15”. 

 5. Amending the Scheme Amendment Maps accordingly.  

W. BARNES, President 
P. STUBBS, Chief Executive Officer. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Albert Edgar Gorringe, formerly of 37 Honeysuckle Ramble, Halls Head in the State of Western 
Australia late of Mandurah Nursing Home, Hungerford Avenue, Mandurah in the said State, Male 
Nurse (in the will, Retired Assistant Director of Nursing), deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustee’s Act, 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 31st December, 2005 are required by the personal 
representatives to send particulars of their claims to them care of Clement & Co, Lawyers, Unit 2, 
12 Sutton Street, Mandurah by the 31st March, 2006 after which date the personal representatives 
may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which they then have notice. 

CLEMENT & CO, as solicitors for the personal representatives. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

A L L   N E W   ! 
WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Consolidated Loose Leaf Version 
(Including Index) 

 
$49.80 (incl. GST) Plus Postage 

Green Binder is an additional $17.20 if required 

Available from: 
State Law Publisher 

10 William Street, Perth 
Telephone: 9321 7688 

Fax: 9321 7536 
sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 



920 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 February 2006 

 

 
 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 
 

LAW ALMANAC 
2006 

 

 
 

$24.75 (incl. GST) 
(plus postage on 585 grams) 

 
AVAILABLE FROM 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER, 
10 WILLIAM ST, PERTH 

PHONE 9321 7688 
FAX 9321 7536 

www.slp.wa.gov.au 



28 February 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 921 

 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

PUBLIC TRANSPORT AUTHORITY 
ACT 2003 

Price: $19.00 counter sales 
Plus postage on 260 grams 

 
*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

PUBLIC INTEREST DISCLOSURE 
ACT 2003 

Price: $9.05 counter sales 
Plus postage on 107 grams 

 
*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
 

CARBON RIGHTS ACT 2003 
Price: $12.80 counter sales 
Plus postage on 150 grams 

 
*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

CORRUPTION AND CRIME COMMISSION 
ACT 2003 

Price: $29.00 counter sales 
Plus postage on 610 grams 

 
*Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



922 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 28 February 2006 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES 

(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS) 
For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State 
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the 
missing item. 
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full. 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2006 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2006. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 845.90
  Interstate  ..................................... 862.40
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,178.00
 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,098.90
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 771.10
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 407.00
  Interstate ...................................... 484.00
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 558.00
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 333.30
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 803.00
  Interstate ...................................... 981.20
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 924.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 792.00
  Interstate ...................................... 804.10
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999  
 (per year) ........................................  821.70

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 287.10 
  Interstate ....................................... 319.00 
  Overseas ........................................ 295.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 789.80 

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)........................................ 286.00 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 309.10 
  Interstate ........................................ 319.00 
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 415.00 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA ...................................... 423.50 
  Interstate ....................................... 444.40 
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 601.00 

 

 

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is 
searchable. Other CD ROM products with 
legislation or other statutory information can 
be packaged to individual requirements.  
Prices are available on request. 

 
 

!200600039GG! 


