
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  1871 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 26 MAY 2006 No. 90 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Industrial Training Act 1975—Industrial Training (Apprenticeship Training) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 ............................................................................................................1873 

Local Government Act 1995—Local Government (Amendment of Part VIA—Employee 
Superannuation) Regulations 2006 ...........................................................................................1877 

Road Traffic Act 1974— 
Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006 ..............................1881 
Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2006 ..............................1882 
Road Traffic (Vehicle Standards) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006 ............................1883 
Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006...........................................1884 
Road Traffic (Fees for Vehicle Licences) Regulations 2006...................................................1885 
Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2006...........................................1888 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967—Mooring Amendment Regulations 2006................................1879 
Western Australian Marine Act 1982—Western Australian Marine (Infringements) 

Amendment Regulations 2006 ...................................................................................................1880 
Workers’ Compensation and Injury Management Act 1981—Workers’ Compensation 

(DRD) Amendment Rules 2006..................................................................................................1892 
 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Agriculture .....................................................................................................................................1896 
Armadale Redevelopment Authority ............................................................................................1896 
Deceased Estates ...........................................................................................................................1912 
Energy ............................................................................................................................................1897 
Fire and Emergency Services ........................................................................................................1898 
Fisheries .........................................................................................................................................1903 
Heritage..........................................................................................................................................1903 
Justice.............................................................................................................................................1904 
Local Government..........................................................................................................................1906 
Minerals and Petroleum................................................................................................................1907 
Planning and Infrastructure .........................................................................................................1909 
Police ..............................................................................................................................................1910 
Premier and Cabinet......................................................................................................................1911 
Racing, Gaming and Liquor...........................................................................................................1911 
Transport........................................................................................................................................1912 
Water ..............................................................................................................................................1912 
 
 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2005 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$22.90 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$53.45 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$53.45 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$10.70 

  Bulk Notices—$199.10 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1873 

 

— PART 1 — 

EDUCATION 

ED301* 

Industrial Training Act 1975 

Industrial Training (Apprenticeship Training) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Industrial Training (Apprenticeship 
Training) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 June 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Industrial 
Training (Apprenticeship Training) Regulations 1981*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 2 August 2002. 
  For amendments to 3 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 214 and 
Gazette 4 April 2006.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting the items for —  

 (i) Autobody Refinisher;  

 (ii) Autobody Repairer; 

 (iii) Automotive Electrical Fitting;  

 (iv) Engineering Tradesperson (Automotive); 

 (v) Engineering Tradesperson (Fabrication); 

 (vi) Engineering Tradesperson (Mechanical); 



1874 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

 (vii) Fuel Injection Fitting; 

 (viii) Shipwrighting;  

 (ix) Shipwrighting and Boatbuilding;  

 (x) Trimming; 

 (b) after the item for “Wood Turning” by inserting the 
following items —  

“     
Automotive Electrician 3.5 Years 
Automotive Technician  
Engineering Tradesperson (Fabrication)  
Engineering Tradesperson (Mechanical)  
Panel Beater  
Shipwright and Boatbuilder  
Vehicle Body Builder  
Vehicle Painter  

    ”; 

 (c) after the item for “Tilelaying” by inserting the following 
item —  

  “    Vehicle Trimmer    ”. 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended by deleting the items for —  

 (a) Automotive Electrical Fitting; 

 (b) Fuel Injection Fitting; 

 (c) Engineering Tradesperson (Fabrication); 

 (d) Engineering Tradesperson (Mechanical); 

 (e) Shipwrighting; 

 (f) Trimming. 

6. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 is amended by deleting the item for “Engineering 
Tradesperson (Fabrication) Engineering Tradesperson 
(Mechanical)”. 

7. Schedule 3A amended 

 (1) Schedule 3A is amended by inserting the following items in the 
appropriate alphabetical positions —  

“     

Engineering 
Tradesperson 
(Fabrication) 

352 hours 352 hours 160 hours  

Engineering 
Tradesperson 
(Mechanical) 

352 hours 352 hours 160 hours  

Shipwright and 
Boatbuilder 

352 hours 352 hours 160 hours  



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1875 

 

Automotive 
Electrician 

352 hours 352 hours 160 hours  

Automotive 
Technician 

352 hours 352 hours 160 hours  

Panel Beater 352 hours 352 hours 160 hours  

Vehicle Body 
Builder 

352 hours 352 hours 160 hours  

Vehicle Painter 352 hours 352 hours 160 hours  

Vehicle Trimmer 352 hours 352 hours 160 hours  

    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 3A is amended by inserting at the end of the 
Schedule —  

“     
  For the purpose of this Schedule attendance for one day 

shall be taken to constitute attendance for 8 hours. 
    ”. 

8. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 is amended by deleting the items for —  

 (a) Automotive Electrical Fitting; 

 (b) Shipwrighting; 

 (c) Trimming. 

9. Transitional 

 (1) Subject to this regulation the Industrial Training 
(Apprenticeship Training) Regulations 1981 as in force 
immediately before 1 June 2006 continue to apply to and in 
relation to —  

 (a) an apprentice who commenced service in an old trade 
under an apprenticeship agreement before 1 June 2006; 
or  

 (b) a person who —  

 (i) commenced employment as a probationer in an 
old trade before 1 June 2006; and 

 (ii) completes that probationary employment after 
1 June 2006; and 

 (iii) on completing that probationary employment 
commences service under an apprenticeship 
agreement, 

  (an “existing probationer”). 

 (2) The parties to the apprenticeship agreement of an existing 
probationer may, with the approval of the Director, agree in the 
apprenticeship agreement — 

 (a) if the probationer was employed in a trade that is also a 
new trade, that the apprentice is to be employed in the 



1876 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

same trade but that the term of the apprenticeship is to 
be the new term for that trade; or  

 (b) that —  

 (i) the apprentice is to be employed in a new trade 
(instead of the old trade in which he or she was 
employed as a probationer); and  

 (ii) the term of the apprenticeship is to be the new 
term for that new trade.  

 (3) If the parties to an apprenticeship agreement agree in the 
manner described in subregulation (2)(a) or (b), 
subregulation (1) ceases to apply to and in relation to the 
apprentice when he or she commences service under the 
apprenticeship agreement. 

 (4) In this regulation —  

 “old trade” means —  

 (a) Autobody Refinisher; or  

 (b) Autobody Repairer; or 

 (c) Automotive Electrical Fitting; or 

 (d) Engineering Tradesperson (Automotive); or 

 (e) Engineering Tradesperson (Fabrication); or 

 (f) Engineering Tradesperson (Mechanical); or 

 (g) Fuel Injection Fitting; or 

 (h) Shipwrighting; or 

 (i) Shipwrighting and Boatbuilding; or 

 (j) Trimming; 

 “new term”, in relation to a trade, means the term prescribed in 
relation to that trade in the Industrial Training 
(Apprenticeship Training) Regulations 1981 Schedule 1, as 
amended by these regulations;  

 “new trade” means —  

 (a) Automotive Electrician; or 

 (b) Automotive Technician; or 

 (c) Engineering Tradesperson (Fabrication); or  

 (d) Engineering Tradesperson (Mechanical); or  

 (e) Panel Beater; or 

 (f) Shipwright and Boatbuilder; or 

 (g) Vehicle Body Builder; or 

 (h) Vehicle Painter; or 

 (i) Vehicle Trimmer. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1877 

 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 

Local Government Act 1995 

Local Government (Amendment of Part VIA - 
Employee Superannuation) Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Local Government (Amendment of 
Part VIA - Employee Superannuation) Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. Continued provisions of Local Government Act 1960 
Part VIA amended  

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Local 
Government Act 1960* Part VIA as continued by the Local 
Government Act 1995** Schedule 9.3 clause 16. 

 [* Reprinted as at 24 June 1983. 
  For subsequent amendments prior to commencement of 

Local Government Act 1995 see 1995 Index to Legislation 
of Western Australia, Table 1, p. 130-2.] 

 [** Reprint 3 as at 5 August 2005  
  For subsequent amendments see Acts No. 24 and 38 of 

2005.] 

4. Section 170A amended 

  Section 170A(1) is amended by deleting the definition of 
“industry scheme” and inserting the following definition 
instead —  

“     
 “industry scheme” means the WA Local Government 

Superannuation Plan (formerly called the W.A. 
Local Government Occupational Superannuation 
Fund) established by a trust deed dated 
21 March 1990 and continued under a trust deed 
dated 4 November 2004;  

    ”. 



1878 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

5. Section 170B amended 

  After section 170B(4) the following subsections are inserted —  

“     
 (5) If, in respect of an employee for any period —  

 (a) there is a chosen fund for the employee 
throughout the period; and 

 (b) the chosen fund is not the industry scheme; and 

 (c) the municipality makes the minimum SG 
contributions for the employee for that period 
to the chosen fund, 

  the amount that the municipality would, but for this 
subsection, be required under subsection (1) and the 
industry scheme trust deed to contribute to the industry 
scheme for that employee for that period is reduced by 
the amount of those minimum SG contributions made 
to the chosen fund.  

 (6) In subsection (5) —  

 (a) the following terms have the same meanings as 
they have in the Superannuation Guarantee 
(Administration) Act 1992 (Cwlth) —  

 (i) chosen fund for the employer;  

 (ii) individual superannuation guarantee 
shortfall; 

  and 

 (b) a reference to a municipality making the 
minimum SG contributions for an employee for 
a period is a reference to the municipality 
making the contributions necessary for it to 
avoid incurring an individual superannuation 
guarantee shortfall in respect of the employee 
in respect of that period.  

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 

 

 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1879 

 

MARINE/MARITIME 
MX302* 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Mooring Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Mooring Amendment Regulations 
2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Mooring 
Regulations 1998*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 8 August 2003. 
  For amendments to 1 February 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 371 and 
Gazette 24 June 2005.] 

3. Heading to Part 2 replaced 

  The heading to Part 2 is deleted and the following heading is 
inserted instead —  

“     
Part 2 — Moorings and use of mooring 

control areas 
    ”. 

4. Regulation 6A inserted 

  After regulation 6 the following regulation is inserted — 

“     
6A. Use of temporary anchors in mooring control area 

 (1) A person must not, in a mooring control area —  

 (a) secure a vessel, or allow it to remain secured to 
any gear other than a mooring for a period of 
more than 6 hours; or 

 (b) otherwise anchor a vessel, or allow it to remain 
anchored, for a period of more than 6 hours,  

  unless the vessel is manned for the whole of the period 
it is so secured or anchored. 

 Penalty: $1 000. 

 (2) Subsection (1) does not apply so as to prohibit —  

 (a) a tender, as defined in regulation 6(4), from 
being secured to another vessel; or 



1880 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

 (b) the vessel being secured or anchored in the 
event of an emergency.  

    ”. 

5. Regulation 7 amended 

  Regulation 7(1) is amended by deleting “a mooring in”. 
 
By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 

 

MX301* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

Western Australian Marine (Infringements) 
Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Western Australian Marine 
(Infringements) Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendment in these regulations is to the Western Australian 
Marine (Infringements) Regulations 1985*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 27 August 1999. 
  For amendments to 1 February 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 452 and 
Gazette 23 December 2005.] 

3. First Schedule amended 

  The First Schedule is amended by inserting the following item 
after item 100 —  

“     
101 6A Securing vessel in a mooring control area 

for more than 6 hours …………………… 
 

100 
    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1881 

 

TRANSPORT 

TR301* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Drivers’ Licences) Regulations 1975*. 

 [* Reprint 6 as at 18 March 2005. 
  For amendments to 1 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 357.] 

4. Schedule 11 amended 

  Schedule 11 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 4(a) by deleting “33.80” and inserting instead —  

  “    35.00    ”; 

 (b) in item 4(b) by deleting “107.30” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    111.00    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

 

——————————— 
 



1882 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

TR302* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Drivers’ Licences) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Drivers’ Licences) Regulations 1975*. 

 [* Reprint 6 as at 18 March 2005. 
  For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 357.] 

4. Regulation 9 amended 

  Regulation 9 is amended by deleting “$11.50.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $12.10.    ”. 

5. Regulation 9A amended 

  Regulation 9A(c) is amended by deleting “$11.50;” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $12.10;    ”. 

6. Regulation 15 amended 

 (1) Regulation 15(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$75.80;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $80.30;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$151.60.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $160.60.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 15(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$16.40;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $17.30;    ”; 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1883 

 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$33.10.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $35.00.    ”. 

7. Schedule 11 amended 

  Schedule 11 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1(a)(i) by deleting “53.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    55.40    ”; 

 (b) in item 1(a)(ii) by deleting “150.30” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    155.70    ”; 

 (c) in item 1(b) by deleting “41.80” and inserting instead —  
  “    43.30    ”; 

 (d) in item 2(a) by deleting “27.40” and inserting instead —  
  “    28.40    ”; 

 (e) in item 2(b) by deleting “109.30” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    113.20    ”; 

 (f) in item 3 by deleting “9.90” and inserting instead —  
  “    10.20    ”; 

 (g) in item 5(b) by deleting “81.10” and inserting instead —  
  “    84.00    ”; 

 (h) in item 6 by deleting “25.20” and inserting instead —  
  “    26.10    ”; 

 (i) in item 7 by deleting “15.50” and inserting instead —  
  “    16.00    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 
TR303* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Vehicle Standards) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Vehicle Standards) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 



1884 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Vehicle Standards) Regulations 2002*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 2 December 2005. 
  For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 365.] 

4. Regulation 69 amended 

  Regulation 69(3) is amended by deleting “$31.00.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $32.00.    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

——————————— 
 

TR304* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Licensing) Regulations 1975*. 

 [* Reprint 6 as at 26 August 2005. 
  For amendments to 1 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 363.] 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1885 

 

4. Regulation 21PB amended 

  Regulation 21PB(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$53;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $55;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$53” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $55    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

TR305* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Fees for Vehicle Licences) 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 28A. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Fees for Vehicle 
Licences) Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 31 May 2006. 

3. Specified day: section 28A 

  For the purposes of section 28A(3) of the Act, the specified day 
in relation to these regulations is 1 July 2006. 

4. The Act amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
Act 1974*. 

 [* Reprint 9 as at 10 March 2006.] 



1886 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

5. Second Schedule amended 

 (1) Second Schedule Part III Division 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 2(1) —  

 (i) by deleting “$14.24” and inserting instead —  

  “    $14.75    ”; and 

 (ii) by deleting “$334.00.” and inserting instead —  

  “    $343.00.    ”; 

 (b) in item 3 —  

 (i) by deleting “$14.24” and inserting instead —  

  “    $14.75    ”; and 

 (ii) by deleting “$1 446.00.” and inserting instead —  

  “    $1 485.00.    ”; 

 (c) in item 4 by deleting “$7.11” and inserting instead —  

  “    $7.37    ”; 

 (d) in item 5 —  

 (i) by deleting “$3.56” and inserting instead —  

  “    $3.69    ”; and 

 (ii) by deleting “$83.00.” and inserting instead —  

  “    $86.00.    ”; 

 (e) in item 6(1) by deleting “$28.48.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $29.51.    ”; 

 (f) in item 6(2) by deleting “$42.75.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $44.29.    ”. 

 (2) Second Schedule Part III Division 4 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting the Table to clause 3 and inserting the 
following Table instead —  

“     
Table 

Licence Class Fee 
$ 

1B2 343 
2B2 572 
2B3 1 428 
AB3 572 

    ”; 

 (b) by deleting the Table to clause 4 and inserting the 
following Table instead —  

“     
Table 

Licence Class Fee 
$ 

1R2 343 
2R2 572 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1887 

 

Licence Class Fee 
$ 

1R3 686 
2R3 914 
1R4 1 029 
2R4 2 285 
1R5 1 029 
2R5 2 285 
SR2 629 
SR3 2 285 
SR4 2 285 
SR5 2 285 
MR2 4 342 
MR3 4 342 
MR4 4 684 
MR5 4 684 
LR2 5 998 
LR3 5 998 
LR4 5 998 
LR5 5 998 

    ”; 

 (c) by deleting the Table to clause 5 and inserting the 
following Table instead —  

“     
Table 

Licence Class Fee 
$ 

SP2 1 485 
SP3 3 883 
SP4 5 025 
SP5 5 025 
MP2 4 569 
MP3 5 711 
MP4 6 283 
MP5 6 283 
1LP2 5 711 
1LP3 5 711 
1LP4 6 283 
1LP5 6 283 
2LP2 5 711 
2LP3 5 711 
2LP4 6 283 
2LP5 6 283 

    ”; 

 (d) in clause 6 by deleting “$334.00” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    $343.00    ”; 

 (e) by deleting the Table to clause 7 and inserting the 
following Table instead —  

“     
Table 

Licence Class Fee 
$ 

PSV 86 



1888 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

Licence Class Fee 
$ 

TSV 86 
OSV2 286 
OSV3 572 
OSV4 858 
OSV5 1 144 
OSV6 1 430 
OSV7 1 716 
OSV8 2 002 
OSV9 2 288 

    ”. 
By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

TR306* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Licensing) Regulations 1975*. 

 [* Reprint 6 as at 26 August 2005. 
  For amendments to 5 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 363.] 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1889 

 

4. Regulation 3B amended 

 (1) Regulation 3B(2a) is repealed and the following subregulation 
is inserted instead —  

“     
 (2a) The fee specified in item 2B of Schedule 2 shall be 

payable by the owner of a licensed vehicle for 
examination of the licensed vehicle by the Director 
General for the purpose of verifying the vehicle’s 
identity and/or its specifications. 

    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 3B(2c) is amended by deleting “for the purposes of 
subregulation (2a)”. 

5. Schedule 2 replaced 

  Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 2 — Fees and charges 

 

Item Regulation 
No. 

Service Fee 
$ 

1. 3A(1a) Upon establishment of premises as 
an authorised inspection station. 154.70 

  Each year for the renewal of 
authorisation. 64.30 

2. 3B(1) An initial examination of a caravan 
or trailer without brakes, motor 
cycle, motor carrier, engine change. 41.80 

2A. 3B(1) Subject to items 3, 3AA, 3A and 3B, 
an examination of a vehicle under 
regulation 3B(1) that is not set out in 
item 2. 56.50 

2B. 3B(2a) An examination of a licensed 
vehicle for the purpose of verifying 
the vehicle’s identity and/or 
specifications. 

 
 

41.80 

3. 3B(1) A second or subsequent examination 
of a vehicle referred to in item 2A. 

 
39.10 

3AA. 3B(1) A second or subsequent examination 
of a vehicle referred to in item 2. 30.80 

3A. 3B(2b)(a) An initial examination by the 
Director General of a heavy vehicle 
(i.e. a vehicle with an MRC 
exceeding 4 500 kilograms). 117.40 

3B. 3B(2b)(b) A re-examination by the Director 
General of a heavy vehicle (i.e. a 
vehicle with an MRC exceeding 
4 500 kilograms). 

 
 
 

84.90 



1890 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

Item Regulation 
No. 

Service Fee 
$ 

4. 5A(2) For —  

  (a) searching records —  

   (i) manually, per vehicle; 12.85 

   (ii) by computer where a 
list of vehicles to be 
searched is supplied to 
the Director General on 
magnetic tape, per 
vehicle; 

 
 
 
 
 

2.60 

  (b) production of an extract 
describing the current status of 
ownership of a vehicle, 
according to the Director 
General’s records; 

 
 
 
 

14.05 

  (c) detailed searching of current 
and previous owner’s records 
and production of supporting 
documentation. 

 
 
 

17.20 

5. 8A(1) Recording fee for grant or renewal 
of vehicle licence (not heavy 
vehicle). 

 
 

10.15 

5A. 8A(2) Recording fee for grant or renewal 
of heavy vehicle licence. 

 
16.75 

6. 8B Fee for transfer of a vehicle licence. 8.50 

7. 11(6)(a)(i) Fee for issue of permit for 
unlicensed vehicle. 

 
9.10 

8. 11(6)(b)(i)(B) Minimum permit fee. 21.20 

9. 14 Fee for issue of duplicate or certified 
copy of a vehicle licence. 

 
10.20 

9A. 21K Fee for authorisation under 
regulation 21K(4). 

 
10.30 

10. 22(2) Charge —  

(a) for the issue of plates (other 
than personalised plates, plates 
bearing the same characters as 
previous plates, or dealers 
plates) except where 
paragraph (b) applies; 

 
 
 
 
 
 

19.00 

  (b) for the re-issue of plates which 
have been returned under 
regulation 22(3), (3a) or (4) 
(other than personalised plates, 
plates to replace existing plates 
bearing the same characters, or 
dealers plates); 

 
 
 
 
 
 

8.00 

  (c) upon application for the issue 
of personalised plates; 

 
96.60 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1891 

 

Item Regulation 
No. 

Service Fee 
$ 

  (d) upon application for the issue 
of plates to replace ordinary 
plates bearing the same 
characters; 

 
 
 

32.10 

  (e) upon application for the issue 
of plates to replace 
personalised plates bearing the 
same characters without the 
letter “P” previously required 
by these regulations. 

 
 
 
 
 

74.30 

11. 22(2aa) Fee upon application for issue of 
name plates. 

 
735.80 

12. 22(2b) Charge for transfer of right to 
display special plates —  

 

  (a) single digit numeral special 
plates; 

 
7 386.80 

  (b) 2 digit numeral special plates; 1 477.80 

  (c) 3 digit numeral special plates; 735.70 

  (d) any other number of digit 
special plates; 

 
146.90 

  (e) unique series special plates 
referred to in 
regulation 24(4a)(b); 

 
 

1 477.80 

  (f) unique series special plates 
referred to in 
regulation 24(4a)(c). 

 
 

64.40 

13. 22(2ba) Charge for transfer of right to 
display name plates. 

 
368.80 

14. 22(2c) Charge for transfer of right to 
display special plates or name 
plates —  

 

  (a) pursuant to an agreement or 
order under the Family Law 
Act 1975 of the 
Commonwealth; 

 
 
 

15.30 

  (b) to a beneficiary by a trustee or 
other person in a fiduciary 
capacity under a trust whether 
express or implied. 

 
 
 

15.30 

15. 22(2e) Charge upon application for the 
issue of special plates or name plates 
to replace special plates or name 
plates bearing the same 
characters —  

 

  (a) for premium material plates; 167.40 

  (b) for standard metal plates. 81.20 

16. 22(6) Fee for transfer of —  

(a) special plates or name plates 
by a person to another vehicle 
owned by that person; 

 

 
 

15.30 



1892 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

Item Regulation 
No. 

Service Fee 
$ 

  (b) personalised plates by a person 
to another vehicle owned by 
that person or by a member of 
his immediate family. 

 
 
 

15.30 

17. 25B(2) Fee for storage of special plate by 
Director General (per year or part 
thereof). 

 
 

15.30 

18. 26(3) Fee for assignment and issue of 
dealers plates —  

 

  (a) where the plate is issued in 
substitution for a plate bearing 
the same characters, per plate; 

 
 

30.20 

  (b) in any other case, per set of 
plates. 

 
21.40 

19. 26A Annual fee for the use and 
possession of dealers plates. 

 
87.50 

20. 33 Fee for duplicate of registration 
label. 

 
0.50 

21. 38B Fee for duplicate tax invoice. 10.20 
    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

WORKCOVER 

WC301* 

Workers’ Compensation and Injury Management Act 1981 

Workers’ Compensation (DRD) Amendment 
Rules 2006 

Made by the Commissioner under section 293 of the Act after 
consultation with the Director. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Workers’ Compensation (DRD) Amendment 
Rules 2006. 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1893 

 

2. The rules amended 

  The amendments in these rules are to the Workers’ 
Compensation (DRD) Rules 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 4 November 2005, p. 5353-418. 
  For amendments to 18 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 480.] 

3. Rule 13 amended 

  Rule 13(6) is amended by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”. 

4. Rule 21 amended 

  After rule 21(4) the following subrule is inserted — 

“     
 (5) A party who obtains an order for substituted service 

must, within 7 days of complying with the order, file a 
certificate of service in the approved form with the 
Director. 

    ”. 

5. Rule 35 amended 

  Rule 35 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “filed.” and inserting instead —  

  “    accepted by the Director.    ”. 

6. Rule 36 amended 

  Rule 36 is amended by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”. 

7. Rule 39 amended 

 (1) Rule 39(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “filed.” and inserting instead —  

  “    accepted by the Director.    ”. 

 (2) Rule 39(3) is amended by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”. 

8. Rule 42 amended 

  Rule 42 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”; 



1894 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

 (b) by deleting “filed.” and inserting instead —  

  “    accepted by the Director.    ”. 

9. Rule 43 amended 

  Rule 43 is amended by deleting “7” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”. 

10. Rule 47 amended 

 (1) Rule 47(4) is amended by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”. 

 (2) Rule 47(5) is amended by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”. 

11. Rule 48 amended 

  Rule 48(1)(c) is amended by inserting after “241(1)(b)” —  

  “    or 241(2)(b), as the case requires,     ”. 

12. Rule 50 amended 

  Rule 50 is amended by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”. 

13. Rule 51 amended 

  Rule 51 is amended by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”. 

14. Rule 58 amended 

 (1) Rule 58(5)(c) is amended by deleting “70” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    71    ”. 

 (2) Rule 58(5)(c) is amended by deleting the comma at the end of 
the paragraph and inserting instead —  

“     
  ; or 

 (d) an application under section 72A of the Act for 
an order that weekly payments be suspended or 
discontinued, 

    ”. 

15. Rule 65 amended 

  Rule 65(1) is amended by deleting “3” and inserting instead —  

  “    5    ”. 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1895 

 

16. Rule 80 amended 

  Rule 80(1)(a) is amended by deleting “10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    14    ”. 

17. Rule 81 amended 

  Rule 81(1) is amended by deleting “10” and inserting instead —  

  “    14    ”. 

18. Rule 97 amended 

  Rule 97(1)(b) is amended by deleting “3” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    5    ”. 

 
Date: 19 May 2006. 

 
P. M. NISBET, Commissioner. 

 

 

 

 
——————————— 

 
 



1896 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

— PART 2 — 

AGRICULTURE 

AG401* 
AGRICULTURE AND RELATED RESOURCES PROTECTION ACT 1976 

DECLARED PLANTS 
Agriculture Protection Board, 

South Perth. 
Acting pursuant to the powers granted by Section 35 and 36 of the Agriculture and Related Resources 
Protection Act 1976, the Agriculture Protection Board hereby declares the following plants to be 
declared plants and assigns them to the categories listed below— 

Common Name Scientific Name Declaration 
bitou bush/boneseed Chrysanthemoides monilifera P1, P2 for the whole of the 

State 
sensitive plant, common Mimosa pudica P1, P2 for the whole of the 

State 
harrisia cactus Harrisia martini P1, P2 for the whole of the 

State 
arum lily Zantedeschia aethiopica P1, P4 for the whole of the 

State 
physic nut Jatropha curcas P1 for the whole of the State, 

P2 for all municipal districts 
in that portion of the State 
south of the 26th parallel, 
P4 for all municipal districts 
in that portion of the State 
north of the 26th parallel. 

bellyache bush Jatropha gossypifolia P1 for the whole of the State, 
P2 for all municipal districts 
in that portion of the State 
south of the 26th parallel, 
P4 for all municipal districts 
in that portion of the State 
north of the 26th parallel. 

Dated: 24 May 2006. 
CHRIS RICHARDSON, Chairman. 

ARMADALE REDEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY 

AB401* 
ARMADALE REDEVLOPMENT ACT 2001 

ARMADALE REDEVELOPMENT SCHEME 2004—AMENDMENT NO. 6 
In accordance with section 34 and 35(3)(d) of the Act, it is hereby notified for public information that 
Amendment No. 6 to the Armadale Redevelopment Scheme 2004 has been approved by the Minister 
for Planning and Infrastructure. 
The Armadale Redevelopment Authority advises that as a result of the Minister’s approval, the 
amended redevelopment scheme comes into operation on 26 May 2006. The effect of the Amendment 
is inclusion of the Kelmscott precinct within the Armadale Redevelopment Scheme area with relevant 
statutory provisions, in order to coordinate its subdivision and development. 
A copy of Amendment No. 6 is retained and may be inspected at the offices of the Armadale 
Redevelopment Authority at Unit 5, Jull Street Mall, Armadale. 

JOHN ELLIS, Executive Director. 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1897 

 

ENERGY 

EN101* 
CORRECTION 

ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY (WHOLESALE ELECTRICITY MARKET) 

REGULATIONS 2004 
WHOLESALE ELECTRICITY MARKET RULES 

In the notice published in the Government Gazette on 28 April 2005, item EN401 at pages 1661 and 
1662, an error occurred and is corrected as follows. 
At page 1661 Delete heading— 

“COMMENCEMENT OF PROVISIONS 2.16.6, 2.16.7, 2.16.9, 2.16.9A, AND 2.16.9B OF THE 
MARKET RULES” 

and insert— 
“COMMENCEMENT OF PROVISIONS 2.1.2(n), 2.16.6 and 2.16.7 OF THE MARKET RULES” 

At page 1661 Delete— 
“Provisions 2.16.6, 2.16.7, 2.16.9, 2.16.9A, and 2.16.9B of the Wholesale Electricity Market Rules 
made under regulation 6(2) of the Electricity Industry (Wholesale Electricity Market) Regulations 
2004” 

and insert— 
“Provisions 2.1.2(n), 2.16.6, and 2.16.7 of the Wholesale Electricity Market Rules made under 
regulation 6(2) of the Electricity Industry (Wholesale Electricity Market) Regulations 2004” 

Dated at Perth this 22nd day of May 2006. 
FRANCIS LOGAN MLA, Minister for Energy. 

 

——————————— 
 

EN401* 
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23 (1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS 
Notice is given that the following Retail Licence has been granted— 

Licensee: Alinta Sales Pty Ltd 
Issue Date: 19 May 2006 
Address of Licensee: GPO Box W 2030 
 PERTH WA 6846 
Classification: Retail  
Term of Licence: Up to and including 18 May 2021 
Area Covered: Within the boundaries of the South West Interconnected System 

Electricity Licence Area as set out in Plan No. ERA-EL-082. 
Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
 6th Floor 
 197 St Georges Terrace 
 Perth WA 6000 
 http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

 

——————————— 
 

EN402* 
ENERGY COORDINATION ACT 1994 

APPROVAL OF AMENDMENTS TO GAS RETAIL MARKET SCHEME 
Retail Energy Market Company Limited (“REMCo”) submitted the following amendments to the 
REMCo Constitution to the Authority, pursuant to Section 11ZOM of the Energy Coordination Act 
1994, for approval as an amendment to the gas retail market scheme operated by (“REMCo”)— 
 (1) It was resolved as a special resolution— 
  THAT the Constitution of the Company be amended with effect on and from 14 March 2006 

as follows— 
 (a) In clause 8.4, delete the word “and” occurring at the end of paragraph (c); 



1898 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

 (b) In clause 8.4, insert the following new paragraph (d) immediately following 
paragraph (c)— 

 (d) continue to be liable for any obligations (including any charges that may be 
imposed) under the Retail Market Rules as if the Member were a user for the 
purposes of rule 377B for the period ceasing on the earlier of the dates in sub-
paragraphs (i) and (ii) of sub-rule 377B(2)(b) of the Retail Market Rules; and 

  and 
 (c) In clause 8.4, renumber the existing paragraph (d) as paragraph (e). 
 (2) It was resolved as a special resolution— 
  THAT the Constitution of the Company be amended with effect on and from 14 March 2006 

as follows— 
 (a) In clause 8.2(b), insert the words “, or has ceased,” after the word “ceases”; 
 (b) In clause 8.2(b), delete the words “and more than 425 days have passed since the 

cessation of such business”; 
 (c) In clause 7.1, delete the word “or” occurring at the end of paragraph (b); 
 (d) In clause 7.1, delete paragraph (c); 
 (e) In clause 7.1, renumber the existing paragraph (d) as paragraph (c);  
 (f) In clause 10.6(e), delete paragraph (v); 
 (g) In clause 10.6(e), renumber the existing paragraph (vi) as paragraph (v); 
 (h) In clause 1.1, insert the following definition— 
  “Ex-Licensee” means a person that before 14 March 2006 held a Licence but ceased to 

do so, or was a Gas Retailer as defined in Clause 7.1 but ceased to be so, before 
14 March 2006, whether or not that person is a Member or the person’s 
membership has been revoked under clause 8.6; 

  and 
 (i) Insert the following new clauses 8.5 and 8.6 immediately following clause 8.4— 
 8.5 Ex-Licensees 
  An Ex-Licensee continues to be liable for any obligations (including any charges 

that may be imposed) under the Retail Market Rules until 453 days have passed 
since that person first became an Ex-Licensee. 

 8.6 Removal of Ex-Licensees 
  The Board may by resolution revoke the membership of an Ex-Licensee and, 

upon receipt by that Ex-Licensee of written notice of such resolution, the person 
ceases to be a Member and, for the avoidance of doubt, clauses 8.4 and 8.5 apply 
to such an Ex-Licensee. 

These amendments to the Constitution of REMCo were approved by the Authority on 26 April 2006. 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman,  
Economic Regulation Authority. 

FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES 

FE401* 
FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES AUTHORITY OF 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1998 
DETERMINATION UNDER SECTION 35B 

Annual Estimates of Expenditure by Authority 
Pursuant to Section 35B of the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western Australia Act 1998, 
the Authority is to cause an annual estimate of its expenditure, expenditure attributable to 
prescribed services and amounts payable to local governments in relation to the services to be 
provided under the emergency services Acts, to be prepared and submitted to the Minister for 
approval. 
Your approval is sought for the total estimated expenditure of $189,083,000 for the financial year 
2006/2007 in accordance with Section 35B. 
The estimate above includes— 
 • Section 35B(2)(a) provision for amounts attributable to 

prescribed services (not yet regulated): Nil 
  and 
 • Section 35B(2)(b) provision for amounts payable to 

local governments: $17,000,000 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1899 

 

Ministerial Approval 
Pursuant to Section 35B of the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western Australia Act 1998, 
I, John Kobelke, the Minister administering the said Act, hereby approve the annual estimates of 
expenditure in relation to the services to be provided under the emergency services Acts of 
$189,083,000 for the financial year 2006/2007. 
Date: 20/5/06. 

Hon JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Police 
and Emergency Services. 

 

——————————— 
 

FE402* 
FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES AUTHORITY OF 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1998 
DETERMINATION UNDER SECTION 36G(3) 

Determination and Assessment of Levy 
Pursuant to Section 36G(3) of the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western Australia 
Act 1998, the Minister is to determine the emergency services levy that is payable for the next levy 
year on all land that is located in an ESL area by reference to the estimate of expenditure approved 
under section 35B less the amount identified under section 35B(2)(a), less monies appropriated by 
Parliament and any other matter the Minister considers relevant to a proper determination of the 
levy. 
Your approval is sought for the emergency services levy that is payable of $146,959,000 for the levy 
year 2006/2007 in accordance with Section 36G(3) of the Act that is made up as follows— 
 $ 

Section 35B annual estimate of expenditure 189,083,000 
Less: 

 – Section 36G(3)(a)(i) amounts attributable to 
prescribed services (not yet regulated) — 

 – Section 36G(3)(a)(ii) amounts appropriated by Parliament (34,207,000) 
 – Section 36G(3)(b) amounts the Minister considers relevant (7,917,000) 
   —–––––––––– 

Emergency Services Levy Payable $146,959,000 
   —–––––––––– 

———— 
Ministerial Approval 
Pursuant to Section 36G(3) of the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western Australia 
Act 1998, I, John Kobelke, the Minister administering the said Act, hereby approve the emergency 
services levy payable in relation to the services to be provided under the emergency services Acts of 
$146,959,000 for the levy year 2006/2007. 
Date: 20/5/06. 

Hon JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Police 
and Emergency Services. 

 

——————————— 
 

FE403* 
FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES AUTHORITY OF 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1998 
DETERMINATION UNDER SECTIONS 36G(1) AND 36I 

Fire and Emergency Services (Determination of Emergency 
Services Levy) Notice 2006 

1. Determination of levy for 2006/07 levy year [36G(1)] 
(1) The emergency services levy that is payable for the 2006/07 levy year on land in ESL categories 1, 
2, 3 and 4 is determined as a rate in the dollar of the gross rental value (GRV) of the land as follows— 
 (a) for land in ESL category 1: 0.0146 dollars for each dollar of GRV; 
 (b) for land in ESL category 2: 0.0110 dollars for each dollar of GRV; 
 (c) for land in ESL category 3: 0.0073 dollars for each dollar of GRV; 
 (d) for land in ESL category 4: 0.0051 dollars for each dollar of GRV. 
(2) The emergency services levy that is payable for the 2006/07 levy year on land in ESL category 5 is 
determined as a fixed charge of $35.00. 
(3) Subclauses (1) and (2) apply regardless of the purpose for which the land is used. 



1900 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

2. Determination of minimum and maximum amounts of levy [36I] 
(1) The minimum amount of levy payable for the 2006/07 levy year on land in ESL categories 1, 2, 3 
and 4 is determined as $35.00. 
(2) Subclause 1 applies regardless of the purpose for which the land is used. 
(3) The maximum amount of levy payable for the 2006/07 levy year on land in ESL categories 1, 2, 3 
and 4 is determined as follows— 
 (a) for vacant land and for land used for farming or single-unit residential purposes: $195.00; 
 (b) for land used for multi-unit residential purposes: $195.00 multiplied by the relevant number 

of units; 
 (c) for land used for commercial, industrial or miscellaneous purposes: $110,000.00. 
Date: 20/5/06. 

Hon JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Police 
and Emergency Services. 

 

 

——————————— 

 

 

FE404* 
FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES AUTHORITY OF 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1998 
DETERMINATION UNDER SECTION 36I 
Minimum and Maximum Levy Charges 

I, John Kobelke, the Minister administering the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western 
Australia Act 1998, hereby declare under Section 36I of that Act that— 
 1. All Pad Mount Transformers and Pad Mount Sites owned by, or vested in, the Electricity 

Networks Corporation and the Regional Power Corporation, and located in areas declared to 
be within ESL Category 1, 2, 3, or 4 shall be levied based solely on the Gross Rental Value 
(GRV) of the property, and no minimum levy threshold shall apply; and 

 2. All land owned by or vested in the Water Corporation that has an individual Gross Rental 
Valuation of less than $2,000 and is located in an area declared to be within ESL Category 1, 
2, 3, or 4 shall be levied based solely on the Gross Rental Value (GRV) of the property, and no 
minimum levy threshold shall apply. 

Date: 20/5/06. 
Hon JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Police 

and Emergency Services. 

 

 

——————————— 

 

 

FE405* 
FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES AUTHORITY OF 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1998 
DETERMINATION UNDER SECTION 36W 

Local Government Levy Administration Fees 
I, John Kobelke, the Minister administering the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western 
Australia Act 1998, hereby determine that under Section 36W of that Act that local governments 
collectively be paid, by the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western Australia, an annual 
“ESL Administration Fee” by 31 October each levy year, which in 2006/07 shall be an aggregate 
payment of $2,250,000. 
This determination has been made following consultation with representatives of the local 
government sector, and having regard to the costs that will be reasonably incurred by local 
governments in administering the levy. 
Date: 20/5/06. 

Hon JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Police 
and Emergency Services. 

 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1901 

 

FE406* 
FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES AUTHORITY OF 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1998 
DETERMINATION UNDER SECTION 36A(2) 

Local Governments Not Required to Submit Estimate of Expenditure 
I, John Kobelke, the Minister administering the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western 
Australia Act 1998, hereby determine that under Section 36A(2) of that Act that the following local 
governments are not required to submit estimates of expenditure for the levy year 2006/07— 

Town of Cambridge 
Shire of Christmas Island 
Town of Claremont 
Shire of Cocos (Keeling) Islands 
Town of Cottesloe 
Town of East Fremantle 
City of Fremantle 
Shire of Halls Creek 
Town of Mosman Park 
City of Nedlands 
Shire of Peppermint Grove 
City of Perth 
City of South Perth 
City of Subiaco 
Shire of Trayning 
Town of Victoria Park 

Date: 20/5/06. 
Hon JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Police 

and Emergency Services. 

 

 

——————————— 

 

 

FE407* 
FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES AUTHORITY OF 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1998 
DETERMINATIONS UNDER SECTION 36H(3) 

Special Levy Charging Arrangements 
I, John Kobelke, the Minister administering the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western 
Australia Act 1998, hereby determine the following matters pursuant to Section 36H(3) of that Act, 
after consultation with the Valuer-General and representatives of the local government sector— 
 1. The following Mining Tenement types (as classified by the Valuer-General) shall be levied a 

fixed charge of $35 in the 2006/07 levy year by each local government in whose district that 
tenement or a portion of that tenement is located— 

 a. Coal Mining Lease (CML); 
 b. Gold Mining Lease (GML); 
 c. Mining Lease (M); 
 d. Mining Lease (Special Agreement) (AM); 
 e. Mineral Lease (ML); 
 f. Mineral Lease (Special Agreement) (AML); 
 g. General Purpose Lease (Special Agreement) (AG); 
 h. Tailing Lease (TL); 
 i. Licence to Treat Tailings (LTT); 
 j. Petroleum Production Licence (PPL); 
 k. Special Licence (Special Agreement) (ASL). 
  This arrangement shall apply regardless of whether the Mining Tenement is in an area 

declared to be within ESL categories 1, 2, 3, 4 or 5, or any combination of those categories. 
 2. If, at 1 July 2006, a Gross Rental Valuation (GRV) of land is not available for leviable land 

that is located in an area declared to be within ESL Category 1, 2, 3 or 4, that land shall be 
charged the minimum annual amount of levy that applies to that land use type with that ESL 
Category in the 2006/07 levy year. 



1902 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

 3. All Pad Mount Transformers and Pad Mount Sites owned by, or vested in, the Electricity 
Networks Corporation and the Regional Power Corporation, that are located in an area 
declared to be within ESL Category 5 shall be treated as one property for the purpose of levy 
assessment and charging. 

 4. All land owned by or vested in Water Corporation that has an individual Gross Rental 
Valuation of less than $2,000 and is located in an area declared to be within ESL Category 5 
shall be treated as one property for the purpose of levy assessment and charging. 

 5. All land that is located in an area declared to be within ESL Category 5 and is included 
within the district of more than one local government, shall be assessed a fixed charge of $35 
by each local government. 

Date: 20/5/06. 
Hon JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Police 

and Emergency Services. 

 

 

 

——————————— 
 

 

 

FE408* 
FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES AUTHORITY OF 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1998 
APPROVAL UNDER SECTION 36ZJ 

Agreements with Local Governments 
I, John Kobelke, the Minister administering the Fire and Emergency Services Authority of Western 
Australia Act 1998, hereby give approval under Section 36ZJ of that Act for the Fire and Emergency 
Services Authority of Western Australia (FESA) to enter into agreements with the following local 
governments, for the terms shown (commencing 1 July 2006)— 

City of Armadale (5 Yr) 
Shire of Busselton (1 Yr) 
Shire of Carnamah (5 Yr) 
Shire of Carnarvon (5 Yr) 
Town of Claremont (3 Yr)* 
Shire of Coolgardie (1 Yr) 
Shire of Corrigin (5 Yr) 
Town of Cottesloe (3 Yr)* 
Shire of Cranbrook (1 Yr) 
Shire of East Pilbara (3 Yr)* 
Shire of Gnowangerup (3 Yr) 
Shire of Irwin (1 Yr) 
Shire of Jerramungup (1 Yr) 
Shire of Kondinin (3 Yr) 
Shire of Lake Grace (3 Yr) 
City of Mandurah (5 Yr) 
Shire of Mingenew (1 Yr) 
Shire of Mundaring (5 Yr) 
Town of Narrogin (1 Yr)* 
Shire of Northampton (5 Yr) 
Shire of Perenjori (3 Yr) 
Shire of Roebourne (3 Yr) 
Shire of Sandstone (3 Yr) 
City of South Perth (3 Yr) 
City of Subiaco (1 Yr) 
Shire of Wagin (1 Yr) 
City of Wanneroo (3 Yr)* 
Shire of Williams (3 Yr)* 
Shire of Wongan-Ballidu (3 Yr)* 

* Local government operated under section 36ZJ in 2005/06. 
Date: 20/5/06. 

Hon JOHN KOBELKE MLA, Minister for Police 
and Emergency Services. 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1903 

 

FISHERIES 

FI401 
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 

KIMBERLEY PRAWN MANAGED FISHERY MANAGEMENT PLAN 1993 
Notice of Areas Closed to Fishing for Prawns 

Notice No. 2 of 2006 
I, Peter Rogers, Executive Director of the Department of Fisheries, in accordance with clause 17 of the 
Kimberley Prawn Managed Fishery Management Plan 1993 (the Plan), do hereby— 
 1. Cancel Notice No. 1 of 2006, dated 28 March 2006; 
 2. Prohibit fishing for prawns in those parts of the Kimberley Prawn Managed Fishery (the 

Fishery), between the times and dates provided for in items (a) and (b) below— 
 (a) Fishing for prawns is prohibited in the waters described in Schedule 2 of the Plan from 

the date of the gazettal of Notice No. 2 of 2006 until 1000 hours WST on 10 June 2006; 
and 

 (b) Fishing for prawns is prohibited in the waters described in Schedule 1 of the Plan 
during the period commencing at 1000 hours WST on 10 June 2006 and ending at 
0600 hours WST on 1 May 2007. 

(WST—Western Standard Time) 
Dated this 23rd day of May 2006. 

P. P. ROGERS, Executive Director. 

HERITAGE 

HR401* 
HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990 

ENTRY OF PLACES IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES 
Notice is hereby given in accordance with section 51(2) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, the places described in Schedule 1 have 
been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect from today. 

Schedule 1 
Description of Place 

Barnes Federal Theatre (fmr) at Lot 71 Tower St, Leonora; Lot 71 on DP 222749 being the whole 
of the land contained in C/T V 1813 F 645, Lot 72 on DP 222749 being the whole of the land contained 
in C/T V 966 F 188 and Ptn of Leonora Lot 71 the subject of D 11927 and being the whole of the land 
contained in C/T V 1076 F 509. 
Cowalla Homestead Group at Cowalla Rd, Cowalla; Ptn of Swan Loc 465 on DP 231047 and being 
part of the land contained in C/T V 2223 F 389 as shown on HCWA Survey Drawing No. 1088 
prepared by Midland Survey Services and dated 18 January 2005. 
Masonic Hall, Bunbury at 74 Wittenoom Street, Bunbury; Bunbury Town Lot 322 being the whole 
of the land contained in C/T V 666 F 148. 

Pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, notice is hereby given in accordance with 
section 49(1) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 that it is proposed that the places 
described in Schedule 2 be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis. The 
Heritage Council invites submissions on the proposal, which must be in writing & should be 
forwarded to the address below not later than 7 July 2006. The places will be entered in the Register 
on an interim basis with effect from today in accordance with section 50(1) of the Heritage of Western 
Australia Act 1990. 

Schedule 2 
Description of Place 

Carrolup Native Settlement at Mission Rd, Kojonup; The whole of Kojonup Loc 8151 and Ptn of 
Kojonup Loc 7950 being part of the land contained in C/T V 2032 F 545. Ptn of unallocated Crown 
land and that Ptn of Mission Road being part of road number 11460 together as shown on HCWA 
Survey Drawing No. 10592 prepared by Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd. 
Royal Flying Doctor Service House & Office at Clarendon Street, Derby; Lot 519 on D 20400 
being the whole of the land contained in C/T V 2111 F 127. 
St Matthew’s Anglican Church Group, Armadale at 108 Jull Street, Armadale; Lot 200 on D 
97853 being the whole of the land contained in C/T V: 2174 F: 994. 
Victoria Square Cottages Group at 23-29 Victoria Square, Perth; Ptn of Lot A20 on DP 223021 
and being part of the land contained in C/T V 1192 F 717 as is defined in HCWA Survey Drawing No. 
2121 prepared by Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd. 



1904 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

NOTICE OF ADVICE REGARDING REGISTRATION OF CROWN PROPERTY 
In accordance with section 47(5) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990, the Heritage Council 
hereby gives notice that it has advised the Minister for Heritage that it has resolved that— 
 1. the places listed in Schedule 3 are of cultural heritage significance, and are of value for the 

present community and future generations; 
 2. the protection afforded by the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 is appropriate; and 
 3. the places should be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on an interim basis. 
The places will be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on an interim basis with effect from 
today in accordance with section 50(1)(b) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990. The places 
listed in Schedule 3 are vested in the Crown, or in a person on behalf of the Crown, in right of the 
State. 
The Heritage Council hereby invites submissions as to whether the places listed in Schedule 3 should 
be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis. The submissions must be in 
writing and should be forwarded to the address set out below not later than 7 July 2006. 

Schedule 3 
Description of Place 

Corunna Downs Station and Former Wartime Airbase at Salgash Corunna Downs Road, East 
Pilbara; Ptn of De Grey Loc 92 being part of Crown Lease 483/1968 and part of the land contained in 
CLT V 3065 F 322, Ptn of De Grey Loc 22 being part of Reserve 13672 and Ptn of Corunna Downs 
Road being an unnumbered road reserve, together as shown on HCWA Survey Drawing No. 3695 
prepared by Whelans and dated 25 January 2005. 
Fremantle Traffic Bridge (1939) & Ferry Capstan Base at Queen Victoria Street and Beach 
Street, Fremantle; Ptns of the Queen Victoria Street and Beach Street Road Reserves and the whole 
of Fremantle Traffic Bridge being Main Roads of Western Australia Bridge No. 916. Ptn of Lot 4565 
on DP 220793 and being part of the land contained in CLT V: 3117 F 615. North Fremantle Lot 406 
being part of Reserve 33710. Ptn of Lot 2114 on DP 192891 being part of Reserve 29675 and part of 
the land contained in CLT V: 3108 F 28. Ptn of Lot 1941 on DP 213981 being part of Reserve 4720 
and part of the land contained in CLT V: 3037 F 561 and Ptn of Fremantle Lot 2010 being part of 
Reserve 37088. Ptn of the Swan River riverbed together as are defined in HCWA Survey Drawing No 
4207 prepared by Cadgraphics WA. 
Gascoyne Research Station at South River Road cnr Research Road, Carnarvon; Ptns of Gascoyne 
Locs 125, 460 and 461 being part of Reserve 18009 and being part of the land contained in CLT V 
3042 F 117 and Ptn of the Research Road road reserve together as is defined in HCWA Survey 
Drawing No 6839 prepared by Whelans 21 January 2005. 
Paxwold Girl Guides Camp at 120 Gilchrist Road, Lesmurdie; Ptn of Lot 3070 on DP36440, being 
Ptn of Class A Reserve 47881 and being part of the land contained in Certificate of CLT V 3134 F 992 
as shown on HCWA (HCWA) Survey Drawing No. 10411 prepared by HCWA and dated 7 July 2005. 
Robertson Park and Archaeological Sites at Fitzgerald Street, Randell, Palmerston and Stuart 
streets, Perth; Ptn of Perth Lot Y241 and being Lots 1 and 2 on D 2503 and being the whole of the 
land contained in C/T V: 598 F: 153; Ptns of Perth Town Lot Y228 and being Lots 4,7 and 10 on D 
9231 and being the whole of the land contained in C/T V: 1031 F: 829; Ptn of Perth Town Lots Y242 
and Y243 and being part of the land on D 2503 and being the whole of the land contained in C/T V: 
952 F: 83; Ptn of each of Perth Town Lots Y241 and Y242 and being Lot 3 on D 2503 and Lot 400 on 
DP 35447 and being the whole of the land contained in C/T V: 1389 F: 497; (Firstly) Ptn of Perth 
Town Lot Y245 the subject of D 8847, (secondly) Ptns of Perth Town Lot Y228 being the subject of D 
7698 and part of the land on D 964 (lots 5,6 & 0) (thirdly) Perth Town Lots Y229 to Y234 (inclusive) 
and Ptn of each of Perth Town Lots Y241, Y242, Y243 and Y244 being the whole of the land contained 
in C/T V: 1077 F: 518.  Note: Perth Lots Y229 to Y232 are shown as Lots 1 to 7 inclusive on Plan 835; 
Ptns of Perth Town Lots Y244, Y243, Y242 amd Y241 in C/T V: 1077 F: 518 are also known as Lots 0, 
11 and 12 on D 2503; Drain Reserve and Right of Way contained in C/T V 1077 F 518 Lot 1316 on DP 
35708 being Reserve 47588 and being the whole of the land contained in CLT V: 3130 F: 743. 
Dated 26 May 2006. 

 (sgd) IAN BAXTER, Director, Office of the Heritage Council of W.A. 
108 Adelaide Terrace East Perth WA 6004. 

JUSTICE 
JU401* 

PRISONS ACT 1981 
PERMIT DETAILS 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permits to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 
Janosevic Stevan AP 0392 15 May 2006 
Donaldson Neil  AP 0251 15 May 2006 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1905 

 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 
Coyne Peter William AP 0272 15 May 2006 
Corrigan Amanda AP 0181 15 May 2006 
Nicholson David AP 0281 15 May 2006 
Payne Stephen AP 0072 15 May 2006 
Wells John AP 0279 15 May 2006 
Wright John Walker AP 0127 15 May 2006 
Forsyth Michael Peter AP 0402 15 May 2006 
Jenkins Lucinda Gaye AP 0238 15 May 2006 
McIntosh Pamela Joy AP 0028 15 May 2006 
Northcott Paul AP 0343 15 May 2006 
Parent Kevin George Francis AP 0268 15 May 2006 
Anderson Eric Shawn AP 0276 15 May 2006 
Thorpe Juliann AP 0417 15 May 2006 
Richards Cameron David AP 0416 15 May 2006 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 
Dated 23 May 2006. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager, Acacia Prison Contract. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

JU402* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has issued the following persons with Permits to do High-Level 
Security Work— 

Surname First Names Permit No Issue Date 
MacFarquhar Roderick AP 0434 24/04/06 
Ouston Scott David AP 0437 24/04/06 
Thomas Mark Richard AP 0440 24/04/06 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 
Dated 23 May 2006. 

BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager Acacia Prison Contract. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

JU403* 
JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

APPOINTMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has 
approved of the following to the office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia— 

Peter Henry Bradley of 76 Holyoake Road, Dwellingup 
Trendafil Hasarliev of 3 Bulbine Vista, Beechboro 
Renjit Kumar of 3 Galeru Place, Wanneroo 
Bruce William Mead of 3 Janes Drive, Corrigin 
Danver Alban Raymond of 5 Jacaranda Drive, Tom Price 

RAY WARNES, A/Executive Director, Court Services. 



1906 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
DOG ACT 1976 

Shire of Mount Magnet 
APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed under the 
provisions of the Dog Act 1976— 

Registration Officers Peter McConnell 
 Rosemary Balchin 
 Bobbie O’Brien 
 Marilyn Davies 
 Laurie Evans 
 Maureen Murat 
 Peter Smith 
Authorised Persons Peter McConnell 
 Ross Manns 
 Steve Anaru 
 Alex Butcher 
 Peter Smith 
 Douglas Witanga 

All previous appointments are hereby revoked, effective from 31st May, 2006. 
Dated this 22nd May, 2006. 

M. N. BROWN, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

LG501* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 
Shire of Chapman Valley 

FIREBREAK REQUIREMENTS 
Section 33 of the Bush Fires Act gives the Shire the power to require the owner, or occupier, of land to 
install firebreaks, or implement other fire prevention measures. Fire prevention measures for 
different types of properties are outlined below— 
 1 Naraling, Durawah/Valentine & Yuna Brigade Areas 
  All land (other than Townsites/Residential—See Section 3 below) within the abovementioned 

Brigades the fire prevention measures outlined below are NON-COMPULSORY. However, 
landowners are strongly encouraged to provide firebreaks in accordance with these measures 
at least between the 30 September and 15 March.  

 1.1 In areas of greater than 100 hectares held in a single, contiguous ownership 
landowners are encouraged to install firebreaks as follows— 

 1.1.1 Plough, cultivates, scarify or otherwise clear firebreaks not less than two metres 
wide— 

 (a) inside, along and within 21 metres of all external boundaries; 
 (b) in such other positions as is necessary to— 

(i) divide crops in excess of 400 hectares into areas not exceeding 
400 hectares, each completely surrounded by a firebreak; and 

(ii) divide crops and pasture land in excess of 200 hectares into areas not 
exceeding 200 hectares, each completely surrounded by a firebreak; 
and 

 (c)  within 100 metres of the perimeter of all buildings, bulk and drum fuel 
deposits, and haystacks on the land so as to completely surround the 
building, fuel deposit and haystack; and 

 (d)  to divide every area of crop from pasture or bush. 
 1.1.2  Firebreaks of not less than 20 metres wide around the perimeter of any scrub or 

timber which has been logged, chained or otherwise prepared for burning. 
 2 Nabawa, Yetna & Howatharra Brigade Areas 
  All land (other than Townsites/Residential—See Section 3 below) within the abovementioned 

Brigades the fire prevention measures outlined below are COMPULSORY. Landowners are 
required to provide firebreaks in accordance with these measures at least between the 
21 October and 29 March  



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1907 

 

 2.1 In areas of less than 100 hectares held in a single, contiguous ownership landowners 
are required to install firebreaks as follows— 

 2.1.1 Plough, cultivate, scarify or otherwise clear firebreaks not less than two metres 
wide— 

 (a) inside, along and within 21 metres of all external boundaries; and 
 (b)  within 100 metres of the perimeter of all buildings, bulk and drum fuel 

deposits, and haystacks on the land so as to completely surround the 
building, fuel deposit and haystack; and 

 (c)  to divide every area of crop from pasture or bush. 
 2.2 In areas of greater than 100 hectares held in a single, contiguous ownership 

landowners are required to install firebreaks as follows— 
 2.2.1 Plough, cultivate, scarify or otherwise clear firebreaks not less than two metres 

wide— 
 (a) inside, along and within 21 metres of all external boundaries; 
 (b)  divide crops and pasture land into areas not exceeding 200 hectares, each 

completely surrounded by a firebreak; and 
 (c) within 100 metres of the perimeter of all buildings, bulk and drum fuel 

deposits, and haystacks on the land so as to completely surround the 
building, fuel deposit and haystack; and 

 (d)  to divide every area of crop from pasture or bush. 
 2.2.2. Firebreaks of not less than 20 metres wide around the perimeter of any scrub or 

timber which has been logged, chained or otherwise prepared for burning. 
 2.3. Install firebreaks of not less than 20 metres wide around the perimeter of any scrub or 

timber which has been logged, chained or otherwise prepared for burning. 
 2.4. Notwithstanding, 2.1 and 2.2 above the Chief Bush Fire Control Officer may accept the 

slashing of all or part of the property to a height not exceeding 7.5 centimetres as an 
alternative to some or all of the normal firebreak requirements on land where the area 
is between 5000m2 and 10 hectares. 

 3 Townsite/Residential Properties 
  (‘Townsite/Residential Properties’ are considered to be all properties that are within a 

Gazetted Townsite or where an area of less than 5000m2 is held in a single, contiguous 
ownership.) 

  On Townsite/Residential Properties, landowners are required to ensure that the whole 
property, other than buildings, is clear of all inflammable material, such as dry grass, dead 
timber and flammable liquids. Landowners are also encouraged to lop or remove any trees 
that overhang buildings and ensure that an accessible water supply is available around all 
buildings, especially houses. Landowners are also encouraged to install smoke alarms. 

 4 Inspections and Enforcement 
  Inspections to ensure that firebreaks and low fuel zones have been installed are undertaken 

annually immediately following the date when they must be in place. The Council, in 
conjunction with the Chief Bush Fire Control Officer, will determine where firebreaks and 
low fuel zones have not been installed satisfactorily and take appropriate action. 

 5 Information and Advice 
  If you are unsure of the firebreak or low fuel zone requirements for your property, or require 

any further advice, please contact your local brigade, or Council’s Senior Ranger. A list of 
contact details is provided overleaf. A list of firebreak contractors and contact details is also 
provided overleaf. 

 6 Firebreak Variations 
  Should it be impractical to comply with any of the abovementioned requirements landowners 

may apply to the Chief Bush Fire Control Officer (via the Shire) before the 21st October for 
permission to provide firebreaks in an alternative position.  

MAURICE BATTILANA, Chief Executive Officer. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
PETROLEUM ACT 1967 

RENEWAL OF PRODUCTION LICENCE L6 (R1) & L8 (R1) 
Renewal of Production Licence L6 (R1) & L8 (R1) has been granted to Terratek Drilling Tools Pty Ltd 
to have effect from and including 19 May 2006 for a period of twenty one (21) years. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 



1908 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

MP402* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
RENEWAL OF EXPLORATION PERMIT WA-274-P (R1) 

Renewal of Exploration Permit WA-274-P (R1) has been granted to Coveyork Pty Ltd and Unocal 
Western Australia Pty Ltd to have effect from and including 15 May 2006 for a period of five years. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 
 

——————————— 

 

MP403* 
Commonwealth of Australia 

PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 
RENEWAL OF EXPLORATION PERMIT WA-281-P (R1) 

Renewal of Exploration Permit WA-281-P (R1) has been granted to Santos Offshore Pty Ltd and 
Unocal Beach Petroleum Ltd to have effect from and including 15 May 2006 for a period of five years. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 
 

——————————— 

 

MP405 
MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURE 

Department of Industry and Resources, 
Perth WA 6000. 

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of section 96A(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned mining tenements are forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply with the 
prescribed expenditure conditions. 

JOHN BOWLER JP MLA, Minister for Resources and  
Assisting the Minister for State Development. 

NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD 
EXPLORATION LICENCE 

63/802 Avoca Resources Ltd Dundas 
63/803 Avoca Resources Ltd Dundas 
 

——————————— 

 

MP404 
MINING ACT 1978 

INTENTION TO FORFEIT 

Department of Industry and Resources, 
Perth WA 6000. 

In accordance with Regulation 50(b) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that 
unless the rent due on the undermentioned licences and leases is paid on or before 19 June 2006, it is 
the intention of the Minister for Resources and Assisting the Minister for State Development under 
the provisions of Sections 96A(1) and 97(1) of the Mining Act, 1978 to forfeit such for breach covenant, 
viz, non-payment of rent. 

JIM LIMERICK, Director General. 

———— 
Number Holder Mineral Field 

Exploration Licences 
51/921 Brosnan, Allan Neville Murchison 
59/1165 Sovereign Seas Pty Ltd Yalgoo 
63/852 Fox, Keith Dundas 
80/3318 Ashburton Minerals Ltd; Richmond, William 

Robert 
Kimberley 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1909 

 

Mining Leases 
15/658 Boyes, Charles Joseph Coolgardie 
24/424 Stillman, William James Broad Arrow 
25/97 Bulong Nickel Pty Ltd; Bulong Operations Pty 

Ltd 
East Coolgardie 

47/249 Boral Contracting Pty Ltd West Pilbara 
63/234 Dimension Stone Group Australia Pty Ltd Dundas 
63/235 Dimension Stone Group Australia Pty Ltd Dundas 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MP406 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Industry and Resources, 

Kalgoorlie WA 6430. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following Prospecting Licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the 
Mining Act, 1978, for breach of covenant, viz. non compliance with the expenditure condition &/or non 
compliance with the reporting requirement. 

D. TEMBY (SM), Warden. 

———— 
To be heard in the Warden’s Court, Kalgoorlie on the 20th June, 2006. 

EAST COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 
25/1270—Cazaly Resources Ltd 
25/1271—Cazaly Resources Ltd 
25/1272—Cazaly Resources Ltd 
25/1273—Cazaly Resources Ltd 
25/1274—Cazaly Resources Ltd 
26/2249—Richard Henry Cooke, Neil Wesley Sinclair, Wombola Gold Pty Ltd 
26/2551—Black Mountain Gold NL 
26/3116—Cazaly Resources Ltd 
26/3128—Cazaly Resources Ltd 

NORTH COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 
30/868—Anneliese Hoppmann & Hermann Friederich Reif 

NORTH EAST COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 
P27/1217—Melville Raymond Dalla-Costa 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

METROPOLITAN REGION SCHEME AMENDMENT NO. 1090/33 
Lake Karrinyup Country Club 

Outcome of Amendment 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Lake Karrinyup Country Club Amendment to the 
Metropolitan Region Scheme has been submitted before both Houses of Parliament in accordance 
with the provisions of section 41 of the Planning and Development Act 2005. 
This amendment, as depicted on Western Australian Planning Commission plan number 3.1762, is 
effective in the Metropolitan Region Scheme on and from 4 May 2006. 

LINDSAY PREECE, Acting Secretary 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 



1910 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVE LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Harvey 

District Planning Scheme No. 1—Amendment No. 61 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Harvey local planning scheme amendment on 14 May 2006, for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning portion Lot 9 Wellington Location 1 Swamp Road, Benger from the ‘Residential 

R15/R30/R50’ zone to ‘Residential R15/R30/R50’ and ‘Additional Use’. 
 2. Introducing a new clause in Schedule 7—Schedule of Additional Uses as follows— 

STREET 
LOCALITY 

PARTICULARS 
OF LAND 

ONLY USE PERMITTED 

Lot 9 Swamp Road 
Benger 

Lot 9 Wellington Loc 1 1. Service Station and incidental 
office. 

2. The sale of any fuels and/or 
establishment of a cafeteria or 
restaurant are not permitted. 

P. R. MONAGLE, Shire President. 
M. A. PARKER, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
 

——————————— 

 
 

PI403* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Joondalup 

District Planning Scheme No 2—Amendment No 34 
Ref: 853/2/34/2 Pt 34 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of 
Joondalup local planning scheme amendment on 16 May 2006 for the purpose of modifying Schedule 
3 (Commercial and Centre Zones) and the corresponding retail floorspace NLA(m2) figure under the 
columns headed ‘Description of Centre and Commercial Zones’ and ‘NLA(m2)’ respectively— 

LOCALITY DESCRIPTION OF CENTRE AND 
COMMERCIAL ZONES NLA (m2) 

KINROSS Lot 2278 (3) Selkirk Drive [formerly Portion 
Lot 2 (400) Burns Beach Road (East)] 

4000 

J. PATERSON, Chairman of Commissioners. 
G. HUNT, Chief Executive Officer. 

POLICE 

PO501 
POLICE ACT 1892 
POLICE AUCTION 

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892, unclaimed and stolen property will be sold by public 
auction at Karratha Outdoors and Dive Centre, Lot 1435 Warambie Road, Karratha at 10.00 am on 
Sunday, 11 June 2006. 
Auction to be conducted by Paul Kensington, Licensed Auctioneer. 

K. O’CALLAGHAN, Commissioner of Police. 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1911 

 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PC401 
CIVIL LIABILITY ACT 2002 

SPECIFIED AMOUNTS 
In accordance with the requirements of Sections 10(3) and 13(3) of the Civil Liability Act 2002, I give 
notice that the following amounts will apply for the purposes of those sections with effect on and from 
1 July 2006. 

Section 10(3) 
Amount A $14,000 
Amount C $42,500 

Section 13(3) 
Amount B $5,000 

ALAN CARPENTER, MLA, Premier. 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG401* 
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988 

LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS 
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and 
required to be advertised. Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about 
the objection process, should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming and Liquor, 1st Floor, Hyatt 
Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant 
industry organisation. 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE 
11395 Nannup Winery Pty 

Ltd 
Application for the grant of a Wholesaler’s 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Nannup and known as Nannup Winery No.2 

08/06/2006 

11397 Food Australia 
Group Pty Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Producer’s 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Metricup and known as The Margaret River 
Providore 

01/06/2006 

11399 Svetlana Sergeevna 
Martin 

Application for the grant of a Wholesaler’s 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Fremantle and known as Little Russia 

01/06/2006 

11408 Te Atatu Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Producer’s 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Karridale and known as Pialligo Estate 

05/06/2006 

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS 
27103 Enza Holdings Pty 

Ltd 
Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Northbridge 
and known as Novaks Tavern 

08/06/2006 

APPLICATIONS FOR APPROVAL TO ALTER/REDEFINE THE LICENSED PREMISES 
247683 Palmflag Pty Ltd Application for approval to alter/redefine the 

Hotel in respect of premises situated in 
Innaloo and known as The Saint George 
Hotel 

8/06/2006 

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988. 

Dated: 24 May 2006. 
P. MINCHIN, Director of Liquor Licensing. 



1912 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

TRANSPORT 

TR401* 
RAIL FREIGHT SYSTEM ACT 2000 

RAIL FREIGHT SYSTEM (S.37 CORRIDOR LAND) ORDER NO. 1/2006 
Made under Section 37 by the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure 

1. Citation 
This order may be cited as the Rail Freight System (S.37 Corridor Land) Order No. 1/2006. 

2. Cancellation of Corridor Land  
The cancellation of corridor land identified in the last column of the Schedule. 

Schedule—Land to be cancelled 

Designation 
Identification 

Railway Line 
Identification 

Railway Identification 
Plan Number Land Description 

11.30.75 East Perth—
Cockburn North 

Plan 02 Identified as Lot ‘A’ on 
Deposited Plan 49474 having 
an area of 2241m². 

Dated this 13th day of May 2006. 

ALANNAH MacTIERNAN, MLA, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure. 

WATER 

WA401* 
WATER SERVICES LICENSING ACT 1995 

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 31 (5) AMENDMENT OF LICENCE. 
Notice is given that the following operating licence has been amended. 

Licensee: Water Corporation 
Issue Date: 12 May 2006 
Address of Licensee: PO Box 100 
 Leederville WA 6092 
Classification: Operating Licence, Water Supply, Sewerage, Irrigation and Drainage 

Services 
Amendment: Licence substituted as a result of amendment to Carnarvon Operating 

Area, Map number OWR-OA-128E. Term of the licence valid to 28 June 
2021. 

Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
 6th floor 
 197 St Georges Terrace 
 Perth WA 6000 
 http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, Economic Regulation Authority. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Pamela Margaret Piesse late of 2 Shorts Place, Albany in the State of Western Australia, Retired 
Nurse, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of Pamela Margaret Piesse deceased who died on the 17th day of February 2006 
at Albany in the State of Western Australia are required by the personal representative Richard 
Talbot Grist 45, 49 Serpentine Road, Albany, Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to 
David Moss & Co of PO Box 5744, Albany WA 6332 by the 26th day of June 2006 after which date the 
personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claim for which 
he has then had notice. 



26 May 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1913 

 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
In the estate of Salvatore Sparta, late of 3/17 Burragah Way Duncraig, Western Australia deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the abovenamed deceased who died on the 15th day of March 2006 are 
required by the personal representative Maria Teresa Santi of c/- Wheatleys Legal, PO Box 1363, 
West Perth, Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to her by the 14th day of July 2006 
after which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only 
to the claims of which she then has notice. 
 

——————————— 
 

ZX403 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
David John Eddy, late of 7/68 McMaster Street, Victoria Park in Western Australia. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased, who died on or around 13 July 2005 at 7/68 McMaster Street, 
Victoria Park in Western Australia are required by the trustee, being Margaret Susan Emily Lester 
to send particulars of their claims to Shannon Donaldson Province Lawyers, PO Box 667, Dalby, 
Queensland, 4405 within thirty (30) days of publication of this notice after which date the trustee 
may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to the claims of which she then has notice. 
 

——————————— 
 

ZX404* 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before the 26th June 2006 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, 
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 
ASKEVOLD Lillian Cicelly Sarah also known as Lillian Cicly Sarah ASKEVOLD, late of Bethanie 

waters Nursing Home 18 Olivenza Crescent Port Kennedy, died 23.04.2006, (DE19703222EM16) 
EGGERT Herbert John, late of 4 Landra Gardens City Beach, died 20.04.2006, (DE19761344EM23) 
HENRY Dorothy Ray, late of Tandara Nursing Home 73 Jarrah Road Bentley, died 07.01.2006, 

(DE33016118EM36) 
JERMYN Edna Alice Marie, late of Little Sisters of the Poor Renwick Street Glendalough, died 

05.04.2006, (DE19850177EM27) 
MAHER Thomas Albert, late of Riverview Residence Nursing Home Pendleton Street Collie, died 

16.04.2006, (DE19700059EM17) 
ROBINSON Thomas Hugh, late of 25 Anstey Street South Perth formerly of Unit 237 Ocean Gardens 

Retirement Estate City Beach, died 13.05.2006, (DE19903706EM22) 
SANGSTER Catherine Florance, late of 13 Pinaster Street Menora, died 09.05.2006, 

(DE32002199EM34) 
SAUL John West, late of 1 Arkwell Avenue Rockingham, died 13.11 2005, (DE19852659EM35) 
SAVAGE Stella Joan, late of John Wesley House Hayman Road Bentley, died 02.04.2006, 

(DE19841840EM37) 
SMESCHKAL Josefine also known as Josephine SMESCHKAL, late of 5 McNeill Road Waroona, died 

28.01.2006, (DE19851417EM13) 
TOWNSEND Ethel May, late of Bassendean Aged Care 27 Hamilton Street Bassendean, died 

04.05.2006, (DE30225971EM27) 
WILLIAMS Bertie, late of Numbala Nunga Nursing Home 1 Sutherland Street Derby, died 

21.12.2005, (DE33047220EM27) 
WISHART James Brian, late of 15 Bedbrook Place Shenton Park, died 16.05.2005, 

(DE30225991EM36) 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
Public Trust Office, 565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000. 

Telephone 9222 6777. 



1914 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 26 May 2006 

 

ZX405* 
PUBLIC TRUSTEE ACT 1941 
ADMINISTERING OF ESTATES 

Notice is hereby given that pursuant to Section 14 of the Public Trustee Act, 1941 and amendments 
the Public Trustee has elected to administer the estates of the undermentioned deceased persons. 
Dated at Perth the 24th day of May 2006. 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000. 

———— 
 

Name of Deceased; Address; Date of Death; Date Election Filed. 
SEWELL Margaret Ada Ellen (DE30316345EM27); East Fremantle; 14/03/2006; 16/05/2006 
TAN Kuan Hin (DE19981827EM16); Beckenham; 28/01/2006; 18/05/2006 
 
 

 
 

——————————— 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

!200600090GG! 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

RETIREMENT VILLAGES ACT 1992 
Price: $9.05 counter sales 

Plus postage on 105 grams 

————— 

RETIREMENT VILLAGES REGULATIONS 1992 
*Price: $5.30 counter sales 

Plus postage on 55 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 1992 
 

*Price: $14.65 counter sales 
Plus postage on 200 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 


