
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  2107 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 16 JUNE 2006 No. 101 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Aerial Spraying Control Act 1966—Aerial Spraying Control Amendment Regulations 2006 2111 
Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976—Agriculture and Related 

Resources Protection (Declared Animals) Amendment Regulations 2006 ..........................  2112 
Beekeepers Act 1963—Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 2006 ........................................  2113 
Defamation Act 2005—Defamation (Damages for Non-economic Loss) Order 2006 ..............  2123 
Exotic Diseases of Animals Act 1993—Exotic Diseases (General) Amendment 

Regulations 2006 ....................................................................................................................  2115 
Firearms Act 1973—Firearms (Licence Exemption) Notice 2006 ...........................................  2126 
Human Tissue and Transplant Act 1982—Human Tissue and Transplant Regulations 

2006.........................................................................................................................................  2123 
Plant Diseases Act 1914—Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2006 .................  2110 
Plant Diseases Act 1914—Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations (No. 5) 2006 .................  2116 
Proclamations— 
  Motor Vehicle (Third Party Insurance) Amendment Act 2006—No. 15 of 2006..............  2109 
  Swan Valley Planning Legislation Amendment Act 2006—No. 7 of 2006 .......................  2109 
Seeds Act 1981—Seeds Amendment Regulations 2006 ...........................................................  2118 
Settlement Agents Act 1981—Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006.....  2121 
Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968—Enzootic Diseases Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2006.............................................................................................................................  2114 
Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970—Stock (Identification and Movement) 

Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006...................................................................................  2120 
Western Australian Marine Act 1982—W.A. Marine (Certificates of Competency and 

Safety Manning) Amendment Regulations 2006 ..................................................................  2124 
 
 

——— 
 

PART 2 
 

Cemeteries..................................................................................................................................  2127 
Consumer and Employment Protection ....................................................................................  2134 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  2147 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  2135 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................  2135 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  2136 
Marine/Maritime........................................................................................................................  2137 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  2138 
Parliament..................................................................................................................................  2139 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  2140 
Premier and Cabinet..................................................................................................................  2139 
Public Notices.............................................................................................................................  2148 
Racing, Gaming and Liquor.......................................................................................................  2145 
WorkSafe ....................................................................................................................................  2146 



 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2006 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$23.70 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$55.20 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$55.20 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.05 

  Bulk Notices—$201.70 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2109 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 

AA101* 
SWAN VALLEY PLANNING LEGISLATION AMENDMENT 

ACT 2006 
No. 7 of 2006 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 

By His Excellency 
Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

I, the Governor, acting under the Swan Valley Planning Legislation Amendment 
Act 2006 section 2 and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix 
18 June 2006 as the day on which the provisions of that Act, other than section 20(1) 
and (2), come into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 6 June 2006. 
By Command of the Governor, 

A. MacTIERNAN, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

AA102* 
MOTOR VEHICLE (THIRD PARTY INSURANCE)  

AMENDMENT ACT 2006 
No. 15 of 2006 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 

By His Excellency 
Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

I, the Governor, acting under the Motor Vehicle (Third Party Insurance) Amendment 
Act 2006 section 2(2) and with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, fix 
1 July 2006 as the day on which section 5 of that Act comes into operation. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 6 June 2006. 
By Command of the Governor, 

E. RIPPER, Minister for Government Enterprises. 

 

 

 

——————————— 



2110 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

AGRICULTURE 

AG301* 

Plant Diseases Act 1914 

Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Plant Diseases Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendment in these regulations is to the Plant Diseases 
Regulations 1989*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 20 September 2002. 
  For amendments to 13 April 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 293-4, 
and Gazette 17 and 31 May and 16 December 2005 and 
7 February 2006.] 

3. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 Part B item 58(2) is amended by inserting after 
“where lettuce aphid is known not to occur” — 

  “    or in accordance with approved conditions    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2111 

AG302* 

Aerial Spraying Control Act 1966 

Aerial Spraying Control Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Aerial Spraying Control Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Aerial Spraying 
Control Regulations 1971*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 4 March 2005. 
  For amendments to 27 April 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 11.] 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  Regulation 4(3)(b) is amended by deleting “$10.60.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $11.00.    ”. 

5. Regulation 9 amended 

  Regulation 9(2)(b) is amended by deleting “$20.00” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $20.60    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



2112 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

AG303* 

Agriculture and Related Resources Protection Act 1976 

Agriculture and Related Resources Protection 
(Declared Animals) Amendment 

Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Agriculture and Related Resources 
Protection (Declared Animals) Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Agriculture and 
Related Resources Protection (Declared Animals) 
Regulations 1985*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 4 January 2000. 
  For amendments to 27 April 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 16.] 

4. Regulation 15 amended 

  Regulation 15(2) is amended by deleting “$127” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $131    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2113 

AG304* 

Beekeepers Act 1963 

Beekeepers Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Beekeepers Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Beekeepers 
Regulations 1963*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 21 January 2005. 
  For amendments to 28 April2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 33.] 

4. Third Schedule amended 

  The Third Schedule is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 1 by deleting “$28.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $29.00    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “$17.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    $17.50    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 
 



2114 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

AG305* 

Stock Diseases (Regulations) Act 1968 

Enzootic Diseases Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Enzootic Diseases Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Enzootic 
Diseases Regulations 1970*. 

 [* Reprint 4 as at 28 October 2005.] 

4. Schedule 4 replaced 

  Schedule 4 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 4 — Charges 

[r. 28, 31, 42 and 60] 

Charges $ 

1. Charges for inspection of stock being imported or 
exported (regulations 28 and 31) — 

 

A. Inspection on week day inside normal hours (6 a.m. 
to 6 p.m.) —  
 per 15 minute unit or part of 15 minute unit 

 
 

25.00 

 Travel on week day inside normal hours  
(6 a.m. to 6 p.m.) —  

 

 (i) For the first 25 km from headquarters 
plus 

25.00 

 (ii) For each 25 km or part of 25 km in excess of 
25 km from headquarters 

 
25.00 

B. Inspection on week day outside normal hours — 
 per 15 minute unit or part of 15 minute unit 

 
30.50 

 Travel on week day outside normal hours —   

 (i) For the first 25 km from headquarters 
plus 

30.50 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2115 

Charges $ 

 (ii) For each 25 km or part of 25 km in excess of 
25 km from headquarters 

 
30.50 

C. Inspection on Saturday, Sunday or public holiday —   

  minimum fee 416.00 

  per 15 minute unit or part of 15 minute unit 34.50 

 Travel on Saturday, Sunday or public holiday —   

 (i) For the first 25 km from headquarters 
plus 

34.50 

 (ii) For each 25 km or part of 25 km in excess of 
25 km from headquarters 

 
34.50 

2. Charges for supply of Triclabendazole —  

Minimum charge per session (regardless of number 
of animals) 

 
21.70 

or per kg body weight of each animal (where the sum 
is greater than minimum fee) —  

 

 up to 35 kg 0.55 

 36 — 100 kg 1.75 

 101 — 300 kg 4.00 

 301 — 600 kg 8.05 

 more than 600 kg 10.40 
    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

AG306* 

Exotic Diseases of Animals Act 1993 

Exotic Diseases (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Exotic Diseases (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 



2116 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Exotic Diseases 
(General) Regulations 1970*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 11 April 2003. 
  For amendments to 27 April 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 118.] 

4. Regulation 13E amended 

  Regulation 13E(4) is amended by deleting “$230.00.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $237.00.    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

AG307* 

Plant Diseases Act 1914 

Plant Diseases Amendment Regulations 
(No. 5) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Plant Diseases Amendment 
Regulations (No. 5) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Plant Diseases 
Regulations 1989*. 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2117 

 [* Reprint 4 as at 3 March 2006. 
  For amendments to 27 April 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 300, and 
Gazette 21 April 2006.] 

4. Regulation 19P amended 

  Regulation 19P is amended as follows: 

 (a) in subregulation (1)(a) by deleting “$100” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $103    ”; 

 (b) in subregulation (1)(b) by deleting “$40.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $41.25.    ”; 

 (c) in subregulation (2) by deleting “$40.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $41.25.    ”. 

5. Schedule 2 replaced 

  Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 2 

[r. 9] 

Fees $ 
1. General inspection inside normal or shift hours —   

(a) at an inspection point (other than for Nursery stock), 
per 15 minute unit 

 
32.75 

(b) at an inspection point for Nursery stock, per 
15 minute unit 

 
33.75 

(c) away from an inspection point —   

 other than for Nursery stock, per 15 minute unit 
within 2 hours from the commencement of the 
inspection 

 
 

41.25 
 for Nursery stock, per 15 minute unit within 

2 hours from the commencement of the 
inspection 

 
 

42.25 
 for each additional contiguous 15 minute unit 

beyond 2 hours for the rest of the working period 
 

32.75 
PLUS an additional service charge when the inspection is 
more than 50 km away from an inspection point 

 
101.00 

2. General inspection contiguous with normal or shift hours —  
(a) at an inspection point, per 15 minute unit 43.25 
(b) away from an inspection point —   

 per 15 minute unit within 2 hours from the 
commencement of the inspection 

 
57.50 

 for each additional contiguous 15 minute unit 
beyond 2 hours for the rest of the working period 

 
43.25 

PLUS an additional service charge when the inspection is 
more than 50 km away from an inspection point 

 
128.00 



2118 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

Fees $ 
3. Call out, inspection and travel outside normal or shift hours —   

(a) at an inspection point —   
 for the first 2 hours (minimum fee) 320.00 
 for each additional 15 minute unit 49.50 

(b) away from an inspection point —   
 for the first 2 hours (minimum fee) 430.00 
 for each additional 15 minutes 64.00 

PLUS an additional service charge when the inspection is 
more than 50 km away from an inspection point 

 
128.00 

4. Documentation assessment fee 19.00 
5. Laboratory analysis of plants 57.00 

    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

AG308* 

Seeds Act 1981 

Seeds Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Seeds Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Seeds 
Regulations 1982*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 16 September 2005.] 

4. Regulation 15 amended 

 (1) Regulation 15(2) is amended by deleting “$400” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $415    ”. 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2119 

 (2) Regulation 15(6) is amended by deleting “$275” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $285    ”. 

5. Seventh Schedule replaced 

  The Seventh Schedule is repealed and the following Schedule is 
inserted instead —  

“     
Seventh Schedule 

Seed analysis and report fees 
[r. 13] 

    $ 
Fees for the analysis of a seed sample 
provided under section 25 of the Act and for 
a report of the result of the analysis are —  

 

Pure seed content analysis, group 1 .............. 52.00 
Pure seed content analysis, group 2 .............. 65.00 
Pure seed content analysis, group 3 .............. 79.00 
Pure seed content analysis, group 4 .............. 95.00 

The pure seed content analysis group is displayed in column 6 
of the First Schedule. 

Germination analysis, group 1 ...................... 50.00 
Germination analysis, group 2 ...................... 56.00 
Germination analysis, group 3 ...................... 61.00 

The germination analysis group is displayed in column 7 
of the First Schedule. 

Pure seed content analysis of chaffy seed ..... 95.00 
Cultivar determination by grow-on test ........ 140.00 
Moisture content determination .................... 57.00 
Pest or disease test ........................................ 62.00 
Weed seed presence test ............................... 57.00 
Caryopsis presence test ................................ 57.00 
Pigmented seed content ................................ 40.00 
Number of seeds (per unit volume) .............. 52.00 
Seed identification ........................................ 25.00 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 



2120 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

AG309* 

Stock (Identification and Movement) Act 1970 

Stock (Identification and Movement) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Stock (Identification and Movement) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Stock 
(Identification and Movement) Regulations 1972*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 7 October 2005.] 

4. Schedule 2 replaced 

  Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 2 

Item Reg. Service Fee 
$ 

1.  Information concerning a registered 
brand —  
 (a) single brand . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  

 
 
no charge 

   (b) 2 — 200 brands or  
1 — 10 pages . . . . . . . . . . . . . 

 
15.80 

   (c) 201 — 1 500 brands or  
11 — 200 pages . . . . . . . . . . . 

 
32.50 

   (d) a printed copy of more 
than 1 500 brands or 
200 pages . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 

 
 

163.00 
   (e) an electronic copy of 

information by way of a 
computer disk of more 
than 1 500 brands . . . . . . . . . . 

 
 
 

162.00 
2. 14(2) Application to register a brand . . . . . . 54.00 
3. 16 Provision of a duplicate certificate . . .  17.50 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2121 

Item Reg. Service Fee 
$ 

4. 17(2) Application to transfer a registered 
brand . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 

 
54.00 

5. 18 Application to re-register a brand . . . .  54.00 
    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE301* 

Settlement Agents Act 1981 

Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Settlement Agents Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. The Settlement Agents Regulations 1982 amended 

 (1) The amendments in this regulation are to the Settlement Agents 
Regulations 1982*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 18 March 2005.] 

 (2) Regulation 6(1) is repealed and the following subregulation is 
inserted instead — 

“     
 (1) For the purposes of Schedule 1 clause 1(1)(a) of the 

Act the prescribed examinations are the examinations 
required to be passed to complete the following 
units —  

 (a) FNBCNV01A: Take instructions in relation to 
a transaction or FNSCONV501A: Take 
instructions in relation to a transaction;  



2122 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

 (b) FNBCNV02A: Obtain and analyse all 
information for the transaction or 
FNSCONV601A: Obtain and analyse all 
information for the transaction;  

 (c) FNBCNV03A: Liaise with clients, other 
professionals and third parties or 
FNSICCUS501A: Develop and nurture 
relationships, with clients other professionals 
and third parties;  

 (d) FNBCNV04A: Negotiate to achieve goals and 
manage disputes or FNSICORG603A: 
Negotiate to achieve goals and manage 
disputes;  

 (e) FNBCNV05A: Prepare and/or analyse and 
execute documents or FNSCONV502A: 
Prepare and/or analyse and execute documents;  

 (f) FNBCNV06A: Establish, manage and 
administer trust accounts or FNSCONV503A: 
Establish, manage and administer trust 
accounts;  

 (g) FNBCNV07A: Finalise transactions or 
FNSCONV504A: Finalise conveyancing 
transactions. 

    ”. 

3. The Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2004 
amended 

 (1) The amendments in this regulation are to the Settlement Agents 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2004*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 15 June 2004, p. 2024-6 (as amended in 
Gazette 21 January 2005, p. 258).] 

 (2) Regulation 4 is amended by deleting “1 July 2006” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    1 July 2007    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2123 

HEALTH 

HE301* 

Human Tissue and Transplant Act 1982 

Human Tissue and Transplant Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Human Tissue and Transplant 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Prescribed body of medical practitioners (section 29(4b)) 

  The Council of the WA Kidney Transplant Service is a 
prescribed body of medical practitioners for the purposes of 
section 29(4b) of the Act. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

JUSTICE 

JU301* 

Defamation Act 2005 

Defamation (Damages for Non-economic Loss) 
Order 2006 

Made by the Minister under section 35(3) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Defamation (Damages for Non-economic Loss) 
Order 2006. 



2124 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

2. Adjustment to maximum damages amount 

  It is declared that from 1 July 2006 the amount that applies for 
the purposes of section 35(1) is $259 500. 

JIM McGINTY, Attorney General. 

MARINE/MARTIME 

MX301* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Certificates of Competency and 
Safety Manning) Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Certificates of 
Competency and Safety Manning) Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Certificates of Competency and Safety Manning) 
Regulations 1983*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 17 September 2004. 
  For amendments to 14 March 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2004, Table 4, p. 447, and 
Gazette 24 June 2005.] 

3. Regulation 15 amended 

 (1) Regulation 15(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “, or suspend for a period,” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    or suspend    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “incapable of discharging his duties by 
reason of incompetency” and inserting instead —  

  “    guilty of incompetence    ”. 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2125 

 (2) After regulation 15(1) the following subregulation is inserted —  

“     
 (1a) The chief executive officer may suspend a certificate of 

competency or certificate of satisfactory service under 
subregulation (1) —  

 (a) for a period specified by the chief executive 
officer; or 

 (b) until the person complies with a requirement 
specified by the chief executive officer. 

    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 15(2) is repealed and the following subregulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (2) Before the chief executive officer decides to cancel or 

suspend a certificate of competency or a certificate of 
satisfactory service, the chief executive officer shall 
give notice in writing to the holder of the certificate 
of —  

 (a) the proposed cancellation or suspension; 

 (b) the findings of an investigation into the material 
questions of fact; 

 (c) the reason why it appears to the chief executive 
officer that the certificate should be cancelled 
or suspended; and 

 (d) the period during which the holder may make 
written or oral representations to the chief 
executive officer. 

    ”. 

 (4) Regulation 15(3) is amended by deleting “and” after 
paragraph (b) and inserting instead —  

“     
 (ba) in the case of suspension —  

 (i) the period of the suspension; or 

 (ii) any requirement that has to be complied 
with by the holder before the suspension 
ceases to have effect; 

  and 
    ”. 

 (5) After regulation 15(3) the following subregulation is inserted —  

“     
 (4) Where the chief executive officer decides to cancel or 

suspend a certificate of competency or a certificate of 
satisfactory service, the chief executive officer shall 
advise other marine authorities within whose 
jurisdiction the certificate is normally accepted for 
manning purposes of the general details and 



2126 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

circumstances attached to the cancellation or 
suspension in order that they may then take appropriate 
parallel action. 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

POLICE 

PO301* 

Firearms Act 1973 

Firearms (Licence Exemption) Notice 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council under section 8(1)(e) of 
the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This notice is the Firearms (Licence Exemption) Notice 2006. 

2. Exemption from licensing requirements 

 (1) In subclause (2) —  

 “police force” means —  

 (a) the police force of another State or of a Territory; or 

 (b) the Australian Federal Police. 

 (2) Each police force is specified for the purposes of section 8 of 
the Act in respect of the possession by a member of that police 
force of a firearm or ammunition for use in the performance of 
the member’s duties as —  

 (a) a special constable under the Police Act 1892 
section 35A; or 

 (b) a special officer under the Terrorism (Extraordinary 
Powers) Act 2005 section 17. 

 (3) Subclause (2) does not limit the Firearms (Licence Exemption) 
Notice 1985. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2127 

— PART 2 — 

CEMETERIES 
CC401* 

CEMETERIES ACT 1986 

Metropolitan 

Cemeteries Board 
Schedule of Fees 

1 July 2006-30 June 2007 
In pursuance of the powers conferred by section 53 of the Cemeteries Act 1986, the Metropolitan 
Cemeteries Board hereby records having resolved on 27 April 2006, to set the following fees effective 
from July 1st, 2006. The fees shall be payable upon application for services at Karrakatta, Fremantle, 
Pinnaroo, Midland and Guildford Cemeteries detailed hereunder. 

FEES & CHARGES INCLUSIVE OF 10% GST (except where indicated) 

Description Cemetery 

BURIAL Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

Interment Fees:   

Adult Interment (May use Garden Chapel @ 
Karrakatta) 

803.00 803.00 803.00 803.00 803.00

Adult Interment (Government Charge) 803.00 803.00 803.00 803.00 803.00

Child Interment (under 13 years) 480.70 480.70 480.70 480.70 480.70

Perinatal Interment (without service) 205.70   205.70 205.70

Entombment in Mausoleum 803.00 803.00  803.00 803.00

Grant of Right of Burial (25 Years):      

Gravesite / Grant: Lawn 1,113.20 1,113.20 1,113.20  

Gravesite / Grant: Monumental Area 1,071.40 860.20  1,071.40 1,071.40

Gravesite / Grant: Jewish Orthodox Lawn 
(includes Star of David)     

1,200.10     

Gravesite / Grant: Children’s Memorial 
Garden (2 interments, under 13 only) 

683.10     

Renewal of Expired Grant: Lawn 1,113.20 1,113.20 1,113.20  

Renewal of Expired Grant: Monumental 
area 

1,071.40 860.20  1,071.40 1,071.40

Extension of Grant: Lawn 1,669.80 1,669.80 1,669.80  

Extension of Grant: Monumental Area 1,609.30 1,290.30  1,609.30 1,609.30

Extension of Grant: Children’s Memorial 
Garden 

1,029.60     

Pre-Need Gravesite / Grant: Lawn 1,324.40 1,324.40 1,324.40  

Pre-Need Gravesite / Grant: Monumental 
Area 

1,282.60 860.20 1,282.60 1,282.60 1,282.60

Pre-Need Gravesite / Grant: Rockingham 
Regional Memorial 

1,282.60     

Pre-Need Gravesite / Grant: Jewish 
Orthodox Lawn 

1,329.90     

Maintenance (applies if grant has expired 
and cannot be renewed) 

154.00 154.00 154.00 154.00 154.00

Family Estate Grave (Grant Fee will apply) 1,266.10     

 



2128 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

Description Cemetery 

BURIAL Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

Premium Land (Grant fee will apply) Quote Quote Quote Quote

Jewish Granite Base Upgrade 544.50     

Paths between Graves Quote Quote Quote Quote

Mausoleum      

Mausoleum Entitlement Quote Quote Quote Quote

Mausoleum At-Need Grant 1,071.40 1,071.40 1,071.40 1,071.40

Mausoleum Pre-Need Grant 1,071.40 1,071.40 1,071.40 1,071.40

Mausoleum Grant Extension 1,609.30 1,609.30 1,609.30 1,609.30

Ossuary:  

Ossuary (Single)—must purchase grant 1,277.10     

Ossuary (Double)—must purchase grant 3,326.40     

Ossuary (Grant) 1,071.40     

 
ALL PRICES SHOWN INCLUDE GST AT 10% 

Description Cemetery 

BURIAL Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

Funeral Services/Penalties:     

Selection of Grave 155.10 155.10 155.10 155.10 155.10

Saturday Interment / Entombment 401.50 401.50 401.50 401.50 401.50

Interment of Oversize Casket: monumental 
areas only 

218.90 218.90 218.90 218.90

Funeral Services—Minimum Fee (1st hour) 157.30 157.30 157.30 157.30 157.30

Funeral Services—Hourly Rate (after 1st 
hour) 

78.10 78.10 78.10 78.10 78.10

Funeral Fee—outside MCB office hours 
(add all other funeral costs) 

468.60 468.60 468.60 468.60 468.60

Exhumation 2,099.90 2,099.90 2,099.90 2,099.90 2,099.90

Re-interment after exhumation 803.00 803.00 803.00 803.00 803.00

Lift & Deepen 803.00 803.00 803.00 803.00 803.00

Late to arrive or depart for Interment (after 
10 minutes) 

150.70 150.70 150.70 150.70 150.70

Transfer of Grant / Re-Issue / Refund / 
Admin 

44.00 44.00 44.00 44.00 44.00

PRE-NEED INTERMENT SERVICES      

Interment Agreement:      

Adult Interment 840.40 840.40 840.40 840.40 840.40

Pre-need Burial Packages Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2129 

ALL PRICES SHOWN INCLUDE GST AT 10% 

Description Cemetery 

CREMATION Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

Cremation Fees:     

Adult Cremation—1 hour use of Chapel and 
Lounge 

825.00 825.00 825.00   

Adult Cremation (Government charge) 825.00 825.00 825.00   

Adult Cremation—Use of Garden Chapel or 
Direct Delivery 

691.90 691.90 691.90   

Adult Cremation—1/2 Hour Use of Chapel 
(time restrictions apply) 

691.90 691.90 691.90   

Child Cremation—under 13 years 529.10 529.10 529.10   

Child Cremation—under 2 years (includes 
30min in Dench or Pinnaroo chapel) 

198.00 198.00 198.00   

Child Cremation—under 2 years (no 
Service, Includes scattering of ashes) 

126.50 126.50 126.50   

Cremation Services/Penalties:      

Saturday Cremation 401.50 401.50 401.50   

Chapel / Lounge Time (1hour)  350.90 350.90 350.90   

Extra Chapel / Lounge Time (1/2 hour prior 
to burial only) 

181.50 181.50 181.50   

Late to Arrive or Depart for Cremation 
(after 10 minutes) 

150.70 150.70 150.70   

Video of Service (Tape to be provided by 
Funeral Director) 

 53.90    

Web Casting:      

Webcasting Package (includes Live & 
Delayed + one copy) 

333.30  333.30   

Webcasting—Live telecast plus access to 
delayed telecast for 30 days 

246.40  246.40   

Webcasting—Live telecast only (no 
recording) 

123.20  123.20   

Webcasting—access to delayed telecast for 
30 days 

170.50  170.50   

Copy of webcast on DVD or VHS video 126.50  126.50   

Additional copies on DVD 60.50  60.50   

Additional copies on VHS video 34.10  34.10   

Alternate Arrangements for Ashes:      

Family Attending Placement of Ashes 110.00 110.00 110.00 110.00 110.00

Family Attending on Saturday 248.60 248.60 248.60 248.60 248.60

Placement of ashes in Family Grave 200.20 200.20 200.20 200.20 200.20

Holding Fee per month (after 6 months) 11.00 11.00 11.00   

Postage of ashes within Australia 144.10 144.10 144.10   

Scatter Ashes to the Winds 96.80 96.80 96.80   

Transfer of Ashes (plus new position fee) 96.80 96.80 96.80 96.80 96.80

Registration of Deceased (Non-MCB) 96.80 96.80 96.80 96.80 96.80

Ash Container—Large 16.50 16.50 16.50   

Ash Container—Small 11.00 11.00 11.00   

Urns & Lockets: Quote Quote Quote  

 
 



2130 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

Description Cemetery 

CREMATION Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

PRE-NEED CREMATION SERVICES      

Cremation Agreement:      

Adult Cremation 863.50 863.50 863.50   

Pre-need Cremation Packages Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

Memorial Agreement (25 Years):      

Reserve Memorial Position (Plaque—
payable at time of use) 

See Memorial Plaque Fees 

Plaques for Pre-Need Memorials:  

This includes replacement plaques, 
preneeds and take home plaques 

Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

 
ALL PRICES SHOWN INCLUDE GST AT 10% 

Description Cemetery 

MEMORIALS Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

Burial Plaques:      

Bronze—380mm x 280mm 640.20 640.20 640.20   

Bronze—560mm x 305mm 844.80  844.80   

Bronze—Detachable Plate  301.40  301.40   

Bronze—Jewish Orthodox (including 
granite base) 

814.00     

Bronze—Jewish Orthodox (including 
concrete base) 

680.90     

Bronze—Jewish Orthodox At-Need Package 
(including granite base) Must also 
purchase GRB 113 + Interment 101 

380.60     

Bronze—Religious Area 218.90     

Memorial Plaques (25 Years):      

Centenary Rose Garden—1st inscription 2,730.20     

Centenary Rose Garden—Other inscriptions 530.20     

Classic Granite Niche Wall—Single     587.40

Classic Granite Niche Wall—Double     903.10

Classic Granite Niche Wall—Second 
Inscription 

    301.40

Family Shrub—First Inscription 4,500.10 4,500.10 4,500.10 4,500.10 4,500.10

Family Shrub—Other Inscriptions 620.40  620.40 620.40 620.40

 Additional fee for 229 x 229 plaque—
individual position 

271.70  271.70 271.70 271.70

Garden of Remembrance—Chrome / 
anodised plaque 

457.60 457.60    

Garden of Remembrance—Bronze plaque 542.20 542.20    

Granite Boulder—1st plaque Quote     

Granite Boulder—Detach Plate 301.40     

Granite Boulder—Niche Plaque 301.40     

Granite Boulder—Ground Plaque 568.70     

Granite Niche Wall—Single    478.50  



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2131 

Description Cemetery 

MEMORIALS Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

Granite Niche Wall—Double    800.80  

Granite Niche Wall—2nd Inscription    301.40  

Ground Niche Shrub 995.50 995.50 995.50 995.50 995.50

Ground Niche Rose 1,100.00 1,100.00  1,100.00 1,100.00

Memorial Garden   467.50 467.50 467.50

Memorial Rock Quote Quote Quote   

Memorial Rock—other inscriptions 546.70 546.70 546.70   

Memorial seat—bushland setting   2,799.50   

Memorial Seat—panorama  3,532.10  3,532.10   

Memorial Seat—Granite 3,899.50 3,899.50    

Memorial Seat—Curved Granite 4,973.10     

Memorial Seat—Detach Plate or 2nd insc 
for Garden Bench  

301.40  301.40   

Memorial Seat—Niche Plaque 301.40     

Memorial Seat—Ground Plaque 568.70  568.70   

Memorial Tree—small Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

Memorial Tree—medium Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

Memorial Tree—large Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

Memorial Tree addit for Burial Plaque 755.70 755.70 755.70 755.70 755.70

Memorial Tree—detachable plate 301.40 301.40 301.40 301.40 301.40

Memorial Tree—other inscriptions 568.70 568.70 568.70 568.70 568.70

Memorial Tree—Additional for Burial 
Plaque 

755.70 755.70 755.70 755.70 755.70

Memorial Wall—Single 606.10     

Memorial Wall—Double 884.39     

Memorial Wall—2nd Inscription 301.40     

Niche Wall—Single 424.60 424.60 424.60   

Niche Wall—Double 600.59 600.59 600.59   

Niche Wall—Karrakatta Classic Quote     

Military Niche (Single position only, no 
Plaque) 

295.90 295.90 295.90   

Niche Wall—2nd Inscription (*ALL walls) 301.40 301.40 301.40   

Granite Niche Wall—single  819.50    

Reflection Wall (Green plaque only)   885.49   

Rose Memorial Bronze—1st Inscription 1,899.70 1,899.70 0.00 1,899.70 1,899.70

Rose Memorial Chrome—1st Inscription 1,299.10     

Rose Memorial—Other Inscriptions ( 
chrome) 

447.70  447.70 447.70 447.70

Rose Memorial—Other Inscriptions ( 
bronze) 

545.60  545.60 545.60 545.60

Memorial Garden Homicide—Pinnaroo  466.40  

Arbor Lane—Standard Roses 3,713.60     



2132 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

Description Cemetery 

MEMORIALS Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

Arbor Lane—Standard Gardenias 3,713.60     

Arbor Lane—Standard Roses additional 
inscriptions (inc granite base) 

831.60     

Arbor Lane—Standard Gardenias 
additional inscriptions (inc granite base) 

831.60     

Arbor 1,871.10     

Arbor—Additional inscriptions (inc granite 
base) 

1,871.10     

Bill Manners Walk Quote     

Standard Rose—Individual—First 
Inscription (143 x 117mm plaque) 

7,199.50 7,199.50    

Standard Rose—Individual—second 
inscription 

620.40 620.40    

Standard Rose—in bed—first inscription 
(143 x 117 mm plaque) 

3,300.00     

Standard Rose in bed 1st Inscription  
(229 x 229) 

3,713.60 3,713.60    

Standard Rose—Garden Bed—other 
inscriptions (143 x 117 plaque) 

484.00     

Special Memorials (Family Estates etc.) Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

Special Water Feature Quote  

Special Water Feature—second inscription Quote  

Upgrade existing Memorial to Family 
Estate 

Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

Rose gardens-       

Bronze plaque (110mm x 110mm) 8 line 
inscription (one interment only) 

 715.00    

Bronze plaque (120mm x 144mm) 8 line 
inscription (one interment only) 

 950.40    

Bronze plaque (ground niche) (229mm x 
229mm) 8 line inscription (one interment 
only) 

 1,035.10    

Shrub gardens-      

Bronze plaque (77mm x 90mm) 8 line 
inscription (one interment only)  

 577.50    

Bronze plaque (120mm x 144mm) 8 line 
inscription (one interment only)  

 748.00    

Bronze plaque (229mm x 229mm) 8 line 
inscription (one interment only)  

 851.40    

Individual Memorial Standard (Family) 
Rose—4 interments—First Interment 
Bronze Plaque (381mm x 216mm)  

 2,729.10    

Lawn N Memorial Native Garden 
(doesn't include automatic 2nd 
reservation) 

     

Bronze plaque fixed to garden kerbing—
Feature Bronze plaque 190mm x 190mm: 
= ground niche 

 1,014.20    

Lakeside Memorials      

Bronze plaque (120mm x 144mm) 8 line 
inscription (Granite Pedestal Included) 

 1,950.30    

Lakes Internal Wall Rose Garden—
Bronze plaque fixed to garden wall 
capping (doesn't include automatic 
2nd reservation) 

     

Bronze plaque—plain (380mm x 280mm)  1,699.50    

- 2nd interment/bronze plate  326.70    

- Detachable 5 lines—add price to both base 
plaque & 2nd detachable 

 82.50    



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2133 

Description Cemetery 

MEMORIALS Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

Lakes Wall Rose Garden—Bronze 
plaque fixed to garden wall capping 
(doesn't include automatic 2nd 
reservation) 

     

Bronze plaque 229mm x 229mm  1,364.00    

Infants' Butterfly Garden:      

Rustic Cameo 393.80     

Earth Ribbon 360.80     

Garden Plaque 420.20     

Butterfly Twig 523.60     

River Stone—Small 382.80     

River Stone—Medium 546.70     

River Stone—Large,  727.10     

Memorial Tree in Forest Area (IBG only) 3,165.80     

Memorial Tree in Forest Area- Additional 
Interment 

568.70     

Teak seats Quote     

Stairway to Heaven 10,189.30     

Wind Sculpture—Medium 2,247.30     

Wind Sculpture—Large 2,676.30     

Totem 2,808.30     

Pots on Earth Mound 779.90     

Rock in Garden Lawn 541.20     

Additional Plaque Options 
(granite/emblems/photos etc) 

Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

Life's Memories plaque upgrades Quote Quote Quote Quote Quote

Memories E-ternal (On-Line Memorial)      

Companion 41.80 41.80 41.80 41.80 41.80

Memories Eternal 504.90 504.90 504.90 504.90 504.90

Updates to memorial 77.00 77.00 77.00 77.00 77.00

Book of Remembrance:      

Two Lines 188.10  188.10   

Each additional line (max 8 lines) 48.40  48.40   

Emblem (min 5 lines required) 133.10  133.10   

Personal Copy 169.40  169.40   

 
ALL CHARGES SHOWN BELOW, EXCEPT WHERE OTHERWISE STATED, 

ARE EXEMPT FROM GST 

 Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

FUNERAL DIRECTORS FEES      

Annual Licence 599.00 – Includes All Cemeteries 

Branch Account 183.00 – Includes All Cemeteries 

Single Funeral Permit 135.00 135.00 135.00 135.00 135.00



2134 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

 Karrakatta Fremantle Pinnaroo Midland Guildford 

MONUMENTAL MASONS FEES      

Annual Licence 296.00 – Includes All Cemeteries 

Single Use Monumental Licence (Permit fee 
also payable) 

103.00 103.00 103.00 103.00 103.00

Permits:      

New Headstone—No kerbing (Lawn or Park 
Type) 

183.00 183.00 183.00 183.00 183.00

New Headstone—With kerbing 231.00 231.00  231.00 231.00

Mausoleum Inscription 109.00 109.00  109.00 109.00

Additional Inscriptions/Renovation 90.00 90.00 90.00 90.00 90.00

Additional Monumental 109.00 109.00  109.00 109.00

RESEARCH SERVICES     

Location Query (up to 4 queries) Free Free Free Free Free

Location Query (after 4 queries) 2.20 2.20 2.20 2.20 2.20

Photocopy of Record (inc GST) 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50 5.50

Surname Report (minimum)(inc GST) 25.30 25.30 25.30 25.30 25.30

Microfiche (Alpha listing of all MCB 
Cemeteries) (inc GST) 

127.60 127.60 127.60 127.60 127.60

Access to CRS or microfiche (per hour)  (inc 
GST) 

9.90 9.90    

Digital Photograph sent via e-mail * (inc 
GST) 

24.20 24.20 24.20 24.20 24.20

Digital Photograph sent via post * (inc GST) 35.20 35.20 35.20 35.20 35.20

35mm Photograph sent via post * (inc GST) 46.20 46.20 46.20 46.20 46.20

* Each additional photograph, in any format 
(inc GST) 

11.00 11.00 11.00 11.00 11.00

Publications:      

Memories Eternal by Leonie Liveris (inc 
GST) 

37.40 37.40 37.40   

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401* 
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 

Section 35(4) 
REINSTATED ASSOCIATIONS 

MALAY ASSOCIATION OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
EASYBEAT WALKERS INC. 
LES SANDS PAVILION MANAGEMENT COMMITTEE INC 
ASSOCIATED MISSION CHURCHES OF AUSTRALIA (W.A.) INC. 
GUN DOG CLUB OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 
THE HARTLEY TRAILER SAILER 16 ASSOCIATION OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

(INCORPORATED) 
A.N.F.E. FREMANTLE INCORPORATED 
Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named associations has been re-instated as 
from the date of this notice. 
Dated 20 February 2006. 

PATRICK WALKER, Commissioner for Fair Trading. 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2135 

ENERGY 

EN401* 
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 

Notice under section 23 (1) Notice of Decisions. 

Notice is given that the following Generation Licence has been granted— 

Licensee: Perth Power Partnership 

Issue Date: 9 June 2006 

Address of Licensee: Level 37, Rialto North Tower 

 525 Collins Street 

 Melbourne VIC 3000 

Classification: Generating Works  

Term of Licence: Up to and including 8 June 2036 

Area Covered: Licence area is the area within the boundaries as set out in map ERA-EL-
085 (land located within the BP Australia Limited ABN 53 004 085 616 
Oil Refinery Facilities at Kwinana in the State of Western Australia). 

Inspection of Licence:  Economic Regulation Authority 
 6th Floor 
 197 St Georges Terrace 
 Perth WA 6000 
 http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

JUSTICE 

JU401* 
COURT SECURITY AND CUSTODIAL SERVICES ACT 1999 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 51 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Director General of the Department of the Attorney General has issued the following persons with 
Permits to do High-Level Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Issued 

Permit 
Commence 
Date 

Permit 
Expiry Date 

Harvey Lesley Anne CS6-628 15/05/2006 18/05/2006 30/07/2008 

Donnelly Sally Anne CS6-630 07/06/2006 02/06/2006 30/07/2008 

Pursuant to the provisions of section 56 of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999, the 
Director General of the Department of the Attorney General has revoked the following Permits to do 
High-Level Security Work— 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Revoked 

Savage Donald  John CS6-136 19/04/2006 

Donnelly Sally Anne CS6-395 07/06/2006 

Trevena Gavin  Scott CS6-597 07/06/2006 

Graves Michael  CS6-598 07/06/2006 

Van Kempen Martinus Christiaan Petrus CS6-554 07/06/2006 



2136 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

Surname First Name(s) Permit 
Number 

Date Permit 
Revoked 

Bennett William James CS6-164 07/06/2006 

Bettesworth Travis Adam CS6-003 07/06/2006 

Brown Aaron David CS6-452 07/06/2006 

Budding Ivor Wayne CS6-425 07/06/2006 

Cook Catherine Jane CS6-233 07/06/2006 

Costolloe Colin Robert CS6-180 07/06/2006 

Cross Yvonne Maria CS6-163 07/06/2006 

Fussell Suzannah Rene CS6-432 07/06/2006 

Mahlook Peter John CS6-032 07/06/2006 

Mahlook Sally Anne CS6-215 07/06/2006 

Pickett Lindsay Craig CS6-198 07/06/2006 

Wild Ian Michael CS6-210 07/06/2006 

Wild Leisa Anne CS6-330 07/06/2006 

Wynne Craig Michael CS6-109 07/06/2006 

This notice is published under section 57(1) of the Court Security and Custodial Services Act 1999. 

GREGORY RICKIE, A/ CSCS Contract Manager. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Mundaring 

(Basis of Rates) 

Department of Local Government  
and Regional Development. 

17 May 2006. 

DLGRD: MG5-4#03 
It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with the provisions of section 6.28 of the 
Local Government Act 1995, the Director General of the Department of Local Government and 
Regional Development under delegation from the Hon Jon Ford MLC, Minister for Local Government 
and Regional Development being charged for the time being, with the administration of the Local 
Government Act 1995, has determined that the method of valuing the land described in the schedule 
hereunder shall be gross rental value for the purposes of rating with effect from 17 May 2006. 

CHERYL GWILLIAM, Director General. 

 

 

———— 
 
 

SCHEDULE 

ADDITIONS TO GROSS RENTAL VALUE AREA 

Shire of Mundaring 

All those portions of land being Lot 205 on Deposited Plan 42510, and Lots 201 to 204 inclusive, Lots 
206 to 212 inclusive and Lots 217 to 219 inclusive as shown on Deposited Plan 45222. 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2137 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MX401* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

SPEED RESTRICTIONS 
Canning River 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 
Fremantle WA, 

16 June 2006. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 67 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, 
the department by this notice revokes Notice TR401 as published in the Government Gazette on  
28 September 2004, relating to the temporary 5 knot speed restriction during construction work on 
the Mount Henry Bridge. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager 
Marine Safety, 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

 

 

——————————— 
 

 

 

MX402* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
WATER SKI AREA 

Canning River 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 
16 June 2006. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 48A of the Navigable Waters Regulations, the 
department by this notice defines and sets aside the following area of Navigable Water for the 
purpose of Water Skiing— 

Mount Pleasant: On Mondays to Fridays (not including public holidays), all the waters of 
the Canning River between a line drawn from Deep Water Point due east to the Manning 
foreshore and a line drawn between points 115° 52.331'E, 32° 1.892'S and 115° 52.331'E,  
32° 1.740'S (due north-south roughly 140 metres downstream of Salter Point) but so that no boat 
or skier shall approach within 60 metres of the foreshore except on— 

 • the west bank between Deep Water Point and Queens Road,  

 • the water ski take-off area on the Manning foreshore which commences from a point on the 
foreshore 73 metres south of the prolongation of the southern side of Edgewater Road and 
extending for 100 metres in a southerly direction along the foreshore.  

No water ski take-off or landing shall be permitted on the Manning foreshore except from the 
designated water ski take-off area.  

All water skiing within this area shall be in an anti-clockwise direction and no person shall 
engage in water skiing except between the hours of 0900 and sunset.  

It shall also be a condition of water skiing in this area that all vessels and water ski boats shall 
observe the ENTRY and NO ENTRY signs on the spans of the Mount Henry Bridges and that no 
boat being within 300 metres of either side of the Mt Henry Bridges shall turn across the 
directional line of traffic.  

(On Mondays to Fridays, not including public holidays, the area immediately north of the line 
drawn from Deep Water Point due east to the Manning foreshore is gazetted as an 8 knot speed 
limit and water skiing is prohibited in this area during these times.) 

All coordinates based on GDA 94. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager 
Marine Safety, 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 



2138 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

MX403* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
WATER SKI AREA 

Canning River 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 16 June 2006. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 48A of the Navigable Waters Regulations, the 
department by this notice defines and sets aside the following area of Navigable Water for the 
purpose of Water Skiing— 

Mount Pleasant: On Saturdays, Sundays and public holidays, provided that authorised 
rowing regattas are not in progress, all the waters of the Canning River between a line drawn 100 
metres upstream of the Canning Bridge and a line drawn between points 115° 52.3313'E, 32° 
1.8922'S and 115° 52.3313'E, 32° 1.7402'S (due north-south roughly 140 metres downstream of 
Salter Point) but so that no boat or skier shall approach within 60 metres of the foreshore except 
on— 

 • the west bank between Deep Water Point and Queens Road,  
 • the water ski take-off area on the Manning foreshore which commences from a point on the 

foreshore 73 metres south of the prolongation of the southern side of Edgewater Road and 
extending for 100 metres in a southerly direction along the foreshore.  

No water ski take-off or landing shall be permitted on the Manning foreshore except from the 
designated water ski take-off area.  
All water skiing within this area shall be in an anti-clockwise direction and no person shall 
engage in water skiing except between the hours of 0900 and sunset.  
It shall also be a condition of water skiing in this area that all vessels and water ski boats shall 
observe the ENTRY and NO ENTRY signs on the spans of the Mount Henry Bridges and that no 
boat being within 300 metres of either side of the Mt Henry Bridges shall turn across the 
directional line of traffic.  
All coordinates based on GDA 94. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 

MX404* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
WATER SKI AREA 

Canning River 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 16 June 2006. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 48A of the Navigable Waters Regulations the 
department by this notice revokes Notices TR402, TR403 and TR404 as published in the Government 
Gazette on 28 September 2004, relating to the temporary water ski areas, as required during 
construction work on the Mount Henry Bridge. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401 
MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURES 

Department of Industry and 
Resources, Perth WA 6000. 

I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of section 96A(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned mining tenements are forfeited for breach of covenant viz; non-payment of rent. 

JOHN BOWLER JP MLA, Minister for Resources and 
Assisting the Minister for State Development. 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2139 

Number Holder Mineral Field 
Exploration Licences 

80/3271 East Kimberley Industrial Minerals Pty Ltd Kimberley 
80/3273  East Kimberley Industrial Minerals Pty Ltd Kimberley 

 

——————————— 
 

MP402 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Industry and 

Resources, Meekatharra. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable for forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining 
Act 1978, for breach of covenant, viz; non-payment of rent. 

S. RICHARDSON, Warden. 

———— 
To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Meekatharra on 19 July 2006. 

PEAK HILL MINERAL FIELD 
Prospecting Licences 

P52/528—St Barbara Ltd 
P52/529—St Barbara Ltd 
P52/530—St Barbara Ltd 
P52/531—St Barbara Ltd 
P52/532—St Barbara Ltd 
P52/533—St Barbara Ltd 
P52/534—St Barbara Ltd 

PARLIAMENT 

PA401* 
PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

Royal Assent to Bills 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor has Assented in the name and on behalf 
of Her Majesty the Queen, on the dates shown, to the undermentioned Bills passed by the Legislative 
Council and the Legislative Assembly during the First Session of the Thirty-Seventh Parliament. 
Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No. 
Gene Technology Bill 2005 9 June 2006 20 of 2006 
Medical Radiation Technologists Bill 2005 9 June 2006 21 of 2006 
Health Amendment Bill 2005 9 June 2006 23 of 2006 

MIA BETJEMAN, Clerk of the Parliaments. 
14 June 2006. 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PC401* 
INTERPRETATION ACT 1984 

MINISTERIAL ACTING ARRANGEMENTS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor in accordance with Section 52(1)(b) of 
the Interpretation Act 1984 has approved the appointment of the Hon J. C. Kobelke MLA to act 
temporarily in the office of Minister for Community Development; Seniors and Volunteering; Youth in 
the absence of the Hon D. A. Templeman MLA for the period 9 to 23 July 2006 (both dates inclusive). 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 



2140 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Bayswater 

Town Planning Scheme No. 24—Amendment No. 16 
Ref: 853/2/14/29 Pt 16 

It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of 
Bayswater local planning scheme amendment on 16 May 2006 for the purpose of— 

 1. Reclassifying Lot 92 Lincoln Road, Morley, from ‘Public Purposes—Religious Institution’ to 
‘Medium Density Residential R25’.  

 2. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly.  

T. G. KENYON, Mayor. 
M. J. CAROSELLA, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Albany 

Town Planning Scheme No. 1a—Amendment No. 146 
Ref: 853/5/2/15 Pt 146  
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of Albany 
local planning scheme amendment on 14 May 2006 for the purpose of— 

 1. Rezoning Lot 1013 Albany Highway, Mount Melville, from the 'Clubs & Institution' zone to 
Special Site with a Residential (R30) base zone.  

 2. Incorporating the proposal within Appendix II of the Town Planning Scheme text in the 
following manner— 

Code 
No. 

Particulars 
of Land 

Base 
Zone 

Additional 
Use 

Conditions 

39 Lot 1013 Albany 
Highway, Mount 
Melville 

Residential 
R30 

Medical Clinic 
Professional Offices 

1. Refurbishment of the 
facade of the building 
fronting Albany 
Highway to retain 
window details, scale 
and character of the 
original building. Any 
other extensions/ 
modifications to be 
compatible in 
proportion and scale 
with the original 
building. 

2. On-site car parking to 
be provided in 
accordance with 
Council's car parking 
requirements. 

  

A. E. GOODE, Mayor. 

W. P. MADIGAN, Acting Chief Executive Officer. 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2141 

PI403* 
TOWN PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 1928  

TOWN PLANNING SCHEME NO. 3 
City of Albany 

Amendment No. 237 
The City of Albany Shire Council under and by virtue of the powers conferred upon it in that behalf 
by the Town Planning and Development Act, 1928 (as amended), hereby amends the above Town 
Planning Scheme by— 

 1. Rezoning Portion of Lot 21 Two Peoples Bay Road, Kalgan from the “Rural” zone to “Special 
Use” zone. 

 2. Incorporating the following land particulars, additional uses and special conditions in 
“Schedule III—Special Use Zones” of the Scheme Text. 

No. Land Particulars Special Uses Special Conditions 
18 Portion of Lot 21 

Two Peoples Bay 
Road, Kalgan. 

• Caravan Park 
• Caretakers Dwelling 
• Other incidental or non 

defined activities considered 
appropriate by Council which 
are consistent with the 
permitted uses of the zone 

1.0  General 
1.1 All development to be 

generally in accordance with 
the Concept Development 
Guide Plan as signed by the 
Chief Executive Officer along 
with any minor variations as 
may be approved by Council. 

1.2 All development to be subject 
to the issue of planning 
consent. 

1.3 All development shall be 
screened from Two Peoples 
Bay Road to the satisfaction of 
Council. 

1.4 All signage is subject to the 
prior approval of Council in 
accordance with Scheme 
requirements, relevant Local 
Law and Policy. 

1.5 Occupancy of the caravan park 
is limited to short stay only. 

2.0 Water Supply 
2.1 Potable water supply shall be 

provided to the satisfaction of 
Council and the Health 
Department of WA with all 
sampling, analysis and/or 
treatment costs being borne by 
the landowner. 

2.2 Council shall require any new 
water tanks to be suitably 
coloured and screened from 
external view by tree/shrub 
planting. 

3.0 Tree/Shrub Planting & 
Landscaping 

3.1 Council shall require, at the 
development stage, tree/shrub 
planting and/or landscaping as 
shown on the Concept 
Development Guide Plan. 

3.2 Tree/shrub planting and/or 
landscaping shall be 
appropriately maintained so 
as to achieve screening 
objectives. 

4.0 Fire Management 
4.1 A minimum of 20 metre low 

fuel zone is to be maintained 
around each caravan bay and 
building. 



2142 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

No. Land Particulars Special Uses Special Conditions 
4.2 Council shall require, at the 

development stage, the 
provision of fire hydrants as 
shown on the Concept 
Development Guide Plan. 

4.3 Council shall require, at the 
development stage, the 
construction of strategic 
firebreaks as shown on the 
Concept Development Guide 
Plan. 

4.4 Strategic firebreaks shall be 
constructed and maintained to 
a standard suitable for all year 
access by heavy duty fire 
appliances and two wheel 
drive vehicles. 

4.5 The preparation and 
submission of a fire 
management plan is required 
in conjunction with any 
application(s) for planning 
consent to the satisfaction of 
Council in consultation with 
FESA. 

5.0 Effluent Disposal 
5.1 Effluent disposal shall be 

undertaken to the satisfaction 
of Council and the Health 
Department of WA with 
approved effluent disposal 
systems. It is advised that 
ATU systems may be required 
to service the proposed 
development. 

5.2 All applications for planning 
consent are to be accompanied 
by a report prepared by a 
suitably qualified consultant 
detailing land capability for 
effluent disposal, based on late 
August site testing and in 
accordance with the 
Department of Health 
requirements. 

6.0 Access 
6.1 Council may, at the time of a 

future development 
application in relation to the 
proposed caravan park 
expansion require as a 
condition of planning consent 
that improvements be made to 
the crossover intersection 
arrangement with Two 
Peoples Bay Road. 

 3. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly. 
 

——————————— 

PI404* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Dandaragan 

Town Planning Scheme No. 6—Amendment No. 23 
Ref: 853/3/6/7 Pt 23 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2143 

Dandaragan local planning scheme amendment on 9 May 2006 for the purpose of rezoning Crown 
Reserve 35716 Bashford Street, from “Recreation” to “Special Development”, as depicted on the 
Scheme Amendment Map. 

S. LOVE, Shire President. 
C. STRUGNELL, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PI405* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Dandaragan 

Town Planning Scheme No. 6—Amendment No. 27 
Ref: 853/3/6/7 Pt 27 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Dandaragan local planning scheme amendment on 19 April 2006 for the purpose of rezoning portion 
of Unallocated Crown Land at the corner of Seville Street and Valencia Road, Cervantes, from Rural 
zone to Residential R15, as depicted on the Scheme Amendment Map 

S. LOVE, Shire President. 
C. STRUGNELL, Chief Executive Officer. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 
PI406* 

PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 
APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SHCEME AMENDMENT 

City of Wanneroo 
District Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 52 

Ref:  853/2/30/19 Pt 52 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of 
Wanneroo local planning scheme amendment on 5 June 2006 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning the severed portion of Reserve 28058 from ‘Parks and Recreation’ to ‘Urban 

Development’. 
   2. (i) Modifying Subclause 3.7.1 by inserting the words ‘or proposed’ following the words ‘is 

intended to accommodate existing’. 
 (ii) Modifying Subclause 3.7.2(a) by inserting the words ‘or proposed’ following the words 

‘make provision for existing’. 
   3. (i) Renumbering Clause 4.8 to Subclause 4.8.1. 
 (ii) Inserting a new Subclause 4.8.2 to read as follows: ‘The façade or facades of all non 

rural and non residential development shall have incorporated in their design, 
integrated panels for the purpose of signage placement.’ 

 4. Modifying subclause 4.23.3(b) by inserting the zone ‘Special Residential,’ before the zone 
‘Special Rural’. 

   5.  (i) Modifying Subclause 6.10.1 by deleting the following ‘, or the Minister’ and replacing 
the words ‘Town Planning Appeal Tribunal’ with ‘State Administrative Tribunal’. 

 (ii) Modifying Subclause 6.11 by deleting the words ‘the Minister or’ after the words ‘given 
by’ and ‘imposed by’ and replacing the words ‘Town Planning Appeal Tribunal’ with 
‘State Administrative Tribunal’. 

 (iii) Modifying Subclause 9.12.3 by replacing the words ‘Town Planning Appeal Tribunal’ 
with ‘State Administrative Tribunal’. 

   6. (i) Modifying Subclause 9.12.2 by replacing ‘35’ days with ‘60’ days. 
 7. Modifying Subclause 11.4.6.2 by replacing the word ‘must’ with the word ‘should’. 
 8. Modifying Table 1—The Zoning Table as follows— 
 (i) Modifying the use class ‘Pharmacy’ from a use not permitted ‘X’ use in the Mixed Use 

and Business zones to a discretionary ‘D’ use. 
 (ii) Renaming the use class ‘Mast and Antenna’ as ‘Mast or Antenna’. 



2144 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

   9. (i) modifying the number of on-site car parking spaces from ‘2 per classroom but not less 
than 10’ for the use class ‘Primary School’ to ‘a minimum of 46 car bays for staff and 
visitor parking for the first 475 students and then ten (10) car bays for every 100 
students or part thereof afterwards, plus fourteen (14) pickup/set down bays for every 
100 students or part thereof which may be provided in the road reserve’  

 (ii) modifying the number of on-site car parking spaces from ‘2 per classroom but not less 
than 10’ for the use class ‘Secondary School’ to ‘a minimum of 60 car bays for staff and 
visitor parking for the first 600 students and then ten (10) car bays for every 100 
students or part thereof afterwards plus seven (7) pick up/set down bays for every 
100 students or part thereof which may be provided in the road reserve.’ 

 (iii) modifying the number of on-site car parking spaces from ‘see Child Care Centre’ for the 
use class ‘Kindergarten’ to ‘provision of a drive-in pickup/set down facility plus eight 
(8) bays’. 

 10. Modifying Schedule 1—Interpretations as follows— 

 (i) Deleting the following ‘(See “communications antenna”.)’ from the definition of ‘mast or 
antenna’. 

 (ii) Amending the definition ‘medical centre’ by deleting the phrase ‘and may include 
ancillary uses such as a pathologist, radiologist and pharmacy.’ 

 (iii) Renaming the definition of ‘markets (retail)’ to ‘market (retail)’. 

 (iv) Renaming the definition of ‘motor vehicle repair’ to ‘motor vehicle repairs’ 

  11. (i) Modifying Clauses and Subclauses 1.9.1, 1.9.2, 1.9.3, 3.4.2, 4.2.1, 4.4, 4.4.1, 4.4.2, 4.4.3, 
4.4.4, 4.4.6, 4.4.7, 4.5 and 4.21.1 by replacing the word ‘Planning’ before the word 
‘Codes’ with the word ‘Design’; 

 (ii) Modifying the titles of Clauses 4.4 and 4.5 and titles in the Contents Page of Clauses 
4.4 and 4.5 by replacing the word ‘Planning’ before the word ‘Codes’ with the word 
‘Design’; 

 (iii) Replacing the word ‘Planning’ before the word ‘Codes’ with the word ‘Design’ in the 
definition of ‘Residential building’ and ‘Codes’ in Schedule 1. 

  12 (i) Amending Schedule 4(a) by replacing the words ‘provisions of the Signs Local Law’ with 
‘requirements of the City’s Signs Local Planning Policy’. 

 (ii) Amending Schedule 4(c) by replacing the figure ‘1.2m2’with ‘2m2’. 

 (iii) Amending Schedule 4(g) by inserting the following words ‘not exceeding 50% of the 
glazed area of any one window or 10m2 in aggregate area per tenancy, whichever is the 
lesser,’ after the word ‘window’. 

 (iv) Amending Schedule 4(m) by inserting the following words ‘measuring up to 3m in 
height and 3m2 in area,’ after the words ‘rural producer’s sign’. 

 (v) Amending Schedule 4 by adding the following additional exemptions— 

 ‘(t)  an election sign which is— 

 (i)  erected on private property with the approval of the owner of that property, 
where such approval has been obtained prior to the erection of the election 
sign; 

 (ii)  not in excess of 0.75m2 in area per property, except a corner property which 
may display one sign facing each thoroughfare of the corner; 

 (iii)  erected not more than 28 days prior to the date of the election to which it 
relates; 

 (iv)  erected in accordance with the restriction provisions of Clause 16 of the 
Signs Local Law 1999; 

 (v)  removed within 7 days of the date of the election. 

 (u)  a sign permanently affixed or painted on a vehicle to identify a company, 
business, service or product supplied or sold by that company.’ 

 13. Amending Special Provision No. 11 of Special Rural Zone No.18 in Schedule 13 by adding the 
following ‘with the exception of a post and wire boundary fence.’ after the word ‘zone’. 

 14. Modifying Special Provision No.1.1.3 of Rural Community Zone No. 1 of Schedule 15 by 
inserting the words ‘Ancillary Accommodation,’ after the phrase ‘Home Business—Categories 
1, 2 & 3,’. 

S. SALPIETRO, Mayor. 

C. JOHNSON, Chief Executive Officer. 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2145 

PI407* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED TOWN PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Perth 

City Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 3 
Ref: P1002002-8 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87(3) of the Planning and 
Development Act, 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of Perth 
town planning scheme amendment on 16 May 2006 for the purpose of— 
 1. After clause 57A(1)(c) of the Scheme Text insert the following— 
 “(d)  1299—1305 Hay Street Special Control Area.” 
 2. In Schedule 9 of the Scheme Text insert a new special control area, as follows— 
 “4.0 1299—1305 Hay Street Special Control Area 
 4.1 Special Control Area 
  The following provisions apply to the land area marked as Figure 4—1299—1305 Hay 

Street Special Control Area. 
 4.2 Plot Ratio 
  For the purpose of determining plot ratio the 1299—1305 Hay Street Special Control 

Area shall be treated as one site. 
 4.3 Car Parking 
  For the purpose of determining the maximum tenant parking allowance for any 

development on the subject land, the 1299—1305 Hay Street Special Control Area shall 
be treated as one site.” 

Dr. P. R. NATTRASS, Lord Mayor. 
F. EDWARDS, Chief Executive Officer. 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG401* 
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988 

LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS 
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and 
required to be advertised. Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about 
the objection process, should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming and Liquor, 1st Floor, Hyatt 
Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant 
industry organisation. 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE 
11435 Boulla Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Producer's 

licence in respect of premises situated in 
Yallingup and known as Seven Ochres 
Vineyard 

29/6/2006 

11436 Touraust Hotels Pty 
Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Hotel Restricted 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Belmont and known as Country Comfort 
Intercity Motel 

6/7/2006 

11428 Angela Elizabeth 
Munday & Donald 
John Munday 

Application for the grant of a Producer's 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Busselton and known as Glendon Range 
Estate 

27/6/2006 

11439 Anna Gare Application for the grant of a Special 
Facility—Caterer licence in respect of 
premises situated in North Fremantle and 
known as Deluxe Catering 

2/7/2006 

11441 Emilie Nguyen, 
Nua Van Nguyen, 
Tu Thi Tran and 
Hai-Au Nguyen 

Application for the grant of a Restaurant 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Carnarvon and known as City Asia 

26/6/2006 



2146 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE—continued 
11443 Ian Colin Robert 

Mackenzie & 
Marjorie Lyn 
Mackenzie 

Application for the grant of a Producer's 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Yallingup and known as Q Wines 

26/6/2006 

11423 Compass Group 
(Australia) Pty Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Special 
Facility—Canteen licence in respect of 
premises situated in Murrin Murrin and 
known as Grey Mare Borefields Project 
Tavern 

18/6/2006 

 

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS 
27244 Margaret Pool and 

Darren Lyndsay 
Pool 

Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Kondinin and 
known as Kondinin Hotel  

29/6/2006 

27183 Good Things in Life 
Pty Ltd 

Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Margaret 
River and known as Settlers Tavern 

22/6/2006 

 

APPLICATIONS TO ADD, VARY OR CANCEL A CONDITION OF LICENCE 
255782 Valley (WA) Pty Ltd Application to add, vary or cancel a condition 

of the Special Facility—Tourism licence in 
respect of premises situated in Henley Brook 
and known as Elmar’s In The Valley 

30/6/2006 

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988. 

Dated: 14 June 2006. 
P. MINCHIN, Director of Liquor Licensing. 

WORKSAFE 

WS401* 
OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH ACT 1984 

OCCUPATIONAL SAFETY AND HEALTH REGULATIONS 1996 
EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE PURSUANT TO REGULATION 2.13 

(No. 13 of 2006) 
I, Nina Lyhne, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner, hereby grant an exemption to John 
Holland Pty Ltd, Multiplex Limited and McMahon Contractors Pty Ltd T/A as RailLink Joint Venture 
from the requirements of Regulation 3.64 of the Occupational Safety and Health Regulations 1996, to 
permit the HARSCO tracklayer machine to enter the “danger zone” of an overhead power line, to a 
distance of not less than 5.2 metres from a live overhead power line, whether insulated or not, of a 
voltage exceeding 33 000 volts. This exemption applies only in relation to the HARSCO tracklayer 
machine working under the Western Power HV 132kV power line crossing the Kwinana Freeway and 
the Perth to Mandurah Railway at Glen Iris, as part of the Southern Suburbs Railway construction 
project, and is valid on 13 and 16 June 2006 between 7.00 am and 3.00 pm. 

This exemption is granted on the following conditions— 

 • the sleeper gantry operator is not on the gantry of the tracklaying machine during the 
tracklaying process while it occurs within 10 metres from the point vertically below the 
overhead power line;  

 • an observer is in place at all times during the tracklaying process while it occurs within 10 
metres from the point vertically below the overhead power line and ensures no person comes 
into contact with or boards the tracklaying machine; 

 • no person is on or has physical contact with the tracklaying machine while it is within 10 
metres from the point vertically below the overhead power li;  



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2147 

 • should the tracklaying machine break down, no repair or maintenance work is carried out 
while it is within 10 metres from the point vertically below the overhead power line; 

 • all employees carrying out works are instructed in safe work procedures, which include 
details of the exemption, before work commences; and  

 • work is conducted according to the procedure outlined in the process procedure no RL-PP-
AOB. 

Dated this 12th day of June 2006. 

NINA LYHNE, WorkSafe Western Australia Commissioner. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Notice to Creditors and Claimants of Gregory Lachlan Burdon late of 1/140 Hubert Street, East 
Victoria Park, Western Australia, Retired Cabinet Maker deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 22 April 2006 are required by the Trustee ANZ 
Executors & Trustee Company Limited ABN 33 006 132 332) of Level 21, 530 Collins Street, 
Melbourne, VIC 3000 to send particulars of their claim to them by 28 July 2006 after which date the 
Trustee may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which he then has 
notice. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before the 16th July 2006 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, 
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 
Astley, Elsie Florence, late of Craigville Nursing Home/Retire Village 1 French Road Melville 

formerly of 4/155 Ninth Avenue Inglewood, died 14/5/2006, (DE19842645EM38) 
Bainbridge, Jean Violet. late of 22 Ivermey Road Hamilton Hill, died on 23/5/2006, 

(DE19772640EM110) 
Clifton, Doris Marjorie, late of 25 Anstey Street South Perth, died 16/5/2006, (DE19691976EM16) 
Devaney, Bernard Michael, late of Bibra Lake Lakeside Villas 18/8 Lewington Gardens Bibra Lake 

formerly of 40 Vista Street South Perth, died 30/3/2006, (DE19782475EM38) 
Farrar, Ada Phyllis, late of Howard Solomon Aged Care Facility 91 Hybanthus Road Ferndale, died 

27/5/2006, (DE33030233EM36) 
Few, James Alwin, late of 82 Oakmont Avenue Meadow Springs, died 19/4/2006, (DE19800776EM17) 
Grot, Jan, late of 53 Ross Street Cloverdale, died 4/6/2006, (DE33026337EM12) 
Innes, Gregory Charles, late of 10 Dalaroo Court Cooloongup, died 23/2/2004, (DE33032491EM32) 
King, Lorraine Ellen, late of St Michael’s Nursing Home 53/57 Wasley Street North Perth formerly of 

7 Smith Street Dianella, died 13/5/2006, (DE33009569EM34) 
Lane, David Ronald, late of 4 Millstream Street Pannawonica, died 2/8/2005, (DE33046867EM22) 
Luckly, Ernest Avery, late of Sunshine Park Hostel 10 Brady Road Lesmurdie, died 27/5/2006, 

(DE19790113EM26) 
Moores, Beatrice Mary, late of Amaroo Nursing Home 74 Lissiman Street Gosnells formerly of 

69 Station Street Gosnefls1 died 28/5/2006, (DE19762814EM22) 
Ogg, Douglas David Graham also known as Douglas Graham Ogg, late of Brightwater Care Group 

139 Kingsway Way Madeley, died 25/4/2006, (DE19752835EM32) 
Pilcher, Margery, late of 25 Sweeney Way Padbury, died 11/5/2006, (DE19691302EM37) 



2148 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

Robertson, Emily Caroline, late of 36 Laurie Street Cloverdale, died 22/5/2006, (DE33027268EM36) 
Robinson, Betty Lenore, late of Raafa Estate 33/19 Hughie Edwards Drive Merriwa, died 29/5/2006, 

(DE19910836EM27) 
Selwood, Margaret Ruth, late of Kimberley Nursing Home 76 Kimberley Street West Leederville, died 

28/4/2006, (DE19801920EM110) 
Spargo, Diana Fairlie, late of Madeley High Care Facility 95 Imperial Circuit Madeley, died 5/5/2006, 

(DE19942941EM17) 
Wilde, Ethel Kathleen late of 495 Marmion Street Booragoon formerly of Unit 33/144 Mill Point Road 

South Perth, died 29/5/2006, (DE19540625EM313) 
Williams, Leanne Francis late of Bristol Hostel 70 Spencer Avenue Yokine, died 13/8/2005, 

(DE33049245EM16) 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
Public Trust Office, 

565 Hay Street, 
Perth WA 6000. 

Telephone: 9222 6717 

PUBLIC NOTICES 

ZZ401* 
PARTNERSHIP ACT 1895 
RETIREMENT OF PARTNER 

WRIGHT LEGAL 
PAUL WRIGHT and MASON HILLS give notice under Section 47 of the Partnership Act 1895 (WA) 
that MASON HILLS has retired from the partnership of the firm trading as Wright Legal of 1/103 
Colin Street, West Perth, Western Australia. 
Dated 14 June 2006. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

ZZ402 
DISPOSAL OF UNCOLLECTED GOOD ACT 1970 

To Paul Francis Cockerill of Last Known Address 15 Simper Crescent, White Gum Valley WA 6162. 
Please be advised that Potter Cook & Dodd Real Estate of 11 Station Street, Cottesloe W.A. 6011 are 
in possession of 1991 VP Commodore registration number 1AZL—251 Chassis Number 
6H8VPKL9UP1617927 Engine Number VU613237 left at the property located at 6/6 McNeece Place, 
O’Connor on 31st August 2003. 
Also be advised that we will be making application to the Perth Local Court for disposal of the 
uncollected vehicle should you fail to contact our office to arrange collection of the vehicle within 
30 days (Thirty days) of publication of Notice of Intent to Sell 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 



16 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2149 

PERTH OBSERVATORY

 

THE W.A. SPECIALISTS IN 
ASTRONOMICAL 

RESEARCH & EDUCATIONAL 
ASTRONOMY 

Public Tours (day and night) 
Field Nights, Lectures 

Astronomical Information 

Astronomical Handbook 
Sun rise & set; Moon rise & set 

Legal advice 
Chronometer calibration 
Astronomical souvenirs 

SERVING WESTERN AUSTRALIA SINCE 1896 

WALNUT ROAD, BICKLEY 6076 
TELEPHONE 9293 8255  FAX 9293 8138 

ASTRONOMY IS LOOKING UP 



2150 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2006 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES 

(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS) 
For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State 
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the 
missing item. 
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full. 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2007 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2007. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 876.70
  Interstate  ..................................... 893.20
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,220.00
 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,138.50
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 798.60
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 421.30
  Interstate ...................................... 501.60
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 578.00
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 345.40
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 831.60
  Interstate .................................... 1016.40
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 957.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 820.60
  Interstate ...................................... 832.70
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999  
 (per year) ........................................  851.40

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 297.00 
  Interstate ....................................... 330.00 
  Overseas ........................................ 305.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 818.40 

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)........................................ 295.90 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 320.10 
  Interstate ........................................ 330.00 
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 430.00 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA ...................................... 438.90 
  Interstate ....................................... 459.80 
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 622.00 

 

 

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is 
searchable. Other CD ROM products with 
legislation or other statutory information can 
be packaged to individual requirements.  
Prices are available on request. 

 
 
 
 

!200600101GG! 


