
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  2159 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 23 JUNE 2006 No. 103 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

CONTENTS 
 PART 1 Page 

Animal Welfare Act 2002—Animal Welfare (General) Amendment Regulations 2006............................  2192 
Children’s Court of Western Australia Act 1988—Children’s Court (Fees) Amendment 

Regulations 2006 ....................................................................................................................................  2181 
Civil Judgments Enforcement Act 2004—Civil Judgments Enforcement Amendment 

Regulations 2006 ....................................................................................................................................  2175 
District Court of Western Australia Act 1969—District Court (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2006 ....  2187 
Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation Fund Act 1980—Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation 

Fund Amendment Regulations 2006......................................................................................................  2231 
Evidence Act 1906—Evidence (Video and Audio Links Fees and Expenses) Amendment 

Regulations 2006 ....................................................................................................................................  2190 
Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994—Fines, Penalties and Infringement 

Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006.................................................................  2191 
Government Financial Responsibility Act 2000—Government Financial Responsibility Regulations 

2006.........................................................................................................................................................  2230 
Jetties Act 1926—Jetties Amendment Regulations 2006..........................................................................  2193 
Magistrates Court Act 2004—Magistrates Court (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2006 .........................  2178 
Marine Navigational Aids Act 1973—Marine Navigational Aids Amendment Regulations 2006 ...........  2205 
Mining Act 1978—Mining Amendment Regulations (No. 6) 2006 ............................................................  2219 
Motor Vehicle Drivers Instructors Act 1963—Motor Vehicle Drivers Instructors Amendment 

Regulations (No. 4) 2006.........................................................................................................................  2222 
Rail Safety Act 1998—Rail Safety Amendment Regulations 2006............................................................  2223 
Road Traffic Act 1974— 
  Road Traffic (Events on Roads) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006 .............................................  2224 
  Road Traffic (Vehicle Standards) Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2006 ..........................................  2225 
Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967— 
  Mooring Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006..................................................................................  2206 
  Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations 2006 ..............................................................................  2207 
  Ports and Harbours Amendment Regulations 2006 ...........................................................................  2208 
Supreme Court Act 1935—Supreme Court (Fees) Amendment Regulations 2006 ...................................  2184 
Taxi Act 1994—Taxi Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2006 .....................................................................  2227 
Transport Co-ordination Act 1966— 
  Transport (Country Taxi-car) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006................................................  2229 
  Transport Co-ordination Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006........................................................  2228 
Western Australian Marine Act 1982— 
  Mooring Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006..................................................................................  2206 
  W.A. Marine (Certificates of Competency and Safety Manning) Amendment Regulations  

   (No. 2) 2006.....................................................................................................................................  2212 
  W.A. Marine (Hire and Drive Vessels) Amendment Regulations 2006..............................................  2211 
  W.A. Marine (Radiotelephony) Amendment Regulations 2006..........................................................  2213 
  W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates of Survey) Amendment Regulations 2006...........................  2214 
Wildlife Conservation Act 1950— 
  Wildlife Conservation (Rare Flora) Notice 2006 .................................................................................  2169 
  Wildlife Conservation (Specially Protected Fauna) Notice 2006........................................................  2161 

 
——— 

 
PART 2 

Agriculture..................................................................................................................................................  2232 
Deceased Estates ........................................................................................................................................  2245 
Fisheries .....................................................................................................................................................  2235 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................................  2237 
Land............................................................................................................................................................  2237 
Local Government ......................................................................................................................................  2238 
Minerals and Petroleum.............................................................................................................................  2239 
Planning and Infrastructure ......................................................................................................................  2241 
Police...........................................................................................................................................................  2242 
Racing, Gaming and Liquor .......................................................................................................................  2243 
Water/Sewerage..........................................................................................................................................  2243 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2006 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$23.70 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$55.20 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$55.20 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.05 

  Bulk Notices—$201.70 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2161 

 

— PART 1 — 

CONSERVATION 

CO301* 

 
Wildlife Conservation Act 1950 

Wildlife Conservation (Specially Protected 
Fauna) Notice 2006 

Made by the Minister for the Environment under section 14(2)(ba) of 
the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This notice is the Wildlife Conservation (Specially Protected 
Fauna) Notice 2006. 

2. Interpretation 

  In this notice —  

 “taxon” includes any taxon that is described by a family name 
or a genus name or any other name or description. 

Note: The plural form of “taxon” is “taxa”. 

3. Declaration of specially protected fauna 

  For the purposes of the Act, all taxa of the fauna —  

 (a) specified in Schedule 1, being fauna that is rare or likely 
to become extinct, are declared to be fauna that is in 
need of special protection; 

 (b) specified in Schedule 2, being fauna that is presumed to 
be extinct, are declared to be fauna that is in need of 
special protection; 

 (c) specified in Schedule 3, being birds that are subject to an 
agreement between the governments of Australia and 



2162 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Japan relating to the protection of migratory birds and 
birds in danger of extinction, are declared to be fauna 
that is in need of special protection; and 

 (d) specified in Schedule 4, are declared to be fauna that is 
in need of special protection, otherwise than for the 
reasons mentioned in paragraphs (a), (b) and (c). 

4. Revocation 

  The Wildlife Conservation (Specially Protected Fauna) 
Notice 2005 is revoked. 

 
Schedule 1 — Fauna that is rare or is likely to 

become extinct 
[cl. 3(a)] 

Division 1 — Mammals 
 Scientific Name Common name 
1.  Balaenoptera borealis Sei Whale 
2.  Balaenoptera musculus  Blue Whale 
3.  Balaenoptera physalus Fin Whale 
4.  Bettongia lesueur lesueur Burrowing Bettong or Boodie 

(Shark Bay islands) 
5.  Bettongia lesueur ssp. 

(WAM M10733) 
Burrowing Bettong or Boodie 

(Barrow Island) 
6.  Dasycercus cristicauda Mulgara or Minyi-minyi 
7.  Dasycercus hillieri Ampurta 
8.  Dasyurus geoffroii Chuditch or Western Quoll 
9.  Eubalaena australis Southern Right Whale 
10.  Isoodon auratus auratus Golden Bandicoot or Wintarru 

(mainland) 
11.  Isoodon auratus barrowensis Barrow Island Golden 

Bandicoot 
12.  Lagorchestes conspicillatus 

conspicillatus 
Barrow Island Spectacled 

Hare-wallaby 
13.  Lagorchestes hirsutus bernieri Bernier and Dorre Island 

Rufous Hare wallaby or 
Mala 

14.  Lagorchestes hirsutus ssp. 
(NTM U2430) 

Rufous Hare-wallaby or Mala 
(Tanami Desert) 

15.  Lagostrophus fasciatus 
fasciatus 

Banded Hare-wallaby or 
Mernine 

16.  Leporillus conditor Greater Stick-nest Rat or 
Wopilkara 

17.  Macropus robustus isabellinus Barrow Island Euro 
18.  Macrotis lagotis Dalgyte or Bilby or Ninu 
19.  Megaptera novaeangliae Humpback Whale 
20.  Myrmecobius fasciatus Numbat or Walpurti 
21.  Notoryctes caurinus Kakarratul or 

Northern Marsupial Mole  
22.  Notoryctes typhlops Itjaritjari or 

Southern Marsupial Mole  
23.  Parantechinus apicalis Dibbler 
24.  Perameles bougainville 

bougainville 
Western Barred Bandicoot or 

Marl 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2163 

 

 Scientific Name Common name 
25.  Petrogale lateralis hacketti Recherche Rock-wallaby 
26.  Petrogale lateralis lateralis Black-footed Rock-wallaby or 

Warru 
27.  Petrogale lateralis ssp. 

(ANWC CM15314) 
McDonnell Range 

Rock-wallaby 
28.  Petrogale lateralis ssp. 

(WAM M15135) 
West Kimberley Rock-wallaby 

29.  Phascogale calura Red-tailed Phascogale or 
Keengoor 

30.  Potorous gilbertii Gilbert’s Potoroo 
31.  Pseudocheirus occidentalis Western Ringtail Possum or 

Nguara 
32.  Pseudomys australis Plains Rat or Palyoora 
33.  Pseudomys fieldi Shark Bay Mouse or Djoongari 
34.  Pseudomys nanus ferculinus Barrow Island Mouse 
35.  Pseudomys shortridgei Heath Rat or Dayang 
36.  Rhinonicteris aurantius Orange Leaf-nosed Bat 
37.  Setonix brachyurus Quokka 
38.  Sminthopsis butleri Butler’s Dunnart 
39.  Sminthopsis griseoventer 

boullangerensis 
Boullanger Island Dunnart 

40.  Sminthopsis psammophila Sandhill Dunnart 
41.  Zyzomys pedunculatus Central Rock-rat or Antina 

Division 2 — Birds 
 Scientific name Common name 
42.  Anous tenuirostris melanops Lesser Noddy 
43.  Atrichornis clamosus Noisy Scrub-bird or Tjimiluk 
44.  Botaurus poiciloptilus Australasian Bittern 
45.  Cacatua pastinator pastinator Muir’s Corella or 

Western Long-billed Corella 
46.  Calamanthus campestris dorrie Dorre Island Rufous Fieldwren 
47.  Calamanthus campestris 

hartogi 
Dirk Hartog Island Rufous 

Fieldwren 
48.  Calyptorhynchus banksii naso Forest Red-tailed 

Black-Cockatoo 
49.  Calyptorhynchus baudinii Baudin’s Black-Cockatoo 
50.  Calyptorhynchus latirostris Carnaby’s Black-Cockatoo 
51.  Catharacta lonnbergi lonnbergi Subantarctic Skua 
52.  Cereopsis novaehollandiae 

grisea 
Recherche Cape Barren Goose 

53.  Dasyornis longirostris Western Bristlebird 
54.  Diomedea amsterdamensis Amsterdam Albatross 
55.  Diomedea dabbenena Tristan Albatross 
56.  Diomedea epomophora Southern Royal Albatross 
57.  Diomedea exulans Wandering Albatross 
58.  Diomedea gibsoni Gibson’s Albatross 
59.  Diomedea sanfordi Northern Royal Albatross 
60.  Erythrotriorchis radiatus Red Goshawk 
61.  Erythrura gouldiae Gouldian Finch 
62.  Falcunculus frontatus whitei Northern Crested Shrike-tit 
63.  Geophaps smithii blaauwi Partridge Pigeon (western) 
64.  Leipoa ocellata Malleefowl 
65.  Macronectes giganteus Southern Giant Petrel 



2164 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

 Scientific name Common name 
66.  Malurus lamberti bernieri Shark Bay Variegated 

Fairy-wren 
67.  Malurus leucopterus edouardi Barrow Island Black and White 

Fairy-wren 
68.  Malurus leucopterus 

leucopterus 
Dirk Hartog Island Black and 

White Fairy-wren 
69.  Morus capensis Cape Gannet 
70.  Pezoporus occidentalis Night Parrot 
71.  Pezoporus wallicus flaviventris Ground Parrot 
72.  Phoebetria fusca Sooty Albatross 
73.  Phoebetria palpebrata Light-mantled Albatross 
74.  Platycercus icterotis 

xanthogenys 
Western Rosella (Mallee) 

75.  Procellaria aequinoctialis White-chinned Petrel 
76.  Psophodes nigrogularis 

nigrogularis 
Western Whipbird 

(Western Heath) 
77.  Rostratula benghalensis 

australis 
Australian Painted Snipe 

78.  Stipiturus malachurus hartogi Dirk Hartog Island Southern 
Emu-wren 

79.  Sula dactylatra bedouti Masked Booby 
(eastern Indian Ocean) 

80.  Thalassarche carteri Indian Yellow-nosed Albatross 
81.  Thalassarche cauta Shy Albatross 
82.  Thalassarche chlororhynchos Atlantic Yellow-nosed 

Albatross 
83.  Thalassarche chrysostoma Grey-headed Albatross 
84.  Thalassarche salvini Salvin’s Albatross 
85.  Turnix varia scintillans Abrolhos Painted Button-quail 

Division 3 — Reptiles 
 Scientific name Common name 
86.  Aprasia rostrata rostrata Hermite Island Worm Lizard 
87.  Caretta caretta Loggerhead Turtle 
88.  Chelonia mydas  Green Turtle 
89.  Ctenophorus yinnietharra Yinnietharra Rock-dragon 
90.  Ctenotus angusticeps Airlie Island Ctenotus 
91.  Ctenotus lancelini Lancelin Island Skink 
92.  Ctenotus zastictus Hamelin Ctenotus 
93.  Cyclodomorphus branchialis  
94.  Dermochelys coriacea Leathery Turtle or Luth 
95.  Egernia kintorei Giant Desert Skink 
96.  Egernia pulchra longicauda  
97.  Egernia stokesii aethiops Baudin Island Spiny-tailed 

Skink 
98.  Egernia stokesii badia Western Spiny-tailed Skink 
99.  Eretmochelys imbricata Hawksbill Turtle 
100. Lepidochelys olivacea Olive Ridley Turtle 
101. Lerista praefrontalis Buccaneer Burrowing Skink 
102. Liasis olivaceus barroni Pilbara Olive Python 
103. Natator depressus Flatback Turtle 
104. Pogona minor minima  
105. Pseudemydura umbrina Western Swamp Tortoise 
106. Pseudonaja affinis exilis Rottnest Island Dugite 
107. Pseudonaja affinis tanneri Pygmy Dugite 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2165 

 

 Scientific name Common name 
108. Tiliqua rugosa konowi Rottnest Island Bobtail  

Division 4 — Frogs 
 Scientific name Common name 
109. Geocrinia alba White-bellied Frog 
110. Geocrinia vitellina Yellow-bellied Frog 
111. Spicospina flammocaerulea Sunset Frog 

Division 5 — Fish 
 Scientific name Common name 
112. Carcharias taurus Grey Nurse Shark 
113. Carcharodon carcharias Great White Shark 
114. Galaxias truttaceus hesperius Western Trout Minnow 
115. Milyeringa veritas Blind Gudgeon 
116. Ophisternon candidum  Blind Cave Eel 

Division 6 — Snails 
 Scientific name Common name 
117. Amplirhagada astuta  
118. Austroassiminea letha Cape Leeuwin Freshwater Snail 
119. Carinotrachia carsoniana  
120. Cristilabrum bubulum  
121. Cristilabrum buryillum  
122. Cristilabrum grossum  
123. Cristilabrum isolatum  
124. Cristilabrum monodon  
125. Cristilabrum primum  
126. Cristilabrum rectum  
127. Cristilabrum simplex  
128. Cristilabrum solitudum  
129. Cristilabrum spectaculum  
130. Mouldingia occidentalis  
131. Mouldingia orientalis  
132. Ningbingia australis australis  
133. Ningbingia australis elongata  
134. Ningbingia bulla  
135. Ningbingia dentiens  
136. Ningbingia laurina  
137. Ningbingia octava  
138. Ningbingia res  
139. Ordtrachia elegans  
140. Turgenitubulus christenseni  
141. Turgenitubulus costus  
142. Turgenitubulus depressus  
143. Turgenitubulus foramenus  
144. Turgenitubulus opiranus  
145. Turgenitubulus pagodula  
146. Turgenitubulus tanmurrana  
147. Undescribed Rhytidid species 

(WAM 2295-69) 
Stirling Range Rhytidid Snail 

148. Westraltrachia alterna  
149. Westraltrachia inopinata  
150. Westraltrachia turbinata  



2166 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Division 7 — Arachnids 
 Scientific name Common name 
151. Aganippe castellum Tree-stem Trapdoor Spider 
152. Austrarchaea mainae Western Archaeid Spider 
153. Bamazomus subsolanus Eastern Cape Range 

Bamazomus 
154. Bamazomus vespertinus Western Cape Range 

Bamazomus 
155. Draculoides bramstokeri Barrow Island Draculoides 
156. Draculoides brooksi Northern Cape Range 

Draculoides 
157. Draculoides julianneae Western Cape Range 

Draculoides 
158. Hyella sp. (BES 1154, 2525, 

2546, 2554) 
Cameron’s Cave 

Pseudoscorpion 
159. Idiosoma nigrum Shield-backed Trapdoor Spider 
160. Kwonkan eboracum Yorkrakine Trapdoor Spider 
161. Moggridgea sp. 

(BY Main 1990/24, 25) 
Stirling Range Trapdoor Spider 

162. Moggridgea tingle Tingle Trapdoor Spider 
163. Tartarus mullamullangensis Mullamullalang Cave Spider 
164. Tartarus murdochensis Murdoch Sink Cave spider 
165. Tartarus nurinensis Nurina Cave Spider 
166. Tartarus thampannensis Thampanna Cave Spider 
167. Teyl sp. (BY Main 1953/2683, 

1984/13) 
Minnivale Trapdoor Spider 

168. Troglodiplura lowryi  Nullarbor Cave 
Trapdoor Spider 

Division 8 — Crustaceans 
 Scientific name Common name 
169. Abelaioscia troglodytes Pannikin Plains Cave Isopod 
170. Bogidomma australis Barrow Island Bogidomma 
171. Bunderia misophaga  
172. Cherax tenuimanus  Margaret River Marron 
173. Danielopolina kornickeri  
174. Engaewa pseudoreducta  Margaret River Burrowing 

Crayfish 
175. Engaewa reducta  Dunsborough Burrowing 

Crayfish 
176. Engaewa walpolea  Walpole Burrowing Crayfish 
177. Hurleya sp. (WAM 642-97) Crystal Cave Crangonyctoid 
178. Lasionectes exleyi Cape Range Lasionectes 
179. Liagoceradocus branchialis Cape Range Liagoceradocus 
180. Liagoceradocus subthalassicus Barrow Island Liagoceradocus 
181. Nedsia fragilis  
182. Nedsia humphreysi  
183. Nedsia hurlberti  
184. Nedsia macrosculptilis  
185. Nedsia sculptilis  
186. Nedsia straskraba  
187. Nedsia urifimbriata  
188. Speleophria bunderae  
189. Stygiocaris lancifera Lance-Beaked Cave Shrimp 
190. Stygiocylopia australis  



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2167 

 

Division 9 — Polychaete 
 Scientific name Common name 
191. Prionospia thalanji  

Division 10 — Millipedes 
 Scientific name Common name 
192. Cynotelopus notabilis Western Australian Pill 

Millipede 
193. Speleostrophus nesiotes Barrow Island Millipede 
194. Stygiochiropus isolatus  
195. Stygiochiropus peculiaris Cameron’s Cave Millipede 
196. Stygiochiropus sympatricus  

Division 11 — Native bees 
 Scientific Name Common name 
197. Leioproctus douglasiellus  
198. Neopasiphe simplicior  

Division 12 — Moth 
 Scientific name Common name 
199. Synemon gratiosa  Graceful Sun Moth 

Schedule 2 — Fauna presumed to be extinct 
[cl. 3(b)] 

Division 1 — Mammals 
 Scientific Name Common name 
1.  Bettongia pusilla Dwarf Nullarbor Bettong  
2.  Chaeropus ecaudatus Pig-footed Bandicoot or 

Kantjilpa 
3.  Lagorchestes asomatus Central Hare-wallaby or 

Kuluwarri 
4.  Leporillus apicalis Lesser Stick-nest Rat 
5.  Macrotis leucura Lesser Bilby or Tjunpi 
6.  Notomys amplus Short-tailed Hopping Mouse or 

Yoontoo 
7.  Notomys longicaudatus Long-tailed Hopping-mouse 
8.  Notomys macrotis Big-eared Hopping-mouse 
9.  Onychogalea lunata Crescent Nailtail Wallaby or 

Tjawalpa 
10.  Perameles eremiana Desert Bandicoot or Walilya 
11.  Potorous platyops Broad-faced Potoroo 

Division 2 — Birds 
 Scientific name Common name 
12.  Dasyornis broadbenti litoralis Rufous Bristlebird 
13.  Rallus pectoralis clelandi Lewin’s Water Rail 

Division 3 — Snails 
 Scientific name Common name 
14.  Bothriembryon praecelsus  
15.  Bothriembryon whitleyi  
16.  Helicarion castanea  
17.  Occirhenea georgiana  



2168 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Division 4 — Native bees 
 Scientific name Common name 
18.  Hesperocolletes douglasi a Short-tongued Native Bee 

 
Schedule 3 — Birds protected under an 

international agreement 
[cl. 3(c)] 

 Scientific Name Common name 
1.  Amytornis dorotheae Carpentarian Grass-wren 
2.  Buteo buteo oshiroi Daito Island Buzzard 
3.  Chalcophaps indica 

yamashinai 
Emerald Dove 

4.  Cyanoramphus novaezelandiae 
cookii 

Norfolk Island Parrot 

5.  Cyclopsitta diopthalma coxeni Coxen’s Fig Parrot 
6.  Drymodes superciliaris 

colcloughi 
Northern Scrub-robin 

7.  Fregata andrewsi Christmas Island Frigate-bird 
8.  Haliaeetus albicilla albicilla White-tailed Sea Eagle 
9.  Lichenostomus melanops 

cassidix 
Helmeted Honeyeater 

10.  Lunda cirrhata Tufted Puffin 
11.  Manorina flavigula melanotis Black-eared Miner 
12.  Neophema chrysogaster Orange-bellied Parrot 
13.  Ninox novaeseelandiae rayana Norfolk Island Boobook Owl 
14.  Ninox squamipila natalis Christmas Island Owl 
15.  Pardalotus quadragintus Forty-spotted Pardalote 
16.  Pedionomas torquatus Plains Wanderer 
17.  Phalacrocorax urile Red-faced Cormorant 
18.  Pitta brachyura nympha Fairy Pitta 
19.  Podargus ocellatus plumiferus Plumed Frogmouth 
20.  Psephotus chrysopterygius Golden-shouldered Parrot 
21.  Psephotus dissimilis Hooded Parrot 
22.  Psephotus pulcherrimus Paradise Parrot 
23.  Pterodroma leucoptera 

leucoptera 
Gould’s Petrel 

24.  Pterodroma solandri Providence Petrel 
25.  Scolopax mira Amami Woodcock 
26.  Strepera graculina crissalis Lord Howe Island Currawong 
27.  Sula abbotti Abbot’s Booby 
28.  Tricholimnas sylvestris Lord Howe Island Woodhen 
29.  Uria aalge inornata Common Murre, Guillemot 
30.  Zosterops albogularis Norfolk Island Silvereye 

 
Schedule 4 — Other specially protected fauna 

[cl. 3(d)] 

Division 1 — Mammals 
 Scientific Name Common name 
1.  Arctocephalus forsteri New Zealand Fur-seal 
2.  Dugong dugon Dugong 
3.  Neophoca cinerea Australian Sealion 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2169 

 

Division 2 — Birds 
 Scientific name Common name 
4.  Cacatua leadbeateri Pink or Major Mitchell’s 

Cockatoo 
5.  Falco peregrinus Peregrine Falcon 
6.  Northiella haematogaster 

narethae 
Naretha Blue Bonnet 

7.  Tadorna radjah Burdekin Duck or 
Radjah Shelduck 

Division 3 — Reptiles 
 Scientific name Common name 
8.  Aspidites ramsayi Woma or Ramsay’s Python 
9.  Crocodylus johnstoni Australian Freshwater 

Crocodile 
10.  Crocodylus porosus Saltwater Crocodile 
11.  Morelia spilota imbricata  Carpet Python 

MARK McGOWAN, Minister for the Environment. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

CO302* 

Wildlife Conservation Act 1950 

Wildlife Conservation (Rare Flora) Notice 2006 

Made by the Minister for the Environment under section 23F(2) of 
the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This notice is the Wildlife Conservation (Rare Flora) 
Notice 2006. 

2. Interpretation 

  In this notice —  

 “extant” means known to be living in a wild state; 

 “protected flora” means any flora belonging to the classes of 
flora declared by the Minister under section 6 of the Act to 
be protected flora by notice published in the Gazette 
9 October 1987, at p. 3855; 

 “taxon” includes any taxon that is described by a genus name 
and any other name or description. 

 Note: The plural form of “taxon” is “taxa”. 



2170 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

3. Rare flora 

  Subject to clause 4, protected flora —  

 (a) specified in Schedule 1, being taxa that are extant and 
considered likely to become extinct or rare and therefore 
in need of special protection; and 

 (b) specified in Schedule 2, being taxa that are presumed to 
be extinct in the wild and therefore in need of special 
protection, 

  are declared to be rare flora for the purposes of section 23F of 
the Act throughout the State. 

4. Application 

  Clause 3 does not apply to those plants of a taxon of protected 
flora specified in Schedule 1 or 2 that have been planted for any 
purpose other than such plants that have been planted for the 
purpose of conservation of that taxon and in accordance with 
approval given by the Executive Director. 

5. Revocation 

  The Wildlife Conservation (Rare Flora) Notice 2005 is revoked. 

Schedule 1 — Extant taxa 
[cl. 3(a)] 

Division 1 — Spermatophyta (flowering plants, conifers and cycads) 
1.  Acacia anomala 
2.  Acacia aphylla 
3.  Acacia aprica 
4.  Acacia aristulata 
5.  Acacia ataxiphylla 

subsp. magna 
6.  Acacia auratiflora 
7.  Acacia awestoniana 
8.  Acacia brachypoda 
9.  Acacia chapmanii 

subsp. australis 
10.  Acacia cochlocarpa 

subsp. cochlocarpa 
11.  Acacia cochlocarpa 

subsp. velutinosa 
12.  Acacia denticulosa 
13.  Acacia depressa 
14.  Acacia forrestiana 
15.  Acacia imitans 
16.  Acacia insolita 

subsp. recurva 
17.  Acacia lanuginophylla 
18.  Acacia leptalea 
19.  Acacia lobulata 
20.  Acacia pharangites 
21.  Acacia pygmaea  

22. Acacia recurvata 
23. Acacia rhamphophylla 
24. Acacia sciophanes  
25. Acacia splendens 
26. Acacia subflexuosa 

subsp. capillata 
27. Acacia trulliformis 
28. Acacia unguicula 
29. Acacia vassalii  
30. Acacia volubilis 
31. Acacia wilsonii 
32. Adenanthos dobagii  
33. Adenanthos ellipticus  
34. Adenanthos eyrei  
35. Adenanthos pungens 

subsp. effusus 
36. Adenanthos pungens 

subsp. pungens 
37. Adenanthos velutinus  
38. Allocasuarina fibrosa  
39. Allocasuarina tortiramula  
40. Andersonia annelsii 
41. Andersonia axilliflora  
42. Andersonia gracilis 
43. Andersonia pinaster ms 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2171 

 

44.  Anigozanthos bicolor 
subsp. minor  

45.  Anigozanthos viridis 
subsp. terraspectans  

46.  Anthocercis gracilis 
47.  Apium prostratum 

subsp. phillipii ms 
48.  Asterolasia nivea 
49.  Banksia brownii 
50.  Banksia cuneata 
51.  Banksia goodii 
52.  Banksia oligantha 
53.  Banksia sphaerocarpa 

var. dolichostyla 
54.  Banksia verticillata 
55.  Beyeria lepidopetala 
56.  Beyeria sp. Bandalup Hill 

(G. Cockerton 7553) 
57.  Boronia adamsiana 
58.  Boronia capitata 

subsp. capitata 
59.  Boronia clavata 
60.  Boronia exilis 
61.  Boronia revoluta 
62.  Brachyscias verecundus 
63.  Caladenia barbarella 
64.  Caladenia bryceana 

subsp. bryceana 
65.  Caladenia bryceana 

subsp. cracens 
66.  Caladenia busselliana 
67.  Caladenia caesarea 

subsp. maritima 
68.  Caladenia christineae 
69.  Caladenia dorrienii 
70.  Caladenia drakeoides 
71.  Caladenia elegans 
72.  Caladenia excelsa 
73.  Caladenia harringtoniae 
74.  Caladenia graniticola 
75.  Caladenia hoffmanii 
76.  Caladenia huegelii 
77.  Caladenia melanema 
78.  Caladenia procera 
79.  Caladenia viridescens 
80.  Caladenia wanosa 
81.  Caladenia williamsiae 
82.  Caladenia winfieldii 
83.  Calectasia cyanea 
84.  Calectasia pignattiana 
85.  Calothamnus accedens 
86.  Calytrix breviseta 

subsp. breviseta 
87.  Chamelaucium griffinii ms 
88.  Chamelaucium lullfitzii ms 
89.  Chamelaucium roycei ms 

90. Chamelaucium sp. Hamersley 
(N. McQuoid 379) 

91. Chordifex abortivus 
92. Chorizema humile 
93. Chorizema varium 
94. Conospermum densiflorum 

subsp. unicephalatum 
95. Conospermum toddii 
96. Conospermum undulatum 
97. Conostylis dielsii subsp. teres 
98. Conostylis drummondii 
99. Conostylis lepidospermoides 
100. Conostylis micrantha 
101. Conostylis misera 
102. Conostylis rogeri 
103. Conostylis seorsiflora 

subsp. trichophylla 
104. Conostylis setigera 

subsp. dasys 
105. Conostylis wonganensis 
106. Coopernookia georgei 
107. Cyphanthera odgersii 

subsp. occidentalis 
108. Darwinia acerosa 
109. Darwinia apiculata 
110. Darwinia carnea 
111. Darwinia chapmaniana ms 
112. Darwinia collina 
113. Darwinia ferricola ms 
114. Darwinia foetida ms  
115. Darwinia masonii 
116. Darwinia meeboldii 
117. Darwinia oxylepis 
118. Darwinia squarrosa 
119. Darwinia wittwerorum 
120. Darwinia sp. Carnamah 

(J. Coleby-Williams 148) 
121. Darwinia sp. Stirling Range 

(G.J. Keighery 5732) 
122. Darwinia sp. Williamson 

(G.J. Keighery 12717) 
123. Daviesia bursarioides 
124. Daviesia cunderdin 
125. Daviesia dielsii 
126. Daviesia elongata 

subsp. elongata 
127. Daviesia euphorbioides 
128. Daviesia glossosema 
129. Daviesia megacalyx 
130. Daviesia microcarpa 
131. Daviesia obovata 
132. Daviesia pseudaphylla 
133. Daviesia speciosa 
134. Deyeuxia drummondii 
135. Diuris drummondii 
136. Diuris micrantha 
137. Diuris purdiei 



2172 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

138. Drakaea concolor ms 
139. Drakaea confluens ms 
140. Drakaea elastica 
141. Drakaea isolata ms 
142. Drakaea micrantha ms 
143. Drummondita ericoides 
144. Drummondita longifolia 
145. Dryandra anatona 
146. Dryandra aurantia 
147. Dryandra fuscobractea 
148. Dryandra ionthocarpa 

subsp. chrysophoenix 
149. Dryandra ionthocarpa 

subsp. ionthocarpa 
150. Dryandra mimica 
151. Dryandra montana 
152. Dryandra mucronulata 

subsp. retrorsa 
153. Dryandra nivea 

subsp. uliginosa 
154. Dryandra pseudoplumosa 
155. Dryandra serratuloides 

subsp. perissa 
156. Dryandra serratuloides 

subsp. serratuloides 
157. Dryandra squarrosa 

subsp. argillacea 
158. Eleocharis keigheryi 
159. Epiblema grandiflorum 

var. cyaneum ms 
160. Eremophila ciliata ms 
161. Eremophila denticulata 

subsp. denticulata 
162. Eremophila denticulata 

subsp. trisulcata ms 
163. Eremophila koobabbiensis ms 
164. Eremophila lactea 
165. Eremophila nivea 
166. Eremophila pinnatifida ms 
167. Eremophila resinosa 
168. Eremophila rostrata ms 
169. Eremophila scaberula 
170. Eremophila subteretifolia ms 
171. Eremophila ternifolia 
172. Eremophila vernicosa ms 
173. Eremophila verticillata 
174. Eremophila virens 
175. Eremophila viscida 
176. Eucalyptus absita 
177. Eucalyptus argutifolia 
178. Eucalyptus articulata 
179. Eucalyptus balanites 
180. Eucalyptus beardiana 
181. Eucalyptus blaxellii 
182. Eucalyptus brevipes 
183. Eucalyptus burdettiana 
184. Eucalyptus ceracea 

185. Eucalyptus coronata 
186. Eucalyptus crispata 
187. Eucalyptus crucis 

subsp. crucis 
188. Eucalyptus crucis 

subsp. praecipua 
189. Eucalyptus cuprea 
190. Eucalyptus dolorosa 
191. Eucalyptus impensa 
192. Eucalyptus insularis 
193. Eucalyptus johnsoniana 
194. Eucalyptus lateritica 
195. Eucalyptus leprophloia 
196. Eucalyptus merrickiae 
197. Eucalyptus mooreana 
198. Eucalyptus phylacis 
199. Eucalyptus platydisca ms 
200. Eucalyptus pruiniramis 
201. Eucalyptus purpurata 
202. Eucalyptus recta 
203. Eucalyptus rhodantha 

var. rhodantha 
204. Eucalyptus steedmanii 
205. Eucalyptus suberea 
206. Eucalyptus synandra 
207. Frankenia conferta 
208. Frankenia parvula 
209. Gastrolobium appressum 
210. Gastrolobium diabolophyllum 
211. Gastrolobium glaucum 
212. Gastrolobium graniticum 
213. Gastrolobium hamulosum 
214. Gastrolobium lehmannii 
215. Gastrolobium luteifolium 
216. Gastrolobium modestum 
217. Gastrolobium papilio 
218. Glyceria drummondii 
219. Goodenia integerrima 
220. Grevillea althoferorum 
221. Grevillea batrachioides 
222. Grevillea brachystylis 

subsp. australis 
223. Grevillea brachystylis 

subsp. Busselton (G.J. 
Keighery s.n. 28/8/1985) 

224. Grevillea bracteosa 
225. Grevillea calliantha 
226. Grevillea christineae 
227. Grevillea curviloba 

subsp. curviloba 
228. Grevillea curviloba 

subsp. incurva 
229. Grevillea dryandroides 

subsp. dryandroides 
230. Grevillea dryandroides 

subsp. hirsuta 
231. Grevillea elongata 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2173 

 

232. Grevillea flexuosa 
233. Grevillea humifusa 
234. Grevillea infundibularis 
235. Grevillea involucrata 
236. Grevillea maccutcheonii 
237. Grevillea maxwellii 
238. Grevillea murex 
239. Grevillea phanerophlebia 
240. Grevillea pythara 
241. Grevillea rara 
242. Grevillea scapigera 
243. Guichenotia seorsiflora ms 
244. Gyrostemon reticulatus 
245. Hakea aculeata 
246. Hakea megalosperma 
247. Haloragis platycarpa 
248. Halosarcia bulbosa 
249. Hemiandra gardneri 
250. Hemiandra rutilans 
251. Hemigenia ramosissima 
252. Hensmania chapmanii 
253. Hibbertia priceana ms 
254. Hybanthus cymulosus 
255. Hydatella dioica 
256. Hydatella leptogyne 
257. Hypocalymma angustifolium 

subsp. longifolium 
258. Isopogon robustus 
259. Isopogon uncinatus 
260. Jacksonia pungens ms 
261. Jacksonia quairading ms 
262. Jacksonia velveta ms 
263. Kennedia glabrata 
264. Kennedia macrophylla 
265. Keraudrenia exastia 
266. Kunzea similes 
267. Lambertia echinata 

subsp. echinata 
268. Lambertia echinata 

subsp. occidentalis 
269. Lambertia fairallii 
270. Lambertia orbifolia 

subsp. orbifolia ms 
271. Lambertia orbifolia 

subsp. Scott River Plains 
(L.W. Sage 684) 

272. Lasiopetalum 
pterocarpum ms 

273. Lasiopetalum rotundifolium 
274. Lechenaultia chlorantha 
275. Lechenaultia laricina 
276. Lepidium aschersonii 
277. Lepidium catapycnon 
278. Lepidosperma rostratum 
279. Leucopogon gnaphalioides 
280. Leucopogon marginatus 
281. Leucopogon obtectus 

282. Leucopogon sp. Helena 
and Aurora Range 
(B.J. Lepschi 2077) 

283. Lysiosepalum abollatum 
284. Macarthuria keigheryi 
285. Marianthus mollis 
286. Marianthus paralius 
287. Melaleuca sciotostyla 
288. Meziella trifida 
289. Microcorys eremophiloides 
290. Microtis globula 
291. Muehlenbeckia horrida 

subsp. abdita 
292. Muelleranthus crenulatus 
293. Myoporum cordifolium 
294. Myoporum turbinatum 
295. Myriophyllum lapidicola 
296. Orthrosanthus muelleri 
297. Pandanus spiralis 

var. flammeus 
298. Paracaleana dixonii ms 
299. Patersonia spirafolia 
300. Persoonia micranthera 
301. Petrophile latericola ms 
302. Philotheca basistyla 
303. Philotheca wonganensis 
304. Pityrodia augustensis 
305. Pityrodia axillaris 
306. Pityrodia scabra 
307. Pterostylis sp. Northampton 

(S.D. Hopper 3349) 
308. Ptilotus fasciculatus 
309. Ptychosema pusillum 
310. Pultenaea pauciflora 
311. Rhagodia acicularis 
312. Rhizanthella gardneri 
313. Ricinocarpus brevis ms 
314. Ricinocarpos trichophorus 
315. Roycea pycnophylloides 
316. Rulingia sp. Trigwell Bridge 

(R. Smith s.n. 20.6.89) 
317. Scaevola macrophylla 
318. Schoenia filifolia 

subsp. subulifolia 
319. Sphenotoma drummondii 
320. Spirogardnera rubescens 
321. Stachystemon nematophorus 
322. Stachystemon vinosus 
323. Stawellia dimorphantha 
324. Stylidium amabile 
325. Stylidium coroniforme subsp. 

coroniforme 
326. Stylidium galioides 
327. Stylidium merrallii 
328. Stylidium semaphorum 
329. Symonanthus bancroftii 
330. Synaphea quartzitica 



2174 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

331. Synaphea stenoloba 
332. Synaphea sp. Fairbridge Farm 

(D. Papenfus 696) 
333. Synaphea sp. Pinjarra 

(R. Davis 6578) 
334. Tetraria australiensis 
335. Tetratheca aphylla 
336. Tetratheca deltoidea 
337. Tetratheca erubescens ms 
338. Tetratheca harperi 
339. Tetratheca nephelioides ms  
340. Tetratheca paynterae subsp. 

cremnobata ms 
341. Tetratheca paynterae subsp. 

paynterae 
342. Thelymitra dedmaniarum  
343. Thelymitra psammophila 
344. Thelymitra stellata 
345. Thomasia glabripetala 
346. Thomasia montana 
347. Thomasia sp. Green Hill 

(S. Paust 1322) 
348. Thryptomene wittweri 
349. Tribonanthes purpurea 
350. Verticordia albida 
351. Verticordia apecta 
352. Verticordia carinata 
353. Verticordia crebra 

354. Verticordia densiflora 
var. pedunculata 

355. Verticordia fimbrilepis 
subsp. australis 

356. Verticordia fimbrilepis 
subsp. fimbrilepis 

357. Verticordia helichrysantha 
358. Verticordia hughanii 
359. Verticordia pityrhops 
360. Verticordia plumosa 

var. ananeotes 
361. Verticordia plumosa 

var. pleiobotrya 
362. Verticordia plumosa 

var. vassensis 
363. Verticordia spicata 

subsp. squamosa 
364. Verticordia staminosa 

subsp. cylindracea 
var. cylindracea 

365. Verticordia staminosa 
subsp. cylindracea 
var. erecta 

366. Verticordia staminosa 
subsp. staminosa 

367. Villarsia calthifolia 
368. Wurmbea calcicola 
369. Wurmbea tubulosa 
370. Xyris exilis 

Division 2 — Pteridophyta (ferns and fern allies) 
371. Asplenium obtusatum subsp. northlandicum 

Division 3 — Bryophyta (mosses and liverworts) 
372. Rhacocarpus rehmannianus var. webbianus 

Schedule 2 — Taxa presumed to be extinct 
[cl. 3(b)] 

Spermatophyta (flowering plants, conifers and cycads) 

1  Acacia kingiana 
2  Acacia prismifolia 
3  Coleanthera virgata 
4  Frankenia decurrens 
5  Lepidium drummondii 
6  Leptomeria dielsiana 
7  Leucopogon cryptanthus 
8  Opercularia acolytantha 
9  Philotheca falcata 
10  Ptilotus caespitulosus 
11  Ptilotus pyramidatus 
12  Taraxacum cygnorum 
13  Tetratheca fasciculata 
14  Thomasia gardneri 

MARK McGOWAN, Minister for the Environment. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2175 

 

JUSTICE 

JU301* 

Civil Judgments Enforcement Act 2004 

Civil Judgments Enforcement Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Civil Judgments Enforcement 
Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Civil Judgments 
Enforcement Regulations 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 28 April 2005, p. 1483-559. 
  For amendments to 25 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 52.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this subregulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2, and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 53.00 55.50 

1 79.00 83.00 

1 86.00 90.50 

1 129.00 135.50 

2 (both places) 65.00 68.50 

2 (both places) 87.00 91.50 



2176 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

 (2) After Schedule 1 item 1 note 4 the following note is inserted —  

“     
Note 5: 
The fee payable on an application relating to an order made in the exercise of the 
jurisdiction referred to in the Residential Tenancies Act 1987 section 12A is the fee 
payable on an application in relation to a judgment not exceeding $7 500. 

    ”. 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this subregulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2, and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1(a) 27.00 28.50 

1(b) 37.50 39.50 

1(c) 19.00 20.00 

2 69.00 72.50 

3 69.00 72.50 

4 36.50 38.50 

6(a) 0.95 1.00 

6(b) 1.05 1.10 

7 128.50 135.00 

8 58.00 61.00 

 (2) Schedule 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 6 note 2 by deleting “a bailiff an additional fee 
for travel outside the metropolitan area” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    an enforcement officer an additional fee for travel    ”; 

 (b) in item 10 note 1 by deleting “$189.00.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $198.50.    ”; 

 (c) in item 13 by deleting “a bailiff, assistant bailiff or other 
person employed or engaged by a bailiff ” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    an enforcement officer    ”; 

 (d) by deleting item 16(a); 

 (e) in item 16(b) by deleting “a bailiff or assistant bailiff ” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    an enforcement officer    ”. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2177 

 

 (3) Schedule 2 item 11 and notes 1 and 2 after it and item 12 are 
deleted and the following is inserted instead —  

“     
11. On the execution of an arrest warrant of 

any kind —  
 

 (a) for arresting the person ………..…… 72.50 

 (b) for conveying the person to a court 
or a custodial place and releasing the 
person from arrest or custody ....…… 

 
 

72.50 

 (c) for each 30 minutes after 2 hours and 
30 minutes that an enforcement 
officer is required to keep the person 
in custody until he or she is 
conveyed to a court or a custodial 
place ..……………………………… 

 
 
 
 
 

19.25 
Note 1: 
The fee under paragraph (a) is payable whether or not the Sheriff’s functions under the 
warrant are performed and includes up to 3 attempts to perform the functions at the same 
address. 

Note 2: 
The fee under paragraph (a) includes —  
(a) receipt of the warrant; and 
(b) attendances and inquiries before attempting arrest; and 
(c) giving any notice; and 
(d) making any report. 

12. For each half hour or part of a half hour that 
it is necessary for an enforcement officer to 
engage an assistant to perform a function —  

 

 (a) in relation to the execution of an arrest 
warrant; or 

 

 (b) in accordance with a property (seizure 
and delivery) order; or 

 

 (c) in accordance with a property (seizure 
and sale) order ………………………. 

 
19.25 

    ”. 

6. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2, and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 61.00 64.00 

2 25.00 26.00 

3, 6 and 10 58.00 61.00 

4 143.50 150.50 

5 174.50 183.00 

7, 8 and 12(b) 36.50 38.50 

9 123.50 129.50 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



2178 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

JU302* 

Magistrates Court Act 2004 

Magistrates Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Magistrates Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Magistrates 
Court (Fees) Regulations 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 28 April 2005, p. 1573-603.] 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

  Regulation 3 is amended by inserting in the appropriate 
alphabetical position —  

“     
 “enforcement officer” has the meaning given to that 

term in the Civil Judgments Enforcement Act 2004 
section 3; 

    ”. 

5. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

2 37.50 39.50 

3(a) 0.95 1.00 

3(b) 1.05 1.10 

4 (both places) 22.00 23.00 

4 and 6(b) 55.00 57.00 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2179 

 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

5(b)      31 500.00      33 075.00 

6(a) 33.00 34.00 

8(b) 10.50 11.00 

 (2) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 3 by deleting “Bailiff’s Office” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    enforcement officer’s office    ”; 

 (b) in the note to item 3 by deleting “a bailiff ” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    an enforcement officer    ”; 

 (c) in item 8 note 1 by deleting “$15.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $16.00    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 1 Division 2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 63.00 66.00 

1 95.00 100.00 

1 161.00 169.00 

1 242.00 254.00 

1 257.00 270.00 

1 386.00 405.00 

2 41.00 43.00 

2 62.00 64.50 

2 74.00 78.50 

2 97.00 102.00 

2 119.00 125.00 

2 154.00 161.50 

3 21.00 22.00 

3 42.00 44.00 

3 32.00 33.50 

3 64.00 67.00 

3 43.00 45.00 

3 86.00 90.00 

4 100.00 105.00 

4 150.00 157.50 

4 181.00 190.00 

4 271.00 285.00 

4 202.00 212.00 



2180 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

4 302.00 318.00 

5 and 6 58.00 61.00 

5 and 6 116.00 122.00 

5 and 6 101.00 106.00 

5 and 6 202.00 212.00 

5 and 6 145.00 152.00 

5 and 6 290.00 304.00 

7 and 8(a) 53.00 55.50 

7 and 8(a) 79.00 83.00 

7 and 8(a) 64.00 67.00 

7 and 8(a) 96.00 100.50 

7 and 8(a) 86.00 90.50 

7 and 8(a) 129.00 136.00 

10 161.00 169.00 

11 63.00 66.00 

 (4) After Schedule 1 Division 2 item 8 note 2 the following note is 
inserted —  

“     
NOTE 3 

If the parties agree on the bill of costs and the appointment is cancelled, the 
following percentage of the fee paid is to be refunded —  

(a) if the appointment is cancelled less than 3 days before the day of the 
appointment, nil; 

(b) if the appointment is cancelled 3 days or more and less than 10 days 
before the day of the appointment, 50%; 

(c) if the appointment is cancelled 10 or more days before the day of the 
appointment, 80%. 

    ”. 

 (5) Schedule 1 Division 2 item 9 and notes 1 and 2 after it are 
deleted and the following is inserted instead —  

“     
9. On the execution of an arrest warrant of any 

kind —  
 

 (a) for arresting the person ………………. 72.50 

 (b) for conveying the person to a court or a 
custodial place and releasing the person 
from arrest or custody ………………... 

 
 

72.50 

 (c) for each 30 minutes after 2 hours and 
30 minutes that an enforcement officer 
is required to keep the person in 
custody until he or she is conveyed to a 
court or a custodial place …………….. 

 
 
 
 

19.25 

NOTE 1 

The fee under paragraph (a) is payable whether or not the Sheriff’s functions 
under the warrant are performed and includes up to 3 attempts to perform the 
functions at the same address. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2181 

 

NOTE 2 

The fee under paragraph (a) includes —  

(a) receipt of the warrant; and 

(b) attendances and inquiries before attempting arrest; and 

(c) giving any notice; and 

(d) making any report. 

    ”. 

 (6) Schedule 1 Division 3 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1 and 3(a) 53.00 55.50 

2 10.00 10.50 

3(b) 69.00 72.50 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 
JU303* 

Children’s Court of Western Australia Act 1988 

Children’s Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Children’s Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 



2182 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Children’s 
Court (Fees) Regulations 2005*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 28 April 2005, p. 1415-33. 
  For amendments to 25 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 51.] 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

  Regulation 3 is amended by inserting in the appropriate 
alphabetical position —  

“     
 “enforcement officer” has the meaning given to that 

term in the Civil Judgments Enforcement Act 2004 
section 3; 

    ”. 

5. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

2 37.50 39.50 

3(a) 0.95 1.00 

3(b) 1.05 1.10 

4 (both places) 22.00 23.00 

4 55.00 57.00 

5(a) 33.00 34.00 

5(b) 55.00 57.00 

7(b) 10.50 11.00 

 (2) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 3 by deleting “Bailiff’s Office” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    enforcement officer’s office    ”; 

 (b) in the note to item 3 by deleting “a bailiff ” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    an enforcement officer    ”; 

 (c) in note 1 to item 7 by deleting “$15.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $16.00    ”. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2183 

 

 (3) Schedule 1 Division 2 items 1 and 2 and notes 1 and 2 after 
item 2 are deleted and the following is inserted instead —  

“     
1. On filing an application for a misconduct 

restraining order under the Restraining 
Orders Act 1997 ….……………………. 

 
 

66.00 

2. On the execution of an arrest warrant of 
any kind —  

 

 (a) for arresting the person …………... 72.50 

 (b) for conveying the person to a court 
or a custodial place and releasing 
the person from arrest or custody ... 

 
 

72.50 

 (c) for each 30 minutes after 2 hours 
and 30 minutes that an enforcement 
officer is required to keep the 
person in custody until the person 
is conveyed to a court or a 
custodial place …………………… 

 
 
 
 
 

19.25 

NOTE 1 

The fee under paragraph (a) is payable whether or not the Sheriff’s 
functions under the warrant are performed and includes up to 3 attempts 
to perform the functions at the same address. 

NOTE 2 

The fee under paragraph (a) includes —  

(a) receipt of the warrant; and 

(b) attendances and inquiries before attempting arrest; and 

(c) giving any notice; and 

(d) making any report. 
    ”. 

 (4) Schedule 1 Division 2 item 3 is amended by deleting “161.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    169.00    ”. 

 (5) Schedule 1 Division 3 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in items 1 and 3(a) by deleting “53.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    55.50    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “10.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    10.50    ”; 

 (c) in item 3(b) by deleting “69.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    72.50    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 



2184 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

JU304* 

Supreme Court Act 1935 

Supreme Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Supreme Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Supreme Court 
(Fees) Regulations 2002*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 27 December 2001, p. 6583-616. 
  For amendments to 25 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 406.] 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

  Regulation 3 is amended by inserting in the appropriate 
alphabetical position —  

“     
 “enforcement officer” has the meaning given to that 

term in the Civil Judgments Enforcement Act 2004 
section 3; 

    ”. 

5. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 Division 1 item 4 is deleted. 

 (2) After Schedule 1 Division 1 item 10 note (2) the following note 
is inserted —  

“     
(3) If the parties agree on the bill of costs in a cause or 

matter or under the Legal Practice Act 2003 or the 
Commercial Arbitration Act 1985 and the appointment 
is cancelled, the following percentage of the fee paid is 
to be refunded —  

(a) if the appointment is cancelled less than 3 days 
before the day of the appointment, nil; 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2185 

 

(b) if the appointment is cancelled 3 days or more 
and less than 10 days before the day of the 
appointment, 50%; 

(c) if the appointment is cancelled 10 or more days 
before the day of the appointment, 80%. 

    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1, 2(a) and (b), 5 654.00 681.00 

1, 2(a) and (b), 5 981.00 1 022.00 

2(c) and (d) 218.00 228.00 

2(c) and (d) 327.00 342.00 

3 436.00 456.00 

3 654.00 684.00 

6 and 7 436.00 456.00 

6 and 7 872.00 912.00 

8 153.00 160.00 

8 229.00 239.00 

10(a) 153.00 160.00 

10(a) 229.00 239.00 

11 (both places) 22.00 23.00 

12(a) (both places) 33.00 34.00 

12(b) (both places) 55.00 57.00 

13(d) and (e) 
(4 places) 

 
44.00 

 
46.00 

13A(b) (both 
places) 

 
10.50 

 
11.00 

14 218.00 228.00 

 (4) Schedule 1 Division 2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1 109.00 114.00 

1 218.00 228.00 

2 1 635.00 1 710.00 

2 3 270.00 3 420.00 

3 218.00 228.00 

3 327.00 342.00 

4 153.00 160.00 



2186 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

4 229.00 239.00 

5 545.00 570.00 

5 818.00 855.00 

6 and 7 436.00 456.00 

6 and 7 872.00 912.00 

8 (both places) 22.00 23.00 

9(d) (both places) 44.00 46.00 

10(b) (both places) 10.50 11.00 

6. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 item 1 and notes 1 and 2 after it are deleted and the 
following is inserted instead —  

“     
1. On the execution of an arrest warrant 

of any kind —  
 

 (a) for arresting the person ……..…. 72.50 

 (b) for conveying the person to a 
court or a custodial place and 
releasing the person from arrest 
or custody ..….…………………. 

 
 
 

72.50 

 (c) for each 30 minutes after 2 hours 
and 30 minutes that an 
enforcement officer is required to 
keep the person in custody until 
he or she is conveyed to a court 
or a custodial place .……………. 

 
 
 
 
 

19.25 

NOTE 1: 

The fee under paragraph (a) is payable whether or not the 
Sheriff’s functions under the warrant are performed and 
includes up to 3 attempts to perform the functions at the same 
address. 

NOTE 2: 

The fee under paragraph (a) includes —  

(a) receipt of the warrant; and 

(b) attendances and inquiries before attempting arrest; and 

(c) giving any notice; and 

(d) making any report. 
    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this subregulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2, and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

2 37.50 39.50 

3(a) 0.95 1.00 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2187 

 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

3(b) 1.05 1.10 

4 36.50 38.50 

7. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2, and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 

1(a) 136.00 142.00 

1(b) 272.00 284.00 

1(c) 544.00 568.00 

2 44.00 46.00 

4 54.50 57.00 

5 22.00 23.00 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 
JU305* 

District Court of Western Australia Act 1969 

District Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the District Court (Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 



2188 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the District Court 
(Fees) Regulations 2002*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 27 December 2001, p. 6617-43. 
  For amendments to 25 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 91-2.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 item 4 is deleted. 

 (2) After Schedule 1 item 10 note 2 the following note is 
inserted —  

“     
NOTE 3: 
If the parties agree on the bill of costs in a cause or matter or 
under the Commercial Arbitration Act 1985 and the 
appointment is cancelled, the following percentage of the fee 
paid is to be refunded —  
(a) if the appointment is cancelled less than 3 days before the 

day of the appointment, nil; 
(b) if the appointment is cancelled 3 days or more and less 

than 10 days before the day of the appointment, 50%; 
(c) if the appointment is cancelled 10 or more days before 

the day of the appointment, 80%. 
    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 1 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this subregulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2, and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1, 2(a) and (b), 5 436 454 

1, 2(a) and (b), 5 654 681 

2(c) and (d) 164 171 

2(c) and (d) 218 227 

3 54.50 57 

3 109 114 

6 and 7 382 399 

6 and 7 763 798 

8 and 10(a) 109 114 

8 and 10(a) 164 171 

11 (both places) 22 23 

11A(b) (both places) 1 000 1 042 

12(a) (both places) 33 34 

12(b) (both places) 55 57 

13(d) (both places) 44 46 

14(b) (both places) 10.50 11 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2189 

 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 item 1 and notes 1 and 2 after it are deleted and the 
following is inserted instead — 

“     
1. On the execution of an arrest warrant of 

any kind —  
 

 (a) for arresting the person ……….…… 72.50 

 (b) for conveying the person to a court 
or a custodial place and releasing the 
person from arrest or custody …..…. 

 
 

72.50 

 (c) for each 30 minutes after 2 hours 
and 30 minutes that an enforcement 
officer, as defined in the Civil 
Judgments Enforcement Act 2004 
section 3, is required to keep the 
person in custody until he or she is 
conveyed to a court or a custodial 
place …………………………….… 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

19.25 
NOTE 1: 
The fee under paragraph (a) is payable whether or not the Sheriff’s 
functions under the warrant are performed and includes up to 
3 attempts to perform the functions at the same address. 
NOTE 2: 
The fee under paragraph (a) includes —  
(a) receipt of the warrant; and 
(b) attendances and inquiries before attempting arrest; and 
(c) giving any notice; and 
(d) making any report. 

    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 2 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this subregulation by deleting the figure set out in 
column 2, and inserting instead the figure set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

2 37.50 39.50 

3(a) 0.95 1.00 

3(b) 1.05 1.10 

4 36.50 38.50 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 



2190 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

JU306* 

Evidence Act 1906 

Evidence (Video and Audio Links Fees and 
Expenses) Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Evidence (Video and Audio Links Fees 
and Expenses) Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Evidence (Video 
and Audio Links Fees and Expenses) Regulations 1999*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 6 August 2004. 
  For amendments to 22 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 116.] 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended in each item listed in column 1 of the 
Table to this regulation by deleting the amount set out in 
column 2, and inserting instead the amount set out in column 3 
opposite that item. 

Table 

Column 1 
Item 

Column 2 
Delete 

Column 3 
Insert instead 

1(1) $59.00 $61.50 

1(2) $88.00 $91.50 

2 $47.00 $49.00 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2191 

 

JU307* 

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices Enforcement Act 1994 

Fines, Penalties and Infringement Notices 
Enforcement Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Fines, Penalties and Infringement 
Notices Enforcement Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Fines, Penalties 
and Infringement Notices Enforcement Regulations 1994*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 9 July 2004. 
  For amendments to 26 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 127.] 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 Division 1 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 
1 $12.50 $13.00 
2 $10.50 $11.00 
3 $39.00 $41.00 
4 $26.00 $27.50 

 (2) Schedule 2 Division 2 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 
1 $26.00 $27.50 
2 $122.00 $128.00 



2192 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

 (3) Schedule 2 Division 3 is amended in each item listed in 
column 1 of the Table to this subregulation by deleting the 
figure set out in column 2, and inserting instead the figure set 
out in column 3 opposite that item. 

Table 
Column 1 

Item 
Column 2 

Delete 
Column 3 

Insert instead 
1 $55.00 $57.00 
3 $36.50 $38.50 
4 $39.00 $41.00 
5 $26.00 $27.50 
8 $128.50 $135.00 
10 $58.00 $61.00 
11 $128.50 $135.00 
12 $36.50 $19.25 

 (4) Schedule 2 Division 3 item 12 is amended by deleting “for each 
hour or part of an hour” and inserting instead —  

  “    for each half hour or part of a half hour    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 
Animal Welfare Act 2002 

Animal Welfare (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Animal Welfare (General) Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Animal Welfare 
(General) Regulations 2003*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 4 April 2003, p. 1077-96. 
  For amendments to 9 June 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 23.] 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2193 

 

3. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting item 4; 

 (b) after item 12 by inserting the following item — 

“     
12A. Model Code of Practice for the Welfare of Animals: Cattle 

(2nd Edition) 

 First published by the Primary Industries Ministerial 
Council in 2004 

    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MX301* 

Jetties Act 1926 

Jetties Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Jetties Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Jetties 
Regulations 1940*. 

 [* Reprint 5 as at 15 April 2005. 
  For amendments to 14 June 2006 see Legislation Information 

Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 220.] 



2194 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 Division 1 is amended by deleting each monetary 
amount specified in the first column of the Table to this 
subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$0.83 $0.87 

$127.50 $132.09 

$4.60 (2 places) $4.77 

$84.97 (2 places) $88.02 

$6.61 $6.85 

$21.29 $22.06 

 (2) Schedule 1 Division 2 Subdivision 1 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$42.58 $44.11 

$146.55 $151.83 

$46.37 $48.05 

$73.89 $76.56 

$91.44 $94.73 

$1.82 (2 places) $1.89 

$3.15 $3.26 

$2.55 $2.64 

$0.38 $0.40 

$3.00 (2 places) $3.11 

$7.77 $8.05 

$8.07 $8.36 

$2.50 $2.59 

$1.70 $1.75 

$2.88 $2.99 

$4.95 $5.13 

$11.34 $11.75 

 (3) Schedule 1 Division 2 Subdivision 2 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$23.71 (3 places) $24.56 

$11.86 $12.28 

$17.78 $18.43 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2195 

 

 (4) Schedule 1 Division 2 Subdivision 3 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$4.88 $5.06 
$10.99 $11.40 
$3.66 $3.79 

 (5) Schedule 1 Division 4 is amended by deleting “$7.77” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $8.05    ”. 

 (6) Schedule 1 Division 5 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$0.49” in both places where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $0.51    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$27.15” and inserting instead —  

  “    $28.13    ”. 

 (7) Schedule 1 Division 6 is amended by deleting each monetary 
amount specified in the first column of the Table to this 
subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$9.71 $10.06 
$11.07 $11.48 
$13.83 $14.32 

 (8) Schedule 1 Division 7 is amended by deleting each monetary 
amount specified in the first column of the Table to this 
subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$2.54 $2.63 
$23.47 $24.32 
$7.52 $7.79 
$2.50 $2.59 

 (9) Schedule 1 Division 8 Subdivision 1 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$3.55 $3.68 
$5.92 (2 places) $6.14 



2196 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Delete Insert 
$4.07 (2 places) $4.22 
$28.09 $29.11 
$7.03 (2 places) $7.28 

 (10) Schedule 1 Division 8 Subdivision 2 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$50.77 $52.60 

$101.54 $105.20 

$172.68 $178.89 

$201.46 $208.71 

$7.25 (2 places) $7.51 

$30.22 (2 places) $31.30 

$118.57 $122.84 

$168.37 $174.43 

$142.29 $147.41 

$207.50 $214.97 

$3.20 $3.32 

$5.51 $5.71 

$141.66 $146.76 

$228.38 $236.60 

$284.56 $294.80 

$427.45 $442.85 

$1 387.38 $1 437.32 

$2 745.45 $2 844.29 

$344.40 $356.80 

$104.52 $108.28 

$152.26 $157.74 

$127.73 $132.33 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 Division 1 Subdivision 1 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$41.51 $43.00 

$296.43 $307.10 

$5 335.75 $5 527.84 

$474.29 $491.36 

$4 150.00 $4 299.40 

$2 964.29 $3 071.01 

$59.29 $61.42 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2197 

 

 (2) Schedule 2 Division 1 Subdivision 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$56.21” and inserting instead —  

  “    $58.23    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$11.24” and inserting instead —  

  “    $11.65    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 2 Division 2 Subdivision 1 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$317.24 $328.66 

$344.74 $357.15 

$339.90 $352.14 

$367.40 $380.63 

$31.72 $32.87 

$34.47 $35.72 

$33.99 $35.21 

$36.74 $38.06 

$63.45 $65.73 

$68.95 $71.43 

$67.98 $70.43 

$73.48 $76.13 

$17.00 $17.60 

$150.00 (2 places) $155.00 

$18.38 $19.03 

$3.40 $3.52 

$30.00 $31.00 

$22.00 $22.79 

$86.26 $89.36 

 (4) Schedule 2 Division 2 Subdivision 2 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$505.90 $524.10 

$348.50 $361.05 

$314.78 $326.11 

$28.10 $29.12 

$140.50 $145.60 

$101.18 $104.82 

$69.70 $72.21 

$62.96 $65.22 

$50.59 $52.41 

$34.85 $36.10 



2198 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Delete Insert 

$31.48 $32.61 

$86.26 $89.36 

6. Schedule 4 amended 

 (1) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 2 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$214.95 $222.69 

$21.49 $22.27 

$42.99 $44.54 

$30.50 (2 places) $31.60 

$6.10 (2 places) $6.32 

$150.22 $155.63 

$172.20 $178.40 

$15.02 $15.56 

$17.22 $17.84 

$30.05 $31.13 

$34.44 $35.68 

$18.30 $18.95 

$3.66 $3.79 

$3.06 $3.17 

$24.43 $25.31 

$610.44 $632.63 

$122.13 $126.53 

$183.20 $189.80 

$32.35 $33.50 

 (2) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 3 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting each monetary amount specified in the first 
column of the Table to this paragraph and inserting 
instead the monetary amount specified opposite it in the 
second column of that Table; 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$247.81 $275.00 

$24.78 $27.50 

$49.56 $55.00 

$86.26 $89.36 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2199 

 

 (b) by deleting the items relating to “Weekly Fee”, “3 Day 
Fee” and “Daily Casual Fee” and inserting instead —  

“     
Weekly Fee 
Recreational vessel 
 
Commercial vessel 

 
$19.25/m x length of vessel, 
per week 
$27.50/m x length of vessel, 
per week 

3 Day Fee 
Recreational vessel 
 
Commercial vessel 

 
$7.70/m x length of vessel, 
per 3 day period 
$11.00/m x length of vessel, 
per 3 day period 

Daily Casual Fee 
Recreational vessel 
 
Commercial vessel 

 
$3.85/m x length of vessel, 
per day or part of a day 
$5.50/m x length of vessel, 
per day or part of a day 

    ”; 

 (c) by inserting after the item relating to “Live on 
Board Fee” —  

“     
Short Term Use Fee 
(for use of service 
jetty for loading, 
unloading or 
passenger transfer 
where mooring, 
berthage or pen fees 
not paid) 

 

Annual Fee $825.00 per vessel 

Daily Casual Fee $2.75/m x length of vessel, 
per day or part of a day 

    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 4 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$5.92 (5 places) $6.14 

$118.57 $122.84 

$237.14 $245.67 

$23.71 (2 places) $24.56 

$47.43 $49.13 

$29.60 $30.70 

$23.71 $24.56 

 (4) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 5 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 



2200 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$5.92 (4 places) $6.14 

$71.14 $73.70 

$2.97 $3.08 

$23.71 $24.56 

 (5) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 6 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$191.06 $197.94 

$19.11 $19.79 

$38.21 $39.59 

$17.85 $18.50 

$3.57 (2 places) $3.70 

$174.27 $180.55 

$17.43 $18.05 

$34.85 $36.10 

$17.85 $18.50 

$224.84 $232.93 

$22.48 $23.29 

$44.97 $46.59 

$33.75 $34.95 

$6.75 $6.99 

$23.74 $24.59 

$32.35 $33.50 

 (6) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 7 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$241.75 (2 places) $250.45 

$24.17 (2 places) $25.04 

$48.35 (2 places) $50.09 

$18.15 $18.80 

$3.63 $3.76 

$32.35 $33.50 

 (7) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 9 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2201 

 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$166.09 $172.07 

$183.20 $189.80 

$217.39 $225.21 

$16.61 $17.21 

$18.32 $18.98 

$21.74 $22.52 

$33.22 $34.41 

$36.64 $37.96 

$43.48 $45.04 

$30.50 $31.60 

$6.10 $6.32 

$112.35 $116.40 

$3.66 $3.79 

$28.09 $29.11 

 (8) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 10 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting each monetary amount specified in the first 
column of the Table to this paragraph and inserting 
instead the monetary amount specified opposite it in the 
second column of that Table; 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$359.06 $371.99 

$35.91 $37.20 

$71.81 $74.40 

$35.60 $36.85 

$7.12 (3 places) $7.37 

$3.55 (3 places) $3.68 

$4.74 $4.91 

$311.43 $322.63 

$31.14 $32.26 

$62.29 $64.52 

$17.75 $18.40 

$250.36 (2 places) $259.37 

$25.04 $25.94 

$50.07 $51.87 

$29.60 $30.70 

$5.92 $6.14 

$359.06 $371.99 

$311.43 $322.63 

$32.35 $33.50 

$177.86 $184.26 

$355.72 $368.52 

$12.21 $12.65 

$1.23 $1.26 

$22.50 $23.30 



2202 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Delete Insert 

$30.53 $31.64 

$6.10 (2 places) $6.32 

$61.06 $63.25 

$3.80 $3.94 

$23.71 $24.56 

$610.64 $632.63 

$122.13 $126.53 

 (b) by deleting “Transient Recreational Vessel Daily Casual 
Fee” and inserting instead —  

  “    Short Term Use Fee    ”. 

 (9) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 11 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$202.36 $209.64 

$275.43 (2 places) $285.34 

$20.24 $20.96 

$27.54 (2 places) $28.53 

$26.31 $27.25 

$35.81 $37.09 

$55.09 $57.07 

$28.10 $29.10 

$5.62 $5.82 

 (10) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 13 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$3.55” and inserting instead —  

  “    $3.68    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$71.14” and inserting instead —  

  “    $73.70    ”. 

 (11) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 14 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$355.72 (2 places) $368.52 

$35.57 (2 places) $36.85 

$71.14 (2 places) $73.70 

$35.60 $36.85 

$7.12 $7.37 

$284.57 $294.81 

$28.46 $29.48 

$56.91 $58.96 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2203 

 

Delete Insert 

$29.60 $30.70 

$5.92 $6.14 

$11.86 $12.28 

$23.71 $24.56 

 (12) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 15 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in the item relating to “Standard Fees” —  

 (i) by deleting “10 m” and inserting instead —  

  “    12 m    ”; 

 (ii) by deleting “8 m” and inserting instead —  

  “     9.6 m    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “Transient Vessels Fee” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    Short Term Use Fee    ”; 

 (c) by deleting each monetary amount specified in the first 
column of the Table to this paragraph and inserting 
instead the monetary amount specified opposite it in the 
second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 

$161.17 (2 places) $166.96 

$16.12 (2 places) $16.70 

$32.23 (2 places) $33.39 

$28.80 $29.80 

$19.25 $19.95 

$7.70 $7.98 

$5.76 $5.96 

$3.85 $3.99 

$2.88 $2.99 

 (13) Schedule 4 Division 1 Subdivision 16 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting the item relating to “Daily Casual Fee” and 
inserting instead —  

“     
Daily Casual Fee  

Mooring pens $4.40/m x length of vessel, per 
day (with a minimum overnight 
charge of $44.00 per vessel) 

Service jetty (mooring 
pens available) 

$6.60/m x length of vessel, per 
day (with a minimum overnight 
charge of $66.00 per vessel) 

Service jetty (no 
mooring pens 
available) 

$4.40/m x length of vessel, per 
day (with a minimum overnight 
charge of $44.00 per vessel) 

    ”; 

 (b) by deleting the item relating to “Minimum for overnight 
stay”. 



2204 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

 (14) Schedule 4 Division 2 Subdivision 1 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$106.53 $110.36 
$10.65 $11.04 
$21.31 $22.07 
$9.00 $9.35 
$1.80 $1.87 

 (15) Schedule 4 Division 2 Subdivision 2 is amended by deleting 
each monetary amount specified in the first column of the Table 
to this subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$118.57 $122.84 
$23.71 $24.56 
$2.37 $2.46 

 (16) Schedule 4 Division 3 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting each monetary amount specified in the first 
column of the Table to this paragraph and inserting 
instead the monetary amount specified opposite it in the 
second column of that Table; 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$3.55 $3.68 
$23.71 $24.56 
$4.74 $4.91 
$10.67 $11.05 
$59.29 $61.42 

 (b) in the item relating to “Rubbish Disposal” by deleting 
“not” in the first place where it occurs. 

 (17) Schedule 4 Division 4 is amended by deleting each monetary 
amount specified in the first column of the Table to this 
subregulation and inserting instead the monetary amount 
specified opposite it in the second column of that Table. 

Table 
Delete Insert 
$0.036 $0.038 
$0.035 $0.036 
$0.047 $0.049 
$0.0419 $0.043 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2205 

 

MX302* 

 
Marine Navigational Aids Act 1973 

Marine Navigational Aids Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Marine Navigational Aids Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Marine 
Navigational Aids Regulations 1985*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 4 April 2005. 
  For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 248.] 

4. Schedule amended 

  The Schedule is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$99.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    $103.10    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$130.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    $135.00    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$190.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $197.70    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “$292.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $303.40    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “$446.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $462.90    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “$698.30” and inserting instead —  

  “    $723.40    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 



2206 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

MX303* 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

Mooring Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Mooring Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Mooring 
Regulations 1998*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 8 August 2003. 
  For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 380.] 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in items 1, 3, 4, 5, 6 and 7 by deleting “$49.70” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $51.50    ”; 

 (b) in item 2 by deleting “$242.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $251.60    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 
 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2207 

 

MX304* 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Navigable Waters Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Navigable Waters Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Navigable 
Waters Regulations 1958*. 

 [* Reprint 11 as at 21 March 2003. 
  For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 384, and 
see Gazette 10 February 2006.] 

4. Regulation 45B amended 

 (1) Regulation 45B(3a)(b) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$56.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    $58.60    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$110.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $114.80    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$206.10” and inserting instead —  

  “    $213.50    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “$282.20” and inserting instead —  

  “    $292.30    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 45B(4) is amended by deleting “$26.60.” and 
inserting instead — 

  “    $27.50.    ”. 

5. Regulation 45BAA amended 

  Regulation 45BAA(4)(g) is amended by deleting “$26.60” and 
inserting instead — 

  “    $27.50    ”. 



2208 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

6. Regulation 45BA amended 

 (1) Regulation 45BA(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$233.30” and inserting instead —  

  “    $241.60    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$63.80” and inserting instead —  

  “    $65.80    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 45BA(3) is amended by deleting “$175.50” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $181.80    ”. 

 (3) Regulation 45BA(6a)(b) is amended by deleting “$63.80.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $65.80.    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MX305* 

Shipping and Pilotage Act 1967 

Ports and Harbours Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Ports and Harbours Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Ports and 
Harbours Regulations 1966*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 1 August 2003. 
  For amendments to 9 June 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 386.] 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2209 

 

4. Regulation 14 amended 

  Regulation 14(3) is amended by deleting “$4 054.98” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $4 200.95    ”. 

5. Regulation 15 amended 

  Regulation 15(3) is amended by deleting “$667.31” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $691.34    ”. 

6. Regulation 15A amended 

 (1) Regulation 15A(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$664.83” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $688.76    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 15A(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$664.83” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $688.76    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$789.33” and inserting 
instead —  

  “   $817.75     ”. 

7. Regulation 15B amended 

  Regulation 15B is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$316.23” and inserting instead —  

  “   $327.61     ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$453.19” and inserting instead —  

  “   $469.50     ”. 

8. Regulation 15C amended 

  Regulation 15C(a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$99.60” and inserting instead —  

  “   $103.19     ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$667.31” and inserting instead —  

  “   $691.34     ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$1 733.04” and inserting instead —  

  “   $1 795.43     ”. 

9. Regulation 16 amended 

  Regulation 16(d)(i) is amended by deleting “$733.30” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $759.70    ”. 



2210 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

10. Third Schedule amended 

 (1) The Third Schedule Division 1 item 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$4 456.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    $4 616.83    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$4 560.45” and inserting instead —  

  “    $4 724.63    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$5 062.18” and inserting instead —  

  “    $5 244.42    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “$5 597.53” and inserting instead —  

  “    $5 799.04    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “$6 716.78” and inserting instead —  

  “    $6 958.58    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “$7 509.86” and inserting instead —  

  “    $7 780.21    ”; 

 (g) by deleting “$8 221.99” and inserting instead —  

  “    $8 517.99    ”. 

 (2) The Third Schedule Division 1 item 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$554.03” and inserting instead —  

  “    $573.97    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$316.23/hour” and inserting instead —  

  “    $327.61/hour    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$453.19/hour” and inserting instead —  

  “    $469.50/hour    ”. 

 (3) The Third Schedule Division 2 item 1(a) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$99.70” and inserting instead —  

  “    $103.30    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$130.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    $135.10    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$190.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $197.70    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “$292.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $303.40    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “$446.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $463.00    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “$698.30” and inserting instead —  

  “    $723.40    ”. 

 (4) The Third Schedule Division 2 item 1(b) is amended by deleting 
“$88.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $92.10    ”. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2211 

 

 (5) The Third Schedule Division 2 item 3 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$99.70” and inserting instead —  

  “    $103.30    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$130.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    $135.10    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$190.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $197.80    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “$292.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $303.40    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “$446.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    $463.00    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “$698.30” and inserting instead —  

  “    $723.40    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MX307* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Hire and Drive Vessels) 
Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Hire and Drive Vessels) 
Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Hire and Drive Vessels) Regulations 1983*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 9 March 2001. 
  For amendments to 14 June 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 463.] 



2212 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

4. Regulation 4 amended 

  Regulation 4(2)(e) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in substituted clause 3.1.2(1)(b) by deleting “$297.60” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    $308.30    ”; 

 (b) in substituted clause 3.1.2(3)(b) by deleting “$148.10” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    $153.40    ”; 

 (c) in substituted clause 3.1.3(m) by deleting “$56.90.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $58.90.    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MX306* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Certificates of Competency and 
Safety Manning) Amendment Regulations 

(No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Certificates of 
Competency and Safety Manning) Amendment Regulations 
(No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Certificates of Competency and Safety Manning) 
Regulations 1983*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 17 September 2004. 
  For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 462.] 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2213 

 

4. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$57.10” in the 3 places where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $59.10    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$46.30” in both places where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $47.90    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$35.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $36.70    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “$99.20” and inserting instead —  

  “    $102.70    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “$92.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    $95.90    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “$59.30” and inserting instead —  

  “    $61.40    ”; 

 (g) by deleting “$5.70” and inserting instead —  

  “    $5.90    ”; 

 (h) by deleting “$8.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $8.80    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. .C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 

——————————— 
 

MX308* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Radiotelephony) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Radiotelephony) 
Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 



2214 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Radiotelephony) Regulations 1981*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 16 February 2001. 
  For amendments to 14 June 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 465.] 

4. Regulation 16 amended 

 (1) Regulation 16(2a) is amended by deleting “$284.00” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $294.20    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 16(2b) is amended by deleting “$142.00.” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $147.10.    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

MX309* 

Western Australian Marine Act 1982 

W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates of 
Survey) Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the W.A. Marine (Surveys and Certificates 
of Survey) Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the W.A. Marine 
(Surveys and Certificates of Survey) Regulations 1983*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 23 August 2002. 
  For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 466.] 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2215 

 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 item 1(a) is amended by deleting the Table to the 
paragraph and inserting instead —  

  “     
Table 

Length of vessel  
(metres) 

Examination 
of plans ($) 

Initial  
survey ($) 

Subsequent 
surveys ($) 

Not over 5 373 525 154 

Over 5 but not over 6 433 723 184 

Over 6 but not over 7 471 1 019 224 

Over 7 but not over 8 608 1 353 242 

Over 8 but not over 9 750 1 763 261 

Over 9 but not over 10 879 2 167 275 

Over 10 but not over 11 1 083 2 605 303 

Over 11 but not over 12 1 286 3 049 333 

Over 12 but not over 13 1 486 3 490 364 

Over 13 but not over 14 1 696 3 928 392 

Over 14 but not over 15 1 901 4 368 422 

Over 15 but not over 16 2 096 4 811 449 

Over 16 but not over 17 2 299 5 251 480 

Over 17 but not over 18 2 510 5 691 510 

Over 18 but not over 19 2 704 6 131 538 

Over 19 but not over 20 2 910 6 573 570 

Over 20 but not over 21 3 145 7 045 613 

Over 21 but not over 22 3 382 7 518 662 

Over 22 but not over 23 3 618 7 990 707 

Over 23 but not over 24 3 861 8 471 750 

Over 24 but not over 25 4 093 8 939 792 

Over 25 but not over 26 4 337 9 411 836 

Over 26 but not over 27 4 567 9 884 879 

Over 27 but not over 28 4 811 10 366 928 

Over 28 but not over 29 5 043 10 838 970 

Over 29 but not over 30 5 280 11 307 1 015 

Over 30 but not over 31 5 549 11 816 1 075 

Over 31 but not over 32 5 824 12 331 1 136 

Over 32 but not over 33 6 088 12 835 1 193 

Over 33 but not over 34 6 364 13 345 1 254 

Over 34 but not over 35 6 633 13 851 1 313 

Over 35 but not over 36 6 908 14 357 1 372 

Over 36 but not over 37 7 184 14 864 1 434 

Over 37 but not over 38 7 446 15 380 1 487 

Over 38 but not over 39 7 720 15 883 1 547 

Over 39 but not over 40 7 990 16 391 1 607 

Over 40 but not over 41 8 299 16 929 1 686 

Over 41 but not over 42 8 600 17 474 1 760 

Over 42 but not over 43 8 904 18 022 1 831 

Over 43 but not over 44 9 211 18 553 1 908 

Over 44 but not over 45 9 514 19 106 1 981 

Over 45 but not over 46 9 819 19 639 2 052 



2216 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Length of vessel  
(metres) 

Examination 
of plans ($) 

Initial  
survey ($) 

Subsequent 
surveys ($) 

Over 46 but not over 47 10 124 20 180 2 127 

Over 47 but not over 48 10 427 20 727 2 201 

Over 48 but not over 49 10 738 21 265 2 274 

Over 49 but not over 50 11 038 21 805 2 351 

Over 50 11 340 22 348 2 423 

    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 1 item 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (b)(i)(A) by deleting “$112.10” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b)(i)(B) by deleting “$112.10” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (b)(ii)(A) by deleting “$112.10” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (d) in paragraph (b)(ii)(C)(I) by deleting “$112.10” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (e) in paragraph (b)(ii)(C)(II) by deleting “$112.10” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”. 

 (3) Schedule 1 item 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$81.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $84.80    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$81.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $84.80    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$81.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $84.80    ”; 

 (d) in paragraph (d)(i) by deleting “$112.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (e) in paragraph (d)(ii) by deleting “$112.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (f) in paragraph (e)(i) by deleting “$112.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2217 

 

 (g) in paragraph (e)(ii) by deleting “$112.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (h) in paragraph (f)(i) by deleting “$112.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (i) in paragraph (f)(ii) by deleting “$81.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $84.80    ”; 

 (j) in paragraph (g)(i) by deleting “$112.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (k) in paragraph (g)(ii) by deleting “$81.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $84.80    ”; 

 (l) in paragraph (h)(i) by deleting “$112.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (m) in paragraph (h)(ii) by deleting “$81.90” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $84.80    ”; 

 (n) in paragraph (i)(i)(I) by deleting “$559.40” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $579.50    ”; 

 (o) in paragraph (i)(i)(II) by deleting “$280.20” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $290.30    ”; 

 (p) in paragraph (i)(ii)(I) by deleting “$1679.30” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $1 739.70    ”; 

 (q) in paragraph (i)(ii)(II) by deleting “$559.40” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $579.50    ”; 

 (r) in paragraph (i)(ii)(III) by deleting “$280.20” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $290.30    ”; 

 (s) in paragraph (i)(iii) by deleting “$559.40” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $579.50    ”; 

 (t) in paragraph (j) by deleting “$559.40” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $579.50    ”; 



2218 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

 (u) in paragraph (k) by deleting “$56.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $58.10    ”; 

 (v) in paragraph (l) by deleting “$112.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”; 

 (w) in paragraph (m) by deleting “133.60” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $138.40    ”; 

 (x) in paragraph (n)(i) by deleting “$111.50” in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    $115.50    ”; 

 (y) in paragraph (n)(ii) by deleting “$123.20” in both places 
where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    $127.60    ”. 

 (4) The note 1 after item 2 is amended by deleting “$112.10” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $116.10    ”. 

 (5) Schedule 1 item 3 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$73.20” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $75.80    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$73.20” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $75.80    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$45.20” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $46.80    ”. 

 (6) Schedule 1 item 4(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$60.40” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $62.60    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$120.80” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $125.10    ”; 

 (c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$223.10” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $231.10    ”; 

 (d) in paragraph (d) by deleting “$304.00” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $314.90    ”. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2219 

 

 (7) Schedule 1 item 4(2) is amended by deleting “$30.10” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $31.20    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP301* 

Mining Act 1978 

Mining Amendment Regulations (No. 6) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Mining Amendment Regulations 
(No. 6) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Mining 
Regulations 1981*. 

 [* Reprint 6 as at 7 April 2006.] 

4. Second Schedule amended 

 (1) The Second Schedule item 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “38.72” and inserting instead —  

  “    40.15    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “131.12” and inserting instead —  

  “    135.85    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “244.31” and inserting instead —  

  “    253.00    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “101.42” and inserting instead —  

  “    105.05    ”; 



2220 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

 (e) by deleting “157.74” and inserting instead —  

  “    163.46    ”; 

 (f) by deleting “214.06” and inserting instead —  

  “    221.76    ”; 

 (g) by deleting “405.46” and inserting instead —  

  “    420.09    ”; 

 (h) by deleting “11.88” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    12.32    ”; 

 (i) by deleting “13.42” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    13.86    ”; 

 (j) by deleting “0.33” and inserting instead —  

  “    0.44    ”; 

 (k) by deleting “$18.70” and inserting instead —  

  “    $19.80    ”; 

 (l) by deleting “1.87” and inserting instead —  

  “    1.98    ”; 

 (m) by deleting “5.83” and inserting instead —  

  “    6.05    ”. 

 (2) The Second Schedule item 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “220.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    230.00    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “950.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    985.00    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “320.00” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    330.00    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “215.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    223.00    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “540.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    560.00    ”. 

 (3) The Second Schedule item 2A is amended by deleting “205.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    212.00    ”. 

 (4) The Second Schedule item 2B is amended by deleting “6.50” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    6.75    ”. 

 (5) The Second Schedule item 3 is amended by deleting “6.50” in 
each place where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    6.75    ”. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2221 

 

 (6) The Second Schedule item 3A is amended by deleting “5.40” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    5.60    ”. 

 (7) The Second Schedule item 4 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “270.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    280.00    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “310.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    320.00    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “370.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    385.00    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “1 850.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    1 925.00    ”. 

 (8) The Second Schedule item 5  is amended by deleting “27.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    28.00    ”. 

 (9) The Second Schedule item 7 is amended by deleting “82.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    85.00    ”. 

 (10) The Second Schedule item 8 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$21.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $22.40    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “5.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    5.60    ”. 

 (11) The Second Schedule item 9 is amended by deleting “17.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    17.60    ”. 

 (12) The Second Schedule item 10 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “82.00” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    85.00    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “5.40” and inserting instead —  

  “    5.60    ”. 

 (13) The Second Schedule item 11 is amended by deleting “165.00” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    171.00    ”. 

 (14) The Second Schedule item 11A is amended by deleting “6.50” 
and inserting instead —  

  “    6.75    ”. 



2222 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

 (15) The Second Schedule item 13 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “47.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    50.00    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “30.00” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    35.00    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “10.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    15.00    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “6.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    7.00    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

TRANSPORT 

TR301* 

Motor Vehicle Drivers Instructors Act 1963 

Motor Vehicle Drivers Instructors Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Motor Vehicle Drivers Instructors 
Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Motor Vehicle 
Drivers Instructors Regulations 1964*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 5 July 2002. 
  For amendments to 1 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 270-1.] 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2223 

 

4. Regulation 13 amended 

  Regulation 13 is amended as follows: 

 (a) before the item commencing “The issue of an 
instructor’s permit” by inserting the following item —  

 “     
An application for the initial grant of a 
licence under section 7(1) of the Act ……. 

 
45.00 

    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “4.90” and inserting instead —  

  “    5.00    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “26.00” and inserting instead —  

  “    26.90    ”; 

 (d) by deleting “47.70” and inserting instead —  

  “    49.40    ”; 

 (e) by deleting “13.70” and inserting instead —  

  “    14.15    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 
TR302* 

Rail Safety Act 1998 

Rail Safety Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Rail Safety Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Rail Safety 
Regulations 1999*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 18 June 2004. 
  For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 331.] 



2224 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in item 2 by deleting “89.60” and inserting instead —  

  “    87.09    ”; 

 (b) by deleting item 3; 

 (c) in item 5 by deleting “23.8794” and inserting instead —  

  “    27.7664    ”; 

 (d) in item 6 by deleting “0.0214” and inserting instead —  

  “    0.0249    ”; 

 (e) in item 7 by deleting “23.8794” and inserting instead —  

  “    25.9868    ”; 

 (f) in item 8 by deleting “0.0214” and inserting instead —  

  “    0.0249    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 
TR303* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Events on Roads) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Events on Roads) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Events on Roads) Regulations 1991*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 1 February 2002. 
  For amendments to 26 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 357.] 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2225 

 

4. Schedule 2 replaced 

  Schedule 2 is repealed and the following Schedule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
Schedule 2 — Application fees 

[r. 6(2)(c)] 

 $ 
Category 1 event 137.00 
Category 2 event 82.00 
Category 3 event 55.50 
Category 4 event 55.50 

    ”. 
By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 
TR304* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Vehicle Standards) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 3) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Vehicle Standards) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Vehicle Standards) Regulations 2002*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 2 December 2005. 
  For amendments to 31 May 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 365, and 
Gazette 26 May 2006.] 



2226 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

4. Regulation 25 amended 

 (1) Regulation 25(5) is amended by deleting paragraph (a) and 
“and” after it and inserting instead —  

“     
 (a) if the period is —  

 (i) 12 months — $25; or 

 (ii) 36 months — $50; 

  and 
    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 25(6) is amended by deleting paragraph (a) and 
“and” after it and inserting instead —  

“     
 (a) $25; and 

    ”. 

5. Regulation 30 amended 

  Regulation 30(4) is repealed and the following subregulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (4) The fee payable for the issue of a class 2 permit is —  

 (a) if the permit is for 12 months — $25; or 

 (b) if the permit is for 36 months — $50. 
    ”. 

6. Regulation 34 amended 

  Regulation 34(4) is amended by deleting paragraph (a) and 
“and” after it and inserting instead —  

“     
 (a) if the permit is for  —  

 (i) 12 months — $25; or 

 (ii) 36 months — $50; 

  and 
    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 

 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2227 

 

TR305* 

Taxi Act 1994 

Taxi Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Taxi Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Taxi 
Regulations 1995*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 4 March 2005. 
  For amendments to 2 May 2006 see Gazette 24 February and 

13 April 2006.] 

4. Regulation 19 amended 

 (1) Regulation 19(1)(a) is amended by deleting “$85” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $88    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 19(4) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$30” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $31    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $51.80    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
——————————— 

 



2228 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

TR306* 

Transport Co-ordination Act 1966 

Transport Co-ordination Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Transport Co-ordination Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Transport 
Co-ordination Regulations 1985*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 16 May 2003. 
  For amendments to 8 June 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 427.] 

4. Regulation 8A amended 

  Regulation 8A is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a)(ii) by deleting “$20;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $20.70;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (d) by deleting “$1.26.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $1.30.    ”. 

5. Regulation 8B amended 

  Regulation 8B is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$15” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $15.50    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$20.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $20.70.    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2229 

 

TR307* 

Transport Co-ordination Act 1966 

Transport (Country Taxi-car) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Transport (Country Taxi-car) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 July 2006. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Transport 
(Country Taxi-car) Regulations 1982*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 2 April 2004. 
  For amendments to 8 June 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 427.] 

4. Schedule amended 

  The Schedule is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “150” in both places where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    155    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “85” and inserting instead —  

  “    88    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 

 
 
 
 



2230 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

TREASURY AND FINANCE 

TF301* 

Government Financial Responsibility Act 2000 

Government Financial Responsibility 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Government Financial Responsibility 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Annual Report on State Finances (s. 14A) 

 (1) For the purposes of section 14A(3)(c) of the Act, an Annual 
Report on State Finances is to include —  

 (a) a statement of the balances as at the end of the budget 
year, and as at the end of the preceding budget year, 
of —  

 (i) the Consolidated Fund; and 

 (ii) the Treasurer’s Advance Account established by 
the Financial Administration and Audit Act 1985 
section 5(b); and 

 (iii) the Trust Fund constituted under the Financial 
Administration and Audit Act 1985 section 9; 

  and 

 (b) a statement of the revenue credited to, and the 
expenditure charged to, the Consolidated Fund during 
the budget year and the net amount credited or charged 
to the Consolidated Fund during that year; and 

 (c) a statement of the payments or advances made under the 
authority of the Treasurer’s Advance Authorisation Act 
for the budget year, specifying —  

 (i) the net unrecovered balances as at the end of the 
budget year; and 

 (ii) the payments of an extraordinary or unforeseen 
nature made under the authority of the 
Treasurer’s Advance Authorisation Act for the 
budget year; and  

 (iii) the total amount of payments or advances made 
under the authority of the Treasurer’s Advance 
Authorisation Act for the budget year. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2231 

 

 (2) For the purposes of section 14A(4) of the Act, an Annual Report 
on State Finances is to be certified —  

 (a) by the Under Treasurer; and 

 (b) to the effect that the Annual Report on State Finances —  

 (i) has been prepared by the Under Treasurer from 
information provided by public sector bodies; 
and 

 (ii) has been prepared in accordance with external 
reporting standards; and 

 (iii) in the opinion of the Under Treasurer, presents 
fairly the operating results and cashflows of the 
Government for the budget year and the financial 
position at the end of the budget year. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

WORKCOVER 

WC301* 

Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation Fund Act 1980 

Employers’ Indemnity Supplementation Fund 
Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Employers’ Indemnity 
Supplementation Fund Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Employers’ 
Indemnity Supplementation Fund Regulations 2001*. 

 [* Published in Gazette on 15 June 2001, p. 2977. 
  For amendments to 1 June 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 104.] 

3. Regulation 2 amended 

  Regulation 2 is amended by deleting “2006” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    2009    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 



2232 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

— PART 2 — 

AGRICULTURE 

AG401* 
PLANT DISEASES ACT 1914 

APPOINTMENTS 

Department of Agriculture and Food, 
South Perth  WA 6151. 

I, the undersigned Minister for Agriculture and Food, being the Minister responsible for the 
administration of the Plant Diseases Act 1914, hereby appoint the following Officers as Authorised 
Inspectors pursuant to Section 7A of the said Act to carry out all the functions authorized to be 
performed by an Inspector under the said Act and its Regulations. 

Catherine Diane Corcoran 
Matangaro Crowley 
Karen Tracy Debski 
Jill Patricia Farrant 
Barbara Mary Fry 
Tristan Simon Lane 
Keelan Rory Parke 

KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture and Food. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

AG402* 
SOIL AND LAND CONSERVATION ACT 1945 

Section 25A(1a) 
KATANNING LAND CONSERVATION DISTRICT 

Soil Conservation Service Charge Notice (2006 to 2009) 
I, Kim Chance, being the Minister responsible for the administration of the Soil and Land 
Conservation Act 1945, being satisfied that all prescribed steps have been taken, give notice that the 
soil conservation service charge described in the Schedule to this Notice be imposed in the Katanning 
land conservation district for the three years commencing 1 July 2006 and ending on 30 June 2009. 
The boundaries of the Katanning land conservation district are as specified in the Order establishing 
the district published in the Government Gazette on 6 July 1990 (pp. 3268-3269). 

SCHEDULE 
Amount of service charge $15 per annum on all rateable land within the Katanning 

Land Conservation District 
Specified service To assist in funding— 

1. the operating costs of the Katanning Resource Centre; 
2. the wages of the Katanning Catchment Liaison Officer; 

and 
3. on-ground works for salinity management (draft title) 

Collection and allocation of service 
charge 

The service charge will be collected by the Shire of 
Katanning and paid to the Department of Agriculture for 
allocation to the Katanning Land Conservation District 
Committee. 

Annual report The Katanning District Committee must report to the 
Minister on the progress of the service by 15 June of each 
year the charge is applied. 

KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture and Food. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2233 

 

AG403* 
SOIL AND LAND CONSERVATION ACT 1945 

DE GREY LAND CONSERVATION DISTRICT 
(Appointment of Members of District Committee) Instrument 2006 

Made by the Commissioner of Soil and Land Conservation. 

1. Citation 
This Instrument may be cited as the De Grey Land Conservation District (Appointment of Members) 
Instrument 2006. 

2. Appointment of members 
Under section 23(2b) of the Act and clause 4(1) of the Soil and Land Conservation (De Grey Land 
Conservation District) Order 2002*, the following members are appointed to the land conservation 
district committee for the De Grey Land Conservation District— 
 (a) on the nomination of the Shire of East Pilbara: Lang Coppin of Yarrie Station;  
 (b) on the nomination of the Town of Port Hedland: John Joseph Bettini of De Grey Station; 
 (c) to represent the Pastoralists and Graziers Association of Western Australia: Robin Frederick 

Mills of Warrawagine Station and Graham Rogers of Bonney Downs Station; and 
 (d) as persons actively engaged in, or affected by or associated with, land use in the district— 
 (i) Tony Glenn of Corunna Downs Station 
 (ii) Ann Coppin of Yarrie Station 
 (iii) Peter Allan Edmonds of Mandora Station 
 (iv) Cynthia Therese Stoney of Hillside Station 
 (v) Joseph Anthony de Pledge of Mandora Station 
 (vi) Grant Brooks of Limestone Station 
 (vii) Ken Rieck of Limestone Station 
 (viii) Geoffrey Robin Mills of Warrawagine Station 
 (ix) John Andrew Leeds of Pardoo Station 
 (x) Lance Coppin of Yarrie Station 
(*Published in the Gazette of 2 August 2002 at pp. 3813-14). 

3. Term of office 
Members appointed to the committee under this instrument will hold office for a term expiring on 31 
May 2009. 

ANDREW WATSON, Commissioner of Soil and Land Conservation. 
Dated this day 19th of June  2006. 
 

——————————— 
 

AG404* 
SOIL AND LAND CONSERVATION ACT 1945 

NULLARBOR-EYRE HIGHWAY LAND CONSERVATION DISTRICT 
(Appointment of Members of District Committee) Instrument 2006 

Made by the Commissioner of Soil and Land Conservation. 

1. Citation 
This Instrument may be cited as the Nullarbor-Eyre Highway Land Conservation District 
(Appointment of Members) Instrument 2006. 

2. Appointment of members 
Under section 23(2b) of the Act and clause 5(1) of the Soil and Land Conservation (Nullarbor-Eyre 
Highway Land Conservation District) Order 1988*, the following members are appointed to the land 
conservation district committee for the Nullarbor-Eyre Highway Land Conservation District— 
 (a) on the nomination of the Shire of Dundas: Peter Brown of Arubiddy Station; 
 (b) on the nomination of the City of Kalgoorlie-Boulder: Donald John Hogg of Kinclaven Station; 

and 
 (c) as persons actively engaged in, or affected by or associated with, land use in the district— 
 (i) Ian Foxley of Madura Plains Station 
 (ii) Damien Brown of Arubiddy Station 
 (iii) Colin John Campbell of Mundrabilla Station 
 (iv) Mark Forrester of Kanandah Station 
 (v) Anthony (Tony) Thomas of Balgair Station 
 (vi) Paul Ryan of Fraser Range Station 



2234 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

 (vii) Ross Wood of Rawlinna Station 
 (viii) Colvin Day of Gunnadorah Station 
 (ix) Roderick Campbell of Kybo Station 
 (x) James Ferguson of Noondoonia Station 
 (xi) Greg Campbell of Kybo Station 
 (xii) Regional Manager, Department of Conservation and Land Management, Goldfields 

region 
(*Published in the Gazette of 6 May 1988 at pp. 1567-1568, amended in the Gazette of 26 June 1992 at 
pp. 2655-2656 and an Amendment Order approved by Executive Council on 16 November 1999 
{Department of Agriculture reference: 881783V02P0D}). 

3. Term of office 
Members appointed to the committee under this instrument will hold office for a term expiring on 31 
May 2009. 

ANDREW WATSON, Commissioner 0f Soil and Land Conservation. 
Dated this day 2oth of June 2006. 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

AG405* 
SOIL AND LAND CONSERVATION ACT 1945 
WOODANILLING LAND CONSERVATION DISTRICT 

(Appointment of Members of District Committee) Instrument 2006 
Made by the Commissioner of Soil and Land Conservation. 

1. Citation 
This Instrument may be cited as the Woodanilling Land Conservation District (Appointment of 
Members) Instrument 2006. 

2. Appointment of members 
Under section 23(2b) of the Act and clause 5(1) of the Soil and Land Conservation (Woodanilling 
Land Conservation District) Order 1987*, the following members are appointed to the land 
conservation district committee for the Woodanilling Land Conservation District— 
 (a) on the nomination of the Shire of Woodanilling: Trevor Young of Woodanilling; 
 (b) to represent the Western Australian Farmers Federation (Inc): Barry Shackley of 

Woodanilling and Thomas Haddleton of Woodanilling; and 
 (c) as persons actively engaged in, or affected by or associated with, land use in the district— 
 (i) Wendy Bessell-Browne of Woodanilling 
 (ii) Dale Stuart Douglas of Woodanilling 
 (iii) Richard John Bessell-Browne of Woodanilling 
 (iv) Ian Peter Garstone of Woodanilling 
 (v) Trevor Phillip Young of Woodanilling 
 (vi) Graydn Richard Wilcox of Woodanilling 
 (vii) Thomas Eric Crossley of Woodanilling 
 (viii) Sonya Lisa Harcourt-Smith of Woodanilling 
 (ix) Gilbert Watson of Woodanilling 
 (x) Christopher Sattler of Kojonup 
(*Published in the Gazette 22 May 1987 at pp. 2200-2201 and amended in the Gazettes of 26 April 
1991 at pp. 1859-1860 and 21 July 1995 at p. 3069 and an Amendment Order approved by Executive 
Council on 9 March 1999 {Department of Agriculture reference: 881775V02P05}). 

3. Term of office 
Members appointed to the committee under this instrument will hold office for a term expiring on 31 
May 2009. 

ANDREW WATSON, Commissioner of Soil and Land Conservation. 
Dated this day 20th of June 2006. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2235 

 

AG406* 
SOIL AND LAND CONSERVATION ACT 1945 

APPOINTMENT 
Pursuant to section 23 (2b)(d) of the Soil and Land Conservation Act 1945, being persons actively 
engaged in, or affected by, or associated with land use in the District, Josef Hilzensauer of Australind 
is appointed a member of the Dardanup Land Conservation District (the Committee was established 
by an Order in Council, published in the Government Gazette of 11 September 1992 at pp. 4595-97 and 
amended in the Gazette of 23 April 1993 at pp. 2174-75 and an Amendment Order approved by 
Executive Council on 1 December 1998 (Department of Agriculture reference: 881843V02P00). The 
appointment is for a term ending on 31 March 2008.  

ANDREW WATSON, Commissioner of Soil and Land Conservation. 
Dated this day 19th of June 2006. 

FISHERIES 

FI401* 
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENT ACT 1994 

WEST COAST DEMERSAL GILLNET AND DEMERSAL LONGLINE FISHERY (INTERIM) 
MANAGEMENT PLAN AMENDMENT 2006 

FD 435/02 [747] 
Made by the Minister under section 54. 

1. Citation  
This instrument is the West Coast Demersal Gillnet and Demersal Longline Fishery (Interim) 
Management Plan Amendment 2006. 

2. Management plan amended 
The amendments in this instrument are to the West Coast Demersal Gillnet and Demersal Longline 
Interim Managed Fishery Management Plan 1997*. 

3. Clause 4 amended 
Clause 4 is amended by inserting the following definitions in the appropriate alphabetical order— 

 “ “dusky shark” means a shark of the scientific classification Carcharhinus obscurus; ”; and 
“ “interdorsal fin length” is the length obtained by measuring in a straight line from the first 
dorsal fin origin to the second dorsal fin insertion; ”. 

4. Clause 10 amended 
Clause 10 is amended— 
 (a) before “A person” by inserting the subclause designation “(1)”; 
 (b) by inserting after subclause (1) the following— 
 “ (2) A person must not fish by means of a demersal longline that does not conform to the 

specifications specified in Schedule 6. ”. 

5. Clause 12A inserted 
After clause 12 the following clause is inserted— 
 “ 12A. Protection of dusky shark over 70 centimetres interdorsal fin length 
 (1) A person, on becoming aware of the taking of a dusky shark that is greater than 70 

centimetres interdorsal fin length, must take immediate steps to return that shark to 
the water with the least possible injury to the shark. 

  (2) The master of an authorised boat must not permit a dusky shark that is greater than 
70 centimetres interdorsal fin length to remain on the boat for more than 2 minutes. “. 

6. Clause 17 amended 
Clause 17 is amended by deleting subclause (5). 

7. Clause 26 replaced 
Clause 26 is repealed and the following clause inserted instead— 
 “ 26. Areas closed to fishing 
 (1) A person must not fish by the use of a demersal longline or demersal gillnet in the 

waters described in subclause (1) of Schedule 4.  
 (2) A person must not fish by the use of a demersal longline or a demersal gillnet in the 

waters described in subclause (2) of Schedule 4 at any time during the period 
commencing on 16 August and ending on 15 October in the same year during the years 
2006, 2007 and 2008.  ”.  



2236 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

8. Clause 27 amended 
Clause 27 is amended in paragraph (a) by inserting after “12, “ the following— 

“ 12A, ”. 

9. Schedule 4 amended 
Schedule 4 is amended— 
 (a) before “The waters” by inserting the subclause designation “(1)”;  
 (b) by inserting after subclause (1) the following— 
 “ (2) All waters bounded by a line commencing at the intersection of the high water mark on 

the coastline of Western Australia and 26° south latitude; thence west along the 
parallel to its intersection with 112° 18' east longitude; thence south-easterly along the 
geodesic to the intersection of 26° 24' south latitude and 112° 30' east longitude; thence 
south-easterly along the geodesic to the intersection of 26° 50' south latitude and 112° 
44' east longitude; thence south-easterly along the geodesic to the intersection of 27° 20' 
south latitude and 112° 55' east longitude; thence south-easterly along the geodesic to 
the intersection of 27° 55' south latitude and 113° 10' east longitude; thence south-
easterly along the geodesic to the intersection of 28° 35' south latitude and 113° 29' east 
longitude; thence south-easterly along the geodesic to the intersection of 29° south 
latitude and 113° 46' east longitude; thence south-easterly along the geodesic to the 
intersection of 29° 54' south latitude and 114° 25' east longitude; thence south-easterly 
along the geodesic to the intersection of 30° 40' south latitude and 114° 41' east 
longitude; thence south-easterly along the geodesic to the intersection of 31° 14' south 
latitude and 114° 55' east longitude; thence southerly along the geodesic to the 
intersection of 31° 48' south latitude and 115° 01' east longitude; thence south-easterly 
along the geodesic to the intersection of 31° 58' south latitude and 115° 13' east 
longitude; thence south-westerly along the geodesic to the intersection of 32° 16' south 
latitude and 115° 05' east longitude; thence south-westerly along the geodesic to the 
intersection of 32° 53' south latitude and 114° 41' east longitude; thence south-westerly 
along the geodesic to the intersection of 33° south latitude and 114° 38’ east longitude; 
thence east along the parallel to its intersection with the high water mark on the 
coastline of Western Australia; thence generally north along the high water mark to 
the commencement point. “. 

10. Schedule 5 amended 
Schedule 5 is amended by deleting paragraph (d). 

11. Schedule 6 inserted 
After Schedule 5 the following Schedule is inserted— 

“ Schedule 6 
 (1) A trace used in a demersal longline must be made of— 
 (a) unsheathed monofilament nylon; or 
 (b) fluorocarbon,  

and have a maximum width at any point of 1.8 millimetres. 
 (2) A snood used in a demersal longline must be made of— 
 (a) unsheathed monofilament nylon; or 
 (b) fluorocarbon,  

and have a maximum width at any point of 1.8 millimetres. 
 (3) With the exception of flags, swivels, sinkers, floats and connectors a demersal longline must 

not have any part that is made of, or includes, metal. 
 (4) A longline must not have— 
 (a) any branch lines; 
 (b) any hook— 
 (i) made of material that exceeds 3 millimetres width at any point except for the 

barb; 
 (ii) that when measured externally exceeds 8 centimetres in length or width; 
 (c) more than 2 ferrules/swages/barrel locks/sleeves per snood; 
 (d) any ferrule/swage/barrel lock/sleeve that exceeds 25 millimetres in length; 
 (e) any trace or snood that exceeds 150 centimetres in length when measured from the 

mainline to the eye of the hook and includes the full length of the swivel, snap fastener 
or any other device that attaches the trace to the mainline; 

 (f) more than one hook on each snood; 
 (g) more than one line on each snood; 
 (h) any swivel, snap fastener or other device that attaches the trace to the main line that is 

longer than 150 millimetres. ”. 
[*Published in the Gazette of 30 May 1997. For amendments to 31 May 2006 see the West Coast 
Demersal Gillnet and Demersal Longline Interim Managed Fishery Management Plan Amendment 
1998 published in the Gazette of 29 May 1998, the West Coast Demersal Gillnet and Demersal 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2237 

 

Longline Interim Managed Fishery Management Plan Amendment 1999 published in the Gazette of 
14 May 1999, the West Coast Demersal Gillnet and Demersal Longline Fishery Management Plan 
Amendment 2000 published in the Gazette of 23 May 2000, the West Coast Demersal Gillnet and 
Demersal Longline Fishery (Interim) Management Plan Amendment 2001 published in the Gazette of 
29 May 2001, the West Coast Demersal Gillnet and Demersal Longline Fishery (Interim) Management 
Plan Amendment 2002 published in the Gazette of 24 May 2002, the West Coast Demersal Gillnet and 
Demersal Longline Fishery (Interim) Management Plan Amendment (No.2) 2002 published in the 
Gazette of 21 June 2002, the West Coast Demersal Gillnet and Demersal Longline Fishery (Interim) 
Management Plan Amendment 2003 published in the Gazette of 11 April 2003, the West Coast 
Demersal Gillnet and Demersal Longline Fishery (Interim) Management Plan Amendment 2004 
published in the Gazette of 25 May 2004 and the West Coast Demersal Gillnet and Demersal Longline 
Fishery (Interim) Management Plan Amendment (No. 2) 2004 published in the Gazette of 28 May 
2002.] 
Dated this 15th day of June 2006. 

JON FORD, Minister for Fisheries. 

JUSTICE 

JU401 
IN THE SUPREME COURT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

CIV 1124 of 2006 
IN THE MATTER of the Charitable Trusts Act 1962 

Between 
OPTHALMIC DAY SURGERY PTY LTD AS TRUSTEE OF 

OPTHALMIC DAY SURGERY TRUST (PLAINTIFF) 
and  

ATTORNEY GENERAL FOR THE STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRLAIA (DEFENDANT) 
ORDER APPROVING SCHEME 

BEFORE THE HONOURABLE JUSTICE BLAXELL 
4 April 2006 

Upon the application of the Plaintiff by Originating Summons dated 9th February 2006 and upon 
hearing Mr J. G. Young of Counsel for the Plaintiff and Ms J. P. Weeden of Counsel for the Defendant 
it is ordered that; 
 1. The scheme being Annexure “I” to the Affidavit of Geoffrey Claude Morlet sworn 2nd 

February 2006 and filed herein (“Scheme”) be and is hereby approved. 
 2. The parties’ reasonable costs of and incidental to— 
 (a) preparing and advertising the Scheme; 
 (b) obtaining approval for the Scheme; and 
 (c) the costs of this application 
  be paid out of, and be a charge on, the trust property 
By the Court, 

D. POWELL, Registrar. 

LAND 

LA401* 
TRANSFER OF LAND ACT 1893 

APPLICATION I933313 
Take notice that Dragoljub Garic and Radmila Garic have made application to bring the following 
land under the operation of Transfer of Land Act 1893. 
Being Lot 35 on Diagram 13639 containing 506 square metres and being the whole of the land 
comprised in Memorial Book XXVII Vol. No. 791. 
ALL PERSONS other than the applicants claiming any estate right title or interest in the above land 
and desiring to object to the application are required to lodge in this office on or before 14 July 2006 a 
caveat forbidding the land being brought under the operation of the Act. 
23 June 2006. 

BRUCE ROBERTS, Registrar of Titles. 



2238 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

LA402* 
TRANSFER OF LAND ACT 1893 

SECTION 170 
Application J384842 

Take Notice that White Toro Pty. Ltd. of 28 Duncraig Road, Applecross made Application to be 
registered under the Transfer of Land Act 1893 as proprietor of an estate in fee simple in the land 
situated at Busselton being— 

PORTION OF SUSSEX LOCATION 11 AND BEING LOT 11 ON DEPOSITED PLAN 228826 
DESCRIBED ON CERTIFICATE OF TITLE VOLUME 2080 FOLIO 700 NOW SHOWN AS LOT 
25 ON DEPOSITED PLAN 41766. 

ALL PERSONS other than the Applicant claiming any estate right title or interest in the above land 
and desiring to object to the above Application are required to lodge in this office on or before 7 July 
2006 a Caveat forbidding the granting of Application J384842. 
23 June 2006. 

BRUCE ROBERTS, Registrar of Titles. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Boddington 
APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed as 
Registration Officers under the provisions of the Dog Act 1976— 

Sophie Knight, Stephanie Cornish, Wendy Telae, Vicki Ebert and Martin Dunbar-Stuart. 
The following persons have been appointed as Authorised Persons under the provisions of the Dog  
Act 1976— 

Rodney Pet, Wayne Heinemann and Aaron Cook 
All previous appointments are hereby cancelled. 

P. R. BRADBROOK, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

LG403 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

RESIGNATION AND APPOINTMENT 
Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup 

Fire Control Officer 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with Section 38 of the Bush Fires Act 1954 
(as amended) that the Shire of Donnybrook-Balingup has appointed Mr Christopher Michael Marwick 
as the Fire Control Officer for the Mumble Bush Fire Brigade and cancelled the appointment of Mr 
Bruce Marshall as the Fire Control Officer for the Mumble Bush Fire Brigade effective from 14 June 
2006. 

JOHN R. ATTWOOD, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

LG402* 
SHIRE OF EXMOUTH 

Authorised Persons 
It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons have been appointed Authorised 
Officers in accordance with the relevant Acts hereunder effective from 3rd July 2006. 
1. Caravan Parks & Camping Grounds Act 1995 pursuant to section 17(1). 

Graeme Canon 
It is hereby notified for public information that the authorisation for Christopher Carey is hereby 
revoked in accordance with the relevant Acts hereunder effective from 1st July 2006. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2239 

 

1. Dog Act 1976 & Regulations, Local Government Act & Regulations 1995 (sections 3.39, 9.10, 9.11 
and 9.15) & Local Government Local Laws— 

Christopher Carey 
2. Caravan Parks & Camping Grounds Act 1995 pursuant to section 17(1). 

Christopher Carey 

P. J. ANASTASAKIS, Chief Executive Officer. 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LG404 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

District of Wickepin 
(DISCONTINUATION OF WARD SYSTEM) ORDER 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council on the recommendation of the Minister for Local 
Government and Regional Development. 

1. Citation 
This order may be cited as the District of Wickepin (Discontinuation of Ward System) Order 2006. 

2. Discontinuation of ward system (s.2.2 (1)(d) of the Act) 
All wards in the district of Wickepin are abolished immediately before the first ordinary elections day 
of the district after the commencement of this order. 

3. Consequential directions (s.9.62 of the Act) 
(1) Part 4 of the Act, modified to the extent necessary to give effect to clause 2, applies to preparing 
for and conducting the next ordinary elections of the Shire of Wickepin as if the change effected by 
that clause had taken effect on the day on which this order commenced. 
(2) For the avoidance of doubt, clause 2 does not affect the term of office of any councillor. 
I recommend that the order in clause 2 be made as recommended by the Local Government Advisory 
Board. 

Hon JON FORD JP MLC, Minister for Local Government and 
Regional Development. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Council. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401 
MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURES 
Department of Industry and Resources, 

Perth WA 6000. 
I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of section 96A(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned mining tenement is forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply with the 
prescribed expenditure condition. 

JOHN BOWLER JP MLA, Minister for Resources and Assisting 
the Minister for State Development 

———— 
Number Holder Mineral Field 

Exploration Licence 
31/244 Avoca Resources Ltd North Coolgardie 

 
 



2240 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

MP402 
MINING ACT 1978 

FORFEITURES 
Department of Industry and Resources, 

Perth WA 6000. 
I hereby declare in accordance with the provisions of section 96A(1) of the Mining Act 1978 that the 
undermentioned mining tenement is forfeited for breach of covenant viz; failure to comply with the 
prescribed expenditure condition. 

JOHN BOWLER JP MLA, Minister for Resources and Assisting 
the Minister for State Development 

———— 
Number Holder Mineral Field 

Exploration Licence 
63/804 Avoca Resources Ltd Dundas 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MP403 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Industry and Resources, 

Kalgoorlie WA 6430. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following Prospecting Licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the 
Mining Act 1978 for breach of covenant, viz, non-compliance with the expenditure conditions. 

D. TEMBY, Warden, 

———— 
To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Kalgoorlie on the 18th July, 2006. 

BROAD ARROW MINERAL FIELD 
24/3626—Edwards, Cranston Gilbert 
24/3627—Edwards, Cranston Gilbert 

NORTH COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 
31/1659—Beasley, Albert Charles 
31/1660—Beasley, Albert Charles 
31/1662—Beasley, Albert Charles 
31/1663—Beasley, Albert Charles 
31/1664—Beasley, Albert Charles and Hurley, Paul Richard 
31/1665—Beasley, Albert Charles and Hurley, Paul Richard 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

MP404 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Industry and Resources, 

Kalgoorlie WA 6430. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following Prospecting Licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the 
Mining Act 1978 for breach of covenant, viz, non payment of rent. 

D. TEMBY, Warden, 

———— 
To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Kalgoorlie on the 18th July, 2006. 

BROAD ARROW MINERAL FIELD 
24/3454—Allen, Royce William 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2241 

 

MP405 
MINING ACT 1904 
APPROVED LEASES 

Department of Industry & Resources, 
Perth, 21 June 2006. 

In accordance with the provisions of the Mining Act 1904, the Governor in Executive Council has been 
pleased to deal with the following Leases. 

J. LIMERICK, Director General. 

———— 
The undermentioned applications for Coal Mining Leases were approved conditionally— 

Mineral Field Application No. Lessee 
Collie 12/774 

12/775 
12/844 
12/845 

The Griffin Coal Mining Company Ltd 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Northampton 

Town Planning Scheme No. 9—Amendment No. 4 
Ref: 853/3/14/11 Pt 4 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005, that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Northampton local planning scheme amendment on 06 June 2006 for the purpose of— 
 1. Rezoning UCL Lot 1016 Porter Street, Kalbarri from Parks & Recreation to Commercial. 
 2. Amending the Scheme Maps accordingly. 

G. V. PARKER, Shire President. 
G. L. KEEFFE, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED DISTRICT PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Stirling 

District Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 496 
Ref: 853/2/20/34 Pt 496 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of Stirling 
District Planning Scheme Amendment on 6 June 2006 for the purpose of rezoning Lot 1615, HN 34 
Chipala Road, Westminster from ‘Service Station’ to ‘Medium Density Residential R40’ as depicted on 
the Scheme Amendment Map. 

T. J. TYZACK, Mayor. 
L. DELAHUNTY Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI403* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Stirling 

District Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 503 
Ref: 853/2/20/34 Pt 503 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of Stirling 



2242 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

local planning scheme amendment on 9 May 2006 for the purpose of rezoning Lot 103 HN 163 
Balcatta Road, Balcatta, from ‘Special Garden Industrial’ to ‘Special Garden Industrial and 
Additional Use—Showroom’ as depicted on the Scheme Amendment Map. 

T. J. TYZACK, Mayor. 
L. DELAHUNTY Chief Executive Officer. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI404* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
Shire of Greenough 

Town Planning Scheme No. 4—Amendment No. 108 
Ref: 853/3/7/6 Pt108 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the Shire of 
Greenough local planning scheme amendment on 6 June 2006 for the purpose of— 
 1 Rezoning Portion of Reserve 24738, Whitehill Road, Drummond Cove from the Recreation 

Zone and Single Residential R12.5 Zone to the Single Residential R20 Zone. 
 2 Rezoning Reserve 42813 from the Recreation Zone to the Public Utility Zone. 
 3 Rezoning Reserve 44792 from the Recreation Zone to the Public Utility Zone. 
 4 Amending the Scheme Map accordingly; & 
 5 Inserting the following new section into Part II of the Scheme Text— 

POLICE 

PO501* 
POLICE ACT 1892 
POLICE AUCTION 

Under the provisions of the Police Act 1892-1992, unclaimed and forfeited property and bicycles will 
be sold by public auction Ross’s Sales & Auctions, 241 Railway Parade, Maylands on Wednesday 
5 July 2006 at 10.00am. 
The auction is to be conducted by Mr Brad Buckle, Mr. Craig Edwards, Mr. Kevin Grickage. 

K. O’CALLAGHAN, Commissioner of Police, 
Western Australia Police Service. 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2243 

 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG401* 
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988 

LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS 
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and 
required to be advertised. Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about 
the objection process, should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming and Liquor, 1st Floor, Hyatt 
Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant 
industry organisation. 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE 
11455 Mark Richard 

Messenger & Vikki 
Ann Messenger 

Application for the grant of a Wholesaler's 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Margaret River and known as Zinful Wines 

02/07/2006

11457 Altitude WA Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Restaurant 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Ardross and known as Viva Restaurant 

16/07/2006

11459 Terrence T H Quah, 
Andrew B A Quah 
and Sally T H Quah 

Application for the grant of a Restaurant 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Ardross and known as The Silk Road—
Eastern Cuisine 

02/07/2006

11460 Gibindee Pty Ltd Application for the grant of a Producer's 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Busselton and known as Gibindee 

02/07/2006

11437 Universal Sodexho 
Pty Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Special 
Facility—Canteen Licence in respect of 
premises situated in Newman and known as 
Hope Downs Wetmess 

27/06/2006

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS 
27383 Beelara Pty Ltd Application for the grant of an extended 

trading permit—ongoing extended hours in 
respect of premises situated in Baldivis and 
known as Baldivis Liquor Store 

02/07/2006

APPLICATION FOR APPROVAL TO ALTER/REDEFINE THE LICENSED PREMISES 
258222 Karren Lee Milner Application for approval to alter/rredefine the 

licensed premises situated in Boulder and 
known as Metropole Hotel 

10/07/2006

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988. 

Dated: 21st June 2006. 
P. MINCHIN, Director of Liquor Licensing. 

WATER/SEWERAGE 

WA401* 
WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984 

WILUNA EFFLUENT CONVEYANCE: SHIRE OF WILUNA  
Proposal to Construct a New Effluent Holding Pond.  

To improve the effluent disposal process and contain treated effluent from the Wiluna Effluent 
Collection System, the Water Corporation proposes to construct an effluent holding pond of 
approximately 1 ha.  
The location of the proposed works are shown on the plan. The proposed works are scheduled to 
commence in September 2006 and will continue for approximately six months.  
A copy of this Notice of Proposal (referred to as HP76-0-1) is available for viewing, during office hours, 
at the Water Corporation’s Regional Office: Mid West Region, 45 Cathedral Avenue, Geraldton WA, 
and Head Office, 629 Newcastle Street Leederville.  



2244 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

Further information may also be obtained by contacting the Project Manager, Darren Jackson, on 
telephone (08) 9420 2651.  
Objections to the proposed works will be considered if lodged in writing to the Project Manager, 
Darren Jackson, PO Box 100, Leederville WA 6902, before close of business on 21 July 2006.  

 

——————————— 
 

WA402* 
WATER AGENCIES (POWERS) ACT 1984 

WILUNA EFFLUENT CONVEYANCE: SHIRE OF WILUNA  
Proposal to Construct Effluent Collection Mains and Pumping Stations 

To intercept septic effluent flows entering the three existing disposal ponds in the Shire of Wiluna, 
the Water Corporation proposes to construct— 

A—Below ground sewers of up to 150mm diameter 
Below ground pumping station 
Below ground pressure main (A) 
Below ground emergency overflow storage 

B—Below ground pumping stations 
Below ground pressure main (B) 
Below ground emergency overflow storage 

The location of the proposed works are shown on the plan. The proposed works are scheduled to 
commence in September 2006 and will continue for approximately six months.  
A copy of this Notice of Proposal (referred to as HP76-0-1) is held at the Water Corporation’s Regional 
Office, Geraldton and Head Office, 629 Newcastle Street, Leederville.  
Further information may be obtained by contacting Darren Jackson on telephone (08) 9420 2651.  
Objections to the proposed works will be considered if lodged in writing to the Project Manager, 
Darren Jackson c/o Water Corporation, PO Box 100, Leederville WA 6902, before close of business on 
7 July 2006.  

 



23 June 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 2245 

 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Any creditors having claims on the estate of the late Doris Hope Gangell of 60B Hamilton Street, 
Bassendean, deceased 30 March 2006, are required to send particulars of their claims to Mr & Mrs 
O’Brien, Executors, c/- Lynn & Brown Lawyers, PO Box 1114, Morley WA 6943 by 24 July 2006, after 
which date the executors may distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which they 
then have notice. 
 

——————————— 
 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice To Creditors And Claimants 
In the matter of the Will of Leonie Faye Green formerly of 30 Oakmont Avenue, Meadow springs in 
the State of Western Australia late of 20 Moorhew Gardens, Mariners Cove in the said State, 
Business Proprietor, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustee’s Act, 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 24th March, 2006 are required by the personal 
representatives Patricia Keel and Raylene Cleal to send particulars of their claims to them care of 
Clement & Co, Lawyers, Unit 2, 12 Sutton Street, Mandurah by the 30th July, 2006 after which date 
the personal representatives may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which 
they then have notice. 
Clement & Co as solicitors for the personal representatives. 
 

——————————— 
 

ZX403 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Ida Josephine Beurskens late of 20 Boronia Avenue, Nedlands WA 6009 in the state of Western 
Australia, Home Duties, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act of 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of Ida Josephine Beurskens deceased who died on the 20th February 2002 at 
Perth in the State of Western Australia are required by the personal representative Allan William 
Bradshaw of 61 Parkside Avenue, Mount Pleasant Western Australia to send particulars of their 
claims to Allan William Bradshaw, PO Box 4092, Myaree BC WA 6960 by the 28th day of July 2006 
after which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only 
to the claim for which he has then had notice. 
 

——————————— 
 

ZX404 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Lambertus Mathieu Beurskens late of 20 Boronia Avenue, Nedlands WA 6009 in the state of Western 
Australia, Widow, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act of 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of Lambertus Mathieu Beurskens deceased who died on the 23rd March 2006 at 
Perth in the State of Western Australia are required by the personal representative Allan William 
Bradshaw of 61 Parkside Avenue, Mount Pleasant Western Australia to send particulars of their 
claims to Allan William Bradshaw, PO Box 4092, Myaree BC WA 6960 by the 28th day of July 2006 
after which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only 
to the claim for which he has then had notice. 
 



2246 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 23 June 2006 

 

ZX405 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before the 16th July 2006 after which date I may convey or distribute the assets, 
having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 
Algar, Thelma Rose, late of Brightwater Care Group 19 Pioneer Drive Edgewater, died 18/5/2006, 

(DE19992487EM32) 
Hawkins, Elsie Jean, late of 20 Arundel Street Bayswater, died 5/6/2006, (DE19851533EM35) 
Hayes, Herbert James, late of Bentley, Park 204 Drummond Way Bentley, died 23/5/2006, 

(DE19702102EM13) 
Heller, Alice, late of 63 Archer Street Carlisle, died 8/5/2006, (DE19711610EM36) 
Lewandowski, Johann late of 177 Narrakine Road Narrogin, died 20/4/2006, (DE33047159EM36) 
Lyne, Brian Edward, late of 25A Higham Hill Swan View, died 8/6/2006, (DE19753318EM12) 
Pasqual, Michael Francis, late of 5 Dormans Road Morley, died 26/5/2006, (DE19761150EM34) 
Rizzi, Antonio also known as Anthony Rizzi, late of 284 Drake Street Morley, died 8/12/2005, 

(DE33030694EM113) 
Scale, Gladys, late of Unit 3/105 Safety Bay Road Shoalwater, died 3/4/2006, (DE19970871EM23) 
Smallacombe, Gilbert James, late of 8 Cassia Street Mandurah, died 30/3/2006, (DE33048236EM110) 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
Public Trust Office, 

565 Hay Street Perth WA 6000. 

Telephone: 9222 6777 
 

——————————— 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

!200600103GG! 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

RETIREMENT VILLAGES ACT 1992 
Price: $9.05 counter sales 

Plus postage on 105 grams 

————— 

RETIREMENT VILLAGES REGULATIONS 1992 
*Price: $5.30 counter sales 

Plus postage on 55 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 1992 
 

*Price: $14.65 counter sales 
Plus postage on 200 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 


