
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  3463 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, TUESDAY, 22 AUGUST 2006 No. 146 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Act 1987—Gaming and Wagering Commission 
Amendment Regulations 2006 ...............................................................................................  3465 

Pay-roll Tax Assessment Act 2002—Pay-roll Tax Assessment Amendment Regulations 
(No. 5) 2006.............................................................................................................................  3468 

Stamp Act 1921—Stamp Act section 119 Notice (No. 2) 2006 .................................................  3469 
 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Agriculture .................................................................................................................................  3470 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  3475 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  3470 
Fisheries .....................................................................................................................................  3470 
Heritage......................................................................................................................................  3471 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  3472 
Marine/Maritime........................................................................................................................  3473 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  3475 
Transport....................................................................................................................................  3475 
 
 



 

 

 
 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 
 
 
 

 

ADVERTISING RATES AND PAYMENTS 
EFFECTIVE FROM 1 JULY 2006 (Prices include GST). 

Deceased Estate notices, (per estate)—$23.70 

Real Estate and Business Agents and Finance Brokers Licences, (per notice)—$55.20 

Other articles in Public Notices Section—$55.20 minimum charge (except items of an
exceptionally large nature. In these instances arrangements will be made for pricing
the notice at time of lodging). 

All other Notices 

  Per Column Centimetre—$11.05 

  Bulk Notices—$201.70 per page 

Clients who have an account will be invoiced for advertising charges.  

Clients without an account will need to pay at time of lodging the notice. 
 



22 August 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3465 

 

— PART 1 — 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG301* 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Act 1987 

Gaming and Wagering Commission Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Gaming and Wagering Commission 
Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Gaming and 
Wagering Commission Regulations 1988*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 1 October 2004. 
  For amendments to 13 June 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 167.] 

3. Regulation 22 amended 

  Regulation 22(1)(b) is amended by deleting “30 games” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    32 games    ”. 

4. Regulation 23A amended 

  Regulation 23A(2) is repealed and the following subregulation 
is inserted instead —  

“     
 (2) In this regulation —  

 “prize” includes a jackpot prize; 



3466 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 August 2006 

 

 “value”, in relation to a prize, includes any projected 
value, estimated value or potential value of the 
prize. 

    ”. 

5. Regulation 24 amended 

  Regulation 24 is amended as follows: 

 (a) before “The total” by inserting the subregulation 
designation “(1)”;  

 (b) by deleting the Table and inserting the following Table 
instead —  

“     
Table 

Gross receipts Total of prizes Permitted 
variation 

$3 000 and under no limit — 

$3 001 and above 60% 5% 
    ”; 

 (c) at the end of the regulation by inserting —  

“     
 (2) If —  

 (a) a jackpot prize is offered at a session of bingo; 
and  

 (b) any part of that prize is funded from sources 
other than receipts from that session of bingo, 

  then for the purposes of this regulation the value of the 
part of the prize referred to in paragraph (b) is not 
included in the total of prizes for that session of bingo.  

    ”. 

6. Regulation 25 amended 

 (1) After regulation 25(2) the following subregulation is inserted —  

“     
 (2a) If —  

 (a) a jackpot prize is offered at a session of bingo; 
and  

 (b) any part of that prize is funded from sources 
other than receipts from that session of bingo, 

  then for the purposes of this regulation the value of the 
part of the prize referred to in paragraph (b) is not 
required to be included —  

 (c) in the total retail value of incentives; or  

 (d) in the calculation of expenses. 
    ”. 



22 August 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3467 

 

 (2) Regulation 25(3) is repealed and the following subregulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (3) For the purposes of this regulation the following shall 

be included in the calculation of the gross receipts —  

 (a) receipts from bingo; 

 (b) receipts from any —  

 (i) continuing lottery; or  

 (ii) lottery deemed to be permitted under 
section 103, 

  that is conducted at or in connection with a 
session of bingo. 

    ”. 

7. Regulation 26 amended 

 (1) Regulation 26(2) is repealed and the following subregulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
 (2) Any one or more of the following may be conducted or 

permitted to be conducted on the same premises as are 
used for the conduct of any session of bingo —  

 (a) a continuing lottery;  

 (b) a lottery deemed to be permitted under 
section 103; 

 (c) a standard lottery, other than a lottery deemed 
to be permitted under section 103;  

 (d) a trade promotion lottery where the aggregate 
of the value of the prizes offered or distributed 
does not exceed $3 000. 

    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 26(3) is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “a lottery” and inserting instead —  

“     
  a continuing lottery or a lottery deemed to be permitted 

under section 103 
    ”; 

 (b) in paragraphs (a) and (b) by inserting before “lottery” —  

  “    such    ”. 

8. Regulation 31 amended 

  Regulation 31 is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$500;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $1 000;    ”; 



3468 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 August 2006 

 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$1 000.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $2 000.    ”. 

9. Schedule 4 amended 

  Schedule 4 Part 1 clause 6(d) is deleted and the following 
paragraph is inserted instead —  

“     
 (d) a prize —  

 (i) may accumulate; and  

 (ii) may form part of a jackpot based on 
accumulated prize money, 

  but the total value of the accumulated prize or 
jackpot shall not exceed $3 000. 

    ”. 
 
By Command of the Governor, 
 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

TREASURY AND FINANCE 

TF301* 

Pay-roll Tax Assessment Act 2002 

Pay-roll Tax Assessment Amendment 
Regulations (No. 5) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Pay-roll Tax Assessment Amendment 
Regulations (No. 5) 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Pay-roll Tax 
Assessment Regulations 2003*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 27 June 2003, p. 2341-80. 
  For amendments to 17 July 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 285, and 
Gazette 2 May, 27 June and 11 July 2006.] 



22 August 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3469 

 

3. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “The Department of Conservation and Land 
Management”; 

 (b) by deleting “The Department of Environment” and 
inserting instead —  

  “    The Department of Environment and Conservation    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

TF302* 

Stamp Act 1921 

Stamp Act section 119 Notice (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Minister under section 119 of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This notice is the Stamp Act section 119 Notice (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Exempt body under section 119 

  For the purposes of section 119 of the Act, the Conservation and 
Land Management Executive Body established by the 
Conservation and Land Management Act 1984 section 36 is an 
exempt body with effect on and from the day on which this notice 
is published in the Gazette. 

 

ERIC RIPPER, Treasurer. 

Date: 7/8/06. 
 
 

——————————— 
 



3470 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 August 2006 

 

— PART 2 — 

AGRICULTURE 

AG401* 
PLANT DISEASES ACT 1914 

APPOINTMENTS 
Department of Agriculture, 

South Perth  WA  6151. 
I, the undersigned Minister for Agriculture and Food, being the Minister responsible for the 
administration of the Plant Diseases Act 1914, hereby appoint the following Officers as Authorised 
Inspectors pursuant to Section 7A of the said Act to carry out all the functions authorized to be 
performed by an Inspector under the said Act and its Regulations. 

Raema Kay Kitscha 
Karen Walters 

KIM CHANCE MLC, Minister for Agriculture and Food. 

ENERGY 

EN401* 
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23 (1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS 
Notice is given that the following Integrated Regional Licence has been granted— 

Licensee: Griffin Power Pty Ltd 
Issue Date: 14 August 2006 
Address of Licensee: 15th Floor 
 28 The Esplanade 
 Perth WA 6000 
Classification: Retail (ERL 12) 
Term of Licence: Up to and including 13 August 2021 
Area Covered: Licence area is the area within the South West Interconnected System in 

Western Australia as set out in Plan No. ERA-EL-103. 
Inspection of Licence: Economic Regulation Authority 
 6th Floor 
 197 St Georges Terrace 
 Perth WA 6000 
 http:// www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 

FISHERIES 

FI401* 
FISH RESOURCES MANAGEMENTACT 1994 

ABALONE MANAGEMENT PLAN 1992 
Clause 18—Notice of Approved Fish Processors 

I, Peter Rogers, Chief Executive Officer of the Department of Fisheries, pursuant to clause 18 of the 
Abalone Management Plan 1992, hereby nominate the persons listed below as approved fish 



22 August 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3471 

 

processors in respect of abalone. This Notice also revokes the previous Notice of Approved Fish 
Processors (Abalone Managed Fishery) of 8 May 2006. 

Approved Fish Processor Fish Processing Licence 
Esperance Abalone Enterprises Pty Ltd 1006 
Kailis & France Foods Pty Ltd 1064 
Leeuwin Star Pty Ltd 1151 
Lobster Australian Pty Ltd 1174 
N.C. Reid Pty Ltd 1115 
Colosseum Securities Pty Ltd 1042 
WA Seafood Exporters P/L 1005 
Wilson Diving Company Pty Ltd 1150 

Permitted species of abalone to be processed are listed on the respective Fish Processor Licences. 
Dated this 15th day of August 2006. 

P. P. ROGERS, Chief Executive Officer. 

HERITAGE 

HR401* 
HERITAGE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA ACT 1990 

ENTRY OF PLACES IN THE REGISTER OF HERITAGE PLACES 
Notice is hereby given in accordance with section 51(2) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 
that, pursuant to directions from the Minister for Heritage, the places described in Schedule 1 have 
been entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis with effect from today. 

Schedule 1 
Description of Place 

Ludlow Forestry Mill and Settlement at Ludlow Road, Ludlow; Lot 302 on DP 45948 being 
unallocated Crown land and being the whole of the land contained in CLT V 3138 F 213; Lot 307 on 
DP 45949 being unallocated Crown land and being the whole of the land contained in CLT V 3138 F 
218; Ptn of Lot 300 on DP 45943 being Ptn of Res 23004 and being part of the land contained in CLT 
V 3138 F 222; Lot 4509 on DP 91145 being Res 868 and being the whole of the land contained in CLT 
V 3138 F 221; Ptn of Lot 301 on DP 45948 being Ptn of State Forest No. 2 and being part of the land 
contained in CLT V 3138 F 212; Ptn of Lot 303 on DP 45949 being Ptn of State Forest No. 2 and being 
part of the land contained in CLT V 3138 F 214; Lot 304 on DP 45949 being Ptn of State Forest No. 2 
and being the whole of the land contained in CLT V 3138 F 215; Ptn of Lot 305 on DP 45949 being 
Ptn of State Forest No. 2 and being part of the land contained in CLT V 3138 F 216; Lot 306 on DP 
45949 being Ptn of State Forest No. 2 and being the whole of the land contained in CLT V 3138 F 217; 
Ptn of Lot 309 on DP 45967 being Ptn of dedicated road Res and being part of the land contained in 
CLT V 3138 F 220, together as shown on HCWA Survey Drawing No. 15834 prepared by Whelans 
dated 27 January 2005. 
Norwegian Bay Whaling Station (ruins) at Norwegian Bay N of Point Cloates, Ningaloo; Ptn of 
Lot 173 on DP 220577 being part of Crown Lease 29/1977 and part of the land contained in CLT V 
3085 F 468, Ptn of Lot 144 on DP 240276 being part of Res 40079 and part of the land contained in 
CLT V 3123 F 687 and Ptn of Marine Res No. 2 together as defined in HCWA Survey Drawing No. 
4231 prepared by Whelans and dated 15 February 2005. 
Point Cloates Lightstation (Ruin) at 160kms south of North West Cape, Ningaloo; That Ptn of Lot 
173 on DP 220577 being part of Crown Lease 29/1977 and part of the land contained in CLT V 3085 F 
468 as shown on HCWA Survey Drawing No. 5491 prepared by Midland Survey Services and dated 
19 January 2005. 

NOTICE OF ADVICE REGARDING REGISTRATION OF CROWN PROPERTY 
In accordance with section 47(5) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990, the Heritage Council 
hereby gives notice that it has advised the Minister for Heritage that it has resolved that— 
 1. the place listed in Schedule 2 is of cultural heritage significance, and is of value for the 

present community and future generations; 

 2. the protection afforded by the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990 is appropriate; and 
 3. the place should be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on an interim basis. 

The place will be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on an interim basis with effect from today 
in accordance with section 50(1)(b) of the Heritage of Western Australia Act 1990. The place listed in 
Schedule 2 is vested in the Crown, or in a person on behalf of the Crown, in right of the State. 

The Heritage Council hereby invites submissions as to whether the place listed in Schedule 2 should 
be entered in the Register of Heritage Places on a permanent basis. The submissions must be in 
writing and should be forwarded to the address set out below not later than 3 October 2006. 



3472 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 August 2006 

 

Schedule 2 
Description of Place 

Derby Town Commonage at Derby Highway, approximately 7km from Derby; Lot 1440 on DP 
32959 being part of Res 1326 and the whole of the land contained in CLT V 3129 Folio 148, portion of 
Lot 1434 on DP 32959 being part of Res 1326 and part of the land contained in CLT V 3129 F 142, Lot 
55 on DP 194348 being Res 28439 and the whole of the land contained in CLT V 3059 F 350 and 
portions of closed roads being unallocated Crown land together as shown on HCWA Survey Drawing 
No. 7214 prepared by Steffanoni Ewing & Cruickshank Pty Ltd. 

STEPHEN CARRICK, Acting Director, 
 Office of the Heritage Council of W.A. 

108 Adelaide Terrace East Perth WA 6004.  
22 August 2006. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Corrigin  
APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED PERSONS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons— 
Julian Murphy; Heather Blacklock; 
Greg Tomlinson;  Graeme Bissett; 
Mark Channon; Robert Criddle; 
Daniel Cunneen; Nick Darke; 
Frank Dickinson; Brydon Fare; 
Craig Fulwood; Allan Hamilton; 
Alan Johns; Peter Kirkwood; 
Shane McMiles; Shane Robinson; 
Darren Teasdale; Stanley White; 
Paul Wilkinson John McKenzie; 
Brian Willcox; 

Have been appointed as authorised persons in accordance with the following acts— 
Local Government Act (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1960, Part XX (Ranger/Pound Keeper) 
Local Government Act 1995, Part 3—Executive Functions of Local Government and Part 9—

Miscellaneous Provisions 
Caravan and Camping Grounds Act 1995 
Dog Act 1976 and Regulations 
Bush Fires Act 1954 and Regulations 
Litter Act 1979 and Regulations 
Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 1978 and Regulations 
Shire of Corrigin Local Laws 

The following persons have been authorised as Registration Officers in accordance with the Dog Act 
1976 and Regulations— 

Julian Murphy; 
Heather Blacklock; 
Sarah Whitehouse; 
Anita King; 
Shannon Aldworth; 
Karen Wilkinson and 
Brian Willcox. 

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled. 

JULIAN MURPHY, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

LG402* 
CITY OF BUNBURY 

AUTHORISED OFFICERS 
It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Dean Raymond Host, Mr Harold Bond Neil, Ms 
Jacquelyn Zena Robinson, Mr David John Lanigan, Mr Dean Ball and Mr Murray John Halden have 
been appointed as Authorised Officers and Authorised Persons with the municipality of the City of 



22 August 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3473 

 

Bunbury and are duly authorised under the following acts and local laws to act on behalf of the 
municipality of the City of Bunbury— 

Dog Act 1976, Dog Act Regulations and Dog Local Laws (as amended); 
Local Government Act 1995 and Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1995 (as 
amended); 
Litter Act 1979 and Litter Act Regulations (as amended); 
Control of Vehicles (Off-road Areas) Act 1978 and Control of Vehicles (Off-road Areas) Act 
Regulations (as amended); 
The purpose of control and supervision of any of the Local Laws of the City of Bunbury Council; 
and 
Bush Fires Act 1954 and Bush Fires Act Regulations (as amended). 

The fore-mentioned officers also are appointed as— 
Registration Officer in accordance with the Dog Act 1976; 
Fire Control Officer in accordance with Section 38 and 59 of the Bush Fires Act 1954 (as 
amended); 
Pound Keeper/Ranger pursuant to the provision of Part XX of the Local Government 
(miscellaneous provisions) Act 1995. 

It is hereby notified for public information that Louise Danielia Delport, Belinda Rosemary Sharp, 
Lorraine Helen Campbell, Zoe Adelle Ridgeway and Patricia Mary Blunt have been appointed under 
the provisions of the Dog Act 1976 as Registration Officers for the municipality of the City of 
Bunbury. 

G. TREVASKIS, Chief Executive Officer. 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MX401* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

Shire of Busselton 
BOATING PROHIBITED AREA 

Busselton Snorkel Trail 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 22 August 2006. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 66 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, the 
department hereby revokes Notice TR401 as published in the Government Gazette on 23 July 2004 
and closes the following waters to navigation by all craft until further notice— 

Busselton Snorkel Trail: All the waters of Geographe Bay bounded by lines commencing at a 
point 33° 39.156’ S, 115° 18.921’ E (the northern extremity of the groyne located on the shore 
between Bower Road and Craig Street); thence north for a distance of 50m to 33° 39.129’ S, 
115° 18.921’ E; thence east for a distance of 100m to 33° 39.129’ S, 115° 18.986’ E; thence south to 
the foreshore; thence generally westwards along the foreshore to the starting point. All 
coordinates based on GDA 94. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 

MX402* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

City of Joondalup 
RESTRICTED SPEED AREAS—ALL VESSELS 

Ocean Reef Marina 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 
Fremantle WA, 22 August 2006. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 67 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, the 
department hereby revokes paragraph (b)(4) of Notice MH401 as published in the Government Gazette 
on 25 October 1991 and by this notice limits the speed of motor vessels to five (5) knots within the 
following area— 

Ocean Reef Boat Harbour: All the waters contained therein and limited by lines extending 
from the extremity of the western breakwater to the point 31° 45.583’ S, 115° 43.573’ E 



3474 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 August 2006 

 

(corresponding to the entrance channel port marker) and from this point back to the extremity of 
the north breakwater. All coordinates based on GDA 94.  

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 
MX403* 

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 
City of Mandurah 

RESTRICTED SPEED AREAS—ALL VESSELS 
Mary Street Lagoon 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 
Fremantle WA, 22 August 2006. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 67 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, the 
department hereby revokes paragraph (b)(14)(ii) of Notice MH401 as published in the Government 
Gazette on 25 October 1991 and by this notice limits the speed of motor vessels to five (5) knots within 
the following area— 

Mary Street Lagoon: All the waters of the marina which lie to the west of a line drawn between 
points 32° 31.528’ S, 115° 42.568’ E, and 32° 31.545’ S, 115° 42.570’ E (corresponding to its 
junction with the Mandurah Estuary). All coordinates based on GDA 94. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 
MX404* 

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 
City of Mandurah 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
Prohibited Swimming Area 
Mandurah Ocean Marina 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 
Fremantle WA, 22 August 2006. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 10A(b) of the Navigable Waters Regulations, 
the department hereby revokes Notice TR401 as published in the Government Gazette on 7 September 
2001 and by this notice defines and sets aside the following area of navigable waters as an area where 
swimming is prohibited— 

Mandurah Ocean Marina: All the waters of the marina which lie to the east of a line drawn 
between points 32° 31.510’ S, 115° 42.711’ E and 32° 31.576’ S, 115° 42.758’ E (corresponding to 
its junction with the Mandurah Estuary). All coordinates based on GDA 94. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

——————————— 
 
MX405* 

WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 
City of Mandurah 

RESTRICTED SPEED AREAS—ALL VESSELS 
Mandurah Ocean Marina 

Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 
Fremantle WA, 22 August 2006. 

Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 67 of the Western Australian Marine Act 1982, the 
department hereby revokes paragraph (b)(14)(i) of Notice MH401 as published in the Government 
Gazette on 25 October 1991 and by this notice limits the speed of motor vessels to five (5) knots within 
the following area— 

Mandurah Ocean Marina: All the waters of the marina which lie to the east of a line drawn 
between points 32° 31.510’ S, 115° 42.711’ E and 32° 31.576’ S, 115° 42.758’ E (corresponding to 
its junction with the Mandurah Estuary). All coordinates based on GDA 94. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 



22 August 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3475 

 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
PETROLEUM (SUBMERGED LANDS) ACT 1967 

Section 37(1) 
DECLARATION OF A LOCATION 

I, William Lee Tinapple, Director Petroleum & Royalties Division of the Department of Industry and 
Resources for the State of Western Australia, delegate of the Designated Authority, in respect of the 
area specified as being adjacent to the State of Western Australia by virtue of an instrument of 
delegation dated 20 March 2006 and published in the Government Gazette of Western Australia on 
24March 2006, declare the below block to be a location for the purpose of Part III of the Act. 

Hamersley Range SF50 Map Sheet 
Block Nos. Field Location No. 

1153 Theo/Van Gogh 1SL/06-7 
1154   

The block is the subject of Exploration Permit No. WA155P held by— 
Apache Northwest Pty Ltd 
BHP Billiton Petroleum (Australia) Pty Ltd 
Inpex Alpha Ltd 

Dated at Perth on this 15th day of August 2006. 

W. L. TINAPPLE, Director, 
Petroleum And Royalties Division. 

TRANSPORT 

TR101 
CORRECTION 

PUBLIC TRANSPORT AUTHORITY ACT 2003 
CORRECTION TO TRANSFER ORDER 

Made by the Minister under Section 76(1) 
I, Alannah MacTiernan MLA, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure, order that the transfer order 
made under section 72(1) of the Act which was published in the Western Australian Government 
Gazette No 113 dated Tuesday, 1 July 2003, be corrected by deleting Schedule 12 (Contracts) and 
inserting new Schedule 12 (Contracts). 
The amended Schedule 12 (Contracts) has been signed by the Minister for identification and may be 
inspected during normal office hours at the Public Transport Centre, West Parade, Perth. 

ALANNAH MacTIERNAN MLA, Minister for Planning and Infrastructure. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Ruthven Pomfret late of Clarence Estate Hardie Road, Albany in the State of Western Australia, 
Retired Airline Pilot, deceased. 
Creditors arid other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of Ruthven Pomfret deceased who died on the 20th day of June 2006 at Clarence 
Estate Hardie Road Albany in the State of Western Australia are required by the personal 
representative David Malcolm Moss of 45 Duke Street, Albany Western Australia to send particulars 
of their claims to David Moss & Co of PO Box 5744, Albany W.A. 6332 by the 21st day of September 
2006 after which date the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard 
only to the claim for which he has then had notice. 



3476 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 August 2006 

 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
In the matter of the Will of Thomas Brian Trenouth formerly of 35A Charon Road, Falcon in the State 
of Western Australia late of 36 Belinda Loop, Melros in the said State, Retired Sheet Metal Worker, 
deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 28th July, 2006 are required by the personal 
representative to send particulars of their claims to her care of Clement & Co, Lawyers, Unit 2, 
12 Sutton Street, Mandurah by the 6th October, 2006 after which date the personal representative 
may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which she then has notice. 

CLEMENT & CO, as solicitors for the personal representative. 
 

——————————— 
 

ZX403 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Joseph John Angelo Spiteri late of 57 Hope Street, White Gum Valley, Western Australia, retired 
Flight Service Officer, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the deceased who died on 17 April 2006 are required by the Executor Mary Grace Spiteri to 
send particulars of their claim to them, care of Butcher Paull & Calder, 8th Floor, 231 Adelaide 
Terrace, Perth WA 6000 (Ref: 20060425) within One (1) month of the date of publication hereof after 
which date the Executors may convey or distribute the assets having regard to the claims of which 
they then have notice. 
Dated 18th August 2006. 

BUTCHER PAULL & CALDER, as solicitors for the Executors. 
 

——————————— 
 
 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Consolidated Loose Leaf Version 
(Including Index) 

 
$49.80 (incl. GST) Plus Postage 

Green Binder is an additional $17.20 if required 

Available from: 
State Law Publisher 

10 William Street, Perth 
Telephone: 9321 7688 

Fax: 9321 7536 
sales@dpc.wa.gov.au 



22 August 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3477 

 

 

Order your Bound Volumes of 
Government Gazette 2006 

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette 

 

For Government Departments and 
private firms who presently arrange 
binding for their copies of Government 
Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is 
now offering a subscription covering 4 
Quarterly Volumes at a cost of 
$1,098.90. 

The Gazettes will be bound in black 
cloth with gold foil lettering on the 
spine and personalised by  the addition 
of the client's name in gold lettering on 
the front cover. 

 

PLEASE NOTE 
On the rare occasion where extra 
gazettes are published in one quarter, a 
fifth volume may be required. In this 
instance the extra cost involved will be 
borne by the State Law Publisher and 
not passed on to clients. 

 
 

For further information please contact: 

State Law Publisher 

Telephone: 9321 7688 



3478 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 August 2006 

 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES 

(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS) 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State 
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the 
missing item. 

Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full. 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2007 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2007. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 876.70
  Interstate  ..................................... 893.20
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,220.00
 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,138.50
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 798.60
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 421.30
  Interstate ...................................... 501.60
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 578.00
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 345.40
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 831.60
  Interstate .................................... 1016.40
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 957.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 820.60
  Interstate ...................................... 832.70
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999  
 (per year) ........................................  851.40

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 297.00 
  Interstate ....................................... 330.00 
  Overseas ........................................ 305.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 818.40 

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)........................................ 295.90 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 320.10 
  Interstate ........................................ 330.00 
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 430.00 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA ...................................... 438.90 
  Interstate ....................................... 459.80 
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 622.00 

 

 

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is 
searchable. Other CD ROM products with 
legislation or other statutory information can 
be packaged to individual requirements.  
Prices are available on request. 

 
 

!200600146GG! 


