
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  4655 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 3 NOVEMBER 2006 No. 186 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Local Government Act 1995—Shire of Denmark—Local Government Property 
Amendment Local Law 2006..................................................................................................  4658 

Lotteries Commission Act 1990—Lotteries Commission (Super 66) Amendment Rules 
(No. 3) 2006.............................................................................................................................  4661 

Proclamations—Government Agreements Act 1979 ................................................................  4657 
Western Australian Meat Industry Authority Act 1976—Western Australian Meat 

Industry Authority Amendment Regulations 2006 ..............................................................  4657 
 

 
 

——— 
 
 

PART 2 
 

Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  4670 
Health.........................................................................................................................................  4662 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................  4663 
Land............................................................................................................................................  4664 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  4664 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  4667 
Parliament..................................................................................................................................  4669 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  4669 
Public Notices.............................................................................................................................  4671 
Racing, Gaming and Liquor.......................................................................................................  4670 
 
 



 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

PUBLISHING DETAILS FOR CHRISTMAS 2006 
AND NEW YEAR HOLIDAY PERIOD 2007 

————— 

NOTE: Due to Tuesday 26th December being a public holiday there will not be a gazette 
published on that day 

 Publishing Dates Closing Dates and Times 
 and times for copy 

Friday 29 December 2006 at 3.30 pm Wednesday 27 December 2006 at 12 noon 

Tuesday 2 January 2007 at 3.30 pm Friday 29 December 2006 at 12 noon 



3 November 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4657 

— PART 1 — 

PROCLAMATIONS 

AA101* 
GOVERNMENT AGREEMENTS ACT 1979 

PROCLAMATION 
Western Australia 

By His Excellency 
Doctor Kenneth Comninos Michael, 
Companion of the Order of Australia, 

Governor of the State of Western Australia 
KENNETH COMNINOS MICHAEL 

Governor 

 

[L.S.] 

I, the Governor, acting under the Government Agreements Act 1979 section 2 and 
with the advice and consent of the Executive Council, declare that the agreement 
scheduled to the Railway and Port (The Pilbara Infrastructure Pty Ltd) Agreement 
Act 2004 is a Government agreement for the purposes of the Government Agreements 
Act 1979. 
Given under my hand and the Public Seal of the State on 24th October 2006. 
By Command of the Governor, 

A. J. CARPENTER, Minister for State Development. 

AGRICULTURE 

AG301* 

Western Australian Meat Industry Authority Act 1976 

Western Australian Meat Industry Authority 
Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council after consultation with the 
Western Australian Meat Industry Authority. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Western Australian Meat Industry 
Authority Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Western 
Australian Meat Industry Authority Regulations 1985*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 3 February 2006.] 



4658 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3 November 2006 

3. Schedule 6 amended 

 (1) Schedule 6 Part 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “$2.50” and inserting instead —  

  “    $2.60    ”; 

 (b) by deleting “$3.80” in both places where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $4.00    ”; 

 (c) by deleting “$0.43” in each place where it occurs and 
inserting instead —  

  “    $0.45    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 6 Part 3 is amended by deleting “$0.80” in each place 
where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    $0.85    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

G. M. PIKE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG301* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Denmark 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT PROPERTY AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2006 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and under all other 
powers enabling it, the Council of the Shire of Denmark resolved on the 24 October          
2006 to make the “Shire of Denmark Local Government Property Amendment Local 
Law 2006”. 

1. Citation 
This local law is cited as the Shire of Denmark Local Government Property 
Amendment Local Law 2006. 

2. Principal local law amended 
The Shire of Denmark Local Government Property Local Law as published in the 
Government Gazette on 29 May 2001 is referred to as the principal local law. The 
principal local law is amended as follows. 

3. Table of Contents amended 
The Table of Contents is amended by— 
 (a) deleting “LOCAL GOVERNMENT” in the heading for Part 5; 
 (b) inserting under the heading for clause 5.6— 

“Division 5—Central Business District 
 5.7  Use of wheeled recreational device prohibited”; 
 (c) in the heading for clause 8.2, inserting “,a thoroughfare or footpath” after 

“property”; and 
 (d) inserting “SCHEDULE 3—CENTRAL BUSINESS DISTRICT” under 

“SCHEDULE 2—DETERMINATIONS”. 

4. Clause 1.2 amended 
Clause 1.2 is amended by— 
 (a) inserting in the appropriate alphabetical position the following definitions— 

“bicycle” means a vehicle with two or more wheels that is built to be 
propelled by human power through a belt, chain or gears (whether or not 



3 November 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4659 

it has an auxiliary motor) but not including a wheelchair, wheeled 
recreational device, wheeled toy, scooter or a powered-assisted pedal 
cycle (if the motor is operating); 

“Central Business District” means all of the land contained within 
Schedule 3; 

“footpath” includes every footpath, pedestrian access way or other place— 
 (a) intended for the use of pedestrians only, or in the case of a dual 

use path, for the use of pedestrians and bicyclists only; or  
 (b) habitually used by pedestrians and not by vehicles or, in the 

case of a dual use path, of pedestrians and bicyclists and not by 
vehicles other than bicycles; 

“wheeled recreational device” means a wheeled device, built to transport 
a person, propelled by human power or gravity, and ordinarily used for 
recreation or play, including— 

 (a) rollerblades, rollerskates, a skateboard or similar wheeled 
device;  

 (b) a scooter being used by a person aged 12 years of age or older; 
and  

 (c) a unicycle,  
but not including a pram, stroller, trolley, bicycle, wheelchair or wheeled 
toy; and 

“wheeled toy” means a child’s pedal car, tricycle, a scooter or a similar toy, 
but only if it is being used by a child under 12 years of age.”; 

 (b) in the definition of “trading”, delete “and” after “to them;”; and 
 (c) in the definition of “vehicle”, delete “.” after “boat” and insert instead— 

“;”. 

5. Heading amended 
The heading for Part 5 is amended by deleting “LOCAL GOVERNMENT” after 
“PARTICULAR”. 

6. Division 5 inserted 
In Part 5, insert the following division after clause 5.6— 

“Division 5—Central Business District 
Use of wheeled recreational device prohibited 

 5.7 A person shall not use or travel in or on, a wheeled recreational device on— 
 (a) local government property; 
 (b) a public thoroughfare; or 
 (c)  a footpath, 
  that is part of the Central Business District, unless authorized by a 

determination made under clause 2.1(1)(a).”. 

7. Clause 8.1 amended 
Clause 8.1 is amended by inserting “, a public thoroughfare or footpath” after 
“property”. 

8. Clause 8.2 amended 
Clause 8.2 is amended by— 
 (a) in the heading, inserting “, a public thoroughfare or footpath” after 

“property”; 
 (b) inserting “, a public thoroughfare or footpath” after “property”; and 
 (c) inserting “this local law or any other” after “provision of”. 

9. Schedule 1 amended 
The table in Schedule 1 is amended by deleting the rows relating to clauses 5.7(1), 
5.7(2) and 5.7(3) and inserting instead— 

 “ 5.7 Unauthorized use of, or travel in or on, a wheeled 
recreational device in Central Business District 

50  

”. 

10. Schedule 3 inserted 
The following schedule is inserted after Schedule 2— 

 “SCHEDULE 3 
CENTRAL BUSINESS DISTRICT 
The Central Business District is defined as— 

that area of land contained within the boundary commencing at a point on 
the eastern side of the Hollings Road and Barnett Street intersection, 



4660 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3 November 2006 

travelling generally north west along the east side of Hollings Road and 
Horsley Road to the northern point of Reserve 19912 then due west along 
the southern side of North Street crossing to the western side of Strickland 
Street at lot 150, proceeding south east along the western side of Strickland 
Street to the southerly point of lot 150, then crossing Mt Shadforth Road to 
the north boundary point of lot 2 where it adjoins lot 218, then following the 
boundary of lot 2 south-east and south-west to the southern most corner of 
that lot, then south crossing South Coast Highway to the western most 
corner of lot 935 following that lot boundary and the eastern side of Price 
Street proceeding generally south to the southern side of the Barnett Street 
intersection and along that side of Barnett Street proceeding north east to 
the commencement point.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

———— 

Dated this 30th day of October 2006. 
The common seal of the Shire of Denmark was affixed by authority of a resolution of 
the Council in the presence of— 

J. K. BARROW, Shire President. 
P. DURTANOVICH, Chief Executive Officer. 

 

 

 

 

——————————— 
 



3 November 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4661 

LOTTERIES 
LO301* 

Lotteries Commission Act 1990 

Lotteries Commission (Super 66) Amendment 
Rules (No. 3) 2006 

Made by the Lotteries Commission under section 28(1) of the Act. 

1. Citation 

  These rules are the Lotteries Commission (Super 66) 
Amendment Rules (No. 3) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These rules come into operation on 21 January 2007, and apply 
to super 66 draw No. 2663 and the super 66 draws following 
that draw. 

3. The rules amended 

  The amendments in these rules are to the Lotteries Commission 
(Super 66) Rules 1996*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 4 July 2003. 
  For amendments to 18 September 2006 see Western 

Australian Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, 
p. 243 and Gazette 21 April 2006.] 

4. Rule 17 amended 

  Rule 17(2) is repealed and the following subrule is inserted 
instead —  

“     
 (2) Where there is no super 66 division 1 prize winner for 

26 consecutive super 66 draws, the Commission must 
allocate the accumulated division 1 prize pool in the 
26th super 66 draw the next lowest division in which 
there is a winner in that draw. 

    ”. 

5. Part 7 repealed 

  Part 7 is repealed. 

The Common Seal of the  ) 
Commission was affixed on the ) L.S. 
21st day of September 2006, ) 
by order and in the presence of —  ) 

CLYDE BEVAN, Chairperson. 

ROGER LEWIS, Member. 

ANNE CONTI, Member. 



4662 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3 November 2006 

— PART 2 — 

HEALTH 

HE401* 
MENTAL HEALTH ACT 1996 

MENTAL HEALTH (AUTHORIZED MENTAL HEALTH 
PRACTITIONERS) REVOCATION ORDER (NO. 6) 2006 

Made by the Chief Psychiatrist under section 20. 

Citation 
1. This order may be cited as the Mental Health (Authorized Mental Health Practitioners) Revocation 
Order (No. 6) 2006. 

Commencement 
2. This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Gazette. 

Revocation of designation 
3. The designation, as an authorized mental health practitioner, of the mental health practitioners 
specified in Schedule 1 to this order is revoked. 

Schedule 1 
Name Profession 
Booth, Janet Mental Health Nurse 
Wallis, Bev Mental Health Nurse 

Dated: 26th October 2006. 

Dr ROWAN DAVIDSON, Chief Psychiatrist. 
 

——————————— 
 

HE402* 
MENTAL HEALTH ACT 1996 

MENTAL HEALTH (AUTHORIZED MENTAL HEALTH 
PRACTITIONERS) ORDER (NO. 7) 2006 

Made by the Chief Psychiatrist under section 20. 

Citation 
1. This order may be cited as the Mental Health (Authorized Mental Health Practitioners) Order 
(No. 7) 2006. 

Commencement 
2. This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Gazette. 

Authorized mental health practitioner 
3. The mental health practitioners specified in Schedule 1 to this order are designated as authorized 
mental health practitioners. 

Schedule 1 
Name Profession 
Carr, Phil Mental Health Nurse 
Gill, Bridget Jacqueline Mental Health Nurse 
Jones, Bryan Mental Health Nurse 
Julian, Leanne Social Worker 
Kiely, Marian Mental Health Nurse 
Sunley, Julie Mental Health Nurse 
Tate, Catherine Mental Health Nurse 
Wilkie, Stephen Mental Health Nurse 

Dated: 26th October 2006. 

Dr ROWAN DAVIDSON, Chief Psychiatrist. 



3 November 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4663 

HE403 
MEDICAL ACT 1894 

MEDICAL (UNMET AREA OF NEED) DETERMINATION (NO. 28) 2006 
Made by the Minister for Health pursuant to section 11AF of the Medical Act 1894. 

Citation 
1. This determination may be cited as the Medical (Unmet Area of Need) Determination (No. 28) 2006. 

Commencement 
2. This determination comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government 
Gazette. 

Unmet Area of need 
3. The area of need specified in the Schedule is determined to be an unmet area of need for the 
purposes of section 11AF(1)D of the Act. 

Expiry of determination 
4. This determination expires 2 years after its commencement. 

Schedule 
General Medical Services in the Shire of Capel 

Dated this 26th day of October 2006. 

JIM McGINTY, MLA, Minister for Health. 
 

——————————— 
 

HE404 
MEDICAL ACT 1894 

MEDICAL (UNMET AREA OF NEED) DETERMINATION (NO. 29) 2006 
Made by the Minister for Health pursuant to section 11AF of the Medical Act 1894. 

Citation 
1. This determination may be cited as the Medical (Unmet Area of Need) Determination (No. 29) 2006. 

Commencement 
2. This determination comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government 
Gazette. 

Unmet Area of need 
3. The area of need specified in the Schedule is determined to be an unmet area of need for the 
purposes of section 11AF(1)D of the Act. 

Expiry of determination 
4. This determination expires 2 years after its commencement. 

Schedule 
General Medical Services in the suburb of Merriwa in the City of Wanneroo. 

Dated this 26th day of October 2006. 

JIM McGINTY, MLA, Minister for Health. 

JUSTICE 

JU401* 
JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 

RESIGNATIONS 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Minister has accepted the resignation of— 

John Clifton Clapin of 3A Kingsmill Street, Claremont 
Brian Henry Gibson of 7 Armstrong Street, Halls Head 
Gilbert May Goodwin of 5 Pine Street, Yungaburra 

from the Office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia. 

JOANNE STAMPALIA, A/Executive Director, 
Court and Tribunal Services. 



4664 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3 November 2006 

JU402* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 

KINNAIRD JON PIERRE AP 0160 28/10/06 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

 BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager, 
30 October 2006. Acacia Prison Contract. 
 

——————————— 
 

JU403* 
PRISONS ACT 1981 

PERMIT DETAILS 
Pursuant to the provisions of section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981, the Commissioner of the 
Department of Corrective Services has revoked the following Permit to do High-Level Security 
Work— 

Surname Other Names Permit No. Revocation Date 

JACKSON MATTHEW ERROL AP 0373 01/11/06 

This notice is published under section 15P of the Prisons Act 1981. 

 BRIAN LAWRENCE, Manager, 
1 November 2006. Acacia Prison Contract. 

LAND 

LA401* 
DAMPIER TO BUNBURY PIPELINE ACT 1997 

DESIGNATED LAND 
I, Tony McRae, DBNGP Land Access Minister, give notice in accordance with section 33(1) of the 
Dampier to Bunbury Pipeline Act 1997 that the land the subject of the LAND DESCRIPTION 
described below is designated, at the beginning of the day this notice is published in the Government 
Gazette, as additional land in the DBNGP corridor. 

LAND DESCRIPTION 
1. Portion of Lot 1 on Diagram 20497 as shown as DBNGP corridor marked Y on Deposited Plan 
39004 being part of the land comprised in Certificate of Title Volume 1974 Folio 453. 
The Plans may be inspected at the Department of Land Information, Midland Square, Midland. 

TONY McRAE MLA, DBNGP Land Access Minister. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 

LG401* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Dandaragan 
FIRE CONTROL OFFICERS 

Notice is hereby given that Grant Douglas Creagh, Richard James McKnight Hamilton and Hugh 
Bryan Roberts have been appointed to the position of Fire Control Officer with the Shire of 
Dandaragan and that the appointment of John Oriel Cusack and Alan John Grigson have been 
cancelled. 
Dated: 27 October 2006. 

CLINTON STRUGNELL, Chief Executive Officer. 



3 November 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4665 

LG402* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Wickepin 
APPOINTMENT OF OFFICERS 

It is hereby notified for public information that in accordance with Section 38 of the Act the following 
persons have been appointed as Fire Control Officers for the 2006/07 season— 

Chief Fire Control Officer Keith Parnell 
Deputy Chief Fire Control Officer Wes Astbury 
Fire Control Officers— 

Wickepin Rex Bergin 
Townsendale Steven Rose 
 Claude Simpson 
 Roger Butler 
East Wickepin Phil Spark 
86 Gate Barney Langford 
 Tim Heffernan 
 Ashley Lewis 
 Peter Stacey 
Tincurrin/Toolibin Lachlan White 
 Keith Parnell 
Harrismith Wes Astbury 
 David Quartermaine 
Yealering (Fire Weather Officer only) Colin Coxon 

Dual Fire Control Officers— 
Narrogin Rex Bergin & Lachlan White 
Pingelly Claude Simpson 
Kulin Ashley Lewis & Wes Astbury 
Wagin Lachlan White 
Cuballing Steven Rose 
Corrigin Ashley Lewis 
Dumbleyung Keith Parnell & Wes Astbury 

 

——————————— 
 

LG403* 
LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 

Shire of Narembeen 
APPOINTMENT OF AUTHORISED PERSONS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the following persons— 
Ryan Nicholas Duff 
Natalie Jane Purdy 
Arthur Cousins 
Michael Richard Lethlean 
Brian Willcox 

have been appointed as authorised persons in accordance with the following acts— 
Local Government Act (Miscellaneous Provisions) 1960, Part XX (Ranger/Pound Keeper) 
Local Government Act 1995, Part 3—Executive Functions of Local Government and Part 9—
Miscellaneous Provisions 
Caravan and Camping Grounds Act 1995 
Dog Act 1976 and Regulations 
Bush Fires Act 1954 and Regulations 
Litter Act 1979 and Regulations 
Control of Vehicles (Off Road Areas) Act 19978 and Regulations 
Shire of Narembeen Local Laws 

The following persons have been authorised as Registrations Officers in accordance with the Dog Act 
1976 and Regulations— 

Ryan Nicholas Duff 
Natalie Jane Purdy 
Rebecca Ann Hunter 
Claire Stirrat 
Taryn Maree Bristow 

All previous appointments are hereby cancelled. 

RYAN DUFF, Chief Executive Officer. 



4666 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3 November 2006 

LG502* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Wickepin 
NOTICE TO ALL OWNERS AND OCCUPIERS OF LAND 

Pursuant to the powers contained in Section 33 of the Bush Fires Act 1954, owners and occupiers of 
property within the Shire of Wickepin are hereby required on or before 1 October 2006 and thereafter 
to 28 April 2007 to plough, scarify or otherwise provide and maintain firebreaks clear of all 
inflammable material at least 2.5 metres wide as follows— 
 1. Rural Land 
 a. Inside the boundary of all land held by each owner or occupier, their firebreaks need 

not follow the perimeter of any paddock but will be acceptable following land contours 
in an endeavour to overcome water erosion; and 

 b. To subdivide each holding into lots of no greater than 200 hectares; and 
 c. To surround the homestead, out buildings and fuel storages on any such land.    
 2. Townsite Land 
  All lots within the townsites of Harrismith, Tincurrin, Toolibin, Wickepin and Yealering are 

required to be cleared and maintained free of all debris or inflammable material. Failure to 
comply with these requirements renders the owner or occupier liable to a penalty not more 
than $400. 

Standard of Fire Breaks and Penalties to be Imposed— 
Category 1 14 days notice given to have the breaks put in. 
 Penalty = no fine applied 
Category 2 A category 1 offender in the past automatically becomes a category 2. 
 Penalty = 21 days notice given to apply—$80 fine 
Category 3 A category 2 offender in the past automatically becomes a category 3. 
 Penalty = immediate prosecution by council, $1000 fine plus costs to put 

breaks in. 
If the requirements of this notice are carried out by burning, such burning must be in accordance with 
Section 18 of the Bush Fires Act. Permits are to be obtained from your Bush Fire Control Officer. 

Restricted and Prohibited Burning Times 
Restricted 1 October 2006 to 13 November 2006 
Prohibited 14 November 2006 to 7 February 2007 
Restricted 8 February 2007 to 28 April 2007 

Automatic Harvest Bans  
An automatic Harvest Ban applies throughout the Shire on Christmas Day, New Years Day, no 
lighting of fires on Good Friday, and Easter Sunday each year. 

ALAN J. LEESON, Chief Executive Officer. 
 

——————————— 
 

LG501* 
BUSH FIRES ACT 1954 

Shire of Lake Grace 
FIREBREAK NOTICE 

Notice to All Owners and Occupiers of Land 
Pursuant to the powers contained in section 33 of the above Act, you are hereby required on or before 
the first day of November up to and including the 31st day of March the following year, to have a 
firebreak clear of all inflammable material in accordance with the following— 
 (i) RURAL LAND 
 1.   (a) Immediately inside all external boundaries of the property or as is practicable, 

firebreaks of not less than 3 metres wide and 
 (b) Where buildings, haystacks, fuel ramps, fuel tanks and stored fuel drums are 

situated on land, firebreaks of not less than 2.5 metres wide within 33.5 metres 
of the perimeter of such buildings, haystacks, fuel ramps, fuel tanks and stored 
fuel drums in such manner as to completely encircle the buildings, haystacks, 
fuel ramps, fuel tanks and stored fuel drums and; 

 2. Where land is in crop and adjoins the railway line reserve a firebreak of not less than 
3 metres wide encircling the crop and; 

 3.   (a) Immediately surrounding an aerial landing ground situated on the land a 
firebreak of not less than 6 metres wide and; 

 (b) Any aerial landing ground used as the motor start up, refuelling and 
maintenance area to be completely cleared of all flammable materials for a radius 
of 18 metres and; 



3 November 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4667 

 4. Maintain clear of all flammable materials all townsite blocks and; 
 5. Where bush or land has been bulldozed, chained or prepared in any similar manner for 

clearing by burning (whether intended to burn the bush or not), provide a firebreak of 
NOT LESS THAN 13 METRES WIDE inside the external boundaries of the land so 
prepared. If you become owner or occupier of land after the first day of November, 2006, 
the requirements of this notice are varied so as to require you to comply with the terms 
of this notice within fourteen days of the date of your becoming owner or occupier of 
such land, instead of on or before the first day of November, 2006. The firebreaks 
required by this notice are to be maintained clear of flammable materials up to and 
including the 31st day of March, 2007. 

 6. A readily mobile operational fire fighting unit containing a minimum of 400 litres of 
water on standby and available for inspection is required during the period 1 November 
2006 to 31 March 2007. 

 (ii) TOWN LAND 
 1. Where the area of the land is 0.202 hectares (half an acre) or less all inflammable 

material on the land shall be removed from the whole of the land; and 
 2. Where the land exceeds 0.202 hectares (half an acre) in area, firebreaks at least 

2 metres wide shall be cleared of all inflammable material immediately inside all 
external boundaries of the land and also immediately surrounding all buildings 
situated on the land. 

GENERAL 
If it is considered to be impracticable for any reason to clear firebreaks or to remove inflammable 
material from land or any other provisions required by this notice you may apply to the Council or its’ 
duly authorised officer not later than 30 October, for permission to provide firebreaks in alternative 
positions or to take alternative action to abate fire hazards on the land. If permission is granted by 
Council or its’ duly authorised officer, you shall comply with the requirements of this notice. 
“Inflammable Material” is defined for the purpose of this Order to include bush (as defined in the 
Bush Fires Act), timber, boxes, cartons, paper and like inflammable materials, rubbish and also any 
combustible matter, but does not include green standing trees or growing bushes and plants in 
gardens, or lawns. 
The penalty for failing to comply with this notice is a fine of not more than $1,000 or a penalty of $100 
may be incurred by issue of an infringement notice, and a person in default is also liable, whether 
prosecuted or not, to pay the cost of performing the work directed in this notice if it is not carried out 
by the owner or occupier before the date required by this notice. 
If the requirements of this notice are carried out by burning, such burning must be in accordance with 
the relevant provision of the Bush Fires Act. A permit to burn is required during the restricted 
burning period from an authorised officer. Permits are not valid on Sundays or public holidays. 
By Order of the Council, 

CHRIS JACKSON, Chief Executive Officer. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Industry & Resources, 

KALGOORLIE WA 6430. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following Prospecting Licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the 
Mining Act 1978 for breach of covenant, viz. non-compliance with the expenditure condition &/or  
non-compliance with the reporting requirement. 

K. AUTY (SM), Warden. 

———— 

To be heard in the Warden’s Court, Kalgoorlie on 19 December 2006. 

EAST COOLGARDIE MINERAL FIELD 
26/2903—Solomon (Australia) Pty Ltd 
26/2993—Solomon (Australia) Pty Ltd 



4668 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3 November 2006 

MP402 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Industry and 

Resources, Leonora. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining 
Act 1978, for breach of covenant, viz, non-payment of rent 

D. TEMBY, Warden. 

———— 

To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 29 November 2006. 

EAST MURCHISON MINERAL FIELD 
Lawlers District 

Prospecting Licence 
P36/1518—Bennett, Jeffrey Steven 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Morgans District 

Prospecting Licences 
P39/3958—Crew, Ross Frederick 
P39/4235—Collins, Melissa 
 Knight, Edward William 
 Lydeamore, Donald Murray 
 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 
 

MP403 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Industry and 

Resources, Leonora. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining 
Act 1978, for breach of covenant, viz, failure to lodge a report within the prescribed period. 

D. TEMBY, Warden. 

———— 

To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 29 November 2006. 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Malcolm District 

Prospecting Licence 
P37/6706—Williams, Norman Andrew 
 Williams, Thomas Geoffrey 

Mount Margaret District 
Prospecting Licence 

P38/2892—Gondwana Resources Ltd 
Mount Morgans District 

Prospecting Licence 
P39/3802—Smith, Glen Jangala 
 Smith, Joseph Rex 
 Woodley, David John 



3 November 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4669 

MP404 
MINING ACT 1978 

APPLICATION FOR AN ORDER FOR FORFEITURE 
Department of Industry and 

Resources, Leonora. 
In accordance with Regulation 49(2)(c) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that the 
following licences are liable to forfeiture under the provisions of Section 96(1)(a) of the Mining 
Act 1978, for breach of covenant, viz, failure to comply with the prescribed expenditure conditions. 

D. TEMBY, Warden. 

———— 
To be heard in the Warden’s Court at Leonora on 29 November 2006. 

MOUNT MARGARET MINERAL FIELD 
Mount Malcolm District 

Prospecting Licences 
P37/6709—Hawtin, Dennis James 
P37/6710—Hawtin, Dennis James 
P37/6711—Hawtin, Dennis James 
P37/6712—Hawtin, Dennis James 
P37/6713—Hawtin, Dennis James 

Mount Margaret District 
Prospecting Licence 

P38/3088—Excalibur Mining Corporation Ltd 
 Pocketmail Group Ltd 

PARLIAMENT 

PA401* 
PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

Royal Assent to Bills 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor has Assented in the name and on behalf 
of Her Majesty the Queen, on the dates shown, to the undermentioned Bills passed by the Legislative 
Council and the Legislative Assembly during the First Session of the Thirty-Seventh Parliament. 

Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No. 
Volunteers (Protection from Liability) Amendment Bill 2006 26 October 2006 53 of 2006 
Road Traffic Amendment Bill 2006 26 October 2006 54 of 2006 
Electoral Reform (Electoral Funding) Bill 2006 26 October 2006 55 of 2006 

MIA BETJEMAN, Clerk of the Parliaments. 
30 October 2006. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Stirling 

District Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 421 
Ref: 853/2/20/34 Pt 421 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of Stirling 
local planning scheme amendment on 17 October 2006 for the purpose of applying an “Additional 
use—Consulting Rooms and Offices” to the existing “Medium Density Residential R40” zoning on Lot 
6081 HN 182, Scarborough Beach Road, Doubleview as depicted on the Scheme Amendment Map. 

T. J. TYZACK, Mayor. 
L. DELAHAUNTY, Chief Executive Officer. 



4670 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3 November 2006 

PI402* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

NOTICE OF RESOLUTION 
Clause 32 (No. 63) 

Coastal Buildings Above Specified Heights 
File: 810-2-1-11 
The Western Australian Planning Commission (the Commission) acting pursuant to clause 32 of the 
Metropolitan Region Scheme (MRS) has resolved to— 

 1. Revoke resolution No. 62 made by the Commission and published in the Government Gazette 
of 2 August 2005. 

 2. Require the local governments of the Cities of Wanneroo, Joondalup, Stirling, Nedlands, 
Fremantle, Kwinana, Cockburn and Rockingham and the Towns of Cambridge, Cottesloe and 
Mosman Park to refer for determination by the Commission all applications for approval to 
commence development for residential (including short stay residential), car-parking, retail, 
office or hotel purposes, or any combination of these uses, exceeding five storeys or 21 metres 
in height (or both), (or exceeding eight storeys or 32 metres in height (or both) where a height 
of eight storeys or more is permissible under the local government scheme) on land within 
300 metres of the horizontal setback datum defined in State Planning Policy No. 2.6 and 
shown on WAPC Plan No. 0.0728 and in more detail on plans 2.0771, 2.0772, 2.0773, 2.0774, 
2.0775, 2.0776, 2.0777, 2.0778, 2.0779 and 2.0780 (being Maps 1 of 10 to 10 of 10 
respectively). 

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

 
 

——————————— 
 
 

PI403* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

NOTICE OF RESOLUTION 
Clause 21 (No. 3) 

Coastal Buildings Above Specified Heights 
File: 810-6-1-2 
The Western Australian Planning Commission (the Commission) acting pursuant to clause 21 of the 
Peel Region Scheme (PRS) to— 

 1. Revoke resolution No. 2 made by the Commission and published in the Government Gazette of 
2 August 2005. 

 2. Require the local governments of the City of Mandurah and Shire of Waroona to refer for 
determination by the Commission all applications for approval for any development for 
residential (including short stay residential), car-parking, retail, office or hotel purposes, or 
any combination of these uses, exceeding five storeys or 21 metres in height (or both) (or 
exceeding eight storeys or 32 metres in height (or both) where a height of eight storeys or 
more is permissible under the local government scheme) on land within 300 metres of the 
horizontal setback datum of the coast as defined in State Planning Policy No.2.6 and 
described on WAPC Plan No. 0.0729. 

MOSHE GILOVITZ, Secretary, 
Western Australian Planning Commission. 

RACING, GAMING AND LIQUOR 

RG401 
LIQUOR LICENSING ACT 1988 

LIQUOR LICENSING APPLICATIONS 
The following is a summary of applications received under the Liquor Licensing Act 1988 and 
required to be advertised. Any person wishing to obtain more details about any application, or about 
the objection process, should contact the Department of Racing, Gaming and Liquor, 1st Floor, Hyatt 
Centre, 87 Adelaide Terrace, Perth, Telephone: (08) 9425 1888, or consult a solicitor or relevant 
industry organisation. 



3 November 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4671 

 Last Date 
App. No. Applicant Nature of Application for 
   Objections 

APPLICATIONS FOR THE GRANT OF A LICENCE 
11700 Wayne Victor Galea Application for the grant of a Producer’s 

licence in respect of premises situated in 
Forest Grove and known as Penny Lane 
Estate 

13/11/2006 

11692 Morris Corporation 
(WA) Pty Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Special 
Facility—Canteen licence in respect of 
premises situated in Whim Creek and known 
as Indee Gold Project Village 

12/11/2006 

11706 Mendosa Holdings 
Pty Ltd 

Application for the grant of a Producer’s 
licence in respect of premises situated in 
Wilyabrup and known as Heydon Vineyard 

19/11/2006 

APPLICATIONS FOR EXTENDED TRADING PERMITS—ONGOING EXTENDED HOURS 
28803 Pharoh Investments 

Pty Ltd 
Application for the grant of an extended 
trading permit—ongoing extended hours, in 
respect of premises situated in Karratha and 
known as Karratha International Hotel 

16/11/2006 

This notice is published under section 67(5) of the Liquor Licensing Act 1988. 

Dated: 1 November 2006. 
P. MINCHIN, Director of Liquor Licensing. 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Ottavia Frati Fontana, late of 208/128 Carr Street, West Perth in the State of Western Australia, 
Business Proprietor, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of Ottavia Frati Fontana, deceased who died on the 7th day of July 2005 
intestate at West Perth, Western Australia are required by the personal representative, David 
Malcolm Moss of 45 Duke Street, Albany, Western Australia to send particulars of their claims to 
David Moss & Co of PO Box 5744, Albany WA 6332 by the 1st day of December 2006 after which date 
the personal representative may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of 
which he has then had notice. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX402 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act, relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before the 3rd December 2006 after which date I may convey or distribute the 
assets, having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 
Ballard, Esme Gwendoline, late of Hill Crest Aged Care, 23 Harvest Road, North Fremantle, died 

3/10/06, (DE19842199EM13) 
Craig, Campbell John Morton, late of 8 Haymarket Place, Alexander Heights, died 6/9/06, 

(DE19902492EM27) 
Fox, Kenneth Charles, late of 5 Bournan Heights, Parmelia, died 13/4/06, (DE33049223EM38) 
Haseldine, Beryl Pauline, late of St Vincent’s Nursing Home, 224 Swan Street, Guildford, died 

8/10/06, (DE19982975EM37) 
Hayward, Leslie Richard, late of Windsor Park Aged Care Facility, 110 Star Street, Carlisle, formerly 

of 15 Winfield Street, Lynwood, died 4/8/06, (DE19733070EM16) 



4672 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3 November 2006 

Hobby, Iris Pauline, late of 14 Du Maurier Road, North Lake, died 1/10/06, (DE19982726EM15) 
Kershaw, Margaret Adamson, late of Nazareth House, Crowtherton Street, Bluff Point, died 28/8/06, 

(DE33038979EM27) 
Landon, Margaret Lamb, late of 6/59 Comer Street, Como, died 27/9/06, (DE19790314EM15) 
Murphy, Edward Roy, late of Cottage Home Hostel, 21 Wright Street, Highgate, died 9/10/06, 

(DE19983033EM22) 
Otley, Warren Edward William, late of 21 Aughton Street, Bayswater, died 2/10/06, 

(DE19722534EM12) 
Van Ast, Martina Johanna, late of Hillcrest Lodge, 40 Onslow Street, Geraldton, died 28/9/06, 

(DE19720256EM36) 
Wieboldt, John Allan, late of 16/52 Bronte Street, East Perth, died 12/6/06, (DE33051881EM13) 
Wilson, Amy Adelaide, late of Kelmscott River Gardens Aged Care, 89 Clifton Street, Kelmscott, 

formerly of 44 Gosnells Road, West Maddington, died 6/8/06, (DE19700673EM26) 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
Public Trust Office, 

565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000. 
Telephone: 9222 6777 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX403 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Yvonne Helen Chilcott, late of Brightwater Nursing Home, 95 Imperial Court, Madeley, Western 
Australia, Home Duties, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962, relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 4 July 2006 are required by the Trustee ANZ 
Executors & Trustee Company Limited ABN 33 006 132 332) of Level 21, 530 Collins Street, 
Melbourne VIC 3000 to send particulars of their claim to them by 15 December 2006 after which date 
the Trustee may convey or distribute the assets having regard only to the claims of which he then has 
notice. 

PUBLIC NOTICES 

ZZ401 
DISPOSAL OF UNCOLLECTED GOODS ACT 1970 

NOTICE UNDER PART VII OF INTENTION TO APPLY TO COURT FOR AN ORDER TO 
DISPOSE OF GOODS IN POSSESSION OTHERWISE THAN UNDER A BAILMENT 

IN THE COURSE OF A BUSINESS, WHERE SECTION 20(A) APPLIES 
To: The Commissioner of Police, Mr O’Callaghan, 2 Adelaide Terrace, Perth WA 6000 and Derek 

Inwood, PO Box 2480, Esperance WA 6450. 
 1. The following goods: Map by Ihon Speede “Devonshire with excester described and the arms 

of such nobles…” came into possession of Papierniak The Paper Specialist of 14 Hardy Street, 
Bull Creek WA 6149 in the following circumstances: Mr Derek Inwood contracted us to 
conduct full conservation treatment on the abovementioned artefact. The work was carried 
out and ready for collection on 18 January 2006 and the invoice totaled $365.00. We have 
tried to communicate with Mr Inwood via mail and mobile phone with no response from him. 

 2. It is intended to make an application to the court for an order to sell or otherwise dispose of 
the artefact to recover the costs in accordance with the Act. 

Dated: 31 October 2006. 

KATE PAPIERNIAK, Person in possession of goods. 
 

 
 

——————————— 



3 November 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 4673 

 

DID YOU KNOW ? ? 
 

Hard copies of consolidated Acts and Regulations, 
(as seen on our website at www.slp.wa.gov.au), 

can be purchased from State Law Publisher. 
 

Why pay for paper, ink or toner and 
wear out your printer when we can produce 

your documents for you. 
 

Call us now on (08) 9321 7688 for a price. 

Order your Bound Volumes of 
Government Gazette 2006 

An attractively presented set of 4 Bound Volumes
of Government Gazette 

 

For Government Departments and 
private firms who presently arrange 
binding for their copies of Government 
Gazettes, the State Law Publisher is 
now offering a subscription covering 4 
Quarterly Volumes at a cost of 
$1,098.90. 

The Gazettes will be bound in black 
cloth with gold foil lettering on the 
spine and personalised by  the addition 
of the client's name in gold lettering on 
the front cover. 

 

PLEASE NOTE 
On the rare occasion where extra 
gazettes are published in one quarter, a 
fifth volume may be required. In this 
instance the extra cost involved will be 
borne by the State Law Publisher and 
not passed on to clients. 

 
 

For further information please contact: 

State Law Publisher 

Telephone: 9321 7688 



4674 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3 November 2006 

CLAIMS FOR MISSING ISSUES  
(SUBSCRIPTION ITEMS) 

For a claim to be recognised as valid, written notification must be lodged at State 
Law Publisher, 10 William Street, Perth 6000 within 28 days of publication of the 
missing item. 
Claims lodged after this date will attract payment in full. 

 

STATE LAW PUBLISHER 
SUBSCRIPTION RATES FOR 2007 

All subscriptions are for the period from 1 January to 31 December 2007. Subject to 
certain limitations, refunds may be allowed if a subscription is cancelled during the year. 
The prices quoted include GST where applicable and postage by surface mail unless stated 
otherwise. 

 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 
General Government Gazettes are published 
on Tuesday and Friday of each week, 
unless disrupted by public holidays or 
unforseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes are published 
periodically. 
All Gazettes $ 
  Within WA ..................................... 876.70
  Interstate  ..................................... 893.20
  Overseas (airmail) ....................... 1,220.00
 
Bound Volumes of full year ........ 1,138.50
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 798.60
 

INDUSTRIAL GAZETTE 
Industrial Gazette is published monthly. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 421.30
  Interstate ...................................... 501.60
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 578.00
 
Gazettes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)....................................... 345.40
 

HANSARD 
Hansard is printed and distributed weekly 
during parliamentary sessions. 
 $ 
  Within WA  .................................... 831.60
  Interstate .................................... 1016.40
  Overseas (airmail)  ......................... 957.00
 
Bound Volumes of Hansard 
  Within WA  .................................... 820.60
  Interstate ...................................... 832.70
Hansards on CD ROM from 1999  
 (per year) ........................................  851.40

STATUTES 
 

Bound Statutes 
Bound volumes are posted during March of 
the following year. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 297.00 
  Interstate ....................................... 330.00 
  Overseas ........................................ 305.00 
  Half Calf Bound Statutes ................ 818.40 

Bound Volumes on CD ROM from 1998 
 (per year)........................................ 295.90 

Loose Statutes 
Statutes are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA....................................... 320.10 
  Interstate ........................................ 330.00 
  Overseas (airmail)............................ 430.00 

Sessional Bills 
Bills are posted weekly as they become 
available. 
 $  
  Within WA ...................................... 438.90 
  Interstate ....................................... 459.80 
  Overseas (airmail) ........................... 622.00 

 

 

Data on CD’s is fully indexed and is 
searchable. Other CD ROM products with 
legislation or other statutory information can 
be packaged to individual requirements.  
Prices are available on request. 

 

 

!200600186GG! 


