
PRINT POST APPROVED PP665002/00041 

 

  5795 
  
 
 
 
 
 

PERTH, FRIDAY, 22 DECEMBER 2006 No. 231 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY JOHN A. STRIJK, GOVERNMENT PRINTER AT 3.30 PM 

© STATE OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

 

 

WESTERN 
AUSTRALIAN 
GOVERNMENT 
 
 
 
ISSN 1448-949X 

 
 
 

CONTENTS 
 

PART 1 
Page 

Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943—Companies (Co-operative) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 ....................................................................................................................  5801 

Conservation and Land Management Act 1984—Forest Management Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 ........................................................................................................  5804 

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947—Country Areas Water Supply (Clearing Licence) 
Amendment Regulations 2006 ...............................................................................................  5802 

Credit Act 1984—Credit Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2006 .............................................  5803 
Emergency Management Act 2005—Emergency Management Districts Order 2006............  5797 
Freedom of Information Act 1992—Freedom of Information Amendment Regulations 2006  5805 
Pay-roll Tax Assessment Act 2002—Pay-roll Tax Assessment Amendment Regulations 

(No. 6) 2006.............................................................................................................................  5806 
Police Act 1892—Police Force Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2006.....................................  5823 
Road Traffic Act 1974— 

Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) Amendment Regulations 2006 ....................................  5812 
Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006 ........................  5814 
Road Traffic Code Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2006................................................  5817 

Settlement Agents Act 1981—Settlement Agents Amendment Regulations (No. 4) 2006.....  5807 
State Enterprises (Commonwealth Tax Equivalents) Act 1996—State Enterprises 

(Commonwealth Tax Equivalents) (Application) Amendment Regulations 2006 ...............  5808 
State Trading Concerns Act 1916—State Trading Concerns (Authorisation) Amendment 

Regulations (No. 2) 2006 ........................................................................................................  5809 
Swan River Trust Act 1988—Swan River Trust Amendment Regulations 2006....................  5810 
Taxation Administration Act 2003—Taxation Administration Amendment Regulations 

2006.........................................................................................................................................  5811 
Taxi Act 1994—Taxi Amendment Regulations (No. 6) 2006 ...................................................  5822 

 
——— 

 
PART 2 

 
Consumer and Employment Protection ....................................................................................  5824 
Deceased Estates .......................................................................................................................  5832 
Energy ........................................................................................................................................  5824 
Health.........................................................................................................................................  5825 
Industry and Resources .............................................................................................................  5826 
Justice.........................................................................................................................................  5826 
Local Government......................................................................................................................  5826 
Marine/Maritime........................................................................................................................  5827 
Minerals and Petroleum............................................................................................................  5827 
Parliament..................................................................................................................................  5829 
Planning and Infrastructure .....................................................................................................  5829 
Police ..........................................................................................................................................  5830 
Premier and Cabinet..................................................................................................................  5829 
Public Notices.............................................................................................................................  5833 
 



 

 

 

IMPORTANT COPYRIGHT NOTICE 
© State of Western Australia 
This work is copyright. Apart from any use as permitted under the Copyright Act 1968, no part 
may be reproduced by any process without written permission from the Attorney General for 
Western Australia. Inquiries in the first instance should be directed to the Government Printer, 
State Law Publisher, 10 William St, Perth 6000. 

 

PUBLISHING DETAILS 
The Western Australian Government Gazette is published by State Law Publisher for the State of 
Western Australia on Tuesday and Friday of each week unless disrupted by Public Holidays or 
unforeseen circumstances. 
Special Government Gazettes containing notices of an urgent or particular nature are published 
periodically. 
The following guidelines should be followed to ensure publication in the Government Gazette. 
 • Material submitted to the Executive Council prior to gazettal will require a copy of the signed 

Executive Council Minute Paper and in some cases the Parliamentary Counsel’s Certificate. 
 • Copy must be lodged with the Sales and Editorial Section, State Law Publisher no later than 

12 noon on Wednesday (Friday edition) or 12 noon on Friday (Tuesday edition). 
Delivery address: 
  State Law Publisher 
  Ground Floor, 
  10 William St. Perth, 6000 
  Telephone: 9321 7688  Fax: 9321 7536 

 • Inquiries regarding publication of notices can be directed to the Editor on (08) 9426 0010. 
 • Lengthy or complicated notices should be forwarded early to allow for preparation. Failure to 

observe this request could result in the notice being held over. 
If it is necessary through isolation or urgency to fax copy, confirmation is not required by post. If 
original copy is forwarded later and published, the cost will be borne by the advertiser. 

 

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE 

PUBLISHING DETAILS FOR CHRISTMAS 2006 
AND NEW YEAR HOLIDAY PERIOD 2007 

————— 

NOTE: Due to Tuesday 26th December being a public holiday there will not be a gazette 
published on that day 

 Publishing Dates Closing Dates and Times 
 and times for copy 

Friday 29 December 2006 at 3.30 pm Wednesday 27 December 2006 at 12 noon 

Tuesday 2 January 2007 at 3.30 pm Friday 29 December 2006 at 12 noon 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5797 

 

— PART 1 — 

FIRE AND EMERGENCY SERVICES 

FE301* 

Emergency Management Act 2005 

Emergency Management Districts Order 2006 

Made by the Minister, on the advice of the SEMC, under section 28(1) of 
the Act. 

1. Citation 

  This order is the Emergency Management Districts Order 2006. 

2. Emergency Management Districts 

  The State is divided into the following emergency management 
districts, constituted by the specified local government 
districts —  

 COUNTRY DISTRICTS 

1 KIMBERLEY Emergency Management District 

Shire of Broome 
Shire of Derby/West Kimberley 
Shire of Halls Creek 
Shire of Wyndham/East Kimberley 

2 PILBARA Emergency Management District 

Shire of Ashburton 
Shire of East Pilbara 
Shire of Exmouth 
Shire of Port Hedland 
Shire of Roebourne 

3 MID WEST-GASCOYNE Emergency 
Management District 

Shire of Carnamah 
Shire of Carnarvon 
Shire of Chapman Valley 
Shire of Coorow 
Shire of Cue 
City of Geraldton 
Shire of Greenough 
Shire of Irwin 



5798 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

Shire of Meekatharra 
Shire of Mingenew 
Shire of Morawa 
Shire of Mount Magnet 
Shire of Mullewa 
Shire of Murchison 
Shire of Northampton 
Shire of Perenjori 
Shire of Sandstone 
Shire of Shark Bay 
Shire of Three Springs 
Shire of Upper Gascoyne 
Shire of Wiluna 
Shire of Yalgoo 

4 GOLDFIELDS-ESPERANCE Emergency Management 
District 

Shire of Coolgardie 
Shire of Dundas 
Shire of Esperance 
City of Kalgoorlie Boulder 
Shire of Laverton 
Shire of Leonora 
Shire of Menzies 
Shire of Ngaanyatjarraku 
Shire of Ravensthorpe 
Shire of Yilgarn 

5 WHEATBELT Emergency Management District 

Shire of Beverley 
Shire of Bruce Rock 
Shire of Chittering 
Shire of Cunderdin 
Shire Dalwallinu 
Shire of Dandaragan 
Shire of Dowerin 
Shire of Gingin 
Shire of Goomalling 
Shire of Kellerberrin 
Shire of Koorda 
Shire of Merredin 
Shire of Moora 
Shire of Mt Marshall 
Shire of Mukinbudin 
Shire of Narembeen 
Shire of Northam 
Town of Northam 
Shire of Nungarin 
Shire of Quairading 
Shire of Tammin 
Shire of Toodyay 
Shire of Trayning 
Shire of Victoria Plains 
Shire of Westonia 
Shire of Wongan-Ballidu 
Shire of Wyalkatchem 
Shire of York 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5799 

 

6 PEEL Emergency Management District 

Shire of Boddington 
City of Mandurah 
Shire of Murray 
Shire of Serpentine-Jarrahdale 
Shire of Waroona 

7 SOUTH WEST Emergency Management District 

Shire of Augusta/Margaret River 
Shire of Boyup Brook 
Shire of Bridgetown/Greenbushes 
City of Bunbury 
Shire of Busselton 
Shire of Capel 
Shire of Collie 
Shire of Dardanup 
Shire of Donnybrook/Balingup 
Shire of Harvey 
Shire of Manjimup 
Shire of Nannup 

8 GREAT SOUTHERN Emergency Management District 

City of Albany 
Shire of Brookton 
Shire of Broomehill 
Shire of Corrigin 
Shire of Cranbrook 
Shire of Cuballing 
Shire of Denmark 
Shire of Dumbleyung 
Shire of Gnowangerup 
Shire of Jerramungup 
Shire of Katanning 
Shire of Kent 
Shire of Kojonup 
Shire of Kondinin 
Shire of Kulin 
Shire of Lake Grace 
Shire of Narrogin 
Town of Narrogin 
Shire of Pingelly 
Shire of Plantagenet 
Shire of Tambellup 
Shire of Wagin 
Shire of Wandering 
Shire of West Arthur 
Shire of Wickepin 
Shire of Williams 
Shire of Woodanilling 
 



5800 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

 METROPOLITAN DISTRICTS 

9 SOUTH EAST METROPOLITAN Emergency 
Management District 

City of Armadale 
City of Belmont 
City of Canning 
City of Gosnells 
City of South Perth 
Town of Victoria Park 

10 SOUTH METROPOLITAN Emergency Management 
District 

City of Cockburn 
Town of East Fremantle 
City of Fremantle 
Town of Kwinana 
City of Melville 
City of Rockingham 

11 NORTH WEST METROPOLITAN Emergency 
Management District 

City of Joondalup 
City of Wanneroo 

12 EAST METROPOLITAN Emergency 
Management District 

Shire of Mundaring 
Shire of Kalamunda 
City of Swan 
Town of Bassendean 

13 WEST METROPOLITAN Emergency 
Management District 

City of Stirling 
City of Bayswater 

14 CENTRAL METROPOLITAN Emergency Management 
District 

Town of Cambridge 
Town of Claremont 
Town of Cottesloe 
Town of Mosman Park 
City of Nedlands 
Shire of Peppermint Grove 
City of Perth 
City of Subiaco 
Town of Vincent 

 

JOHN KOBELKE, Minister for Police and 
Emergency Services. 

 
——————————— 

 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5801 

 

LAND ADMINISTRATION 

LA301* 

Companies (Co-operative) Act 1943 

Companies (Co-operative) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Companies (Co-operative) Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Companies 
(Co-operative) Regulations 1947*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 5 November 1947, p. 2017-58. 
  For amendments to 5 December 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, and 
Gazette 22 September 2006.] 

4. Schedule II amended 

  Schedule II is amended in item 12 by deleting “Land Titles 
Office” and inserting instead —  

“     
  office of the Western Australian Land Information Authority 

    ”. 
 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



5802 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

LA302* 

Country Areas Water Supply Act 1947 

Country Areas Water Supply (Clearing Licence) 
Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Country Areas Water Supply (Clearing 
Licence) Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Country Areas 
Water Supply (Clearing Licence) Regulations 1981*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 23 May 2003. 
  For amendments to 5 December 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4.] 

4. Regulation 13 amended 

  Regulation 13(b) is amended by deleting “Department of Land 
Administration” and inserting instead —  

  “    Western Australian Land Information Authority    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5803 

 

LA303* 

Credit Act 1984 

Credit Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Credit Amendment Regulations 
(No. 3) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Credit 
Regulations 1985*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 28 July 2000. 
  For amendments to 5 December 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, and 
Gazette 22 September 2006.] 

4. Regulation 14A amended 

  Regulation 14A(1)(c) is amended by deleting “Land Titles 
Office for searching” and inserting instead —  

“     
  Western Australian Land Information Authority 

for searching land title 
    ”. 

5. Regulation 27 amended 

  Regulation 27(1)(c) is amended by deleting “Land Titles Office 
for searching” and inserting instead —  

“     
  Western Australian Land Information Authority 

for searching land title 
    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



5804 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

LA304* 

Conservation and Land Management Act 1984 

Forest Management Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Forest Management Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Forest 
Management Regulations 1993*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 15 September 1999. 
  For amendments to 5 December 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4.] 

4. Regulation 80 amended 

  Regulation 80(2) is amended by deleting “Department of Land 
Administration” and inserting instead —  

“     
  Minister for Lands referred to in the Land 

Administration Act 1997 section 7(1) 
    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5805 

 

LA305* 

Freedom of Information Act 1992 

Freedom of Information Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Freedom of Information Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Freedom of 
Information Regulations 1993*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 22 October 1993, p. 5800-2. 
  For amendments to 5 December 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4.] 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 is amended by deleting from column 1 the entry 
“Department of Land Administration” and from column 2 the 
entries opposite that entry and inserting instead —  

“     
Western Australian 
Land Information 
Authority 

.  Geographic Names 
Committee 

.  Land Surveyors 
Licensing Board 

    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting from column 1 the entry “Department of 
Planning and Urban Development” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    Department for Planning and Infrastructure    ”; 

 (b) by deleting from column 2 the entry “Town Planning 
Appeal Tribunal” and inserting instead —  

  “    Pastoral Lands Board of Western Australia    ”. 



5806 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

 (3) Schedule 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting from column 1 the entry “State Planning 
Commission” and inserting instead —  

  “    Western Australian Planning Commission    ”; 

 (b) by inserting in column 2 opposite that entry, after 
“Country Planning Council” —  

“     
  Any committee established under the Planning and 

Development Act 2005 Schedule 2 
    ”. 

 (4) Schedule 2 is amended by deleting from column 1 the entry 
“Minister for Planning” and from column 2 the entry “Town 
Planning Appeal Committee”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

LA306* 

Pay-roll Tax Assessment Act 2002 

Pay-roll Tax Assessment Amendment 
Regulations (No. 6) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Pay-roll Tax Assessment Amendment 
Regulations (No. 6) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Pay-roll Tax 
Assessment Regulations 2003*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 13 October 2006.] 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5807 

 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

  Schedule 1 is amended as follows: 

 (a) by deleting “The Department of Land Administration”; 

 (b) by deleting “The Valuer General’s Office”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

LA307* 

Settlement Agents Act 1981 

Settlement Agents Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Settlement Agents Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Settlement 
Agents Regulations 1982*. 

 [* Reprint 3 as at 18 March 2005. 
  For amendments to 6 December 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, and 
Gazette 16 and 27 June and 22 September 2006.] 



5808 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

4. Schedule 3 amended 

  Schedule 3 Part B is amended as follows: 

 (a) in clause 1, by deleting “at the Land Titles Office” in 
both places where it occurs and inserting instead —  

  “    under the Transfer of Land Act 1893    ”; 

 (b) in clause 8, by deleting “Land Titles Office”. 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 
 

LA308* 

State Enterprises (Commonwealth Tax Equivalents) Act 1996 

State Enterprises (Commonwealth Tax 
Equivalents) (Application) Amendment 

Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the State Enterprises (Commonwealth Tax 
Equivalents) (Application) Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendment in these regulations is to the State Enterprises 
(Commonwealth Tax Equivalents) (Application) 
Regulations 1997*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 6 June 2003. 
  For amendments to 5 December 2006 see Gazette 

31 March 2006.] 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5809 

 

4. Regulation 3 amended 

  The Table to regulation 3 is amended by inserting the following 
item after the item for the Insurance Commission —  

“     
Western Australian Land Information 
Authority established by the Land 
Information Authority Act 2006 s. 5 

The day on which the 
Land Information 
Authority Act 2006 s. 5 
comes into operation 

    ”. 
 
By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 

LA309* 

State Trading Concerns Act 1916 

State Trading Concerns (Authorisation) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the State Trading Concerns 
(Authorisation) Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the State Trading 
Concerns (Authorisation) Regulations 1998*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 6 August 2004. 
  For amendments to 5 December 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, and 
Gazette 17 March 2006.] 



5810 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

4. Schedule 1 amended 

 (1) Schedule 1 Part 1 is amended by deleting “Department of Land 
Information”. 

 (2) Schedule 1 Part 2 is amended by deleting the heading 
“Department of Land Information” and the provisions covered 
by that heading. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 
 

——————————— 
 

LA310* 

Swan River Trust Act 1988 

Swan River Trust Amendment Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Swan River Trust Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendment in these regulations is to the Swan River Trust 
Regulations 1989*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 10 September 2004.] 

4. Schedule 2 amended 

  Schedule 2 Form 1 is amended in item 4(a) by deleting “Titles 
Office Description”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5811 

 

LA311* 

Taxation Administration Act 2003 

Taxation Administration Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Taxation Administration Amendment 
Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on the day on which the 
Land Information Authority Act 2006 comes into operation. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Taxation 
Administration Regulations 2003*. 

 [* Published in Gazette 27 June 2003, p. 2419-22. 
  For amendments to 5 December 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4.] 

4. Regulation 8 amended 

  Regulation 8(a) is amended by deleting “Department of Land 
Information” and inserting instead —  

  “    Western Australian Land Information Authority    ”. 

5. Regulation 13 amended 

  Regulation 13(3) is amended by deleting “Department of Land 
Information.” and inserting instead —  

  “    Western Australian Land Information Authority.    ”. 
 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 
 
 

——————————— 



5812 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI301* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) Amendment 
Regulations 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) 
Amendment Regulations 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 January 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Charges and Fees) Regulations 2006. 

4. Regulation 23A inserted 

  After regulation 23 the following regulation is inserted — 

“     
23A. Fee payable by motor vehicle dealers and vehicle 

manufacturers in relation to vehicle licensing 

 (1) In addition to any charge payable under regulation 4, 
and except as provided in subregulation (2), the fee 
specified in Schedule 1 Division 2 item 8A is 
payable — 

 (a) by a motor vehicle dealer licensed under the 
Motor Vehicle Dealers Act 1973 section 15 
wishing to licence a vehicle that is intended to 
be sold by the dealer; or 

 (b) by the operator of a business manufacturing 
vehicles wishing to licence a vehicle 
manufactured in that business. 

 (2) The fee specified in Schedule 1 Division 2 item 8A is 
not payable in respect of a particular vehicle if the 
Director General requires the vehicle to be examined 
under the Act section 17(2)(a). 

    ”. 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5813 

 

5. Schedule 1 amended 

  After Schedule 1 Division 2 item 8, the following item is 
inserted — 

“     
8A. 23A Fee payable by a motor vehicle dealer 

or vehicle manufacturer for each 
vehicle the dealer or manufacturer 
wishes to licence 

 
 
 

5.80 
    ”. 

6. Schedule 2 amended 

 (1) Schedule 2 is amended by deleting the full stop at the end of the 
definition of “practical driving assessment” and inserting 
instead — 

“     
  ; 

 “theory test” means a test to satisfy the Director General 
that the applicant has a reasonable knowledge of the 
traffic laws of the State and of safe driving techniques. 

    ”. 

 (2) Schedule 2 is amended as follows: 

 (a) immediately before item 1 by inserting — 

“     
1A. Fee to take a theory test for the first time .……... 33.00 
1B. Fee to resit a theory test ………………………... 22.00 

    ”; 
 (b) in item 1, by deleting “55.40” and inserting instead — 

  “    45.00    ”; 

 (c) in item 2(a) by deleting “28.40” and inserting instead — 

  “    47.30    ”; 

 (d) in item 2(b) by deleting “113.20” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    111.70    ”; 

 (e) in item 6 by deleting “26.10” and inserting instead — 

  “    33.00    ”; 

 (f) in item 7 by deleting “16.00” and inserting instead — 

  “    22.00    ”; 

 (g) after item 7 by inserting — 

“     
8. Fee for logbook under the Road Traffic 

(Drivers’ Licences) Regulations 1975 
regulation 4E(2) ………………………………... 

 
 

20.00 
    ”. 

By Command of the Governor, 

 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 



5814 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

PI302* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic (Charges and Fees) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 2) 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
(Charges and Fees) Regulations 2006. 

 [* Published in Gazette 24 November 2006, p. 4843-85.] 

3. Regulation 39 amended 

  Regulation 39(1) is amended by deleting “$11.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $12.10    ”. 

4. Regulation 40 amended 

  Regulation 40 is amended by deleting “$11.50” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $12.10    ”. 

5. Regulation 42 amended 

 (1) Regulation 42(1) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$75.80;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $80.30;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$151.60.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $160.60.    ”. 

 (2) Regulation 42(2) is amended as follows: 

 (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$16.40;” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $17.30;    ”; 

 (b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$33.10.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $35.00.    ”. 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5815 

 

6. Regulation 47 amended 

  Regulation 47 is amended by deleting “Road Traffic (Drivers’ 
Licences) Regulations 1975.” and inserting instead — 

  “    Road Traffic (Vehicle Standards) Regulations 2002.    ”. 

7. Regulation 49 replaced 

  Regulation 49 is repealed and the following regulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
49. Fee payable for the grant of a class 1 permit 

 (1) The fee payable for the grant of a class 1 permit that is 
for all journeys made in a period specified in the permit 
is the greater of —  

 (a) if the period is —  

 (i) 12 months — $25; or  

 (ii) 36 months — $50;  

  and 

 (b) for each full month for which the permit is 
granted — $4 for each tonne or part of a tonne 
by which the relevant mass limit is permitted to 
be exceeded under the permit.  

 (2) The fee payable for the grant of a class 1 permit that is 
for a journey specified in the permit and no other 
journey is the greater of —  

 (a) $25; and  

 (b) one cent per tonne per kilometre (rounded to 
the nearest 5 cents). 

    ”. 

8. Regulation 50 replaced 

  Regulation 50 is repealed and the following regulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
50. Fee payable for the grant of a class 2 permit 

  The fee payable for the grant of a class 2 permit is —  

 (a) if the permit is for 12 months — $25; or  

 (b) if the permit is for 36 months — $50. 
    ”. 



5816 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

9. Regulation 51 replaced 

  Regulation 51 is repealed and the following regulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
51. Fee payable for the grant of a class 3 permit 

  The fee payable for the grant of a class 3 permit is —  

 (a) if the permit is for —  

 (i) 12 months — $25; or  

 (ii) 36 months — $50; 

  and 

 (b) if the permit exempts a vehicle from a mass 
requirement, for each month or part of a month 
for which the permit is granted — $4 for each 
tonne or part of a tonne by which the relevant 
mass limit is permitted to be exceeded under 
the permit. 

    ”. 

10. Regulation 54 amended 

  Regulation 54 is amended by deleting “$25.” and inserting 
instead —  

  “    $32.    ”. 

11. Regulation 56 amended 

  Regulation 56 is amended by deleting the Table to 
subregulation (1) and inserting instead — 

“     
Table 

 $ 

Category 1 event 137.00 

Category 2 event 82.00 

Category 3 event 55.50 

Category 4 event 55.50 
    ”. 

 

By Command of the Governor, 

 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

 
——————————— 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5817 

 

PI303* 

Road Traffic Act 1974 

Road Traffic Code Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Road Traffic Code Amendment 
Regulations (No. 4) 2006. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation on 1 January 2007. 

3. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Road Traffic 
Code 2000*. 

 [* Reprint 1 as at 27 August 2004. 
  For amendments to 24 November 2006 see Western 

Australian Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4.] 

4. Regulation 9 amended 

  Regulation 9(2) is amended by deleting “sixteen penalty units 
(16 PU)” and inserting instead —  

  “    twenty penalty units (20 PU)    ”. 

5. Regulation 17 replaced 

  Regulation 17 is repealed and the following regulation is 
inserted instead —  

“     
17. Penalties for speeding 

 (1) Subject to regulation 17(2), the following points and 
modified penalties apply for the offences in this Part 
that refer to this regulation for their penalty. 

Description Points Modified 
Penalty 

Exceeding a speed limit by —   

(a) not more than 9 km/h  1.5 PU 



5818 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

Description Points Modified 
Penalty 

(b) more than 9 km/h but not 
more than 19 km/h — 

  

(i) during a holiday period 4 3 PU 

(ii) other than during a 
holiday period 

 
2 

 
3 PU 

(c) more than 19 km/h but not 
more than 29 km/h — 

  

(i) during a holiday period 6 5 PU 

(ii) other than during a 
holiday period 

 
3 

 
5 PU 

(d) more than 29 km/h but not 
more than 40 km/h — 

  

(i) during a holiday period 10 7 PU 

(ii) other than during a 
holiday period 

 
5 

 
7 PU 

(e) more than 40 km/h —   

(i) during a holiday period 14 20 PU 

(ii) other than during a 
holiday period 

 
7 

 
20 PU 

 (2) Despite regulation 17(1), the following points and 
modified penalties apply for the offences in this Part 
that refer to this regulation for their penalty if the 
offence is committed by the driver of a heavy vehicle. 

Description Points Modified 
Penalty 

Exceeding a speed limit by —   

(a) not more than 9 km/h  3 PU 

(b) more than 9 km/h but not 
more than 19 km/h — 

  

(i) during a holiday period 4 5 PU 

(ii) other than during a 
holiday period 

 
2 

 
5 PU 

(c) more than 19 km/h but not 
more than 29 km/h — 

  

(i) during a holiday period 6 7 PU 

(ii) other than during a 
holiday period 

 
3 

 
7 PU 

(d) more than 29 km/h but not 
more than 40 km/h — 

  

(i) during a holiday period 10 10 PU 

(ii) other than during a 
holiday period 

 
5 

 
10 PU 

(e) more than 40 km/h —   

(i) during a holiday period 14 20 PU 

(ii) other than during a 
holiday period 

 
7 

 
20 PU 

    ”. 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5819 

 

6. Regulation 201 amended 

  Regulation 201(1) is amended by inserting the following 
penalty at the foot of that subregulation —  

  “    Modified penalty: 2 PU    ”. 

7. Regulation 254 amended 

  Regulation 254(2) is amended by deleting the penalty at the foot 
of that subregulation and inserting instead —  

“     
 Penalty: 

 (a) if offence committed by the driver of a motor 
vehicle other than a ride-on lawn mower or 
motorised wheelchair —  

   Points: 3 Modified penalty: 2 PU; 

 (b) otherwise —  

   Modified penalty: 2 PU. 
    ”. 

8. Various points and penalties amended 

  The regulations set out in column 1 of the following Table are 
amended by deleting the points and modified penalties set out in 
column 2 of the Table and substituting the points and modified 
penalties in column 3 instead. 

Table 

Regulation Former points/modified 
penalty 

New points/modified 
penalty 

r. 27(1) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 30(1) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 31(1) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 32(1) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 33(2) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 41(3) Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 44(4) Modified penalty: 1 PU Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 48 Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 57(1) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 58 Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 



5820 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

Regulation Former points/modified 
penalty 

New points/modified 
penalty 

r. 62(2) Points: 4 

Modified penalty: 4 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 4 PU 

r. 66 Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 67 Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 68(1) Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 68(3) Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 73(1) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 77 Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 92(1) Modified penalty: 1 PU Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 92(2) Modified penalty: 1 PU Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 92(3) Modified penalty: 1 PU Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 92(5) Modified penalty: 1 PU Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 97 Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 111(1) Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 1 PU 

 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 112(1) Modified penalty: 1 PU Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 1 PU 

r. 117 Points: 4 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 119(1) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 119(3) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 126(2) Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 183(3) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 183(4) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 185(1) Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 1 PU 

Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 186(1)  

Modified penalty: 1 PU 

Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5821 

 

Regulation Former points/modified 
penalty 

New points/modified 
penalty 

r. 191(2) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 192(2)  

Modified penalty: 1 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 197(2) Modified penalty: 3 PU Modified penalty: 1 PU 

r. 197(3) Modified penalty: 3 PU Modified penalty: 1 PU 

r. 197(4) Modified penalty: 3 PU Modified penalty: 1 PU 

r. 198(2) Modified penalty: 3 PU Modified penalty: 1 PU 

r. 200(2) Modified penalty: 1 PU Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 225 Modified penalty: 3 PU Modified penalty: 1 PU 

r. 226(1) Modified penalty: 2 PU Modified penalty: 1 PU 

r. 232(1) Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in each 
case)  3 PU 

Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in 
each case): 4 PU 

r. 233(1) Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in each 
case)  3 PU 

Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in 
each case): 4 PU 

r. 234(1) Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in each 
case)  3 PU 

Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in 
each case): 4 PU 

r. 234(2) Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in each 
case)  3 PU 

Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in 
each case): 4 PU 

r. 235(1) Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in each 
case)  3 PU 

Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in 
each case): 4 PU 

r. 236(1) Modified penalty: 3 PU Modified penalty: 4 PU 

r. 237(1) Modified penalty: 3 PU Modified penalty: 4 PU 

r. 237(2) Modified penalty: 3 PU Modified penalty: 4 PU 

r. 238A(1) Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in each 
case)  3 PU 

Points: during a holiday 
period  6;  otherwise  3 

Modified penalty (in 
each case): 4 PU 

r. 239(1) Modified penalty: 3 PU Modified penalty: 4 PU 

r. 242(1) Points: 3 (driver)  

Modified penalty: 1 PU 
(driver or passenger) 

Points: 1 (driver)  

Modified penalty: 1 PU 
(driver or passenger) 

r. 242(2) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 1 PU 

Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 1 PU 



5822 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

Regulation Former points/modified 
penalty 

New points/modified 
penalty 

r. 248 Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 3 PU 

Points: 2 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 253(1) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 253(4)  

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 257(1) Modified penalty: 2 PU Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 257(2) Modified penalty: 2 PU Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 257(3) Modified penalty: 2 PU Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 257(4) Modified penalty: 2 PU Modified penalty: 3 PU 

r. 261 Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 263(1) Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

r. 265(1) Points: 1 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

Points: 3 

Modified penalty: 2 PU 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

 

——————————— 
 

PI304* 

Taxi Act 1994 

Taxi Amendment Regulations (No. 6) 2006 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Taxi Amendment Regulations 
(No. 6) 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendments in these regulations are to the Taxi 
Regulations 1995*. 

 [* Reprint 2 as at 4 March 2005. 
  For amendments to 29 November 2006 see Gazette 

24 February, 13 April and 23 June 2006.] 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5823 

 

3. Regulation 4A amended 

  Regulation 4A is amended by deleting “30%.” and inserting 
instead — 

  “    35%.    ”. 

 
By Command of the Governor, 

 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Executive Council. 

POLICE 

PO301* 

Police Act 1892 

Police Force Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2006 

Made by the Commissioner of Police, with the approval of the Minister 
for Police and Emergency Services, under section 9. 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Police Force Amendment Regulations 
(No. 4) 2006. 

2. The regulations amended 

  The amendment in these regulations is to the Police Force 
Regulations 1979*. 

 [* Reprinted as at 15 June 2001. 
  For amendments to 15 August 2006 see Western Australian 

Legislation Information Tables for 2005, Table 4, p. 312.] 

3. Part VII repealed 

  Part VII is repealed. 

Date: 5 December 2006. 

Signed: K. O’CALLAGHAN, 
 Commissioner of Police. 

Approved: JOHN KOBELKE, 
 Minister for Police and Emergency Services. 

 



5824 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

— PART 2 — 

CONSUMER AND EMPLOYMENT PROTECTION 

CE401* 
ASSOCIATIONS INCORPORATION ACT 1987 

Section 35(4) 

PORONGURUP COMMUNITY ASSOCIATION—A0822300U 

PERTH OBSERVATORY VOLUNTEER GROUP INCORPORATED—A1009534K 

Notice is hereby given that the incorporation of the above-named associations has been re-instated as 
from the date of this notice. 

Dated: 20 February 2006. 

PATRICK WALKER, Commissioner for Fair Trading. 

ENERGY 

EN401* 
ELECTRICITY INDUSTRY ACT 2004 

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 23 (1) NOTICE OF DECISIONS 
Notice is given that the following Retail and Distribution Licences have been amended— 

Licensee: BHP Billiton Nickel West Pty Ltd 

Issue Date: 15 December 2006 

Address of Licensee: Level 27, BHP Billiton Centre 
 180 Lonsdale Street 
 MELBOURNE  VIC 3000 

 1. Classification: Retail (ERL 2)  

  Term of Licence: Up to and including 23 March 2021 

  Area Covered: Area covered by Leinster, Mt Keith and Kambalda as at the 
commencement date as set out in Plan No. ERA-EL-070(B) and 
ERA-EL-071(B). 

  Amendment: Change of trading name from WMC Resources Ltd t/a Nickel West to 
BHP Billiton Nickel West Pty Ltd ACN 004 184 598 

 2. Classification: Distribution (EDL 2) 

  Term of Licence: Up to and including 23 March 2036 

  Area Covered: Area covered by Leinster, Mt Keith and Kambalda as at the 
commencement date as set out in Plan No. ERA-EL-070(B) and 
ERA-EL-071(B). 

  Amendment: Change of trading name from WMC Resources Ltd t/a Nickel West to 
BHP Billiton Nickel West Pty Ltd ACN 004 184 598 

  Inspection of Licence:   Economic Regulation Authority 
   6th Floor 
   197 St Georges Terrace 
   Perth WA 6000 
   http://www.era.wa.gov.au 

LYNDON G. ROWE, Chairman, 
Economic Regulation Authority. 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5825 

 

HEALTH 

HE401 

HEALTH SERVICES (QUALITY IMPROVEMENT) ACT 1994 

HEALTH SERVICES (QUALITY IMPROVEMENT) (APPROVED 
COMMITTEE) ORDER (NO. 6) 2006 

Made by the Principal Medical Officer (as delegate of the Minister for Health) pursuant to section 7(1) 
of the Health Services (Quality Improvement) Act 1994. 

Citation 
1. This order may be cited as the Health Services (Quality Improvement) (Approved Committee) Order 
(No. 6) 2006. 

Commencement 
2. This order comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Government Gazette. 

Committee 
3. The Clinical Quality Improvement Committee established by MercyCare Ltd. is an approved 
quality improvement committee for the purposes of the Act. 

Expiry of order 
4. This order expires three years after its commencement. 

Dated this 14th day of December 2006. 

Dr DOROTHY JONES, Principal Medical Officer. 
 
 
 

——————————— 
 
 
 

HE402* 

RADIATION SAFETY ACT 1975 

RADIATION SAFETY ACT (AUTHORISED OFFICERS) APPOINTMENT 
NOTICE (NO. 2) 2006 

Made by the Executive Director, Public Health and Scientific Support Services under section 4(1). 

1. Citation 
This notice may be cited as the Radiation Safety Act (Authorised Officers) Appointment Notice (No. 2) 
2006. 

2. Commencement 
This notice comes into operation on the day on which it is published in the Gazette. 

3. Authorised officers 
The officers of the Radiation Safety Branch of the Department of Health specified in the table to this 
notice are appointed as authorised officers for the purposes of the Act until 1 January 2010. 

Table 
Mary Gwendoline Aerts 

Zachary James Alach 
Leif Erik Dahlskog 

Joseph Favory 
Paul McGill 

Cameron Storm 
Duncan Ian Surin 
Dr Carla Thomas 

Hazel Upton 
Dated this 19th day of December 2006. 

Dr MARGARET STEVENS, Acting Executive Director, 
Public Health And Scientific Support Services. 



5826 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

INDUSTRY AND RESOURCES 
IT401* 

MINING ACT 1978 
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO FORFEIT 

Department of Industry Resources, 
Perth WA 6000. 

In accordance with Regulation 50(b) of the Mining Regulations 1981, notice is hereby given that 
unless the rent due on the under mentioned licence and lease are paid on or before 19 January 2007 it 
is the intention of the Minister for Resources under the provisions of sections 96A(1) and 97(1) of the 
Mining Act, 1978 to forfeit such for breach covenant, viz, non-payment of rent. 

JIM LIMERICK, Director General. 
———— 

NUMBER HOLDER MINERAL FIELD 
EXPLORATION LICENCE 

70/2600 G and A Earthmoving Group Pty Ltd South West 

MINING LEASE 
M24/634 Heron Resources Ltd Broad Arrow 

JUSTICE 
JU401 

JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 
APPOINTMENTS 

It is hereby notified for public information that His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council has 
approved of the following to the office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia— 

Michelle Gaye Baines of 7 Koolyoo Street, Newman 
Scott Barrington Baines of 7 Koolyoo Street, Newman 

ROBERT M. CARTER, A/Executive Director, 
Court and Tribunal Services. 

 
——————————— 

 
JU402 

JUSTICES OF THE PEACE ACT 2004 
RESIGNATIONS 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Minister has accepted the resignation of— 
Mr Peter Duncan Blockey of 6 Araluen Close, Mountain Creek, Queensland 

from the Office of Justice of the Peace for the State of Western Australia. 

ROBERT M. CARTER, A/Executive Director, 
Court and Tribunal Services. 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT 
LG401* 

SHIRE OF CAPEL 
AUTHORISED PERSON 

It is hereby notified for public information that Mr Graham George Chester has been appointed as an 
authorised person of the Shire of Capel pursuant to the following from 27 November 2006— 
 1. An Authorised Officer to administer the following legislation— 

Bush Fires Act 1954 
Caravan Parks and Camping Grounds Act 1995 
Control of Vehicles (Off-road Areas) Act 1978 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5827 

 

Dog Act 1976 
Local Government Act 1995– Section 3.39 &Part 9 Division 2 
Local Government (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960 
Litter Act 1979. 

 2. A Pound Keeper and Ranger to exercise powers under Part XX of Local Government 
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 1960. 

 3. A ‘Prosecutor’ (to instigate and carry on proceed against persons committing offences) under 
section 59(3) of Bush Fires Act 1954 and section 44(2)(b) of Dog Act 1976. 

  The appointment of Mr Robert Anthony Anstee is hereby cancelled. 

Dated 18 December 2006. 

P. F. SHEEDY, Chief Executive Officer. 

MINERALS AND PETROLEUM 

MP401* 
PETROLEUM PIPELINES ACT 1969 
APPLICATION FOR A PIPELINE LICENCE 

I, William Lee Tinapple, Director of the Petroleum and Royalties Division in the Department of 
Industry and Resources for the State of Western Australia being the Officer for the time being holding 
certain powers and functions of the Minister in respect of the area specified in the State of Western 
Australia by virtue of an instrument of delegation dated 20 March 2006 and published in the 
Government Gazette of Western Australia on 24 March 2006, give notice pursuant to Section 8(4) of 
the Petroleum Pipelines Act, 1969 that an application recorded as 2P/06-7 has been received from 
Apache Northwest Pty Ltd for a pipeline licence to construct and operate a pipeline for the 
conveyance of natural gas from the Mean Low Water Mark at the western end of the Forty Mile 
Beach, at the existing Special Purpose Lease area for pipeline construction, approximately 10 
Kilometres a proposed gas plant adjacent to the Forty Mile Beach Road/North West Coastal Hwy 
junction. 
Maps showing the position of the proposed pipeline may be examined during public office hours from 
22 December 2006 until 26 January 2007 at the Petroleum and Royalties Division, Department of 
Industry and Resources, 11th Floor, Mineral House, 100 Plain Street, East Perth, WA. and at the 
office of the Mining Registrar, Karratha, WA. 
Dated this 19th day of December 2006. 

W. F. MASON, A/Director Petroleum and Royalties Division. 

MARINE/MARITIME 

MX401* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
PROHIBITED SWIMMING AREA 

Mandurah Estuary 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 22 December 2006. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 10A(b) of the Navigable Waters Regulations,  
I hereby close all of the following waters to swimming, between 2030 to 2130 hrs on Sunday  
31 December 2006 and from 2330 hrs on Sunday 31 December 2006 to 0030 hrs on Monday 1 January 
2007. 

MANDURAH ESTUARY 
All the waters within an 70 metre radius of the firing point, located on the southern foreshore 
(adjacent to the War Memorial), at the entrance to Mandurah Canals.  
This area is set aside for safety measures during the set up and display of pyrotechnics. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 



5828 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

MX402* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
PROHIBITED SWIMMING AREA 

Mindarie Marina 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 22 December 2006. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 10A(b) of the Navigable Waters Regulations,  
I hereby close all of the following waters to swimming, between 2330 hrs on Sunday 31 December 
2006 to 0030 hrs on Monday 1 January 2007. 

MINDARIE MARINA 
All the waters within a 200 metre radius of the firing point, located 50 metres north, north west of the 
northern extremity of Alexandria View on the western side of Mindarie Marina.  
This area is set aside for safety measures during the set up and display of pyrotechnics. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

 

——————————— 
 
 

MX403* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
PROHIBITED SWIMMING AREA 

Peppermint Grove 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 22 December 2006. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 10A(b) of the Navigable Waters Regulations,  
I hereby close all of the following waters to swimming, between 2315 hrs on Sunday 31 December 
2006 to 0030 hrs on Monday 1 January 2007. 

PEPPERMINT GROVE 
All those waters within a 50 metre radius of the firing point, located on a barge, anchored at a 
position approximately 75 metres northeast of the Royal Freshwater Bay Yacht Club. 
This area is set aside for safety measures during the set up and display of pyrotechnics. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 

 

 

——————————— 
 
 

MX404* 
WESTERN AUSTRALIAN MARINE ACT 1982 

NAVIGABLE WATERS REGULATIONS 
PROHIBITED SWIMMING AREA 

Rockingham 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure, 

Fremantle WA, 22 December 2006. 
Acting pursuant to the powers conferred by Regulation 10A(b) of the Navigable Waters Regulations,  
I hereby close all of the following waters to swimming, between 2330 hrs on Sunday 31 December 
2006 to 0030 hrs on Monday 1 January 2007. 

ROCKINGHAM FORESHORE 
All those waters within a 80 metre radius of the firing point, located at the end of the Val Street 
Jetty, Rockingham. 
This area is set aside for safety measures during the set up and display of pyrotechnics. 

DAVID HARROD, General Manager, Marine Safety, 
Department for Planning and Infrastructure. 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5829 

 

PARLIAMENT 

PA401* 
PARLIAMENT OF WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

Royal Assent to Bills 
It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor has Assented in the name and on behalf 
of Her Majesty the Queen, on the dates shown, to the undermentioned Bills passed by the Legislative 
Council and the Legislative Assembly during the First Session of the Thirty-Seventh Parliament. 

Short Title of Bill Date of Assent Act No. 

Consumer Protection Legislation Amendment and Repeal 
 Bill 2005 

13 December 2006 69 of 2006 

Betting and Racing Legislation Amendment Bill 2006 13 December 2006 70 of 2006 
Shipping and Pilotage Amenment Bill 2006 13 December 2006 71 of 2006 

Railway Discontinuance Bill (No. 2) 2006 13 December 2006 72 of 2006 
Liquor and Gaming Legislation Amendment Bill 2006 13 December 2006 73 of 2006 

Dated: 15 December 2006. 
PETER McHUGH, Acting Clerk of the Parliaments. 

PREMIER AND CABINET 

PC401* 
APPOINTMENT OF DEPUTY OF THE GOVERNOR 

It is hereby notified for public information that the Governor, under clause XVI of the Letters Patent 
relating to the Office of Governor of the State of Western Australia dated 14 February 1986, has 
appointed the Lieutenant-Governor the Honourable David Kingsley Malcolm AC, QC, to be deputy of 
the Governor and in that capacity to perform and exercise all the powers and functions of the 
Governor during the following period— 

4 to 14 January 2007 (both dates inclusive). 

M. C. WAUCHOPE, Director General, 
Department of the Premier and Cabinet. 

PLANNING AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

PI401* 
PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT ACT 2005 

APPROVED LOCAL PLANNING SCHEME AMENDMENT 
City of Nedlands 

Town Planning Scheme No. 2—Amendment No. 171 
Ref: 853/2/8/4 Pt 171 
It is hereby notified for public information, in accordance with section 87 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2005 that the Minister for Planning and Infrastructure approved the City of 
Nedlands local planning scheme amendment on 7 December 2006 for the purpose of— 
 1. Lot 382 (No. 31A and 31) Cooper St, Nedlands, from Residential R12.5 to Residential R12.5 

(Additional Use—Two Grouped Dwellings); 
 2. Inserting into Schedule No. 1 Additional Uses of Planning Scheme No. 2, an entry for “Lot 

382 (No.31A and 31) Cooper Street”, Nedlands. 

L. G. TAYLOR, Mayor. 
G. FOSTER, A/Chief Executive Officer. 



5830 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

POLICE 

PO401* 

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974 

TEMPORARY SUSPENSION OF REGULATIONS 

I, Martin Paul Bond, Inspector being the delegated officer of the Minister for Transport under Section 
83(6) of the Road Traffic Act 1974, pursuant to the powers conferred by Section 83(1) of that Act, and 
the consent of the Local Authorities having been obtained and nominated for the purposes of: 

A Duathlons (Run & Cycle Race) by members/entrants of the Rockingham Triathlon Club on 
8 December 2006 between the hours of 17:30 Hrs and 18:30 Hrs, 19 January 2007 between the hours 
of 17:30 Hrs and 18:30 Hrs, 16 February 2007 between the hours of 17:30 Hrs and 18:30 Hrs, 9 March 
2007 between the hours of 17:30 Hrs and 18:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of 
the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Saltaire Way, Blackburn Drive, Jacquard 
Way, Gott Street in the City of Rockingham. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event. 

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Mandurah Triathlon Club Inc on 10 December 2006 between 
the hours of 06:30 Hrs and 09:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations 
made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Cycleway from Doddies Beach, Leighton 
Road, Cambria, Reverie Mews, Leighton Place in Halls Head. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event. 

A Cycle Race—Eastern Bypass Road by members/entrants of the Eastern Goldfields Cycle Club on 
3 December 2006 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs, 7 January 2007 between the hours of 
08:00 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs, 4 February 2007 between the hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs do hereby 
approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) 
mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Junction of Sutherland Street and Eastern 
Bypass Road, South to Roundabout at Kambalda Road and return along Eastern Bypass Road, into 
Hannan Street and finish in front of Kalgoorlie Museum in the City of Kalgoorlie/Boulder. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Bunbury Triathlon Club on 26 November 2006 between the 
hours of 07:30 Hrs and 11:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations 
made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Leave Rec Centre, Parade Road, Washington 
Avenue, Rotary Drive in the City of Bunbury. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event. 

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Bunbury Triathlon Club on 11 March 2007 between the 
hours of 07:30 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations 
made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Parade Road, Centenary Road, Washington 
Avenue, Rotary Drive in the City of Bunbury. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event. 

A Cycle Time Trial Race (40Kms) by members/entrants of the Australian Time Trials Association on 
26 November 2006 between the hours of 07:00 Hrs and 11:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Start on Old Northam Road (300 Metres 
north of Great Eastern Highway), travelling north/eastwards on Government Road/Werribee Road 
and turning (50 Metres prior to Hawke Avenue) and returning to start/finish in the Shire of 
Mundaring. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycle Race—Criterium by members/entrants of the South West Cycle Club Inc on 29 November 
2006 between the hours of 17:00 Hrs and 19:30 Hrs, 13 December 2006 between the hours of 17:00 
Hrs and 19:30 Hrs, 10 January 2007 between the hours of 17:00 Hrs and 19:30 Hrs, 31 January 2007 
between the hours of 17:00 Hrs and 19:30 Hrs, 14 February 2007 between the hours of 17:00 Hrs and 
19:30 Hrs, 28 February 2007 between the hours of 17:00 Hrs and 19:30 Hrs, 14 March 2007 between 
the hours of 17:00 Hrs and 19:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations 
made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Maxted Street, Shanahan Road, Halifax 
Drive, and return to start in the City of Bunbury. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5831 

 

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Rockingham Triathlon Club on 21 January 2007 between the 
hours of 07:30 Hrs and 08:30 Hrs, 11 February 2007 between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 08:30 Hrs, 
18 March 2007 between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 08:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—from small carpark opposite Wastewater 
Treatment Plant on Point Peron Road westward to carpark at end of road in the City of Rockingham. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event. 

A Cycle Time Trial Race (30Km) by members/entrants of the Australian Time Trials Association on 
10 December 2006 between the hours of 07:00 Hrs and 11:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Start adjacent to Primary School, Pickering 
Brook Road, Bracken Road, Forrest Road, Repatriation Road and finish at start in the Shire of 
Kalamunda. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Cycle Time Trial Race (40Km) by members/entrants of the Australian Time Trials Association on 
17 December 2006 between the hours of 07:00 Hrs and 10:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—De Haer Road, Rowley Road, Lyon Road, 
repeat and finish opposite Community Hall in the Shire of Kwinana. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A 40Km & 20Km Time Trial Championship Race by members/entrants of the Albany Cycling Club 
Inc on 24 February 2007 between the hours of 06:30 Hrs and 10:00 Hrs do hereby approve the 
temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned 
hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Lower Denmark Road in the City of Albany. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Road Cycling Race—20Km & 10Km Time Trial by members/entrants of the Albany Cycling Club 
Inc on 27 January 2007 between the hours of 06:30 Hrs and 08:30 Hrs, 3 February 2007 between the 
hours of 06:30 Hrs and 08:30 Hrs, 10 February 2007 between the hours of 06:30 Hrs and 08:30 Hrs, 
17 February 2007 between the hours of 06:30 Hrs and 08:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Frenchman Bay Road in the City of Albany. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times. 

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Bunbury Triathlon Club on 17 December 2006 between the 
hours of 07:30 Hrs and 09:30 Hrs, 11 February 2007 between the hours of 07:30 Hrs and 09:30 Hrs do 
hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the 
carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Wellington Weir Road, in the Shire of Collie. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event. 

A Triathlon by members/entrants of the Trievents W.A. on 17 December 2006 between the hours of 
06:30 Hrs and 09:30 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations made under 
such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Rockingham Beach Road in Rockingham. 

All participants to wear approved head protection at all times for the cycle event. 

A Burswood Twilight Run—Foot Race by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 
14 January 2007 between the hours of 18:00 Hrs and 19:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Burswood Water Sports Centre north on dual 
use path under Windan Bridge, onto Bridge cross river turn right go under Bridge on footpath to 
Children’s Playground, turn right across grass to path on north side of Brown Street turn right on 
path to east side of Jewell Lane go onto Goongoonup Bridge cross Bridge and follow path back to 
Burswood Water Sports Centre, in the Burswood and East Perth areas. 

A Point Walter—Foot Race by members/entrants of the West Australian Marathon Club on 
28 January 2007 between the hours of 07:00 Hrs and 09:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary 
suspension of the Regulations made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Point Walter Reserve, use cycle path to 
Tompkins Park, return to start area in the City of Melville . 

A Duathlon by members/entrants of the Albany Triathlon Club on 17 December 2006 between the 
hours of 08:00 Hrs and 10:00 Hrs do hereby approve the temporary suspension of the Regulations 
made under such act on the carriageway(s) mentioned hereunder.  

Racing to be confined to the left of the carriageway on—Whalers Cove Carpark and Camp Quaranup 
Road, in the City of Albany. 

M. P. BOND, Inspector. 



5832 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

DECEASED ESTATES 

ZX401 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
In the matter of the Estate of Joy Iris Elaine Parsons, late of 68 Cooper Street, Mandurah in the 
State of Western Australia, Widow, deceased. 
Creditors and other persons having claims to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relate in 
respect of the Estate of the deceased, who died on the 5th day of November 2006, are required by the 
Executrix, Linda Grace Lawrance to send the particulars of their claim to Messrs Taylor Smart of 
Level 8, 50 St George’s Terrace, Perth in the State of Western Australia, by the 22nd day of January 
2007, after which date the said Executrix may convey or distribute the assets, having regard only to 
the claims of which she then has had notice. 
Dated the 15th day of December 2006. 

GARRY E. SAME, Taylor Smart. 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX402 

PUBLIC TRUSTEE ACT 1941 
ADMINISTERING OF ESTATES 

Notice is hereby given that pursuant to Section 14 of the Public Trustee Act 1941 and amendments 
the Public Trustee has elected to administer the estates of the undermentioned deceased persons. 
Dated at Perth the 20th day of December 2006. 

JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 
565 Hay Street, PERTH WA 6000. 

———— 
 
Name of Deceased Address Date of Death Date Election 
   Filed 
GREEN Geoffrey George William Hamilton Hill 30/09/2006 7/12/2006 
(DE20010820EM27) 
EVANS Stanley Russell Carnarvon 29/01/2006 14/12/2006 
(DE19900163EM37) 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX403 

TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act relates) in respect 
of the Estates of the undermentioned deceased persons are required to send particulars of their 
claims to me on or before the 15th January 2007 after which date I may convey or distribute the 
assets, having regard only to the claims of which I then have notice. 

Binet, Violet Isabel, late of Hollywood Aged Care Village 118 Monash Avenue Nedlands, died 
24.11.2006, (DE19813137EM16) 

Brown, Mavis Elsie, late of Moonya Nursing Home 59 Ipsen Street Manjimup, died 26.11.2006, 
(DE19881080EMI7) 

Bubb, Peter Henry Joseph, late of 33 Clyde Street Menora, died 10.11.2006, (DE33053794EM313) 
Cole, Margaret Edwards, late of Brightwater Care Group Inc 95 Imperial Avenue Madeley, died 

21.11.2006, (DE20010528EM37) 
Hamlett, Mary, late of 14 Werloo Court Leda, died 21.11.2006, (DE20002994EM36) 
Labruyere, Catharina Anna, late of 7 Maley Way Geraldton, died 02.11.2006, (DE19672755EM110) 
McDonnell, Leonard, late of Tandara Nursing Home 73 Jarrah Road Bentley formerly of Unit 8/91 

Mars Street Carlisle, died 09.09.2006, (DE19780330EM26) 



22 December 2006 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 5833 

 

McInnes, Dora Frances, late of 5 Dean Lodge Bulicreek Drive Bull Creek, died 23.11.2006, 
(DE19540962EM27) 

Pearson, Shirley May, late of 255 Spencer Road Thomlie, died 04.12.2006, (DE19783930EM12) 
Sandison, Jean Fowler Mitchell, late of Unit 5/4 Durant Way Brentwood, died 27.11.2006, 

(DE19930551EM17) 
Standring, Patricia Phyllis, late of 7 Elabana Crescent Dianella, died 25.11.2006, 

(DE33035924EM110) 
Wood, Yvonne Margaret, late of 51 Stanton Crescent Greenwood, died 07.11.2006, 

(DE19991101EM35) 
JOHN SKINNER, Public Trustee, 

Public Trust Office, 565 Hay Street, Perth WA 6000. 
Telephone: 9222 6777 

 

——————————— 
 

ZX404 
TRUSTEES ACT 1962 
DECEASED ESTATES 

Notice to Creditors and Claimants 
Joan Shirley Manning late of Sir Joseph Banks Aged Care Facility 58 Canna Drive Canningvale 
Western Australia, Home Duties, (“the deceased”). 
Creditors and other persons having claims (to which Section 63 of the Trustees Act 1962 relates) in 
respect of the estate of the deceased who died on 4 November 2006 are required by the applicant for 
grant of probate namely Cecil Grant Bartle c/- Rouphael & Associates Solicitors of 300 Albany 
Highway Victoria Park WA 6100, to send particulars of their claims to Rouphael & Associates 
Solicitors being the Solicitors for the applicant for grant of probate by the 22nd day of January 2007 
after which date the applicant for grant of probate may convey or distribute the assets having regard 
only to the claims of which he then has notice. 

PUBLIC NOTICES 

ZZ401 
COMPANIES (CO-OPERATIVE) ACT 1943 

Pursuant to Section 99(4) 
NOTICE OF CHANGE IN SITUATION OF REGISTERED OFFICE 

Swan Taxis Co-operative Limited 
Notice is hereby given that the registered office of the aforementioned was on the 16th day of June 
2006 changed and is now situated at 7 Harvey Street, Victoria Park WA 6100. 

 
 
 

——————————— 
 

 

WESTERN AUSTRALIA 

FAIR TRADING (RETIREMENT VILLAGES 
CODE) REGULATIONS 2006 

*Price: $9.05 counter sales 
Plus postage on 120 grams 

* Prices subject to change on addition of amendments. 



5834 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 22 December 2006 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

!200600231GG! 

W A N T E D ! ! ! 

Old copies of the Government Gazette 

State Law Publisher is in the process of scanning all Government 
Gazettes (back to the first one ever published in the 1840’s) with 
the intention of adding the archived copies to our existing on-line 
service. 

We are looking for donations of any copies (pre 1994) that are no 
longer required by clients and would be appreciative of any 
assistance you can offer in this undertaking. 

The scanning process requires single pages, therefore we need to 
trim the spine off each gazette, which unfortunately ruins the 
gazettes for future use. 

Our preference is for unwanted copies, however, if a client requires 
their gazettes returned, State Law Publisher will reprint and replace 
individual editions. If a bound copy is supplied and is to be returned 
we will reprint all gazettes and arrange to have them rebound for 
the client. 

The benefits of having all the gazettes and indices on-line and 
searchable will be enormous. This service should remove the need 
for clients to retain hard copies and will free up valuable storage 
space. 

Barring any unforeseen delays, it should take around a month to 
scan each year and then release on our website. 

 

——————————— 

 

Please contact John Thompson on 9426 0010 if you can assist by 
supplying editions of the Government Gazette. For large quantities 
we will arrange for them to be collected. 
 


